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Weekly Thought
Daylight Savings Time ie

over this Sunday at 2:00 a.m.
All clocks should be moved
one hour back before you re-
tire on Saturday evening.  
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Rost Anything

At A Vance

- /Mirtad

This coming week Hallo-
ween will be celebrated by
the town's little ones with a
parade and a tour of resi-
dences with the familiar ch
lenge of "trick or treat?" If
there are as many goblins,
gouls and black cats as last
year, I'll not venture outside.
It's enough to scare an old
woman to death. I believe
Halloween has its origins in
China some 5,000 years back
when peasants attempted to
chase off evil spirits with
masks and noise. Whoever
thought that all these yea's
later we would be able to co
the same thing with a battery
of chocolate bars?

* • 4,

In light of the Presient's
speech last Tuesday night and
the current economic woes
call me to comment on more
serious matters.

There is in this country, a
growing mood of despair and
hopelessness which is both
ill founded and self defeat-
ing. 111 founded because there
is little sound reason behiad
the gloomy forecasts of the
many doomsdayers we see and
hear on the news each eve-
ning. Daily reports of the
crumbling stock market and
specific industries which have
fallen victim to these harsh
economic times do not properly
illustrate the real ntagaitmle
end cause of these proolems.

This exploding inflation, this
economic recession and these
increasing outbreaks of short-
ages are all a result of one
simple economic fact. There
is suddenly too great a de-
mand for too many goods.
Normally this demand would
spell economic growth and
wiP".2L.futteee. liseeevee,
its immediate effect is the
creation of shortages, real and
artificial, which forces prices
up to a point where suddenly
only the highest leveled in-
come members of our society
are able to afford them.

Now most political _leaders
including our own President,
are currently pleading with
Americans to use less than
their entire lifestyle and up-
bringing has taught them to
use. For most Americans, this
upbringing and billions of dol-
lars of advertising, promised
them the good life, after many
years of hard work and self
induced sacrifice and discipline
on their own part. Now to
tell them that they will be de-
nied this because they have
used too much is more than
they should tolerate. The av-
erage American is not tee
,glutton of energy, food .or
any other commodity that he
has been purported to be by
the nation's conservationalists,
energy zar or President. He
has known his whole life what
it. means to squeeze the last
bit from the toothpaste tube,
the gallon of gas and • the
grocery bag.
For the first time in his-

tory, the common middle class
of a nation is enjoying a life-
style which was reserved for
the upper class only in the
past. The solution to our
shortages should not be and is
not found in depriving the
common man of that accomp-
lishment. The real cause ef
this dilemma of too great a
demand can be found in pop-
ulation growth. Within the
nation and internatioally there
is a increasing number of peo-
ple pursuing the same amount
of goods. This ridiculiusly ap-
parent fact and its enormous
impact. on our economy is to-
tally ignored in political re-
quests and retoric. In the
meanwhile, government con-
tinues to encourage marriage
and offspring with tax laws
and legal ceremony. But the
cold realty of the world of the
1970's will demand an answer
to this qquestion of popula-
tion control. Will there be ' '-
creasing shortages for many
or enough for us all?

Plywood boxes containing a
mixture of clay, sand and
shells have been used to rein-
force levies along the Missis-
sippi during flood emergen-
cies.

On Good Friday in Scandi-
'avian countries, mountain ash
branches are put on doors to
protect the house from evil.

!Delegate Night
For Democrats
The Emmitsburg Democratic

Central Committee is having
a Delegates ngiht on Octobet
30 at the Senior Citizens Cent-
er in Emmitsburg, at 8 o'clock.
The delegates are from

Area 4B. The Democratic can-
didates are: Arthur Caple and
Lou Scharon, and the Repub-
lican candidates are Ray Beck
and Lanny Harkenhorn.

Election District Area 4B
covers Emmitsburg, Creagers-
town and sections of Carroll
County. Everyone is welcome
to attend this program.

Miss Wivell Plans

Summer Wedding

Mr. and Mrs. Bernard R.
Wivell, Appolds Rd., ;Rocky
Ridge. Md., announce the en-
gagement of their daughter,
Connie jean, to John David
Hemingway, son of Mrs. Hilda
Rose Hemingway, Center
Square, Emmitsburg, Md.

Miss Wivell is presently a
senior at 'Catoctin High School,
Thurmont, Md., and is em-
ployed at the Casa Del Oro

•velry Shop, International
. (lettysburg. Her fian-

ee igl"- 1971 glativatte'ee! '''•rt •
toctin High, and is currently
manager of the Hanover Shoe
Store, Frederick Towne Mall.
A July wedding is planned.

UNICEF Drive Set

For Monday Night
The annual UNICEF collec-

tion will take place on Mon-
day, October 28. Fifth and
sixth graders will be going
from door-to-door in Emmits-
burg collecting money for
needy children of other lands.
The collectors will wear a
name tag and carry the tradi-
tional orange box.

Children interested in this
activity will meet at 7 p.m.
at Mother Setin School in
the cafeteria. Sister Mary
Louise and Sister Margaret
will organize the children into
groups. •

Refreshments will be serv-
ed when the youngsters re-
turn from their quest. They
will be ready to return home
between 8:30 and 9 p.m.
Parents are needed for driv-

ing. Anyone who is interested
please call Mother Seton
School.

Senior Citizens To

Have Bazaar Nov. 9
On October 15, 37 members

attended the regular monthly
meeting of the Emmitsburg
Senior Citizens. The short bus-
iness meeting was followed by
a sing-a-long led by Mrs. Anna
Margaret Martin and Sister
Paula. A short skit, "Jimmie
goes for Hog Feed," was giv-
en by Mrs. Helen McNair and
Mrs. Larue Harman. Light
refreshments were served fol-
lowing the meeting.
The members are busy get-

ty ready for the Fall Bazaar
to be held November 9, start
ing at 10 a.m. in both the
Senior Citizens Building and
old Post Office building. This
will also include a rummage
sale.

Whistle Stop Tour
Comes To Town

Fred Bower, chairman of
the Democratic State Central
Committee, has announced that
the Democratic candidates for
office in Frederick County will
conduct a "whistle stop" tour
of the county.
The caravan will be in Em-

mitsburg on Saturday, Octob-
er 26 from 3:30 to 4:30 in the
afternoon.

Light refreshments and en-
tertainment will be provided.
All citizens are invited to stop
by and meet the candidates.

Local -Veteran

Dies Friday
THOMAS "TIP" HARBAUGH

Thomas Clifton "Tip" Har-
baugh, 51, 311 E. Main St.,
Emmitsburg, died last Friday
afternoon at 2:09 o'clock in the
Warner Hospital, Gettysburg.

A veteran of World War II,
in which he was awarded the
Bronze Star for his service
with the Army, he was a past
commander of the Emmitsburg
Memorial Post 6658, Veterans
of Foreign Wars.

He served as a bartender
at the Francis X. Elder Post
121, American Legion, Emmits-
burg.

In addition to being a mem-
ber of the American Legion
and the Veterans of Foreign
Wars at Emmitsburg, he was
also a member of the Forty
and Eight of Frederick, the
Fairfield Amvets, the Gettys-
burg Moose and Eagles, and
the Vigilant Hose Co. of Ent-
mitsburg.

He was a member of Elias
Lutheran Church in Emmits-
burg and was a past president
of the Emmitsburg Little
League.

Born in Washington County,
he was a son of Mrs. Mabel
(Cline) Harbaugh, Cascade,
and the late William Har-
baugh.
Surviving in addition to his

mother, are his wife, the for-
mer Vernie Givens; two sons,
Thomas R. Harbaugh, York
Springs, and David E. Har-
baugh, at home; two grand-
sons, and these brothers and.
sisters: Mrs. Eletha Wise,
Mrs. IIelen Shockey, Mrs. Dor-
othy Kendall and Richard Har-
baugh, all of Cascade.
Funeral services were held

Monday afternoon at 2 o'clock
at the Elias Lutheran Church,
Emmitsburg, with the Rev. W.
Ronald Fearer officiating. In-
terment was in the Emmits-
burg Memorial Cemetery.

Pallbearers were Charles B.
Barney, Clyde Knipple, Stan-
ley Lupinski, William L. Top-
per, Thomas Sayler and Don-
ald Topper, all past command-
ers of the American Legion
and VFW.
Honor guard for the view-

ing included Charles B. Hamn-
er, Roger T. Harner, Andrew
T. Shorb, William L. Topper,
Leo B. Topper, T. Eugene
Rodgers, Austin E. Umble,
and Herbert H. Click, Sr.

Color guard for the funeral
services were T. Eugene Rod-
gers, Roger ,Harner, Austin
Umble, Herbert Click, Sr., An-
drew T. Shorb, and William
Rodgers.
The firing squad, all mem-

bers of the Amvets of Fair-
field, consisted of James Her-
ring, Merhl Singley, Allen
Bowling, Robert Bushman,
Richard Falcon, and Delbert
Haines. Bugler was Richard
Ott.
Arrangements were in

charge of the Wilson Funeral
Home, Emmitsburg.

* * *

CHARLES P. KOONTZ

Charles Perry Koontz, 80,
R2, Emmitsburg, died Tuesday
at the Warner Hospital, Get-
tysburg. He was born in Fred-
erick County, the son of the
late James Oliver and Chris-
tiana Weaver Koontz. He
was the last member of his
immediate family.
He was the husband of the

late Mary Margaret Byard
Koontz.
Surviving are ten children:

Mrs. Marshall Manahan, of
Smithsburg; Mrs. Catherine
Stokely, Gettysburg; Mrs. Ed-
gar Riley, Gettysburg; Wil-
liam Koontz, Emmitsburg;
Lloyd Koontz, Keymar; James
Koontz, Emmitsburg; Mrs.
Joseph Topper, Taneytown;
Mrs. Walter Preston, Altoona,
Pa.; Kenneth Koontz, Emmits-
burg; Mrs. Norman Swartz,
Taneytown; 33 grandchildren,
and 19 great-grandchildren.
He was a member of Elias

Lutheran Church, Emmitsburg.
Funeral services will be held

Friday, meeting at the Wil-
son Funeral Home, Emmits-
burg, at 1:30 p.m. with Chris-
tian services at Elias Lutheran
Chruch at 2 p.m. The Rev. W.
Ronald Fearer will officiate.
Interment will be in Elias
Lutheran Cemetery. Friends
may call at the Wilson Funer-
al Home this evening (Thurs-
day).

Plywood accounts for about
one-quarter of the siding mar-
ket for new homes.

Trees are planted on Me-
morial Day as living tributes
to our war dead.

Lions Mark 45th Anniversary Oct. 30

Speaker for the 45th Chart-
er Night celebration of the
combined Thurment and Em-
mitsburg Lions Clubs on Oc-
tober 30 at the Peter Pan Inn,
at Urbana, will be Joseph W.
Rabbitt of Hyattsville, an im-
mediate past Director of the
International Association of
Lions Clubs.
Mr. Rabbitt is an active

member of the Hyattsville
Lions Club, having served as
President with 31. years of
perfect attendance. He also
served as District Governor
of 22e in the Washington, De
C. area and this past year
completed his two year teem

as International Director. He
is Secretary-Treasurer of
Ewing Lumber and Millwork
Corp.
The sealer will be intro-

duced by Albert Brault of the
Thurmont club and a past Dis-
trict Governor of 22C. The
Charter Night will start at 6
p.m. William Kelz, presid ;et
of the Emmitsburg Lions, will
also participate in the pro-
gram, which will conclude with
dancing to the music of the
Rudy Carroll Combo.
Francis S. K. Matthews of

Emmitsburg, is the only sur-
viving charter member of the
local club still active.

Church Crusade To Begin Tonight

The Weller United
dist Church of Thurmont
sponsoring a Musical Evan-
gelistic Crusade this week.
Mr. Clair Saxman, known as
the famous "One Man Gospel
Band," will perform with a
total of 20 instruments. He
plays as many as six at one

Metho- time.
Mr. Saxman will perform

from Thursday through Sun-
day, October 24-27, at the
Weller United Methodist
Church in Thurmont,. The ser-
vices start each night at 7:30
o'clock and everyone is wel-
come to attend.

Seminar Attended

By Local Physician
Dr. George L. Morningstar,

Emmitsburg, attended the An-
nual Scientific Assembly of the
American Academy of Family
Physicians in Los Angeles.
The medical meeting begen
October 14 and ran through
October 17. More than 4,000
family doctors participated in
this once-a-year continuing ed-
ucation conclave.
Dr. Morningstar, who is a

member of the Academy,
heard nationally-known speak-
er discuss up-to-the-minute
health care topics. He had an
opportunity to attend his
choice of clinical seminars m.
40 different topics and visit
more than 110 scientific and
2880 technical exhibits.

SJHS Girls Soccer
Team Posts Win

St. Jiseph's High School
girls' soccer team won their
opening game of the season
Monday by defeating Prospea
Hall, 4-1, in Frederick.

Senior Lynne Phelan scored
all four goals for the winners,
but was assisted by strong
offense and an extremely stin-
gy defense.
Mrs. McWilliams, the girl's

coach, was very pleased by the
way the girls played their de-
fense and by the conduct of
all the players.
The girls' next contest will

be Monday, Oct. 28, at St. Ma-
ria Goretti in Hagerstown.

Girl's varsity soccer is the
most recent addition to the
athletic program at St. Joe's.

Mr. and Mrs. Leo M. Boyle
and family, E. Main St., have
returned from a 10-day vaca-
tion which included a two-day
visit to Disney World in Flor-
ida along with sight seeing
tours at Kennedy Space Cent-
er, Silver Springs, Sea World
and the Ringling Brothers Cir-
cus World in Florida. Other

points of interest included
Stone Mountain in Atlanta,
Ga., the Natural Bridge in Vir-
ginia, and the Luray Caverns.
While in Jacksonville, Fla., the
Boyles visited with Mr. and
Mrs. Thomas Leonard and fam-
ily and Mrs. Genevieve Clem-
ents, former residents of Ein-
mitsburg.

VOTE NOVEMBER 5TH

GOPCandidates Halloween Parade Next
Here Tuesday Thursday; Offer Many Prizes
The Republican candidates

for County Commissioner will
be in Emmitsburg Tuesday,
October 29 at 7:30 p.m. in the
Senior Citizens meeting room,
on the square. The public is
invited to meet the candidates
at this question and answer
meeting, sponsored by the lo-
cal Republican Committee.

, Drowning Victim

Found On Saturday
The body of James L. Kess-

ler, 54, 217 Diller Rd., Hanov-
er (formerly of Emmitsburg),
who drowned in a boating az- ,
cident in Prospect Bay off the 1
Chesapeake Bay on Oct. 12,1
was found Saturday afternoen
by Maryland Marine Police.

Marine police said Kessler
and Norman Dunkinson, Han-
over, were in an 18-foot mo-
torboat in the bay on Oct.
12 when the boat's steering
wheel broke. The two men
tried to steer by using a
wrench but the boat hit a swell
and locked into a turn, throw-
ing both men out of the vessel.

Marine police surmised that
Kessler was struck twice by
the boat. Dunkinson was re :-
cued and treated for lacera-
tions at a hospital.
Born in Emmitsburg, a eson

of James L. Kessler, Emmi•
burg, and the late May (Bowl-
ing) Kessler, who died in 1970,
he was employed as a shift-
supervisor at Doubleday Co.,
Hanover, since 1948. He was
a veteran of World War (I,
when he served in the Navy.
He was a member of the Elks
Lodge of Hanover, the Hanov-
er Coast Guard Fortilla 56,
and the VFW and American
Legion Post of Emmitsburg.
He was a member of St. Vin-
cent de Paul Catholic Church,
Hanover.

Surviving besides his father
is his wife, Helen A .(Miller)
Kessler; a son; James L .Keee-
ler, Hanover; one stepson,
Theodore B. Eliott, Baltimore;
a step-daughter, Mrs. Helen
A. Dunkinson, Hanover; fi
sisters, Miss Mary Kessler,
Miss Catherine Kessler, Mrs.
Frances Lewis, and Mrs. Gee-
evieve Neal, all of Emmitsburg.
and Mrs. Dorothy Gulden of
Tyson; two brothers, Guy
Kessler, Fairfield and Donald
Kessler, Gettysburg.
Funeral services were held

Wednesday morning with A

Mass of Christian Burial at

10 o'clock at St. Vincent's
Church, Hanover, with the Rev.
Monsignor Robert J. Maher
officiating. Interment was in

the parish cemetery.

State VFW
Paper Praises
Post 6658
The VFW Memorial Post

6658 of Emmitsburg, was giv-
en special praise in an article
published in the current issve
of the Maryland VFW Bulletin
mailed out this week. The ar-
ticle was written by Ed Gos-
nell, Sr., Commander of the
7th District, Department of
Maryland, and was entitled
"Hats Off to Post 6658." The
article • commends the 'local
VFW for their generosity to
the community through the ex-
cellent ambulance service it
provides.

In his article Mr. Gosnell
says, "When you see the VFW
Ambulance with all its extra
apparatus and those fine men
who drive and tend this ve-
hicle, it gives you a fine feel-
ing. It's nice to see what the
VFW is doing.
"These members are proud

of their work and their com-
munity, and we are proud of
them. When you look for
southern hospitality, you had
better look north to Emmits-
burg.

"If I were to write of all
their accomplishments, it
would take a hundred pages.
As Commander of District 7,
I want the rest of the people
to know that our District and
the people in it, are second to
none, and we get better as the
years roll on.

"If you want to see work
done the VFW way, come to
Emmitsburg and the 7th Dis-
trict, because that's where it
starts."

The annual spook and gob-
lin parade will be held next
Thursday evening, Oct. 31, it
has been announced by officials
of Francis X. Elder Post 121,
American Legion, Emmitsburg.

All local kiddies, and adults
too, who want to be partici-
pants in the big, parade, are

Teen Center Will

Become A Reality
The Emmitsburg Teen Cent-

er is no longer just a possi-
bility. Programs and events
are being organized and nec-
essary equipment, materials,
and personnel are being ob-
tained.

The Center, which is open to
anyone within the 13 to 19
age group, will consist of three
organizational components. The
Group Action Program from
Mt. St. Mdry's College will
provide the necessary instruc-
tors, teachers, and program
leaders, while volunteer mein-
bers from the various organi-
zations and clubs in Emmits-
burg will serve on a supervis-
ory level. Mr. Edward 0. Ad-
elsberger will serve as coor-
dinator-director of the Center.
In addition, a Teen Center
Youth Council will aid in the
planning, organization, and ac-
tual running of the Teen
Center activities.
By utilizing the former Em-

mitsburg Elementary School
on South Seton Avenue, the
Center will be able to offer a
variety of programs. Current
plans involve opening the
Center on a twice a week bas-
is with the possibility of ex-
pandietg to three and even
four nights a week if enough
intereet is shown.

October 11 saw the opening
of the Center with a dance
featuring 'New Country.' Be-
ginning November 6, the Cent-
er will be opened from 6:30
to 9:30 p.m. on Wednesday
eveningee eted from 6:30 to
10:30 p.m. on Saturday eve-
nings. Courses such as Fir:t
Aid Training, Guitar lessons,
and various Arts and Crafts
are samples of the programs
for Wednesday evenings. The
game room and gym will also
be open at this time. Saturday
evening programs involve a
more open house type atmos-
phere with a variety of athlet-
ic activities available for boys
and girls.
On Wednesday, November 6,

from 7:30 to 8:30 p.m., a
meeting will be held at the
Center to discuss organization
of the Teen Center Youth
Council. All teens are urged
to attend this opening meeting.
Anyone interested in serving
in any capacity whatsoever
at the Center is also welcome
to attend this meeting.
In order for the Teen Cent-

er to remain a reality and to
function on a continuous bas-
is, the support of everyone is
needed. Come down to the
Center on Wednesday and get
involved.

/NM

asked to assemble at the
Doughboy monument in West
End at 6:30 p.m., to obtain
numbers which will be used
to identify the participants,
should they be among the
winners.
The parade march-off time

has been established at 7:30
p.m. Leading the promenaee
will be the American Legion
Color Guard, police cars, the
Dynamic Majorettes, the local
fire company participants awl
floats on hand.
The affair is sponsored an-

nually by the Francis X. El-
der Post 121 American Legion.
Refreshments will be served
on the St. Joseph's rectory
grounds following the parade.
The line of march will take

the parade directly from the
Doughboy through the square,
down East Main Street to
Federal Avenue, up De Paul
St., to the rectory grounds.
The judges will review the pa-
rade at the square. All prize
winners are asked to pick up
their prizes at the rectoey
grounds.

Prizes to be awarded this
year are: Most original, $10,
$5, $3; funniest costume, $10.
$5, $3; best looking costume,
$10, $5, $3; best decorated
bicycle, wagon or tricycle, $10,
$5, $3. Two mystery prizes
of $5 will be given.
Town officials have announc-

ed that Trick or Treating by
the youngsters will be per-
mitted this year between the
hours of 6 and 7 p.m. on Oct.
31, immediately before the
parade only.

Seton School Ready

For Annual Bazaar
Final plans are being ma 'e

for the Annual Bazaar at.
Mother Seton School, to be
held Saturday, November 2
from 12 Noon to 6 p.m. As
always, there will be lots if
delicious food - hoagies, het
dogs, barbecue, pizza and soft
drinks, plus homemade cak
and candies to take home.
There will be games to play
for young and old - corn
game, chuck-a-luck, parcel
.post, grab bag, and fish.

While the adults are look-
ing for bargains at the rum-
mage and white elephant tab-
les, and doing sonic early
Christmas shopping at the doll,
ancy good!, and religious items
tables, the children can enjoe
free movies in the library.

There will be something -cm-
everyone, and all are invited
to join the fun.

Save The Monocacy Meeting

The Save the Monocacy Ae-
sociation will have a pre-elec-
tion meeting on Friday, Nov.
1, at 7:30 p.m. at the Fire
Hall in Thurmont. The meet- •
ing is open to the public and
anyone opposed to the Sixeas
Bridge Dam is urged to at-
tend.

4-H Team Captures Honors

BRINGING HOME THE
LOOT-Maryland's "A" team
members and their coaches
show off first-place trophy
paraphernalia won in their
barnstorming trip to runaw y
championship honors in na-
tional 4-H dairy cattle judging
competition on Oct. 7 during
the North American Dairy
Show at Columbus, Ohio.

Seated are (left to right):
Allen Stiles, 18, Westminste. ;
Denton Lenhart, 18, Thurmont
and Ronnie Kling, 15. Em-
mitsburg. Standing are (left
to right): James M. Downes,
Centreville, Extension 4-H and
youth agent in Queen Annes

In Judging

county; W. Allen Galbreath,
19, of Street, and John L. Mor-
ris of Gaithersburg, Extension
dairy science specialist at the
University of Maryland.

Their mementos include
"Ideal Jersey Cow" statuettes
and team trophy; "Guernsey
Jug" cream pitchers; Brie et»
Swiss cowbells, and Ayrsh;ee
pastoral scene pictures. The
Maryland delegation also re-
ceived individual attache cases
for being high over-all team
in the contest. This year's win
marked 21 victories for Mary-
land 4-H teams in 53 national
dairy cattle judging contests
since 1919.
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Sodality To Host Several Activities
Many events have been

planned for the Sodality of the
Virgin Mary of St. Joseph's
Parish, Emmitsburg. These
events were discussed at the
recent meeting held by the So-
dality with Mrs. Helen Brown,
president, presiding. Eighteen
members were present at the
meeting.
On October 27 Sodality mem-

bers will wear the miraculous
medal at all masses at St.
Joseph's Church. Medals will
be provided at each mass for
members to wear.
A Christmas Gift Evening

of Games will be held on No-
vember 18 at St. Joseph's

Parish Hall. All members are
asked to give prizes for the
games and participate at the
event.
An interior decorator dem-

onstrator will be present at
the November 25th meeting
of the Sodality. The meeting
will be held at 8 p.m. and all
members are invited to attend.
At 6 p.m. on December 8th,

there will be a reception f
new members into the Sodali-
ty. Anyone interested in be-
coming a member may con-
tact President Helen Brown
or any other member. Follow-
ing the reception of new mem-
bers, a Christmas party will be

Datsun 710.
The driving man's economy car.

Every now and then, a car with just the
right size, price and handling comes
along. Datsun 710 is just such a car!

• Excellent gas mileage
• 1800cc overhead cam engine
• Reclining buckets and sports console
• Power-assist front disc brakes
• Electric rear window defogger
• Tinted glass, carpeting
• Whitewalls, deluxe wheel covers
• All and more, standard Dat

saves
sets you free

DEE 6EE
IMPORTS INC.

F.AIRFIELD ROAD

GETTYSBURG, PA.

Phone 717-334-1919

held at St. Joseph's High
School. It will be in the form
of a covered dish party with
the Sodality providing meat,
rolls and beverage. Each mem-
ber is asked to bring a cover-
ed dish and a $2 Christmas
gift for exchange. Members
also discussed providing a gift
for the residents at Victor
Cullen Center.
The next meeting of the So-

dality will be Monday, Octob-
er 28 at 8 p.m. All members
are asked to attend. Mrs.
Singh will be the guest speak-
er. Refreshments will be serv-
ed.

Take stock in America.

Buy TY.S.SavingsBonds.

Some people believed that
gold was begotten by the
sun and that the heat of under-
ground veins wholly burned
everything they came into
contact with, turning those
substances into gold.

ZIP COLUMN
Our office will be closed on

Monday, October 28, in obser-
vance of Veterans Day.
There will be a receipt and

dispatch of mail, in the morn-
ing only. The box lobby will
remain open until 6 p.m.
No rural delivery service

performed this day.

VOTE FOR

Edgar C. Virts, Jr.
Democratic Candidate For

COUNTY COMMISSIONER
An honest, dedicated man you can talk to

about problems affecting Frederick Co.

_A man who has always put community
service above private gain.

A man who will plan ahead with basic facts
instead of special interest group's pres-

Your chance for the citizens to restore con-
trol over our local government.

A man who has been successful in business
because of hard honest work and wise
decisions.

By authority of G. Virts, Treas.

1

ELECT:

CHARLES C. KELLER

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
EXPERIENCE
Began working at the Court House as Deputy Clerk of the Circuit Court
on February 1, 1956.

KNOW-HOW
Familiar with ALL aspects of the office (court, recording deeds, pass-
ports, business licenses, marriage licenses & other related matters.

DEDICATION
To serve the people of Frederick County and give my assistance when-
ever needed.

By Authority of C. 'R. Miller, Treas.

s • •

Three Christmas stamps will
be offered for sale this year,
and they go on sale at our of-
fice today.

One of these stamps is pre-
canceled and printed on pres-
sure sensitive paper. The pre-

canceled stamp is being opera-
tionally tested in the Alle-
gheny, Boston, Chicago, Salt
Lake City and Tampa Postal
Districts as a means of speed-
ing seasonal mail processing.
To meet philatelic require-
ments, small quantities of this

stamp will be available at post
offices nationwide and by mail
order from the Philatelic Sales
Division in Washington.
The precanceled design

shows the dove of peace wea-
htervane atop Mount Vernon,
home of George Washington.

The Altarpiece stamp design
is based on a 15th century
French painting which hangs
in the Metropolitan Museum.
The third stamp is based upc,n
a 19th century Currier and
Ives lithograph.

George E. Rosensteel, PM.

NOTICE

The Elinnitsburg Planning
Commission meets the third
Wednesday of each month at
8:00 p.m. in the Town Office.
The public is invited to at-
tend these open meetings.

1974
PROCLAMATION OF THE GOVER-
NOR OF MARYLAND DIRECTING
THE PUBLICATION OF BILLS
PROPOSING AMENDMENTS TO
THE CONSTITUTION OF MARY-
LAND
WHEREAS, at its regular session of

1973, the General Assembly enacted
Chapters 258, 632 and 745 proposing
amendments to the State Constitution;
and
WHEREAS, at its regular session of

1974, the General Assembly enacted
Chapters 133, 879, 880, 881, 882, 883,
886, 887, 888 and 889 proposing amend-
ments to the State Constitution; and
WHEREAS, it is the duty of the

Governor, under Section 1 of Article
XIV of the Constitution to order the
publication of the bills proposing said
amendments in advance of the General
Election of November 5, 1974; and
WHEREAS, there will be presented

on the ballot at said election the fol-
lowing proposed amendments to the
Constitution for adoption or rejection
by the voters:

CHAPTER 258
(Question No. 1)

AN ACT to propose an amendinent to
Article Ill of the Constitution -of
Maryland, title "Legislative Depart-
ment", (by repealing and re-enact-
ing, with amendments, Section 40A
thereof), to add Abne Arundel County
to the provisions relating to the im-
mediate taking of property by. the
State which presently apply to Balti-
more City, Baltimore County, Mont-
gomery County, and Cecil County. and
providing for the submission of this
amendment to the qualified voters of
the State of Maryland for their adop-
tion or rejection.
SECTION 1. Be it enacted by the Gen-

eral Assembly of Maryland. (Three'
fifths of all members elected to each of
She two Houses concurring), That the
following be and the same is hereby
proposed as an amendment to Section
40A of Article III of the Constitution
of Maryland, title "Legislative Depart-
ment", • the same, if adopted by the
legally qualified voters of the State, as
herein provided, to becothe a part of
the Constitution of Maryland:
40A.
The General Assembly shall enact no

law authorizing private property to be
taken for public use without just com-
pensation, to be agreed upon between
She parties, or awarded by a jury, being
first paid or tendered to the party en-
titled to such compensation, but where
such property is situated in Baltimore
City and is desired by this State or by
the Mayor and City Council of Balti-
more, the Gnneral Assembly may pro-
vide that such property may be taken
immediately upon payment therefor to
the owner or owners thereof by the
State or by the Mayor and City Coun-
cil of Baltimore, or into court, SLICil

amount as the State or the Mayor and
City Council of Baltimore, as the case
may be, shall estimate to be the fair
value of said property, provided such
legislation also requires the payment
of any further sum that may subse-
quently be added by a jury; and further
provided that the authority and proce-
dure for the immediate taking of prop-
erty as it applies to the Mayor and
City Council of Baltimore on June 1,
1961, shall remain in force and effect
to and including June 1, 1963, and
where such property is situated in
ANNE ARUNDEL COUNTY OR IN
Baltimore County and is desired by
ANNE ARUNDEL COUNTY OR BY
Baltimore County. Maryland, the County
[Council of Baltimore County, Mary-
land.] COUNCILS OF THOSE COUN-
TIES may provide for the appointment
of an appraiser or appraisers by a
Court of Record to value such property
and that upon payment of the amount
of such evaluation, to the party en-
titled to compensation, or into Court,
and securing the payment of any further
sum that may be awarded by a jury.
such property may be taken; and where
such property is situated in Montgomery
County and in the judgment of and
upon a finding by the County Council
of said County that there is immediate
need therefor for right of way for
County roads or streets. the County
Council may provide that such property
may be taken immediately upon pay-
ment therefor to the owner or owners
thereof, or into court, such amount as
a licensed real estate broker appointed
by the County Council shall estimate to
be the fair market talue of such prop-
erty, provided that tie Council shall
secure the payment of any further sum
that may subsequently be awarded by
a jury. In the various municipal corpora-
tions within Cecil County, where in the
judgment of and upon a finding by the
governing body of said municipal corpo-
ration that there is immediate need
therefor for right of way for municipal
roads, streets and extension of municipal
water and sewage facilities, the govern-
ing body may provide that such prop-
erty may be taken immediately upon
payment therefor to the owner or own-
ers thereof, or into court. such amount
as a licensed real estate broker ap-
pointed by the particular governing body
shall estimate to be a fair market value
of such property, provided that the mu-
nicipal corporation shall secure the pay-
ment of any further sum that subse-
quently. may be awarded by a jury.
This Section 40A shall not apply in
ANNE ARUNDEL COUNTY OR
Montgomery County or any of the
various municipal corporations within
Cecil County, if the property actually
to be taken includes a btlilding or
buildings.

SEC. 2. And be it further enacted,
That the aforegoing section hereby pro-
posed as an amendment to the Con-
stitution of Maryland, at the next gen-
eral election to be held in this State in
November 1974, shall be submitted to
the legal and qualified voters thereof
for their adoption or rejeetion in our:,
suance of directions contained in Arti-
cle XIV of the Constitution of this
State; and at this general election, the
vote on this proposed amendment to
the Constitution shall be by ballot, and
upon each ballot there shall be printed
the word S "For the Constitutional
Amendment" and "Against the Consti-
tutional Amendment", as now provided
by law, and, immediately, after the
election. all returns shall be made to
the Governor of the vote for and against
the proposed amendment, as directed
by Article XIV of the Constitution. and
further proceedings had in accordance
with Article XIV.

BALLOT LABEL AS IT WILL APPEAR
ON THE VOTING MACHINE

QUESTION NO. 1
CONSTITUTIONAL
AMENDMENT

AN ACT to add Anne Anindel
County to the provisions relating to
the immediate taking of property
by the State which presently apply
to Baltimore City, Baltimore County,
Montgomery County and Cecil
County.

CHAPTER 632
(Question No. 2)

AN ACT to propose an amendment to
.Section 3 of Article VI of the Con-
stitution of Maryland, title "Treasury
Department," to provide that the
Legislature may authorize a system of
disbursing funds other than by the
use of checks, and providing for the
submission of this amendment to the
qualified voters of the State of Mary-
land for their adoption or rejection.
SECTION 1. Bc it enacted by the Gen-

eral Assembly of Maryland, (Three-
fifths of all members elected to each of
the two Houses concurring), That the
following be and the same is hereby
proposed as an amendment to Section
3 of Article VI of the Constitution of
Maryland, title "Treasury Department,"
the same, if adopted by the legally
qualified voters of the State, as herein
provided, to become a part of the Con-
stitution of Maryland, and to read as
follows:
3.
The Treasurer shall receive the moneys

of the State, and, until otherwise pre-
scribed by law, deposit them, as soon
as received, to the credit of the State,
in such bank or banks as he may, from
time to time, with the approval of the
Governor, select (the said bank or
banks giving security, satisfactory to
the Governor, for the safekeeping and
forthcoming, when required of said de-
posits), and he or such of his deputies
as may be authorized to do so by. the
Legislature shall disburse the same for
the purposes of the State according to
law, upon warrants drawn by the Comp-
troller. or his duly authorized deputy,
and on checks countersigned by the
Comptroller, or his duly authorized
deputy r, and not otherwise]. THE
LEGISLATURE MAY PRESCRIBE,
BY LAW. FOR THE TREASURER
TO DISBURSE THE MONEYS OF
THE STATE BY A SYSTEM OTHER

THAN BY THE USE OF CHECKS.
-The Treasurer or such of his deputies
as may be authorized to do so by the
Legislature shall take receipts for all
moneys paid from the Treasury Depart-
ment; and receipt for moneys received
by him shall be endorsed upon warrants
signed, by the Comptroller, or such
deputy as may be authorized to do so
by law, without which warrants, so
signed, no acknowledgment of money
received into the Treasury shall be
valid; and upon warrants issued by the
Comptroller, or his duly authorized
deputy, the Treasurer shall make ar-
rangements for the payment of the in-
terest of the public debt, and for the
purchase thereof, on account of the
sinking fund. Every bond, certificate, or
other evidence of the debt of the State
shall. be signed by the Treasurer, Chief
Deputy Treasurer, or a Deputy Treas-
urer, and countersigned by the Comp-
troller, Chief Deputy Comptroller, or a
Deputy Comptroller; and no new cer-
tificate or other evidence intended to
replace another shall be issued until
the old one shall be delivered to the
Treasurer, and authority executed in
due form for the transfer of the same
filed in his office, and the transfer ac-
cordingly made on the books thereof,
and the certificate or other evidence
cancelled; but the Legislature may make
provisions for the loss of certificates,
or other evidences of the debt; and may
prescribe, by law, the manner in which
the Treasurer shall receive and keep
the moneys of the State.
SEC. 2. And be it further enacted,

That the aforegoing section hereby pro-
posed as an amendment to the Con-
stitution of Maryland, at the next gen-
eral election to be held in this State in
November 1974, shall be submitted to
the legal and qualified voters thereof
for their adoption or rejection in pur-
suance of directions contained in Arti-
cle XIV of the Constitution of this
State; and at this general election, the
vote on this proposed amenoment to
the Constitution shall be by ballot, and
upon each ballot there shall be printed
the' words "For the Constitutional
Amendment" and "Against the Consti-
tutional Amendment". as now provided
by law, and, immediately, after the
election, all returns shall he made to
the Governor of the vote for and against
the proposed amendment, as directed
by Article XIV of the Constitution. and
further proceedings had in accordance
with Article XIV.

BALLOT LABEL AS IT WILL APPEAR
ON THE .VOTING MACHINE

QUESTION NO. 2
CONSTITUTIONAL
AM EN DM ENT

AN ACT to provide that the
Legislature may provide, by law,
for the Treasurer to disburse the
monies of the State by a system
other than by the use of checks.

CHAPTER 745
(Question No. 3)

AN ACT to amend Section 52 of Arti-
cle III of the Constitution of Mary-
land. title "Legislative Department,"
by the addition of a new subsection
(5A) thereto, to follow immediately
after subsection (5) thereof, imposing
certain requirements for a balanced
budget, requiring that the budget bill
as submitted by the Governor, sup-
plernented by the Governor. and
amended by the General Assembly
contain proposed appropriations not
in excess of total estimated revenues.

. relating generally to the contents and
totals in the budget bill, and sub,
milting this amendment to the quali-
fied voters of the State for adoption
or rejection.
SEcTiort 1. Be it enacted by the Gen-

eral Assembly of Maryland, (Three-
fifths of all the members elected to each
of the two Houses concurring), That the
following section be and the same is
hereby proposed as an amendment to
Section 52 of Article III of the C'onsti-
tutLon of Maryland, title "Legislative
Depaitment," the same, if adopted by
the legally qualified voters of the State,
as herein provided, to become a part
of the Constitution of Maryland:
(5A) THE BUDGET AND THE
BUDGET BII.I. AS SULIMITIED BY
THE GOVERNOR TO THE GENERAL
ASSEMBLY SHALL HAVE A FIG-
URE FOR THE TOTAL OF ALL
PROPOSED APPROPRIATIONS AND
A FIGURE FOR THE TOTAL
OF ALL ESTIMATED REVENUES
AVAILABLE TO PAY THE APPRO-
PRIATIONS, AND THE FIGURE FOR
TOTAL PROPOSED APPROPRIA-
TIONS SHALL NOT EXCEED THE
FIGURE FOR TOTAL ESTIMATED
REVENUES. NEITHER THE GOVER-
NOR IN SUBMITTING AN AMEND-
MENT OR SUPPLEMENT TO THE
BUDGET BILL NOR THE GENERAL
ASSEMBLY IN AMENDING THE
BUDGET BILL SHALL THEREBY
CAUSE THE FIGURE FOR TOTAL
PROPOSED APPROPRIATIONS TO
EXCEED THE FIGURE FOR TOTAL
ESTIMATED REVENUES, [f,]] IN-
CLUDING ANY REVISIONK-AN-D-
TN- I HE -rep DaEr 13TI1 AS EN-
ACTED THE FIGURE FOR TOTAL
ESTIMATED REVENUES ALWAYS
SHALL BE EQUAL TO OR EXCEED
THE FIGURE FOR TOTAL APPRO-
PRIATIONS.

SEC. 2. And be it further enacted,
That the aforegoing section hereby pro-
posed as an amendment to the Consti-
tution of Maryland. at the next gen-
eral election to be held in this State
in November 1974, shall be submitted
to the legal and qualified voters thereof
for their adoption or rejection in pur-
suance of directions contained in Arti-
cle 14 of the Constitution of this State,
and at the said general election, the
vote on the said proposed amendment
to the Constitution shall be by ballot,
and upon each ballot. there shall be
printed the words "For the Constitu-
tional Amendment" and "Against the
Constitutional Amendment" as now pre-
scribed by law. and, immediately after
said election, all returns shall be made
to the Governor of the vote for and
against said proposed amendment, as
directed by said Article 14 of the Con-
stitution. and further proceedings had
in accordance with said Article 14.

BALLOT LABEL AS IT WILL APPEAR
ON THE VOTING MACHINE

QUESTION NO. 3
CONSTITUTIONAL
A M EN DM ENT

AN ACT imposing requirements
for a balanced budget, requiring
that the budget bill as submitted
by the Governor, supplemented by
the Governor and amended by the
General Assembly contain proposed
appropriations not in excess of
total estimated revenues.

CHAPTER 133
(Question No. 4)

AN ACT concerning City of Baltimore-
Rehabilitation and Improvement Loans
FOR the purpose of amending the
Constitution to authorize the Mayor
and City Council of Baltimore ' to
make, guarantee or insure financial
loans for or in connection with the
rehabilitation, renovation, redevelop
ment or improvement of residential
or commercial property, or any com-
bination thereof, in Baltimore City,
and submitting this amendment to the
qualified voters of the State for adop-
tion or rejection. By proposing an
amendment to the Constitution of
Maryland Article XI-G-City of Bal-
timore-Rehabilitation and Improve-
ment loans Section 1 I [and 2]1 .
SECTION 1. Be it enacted by the Gen-

eral Assembly of Maryland, (Three-
fifths of all the members elected to
each of the two Houses concurring),
That the following be and the same is
hereby proposed as an amendment to
Section 1 Hand 2]] of Article XI G
City of Baltimore-Rehabilitation and
Improvement Loans, of the Constitution
of Maryland, the same, if adopted by
the legally qualified voters of the State,
as herein provided, to become a part
of the Constitution of Maryland:

Article XI-G-City of Baltimore- •
Rehabilitation and Improvement Loans
I. The General Assembly of Maryland,

by public local law may authorize the
Mayor and City Council of Baltimore:
(a) To make or contract to make fi-

nancial loans to the owners of build-
ings or structUreS located within the
boundaries of Baltimore City, which are
used or occupied for residential OR
COMMERCIAL purposes. OR ANY
COMBINATION THEREOF, for or in
connection with rehabilitating, RENO-
VATING. REDEVELOPING;, or im-
proving said buildings or structures..
(b) To guarantee or insure financial

loans made by third parties to the
owners of buildings or structures lo-
cated within the boundary lines of Bal-
'timore City, which are used or occu-
pied for residential OR COMMERCIAL
purposes, OR ANY COMBINATION

4, THEREOF, for or in connection with

rehabilitating, RENOVATING, REDE-
VELOPING or improving said build-
ings or structures.
(c) Any and all financial loans made

by the Mayor and City Council of Balti-
more; any and all guarantees or insur-
ance commitments made by the Mayor
and City Council of Baltimore in con-
nection with any of said loans; and any
and all money used or expended by
the Mayor and City Council of Balti-
more in connection with said loans,
guarantees, or insurance commitments,
pursuant to the power and authority
hereinabove vested in the municipality,
and any and all acts performed by the
Mayor and City Council of Baltimore
in connection with any powers which
may be granted to the Mayor and City
Council of Baltimore pursuant to this
Article, are all hereby declared to be
needed, contracted for, expended Or
exercised for a public Use. '
(d) In the event of any [[conflect]]

CONFLICT between the provisions of
tflFs Article- and those of Article XI,
Section 7, of the Constitution of Mary-
land, or any other provisions of said
Constitution, then the provisions of this
Article shall control.

1[2. The General Assembly of Mary-
land may grant to the Mayor and City
Council of Baltimore any and all addi-
tional power and authority necessary or
proper to carry into full force and effect
any and all of the specific powers which
the General Assembly is authorized to
grant to the Mayor and City Council Of
Baltimore pursuant to this Article, and
to fully accomplish any and all of the
purposes and objects contemplated by
the provisions of this Article, provided
such additional power or authority is
not inconsistent with the terms and pro-
visions of this Article or with any
other provision or provisions of the
Constitution of Maryland, except as
provided in this Article. The General
Assembly may place such other and
further restrictions or limitations on the
exercise of any of the powers which
it may grant to the Mayor and City
Council of Baltimore under the provi-
sions of this Article as it may deem
proper and expedient.]]
SEC. 2. And be it further enacted,

That the aforegoIng section hereby pro-
posed as an amendment to the Consti-
tution of Maryland, at the next gen-
eral election to be held in this State
in November, 1974, shall be submitted
to the legal and qualified voters thereof
for their adoption or rejection in pur
suance of directions contained in Arti-
cle XIV of the Constitution of this
State. At that general election, the
vote on this proposed amendment to
the Constitution shall be be ballot, and
upon each ballot there shall be printed
the words For the Constitutional
Amendments" and "Against the Con-
stitutional Amendments." as now pro-
vided by law. Immediately after the
election, all returns shall be made to
the Governor of the vote for and against
the proposed amendment, as directed
by Article XIV of the Constitution,
and further proceedings had in accord-
ance with Article XIV.

BALLOT LABEL AS IT WILL APPEAR
ON THE VOTING MACHINE

QUESTION NO. 4
CONSTITUTIONAL
AMENDMENT

AN ACT to authorize the Mayor
:ind City Council of Baltimore to
make. guarantee or insure financial
loans for or in connection with the
rehabilitation, renovation. redevelop-
ment. or improvement of residential
or commercial property, or .any
combination thereof. in Baltimore
City. "

CHAPTER 879
(Question No, 5)

AN ACT concerning Elected Officials-
Convicted of Crimes FOR the pur-
pose of adding to the Constitution of
Maryland a provision [ [removing i
certain elected„otilvtls front office
tiOon conviction of certain crimes not-
withstanding any appeal which may
be taken]] [[for the suspension with- ;
out pay of certain -elected officials
from ()Tee upoiw conviction of cer-
tain crimes and for the removal of
such officials LI the conviction is up- I

a cenion aEill-p-RiViafrii I
-for-the appointriterif-rif- a person to
temporality  fill  such elective office

td-O-Tfig-g-fitc suspension; pima-ilia for
the reinstatement -Cituch- eTe-cTa 

ut-Tder certain circumstances; pro-
viding Fir-the restoration a- pay roi
th-e-Period-eif suspension under certain
circumstances;]']" for the sitspcnion
without pay or benefits o-f-eertain
elected UffieraTi-Trom oce upon con-
viction  of or the entry of certain
pleas to certain crimes and for the
removal of such-Officials if  the con-
vitt-Haft becomes final, after -jitaiEfil 
review; providirt-for the ap_paatment
or-a  person to temporarily fill such 
le-clive office during such suspension;

BrtiVidinT-Tor th-e reinstatement—oT
TOT elected-olfi-ciir ur-ider certain 
circumstances; pir-ivi-ding for the res-
toration of pay and-benefits uidei-
affain circumstances; generally re-
lating to suspension and removal of
certain elected olfiCifor certain 
misconduct and-The fihlijig of vacan-
cies thus created;. and submitting this
amendment to the qualified voters of
the State for adoption or rejection.
By proposing an amendment to the
Constitution of Maryland By adding
to Article XV-MiScellaneous Sec-
tion 3,
SECTION I. Be it enacted by the Gen-

eral Assembly of Maryland, (Three-
tl!Ths of all the members elected to
each of the two Houses concurring),
That the following be and the same is
hereby proposed as an amendment to
the Constitution of Maryland. by add-
ing new Section 3 to Article XV-Mis-
cellaneous, the same, if adopted by the
legally qualified voters of the State, as
herein provided, to become a part of
the Constitution of Maryland:

VAN tLEczrED OFFICIAL OF 
Article XV-Miscellaneous

THE STATE WHO IS CONVICTED
OF ANY CRIME WHICH IS A
FELONY OR FOR rnCATlT 

 MAY BE CONFINEMENT 
IN ANY INSTITUTION FOR A 
PERIOD OF MOIRE THAN ONE 
YEAR IS REMOVED FROM  THE 
ELECTIVE OFFICE EFFECTIVE 
UPON CONVICTION IN THE TRIAL 
COURT-AND-NOTWITHYTANDING
ANY APPEAL WHICH MAY BE 
TAKEN.]] •
[(ANY ELECTED  OFFICIAL OF 

THE  STATE. OR OF A  COUNTY
OR OF A MUNICIPAL CORPORA-
TION WHO DURING HIS TERM OF 
OFFICE IS CONVICTED OF ANY 
GRIME wHICTI-TS-A FELONY, OR
WHICH IS A-MISDEMI -101C-RET
LA1ED -I 0 HIS  PUBLIC DUTIES
AND. RESPONSIBILI 1 IES I-OW
'WHICH THE  PENALTY MAY BE 
-mc-Alk-cricA-noN  IN  ANY PENAL
1NSTITUTION:--SHALL BE -SUS:
PENDED BY-OPERATFON-Or-EAW
WITHOUT-PAY-FROM THE ELEC-
TIVE cirrva. DURING AND FOR 
THE PERIOD OF SUSPENSION OF 
THE ELECTED OFFICIAL. THE AP-
PROPRIATE GOVERNING BODY
AND/OR OFFICIAL AUT IITUITZED
BY LAW TO FILL ANY VACANCY 
IN 'SHE ELEC I 1VE 01-1-ICE-SHALE
APPOINT A PERSON TO TEMPO-
RARILY  FILL THE ELECTIVE OF-
FICE. IF, AFTER EXHAUSTION OF
ANY APPEAL AS-A NI-AMER OF
RIGHT WITHIN IHE. COURT SYS-
TErniTaF''THE-EIE. CTEO
OFFICIAL IS SO CONVICTED, THE
CONVICTION-IS UPHELD, SUCH
ELECTED 01-1-1CIAL•SHALL BE RE-
'• 11 • • • ••
FICE BY OPERATION OF---NV. THE 
GOVERNOR, UPON A FINDING BY 
THE ATTORNEY GENERAL OF 
SUCH A REMOVAL, SHALL FOR-
MALLY DECLARE THE OFFFCE
VACANT. IF THE CONVICTION OV
IHETELECTED OFFICIAL IS RE-
VERSED OR OVERT1URNED ON 
ANY APPEAL AS A MATTER  OF
RIGHT AS PROVIDED ABOVE, THE 
ELECTED • OFFICIAL SHALL BE
REINSTATED BY OPERATION OF

LAW TO THE ELECTIVE OFFICE

FOR THE REMAINDER. IF ANY, 

OF THE ELECTIVE TERM OF OF-

FICE DURING WHICH HE WAS SO
CONVICTED. IN THE EVEI-4T THE

CONVICTION IS REVERSED—OR
OVERTURNED ON ANY-APPEAL

BY ANY COURT OF COMPTEVI

JURISDICTION, WHETHER BY AP-
PEAL AS A MATTER OF RIGHT.
OR OLHERWISE, THEN  -ALL PAS"
WITTIFIELD-DURING nTr:-P-m-uori)
OF SUSPENSION SHALL BE RE-
STORED.]]
--ANY-ELECTED OFFICIAL OF THE

'STATE, OR or—A COUNTY OR OF
-A-MUNTCIPAL CORPORATION WHO
DURING HIS_,TERM OF OFFICE IS
CONVICTED OF OR ENTERS A
PLEA oF-NOLO CONTENDERE-TO
-ANY-CRIME WHICH IS A FELONY;
OR-WHICIF-IS A MISDEMEANOIS
RELATED TO  HIS PUBLIC DUTIES
AND RUFONSIBILITIES AND IN-
VOLVES-MORAL TURPITUDE FOR
WHICH THE PENALTY  MAY BA
INCARCERATION IN ANY PENAL
INSTITUTION-. SHALL RE SUS-
PENDED  BY OPERATION-05F LAW
WITHOUT PAY OR BENEFITS
FROM THE ELECTIVE OFFICE;
DURING-AND -FOR THE P-E-12-10-15
OF SUSPENSIONOF -TFIE-ELECTED
01-1-1C1ATT-THE---APPROPRIAT'E
GOVERNING-110DY-AND7OR OFFI-
CIAL AUTHORIZED BY LAW TO 
I-ILL "'ANY VACANCY-IN THE
ELECTIVE OFFICE SHALL AP-
POINT A-PERSON TO TEMPO-
RARILY-FILL-THE ELECTIVE OP:
EICE,  PROVIDED THAT IF THE
ELECTIVE OFFICE IS ONE FOR.
win-a-r-A-uromAi SUCCESSTON-
TS-PROVITJED-HY-LIEN IN,
SUCH--EVENT THE PERSON EN-
TITLED TO SUCCEED TO THE OF-
FICE SHALL TEMPORARILY FILC
1HE ELELOVE 01-1-14E. IF 11th.
CONVICTION BECOMES  FINAL,
A--F-TER JUDICIAL REVIEW OR.
OTHERWISE. SUCH ELECTED OF-•
FICIAL SHALL BE REMOVED
FROM THE ELECTIVE OFFICE BY
OPERATION OF LAW AND THE. 
OFFICE-SHALL-BE-DEEMED VA-
CANT. IF pit CONVICTION 0-F-
THE  ELECTED OFFICIAL  IS RE-
VERSED OR OVERTURNED,--THE.
ELECTED OFFILIAL-STUAEL—BE-
REINS1ATED BY -OPERATION or
LAW TO THE ELECTIVE OFFICE 
FOR THEREMAINDER, IF ANY, 
OF-THE ELECTIVE  TERM or- OF-
FICE DURING WHICH HE WAS SC)*
SUSPENDED OR REMOVED. AN_R
ALL PAY AND BE.NEFITS SHALL.
TIE RUT-ORED.

Andi be it further enacted,.
That the aforegoing section hereby pro-
posed as an amendment to the Consti-
tution of Maryland, at the next gen-
eral election to he held in this State
in November, 1974, shall be submitted
to the legal and qualified voters thereof
for their adoption or rejection in pur-
suance of directions contained in Arti-
cle XIV of the Constitution of this
State. At that general election. the
vote on this proposed amendment to
the Constitution shall be by ballot, and
upon each ballot there shall be printed
the words "For the Constitutional
Amendments" and "Against the Con-
stitutional Amendments", as now pro-
vided by law. Immediately after the
election, all returns shall he made to
the Governor of the vote for and against
the proposed amendment, as directed

Article XIV of the Constitution, and
f .rther proceedings had in accordance

th Article XIV.

BALLOT LABEL AS IT WILL APPEAR
ON THE VOTING MACHINE

QUESTION NO. 5
,CONSTITUTIONAL

AMENDMENT
AN ACT providing for the suspen-

sion. without pay or benefits, of
certain elected officials from office
upon conviction of or the entry of

plei.s to ceCain criples and
'oe the removal of such officials if

conviction becomes final; pro-
v;ding for appointments to fill such
elective office during such suspen-
sion; providing for the reinstate-
ment of such elected official and the
restoration of pay and benefits un-
der certain circumstances.

CHAPTER 880
(Question No. 6)

AN ACT concerning General Assem-
bly-Eligibility FOR the purpose of'
clarifying certain provisions concern-
ing eligibility of persons for the Gen-
eral Assembly. changing the refer-
ences to certain districts or subdis-
tricts from which Delegates and Sena-
tors are elected, abolishing certain
residence requirements and establish-
ing new residence requirements, re-
numbering where appropriate, gen-
erally relating to residence require-
ments of Delegates and Senators,
correcting an error therein and pro-
viding for the submission of these-
amendments to the qualified voters
of the State of Maryland for their
adoption or rejection. By proposing
an amendment to the Constitution of'
-Maryland Article III-Legislative De-
partment Section 9.
Sccrtost 1. Be it enacted by the Gen--

erat Assembly of Maryland. (Three-
fifths of all the members elected to
each of the two Houses concurring).
That the following be and the same is
hereby proposed as an amendment to
Section 9 of Article III-Legislative
Department. of the Constitution of
Maryland, the same, if adopted by the
legally qualified voters of the State, as
herein provided, to become a part of
the Constitution of Maryland:

Article III-Legislative Department,
9.
[No] A person [[shall BE]] IS

eligible TO SERVE  as a Senator or
Delegate, who Hat the time]] ON'
THE DATE of his election, (I), is [not]
a citizen of the State of Maryland,
[ [and) ] (2) [ who] 1 has not resided
therein[ [.111 for at least [(three years))
ONE YEAR[[,]] next preceding [[the
dIi of his election,]] THAT DATE. 
[and the last year thereof, in the
County, or in the Legislative District
of Baltimore City, which he may be
chosen to represent, if such County. or
Legislative District of said City, shall
have been so long established; and if
not, then in the County, or City, front
which, in whole, or in part, the same
may have been formed;] AND (3),
WITH RESPECT TO ANY PERSON
ELECTED AFTER 1974, IF THE
I [ LEG !SLAT IVE OR DELEGATE)]
DISTRICT WHICH HE[[MAY 13E11
HAS BEEN CHOSEN TO REPRE-
SENT HAS BEEN ESTABLISHED
FOR AT LEAST [[ONE YEART]
SIX MONTHS PRIOR TO THE DATE.
OF HIS ELECTION, [[HE SHALL
HAVE]] HAS RESIDED IN THAT'
[[LEGISLATIVE OR DELEGATE]]
DISTRICT[f, AS THE CASE MAY
BE,]] FOR [[ONE YEAR]] SIX
MONTHS NEXT PRECEDING THAT
DATE.
IVTHE [[LEGISLATIVE OR

DELEGATE]] DISTRICT WHICH
[[HE MAY BE]] THE PERSON HAS 
BEEN CHOSEN TO REPRESENT'
[[WAS]] HAS BEEN ESTABLISHED
LESS THAN [[ONE YEAR]] SIX
MONTHS PRIOR TO THE DATE-OF
HIS ELECTION, THEN [(HE
SHALL]], IN ADDITION TO (I)
AND (2) ABOVE,  HE SHALL  HAVE
RESIDED IN THE [[LEGISLATIVE
OR DELEGATE]] DISTRICT[[. AS
THE CASE MAY BE,]] FOR AS.
LONG AS IT HAS BEEN ESTAB-
LISHED.
[nor shall any] A nerson ([SHALL

be]] IS eligible  TO SERVE  as a Sena-
tor, [unless] IF he [[shall haven
HAS attained the age of twenty-five-
years, [nor] [ [AND]] OR as a Dele-
gate. [unless] IF he [Tsfiall have]] '
HAS attained the age of twenty-one

Yeari, ([at the time]] ON THE DATE 
of his election.

SEC. 2. And be it further enacted,
That the aforegoing section hereby pro-
posed as an amendment to the Consti-
tution of' Maryland, at the next gen-
eral election to be held in this State in
November, 1974, shall be submitted to
the legal and qualified voters thereof
for their adoption or rejection In pur-
suance of directions contained in Arti-
cle XIV of the Constitution of this
State. At that general election, the
vote on this proposed amendment to
the Constitution shall be by ballot, and
upon each ballot there shall be printed
the words "For the Constitutional
Amendments" and "Against the Con-
-stitutional Amendments", as now pro-
vided by law. Immediately after the
election, all returns shall be made to
the Governor of the vote for and against
the proposed amendment, as directed
by Article XIV of the Constitution, and
further proceedings bad in a cc or dance'

with Article XIV.
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BUSINESS AND THE STOCK MARKET
Medical Equipment
Industry Still Prospers
By Babson's Reports Inc.,

Wellesley Hills, Mass., Octob-

er 24, 1974—In 1973 the typ-
ical medical and hospital sup-
ply company had an earnings
gain of about 20% over that

,of the prior year. Another
good increase is being racked
up this year. Furthermore, the
prospects for additional gains

as the 1970s move along look
very bright. Overall spending
for health care continues to
represent an increasingly
large share of total personal
spending.
Even though most of the

important companies engaged

in the business of supplying
hospitals, nursing homes, and
the like with medical equip-

ment are still experiencigg
good sales and earnings in-
creases, one would never know
it by looking at the prices at
which their stocks are selling.

Over the past year or two
they have all fallen sharply.
The prices of the stocks of
such companies as Barnes En-
gineering, Damon Corp., Bio-
Dynamics, Cordis, Cenco, and
some others are only a frac-
tion of , what they were in

BALLOT LABEL AS IT WILL APPEAR
ON THE VOTING MACHINE

QUESTION NO. 6
CONSTITUTIONAL
AMENDMENT

AN ACT clarifying provisions con-
cerning eligibility of persons for the
General Assembly, changing the
references to Districts or Subdis-
tricts from which Delegates and
Senators are elected, abolishing cer-
tain residence requirements, and es-
tablishing new residence require-
ments.

CHAPTER 881
(Question NO. '7)

AN ACT concerning Elective Fran-
chise-Absentee Voting FOR the pur-
pose of permitting the General As-
sembly to provide by suitable enact-
ment for. voting by certain qualified
voters and providing for the submis-
sion of this amendment to the quali-
fied voters of the State of Maryland 
for their adoption or rejection. By
proposing an amendment to the Con-
stitution of Maryland Article 1-Elec-
tive Franchise Section IA.
SECTION I. Be it enacted by the Gen-

eral Assembly of Maryland, (Three-
fifths of all the members elected to
each of the two Houses concurring),
That the following be and the same is
hereby proposed as an amendment to
Section IA of Article I of the Consti-
tution of Maryland, the same, if adopted
by the legally qualified voters of the
State, as herein provided, to become a
part of the Constitution of Maryland:

Article 1
7A.
The General Assembly of Maryland

shall have power to provide by suitable
enactment for voting by qualified voters
of the State of Maryland who are ab-
sent at the time of any election [[from
the ward or election district]] in which
they are entitled to vote and for vat-
ing by other qualified voters who are
unable to vote personally [by reason
of physical disability which shall con-,
fine said voters to a hospital or cause
them to be confined to bed,] and for
the manner in which and the time and
place at which such absent voters may
vote, and for the canvass and return
of their votes.

SEC. 2. And be it further enacted,
That theoaforegoing section hereby pro-
posed as an amendment to the Consti-
tution of Maryland, at the next gen-
eral election to be held in this State in
November, 1974, shall be submitted to
the legal and qualified voters thereof
for their adoption or rejection in pur-
suance of directions contained in Arti-
cle XIV of the Constitution of this
State. Al that general election, the
vote on this proposed amendment to
the Constitution shall be by ballot, and
upon each ballot there shall be printed
the words "For the Constitutional
Amendments" and "Against the Con-
stitutional Amendments", as now pro-
vided by law, Immediately after the
election, all returns shall be made to
the Governor of the vote for and against
the proposed amendment, ea directed
by Article XIV of the Constitution.
and further proceedings had in accord-
since with Article XIV.

BALLOT LABEL AS IT WILL APPEAR
ON THE VOTING MACHINE

QUESTION NO. 7
CONSTITUTIONAL,
AMENDMENT

AN ACT permitting the General.
Assembly to provide by suitable
enactment for voting by qualified
voters of the State who are absent
at the time of any election in which
they are entitled to vote and for
voting by other qualified voters who
are unable to vote personally.

CHAPTER 882
(Question No. 8)

AN ACT concerning Governor-Com-
pensation FOR the purpose of increas-
ing the salary of the Governor and
submitting this amendment  to the
qualified voters of the State of Mary-
land  for their adoption or rejection.
By proposing an amendment to the
Constitution of the State of Mary-
land Article II-Executive Depart-
ment Section 21.
SECTION Be it enacted by the Gen-

eral Assembly of Maryland, (Three-
fifths of all the members elected to
each of the two Houses concurring),
That the following be and the same is
hereby proposed as an amendment to
Section -I of Article II-Executive De-
partment, of the Constitution of Mary-
land. the same, if adopted by the legally
qualified voters of the State. as herein
provided, to become a part of the Con-
stitution of Maryland:

Article II-Executive Department
21.

The Governor shall reside at the seat
of government, and, from and after the
fourth Wednesday in January [1967]
1975. shall receive for his services an
annual salary of [Twenty-five Thou-
sand Dollars.] [[S48,000]] [[$50,000]]
;45.000.

Sac. 2. And be it further enacted.
That the aforegoing section hereby pro-
posed as an amendment to the Consti-
tution of Maryland, at the next gen-
eral election to be held in this State in
November, 1974. shall be submitted to
the legal and qualified voters thereof
for their adoption or rejection in pur-
suance of directions contained in Arti-
cle XIV of the Constitution of this
State. At that general election, the
vote on this proposed amendment to
the Constitution shall be by ballot, and
upon each ballot there shall be printed
the words "For the Constitutional
Amendments" and ''Against the Con-
stitutional Amendments", as now pro-
aided by law. Immediately after the
election, all returns shall be made to
the Governor of the vote for and against
the proposed amendment, as directed
by Article XIV of the Constitution, and
further proceedings had in accordance
with Article XIV,

BALLOT LABEL AS IT WILL APPEAR
ON THE VOTING MACHINE

QUESTION NO. 8
CONSTITUTIONAL. 

AMENDMENTAN ACT increasing the annual
salary of the Governor to $45,000.

CHAPTER 883
(Question No. 9)

AN ACT concerning Legislative Bills-
Presentment, Signing, Veto, an& Ef-
fective Date [ [ and Referendum]]
FOR the purpose of making certain
changes relating to the presentment.
signing, veto, and effective date [(and
referendum]] of bills that have
passed the General Assembly, cor-
recting certain language, and provid-
ing for the submission of these
amendments to the qualified voters
of the State of Maryland for their
adoption or rejection. By proposing
an amendment to the Constitution
of Maraland Article II-Executive De-
partment Section 17. By proposing
an amendment to the Constitution of
Maryland Article III-Legislative De-
partment Section 30 and 31. [(By
proposing an amendment to the Con-
stitution of Maryland Article XVI-

. The Referendum Section 1(a), 2 and
3(b)I].
SECTION 1. Be it enacted by the Cen-

tral Assembly of Maryland, (Three-
Ifths of all the members elected to
each of the two Houses concurring),
That the following be and the same is
kereby proposed as an amendment to
Section 17 of Article II-Executive De-
partment, of the Constitution of Mary-
land, the same, if adopted by the

ie 
golly qualifiedvoters of the State, as
rein provided, to become a part of
e Constitution of Maryland:
Article 11-Executive Department

17.
To guard against hasty or partial

legislation and encroachment of the
Legislative Department upon the co-
ordinate Executive and Judicial De-
partments, every Bill which shall have
passed the House of. Delegates[ [,] ]
and the Senate shall, before it becomes
I. law, [(BE SEALED WITH THE
tEREAT SEAL, AND)] be presented
[BY THE PRESIDING OFFICER
F THE .HOUSE IN WHICH IT
RIGINATED]] to the Governor of
e State: __[_;]_ [ [WITHIN SIX DAYS
F PASS IF THE GENERAL
SSEMBLY IS IN SESSION. ANY
ILL PASSED DURING THE LAST
EN DAYS OF A REGULAR OR
PECIAL SESSION SHALL BE
EALED WITH THE GREAT SEAL
ND PRESENTED BY THE PRE-
IDING OFFICER OF THE HOUSE

WHICH IT ORIGINATED TO
GOVERNOR NO LATER THAN

DAYS AFTER ADJOURNMENT.
WITHIN 30 DAYS AFTER. PRE-
IENTMENT.11 if [he, [(THE GOV-
410101132 ,..., approves lao shall alga

... but -r /..1C iw somt return It with
his oto-ctioos to the House in which
it originated, which House shall enter
the objections at large on its Journal
and proceed to reconsider the Bill; if,
after such reconsideration, three-fifths
of the members elected to that House
shall pass the Bill, it shall be sent
with the objections to the Other House,
by which it shall likewise be recon-
sidered, and if it pass by three-fifths
of the members elected to that House
it shall become a law; but in all such
cases the votes of both Houses shall
he determined by yeas and nays, and
the names of the persons voting for
and against the Bill shall be entered
on the Journal of each House respec-
tively. If any Bill PRESENTED TO 
THE GOVERNOR WHILE THE
GENERAL  ASSEMBLY IS IN SES-
SION shall not be returned by [(the
Governor]] HIM WITH HIS OBJEC-
TIONS_ within six days (Sundays ex-
cepted), ((after it shall have been
presented to him, WHILE THE GEN-
ERAL ASSEMBLY IS IN SESSION]]
the same shall be a law in like manner
as if he signed RE, unless the General
Assembly shall, by adjournment, pre-
vent its return, in which crse it shall
not be a law]. unless the General As-
sembly shall, by adjournment, prevent
its return, in which case it shall not
be a_law, ,
ANY BILL PRESENTED TO THE 

GOVERNOR WITHIN SIX DAYS 
(SUNDAYS EXCEPTED), PRIOR TO 
ADJOURNMENT OF ANY SESSION 
OF THE GENERAL ASSEMBLY  OR 
AFTER SUCH ADJOURNMENT,
SHALL BECOME LAW WITHOUT
THE GOVERNOR'S SIGNATURE 
UNLESS IT SHALL BE VETOED
BY THE GOVERNOR WITHIN 30 
DAYS AFTER ITS PRESENTMENT.
Any bill [[which is]] SO vetoed by

the Governor ([following the adjourr>
ment of the General Assembly]][,
or any bill which fails to become a
law by reason of not having been
signed by the Governor following the
adjournment of the General Assembly,]
shall be returned to the House in which
it originated, immediately after said
House shall have organized at the
next regular or special session of the
General Assembly. Said bill may then
oe reconsidered according to, the pro-
cedure specified hereinabove. I If the
bill is]] ANY BILL [passed] EN-
ACTED over the veto of the Gov-
ernor. [[it]] OR A,-4Y BILL WHICH 
SHALL BECOME LAW  AS THE RE-
WLT OF THE FAILURE OF THE
GOVERNOR TO ACT WITHIN THE 
TIME HEREIN ABOVE SPECIFIED,
shall take effect [on June I following,]
30 DAYS AFTER THE GOVERNOR'S
VETO IS OVER-RIDDEN, OR ON 
THE DATE SPECIFIED IN THE
BILL. WHICHEVER IS LATER. un-
less the bill is an emergency measure
[(to]]  . IN WHICH EVENT IT
SHALL take effect when [passed]
ENACTED. No such vetoed Bill shall
be returned to the Legislature when a
new General Assembly of Maryland
has been elected and sworn since the
passage of the vetoed Bill.
([IF THE GOVERNOR NEITHER

SIGNS NOR VETOES THE BILL
WITHIN THE TIME HEREIN PRE-
SCRIBED. THE BILL SHAL1. BE-
COME LAW.]]
The Governor shall have power to

disapprove of any item or items of any
Bills making appropriations of money
embracing distinct items, and the part
or parts of the Bill approved shall be
the law, and the item or items of ap-
propriations disapproved shall be void
unless repassed according to the rules
or limitations prescribed for the pas-
sage of other Bills oaer the Executive
veto.

SEC. 2. And be it further enacted,
(Three-fifths of all the members
elected to each of the two Houses
concurring), That the following be and

' the same is hereby proposed as an
amendment to Section 30 and 31 of
Article III-Legislative Department, 'of

• the Constitution of Mary!..-d, the
same. if •odopted by the legally quali-
fied voters of the State. as herein pro-
vided, to become a part of the Con-
stitution of Maryland:

Article 111-Legislative Department
30.
Every bill, when passed by the Gen-

eral Assembly, and sealed with the
Great Seal, shall be presented BY THE
PRESIDING OFFICER OF TH E
HOUSE IN WHICH IT ORIGINATED
to the Governor]. who,] FOR Ills
APPROVAL 
OF PASSAGE IF THE GENERAL
ASSEMBLY IS IN SESSION. ANY
BILL]] ALL BILLS PASSED DUR-
ING [ [THE LAST TEN DAYS OF]]
A 'REGULAR OR SPECIAL SESSION
SHALL BE PRESENTED TO THE
GOVERNOR FOR HIS APPROVAL
NO LATER THAN [ [15] ] 29_ DAYS
AFTER ADJOURNMENT. WITHIN_

([THE CDVERNORa] ] if [ [he] i
THE GOVERNOR approves [[it.]]
THE BILL. HE shall sign the same in
the presence of the presiding officers
and Chief Clerks of the Senate and
House of Delegates. Every Law shall
be recorded in the office of the Court
of Appeals, and in due time, be
printed, published and certified under
the Great Seal, to the several C mina,
in the same manner as has been here-
tofore usual in this State.
31.
[No Law passed by the General As-

sembly shall take effect, until the first
day of June, next after the Session,
at which it may be passed, unless it
be otherwise expressly declared there-
in.] A LAW PASSED BY THE GEN-
ERAL ASSEMBLY SHALL TAKE 
EFFECT THE  FIRST DAY OF 
JUNE NEXT AFTER THE SESSION
AT WHICH-TT—MAY BE PASSED-:
UNLESS IT BE OTHERWISE EX-
PRESSLY DECLARED THEREIN OR 
PROVIDED FOR IN THIS CONSTI-
TUTION. 
[(THE GENERAL ASSEMBLY
MAY BY PUBLIC GENERAL LAW
ESTABLISH A UNIFORM EFFEC-
TIVE DATE FOR ALL BILLS
WHICH IT PASSES AND WHICH
ARE SIGNED BY THE GOVERNOR.
IN NO EVENT SHALL ANY BILL
TAKE EFFECT PRIOR TO 30 DAYS
AFTER IT HAS BEEN SIGNED BY
THE GOVERNOR UNLESS IT IS
AN EMERGENCY MEASURE TO
TAKE EFFECT WHEN ENACTED.
AND THE GENERAL ASSEMBLY
MAY ESTABLISH A LATER EFFEC-
TIVE DATE IN ANY BILL WHICH
IT PASSES. IF THE GOVERNOR
NEITHER SIGNS NOR VETOES THE
BILL WITHIN THE TIME HEREIN
PRESCRIBED, THE BILL, SHALL
BECOME LAW.
BILLS PASSED OVER THE GOV-

ERNOR'S VETO SHALL TAKE EF-
FECT 30 DAYS AFTER THE GOV-
ERNOR'S VETO IS OVER-RIDDEN
OR AT A LATER DATE IF SPECI-
FIED IN THE BILL.
SEC. 3. And be it further enacted,

(Three-fifths of all the members elected
to each of the two Houses concurring),
That the following be and the same is
hereby proposed as an amendment to
Section 1(a), 2 and 3(b) of Article
XV1-The Referendum, of the Consti-
tution of Maryland, the same, if
adopted by the legally qualified voters
of the State, as herein provided, to be-
come a part of the Constitution of
Maryland:

Article XVI-The Referendum
1.
(a) The people reserve to themselves

power known as The Referendum, by
petition to have submitted to the regis-
tered voters of the State, to approve
or reject at the polls, any Act, or
part of any. Act of the General As-
sembly, if approved by the Governor,]]
[or,] ([if passed by the General As-
sembly over the veto of the Governor;
OR IF THE BILL BECOMES LAW
WITHOUT THE SIGNATURE OF
THE GOVERNOR.]]
[in]
[No law] [(ANY BILL enacted, by

the General Assembly shall take ef-
fect]] (until the first day of June
next after the session at which it may
be passed,) [[30 DAYS AFTER IT
HAS BEEN SIGNED BY THE GOV-
ERNOR, OR AT A LATER DATE IF
SPECIFIED IN THE BILL, sinless
it]] [contain] ([CONTAINS a Sec-.
tion declaring such law an emergency
law and necessary for the immediate
preservation of the public health or
safety, and passed upon a yea and nay
vote supported by three-fifths of all the
members elected to each of the two
Houses of the General Assembly; pro-
vided, however, that said. period of
suspension may be extended as pro-
vided in Section 3 (b) hereof. I01 [be-fore said first day of June] f
WITHIN 30 DAYS OF EITHER THE
SIGNING BY THE GOVERNOR. OR
THE OVERRIDING OF 11115 'VETO,

OR WITHIN 30 DAYS AFTER THE
BILL 'BECOMES LAW WITHOUT
THE SIGNATURE]] ._1[OF THE
GOVERNOR, OR PRIOR TO THE
LATER EFFECTIVE DATE SPECI-
FIED 11.1 THE BILL, there shall have
been filed with the Secretary of]]
[the] ([State a petition to refer to a
vote of the people any law or part of
a law capable of referendum, as in
this Article provided, the same shall
be referred by the Secretary of State
to such vote, and shall net become a
law or take effect until thirty days
after its approval by a majority of the
electors voting thereon at the next en-
suing election held throughout the
State for Members of the House of
Representatives of the United States.
An emergency law shall remain in
force notwithstanding such petition,
but shall stand repealed thirty days
after having been reacted by a ma-
jority of the qualified electors voting
thereon; provided, however, that no
measure creating or abolishing any
office, or changing the .salary, term or
duty of any officer, or granting any
franchise or special privilege, or cre-
ating any vested right or interest, shall
ho enacted as an emergency law. No
law making any appropriation for
maintaining the State Government. or
for maintaining or aiding any public
institution, not exceeding the next
previous appropriation for the same
purpose, shall be subject to rejection
or repeal under this Section. The in-
crease in any such appropriation for
maintaining or aiding any public in-
stitution shall only take effect as in
the case of other laws, and such in-
crease or any part thereof specified in
the petition, may be referred to a
vote of the people upon petition.]]
([3.
(b) If more than one-half, but less

than the full number of signatures re-
quired to complete any referendum
petition against any law passed by the
General Assembly, be filed with THE
Seaaetary of State]] [before the first
day of !tined [[ WITHIN 30 DAYS
AFTER IT HAS EITHER BEEN
SIGNED NY THE GOVERNOR OR
THE GOVERNOR'S VETO IS OVER-
RIDDEN, OR WITHIN 30 .DAYS
AFTER IT HAS BECOME LAW
WITHOUT THE GOVERNOR'S SIG-
NATURE, the time for the law to
take effect, and for filing the remainder
of signatures to complete the petition
shall be extended]] [to the thirtieth
day of the same month.] [ [FOR
THIRTY DAVIS THEREAFTER, with
like effect]]
SEC. [[4]] 3. And be it further en-

acted, That 'The aforegoing section
hereby proposed as an amendment to
the Constitution of Maryland, at the
next general election to be held in
this State in November, 1974, shall be
submitted to the legal and qualified
voters thereof for their adoption or
rejection in pursuance of directions
containad in Article XIV of the Con-.
stitution of this State. At that general
election, the vote on this proposed
amendment to the Constitution shall
be by ballot, and upon each ballot
there shall be - printed the words "For
the Constitutional Amendments" and
"Against the Constitutioral Amend-
ments", as now provided by law, Im-
mediately after the election, all returns
shall be made to the Governor of the
vote for and against the proposed
amendment, as c''..ected by Article XIV
of the Constitution. and further pro-
ceedings had in accordance with Arti-
cle XIV.

BALLOT LABEL AS IT WILL APPEAR
ON THE VOTING MACHINE
- ------------ -

QUESTITial NO. 9
CONSTITUTIONAL
AM EN DMEN T

AN ACT making certain changes
relating to the presentment. veto,
and effective date of hills that have
passed the General Assembly.

CHAPTER 8116
(Question No. 10)

AN ACT concerning Commission on
Judicial Disabilities FOR the purpose
of authorizing the Commission on
Judicial Disabilities • to recommend
to the. Court of Appeals the censure
or other appropriate disciplining of a
judge and to issue a reprimand; au-
thorizing the Court of Appeals to
ado* LACS governing the confiden-
tiality of Commission proceedings.
and the record thereof filed in the
Court of Appeals; clarifying the
power of the Court of Appeals to
act upon the recommendation of the
Commission; and submitting this
aniendnient to the I (Minified]]
oi,lified voters of the State for
adoption or rejection. By proposing
an amendment to the Constitution of
Maryland Article IV-Judiciary De-
partment Section 4B.
SEcTioN 1. Be it enacted by the Gen-

eral Assembly of Maryland, (Three-
fifths of all the members elected to
each of the two Houses concurring),
That the following be and the same is
hereby proposed as an amendment to
Section 4/3 of Article IV-judiciary
Department, of the Constitution of .
Maryland. the same, if adopted by the
legally. qualified voters of the State,
as hetein provided, to become a part
of the Constitution of Maryland:

4B. 
Article 1V-Judiciary Department

(a) The Commission on Judicial Disa-
bilities [shall have I HAS the power to
investigate complaints against any
judge of the Court of Appeals, any
intermediate courts of appeal. the Cir-
cuit Courts, the Supreme Bench of
Baltimore City. THE DISTRICT
COURT OF MARYLAND, the Or-
phans' Court [and all other judges ap-
pointed or elected if the full term of
the office is not less than four years
(including a judge holding office on the
date of adoption of this amendment)];*
and to conduct hearings concerning
[the removal or retirement of a judge]
SUCH COMPLAINTS, administer oaths
and affirmations, issue process to com-
pel the attendance of witnesses and
the production of evidence, and require
persons to testify and produce evidence
by • granting them immunity from
prosecution or from penalty or for-
feiture. The Commission [shall have]
HAS the power to ISSUE A REPRI-
MAND AND THE POWER TO rec-
ommend to the Court of Appeals the
removal for retirement of a judge.],
CENSURE OR OTHER APPROPRI-
ATE DISCIPLINING OF A JUDGE
OR, IN AN APPROPRIATE CASE,
RETIREMENT. All proceedings, testi-
mony, and evidence before the Com-
mission shall be confidential and privi-
leged. except [that] AS 'PROVIDED
BY RULE OF THE COURT OF AP-
PEALS; the record and any proceed-
ing filed with the Court of Appeals
shall lose its confidential character,
EXCEPT AS ORDERED BY THE
COURT OF APPEALS. No judge
shall participate AS A MEMBER OF
THE COMMISSION in any proceed-
ings involving his own [removal or
retirement] CONDUCT, and- the Gov-
ernor shall appoint another judge as a
substitute member of the Commission
for those proceedings. The Court of
Appeals shall prescribe by rule the
means to implement and enforce the
powers of the Commission and the
practice and procedure before the
Commission.
(b) Upon ANY recommendation of

the Commission [that a judge be re-
moved from office, or that he be re-
tired], the Court of Appeals, after a
hearing and upon a finding of miscon-
duct while in office, or of persistent
failure to perform the duties of his
office or of conduct prejudicial to the
proper administration of justice, may
remove the judge from office or may
censure OR OTHERWISE DISCI-
PLINE him, or the Court of Appeals.
after hearing and upon a finding of
disability which is or is likely to be-
come permanent and which seriously
interferes with the perfcgmance of his
duties. may retire the Wee from of-
fice. A judge removed under this sec-
tion, and his surviving spouse, shall
have the rights and privileges accruing
from his judicial service only to the
extent prescribed by the order of re-
moval. A judge [retiring] RETIRED
under this section shall have the rights
and privileges prescribed by law for
other retired judges. No judge OF THE
COURT OF APPEALS shall sit in
judgment in any hearing involving his
own [removal or retirement] CON-
DUCT.
(c) This section is alternative to,

and cumulative with, the methods of
retirement and removal provided in
Sections 3 and 4 of this Article, and
in Section 26 of Article Ill of this
Constitution.
SEC, 2. And be it further enacted,

That the aforegoing section hereby pro-
posed as an amendment to the Con-
stitution of Maryland, at the next gen-
eral election to be held in this State in
November, 1974, shall be submitted to
the legal and qualified voters thereof
for their adoption or rejection in pur-
suance of directions contained in Arti-
cle XIV of tho Constitution of this
State. At that metal CICCL1OLIa LbC

vote on this proposed amendtnent to
the Constitution shall be by ballot, and
upon each ballot there 6/241 be printe4
the words 'Tor the Constitutional
Amendments" and "Against the Con-
stitutional Amendments", as now pro-
vided by law. Immediately after the
election, all returns shall be made to.
the Governor of the vote for and
against the proposed amendment, as di-
rected by Article XIV of the Consti-
tution, and further proceedings had in
accordance with Article XIV,

BALLOT LABEL AS IT WILL APPEAR
ON THE VOTING MACHINE

QUESTION NO. 10
CONSTITUTIONAL
AMENDMENT

AN ACT authorizing the- Com-
mission on Judicial Disabilities to
recommend to the Court of Appeals
the censure or other -appropriate
disciplining of a judee and to issue
a reprimand; authorizing the Court
of Appeals to adopt rules governing
the confidentiality of Commission
proceedings and the record thereof;
clarifying the power of the Court of
Appeals to act upon the recom-
mendation of the Commission.

CHAPTER 887
(Question No. 11)

AN ACT concerning Carroll
[[County]] ([and]]  Garrett_ and,
Montgomery --rounties - Surveyor
FOR the purpose of abolish-
ing the office of [ [the Carroll]]
County Surveyor in Carroll and Gar-
rett  Counties  and, after a certain1
time, in Montgomery County, and
submitting this amendment to the
„qualifie-a voters of the State for their.
adoption or rejection. By proposing
an amendment to the Constitution of
Maryiand Article VII-Stindry 011ia
cers Section 2.
SECTION I. Be it enacted by the Gen-

erat Assembly of Maryland, ( three-
fiftas of all the members elected to
each of the two Houses concurring),
That the' following be it'd the same
is hereby proposed as an amendment
to Section 2 of Article VII-Sundry
Officers, of the Constitution of Mary-
land, the same, if adopted by the
legally qualified voters of the State,
as herein provided, to become a part
of the Constitution of Maryland:

2 
Article VII-Sundry Officers

.
(a) The qualified voters of each

County shall, on the Tuesday next
after the first Monday in the month of
November, in the year nineteen hun-
ched and fifty-eight, and on the same
day . in every fourth year thereafter.
elect a Surveyor for each County whose
term of office sla 'I commence on the
first Monday of January next ensuing
their election, and whose duties and
compensation shall be the same as are
now or may hereafter be prescribed
by Law. And any vacancy in the Office
of Surveyor, shall be filled by the Com-
missioners of the cotrities, or by the
County Council of Chartered Counties
for the residue of the term.
tb) This section shall not apply to

Allegany, Anne Arundel. Baltimore,
Calvert, Caroline, CARROLL, Cecil,
Dorchester, Frederick, GARRET!')
Harford. Howard, Kent, mobrn
GOMERY, Prince George's, Queen
Anne's, St. Mary's, Somerset, Talbot,
Washington, Wicomico, and. Worcestet
counties. PROVIDED, HOWEVER
THAT THE Or-FiCE-- OF-COUNTal
SURVEYOR IN MONTGOMERY
-COUNT\ -NITALT—FIDT BE A 801..
[SHED UNTIL TIFE-COMPLETIOal
OT-THE 1---ERNF-0-E ANY INCUM-
BENT ELECTED AT THE ELEC.
TION AT WHICH THIS CLAUSE IS
APPROVED BY THE VOTERS.
Sec. 2. And be it rather

That the aforegoing section hereby pro-
posed as an amendment to the Con-
stitution of Maryland. at the next gen-
eral election to be held in this State in
November, 1974, shall be submitted to
the legal and qualified voters thereof
for their adoption or rejection in pur-
suance of directions contained in Arti.
dc XIV of the Constitution of this State,
At that general election, the vote oil
this proposed amendment to the Con.
nitution shall be by ballot, and upon
each ballot there shall be printed the
words "For the Constitutional Amend-
ments" and "Against the Constitutional
Amendments", as now provided by law,
Immediately after the election, all re-
turns shall be made to the Governot
of the vote for and against the pro-
posed amendment, as directed by Arti.
de XIV of the Constitution, and fur.
(her proceedings had in accordance with
Article XIV.

BALLOT LABEL AS IT WILL APPEAR
ON THE VOTING MACHINE

QUESTION NO. I
CONSTITUTIONAL
AMENDMENT

AN ACT abolishing the office of
County Surveyor in Carroll and
Garrett Counties and, after a cer-
tain time, in Montgomery County.

CHAPTER 888
(Question No. 12)

AN ACT concerning City of Bahl.
more Financing Loam
FOR the purpose of adding a new
Article to the Constitution to out
thorize the Mayor and City Council
of Baltimore to make, guarantee or
insure financial loans for or in cort•
nection with the purchase, acquisi.
lion, Construction, erection, or de-
velopment of residential property in
Baltimore City, including any land
necessary therefor, and submitting
this amendment to the qualified
voters of the State for adoption of
rejection. By proposing an amend+
merit to the Constitution of Mary..
land, By adding New Article XI-H-]
City of Baltimore-Residential Fi-
nancing Loans Section I and 2.
SECTION 1. Be it enacted by the Gen-

eral Assembly of Maryland, (Three-
fifths of all the members elected to
each of the two Houses concurring).
That the following be and the same is
hereby proposed as an amendment td
the Constitution of Maryland, by add.
ing new Article XI-H-City of Balti-
more-Residential Financing Loans,
Sections I and 2, the same, if adopted
by the legally -qualified voters of the
State, as herein provided, to become a
part of the Constitution of Maryland:

-ARTICLE XI-H
CITY OF BALTIMORE-

RESIDENTIAL FINANCING LOANS
I. THE GENERAL ASSEMBLY OF

MARYLAND, BY PUBLIC LOCAL
LAW. MAY AUTHORIZE THE
MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF'
BALTIMORE:
(A) TO MAKE OR CONTRACT TO
MAKE FINANCIAL LOANS TO
ANY PERSON OR OTHER LEGAL
ENTITY TO BE USED FOR OR IN
CONNECTION WITH THE PUR-
CHASE, ACQUISITION. CONSTRUCa
TION. ERECTION OR DEVELOP:
MENT OF BUILDINGS OR STRUC-
TURES, INCLUDING ANY LAND
NECESSARY THEREFOR. WITHIN
THE BOUNDARIES OF BALTIMORE
CITY. WHICH BUILDINGS OR
STRUCTURES ARE TO BE USED
OR OCCUPIED FOR RESIDENTIAL
PURPOSES.
(B) TO GUARANTEE OR INSURE,

FINANCIAL LOANS MADE BY
THIRD PARTIES TO ANY PER-
SON OR OTHER LEGAL ENTITY
WHICH ARE TO BE USED FOR OR,
IN CONNECTION WITH THE PURa
CHASE, ACQUISITION. CONSTRUC-
TION, ERECTION OR DEVELOP-
MENT OF BUILDINGS OR STRU
TURES, INCLUDING ANY LAN
NECESSARY THEREFOR. WITHI
THE BOUNDARIES OF BALT
MORE CITY. WHICH BUILDING
OR STRUCTURES ARE TO B
USED OR OCCUPIED FOR RESI4
DENTIAL PURPOSES.
(C) ANY AND ALL •FINANCIAZ
LOANS l'afADE BY THE MAYOR
AND CITY COUNCIL OF HALTS
MORE; ANY AND ALL GUARAN.
TEES OR INSURANCE COMMIT
MENTS MADE BY THE MAYOR
AND CITY COUNCIL OF HALT!
MORE IN CONNECTION WITE
ANY OF THE LOANS; AND ANY
AND ALL MONEY USED OR EX
FENDED BY THE MAYOR AN
CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE I
CONNECTION WITH THE LOAN
GUARANTEES. OR INSURANC
COMMITMENTS. PURSUANT T
THE POWER AND AUTHOR1T
HEREINABOVE VESTED IN TH
MUNICIPALITY. AND ANY AN
ALL ACTS PERFORMED BY T
MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL 0
BALTIMORE IN CONNECTIO
WITH ANY- POWERS WHICH MA
BE GRANTED TO THE MAYO
AND CITY COUNCIL OF BAL
MORE PURSUANT TO THIS ARTS
CLE, ARE ALL DECLARED TO BE
NEEDED, CONTRACTED FOR. EX
PENDED OR EXERCISED FOR
PUBLIC LI313.

(D) I/4 THE EVENT OF
CONFLICT BETVVEEN THE PRV'aiisloNs OF THIS ARTICLE AN

..BOSE OF ARTICLE XI. SEC' 1-10
,'7, OF THE CONSTITUTION 
14AR VTAND, OR ANY OTHER
PROVISIONS OF THE CONSTITI1TION, THEN THE PROVisio,:s

. THIS ARTICLE SHALL CON i ROL.,
2. THE GENERAL ASSEMBLY OP

/MARYLAND MAY GRANT To THE,
MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OP
BALTIMORE ANY AND ALL ADDL.
T1ONAL POWER AND AUTHORITY
NECESSARY OR PROPER TO
CARRY INTO FULL FORCE AN1
EFFECT ANY AND ALL OF TH
SPECIFIC POWERS WHICH TH

1GENERAL ASSEMBLY OF MARY.,LAND IS AUTHORIZED TO GRANT
iTO THE MAYOR AND CITY COON.
IIC1L OF BALTIMORE PURSUANY
ITO THIS ARTICLE, AND TO
'35ULLY ACCOMPLISH ANY AND
LL OF THE PURPOSES AND 013:

JECTS CONTEMPLATED BY THE
lPROVISIONS OF THIS ARTICLE.
' ROVIDED SUCH ADDITIONAL,
IPOWER OR AUTHORITY IS NOT
INCONSISTENT WITH THE 7-1,11MS
AND PROVISIONS OF THIS ARTI-
CLE OR WITH ANY OTHER PRO-
VISION OR PROVISIONS OF THE

VXNSTITUTION OF MARYLAND,CEPT AS PROVIDED IN THIS
ARTICLE. THE GENERAL ASSEM.
BEY MAY PLACE SUCH OTHER
AND FURTHER RESTRICTIONS OR
LIMITATIONS ON THE EXERCISE
OF ANY OF THE POWERS WHICK
IT MAY GRANT TO THE MAYOR.
IAND CITY COUNCIL OF BALTI-
MORE UNDER THE PROVISIONS
OF THIS ARTICLE AS IT MAY
IDEEM PROPER AND EXPEDIENT.

SEC. 2, And be it further enacted.
That the aforegoing [[section]] Arti-
cle hereby proposed as an amendment
to the Constitution of Maryland, :it the
next general election to be held in this
State in November, 1974, shall sub-
tinned to the legal and qualified oters
thereof for their adoption or r. _.ctioa
In pursuance of directions contai, d la
Article XIV of the Constitution this
State. At that general election. tha vote
on this proposed amendment 1,, the
Constitution shall be by ballot, and.
upon each ballot there shall be mted,
the words "For the Consti mat'
Amendments" and "Against the Con-i
stitutional Amendments", as now pro-
vided by law. Immediately after the,
elec-ion. all returns shall be made tae
the Governor of the vote for midi
Against the proposed amendment, asi
directed by Article XIV of the Constia
tution. and further proceedings had in
accordance with Article XIV,

BALLOT LABEL AS IT WILL APPEAR
ON THE VOTING MACHINE

QUESTION NO. 12
CONSTITUTIONAL
AMENDMENT

AN ACT to authorize the Mayor
and City Council. of Baltimore to
make, guarantee or insure financial
loans for or in connection with the
purchase, acquisition, construction,
erection or development of residen-
tial property in Baltimore City, in-
cluding any land necessary therefor.

CHAPTER 889
(Question No. 13)

AN ACT concerning Baltimore City
Criminal Court-Ottice of the Clerk
FOR the purpose of providing that!
in Baltimore City all employ:,: of
the Clerk of the Criminal ('out ' OtaU

. be appointed or removed aca. ding
to the merit system procedure mb-
lished by law tor deputies and c'erks„
clarifying language, and subaatting,
this amendment to the qualified
voters of the State for adoption or re-
jection, By proposing an amen:intent
to the Constitution of Maryland Arti-
cle 1V-Judiciary Department Sec-
tion -26.
SECItON I. Be it enacted by the Gees

teat Assembly of Maryland, (I eree-
fifths of all the members eiccica La
cacti of the two houses concurring),
That the following be and tilesalea is
hereey proposed as an amendateto to
Section 20 of Article 1V-Judiciary De-
Newmann, of the Constitution 01 ..
Led, the same, if ...adopted by -the
let'- a: qualified voters of the State, as
hereia provided, to become a part of -
the Constitution of Maryland:

Article IV-Judiciary Department
26. -

'the [said] Clerks shall appoinf.
sueaect to the confirmation of the
Jutlaas of their respective Courts, as
many deputies under them, as the
[moil Judges shall deem necessary, to,
perform, together with themselves, tha
duties of Inc [said] office, who shall
be removable by the [said] Judges for
incompetency, or neglect of duty, and
whose compensation shall be accord-
ing to existing, or future provisions of
the General Assembly. In Vvashingtoa
County, all deputy clerks and other
clerks shall be appointed pursuant to
and be removable according to the
merit system procedure established by
law for these deputies and clerks. ALL
DEPUTY CLERKS AND OTHER
EMPLOYEES OF THE OFFICE OF.
THE CLERK OF THE CRIMINAL.
COURT OF BALTIMORE CITY, EX-
CEPTING THE CLERK, SHALL BE
SELECTED PURSUANT TO AND
BE REMOVABLE ACCORDING TO
THE MERIT SYSTEM PROCEDURE
ESTABLISHED BY LAW FOR
THESE DEPUTIES AND CLERKS.
ANY EMPLOYEE OF THE OFFICE
OF THE CLERK OF THE CRIM-
INAL COURT OF BALTIMORE
WHO HAS BEEN EMPLOYED FOR
AT LEAST SIX MONTHS ON JULY
1. 1974 SHALL BE A MEMBER Oh-
THE CLASSIFIED SERVICE . OF'
THE STATE [[WITHOUT FURTHER
EXAMINATION OR QUALIFICA:
TION]].

SEc. 2. And be it further enacted,
That the aforegoing section hereby pro-
posed as an amendment to the Con-
stitution of Maryland, at the next gen-
eral election to be held in this State ita
November, 1974, shall be submitted to.
the legal and qualified voters thereof
for their adoption or rejection in pur-
suance of directions contained in Arti-
cle XIV of the Constitution of this
State. At that general election, the vote
on this proposed amendment to the
Constitution shall be by ballot, and
upon each ballot there shall be printed
the words "For the Constitutional
Amendments" and "Against the Con-
stitutional Amendments', as now pro-
vided by law. Immediately after the
election, all returns shall be made to
the Governor of the vote for and
against the proposed amendment. as di-
rected by Article XIV of the Consti-
tution, and further proceedings had its
accordance with Article XIV.

BALLOT LABEL AS IT WILL APPEAR
ON THE VOTING... MACHINE

QUESTION NO. 13
CONSTITUTIONAL
AMENDMENT

AN ACT providing that in Balti-
more City all employees of the
Clerk of the Criminal Court shall
be appointed or removed according
to the Merit System procedure es-
tablished .by law for deputies and
clerks. '

EXPLANATION: CAPITALS INDICATE
MATTER ADDED TO EXISTING
LAW.
[Brackets] indicate matter stricken
from existing law.
[(Double Brackets]] indicate matter
stricken out of bill.
Underlining indicates amendments to
bill.
NOW. THEREFORE. I, MARVIN

MAN DEL. GOVERNOR OF MARY-
LAND, by virtue of the power and au-
thority conferred upon me by the Con-
stitution of Maryland, do ,by this, my
proclamation, ORDER that the bills
proposing the aforegoing amendments
shall be published in at least two news-
papers in each county where, so many
may be published, and where not more
than one may be published, then in that
newspaper, and in three newspapers
published in Baltimore City, once a
'week for four weeks immediately pre-
ceding the General Election to be held
on November 5, 1974, at which elec-
tion the proposed amendments shall be
submitted, in the form prescribed by
the General Assembly, to the qualified
voters of the State for adoption or re-
jection,
GIVEN Under My Hand and the

Great Seal of the State of Maryland. 1
at the City of Annapolis, this 14th day 

Iof August, in the Year of Our Lord.
One Thousand. Nine Hundred and
Seventy-four.

MARVIN MANDEL
By the Governor

-
FRED L.WINELAND
Secretary of State •
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the early 1970s. Even the
stocks of some of the leaders
in the field such as America
Hospital Supply, Baxter,
American Sterilizer, Searle,
and Becton, Dickinson have
taken it on the chin. This
price weakness has been due
chiefly to the general decline
in the stock market, where
selling emphasis has been on
stocks with high price/earn-
ings ratios. In times past the
majority of medical equipment
stocks were generously ap-
oratories, and outpatient care
lie; hence, they have come un-
der especially heavy selling
pressure'.
Industry Outlook
Remains Bright

As already mentioned, total
health care expenditures are
continuing to increase, due
largely to the big jump in the
number of people 65 or older.
This group accounts for more
than one-fOurth of total health
Care spending. Another posi-
tive factor for the medical
equipment field is the persis-
tent need for hospital modern-
ization and renovation both
here and abroad. In additio9,
the industry should benefit
from advanced product pric-
es, new product developments,
and the continued expansion
of nursing homes, medical lab-
oratives, and outpatient care
centers. Furthermore, the
shortage of trained personnel
means more business or cer-
tain makers of time saving
medical supplies. Beyond the
very near term it seems al-
most certain that a national
health bill will be enacted.
When this happens — perhaps
in 1975—it should give a fur-
ther boost to the medical equi )-
ntent industry.
More Participants

Currently there are hul-
dreds of relatively small firms
in the business of producing
medical equipment. Some, of
course, are only one-product
companies. But there are also
a number of very sizable and
prominent corporations that
are dominant in the industry.
Among those are American
Hospital Supply, American
Sterilizer, Baxter Laboratories,
Beckman Instruments, John-
son &Johnson , Milton Roy,
Cenco, and Becton, Dickinson.
Along with these, there ar.-.
some extremely big firms Ow t
produce medical equipment
but whose major interests lie
in other areas. These would
include General Electric, Boe-
ing, RCA, Litton, and Rockwell
International, as well as moq
of the leading drug make:s
such as G. D. Searle.

At the present time, the Re-
search Department of Bab-
son's Reports is advising re-
tention of the stocks of all
major companies involved in
the production of medical sup-
plies. For those who are in-
terested in acquiring represen-
tation in the industry, the
stocks of American Sterilizer,
G. D. Searle, and Becton, Dick-
inson are recommended. The
shares of all three of these
concerns appear to be over-
sold and do not reflect the ex-
cellent growth prospects.
Searle, of course, is primari-
ly a manufacturer of ethical
drugs, but in later years it
has greatly extended its in-
terest in the medical supply
field through acquisitions. If
readers are interested in re-
ceiving free detailed reports
these three recommended Con:-
panies, write to Babson's Re-

ports Inc., Wellesley H ill s,
Massachusetts 02181.

LOOKING FOR A GOOD USED CARP
16-0:4;„ ,

lob; SEE OUR rirt;4416• .1),_

GUARANTEED USED CA
%.• a" '.•

1973 Ford Grand Torino 4-Dr. Sedan; V-8; Auto. Trans;
Power Steering; Air; Vinyl Top; Like New.

1973 Dodge Polara Sport Coupe; V-8; Automatic Trans-
mission; Power Steering; Air Conditioning.

1972 Ford Galaxie 500 4-Dr. Hardtop; V-8; Automatic
,Transmission; Power Steering; Air Conditioning.

1972 Ford Maverick 6 Cyl.; Standard Transmission;
R&H; Good Economy Car.

1971 Chevrolet Impala Sport Coupe; V-8; Automatic
Transmission; l'ower Steering; R&H.

COMPLETE LINE ALLCAR AUTO PARTS
BATTERIES & TIRES

SANDERS GARAGE
—AUTO SALES & SERVICE—

PHONE 447-6151 EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND

PUBLIC SALE
Young Cattle and Hog Dispersal

SATURDAY, NOVEMBER 2, 1974
AT 10:30 A.M.

Farm located along Md. Rt. 76 at Motters, Md., 2
miles east of Mount St. Mary's College, 31/i miles
north of Rocky Ridge, ma.

71 HEAD OF CATTLE
Cattle tested for interstate shipment. 8 springing

heifers, 10 bred heifers, 40 open heifers, 400 to 900
lbs.; 10 Charolias Steers, 400-700 lbs.; 3 Charolias Bulls,
700 lbs.

225 HEAD OF HOGS
From Purebred Yorkshire-Hampshire Cross. This

herd foundation came fom S.P.F. herds in Indiana and
Illinois. They are excellent meat-type hogs. 200 shoats,
40-125 lbs.; 19 bred gilts; 7 boars, 70-400 lbs. Some
shoats are 3-way, Yorkshire, Hampshire, Duroc.

Lunch Rights Reserved — Not Responsible for Accidents

SALE ORDER—Hogs, Cattle. Sale to he held under roof

Mr. & Mrs. Marshall Sharrer, Sr.
Rt. 1, Rocky Ridge, Md. 21778

Phone 301-447-2005

MULLENDORE, Auctioneer

SAYLER 'BROS., Clerks
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BRARDENBURG ELECTRIC
Ralph Bovvders - Manager
The commecial and resident-

ial experts in this locale for
all electric contracting work
is Brandenburg Electric locat-
ed at 700 East Street in Fred-
erick, phone 662-0144.

This company has proved
its professional abilities in this
field through the many var-
ied electric contracting jobs
they have successfully con,

pleted to the satisfaction of
the customer.
They are fully licensed and

insured by the state and can
handle any wiring job from
remodeling to new construc-
tion and are more than glad
to give you complete inspec-
tion and recommendation as
well as accurate cost estimates
at anytime.
The electricians in their em-

ploy are fully qualified to
handle any job and complete
it in the shortest time pos-
sible.
The designers of this 1974

Review, without hesitation,
recommend this reputable con-
tractor to anyone who might
need this type of service and
commend Brandenburg Elec-
tric on-the many fine business
practices they adhere to.

Southern States Frederick Cooperative
Southern States Woodsboro Cooperative

These firms may be reach-
ed by calling 663-6164 at E.
South St. in Frederick or,
phone 898-7667, in Woodsboro.
They feature everything for
the farmers needs.
Through all periods of eco-

nomic fluctuation this firm has
always been ready to serve
the best interests of the far-

mers and general public of
this section. They have de-
rived more than the mere
profit as measured by dollars
and cents because there haa
been a real and genuine sat-
isfaction to this firm to be
able to render this service.
A business of this kind is

essential to the entire sectiji.

By fair and honest methods

they have gained the confi-

dence and patronage of the
people of this community.
A 'fine spirit of cooperation

has always been in every

transaction with this firm and

we, the writers of this Re-

view, wish to compliment
them.

FREDERICK UNDERWRITERS, INC.
J. R. Ramsburg, Jr.

President and Treasurer
Robert Linguist

Vice President and Secretary
Frederick Underwriters, Inc.

in Frederick at 1201 East St.,
phone 662-1147, has enjoyed a
successful business here for
some time, due to their integ-
rity and honest service to
their clients. They are avail-
able to give you personal coun-

cil and to help solve insurance
problems at any time.
This agency is able to fur-

nish you with any type of in-
surance you desire on "Any-
thing that is Insurable" nad al-
ways with the reliable major
companies. They are "Your In-
dependent Insurance Agent."
Today the value of insur-

ance becomes ever more rec-
ognized as an absolute neces-

sity in our way of life. There

is no insurance agency in the

area that is more deserving

of favorable comment than

this one.
The writers of this 1974 Re-

view advise you to see Fred-

erick Underwriters, Inc. before

reviewing or adding to your

present insurance policies.

CRUM ELECTRIC CO., INC.
This progressive firm is lo-

cated at 269 W. Patrick in
Frederick, phone 663-3602.
' As believed by the writers
of this 1974 Review, no Re-
view of the business, agricult-
ural and industrial interests
of this section of the state
would be complete without
prominent mention of this
company which aids in no lit-
tle measure to the progress

and prosperity of this section.

By reason of the fact that
the management has had wide
experience in every feature Of
this business, this firm has
continued to increase the Tuna-
ber of their patrons.
There are no more public-

spirited citizens in the com-

munity than the management

of this firm and in making

this Business Review of the

area it is natural to compli-
ment them and to direct yoer

attention to this business as
one of the most reliable es-
tablishments which has added
to the development and prog-
ress of this part of the state.
Paul Crum, Jr. wishes every-

one his best and will be run-
ning for County Commission-
er this fall.

HYDRO-AIRE, INC.
Kirk Cramer

Secretary/Treasurer
Your Local CARRIER

Distributor
The purpose of a building

is. to protect us from the wea-
ther. Unless it protects us
from the weather year around,
it is not a modern building. In
regards to year around air
conditioning, most of us are
living in houses or voarking in
buildings not up with the mad-

ern times in which we live.

With a CARRIER year
around air conditioner, you set.
the thermostat for either heat.

ing or cooling and you have

spring the whole year.
If you have a central fur-

nace, you likely have half an
air conditioning system al-
ready and do not realize it.

Call today for an estimate of
the low cost of enjoying year
around CARRIER air condi-

tioning. Let them furnish you

a personal survey with all the
pertinent facts and figur 39.
They feature excellent design,
installation and service on
heating and cooling systems.
See Hydro-Aire, Inc., located
at 101 Grove Read in Freder-
ick, phone 662-6474.
The writers of this 1974 Re-

view recommend this firm for

their fine service and expo t
workmanship.

MARYLAND ARTIFICIAL BREEDING
COOPERATIVE, INC.
The services rendered ' by

the Maryland Artificial Breed-
ing Cooperative, Inc., in Fred-
erick, phone 898-9113, is an
important chapter in the rais-
ing of fine livestock through-
out this entire section. Arti-
ficial insemination si import-
ant to the cattlemen, dairy-
men, and farmers, and is es-
sential many times in improv-
ing breeds of livestock.

We would like to include

the names of their fine tech-
nicians — Donald Butt, John
Summers, John Greene, Sam
Glisan, Frank Fogle, David

Ifert, Robert Valentine.
Artificial insemination .s

available for all breeds of cat-
tle, including beef and dairy
cattle.
They can give you any in-

formation you desire op the

breeding of livestock by the
artificial insemination process.
They have built an envied

reputation by being honest in
all business dealings and the

writers of this 1974 Review

feel that we can highly rec-

ommend this firm to all our

readers. Remember to write

or call them for any infor-

mation.

POLING MOBILE HOMES
Enjoy the spacious luxury

of mobile home living from
Poling Mobile Homes in Fred-
erick, phone 371-7541.
They feature beautiful name

brand mobile homes, known
for their quality and value.
From their selection in stock,

you'll be able to find just the
home tailored to your desire...

They offer many floor plan
arrangements designed to fit
your family.
This dealer has a fine rep-

utation for fair dealing, and

you can be assured that they

will make an honest deal with
you at the terms you need to

fit your budget, and after the
sale is final, you can know
that they will stand behind
their sale agreements and
their products with the high-
est of integrity.
The next time you are in

town, take the time to look
through their beautiful mod-
els on display. If you have
not looked at mobile homes fo
several years, you won't be-

lieve their spacious elegance,
convenience, and practicality

at prices far below what you

would have expected.
The writers of this 1974 Re-

view suggest th our readers

that they visit this reputable

dealer and investigate the

many money saving advant-

ages of owning a mobile home.

You'll like the friendly way

you are treated at Poling Mo-

bile Homes, whether you are

just looking, or want to bny.

IRVING'S TIRE SERVICE
Dunlop Tire Distributor
The name Irving's Tire Ser-

vice in Ceresville, located at
Scott Gas Station (Routes 26
and 194) phone 898-9041 or
898-7181, has become a popu-
lar byword in the area Cor
farmers, businessmen and driv-
ers in general for their friend-
ly service and excellent line of
the popular high quality Dun-
lop tires.
We all know that worn tires

can be extremely dangerous,
but sometimes the cost of buy-

ing new tires can make us put

off taking the steps of retiring
our car or truck. Don't let
that factor bother you any-
more. The management at this
well liked tire store has made
arrangements for easy bud -
get terms for tire purchases.
Along with their fine line

of reasonably priced tires,
you'll not find a more friendly
and honest firm to do business.
Everyone in their employ is
fully trained in selecting just
the right tire to do the job

and they also make sure that
when it is mounted it will be
in perfect balance.
In this 1974 Review, we,

th authors, are pleased to
recommend this tire dealer to
all of our readers, and co a-
mend the management for con-
tinued efforts to serve the peo-
ple of this section to the best
of their ability. Remember
the name, Irving's Tire Serv-
ice for all your tire needs.

THURMONT COOPERATIVE, INC.
It is a well known fact that

there is no ope institution in
this community that has done
more toward the development
and progress of this section
than has this reputable co-
operative. They operate one
of the finest establishments in
the area, and it came into
existence to fill the need for
a place where farmers could
go for their feed, seed and
farm supply needs and be sue

they were getting the best
and most for their money.
Through their service, many

of the farmers in the sur-
rounding communities and rur-
al districts have been sup-
plied with quality feeds and
farm supplies at lower pric-
es and have thus been enabled
to operate more efficiently and
at greater profit.
The Thurmont Cooperative,

Inc., in Thurmont, is owned

and controlled by the members
who use its services. Through
democratic processes the mem-
bers meet each year to select
their own choices for the
Board of Directors.
In this 1974 Review, we,

the writers, are glad to call
attention to their very coo.-
plete and comprehensive ser '-
ice. Phone 271-7321 for in-
formation.

PALMER INSURANCE AGENCY
Sterling E. Bollinger

Also Representing Thurmont
Real Estate Agency

For all kinds of insurance
call the Palmer Insurance
Agency in Thurmont, locat, d
at 13 Water St. Phone 271-
2771.
They are looked to for in-

surance service by a large
number of people in this corn-

munity because they represent
some of the largest companies
and are ready to serve you in
every need.
When in need of insurance,

be sure to consult them. Go
over the ground with them as
you do your lawyer and they
will be able to assist you in se-
lecting the kind of insurance
suited to your needs.

They have made a study of
insurance problems and will
help you determine what your
need is, and how best you can
meet that need at a minimum
cost.
The compilers of this 1974

Review feel a sense of satis-
faction in recommending this
firm in Thurmont for insur-
ance of all kinds.

MONOCACY VALLEY REALTORS, INC.
This prominent firm is lo-

cated at 308 W. Patrick in
Frederick, phone 662-0271.

This is one of the most de-
pendable real estate firms in
this section of the state of-
fering all kinds of city and
country properties. Your best
investment today is real es-
tate, regardless if you invest
in a homesite or business lo-

cation. They also have many
income listings for a really
worthwhile investment.

If you have any real estate
you would like to turn into
cash, get in touch with this
reliable firm and they will sell
this property as well -as rent
it for you, if you wish.
The Monocacy Valley Real-

tors, Inc. extends an excellent

service to the people of this
section with their Unaerstand-
ing and interest in the growth
of our section.
The editing staff of this

1974 Review are more than
glad to give them extended

mention, and invite our read-
ers to contact them soon.

BILL & EARL'S AUTOMOTIVE
SERVICE CENTER
David W. Ludewig - Manager

Bill & Earl's Automotive
Service Center at 420 E. Pat-
rick Street in Frederick, phone
662-5941, is one of those se-
liable firms whom we are able
to speak of in the highest
terms. They specialize in au-
tomatic transmissions repair
or replacement, air condition
sales and service, diagnos;icy
electronic tune ups, and gen-
eral repairs.
To better serve you, they

are open Monday thru Friday,

8 a.m. to 6 p.m., and Satur-

days from 8 a.m. to 1 p.m.
This company has been do-

ing business with the people
of this area for some time,

and over that period, they

have established themselves as

one of the leading firms in
their field. No amount of ef-
fort is spared to give you the

most careful service and the
customers of the concern are
delighted with the service

which they receive.
The manager of the corn-

pany, has had a long exper-
ience at this business and is
thoroughly competent in ev-
ery respect. His advice in
matters pertaining to his
trade is sought after and re-
spected.
The composers of this 1974

Review are not often able to
give the whole-hearted rec-
ommendation to any firm
which we give to Bill 8z Earl's
Automotive Service Center.

FREDERICKTOWN BANK 86 TRUST CO.
This prominent bank is lo-

cated at 30 N. Market St. in
Frederick, phone 662-8231.
The Fredericktown Bank &

Trust Co. is an institution of
financial strength and safe-
ty and may well be termed
the "Friendly Bank".

It was founded by men of
character and integrity . who
were very prominent in busi-
ness and commercial activities

and has progressed as this see.-
tion itself has grown and pro-

gressed.
Under the management of

efficient and capable men, they

invite accounts of businessmen

and women, farmers, laborers,

arid all people who desire

profitable service with a mod-
ern banking institution.

At this bank you will find
strength, seasoned judgement,

dependability, accuracy in
handling details and breadth
of vision—all to be applied to
the management of your per-
sonal commercial affairs.
In making this 1974 Review,

we, the writers, wish to make
the statement that at the
Fredericktown Bank & Trust
Co. you may at all times bank
with safety.

C. A. CROMWELL & SON
Over 50 Years Experience
Located at Rt. 7, Yellow

Springs, in Frederick area,
phone 663-4019, is C. A. Crom-
well & Son who is completely
equipped to drill your water

well promptly and efficiently.

Call them anytime for esti-

mates on any water well that

you want drilled.

They have had years of ex-

perience in drilling and re-

pairing wells. Many of this

community have had occasion

to call on them times in the

past. They have always of-

fered efficient and reliable ser-

vice at a fair price. When

you think of drilling a new

well or repairing your old one,

think of this reputable driller.

In this 1974 Review, we, the

authors, feel that we can high-

ly recommend the reliable ser-

vice offered by C. A. Cromwell

& Son, and suggest that you

call them and get estimates

before having any well drilled

or repaired.

PHOENIX, INC.
Superior Concrete Co. - LeGore

Quarries - Economy Oil Co.

Mobil Heating Oil Distributors

The name Phoenix, Inc. at

S. Wisner Street in Frederick,

phone 603-3151, has become a

legend of good service among

the people of this section for

their deliveries and service

with the popular Mobil hev.t-

ing oils.
Through their desire 4o

serve better, they offer such

advantages as: Fast, Depend-

able Deliveries, Automatic Fill

Service, Complete Oil Burner

and Furnace Service, 24 Hour

Emergency Service, Meter

Printed Invoices, and top it

off with Easy Budget Terms.

You will find that the men

who make delivery are very

careful with consideration of

your property.
They use only the latest

modern equipment and can be

completely depended on to

make their deliveries on time
and to keep your account

straight.
In this 1974 Review, we, the

writers, are pleased to make

our wholehearted recommenda-

tion of Phoenix, Inc. and sug-

gest to our readers that they

begin enjoying the competent

services of this distributor as

so many other people have.

PARKVIEW OPTICIANS, LTD.
Ronald Penn - Manager
This firm is located at 516

Trail Avenue in Frederick,
phone 662-5220. At Parkview
Opticians, Ltd., they feature

quality eyewear for the best

in sight and smart good looks.

Bring them your eye physi-

cian's prescription and they

will fill it in the -most careful
manner.
They have a wide selection

ively and comfortably styled

of beautiful frames distinct-

to each individual. They also

feature the new Photo-Gray,

Photo-Sun and Photo-Brown

glasses.
Where your eyes are con-

cerned, there is no substitute

for quality, and you can count

on them for the best. If you

need a pair of fine prescription

sunglasses, be sure to come in

and look ever their wide selec-

tion, consisting of many beau

tiful styles.
Parkview Opticians, Ltd.,

also has an expert repair ser-

vice, and their work is fully

guaranteed.
We, the writers of this 1974

Review, highly recommend

this reliable firm to all our

readers for their important
service is unexcelled anywhere.

JENKINS MOTORS, INC.
Jerry Lowman - Sales Manager
In this day and age when

every car maker has such a

wide selection of models :to
choose from, it is really difficult
for you to decide where to go
for a new car. All the com-
panies advertise that their
cars are the best, but who
is to say which car really is.
Obviously all the cars on the
market today must have their
good points or they wouldn't
have survived the ups and
downs of the business. We,
therefore, can conclude that
the real difference in buying

a car is the dealer you buy it

from.
The ideal dealer to buy a

car from offers a fair price on

the new unit, as well as an

honest dollar for the car you
trade in. However, the most
important factor is the service

that you receive on your nevi
car year after year.
The writers of the 1974 Re-

view would like to point out

a dealer that considers the

most important part of selling

a car the quality service ha

can offer you after the sale.

We are talking about Jenkiis

Motors, Inc. at East and 9th

Street in Frederick, phone

662-0111, dealers for the fa-
mous Oldsmobile and Datsun
automobiles. See them today
for a new or quality used car,
and you'll see why we say
"Customer Consideration" is
their byword.

Albert N. Stone
Upholstering

Albert N. Stone - Owner
When the upholstery on your

home or office furnishings has
served its useful purpose,
whether from wear, or be-
cause of a change in decorat-
ing, let the experts at Albert
N. Stone, with the new loca-
tion at .Rt. 180 (4 miles North
of Rt. 2) in Frederick, phone
473-5393, show you how in-
expensively they can reup-
holster it with your choice of
beautiful, durable materials.
They carry a complete line

of fabrics, vinyls, and leathre-
ette materials in many designs,
weaves, and colors. You are
sure to find one that will suit
your taste, and your decor.
Their professional craf'

men will completely check out

SHOCKLEY VOLKSWAGEN, INC.
Al Shockley - President
Since 1949, when the first

two Volkswagens appeared on
the scene in America until the
present, the "Bug" has gained
so much popularity that now
it sells as the number one im-
port with over one-half mil-
lion in sales every year.
The dealer to see is Shock-

ley Volkswagen, Inc. at 1-70
& Maryland 85 in Frederick,
phone 663-8411, for any of the
1975 Volkswagens including
the Squareback, Kharmann
Ghia, and VW buses and vans.
And don't forget the "Bug's"
Big Brother, the 411 Four-
Door. They are also dealers
for Audi, featuring the Audi
Fox and Audi 100.

This dealer is well known In
this area for his high inte.a-
rity. You can be assured that
you'll, receive the highest
trade-in value for your old
car, as well as the best serv-
ice anywhere from their team
of factory trained Volkswag-
en mechanics.
The authors of this 1974 Re-

view suggest that if you've
been looking for a way out
from staggering gas and re-

- pair bills, you stop in at
Shockley Volkswagen, Inc. and
let them show you the ad-
vantages of owning any one
of the many models for 1975.
You'll not be unhappy if you
let this reputable dealer serve
you.

DONALD B. RICE TIRE CO., INC.
The Name Donald B. Rice

Tire Co., Inc. in Frederick,
located at 909 East Street,
phone 662-0166, has become a
popular byword in the area
for farmers, businessmen and
drivers in general for their
friendly service and excelle at
line of the popular high qual-
ity Goodyear tires.
They offer complete tire ser-

vice such as recapping, balanc-
ing, alignment and repair.
They are headquarters for the
famous Goodyear polyglas
tires.
We ml know that worn tires

can be extremely dangerous,

but sometimes the cost of buy-

ing new tires can make

put off taking the steps of re-

tiring our car or truck. Don't
let that factor bother you any-
more. The management af

thiS well liked store has made
arrangements for easy bud-
get terms for tire purchases.
Along with their fine line of

reasonably priced tires, you'll
not find a more friendly and
honest firm to do business. Ev-
eryone in their employ is ful-

ly trained in selecting just the

right tire to do the job and

they also make sure that when

it is mounted it will be in per-

feet balance.
In this 1974 Review, we, the

authors, are pleased to recom-

mend this tire dealer to all

of our readers, and commeld

the management for continued

efforts to serve the people of

this section to the best of

their ability. Remember the

name, ,Donald B. Rice Tire

Co., Tnc., for all your tire

needs.

MILLIE'S RESTAURANT
Millie Rippeon - Owner

Visit Their New Location
Millies #2

Located in Frederick, phone
663-9607, at 4th & East Sts.,
this is the place to go if you
want the very best in prepar-
ed foods. Their kitchen is
spotlessly clean and their din-
ing room presents an atmos-
phere you will enjoy. This is

true also at Millies #2 locat-
ed at 911 E. Patrick.
The management of this

modern restaurant has done
everything in their power to

i provide a place to which you
will want to return. You can
be assured the food here will
be as delicious as it is pos-
sible to prepare.
You will find ample park-

ing space and efficient service
at this delightful restaurant

in Frederick.
We, the drafters of this 1974

Review, wish to commend the
management of Millie's. We
suggest you drop in for din-
ner the- next time you are in

town. We are happy to recom-

mend them to all our readers.

YOUNG ELECTRIC
Gene Young

City and county ordinances
affecting electric wiring of all
buildings and homes are def-
initely strenuous. The purpose
however, is evident. Many
disastrous fires and home ac-
cidents are the result of de-
fective wiring. For these rea-
sons, it is imperative that ev-
eryone needing electrical sv;r-
Mg, insist upon the services
of a competent, licensed elec-
trician, who is qualified to do
work.
Young Electric at 520 Grant

Place in Frederick, phone 662-
6372, is a local firm of licens-

ed electricians. Few persons
in this line of work can boast
of so many,years of competert
and skilled service to the resi-
dents of this area. They have
established an enviable rep-
utation throughout the entire
field of electrical contractieg
and has proved itself worthy
of the faith and patronage of
our people. For all your elec-
trical problems as well as pow-
er, commercial, and residential
wiring, see this firm.
The writers of this 1974 Re-

view recommend Young Elec-
tric to all our many readers.

FREDERICK BOTTLED GAS CO., INC.
Homer J. Gatrell - Owner

Over 30 Years Of Leadership

The Frederick Bottled Gas

Co., Inc., located at 410 N.
Market Street in Frederick,

phone 662-1531, is your head-

quarters for all L.P. Gas ap-

pliances. They carry a large

stock of parts and accessories

for all these appliances.

L.P. Gas has been a life-

saver for folks in the rural

community. Many prefer to

use it even when ether types

are available. For L.P. Gas

to really be satisfactory and

desirable you must have ap-

pliances of a good quality.

This well known firm makes

it a special point to hand
le

only the best quality fixtures
ii order to better satisfy their
customers. It is to your ad-
vantage to buy appliances of
the better quality because in
the long run they are really
cheaper. This firm has a large
stock of these fixtures which
they will be happy to show
you. Stop in the next time you
are in town shopping.

Frederick Bottled Gas Co.,
Inc., has the equipment and
experience to properly service
all your propane gas burning
equipment.
The editors of this 1974 Re-

view suggest you call them
for all your needs of this type.

M & M Electric

Motor Repair
Allen Roberts - Shop Mg.

The M & M Electric Motor

Repair in Frederick is locat-

ed at 702 East Street. Phone

662-5701. They are experts

in electric motor and gener-

ator repair. They handle Day-

ton, LeLand, Franklin and Al-

lis-Chalmers Motors as well

as Browning Drive equipment.

This firm has the equipment

and experience to properly ser-

vice your electrical equipment

regardless of what the prob-

lem. might be. Their trained

repairmen know exactly how

to contend with any difficulty

that may arise.
They carry a complete stock

of repair parts such as brush-

es and bearings. Industrial

and farm motors are a spe-

cialty with this firm.
Remember, no job is too

or too small to receive their

expert service. Call on them

the frame and spring work of

the piece to be recovered and

bring it back to its original

condition, then carefully pad

and cover it with the material

of your choice so that it will

be like having a new piece.

We ,the originators of this

1974 Review, recommend you

contact Albert N. Stone, at

his new location, for all of

your upholstering needs. We

commend them on their fine
work mad reasonable prices.

today.
The compilers of this 1974

Review highly recommend the
M & M Electric Motor Repair
in Frederick for all your elec-
tric motor repairing.

Security Alert

Alarm Service
Gene Jenkins - Owner

Many businessmen nowdays
have come to enjoy the satis-
faction of knowing that *heir
place of business is protected
with not only just a good lock
on the front door, but with
an approved alarm system
guarding their business with
the utmost of reliability for
Only pennies a daY.
The people to see in this

area are Security Alert Alarm
Service in Frederick at 1009
E. Patrick Street, phone 663-
4874 for estimates on your
alarm needs.
They carry many different

types of alarms, not only for
business and industry, but for
home protection also.
Their experience in this field

has taught them just exactly
what type of alarm system is
best suited for each individual
need.
The composers of this 1974

Review invite our readers to
look into the proper alarm
protection system for their
home or business. You will
enjoy doing business with this
reputable firm who has served
this area faithfully and well.
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Auto Craft, Inc.
Don Lawson - Manager

1 The personnel at this firm
are specialists in body and
fender work as well as auto
painting. The place to h::
you car body rebuilt or painted
is at Auto Craft, Inc., located
at 521 East Church St. 'n

- Frederick. Phone 662-8178.
The ' manager of this firm

ully understands auto body
,and fender repair work. Whe-
ther it is a small or a large
'ob, you will receive the same
courteous treatment and pr3-
fessional workmanship.

Thsi is one of the best
known auto body repair shops
in this section because of its
excellent workmanship and
service.
Most insurance policies now

permit you to choose the re-
pair shop you like best. Se-
lect them to do your work.
Their body work as well as auto
painting is among the best
done in this section. They

, have the 'know how' that puts
their work in a class by itself.
The narrators of this 1974

Review recommend you see
1 Auto Craft, Inc. for all work

of this type.

Cl
AkoiERICAN CANCER sociar

of the latest migratory game
bird regulations covering
western Maryland?
The "1974 Point System

OUTDOOR OUTFITTERS
THURMONT SHOPPING PLAZA

Open 9 til 9 — 7 Days A Week

HUNTERS SUPPLIES
Guns - Ammo - License - Clothing - Boots

Shoes - Western Wear For All

Leather Goods & Tack, Made & Repaired

Phone 271-2275

G. RAYMOND

SHIPLEY
CANDIDATE FOR

Judge Of The

Orphans Court

Your Vote Is Sincerely

Appreciated

By Auth: Mrs. Suzanne
Schmid. Treas.

Guide for Maryland Duck
Hunters" is available from
the Maryland Department of
Natural Resources, Wildlife
Administration, Tawes State
Office Building, Annapolis
21401.
What kind of enforcement

power would be established
(leder the proposed campaign
finance reform bill?
Enforcement power would

be vested in an eight-member
bipartisan, fulltime suPervis •

ory board controlled by six
voting public members. Two

of the public members would

be appointed by the House
Speaker, two by the president

of the Senate and two by the

OPEN LINE
By

Congressman Goodloe Byron
Maryland—Sixth District

The following questio: s
were typical of the kind ask-
ed of me in recent weeks. Let-
ters should be sent to me cio
U. S. House of Representa-
tives, Washington, D.C. 20515.

Please explain the federal
health planning program re-
cently approved by the House
Commerce Committee?

Several weeks ago the com-
mittee voted to set in place a
new national network of local
health agencies charged with
preventing • unnecessary hos-
pital construction and moni-
toring the distribution of fed-
eral health funds. Changes in
the nation's health planning
systems are considered esse i-
tial before enactment of any President, all of whom would
national health insurance le ,- be confirmed by Congress. The
islation. House clerk and the secretary
Where can I obtain a copy of the Senate would be ex-of-

ficio members. The board
would have civil enforcement
powers and would be able to
seek court injunctions. Crim-
inal cases would be referred
t,-.) the Justice Department for
prosecution.
Our class is currently study-

ing insurance and I wondered
if you had any booklets on
buying insurance?
To help young consumers

learn more about the three
major types of insurance that
most people buy, the U. S.
Department of Agriculture has
printed a leaflet entiled "In-
surance for your Health, Car
and Life". Copies are avail-
able free from Consumer In-
formation, Pueblo, Col. 81009.
Has the budget for rural

development programs been
cut?

Appropriations for the Far-
mers Home Administration
(FHA) and for the FHA wa-
ter and sewer grant program
have not been reduced by Con-
gress.
A neighbor told me you

were trying to help local
dairymen. How about elim-
inating dairy imports as a
starter?
As you probably know, I

have joined with several other
congressmen in requesting a

special White House meeting

to discuss the economic prob-

lem facing America's dairy-
men. I, too, am concerned over
the increasing dependence on
dairy product imports and feel
the dairy farmer must be giv-
en some stability in the mar-
ket place

Use Classified Ads

Call 662-6333 to report a fire

4 

Grinders
24 HR. TOWING

DAY 447-2523

NIGHT 447-2855

Service
Emmitsburg, Md.

Now Offering
S&H GREEN STAMPS

With Your Purchase And Our Service
(The Only Service Station in the Area To Offer

Savings Stamps)
NOW OPEN SUNDAYS 11 A.M. TO 7 P.M.

ICE COLD
Beer-Mine-Liquors

10% DISCOUNT ON CASE LOTS OF WHISKEY

ROGER LIQUOR STORE
ANN G. ROGER, Prop.

SOUTH SETON AVE. PHONE 447-6262 EMMITSBURG, MD.

Store Hours: Monday Through Thursday, 8 A. M. to 10 P. M.

Friday & Saturday: 8 A. M. to 11 P. M.

PERSPECTIVES IN LEARNING
By Hazel Brown, President
Harry Lundeberg School

Books As Therapy!
In these times of anxiety

and trouble there is still the
comfort and relaxation rovid-
ed by good books. People have
found that books can be a
great help with maintaining
emotional stability.
Some parents have found

that children tend to use lit-
erature and reading as a
means of therapy and adjust-
ment. These parents help

,

f,FECIAL. SKILLS RATE SPECIALPAY. -THE ARMY IS OFFERING
$1500 AND. ,2500 CASH
BONUSES 'TO YOUNG PEOPLE

WHo EN LI ST IN SPECIAL
TECHNICAL. SKILLS FOR q-yEARs!

CUALIREP ENL1STEE4
MM SELECT FROM ANY

Or,ie OP 25 PlFrefeepar
ECANICAL TR4LII06 FWGIZAMS,

TI-SE AMOUNT OF THE BONUS IS
VETERMiNED BY INC J08
SELECTEP.1-14E MAJORITY OF
THE 5KILLS ARE OPEN TO
BOTH mem AND WOMEN!

their children to find books
which might be helpful in de-
veloping self-realization and
•understanding.

Reading good books can pro-
vide children with broad ex-
periences and therefore broad-
en their understanding about
many things. Stories do much
more than tell a tale. Through
reading individuals can get
greater insight into them-
selves or others around them.
It is also possible to use books
for developing a greater . ap
preciation for people, beliefs
and emotions.

It is impossible to predict
what reading a certain book
will do for any given individ-
ual, but it is evident that books
do effect emotions. Some books
have a tremendous emotionai
impact on the reader.

f'Biblotherapy" or "Therapy
through books" has been used

but the results are very un-
predictable. It is possible to
recall a hook which left you
very emotionally involved but
a friend may not have rec-
ognized the signifirance of the
meaning. The book appeals to
cash person a little differently.
A book can provide many

aides to adjustment. It .can
reflect or mirror situations so
that people can see their own
circumstances more clearly. it
can possibly ease the pain .1
feeling unique or alone in the
world. It may help to prepa,-e

a person for a future situation

by having the characters in

the book successfully survive

the experience.
Reading about the problems

that others must face may

show new solutions to very

frustrating and difficult prob-

lems. It can make people

more aware ' that their prob-

lems and struggles have been

suffered and conquered by 
oth. :

GET READY FOR WINTER
STOVE PIPE - FURNACE PIPE

FITTINGS

WEATHER STRIPPING

CAULKING- WINDOW COVERING

ZURGABLE BROTHERS
FEED & FARM SUPPLIES

PHONE 447-2020 EMMITSBURG. r:D

ers.
Literature has always re-

flected the many ways that in-
dividuals exhibit feelings of
love, hate, power, frustrations,
aggression, guilt,- jealously
and fear. The great works of
Shakespeare are famous for
revealing the emotions of Li-
dividuals. By reading about
others, the individuals can put
their ow.n problems into per-
spective.
"A Cup of Courage" by Lew-

ii.cm can help a teenager cope
with an alcoholic father. "In
A Mirror," by Mary Stolz,
tells of an overweight girl
and how she learns to over-
come her problem. "Boy
Alon,", by Ottley, can be a
great comfort to the misuo-
derstood youtsh.
These books are just a few

of the many books which can
help youngsters to adjust t.;

the situations of life which
cause them concern.

WEATHER REPORT

Temperatures and precipi-
tation for the Emmitsburg Dis-
trict for the week ending Fri.,
Oct. 18, as reported by the Na-
tional Weather Service, M. s.
Lucille K. Beale, local observ-
er, were as follows:

H L Pr.
Sat., Oct. 12  75 41 ...
Sun., Oct. 13  '72 56 T
Mon., Oct. -14  70 58 T
Tues., Oct. 15  70 53 .03
Wed.,' Oct. 16  58 48 1.52
Thurs., Oct. 17  66 34 ....
Fri., Oct. 18  65 41

Use Classified Ads

YOU CAN SEND YOUR

BOY SCOUTS TO CAMP

BY

WEIGHING YOURSELF?

Just 5c At

EMMITSBURG PHARMACY
Phone 447-6226

EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND

t'aul M. Carter, Pharmacist

Looking for a simple dependable, economy car?

e a
closer look
atyour

Ford Dealer's!
Ease 2-door Ford Pinto

Base 2-door Ford Mustang II

When it comes to economy cars, your Ford Dealer's
the man to see! Because he wants to help you find

just the kind of economy (or luxury) you're
looking for ... with the exciting new '75 Ford Pinto,

Maverick and Ford Mustang II!

• The closer you look at your
Ford Dealer's ... the better the deal!

5Eg.-Dt

rDAP,s,„v

SPERRY'S FORD SALES INC.
SOUTH SETON AVE. EMMITSBURG. MD.
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LOOKING AHEAD
By George S. Benson, President, National Education

Searcy, Arkansas

Constitution Hall Revisited

Amid all the problems fac-
ing America, inflation, scan-
dal, loss of confidence in pub-
lic officials, fear of the future
and concern for the basic in-

stitutions of our national life,
we are still the most blessed
people in the human race. The
source of those blessings
needs to be remembered, re-
studied and re-emphasized if

they are to continue. We need

to generate anew the eager-

ness, the enthusiasm, and the

determination of our forefath-

ers who brought our nation

into being almost two cen-

turies ago.
Ours is a nation with a

spiritual foundation. Ours is

a system of government rest-

ing on the premise of the in-

herent dignity of man as it

created being. Our basic doc-

LIBRARY HOURS

Monday, Tuesday, Wednesday!

2:30-5 - 6:30-9
Tuesday, 10 - Noon

Thursday, 10-Noon - 2:30-5

Friday, 2-5

Saturday, 9 A.M.-12 Noon

Busincss Services
PATRONIZE our advertisers.

These firms are reliable and

have proven through the years

that they handle only quality

products and offer skilled

proftssional service and ad-

rice to their patrnns.

ANTENNA WORK

Estimates. Installations
& Repairs

of Antenna Towers
& Systems

OUR SPECIALTY

LOOK TO MYERS'
FOR THE BEST
IN SERVICE

Myers Radio &TV
125 E. Main St. - 447-2202

Emmitsburg, Md.

visommommnimmommo

'HE GAS SERVICE 6 PEOPLE PREFER 
Alappii

THE MATTHEWS

GAS COMPANY
Ent mitsburg - Thurmont

111111M111111=111111111

Hanover Maternity Shop

Complete Line Of

MATERNITY WEAR

fThildrens' Wear to Size 6X

Danskin Leotards, Tights &

Trunks — Shower Gifts

Selva Dance Footwear

41 Frederick St., Hanover, Pa.

P••••••••••••

Coffman Jewelers
28 Baltimore St.

Gettysburg, Pa.

OMEGA WATCHES

(ORANGE BLOSSOM

DIAMOND RINGS)

OR. R. P. KLINGER, JR.

Optometrist

19 East Main Street
EMMITSBURG. MD.

yes Examined-Glasses Fitted
Complete Optical Repairs

HOURS
IICINDAY: 6:30 to 8:30 P.m.
Other Evenings By Appoint.)

PHONE
WESTMINSTER TI 8-8340

CODORI

MEMORIALS
Rock of Ages

Monuments, Markers
Mausoleums

7emetery Lettering & Cleaning
4114) W. Middle St., Gettysburg

Phone 717-334-1413

....imommumammimmi

WILSON

Funeral Home

EMMITSBURG, MD.

Phones:

Emmitsburg 447-6244

Fairfield 642-8642

111111•1111111•11111111111111MININIIIIIIIIIM

uments herald the great truth

of "inalienable rights" grant-
ed by the Creator, and we
need to ever keep our eyes
on the goal of fulfilling the
dream of our founding fath-
ers of equal justice and op-
portunity for all.

It is apparent that for a
number of years, our national
government, followed by State
and local governments, has
been disregarding the basic
blueprint of our freedom and
legislating by edict of polit-
ical expedient rather than .4
constitutional restriction. We
need to return to the Consti-
tution with its checks and bal-
ances, with its separation of
powers and responsibilities. I
suggest that all Americans
will benefit by re-reading Carl
Van Doren's books, The Great
Rehearsal, which is the story
of the making and ratifying
of our Constitution. Today,

Program

come with me on a tour of
Constitution Hall and a review
of our birth as a nation.
There in that room in Phil-

adelphia, hammer descended
on anvil until the iron of
statehood was shaped into the
steel pattern of a brand new
nation. There, littlene,s
fought with bigness, and the

narrow view denounced the

views of breadth. There men

of soul-greatness, and those

of small stature, struggled

mightily to come to grips with

a solid fact of history. As

we look back at that -Conven-

tion in Philadelphia, we won-

der if there has ever been a

more important gathering of

great men dedicated to a great

task and meeting magnificent-

ly the great responsibilities of

their mission. Seldom have so

few done so much for so many.

But, it almost failed. It was

not until men rose above state

MARYLAND
FOOTBALL

North Carolina State

Oct. 26

1:30 P.M.

930 AM___......................_____

ALBERT

Custom

Remodeling

Excavation

Homes

F. WIVELL
CONTRACTOR

&a SONS
$

Swimming Pools

Sales and Service

Cal/ 447-2218

.....
_

GET A DEAL-ON

1975 CHEVROLET

And On OK Used Cars & Chevrolet

WANT! CHEVROLET
Phone 756-6006

k COMPLETE AUTO AND BODY

Service Department Hours
1:30 A.M.---5:00 P.M., MONDAY—FRIDA1

5:3e P.M.-9:00 P.M.. THURSDAY

Sales Department Hours
9:00 A.M.-9:00.P.M, MONDAY—FRIDAY

9:00 A.M.-5:00 P.M- S ATURDAT

THE

Taneytown,

Trucks

REPAIR

EVENING

INC.
Md.

$

-r----

Se SeeiN 4 Value-, .,

I --1 newl 
) • USED

CARS
I

li:'::*:.::.::i::::;:.::*::.::*::::•;::.::::**.n::::.*:**K:1::.::*::*:.::.::.:::1

ALWAYS
197:1 Pinto

1973 Ford

1973 Chevy

1972 Ford

1971 Ford

1971 Pinto

1968 Pontiac

1966 Fairlane

Sperry's
PHONE

3-Dr. Runabout;

Gran Torino

Vega Hatchback; 

Gran Torino

LTD 4-or.

2-Dr.; 4-Spd.;

Letnans

4-Dr.,

447-6171

GOOD
4

Spt.

H.T.;

2-Dr.

V-8;

Ford

-Dr.;

R&H;

Auto.;

Low

4-Spd.;

2-Dr.

Fully

H.T.

'Sales,

Mileage.

Air;

H.T.

Equipped;

Very

R&H.

EMMITSBURG,

VALUES
P.S.;

Clean.

Clean.

V-8.

Inc.
MD.

arid local considerations, to
think above the pull of self-
interest, that the seeds of true
liberty were free to take root
and sprout. Not until the
grand idea defeated a thou-
sand trivial ones did men be-
gin to feel the thrill of calling

themselves by a new name .
Americans. All finally saw
what some had seen from the

beginning, that the nation had
to be a Union of States, not
a mere confederation or asso-
ciation.
Governor Randolph of Vir-

ginia put it bluntly when he
said: "A government is no
government at all until it can
Accomplish five things; defend
itself against foreign aggres-
sion, prevent dissension
among the states and sedition
from within them, provide for
the general welfare, protect
itself against encroachment by
the member states, and be su-
perior to all local govern-

ments."
In the debates, they argued,

shouted, shook their fists,
threatened and yet, in the end,
they produced the freest, and

most creative government in

the history of man, and one:

which finally would offer

equality of justice and oppor-

tunity to all races and all na-

tionalities.
Those men formulated ideas

that were simple and clear; a

federal government composed

of, three parts, the executive,

the judicial and the legisla-

tive; two houses, one elected

by popular vote, and a Sen-

ate elected by state legisla-

tures representing at that

time, the educated, cultured

.and knowledgable interests of

the states; a court system that

would recognize the boundary

lines between local responsi-

bilities and federal jurisdic-

tion. Each citizen was the re-

pository of fundamental sov-

ereignty. Each citizen re-

linquished some of his sov-

ereignty to the state, the state

relinguished some of its sov-

ereignty to the federal gov-

ernment ,and in turn, the fed-

eral government was to honor

t h e sovereignty remaining

with the states. All powers

not specifically delegated to

the federal authority were 
re-

tained to the states and to

the people.
As we approach our bicen-

tennial we should ask our-

selves the question: Have

times changed so much f
rom

1789 that we are now 
willing

to settle for less? Think ju.5t

how much those 'boundaries
 of,

freedom set by that conven-

tion have beet i expanded. 
Then,

there was slavery . . . 
and

now the last vestiges of 
that

cancer are fading away. Even

then, there was George 
Mason,

the unsung and still 
unrecog-

nized architect who partici-

pated in framing our 
Consti-

tution, and who warned t
hat

if America began her 
nation-

al life with the cancer of 
slav-

ery emcompassed within 
her

body politic, it would take

two hundred years to heal

from its wounds. Few Amer-

icans know who George Mason

was, let alone that after his

plea for the outlawing of

slavery was rejected, he. left

that convention, returning to

Gunston Hall, his home in Vir-

ginia close by Mt, Vernon, re-

tired from political life, re-

fusing to serve in any capaci-

ty thereafter and died about

five years later. It is said by

some that he died of a heart

sorrowing for the future of

his country.

HERE'S
CLYDE'S
HAIR STYLISTS

Specializing In Men's &

Women's Flair Styling

12 E. Main St., Thurmont

Phone 271-4479

Sunday 1:00 P.M.
October 27, 1974

ST. LOUIS

I* )

Introducing the fastest way
find a number since operators.

Your new C&P Telephone Directory.
It's everything you need to find any number you want.

Fast Even faster than calling us.
By the time you call us, give the operator the information, get

the spelling right, then the operator looks the number up, gives it to you, and

you write it down, well, you probably could have looked it up yourself.
It's faster.

Look it up yourself. It's faster

C&P Telephone

NOW IS THE TIME FOR YOU TO RELAX
Mat The lafftiht!

VISIT YOUR FAVORITE AREA RESTAURANT
For a Special Meal and Beverage

The paimu Re.licatizaott
EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND

HOME COOKING OUR SPECIALTY

Dinners Daily Specials

Homemade Soups

Pizza - Sandwiches - Subs
CHICKEN - SOFT SHELLS

SPAGHETTI

—Carry-Out Service—.

We Serve Your Favorite Beer and Wine

HOURS: 6:30 A.M. - 11 P.M. Daily

—Closed Sunday—

THE PALMS RESTAURANT

Emmitsburg, Md. Phone 447-2303, 447-2991

THE OTT HOUSE
PUB & RESTAURANT

Phone 447-2625

SUBS AND PIZZAS

Complete Line Of

WINES & BEERS

CARRY-OUT SERVICE

OYSTERS
" R "
IN SEASON

AT THE

SHAMROCK

RESTAURANT

Rt. 15 North

271-2912 Thurmont

SOUP AND SANDWICHES — FOUNTAIN

SUNDRIES — MAGAZINES

FAIRFIELD CUT RATE
Fairfield, Pa. 17320

INIVEVM•41#••••••

Soup &
Salad Bar

TUESDAY, WEDNESDAY, THURSDAY

11:30 A.M. - 1:30 P.M.

1.45
TOSS YOUR OWN SALAD
SERVE YOUR OWN SOUP

New Luncheon Menu

Sandwiches on Home-Baked Bread

Don't Miss Our Dessert Cart

COZY RESTAURANT
Thurmont, Md. Phone 271-7373
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OTICE — Home heating oil
burner and furnace installa-
tions. Call Wilson Stup,
Economy Oil Company, Di-
vision of Phoenix, Inc., 663-
3151. 10124I4t

FOOD CARRY - OUT
Sandwiches - Ice Cream

PECIAL — 10 1/2. Pints, $1
M & M DAIRY BAR

Thurmont Shopping Plaza
(Old J Dee One)

POR SALE—Portable Electric
Heaters. Also Remington
Limb Si Trim Electric Saws,
$34.95. Emmitsburg Feed
& Farm Supply, E. Main St.

PRUIT TREES, Nut Trees,
".Berry Plants, Grape Vines,
Landscaping Plant Material
—offered by Virginia's larg-
est growers. Free copy 40-
Page Planting Guide-Cata-
log in color, on request.
Waynesboro Nurseries —
Waynesboro, Virginia 22980.

104014t

OTICE—Annual Turkey and
Oyster Supper, Saturday,
November 2, 1974 at Tom's
Creek United Methodist
Church. Served family style

, from 1:30 p.m. until ?
Adults 81.50; children 6-12
$1.75; under six, no cost.
No carryouts. 10,315t

CARD OF ?HANKS
We wish to express our sin-

cere thanks to our friends and
neighbors for their kindness
and expressions of sympathy
on the death of our husbaild
and father, Thomas C. (Tip)
Harbaugh. Special thanks to
Dr. Morningstar, Dr. Johnson,
nurses at Annie M. Warner
Hospital, Rev. Donald Olson,
Rev. Ronald Fearer, the ambu-
lance drivers, colorguard and
members of the VFW and the
American Legion of Emmits-
burg, and the Amvets of Fair-
field.

His Wife and Fami'y
it

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to express our sin-

cere appreciation to relatives,
friends and neighbors for 411
kindness shown us during the
illness and after the death of
Vergie V. Ohler. Special
thanks to Pastor Markley.
Thanks also for the floral trib-
utes, expressions of sympathy,
and the service of pallbearers.
Special thanks to the Em-
mitsburg VFW for use of the
ambulance.

Norville and Mary Welty
it

FOR SALE — 1965 Pontiac
Catalina, power steering and
brakes, automatic transmis

OST—Weimeraner. Tan col- sion. Good condition. Call

lar. Answers to name of 447-6142 or 447-2370. ltp

"Tanner . Reward. Call
collect 7/ 1- '94-2831.

'OTICE—No trespassing on
ere B. H. Boyle Farms which
include the rapp farm, the
Wilhide farm, the James A.
Boyle farm, and the form-
er Fitzgerald farm. tf

NOTICE—,-House for sale, or
Rent. Brand new house, 3
bedrooms, rec. room. Wall-
to-wall carpet. All electric
heat. Phone 447-2657.

WANTED - — Housekeepers,
dishwasher and waitresses
for Mt. Manor Motel, phone
447;2361. tf
— — —

New & Used Guns For Sale
Licensed Hanagun Dealer

GUNS WANTED
Gene's Gun Shop
Eugene Bankard1 Emrnitsburg, R.D. 2, Md.
Phone 447-2869

; Guns bought, sold & repaired

ZENTZ AUTO SALES
Serw:ng You Since 1943

Carlisle St. Gettysburg, Pa.
Open 9-9 Daily

CUSTOM SLAUGHTEI:ING
tVz PROCESSING OF BEEF
Cut and wrapped for the
freezer to your specifications.
NORMAN SHRIVER, JR.

Phone 447-2255 - Emmitsburg
We sell beef by half or

quarters

ilATSUN Sure Beats what
twer is second. Drive a Dat-
sun and then decide. Dee
Gee Imports Inc., Route
116 West, Gettysburg, Pa.

PIANO — Kimball— Walnut.
You too, may have a rea-
sonably-priced piano with-
out sacrificing quality. See
this before you buy. Liber-
al trade-in now at Menchey
Music Service, 1100 Carlisle
St., Clearview Shopping
Center, Hanover.

GOOD USE CARS — For-
eign and domestic Re-con-
litioned and priced to sell
—bank financing available.
Dee Gee Imports, Fairfield
Rd., Gettysburg, Pa.

AWNINGS

CAR PORTS

PATIO COVERS

PORCH ENCLOSURES

PIBERGLASS AWNING CO.

127 York St.
Gettysburg. Pa.-Ph. 334-4612

NOTICE — The Datsun Pick-
up — Definitely your best
buy — Drive a Datsun and
then decide. Dee Gee Im-
ports, Inc., Fairfield Rd.,
Gettysburg, Pa.

RONALD J. SHORB
Ceramic Tile

Contractor
tiaths-Kitchens-Flagstone

Wall-to-Wall Carpet
krmstrong Floor Covering

Free Estimates

Phone 271-7252

Thurmont, Md.

PRINTING
ALL KINDS

Also
Plastic Signs

Wedding Invitations
FAST SERVICE

,CHRONICLE PRESS INC.
47-2333 Emmitsborg-

FOR SALE—Workshoes. Em-
mitsburg Feed and Farm
Supply, E. Main St.

HELP WANTED — Full or
part time food and cocktail
servers, cooks, and bus per-
sons, Apply Wally's Inn,
Blue Ridge Summit, 11 a.m.-
1 p.m. or 6-9 p.m.

WANTED—Two mason tend-
ers. Experience preferred.
Local work in Emmitsburg.
84.00 an hour to start. Call
Collect 876-1799.

FOR SALE—Certified barley.
Emmitsburg Feed & Farm
Supply, E. Main St.

NOTICE—A A meeting, Em-
mitsburg, Md. Group, over
Mt. Manor Restaurant, ,Rt.
15, Wednesday, 8:30 p.m.,
closed; Sunday, 3 p.m., open
discussion. 9i26I4t

The Best Used Cars ale Found
Where the Best Used Cars
are Sold.

William (Bill) Sentz
Fairfield Rd.

RD3 Gettysburg, 2a.
PhGne 7:7-642-5603

ATTENTION' FARMERS
hauling to Auction Everyday

J. E. Watkins
Dealer in Livestock
Emmitsburg, Md.

tf Phone 447-2347

WANTED
REAL ESTATE

Luther N. Martin

Agency
H. Kenneth Seiferd

Salesman

BLUE RIDGE SUMMIT

PENNSYLVANIA

Phone 717-794-2441

FREDERICK COUNTY BACKGROUNDS
BY SAMUEL CARRICK

More Families Of
Old Tom's Creek
"0 suns and skies and

clouds of June,
And flowers of June to-

gether,'
Ye cannot rival for one

hour
October's bright blue

weather.

"When on the ground red
apples lie

In piles like jewels shin-

And redder still on old
stone walls

Are leaves of woodbine
twining."

—Helen Hunt Jackson
Last week a few notes re-

garding the Lynn- (Linn-Lind./
family of Pennsylvania and
Maryland, members of the old

Tom's Creek Church and later,

when in 1797 the church was

moved to Emmitsburg, of that
congregation also.

It is reasonable to assume

that the pioneer members of

the Lynn family came into

Maryland with the Monocacy

settlers for it is known that

they originally settled in the

Province of William Penn.

However, according to the late

Edith (Sheads) Ditchburn, a

recognized authority on the

Lynn genealogy, some mem-

bers of the family were mem-

bers of the Presbyterian
church—probably of the Upper

Marsh Creek (now Gettys-

burg) Presbyterian church. As

a matter of fact one member of

the clan became a Presbyter-

ian minister. Dr. Henry Egle,
Pennsylvania's great historian

and genealogist, has this to

say of the Rev. Lind (Lynn-

Linn)—
"The Rev. Matthew Linn was

born at Cairn Castle, County

Antrim, Ireland, in 1732. He

was educated at the University

of Glasgow and was ordained

by the Reformed (Covenan-

tor) Presbytery of Scotland.

For thirteen years he was pas-
tor of the Reformed (Preshy-
terian ) church of Aghadowey,
County Londonderry, Ireland.

In 1773, at the earnest desire
of William Brown, of Paxtang,
who went to Ireland for the
purpose, he, in company with
the Rev. Alexander Dobbin,
came to America, arriving t
New Castle, Delaware, in De-
cember of that year. In the
spring of 1174 he became the
first. and only pastor of the
Covenantor thurch at Pax-
tang (now in Dauphin Coun-
ty, Pennsylvania), also .offi-
ciating at Stoney Ridge, now
in Cumberland County, Penn-
sylvania.
"When the Seceder and Cov-

enantor churches united in
1782 and formed the Associate
Reformed church, the Rev.
Lynn and his two churches

went into that union. In 1783
he resigned at Paxtang and
took charge of the Associate
Reformed congregations of
Greencastle, Chambersburg,
Mercersburg, and Great Cove.

Here he died April 21, 1780,

and was buried in the old

CARD OF THANKS

We wish to extend our
heartfelt thanks to Rev. Keen-
ey, Dr. McCorkle, the nurses
at Gettysburg Hospital, our
neighbors and friends duni
the illness and death of our
wife and mother, Mrs. Eliza-
beth Wetzel, and for the many
floral tributes, Mass cards and
cards of sympathy.

Charles R. Wetzel
and Family

ltp

Dry, snug,
and rugged,
Stride Rite's
boots for girls,

Stride Rife

For Best
Boot Selection
Shop Now!

Frederick County's Only

Specialists in fitting the growing foot
BE and regular

Chanticleer
Shoes

Rockville Store
Tenley Building, 903 RoAville Pike

424-2266
•

Frederick Store
Frederick Towne Mall
Next lo Poppy's Fon,ly Pub

663-5646

churchyard at Brown's Mills,
six miles south of Chambers-
burg, near which he lived.
"The Rev. Mr. Linn mar-

ried Jennie Fulton, of Pax-
tang, who was born in 1746
and died April 1, 1819. She,
too, is interred at Brown's
Mills. Their son, John Linn,
subsequently succeeded his
father in the' ministry. He
died at Hagerstown, Maryland
in 1834."
According to a fairly reli-

able tradition the Rev. Mat-
thew Lind was of the same
family as the earlier Lynns
of Pennsylvania and Mary-
land. In the Preprietory "ma-
nor of the 1'1,Y:swine" (in what
is now Adams County, Penn-
,sylvania), there is a hill known
as "Adam Lynn's Hill." Here
it is thought that the Lynns
first settled and from this
site "spread out in all direc-
tions." They came early into
Maryland, perhaps Johann

Miss Teenager Of Md. Visits Area

Pictured above is Miss Na-
tional Teenager of Maryland,
Linda Lee Potter, being pre-
sented a corsage by Mrs. Ber-
nice Cornwell, Designer-Man r-
ger ot the Cozy Bud 'N Vase

Shoppe, Thurmont.
Miss Potter, who is a resi-

dent of Adelphi, was a recent
visitor at the Colorfest and
was a guest of Cozy.

linuommb. 

ASSIGNEES' SALE
of valuable fee simple real property suitable for ex-
tensive dairy farm operations, and improvements locat-
ed on the south side of Mountain Road in Emmitsburg
Election District, Frederick County, Maryland.
Under and by virtue of the power of sale contained

in a mortgage from Viking Ventures, Inc.. dated Sep-
tember 14. 1971 and recorded in Liber 858, folio 359. one
of the Land Records of Frederick Ciunty, Maryland,
the said mortgage being in default and having been as-
signed ti the undrsigned Assignees for foreclosure, the
said Assignees will offer for sale at public auction at
the Court Houe door in the City of Frederick. Mary-
land on:

MONDAY, NOVEMBER 4, 1974
AT 11:45 A.M.

all of the hereinafter described real estate and improve-
ments described as follows:

All that tract of land situate on the south side of
Mountain Road in the Emmitsburg Election District,
Frederick County. Maryland containing 270.72 acres of
land, more or less, being more particularly described
in a deed from Edward L. Meadows an Margaret I.
Meadows, his wife, unto Viking Ventures, Inc., dated
January 2, 1970 and recorded in Liber 817, folio 655,
one of the Land Records if Frederick County. Maryland.
The aforesaid real property being improved by a two-

story, nine-room frame farm dwelling with stone foun-
dation, having five bedrooms, fireplace, basement, attic
and slate roof, heated by steam (oil fired); said prem-
ises being further improved by 134x46' bank barn, a
56'x116 free stall barn, a 23'x38' double eight (sixteen
stalls) herringbone milking parlor, a 23'i28' dairy house,
large holding area with approximately two hundred
and forty free standing stalls, two 20'x60' stave silos,
a machinery storage building and shop, hog house, corn
cribs and wagon shed and other miscellaneous farm
structures.
TERMS OF SALE: The above mentioned real prop-

erty and improvements are to be sold subject to a first
mortgage from Nriking Ventures, Inc., to Edward 1.
Meadows and Margaret L. Meadows, his wife, dated
January 2, 1970 and recorded in Liber 818, Folio 340,
one of the Land Records of Frederick County, Maryland.
Purchaser shall assume the aforesaid mortgage with the
following amendments thereto, namely, the principal
amount shall be $148,500, with interest at the rate of
9% per annum, merest and principal payable quarterly
in equal installments for a term of ten years from date
of settlement, when all such principal and interest due
shall be paid. At time of settlement Purchaser shall
execute such documents as may be deemed necessary
by Assignees( including, but not limited to. a renewal
promissory note and confirmatory mortgage contain-
ing the provisions herein mentioned to properly secure
the lien of this mortgage.
A deposit of 10 percent of the purchase price in cash

or check acceptable to Assignees will be required of the
Purchaser at the time and place of sale and the balance
of the purchase price is to be paid within five days of
the ratification of the sale by the Circuit Court for
Frederick County, Maryland. Taxes and public charg-
es will be adjusted to the date of sale and expenses of
conveyancing will be paid by the purchaser. Assignees
reserve the right to withdraw the herein described prop-
erty and improvements from sale at any time.

BENJAMIN B. ROSENSTOCK and
JOSEPH V. GARTLAN, JR.,

Assignees
FREDERICK J. BOWER
Attorney for Assignees
100 West Church Street
Frederick, Maryland 21701
ROBERT MEUNIER
Auctioneer
119 Carroll Street
Thurmont, Maryland 21788
Phone: '271-2800

Melehoir Lynn was the second
or third generation in Lord
Baltimore's Province.
Now as to the early Lynn

graves in Frederick County—
and—this question poses more
or less of a mystery. Of
course some could be interred
in the old churchyard at the
Monocacy Settlement. Others,
of a later generation, were
probably buried in the old
Lutheran a n d Reformed
churchyard at Tom's Creek.
Since only one-third of the
original burial, plot remains
at the present time — more
graves have been lost than re-
main within the ericlosure Some
are interred in Elias church-
yard and the majority of these
graves are marked. Others,
o a still later period, are to be
found in the Mountain View
Cemetery.

It is interesting to note
that the Lynns of Maryland
intermarried with the Harpers
o that branch o the amily
who founded the historic to sn
of Harper's Ferry, now ;n
West Virginia.
This concludes, for a time,

at least, the data pertaining
to the Lyhn-Lind-Linn family.
The Gaugh-Barton Family
In the records of Saint

James Lutheran church,
Gettysburg, Pennsylvania, the
following marriage record is to
be found-

1. Married, January 11, 1846
by the Rev. Benjamin Keller,
Isaac D. Barton to Miss Sophia
Gaugh, both of Frederick
County, Maryland.

Interred in the southwest
corner of the old Tom's Creek
Lutheran and Reformed church
yard are the following mem-
bers of the Gaugh - Barton
f amil ie s-

1. In memory of Carrie
Gaugh, daughter of W. and C.

"YOUR PEACE OF

MIND DEALER"

RANDY'S

Pre-Owned

Cars & Trucks
Fairfield, Pa.

"FEEDER" I
CATTLE

'EVERY

Tuesday
Is A

Feeder Sale

Due to the large response
to "Special" Feeder Sales
last spring,every week will
be a feeder sale.

All types and sizes. Lots of
local cattle right off the
farm. Cattle sold in order
received.

EVENING SALE
FOR YOUR

CONVENIENCE

AT

Westminster

Livestock Auction
For a dependable trucker

Call 848-9820

Westminster, Md.

Gaugh, died March: 31, 1887,
aged 10 days.

2. In memory of George
Gaugh, died November 16,
1854, aged 78 years, 10 months
and 2 days.

3. In memory of Elizabeth
Gaugh, wife of George Gaugh
died October 18, 1858, aged 78
years 6 months and 9 days.

4. In memory of Persival
Gaugh, died January 11, 1877,
aged 56 years, 6 months, and
17 days.

5. In memory o Harriet
Gaugh; wife of Persival Gaugh,
born April 13, 1822, died May
31, 1896.
The notes regarding the

Gaugh-Barton families will be
continued in this series next
week.

Mt. Prof. Has

Article Accepted
Dr. Olaf Tollefsen, assistant

professor in the Department
of Philosophy at Mount Saint
Mary's College, has had an
article accepted for publica-
tion in "Metaphilosophy." The
article, entitled, "The Family
Resemblances Argument and
Definition of Art," will prob-
ably appear in the Spring
1976 issue of the journal. •
Dr. Tollefsen did his under-i

graduate work at the Univ rr-
sity of Scranton and earned
his Ph.D. at Georgetown, Uni-
versity. Last year he was
named an Outstanding Edu-
cator for 1978.

Use Classified Ads
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One of the questions I'm most
often asked is this one: How do
I get my children to drink more,

That's easy to answer. lust
tell me what your child's favor.
ite flavor is, Combine with mi'lr
and/or ice cream and it's easy
as sippin! through a straw!

Is it peanut butter? Mix Si
cup of peanut butter with 1 pint
of softened vanilla ice cream,
then add 2 cups of milk and 1/2.
teaspoon of vanilla extract, and
you'll get 4 to 5 cups that will
serve two or three children,
nicely, and they'll thank you
sweetly.

Is it chocolate and peanut
butter? That's easy, too. Just
substitute 2/4 cup of chocolate
syrup for the vanilla and beet
all together. You'll then have a
chocolate peanut butter shake.
Oh, peppermint is your child's

favorite? Whip a pint of pep-
permint stick ice cream with
quart of milk, then top with
scoops of peppermint ice cream.
If you like, dress it up with
crushed peppermint stick candy'
or give them a stirrer of a pep-
permint candy cane. They'll go
for it.
A rainbow of milk drinks?

Use a pint of sherbet for each
quart of milk and stir together.
You can select front orange,
lemon, lime, pineapple or rasp.
berry sherbets if the youngster
wants variety.

TRUSTEES' SALE
of valuable fee simple real property located on the north
side of Riffle Road in the Emmitshurg Election District,
Frederick County, Maryland.

Under and by virtue of the power of sale contained
in a 1)eed of Trust from Sheldin G. Erickson. dated De-
cember 6, 1973 and recorded in Liber 928, Folio 928, one
of the Land Records of Frederick County, Maryland:
the terms of said Deed of Trust being in default, the
undersigned Trustees will offer for sale at public auction
at the Court House Door in the City of Frederick,
Maryland on:

MONDAY, NOVEMBER 4, 1974
AT 11:00 A.M.

all the hereinafter described real property and improve-
ments which are described as follows:

All that tract of land situate and lying in the Em-
mitsburg Election District, Frederick County, Mary-
land, containing 57.25 acres of land, more or less, and
being more particularly described in a deed from Jack-
son Brodsky, Trustee, unto Sheldon G. Erickksort dated
January 10, 1969 and recorded in Liber 797, Folio 389,
me of the Land Records of Frederick County, Maryland.
The aforesaid real property being improved by a three

stary, 10 room brick house with cement block founda-
tion, having three and one-half baths, central air con-
ditioning, electric heating. hardwood floors, fully finish-
ed basement and four fireplaces; said premises being
further improved by an attached 24'x24' two-car garage
with bannistered porch above and an attached S'x16'
oval porch; and also a 48'x54' bank barn.

TERMS OF SALE — The above mentiined real prop-
erty and improvements is to be sold free and clear of
all existing prior liens A deposit of 10 percent of the
purchase price in cash or check acceptabble to the Trus-
tees will be required of the purchaser at the time and
place of sale and the balance of the purchase price is
to be paid within five days of the ratification of the sale
by the Circuit Court for Frederick County, Maryland.
Expenses of conveyancing will be paid by the purchaser.
Real property taxes and public charges will be adjusted
to date of sale. The Trustees reserve the right to with-
draw the hereinabove described property and improve-
ments from sale at any time.

BENJAMIN B. ROSENSTOCK and
JOSEPH V. GARTLAN, JR.,

Trustees
Frederick .1. Bower
Attorney for Trustees
100 West Church Street
Fredreick, Maryland 21701
JAMES TROUT
Auctioneer
15 North Court Street
Frederick, Maryland 21701

YEAR - END CLEARANCE

25%
OFF

Scotts.

LAWN PRODUCTS
Turf Builder, 10,000 sq. ft. 95 11.21

Turf Builder Plus 2 15,000 sq. ft. 2; 95 22.46
Family Seed, 1,000 sq. ft. ?5 2.96

Zerfing's Hardware
Gettysburg Free Parking Rear of Store Littlestown

Hours: Mon. & Fri. 7-9; Tues, Wed., Sat. 7-5; Thurs. 7-12
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LOUISE
GORE

INVITES, FRIENDS, SUPPORTERS,

AND PUBLIC AT LARGE TO

COFFEE AT

"MARWOOD"

11300 RIVER RD.

ROCKVILLE, MD.

From 10 A.M .To 6 P.M.

SUNDAY, OCTOBER 27

Auth.: Robert Understein, Treas.

041.,(4,#~•~4.(41,

SAY IT WITH

FLOWERS
On Every Occasion

Largest Local Selection of Fresh
And Artificial Flowers; Cut Flowers,

Plants
—PROFESSIONAL ARRANGEMENT-

-DELIVERY SERVICE-
-WEDDING CONSULTING SERVICE—

SPECIAL THIS• WEEK

Long Stemmed

YELLOW, WHITE & RED ROSES
$7.50 Dozen Boxed
$10.00 Dozen Arrangedz

CASH & CARRY — THIS WEEK ONLY

Cozy Bud ̀ 11' Vase Shoppe
South End of Thurmont On Route 806

PHONE 271-2445

•••••••••••#•••••••••••••••^4,......0.0-04NONP(.4,0#4.~~(0.4.....,,,Ans,pm,....

EFFECTIVE NOVEMBER 1, 1974

First National Bank of Fairfield announces

new interest terms on their passbook sav-

ings accounts. Deposits received by the

15th of the month will receive credit from

the 1st of the month.

FIRST NATIONAL BANK
OF FAIRFIELD, PA.

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

PHONE: 642-8225
Office Hours: Mott. thru Thurs., 9 A.M. - 3 P.M.

Fri., 9 A.M. - 8 P.M.
SATURDAY 8:30 A.M. - 11:00 A.M.

Classified Ads Offer Good Values

Cast a Vote

for

G.

EUGENE

ANDERSON

for

COUNTY

COMMISSIONER

• Experienced Dariy Farmer
• Chairman & Engineer with Board of Property Review
• Extensive experience in engineering, industrial build-

ing and appraisal
• Past Director, Southern States Co-operative
• Member, American Society of Military Engineers
• Past Director, Md. Co-operative Milk l'roducers Assn.
• Member, Farm Bureau and Grange
• Chairman. Souvenir Committee, County Bicentenniel

Committee
• Active Leader 4-II Activities
• Member of Citizens Advisory Comanitte, Board of

Education
• Member & Past President, Thurmont Lions Club

"I will pledge my efforts to the best interests of
all taxpayers without making promises I would be un-
able to keep. Your support will be greatly apreciated."

Authority of the Candidate

VOTE NOVEMBER 5TH

VOTE

STERLING
BOLLINGER

Democratic Candidate

for

COUNTY
COMMISSIONER
PULL LEVER 9-A

By Authority Francis W. Bush, Treas.

ELECT AN EXPERIENCED COUNTY COMMISSIONER WITH A PROVEN

DESIRE TO SERVE

LAWRENCE A. "LOU" DORSEY
,„01041

believe that only

by working together

with openminds,

by communicating

with each other,

and by respecting

each other can we

have a better

Frederick County.

• 8 years Co. Commissioner

• 6 years State Board of
Directors, County Commis-
sioner Association

• 15 years Burgess of
Woodsboro

• 15 years President Woods-
boro Vol. Fire Company

• 40 years in business

• Member of more than 13
boards and commissions

This will continue to be my approach towards serving all the people of Frederick County

;
Our team can show you how your remodeling

ideas can be turned into a living reality. Our total

concept capabilities enable us to carry your

thoughts from design and building to paintin!, and

decorating. CCA will give you a top job, executed

by a team of qualified professionals. Call us.

We can talk about your project now.

RESIDENTIAL • INDUSTRIAL • COMMERCIAL
(301) 447-2949

2a14 Scitaiwit
Candidate For

HOUSE OF DELEGATES

District 4B

Any candidate who will insult the intelligence of
the voter by campaigning on reducing taxes does not
deserve to win an elect-on. In these days of inflation,
growth and demands on government, it is sheer folly to
expect taxes to he lowered or eliminated. It is true that
our county tax rate has been lowered the past two years
but this is not to say that your final tax gill was less
than the previous year. The only thing that I, as a can-
didate for the Maryland House of Delegates, can and
will promise is that I will be most critical and out-
spoken on budgets that are frivolous and also on waste.
Both of these factors will tend to reduce the rate of
increase. There is one tax, however, that I will strong •
ly oppose increasing and that is the Retail Sales Tax.
It is my opinion that this is the most inequitable of all
taxes, simply because it is a greater burden on a low-
income citizen to pay 4% than it is a person in a high-
er income bracket. If elected to the House of Delegates,
I would inject as much as possible good business phi-
losophy into state government as I have successfully
done in my own business. I can assure you curtailing
waste is a good business practice. Your vote for me
on November 5th will not be wasted.

Auth.: Ken Hoffzneyer, Treas.

You and Grove a hard team to beat! That's be-
cause Grove is growing and Grove employees are
growing too. Growing in numbers and growing in
opportunities for advancement. If you qualify to
be part of the Grove team, you'll enjoy good pay
and good working conditions. You'll receive fre-
quent merit increases and become eligible for
Grove's special job-bid program that provides op-
portunities for better jobs as they become avail-
able. You'll enjoy ten paid holidays a year, up
to 4 weeks paid vacation, liberal insurance pro-
tection for you and your family and there's
even a full week plant shutdown during deer
season. All of this and much more at Grove
Manufacturing...the world leader in mobile hydrau-
lic cranes. Get your job application now! Just mail
the coupon in this ad or stop by the main gate on Pa.
Route 16 between Greencastle and Waynesboro — it's open
24 hours a day. You and Grove...a hard team to beat!

To: Grove Manufacturing,
Box 2.1, Shady Grove, Pa. 17256

YES! Please send me a job application form,

NAME

I ADDRESS

CITY STATE

Elect

HARRY 0.

SMITH

Judge of

Orphans Court

The Man For the Job

I'ULL LEVER 23-A

Auth.: Marvin Houck.
Treas.

NOTICE
EFFECTIVE IMMEDIATELY

Due to lack of rain, residents are asked to

refrain from watering lawns, hosing down side-

walks, washing cars, and using water unneces-

sarily in any other way until further notice.

RICHARD M. SPRANKLE, Mayor

ONLY AT

SHEPLEY'S
Brand-New — Factory Fresh

QUALITY FURNITURE
TVs STEREOS
APPLIANCES

• Discount Prices

• Easy Terms

• Free Lay-A-Way

• Friendly Service

Come In Today!

SHEPLEY'S
FURNITURE WAREHOUSE

IN THURMONT: 15 WATER ST. 271-7066

414

Apply now-
immediate
job openings
Grove now has openings for numer-
ous entry level jobs, primarily on
2nd shift, such as welder trainees,
yard or shop workers. Apply now

and EARN OVER $9,000 YOUR
FIRST YEAR!

An equal opportunity employer

PULL LEVER 12-A By Authority Doris Remsherg. Treas. E 
ZIP CODE PHONE


