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Weekly Thought
Kindness means putting our-

selves in the place of other
people.
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Most Anything

At 4 Glance

- Bv rel4i9cal -

Summer seems to have set-
tled in for a time. I under-
stand that those folks who
are selling or installing air
conditioning are doing a boom-
ing business, in fact, I've
heard a few comment that
they really had more work
than they could get done.

* * *

Congratulations to the Co-
lumbian Squires who spent
one of their evenings last
week sweeping the town
streets. And a big "Bee" to
those uncouth few who seem
to think that town streets
and sidewalks and folk's front
yards are the proper place to
dispose of their empty beer
and pop cans.

* * *

I've noticed that the ball
games around town have been
enjoying a very good attend-
ance so far this summer. Most
of the fans seem to have a
good, and often loud, time.
But according to what I heard
the prize for the loudest, most
persistent, most bothersome
voice should be awarded to a
spectator from Thurmont, for
his outstanding performance
at last Sunday's game.

* * *

For any of you who might
have missed it—what's this
about some man who would
like to buy the whole town of
Emmitsburg and make it over
as a miniature Williamsburg
or Georgetown? I wonder if
he is really serious!

* * *

Nobody has yet reported
seeing "The Phantom" around
town. According to one re-
port he. is liked- to prey .-n
small children and cattle (now
that's some combination). One
police officer was quoted as
saying that most likely armed
people out looking for the
creature would accidently be
shooting each other. Well, if
any of you spot the thing,
let ole Abbie know.

* 4 *

Those of you who have been
carrying a supply of pennies
around with you for use in
town parking meters better
start switching over to nick-
els. Seems that slowly but
surely our town meters are
all being replaced with new-
er models—and they require
nickels.

* * *

Which reminds me, I hear
the new meter-maid will be
starting her rounds soon. I
heard one of our local gentle-

men say that maybe folks
won't mind paying the tickets

so much if they are being

handed out by a pretty girl.
* a *

Prices are still going up—

and there doesn't seem to be

much us regular type folks

can do about it. Even the

phone company is wanting to

raise their rates. If they do,

guess we'll just have to pay

them, cause they're the only

phone company in town. Would

help us feel a little bit better

though, if they could be a bit

faster on service calls. Noth-

ing more aggravating than

having to keep running over

to a neighbor's house to use

their phone to tell the phone

company that yours doesn't
work—after a couple of days

of that a person tends to get

a bit discouraged about the

whole thing.
• • •

Seems we've been having a

lot of damage caused around

town lately by Bee-Bee guns.

I can't help but feel that if
parents are going to supply

their children with such po-
tentially dangerous and de-
structive items, that they
should also give a bit of safe-

ty training and supervision,
too. It seems to me that par-
ents are legally responsible
for destructive acts perform-
ed by their minor children, so
you parents out there, how
about keeping a little closer
check on where that child is
going and what he is shoot-
ing at when he leaves the
house with that gun.

Special Legion Meeting

A special meeting for the
election of post officers of the
Francis X. Elder Post 121,
American Legion, will be held
Tuesday night, June 19, in the
Post Home, beginning at 8
o'clock.

Receives Marine
Corps Commission

Marine Francis X. Ryan,
son of Mrs. Valli M. Ryan of
Tom's Creek Church [Road, Em-
mitsburg, was commissioned
a second lieutenant in the
Marine Corps after graduating
from basic officer training at
the Marine Corps Develop-
ment and Education Command
at Quantico, Va.
A 1969 graduate of Fair-

field High School, and a 1973
graduate of Mount St. Mary's
College ,he joined the Marine
Corps in December 1969.

Two Arrested;
Three Ticketed
Two area men were taken

to the Frederick County Jail
on June 2 after being arrest-
ed by Officer J. L. Fuss. The
men, Lynn A. Miller and Philip
L. Fox, were charged with
disorderly conduct.
Charged with vehkle of-

fenses during the past week
by Officer Fuss were George
W. Lookingbill, E. Main St.,
and Hollis J. Broyles, Way-
nesboro, Pa. Both were charg-
ed with exceeding the posted
speed limit and face possible
$25 fines. Also cited was
Michael Wastler, of Federal
Ave., for operating a motor
vehicl.. in a negligent man-
ner.

Area Deaths
MRS. IVA ORNDORFF
Mrs. Iva Orndorff, 80, of Rt.

3, Smithsburg, died Monday,
June 11, at the Waynesboro
Hospital. She was born in
Emmitsburg, a daughter of
the late Charles B. and Ade-
laide B. Little Topper, and
was the wife of the late
James Orndorff. She was a
member of St. Mary's Cath-
olic Church, and Sodality of
the Blessed Virgin Mary. She
is a former member of St.
Anthony's Shrine, Emmits-
burg.
She is survived by 3 daugh-

ters, Mrs. Mary I. Wivell of
Smithsburg; Mrs. Lillian Lay-
man, of Keymar, and Mrs.
Helen Fry, of Mt. Airy; sis-
ters, Sister Mary Topper, Mrs.
Laura Fritz and Mrs. Dora
Wormley, all of Emmitsburg;
Mrs. Nellie Wetzel of Thur-
mont; Mrs. Caroline Hock of
Washington; Mrs. Margaret
Benchoff of Charmian,
and Mrs. Effie Hemler of Mc-
Sherrystown, Pa.; brothers,
Charles Topper of Wildwood,
Fla., and Russell Topper of
Baltimore; and 12 grandchil-
dren.

Funeral services were held
this morning (Thursday) with
a Requiem Mass at St. Mary's
Catholic Church at 9:30 a.m.
with Father Robert S. Pas-
sarelli the celebrant. Inter-

ment was in St. Anthony's
Cemetery, Emmitsburg.

St. Joe's High
Students Honored

Sister Elaine, D.C., princi-
pal of St. Joseph's High
School, recently announced the
selection of the school's stu-
dents who have been chosen
as members of The Society of
Outstanding American High
School Students, one of the
nation's leading high school
honoraries. The students are:
Mary Jo Cole, Conrad Fless-

ner, Christine Skybyk, Mary
Beth Devlin, Marcella Louise
Nusbaum and Steven Michael
Hollinger.
The Society accepts for

membership only young men
and women who have distin-
guished themselves as their
school's highest achievers.
Members of the society are

now competing for over $640,-
000.00 in renewable college
scholarships.

Because of their accomplish-
ments, these students are most
deserving of recognition by
the school, the community, and
the nation. As leaders of
American youth they repre-
sent the most important seg-
ment of our society.

Knights Elect
Raymond Sanders
Election of Council officers

was the main order of busi-
ness for Brute Council 1860,
Knights of Columbus, last
Monday evening at the coun-
cil home with Grand Knight
George L. Danner presiding.
Raymond Sanders of Sabillas-
ville was elected Grand Knight
for the coming year, begin-
ning ,July 1. Others elected
were: Deputy Grand Knight,
Lawrence Kolb; chancellor,
William Sanders, Jr.; record-
er, George Arnold; treasurer,
William Topper; advocate,
Mark Sanders; warden, Clyde
Eyler; inside guard, Robert
L. Myers; outside guard, Har-
old G. Raab; trustee for 3
years, George L. Danner; del-
egate to the convention, Carl
Wetzel, and alternate, Clyde
Eyler. Alternate to the grand
knight is Lawrence Kolb.

Letters were read from Vic-
tor Cullen School for Boys,
the Vigilant Hose Company
and from a member of the
council urging the Knights to
be more involved in communi-
ty, church and school activi-
ties. A donation was approv-
ed to the Emmitsburg Little
League.

James Doolan will represent
the council at an Open House
and Dedication ceremony at
Victor Cullen School for Boys
on June 27.

William Sanders Jr., report-
ed that the awards and recog-
nition night will be held on
Saturday, July 21, at Mt. St.
Mary's College Student Union
Building beginning with a
cocktail hour at 6 p.m., din-
ner and dancing to follow.
The dance will begin at 9 p.m.
with "The Jenkins Sisters"
providing music. Tickets will
be $5 each.
Paul Keepers announced

that the honorary Life Mem-
bers of the council will be
honored at the next council
meeting, June 18. This is the
first time such a ceremony
will be conducted by the coun-
cil.
Members who have attained

the age of 65 and who have
been members of the order
for 25 years but still pay $5
per annum are designated hon-
orary members. Those attain-
ing the age of 75 who have
been members for 25 years
are designated as honorary
life members. These members
are exempt from further pay-
ment of dues and per capita
assessments.
These men will also be hon-

ored at the Awards Dinner on
July 21. Keepers also asked
that members wishing to see
a knight, an organization or
fellow citizen of the commun-
ity recognized for something
outstanding should submit the
name and re man for an award
within the next week or 10
days so the proper award can
be given at the banquet on
July 21.
Grand Knight Richard Kun-

kle of Pang) Council, Hag-
erstown, wa introduced.
Mass will be offered by Rev.

Carl Fives prior to the June
1S meetine at the Council
Home at 7:30 p.m.

PTA Presents School With Plaque
In Honor Of Sister Mary Xavier

Since she served Mother
Seton School for 14 years as
both teacher and principal,
the Parent Teachers' Associa-
tion presented in Sr. Mary
Xavier's name a sculpture of
Mother Seton for use in the
school. The wood sculpture,
24"x30", was created by John
Segerin of Harper's Ferry,
W. Va.
Mr. Segerin, formerly from

Holland, is employed by the
Department of Interior in
Harper's Ferry and has
works in numerous museums
throughout the United States
and the world. To date this

the largest portrait done by
Mr. Segerin.
The wood scupture was pre-

sented to Sr. Mary Xavier
by the president of the PTA,
James Otto, following the
eighth Grade farewell pro-
gram, "Sunshine Daze."

Sister will be teaching next
year at Holy Cross School in
Lynchburg, Virginia. She ex-
pressed her deep appreciation
to the parents for their co-
operation and support and for
all they had done to make her
fourteen years at the school
such hapy ones.

Engagement

Announced

Miss Beth Anne Little

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Little,
Emmitsburg, announce the en-
gagement of their daughter,
Beth Anne, to Airman 3rd
Class Charles F .Fisher, son
of Mr. and Mrs. Russell E.
Fisher, Thurmont.
The bride-to-be is a junior

at Catoctin High School and
is employed at Mt. St. Mary's
College.
Her fiance is a 1971 gradu-

ate of Catoctin High. He just
returned from a 6 months
deployment in the Philippines
and is presently serving at the
Naval Base in Barbers Point,
Hawaii.
No date has been set for

the wedding.

Most fish lay their eggs in
water. On the West Coast,
however, there is a small fish
known as the grunion which
lays its eggs on land.—Sports
Afield

Mount Graduate

Honored
Stephen A. Lovelidge, of

Freeport, New York, has re-
ceived the Past President's
Award of the Holy Name So-
ciety of the Archdiocese of
Baltimore. The presentation
took place during Commence-
ment Weekend at Mount St.
Mary's College.

The 1973 Mount graduate,
who was cited for his "extra
degree of youth leadership in
Christian endeavors", is the
son of Mr. and Mrs. Thomas
J. Lovelidge of 221 Atlantic
Ave., in Freeport. He was
active throughout h's four
years at Mount Saint Mary's
in the college's Group Action
Program, a eornniunity serv-
ice organization for Emmits-
burg and surrounding areas.
The award took the form

of a $250 cash grant and a
plaque which was presented
June 5 during the Baltimore
Orioles Holy Name Family
Night.

Fireballetts'

Schedule
The Emmitsburg Firebal-

letts defeated Fort Ritchie on
June 10 by 14 to 13, winning
the game in the last inning.
On Tuesday evening on the
local field, they lost 11 to 8
to Mt. Airy in a well-played
game.
The Fireballetts are sche-

duled to play Waynesboro at
2 p.m. Sunday, June 17, on
the local deld, and Thurmont,
at Thurmont at 6:30 p.m. on
Tuesday, June 19.

Call 662-6333 to report a fire

Immunization

Regulations
Parents of school children in

Frederick County are remind-
ed that state regulations ef-
fective January 1973, require
immunization of nursery, kin-
dergarten, and first grade
children for protection against
Diphtheria, Whooping Cough,
Tetanus, Polio, Rubeola (Mea-
sles) and Rubella (German
Measles). These same regu-
letions apply to all children
in grades second through
sixth as of September 1, 1973.

Section .01 of the Regula-
tions Governing Immunization
Prior to Entry Into A Mary-
land School provides for this
requirement as follows:
"No school principal or oth-

er person in charge of a
school shall knowingly admit
any pupil to on retain any
pupil in a public or private
nursery, kindergarten, or ele-
mentary school who has not
furnished evidence of primary
immunizations against Diph-
theria, Tetanus, Pertussis, Po-
liomyelitis, Measles (Rubeola)
and Rubella (German Meas-
les) in a manner approved by
the Local Deputy State Health
Officer. Such immunization
will be in accordance with the
current schedule of immuniza-
tions recommended by the
Maryland Steering Committee
on Immunization Practices of
the Medical and Chirurgical
Faculty of Maryland. Excep-
tion may be made for a per-
iod of 90 days in the case of
a child whose parent or guar-
dian indicates that his child
is in the process of comply-
ing with these regulations
and furnishes evidence of fur-
ther compliance after the start
of the school term or within
a reasonable length of time
that is consistmt with the cur-
rent schedule of immuniza-
tions."

Other sections of the regu-
lations provide for exceptions
in certain instances involving
religious conflict or medical
contraindication of immuniza-
tion.

School records have been
checked and parents notified
of instances in which further
immunization is required.
Prompt cooperation is urged
of parents in obtaining needed
immunizations.
Family physicians will nor-

mally administer required im-
munizations, however, the
Frederick County Health De-
partment will do so upon re-
ferral by the family physician.

Landmarks Society

To Meet June 18
The Emmitsburg Landmarks

Society will meet at the Em-
mitsburg Public Library on
Monday, June 18, 1973, at 8
p.m. The group is interested
in developing an oral history
of the area, starting a local
museum, registering local
landmarks and preparing for
the bicentennial celebration.

Citizens interested in our lo-
cal history are invited to at-
tend the meeting and join the
organization.

Area Deaths
CHARLES R. ALTHOFF

Charles Raymond Althoff,
75, of Centreville, died after
a long illness Thursday, May
31, at the Rio Vista Nursing
Home in St. Michaels. He was
a resident of Queen Anne's
County for 50 years.
Born in Emmitsburg on

July 15, 1897 he was the son
of George and Mary Sanders
Althoff. Mr. Althoff was the
husband of the late Margaret
Louise Althoff, who died June
8, 1951.
A member of St. Peter's

Catholic Church in Queens-
town, Mr. Althoff was a World
War I veteran and a member
of Jeff Davis Post No. 18 in
Centreville and Grasonville
VFW Memorial Post 7464. He
was also active in the Knights
of Columbus, Regina Coeli
Council 2274, Easton.

Surviving Mr. Althoff are
four daughters, Mrs. John
Vest, Baltimore; Mrs. Ernest
M. Smith, Grasonville; Miss
Mary P. Althoff, Queenstown,
and Mrs. Olin Jarrell, Jr., of
Quenestown; and a son,
Charles E. Althoff, Queens-
town. Also surviving are four
brothers, John H. Althoff, Bal-
timore; Bernard Althoff, Phil-
adelphia; Jacob Althoff, of
Wharton, N. J.•

' 
and Frank

Althoff, Emmitsburg; two sis-
ters, Mrs. Jessie Jordan, Dan-
ville, Pa., and Mrs. Stella
Like, Melbourne Beach, Fla.;
13 grandchildren and two
great-grandchildren.

Services were held at 11
a.m. Saturday, June 2 at St.
Peter's Catholic Church in
Queenstown. The Rev. Ed-
ward B. Carley officiated at
the ceremony. Interment was
in St. Peter's Church Ceme
tery.

CITIZENS OF
TOMORROW

This week's Citizen of To-
morrow is Kristin ,age 1,
daughter of Mr. and Mrs.
Michael Flynn, Emmitsburg.

GM LOSES

The GM Softball Team lost
Monday evening's game in
Frederick by 5 to 1. The team
is scheduled to play Ft. Rit-
chie at the Fort at 8 p.m.
Sunday, June 17. GM and the
Ott House will replay a game
June 20 on the local field.

Women's Club Honors Charter Members On Club's 50th Anniversary; Recall 50 Years Of Progress

HOMEMAKERS HONORED
Club. Pictured are from left
Mrs. Charles McNair; second
the Frederick News-Post).
The Women's Club of Em-

mitsburg, Maryland, was or-
ganized at the home of Mrs.
Harry Boyle on Monday af-
ternoon, January 15, 1923, by
Miss Elizabeth Thompson,
Home Demonstration Agent of
Frederick County, Maryland.
The following officers were

elected: President, Mrs. Har-
ry Boyle; Vice President, Mrs.
John Crumlish; Secretary,

— The above charter members of the Emmits burg Homemakers Club were honored recently at the 50th anniversary of the
to right, first row, Mrs. Edgar Phillips, Mrs. Harry Boyle, who was the first president of the club, Mrs. Charles Harner.
row, Mrs. Luther Cregger, who is the current president, and Mrs. Oscar Stinson. (Photo by Cedric H. Smith, courtesy of

Mrs. Andrew A. Annan; and
Treasurer, Mrs. Lewis Hig-
bee.

It was decided to hold club
meetings every two weeks in
a classroom at the Emmits-
burg High School.
As two of its first projects,

the organization took up "Ec-
onomics" and "Sewing."
The first demonstration was

"The Making of Dress Forms."

At the second meeting, six
dress forms were made. Also,
at this meeting, the Constitu-
tion and By-Laws were drawn
up and adopted.

Article I of the Constitu-
tion read: This organization
shall be known as The Wo-
mens Club of Emmitsburg,
Md.

Article II: The object of
the club shall be for the pur-

pose of individual and social
improvement of its members
and civic improvement of the
community. Also: The mem-
bership of this club shall not
be limited. (Sixty members
joined the first year).

Article III. Officers shall be
elected annually by each mem-
ber present writing the name
of one person on a piece of
paper. The two receiving the

greatest number of votes shall
be the nominees. The candi-
dates receiving the majority
of votes shall be elected.

Article IV. Dues of the club
shall be 5c per mo.
The Constitution read: The

motto of this club shall be
"For the Good of Others."

The Colors chosen were
"Blue and White."
(Continued On Page Six)

Organize Against
Dam Project
Opponents of the Sixes

Bridge Dam Propect held
meetings in the area Tuesday
night to voice their opposi-
tion to the project to repre-
sentatives of the Army Corps
of Engineers, and to begin an
organized opposition effort to
the $35 million project that
promises to displace some 70
families.

At a meeting at the Tom's
Creek Church, Sam Hays of
Emmitsburg, told Army En-
gineers "Our community is
getting water they don't need,
recreation they don't want and
a bill they can't avoid."
Some fifty residents grilled

two engineers about land con-
demnation and costs at the
church.

Other county residents were
meeting at the home of
Charles Fisher near Harney,
to form a "Save the Monoc-
acy Association." Fisher stat-
ed that there is a very strong
grassroots opposition to the
dam in both Frederick and
Carroll counties.

Going beyond the dam, the
association states its object-
ives as orderly and planned
development in northern Fred-
erick and Carroll Counties and
the preservation of the Mo-
nocacy and all its existing
recreational, historic, scenic
and social potential, Fisher
said.
The association will meet

Thursday, June 21, at the
Thurmont Methodist Church,
at 8 p.m., to map out its cam-
paign against the dam.

Recover Stolen

Car From Quarry
A car, stolen from the park-

ing lot of the Blue Duck Inn,
was recovered Monday night
from a Fairfield Quarry.
The 1971 light blue Ply-

mouth Satellite, belonging t.
Siuert 0. Tostee, Fort Bel
voir, Va., was reported mis-
sing at 12:45 a.m. Monday.
Maryland State Police at
Frederick received an anony-
mous telephone call 30 min-
utes later that the car had
been "dumped" in the quarry,
and upon investigation Mon-
day morning, police verified
that a vehicle had been driv-
en through the cable around
the hole.
The water-filled limeston

quarry is owned by Harry T
Campbell Co. Assisting in th,
recovery operation were 40
volunteers from Hanover, Fair-
field and Gettysburg Fire
Companies. Police are at pres-
ent attempting to establish

the identity of the persons

who stole the vehicle,

Orioles Defeat

Yanks, Dodgers
The Orioles handed the

Yanks their eighth defeat of
the season, 15-10, in a weath-
er-shortended Little League
game this week. Sam Topper
picked up the win. Doug Mil-
ler led in hitting with three
singles while Sam Topper ad-
ded two. Mark Bowers and
Jimmy Click led the Yanks
in hitting with two each.

• * •

The Dodgers tumbled from
the ranks of the undefeated
when they lost a 9-7 decision
to the Orioles in a well-play-
ed game. The game was tied
4-4 at the end of four. Then
the Dodgers regained the lead
with a run in their half of the
fifth, but the Orioles were not
to be denied. After a leadoff
strikeout, Joe Antolin walked,
moved to second on Doug Mil-
ler's third hit of the game,
and scored in Lenny Zentz's
double. Sammy Topper later
lofted one just inside the foul
pole for a three-run homer.
Matt Reaver who( pitched a
fine game up to this point,
seemed to wilt in the intense
heat, just as happened to Len-
ny Zentz in the top of the
six. The Dodgers threatened
and came up with two runs
before a fine play from cent-
er to third cut down another
runner.

Freeman Shoe Stops Bombers

Freeman Shoe Co. knocked
off first place Thurmont,
7-1, Wednesday evening in a
Northern Maryland Fastpitch
Softball League game. Wayne
Lingg held the losers to but
one hit over the last six in-
nings. The local attack was
led by Donnie Sweeney with
three hits and Jim Hewitt's
three runs batted in.
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FREDERICK COUNTY BACKGROUNDS
BY SAMUEL CARRICK

The Duphorne Family
"Thank God, a man can

grow!
With earthward gaze to
creep along the ground:

Though his beginnings be
but poor and low.

Thank God, a man can
grow!

The fire upon his altars
may grow dim,

The torch he lighted may
in darkness fail,

And nothing to rekindle it
avail—

And yet beyond his dull
horizon's rim--

Arcturus and the Pleiads
becken him."

A few remaining notes per-
taining to the Winter family,
of Pennsylvania and Maryland,
dealing with additional burials
in the Winter's (Saint Luke's)
churchyard.

31. In memory of John
Winter, died June 3, 1827, aged
43 years, 5 months, and 26
days.
Note: This inscription was

also taken from the list com-
piled by the historian Thomas
Scharf. At the time, some
ten or twelve years ago, when
J. M. Holdcraft made his sur-
vey of Winter's churchyard,
this marker had disappeared.

32. In memory of Joseph
Winter, born February 9, 1797,

died December 2, 1863.
33. In memory of Martin

Winter, died July 7, 1876, aged
72 years, 6 months, and 6
days.
This concludes, for the pres-

ent at least, the data on the
Winter family, who were long
residents of Emmitsburg and
vicinity.
The Duphorne (Duphorn)

family—
Interred in Elias churchyard

are members of the John and

Samuel Duphorne families.

Others of this clan may well

be buried in old Tom's Creek

Lutheran a n d Reformed
churchyard in graves long

since lost to all memory and
knowledge. It will be remem-

bered that only one-third of

this ancient ground remains

a small part of the original

"given acre."
Undoubtedly the Duphorne

family were of French Hugue-

not extraction and mention is

made of them in Stapleton's
"Memorials of the Huguenots."

It is reasonable to assume

that the Duphornes came into

Maryland with the Pennsyl-

vania Germans, en route to

Shenandoah Valley of Virgin-

ia. Some of these people, as

stated in previous columns, re-

mained in Maryland, particu-

larly in Frederick County.

Pennsylvania, prior to the

FATHER'S DAY - JUNE 17

SELECT A GIFT

FIT FOR A KING
FOR YOUR DAD

Choose From
Johnny Carson Clothes

Cricketeer Clothing

Wembley Ties

Arrow Sport and Dress Wear

Woolrich Casual Wear

Burlington Sox

Levi, Lee and Higgins Slacks

Swank Jewelry

—If in Doubt, Give A Gift Certificate—

HERSHEY'S MEN'S SHOP
Baltimore Street Gettysburg, Pa.

FATHER'S DAY
JUNE 17th

Evans Slippers

Florsheim Shoes

Camp Sox

Ronson Electric Roto-Shine Kits

Gift Certificates

Make It A Family Affair

The Shoe Box
Gettysburg, Ra.
Mon. and Fri. - 9 to 9

PUBLIC SALE
OF'

VALUABLE REAL ESTATE
I, the undersigned Agent and Attorney for the

Estate of William T. Bentz, will sell at public auction
on premises located I/2 mile south of Mt. Manor Motel
along Old Frederick Road, 11/2 miles south of Emmits-

burg, Md., on

SATURDAY, JUNE 16, 1973
At 1:00 P. M.

All that parcel of real estate containing 84 acres,
more or less, located on the east side of Old Frederick
Road in the Emmitsburg Election District, Frederick
County, Maryland.

Being all and the same real estate described in

parcel No. I of a deed from George Thomas Zurgable,

dated January 3, 1940 and recorded in Liber 421, Folio

538, among the Land Records of Frederick County,

Maryland.
Said property having long frontage on Old Fred-

erick Road and Dry Bridge Road and improved by a
6 room frame house with metal roof and further im-
proved by a large barn and other outbuildings.
TERMS: A deposit of 10% of bid price will be re-
quired of the Purchaset or Purchasers on the day of
the sale. Taxes to be adjusted as of date of settlement.
All cost of conveyancing including transfer and recorda-
tion tax shall be borne by tire purchaser or purchasers.

Not responsible for accidents

FREDERICK J. BOWER
Agent and Attorney

100 W. Church St., Frederick, Md.

ROBERT MEUNIER, Auctioneer
Thurmont, Md., Phone 271-1800

War of the American Revo-
lution, had quite in influx of
Holland Dutch and French
Huguenot settlers. These peo-
ple came into Penn's Prov-
ince together from New Jer-
sey to which colony they had
emigrated from New York. Be-
fore and after the Massacre
of Saint Bartholomow's day
many of the French protes-
tants, called Huguenots, fled
to Germany and Holland. For
this reason they were includ-
ed in what was known as the
"Low Dutch Settlement" which
was located, at one time, in
what is now Adams County,
Pennsylvania.
At present very little is

known pertaining to the Dup-

horne family of Emmitsburg

and vicinity. The material con-

tained in the church records

and the files of the "Emmits-

burg Chronicle" appears 1,o be

all that is available. From

these a skeleton may be put

together.
Trinity Lutheran church,

Taneytown-
1. Baptized—Franklin Din-

widdle Duphorn—son of John

and Rosanna Duphorn — born

January 28, 1841 — baptized

June 20, 1841.
2. Baptized—Eliza Ann Dup-

horn—daughter of Samuel and

Maria Duphorn — born Aug.

2, 1841—baptized Oct. 24, 1841.
Note: There is a mistake

as to this child's name—eith-

er as given in the church rec-

ords or cut on her tombstone.

She is interred in Elias church-

yard and ie inscription from

the marker at her grave reads
as follows;

1. In memory of Annie E.
Duphorne, born August 2,
1841, died June 14, 1924.
Annie Eliza Duphorne is

buried in the plot of her fath-
er and mother along with oth-
er members of the family.

3. Baptized, Robert John
Duphorn — son of John and
Rosanna Duphorn—born Feb-

ruary 27, 1842—baptized Sep-

tember 11, 1842.
Note: This little boy lived

less than a year He is ir-

terred in Elias churchyard in

the family plot. The inscrip-

tion follows:
2. Sacred to the memory of

Robert Duphorn, son of John

and Rosanna Duphorn, died

November 1842, aged 8 mos.

4. Baptized — Sarah Jane

Duphorne — daughter of John

and Rosanna Duphorne—born

September 19, 1843—baptized

April 6, 1844.
Baptized—Calvin Duphorne

—son of Samuel and Maria

Duphorne — born October 2,

1843 — baptized February 
23,

1846.
6. Baptized—Robert Sam

u-

el Duphorn—son of Samuel

and Maria Duphorn — 
Born

April 4, 1846--baptized De-

cember 14, 1846.

7. Baptized—Sarah Louisa

Duphorne—daughter of Sam-

uel and Maria Duphorne —

born November 24, 
1848—bap-

tized November 23, 1850.

Note: This little girl lived

less than five years and is

interred with her parents in

Elias churchyard. The 
inscrip

tion follows:
3. Sacred to ..ne memory

THE YARN BARN
JUST OFF SQUARE

2 South Seton Ave., Emmitsburg, Md.

Featuring the finest yarns

And Accessories

Come In and See Our Selections

—Free Instructions—

Phone 447-6550

CAMPERS
EVERYTHING FOR YOUR

CAMPING NEEDS
SLEEPING BAGS

TENT STAKES — CAMP STOVES

STOOLS — LIGHTS

MOUNTAIN HOUSE FREEZE DRIED FOODS

—SPECIAL PURCHASE—

Sneakers For Men, Woman, Children. From $2.79

OUTDOOR OUTFITTERS
IN THE

THURMONT SHOPPING PLAZA

Phone 271-2275

9 Til 9 7 Days A Week

AS YOU
SAVE...
SO YOU SHALL HAVE!

You'll never get ahead of the game, simp-

ly by living from pay-day to pay-day without

setting anything aside. It's the money you save

and invest that counts. What you spend today

is gone forever!

Visit your nearby Farmers and Mechanics

National Bank Office and open a Passbook Sav-
ings Account. Make regular deposits every
week. It's the only sure way to future security.

In no time, your savings will add up to an
impressive amount . . . why not get started
this payday?

RS AND MECHANICS

NATIONAL BANK
EMMITSBURG OFFICE

6 E. Main St., Emmitsburg, Md.
Phone 447-6134

MEMBER F.D.I.C.

VFW Ladies Auxiliary Holds Meeting
The regular meeting of the

Ladies Auxiliary to Emmits-
burg Memorial Post 6658, Vet-
erans of Foreign Wars, was
held on Thursday, June 7, at
8 p.m., with the president,
Judy Larsen, presiding. There
were 15 members present.
The minutes of the previous

meeting were read and cor-
rected. Bills were presented,
and correspondence was read.
The Community Action re-

port was then given.
A report on the recent

"Lite-a-Bike" program was
then given. Approximately
150 bikes were brought by
the local youth to have reffect-
or tape attached.
A committee for punch for

the upcoming party to held at
the Holiday Inn in Gettys-
burg, was selected. They are
Danielle White and Jill Ott.
A committee was selected

for the July 7 wedding to be
catered. They are Rita By-
ard, chairman; Eve Ott, J...dy
Larsen, Maxine Keilholtz, Lois
Hartdagen and Delores Henke.
Volunteers are to be at the
VFW at 10 a rr

of Sarah L. Duphorn — died
August 15, 1853—aged 4 years,
8 months and 22 days.
The notes pertaining to the

Duphorne (Duphorn) family
and their relationships will be
continued in this series next
week.

The July 14 wedding will
be arranged at the next meet-
ing.

Motion was made and sec-
onded to donate to the pur-
chase of a gift for the De-
partment President.
A motion was passed to

give a donation to the Em-
mitsburg Community Parade.
Discussion was held about en-
tering a float. Rita Byard
and Judy Larsen will take
care of this.

Motion was made and sec-
onded to buy frames for the

certificates that the Auxiliary
has received over the year.
The treasurer's report was

then given.
Mrs. Chata Carr's name was

called for the door prize, but

was not present. There being

no further business, the meet-

ing adjourned

VFW AMBULANCE

Mrs. Irene Baughman, R2,
Taneytown, and J. L Nester,
R1, Emmitsburg, were taken
to the Warner Hospital, Get-
tysburg, this week in the VFW
ambulance. Mrs. Wooley, R2,
Emmitsburg, was taken to the
York General Hospital, and
George Beall, R1, Woodsboro,
was transported to the Fred-
erick Memorial Hospital, in
the vehicle. Drivers were Sam
Cool, Charles Champlain, Leo
M. Boyle, James Kittinger,
and Larry Little.

How to judge

the value of

a prescription

The true test of value is what 
you get

for what you pay. On this basis,
 today's

prescription is the best buy in medica
l

history. Containing wonder drugs, 
un-

known years ago, it can speed re
covery,

cut over-all cost of illness.

EMMITSBURG PHARMACY
Paul M. Carter, Pharmacist

Phone 447-6226

ElVIMITSBURG, MARYLAND

Area Residents Receive Safe

Driving Awards At Ft. Ritchie
Several Emmitsburg area

residents were among 26 em-
ployees at Ft. Ritchie who
have received the National
Safety Council's Safe Driving
Award.
During a presentation cere-

mony held at the post, Col.
Merman Ertlschweiger, com-
mander, Ft. Ritchie, had this
to say: "The National Safety
Council Safe Driving Awards
we are presenting today are
a nationally recognized sym-
bol of safe driving for person-
nel whose regular employment
requires the daily operation
of organizational motor vehic-
les. It isn't just luck or chance
that 78 civilian drivers of this
command operated vehicles
over 100,000 miles last year
without hav-i-cg an accident.

It takes more than luck or
chance to drive accident-free
on the mountainous roadways
in this area.

Skillful driving and the abil-
ity to recognize and control
accident - producing situations
have earned you these awards.
To each of you I offer my
congratulations and thanks
for a job well done."

Local residents receiving
awards were: Ralph L. Keil-
holtz and Larry B. Utz, both
of Emmitsburg; and Merle E.
Keeney, Russell B. Ohler, Jr.,
and Richard S. Wilhide, all of
Thurmont.

Passenger car tires will per-
form better on long vacation
trips if their inflation is in-
creased by three or four lbs.

FOR SALE

30 Acres — Panoramic View Over-Looking

Harbaugh Valley. $1,000 Per Acre

BITTNER REAL ESTATE
Phone 241-3621

Ft. Ritchie Rd. Sabillasville, Md.

THE CARPETBRAGGERS

Offer You

PERSONAL
PROFESSIONAL

SERVICE
SELECT FROM OVER 5000 SAMPLES

CARPETING FOR ANYWHERE

AND EVERYWHERE

GETTYSBURG SHOPPING CENTER

22 Spring* Avenue Phone 334-7300 Gettysburg. Ps

Frederick Community College
SUMMER 1973 SCHEDULE — JUNE 18th - JULY 26th

DAY SECTION COURSES
English Composition
English Composition & Literature
Speech Fundamentals
Fundamental Concepts of Biology
General Chemistry
Health Education (3 week session
Math Laboratory
Math Laboratory
Introduction to Math
Introduction to Math
History of Western Civilization

CREDITS
3
3
3
4
4

6/18-7/6) 2
0
0
3
3
3

EVENING SECTION COURSES

Principles of Accounting

Introduction to Business
Business Math
Business Law
Principles of Management
Advertising and Sales Promotion

Introduction to Data Processing
Personal Typing
Fundamental Design & Materials
Survey of Art
English Composition
English Composition & Literature
American Literature
World Literature
Speech Fundamentals
Math Laboratory
Introduction to Math
Introduction to Math

History of Economic Development

Principles of Economics

History of the United States

History of the Afro American

Diplomatic History of the United States

General Psychology

Social Psychology
Introduction to Sociology

Social Problems

COURSE
Introduction to Archeology

(The above course will meet

CREDITS
4
3
3
3
3
3
3
0
2
3
3
3
3
3
3
0
3
3
3
3
3
3
3
3
3
3
3

INSTRUCTOR TIME

Mrs. Meeks 8- 9:40 A.M.

Mrs. Meeks 10-11:40 A.M.

Mr. Thompson 10-11:40 A.M.

Mr. Wicklund 8-11:40 A.M.

Mr. Stonestreet 8-11:40 A.M.

Mr. Clark 10-11:40 A.M.

Mr. Luttrell 8- 9:40..A.M.

Mr. Luttrell 10-11:40 A.M.

Mr. Luttrell 8- 9:40 A.M.

Mr. Luttrell 10-11:40 A.M.

Mr. Millington 10-11:40 A.M.

INSTRUCTOR TIME

Mr. Burgo 8- 9:40 P.M.

Mr. Esworthy 6- 7:40 P.M.
Mr. Burgo 6- 7:40 P.M.
Dr. Davis 6- 7:40 P.M.
Dr. Davis 8- 9:40 P.M.
Mr. Esworthy 8- 9:40 P.M.
TBA 8- 9:40 P.M.
TBA 8- 9:40 P.M.
Mrs. Riner 6- 7:40 P.M.
Mrs. Riner 8- 9:40 P.M.
Miss Crandall 6- 7:40 P.M.
Miss Crandall 8- 9:40 P.M.
Mr. Ondrejack 6- 7:40 P.M.
Mr. Ondrejack 8- 9:40 P.M.
Mr. Thompson 6- 7:40 P.M.
Mr. Sussmann 6- 7:40 P.M.
Mr. Sussmann 6- 7:40 P.M.
Mr. Sussmann 8- 9:40 P.M.
Mr. Wood 6- 7:40 P.M.
Mr. Wood 8- 9:40 P.M.
Dr. Lewis 6- 7:40 P.M.
Mr. Millington 6- 7:40 P.M.
Dr. Lewis 8- 9:40 P.M.
Mrs. Wilson 6- 7:40 P.M.
Mrs. Wilson 8- 9:40 P.M.
Miss McElroy 6- 7:40 P.M.
Miss McElroy 8- 9:40 P.M.

SATURDAYS

CREDITS INSTRUCTOR
3 TBA

on seven Saturdays beginning June 23rd

TIME
8:30 A.M. - 2:30 P.M.

and ending August 4th, 1973)

LATE REGISTRATION: June 18th - 21st
COSTS: Average Tuition is $36 Per Course
Classes meet for six weeks, Monday through Thursday

For additional information, contact the Registrar, Frederick Community College

Phone: 662-0101
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BUSINESS AND THE STOCK MARKET
Ups And Downs
In Job Prospects
By Babson's Reports Inc.,

Wellesley Hills, Mass., June
14, 1973—During the current
business boom which is still
bumping along its all - time
ceiling the employment situ-
ation has been peculiarly dif-
ficult to predict, by both geo-
graphical area and industry.
Even with the economy shat-

tering all previous records,
jobless totals have held close
to 5% of the labor force even
as employment as a whole
has touched one new peak af-
ter another. This has, of
course, been due in large mea-
sure to the vast numbers of
people entering the job mar-
ket each year.
There has been the influx

of high school and college

get

use your
furnace to

COOL
your house

27APPAll
whole house air conditioning

Quickly, easily and economically installed
into the duct work of your present

warm air heating system.

For free estimate call

C. F. STOUTER OIL CO. INC.
EMMITSBURG, MD. 21727

Telephone: (301) 447-2118

SPORTS CARS

TRIUMPH
WEIKERT'S GARAGE

Blue Ridge Summit, Pa. 17214
Phone 717-794-2614

GOOD USED CARS

1972 Ford Pinto Runabout; 6,000 Original Miles; One
Owner, $1,895.

1971 Triumph Stag, V-8, Auto. w/Convert. and remov-
able hard top, $4.200.

1969 Opel Coupe, Auto. Trans., $950.
1968 Opel GT, Straight Stick, $950.
1968 Austin-Healy Sprite, $1,395.
1967 Mustang, $900.
1966 Pontiac 4-Dr., Air, $595.
1961 Spitfire, $495.
1960 Mark I Sprite, Completely Restored—Collector's

Item, $1,500.

lamemismilreinee 

ALBERT F.WIVELL & SONS
CONTRACTOR 

Custom Homes

Remodeling

Excavation

Swimming Pools

Sales and Service

Call 447-2218

LOOKING FOR A GOOD USED CARP

SEE OUR litvlit*,'1;64...i„.
',

flinrnffiTirprin Hann fume,
yll'UflAHRILLV Uali,U tAKD

1971 Chevrolet Bel Air 4-Dr. Sedan V-8; Auto. Trans.;
Power Steer.; Air Cond.; One Owner.

1971 Galaxy 500 4-Dr. Hrdtp. V-8; Auto. Trans.; Pow.
Steer.; Air; Real Sharp.

1970 Ford 4-Dr. Sedan V-8; Auto. Trans; Power Steer.;
Air Conditioned.

1970 Ford 4-Dr. Sedan V-8; Stand. Trans.; Power Steer.;
R&H; One Owner.

1970 Ford Galaxie 500, 4-Dr. Hrdtp; V-8; Auto. Trans.;
Power Steering; Air Cond.; Vinyl Top.

1968 Pottitac Tempest 4-Dr. Sport Sedan; R&H; P.S.;
Auto. Trans.; Air Cond.; V-8.

COMPLETE LINE ALLCAR AUTO PARTS

BATTERIES & TIRES

SANDERS GARAGE
—AUTO SALES & SERVICE—

PHONE 447-6151 EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND

FOR PRESCRIPTION SERVICE

PEOPLES DRUG STORE
GETTYSBURG, PA.

Phone 334-2916

• Sick Room Supplies

• Greetings Cards

• Cosmetics

graduates moving annually
into the already enormous la-
bor reservoir. Then, too, the
revving up of our business mo-
tor has attracted back into
the labor force many house-
wives whose families have
grown up, long-time unem-
ployed people whose hopes
have been stimulated anew by
the rise in economic activity,
and older folk including rest-
less retirees. Apparently
there have not been enough
positions emerging to absorb
all these job aspirants, leav-
ing unemployment substantial-
ly higher than the Adminis-
tration had hoped for earlier.
Finding The Openings
But conditions have improv-

ed so much in mrny fields
that employers are on the
prowl for workers once mire.
During the recession, hiring
polictes became less active,
competition less vigorous for
the best graduates of leading
colleges. The need for adding
to personnels is now becoming
more widespread, and recruit-
ing at institutions of higher
learning is more prevalent.

It should be noted, however,

that the upsurge in costs of

labor, materials, machines,

and general operations has

made most hiring officials

more cautious in choosing new

manpower. If efficiency is to

be preserved, turnover must

be held to a minimum, and

the best way to achieve that

is to make certain that orly

the most intelligent man and

women of highest skill and

Gibson
opeyaferfr

Air Conditioners
Best Values Anywhere

Only Gibson with Air Sweep can offer you draft

free comfort in every part of the room. Patent-

ed, motor driven vanes sweep the cool air back

and forth, from wall to wall, and air it overhead

where it settles naturally, without drafts.

REAVES ELECTRIC CO.
W. Main St. — Phone 447-2497 — Emmitsburg

Wear them at
board meetings,
rock concerts
or anywhere.

$20.98

Whether your scene is
fifty stories up or the
Underground, this is

the shoe for you.
In soft kid and patent
leathers, leather with

leather and the new
higher heel. Genera-

tion Gap? Not with
Dexter.

MARTIN FAMILY SHOES
GETITSBUII9:7YOBE-SHIPPENSBUBG

adaptability are taken on. So
today most employers are ang-
ling for only the best, and
unskilled job seekers are find-
ing it tough to get work with
top firms.
Present Hiring Trends

Businesses going at top
speed tend to hire back —
where possible—workers they
let go earlier when condi-
tions were bad. But in many
cases they have to reach well
beyond this limit and recruit
fresh talent at higher rates
of pay. Demand is particular-
ly heavy for engineers of var-
ious types including project,
manufacturing, and process
specialists. Accountants are
widely sought, especially those
thoroughly at home with com-
puters. There is an increas-
ing call for supersalesmen,
those who are acquainted with
mod techniques and who know
the difference between "tak-
ing orders" and doing a real
selling job.

In most areas where indus-
trial and service operations
are focused, there is sharp and

continuing demand for offfice
help. Gifted, experienced ste-
nographers are usually at a
considerable premium, while

the same is generally true for

clerks, computer programmers,

and operators of sophisticat-

ed machines. As is usual dur-

ing active times, employers

put themselves out to retain

their best people, often grant-

ing raises, incentive improve-

ments, fringe benefits, and

free choice of working time

without union or o';her pres-

sure.
Executive Demand
On The Rise
There is no question but

that executive genius is rare

and must be well paid. For

this reason wage-price admin-
istrators are frustrated by in-

stances of salary hikes for top
company officials way beyond
those permitted for regular
workers. John T. Dunlop, di-
rector of the Cost of Living
Council, must face up to this

WIVE
up!

...DEAL WITH THE DEALER
who can do the complete

HEATING

and INSULATION 
JOB

Comfort and satisfaction
with your electric heat
installation depends
upon qualified heating
engineers who can plan
and install the quality
products which will
guarantee the result.

For complete satisfaction
"DEAL WITH THE DEALER"

who can do
the complete job!

WE INSTALL THE BEST:

HAGAN
SUPER•R
CELLULOSE INSULATION

C. F. STOUTER

OIL CO., INC.
Emmitsburg, Md. 21727

Phone 447-2118

ICE COLD
Beer-Wine-Liquors

10% DISCOUNT ON CASE LOTS OF WHISKEY

ROGER LIQUOR STORE
ANN G. ROGER, Prop.

SOUTH SETON AVE. PHONE 447-6262 EMMITSBURG, MD.

Store Hours: Monday Through Thursday, 8 A. M. to 10 P. M.

Friday & Saturday: 8 A. M. to 11 P. M.

Open Line By

Goodloe Byron
The following questions

were typical of the kind asked
of me in recent weeks. Let-
ters should be sent to me c/o
U. S. House of Representa
tives, Washington, D.C. 20515.
How much additional money

are airline passengers charg-
ed to cover the cost of anti-
skyjacking procedures?
The Civil Aeronautics Board

has permitted domestic air-
lines to charge passengers a
59c surcharge (plus 4c Fed-
eral tax per ticket) to cover
security screening and inspec
tion costs at airports. The 63c
total will be applied to each
airline ticket and to each part
of a flight when a flight in-
volves changing planes.
Where can I get a list of

toys the government has ban-
ned?
A monthly bulletin, "Ban-

ned Toys", may be obtained

by writing the Bureau of Pro-

duct Safety, Food ez. Drug Ad-

ministration, 5401 Westbard
Avenue, Bethesda, Md. 20016.

I receive a VA pension and

would like to know if a per-

son over age 72 has to file the

annual income questionnaire?

A recent law excludes per

sioners 72 years of age and

older who draw benefits dur-

ing two consecutive years

from filing annual income

questionnaires. However, you

still must report changes in

income.
Where can I obtain Presi-

dential Sports Award mater-

ials?
Persons interested in trying

for one or more Presidential

Sports Awards may obtain

free log hooks and copies of

the qualifying standards and

procedures by writing to:

Presidential Sports Award. P.

0. Box 129, Radio City Sta-

tion, New York, N. Y. 10019.

Awards cal be earned for

issue, since union forces are

already citing instances of ex-

ecutive raises in salary rang-
ing in rare instances as high

as 100 %-200% compareu with
the non-brass guideline of 5.-
5%, or 6.2% including fringe
benefits. This is only a part
of the pay-price problem so
difficult to solve.

• EQUIPMENT CENTER.
01v. Farm Equip. Center, fee,

• 
Ira jolt.

r"Where Quat is Firsik'
CliWiCti

OP., tt 6 P.M

Before heading out on that
long-awaited vacation, motor-
ists are advised to make sure
their tires have not worn to
1/16 inch or less. Thirty-
five states now have require-
ments against "bald" tires.

Our 1i Wagon Sale has
made so many people hap-
py . . . were keeping the
sale going for another
month.
So, here's another

chance to get this popular
kid's wagon for just one
cent.

At participating dealers,
between now and June 30,
buy any Ford Station Wagon

t"tittititsburg Tilrottirle
Established 1879

Successor to the Emmitsburg Banner, Established 1840
EMMITSBURG, FREDERICK COUNTY, MARYLAND 

Published weekly on Thursday by COLONIAL NEWSPAPERS
INC., 107 South Seton Avenue, Emmitsburg, Maryland 21727.

Telephone 301-447-2333

ROBERT B. WENTWORTH, PUBLISHER
KAREN E. KING, EDITOR

Copy for Advertisements must be received in this Office not
later than Tuesday morning to insure publication in the cur-
rent week's edition, Advertising rates furnished unon request.
Subscription rate, $4.00 per year in advance. All Communi-
cations and Checks intended for this Paper should be ad-
dressed and made payable to EMMITSBURG CHRONICLE,
Emmitsburg,  Maryland 21727. 

Entered as Second Class Matter at the Postoffice at Emmits-
burg, Md., under the Congressional Act of March 3, 1879.

Member

NEAR PIpAAL
PER 

Maryland-Delaware-D.C.

Association Founded meg Press Association Inc.

regular pra• 'ice in most any
sport.
My husband was receiving

black lung benefits until his
death five months ago. I was
told the payments would con-
tinue but they haven't. Can
you look into the matter?
Upon receipt of your letter

my office contacted the Social
Security Administration and,

as you are now awar?,, your
black lung widow benefits have
been approved. You will be
receiving a five-month retro-
active cheek and a regular
monthly benefits check there-
after. Citizens experiencing
similar difficulties receiving
government benefits justly due
them should feel free to con-
tact my office for assistance.

MAKE IT

icassorom

FATHER'S DAY
EassIrom
aedewaeetme GRASS SHEAR

$1699

ntssirori
&e' SHRUB TRIMMER

ZERFING'S HARDWARE
BALTIMORE ST. GETTYSBURG

Phone 717-334-1122

Free Parking Rear of Store

and this full-sized kid's
coaster wagon is yours for
just one penny more!

It's bright red with wood
stake side inserts; nylon
bearing wheels and rubber
tires.
See your Ford Dealer.

Because by popular de-
mand he's extending his
1t Wagon Sale through
the month of June.

btlYS you the 0111Y wagon

that out-sells Ford wagons.

"WE WANT TO

 I

MAKE YOU HAPPY"-1
il

SPERRY'S FORD SALES INC.
SOUTH SETON AVE. EMMITSBURG, MD.
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LOOKING AHEAD
By George S. Benson, President, National Education Program

Searcy, Arkansas

The Biggest Political Scandal
The big guns of the eastern

journalism concentration—in-
cluding the New York Times,
the Washington Post and the
three nationwide television
networks—can claim credit for
keeping the Watergate affair
alive day by day for a period
of six months and finally
tracking some of the tentacles
of the octopus-like scandal di-
rectly to the White House.
Their massive operation of
"investigative" journalism,
however, leaves them, in ret-
rospect, out on what some
people consider to be a part-
isan political limb.
News nine years ago, on

the ramifications of what may
have been the biggest politic-
al scandal in American his-
tory, in which Democrat big-
wigs, including President John-
son, were clearly involved,
was snuffed out by actions of
the Democratic Congress, the
White House, the Justice De-
partment, and a failure of the
Washington and New York
press centers to pursue wide-

open leads. In that last big
Washington scandal, unearth-

ed by Senator John J. Wil-
liams a few months before

the 1964 Presidential cam-
paigning, the eastern media
went along with a coverup

and never a thought apparent-

ly of bringing "investigative"
journalism into play.
Taxpayers' Money Involved

IllikroSizr#4611114aSalifiNIM1111111.

LIBRARY HOURS

Mon., Tue., Wed., Fri., 2:30-5
Thursday 10-12 - 2:30-5

Saturday, 9-12
Evenings: Mon., Tue., Wed.

6:30 - 9

C111311111M111.11OMMINIUM1.11.11

Business Services
PATRONIZE our advertisers.
These firms are reliable and
have proven through the years
that they handle only quality
products and offer skilled
professional service and ad-
vice to their patrons.

THE GAS SERVICE 6 PEOPLE PREFER

THE MATTHEWS

GAS COMPANY

Emmitsburg - Thurmont

1•111111111

mommimmolomollosom
Hanover Maternity Shop

Complete Line Of
MATERNITY WEAR

Childrens' Wear to Size 6X

Danskin Leotards, Tights &

Trunks — Shower Gifts

Setva Dance Footwear
41 Frederick St., Hanover, Pa.
 NMI

Coffman Jewelers
28 Baltimore St.

Gettysburg, Pa.

OMEGA WATCHES
(ORANGE BLOSSOM
DIAMOND RINGS)

smosammommommoi

DR. R. P. KLINGER, JR.

Optometrist

19 East Main Street
EMMITSBURG, MD.

Eyes Examined-Glasses Fitted
Complete Optical Repairs

HOURS
MONDAY: 6:30 to 8:30 p.m.
(Other Evenings By Appoint.)

PHONE
WESTMINSTER TI 8-8340

CODORI
MEMORIALS

Rock of Ages
Monuments. Markers

Mausoleums
Cemetery Lettering & Cleaning
400 W. Middle St., Gettysburg

Phone 717-334-1413

simmimmaimmumrsi

WILSON

Funeral Home

EMMITSBURG, MD.

Phones:

Emmitsburg 447-6244

Fairfield 642-8642

The four major figures in-
volved in the early disciosures
were Robert G. Baker, Secre-
tary to the Senate Democratic
Majority and one of President
Johnson's most intimate
friends; Mr. Johnson himself,
as Senate Majority leader,
subsequently Vice President,
and then President; Walter
Jenkins, Mr. Johnson's inti-
mate friend and right hand
man in the White House and
an associate with him in var-
ious business enterprises; and
Matthew H. McCloskey, for
years Treasurer of the Na-
tional Democratic Party, sub-
sequently Ambassador to Ire-
land, who, it turned out, made
a fortune as a contractor
building Federal Government
buildings, the $20 million DC
Stadium, the $100 million-plus
Rayburn House Office Build-
ing, and others.
The inconsistency of the

performance of the major
news media in these two scan-
dals was pointed up during
the glow of satisfaction that
some of the newsmen "stars"
exuded when President Nixon
was finally smoked out and
surrendered to Watergate cir-
cumstances on last April 30.
Two hours before the Presi-
dential TV address on Water-
gate, Waltre Cronkite, the
CBS News star, ran down a
list of historic Washington
scandals without even men-
tioning the Baker -1ohnson-
Jenkins-McClosky mess which
had been buried with the help
of a strangely tolerant press
just nine years ago.
Far-Reaching Ramifications
Mr. Cronkite mentioned

Teapot Dome (President Hard-
ing's onetime Interior Secre-
tary got caught taking a $100,-
000 bribe tor allocating gov-
ernment oil rights to a big oil
company); the Harry Tru-
man-General Vaughan et al
"deep freeze" scandal; and the
Eisenhower-Sherman Adams
vicuna coat affair. But not a
word did he say about the
sordid machinations that nine
years ago involved directly
the Democrat President, the
Democratic Party's biggest
money raiser, the Get-Rich-
Quick Secretary of the Sen-
ate's Democratic majority,
and a seemingly endless ar-
ray of lesser figures, includ-
ing the handsome German wo-
man who allegedly ran a "call
girl" service exclusively for
Democratic Senator friends of
Bobby Baker and who was my-
steriously shanghaied back to
Germany.
Mr. Cronkite said there

were "those' who would con-
sider 'Watergate the worst
scandal in history. Because of
his obvious omission of the
Baker-Johnson-Jenkins et al
Democratic scandal, which was
largely covered up, I have de-
cided, for the sake of journ-
alistic balance, to review the
facts.
Political News Blindness

AMERICAN OCANCFQ SOCIETY

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF MARYLAND

NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT
AND

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
TO ALL PERSONS INTER-
ESTED IN THE ESTATE OF
VERNE M. RAY
This is to give notice that

the undersigned, Dolores Faxel
Ray whose address is 663 W.
Main Street, Emmitsburg, Md.
21727 was, no May 22, 1973,
appointed personal represent-
ative of the estate of Verne
M. Ray who died on May 4,
1973, with a will.

All persons having any ob-
jection to such appointment
(or to the probate of the de-
cedent's will) shall file the
same with the Register of
Wills of Frederick County on
or before November 22, 1973
(six months from the date of
such appointment).

All persons having claims
against the decedent must pre-
sent their claims to the un-
dersigned, or file the same
with the said Register of Wills
in or before six months from
the date of such appointment.
Any claim not so filed. on

or before such date, or any
extension thereof provided by
law, shall be unenforceable
thereafter.

DOLORES FAXEL RAY
Personal Representative
Thomas M. Eichelberger

Register of Wills
STORM & STORM,
Attorneys-at-law
W. Church St.,
Frederick, Md. 21701
Date of first
publication:
May 31, 1973-3t

First let me say that Water-
gate, merely on the basis of
what is known, is truly a scan-
dal. It's future revelations
may prove to be bad examples
useful in improving the work-
ings of our American politic-
al system. And the Washing-
ton and New York news me-
dia axis undoubtedly opened
the door to its major rami-
fications. The question is, why
did they not pursue with equal-
ly intensive aguTessiveness the

many fascinating trails that
led off from the Baker-John-
son-Jenkins,McClosky affair?
The facts no doubt will

suggest to many people that
it was a case of political news
blindness nine years ago when
the Democrats were in the
scandal soup, and a case of
gleeful political crucifixion
which carried the newsmen
into a massive media invest-
igative spree against hte Re-
publcian Administration of
Richard Nixon. The past will
speak for themselves — here,
in a review of the Democrat
scandal which shriveled and
died for lack of me,lia at-
tention, and what is to come
out of the further Watergate
explorations nnd court actions.

ALWAYS GOOD VALUES
1972 Pinto 2-Dr.; Fully Equipped; Very Clean.
1971 Ford LTD 2-Dr., H.T.; Air; Fully Equipped.
1969 VW Station Wagon; Very Clean.
1967 Chevrolet 2-Dr. MT.; Fully Euipped.
1967 Pontiac 4-Dr.; Low Mileage; Very Clean.
1966 Ford Galaxy 500 2-Dr. H.T.; V-8; Auto.
1966 Ford Country Sedan; Very Clean.

USED TRUCKS
1970 Ford F100 1/2-Ton Pickup, Ranger; R&H.
1970 Ford F100 4-Wheel Drive Pickup.

Sperry's Ford Sales, Inc.
PHONE 447-6171 EMMITSBURG, MD.

We, The Friendly
FIRST NATIONAL BANK OF

FAIRFIELD
OFFER HIGHER INTEREST

ON SAVINGS!

53A7
ON CERTIFICATES

A OF DEPOSIT; 2 Yr.,

V $500 Minimum.

ON CERTIFICATES

51/2(YA OF DEPOSIT; 1 Yr.,V $500 Minimum.

41/2%ON PASSBOOK

SAVINGS 

Now Start a VACATION Club Account.
YOU make the first 50 payments,
the FRIENDLY First National of
?AIRFIELD WILL Make THE LAST
PAYMENT FREE!

Now. NO CHARGE For Checking Accounts
No Minimum Balance Required.

Now! For The Customer's Convenience. .

WE ARE OPEN MONDAY-THURSDAY, 9 til S

ALL DAY FRIDAY, 9 A.M. til 8 P.M.

SATURDAY MORNING, 8:30 A.M. til 11 A.M.

FIRST NATIONAL BANK OF

FAIRFIELD
Fairfield, Pa. 17320 Phone 717-642-8225

Member

NOW IS THE TIME FOR YOU TO RELAX
eat out Ma The lamiht!

VISIT YOUR FAVORITE AREA RESTAURANT
For a Special Meal and Beverage

The On House
Pub & Restaurant

Phone 301-447-2625

SUBS AND PIZZAS

Complete Line Of

WINES & BEERS

Complete Carry-Out Service

FAMILY STYLE HOME COOKING

DAILY SPECIALS

BANQUETS SUNDAY DINNERS

HILLTOP INN

BLUE RIDGE SUMMIT, PA. 17214

Tracey's Corner 717-794-5122

HAY FEVER SUFFERERS
DINE IN

POLLEN FREE AIR

Our Electrostatic Filtering System Removes All

Pollen To Insure Your Dining In The Most

Comfortable Atmosphere Possible.

SHAMROCK RESTAURANT
U. S. Rt. 15

301-271-7882

Thurmont, Md.

301-271-2912

Phone 717-334-9911 or 334-6144

GETTYSBURG ROLLER
RINK

55 Fifth Street

Gettysburg, Pa. 17325

Group Rates Operators

Open Skating Mr. & Mrs. Charles Kerrigan

GET A DEAL ON THE

1973 CHEVROLET

And On OK Used Cars & Chevrolet Trucks

WANTZ CHEVROLET INC.
Phone 756-6006 Taneytown, Md.

COMPLETE AUTO AND BODY REPAIR

Service Department Hours
7:30 A.M.-5:00 P.M., MONDAY—FRIDAY

5:3e P.M.-9:00 P.M., THURSDAY EVENING

Sales Department Hours
9:00 A.M.-9:00.P.M, MONDAY—FRIDAY

9:00 A.M.-5:00 P.M., SATURDAY

CECIL STULTZ
CUSTOM HOME BUILDERS

REMODELING
ROOFING - SIDING

CONCRETE WORK - CABINET BUILDER

FREE ESTIMATES—
By Contract Or By Hour

Phone 717-642-5315 R2, Fairfield, Pa. 17320

VISIT THE

BLUE DUCK INN
Waynesboro Road, Emmitsburg, Md.

CRAB FEED
WEDNESDAY — FRIDAY

7:00 - 10:00 P.M.

$3.00 ALL YOU CAN EAT
STOP IN FOR

YOUR FAVORITE

COCKTAILS & MIXED DRINKS
WINE & BEER

ALONG WITH OUR EXCELLENT
FOOD FROM THE MENU

DANCING—Friday, Saturday, Sunday Nights

BLUE MOUNTAIN INN
CRAB HOUSE

Rt. 8e6, 2 Miles South of Thurmont
Phone 301-271-2190

Your Choice Of One
FRESHLY STEAMED CRABS
SHRIMP (Steamed & Fried)

OYSTERS (Fried, Half Shell, Stew) in season
CLAMS (Steamed & Fried)

ALL YOU CAN EAT $5.50
COCKTAILS AND MIXED DRINKS

—CARRY-OUT SERVICE—

CRABS: Wholesale and Retail

All Popular Beers Soft Drinks

CRABS TO TAKE OUT

Hours: Mon., Tues., Wed., Thurs., 9 a.m.-12 p.m.
Friday, Saturday, 9 a.m. - 1 a.m.

Sunday, 1 p.m. - 10 p.m.

EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND

HOME COOKING OUR SPECIALTY
Dinners Daily Specials

Homemade Soups
Pizza - Sandwiches - Subs
CHICKEN - SOFT SHELLS

OYSTERS - SPAGHETTI

—Carry-Out Service—

We Serve Your Favorite Beer and Wine

HOURS: 61:30 A.M. - 11 P.M. Daily

—Closed Sunday—

THE PALMS RESTAURANT
Emmitsburg, mfl. Phone 447-2303, 447-2991

SATURDAY, JUNE 16, 1973
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CHAMPAGNE III 1

PEACE LIGHT INN 1
ON THE BATTLEFIELD

GETTYSBURG, PA.

Dancing 9:30 'Til 12:30

SOUP And
SANDWICHES

FOUNTAIN

Sundries - Magazines

FAIRFIELD

CUT RATE

Fairfield, Pa. 17320

NAT AT

BIG BOY
FAMILY RESTAURANT

Stolnwebt Avenue
Gettysburg. Pa.

Illona Mara T ea. to III pa.
t 74. SM. T sa. se Is issesellu

Fl

6
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FOR SALE—Southern States

Baler Twine—$8.00 bale at

Emmitsburg Feed and Farm

Supply, E. Main St.

FOR SALE--Pony, 1 year old.

Gentle and affectionate, but

not broken to ride. Excep-

tionally pretty and very

healthy. Phone 447-2814.

61412t

FOR SALE — 1961 Chevrolet

pickup, good body. Phone

447-6511 after 6 p.m.

611414tp

FOR SALE—Early American

maple drop leaf table with

2 boards and 6 matching

chairs; excellent condition.

Call 447-2006 after 4 p.m.

611412t

FOR SALE — ifsed Applianc-

es—Refrigerators, Freezers,

Ranges. See these bargains

at Reaves Electric Co., W.

Main St., Emmitsburg, Md.

Phone 447-2497. tf

FOR SALE-1971 Gibson 30"

electric range, avocado, in

excellent shape; and 1972

Gibson 18 Cu. ft. refrigera-

tor, excellent shape, both

$600, used 15 mo. Also 1

metal china cabinet, avo-

cado, 8 mo. old, $35; 10 pc.

walnut bedroom suite, exce!-

lent condition, $350.00. We

are moving—must sell by

June 15. Contact Charles

or Edith (Martin) Long or

call 756-6076 after 5 p.m.

617124

HELP WANTED — Man for

part - time day work in

Chronicle Press Inc., Em-

mitsburg, Md. Must be

willing to run printing press.

Apply in person. 0.412tp

CARD OF THANKS

The family of Henry Ger-

ken wishes to express their

sincere appreciation for the

many acts of kindness and

expressions of sympathy re-

ceived upon the recent death

of our husband and father.

Such generosity of heart will

long be remembered. Thank

you.
Ann Gerken
a. Family ltp

CONSIGNMENT SALE — At

Rocky Ridge Fire Hall, Fri.,

lune 15 beginning at 6:30

p.m. Benefit Rocky Ridge

Fire Co. 61712t

CUSTOM SLAUGHTERING

8z PROCESSING OF BEEF

Cut and wrapped for the

freezer to your specifications.

NORMAN SHRIVER, JR.

Phone 447-2255 - Emmitsburg

We sell beef by half or

quarters

DRIVEWAYS—Blacktop, pav-

ing, repairing and sealing.

Reasonable rates. Free as-

timates. All work guaran-

teed. Call collect, Lewis

Reinhart, 717-624-8460. Ref-

erences in Charnita area.

3115126t

DATSUN Sure Beats what

ever is second. Drive a Dat-

sun and then decide. Dee

Gee Imports Inc., Route

116 West, Gettysburg, Pa.

NOTICE—New and Used Pi-

anos—We need good used

pianos and will pay top dol-

lar on trade-ins. We offer

America's best pianos at the

best prices and we service

everything we sell. New pi-

anos carry a 10-year war-

ranty. Menchey Music Ser-

vice, 1110 Carlisle St., t,lear-

view Shopping Center. Han-

Center, Hanoverr, Pa.

over.

GOOD USED CARS — For-

eign and domestic Re-con-

ditioned and priced to sell

--bank financing available.

Dee Gee Imports, Fairfield

Rd., Gettysburg, Pa.

AWNINGS

CAR PORTS

PATIO COVERS

PORCH ENCLOSURES

FIBERGLASS AWNING CO.

127 York St.

Gettysburg, Pa. - Ph. 334-4612

NOTICE — The Datsun Pick-

up — Definitely your best

buy — Drive a Datsun and

then decide. Dee Gee Im-

ports, Inc., Fairfield Rd.,

Gettysburg, Pa.

RONALD J. SHORB

Ceramic Tile

Contractor
Baths-Kitchens-Flagstone

Wall-to-Wall Carpet

Armstrong Floor Covering

Free Etsimates

Phone 271-7252

Thurmont, Md.

WANTED — Kitchen help —
night work. Apply to The

Palms Restaurant or phone

337-2303 tf

NOTICE — Will teach piano

lessons in my how. Call

447-2734. it

WANTED—House to rent for

two. Call 447-2403.
6172tp

NOTICE—Summer Piano Les-

sons in your home or mine.

Mrs. James Graff, phone

447-2343. 617I2t

HELP WANTED—FEMALE

ATTENTION PARTY PLAN

OUR 26th YEAR

Highest Commissions - Larg-

est Selection of Toys &

Gifts. Over 350 best-sell-

ing items in a Full-color

Catalog. No Cash Invest-

ment - No Collecting - No

Delivering! Dealers and

Managers needed. Try us!

Call collect today 1 (203)

673-3455, or write SANTA's

Parties, Avon, Conn., 06001.

ALSO BOOKING PARTIES

6714t

IMMEDIATE

EMPLOYMENT

KITCHEN HELP
WAITRESSES

Full or Part Time

SHAMROCK

RESTAURANT
Rt. 15

6 Mi. South of Emmitsburg
271-7882 271-2912

The Best Used Cara are Found
Where the Best Used Cars
are Sold.

William (Bill) Sentz
Fairfield Rd.

RD 3 Gettysburg, Pa.
Phone 717-642-5603

ZENTZ AUTO SALES
Serving You Si-ce 1943

Carlisle St. Gettysbnrg, Pa.

Open 9-9 Daily

ATTENTION FARMERS
tiauling to Auction Everyday

J. E. W ATKINS
Dealei n Livestock
Emmitshurg, Md
Phone 447-2347

slew & Used Guns For Sale

Licensed Handgun Dealer

GUNS WANTED
Gene's Gun Shop
Eugene Bankard

Eminitsburg, R.D. .Md.

Phone 447-2869

,yuns bought, sold & repaired

,••••••r*•••••4
PRiNTING
ALL KINDS

Also
Plastic Signs

Weduing Invitations
FAST SERVICE

CHRONICLE PRESS INC.
447-2333 Emmitsbarg, Md.

FARMERS & DAIRYMEN
Terramycin

Mastit:s — Scours Tablets
Injectables

All Veterinarian Supplies

PEOPLES DRUG STORE

tf Gettysburg, Pa.

REAL ESTATE

WANTED

Luther N. Martin

Agency
H. Kenneth Seiferd

Salesman

BLUE RIDGE SUMMIT

PENNSYLVANIA

Phone 717-794-2441

Byron To Support

Farm Subsidy Cuts
Rep. Goodloe Byron said this

week that he will support

amendments to cut farm sub-
sidy payments by at least

65% when the Agriculture

Appropriations Bill comes to

the floor later this month.

A similiar amendment to

the Agricultural Act of 1970

proposing a ceiling to $20,000

was defeated in the 92nd

Congress.
In announcing his position,

Byron cited the negative ef-

fect of the current $55,000

limitation on small and me-

dium-sized farmers for whom

the program was originally

designed.
"Large subsidies have the

effect of accelerating the

growth of large farm units 
to

the detriment of the family

farmer," he said.
"Projected savings from

the present ceiling have ap-

parently not materialized

again and therefore the large

payments are nothing more

than welfare for the wealth
y

—an abuse to the taxpayer

which must be ended," Byron

said.

Ballet Performance Of "Carousel"

At St. Joseph's High School Saturday

Melisa Austin, Sue Higgins, Michelle Boyle, Alice

Fisher and Cindy Green, pose during rehearsal of Carou-

sel, to be held Saturday evening at St. Joseph's High

School at 8:30. The public is cordially invited.
• • • • * •

Miss Debora Sprankle, instructor

'Deegan Elected

Assn. President
James G. Deegan, head

coach for track and soccer at

Mount Saint Mary's College,

has been elected president of

the National College Division

Track Coaches Association for

the 1973-75 term.
The election was held re-

cently at the Association's

general business meeting dur-

ing the National Collegiate

Athletic Association's college

division track and field cham-

pionships at Wabash College

in Crawfordsville, Ind.

Coach Deegan, who holds

the academic rank of assist•

ant professor at Mount Saint

Mary's, has been on the fac-

ulty at the Mount since 1956.

He resides with his wife, Mar-

garet Ann, and their three

children near Blue Ridge

Summit, Pa.

Hospital Report
Admitted
Mrs. Bruce

field R2.
James L. Nester, Emmits-

burg Rl.
Mrs. Dale Rider, Fairfield,

R2.
Discharged
John Mort, Fairfield R2.

Mrs. Francis Myers, Fair-

field R2.
Mrs. J. Donald Stoner, Em-

mitsburg.
Carl Valentine, Rocky Ridge.

Births
Mr. and Mrs. Charles M.

Shorb, Emmitsburg, son, Tues-

day.

Gearhart, Fair-

Meet
Datsun's
new
Li'l
Hustler.

A brand-new look.
Roomier, full-vinyl cab with
contoured seat, new instru-
ments, new power-flow yen.
tilcrtion. New power-assist
brakes. Plus all the things
that made us America's No. I
selling import truck: over-
bead cam engine, 6-foot load
bed, 4-speed stick, white-
walls and more.Try one soon.

Nobody lmows small trucks
like Datsun

ATSUN
FROM NISSAN WITH PRIDE

DEE GEE

IMPORTS INC.
FAIRFIELD ROAD

GETTYSBURG, PA.

Phone 717-334-1919

Tom's Creek 4-H Club Holds Meeting
The May meeting of the

Tom's Creek 4-H Club was
held in the home of David and
Mike Hill. Roll call was an-
swered by 13 members, giving
the name of a fly. Also pres-
ent were the two leaders, three
parents, and one guest, Mrs.
JoAnn Duvall.
The treasurers' report was

given and accepted, as well as
the secretary's report. All

committee reports wer e giv-

en, these included the banquet,

fair, ways and means, window

and booth.
At demonstration Day con-

test, Cathy Wivell stated that

she received first and reserve

champion, and Stanley Gregg

reported that he received first

and Champion on Hoof Trim-

ming.
The Holstein Field Day was

reported by Mike and Naomi

Weimer, Mike and David Hill,

and Ronnie Kling, giving

their placings.
Mike and Naomi Weimer re-

ported on the Dairy Beef

show and sale. This event

was the first held in Frederick

County and was a great suc-

cess.
Mike Wivell reported on the

State Citizenship Tour. The

Future Farmers of Catoctin

annual banquet was reported

to the club by those receiving

awards. The dairy judging

team won 2nd at the state

competition. Those receiving

awards were, Charles Kaas,

George ICaas, Stanley Gregg,

Mike Weimer, Naomi Waimer
,

Marty Wivell and Cathy Wi-

vell.
The club received a $50.00

check and pia iue from Hoard's

Dairyman for winning first

place in the Dairy Judging

Contest.

USED CAR SPECIALS
I OWNER—LOW MILEAGE CARS

'72 Ford LTD 4-Dr. H.T.; R&H; P.S.; P
.B.; Air.

'71 Chevrolet Impala 4-Dr. H.T.; R&H; P.S.
;P.B.; Air.

'71 Ford Ranch Wagon; R&H; P.S.; P.B.; Air.

'71 Ford Galaxy 500 4-Dr. H.T.; RH&A; P.S.
; V. Top;

New Rubber; 28.000 miles.
'71 Ford Gal. 500 2-Dr. H.T.; RH&A; P.S.; 

P.B.; Air;

V. Top; 27,000 Miles.

'70 Chev. Pickup, 6 Cyl.; Electrician Body;
 12,000 Miles.

New Condition.
'70 Ford Galaxy 4-Dr. H.T.: RH&A; P.S.: A

ir; Exael-

lent Condition; 3;1,000 Miles.

'69 Ford LTD 2-Dr. H.T.; Small V-8; R51 H; 
P.S.; P.B.;

Vinyl Top.
'68 Pontiac SW; R.; P.S.; P.B.; Air. 53,000 Miles.

'69 Mercury 2-Dr. HT; R.; A.; P.S.; PB.; Ai
r

'68 Ford Gal 500 4-Dr. H.T.; RH&A; P.S.
; P.B.

'69 Ford 4-Dr H.T., RH&A, P.S., P.B., Air

IF YOU NEED A SPECIAL CAR CONTAJ
F

Emmitsburt Auto Sales
MARSHAL SANDERS

PHONE 447-2 ' 76 EMMITSBURG, MD.

APARTMENTS
FOR RENT

New, Large, Attractive Apartments,

Air Conditioned, Carpeted and Many

Extras. Located In Emmitsburg. Oc-

cupancy—July 1, 1973.

Contact: CENTRAL MARYL'AND CORP.

226 Church St. Thurmont, Md.

Phone 271-7071

Weekdays Between 8:30 A.M.-3:30 P.M.

Keep Your Cool!
COLD BEER
COLD WINE
COLD CUTS
COLD MILK

CHEESE DIPS - BEERWURST

PEPPERONI - HOT DOGS - ICE

MILK - BREAD

21 DIFFERENT CHEESES

Mountain
Liquors
Pat Buch, Prop

Phone 447-2342 Emmitsburg, Md.

County
test.
Naomi Weimer, chairman of

the window and booth dis-
plays, has room for ideas o:
the display using the theme,

"June Is Dairy Month." Mik,„

Weimer was elected chairman

for the radio taping session

and to set up a commtitec.

The club elected to have a

coed softball team and thei.

track shoes are ready.
The main topic of the eve-

ning was a discussion on

"How to Prepare a 4-H Rec-

ord Book." This demonstra-

tion talk was given by the

Frederick County Extension

Agent, Mrs. JoAnn Duvall.

The group learned that the

record book is a picture of

yourself.
The recreation for the eve-

ning was basketball played

after the meeting.

Since McDonogh Fair is com-
ing up, over half of the club
stated they were almost ready
to attend. The club is plan-
ning to send two senior teams
and one junior team to the

Dairy Judging Con-

RECEIVE TREATMENT

Convalescing at home with

their parents, Mr. and Mrs.

Irvin C. Tokar, Jr., Gaithers-

burg, are Andy and Wina

Tokar, after receiving treat-

ment at Children's Hospital,

Washington, D. C. Recent

visitors with the Tokar fam-

ily were Mr. and Mrs. LeRoy

Smith and daughter, Lisa, of

Norfolk, Va.; Mr. and Mrs.

Cyrus Weddle and son, Brian,

Dickerson; Mr. and Mrs. Leon-

ard Fogle, and Mrs. Cora

Gourley, of Thurmont.

Byron Supports

Vets' Pension Bill
Rep. Goodloe Byron testi-

fied Tuesday before a House

Veterans Affairs Committee

calling for passage of legis-

lation that would prevent a

reduction of veterans' pen-

sions when there is a subse-

quent rise in Social Security

benefits.
The proposed measure, co-

sponsored by Byron, would ig-

nore Social Security and cos
t-

of-living increases when de-

termining eligibility for a vet-

eran's pension and compensa-

aon.
In testimony submitted f

or

the record Byron cited the

aaverse effects of inflation and

the shrinking value of the

dollar on a retiree's fixed in-

come. He also noted the large

volume of constituent mail in

support of the bill.

-The reduction of veterans'

pensions as a result of in-

creases in Social Security

oenefits has a direct impact

on hundreds of senior citi-

Maryland," he said.

alaryland,"he said.

"Their needs are real and

cannot be ignored and I urge

,his committee to give favor-

able consideration to this im-

portant legislation," Byron

SPECIAL PRICES
ON PUSH TYPE ELECTRIC START MOWERS

ALSO SEE OUR LINE OF

SPEED QUEEN WASHERS & DRYERS

Yarns, Materials, Notions & Patterns

Religious & Decorative Lawn Ornaments

Plaza hame & Garden Center, Inc.

C k LVIN S. BURRIER

THURMONT SHOPPING PLAZA

MINOR RADIO & TV
206 N. Church St. Thurmont. Md.

Phone 271-2158

SALES 16 SERVICE
Over 25 Years Experience

—FEATURING—

MAGNAVOX - PHILCO
TOWERS & ANTENNAS

HELP WANTED
Part Time - Full Time

KITCHEN HELP, WAITRESSES

Paid Vacation and Holidays

Health Insurance, Life Insurance

Also Saturday Delivery Boy And

Greenhouse Worker

APPLY COZY RESTAURANT

OR CALL 271-7373

AIR

$133.80 PER MONTH CONDMONED
CALL 717-334-3191.  

CHEVROLET-BUICK-OPEL

LINCOLN WAY EAST
GETTYSBURG, PENN.

SHOW DAD HE'S A VIP
(Very Important Parent)

7 BRILLIANT DIAMONDS

MORE SPARKLE
MORE LUXURY
MORE VALUE

1/4 CARATI
TOTAL WEIGHT

'89
Knock dad's eyes out on June 17, with this massive
diamond ring. Three different carat weights and three
super value prices!

1/2 CARAT $169 1 FULL CARAT $349

TOTAL WEIGHT. TOTAL WEIGHT

SHOP TODAY AND SAVE!

ROYAL 'JEWELBOX
42 BALTIMORE STREET

GETTYSBURG, PENNSYLVANIA

Phone 334-1314

Other locations include Hanover, Waynesboro, York,

Chambersburg and Carlisle

Ert:ster chargl
•-• •••••••••
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USE OUR YOUNG ADULT CREDIT PLAN
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Local Author Writes Itinerary For County Mini-Tour

Local author Ann Burnside Love is shown in Sabillasville with the current issue
of MARYLAND Magazine which contains a special feature by her entitled "A Mini-
Tour of Upper Frederick County". The driving tour of the area features a detailed
map showing the 25 stops which include scenic and historic sites as well as rest-
aurants. The magazine is on sale locally at Emmitsburg Pharmacy.

The would-be travel advent-
urer is offered "A Mini-Tour of
Northern Frederick County"
in the Summer issue of
"Maryland" Magazine, now on
sale locally.

Written by local author, Ann
Burnside Love, the guided
driving tour starts just above
Frederick and extends north-
ward as far as Sabillasville
(shown in a drawing on the

NEVER
AN EXTRA CHARGE

For

MOUNTING AND BALANCING

OF PASSENGER TIRES

Most Safe Miles Per $

Quality tire - $ - ervice
E. Main Street Emmitsburg, M

Phone 447-2909
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MONDAY, JUNE 25

The Adams Brothers Show
Featuring Miss Patty Epley

Chicken Corn Soup, Hot and Cold Sandwiches

TUESDAY, JUNE 26

Miss Fairfield Fire Co. Queen Contest
Soup and Sandwiches

WEDNESDAY, JUNE 27

The Country Ramblers
Ham Pot Pie Platter, $1.75
Roast Pork Platter, $1.75
Soup and Sandwiches

THURSDAY, JUNE 28

The Country Kings Featuring

Janice Lynn
Chicken Corn Soup, Hot and Cold Sandwiches

........

FRIDAY, JUNE 29

J. D. And The In-Laws
Crab Cakes. Chicken Corn Soup

Hot and Cold Sandwiches

SATURDAY, JUNE 30

The Blue Grass Strings
Roast Turkey Platter, $2.00

Soup and Sandwiches

GAMES - RIDES - REFRESHMENTS

front cover) and Emmitsburg
and ends at Libertytown.

Readers are invited to fol-
low a pre-arranged route
through scenic back roads,
guided by detailed descrip-
tions of the landscape and the
interesting and historic sites
en route. The tour is design-
ed for an afternoon in the
country and includes an easy-
to-follow map plus directions
and meal stops.

Another story of local in-
terest in the new edition,
-Truck Stop—a little world
within itself", tells with words
and dramatic photos what
trucking means to Maryland.
One of the largest truck stops
in the State, located near
Frederick, is included.

A five-page article entitled
"New Skills for Appalachia",
details western Maryland's ef-
forts to stem the out-migra-
tion of its young people in
search of good jobs. Fire en-
gine buffs will enjoy "A New
Home for Old Firehorses", the
story of the creation and de-
velopment of the Fire Museum
of Maryland in Lutherville,
Baltimore County.

Single copies of the quart-
erly publication of the Depart-
ment of Economic and Com-
munity Dev elopnient, at $1.00
each, are available at the fol-

Special Discount On

Riding Mowers

During June

,7arts frc,rn
revt•ri;e

lfle Ciutch
• b. 7 .:ind 8 H.P. modi••!s.
• Geared-steering for
easy, tight turns,
• 26- & 30- cutting widths.
• Electric starting standar(
on most modols.

(HOMEUTE)

Plaza Home &

Garden Center,

Inc.
Calvin S. Burner

Thurmont Shopping Plaza

• Womerfs Club
(Continued From Page One)

The Flower: "The Black
Eyed Susan."
During the early years (the

1920's) some of the most in-
teresting and basic demon-
strations were:

1. The Making of Dress
Forms—Cutting and Fitting
Patterns,

2. Millinery—Including the
shaping and remodeling of old
hats.

3. The Care of the Hair.
4. The Making of Silk, Or-

gandy and Woolen Flowers.
5. Clothing—Fashions, Ma-

terial Laundering, Storing.
6. Well Balanced Meals.
7. Caning and Weaving

seats in Split-Bottom Chairs
and Stools.

Note: Mrs. Higbee caned
more than 100 chairs.

It is perhaps interesting to
note here that such demon-
strations reflected the time
and manner of living during
these years. For example:
Care of the hair was very im-
portant because of the long
braids, hair pins, methods of
curling. There were no Per-
manents then.

Clothing was laundered at
home, many times scrubbed on
a wash-board and hung out-
side to dry.
Eggs were beaten by hand;

Recipes made from "Scratch."
The old ice box was still be
ing used—"The Ice Man Com-
eth!"
The good old days had their

attractions but how many of
us would want to return to
them?
The club projects listed at

this time were:
1. The purchase of 5 dozen

"Easy-Seal" jars to can fruit
and vegetables to be exhibited
at the Frederick Fair.

2. The donation of Shrub-
bery from the Homemakers'
gardens to be planted on the
grounds of the High School.
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tege-Week
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0. me supplying or -music
Programs" for the membei

and the community b
club members.

4. The establishment of
Loan Closet" cor

about 50 different at
which are used for th

of patients in a sick roorr
articles were mad
at all times to th

of the community i
when needed.

5. The presentation of Lit
and Art Programs.

Reports were given on: Th
Dirigible and Lind
Flight.

Visits were made to M1
DuPont Gardens, Ar
and places of his

interest.

6. The annual picnic wa
each year at Braddocl

7. The Exchange was opei
Saturday afternoon fo

sale of food and farm:

8. The Community Christ
Party given jointly b:
Homemaker's Club an
Lions Club. The ladie
as many as 1200 lunch

at these parties. A fro
was shown and the chit

treated by Santa Claus.
9. Delegates were sent t(

Short Course at Colleg(

This Short Course was orig
and organized by Mis:
Kellar in 1923, the sam(
our clug was organized

the Emmitsburg Club wat
the first to send dele.
and participate in thi:

The cost was $'4'
person for one week. (20::

first Short Course). Many
at the end of foui

received 8-year
Today it is called Col.

for Women. It':
was to give a special

of lectures-musical pro.
and demonstrations or

art of home-making. SOME
or prominent

were: Dr. Valerie
Mrs. Emily Newell

Mrs. Frances Parkin-
Keys, Mrs. Evelyn Toby
Arnold Bennett Hall, Dr.

Admiral Byrd, and
Ritchie.

And the highlight of the

!owing area locations: Poole's
Store, Sabillasville; Emmits-
burg Pharmacy, Emmitsburg;
Fitzgerald's Shamrock Rest-
.,iirant on Route 15; Crow's
Nest Campground and Cozy
Restaurant, both in Thur-
mont.

speakers
Parker,
Blair,
son
Dr.
Stocksdale,
Governor

FASTPITCH

Thurmont  
Ft.
Tyeryars
Freeman
Club
Emmitsburg  
Ott
GM
Sunday's
Freeman
Ft.
Thurmont
Sunday's
Tyeryars
Emmitsburg
Club
GM

TEXACO DAY

NORTHERN

Ritchie  
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House  

Ritchie

72
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Grinders
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Shoe  

9:

at

at
Ft.

WEEK'S

SOFTBALL

Results
Emmitsburg

5; Club
4; Tyeryars
Games
Freeman
at Thurmont
Ott House
Ritchie

am
WV

MD.

W
5
5
5
4
4
3
1
1

72 4
;)

Shoe

COURTESY

STANDINGS

EMMITSBURG

LITTLE LEAGUE
L W L2
2 Red Sox  7 0
2 Dodgers  5 1
4 Giants  4 4
4 Orioles  3 3
4 Cards  2 5
3 Yanks  0 8
6

Next Games
5

Fri.—Dodgers at Red Sox

Sat., 1:30—Orioles at Red
Sox: 3:30 — Dodgers at
Giants

Mon.—Cards at Orioles

OF

Service
24 HR. TOWING

447-2523

NIGHT 447-2855

Newlywed

Special

HOUSE

FURNITURE
ESPECIALLY
NEW
$500

GUARANTEED

HOMEMAKERS
VALUE

&

TERMS

St.

BRAND
FACTORY

WHAT
CHAIR

SET
SET

OF

DESIGNED

ARRANGED

TV

SHEPLEY'S

Package

NEW
FRESH

QUALITY

Mon.,

YOU

IN
117

Savings

FULL

FOR
FOR

GET

only

$333
Serving

Thurs.,

A

You

Fri. until 9

St.

2 PC.
2 END
1 COFFEE
2 TABLE
5 PC.
4 PC.
EASY

SHFPLEY's

FURNITURE

IN
15

LOOK
SOFA
TABLES

DINETTE
BEDROOM
BUDGET

THURMONT
Water
271-7066

TABLE
LAMPS

APPLIANCES

FREDERICK
S. Market
662-5216

week was the Bus Tour of VHC Thanksthe city of Washington on Fri-
y day afternoon after the Corn- Fund Drive Helpersrn encement Exercises.

Can you imagine nearly
1000 women on as many as
thirty special buses escorted
by a motorcade of D. C. po-
licemen touring the city of
Washington? Traffic would be
tied up for blocks. Taxi driv-
ers were infuriated, govern-
ment workers looked in amaze-
ment. Bull Dr. Symans and

_ Miss Kellar saw to it that
we had the key to the city for

e one afternoon. We were the
- women of Maryland and we

were entitled to see the White
House, the Capitol, the Wash-

t ington Cathedral, the Roman
_ Catholic Monastery, the Shak-
esperean Library and Theater
and the Pan American Build-
ing (to mention a few), then
to Rock Creek Park for a pic-
nic supper.
The 1930's or Second De-

cade of Homemaking, saw the
beginning of many Communi-
ty Projects. A splendidly

_ equipped kitchen for the Fire-
mens' Hall was the result of
Kitchen Shower. Benefits were
held for neighboring hospit-
als, the Library and Scouts.
Funds were solicited for arti-
ficial limbs for a local boy.
We sponsored the Girl Scouts
and Childrens' Aid; also the
Cancer Fund. Prizes were
given to local school students
outstanding in mathematics.
The families of the community
were receiving informative
demonstrations on:

(To Be Continued)

a

I.

Miss Rice On

Dean's List
Miss Mary Ann Rice, daugh-

ter of Mr. and Mrs. Earl Rice,
Jr., Emmitsburg, earned
Dean's List honors during the
second semester of the 1972-
1973 academic year at Madi-
son College, Harrisonburg,
Va. A total of 999 of the
co-educational college's 5,500
students earned a place on
the list by compiling a grade
point average of at least 3.25
out of a posible 4.0 work
taken during the semester.

Little League

Donors Listed
1Recent donors to the Em-

mitsburg Little League are as
follows:
VFW Post 6658
Town of Emmitsburg
American Legion Post 121
Farmers & Mechanics National

Bank, Emmitsburg Office

LEGAL NOTICE
PLANNED USE OF REVE-
NUE SHARING FUNDS AL-
LOCATED TO THE TOWN
OF EMMITSBURG TAN. 1,
1973 TO TUNE 30, 1973

Capital Expenditures — Re-
tirement of Sewer Bonds
$8,000.00.

Signed
Richard M. Sprankle
Burgess
June 13, 1973
Emmitsburg, Md.

The Vigilant Hose Co. wish-
es to thank the Sisters at St.
Josephs' High School and the
Junior Typing Class for as-
sistance given in addressing
envelopes for mailing to kick-
off the 1973 Fund Drive. The
goal for this year's (hive has
been set at $7,500 and per-
sons mailing in contributions
are asked to send them in
early.

To Appear On
WMAL Panel Show
Kenneth Fields, Jr., R2,

Taneytown, will be among the
panelists appearing on WMAL
TV, Channel 7, Washington,
in a discussion concerning the
Sixes Bridge and Verona Dam
Projects. Congressman Gil-
bert Gude is also scheduled
to appear on the program
which will be aired at 10:30
p.m., Saturday evening, June
16.

In Towson Hospital

Mrs. Betty Wierman, West
Main Street, is presently a
patient at St. Joseph's Hos-
pital in Towson. She is ex-
pected to be there another
week. Her addess is Room
735, St. Josephs' Hospital,
7620 York Road, Towson, Md.
21204.

Monthy Ambulance Report

During the month of May,
22 calls were responded to by
the Emmitsburg VFW Post
6658 Ambulance Corps. Sev-
enteen calls were emergencies
while five were non-emerg-
encies. Man hours total 62,
with 27 patients conveyed in
the vehicle. The ambulance
traveled a total of 706 miles
during the month.

Undergoes Surgery

Mrs. William (Melva) Smith
recently underwent surgery at
Johns Hopkins Hospital, Bal-
timore. She is in Brady Bldg.,
room 312, 3'rd floor.

NOTICE/
The discharging of guns, including B-B

guns, inside the Emmitsburg Town limits is un-
lawful according to Town Ordinances. Any B-B
gun discharged inside the Emmitsburg Town
Limits will be confiscated and held.

W. HENRY FILLER
Chief of Police

Dad's Day
is June 17th

Give him something really different.

,T;70iV2,7

Give Dad FTD's exclusive
new MiniGARDEN Terrari-
um this year. It's a minia-
ture garden that will look
great in his home or office.
We can arrange delivery
anywhere in U.S. or Can-
ada.

FTDIs new
144iniGARDEN
Terrarium

FTD 12.50 Local 10.00 9"
15.00 12.50 12"

Cozy Bud 'n' Vase Shoppe

c
(Formerly Creager's Flower Shop)

South End of Thurmont On Route 806
PHONE 271-2445

New Hours: Mon.-Fri. 8:30-6
Sat. 8:30-7:30 Sun. 12:30-7:30

EVERY PART
Is

GUARANTEED

the extra-quiet
Room Air Conditioner
om Chrysler Airtemp

r Airtemp's lowest priced room air conditioner
1, Models from 5,000 to 8,000 BTU's

Attached mounting kit for instant installation
t, Come in today. Carry "The Sleeper" hme

irtemp
POINTE ENOINEERIO NY CHRYSLER

CORPORATION

YEARS

',",,CK*-XX1-A. • • 03C

Room Air Conditioners
FIVE YEAR PARTS WARRANTY
CHRYSLER AIRTEMP BALTIMORE BRANCH
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Myers' Radio & TV
AND RECORD SI-10P

Phone 447-2202 Emmitsburg, Md.


