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Another Christmas has come
and gone and some of us are
still looking for a little snow
as we look forward to the new
year. However snow lovers
are probably in the minority
as no oae really needs it ex-
cept the skiiers. The town is
pretty quiet with the two col-
leges practically closed for va-
cation. Who says that we
don't miss the students?

* *
I trust that everyone was

well satisfied by Santa and
grateful for accomplishments
and other good things in the
past year. Now we can look
forward to another big holi-
day, New Year's Eve, and a
clean slate with which to be-
gin the new year. We can
forget past frustrations and
all those things we wanted to
happen, but didn't. It is good
to start over once in a while
because most of us find that
things don't go just the way
we want them to a lot of the
time and swabbing the slate
gives us a chance to set up
new goals to guide us in the
future without worrying about
the many things not done in
the past.

*

The service clubs of Em-
rnitsburg are to be congratu-
lated for the generous way in
which they treated the town
chiW,•en to Chistnlz-,
es. This just goes to show
what individual citizens can
accomplish by working togeth-
er without the guiding hand of
Big Daddy. It is too bad that
more communities do not take
the initiative to do more for
themselves and some commun-
ities to do something for them-
selves. We would find that
we don't need the big imper-
sonal welfare programs in ef-
fect today and all of us would
be better off because there
would be no place for much
of the waste that goes with
the impersonality of bigness.
It is refreshing that a few
states have closed the old
time welfare experts how to
do it handbooks and begun to
use some common sense in
passing out the public's mon-
ey. I'm sure that the town
clubs did a much better job
with their limited funds than
Big Daddy would have done
with a lot more.

* * *

While some of the local eat-
ing and drinking establish-
ments closed over Christmas
and took a well deserved rest,
others worked twice as hard
by putting on parties for their
customers. I'm told that one
local spot was jammed with
guests from both the straight
and hippie groups in the com-
munity. Much to the sur-
prise of a few, they got along
fine as they jointly took part
in the conversation and danc-
ing. Surely this type of en-
deavor will contribute to
greater understanding of each
other as individuals without
the group labels, and Emmits-
burg and all other communi-
ties in the world can not help
but benefit from greater un-
derstanding among local resi-
dents.

* *

Those who think there are
no dangers in the drug scene
might take time to read the
letter to the editor appearing
elsewhere in this issue. It is
particularly sad at Christmas
time to speculate on the frus-
tration which must have at-
tended this little girl's last
moments as she tried vainly
to shake off the monkey on
her back. Perhaps one of the
biggest challenges offered by
the drug world is finding a
way for individuals to devel-
op the hopes and dreams
that will lead to constructive
action and preclude a need
for the passive world of freak
outs, etc.

* * *

The fellows down at the
newspaper office asked me to
convey to you their heartiest

(Continued On Page Two)
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Gail Eyler Engaged Garden Club Lists Miss Topper, Sgt. Cool,
To Kenneth

Mr. and Mrs. Charles F.
Eyler, Jr., Rocky Ridge, an-
nounce the engagement of
their daughter, Gail Melissa,
to Ktnneth 0. Riffle, son of
Mr. and Mrs. Elwood 0. Rif-
fle, Rocky Acres, Thurmont.

Miss Eyler is a 1971 grad-
uate of Catoctin High School
and is enrolled in the Nurs-
ing Program at Frederick
Community College.
Her fiance is a 1970 grad-

uate of Catoctin High School
and is employed at the Super
Thrift of Thurmont.
No date has been set for

the wedding.

Post Office To

Close Saturday
Our office will be closed on

Saturday, January 1, 1972, in
:‘bservance of N:_zz.. Y7,1r. r`ay.
All services will be suspended.

* * *

On January 3, 1972, our of-
fice will perform a new ser-
vice, on behalf of the Internal
Revenue Service.
Internal Revenue Publica-

tion number 17, 'Your Feder-
al Income Tax', will be sold,
over the counter, at our of-
fice, for 75c.

This booklet explains how
to file your return, covers
items of income, such as sal-
aries and wages, interest and
dividends and rentals, explains
moving expenses, sick pay,
employee business expenses,
and many other adjustments
to Income Tax Filing.

* *

It is our wish that all our
customers will enjoy the New
Year's Holiday, and have a
very happy New Year 1972.

George E. Rosensteel, PM.

Letter To The Editor
Editor, Emmitsburg Chronicle:

The following poem was
found beside the body of an
18-year-old girl found dead in
an automobile outside Wash-
ington, D. C. Perhaps your
readers would be interested
in knowing how some people
with experience with drugs
look upon the situation.

KING HEROIN
Heroin is my King, I shall
always want.

He maketh me to lie down in
the gutters,

He leadeth me beside the
troubled waters,

He destroyeth my soul,
He leadeth me in the paths

of wickedness for the ef-
fort's sake.

Yea, I shall walk through the
valley of poverty

And will fear all evil,
For thou, Heroin, are with me.
Thy needle and thy capsule
try to comfort me.

Thou strippeth the table of
groceries

In the presence of my family;
Thou robbeth my head of
reason;

My cup of sorrow runneth
over.

Surely Heroin addiction shall
stalk me

All the days of my life
And I will dwell in the house
of the damned forever.
Name witheld by request

LEGION TO MEET

Francis X. Elder Post 121,
American Legion, will hold its
regular meeting on Tuesday,
January 4, at the Post Home,
at 8:00 p.m.

Riffle Contest Winners
Winners in the Christmas

door trimming contest spon-
sored by the Silver Fancy
Garden Club were as follows:
Emmitsburg — First, Mrs.

Walter Simpson, 312 W. Main
St.; Second, Marvin E. Laws,
115 E. Main St.; Third, Mrs.
Ann Thompson, West Main
St.
Taneytown — First, Richard

Sanner, 330 E. Baltimore St.;
Second, Ronnie Adkins, 411 E.
Baltimore 'St.; Third, James
Sell, Carroll Heights.

Prizes of $10, $5, and $3,
respectively, were awarded in
each town. The club wishes
to thank all who participated.
Their efforts brought added
beauty and Christmas spirit to
both communities.
On December 16, members

of Silver Fancy enjoyed their
annual Christmas party at the
Lamp Post in Gettysburg.
Mrs. Vernon Keilholtz, Mrs.
Thomas Freiley, and Mrs.
John White were in charge
of arrangements. Timely dec-
orations, good food, and the
exchange of gifts resulted in
a festive afternoon. At this
time, in keeping with the spir-
it of the season, members
gave $29 to Carroll Haven
Center for Retarded Children,
Westminster.
The next meeting of the

garden club will be held in
the home of Mrs. John Chen-
oweth on January 20.

Seton Anniversary

Ends With Prayer
Saint Joseph's Provincial

House announces that the ob-
servance of the one hundred
and fiftieth anniversary of the
death of Blessed Elizabeth
Ann Seton, which began on
January 4, 1971, will close
with. a Triduum of Prayer.
The purpose of the Services,

to be held in the Provincial
House Chapel at 5 p.m. on
January 1, 2 and 3, will be to
ask Mother Seton's interces-
sion for all those who seek
her help, especially the people
of Emmitsburg and its en-
virons. Father Sylvester A.
Taggart, Vice - Postulator of
Mother's 'Seton's Cause, will
give the homily and Benedic-
tion. The public is invited.

Lions Say Thanks

To Party Helpers
The Lions Club wants to

thank all those who helped
to make the Christmas party
for the town children a suc-
cess. Special thanks go to the
merchants who supported us
by taking ads. Your help has
always been appreciated.

Wasn't the band music a
pleasant surprise for which
we are grateful? Who said
Emmitsburg has no band? We
need to get back of this group
and hear some more good
music.
We wish everyone a very

happy and prosperous New
Year.
EMMITSBURG LIONS CLUB

Bonnie Smith Wed
To Earl L. Gastley

Miss Bonnie K. Smith,
daughter of Mrs. Violet E.
Smith and Richard R. Smith,
Rt. 2, Emmitsburg, became
the bride of Earl L. Gastley,
son of Mr. and Mrs. John D.
Gastley, 328 E. Church St.,
Frederick, Saturday, Decem-
ber 4, at 7:30 p.m., at the
United Calvary Methodist
Church, Frederick. The doub-
le-ring ceremony was perform-
ed by the Rev. Kennth A. Ty-
son of Frederick.
Maid of honor was Mrs. Ju-

dith Ann Whitmer, sister of
the groom. Best man was Mr.
Johnny Whitmer, brother-in-
law of the groom.
A reception following the

ceremony was held at the
Gastley residence.
The bride is a 1969 gradu-

ate of Catoctin High School
and is employed at the Free-
man Shoe Co., Emmitsburg.
The groom attended Freder-
ick High School and is em-
ployed at the Corning-Ware
Co., Frederick. The couple
will reside at E. Church St.,
Frederick.

Miss Pamela Louise Topper,
daughter of Mr. and Mrs.
James L .Topper, 121 DePaul
Street, Emmitsburg, became
the bride of Sgt. Gary Eu-
gene Cool, son of Mr. and
Mrs. Allen Cool, South Seton
Avenue, Emmitsburg, at St.
Joseph's Catholic Church on
Tuesday, December 28. Rev.
John King, pastor, officiated
at the ceremony. Traditional
music was played by Mrs. Lou-
ella Rosensteel. Among the se-
lections Miss Joyce Shields,
soloist, sang, were "Oh Per-
fect Love", "Oh Lord I Am
Not Worthy", and "Mother
At Your Feet We're Kneel-
ing."
The bride, given in marriage

by her father, was a picture
of traditional charm in an
empire styled peau de soie
gown with a yoke of re-em-
broidered alencon lace that
capped the shoulders of her
long pouf sleeves. Her Vic-
torian collar was of scalloped
lace accented in pearls and the
same delicate lace formed
twin hemline borders on her
belled skirt. Complimenting
this was her exquisite spray
headpiece of matching lace
and pearlized orange blossoms
from which her lace bordered
veil of silk illusion cascaded
to full chapel length. She
carried a bouquet of white
carnations mixed with holly.

Miss Dianna Topper, Wash-
ington, D. C., sister of the
bride, was the maid of honor.
Bridal attendants included
Mrs. Diane Young, Emmits-
burg, friend of the bride, and
Miss Denise Standback, Bal-

Exchange Vows

timore, niece of the bride. The
maid of honor wore a red
floor length gown of polyest-
er crepe featuring a squared
neckline, empire waist and
puffed sleeves. Accents of
white lace and red velvet rib-
bon completed the gown. The
other attendants wore gowns
styled identically to that of
the maid of honor but in
green. Miss Susan Lingg,
niece of the bride, was the
flower girl, and wore a white
gown trimmed in red.

Mr. Ronald Cool, Emmits-
burg, served as his brother's
best man. Ushers included
Mr. Michael Byard, Glen Bur-
nie, Md., friend of the groom,
and Mr. Eugene Fisher, Han-
cock, Md., brother-in-law of
the groom. Robert Sellman,
Hanover, nephew of the bride,
was the ring bearer.
Following the ceremony, a

reception was held at the
VFW Annex in Emmitsburg.
The bride is a 1969 gradu-

ate of St. Joseph's High
School, Emmitsburg, and a '70
graduate of Maryland Medic-
al Secretarial School, Hagers-
town. Prior to her marriage,
she was employed as Labora-
tory Secretary at the Annie
Warner Hospital, Gettysburg,
Pa.

Sgt. Cool is a 1968 gradu-
ate of St. Joseph's Hi gh
'School, Emmitsburg, and is
presently serving in the Unit-
ed States Air Force at Alcon-
bury, RAF, England.
Upon their return from a

wedding trip to an unannounc-
ed destination, the couple will
reside in Alconbury, England.

Entertains Cafeteria Staff
Mrs. Frances K. Rosensteel,

manager of the Thurmont
Middle School Cafeteria, en-
tertained the cafeteria staff
at a Christmas Party at her
residence, Center Square, Em-
mitsburg, on December 15. A
light lunch was served and
gifts were exchanged. Guests
at the party included Evelyn
Fisher, Blanche Keeney, Jos-
ephine Gills, Dorothy Broad-
bent, Sarah An Stambaugh,
Miriam Starook, Joan Port-
ner, Margaret Meadows, Eliz-
abeth Wisoztkey, Betty Valen-
tine, Mrs. G. W. Boyer and
Mrs. Charles Valentine.

Visiting with Mrs. LaRue
Harman, S. Seton Ave., dur-
ing the Christmas holidays,
were Daniel Harman, Balti-
more; Mr. and Mrs. George
B. Harman and daughter,
Union Bridge; Mr. and Mrs.
Richard Harman, Richard, Jr.,
David and Rusty, and Mr.
Walter Martin, Taneytown,
and Mr. and Mrs. Burnell
Hawkins of Union Mills.

VFW AUXILIARY TO MEET
The regular meeting of the

Ladies Auxiliary to Emmits-
burg Memorial Post 6658,
Veterans of Foreign Wars,
will be held at the Post Home
on Thursday, January 6, at
8 p.m. All members are urg-
ed to attend.

VFW TO MEET
The regular meeting of

VFW Post 6658, Emmitsburg,
will be held at the Post Home
on the Square, Wednesday,
January 5, beginning at 8:00
p.m.

Nun Receives Ph.D.

From Penn State
Nearly 1,300 graduates were

awarded degrees Dec. 18 by
the Pennsylvania State Uni-
versity, marking the end of
the Fall Term.
Dr. John W. Oswald, presi-

dent of the University, pre-
sided at the commencement
exercises, held at 10:30 a.m.
in Recreation Bldg., and was
joined in the conferring of the
degrees by A. Wayne Read-
inger, of Fleetwood, repre-
senting the Board of Trustees
of the University.
Among the 1,293 graduates

were 828 seniors, 99 of them
graduated with honors. There
also were 321 candidates for
masters' degrees and 144 for
doctorates, 106 of them for
the doctor of philosophy de-
gree and 38 for the doctor of
educatin degree.
Among the candidates for

degrees was Sister Madeleine
S. Wheeler, St. Joseph Col-
lege, Emmitsburg, Md., Ph.D.,
family economics and home
management.

Follies Tickets Available

The tickets for the Ice Fol-
lies Jan. 13, 1972, have ar-
rived and are available at the
Senior Citizens Center. All
those who have signed up for
the trip should come in and
pick the tickets up. The cost
is $3.00 for members and $5.00
for non-members.

Fast driving may get you
there in time—or it may not
get you there at all.

Winners Listed In
Decorating Contest

Francis X. Elder American
Legion Post 121 has an-
nounced the winners in the
annual home decorating con-
test. In the Originality cate-
gory, first place was awarded
to Earl Hilbert and second
place to Mary Hatter.

Roselea Wetzel was award-
ed first place in the Light-
ing category with Jim Houck
getting second place. Nativi-
ty awards went to Gerald Ry-
der, Jr., first, and Charles
Hartdagen, second. In each of
the three categories, first place
awards were $30 and second
place awards $20.
Honorable mention w a s

awarded to Sterling Goulden,
Henry Filler, Richard Sprank-
le, Jim Phelan, Wayne Mc-
Cleaf, Donald F. Topper, Mike
Rosensteel, Herbert Rohr-
baugh, and Richard Oster.

All those who participated
in the contest are to be con-
gratulated for the fine dis-
plays which gave the town a
festive atmosphere for the
holidays.

Tourist Council
Discusses Program
The Catoctin Mountains

Tourist Council held its month-
ly membership meeting at
Charnita on December 16. Af-
ter a very delightful meal,
Council President Don Cur-
rier called the meeting to or-
der. Mr. Currier's main top-
ic of discussion was the Coun-
cil's proposed program for
1972. The group is planning
the sponsorship of these ma-
jor events:

1. Winter Festival — Feb-
ruary 6, 19.72.

2. Spring Weekend — May
12-14, 1972.

3. Colorfest — Oct. 13-15,
1972.

4. 'Special Hobby Groups
(proposed for summer and
fall) — a. Model Airplane
Meet; b. CB Radio Roundup;
c. Antique Car Meet; d. Tur-
key Shoot; e, Field Trials.
The Tourist Council is also

planning to conduct the fol-
lowing projects for the 1972
season:

1. "Logo" for Catoctin Rec-
reation Area (CRA).

2. Map and Informational
brochure of CRA including in-
ventory of area facilities.

3. Layout and signing of a
self-guiding tour of CRA.

4. Press for appropriate
signing for approaches to
CRA. a. Signing of East
lanes of 1-70 at Md. 66; b.
Signing on North and South
lanes of U. S. 15; c. County
signing on Md. 66, 64 and 77.

5. CMTC Placemat sales.
6. CMTC booth at Emmits-

burg - Thurmont Community
Show.

7. CMTC concession and/or
information booth during ma-
jor events in CRA.

8. Publish annual calendar
of events in CRA.

9. Operate Country Store
at Camp Round Meadow.

10. Photography Contest.
11. Easter Egg Etching

Contest.
President Currier and the

entire organization were very
pleased to have many dis-
tinguished a n d interested
guests attend this meeting.
They were David Harp, Di-
rector of Tourism for Wash-
ington County; Robert Nay-
lor, Representative from Md.
Division of Tourism; Ge ne
Straub, Regional Traffic En-
gineer for Western Maryland
—State Roads Commission;
Michael J. Crogan, Chairman
of Tourist Committee for the
Frederick County Chamber of
Commerce, and Margaret Bru-
chey, Librarian at the Thur-
mont Public Library.

VFW AMBULANCE
Herbert Click, E. Main St.,

and Mr. and Mrs. John W.
Scott, Jr., and family, Har-
risburg, Pa., were transported
to the Annie Warner Hospit-
al, Gettysburg, this week in
the VFW ambulance. Sister
Justen, St. Joseph's Provin-
cial House was taken to the
Providence Hospital, Wash-
ington, D. C., and Mrs. Helen
Wills, E. Main St., was re-
moved from the Warner Hos-
pital to her home here, in the
vehicle. Drivers were James
Kittinger, Donald Byard, Mike
Trout and Paul Humerick.

SINGLE COPY: 10c

Cardinal Offers Mass For Canonization

Of Blessed Elizabeth Seton On Sunday
Lawrence Cardinal Shehan,

Archbishop of Baltimore, will
offer a mass at 11 a.m. Sun-
day, January 2, in the Cathe-
dral of Mary Our Queen, Bal-
timore, for the canonization
of Blessed Elizabeth Ann Se-
ton and a solution to the prob-
lems of Catholic education
through her intercession. This
year marks the 151st anniver-
sary of her death.
Speaker at the mass will be

the Rev. Harry J. Flynn, rec-
tor of Mount St. Mary's Sem-
inary at Emmitsburg. The
Cathedral Choir, under the di-
rection of Robert F. Twyn-
ham, will lead those in attend-
ance at the mass in the re-
sponses and the Fourth De-
gree Knights of Columbus
Color Guard will act as honor
guard for the Cardinal.

VFW-Legion Bring

Santa To Schools
The annual arrival of San-

ta Claus, sponsored by VFW
Post 6658 and Elder American
Legion Post 121, took place
on December 23, 1971. Santa
visited Mother Seton School,
E mm it s burg Elementary
'School, Seton Day Care Cent-
er and Mrs. Chatlos' kinder-
garten.

Looks of wonde) a fid appre-
ciation greeted Santa as the
more than 700 children filed
past him and shared their
Christmas desires as they re-
ceived their presents. There
were plenty of candy and
oranges for all as well as gifts
for the younger children.

Santa's helpers included Lu-
MP.)1 Norris, Clarence Orn-
dorff, Allen Bouey, Jack Ott,
Joe Stahura, and Guy Baker,
Jr.

Project chairman Lumen
Norris, Santa and his helpers
and all those who helped with
the preparation did a fine job
in making this year's Christ-
mas a little happier for town
children.

The Maryland chapter of the
International Federation of
Catholic Alumnae sponsors
this mass annually at the ca-
thedral. However, so that the
maximum number of people in
the Archdiocese may join in
at Sunday mass in this two-
fold occasion, a request was
made, with the permission of
Cardinal Shehan, to each of
the pastors of the parishes of
the Archdiocese to have one
of the masses in their parish-
es offered on this Sunday for
these intentions and, if pos-
sible, a pre-offertory petition
at the other Sunday masses.
The parish masses are spon-
sored by St. Joseph Colleg
Alumnae.

Following the mass at the
Cathedral of Mary Our Queen
and the parish masses, there
will be a pilgrimage to the
Mother Seton House, 600 N.
Paca St., Baltimore. The lat-
ter will be open from 10 a.m.
to 4 p.m. with hostesses in
attendance.

After her conversion to the
Catholic faith, Blessed Eliza-
beth Ann Seton, shortly after
moving into the Mother Seton
House on Paca St., started
the first religious community
in the United States.
' Very soon thereafter, she
moved to Emmitsburg, into

!
larger quarters, where she
founded St. Joseph's and be-
came the foundress of all the
Sisters of Charity in America.
These include the American
branch of the Daughters of
Charity of St. Vincent de
Paul with motherhouses in
Emmitsburg, St. Louis, Chi-
cago, Jamaica, N. Y. and San
Jose, Calif., and the Sisters
of Charity with motherhouse,
at Seton Hill, Pa., Mount St.
Vincent, N. Y., Cincinnanti,
Convent Station, N.J., and
Halifax, Nova Scotia. Mother
Seton's first school was the
beginning of the parochial
school system in the U. S.

(Continued on page 7)

Tammy Myers looks pleased as punch during Santa's visit to
Seton School.

Is Santa sharing a secret with Russell Wetzel at the
Elementary School?

Cathleen LaCroce has everything in hand at Mrs. Chatos'
Kindergarten.

(More Pictures On Page 2)
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Blue Cross Expands

Over 65 Program
Maryland Blue Cross this

week announced that effect-
ive January 1, it will expand
benefits under its Blue Cross
65 program at no added cost
to members.
The low-cost program is de-

signed for over-65 subscribers
who also have Medicare cov-
erage. The program supple-
ments Medicare hospital bene-
fits without duplicating their
coverage.
A spokesman for Blue Cross

explained that the benefit ex-
pansion is in response to re-
cently announced increases of
13.3 per cent in the deduct-
ible and coinsurance payments
required of Part A Medicare
beneficiaries. These increases
go into effect January 1. On
that date:
The initial deductible for

each ho.mital inpatient admis-
sion will increase from $60
to $68;
The additional charge for

the 61st through the 90th day
of each inpatient' hospital stay
will increase from $15 to $17

per day;

The ad "+ional charge for
each of the An "lif -4-ime re-
serve" hospital days will in-
crease from $30 to $34 per
day, and
The additional charge for

the 21st through the 100th
day of each extended care fa-
cility stay will increase from

$7.50 to $8.50.
The spokesman pointed out

that this is the fifth time

since 1966 that benefits under

the Blue Cross 65 program

have been expanded to fully

cover gaps created by new

Medicare requirements, There

will be no change in Blue

Shield 65 program benefits or

rates, the spokesman added.

An open enrollment period

for the Plue Cross and Blue
Shield 65 rrogram will be

Local News From Rocky Ridge, Mrs. John D. Kaas Correspondent

Mi. and Mrs. Waldon Mil-
ler and family, East Lansing,
Mich.; Mr. and Mrs. Howard
I. Miller and family, Rock-
ville; Mr. and Mrs. Thomas
Fitzgerald and family, Be-
thesda; Miss Edna Miller,
Washington, and Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Freeze, Camp Le-
jeune, N. C., were Christmas
dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Howard T. Miller.
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Grimes

and family, Emmitsburg; Mr.
and Mrs. Richard Dinterman
and son, Michael, and Mr.
and Mrs. William Dinterman,
were guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Leroy Dinterman on Christ-

mas Day.

Mr. ^nd Mrs. David Long
and family, Hagerstown; Mr.
and Mrs. Donald Eyler and
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Barbe.
Thurmont, and S/Sgt. and
Mrs. Joseph L. Topper and
family, Fort Meade, were re-
cent guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Vernon Barbe.
Mr. and Mrs. Marshall Shar-

rer were supper guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Angleberg-
er, Enimitsburg, on Christ-

mas Day.
Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Barbe

visited recently with Mr. and
Mrs. David Long and family,

Hagerstown.
Jean and Chrissie Long,

Hagerstown, spent a few days
recer'' • with their grandpar-

held through March 31. The
enrollment period applies only
to those senior citizens who
are not now members of eith-
er Blue Cross or Blue Shield.
Current members automatical-
ly will be converted from
their present coverage to the
special program when they

reach age 65.
Anyone eligible for Medi-

care may enroll in the 65 Pro-

g,ram by contacting their

nearest Maryland Blue Cross

d Blue Shield office.

ents, Mr. and Mrs. Vernon

Barbe.
Mr. and Mrs. Marshall Shar-

rer visited recently with Mrs.
Paul Valentine, and Mr. and
Mrs. D. L. Sharrer, Taney-

town.
Mr. and Mrs. Carrollton

Houck visited recently with
his mother, Mrs. Mary Houck,
Detour.

Mrs. Roy Dinterman visit-

ed recently with Mr. and Mrs.
Donald Dinterman, Thurmont.

Mr. and Mrs. David Long

and family, Hagerstown, and
Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Barbe,
visited S /Sgt. and Mrs. Jos-
eph L. Topper and family.
Fort Meade, on Sunday.
Mr. and Mrs. Ronald Eyler

and family; Mr. aqd Mrs.
Ronald Chipley and family,

Walkersville; Mr. and Mrs.

Donald Lescaleet and family,

Gaithersburg, wer e dinner

guests of Mr. and Mrs. Ray
Lescaleet on Christmas Day.
Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Ma-

thias visited recently with
Mr. and Mrs. Maurice Trox-

ell, Owings Mills.
Mrs. Ray Lescaleet visited

recently with Mc. and Mrs.

Eugene Toms and family and

Mrs. Leroy Horner, Legore,

and Mrs. John Stottlemyer,

Woodsboro.
Misses Ruth and Ethel

Krise and Maurice and Bruce
Stambaugh, Thurmont, visit-

ed recently with Mr. and Mrs.

Harold Late. •
Mrs. Guy Boller is recover-

ing from a recent illness.
Mrs. Harry Jumper, Lin-

wood, Pa., and Mrs. Sylvia

Smith, Annapolis, are spend-

ing some time with Mr. an)

Mrs. Charles Brauer.
Thirty-eight members and

friends of the Ladies Auxil-

iary to the Rocky Ridge Vol.

Fire Co. enjoyed a dinner and

party at the Shamrock Rest-

aurant recently.
Private Charles Keeney, Jr.,

of the U. S. Marine Corps is
studying to he an aviator elec-
tronic technician's mate at
Jacksonville, Fla. He is now
enjoying a furlough with his
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Charles
Keeney, Sr.
In the account of the butch-

ering held at the home of
Mrs. Edith Gruber and Mr.
and Mrs. Charles Keeney, re-
cently, the names of Mr. and
Mrs. John Wood and daugh-

ter, Cindy Prederick, were

omitted.

A Christmz.7 party was held
recently at the home of Mr.
and Mrs. Paul Orndorff. Those
present were: Mr. and Mrs.
John Orndorff; Mr. and Mrs.
James Kelly and family, Hag-
erstown; Mr. and Mrs. Fred
Sherman and family, Marri-

ottsville; Mr. and Mrs. Ger-

ald Orndorff and family, Em-

mitsburg; Edward Orndorff,

Sabillasville, and Mrs. Mae

Wolf k d. Waynesboro.

ThoL attending Christmas
dinner at the home of Mrs.

Edith Gruber and Mr. and
Mrs. Charles Keeney were •
Pvt. Charles Keeney, Jr., of
Jacksonville, Fla.; Mr. and
Mrs. John Stitley and sons,
John, Jr. and Donnie, Legore;
Mr. and Mrs. James Sander
and son, James, Emmitsburg;

Mr. and Mrs. John Gruber

and daughter, Sharon; John

Dayhoff; Mr. and Mrs. Gaiiurd

Putman and son, Russell.

Rocky Ridge.
A birthday party was held

recently for Mrs. Grace Say-

ler, at the home of Mr. and

Mrs. Robert Sayler. Those

present were Mr. and Mr_-;. J.

Richard Sayler; Mr. and Mrs.

Bernard Fink, Thurmont; 'Mr

and Mrs. Thomas Sayler, and

Mrs. George Martin, E rnmit.;-

burg.
The Sayler Christmas par-

ty was held on Sunday at the

home of Mr. and Mrs. Rob.Irt

Sayler. There were 38 pres-

VFW-American Legion Sponsor Santa's Annual Visit To Town Schools

Santa is going to hang on to Pam Griffith.

Tara Long greets Santa as the strong, silent type.

Jeff Little i r:ght on top of things.

B Ridonotir gets the word from Santa.

Sharon Topper i looking forward hi good t"...ng—..

Tina Hewi is a big lapfal for Santa.

ent.
Mrs. Lorraine Dubel and

son, Gary, and Mr. and Mrs.
Frank Buckley and family,
Taneytown, attended a Christ-
mas dinner at the home of Mr.
and Mrs. Robert Sayler.
Mr. and Mrs. Gilbert Eiker

and son, Brian, and Mr. and
Mrs. Charles Mumma, attend-
ed the Ice Follies at Hershey,
Pa., recently.
A Christmas dinner was

held at the home of Mrs.
Ethel Mumma. Those attend-
ing were: Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Mumma, Mr. and Mrs.
Kenneth Mumma and daugh-
ter, Pamela, Mr. and Mrs.
Robert Mumma and daughter,
Deborah, and Mr. and Mrs.
Gilbert Eiker and son, Brian.
Recent guests of Mrs. Har-

vey Stambaugh were Mr. and
Mrs. Franklin Stambaugh and
family; Mr. and Mrs. Albert

Stambaugh and daughter, Shir-
ley; Mr. and Mrs. Donald
Dinterman and Mrs. Annie

Duble, Thurmont; and Miss

Rosalie Brown, Lantz.

Use Classifieds

• ABIGAIL
(Continued From Page 1)

best wishes for the coming
year and I would like to join
them in wishing everyone, ev-
erywhere a

HAPPY NEW YEAR

MIRRORS
WARRANTED

Ovals - Round
Rectangular

Large Selection

Englander
Mattresses

From $87.95 per set

LINCOLN
FURNITURE MART

Lincoln Square
Gettysburg, Pa.
Phone 334-4414

Home of Quality Mer-
chandise and Sensible
Prices!

YOUR INCOME TAX
INDIVIDUALS—FARMERS--BUSINESSMEN

Private, Confidential, Courteous Service

All Welcome

Monday Thru Saturday — 9 A.M. to 9 P.M.

ALL FORMS TYPED IN DUPLICATE

LAWRENCE G. HARNE

PHONE 271-2119 THURNIONT, MD.

32 Years Of Experience May Save You Money!

Parking Lot Installed For Your Convenience

The Colonial Beauty Salon
Located in Welty's Market Building

on West Main St., Emmitsburg,

WILL BE CLOSED

Monday, December 27, 1971

and

Monday, January 3, 1972

SUPPLIES FOR

WINTER PROTECTION
Heat Bulbs

Heat Tapes

Pipe Insulation

Weather Stripping

Insulated Boots

Insulated Shoes

Work Jackets

Insulated Jackets

FEED & FARM SUPPLIES

'9-JUNE 447-2020 EMMITSBURG.

1 rLut* Ji i 1̀17T

YOUR GARAGE
FOR

omfort - Convenience - Safety
\,), j i b a Genii nt„

MOONS NIAT IC RADIO
CONTROLLED

Garage Door Opener

Emmitsburg Tilrottirlr
Established 1879

Successor to the Emmitsburg Banner, Established 1840

EMMITSBURG, FREDERICK COUNTY, MARYLAND 

Published weekly on Thursday by COLONIAL NEWSPAPERS

INC., 107 South Seton Avenue, Emmitsburg, Maryland 21727. 

4\ I

 Telephone 301-447-23r.3  
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Subscription rate, $4.00 per year in Avance. All Communi-

cations and Checks intended for th's Paper should be ad-
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AFTER CHRISTMAS SALE

COATS 1/2 PRICE
GROUP OF

DRESSES — 30% OFF

SWEATERS, GOWNS, ROBES

20% and 30% OFF

MISCELLANEOUS MERCHANDISE

AT REDUCED PRICES

Modern Miss Shop
Chambersburg Si. Gettysburg, Pa.

DON'T MISS

TOBEY'S
GREAT AFTER-CHRISTMAS

SALE
NOW GOING ON!
SAVE 1 AND

UP TO MORE
ON

ENTIRE STOCK OF

WINTER COATS
• FUR-TRIMMED COATS • FUN FURS

• HARRIS TWEEDS • CAMELS HAIR

• DRESSY & CASUAL COATS

• SWEATERS • SKIRTS

• SLACKS • BLOUSES

• KNITS • PANT SUITS

• ALL WEATHER COATS

• PANT COATS

TREMENDOUS SAVINGS
ON

DRESSES
FAMOUS MAKE KNITS

BRAS & GIRDLES
ALL THIS AND MORE

AT

• ei of the situation. Tammy Dinterman and Mary Ann Irelan have Santa in a
- (els, IA ft Tr

PRICES START AT $139.88

REAVES ELECTRIC CO.
W. Main St. — Phone 447-2497 — Emmitsburg

30 Baltimore St., Gettysburg

OPEN: THURS. 9 to 5 — FRI., DEC. 31, 9 to 6
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FREDERICK COUNTY BACKGROUNDS
BY SAMUEL CARRICK

Jane (Ferguson) ,Maxell
"I have sent rockets up —

Lancing the sky.
Tin horns I've blown — For
dead months going by.

Whistles have deafened me. —
Lights made me blind.

I have flung wide my heart—

Rattled my mind.
That was the simpler part—
Husks to find.

"No on my knees
God, if you care,

Pity the poor fool that is I—
Give me a New Year."
Without a doubt Samuel

Maxwell (Maxell), of Tom's

I ask —

Kerosene

Gas

Fuel Oil

FUEL OIL FOR EASY HEATING
Automatic Delivery-24-Hr. Service

"Serving Northern Frederick Count"

LEWIS E. HAHN
THURMONT, MD. PHONE 271-2512

N F0 T'H E

We've enjoyed working
for and with you. Once more,
let's join hands to build together
for the future good of our community.

THURMONT COOPERATIVE
THURMONT, MARYLAND

0 if

• ...... ....

0

..... ..... 
..........

Because we

realize that our

success is due

to you, we

are especially

pleased to

greet you and

wish you a
most rewarding,

happy New Year.

VILLAGE LIQUORS
EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND

iilAt PI' till C.

WE'RE PLUMB SET ON PLEASING

YOU IN '72.

CENTRAL MARYLAND
CORPORATION
THURMONT, MARYLAND

Creek Hundred, and the owner
of Maxell's Mill (the old
Crabbs' Mill on Tom's Creek)
was a descendant of William
(1) Maxwell, pioneer, soldier,
and fort builder, in that part
of the Cumberland Valley
that is now Franklin County,
Pennsylvania. This William
(1) Maxwell had but one son
who married and "begat chil-
dren"—Patrick (2) Maxwell
who married Hannah White-
hill. They had four sons —
William (3), James (3), Pat-
rick (3), and John (3) Max-
well. Just which son the Sam-
uel Maxell (Maxwell), of Max-
ell's Mill, is descended from
is not known at this time—
but—it may have been Wil-
liam (3) Maxwell for William
appears to have been a fami-
ly name. But—and this point
is stressed—there is no defi-
nite proof of this relation-
ship at_ the present time.

Samuel (4) Maxell married
Jane Ferguson in Franklin
County, Pennsylvania, before
moving to Frederick County.
The exact date is not known.
They moved into the Emmits-
burg District about 1849 —
purchased the Crabbs' Mill and
became permanent residents
of th- district and members
of th Lutheran Church.

A word about the history of

Maxell's Mill on Tom's Creek
—`William Crabbs built the

mill that later became the
property of Samuel Maxell."
According to Mrs. Rosanna

(Fuss) Long and Mrs. Ruth
(Stambaugh) Shoemaker, both

of whom remember the old
structure quite well, it was at

least three stories high , and
built partially of stone. At

one time the Maxell's conduct-

ed a sn-All store there and the

post for the district was

at the mill.

"The mill race, stones from

the mill and the mill dam are

located in the present Maurice

Fuss farm, just above the Four
Points Road bridge."

According to Mrs. Long,

the Maxells sold the mill

property to . . Leatherman,

who in turn sold it to George

Naylor, and from Naylor it

passed to George Martin.

"The old mill was a center

of community activity — it

contained a post office, black-

smith shop, and a mill store.

The mill house, where the

family lived, is above the mill.

It is still standing, in good

repair, and still in use as a

residence."
Now to return to the study

of the Maxwell (or Maxell)

family.
According to the records of

Waynesboro Lutheran Church,

Samuel (4) and Jane M. (Fer-

guson) Maxwell had the fol-

lowing children baptized

there:
1. Theodore Augustus Max-

well—son of Samuel and Jane

M. Maxwell—born December 5,

1843—baptized December 31,

1845. (The Rev. John Heck).

2. Mary Catharine Max-

well—daughter of Samuel and

Jane Mexwell — born March

22, 1846—baptized March 6,

1847. (The Rev. John Heck).

After this date records per-

taining to the Maxwell (or

Maxell) family are to be

found in the records of the

T'aneytown Lutheran records

and after 1851 in the records

of Elias Lutheran Church of

Emmitsburg.
In Williams' Wistory of

Frederick County, Maryland,"

Volume II, there is the fol-

lowing data pertaining to the

Samuel (4) Maxwell family:

'Samuel Maxell was born

near Waynesboro, Pennsyl-

vania, on December 17, 1809.

He was a miller and spent his

entire life as a miller. The

Maxwell Mill, which is over

one hundred years old, has

been in the Maxell family for

sixty-one years. It was built

by William Crabbs and passed

through many hands.

"The executors of Samuel

Maxell sold the mill property

to his son, Samuel Maxell, II.

"Samuel Maxell left Penn-

sylvania during the first half

of the nineteenth century

(about 1839) and moved to

Frederick County, Maryland,

where he (Samuel) bought the

Crabbs' Mill property. He

married in or near Waynes-

boro, Pennsylvania, Jane M.

Ferguson, who was born No-

vember 27, 1811.
"Samuel and Jane M. (Fer-

guson) Maxwlel were the par-

ents of the following chil-

dren."
1. Henry (5) Maxell—died

in early youth.
Note: This first child must

have died quite young, before

being baptized, for there is

no mention of him in the Luth-

eran church records at Way-

nesboro.
This child is probably in-

terred in the old Union bur-

ial ground at Waynesboro,

which was moved to Green

Hill Cemetery, in 1931.

2. William (5) Maxell —

died in early youth.

Note: Again—this child is

not mentioned in the Waynes-

boro Lutheran church records.
He, too, is probably interred
in the old Union Burial
ground—which was used joint-
ly by the Lutheran, Reformed,
and Presbyterian congrega-
tions of Waynesboro.
The bodies from this grave-

yard were moved to the Green
Hill Cemetery in 1931.

3. Samuel J. (5) Maxell —
member of Cole's Cavalry dur-
ing the Civil War—Married
. . . ( ?) Fleming—died in
Martinsburg, West Virginia.
The notes on the Maxwell

(or Maxell) family will be
continued in this series next
week.

33 Receive Home Nursing Certificates
Last Friday, Mrs. Albert

Dean, Executive Director of
the Frederick County Red
Cross Chapter, came to Em-
mitsburg to present certifi-
cates to 33 students of St.
Joseph's High School. The
awards ceremony, which was
held in the school auditorium,
recognized those girls who re-
cently completed a regular
course of instruction in Red
Cross Home Nursing.
The health course w a s

taught during the fall semest-
er by Sister Ambrose Carrer-

HAIL
to the

NEW
YEAR

A New Year approaches
filled with new prom:se.

For your loyal support, thanks!

THE THURMONT BANK
THURMONT, MARYLAND

Turning the
leaf of a New
Year, we wish

you success
and happiness.
To you, our

appreciation.

ROYER'S RESTAURANT
THURMONT MARYLAND

•

(74 round-up of health,

  fz• wealth, happiness is our
wish to you. We are grateful

for the opportunity of serving you.

FROM ALL OF YOUR FRIENDS AT THE

FARMERS AND MECHANICS

NATIONAL BANK
EMMITSBURG OFFICE

6 E. Main St., Emmitsburg, Md.
Phone 447-6134

Member F.D.I.C.

as, R.N., who is resident nurse
at St. Joseph College. Guest
speakers included Sister Mary
Gilbert of St. Joseph College
Home Economics Department
who lectured on dieting and
nutrition; Mrs. Dean, who
spoke on the history of the
Red Cross; and Donald Schley
who demonstrated the tech-
niques of artificial respiration.

Students from the sor ho-
more and freshman class who
received certificates include:
Cindy Baker, Mary Baker,
Gloria Brown, Mary Devlin,
Barbara Knox, Lydia Lingg,
Elizabeth Lunny, Karen Mil-
ler, Marcy Nusbaum, Cather-
ine Ott, Christine Ott, Joan
Rodgers, Yvonne Rosensteel,
Cynthia Sanders, Donna Stah-
ley, Wendy Barry, Marie
Broussard, Colleen Devlin,
Cynthia Giannim, Christine
Hemler, Denise Soy, Debra
Martinez, Marianne Meagher,
Joan Muir, Kathy Myers, Eliz-
abeth O'Connor, Lynne Phe-
lan, Bonita Rodgers, Jane
Sigler, Jeanette Thomas, Vick-
ie Warren, Wanda Warthen,
at-A Diana Womack.
— - 

Catoctin  Production
Very Successful
"Auntie Mame'", presented

at Catoctin High School in
early December, was definite-
ly a success. Not only did the
audience enjoy seeing the
play, the cast enjoyed per-
forming it. The monetary
profit from the show was sub-
stantial. The money made
from the production will be
used for the CRS spring mus-
ical.
On Saturday, Dec. 4, at the

curtain call, the cast members
of "Auntie Mame" presented

Mr. Michael Miller, director,
with a director's chair in blue
and white, and a director's

navy blue beret. Carol Hu-
merick (Mame), speaking for

the entire cast, thanked all

those who helped to make the

show a success.
Special thanks go to the

members of the props com-

mittee, Bonnie Orndorff, chair-

man, Sigrid Botker, Jackie

Kos, Pam Brown, Marie

Fahnestock, Pat Tressler, and

Karen Kerns, and to those

who helped build the stage

set. They are Larry Carty,

chairman, also responsible for

the construction of the stair-

case used in the play, Gary

Kolb, David Clarke, Dan

Price, Dan Harmon, and a

CHS graduate, Bill Kolb.

A cast party was held Sat-

urday night at the Shamrock

Restaurant in Thurmont.

New Year's Eve is an es-

pecially bad time to be on

the highways. Don't drive un-

less you have to. Another

driver, who has been enjoying

holiday spirits, might make

you his one mistake for the

road.

Sewing Chests
Hampers - Hassocks
Bed Rests - Wedges
Large Selection
To Choose From
Butterfly Tilt Top
Tables, In Maple

and Pine

LINCOLN
FURNITURE MART

Lincoln Square
Gettysburg, Pa.
Phone 334-4414

Home of Quality Mer-
chandise and sensible
Prices!

4.4

St. Joe's Basketball
St. Joseph High School Tro-

jans withstood a fourth quart-
er drive of St. Anselm's and
upset the Panthers 42-41, at
Mount Saint Mary's gym Sun-
day, December 12.
Ken Adelsberger was high

scorer for the winners with
19 points. Roy Adelsberger
and George Hemler had nine
each. The win left the Tro-
jans 1-1 in league competition.
On Friday, December 17,

St. Joe's met Wilde Lake
High School of Columbia, Md.,
on the opponent's court. The
score was 38-38 at halftime,
and, with 1:20 to go, the
teams were still tied. But
the Wildecats pulled ahead in
the last minute and defeat-
ed the Trojans, 74-'
The Varsity record stands

ut 1-3 as they faced Boys Lat-

Team 1-1 In League
in of Baltimore this week.
The Trojan girls lost to

Walkersville 36-32 this week,
leaving their record at 1-1.
They won their opener, 34-
17, against St. Mary's of An-
napolis.
The boys' Junior Varsity is

looking for its first win, with
a record of 0-4. Their last
defeat came at the hands of
Wilde Lake.

Qualifies As Sharpshooter
Marine Sgt. Gary E. Mart-

in, son of Mrs. Adelene K.
Martin of 21 Carroll gt., Thur-
mont, has qualified as a rifle
sharpshooter while serving at
the Headquarters, Fleet Ma-
rine Force, Atlantic, in Nor-
folk, Va.
He is a 1967 graduate of

Thurmont High School.

to

JOY AND HAPPINESS TO ALL

THE BEAUTIFUL PEOPLE WE

KNOW AS FRIENDS.

Suburban House Of Beauty
EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND

•

14toast to the brand New
Year! May it hold many good

things for you. Thank you for your loyalty.

GRINDER'S TEXACO
EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND

•• • •

/ 0 •

•••

Threefold wishes go your way — health,
wealth, happiness in the New Year
— with our thanks by the thousandfold,

ROGER LIQUOR STORE
ANN G. ROGER, Prop.

SOUTH SETON AVE. PHONE 447-6262 EMMITSBURG, MD.

Store Hours: Monday Through Thursday, 8 A. M. to 10 P. M.

Friday & Saturday: 8 A. M. to 11 P. M.
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Babson's Business And
Financial Forecast For 1972
By Babson's Reports Inc.,

Wellesley Hills, Mass., Decem-
ber 30, 1971—A year ago our
Forecast for 1971 looked hope-
fully toward a better business
year than had prevailed in
1970. Unfortunately, t h e
trouble spots we cited com-
bined to frustrate the possi-
bilities offered by the favor-
able forces. For example, the
vexing problems of high un-
employment, uaderutilization
of industrial productive ca-
pacity, dangerous inflationary
pressures, the huge federal
budget deficit, and labor prob-
lems did indeed raise barriers
to economic progress in 1971.
1971—Another Crisis Year
As we look back upon 1971,

therefore, we can justly la-
bel it another "crisis year",
just as 1969 and 1970 had
been. However, the crises of
the previous two years were
largely of a domestic econom-
ic nature, albeit the burden of
the Vietnam war was a con-
tributing influence to the dis-
locations. In 1969 the main
villain was the grinding cred-

BABSON'S BUSINESS AND FINANCIAL FORECAST FOR 1972
it crunch; in 1970 it was the
harrowing corporate liquidity
squeeze, plus two major
strikes and the surprise of
the foray into Cambodia.
In 1971 the focal point was

more the "flight from the
American dollar" in the lead-
ing foreign exchange mark-
ets of the free world. This
crisis had been building for
many years, and it also had
been inexorably linked with a
complex of other problems.
These included cost-push in-
flation, a steady weakening
of the U. S. foreign trade po-
sition, and the long succession
of federal budget deficits and
imbalances in our internation-
al payments position — which
resulted from our foreign aid
and military programs plus

sizable private spending and
investments abroad. There

was also the aggravation of

the long and costly strikes

during 1971; but in the final

analysis, the real havoc was

wrought by the dollar's trou-

bles.
Stabilization Or Trauma?

In a counteroffensive to com-

bat the dollar's woes, to bri-

ishing all
of our good

friends
a New Year

filled
with

health and
happiness.

VFW POST 6658
EMMITSBURG MARYLAND

FOR PRESCRIPTION SERVICE

PEOPLES DRUG STORE
GETTYSBURG, PA.

Phone 334-2916

• Sick Room Supplies

• Greetings Cards

• Cosmetics

What joy and triumph, after all, to

be sincerely honored by the ones we

loved
Your Local Rock of Ages

Atahorized Dealer

Office-Shop-Display Open:

Mon.-Sat., 8 A.M. to 5 P.M.

Evenings & Sun. by Appoint.

CODORI MEMORIALS
Your Authorized Rock of Ages Dealer

400 West Middle Street Gettr.-iburg, Pa.
Phone 334-1413

;He the inflationary spiral,
and to revitalize the nation's
economy, the Nixon Adminis-
tration took everyone by sur-
prise by dramatically revers-
ing its economic approach. In
the first phase of the new
program, President Nixon im-
posed a 90-day emergency
freeze upon prices, wages, and
rents. In addition, he asked
Congress to move to an earl-
ier date the planned revision

of the federal income tax
structure so as to increase
consumer disposable income,

and to grant a tax credit for

certain business capital ex-
penditures. He also imposed

a 10% surcharge on certain

imports of foreign goods.

Initially, public reaction was

favorable. The program was

regarded as a positive step in

coming to grips with the vital

problems afflicting the econo-

my. However, the piecemeal

fashion in which the second

phase of the program was un-

veiled left consumers, busi-
nessmen, and investors in an

uncertain frame of mind.

Doubts mounted as early

lukewarm labor acceptance of

the program turned to antag-

onism, and as industrial ac-

tivity, consumer spending, and
unemployment failed to re

spond as quickly as had been

anticipated.
Vestiges Of Hope
On the surface, the disap-

pointing economic results of

1971 would seem to point to

a year of inept failures. A

deeper analysis r e v e al s

grounds for a contrary view.

Even though business and
employment did not iespond

as the Nixon Administration

had anticipated, there were ex-
tenuating circumstances which

critics of the new economic

game plan have been remiss

in considering.
For example, there was the

protracted tie-up of West

Coast ports, and subsequent-

ly a virtual paralysis of East

Coast and many Gulf Coast

ports, which exacted a toll

on the economy. In addition,

there were the coal and cop-

per miners' strikes, and the

inescapable liquidation of

strike-hedge steel inventory

stockpiles. These retardant

factors would have exerted

adverse influences even if the
Administration had not opted

for "controls".
Furthermore, t h e faint-

hearted miracle seekers and the

opportunistic politicians may

be premature in labeling the

Nixon economic game plan

an exercise in futility. There

has not been enough time to

gauge the results of this pro-

gram. After all, Congress has

been agonizingly slow in act-

ing on those facets of the pro-

gram which arc beyond the

jurisdiction of the President.

CARPET

SALE
QUALITY

FOR QUALITY
WE WILL NOT BE

UNDERSOLD
Mohawk
Monarch

Williamsburg

LINCOLN
FURNITURE MART

Lincoln Square
Gettysburg, Pa.

Home of Quality Mer-
chandise and Sensible
Prices!

1972—Year Of Solid Progress
At this outset of the New

Year, therefore, the staff of
Babson's Reports views con-
structively the prospect of
what lies in store for the
economy. We are hopeful that
the Administration's econom-
ic game plan will jell suffic-
ienly to encourage business-
men and consumers to sluff
off their cocoons of cautious-
ness and assume a more opti-
mistic perspective. Such an
improvement in public confi-
dence, after the long siege of
uncertainty of the past three
year s, should produce a
definite pattern of business
improvement.

It would be well not to ex-
pect an immediate return of
boom conditions for the econ-
omy as a whole. The fight
against inflation will require
continuing vigilance and ther-
apy, and with the large res-
ervoir of idle productive ca-
pacity in American industry
the task of paring unemploy-
ment will require patience.
The Nixon Administration's
economic program was not set
forth as one which would pro-
duce deflation, but rather one
which would restrain inflation-

ary pressures sufficiently to
create productivity gains and
make for solid progress in
the economy, as opposed to
the illusory gains of recent
years when price inflation ac-
counted for much of the ad-
vance. So, to the extent that
inflation is curtailed, Babson's
Reports forecasts that 1972
will emerge as a period of
genuine achie vement.

Less Worrisome Climate
The primary characteristic

which the staff of Babson's
Reports expects will mark
1972 and enable the economy
to regain its forward thrust
in the next twelve months is
an anticipated easing in cer-
tain troublesome areas. The
major labor groups are tied
to multi-year contracts, and
the next "go around" is not
scheduled until 1973. Hence,
on the labor front, it will be
a year of relative quiet on the
part of the major unions,
whose walkouts can be quite
debilitating to the economy.
To further brighten the back-
ground picture for the com-

ing year, we anticipate no
real money and credit wor-
ries for the better part of

What's in the
cards for you

in the New Year?

Everything good, we
hope ... you deserve it.

Thanks for your good will.

HERSHEY'S MEN'S SHOP
GETTYSBURG PENNSYLVANIA

i 0 •

WENTZ'S FURNITURE

With gratitude,
we greet you, our

customers and friends,

and wish you New Year's best.

GETTYSBURG PENNSYLVANIA

On the road ahead
lies another year. As you

travel along it,
our thanks and good

wishes go with you. Best of luckf

ALFRED C. HAHN
EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND

1972.
Even as demand for money

and credit increases in pace
with the projected improve-
ment in economic activity,
the monetary authorities are
well situated to pump in addi-
tional credit to meet legiti-
mate business needs, thus ob-
viating the likelihood of an-
other restrictive credit crunch.
Corporate liquidity in general
has been bolstered quite sig-
nificantly during the past two
years; thus, except for the
marginal companies which
have trouble securing credit
under most circumstances, the
threat no longer looms of
businesses being pushed to
the wall.
We must also remember that

even though the tax incent-
ives have been extremely slow
in gaining congressional ap-
proval, it is very likely that
initial benefits to the econo-
my will be seen by the end
of the first quarter of 1972.

Moreover, the Administration

will strive to impart more zip

to the economy because of the

national elections coming up

in the fall of 1972. Probably
one method will be to increase
attempts to stimulate trade
with hitherto restricted Com-
munist countries. One thing
is true, however — that the
Nixon Administration in gird-
ing for 1972's elections does

not have the latitude to stim-

ulate the economoy which oth-

er incumbent Administrations
have had in the past, due to

the grave budget deficit prob-

WE'VE
GOT IT!

Texaco Fuel Chief ... the
finest heating oil money
can buy! Texaco Fuel
Chief is today's top-qual-
ity heating oil. Result of
the most exhaustive re-
search in the heating oil
field. You'll find Texaco
Fuel Chief dependable in
quality, delivery after de-
livery. It's clean burning.
And it's economical—
gives complete combus-
tion from every drop. Or-
der Texaco Fuel Chief to-
day. We'll fill your fuel-oil
tank promptly.

C. F. STOUTER

OIL CO., INC.
Emmitsburg, Md. 21727

Phone 447-2118

sa

lem. Nevertheless, the health-
ier background climate pre-
vailing should produce a
greater willingness to spend on
the part of consumers. Some
pickup in retail trade surfaced
in the latter part of 1971,
albeit on a spotty basis. Im-
proved consumer demand,
higher inventory requirements
as a result of a more buoyant
level of general business, and
the incentive of the invest-
ment tax credit should bring
management thinking around
toward policies emphasizing
the expansion of inventories
a n d increases in capital
spending.

The Iffy Features
At this juncture, there are

some important iffy aspects to
the 1972 outlook. As 1971
drew to a close, however,
some of these vital issues did
take a turn for the better.
But until they are actually
resolved, these adverse fact-
ors will exert some dampening
influence on public sentiment.
The leading free world na-
tions achieved a meeting of
the minds and realigned their
currency parities. The Amer-
ican dollar was devalued

8.57% via an increase in the
official price of gold, while

stronger foreign currencies
were revalued upward formal-
ly. On the other hand, it will
require a little time to ham-
mer out a new trade agree-
ments providing for a more
equitable climate for Ameri-
can goods in foreign mark-
ets. Until the trade agree-
ments are revised foreign
commerce will remain at a
tenuous area.

Another iffy area concerns
the machinery of Phase Two.
Will it be successful in keep-
ing inflation in check, or do
the generous consessions to
labor in the initial rulings of
the Pay Board portend an in-
evitable loss of effectiveness
in the fight against inflation?
Also, will labor groups revolt
against the game plan and
provoke widespread general

strikes? For the record, we

are hopeful that union lead-

ers will bend enough to give

Phase Two some latitude to

operate.
A third area of uncertainty

is of a military nature. We

refer to the threat that one

of the world trouble spots

will suddenly lose its limited

scope overnight and become

the "cause celebre" in the „.1

(Continued On Page 5)
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For The Best Deal

Check Our Prices First!

Let Us Check Your Battery. Pluas.

And Ignition Points

Mufflers — Fan Belts

Tires — Windshield Wipers

KEEPERS ESSO STATION
Charles E. Keepers, Prop.

EMMITSBURG MARYLAND

- Dougherty I
Chevrolet Inc.

111 Frederick Road
Thurmont, Maryland 21788

Phone: 271-2456

YOUR BEST DEAL

ON A NEW CHEVROLET

1972 Cars and Trucks Now On

Display
—GOOD SELECTION OF OK USED CARS—

Sales Department Hours
8:30 A.M. to 8:30 P.M., Monday through Friday

8:30 A.M. to 3:30 P.M. Saturday
Service Department Hours

8:00 A.M. to 5:00 P.M., Monday through Friday
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LET US UNITE
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THAT THE NEW YEAR

MAY BRING PEACE,

ALONG WITH THE HOPE OF A

BETTER LIFE, FOR PEOPLE

EVERYWHERE, "HAPPY NEW YEAR."

CATOCTIN MOUNTAIN ORCHARD
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(Continued From Page 4)

ckeying for supremacy of
e three major powers. T o>re
adequate precedent in ere'

• the now known tinder box-
namely the Middle East

mtheast Asia, and India and
Pakistan. Indeed, the list
-crud well grow even longer
f the rest of the Arab world

,- ould gang up on Jordan and
i if Northern Ireland ; becomes
I Britain's Vietnam. Let us hope

the attempts of the Nixon Ad-
ministration to establish rap-
port wth Russia and Red Chi-
na, the winding :own of Amer-
ican participation in the Viet-
nam conflict-, and our thus
4 9.7,- r resolute stance againstr

eing drawn into the Arab-
sraeli "brink of war" prob-
lem will provide a calming in-
fluence and keep these trouble
ipots from becoming t h e
breeding grounds for World
War III.
flation Versus Deflation
The shift in Nixon's eco-.

,› •

non-dc strategy last summer
never did include a goal of
deflating the economy. Rath-
er, the object was to restrain
the dangerous pace of infla-
tion, which had been acceler-
ating during 1969, 1970, and
the first half of 1971. There-
fore, once again the staff of
Babsons' Reports rules out de-
flation in the coming year.
However, we no longer re-

gard inflation as "Public En-

emy No. 1'", as we did in our

forecasts for 1970 and 1971.

But it would be unrealistic

to expect an equilibrium be-

tween inflationary and defla-

tionary forces. Instead, what

we look for is a moderate de-

gree of inflation on both peice

and cost fronts. Buffers

against a return to hyper-in-

flation are expected to be the

monitoring on the part of the

Federal Government and, for

the better part of the year,

the caryovri of 1971's record

farm production, plus the large

May your New Year

begin with fun,

and go on to bring

you many rewards. It's

a privilege to serve you.

MOUNTAIN LIQUORS
EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND

TRIUMPH
SPORTS CARS

WEIKERT'S MACE
Blue Ridge Summit, Pa. 17214

Phone 717-794-2614

—The Only Triumph Dealer In This Area—

USED CAR SPECIALS
1970 Dodge Sportsman Wagon; Heater; 6 Cyl.; Auto-

matic; New Snow Tires.

1969 Sunbeam Coupe; 3-Speed Automalc; Radio.

1966 Volkswagen Sunroof.

1964 TR—Spitfire; Radio.

GET A DEAL ON THE

1972 CHEVROLET
And On OK Used Cars & Chevrolet Trucks

WANTZ CHEVROLET INC.
Phone 756-6006 Taneytown, Md.

COMPLETE AUTO AND BODY REPAIR

Service Department Hours
7:30 A.M.-5:00 P.M., MONDAY—FRIDAY

5:3e P.M.-9:00 P.M.. THURSDAY EVENING

Sales Department Hours
9:00 A.M.-9:00.P.M, MONDAY—FRIDAY

9:00 A.M.-5:00 P.M.. SATURDAY

  wavol/WIE=0NRIfil/011/MININPENSIA

BATTERIES
12-VOLT 6-VOLT

24-MONTH GUARANTEE

48-MONTH GUARANTEE

LIFETIME FREE REPLACEMENT

Should this battery fail at any time to hold a
charge, it will be replaced free to the original
purchaser for as long as he owns the passenger
car in which it was originally installed and pro-
vided it remains in that car.

Prices Start At $15.56
—250 Batteries In Stock—

reservoir of unused indastrial
praductive capacity. One must
remember also that despite
the generous wage conces-
sions to the coal miners, the
railroad signalmen, and oth-
et te the major labor union
contracts are going into either
their second or their third
years. In multi-year contracts,
the labor cost increase is us-
ually "front - end loaded,"
which means that almost half
the total increment of the con-
tract is granted in the first
year, so that each of the suc-
ceeding two yeais has sub-
stantially smaller labor cost
increases by comparison.
Tee most difficult area of

inflationary potential which
faces the country in 1972 is
that of public finance. The
Federal Government in the
fiscal year which ends June
30, 1972 will find it hard to
improve on the horrendous
deficit of $23.2 billion for the
fiscal year ended June 30,

1971. Indeed, unless Congress
shows greater spending re-
straint, the federal budget is
in jeopardy of "falling into
the red by well over $30 bil-
lion in this fiscal year. As the
next fiscal year unfolds, Pres-
ident Nixonn's inability to hold
overspending to a tolerable
level might haunt him and the
Republican Party in the elec-
tions of 1972.
Dollar Devaluation
The devaluation of the

American dollar near the end
of 1971 took place pretty
much in line with the expecta-
tions of the Babson's Reports
staff, -at 8.57% in terms of
the official price of gold. More-
over, the multi-national cur-
rency realignment process was
pretty much what the Babson
staff had anticipated, and the
elimination of the 10% sur-

charge on imports as a part
of the effort to revitalize in-
ternational commerce took
place as expected.
The term "devaluation" im-

plies the probability of a loss
of public confidence, along
with chaotic business and in-
vestment conditions. Howev-
er, the American public has
been conditioned to the pros-
pect of devaluation in recent
years, and more particularly
over the past yea:. or so.
Therefore, since devaluation
does not affect the value of
consumer purchasing power
here at home for domestical-

ly produced goods (the loss
wJi be evident in higher pric-

e 6 for foreign goo Is shipped
into this country, and less buy-
ing power for Americans
traveling abroad), no trau-
matic or protracted turbu-
lence greeted the devaluation.

It is likely that more equit-
able trade agreements will be
consummated which, with the
beneficial aspects of the to-

tal currency realignment pro-

gram should be a net plus

factor for the American econ-

omy over the next few years.

That is, the U. S. should gain

a more equitable positicn in

HAVE A

EUREKA

HOLIDAY

A CLEANER

NEW YEAR

LINCOLN
FURNITURE MART

Lincoln Square
Gettysburg, Pa.

Home of Quality Mee-
chandise and Sensible
Prices!

411111111111111•11111115,

I May your troubles melt

Quality tire -S - ervice I and happiness grow in
III 111„ constant sunshine.

Mai Hardware
vairfield, Pa.

wo, id trade, and also, since
our burden of military assist-
ance to the now well-to-do
NAT() nations is likely to be
shared — albek ; grudgingly --
by these coentries over which
we have heid a protee.tive um-
brella, the :Adverse trade and
payments L.e'anees sh add post
some improvement in 1972.
Building And Construction
The residential building pic-

ture 'saved the bacon" for
1971. Strength was centered
largely in housing and in
heavy construction related to
the generation of electric pow-
er. For all practical purpos-

es, however, home building
was the main show in the

building field, with an aver-

age annual rate equivalenit to

2 million units for 1971 com-

pared with 1.4 million inits

started in 1970. - Looking

ahead, Babsons' Reports fore-

casts that residential building

will remain in the forefront

of a high level of total build-

ing and construction activity.

The chief ingredients for sus-

taining the building boom in

housing should again be pres-

Money and credit for mortgage

ent during the year ahead:

demand are ample; the cost

of long-term credit has back-

ed away somewhat from peak

levels; and the rate of new

family formations is definite-

ly on the upswing. Indeed,

the latter could be accentuat-

ed in 1972 if the improvement

iii business, Employment, and

personal income picks up es

expected.
With the high level of home

building expected to persist

throughout 1972, the building

materials, home furnishings

and accessories, and appliance

industries should enjoy brisk

business in the year ahead.

The housing sector of the

economy packs a powerful

wallop in terms of materials

and manpower utilization, and

in contributing -flow-through
strength to related industries.
All in all, this will make for
a stronger real estate market

in the year ahead.
We look for non-residential

construction to start slowly
but gather steam as 1972 pro-
gresses. Because of the delay
by Congress in implementing
the 7% investment tax eredit,
many businesses have had to
"sit on their hands" when it
came to large-scale capital
expenditures. Furthermore, in-
dustrial activity will have to
make quite a bit of headway
before enough excess product-
ive capacity is absorbed to
make businessmen more ex-
pansion-minded.
Consumer Spending
The Babson staff forecasts

a good increase in consumer
spending for 1972. A begin-
ning of the .long-awaited re-
vhal in consumer spending
was evident during the past
year even though, for the most
part, retail trade was sporad-
ic and periods of promising
gains could not be sustain-
ed. In addition, an inordin-
ately high percentage of per-
sonal income went into say-
iiigs in 1971, further fatten-
ing the backlog of buying
power. With fewer major dan-
ger points in the offing, con-
sumers should be much more

willing to loosen their purse

strings in 1)72.
Increases over the past two

years in personal consump-

tion expenditures and private

domestic investments in resi-

dential building have figured

very prominently in lifting

the American economy above

the trillon-dollar gross nation-

al product mark. And, in

1972, the GNP should show

a net gain approximately 8%

over 1971's figure in current

dollar value, and about 5%

on a deflated basis.
Personal Income
And Employment
The emergency freeze and

t h e subsequent controlled
economy slowed the upward

trend of personal income. Not

only were wages frozen, but

the rent freeze restrained
rental income of individuals

We, The Friendly
FIRST NATIONAL BANK OF

F AIRFIELD
OFFER HIGHER INTEREST

ON SAVINGS!

ON CERTIFICATES

5 3A7n OF DEPOSIT; 2 Yr.,
V $500 Minimum.

ON CERTIFICATES51 , /, ,,,, OF DEPOSIT; 1 Yr.,
111 $500 Minimum.

41/2(7 ON PASSBOOK

0 SAVINGS

NOW!! Start a VACATION Club Account.
YOU make the first 50 payments.
the FRIENDLY First National of
FAIRFIELD Will Make THE LAST
PAYMENT FREE!

NOW!! NO CHARGE For Checking Accounts
No Minimum Balance Required.

NOW!! For The Customer's Convenience. . .

WE ARE OPEN MONDAY-THURSDAY, 9 til 3

ALL DAY FRIDAY, 9 A.M. til S P.M.

SATURDAY MORNING, 8:30 A.M. til 11 A.M.

FIRST NATIONAL BANK OF

FAIRFIELD
'airfield, Pa, 17320 Phone 71144244223

Meiriber F.D.I.C.

and non - corporate entities,
while investment income from
dividends and interest like-
wise leveled off. In view- of
the generous awards approv-
ed by the Pay Board, we fore-
cast a resumption of the up-
trend in total personal income
in the year ahead. Babson's
forecasts calls for gross per-
sonal income in 1972 to aver:
age about 8% above that o.••
1971.

This will not all be the re-
sult of higher wage rates.
Since the second quarter of
1971, total employment has
had an upward bias. Unem-
ployment followed e more or
less sideways trend during
the months of 1971. As eco-
nomic activity gains strength,
we look for employment to
show more distinct betterment
in 1972. There will be some
progress along the line reduc-
ing unemployment, but it will
be difficult to shrink the job-
less ranks below the 59: un-
employment rate by year-end
1972, according to estimates
of Babson's Reports. Because
the labor force is now in a
period of accelerated growth,
and the military is Expected
to reduce its manpower re-
quirements further, the task
of absorbing new entrires into
the labor market will be dif-
ficult.
Business Profits
And Dividends
Babson's Reports forecasts

a gain in after-tax profits ap-
proximately 10% over 1971.
Were it not for some examples
of inequitable disparities be-
tween wage boosts over price
hikes in the initial rulings of
the Wage Board and the Price
Commission, we p r o bably
would have projected a larger
increase — say, somewhat in
excess of 15%. While profit
margins will be controlled.

May it be as beautiful

as you want it to be.

Town & Country

Beauty Salon
Thurmont, Md.

there is still room for net cor-
porate profits to show prog-
ress. This is because a rise in
business volume and the bene-
fits of some rather stringent
cost - reduciion programs en-
acted over the past two years
will permit many corporations
to pull down some of the in-
crement in • revenues to the
profit figure. Also, those c,,in-
unnies which lad sn'fer.--;•o
earnings in one or tw f the
past -J.e yo& - e .n ;se
prices in urckr to allow de-
pressed profit margins to as-
sAne a heait;er status with-
out vimating tile guidelines.
The ceiling on dividend in-

impo.,ed upon corpor-
a,ions which had beeii disburs-
ing a higher-than-normal rate
of cash dividend; will, natur-
ally, limit the progress of in-
come for investors. This is
another area in which 1972
and its anticipated economic
improvement will differ from
other years of business re-
bound. The limitation on divi-
dend increases will not act en-
tirely to the detriment of in-
vestors because many corpor-
ations will have no alternative
but to plow back more earn-

ings into the .business. This

will augment their liquidity,

further shore up working cap-

ital, and enhance capabilities

for acquisition, expansion and

modernization programs.
Taxes
Taxpayers should experi-

ence at least a small degree

of relief at the Federal level

on income taxes during 1972.

However, part of this advent-

age will undoubtedly be ne-
gated at the state and mu-
nicipal levels, where new or
higher levies seem unavoid-
able for taxation of incomes,
personal property, and sales
on products and services. But
it will be nip and tuck even at
the Federal level, unless the
improvement in business
brings a sudden expansion of
revenues from taxes, and un-
less Federal expenditures can
-be reduced from currently
projected lofty rates. The
odds are that, in view of elec-
tion-year considerations, the
danger of a Federal income
tax boost will be greater in
1973 than in 1972. For corp-
orations, restoration of the in-
vestment tax credit will yield
some tax advantage at the
Federal level. In summary,
we expect recently enacted
tax relief measures to pro-
vide some benefit for both in-
dividual and corporate tax-
payers.

Bond Market Outlook
The decline during 1971 was

abrupt for short-term money
rates, but more gradual at
the longer end of the maturi-
ty scale. Inasmuch as the ec-
onomic profile for 1972 is
viewed by the Babson staff as
one in which the ascent is

likely to be solid but gradual,

it is not likely that the de-

mand for money and credit

will be voracious. But we look

for short-term money rates

to remain near current levels

initially and then exhibit firm-

(Continued On Page 6)

NEW YEAR SPECIALS
1970 Ford LTD 4-Dr. H.T.; 1 Owner; Fully Equip.; Air
1969 Falcon Wagon. fi Cyl., R&H; Real Economy; Clean.

ALWAYS GOOD VALUES
1970 Torino 4-Dr. Sdn.; Fully Equipped; Very Clean.
1968 Chevrolet Impala 4-Dr. H.T.; Fully Equipped.
1968 Ford Custom, 2-Dr., V-8; R&H.
1966 Chevrolet 4-Dr.; 6 Cyl.: S. Shift; R&H.
1963 Mercury 4-Dr. ELT.; Fully Equipped.

1968 Chevrolet 1/2-lon Pickup.; 8 Ft. Body: R&H.
1951 Ford 1/2-Ton Pickup; V-8; 61/2 Ft. BodY.
1955 Chevrolet 14-Ton Stake; 4 Speed.

Sperry's Ford Sales, Inc.
PHONE 447-6171 EMMITSBURG, MD.
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l>.,uble-decker good wishes for the New Year

go out to you and yours. Thanks for your

support. It has ben a pleasure serving you.

FROM THE

C. F. STOUTER MI. CO., INC.
E. Main Street Emmitsburg, Md.

Phone 447-2909

AND EMPLOYEES
EMMITSBURG MARYLAND
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OPEN LINE

By

Congressman GoodToe Byron
Maryland—Sis.th District

T h e following questions
were typical of the kind asked
of me in rceent weeks. Let-
ters should be sent to me c/o
U.S. House of Representatives,
Washington, D. C. 20515.
What is the status of the

legislation that would allow a
taxpayer to deduct a portion
of his family's college expens-
es from his income tax?
There are currently two bills

ummalarmabzor
Business Services

PATRONIZE our advertisers.
These firms are reliable and
have proven through the years
that they handle only quality
products and offer skilled
professional service and ad-
vice to their patrons.

NATIONWIDE

INSURANCE
* AUTO * LIFE
* FIRE * MIF
* HOSPITALIZATION

JOHN W. (Bill)
STRICKHOUSER

Emmitsburg, Md.

Phone 447-2266

111.411111 

THE GAS SERVICE ‘) PEOPLE PREFER

I/a/Pi/at/4mq
-%-4sauslatigo.

THE MATTHEWS

GAS COMPANY

Emmitsburg - Thurmont

TOPPER

Insurance Agency
Est. 1953

Auto - Homeowner's

Casualty - Accident and

Health - Hospitalization

Office At Home - Mt. Road

Phone 447-6174 - Notary

—No Parking Problems—

Hanover Maternity Shop

Complete Line Oi
MATERNITY WEAR

Infant Wear To T14

Danskin Leotards & Tights

Shower Gifts

SeIva Dance Footwear

41 Frederick St., Hanover, Pa.
11111111•1111111111111111M15111•11=1.1.11

LIBRARY HOURS

Mon., Tue., Wed., Fri., 2:30-5

Saturday, 9-12
Evenings: Mon., Tue., Wed.

7 - 9

vimoomemommiss
Coffman Jewelers

28 Baltimore St.

Gettysburg, Pa.

OMEGA WATCHES
(ORANGE BLOSSOM
DIAMOND RINGS)

DR. R. P. KLINGER, JR.

Optometrist

19 East Main Street
EMMITSBURG, MD.

Eyes Examined-Glasses Fitted
Complete Optical Repairs

HOURS
MONDAY: 6:30 to 8:30 p.m.
(Other Evenings By Appoint.)

PHONE
WESTMINSTER TI 8-8340

WILSON

Funeral Home

EMMITSBURG, MD.

Phones:

Emmitsburg 447-6244

Fairfield 642-8642

in this regard which are pend-
ing before the Ways & Means
Committee. The first, H.R.
307, would permit a taxpayer
to deduct expenses paid by
him in connection with his ed-
ucation, or the education of
his spouse or any of his de-
pendents at an institution of
higher education. These ex-
penses could include tuition,
fees, books, supplies and room
and board, however, t h e
amount of the deduction could
not exceed $1200 for any one
individual in a taxable year.
The second bill, H.R. 309,
would permit the deduction of
90 per cent of tuition paid to
education institutions as a
charitable contribution for pur-
poses of a tax deduction. The
ceiling on this latter measure,
which was introduced by Con-
gressman John Murphy of
New York, would be $2500.
Is the President's Price

Commission going to keep an
eye on hospital costs during
Phase II?
President Nixon has ap-

pointed a special committee to
advise the Price Commission,

Cost of Living and Pay Board
in their task of guiding the
post-freeze economic program
in the area of health services.
The Committee on the Health
Services Industry will seek the
cooperation of the health ser-
vices in restraining cost and

price increases and will sug-

gest ways of applying anti-
inflation measures to medical
costs. The 21 committee mem-

bers represent the medical
profession, consumers, hospit-

als, related health occupations,

health-products industries and

health-insurance groups.
Why doesn't the govern-

ment offer cheaper federal

crime insurance for the small

businessman and homeowner

who only want limited insur-

ance coverage?
According to George K.

Bernstein, Federal Insurance
Administrator, crime insur-

ance deductibles will be reduc-

ed effective January 1st and

limited coverages will also be

permitted at lower costs. The

new optional coverages will

be available at reductions in

premium rates of 50 per cent

for burglary-only and 40 per

cent for robbery-only cover-

age. Minimum loss deducti-

bles for small and medium-

sized businesses will be reduc-

ed from $100 to $50 and de-

ductibles for residential prop-

erties will be reduced from

LUGGAGE
LADIES' - MEN'S

Samsonite

Also
CARD TABLE

SETS

LINCOLN
FURNITURE MART

•
Lincoln Square
Gettysburg, Pa.
Phone 334-4414

Home of Quality Mer-
chandise and Sensible
Prices!

NEW
YEAR

BLESSING

Peace and
happiness- today
and tomorrow.

M. L. Creager

Funeral Home

and

Home Furnishings
Thurmont, Md.

Awards Night Held

For R.R. 4-H Club
The Rocky Ridge Progres-

sive 4-H Club held its De-
cember meeting in the form
of a banquet and achievement
night. The meeting was held
at the Rocky Ridge Fire Hall
amid Christmas decor with ap-
proximately 90 perons in at-
,tendance. Rev. Paul E. Myers,
Pastor of t h e Thurmont
Church of the Brethren, gave
the invocation. The greetings
were extended by Randy
Smith. Bruce Baust led the
Pledges.

Several members of the club
presented a skit in silhouette
about the Story of the Three
Wisemen and the Coming of
Christ. Mehrle Mayne show-
ed some very colorful and in-
teresting slides from his State
to State Exchange trip in Ha-
waii. Following this, Vicki

$100 per loss, to $75.
I recently read that the De-

partment of Agriculture may
regulate bacon packaging.
What is it all about?
According to the Depart-

ment of Agriculture, the Of-
fice of Consumer Affairs is
considering the need for Fed-
eral standards for bacon pack-
ages which would require ex-
posing the full bacon slices
being sold. In fact, one large
company is already introduc-
ing "rear - window" packages
to give consumers a better
view of the bacon they arc
buying. If you have any feel-
ings on this matter you might
want to write the Office of
Consumer Affairs, Exectuive
Office of the President, Wash-
ington, D. C. 20506.

EAT AT

BIG BOY
FAMILY RESTAURANT

Steinwehr Avenue
Gettysburg, Pa.

Sun. thru Thurs. 7 a.m. to 10 p.m.
Fri. & Sat. 7 a.m. to 12 midnight

Wivell and Mike Wivell gave
a history of the 4-H Club for
the past year.

Presentation of awards
highlighted t h e evening's
meeting. The Junior Tour Day
award was received by Ce-
celia Wivell for Gardening.
Alex Parasada received the
'Senior Tour Day award for
Rabbits, while Stanley Gregg
received the Junior Achieve-
ment award in the Dairy De-
partment for Carrying Beef.
Stanley also won the Inter-
mediate Division of Public
Speaking. Mark Wivell re-
ceived the Past President's Pin
from Patti Keilholtz, who is
the incoming president. Re-
ceiving the Key Pin, a Senior
Division Achievement Award,
was Phyllis Wivell.
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Hom-

mey of the Frederick County
Extension A ge nc y, were
among the guests present.
Leaders present were Mr. Ster-
ling Pollinger and Mr. Car-
roll Wivell.

Use Classifieds

• CAB5CIN'S FORECAST FOR
(Continued From Page 5)

to-higher moves as 1972 pro-
gresses. Longer-term interest
rates will reflect continuing
heavy capital needs at the Fed-
eral, state, and local govern-
ment levels.
Bond prices, therefore.

should show some further
firming as 1972 unfolds, but
any additional increase is like-
ly to be quite limited. Indeed,
possibly after midyear, there
will be signs of a tightening
in credit supplies. Thereafter,
the bond market may antici-
pate a turn back upward in
interest rates. Just how much
ground bond prices will give
up depends upon the degree
of inflationary psychology and
the vigor in business capital
spending in the second half
of 1972. Therefore, while
yields on bonds and prefer-
red stocks are considerably
lower than at the height of
the credit crunch of 1969-70,
investors will have a general-
ly favorable climate for mak-
ing investments in good-quali-
ty fixed-income securities.

However, because inflation
is likely to persist in 1972,
albeit at a restrained pace,
those investors who are not
obliged to seek the highest
-current yield possible (safe-
ty of principle and income
included) m a y be better
off to place some of their
funds in convertible securities.
As the new year makes its
debut, there is still a goodly
supply of bonds and preferred
stocks which have the conver-
sion privilege and which offer
the investor a little better in-
come than common stocks. But
this opportunity may not be
present for long. As stock
prices advance, these convert-
ible securities take on greater
value, and as their market
prices increase, the percentage
yields which are available to
investors naturally decrease.
Stock Market Outlook

Babson's Reports is looking
for a good year from the stock
market in 1972. The advance
which began just af ter
Thanksgiving Day 1971 should

1972
be extended in the year ahead,
although correction phases are
to be expected. Barring some
unforeseen major development,
such as a radical degeneration
of international conditions,
the Dow Jones Industrial Av-
erage can mount yet another
challenge to the previous all-
time high near the 1,000 mark.
Indeed, chances are that the
previous top can be pierced
as the stock market marches
toward its high for the year,
with the peak coming some-
time in either the latter part
of the summer or the fore-
portion of the fall season.
Right now, the bargain

counter is still laden with at-
tractive buys in common
stocks of all varieties. One
can find an array of good-
quality growth stocks, re-
bound situations for capital
appreciation, and speculative
situations at varying prices.
Naturally, as previously men-
tioned, with the favorable
prospects for building, stocks
of companies which stand to
benefit from the home build-
ing boom are among the at-
tractive buys for 1972. Nor
should investors overlook the
companies which stand to
benefit from the investment
tax credit. These include man-
ufacturers and purchasers of
trucks and truck transporta-
tion equipment. The f arm
equipment companies can also
benefit from this "tax break",
and considering the excellent
farm year of 1971, demand
for agricultural equipment
should be turning upward af-
ter a long downtrend. Other
groups of stocks which should
reflect better sales and prof-
its is 1972 include chemicals,
containers, pollution a n d
waste control, and those which
have particiPation in the med-
ical equipment lines. Remem-
ber also that the role of con-
sumer spending looms import-
ant over the coming year.
Therefore, many retail, food,
and apparel stocks represent
good candidates for capital ap-
preciation.

Beautiful Sight!
/ s ,Stere--(

IOOH

Beautiful Sound!
ABC ITV NEWS 4T 2 900C

F redertck fitoryland
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VISIT YOUR FAVORITE AREAlaARESTAURANI!
DURING THE HOLIDAYS!

FOR A GRAND

NEW YEARS

BLUE MOUNTAIN INN
CRAB HOUSE

Rt. 806, 2 Miles South of Thurmont
Phone 301-271-2190

BOB'S SPECIAL

NEW YEAR'S EVE
BUFFET
THE FAMOUS

NIGHT HAWKS
FOR YOUR DANCING PLEASURE

—PARTY FAVORS—

$15 Per Couple Includes
FOOD — BEER — SODA

8 p.m. - 1 a.m.
COCKTAILS AND MIXED DRINKS

—CARRY-OUT SERVICE—
CRABS: Wholesale and Retail

All Popular Beers Soft Drinks
HOURS: Tues., Wed., Thurs., 9 A.M. - 12 P.M.

Friday, Saturday, 9 A.M. - 1 A.M.
Sun., 1 P.M. - 10 P.M. — Closed Monday

The Ott House
Pub & Restaurant

Phone 301-447-2625

OPEN NEW YEAR'S EVE
STOP IN FOR A SNACK WITH YOUR

FAVORITE BEVERAGE

SUBS AND PIZZAS

Complete Line Of

WINES & BEERS
SANDWICHES & DINNERS

Comolete Carry-Out Service

FAMILY STYLE HOME COOKING
DAILY SPECIALS

BANQUETS SUNDAY DINNERS
Closed New Year's Day

HILLTOP INN
BLUE RIDGE SUMMIT, PA. 17Z14

Tracey's Corner 7/7-794-5122

11 Now Open 24 Hrs.

"THE LATE NIGHT

PLACE TO EAT"

SOUP And
SANDWICHES

FOUNTAIN

Sundries - Magazines

FAIRFIELD
CUT RATE

Fairfield, Pa. 17320

LINCOLN
DINER

Block North of Lincoln Sq.
Gettysburg, Pa.

• FINE FOOD

• FAST FRIENDLY

SERVICE

• DAILY SPECIALS

PIZZA

SUBS

Texas HOT DOGS

Carry-Out Service

THE PALMS
447-2303 or 447-2991

Emmitsburg, Md.

Sp. 5 Douglas Young re-
ported to Fort Dix, N. J., on
Nov. 30, prior to leaving for
Germany for a two-year tour
of duty with the Army. He
is the husband of the former
Diane Dutrow, and son-in-law
of Mrs. Mildred Dutrow, De-
Paul Street, Emmitsburg.

Mr. and Mrs. Stephen Wil-
hide, Bladensburg, Md., were
visitors with Mr. Wilhide's
mother, Mrs. Margaret Wil-
hide, W. Main St. Mr. Wilhide
is presently working on his
Master's degree in Community
Planning and Social Science
at the University of M
land, Baltimore campus

Fitzgerald's

RESTAURANT & MOTEL
Phone 301-271-7882

HOLIDAY
FRUIT CAKES

HOME MADE TO AN OLD

FAMILY RECIPE

AND BASTED WITH WINE

AN IDEAL SUGGESTION FOR THAT

Thurmont, Md.
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LAST MINUTE GIFT OR A FINE ADDITION up

TO NEW YE)kR'S DINNER
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NEW YEAR'S EVE

NN; Dining Room Closes 8:00 P. M., 1
w

t7 al
;

g 
Lounge Open Until 2:00 A. M. 1 1-\76'

h, Free Snacks All Evening ti
sto —CLOSED NEW YEAR'S DAY—

On U.S. 15, 6 Miles South of

Emmitsburg, Maryland 21727

Frederick County's First Restaurant To g
Serve Cocktails 0

gulisommizzompaivaamzolvm).%)m),D,Azkz),20421)4).)akaaomv,i

VISIT TEE

BLUE DUCK INN
Waynesboro Road, Emmitsburg, Md.

FOR AN OLD FASHIONED

NEW YEAR'S EVE

PARTY

Hats, Noisemakers, Party Favors

WE WILL BE SERVING

Your Favorite Cocktails,

Mixed Drinks, Wine and Beer

ALONG WITH OUR EXCELLENT

FOOD FROM THE MENU

No Cover — No Minimum

BLUE DUCK INN
Waynesboro Road, Emmitsburg, Md.

;11=721?

NEW YEAR'S EVE PARTY I
Music By The Southernaires Trio

9:30 P. M. - 1:30 A.M.

Snacks - Drinks - Coffee - Favors Included

9:30 - 2:00

$22.00 Per Couple
—NO REFUNDS—

COZY RESTAURANT -1
Phone 271-7373 I

GREYSTONE INN
Specializing In

FAMILY STYLE DINNERS

COCKTAILS

OPEN NEW YEAR'S EVE, 4 - 9 P.M.
OPEN NEW YEAR'S DAY, 12 - 6 P.M.

G EYSTONE INN
1-Mile off Sunshine Trail at Blue Ridge Summit

OPEN: Weekdays 4-9 P.M.—Sundays 12-6 P.M.
Closed Tuesdays Phone 717-794-8821
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CILASSIII Fir
OR SALE — Used Applianc-
es—Refrigerators, Freezers,

-es. See these bargains
yes Electric Co., W.

qt., Emmitsburg, Md.
none 447-2497. tf

61,'OR SALE—Stove and Fire-
place Wood. S. E. Baker,
phonne 447-2670. tf

ii•

. * FARMERS & DAIRYMENI

ll Terramycin
4 Mastitis — Scours TabItts

- iAll nieVeterinarian7.taiesb Supplies
PEOPLES DRUG STORE

. tf Gettysburg, Pa.

to NOTICE—I will not be re-
AI sponsible for any pills oth-

er than my own.
A Patricia A. RohrbaughA
ri 1211613tp

-6•pi . id-Irv-OUSE FOR RENT — Char
nita "A" Frame, fire place,

A
A full kitchen, central heat,
g fully furnished. Ideal for
t* faculty couple. Charnita

g Club privileges. Available

iii now: (202) 347-8998.
2116I4t

NOTICE — Anyone caught
trespassing or cutting down

r* a fence on Mrs. Joan Mar-
tinez's property on Irish

t rr  wn Ru dl 1. 
• extentA'i l I be o f prosecut-edthe law 

to 
f.

1 ltp
I  
FOR RENT—House on South

: Seton Avenue. Phone 447-
. al • 2236. 12302t

Zr HELP WANTED — Full time
Waitress. Apply in person
at The Palms, W. Main St.

tf

,44

NA 4.
BEAUTIFY your carpet with

"CAMPOO" rug shampoo
that revive:, colors. Rent

electric shampooer $1.00.
Shorb Floor Co., Thurmont,
Md., phone 271-7252. it

NOTICE — We're proud that
thousands have relied on
our reputation when they
buy a musical instrument.
They know we offer quali-
ty and service, after all,
service is part of our name.
May we show you? Men-
chey Music Service, 1100
Carlisle St., Clearview
Shopping Center in Hanov-

er. it

NOTICE — A Color Portrait
the right gift for any oc-
casion from The Zeigler
Studio, 69 West Middle St.,

Gettysburg, Pa. Phone 334-
1311. Artistry in Photog-
raphy. tf

CUSTOM SLA-UGHTERING
& PROCESSING OF BEEF

y
Cut and wrapped for the
freezer to _cur specifications.

IsionisfAN stinrytR, JR.
Phone 447-2255. Emmitsburg

We sell beef by half or
quarters.

ATTENTION FARMERS
Hauling to Auction Everyday

J. E. WATKINS
Dealer in Livestock
Emmitsburg, Md.

tf Phone 447-2347

AWNINGS

CAR PORTS

PATIO COVERS

PORCH ENCLOSURES

FIBERGLASS AWNING CO.

127 York St.
Gettysburg, Pa. - Ph. 334-4612

NOTICE—Kitchen help want-

ed. Experience desirable

but not necessary. Earn

while you learn, with new,

modern equipment. Sham-

rock Restaurant, phone 271-

7882. tf

LEGAL NOTICE 
STATE OF MARYLAND

NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT
AND

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

TO ALL PERSONS INTER-

'ESTED IN THE ESTATE OF

ROSE L. PUTMAN
This is to give notice that

the undersigned, Helen G.

Marshall whose address is

1612 Rock Creek Drive, Fred-

erick, Maryland 21701, was

on December 22, 1971 appoint-

ed personal representative of

the estate of Rose L. Putman

who died on December 7, 1971

without a will.
All persons having any ob-

jection to such appointment

shall file the same with the

Register of Wills of Freder-

ick County on or. before June

22, 1972.
All persons having claims

against the decedent must

present their claims to the un-

dersigned, or file the same

with the said Register of

Wills on or before six months

from the date of such ap-

pointment.
Any claim not so filed on or

before such date or any ex-

tension thereof provided by

law shall be unenforceable

thereafter.
HELEN G. MARSHALL
Personal Representative
Thomas M. Eichelberger

• Register of Wills
Date of first
publication:
December 30, 1971-3t

NOTICE — Texas Hot Dogs
now available at The Palms,
W. Main St. Phone 447-
2303. tf

Rosensteel's

Car Beauty Center

—AUTO WAXING-

110 DePaul Sr., Emmitsburg

Phone 447-6272

lifilooneranansammigmam

NOTICE

Welty's

Barber Shop
HOURS OPEN:

P.M. To 9 P.M.
Mon., Tues., Thurs., Fri.

8:30 A.M. To 5 P.M.
On Saturday

Closed Wednesday—

THI3RMONT
REAL ESTATE

AGENCY
60 Acre Mountain - Farm, 3
Bedroom, 2 story frame
house, has bath, Oil hot-
water H e a t, Bankbarn,
Poultry houses, Garage and
other farm buildings, two
Ponds, Trout - stream, all
buildings in Al condition,
Price . . $60,000.00.
JOSEPH F. ROYER

Salesman
Church Street

Thurmont, Marylanu
rhone 301-271-2342

301-898-7180

GOOD USED CARS — For-
eign and domestic. Re-con-
ditioned and priced to sell
—Bank financing available.
Dee Gee Imports, Fairfield
Rd., Gettysburg, Pa.

Wedding Invitations

—Fast Service—

CHRONICLE PRESS INC.
South Seton Ave.
Emmitsburg, Md.

HELP WANTED — To take
care of criPpled lady. Hours

from 4 p.m. to 12 midnight.

Apply 400 W. Main St., or
call 447-6210. tf

NOTICE — Interior Painting,

Paneling. Ceiling and Floor

Tile Installed, etc, For

prompt estimate call 756-
2345. John Balmer, Taney-

town. tf

NOTICE—No Trespassing on

any property owned by Vei-

• gie Valentine, near Tom's

Creek, R2, Emmitsburg, Md.

11,11184

New & Used Guns For Sale

Licensed Handgun Dealer

GUNS WANTED
Gene's Gun Shop
Eugene Bankard

Emmitsburg, R.D. 2, Md.
Phone 447-2869

Guns bought, sold & repaired

LES MORTON
Painting — Papering

Fairfield, Pa. Phone 642-5415

tf

LISTINGS WANTED

Farms, Homes, Mountain
Property — Call

Thurmont Real Estate Agency

Joseph F. Royer
Salesman

Thurmont, Maryland

Phone 301-271-2342
301-898-7180

NOTICE—No trespassing on

the B. H. Boyle Farms

which include the Papp

farm, the Wilhid e farm,

the James H. Boyle farm

and the former Fitzgerald

farm. tf

ZENTZ AUTO SALES

Serving You Since 1943

Carlisle St. Gettysburg, Pa.

Open 9-9 Daily

WEDDING PORTRAITS

Groups At The Studio

WEDDING ALBUMS

Color or Black & White

Finishes. Call for prices.

The Lane Studio
34 York St.

Gettysburg, Pa.

Over 30 Yrs. Experience

RONALD J. SHORB

Ceramic Tile

Contractor
Baths-Kitchens-Flagstone

Wall-to-Wall Carpet

Armstrong Floor Covering

Free Etsimates

Phone 271-7252

Thurmont,

Year End Sale

TOPPERS

Low, Low Prices
EKDAHL'S

CAMPER SUPPLIES

Business Rt. 15 North, 1/2 Mile
Gettysburg • Phone 334-7939

The Best Used Cars are Found
Where the zest Used Cars
are Sold.

William (Bill) Sentz
Fairfield Rd.

RD 3 Gettysburg, Pa.
Phone 717-642-5603

CLOSED

Saturday, January 1
Sunday, January 2

Best Wistws
For The Holidays

THE PALMS

Allen & Dot Davis

Complete

FILM

DEVELOPING

SERVICE

CROUSE'S
Center Square

Emmitsburg, Md.
Phone 447-2211

ANNOUNCE BIRTH

Mr. and Mrs. Michael
Kreitz are the proud parents
of a baby daughter born on
Christmas Day at the Waynes-
boro Hospital. Mrs. Kreitz is
the form Miss Linda Topper,
daughter of Mrs. Gladys Top-
per and the late Carroll
"Chick" Topper, of Emmits-
burg.

Student Council Is Active
The Catoctin High School

Student Council has been busy
recently. At the two latest
meetings, many different ac-
tivities were discussed.

Operation or the Student
Council Room, where members

of the Student Council are

available to receive ideas,

complaints, and suggestions

from the student body, began

on Monday, Nov. 22. Although

not too many people took ad-

vantage of this opportunity

to have more voice in the op-

eration of the school, it was

decided to continue the pro-

gram.
Another recent accomplish-

ment of the Catoctin Student

Council is the publication of

the lunch menus. From now

on, the lunch menu for the

week will be posted Monday

morning in every room. This

way, the guesswork in "what's

for lunch?" is eliminated, and

students have a chance to de-

cide whether or not they want

to buy lunch or bring their

own.
The Canned Food Drive, be-

ing held the week of Decem-

ber 13 to the 22. is another

activity upon which the Stu-

dent Council has embarked.

The canned foods received

during this time will be given

to the Salvation Army, which

in turn will donate them to

the needy people of the coun-

ty. This year, the drive will

be county wide, a move initi-

ated by Roxie Aubol, Catoctin

g. C. President. E;ach individ-

ual school handles the Can-

ned Food Drive in a different

manner. At Catoctin, there is

a competition between the

classes, to see which can col-

lect the most cans. The win-

ning class will be given an

award.
At these two meetings.

t} -re was much discussion

concerning the Exchange Pro-

USED CAR SPECIALS
69 Buick LeSabre Custom 400 4-dr. hardtop; RH&A:

P.S.; P.B.; 1 Owner;, Low Mileage.

'69 Chevrolet 4-Dr. Sedan; RH&A; P.S.; 327 Eng.

'69 Pontiac Caalina S.W'.; RH&A; P.S.; 1 Owne
r; Low

Mileage; Excellent Condition.
'69 Pontiac Catalina 4-Dr.; RH&A; P.S.; Air Condit

ion-

ing; Low Mileage; 1 Owner.
'68 Ford, Custom 500 4-Dr.; Fully Equipped.

'68 Mustang Convertible; Small V-8; RH&A; P.S.; I

Qwner.
'68 Plymouth Fury III 4-Dr.; R&H&A; 1 

Owner; Low

Mileage.
'67 Pontiac 4-Dr. H-top; RH&A; P.S.; P.B.; 1 Owner

:

Low - Mileage.
'67 Mercury 4-Dr. HT; RH&A; P.S.; P.B.; Low 

Mileage.

'67 Ford Galaxie 500 4-Dr.; V-8; RH&A P.S.

'66 Ford Fairlane Station Wagon; Small V-8; 
RH& A

Power Steering; Power Brakes.
'e.6 Dodge 4-Dr.; RH&A; Power Steering; 1 Owner.

'66 Chevrolet Bel Air 4-Dr.; RH&A; 1 Owner.

'65 Ford LTD 4-Dr. Hardtop; RH&A; Power Steering
;

Power Brakes; Good Condition.
'65 Falcon 4-Dr., 6 Cyl.; R&H; Straight Stick.

'65 Dodge 2-Dr. "6"; Stick.

IF YOU NEED A SPECIAL CAR CONTACT

Emmitsburg Auto Sates
MARSHAL SANDERS

PHONE 447-2176 EMMITSBURG, NI 11

DOG OWNERS
BUY YOUR LICENSE BY JANUARY 1, 1972

The law provides a fine of from $5.00 to $25.00 on

any owner of a dog, six months of age or over, which

is not licensed after January 1, 1972.

LICENSES AVAILABLE AT

Brunswick Town Office Thurmont Town Office

Burkittsville Town Clerk New Market Town Office

Mt. Airy Milling Co. Walkersville Town Office
Woodsboro Liquors

—OR BY MAIL OR IN PERSON AT—

County Treasurer's Office, Frederick, Maryland

You can fill in this form and mail 2.00 for Male or

Spayed Female; $3.00 for Female; $15.00 for Kennel

(not more than 25); $25.00 for Kennel (more than 25)
to: TREASURER OF FREDERICK COUNTY, FRED-

ERICK, MARYLAND, and your license will be mailed
to you.

COUNTY TREASURER, Winchester Hall,
FREDERICK, MARYLAND 21701

Please send me tag for my dog as follows:

Owner  

Address  

Male   Female  Spayed   Breed  

If dog is not six months of age by January 1, 1972.

license must be bought when dog becomes six months

old.
Failure to buy your dog license will mean not onl-

your arrest, but your dog may be picked up and im-

pounded. •
The License does not jive the dog the right to ires-

pass on anyone's property without the permission of the

owner.

ARTHUR C. SIMONS,
Frederick County Dog Warden

At Catoctin High School
gram. The Exchange Program

will involve each school that

has agreed to participate in

sending five to ten representa-

tives, chosen by the S C. end

administration, to observe in

any county schocl. The dele-

gates will be restricted to

schools of their own grade

level; for instance, middle

school students will observe

other middle schools, and se-

nior high students will be

sent only to other senior high

schools.
During the day, the out-of-

school delegates will attend a

student government meeting

Interior Pointing

Mason Work
PHONE
271-7966

Fred Koeppel

& Son
Rt. 1 Box 390

Thurmont, Md.

Pick Up Truck Specials

1971 Chevrolet 8' Fleetside,
V-8, 3-speed, heavy duty
rear springs, leaf type;
front stabilizer bar, ra-
dio, rear step bumper.
new fiberglass camper
cap, actual 10.000 miles
(drove myself)  $2,900

1970 Chevrolet 8' Fleetside,
6-cylinder, 3-speed, hea-
vy duty rear springs,
rear step bumper, radio,
two - tone paint, white/-
red, 11,000 miles, local
owner  $2,200

1970 Ford Ranchero 500 pick-
up, V-8, automatic, pow-
er steering, radio, 1 own-
er, like new  $2,506

1967 Jeep 4-wheel drive Com-
mando convertible with
extra seat, V-8, 3-speed,
and snow plow  $2,000

Financing Arranged

WILLIAM "BILL"

SENTZ

USED CARS
5'2 Miles WeSt n Faii-j, Id

Utor.d Phnle ,149 V:11

at their host school, eat lunch
in the school cafeteria, and

attend a class of their choice.

Later, all the delegates will

convene as a group and hold

discussions concerning t h e

function of the school's Stu-

dent Council, its problems,

projects, and finances. Other

aspects of school life, sir h as

clubs, curriculum, student ad-

visory board, and student con-

cerns will be talked about.
The purpose of the overall

observation will be to relate

back into each school. fres-

and updated thinking and

ideas.
The day chosen for the Ex-

change Program is Wednes-

day, January 12.

Use Classliiea Ads

Berkline

RECLINERS
Rock-A-Loungers

The

All Year Gift

BUY NOW

LINCOLN
FURNITURE MART

Lincoln Square
Gettysburg, Pa.

Home of Quality Mer-
chandize and Sensible
Prices!

• Seton Mass
(Continued From Page One)
A miraculous cure, attribut-

ed to Mother Seton's interces-
sion, has recently been re-
viewed by the Sacred Congre-
gation of Rites in Rome. but
proof of an additional miracle,
ron-Cr or nliroc'es
the ti • her beathleation.
is ilexes canoriz

Mr. and Mrs. Cen -i ' F,.

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Scott, '

Wed., Dec. 22
er, Baltimore, vi=ite,i with Thu

Villa Rest, o-er the Christ- 
Fri., 

Dec. 23.

mas weekend. The Fosters 

Fri Dec. 24

also visited with Mr. and Mrs.
Leo M. Boyle and family, E.
Main St., on Christmas Day.

WEATHER REPORT

Temperatures ana rainfall

for the Emmitsburg District

for the period ending Friday,

Dec. 24, as reported by the U.

S. Weather Service, Mrs. Lu-

cille K. Beale, local observer,

were as follows:
H L Pr.

Sat., Dec. 18  44 22 T

Sun., Dec. 19  35 20 ....

Mon., Dec. 20  45 32 .06

Tues., Dec. 21  56 40 ....

 47 29 ....

 36 13
 53 31

Use Classifieds
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Notice Of Policyholders' Meeting

The regular annual meeting of the 
Policyhold-

ers of The Taneytown Mutual Fire 
Insurance

Company of Carroll County, will be 
held on

Tuesday, Jan. 4, 1972 between the hours
 of 1

and 2 P.M., at the Company's office, 
32 East

Baltimore St., in Taneytown, Md., for 
the fol-

lowing purposes:

(1) To elect the Directors for the year 
1972.

(2) To transact such other business 
as may

properly come before tho meeting or any

adjournment or adjournments thereof.

By order of The Board of Directors

Margaret A. Angell — Assistant Secretary

T & S FACTORY OUTLET

FIRST QUALITY IN MEN'S WEAR

1/i BLOCK FROM CENTER SQUARE — 22 
BALTIMORE ST.

GETTYSBURG, PENNSYLVANIA 
PHONE 717-334-7575

SHIRTS * SLACKS * SUITS * SPORT COATS

TIES * BELTS * FORMALS
AmmommENIII!,

IMMEDIATE JOB OPENINGS IN ALL DEPARTMENTS
AT

FREEM
SHOE

COMPANY
EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND

NO EXPERIENCE NECESSARY

ON-THE-JOB TRAINING AVAILABLE
PRODUCTION DEMANDS REQUIRE ADDING ADDITIONAL PERM

AN-

ENT EMPLOYEES. THIS WILL GIVE YOU THE OPPORTUNITY TO

EARN WHILE YOU LEARN

BENEFITS INCLUDE:
• HIGH STARTING WAGE

• STEADY EMPLOYMENT

• PAID VACATION

• LIFE INSURANCE

• HOSPITALIZATION

• PENSION PLAN

• EXCELLENT WORKING CONDITIONS

COME SEE US - COME JOIN US
Join A Continuous Growing Company Offering A Future

Personnel Office Is Open, Monday Th ru Friday, 7:00 A.M. To 3:30 P.M.

An Equal Opportunity Employer



PAGE EIGHT

LITCHFIELD PARK, Ariz. - Award-winning conserve-
tionalist Raymond E. Keilholtz, Ernmitsburg, Md., is shown
with one of the world's largest tires. The Earthmover tire,
11 1/2 feet tall and weighing 31/2 tons, is an attraction at the
24th annual grand awards tour for winners in the nation-
wide competition among conservation districts, sponsored by
Goodyear Corp. in cooperation wiht the National Association
of Conservation Districts (NACD).

County Ornithological Group Offers
Scholarship To Audubon Nature Camp
A scholarship grant which

may enable a teacher or
youth worker from this area
to receive a free "working va-
cation" at one of the four
beautiful Audubon nature
oamps has been announced by
the Maryland Ornithological
Society.
The grant will cover all ba-

sic costs except travel ex-
pense for two weeks of stu-
dy next summer at one of the
camps operated by the Na-
tional Audubon Society in
Maine, Connecticut, Wisconsin
and Wyoming.
Announcement was made lo-

cally by Robert B. Alexan-
der, president of the Freder-
ick Chapter of the Maryland
Ornithological Society, at the
chapter's annual dinner meet-
ing at the Francis Scott Key
Hotel.
Any teacher or youth work-

er who is 18 or older is elgi-
ble to apply. This includes
Scout and YMCA leaders, or
club officials specializing in
youth work and students who
expect to make nature coun-

seling a part of their adult
career. Applicants do not
need to be members of the
M.O.S.
The $150.00 grants which

have been awarded to 19 peo-
ple since 1959, are called the
"Helen Miller Scholarship" in
honor of a pioneer M.O.S.
member who was instrument-
al in organizing local and
state junior nature programs.
Persons interested in the pro-
gram may receive further in-
formation from Mrs. Allen M.
Clayton, Frederick Chapter
Secretary - Treasurer, at tel.
662-6096 in Frederick, or by
writing Mrs. Clayton at 112-A
West Church Street, Freder-
ick. The deadline for appli-
cations to be received by the
local group is January 20,
1972.
The purpose of the scholar-

ship is to provide intensive
training to youth leaders who
in turn will pass on their
knowledge and appreciation of
nature to young people thru-

out the community.

30% OFF
ALL COATS

IN STOCK
AND

ONE RACK OF

DRESSES
JACK 'N JILL SHOPPE

Chambersburg St. Gettysburg, Pa.

N
9C-3-

r

MAY EACH DAY BE A NEW ROAD

TO HAPPINESS AND SUCCESS.

WEIKERT'S GARAGE

EMMITSBURG CHRONICLE, EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND, THURSDAY, DECEMBER 30, 1971

Rev. Carmen Vignola Ordained Deacon
The Reverend Mr. Carmen

D. Vignola of the Catholic
Diocese of Wilmington was
ordained a Deacon on Sunday,
December 29, in St. Paul's
Church at Fourth and Jackson
Streets in Wilmington. He
received the order of Sub-Dea-
con on Saturday, December
18, in a private ceremony.

Bishop Thomas J. Mardaga,
Bishop of the Diocese, was
the ordaining prelate and
principal concelebrant of the
noon Ordination Mass. Other
concelebrants included: Mon-
signor Paul J. Taggart, vicar
general of the Diocese and
pastor of St. Paul's; the Rev-
erend Clement Lemon, direct-
or of diocesan vocations; the
Reverend Harry Flynn, rector
of Mount Saint Mary's Sem-
inary, Emmitsburg, Md.; and
the Reverend John F. O'Brien,
director of the Catholic Youth
Organization. Master of cere-
monies was Monsignor Paul
J. Schierse.
Mr. Vignola is the son of

Mrs. Ann Siconte Vignola of
West Fourth Street, Wilming-
ton, and the late Carmen D.
Vignola.
He attended St. Paul's

Grade School and Salesianum
High School in Wilmington.
Mr. Vignola received his de-
gree in Philosophy from S't.
Marys' College in Kentucky.
He is currently completing his
studies for the priesthood at
Mount Saint Mary's Semin-
ary in Emmitsburg.
Today deacons receive from

the bishops the authority to
preach the word of God, bap-
tize solemnly, bless marriages,

distribute holy communion, of-
ficiate at funeral and burial
services, and even govern, in
the name of the pastor, or the
bishops, a portion of the
church. Vatican II restored
the diaconate as a permanent
rank in the hierarchy of the
Church. Priests and deacons
share in the bishop's service
to the Christian community.

Completes Busic

Airman Dale E. Hauver, son
of Mr. and Mrs. Raymond C.
Hauver, R2, Thurmont, has
recently completed his U. S.
Air Force basic training at
the Air Training Command's
Lackland AFB, Tex. He is
remaining at Lackland for
training as a security police-
man. Airman Hauver attend-
ed Catoctin High School. His
wife, Diane, is the daughter
of Mrs. Dorothy P. Brown of
R5, Frederick.

HAPPY
HOLIDAYS

YOU ARE OUR KIND OF PEOPLE

AND WE'RE YOUR KIND OF STORE

Plenty of Friendliness, Super Quality,
Savings, and Service

Complete Line Of

HOME FURNISHINGS
BANK - FINANCING

Come In Today-We Want To Meet Everybody

-BEDDING SPECIAL-

MATTRESS & BOX SPRING SETS
Twin Or Full Size

Regular $139.00 Per Set
THIS WEEK $77.42 Per Set

SEE MR. E. GLEN HUPP, Manager

SHEPLEY'S, INC.
Furniture - TV - Appliances

15 Water St. Phone 271-7066 Thurmont

Open: 10a.m.-9 p.m. daily except Sat. 'til 6 p.m.

LOOKING FOR A GOOD USED CAR?"
44.44,
It.:§1,41 SEE OUR ItkE11021/10

GUARAIITEED
;

1971 American Motors Matador 3-Seat Wagon; V-8;
RH&A; P.S.; Air Conditioning; 12,000 Miles.

1971 Rambler Matador 4-Dr., Sdn..; V-8; RH&A; Pow-
er Steering; Air Conditioning; Vinyl Top; 8,000 Mi.

1970 Chevrolet Bel Air 4-Dr. Sdn; RH&A; Viynl Top.
1970 Ford Galaxie 500 4-Dr. Sdn.; R&H; Power Steer-

ing; Automatic; Air Conditioning; 1 Owner.
1970 Chevrolet Impala 4-Dr. Sport Sdn.; V-8; Auto.

Trans.; Power Steering; Air Conditioning; R&H;
Excellent Condition.

1970 Bel Air 4-Dr. Sdn., V-8; Auto. Trans.; Power
Steering; Air Conditioning; R&H; One Owner.

1970 Mercury Montego MX Brougham 4-dr. Sport Sdn.;
V-8; Auto. Trans.; R&H; P.S.; & Air Conditioning.

1970 Ford Fairlane 500 Spt. Cpe.; V-8; RH&A; P.S.
1969 Chevrolet Biscayne V-8; RH&A; P.S.
1969 Ford Ranch Wagon V-8; RH&A; P.S.
1969 Mercury Montego 4-Dr. Sedan; V-9;

Transmission; Power Steering.
1969 Olds Delta 88 Sport Coupe; RH&A; P.S.; 1 Owner.
1969 Ambassador SST Sport Cpe; RH&A; Power Steer-

ing; Pow. Brakes; Air Conditioning; 1 Lady Owner.
1968 Oldsmobile Delmont 88 4-Dr. Sdn.; RH&A; Power

Steering; Power Brakes; 1 Lady Owner.
1968 Chevrolet Station Wagon; R&H; 1 Owner.
1968 Dodge Coronet 440 V-8; Auto. Trans.; Power Steer-

ing; R&H; 4-Dr. Sedan.
1968 Plymouth Satellite Sport Coupe; 6 Cy-1.; Standard

Transmission; R&H.
1968 Ford 4-Dr. Sdn. V-8; Standard Trans.; Air Condi-

tioning; 1 Owner.
1968 Chrysler New Yorker 4-Dr. Sport Sedan; Power

Steering; Excellent Condition.
1967 Mercury Montclair 4-Dr. Sport Sdn.; R&H; Air

Conditioning; Power Steering; 1 Owner.
1967 Chevrolet Bel Air Sta. Wag. V-8; Auto. Trans.;

Power Seering and Air Conditioning.
1967 Mercury Monterey 4-Dr HT.; RH&A; Power

Steering; Air Conditioning; 1 Owner.
1966 Chevrolet Bel Air 4-Dd., V-8; Automatic; Power

Steering.
COMPLETE LINE ALLCAR AUTO PARTS

BATTERIES & TIRES

Automatic

SANDERS GARAGE

..n.010011.09.4.1111rowoorommennonsamoteami

VOUR. FRIENDS FROM

NEWINAMIll
FARCIELD, PA. 17320

• woomileminWOOMNIMMIAmmft

NOTICE
The Potomac Edison Company's

Stores And Offices In Frederick,

Brunswick, Mt. Airy And Taney-

town Will Be Closed Friday, De-

cember 31. We Wish To All Our

Customers A

Happy New Year

For Your Holiday Entertaining
See Our Bar Accessories

Glasses (Stem and Weighted Bottoms)

Bar Tools (Sets and Individual Pieces)

41 Piece Glass Sets - Ice Crushers - Ice Buckets

Ice Tongs - Shakers - Punch Bowl Sets - Coasters

GEO. M. ZEREING
HARDWARE, INC.

GETTYSBURG - LITTLESTOWN

TWO NEW 2 - STAGE
SNOW THROWERS

Powerful * Fast.
International Cadet
265 (5 hp) and 268 (8 hp)

,

Two-stage design-separate stool augers atio power-
ful 4-blade fan-provides high capacity in light heavy,

deep or powder snow. Sett-propelled, 26 inches mile.

Both 265 and 268 clear a valk in t..tyo passes, your
drive in four or live. Four speeds forward. one reverse.
Handle grip controls. Quick starting. (Model 268 avail-
able with electric start.) Very sturdy: from the makers

of Cub,. Cadet tractors.

H O_M E
EQUIPMENT ..CENTER

Div. Farm Equip. Center. Inc..
THURnim29011788 pit

"Where Quality Is First

Holstein Association Cites Hill Herd
A report of milk production

levels attained by dairy cows
in the area has been received
from Holstein-Friesian Asso-
ciation of America. The act-
ual food production output,
recorded in the DHIR pro-
gram, by these local Regis-
tered Holsteins is:

Edrich Ed Mars Jenny
4987624, a ten-year-old, pro-
duced 22,010 lbs. of milk and
771 lbs. of butterfat in 365
days. Hills-Hope Astronaut
Spectate 6749484, a three--

VA counseling to help mi-
nority group veterans use the
CI Bill effectively to buy
homes is being expanded from
two to 11 cities.

year-old, had 16,570 lbs. of
milk and 760 lbs. of butter-
fat in 365 days. Both are in-
cluded in the herd tested for
Mr. and Mrs. James R. Hill,
Emmitsburg.
These new production fir,i

ures may be compared tr.til
estimated annual o
9,388 lbs (4,366 qua /
milk and 345 lbs. of b ( .
fat by the average U. S. dairyll
cow, notes the National Hol-
stein Association.

Production testing is made
available through the cooper- '
ative efforts of the state and
local testing associations and
Holstein - Friesian Association
of America. Dairymen enroll-
ed in the program pay for
the service.

For Complete Auction

Service, Call

Robert Meunier
Auctioneer
Phone 271-2800

7 Radio Lane, Thurmont

DOUGHERTY
& HARTLEY

PRE-

INVENTORY

and

BEFORE MOVING

SALE

100% WOOLS
MACHINE WASHABLE

56" Wide

Reg. 4.98  $2.99 Yd.

Reg. 5.98   $3.59 Yd.

SUEDE CLOTH
52" Wide-100/ Cotton

Reg. 3.98  $2.59 Yd.

BONDED ACRYLICS
MACHINE WASHABLE

Reg. 3.98  $2.69 Yd.
Reg. 4.49   $2.99 Yd.

ALL CORDUROYS
100', Cotton-44/45" Wide

Reg. 2.29  $1.77 Yd.
Reg. 2.79  $1.88 Yd.
Reg. 3.29  $2.69 Yd.
Reg. 3.79  $2.99 Yd.

100% DOUBLE KNIT
POLYESTERS

60" Wide -Machine Washable

Reg. 5.98  $3.59 Yd.
Reg. 6.98  $3.88 Yd.
Reg. 7.98  $4.59 Yd.
Reg. 8.98   $4.88 Yd.

ALL OTHER

FALL-WINTER FABRICS

20% to 1/3 OFF
Authorized Dealer

SINGER SEWING MACHINE
SALES AND SERVICE

DOUGHERTY & HARTLEY
FABRIC CENTER

Your Headquarters For Quality Fabrics"

7 BALTIMORE STREET GETTYSBURG, PA.

If

\i

BLUE RIDGE SUMMIT, PA.

-AUTO SALES & SERVICE-
PHONE 447-6151 FMMITSBURG, MARYLAND Does your heart good just to use one


