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Idleness is emptiness; the

tree in which the sap is
stagnant, remains fruitless,

—Ballou.
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NM COMMUNITY LOCALS _
Mr. 0. A. Horner and Miss Eliz-

&teeth Horner of South Kent, Conn.,
are guests Of the Mi's's Annan.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Wargny and
daughters, Nancy and Patricia, spent
several days at Oberlin, Ohio.

Mr. John Toomey of Rutherford,
N. J., was a Sunday dinner guest of
Mr. and Mrs. Charles R. Arnold.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Fair, York
rings, Pa., were Sunday guests of

Mary Fringe/. and Mr. and Mrs.
Clyde L. Hesson.

Miss Mary Baumgardner of Ipava,
Ill., came last week to spend the
winter in Taneytown with her cousin,
Mrs. Fern Hitchcock.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Wargny and
daughters, Nancy and Patricia, visit-

ed recently in Princeton, N.J., with
MI. and Mrs. Samuel DeCou.

Mr. Arch Carpenter returned to his
haune yesterday (Wed.) after about
two weeks stay in Annie Warner
Hospital, Gettysburg, Pa., for treat-
ment.

Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Hostetter of
Baltimore, Md., announce the birth
of a son, Saturday, October 19th at
the Maryland General Hospital. Mrs.
Hostetter was the former Dorothy
Lookingbill.

Rev. Dr. Frank L. Brown of Col-
umbus, Ohio, and Frank Brown and
son, Larry Brown, of Baltimore were
guests last Thursday of Miss Mary
Fringer and Mr. and Mrs. Clyde L.
}lesson.

Rev. William M. Hendricks, pastor
of the local United Presbyterian
Church has been in Louisville this
week attending the Pan-Presbyterian
Towson and Country Church Convo-
cation.

Mr. and Mrs. George B. Arnold of
Washington, D. C., were week-end
guests of his parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Charles R. Arnold, and attended the
Homecoming at Mt. St. Mary's Col-
lege at Emmitsburg.

The Triple-3 Bridge Club held their
annual Halloween covered dish sup-
per at Big Pipe Creek Park for the
members and their families and
guests. The hostesses were Mrs.
Edith Derr and Miss Mary Fringer.

Mr. and Mrs. Merle Ohler spent the
past week touring the "Fall Foliage
Festival Trail" of West Virginia,
Kentucky. The Great Smokies and
the North Carolina Blue Ridge Park-
way from Asheville to Roanoke, Va.

The regular meeting of the Ki-
Wives -will be held at Taney Inn on
Monday, October 28th. The program
seems to be somewhat a a surprise,
but by the name of one of the en-
tertainers a musical treat is ex-
pected.

Mr. and Mrs. David Miller, Union
Bridge, and Mr. and Mrs. Walter

Hilterbrick of near town spent Sun-

day with Mrs. Helen Miller and Mr.

and Mrs. George Gass and daughters,

Kathleen and Margaret, of Mt. Un-

ion, Penna.

Mrs. Hazel Gluts, who, with her

husband Charles Cluts, enroute to

celebrate the 50th anniversary of
their cousins in South Dakota, was
suddenly stricken ill at the home of
cousins in Franklin Grove, Ill., and
is hospitalized at Rochelle Hospital,
Room 119, Rochelle, Ill.

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 0. Lloyd of
Mayberry have moved to the 86-
acre farm near Manchester, which
they recently purchased from Mr.
and Mrs. Frederick W. Young of
Gettysburg. The sale of the farm
was made by R. L. Zentz, Real Es-
tate Broker of Taneytown.

The Pleasant Inn restaurant and
apartments located between West-
minster and Union Mills was sold
this week by the owners, Mr. and
Mrs. George M. Miller to Mr. Stan-
ley T. Reiker of Hanover, Penna. The
sale was negotiated by the office of
R. L. Zentz, Broker of Taneytown.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert P. Liller of

Taneytown, recently purchased a

bungalow property near Taneytown

from Mr. and Mrs. Paul E. Hum-

bert and plan to move there around

the first of November. The sale of

the property was handled by R. L.

Zentz, Broker of Taneytown.

Callers at the home of Mr. and Mrs.

Roy B. Kiser on Sunday evening were
Rev. Howard W. Miller, pastor and
Mr. George E. Buechner, seminarian,

Gettysburg. Rev. Miller presented
Mrs. Kiser with a Sunday School pin
marking six years perfect attendance.
Miss Nellie Griffin, Mt. Rainier, was
a caller later in the evening.

The Family Night observance held
annually by the Women's Guild of
Grace United Church of Christ will
be held on November 7th at 6:30 P.
M. in the form of a covered dish sup-
per. A fine program has been plan-
ned with Mrs. Ethel Welker as guest
speaker. Every member is urged to
attend and enjoy an evening of
fellowship.

Mr. and Mrs. George A. Sevick,
Sr. of Baltimore have recently pur-
chased the 68-acre farm of the late
Edgar R. Wilhide, near Keymar,
bordering on Big Pipe Creek and
Keysville-Bruceville Rd., and plan ex-
tensive improvements. It is reported
this is the first time this farm has
been sold outside of the Wilhide
family in over 100 years. The sale
of the farm was made by R. L.
Zentz, Broker of Taneytown.

(Continued on Page 5)
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The newly elected officers of the
Taneytown Chapter of Future Busi-
ness Leaders of America were in-
stalled in a formal ceremony held
on Oct. 16. They were installed by
Miss Joyce Morningstar, who attends
Westminster High School and is first
vice president of the state organiza-
tion. Accompanying Miss Morning-
star from Westminster were Miss
Phyllis Myers, Miss Brenda Fogle
and their advisor, Mr. Dennis Bodnar.
The officers installed were: presi-

dent, Frances Flohr; vice president,
Linda Hahn; secretary, Vicki Cutsail;
treasurer, Rosa Liller; reporter, Bon-
nie Wood.
New members of the club were

addressed and accepted into the club
by President Frances Flohr. Other
officers then presented the ideals
which FBLA strives to attain.
On Saturday, October 12, Frances

Flohr, Linda Hahn, Norma Horning
and Linda Gibson attended an execu-
tive meeting held at Dundalk High
School. They were accompanied by
FBLA advisor, Mrs. Catherine Myers.

On Friday, Oct. 25, a Sports Carni-
val is to be held in the high school
auditorium. From 6:30 to 9:30 there
will be activities such as shaving
balloons, dunking teachers and try-
ing to make a basket. There will be
a booth for each activity. At 6:30,
the boys will hold a Beauty Contest
in the cafeteria. For this, some of
the boys will be dressed as girls. It
has been rumored that some of the
boys will even be wearing bathing
suits—girls bathing suits. A dance
will end the carnival; held from 9:30
to 11:30. Highlighting this will be the
announcing of the Sportsman and
Sportswoman of 1963. This carnival,
the first of its kind at THS, is spon-
sored by the Girls' Athletic Associ-
ation (GAA) and the Boys' Athletic
Association (BAA).

The Future Teachers of America
held their first meeting on Wednes-
day, Oct. 16. There were three items
of business on the agenda. They
were: decided to get a new charter,
election of officers, and the plans
for the forthcoming year.
The new officers of FTA for the

1963-64 school year are: president,
Marian Dunham; vice president, Joan
Cassell; secretary, Carol Piezonki;
treasurer, Nancy Stine; and reporter,
Oscar Fogle.
Program plans for the year are

parent visitation day, sixth grade
visitation day, and the visiting of the
elementary school by the club.

Approximately 75 students from
Taneytown High will attend the Bal-
timore Symphony Concert which will
be held Friday, October 25.

Your reporter this week was Janet
Montgomery.

0

CUB PACK BOASTS 22 CUBS

Information from Pack Master
Myron Tracey indicated that Cub
Pack 718 has reached capacity for
the number of adult sponsors. This
worthwhile program is only limited
by the number of mothers and dads
who will take an interest in its sup-
port. If any adults are interested in
working with this pack please con-
tact Mr. Tracey.
Pack 718 wishes to thank all par-

ents who purchased their candy for
making the project a success.
A bake sale is scheduled at the

Firemen's Building Friday, October

25, at 4:30 P. M. The public is in-

vited to patronize this sale. The

proceeds will go for equipment and

general expenses.
The next regular pack meeting is

scheduled for Monday evening at

7:30 P. M., October 28. All parents

of Cubs are invited to attend this

meeting.
0

SACRED MUSICALE

The Graceful Workers Sunday

School Class of Grace United Church

of Christ will present a Sacred Mus-

icale Sunday, October 27, at 7:30

P. M. in the church sanctuary. The

program is as follows:
Vocal solo, Mrs. Laverne Smith;

male chorus, St. Matthew's Lutheran
Church, Hanover, Pa.; piano solo,
Shoko Saito, Western Maryland Col-
lege; choir, Christ United Church of
Christ, Littlestown, Pa.•, baritone
solo, Mr. Bart Norman; clarinet solo,
Mr. Gerald Myers; vocal solo, Mrs.
Fern Hitchcock, Jr.; men's chorus,
Trinity Lutheran Church, Taney-
town; tenor solo, Mr. Harry Loates,
Jr.; organ solo, Mrs. Robert Flick-
inger; high school chorus, Taney-
town; instrumental solo, Mr. Jack
Mummert.

KI-WIVES TO HEAR JEFFERSON

Louis A. Jefferson, Program Sec-
retary for the Carroll County YMCA,
will be the guest speaker at the next
regular Dinner Meeting of the Ki-
Wives of Taneytown. The meeting

will be held at the Taney Inn in
Taneytown at 6:30 P. M., October 28.

Mr. Jefferson will speak on the
YMCA and the work that the "Y"

is doing in Carroll County.
 0

BACK TO STANDARD TIME,

SUNDAY, OCTOBER 27, 2 A. M.

TURN YOUR CLOCK BACK

ONE HOUR.

UNION BRIDGE LUTHERANS
TO LAY CORNER STONE

The corner stone of the new Edu-
cational Building, which is being

added to St. James' Lutheran Church,

Union Bridge, will be laid Sunday
afternoon, Oct. 27. The stone will

be laid during a special service held

on the building site, beginning at
2:30 P. M.
The Rev. Elwood S. Falkenstein,

Pastor of Grace Lutheran Church,

Westminster, and Dean of the West-
minster District of The Maryland
Synod of the Lutheran Church in
America, will be the guest speaker.
Items to be placed in the corner

stone are as follows: Bulletins from

the Services of Ground Breaking and
Corner Stone Laying and copy of
Church Newsletter announcing plans

to build, by Mrs. Lon Edwards; a

copy of the Union Bridge newspaper,
"The Pilot," dated Oct. 24, 1963, by
Mr. Wilbur Fowble; a History of the
Congregation, by Mrs. Walter Houck;
a copy of the Constitution and By-
Laws of the Congregation, by Mrs.
Earl Bloom; copies of Sunday School
materials used in various Children's
Departments, by Kevin Houck, Karen
Garber, Sharon Brake, Lamora Otto,
Martha Fritz, Eddie Stulte.
Also Sunday School materials used

in Adult Department, by Mrs. R.
Stoner Welty; a list of Children in
the Cradle Roll, by Mrs. Herbert
Kennedy; Roll of Sunday School
members, by Mrs. E. T. Winger; Roll
of Church members, by Mr. Charles
Fowble; copies of the October issue
of The Maryland Synod News, The
Lutheran magazine, and the Pro-
ceedings of the Second Convention
of the Maryland Synod, May 1963,
by Mr. R. Stoner Welty; copy of the
promotional booklet and pledge card,
by Mr. Clarence Otto; copy of choir
music sung at Service by combined
Youth and Adult Choirs, by Miss
Marcia Edwards; photographs of
Church before new construction, by
Mrs. Clarence Otto; copies of Luth-
er's Small Catechism, The 1963 Year-
book of the Lutheran Church in
America, and The Common Service
Book, by Pastor Brake.

MEETING OF LIONS CLUB

The Taneytown Lions Club met
Tuesday evening, Oct. 22, at 6:29.
The main item fo the evening was
the "Medicare Program" set up by
the Program Chairman, Dr. Paul
Roxin.
Norman Huth, of the A. H. Rob-

ins Pharmaceutical Co., spoke on
medicine as it is related to people.
This is one of the main battle fronts
in our day," he stated, "and this bat-
tle is being fought in the aspect of
research and free enterprise." We
must have medicine free from gov-
ernment controls to have the best
medicine and best medical care. The
speaker intimated that we can have
the best medicine and the best medi-
cal care only under the system of
free enterpris.

Three visitors from Glade Valley
Club were introduced.
A whele chair was purchased to

be used by people of the community
whenever needed.

Chamber of Commerce
Meeting

The Taneytown Chamber of Com-

merce met in regular session on Mon-

day evening at Taney Inn with vice-

president Merle S. Ohler, presiding.

Following the dinner, business

was conducted. Additional plans were

made for the Annual Banquet to be

held Thursday, November 21, in the

Taneytown H. S. Auditorium. All

dues for the coming year must be

paid by November 15, in order for
reservations for the dinner.

There will be no meeting of the
Chamber in November on account of

the Banquet — the next meeting will

be held December 23rd.

PRESBYTERIANS TO
CELEBRATE ANNIVERSARY

Next month the United Presbyter-

ian Church on York Street will ob-

serve the 135th Anniversary of the

organizing of the congregation and

the 80th Anniversary of the building

of the church.
The principal observance will be

the Anniversary Worship on Sunday,

November 17, at 10:30 A. M. The

guest preacher will be the Rev. Fred

M. Webber, General Presbyter of the

Presbytery of Baltimore. All friends

and former members are cordially

invited.
A congregational dinner will be

held on Thursday, November 14.

McINTIRE REAPPOINTED TO
CRIMINAL CODE COMMITTEE

T. Bryan McIntire, State's Attor-

ney for Carroll County, has recently

been reappointed to serve a second

year on the Criminal Code Commit-

tee of the Maryland State Bar As-

sociation.
The Committee is undertaking the

comprehensive revision and reorgan-

ization of Article 27, the Criminal

section of the Maryland Code. Mary-

land's Criminal Laws last underwent

complete revision in 1809.
Others serving on the Committee

with McIntire are William J. O'Don-

nell, State's Attorney for Baltimore
City; John M. Brumbaugh, Professor

of Criminal Law at the University

of Maryland; The Honorable God-

frey Child, Judge of the Circuit Court

for Worcester County; Franklin B.

Olmstead, La Plata; Ambrose T.

Hartman, Baltimore City; Douglas

G. Bottom, Towson; Leonard T.

Kardy, Silver Spring; Thomas J.

Kenney, Baltimore City; Alan H.

Murrell, Baltimore City, and Ben-

jamin B. Rosenstock of Frederick,

who is Chairman of the Committee.

Commenting on the Committee,

McIntire said, "I find it a real pleas-

ure to work with men so dedicated

to improving our laws. Our Com-

mittee meets monthly for general

study and discussion, and at the end

of every meeting each member is

assigned a portion of the Code to

review and make recommended

changes at the following meeting.

It is anticipated that the revised

Code will be presented to the Gen-

eral Assembly in January 1965,"

Civil War Memorial Marker Unveiled
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An event of unusual interest to the community of 
Taneytown took

place Sunday afternoon, October 20, when a plaque was unv
eiled to com-

memorate the encampment of General
 George G. Meade on the former

Benjamin Shunk farm near town. The program was arranged by the

Federation of Republican Women, Mrs.
 Virginia Sanders chairman of the

Committee. The program opened with 
the invocation by the Rev. Howard

Miller of the local Lutheran Church. This church played an important

part as signals were sent from its to
wer on that night of July 1, 1863.

The marker was donated to the commu
nity by Mr. Harold Manakee,

Director of the Maryland Historical Society,
 and presentation was spon-

sored by the Carroll County Historical Society. The president of that

Society, Mr. James Shriver, was present a
s well as other members of the

Society and the towns people.
Mr. Neal Powell, member of the Town Counc

il, was master of cere-

monies. Charles D. Fisher, attorney of Westminster, was the speaker,

and also, in the absence of Mr. Manakee, prese
nted the marker to the

town; which was accepted by the Ma
yor, Raymond Perry. Mr. Fisher

gave the historical in a most informative and interesting speech. He

gave the reasons for the marker, that the 
very important decision was

made on this spot that the battle should be 
fought at Gettysburg instead

of along Pipe Creek as had been made origi
nally.

The marker was unveiled by Robert and 
Richard Reindollar, sons of

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Reindollar and great-great-grandsons of the Rev.

Levi T. Williams, Pastor of the Lutheran Church at 
that time.

The cloth that covered the marker was one u
sed in the Civil War

period in the Keysville area and loaned by Miss Lois B
rown,, great grand-

daughter of the owner.
The Taneytown High School Band, ably conducted by Mr. Gerald

Myers, played inspiringly a medley of Civil War tunes
. The program was

closed with the benediction by the Rev. Miller and selec
tions by the band.

MEETING OF
TANEYTOWN LIONS CLUB

Mr. Norman Huth, a representa-

tive of the A. H. Robbins Pharma-

ceutical Firm, addressed the Taney-

town Lions Club at their regular

Dinner Meeting session held at Taney

Inn. Mr. Huth spoke on the topic

Medicare choosing as his subject

"Today's Medical Battlefronts."
Lion Dr. Paul Roxin was in charge

of the evenings program. Lion Del-

mar Riffle furnished organ music

during the dinner. Lion Dr. Frank

Wargny announced the Club has pur-

chased a wheelchair which may be

used by anyone needing it in the

community. The purchase of another

hospital bed, walker and wheelchair

are in process.
The Club recently underwrote the

cost of transporting two bus loads

(90 boys) of Little League Baseball

Teams to an Oriole Baseball Game.

They have also: purchased glasses

for two Sight Conservatees, under
-

wrote the cost of a new flag and

staff for the Taneytown Jr.-Sr. Hig
h

School Color Guard, made a dona-

tion to the newly formed Brownie

troops in Taneytown and a dona-

tion to the United Fund Appeal.

Lion Dlemont Koons, Tail Twister,

as usual relieved many of the m
em-

bers from their loose change by 
his

unique manner of Fine Collecting.

An official visitation from Glade

Valley Club was present.

LCW DISTRICT SESSION HELD

IN SILVER RUN

Following delicious dinner served

by the women of St. Matthew's

Church, Pleasant Valley, and f
rom

St. Mary's the session of the 
West-

minster District Assembly began.

Mrs. Albert Fischer, synodical

president of the Lutheran Church

Women, spoke to 151 women, 
plus

the six synodical officers.

The theme for the session was

"Learning Is Changing—Changing

Is Learning." The devotional ser
vice

was in charge of Mrs. Stanley Jen
-

nings, Taneytown, followed by a vo
-

cal solo by Mrs. Clifford Miller, Jr.
,

Manchester, accompanied by Mrs.

Robert Spangler, Silver Run.
Greetings were extended by Mrs.

Jacob Hess, president of the St.

Mary's LCW. Mrs. Elwood Baum-

gardner, who serves as chairman of-

the district, presided over the bus-

iness session and reports.
Mrs. Royal Clagett had charge of

the buzz session with the following

women participating: Mrs. Carl Mc-

Cullough, Mrs. Wm. Hopkins, Mrs.

E. Gregg Kiser, Mrs. Wm. Markley,

Mrs. Clifford Miller, Mrs. Howard

Miller, Mrs. Louis Scharon, Mrs.

Clyde Wilhide.
A won -shop, conducted by the sy-

nodical officers, provided the train-

ing for the new program. Reporting

on their respective offices were:

program, Mrs. G. Paul Lottich;

leadership-membership, Mrs. Clarence

Price; chiistian responsibility, Mrs.

Geo. Whetstone; finance, Mrs. Oren

Strine; administration, synodical

president, Mrs. Albert Fischer and

congregation organization, Mrs.

Claude Barrick. Mrs. Philip Schaeffer

explained the interesting displays

that were exhibited.
The host pastor, the Rev. Roland

Ries, pronounced the benediction.

TWENTY-FIFTH ANNIVERSARY

A surprise twenty-fifth wedding

anniversary celebration in honor of

Mr. and Mrs. Reno Haines was held

on Sunday, October 20, at their home,

by their daughter, Miss Sally Haines.

Those present for the occasion

were Mrs. Carrie B. Crouse, Mr. and

Mrs. Gibbert Reitz and Gibbert, Jr.,

and Garry, Westminster; Sgt. and

Mrs. Joseph A. aosebrock, Jeffrey,

Joey, Perry and Betty Jane; Mrs.

Nora Grimes, Mr. Darryl Fleagle,

Frederick; Mr. and Mrs. Richard

Crouse, Richard, Jr., Cheryl and

Charles, of Rockville; Mr. and Mrs.

Horace S. German and Jody, Mrs.

Rebecca Williams, Mr. and Mrs.

Charles W. Crouse, Carrie and Fred;

Mr. and Mrs. John Daneker, Balti-

more; Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Bowman,

Mr. and Mrs. David Bowers, Middle-

burg; Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Welty,

Hampstead; Miss Mary Fabian, Hag-

erstown; Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Rif-

fle, Gettysburg, Pa.; Mr. and Mrs.

Richard Dougherty, LaPlata; Miss

Dana Spence, Germantown; Mr. and

Mrs. Carl Haines, Mr. and Mrs. Rus-

sell / Hai
nes and Clarence, Mr. and

Mrs. Kenneth Dougherty, Mr. and

Mrs. Fern Haines, Eleanor, Richard,
Jimmy, Doris Ann and Glenn; Mrs.
Margaret Angell, Mr. and Mrs. Clar-

ence Motter, Miss Sandra Baker and

Miss Marian Vaughn, Taneytown.
Delicious refreshments were serv-

ed, followed by the opening of many

lovely gifts by the honored couple.

ENGAGEMENT

Mrs. Mable Petry announces the en-

gagement of her daughter, Linda Sue,
to William Andrew Botsch, Jr., Taney-

town, son of the late William Andrew

Botsch, Sr., and of Mrs. Jessie Canapp

of Baltimore.
Miss Petry is a student of West-

minster High School. Mr. Botsch is

employed by Fuller Brush Co. Miss

Petry is also employed at the Twin

Kiss, Westminster.

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Members of the Youth Choir

(grades 9, 10, 11, 12) of Trinity

Lutheran Church are asked to report

to the church this evening (Thurs-

day) promptly at 6:30 in order to

be measured for choir gowns
Members' of the Junior Choir

(grades 4, 5, 6, 7, 8) ,are asked to

report this evening (Thursday)

promptly at 7 to be measured.

'SPICE 'N' EVERYTHING NICE"

With all my heart, I wish you every
morning

A smile that shall last until the next day's
dawning.

I wish you health—life's greatest wealth;
I wish you always near so that I may hap

to cheer
Each future day and in some way—help to

bring you happiness!

Walking up Charles Street, I went
into the old home of the Jenkins
which is all being renovated by the
new owner, Mr. Gladding which is on
the S. W. Corner of Mt. Vernon Place
and Charles Street. Hoeses are not
built like it today and as I walked
around the entire place in each room
realized just that The wide entrance
hall with the handsome winding stair-
way is beautiful! As I walked slowly
up this stairway, I somehow was
turning back the pages of a book and
with my imagination, it is something
to remember. How fortunate Balti-
moreans are that a buyer purchased
it for a home and especially in that
neighborhood where the cream of So-
ciety lived of yesteryear. I went
through the huge rooms on the sec-
ond floor and there are three baths
plus a powder room, plus a foot bath
in one of the bathrooms. As I walked
slowly down the stairway, I pretend-
ed that I lived there years ago and
there was such fascination about it
all beyond describing! Years ago,

there were the draped walls as one
of those draperies still hung with all
the dust clinging to it. I observed a
few pieces of very old furniture which
was left right there and those pieces
are handsome. There are many work-
men and from all I gathered, it ap-
peared as though it would take a full
year to complete the entire job for
there is so much to do. I was wonder-
ing as I stood in that tremendous
living room how many servants has
been kept in that household? There is,
a huge back enclosed porch facing the
old carriage house which, no doubt
will be made into a garage. There
are still some draperies at the win-
dows! Of course, the bathtubs are the
old fashioned ones with feet but I
always liked a big bath tub and that
all of those are. There was something
of tranquility in that wonderful home
which no adjective could describe! I
am one of the thousands who are
awaiting with much anticipation when
all this beauty is restored!

Happiness was the word for every-
one in Annapolis the other day as
parents and wives looked upon some
being handed the Diplomas passing
the Bar examination. One of the sons
was mine and one belonged to Mayor
and Mrs. Theodore McKeldin! Of
course we shook hands congratulat-
ing each other as parents! The day
was ideal and that little town was as
dear to me as ever as I spent many
happy hours there for years each
week as my family — my father's
side of the house were stationed in
the Naval Academy. I love even
those brick pavements and the Co-
lonial architecture of the old homes.
It has not changed much all down
through the years. The younger gen-

eration now live in Baltimore and Los
Angeles with only one daughter re-
maining in the Capitol.
The hundreds of pumpkins along

the highway this time of the year with
that vivid yellow always brings a
thought of pumpkin pie. When you
make yours, Mrs. Housewife be sure
this time to add less pumpkin and it
will be more like a "Chiffon Pump-
kin" and you will enjoy it much more
as naturally it will be of lighter tex-

ture.
That grand Oldsmobile is still my

favorite — the only car as to the
engine getting sweeter the more mi-
leage that it drives. It makes some
think that it is purring! No other car
can compare and if you are thinking
of purchasing a car just wait a little
longer until you can go "OLDS" all
the way. You will never purchase an-
other make when. once you own an
"0 L D S!"

Will be seeing you next week D. V.
Have a grand week-end: Enjoy all
this beauty while you can, no matter
from the old front porch or as you
slowly drive along. Until then.

I am,
Faithfully,

YOUR OBSERVER

SILVER FANCY GARDEN CLUB

The Garden Club held its monthly

meeting October 17th at the home of
Mrs. F. M. Butler, Taneytown, Md.
The president, Mrs. A. Eyster, pre-
sided. Following the business agenda,
Mrs. Eyster reported on the Carroll
County Garden Club's Dried Flower

Arranging Class which was held in
Westminster on October 10th. A brief
sketch of the Third Symposium pro-
gram of the Federated Garden Clubs
of Maryland, which was held at the
Baltimore Museum of Art, October
15th and 16th, was given by Mrs.
Koswick. Mrs. Green described some
of the floral arrangements made by
Mr. Rang at the annual meeting of
District V on October 4 at the Foun-
tain Head Country Club, Hagerstown,
Md. Mrs. Eyster reported that mem-
bers of the auxiliary of Annie M.
Warner Hospital will hold a bazaar
at the hospital on November 8th,
Gettysburg, Pa. There will be many
useful and unique articles for sale. It
was also noted that the YWCA Han-
over Garden Club will exhibit Christ-
mas arrangements and decorations on
November 19th, Hanover, Penna.
The Club proposed to send two bu-

shels of apples to the Victor Cullen
Hospital, Sabillasville, Md., foi
Thanksgiving. It was also decidec
that we would again make special

door decorations for each patient for
the Christmas holidays.
At the close of the meeting Mrs.

Butler and co-hostess, Mrs. Mac-

Pherson served delicious refresh-
ments. The next meeting will he held

on November 21st at the home of

Mrs. H. MacPherson, Taneytown,

Masyland,
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THURSDAY, OCTOBER 24, 1963

BIG QUESTION

A tax reduction bill has passed the
House. It will meet tougher going in
the Senate. But the chances are that
an overall federal tax cut in the $10
billion-plus area is in sight.
Welcome as that may be, some ex-

tremely important questions are yet
to be answered.
One is whether major tax reduction

which is not accompanied by any re-
duction in government spending will
lead to more inflation. Many a recog-
nized economist thinks it will — then
the decline in the dollar's value here
and abroad will more than offset any
benefits.
Another is whether the spiraling

costs of state and local government
will eat up any dollar gains from fed-
eral cuts, aside from the inflation
problem. These costs, proportionately.
have been rising faster than federal
costs in late years. If one tax col-
lector takes from you what another
tax collector leaves, you aren't gain-
ing.
The interest of the citizen lies in

how many dollars he has left after
taxes, and in what those dollars will
buy in the way of goods and services.
That is the big unanswered question.

—Industrial News Service

FACTS AND OPINIONS

"Something we have suspected for
a long time has been verified at last.
The use of the term 'senior citizen'
as applied to retired elderly persons
is 'loathed' by every one of a number
of retirees recently interviewed by a
Los Angeles research firm. The
terms 'old' and 'elderly' are perfectly
good words and, with the backing of
the Goodkin Research Corporation,
it would seem the person who succes-
sfully has navigated a large number
of years cannot abide the condescend-
ing appellation foisted on them by
'modern-minded' younger folks who
seem to have no concept of how ful-
filling it can be to reach a ripe, old
age."—Grants Pass, Oregon, Courier:

Five kinds of drugs orbited the
earth with Astronaut Cooper on his
famous flight into outer space. They
included a stimulant to increase alert-
ness; a relaxant; a pain killer; an an-
tinauseant; and an antihistamine.

Barron's magazine recently ob-
served: "According to the folklore of
politics, successful office-seekers
boast a happy knack of staying in
step with, or slightly ahead of, their
constituents' views. However, on one
major issue of the day—wasteful
federal spending—Congress seems to
be lagging perilously behind public
opinion. To the astonished chagrin of
such agencies as the Area Redevelop-
ment and Urban Renewal Adminis-
trations, several communities lately
have elected to reject government
handouts." Its editorial went on to
deal with the increase in appropri-
ations for the Rural Electrification
_Administration, in the face of the
fact that some .98 per cent of all
American farms are now electrified.
Barron's holds that the REA" . . . .
has become a positive menace to
free enterprise," and concludes,
"Sooner or later the lawmakers must
realize that the time has come to
throw the switch."

There has been a sharp increase in
the number of physicians per 100,000
population in this country, according
to an American Medical Association
report. The present ratio is 146.7
physicians for every 100,000 Amer-
icans, an increase of 8.9 from the
1960 figure, and of 11.4 from the 1950
ratio. Our physician population, as
of a recent date, was 275,974.

PROPJSED

Ordinance No. 4
COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF CARROLL COUNTY

(FOR ADOPTING A FISCAL YEAR, TAXABLE YEAR,
DATES OF FINALITY, PROVIDING FOR A FRACTIONAL LEVY,
LEVY, DATE OF LEVY, DUE DATE AND OVERDUE DATE FOR
TAXES, DISCOUNTS, PENALTIES, TAX SALES AND PROVIS-
IONS FOR TRANSITION PERIOD.)

WHEREAS, by Chapter 825 of the Laws of Maryland, passed
and enacted at the 1963 Session of the General Assembly, eachcounty, incorporated city, town or taxing district within the Stateof Maryland, is required, on or before June 30, 1966, to adopt asits period for recording and reporting all of its fiscal transactions,the fiscal year defined in Section 2 (20a) and 29A of Article 81of the Annotated Code of Maryland, as amended; and

WHEREAS, Carroll County is presently operating on a cal-endar year ending December 31st, requiring a transition period toaccomplish the change to the uniform fiscal year provided in Chap-ter 825, aforesaid, which would commence on July 1 of each yearand end on June 30 of each year; and
WHEREAS, it is necessary for Carroll County to make pro-vision concerning the Fiscal Year, Taxable Year, Date of Finality,Levy, Date of Levy, and the Due Date and Overdue Date for Taxes

in order for Carroll County to be in conformity with the provisionsof Chapter 825 aforesaid; and
WHEREAS, the County Commissioners of Carroll County havedeemed it desirable to immediately comply with the provisions ofChapter 825 aforesaid, and have adopted the Fiscal Year, as definedtherein, beginning July 1, 1964
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNTYCOMMISSIONERS OF CARROLL COUNTY, that pursuant to thepower and authority contained in Chapter 825 aforesaid, the follow-ing proposed ordinance is submitted for adoption:
Section 1. (a) That beginning July 1, 1964, the Fiscal Yearfor Carroll County shall be the period commencing July 1st in eachyear and ending June 30 following.
Section 1. (b) That beginning July 1, 1964, the Taxable Year .shall be the period commencing July 1 of each year and ending onJune 30 following.
Section 1. (c) That from and after July 1, 1964, the date offinality is January 1 and the semi-annual date of finality is July 1of each year.
Section 2. (a) For the taxable period commencing January 1,1964, and ending June 30, 1964, the County Commissioners ofCarroll County will make a fractional levy on real property fromthe records of assessments of the Supervisor of Assessments forCarroll County, as provided by existing law; personal propertytaxes for this six month transitional period will be levied from theassessments made by the Supervisor of Assessments for CarrollCounty for the year 1963; corporation taxes and other assessmentscertified by the State Department of Assessments and Taxationshall be based upon certifications for the year 1963 for the purposeof the transitional period.
Section 2. (b) For the taxable period commencing July 1 ofeach year and ending on June 30 following, from and after July 1,1964, the County Commissioners of Carroll County will make a levyon real property and personal property from the records of assess-ments of the Supervisor of Assessments for Carroll County, asprovided by existing law; corporation taxes and other assessmentscertified by the State Department of Assessments and Taxationshall be based upon certifications as provided by existing law.Section 2. (c) The County Commissioners shall make the taxlevy not later than the first Tuesday of April of each year.Section 3. (a) For the taxable period commencing January 1,1964, and ending June 30,' 1964, all taxes shall be due and payableJanuary 1, 1964, and will bear interest beginning July 1, 1964, atthe rate of %e/c per month or fraction thereof until paid.Section 3. (b) The following discounts will be allowed ontaxes for the taxable period commencing January 1, 1964, andending June 30, 1964:

2% on payments made on or before April 30, 19641'; on payments made during May, 1964
Section 4. (a) From and after July 1, 1964, all taxes for thetaxable year commencing July 1 and ending June 30 in each year,shall be due and payable on July 1 of the year in which levied, andwill bear interest beginning October 1 at the rate of %"4 per monthor fraction thereof until paid.
Section 4. (b) The following discounts will be allowed on taxesfor the taxable year commencing July 1 of the year in which leviedand ending June 30 following:

2% on payments made on or before July 31
117, on payments made during August

Section 5. (a) Tax sales of all property on which taxes areunpaid at the end of the transitional period (Juno 30, 1964) shallbe made together with and at the time of tax sales on all propertyon which taxes have not been paid for the taxable year endingJune 30, 1965, or as may be otherwise or further permitted byapplicable provisions of the law at that time. The tax sale provisionherein contained shall, be in concurrence with and in addition toany other proper collection methods that may exist.
AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that this Ordinance beand is hereby approved this 14th day of October, 1963.

COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF CARROLL COUNTY.

HORACE S. BRAUNING, President,Attest:
PAUL C. BONSACK, Clerk.

NOTICE OF HEARING
A public hearing will be held by the County Commissionersof Carroll County on TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 12, 1963, AT 3:00P. M. in the County Office Building, Westminster, Md., on theabove proposed ordinance No. 4 relative to adopting a fiscal year,taxable year, dates of finality, providing a fractional levy, levy,date of levy, due date and overddue date for taxes discounts,penalties, tax sales and provisions for transition period.
Any person may appear before the Board on the above dateand time and enter objections, if any they may have, to the adoptionof the proposed ordinance.

HORACE S. BRAUNING, President.

10-17-4t

to dear to a bride's heart.-

The

nower

Wedding

Line

\ Invitations

Good taste needn't be expensive. Our beautiful Flower
Wedding Line proves this with the most exquisite papers.
.ype faces and workmanship you could wish for! It
features Heliogravings— rich raised lettering—elegant
as the finest craftsmanship—yet costing so little! Como
see our unusual selection.
•Heliograving—not Co be confused with angratins.

One to two weeks delivery!

The Carroll Record Company, Inc.
DIAL PL 6-6600 Taneytown, Md.
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This is to give notice that the sub-12 Illall=11 11111
scribers have obtained from the Or- ,
phans' Court of Carroll County, in
Maryland, letters Testamentary on
the personal estate of

ALVIN J. IRVIN,
late of Carroll County, deceased. All
persons having claims against the
deceased are warned to exhibit the
same with the vouchers thereof, legal-
ly authenticated, to the subscribers,
on or before the 12th day of May,
next; they may otherwise by law be
excluded from all benefits of said
estate.
Given under our hands this 26th

day of September, 1963.
Alvin J. Irvin, Jr.,
Charles R. Irvin,

Executors.
10-3-5t

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
This is to give notice that the sub•

scriber has obtained from the Or-
phans Court of Carroll County, in
Maryland, letters of Administration
on the personal estate of

BELVA KOONS,
late of Carroll County, deceased. All
persons having claims against the
deceased are warned to exhibit the
same with the vouchers thereof, leg-
ally authenticated, to the subscriber,
on or before the 17th day of May,
next; they may otherwise by law be
excluded from all benefits of said es-
tate.

Given under my hand this 8th day
of October, 1963.

ALMA R. BAIR,
Administratrix.

Bax.514, Taneytown, Md.
10-10-5t

TURKEYS and CAPONS

For Sale

ALIVE OR DRESSED

WILL DELIVER

FERN HAINES
TANEYTOWN, MD.
PHONE: PL 6-6781

9-19-tf

Easily Arranged...

HOME
MORTGAGE

and
CONSTRUCTION
LOANS

AUGUSTA
Bvilding and Loan Ass'n.

Westminster: Shopping Center
Main Office: 410 N. Howard St.

Dundalk: 7 Center Place
Baltimore: 420 N. Howard St.

Dundalk: 7 Center Place
Annapolis: 6 West Street

PUBLIC SALE

1

OF VALUABLE REAL ESTATE
WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 30, 1963

AT 1 O'CLOCK P. M.
This farm of 131 acres, more

District of St. Mary's County,
Charolette Hall to Bud's Creek,
Route 5.

or less, located in the 5th Election
Md., on the road leading from
about one-half mile Southeast of

About sixty acres under cultivation, 20 acres of pasture, balancewoods. Frame house, 12 rooms, two half baths; water in all build-ings; large bank barn, two tobacco barns, 15x20 rooms, silo, twohen houses, hog house, tenant house, 5 rooms and basement; allmetal roofs.
Terms of Real Estate: 10% cash on day of sale, balance when

• 
w full settlement is made.

•
•

11161111=111111111111111,1111MIMIG11111011011111111111111111=11111.11111=0111111

GUSS SHANK, Auct.

AMOSS L. STOLTZFLN,
Owner.

Mechanicsville, Md.
10-17-2t

For over 30 years
S. H. TEVIS & SON

has supplied Taneytown
with complete heating comfort
It has been our special privilege to provide an adequate, depend-
able supply of Gulf Solar Heat® — the world's finest heating oil —
to our friends and neighbors for many years. As a result, our cus-
tomers look to us with confidence for all
of their heating comfort requirements. We
are taking this opportunity to thank each
of you for your valued business. We prom-
ise to continue to supply you with the most
modern and economical home heating serv-
ice available in this area.

If you are not already enjoying the many
extra advantages of using Gulf Solar Heat
and our complete heating services, call us
today. heating oil

S. H. TEVIS & SON
WESTMINSTER, MD. PHONE 848-4433

Choose from 17 Falcon
body styles including
smart convertibles.

•

'64 Falcons arrive in
Taneytown

with a brand-new look...a
brand-new ride...and the
same grand old economy!

'64 Falcon Futura Hardtop Power steering, air conditioning, optional.

'64 Falcon Wagon. Choice of 3 transmissions. Bus.type wagons, too!

Beautiful new big-car
look. New wider tread,
improved suspension—
plushest ride any com-
pact ever had. Falcon's
famous ruggedness,
response, road sense...
honed to perfection in
races, rallies, economy
runs. Come see what
total performance does
for America's All-Time
Economy Champ!

F.D. A F

WY TOTAL PERRIRIVANE '84[9=fORD DMIERY:
OROUSE MOTOR SALESPhone PL 6 6655 

TANEYTOWN,MD.
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Cut Flowers, Designs
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CURRENT EVENTS
FIFTY YEARS AGO

The touch of winter, this week, was
admonitory that it is time to get
through house cleaning, and prepare

the stoves and fuel for winter com-
fort. The storm and hail of Monday

was likely the extreme edge of the
big storm that did so much damage
on the Eastern Shore.
The Frederick Fair was well pat-

ronized from Taneytown on Thursday.
George W. Clabaugh, Jr., of Om-

aha, who came East to attend his

mother's funeral, spent a portion of

the week here after visiting his

brother, Judge Clabaugh in Washing-

ton. Mrs. Clabaugh, who has been

here for some time, and who has been

unwell, is improving in health.
On Oct. 18, Mrs. James Weishaar

received the news of the death of her

only brother, John W. Picking of

Toledo, Ohio, formerly of Taneytown

district. He was employed as night

watchman of an excelsior plant which

caught fire and burnt down and he

was caught in the flames. His widow,

who was Miss Mary Angell, three

sons and two daughters, survive him.

He was in his 82nd year.
New Industry in Operation. The

most important new enterprise that

has commenced operations for years

in Taneytown is the Milk Condensing

and Ice Plant, constructed and now

being operated by the Hanover

Creamery Co. of Hanover, Pa. Man-

ager H. M. Stokes has been operating

a small milk separating station here

for a number of years and saw that

this was a first-class point for a much

larger business. The main business

will be the manufacture of condensed

milk. A large amount of ice will be
needed for the business itself, but

local demand to the extent of three

tons a day can be supplied.
Judge William H. Thomas drew the

jurors for the November term of the
Circuit Court for this county on

Monday. The list by districts is as
follows: Taneytown—David M. Meh-

ring, Levi D. Reid, David F. Eyler

and William H. Bowers; Uniontown—
Calvin G. Sloneker, Clinton E. Fogle-
song, Harry C. Hull and Frank M.
Snader. . . .

TANEYTOWN ORGANIZATIONS
Tanettown Chamber of Commerce meets

on the 3rd Monday in each month at
the Taney Inn at 8:00 o'clock. Frank
Dunham, President; 1st Vice President,
Merle Ohler; 2nd Vice President. Rob.
art 7..entz; Secretary, Donald Smith;
Treasurer, Murray M. Baumgardner;
Executive Committee, Merwyn C. Fuss
and Charles It. Arnold.

The Taneytown Vol. Fire Company meets
2nd Monday of each month in the
Firemen's Building from April thru
Sept. at 8:00 p. in. and October thru
March at 7:30 p. m.; President, John
Perry; Vice President. Howard Welty;
Secretary, J. Wendell Garber; Finan-
cial Secretary, Harry Dougherty, Jr.;
Treasurer, Stanley King; Trustees
Birnie Staley, Norville Welty, Meredith
Gross, Charles Lookingbill and Ken-
neth Houck; Chief, Wilbur F. Miller, Jr.

The American Legion — Hesson-Snider
Post No. 120 meets third Thursday of
each month at 8:00 P. M. in the Legion
Home. All service men welcomed.
Commander, Paul Rodkey; Adjutant
Clarence Horner; Finance (Officer, Stan-
ley King; Service Officer, Neal Powell.
You are eligible to belong to The
American Legion if you served honor-
ably in the Military Forces at any
time during one of these three periods:
April 8, 1917, to Nov. 11, 1918; or Dec.
7. 1941, to Sept. 2. 1945; or June 25,
1950, to July 27, 1953.

Monocacy Valley Memorial Post 6918, Har-
ney, Md., meets on 1st and 3rd Tues-
day of each month in the V.F.W. Hall,
Harney, Md. Commander, Kenneth
McKinney; Adjutant, Robert Reck;
Quartermaster, Raymond Clayba ugh.

The Taneytown Junior Chamber of Com-
merce. Taneytown. Md., meets the
second Thursday of each month at
The Raft Restaurant. President, Dean

Nusbaum; First. Vice President, Robert

Bowers: 0.na Vice President, John

Reever; Secretary, George Fream;

Treasurer, Dean Brown.
_

Hesson-Saider Unit 120, American Legion

Auxiliary meets the first Thursday of
each month at 8 p. m., at the Post

Home, Pres., Bernice Rodkey; 1st Vice

Pres., Catherine Shank; 2nd Vice
Pres., Betty Jane Houck; Sec., Lois

Wksel; Treasurer, Mae Long; His-

torian, Irene Unger; Sergeant at Arms.

Margaret Ritenour; Color Bearers,
Catherine Myers and Marie Ott; Chap-
lin, Regina Foreman.

  Volunteer Fire Company meets
2nd and 4th Monday of each month in
the Firemen's Building at 7:30 P. M.
President, Fred Spangler; Vice Presi-
dent, Wilbur Reifsnider; Secretary,
Melvin Amoss: Treasurer, Elwood
Strickhouser; Chief, Carroll Selby;
Trustees—Donald Hess, Chester Moose,
Walter Clingan.

All other Fraternities and organizations

are invited to use this directory for the

politic information it carries. Cost fce

one year July 4,6.00.

CUSTOM SLAUGHTERING

BEEF - PORK - LAMB - VEAL

Complete Processing

Curing & Smoking

HAHN'S FOOD SERVICE

Westminster Tilden 8 - 4040

9-19-tf
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INSuRANCI,

756 - 6733

ARTHUR GARVIN, JR.

WORLD'S
LARGEST
AUTO INSURANCE COMPANY

COlit

STATE FARM MUTUAL State Farm Agent
AUTOMOBILE

INSURANCE COMPANY

:20::02:0=0:20U01:0:20:201302:02:022*

KOONS FLORIST

Corsages
* LI TTLESTOWN, PENNA.

AREA CODE 717

Phone 359-4821

Harris M. Frosk
TI. 8-7505 Westminster, Md.

Agent for

Virginia S. Griffin
Realtor

TE. 3-1555 Reisterstown, Md.

FIRST TIME OFFERED — 73 acre
dairy farm near Uniontown, Md.,
This is a beautiful farm, lovely
house in a nice setting. Can be
bought with or without cattle and
equipment. By appointment only.

SIX rooms and bath aluminum siding
house on 100x160 ft. lot with city
water. Have you wanted a home in
town that has country atmosphere?
If so, you must see this one.

New Listing — UNION BRIDGE —
2-Apt. Brick House, 4 garages.
Broadway & Whyte St. Nice invest-
ment property.

New Listing — 103 N. Main St. —
MANCHESTER — 5-room House
and bath. This is a nice small house.
Priced to sell.

THE FARM THAT WAS
LISTED IN THIS SPACE

HAS BEEN SOLD.

NEAR WESTMINSTER — 63-Acre
farm with 10-room house (5 bed-

rooms).
IN MANCHESTER—a beautiful 21/2

acre building lot. One of the fin-
est locations in town.

CRANBERRY-10 room house, bath,
1% acres of land. Priced to sell.

TWO nice wooded lots on Woodland
Drive, near Hook Road.

FRIZELLBURG — Five-room house
and bath; frame and aluminum sid-
ing. Second floor can be expanded.
Real nice home in small community.

NICE lots for sale between New

Windsor and Uniontown.
For investment properties or busines-
ses call us.

LET US LIST YOUR FARM.
WE NEED SMALL FARMS.

TI. 8-7505
9-6-tf
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PURCHASE A

RUBBER STAMP
with Taneytown area

"ZIP CODE" NUMBER

2 1 7 8 7

Comply with Postal Require-
ments and add the Zip Code to
your return address after the
city and state, the easy way
with a rubber stamp!

THE
CARROLL RECORD

CO.

NOTICE
All property owners are re-

quested to mow all weeds, gras-

es, etc., on their lots in Taney-
town.

Inspection of all properties

will be made and anyone guilty
of neglecting this request will

be dealt with according to Ordi-
nance pertaining to this sit-
uation.

Mayor & City Council
of Taneytown

6-6-tf

N rade.

J. ALFRED
HELTEBRIDLE
TANEYTOWN, MD.
Phone: PL 6-5141

ATIONWIDE
Mutual Insurance Co.
Mutual Fire Insurance Co.
Life Insurance Co.

' Home Ofin.e ---Columbas, 0

THE
CHRISTIfl

SCIfliCE
1110111TOR
Accurate
Complete
News
Coverage

Printed in

BOSTON

LOS ANGELES

LONDON

1 Year $22 6 Months $11
3 Months $5.50

Clip this advertisement and

return it with your check or

money order to:

The Christian Science Monitor
One Norway Street

Eos;on, Mass. 02115

PE -

FIRE INSURANCE

AUTO INSURANCE

Old reliable Companies — Money Saving rates.

Modern Homeowner's and Farmowner's policies, to.

For All Your Insurance Needs —

ROBERT L. ZENTZ

Uniontown Road, — Taneytown, Maryland — Pho
ne: 756 - 6960

9-12-tf
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has programming for every member of the family.

* NEWS on-the-air
*

St MUSIC through-out the day
K:E
so: * SPORTS — high school, college, professio

nal

Ito * Special Features of Public Interest

Dial: 1470 kc WTTR - AM

100.7 mc WTTR - FM
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i $6. SO and up Haircut — Shampoo — Set 311
ii

87 PRINCE ST. 
:20:4 MARY'S BEAUTY SALON

M 
1

i 

LITTLESTOWN, PA. L

Mary E. Beamer, Prop. Phone: 359-5254 
1:1
St
0

i 
OPEN DAILY AND EVENINGS 10-17-2t I
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,ermanents

Teeter
Phone:

Gettysburg
EDgewood

4-3165
Westminster
TI, 8-6867

CRUSHED STONE.

If It's Crushed Stone, Call Teeter

TEETER STONE, INC.

WESTMINSTER, MD. 
GETTYSBURG, PA.

5rmatunnummortonomazottoztonononononott .0:01
30•40:20=0=0:110W0
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HEMORRHOIDS CURED

No Hospitalization — Painless

tt Write for FREE BOOK

BASED ON ACTUAL CURES — 
Illustrated in Colors

13 Box 1931 
York, Pa.

Dept. C. R. 
10-10-3t
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RUPTURE (HERNIA)
VARICOSE VEINS & ULCERS

PILES
Cured Without Surgery

It is dangerous to neglect rupture and rectal 
troubles. New scientific

modern method cures in most cases withou
t surgery. No time lost

from home or work.

I
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31( PUBLIC SALE
OF REAL ESTATE, ANTIQUES AND

HOUSEHOLD GOODS

SATURDAY, NOVEMBER 2, 1963

The undersigned, discontinuing housekeeping, will offer at

Public Sale, located at
following:

REAL ESTATE

Ten-room house, weatherboard with 
asbestos shingles, five rooms

and semi bath downstairs, four rooms 
and complete bath upstairs,

hot water heat, oil fired furnace, storm 
doors and windows down-

stairs, slate roof, front and side porch
, hooked up to city sewer,

summer house attached, 2-car garage w
ith sealed over head, shop,

storage space above, 12x45-ft. chicken ho
use with running water

and automatic fountains, occupying lot 
333x50, more or less.

TERMS OF REAL ESTATE: 10% of p
urchase price on day of

sale, balance in 30 days, or before if desired 
and immediate possession.

ANTIQUES AND HOUSEHOLD GOODS

Dry sink, old cupboard, organ stool, p
lank bottom chairs, sewing

rocker, reed rocker, old chest of dra
wers, trunk child rocker high

chair, oil lamp, Rayo lamp, wash bowl
 and pitcher, blanket chest,

rope bed, clothes tree, .38 revolver, 
single-barrel shot gun, stone

crocks, copper kettle, iron kettle, iron 
skillet, lots of books, picture

frames, lots of dishes, some milk glass,
 ironstone, lots of old quilts,

Frigidaire self-defrosting refrigerator, with freezer (like new);

Hotpoint elec. stove (good condition),
 washing machine, Trayser

piano and stool, Zenith T.V. and stand, 2
-pc. living room suite (good

condition), davenport, record cabinets, di
ning room suite, with glass

door china closet (good condition), 
chairs, straight and rockers,

stands, lights, 4-pc. bedroom suite, oth
er beds, dressers, oak knee

hole desk, clocks, elec. fan, cedar che
st, commode (like new), book-

case and desk combined, ironing hoard
, electric iron, wheel chair,

extension kitchen table, Dormeyer electric 
mixer, flat iron, electric

griddle, meat bench, juicer, egg cartons, g
arden hose, adding mathine,

shoe stretchers, music rack, 3-burner oil 
stove, rotary tiller, (2) elec.

13 edge trimmers, elec. brooder, elec. sprayer, • push mower, 30-lb.

scales, rat proof feed box, saws, hatchet, 
drills, tools of all kinds,

porch swing, porch chairs, ferm-y, lawn car
t, chicken crates, chicken

nests and feeders. iron hog trough, garden
 tools, other articles too

numerous to mention.

Terms of Personal Property: CASH.

NORMAN S. DEVILBISS,
Owner.

•

•

• I 11111111111,02:0220 I 11111=1110430:40 111111411111
11110=0...,A111=11100=0:101111.=121111001

Li
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AT 10:30 A. M.

86 West Baito. St., in Taneytown
, Md., the tt

•

Not responsible for accidents.

Lunch rights.

GUSS SHANK, Auct.
10-10-24 & 31

Now five kinds of Chevrolets for all kinds of people! •

'64 CORVETTE STING RAY SPORT COUPE

'64 CORVAIR MONZA CLUB COUPE

'64 CHEVY H NOVA 4-DOOR SEDAN

..„
. .....

'64 CHEVROLET IMPALA SPORT COUPE

JET-SMOOTH LUXURY 
CHEVROLET—For luxury-

loving people. Rich new 
styling, finer appointments in

all four series and 15 
models. Engines up to 425 hp*,

manual or Powerglide* transmis
sions.

NEW CHEVELLE—For paces
etting people. A totally

new kind of car with small-c
ar handling, big-car comfort!

Styling that makes expensive car
s jealous. Three series

and 11 models, and a full choice of
 engine and trans-

mission teams!
CHEVY II—For practical people. Che

vy II

with new V8 power* for fun-on-a-
shoestring.

Stretches the shoestring further with
 4- and

CHEVROLET

6-cylinder engines. Chevy II's six models 
in two series

all act like they're bigger, more expensiv
e cars!

CORVAIR—For fun-loving people. More fun than

ever from Corvair's new bigger engine! Same Corvair

handling and riding ease in 9 models—including the

150-hp Turbocharged Spyders!

CORVETTE—For sports-minded people. Corve
tte now

rides softer, smoother—but loses none of its
 gusto because

its big V8 offers versions from 250 to 375
 hp*!

Want to get together with other car-loving

people? Go see your Chevrolet dealer . . . 
he

likes all kinds! *optional at extra cost

See five entirely different lines of cars at your Chevrolet Showr
oom — CHEVROLET, CHEVELLE, CHEVY II, CORVAIR & CORKTTE

LOWRY CHEVROLET, INC.
T VPITTOWN, MARYLAND

C
4
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THURSDAY‘, OCTOBER 24, 1963

CORRESPONDENCE
Latest Items of Local News Furnished
By Our Regular Staff of Writers
We desire correspondence to reaeh our*trice on Wednesday, if at all possible. It

wiII be necessary, therefore, for most let-
re to be mailed on Tuesday morning.Letters mailed on Wednesday may notreach us in time.

FR1ZELLBURG

Services at the Church of God this
Sunday morning, preaching at 9:.00
A. M., Church School following at 10
o'clock, Mr. John Warner of Hanover,
Penna., will be the guest speaker.
C. G. Y. A. at 7:00 P. M., Rev. Fred
Horner, pastor, Mr. Howard Carr,
superintendent_
Mr. and Mrs. Scott Sullivan and

Mr. Charles Coleson represented the
Church of God as delegates to the
Md. and Va. Eldership this week at
South Mountain Church of God, South
Mountain, Penna., Miss Lamore Sul-
livan attended as a visitor on Thurs.

Mrs. Charles Null of High Point,
N. C., is visiting with relatives in and
near this place.
Those who attended the Lutheran

Church Women, Westminster Dis-
trict Assembly, October 17, at St.
Mary's Lutheran Church, Silver Run,
Md., from Emmanuel Lutheran, were:
Mrs. Martin Koons, Mrs. H. K. Myers,
Mrs. Amanda Bare, Mrs. VernonZimmerman, Mrs. Hattie Bowers,Mrs. Walter Marker, Mrs. CharlotteSorb, Mrs. Geo. Sanner, Mrs. Flor-
ence Welk and Mrs. Walter Myers,
SI.
The Frizellburg Homemakers Clubmet at the home of Mrs. HarveyStoner, Wednesday evening, October16th, with the president, Mrs. RobertBosley in charge. Family Life Lead-er—Mrs. Denton Wantz presented afilm—"Retire to Life." This picturewas pertaining to the "Problems ofAging." Mrs. John Hyle was electedas president and Mrs. George Sanner,vice-president. Open House will beheld Dec. 4-5 at the Ag. Center,Westminster. The November meet-ing will be held at the Pleasant Val-ley Fire Hall and will be a joint meet-ing with Pleasant Valley, Myers and

Fnizellburg Clubs, Nov. 6 at 1:30.
Hostesses for the evening were Mrs.
Harvey Stoner, Mrs. Walter Seat,Mrs. Robert Bosley and Mrs. Delmar
Warehime.
Mrs. Walter Marker, Mrs. H. K.

Myers, Mrs. Bessie Freet and Mrs.
Walter 'Myers, Sr., attended an allday quil'ing and luncheon at Hills-dale Club House on Wednesday, Oc-
tober 16. Two quilts ,areere in the
making with 16 ladies at each quilt.
Sunday visitors art the home of Mr.and Mrs. John Berwager were: Mrs.Ethel Williams of Alabama, Mrs.Catherine Coxoe and Mr. Jerry Knox

of Baltimore.
Mrs. Mazie Sullivan wishes to ex-

tend thanks and appreciation to rel-
atives, neighbors and friends, who re-membered to send beautiful cardsfor her 78th birthday anniversary.
Mr. and Mrs. John Hyle anddaughter, Denise returned home onSunday from a 4-day trip to Corn-ing Glass Works, Corning, New Yorkand Cooperstown, New York.
Visitors in the home of Mr. and

Mrs. Joseph Strevig, Sunday, were:Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Patterson anddaughter, Catherine, Mr. and Mrs.Howard Dern of Littlestown, Penna.,and Mrs. Lawrence Trimmer, Han-over, Pa. Miss Bessie Yingling isspending this week in the Trimmerhome, and with her niece, Mrs. HelenShrimes, oilBrenda Haines returned to schoolafter spending two days in bed witha virus or flu.
The Guild and Brotherhood of Em-manuel (Baust) United Church ofChrist met Thursday evening in theparsonage. Mrs. Robert V. Johnsonwas in charge of the program andused as her theme: "Each In His OwnWay." Mrs. Wilbur Long read thescripture taken from Romans 12.Others participating were: Mr. andMrs. Charles Little, Mrs. Ralph Dut-terer, Mr. Denton Wantz, Mrs. LouisBaer, Mr. Norman Graham, Mrs.

Stanley Stonesifer, Rev. Johnson, Mrs.Mary Bowers, Mr. Noah Wa.rehinte,Mr. Stoner Fleagle. The businessmeeting was in charge of the retiringpresident, Mrs. Denton Wantz. Mrs.Raymond Baker, treasurer and Mrs.Ralph Dutterer, acting secretary, re-ported. The group voted to continue
us a combined group and will com-ply with National plans as a Councilef Lay Life and Work. Monthly meet-ings will continue. Educational and in-spirational program themes, to meetthe needs of the local church, will heplanned by the officers and pastor.'
Officers elected were: president,Mrs. Mary Bowers; vice-president,Mr. Norman Graham; secretary, Mrs.
Stoner Fleagle; assistant, Mrs. Ralph
flutterer; treasurer, Denton Wantz;
assistant, Louis Baer. Offerings will
he given for World Missions through
the benevolent church treasury. A
social hour followed.

Services in Emmanuel (Baust)
Church on Sunday will include, Sun-
day School 9:30 A. M.; J. Robert
Waddell, superintendent; Church
Worship at 10:30 A. M.; congrega-
tional meeting following church wor-
&hip in regard to insulation of the
parsonage.
Laymen's banquet on Thursday,

October 31. Tickets may be gotten
from Wilbur Long.

World Comminity Day service on
Sunday, November 3 at 7:30 P. M.Rev. August Borleis pastor of Em-
manuel (Baust) Lutheran Church will
be the speaker. The combined church
ehoirs will sing. This service is spon-sored annually by United Church Wo-
men.
A Hallow'een masquerade partywill be held Friday, October 25, in theparish house, at 7:30 P. M., sponsoredby the Youth Fellowship. All age'rroups are invited, Rev. Robert V.Johnson, pastor.
The Frizellburg Homemakers votedart the Octeber meeting not to haveth^ traditional family Christmaspe-ty. There will be a dinner meet-in' for members on Wednesday, De-ce---ber 18, at g•In P

have been made at the Sunset View
Inn, George St., Westminster. Mrs.
Allen Morelock and Mrs. Thelma
Coleman will accept reservations any-
time before December 1. Please re-
serve this date on your calendar.
Mr. and Mrs. Milton Hull and fam-

ily, New Oxford, visited on Sunday
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. Allen
Morelock, Tyrone Road.
Our neighbor reports .hearing four

flocks of wild geese flying South;
they know that Winter is not so far
away.
The harvest is past, the summer is

ended—Jeremiah 8:20.
There is a sudden hush before the

whiteness
Of Winter settles down upon the

world,
For there's a rhythm and a muted

brightness
That's like a flag of truce not yet

unfurled.
—Margaret E. Sangster.

HARNEY

Services Sunday, Oct. 27, at St.Paul's Lutheran Church. Worship at9:00, Sunday School at 10:00 Pastor,Rev. John Fry.
Word was received of the death ofGeorge Brooke Baker, Fostoria, Ohio.He was the son of the late BrookeBaker, who resided here for severalyears before his death. Mr. BrookeBaker was a brother of the late Mrs.Fannie Baker Fuss. The Baker fam-ily visits here each summer. George'slast visit was in August this year.He will be sadly missed by his cou-sins. Those attending the funeralTuesday from here were Mr. andMrs. Robert Strickhouser, Mrs. Er-man Chipley and Mr. and Mrs. Wes-ley Mummert.

Visitors during the week with Mr.and Mrs. Theodore Ridinger, Rich-ard and Ronald, were Mrs. ClaudeFissel, Gettysburg Rt. 5, Pa.; MissJudy Stirckhouser, Littlestown Rt. 1,Pa.; Miss Luana Rippeon, Littles-town, Pa.; Mrs. Edna Snider, Mr.Robert Striekhouser, Mr. and Mrs.Walter Clingan, Judy and Ricky. Mr.and Mrs. Reynold Ridinger, Mr. Rich-ard Withers, Mr. and Mrs. DalbertSpangler, Mr. and Mrs. RussellWantz, Jr., Mr. and Mrs. RalphVaughn, Mr. Fred Spangler, Mrs.Esther Fuss, Mrs. Harvey Wantz,Mr. and Mrs. George Clingan andStevie, John Shriver, Mrs. ClarenceBaker, Mrs. Luther Fox and Mr. andMrs. John Ridinger and Patty.
Connie and Jimmie Mummert spentMonday and Tuesday nights withtheir grandparents, Mr. and Mrs.Daihert Spangler, while their parents,Mr. and Mrs. Wesley Mummert, at-teeated the funeral of Mr. GeorgeBaker in Fostoria, Ohio.
Mrs. Irene Rinerman, Littlestown,Paa"visited Mrs. Charles Shildt Tues-day evening.
Visitors during the week with Ber-nice and Georgia Hite_shew were Mrs.Arthur Eyler, Littlestown, Pa.; Mrs.Clyde Frock, Mrs. J. Walter Kump,Mrs. Ballard Smith and Linda, Mrs.George Shriver, Mrs. Luther Foxand Mrs. Ernest Eyler and Micky.Mrs. Franklin Koontz, sons Stevenand Kevin, Bonneauville, Pa., andMrs. Effie Fream were Tuesday sup-'per guests with Mrs. Howard Kump.The men attended the Father andSan banquet.
Visitors during the week with Mrs.Marion Haines and family were Mr.and Mrs. William Fuss, Littlestown,PA.; Mr. and Mrs. George Marshall,Littlestown Rt. 2, Pa.; Mrs. ChesterMoose, Mrs. Luther Fox and Mrs.Esther Fuss.
Mrs. Eugene Waybright, Littles-town, Pa., and Mrs. Samuel Valentinevisited Tuesday evening with Mr.John Waybright.
Last week visitors with Miss MaryHaines were Mr. and Mrs. RobertVarner and Betsy, Arlington, Va.;Mrs. Mary Bower of New York, Mrs.Mary Baker and Mrs. Edna Snider.
The annual Father and Son Ban-quet of St. Paul's Lutheran Churchwas held Tuesday evening at the Par-ish Hall. The toastmaster, Mr. GeorgeW. Clingan, welcomed them. Theprogram consisted of the following:opening song "My Country 'Tis ofThee" by the group, table grace of-fered by Rev. Charles Held, meal, ex-tended thanks to the ladies for thedelicious meal, horn duet by WilliamRodgers and Kenneth Strickhouser,sang "Onward Christian Soldiers" bythe group, the guest speaker, Rev.Miller, Taneytown Lutheran Church;and benediction offered by Rev. Held.Mrs. Edward Cluck and sons spentWednesday afternoon with theirgrandparents, Mr. and Mrs. SamuelValentine.
Thursday afternoon visitors with

Mrs. Howard Kump were Mrs. Don-
ald Hess, Diane and Sherry. Dianeand Sherry were also supper guests
with the Kumps.
Miss Susan Spangler spent Thurs-doy with her grandparents, Mr. and

Mrs. Dalbert Spangler.
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Oyler, Gettys-tnirg. Pa., and Mr. and Mrs. RobertStrickhouser visited recently theElectra Roma held at the Metropoli-tan Edison Building, York, Pa., andalso attended the Youth for Christgaily held at McCasky High School,Lancaster, Pa. The speaker was Rev.Park Tucker, Chaplain at .the Fed-eral Prison at Atlanta, Ga. TheShorb Brothers of Silver Spring andthe White Sisters were guest singersof the evening. The auditorium seat-ed 1800 people and was filled to::aPacity.
Mrs. Clyde Frock and Mrs, ShirleyKoontz and Janie visited Fridayafternoon with Gertrude Hagerden,Eyre ts burg.
Mr. and Mrs. Nevin Ridinger andVary Haines visited in WestminsterFriday evening.
Mr. and Mrs. Theodore Ridinger

end Ronald visited Friday evening
with Mr. and Mrs. Delbert Spangler.
Mr. and Mrs. Harry Cline, Mrs.

William Cline and Billie Ann, Green-
;one. Pa.; Mrs. Harvey Wentz and
Mr. George Kump visited Saturday
qfternoon with Mr. and Mrs. Edward
Singer, Hampstead.
Mr. and Mrs. Wesley Mummert,

Connie and Jimmie, visited Saturday
wening with Mr. and Mrs. Ray Slay-
haugh, Sharon and Lisa, LittlestownPenna.
Mr. and Mrs. Nevin Ridinger, Mrand Mrs. Robert Varner, daughter

Betsy, visited Saturday evening with

Miss Gertie Ridinger, Brookfield
Manor Nursing Home, Middleburg.

Callers over the week-end with Mr.
and Mrs. Charles W. Bridinger were
Mr. and Mrs. Edward Bishe, Boyer-
town, Pa.; Mr. and Mrs. Carl Oyler,
Gettysburg, Pa.; Mr. and Mrs. C.
Francis Bridinger, Littlestown, Pa.;
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Baker and
Robert Reifsnider.
Week-end visitors at the home of

Mr. and Mrs. David Yealy were Mr.
and Mrs. Clarence Harner, Hanover,
Pa.; Mr. and Mrs. George Patterson
and daughter, Littlestown, Pa.; Mr.
and Mrs. Elsworth Feeser and fam-
ily, Taneytown.
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Varner,

daughter Betsy, Arlington, Va., spent
the week-end with their parents, Mr.
and Mrs. Nevin Ridinger.
Mr. Albert Koontz of Florida

visited Sunday with Mr. and Mrs.
Harry Angell.
Sunday afternoon visitors with

Mrs. Mary Clutz were Mr. and Mrs.
Wade Brown, Silver Run, and DonnaYingling.
Mr. and Mrs. Stockton Rouzie,

Frederick, and Mr. and Mrs. Samuel
Valentine surprised Mrs. George Val-
entine for her birthday Sunday eve-
ning by taking ice cream and cake
to her home, Littlestown Rt. 2, Pa.
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Crouse and

family visited Sunday evening with
Mr. and Mrs. Edward Crouse andfamily, White Hall, Pa.
Those who visited Sunday with

Mr. and Mrs. Herman Sentz were
Mr. and Mrs. Larry Clouser, Mr. and
Mrs. David Yealy, Yvonne and Joyce.
Mrs. Florence Null, Mr. Sonny Shoe-
maker, Mr. and Mrs. H. William
Clouser, Mr. and Mrs. Oscar Sentz,Mrs. James Sells, Mr. George Sentz,Mr. and Mrs. Ronald Shriver, Tamieand Lisa, Mr. and Mrs. ClarenceHarner, Mr. and Mrs. George Patter-
son and Catherine and Mr. and Mrs.
Elsworth Feeser.

Visitors Sunday with Mr. and Mrs.
Elmer LeGore were Mrs. LeGore's
sister and brother-in-law, Mr. and
Mrs. Edward Bishe, Boyertown, Pa.;
Mr. and Mrs. Mervin Feeser, Taney-
town, and Mr. and Mrs. Luther Fox.
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Shildt visited

Sunday afternoon with Mr. and Mrs.
Eugene Eckenrode and family, Mc-
Sherrystown, Pa.; also Mrs. Shildt's
sister, Mrs. Beulah Turner, Gettys-
burg, Pa.
Sunday supper guest with Mrs.

Esther Fuss was Mrs. Nettie Mar-
shall.
Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Frock visited

Sunday evening with Mr. John Way-
bright.
Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Strickhouser

and Mr. and Mrs. Robert Strick-
houser visited Sunday at the home
of Mr. and Mrs. Carl E. Oyler, Jr.,
and family, Falls Church, Va.
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Spangler, Susie

and Freddie, visited Saturday eve-
ning with Mr. and Mrs. Gene Spang-
ler, Bobbie and Debbie.
Mr. and Mrs. Albert Koontz and

grandson, Chucky, Jacksonville, Fla.,
were guests of Mr. and Mrs. Luther
Angell over the week-end. Other
visitors Sunday were Mr. and Mrs.
Harry Angell, Harney; Mr. & Mrs.
Chas. Koontz, Mr. & Mrs. Roy Koontz,
Mr. and Mrs. Richard DeGroft, Rich-
ard, Jr.; Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Hoff-
man, Bruce II, David and Lisa; Mr.
and Mrs. Terry Lightner, Terry, Jr.,
and Chris; Mr. Earl Strausbaugh,
Thomas, Donald, Ronald and Connie;
Mr. Thomas Koontz, all of Littles-
town, Pa.; Mr. and Mrs. Charles Ker-
rigan, Joyce, Susan, Sharon and Ron-
ald; Mr. and Mrs. Donald Jacob, Mr.
and Mrs. LeRoy Angell, Gary, Mark,
and Gregory, all of Gettysburg, Pa.;
Mr. and Mrs. LeRoy Flickinger, Ber-
nard, Larry and Linda, Mt. Airy;
Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Angell and
Kenneth, Hyattstow-n; Mr. and Mrs.
Albert Angell, Albert, Jr. and Cora
Lynn, Taneytown, and Mr. and Mrs.
Paul DeGroft and Wanda, Blacks
Corner.
The Harney Ball Club will gather

papers on Saturday, October 26.

KEYS VILLE-DETOUR

Greetings to you:
Congratulations to Mr. and Mrs.

Dean Nusbaum of Taneytown who be-
came the parents of a third son, Ker-
ry, on Thursday, October 17. Mrs.
Nusbaum is the former Miss Thelma
Motter

Congratulations also to the newly-
weds, Mr. and Mrs. Larry Stambaugh,
who were married on the 7th. Mrs.
Stambaugh is the former Miss Mary
Frances Black, daughter of Mr. and
Mrs. Norman Black of Union Bridge.
They are living with his parents, Mr.
and Mrs. J. William Stambaugh of
Keysville.
The Carroll Wilhide family near

Detour, recently received a card from
the Rahm brothers. It was sent from
Montreal and told of a Longshore-
men's strike which caused them to
have to take a train to Halifax (we
assume Nova Scotia) to board their
boat for home. They sent thanks to
everyone for their kindnesses to them
while visiting here.
Are you saving your papers, old

rags, cardboard and the like? Don't
forget to tell Charles Young or Ed-
ward Coshun if you'd like collection
of them on November 23 when the
Luther League of Keysville Lutheran
Church will be making the rounds.
They will appreciate your helping
them.
PTA Executive Committee Meet-

ing at Elmer A. Wolfe School on
MOnday, October 28.
A birthday party was held on

Thursday afternoon at the William
Weishaar home on Forest and Stream
Club Road to celebrate Randy's 7th.
There were about 15 young guests
present and a good time was enjoyed
by all.
Mrs. Richard Wiihide and her baby

daughter, Susan, came home to For-est and Stream Club Road from An-nie Warner Hospital on Monday af-ternoon.
Martha, daughter of Mr. and Mrs.Nevin Dutrow of Mt. Union, was aFriday overnight guest of Bethdaughter of Mr. and Mrs. CarrollWilhide near Detour.
Sunday afternoon visitors with Mrand Mrs. Lloyd Wilhide near Keys---Hie were: Mr. and Mrs. Herber'"'rouse of Hanover, Penna.
Miss Helen Fossett, who makes he,-cane with the Maynard Ausherma-

'amily near Detour, spent fror
Welneseley evening to Saturday vis

iting with her mother and grandmoth-
er, Mrs. Fossett and Mrs. Hyde ofWestminster.
Mr. Paull Spring, student at theSeminary in Gettysburg, was guestspeaker at Keysville Lutheran Churchon Sunday.
I understand Pvt. Robert Dinter-man, USMC is on leave now and vis-iting with his parents, Mr. and Mrs.Alton Washburn of the Keysville Rd.
I am sorry to report 3 hospitalcases. It seems Mrs. Geo. (Irene)Miller of Rocky Ridge is a surgicalpatient at Annie Warner Hospital inGettysburg and Mrs. Loren Austin ofDetour entered this same hospital onSunday. I'm sure cards would be muchappreciated. Word has also been re-ceived that Mrs. Charles (Hazel)Cluts of Riverdale Farm near Keys-ville suffered a stroke while visitingin Franklin Grove, Illinois and is ina hospital in Rochelle. Address cardsto Rochelle Hospital, Rochelle, Ill.and add Room 119. Cards and noteswill mean a lot to Mrs. Cluts whenshe is so far from home.
Considering the dry weather we'vebeen having, the flowers have beenlovely. The dahlias are so prettyagain at the home of Mr. and Mrs.Geo. Gartrell of Keysville Rd., andthe petunias are still quite bright inmany gardens as well as the 'mumshaving vivid color. The woods betweenKeysville and Sixes Bridge Rd. werelovely this morning (Tues). Theyare full of yellows, reds, bronzes andalso browns and there is still somegreen left too, for contrast.
Mr. and Mrs. James Coshun of De-tour, Mr. and Mrs. Charles Trimmerof Thurmont and Mr. and Mrs. RogerHildebrand of Woodsboro were Sat-urday supper guests at the home ofMr. and Mrs. Edward Coshun nearDetour, to celebrate the 40th Wed-ding Anniversary of Mr. and Mrs.James Coshun. I understand the cele-bration was a surprise and offer oursincere congratulations also.
Sunday, Nov. 3 will be Youth Sun.at Keysville Lutheran Church withthe Service being held by the youngpeople of the church, and starting at10:45 A. M. Please note that WorldCommunity Day Services will be heldat this same church at 7:45 P. M.with 8 area churches participating inthe service. Special features of theevening will be a film entitled,"Hunger" and singing by the UnionBridge Lutheran Parish Brotherhoodas well as "The Teen Tones," a groupfrom Taneytown High School.
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Cramer ofSykesville were Saturday supperguests with the Maynard Aushermanfamily of Forest and Stream ClubRoad. Sunday visitors in this samehome were: Mr. and Mrs. BernardAusherman and children of Taney-town, and Mr. and Mrs. Gilmore Au-sherman and Terry of Frederick."Bill" Fleharty near Detour, withthree telephone company co-workers,had a camping-fishing trip from Fri-day through Sunday in Davis, WestVirginia.
Mr. and Mrs. Danny Maltigliati ofDetroit, Michigan, visited with herparents, Mr. and Mrs. Loren Austin

of Detour, from Wednesday to Sun.
Saturday visitors with Mr. andMrs. Fred Wilhide and children of In-diana, Penna., to attend the Home-coming Parade of Indiana StateTeachers' College, were: Mr. and Mrs.Lloyd Wilhide of Keysville and Mrs.Wm. E. Ritter and Mrs. Bert Allen-der and son, Don, of Taneytown.
Nursing Trainees, Becky Houckand Jane Wilhide spent the week-endvisiting with their parents, Mr. andMrs. Luther Houck of Forest andStream Club Rd. and Mr. and Mrs.Carroll Wilhide of Keysville Road.(An apology here to the Houcks' forpreviously stating their location asSixes Bridge Road—I goofed)!
There is construction work goingon back on Mumma's Ford Road. Itis my understanding this section isbeing paved from Forest and StreamClub Road down to the bridge.
Week-end visitors with Mr. andMrs. Robert Stine near Keysvillewere his sister and brother-in-law,Mr. and Mrs. Robert Hummell ofSteelton, Penna.
School calendar shows Wednesday,October 30, as a half day session.The school will close at noon, butlunch will be served before dismissal.
This Friday the 25th is the datefor grades 4 to 8 to attend the pro-gram given by the Baltimore Sym-phony Orchestra at the WestminsterJunior High School Auditorium. Thisprogram is being sponsored by theCarroll County Symphony Organiza-tion.
Mr. Carroll Wilhide, near Detour,was among the visitors of his daught-er-in-law and newest granddaughter,Mrs. Richard Wilhide and Susan, atAnnie Warner Hospital in Gettys-burg last Sunday afternoon. He alsocalled upon his sister and brother-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Russell Durboraw,who farm near Gettysburg.
Wolfgang's candy is again sold thisyear by the Keysville Lutheran Sun-day School for the benefit of theBuilding Fund. If interested, pleasecontact any of the Sunday SchoolTeachers or myself. Thanks.
Miss Carol Wolfgang of Washing-ton visited on Sunday with her Sis-ter and family, Mr. and Mrs. WilliamFleharty and children near Detour.
Mr. and Mrs. Maynard Ausherman,near Detour, spent Wednesday withMr. and Mrs. Wm. Amoss of Taney-town and helped to make Kraut fromone hundred lbs. of cabbage.
Mr. Carlton Catlin of Detour, silentthe week-end visiting his brother,Charles, in Barton, N. Y. He also vis-ited in Binghamton.
At 2:30 P. M. next Sunday after-noon (the 27th), the eongregation ofSt. James Lutheran Church in UnionBridge will lay the Cornerstone fortheir new Educational Building. TheRev. Elweed Falkenstein, pastor ofGrace Lutheran Church of Westmin-ster, will be the guest speaker.
Mrs. Maynard Ausherman, near%tour, was in Wheaton and SilverSpring from Thursday evening untilSaturday evening. Her brother, Mr.John-Ed Bee-man, came for her so she'ould be with her mother, Mrs. John-lawman, before and immediately af-er major surgery at the Holy Crossjospital. On Saturday evening, MrsCahn Ammenheuser of Creagerstown'Trs. Bernard Ausherman of Taney-rw-n, and Mrs. Howard Zimmerma,Jefferson, also visited Mrs. Bow-

man and Mrs. Ausherman returnedhome with them.
There was a joint meeting of theUnion Bridge, Linwood, Sam's Creek,Taneytown and Terra Rubra Girls'4-H Clubs at St. Lukes (Winters)Church last Friday afternoon. HomeDemonstration Agent, Mrs. PatriciaStabler conducted a demonstration on"Physical Fitness." One fact shementioned was "The teen-age girl isthe poorest fed member of the fam-ily," and went on to explain propereating habits are also part of physi-cal fitness and not just exercise.These are the 7 important things shestressed: 1. Eat properly. 2. Ex-ercise sensibly. 3. Get enough sleep.4. Adopt healthy mental attitudes.5. Watch personal grooming. 6.Avoid obvious health hazards and 7.Utilize medical services intelligently.The meeting was well attended andwas opened by the singing of songs.The first two were rounds led by theUnion Bridge club song leader andthen several songs were led by the 6members of the Terra Rubra Clubwho had attended Camp: Donna Six,Cindy and Janet Crouch, Patti Poole,Barbara Green and Toni Heiser.There were four announcementsmade: 1. Achievement Night —November 9, 8:00 P. M. at the Ag.Center—each Club bring 4 dozencookies. 2. Goodwill Center of Bal-timore has dolls to be dressed. Any4-H'ers willing to help, contact Mrs.Stabler. 3. Officers Workshop—Nov.12—Westminster H. S. and 4. Home-maker's Clubs having Christmas OpenHouse on December 4 and 5 from1-3 P. M. and 7-9 P. M.;4-H'ers tohave table of baked goods, decorationsor gifts for sale and proceeds to goto Ag Center Building Fund. Thegame played was each member wrotea silly question on one slip of paperand a silly answer to it on anotherpaper and then handed them in. Theywere mixed up and then read to thegroup. Donna Six read the questionsand Joan Thomas the answers. Re-freshments of cider and cookies wereserved.

—Dharlys Fleharty.

Cub Pack #459
Cub Pack #459 met Friday eve-ning, October 18 with Den 4 havingthe opening. Wayne Fleharty led thePledge to the Flag, Chas. Turvin andMike Grossnickle had a reading, "AllThings Bright and Beautiful" andRandy Houck led the group in sing-ing "She'll Be Coming 'Round TheMountain".
The Rev. George Carpenter, UnionBridge Scout Master, spoke to theCubs and parents about TenderfootScouting. He explained that scoutingis built around a program of camp-ing, that parents pass Cubs on theirtests, but Scouts go to the Scoutmas-ter, the Assistant Scoutmaster ortheir Patrol Leader, that from Ten-derfoot to Eagle, all are proud towear the badge of a Boy Scout. Healso explained that when a Club hashis Lion Badge (about 10 lA yearsold), he may start to visit the ScoutMeetings, which are Wednesdaysfrom 7-8 P. M. This helps the Cubto get ready to be a Tenderfoot. Healso told of knot tieing and learningto build a fire and cooking outdoors:all things that Scouts learn to do andenjoy, and ended by inviting all Cubsto become Scouts as they become el-igible.
A new recruit was welcomed, Geo.Eckard. The poem, "That FreckledFaced Boy of Mine" was read by Mrs.Pauline Forney and the awards werepresented.
Bobcat pin to Kenneth Black, Den-ner and Assistant Denner stripes toboys in each den. Den 1 — Jerry For-ney and Tommy Hyde, Den 2 —Stevie Bowman and David Edwards,Den 3 — Dickie Stultz and EddieStultz and Den 4 — Mike Grossnickleand Randy Houck.
All joined in singing, "Hail, HailThe Gangs All Here," and then Dens1 and 3 presented a skit. Cubma.sterWeeks announced the new AmericanFlag had been presented to the Packby the Thurmont Cleaners A gamewas played and all sang "Good NightCub Scouts."
Den 2 joined in leading the CubScout Promise for the closing. EachCub had his turn at bobbing for anapple in a pan of water and then re-freshments were served by Mrs. PaulBowman and Mrs. Earl Myers.

Keysville-Detour Homemakers Club
Wednesday evening, October 16, theKeysville-Detour Homemaker's Clubmet at the home of Mrs. Wm. Fle-harty near Detour. There were 19members and 4 guests present. Afterthe reading of the Creed and roll call,dues were collected for the followingyear.
Terra Rubra 4-H'er, Joan Thomas,told of her experiences during ClubWeek (for which this Club had paidhalf her expenses). She told therewere over 800 there with a ratio of2.1 girls to each boy, and the groupwas divided into two tribes: Iroquoisand Algonquin Indians. There werelectures and classes but lots of timefor fun as well.
Mrs. Hazel Stonesifer, Family LifeLeader, led a most interesting dis-cussion on "The Problems of Aging".The purpose of this program was toawaken Homemakers to the fart thatpeople are living longer and whatsome of the problems are that thispresents. Also things that can bedone to help prepare for that day,such as friends and hobbys and in-terests outside of one's family.Discussion was held and finalplans made for the 41)th AnniversaryParty to be held at the KeysvilleUnited Church of Christ Parish Houseon Wednesday, October 23 at 8 P. M.Reminder was made of the jointmeeting to be held at St. Paul'sMethodist Church in New Windsoron November 12 at 1:30 P. M. Threemembers will take ginger breads to-wards the refreshments. The HomeDemonstration Agent will present theerogram on "The Wise Use of Cred-it."
Christmas Open House will be heldby the Homemaker Clubs of theCounty at the Ag Center on Decemberand 5 from 1-3 P. M. and 7-9M. Mrs. Mae Baumgardner and'firs. Hazel Stonesifer will arrange a'still" exhibit for this occasion withieveral members making arrange--nents for it.

The December meeting will be acovered dish supper at the ParishHouse in Keysville and each memberis to also bring along some good ideasfor Christmas decorating. The meet-ing was adjourned and refreshmentswere served by the hostess.

ROCKY RIDGE

Mr. and Mrs. John M. Pittengerand Mrs. Cora M. Setherly spentThursday with Mrs. Roland D. Wil-son and family of Taneytown.Mr. and Mrs, Harvey M. Pittenger,Sr., and Mrs. Charles H. Setherlyspent Thursday afternoon with Mrs.Florence Foreman of near Taney-town.
Public Sale of Mrs. MarguariteWachter's was largely attended. Ev-erything brought good prices.Mr. and Mrs. Harvey M. Pittenger,Sr., and Mrs. Charles H. Setherlyspent Friday with Mr. and Mrs.John N. Cavell and family of Boyds.Mr. and Mrs. Donald Myers andsons, Vincent and Anthony of nearEmmitsburg-, spent one evening oflast week with Mrs. Myer's parents,Mr. and Mrs. James R. Sayler andfamily.
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Rice havebought the property of Mr. EarlOwens, along the Rocky Ridge andCreagerstown road, recently.Mr. Harvey M. Pittenger, Sr., vis-ited Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Rogers of Le-Gore on Sunday.
 o 

WITH THE ARMED FORCES
ELGIN AFB, Fla. — Airman 3rdClass Michael J. Shaffer of Manches-ter, Md., is participating in a tacticalfirepower demonstration for the De-partment of Defense's joint civilianorientation course here.
Airman Shaffer, a United StatesAir Force supply specialist, is a mem-ber of the 831st Air Division atGeorge AFB, California, and will re-turn there upon completion of the ex-ercise.
Airman Shaffer is the son of Mr.and Mrs. W. P. Shaffer of 36 NorthMain Street, Manchester, and is agraduate of North Carroll HighSchool at Greenmount, Maryland.The demonstration is designed todisplay military capabilities to theselected audience of some 1,300 bus-iness, professional, cultural, militaryand governmental representatives.

DIED

MRS. JOSIAH W. CLICK
Mrs. Annie Katherine Click, 89,widow of Josiah W. Click, died at7:30 P. M. Sunday at the home ofa daughter and son-in-law, Mr. andMrs. James J. Murdock, 89 Manches-ter Ave. extended, Westminster, afteran illness of several days. Her hus-band died seven years ago.Mrs. Click was born in FrederickCounty, a daughter of the late Johnand Clara Stauffer Humerick. Inaddition to Mrs. Murdock, she is sur-vived by four other children, EarlN. Click, Westminster R.D. 1; Mrs.Nellie Bell, Walkersville; Joseph L.Click, Westminster R.D. 7, and Earn-est G. Click, Taneytown R.D. 1; asister, Mrs. Kansas Burns, Dayton,Ohio; 21 grandchildren; 50 great-grandchildren and three great-great-grandchildren.
Funeral services were held Wed-nesday at 2 P. M. at the Myers Fu-neral Home, Westminster. The Rev.Paul W. Moore, pastor of FirstChurch of God, Westminster, offi-cated. Burial was in Leister's Ceme-tery, near Westminster.

HARRY J. OHLER
Harry J. Ohler, 87, died Thursday,October 17, 1963, at 9:45 P. M. atthe House of the Pines, Catonsville,where he had been a guest for 10months.
He was a son of the late Emmanueland Alice Baumgardner Ohler. Hiswife, Minnie Hilterbrick Ohler, died28 years ago. He was a former resi-dent of Taneytown and resided inBaltimore the last 19 years. He wasa member of the Lutheran Church,Taneytown. He is survived by onedaughter, Mrs. Ethel Kaufman, 5117Laurel Avenue, Baltimore, and onegranddaughter.
Funeral services were held at theC. 0. Fuss and Son Funeral HomeSunday at 3 P. M. The Rev. HowardW. Miller, his pastor, officiated.Burial was in the church cemetery.

HORACE C. SIMPSON
Horace Clark Simpson, 75, well-known Uniontown resident, died at7 A. M. Sunday at his home afteran illness of five days.
He was born in Carroll County, ason of the late James and SusanMiller Simpson. He was a memberof St. Paul's Lutheran Church, Un-iontown. Surviving are his widow,Goldie Greenwood Simpson; two chil-dren, Malvin H. Simpson, Waynes-boro, Pa., and Mrs. Hazel Elk, Cen-tral Park, N.J.; a brother and twosisters, Charles Simpson and Mrs.Mettie Campbell, Middleburg, andMrs. Emma Ohler, Woodsboro.Funeral services were held at theUnion Bridge funeral home of D. D.Hartzler and Sons Wednesday at2 P. M. The Rev. J. H. Borleis, hispastor, officiated. Burial was in Un-iontown Lutheran Cemetery.

IN MEMORIAM

In loving memory of Lloyd S.Lambert who departed thislife October 3, 1958 and Ells-worth L. Lambert who de-
parted this life October 28,1962.

'Twee hard to say a last farewell,To those whom we loved so well,But God thought best to take themhome.
An angel whispered to them come!
They never more shall suffer pain,Their death is an eternal gain,For they who die in Christ are blest,And shall forever be at rest.
They sleep, they sleep, they are notdead!
But live with Christ their living head,Their body rests beneath the sod,But their pure spirit rests with God.

THE LAMBERT FAMILY.
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SPECIAL NOTICES

ANNUAL TURKEY and Oyster
Supper—Saturday, October 26, start-
ing 4 P. M., Rocky Ridge Fire Hall,
Rocky Ridge, Md. $1.35 and $.75.
By Willing Workers of Mt. Tabor
Church. 10-10 & 24

FOR easy, quick carpet cleaning
rent Blue Lustre Electric Shampooer
only $1 per day. R,eindollar Bros. & Co.

FOR SALE — 150 bales of good
wheat straw. Joseph A. Greene,
Phone PL. 6-6517. 10-24-2t

FOR SALE — 1960 Chevrolet 2-
Door Belair, straight stick, with
extras. Tim Crabbs, 67 Geroge St.,
Taneytown. Phone PL. 6-6430 .

FOR RENT — 3 rooms and kit-
chen. Phone PL. 6-4764. 10-24-2t

TURKEYS AND DUCKS for Sale.
Place your Thanksgiving order now.
Eerier Brown, phone 756-2162.

10-24-5t

FOR SALE — Large horse on
swings. Price $10.00 cash. Contact
Mrs. Barbara M. Damuth, Rein-
dollar Alley. 10-24-2t

FOR RENT — 8-room house on E.
Balta. St. near center of town. Call
on Saturdays or after 6 P. M. Roy
D. Phillips, PL. 6-6467. 10-24-2t

PIGS for Sale — Jacob E. Hahn,
Rt. 2, Taneytown. Phone PL. 6-6824.

10-24-3t

FOR SALE — 6 Log Chains, 14 ft.
long, % -in. link, new, $10 each.

E. Lawrence, phone Pb. 6-6274.
10-24-2t

POSITIVELY — No Trespassing
or Hunting on my farm. Mrs. Wil-
liam H. Sell. 10-24-2t

FOR RENT — 7-room house, large
garage, large lot; possession Nov. 1.
Price $25 month. Bernice and Georgia
alirteshew, Harney, Md. 10-24-ti

SPECIAL — This Friday and
Saturday at The Sugar Bowl, 10 York
St.. home-made Hallowe'en cookies,
3(le doz.; also fresh assorted choco-
lates and Pa. Dutch Fudge, $1.00 lb.

WANTED — To keep two children
in my home. Rear 58 Baltimore St.

FOR SALE — 5 Hampshire pigs,
10 weeks old. John Wm. Stultz, Rt.
1, Taneytown, phone SPruce 5-5856.

WANTED — Building lot in Tan-
eytown. Write size, location and
price to Box 451-C, Taneytown, Md.

WE CUT BEEF OT Veal for your
freezer; also beef by the side or
quarter. Center Meat Market.

FOR SALE — 22 shoats and 10
pigs. C. Stoner Fleagle, Mayberry,
phone PL. 6-4703.

CENTER MEAT MKT. — Taney-
-town, Md. 50 lb. potatoes, $1.19;
-chuck roast, 490; home made scrap-
ple, 40e pan; country cured ham, 79e.

NOTICE — I will not be respon-
sible for any bills except those con-
tracted by myself. — Mrs. Stanley
Heaver.

LOST, Strayed or Stolen — Ger-
man Shepherd male dog. Reward for
return or information leading to
whereabouts. M. R. Zent, Keymar.
Phone 775-2141.

FOR SALE — One good, used floor
furnace with high pressure oil burn-
er and 275-gal. fuel oil tank. Apply
-Wentz Bros., Inc., Taneytown, Md.

SHELLBARKS for Sale — Karen
Anders. Phone PL. 6-5484.

FOR SALE — 8 solid oak dining
room chairs, 2 arm chairs, 6 side
eliairs. Phone (Area Code 301)
'756-2228. 10-24-2t

FOR SALE — '49 Pontiac 8, black,
4-.door. See at blue and yellow house
trailer behind Shell Station. Reason-
able. Terms. Fred Hawkins, Taney-
town. 10-17-3t

FOR SALE — Ferguson Farm
Tractor. Mary Butler, W. Baltimore
St., Taneytown, Md. 10-17-3t

LEARN HOW much those old
tbings are worth! The book "7th
Antiques and Their Current Prices"
contains 371 pages of old glass, china,
lamps, bottles, postcards, spoons, etc.,
with hundreds of pictures and prices
telling what each item is worth. Send
$6 for your postpaid copy to: An-
tiques Publications, Box 85-CR,
Ladiesburg, Md. 21759. 10-17-4t

FOR SALE — Property, 2 acres;
elec., hard road, gravity water. 1%
miles west of Enunitsburg, Md. Price
reduced. Also have a lot for trailer
with gravity water at same address.
P. W. Hartman, #1, Emmitsburg,
Maryland. 10-17-2t

NOTICE — A pair of sun glasses
was left in our office this week.
Owner may claim them after proper
identification and paying cost of this
advertisement. 10-17-tf

FOR SALE — Space heaters with
pipe. Your choice of any one of three,
$25. Also two 50-gal. oil drums, with
spigots. The Carroll Record Co.

10-17-tf

FOR SALE — Argus C-3 Camera,
also makes slides, 2 years old, in-
cluding light meter, flash attach-
ments and bulbs, lenses, filter and
case. $30.00 Phone PL 6-6254.

10-17-4t

HOME APPLIANCES Repaired —
Also lawn mower and engine repairs;
also auto repairs, body work, painting,
and estimates; also, new and used
tires and parts. Earl Montgomery,
near Kump's Station, on the Bert
Koontz Road. 2-21-tf

WANTED — White Albino Guinea
Pigs, 8-oz. and up, price $1.50 and up.
Ralph Ha,rver, Harney Road. Dial
PL. 6-6769. 10-10-4t

FOR SALE — Frying Chickens,
dressed or alive. Phone Fern Haines,
PL. 6-6781. 10-10-2t

PREPARED—For the unex-
pected. Let us insure you adequate-
ly.—Percy M. Burke, 281 E. Main St.,
Westminster, Md. Phone: Tilden 8-
6620. 4-154f

CHURCH NOTICES

St. Joseph's Catholic Church, Fred-
erick St. Rev. Joseph A. Kenney,
Pastor. Sunday Mass, 8 and 10:31);
Week day Mass in the convent 7:00
o'clock Sept.-June except Friday Mass
for the Children 11:30 a. m. in the
church. First Friday 11:30 a. m., 5:15
p. m., First Saturday, 8:00 o'clock.
Sodality first Wednesday in month
7:30 p. m. followed by business meet-
ing. Meeting: Holy Name Society
meeting 8 p. m. every third Thurs-
day Business Meeting following
Instruction for children attending
public schools after the Masses
on Sunday. Confession Saturday
at 4-5 p .m.; 7-8 p. m. Baptisms
Sunday 11:30 a. m. C. Y. 0., Saturday
7:30 p. m. Novena to Our Lady of
Perpetual Help. followed by bene-
diction. Meeting and Social in Parish
Hall 8 P. M. — 11:30 P. M.

Holiness Christian Church—Key-
mar, Md. Rev. Wilbur M. Whalen,
Minister—Sunday School, 9:30 a.m.;
Morning Service, 10:30 a.m.; Young
Peoples Service at 7:00 p.m.; Even-
ing service at 7:30 p.m.; Every Tues-
day night at 8:00 p.m., Bible Study;
Friday night Cottage Pray Meeting.
Would be glad to come in to your
home. I was glad when they said unto
me, let us go into the house of the
Lord!

Walnut Grove Dunkard Brethren
Church at Kump's—Sunday School,
9:30 a.m.; preaching, 10:30 a.m. How-
ard Surbey and Guy Dayhoff, Minis-
ters.

Piney Creek Presbyterian Church.
Rev. Wm. Yates, D.D., Pastor —
Church Service, 9:30 A. M.; Church
School, 10:30 A. M.

Uniontown Lutheran Parish —
Mt. Union Church—Worship 9:30

A. M., Church School 10:30 A. M.
St. Luke's (Winters) Church —

Church School 10:00 A. M., Worship
11:00 A. M.

St. Paul's, Uniontown — Church
School 9:30 A. M. No Worship service.
Rev. J. H. August Borleis, pastor.
Trinity Lutheran Church, Taney-

town, Md. Howard W. Miller, pastor.
Saturday, October 26, Luther

League Social, Wilhide farm, 7-10:00
P. M.; Sunday, Reformation Sunday,
Sunday Church School 9:00 A. M.,

WANTED — A house to rent in
Taneytown area. Phone PL. 6-6681.

TURKEY AND OYSTER Supper,
family style, Saturday, Nov. 2, start-
ing 3 P. M. Tom's Creek Methodist
Church, near Ernmitsburg. Adults,
$1.50; children, $.75; carryouts, $1.75.
Also fancy table. 10-3-5t

THE ANNUAL Chicken and Oyster
Supper of Keysville Reformed Church
will be held Saturday evening, Nov.
16, served family style. Serving 3:30
P. M. on. Adults $1.50, childern 750,
under 5 years of age free. 9-26-8t

QUALITY HOUSE FURNITURE
—Detour, Md. Nationally advertised
brands: Furniture, Beddings, TV's,
Shades and Linoleum. Stop in and
see for yourself. Liberal credit.

S & H GREEN STAMPS — will be
given on ALL Merchandise, inclu-
ding delicious Breyer's Ice Cream,
Baumgardner's Bakery. 8-15-tf

FOR SALE — Used Furniture:
kitchen set, chairs, tables, rockers,
chest of drawers, dressers, wardrobes,
utility cabinets, stands, des'Ics, stoves,
electric heaters, baby furniture, bi-
cycles, radios, dishes, kitchen set,
2 small cabinets and 2 base cabinets,
4-drawer Macey filing cabinet with
lock, small kitchen range, like new;
rifles, apt. refrigerator; almost any-
thing else. Stop and look! Abra's
Garage, Keymar, Md. Phone SPruce
5-3252. 9-12-ti

BRING YOUR FILMS to us for
EXPERT printing and developing;
24 hour service on black and white-
48 hour service on COLOR Work.
Complete stock of Films - Flashbulbs
- Cameras and Flash outfits—Taney-
town Pharmacy—Free S &H Green
Stamps.

RADIO AND TELEVISION Re-
pairing — Also Aerial Repairing.
2% miles north of Taneytown on
Walnut Grove Road. Service Charge,
$1.00. L. M. Clabaugh, phone PL.
6-4162. 9-5-7t

REDUCED PRICES — All Alum-
inum Storm Doors and Windows. The
new Air Master preducts, triple track
Alcoa aluminum. — Ohler's Metal
Shop—phone: PL 6-6138, Taneytown.

9-27-ti

CARD PARTY — Every Monday
night beginning at 8 P. M. Harney
V.F.W., Harney, Md. 9-4-ti

FOR RENT — Second Floor Apt.,
5 large rooms and bath. Immediate
possession. Elwood Baumgardner.
Phone: PL 6-6151. 6-27-tf

NOTICE—Dial PL 6-6548 for your
Sand, Stone, Blocks and General
Hauling. Fertilizer and Lime. —
Thurston Putman. 7-21-tf

SEE US — for Chick and Pullet
orders, anytime. —Taneytown Grain
& Supply Co. Phone: PL 6-6666.

3-14-tf

FOR SALE—New and used Type-
writers and Adding Machines, Rib-
eons and Carbon Paper. Also Ma-
chines for rent.--Charles L. Stone-
sifer, Representative of Remington
Rand, Inc., Tane:etown, Md., phone
PL. 6-6660 or PL. 6-6789. 5-9-tf

CARD PARTY — Every Saturday
night, Harney Vol. Fire Co. Hall at
8 P. M. (EST). 9-29-ti

FOR WEDDING Invitations and
announcements, reception cards, en-
gagement announcements, napkins,
birth announcements, complete selec-
tion, see—The Carroll Record Co.

8-11-ti

NOTICE— To my garbage custom-
.rs: We take care of collection of
!tins, bottles, glass, garbage, and pa-
oer. Other articles such as tree and
3hubbery trimmings, wire, old roofing.
building partitions, bricks and plaster
will be collected and charges will be
made accordingly.—Walter Benschoff
Taneytown's Garbage Collector.

8-25-ti

The Service 10:00 A. M.; Monday,
Nursery, Beginner and Primary De-
partments Halloween Party 7:30 P.
M.; Tuesday, Junior Department's
Halloween Party 7:00 P. M.; Thurs-
day, Youth Choir 7:00 P. M., Senior
Choir 8:00 P. M.

Piney Creek Church of the Breth-
ren, Rev. Warren M. Eshbach, pastor.
—Sunday School 9:30 A. M., Wor-
ship Service 10:40 A. M., Group Bible
Study 7:30 P. M., Prayer Service
8:30 P. M. Choir Rehearsal, Wed.,
7:00 P. M., Jr. Choir; 7:45 P. M.,
Senior Choir. Women's Fellowship
1st Tues. of every month. CBYF, 1st
and 3rd Sunday evenings of month
at 6:30 P. M.

Messiah Evangelical United Breth-
ren Church—Rev. Paul E. Rhinehart,
D.D., pastor, 25 Middle St., Taney-
town, Md. Mr. Ray Copenhaver, Supt
Mrs. Doris Garvin, organist.

Services Sunday, Oct. 27, 1963,
9:15 A. M. Sunday School, 10:15 A.
M., Worship and Sermon; Men's Day.
The pastor will preach the sermon.
7:45 P. M., Youth Fellowship, U.R.
invited. Thurs., 7:30 P. M. Sr. Choir
Rehearsal.

Taneytown Charge of the United
Church of Christ—William F. Wiley,
B.D., pastor.
Grace Church, Taneytown — 9:15

A. M., Church School; 10:30 A. M.
Divine Worship, sermon: "The Com-
fort of the Church," third and final
sermon in the series, "The Comforts
of the Christian Life." Members of
the visitation for Christian Enlist-
ment (Kingdom Roll Call) for Sun.,
Nov. 10, to meet immediately after
Service this Sun., Oct. 27. Musical
Program, Sun. Oct. 27, 7:30 P. M.,
sponsored by Graceful Workers Class.
Confirmation Class, Sunday evening
at 6:15. Wed.. 9:30 A. M., Radio Sta-
tion WTTR Morning Devotions, con-
ducted by the Pastor. Wed., 7:00 P.
M., Junior Choir; 8:00 P. M., Senior
Choir. Thurs., 7:00 P. M., Carroll
County Supper Rally for the men of
the church with Dr. Lewis Maddocks
of Washington, D.C., as the speaker.

Grace Church, Keysville — 9:00
A. M., Divine Worship, sermon: "The
Comfort of the Church," third and
final sermon in the series, "The Com-
forts of the Christian Life." Mon.,
Oct. 28, 8:00 P. M., Committee for the
Council of Lay Life and Work will
meet at the Parish House.

Taneytown United Presbyterian
Church, Rev. William M. Hendricks,
pastor.
Sunday, Oct. 27, 1963, 8:45 A. M.

Church School, 9:45 A. M. Morning
Worship. The Junior Choir will sing
"Under His Wings." Sermon, "People
of a Book." Wednesday at 7:30, Choir
rehearsal. Thursday at 7:30, the
Missionary Society will meet at the
home of Mrs. Fred Martin. The meet-
ing is one week early.

St. Paul's Lutheran Church, Har-
ney—Rev. John Fry, Supply Pastor.
Worship Service 9:00 A. M., Sunday
School 10:00 A. M.

Keysville Lutheran Church, Rev.
Donald C. Brake, pastor. Sunday
School, 9:30 A. M.; Worship Service,
10:45 A. M.

Maybe) ry Church of God — Sun-
day School at 10:15 A. M. Worship
Service at 11:00 A. M.

The Pipe Creek Charge — Union-
town, Maryland. — Uniontown, 9:00
A. M. Worship, 10:00 A. M. Church
School.
Pipe Creek (Brick), 10:10 A. M.

Worship, 11:10 A. M. Church School.
St. James (on Marston Road) —

10:00 A. M. Church School, 11:15
A. M. Worship.

Uniontown Circuit Churches of God.
Uniontown—Bible School 9:30 A.

M., Worship Service 10:30 A. M., Or-
dinance Service 7:30 P. M. Prayer
Meeting and Bible Study, Wednes-
day, 7:30 P. M.
Frizellburg—Worship Service 9:00

A. M., Bible School 10:00 A. M., GG
YA 7:00 P. M. Prayer Meeting and
Bible Study, Thursday, 7:30 P. M.
Fred E. Horner, pastor.

Hampstead Youth For Christ —
has announced two showings of the
new Christian sports film, "Play for
Keeps," on Saturday night, October
26. The full length color film will
be shown at 8 P. M. and again at
9 P. M.

"CITIZENS OF TOMORROW"

Pictured above are: Lynda,
2 years and Sharon, 3 years,
daughters of Mr. and Mrs.
Kenneth Crou,se, 48 Middle
Street, Taneytown.

WITH THE ARMED FORCES

GREAT LAKES, ILL. (FHTNC)—
Peery I. Riffle. iS. son of Mr. and
Mrs. Wilson A. Riffle of 25 Fairview
Avenue, Donald L. Koontz, 18, son
a Mr. and Mrs. George E. Koontz of
Route 1; Gerald R. Tracey, 17, son of
Mr. and Mrs. Myron R. Iracey of 140
East Baltimore Street, all of Taney-
town, Md., are undergoing nine weeks
training at the Naval Training Cen-
ter, Great Lakes, Ill.
The program includes naval his-

tory and organization, ordnance and
gunnery, seamanship and damage
control, sentry duty and military
drill, physical fitness, first aid and
survival.
During the training recruits com-

plete tests and interviews to deter-
mine (their future assignments in the
Navy. Upon completion of training
they are assigned to service schools
for technical training or to ships and
shore stations for on-the-job training
in a specialized Navy rating.

COMMUNITY LOCALS
(Continued from Page One)

Mrs. Ellen Sklar and children, Lin-
da, Allen and Robert of Ocean City,
spent a few days at the home of Mrs.
Sklar's father, Mr. and Mrs. Carroll
C. Hess.

Mr. and Mrs. Myron McGuigan of
Dennisville, N. J. and Mr. and Mrs.
J. B. Mowbray-Clarke and daughter,
Hester, of Bethesda, were Sunday
dinner guests of the Misses Annan.

Miss Mary Baumgardner and Mrs.
Fern Hitchcock returned home Sun-
day following a five-day excursion
to the Smoky Mountains on a Lincoln
Bus tour.

Visitors at the EUB Parsonage on
Sunday were Mr. Ronald Aughen-
baugh, Mr. and Mrs. Robert E.
Rhinehart and children, Robbie and
Tern, and Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Lind-
ner, all of Baltimore.

Mrs. Harry Whittet, Richmond,
Va., has been visiting since last
Thursday with her brother-in-law
and sister, Dr. and Mrs. Robert Mc-
Vaugh. Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Wiley,
Richmond, Va., came Wednesday tc
the McVaugh home and will be ac-
companied back home Friday by Mrs.
Whittet. Mrs. Wiley is also a sister
of Mrs. McVaugh.

1st Lt. Frank F. Henshaw has been
awarded a regular commission in the
United States Air Force. Lt. Henshaw
is a navigator on the C-124 Globe-
master and is currently stationed at
Hunter Air Force Base, Savannah,
Georgia. He is the son of Mr. and
Mrs. Sir Vantis Henshaw, Westmin-
ster and the husband of the former
Sandra Lee Shorb, daughter of Mr.
and Mrs. Kenneth C. Shorb, Baptist
Road, Taneytown.

CARD OF THANKS

I would like to say thanks to every-
one for their lovely cards and acts
of kindness shown myself and my
girls while I was in the hospital and
since my return home. Thanks again.

MRS BARBARA DAMUTH
AND GIRLS, DIANE AND DONNA

CARD OF THANKS

I wish to express my sincere
thanks and appreciation to everyone
for their kindness, gifts and cards,
the ministers for their visits, and
for use of the ambulance. I espec-
ially want to thank the nurses and
doctors of Carroll County General
Hospital and Brookfield Nursing
Home, to whom I am very grateful.

MRS. WILLIAM ANDERS

CARD OF THANKS

I wish to express my sincere
thanks to my many friends, neigh-
bors, schoolmates and relatives for
the prayers, cards and lovely flowers
which I received during my stay in
the hospital and since my return
home. I also wish to express my
appreciation to the Taneytown Fire
Co. for use of the ambulance.

JANE C. FOWLER

As we have said before, trading at
home is one way to keep some money
circulating here in Taneytown.

God made two great lights; the
greater light to rule the day, and the
lesser light to rule the night.—Old
Testament.

MARRIED

SINGER — DICKINSON
Miss Mary E. Dickinson, daughter

of Mr. and Mrs. Harvey B. Dickin-
son, Sr., Taneytown 1-M, became the
bride of J. Roger Singer, son of Mr.
and Mrs. J. Hamilton Singer, Taney-
town, on Saturday, October 19, at
2 P. M. in Pipe Creek Church of the
Brethren.
The Rev. Austin Cooper performed

the double-ring ceremony. Miss Betty
Waddell, friend of the bride, was
maid of honor. Best man was Aub-
rey Wagner, Jr., friend of the groom.
The bride wore a plain white taf-

feta dress-length gown with three-
quarter length sleeves, fitted bodice
and full skirt with a full rose of
taffeta at the center back waistlnie,
a small white hat with short all-
around veil and a single strand of
pearls. She carried a bouquet of
white gardenias and rosebuds and
a white Bible.

After a brief honeymoon trip they
will reside in Keymar, Md.

THE WAY I SEE IT . . .

Observations on the World of Sports

The calendar says winter is a long
way off, but the first sounds of the
season have already been heard, the
thump of a basketball. The National
Basketball Association has opened an-
other season.
As usual, the league has managed

to come up with new twists here and
there. There have been two franchise
shifts, coaching transfers, a host of
new players, and there is even a new
league president. But the strangest
feeling of all will be caused by the
absence of the man who personified
pro basketball—Bob Cousy of the
Boston Celtics. For the first time in
13 years, the NBA is starting a
season without the alert, quick mov-
ing Celtic, the last of the so-called
little men, who added finesse and
grace to a game now dominated by
towering giants. Cousy has retired
as a player and now coaches the
basketball team at Boston College.

Cousy's brillance no doubt will be
missed by Boston, and all of pro
basketball for that matter, however,
both the Celtics and the league still
have enough talent to entertain and
thrill the buffs of pro basketball.

Bill Russell of the Celtics, Oscar
Robertson of the Royals, Wilt Cham-
berlain of the Warriors, plus Jerry
West and Elgin Baylor of the Lakers
all are ready to go again. And, this
year, the game could wind up with a
new super star, Jerry Lucas. The
former Ohio State All-American has
decided to play for the Cincinnati
Royals. There is some question as
to whether Lucas will be quite the
whiz he was in college ball, but, the
question will not go unanswered
for long.
As to the new franchises, the Bal-

timore Bullets are back in the league
after an absence of several years. The
new Baltimore team last year played
in Chicago as the Zephyrs. Two form-
er Big Ten stars, Walt Bellamy and
Terry Dischinger, form the nucleus
of the club.
The Philadelphia 76-ers will be

making their debut in a new location.
Last year, and for several years be-
fore that, they played in Syracuse
and were known as the Nationals.
They fill the void left when the
Warriors quit the Quaker city for
San Francisco. The Syracuse scoring
ace Dolph Schayes is now the coach
of the team, which features Hall
Greer, Lee Shaffer and Johnny Kerr.
Alex Hannum, who coached at Sy-

racuse, is now the coach of the War-
riors in San Francisco. He has the
league's leading scorer in Wilt Cham-
berlain. But, the Warriors have shown
they need more than Wilt's scoring
to make good. Hannurn insists they
will try something new this time, a
varied attack, with the other players
also taking shots, and Chamberlain
feeding them when possible. That's
what Bob Feerick said last year when
he took over as Warriors coach.

Another coaching switch finds
Charley Wolf now with the Detroit
Pistons. He was at Cincinnati last
year. Bailey Howell and Dave De-
busschere (with the White Sox dur-
ing the summer) are Wolf's key men.

Wolf's replacement at Cincinnati is
.Tack McMahon. who coached Chicago
last year. McMahon starts anew with
a team that has Oscar Robertson and
that's quite a start. If Lucas pans
out, the Royals could be a title threat.
The New York Knicks are far from

being a title threat, but they should
show improvement, largely because
they picked up two of the best in the
rookie crop—Art Heymen of Duke
and Jerry Harkness of Loyola of
Chicago. Boston again is the favorite
in the East, even with Cousy gone.
Russell, the Jones boys, Sam and
K. C., and Tommy Heinsohn are still
around.
The Los Angeles Lakers are ex-

pected to repeat in the west, but they
could get a stiff fight from the St.

1
Louis Hawks. Elgin Baylor and Jerry
West of the Lakers form the best
one-two scoring punch in the league.
The Hawks again have Bob Pettit,
Cliff Hagan and Len Wilkens, which
makes them contenders.
There is a new head man in the

NBA this year, J. Walter Kennedy,
who succeeds the retired Maurice
Podoloff as League President. There
will be 360 games before the league
gets around to the division semi-
finals. Then it will be the division
finals, and finally, the championship
series. By that time, the baseball
season will be getting started again.
Remember When Dept.—The Balti-

more Bullets had the Rookie of the

Year in the NBA, in 1953. It was
their center, Ray Felix, who is still
playing with the Lakers.
Today's Sports Laugh—There is a

constant clamor to raise the height
of the baskets in basketball but coach
Adolph Rupp of Kentucky says it's
all right with him if they lowered this
year. Says Rupp: "We don't have
many tall players this season."

—John Breth

"SHOEMAKER REUNION"

The 11th annual reunion of the
descendants of John   and
Catherine Beecher Shoemaker was
held October 13th in Messiah Lu-
theran Church Social Hall. There
were 34 present. Robert Shoemaker
offered prayer, which was followed by
a basket lunch; after which a bus-
iness session was held.
The following officers were elected

for the next year: James Bushey,
president; Norman Hull, vice-pres-
ident; Mattie Shoemaker, Secretary
and Virginia Bushey, historian. The
program included, a hymn, "Take
Time To Be Holy:" Mrs. Robert Shoe-
maker conducted a number of enjoy-
able games and prizes were given. It
was voted to send a remembrance to
the shut-ins and to meet in Harney,
Md., 2nd Sunday in October 1964.
Closing with a hymn, "God Be With
You 'Till We Meet Again."
There were in attendance relatives

from: Salisbury, Hagerstown, Taney-
town, Westminster and local vicinity.

PUBLIC SALE REGISTER
OCTOBER

23-24-10:30 A. M. Charles W. Bol-
linger and Son, Route 2, Emraits-
burg, Md. 2-day sale, cattle, farm
machinery and household furni-
ture. Five auctioneers.

25-10 A. M., Morgan and Beasley.
Keymar, Md. Dairy cattle and
equipment, f arm machinery.
Glenn & James Trout, Aucts. o

26—Mrs. Lewis E. McClain, Fairfield,
Pa. 1 mi. W. of Zora. Household
goods. Calvin Amoss, Auct. o

26-11 A. M. Community Auction, 2
miles E. of Taneytown on Taney-
town-Westminster Rd. Hank Mc-
Nair, Auct.

30-1 o'clock. Amoss L. Stoltzfus,
Mechanisville, Md. Valuable real
estate. Guss Shank, Auct.

31-6 o'clock. Community Auction,
253 E. Baltimore St., Taneytown.
Guss Shank, Auct.

NOVEMBER

2-10:30 A. M., Norman G. Devilbiss,
86 W. Baltimore St., Taneytown.
Real Estate and Personal Prop-
erty. Guss Shank, Auct.

13-14-10:30 A. M. Louise R. and
John A. Baker, 4 miles S. of Tan-
eytown on Frederick Rd. Dairy
Herd and Farm Machinery. Guss
Shank. Auct.

NO TRESPASSING

All persons are hereby forewarned
not to trespass on my premises with
dog, gun, or trap, for the purpose of
shooting or taking game of any kind,
or for fishing, or in any way injuring
or destroying property.

This warning applies to both Day
and Night Hunting or Trapping.

Airing, Richard E.
Amoss, William I.
Baumgardner, J. S. (2 farms)
Becker, Maurice W.
Brawner, C. S.
Cantwell, Thomas
Devilbiss, Myrle
Glass, Ellis
Irvin, A. J. and Sons
Kephart, Mrs. Charles B.
Lord, Jr., James
Miller, William H.
Motter, Clarence J.
Ohler, C. L. (Wm. Houck Farm)
Overholtzer, Maurice M.
Parker, Mrs. Mildred
Peterson, Stuart (2 farms)
Reaver, Mrs. Stanley
Rohrbaugh, Charles F.
Shank, Emmitt
Shorb Farm, The Harvey
Slaybaugh, Mrs. Laura
Stambaugh, Charles (2 farms)
Utz, W. Wilson

Republicans Honor Senator Beall

Photo courtesy of The (Hanover) Evening Sun.

Front row, left to right: Mrs. J. Glenn Beall, Senator J. Glenn Beall, Mrs.
William Hepburn, President of the State Federation of Republican Women; Mrs.
John S. Harner, President of the Federation of Republican Women in Taneytown.

Back row, left to right: Jacob Yingling, House of Delegates; Alvie Spencer, Jr.,
Chairman of State Central Committee of Carroll County; T. Bryan McIntire, Jr.,
State's Attorney; Raymond Perry, Mayor of Taney-town.

United States Senator
and Mrs. J. Glenn Beall
were honored guests at
the Harvest Tea given by
the Federation of Repub-
lican Women on Saturday
afternoon, October, 19 at
Taney Inn.
Delmar Riffle played

selections on the electric
organ while tea was
poured. Mrs. William
Hepburn, president of the
Maryland State Federa-
tion of Republican Wom-
en was escorted by Mrs.
John S. Harner, the local
president, in greeting
guests.
Senator Beall extended

greetings and made a
short talk. Alvie Spencer,
Jr., Chairman of State
Central Committee; May-
or and Mrs. Raymond
Perry, Jacob Yingling.
Republican member of
the House of Delegates;
T. Bryan McIntire, Jr..
State's Attorney, and
Mrs. McIntire; and Jos-
eph H. Hahn, Jr., and
Mrs. Hahn mingled with
the guests.

Co-chairmen for the oc-
casion were Mrs. Hewitt
MacPherson and Mrs.
James Baumgardner, as-
sisted by Mrs. George
Harmon. Those who pour-
ed were Mrs. William
Hopkins, Mrs. Stanley
King, Mrs. Edward More-
lock, Mrs. Clyde Hesson,
Mrs. Norman Sauble and
Miss Lois Brown.
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A NEW 
MODERN 

FARMING 
METHOD

STALK BALING.
BALEMASTER fits

BHaiolelanr d

BALEMASTER

cutter head
attachment

• Cuts, shreds, bales corn stalks in one operation. Merely
remove baler pick-up and attach Balemaster.
• Flail-type, shredding action takes power from baler

flywheel.

• High absorption, low-cost animal bedding is in demand.
is To speed up hay baling, the Balemaster handles big

heavy windrows very efficiently.

YINGLING'S IMPLEMENT

NEW HOLLAND, MINNEAPOLIS, MOLINE and FOX

Sales and Service

Phone: Littlestown 359-4848
Mailing Address, Gettysburg Route 1

10-24-2t

430teltB:91=1130242.13240544=4103243,32131etlIftrilli

New Brick 3-Bedroom Ranch-Type Homes /
IN AND NEAR TANEYTOWN
Several To Choose From
ATTRACTIVELY PRICED

J. S. Clagett
REAL ESTATE

Phone: PL 6 - 6519 — Taneytown, Md.
10-12-tf
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N 0 W IS THE TIME TO ORDER
YOUR 1964 CALENDARS

The public really values the "calendar" given to customers by
the home town businesses as a token of appreciation for their
patronage, more and more each year as fewer calendars are given
out nowadays as in bygone days. Therefore, to avoid disappoint-
ment come in right away and see our large line of samples, and
place your order for calendars NOW!

THE CARROLL RECORD CO.
Taneytown, Maryland
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Get Pre-Season

Discount on

Southern States

Hybrid Seed Corn

*$1.00 OFF!
On Each Bushel
You Reserve Now

• Nothing to pay 'til delivery
• Take delivery anytime

through April 17
• Don't delay—limited time offer

Top-quality Yield-Boosting Seed
• Double-tested for germination • Double-treated
against insects and disease • All varieties certified
• Field-tested in your state • Backed by SS money-
back seed Guarantee and SS Replant Agreement—
top protection for you.

SOUTHERN STATES
TANEYTOWN COOPERATIVE

Inc.
PHONE: PL 6-6711
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Your Southern States Cooperative Agency

ARK WELL
9a4ee,4t-at4e9 STAPLERS

OBRO
Staples, Pins and Tacks

0790 Complete with 1000 Staples

PACEMAKER
Staples, Pins and Tacks

$1" s250 $325

Complete with 500 Staples

TACIUvIASTER
Gun Type Tacker

1891 Complete with 1000 Staples

FOR OFF1CI

FACTORY

HOME

STUDIST, ITC -

For Sale at---

STA-PLYER
Ws Complete with SOO Repko

The Carroll Record Co.
TANEYTOWN. MARYLAND

WE HAVE IT! NEW MONARCH PORTABLE
BY REMINGTON GIVES YOU 12 EXTRA FEA-
TURES NEVER BEFORE ASSEMBLED
ON ANY PORTABLE UNDER $1009.9

Single Key Sets Card & Writing Line
Columns & Indents! Scale!

•I 2-color Ribbon & 0 Adjustable Paper
'ffi• Stencil Control! u Edge Guide!
2 Erasure Table on

Cylinder!
A Removable Top

Cover!
i c Calibrated Scale on 

Paper Bail! 
4 4

Touch Regulator I'• 

9 Variable Line Spacer!

[ocaVge Centering

Calibrated Paper 12 Lighter Weight!.7 Table!

OUR PRICE
ONLY

Charles L. Stonesiter
TANEYTOWN. MD.

DEALER
REMINGTON RAND PORTABLE TYPEWRITERS

AND ADDING MACHINES
RIBBONS AND CARBON PAPER

Open Evenings by Appointment

Pi 

Plus

e Tax

Shrimp Feed and Dance
FRIDAY, OCTOBER 25, 1963

8:00 P. M.

$2.00 — ALL YOU CAN EAT

Monocacy Valley Post 6918 V. F. W.
HARNEY, MARYLAND

Your Advertisement

Should Appear

Here IND ONO MO

Many Readers Will See It!

DOLLARS SENT
AWAY FOR

PRINTING
ifl Never Come Back

Let Us Do Your Printing

A Good Way
to Worm Cattle

Your cattle will grow and gain more efficiently when
you knock out profit-robbing worms. Safe, palatable
Purina Cattle and Sheep Wormer Concentrate can de
the job. A recent cattle feeding demonstration showed
that every dollar invested in Cattle and Sheep Wormer-
Concentrate returned $6 to $8 in extra beef produced.

Just add this pelleted Health
Aid to your regular ration as
directed, or ask us to mix Cattle
and Sheep Wormer Concentrate
with your feed.

It always pays to worm cattle.
Do it safely, easily with Purina
Cattle and Sheep Wormer Con-
centrate mixed with the feed.
Ask for it at our store.

Taneytown Grain Ca Supply Co.
PHONE: PL 6 - 6666
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

More Power For Large Acreage Farms

This big 14,000 pound tractor with more power for the bigger
acreage farms and more comfort for the operator was added to
the Allis-Chalmers line. A 119 horsepower diesel engine gives the
new D-21 enough power to pull a seven-bottom moldboard plow. The
tractor also features power steering and wheel treads that can be
spaced for row crop work. _

In Our 7717re
•

TURKEY CARVI4/6 /5 AN ART.
ANY MAN CAN MASTER IT W/79 THE /15W
,ELECTR/C SLICING RN/FE 0E5/6/VE.2 70 /1/%5
CARVING ANO suciNG ROASTS ANO POULTRY t<5'
545/ER.ANO Pc0FE-55/ONAL...

THE ELECTRIC KNIFE 
—

HA/VOLE, CONTAINING KRALAST/C,
STYLEO IN ANTIQUE WHITE ANO

BROWN/ IS HEAT; GREASE ANO
IMPACT RESISTANT.

zivr.

,

CHEF SECRETS
ON HOW TO CARVE
ROAST TURKEY
OR CHICKEN.-

1. PLACE ROAST TURKEY WITH' LEG TO RIGHT
START WITH SIPS FACING YOU. GRASP LEG
WITH FINGERS /WO PULL AWAY WH/LECUT71NG
THROUGH MEAT ANO JOINT.

2. CUT THROUGH 771/6H BONE ANL, LEO JOINT.
SLICE MEAT FROM LEG A//0 THIGH PARALLEL
TO BONE. SET AS/OE WHILE CARVING 5REA57:

3, Car THROUGH JOINT WHERE WING
JOINS 500X.. JUST ABOVE JOINT BEGIN
CARVING THIN SLICES OF WHITE MEAT
POW//WARP WHEN CREST OF EFREAST
IS REACHEO TURN 571iVAROUNO
AMP REPEAT CARVING.
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BY DR. KENNETH J. FOREMAN

traernanonal Uneorm
Sunday School Lessons

Two Kinds of Love
Lesson for October 27, 1963

Bible Material: I Corinthians 11:2
through 13:13.

Devotional Reading: John 15:9-17.

WHEN THE religion of Christ
began to spread through the

world, it was so new and totally
different from everything that had
been called by the name of religion
before that Christians almost had
to find new words to express it.

One example is
the familiar Eng-
lish word "Love."
We all know the
13th chapter of I
Corinthians by
heart (or if we
don't, now is the
time to learn it!)
and we have said
all our lives that

Dr. Foreman love is the great-
est thing in the world.. What's new

• about that? Unfortunately, the
• newness of the idea of "love" can-

not be expressed in our English
language, but it can in Greek,
which is the language of all the
New Testament books. For the
Greeks often had several words for
(almost) the same thing, and they
used these words to express the
different varieties of whatever it
was they were talking about. For
example, there were four different
words in Greek Which can all be
translated "love," and two in par-
ticular, "eros" (rhymes with mo-
rose) and "agape" (pronounced
a-GAH-pay).
Selfish love is shellfish love
By far the more familiar one of

these two words was eros; the
other one is hardly ever found be-
-fore the Christians got hold of it
and began using it. Eros is some-
thing everybody knows about; and
no pagan Greek could have seen
the point if Saint Paul had told
him eros is the greatest thing in
the world. But it isn't, and Paul
didn't say it was. Eros can be a
kind of mental sickness, it can be
frustrating, it can injure the one
who has it, for it is what is often
called "possessive" love. It is the
love a domineering mother has for
a child she keeps tied to her apron.
strings. It is the love of a jealous
lover who can't bear to see his
sweetheart smile at another man.
The song of eros is "1 want you all
for mine." This can be very sweet,
and there is room for it in the va-
ried experiences of life. But it can
be frustrating and painful, for it is
never fulfilled. The eros-lover is
never satisfied, always anxious lest
his sweet possession be swept from
him. And at the worst, eros-love
destroys personality, for the tend-
ency of eros to seize and to hold is
like the action of a clam caring not
a minnow's worth for any creature
around it, opening its shell only to
take in, never to give. (Who ever
heard of a generous clam?)

God-like love .
The love of which Paul so elo-

quently and beautifully writes, is
not eros, it is agape. Wherever in
the New Testament the love of
God for his children is spoken of,
it is always agape, not eros. Now
the special glory of agape is that
its desire is not to be served but to
serve. Eros is love that stops being
love when it finds its affection is
not returned. Eros is fastidious; it
loves only what is lovable and no-
ble. Eros demands that what is
loved come up to a certain stand-
ard. Agape loves others as they
are, where they are. But agape is
never content to leave the loved
ones where they are. Agape love is
transforming love. If God's love
were eros, he would be waiting yet
—and he might wait forever—till
man was good enough to deserve
to be loved. But God loved us
"while we were yet sinners."
Agape transforms the unworthy.
Eros vanishes when the loved ob-
ject fades; Agape, itself unfading,
creates a never-fading beauty in
the object of love.
Where love is needed
Now it needs no argument to

persuade us that agape-love is
needed in this distraught world.
Persons and nations perish for the
lack of it. Is there any place where
we can find enough agape-love to
go around? Is there any company
of pilgrims on this earth who have
fed on this bread of heaven till
they want no more? One answer
comes straight to mind: The
church, of course the church! It is
no doubt indeed the one company
out of all mankind which makes
love its aim; it is the one company
which has no excuse for its exist-
ence if it does not make love its
aim. But the church has never
achieved this love, or has never
achieved it in such measure that it
can say, we need no more. Paul
speaks of the need for love, to men
and women who had many gifts of
the spirit; he speaks of it to those
who worshipped with joyful hearts.
But even at the very throne of
grace, who can say that he has
loved enough?

(Based on outlines copyrighted by the
Diviaion of Christian Education, National
Council of the Churches of Christ in the
U. S. A. Released by Community Prima
Service.)

PROGRAM SCHEDULE
WF MD Frederick, Maryland

93 on your A M Radio Dial

4:58 Sign On
5:00 Getting Up Time
5:25 Ministerium
5:30 World News, Weather
5:35 Getting Up Time
6:00 World News, Weather
6:05 Getting Up Time
6:30 World News
6:35 Weather Forecast
0:40 Getting Up Time
7:00 World News, Weather
7.05 Getting Up Time
7:30 Area News, Weather
7:35 Getting Up Time
7:55 Community News
8:00 World News Roundup
8:15 Morning Show
8:30 Area News, Weather
8:35 Morning Show
8:55 Morning Report
9 :00 CBS News
9 :08 Area News, Weather
9:10 Arthur Godfrey
10:00 CBS News
10:08 Area News, 3%

- 
cattier

10:10 House Party
10:30 Dear Abby
10:35 Garry Moore
10:45 Morning Melodies
11:00 CBS News
11 :08 Area News, Weather

MONDAY THRU FRIDAY
11:10
11 :30
11 :35
12:00
12:05
12:10
12:30
12:35
1:00
1 :08
1 :10
1:30
1:35
2 :00
2:08
2:10
2:15
2:30
2:35
3:00
3:08
3:10
3:30
3:35
4 :00
4:08
4:10
4:30
4:35
5:05
5:10

Gospel Light Program
Women of Washington
Happy Johnny
World & Area News
Agriculture News
Happy Johnny
Weather Forecast
Happy Johnny
CBS News
Area News, Weather
Happy Johnny
Woman's World
Happy Johnny
CBS News
Area News, Weather
Here's Hollywood
Bob Helder Show
Fashion Scope
Bob Helder Show
CBS News
Area NeWs, Weather
Bob Helder Show
Personal Close-Up
Bob Helder Show
CBS News
Area News, Weather
Bob Helder Show
Sidelights
Bob Helder Show
World News
Evening Show

5:25 CBS News
5:33 Area Weather
5:34 Evening Show
6:00 CBS News
6:05 Area News, Weather
6:10 Sports News
6:15 Dinner Date
6:30 Headlines, Weather
6:32 Dinner Date
6:45 Lowell Thomas
6:55 Sports Time
7:00 CBS News
7:08 Area News, Weather
7:10 Evening Report
7:15 Worldwide Sports
7:30 Ask Dimension
7:311 Easy Listening
8:00 The World Tonight
8:15 Night Sounds in Music
9:00 CBS News, Weather
9:05 Night Sounds in Music
9:30 Headlines, Weather
9:32 Night Sounds in Music
10:00 CBS News, Weather
10:05 Night Sounds in Music
10:45 Armed Forces Review
11:00 World & Area News
11:05 Sports & Weather
11:19 Be Still & Know
11 :15 Sign Off

4:58 Sign On 11:35
5:00 Getting Up- Time 12:00
5:25 Ministerium 12:05
oat) World News, Weather 12:10
5:35 Getting Up Time 12:30
6:00 World News, Weather 12:35
6:05 Getting Up Time
6:30 World News 

1 :00. 
1:05

6:35 Weather Forecast 10
6:40 Getting Up 'Nine 

1 
:30

7:00 World News, Weather 1 :35

7:30 Area News, Weather 22::(0)05
7 :05 Getting Up Time

7:55 Community News 
2 :107 :35 Getting Up Time
2:30

8:00 World News Roundup 2:32
S :15; Saturday „Show 3:00
8:30 Better Living 3:05
8:35 Saturday Show

3()9:00 CBS News, Weather 3:35:3
9:05 Saturday ' Show 4:00
9:30 The Week in Space 4:05:3
9:35 Saturday Show 

40

10:00 CBS News, Weather 4:35
10:05 Sports News , 5:00
10:10 Social Security . 5:05
10:15 Guard Session 5:30
10:30 This Week in BuSiness 5:35
10:3.5 F.F.A. News .

0 :°(10:45 Knight Gospel Singers 6:05)
11 :00 CBS News, Weather 6:10
11 :05 Sports News 6:15
11:10 Gospel Light Program 6:30
11:30 European Diary

SATURDAY
Happy Johnny 0:35
World News, _Weather 6:45
Agriculture News 6:50
Happy Johnny 6:55
Weather Forecast 7:00
Happy Johnny 7:05
CBS News, Weather 7:10
Sports News 7:15
Music with Lew Wade 7.30
Dimension of a Dateline 7
Music with Lew Wade 7
CBS News, Weather 8
Sports_News 8
Music with Lew Wade 8
Headlines, Weather 8
Music with Lew Wade 9
CBS News, Weather 9
Saturday Show 9
It's New 9
Saturday Show 10
CBS News, Weather 10
Saturday Show 10
Calling .America 10
Saturday Show 10
CBS News, Weather 11
Saturday Show 11
At Your Leisure 11
Saturday Show 11
World News 11
Area News, Weather 12
Sports News 12
Dinner Date 12
Sound Story 12

CBS News, Weather
Congressional Report
Chamber of Commerce
Sports News
CBS News, Weather
News Analysis
Senator Beall
Army Big Bands
In New York

:35 Easy Listening
:55 Sports News
:00 CBS News
.10 Area News Weather
:15 All Kinds of Music
:30 Music Till Midnight
:00 CBS News, Weather
:05 Music Till Midnight
:30 Headlines, Weather
:XI Music Till Midnight
:00 CBS News, Weather
:05 Music Till Midnight
:30 Headlines, Weather
:32 Music Till Midnight
:45 Pat Boone
:00 World News, Weather
:05 Music Till Midnight
:30 Headlines, Weather
:32 Music Till Midnight
:45 The Navy Swings
:00 World & Area News
:04 Sports & Weather
:07 Be Still & Know
:10 Sign Off

6:5.3 Sign On
6:55 Rock of Ages
7:25 Area News, Weather
7 :30 Church of the Air
7 :85 Community News
8:00 World News, Weather
8:05 Sunday Music

Safety Story ady
13:30 Sports News
8:35 Children's Chapel
13:50 CBS News, Weather
9:00 School Report
9:15 Entertainment, U.S.A.
9:30 Science Beat
9:35 Sunday Music
9:55 Folklore
10:00 CBS News
10 :05 Sports & Weather

Roundup
10:15 World of Folk Music
10:30 Moscow Scene
10:35 What's the Issue?
11:00 Chur,h Service
12:00 World News, Weather
12:05 Sports News

SUNDAY

12:10 Pentecostal Church
12:30 Follow up
12:35 Anatomy of a Headline
12:45 University Explorer
1 :00 CBS News, Weather
1 :05 Sports News
1:10 Sunday Music
1:30 Special from London 7
1:35 Sunday Music 8
1 :55 CBS News, Weather 8
2:00 Sunday Music 8
3:00 CBS News, Weather 8
3:0.5 Sunday Music 8
4 :00 CBS News, Weather 9
4:05 Sunday Music 9
5:00 CBS News, Weather 9
5:05 Sunday Music 9
5:30 White House Corspndt. 10
5:35 Sunday Music 10
6:00 CBS News, Weather 10
6:05 Sports News 10
6:10 The Headliner 11
6:15 Washington Report 11
6:30 'Mediterranean Notebook 11
6:35 Heartbeat Theatre 11

7:
7:
7

7
7

:00
05
10
:15
:30
:35
:40
:55
:00
:10
:25
:30
:45
:00
:05
:10
:35
:00
:05
20
:35
:00
:04
:07
:10

CBS News
Sports News
Area News, Weather
Army Spotlight
In Latin America
Sound Flights
Serenade in Blue
Area News, Weather
CRS News
Alexander Kendrick
Folklore
Weekly Report
Science Editor
CBS News, Weather
News Analysis
Leading Question
Capitol Cloakroom
CBS News, Weather
Union Rescue Mission
The Bible Speaks to You
Salt Lake City Choir
World & Area News
Sports & Weather
Be Still & Know
Sign Off

WF MD.F M — 99.9 Megacycles

5:00 Day by Day
5:05 Melody Time
6:00 Headlines & Weather
6:02 Relaxing Rhythms
7:00 Headlines & Weather

MONDAY THRU FRIDAY
7:02 Serenade
7:29 Calendar of the Arts
7:30 Serenade
8:00 The World Tonight
8:15 Music in the Night

9:00 CBS News & Weather
9:05 Concert Hour
10:00 CBS News & Weather
10:05 Moonlight Melodies
11 :00 Headlines & Weather
11:02 Evening Hymn

5:00 CBS News & Weather 8
5:05 Melody Time 8
6:00 Headlines & Weather 8
6:02 Relaxing Rhythms 9:
7:00 Headlines & Weather 9:
7:02 Serenade 10:
7:29 Calendar of the Arts 10:
7:30 Serenade 10

SATURDAY
:00 Headlines & Weather
:05 Invitation to Learning
:30 Music in the Night
00 CBS News & Weather
05 Concert Hour
00 CBS News & Weather
05 Moonlight Melodies
:30 Science Editor

10:45
11 :00
11 :05
11 :10
11 :15
11 :30
12:00
12:02

University Explorer
Headlines & Weather
In Our Day
Day by Day
Canterbury Hour
Ave Marla Hour
Headlines & Weather
Evening Hymn

NOTE: WFMD-FM also broadcasts "Gettin' Up Time" with Happy Johnny
Monday through Saturday, 5:09.8:00 A. M.
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 By: Jacqueline McConaughey, Color Stylist)
DON'T BE A LOOK-ALIKE

MORE
and more people are

living in housing develop-
ments these days — and more
and more of the houses are
looking alike.
Party guest, first-time visitor,

delivery man,
and oftentimes
the owner him-
self is three
doors from
home and
doesn't recog-
nize it.
The solution

to this is sim-
ple and can be
done with a
little ingenuity
and a little
paint.

What is needed is an identi-
fying mark. Paint your garage
door an off-beat color, different
from your neighbors. Don't be
afraid of sun yellow, bright red

or black. To be absolutely non-
conformist about this, go to
your Du Pont paint dealer and
have him mix for you a special
color using his Custom Color
mixing system. Then you'll
really be original.
Or, if you have an outdoor

light standard, paint it like a
barber pole in a spiral of bright
red and white.
How about a jade green mail-

box ? A can of "Duco" spray
magic enamel will do this job
in a few minutes of push button
operation.
And for night, shine an out-

door spotlight on your distin-
guishing marker for night
visitors.

Don't forget, on your invita-
tions, say ... "Look for the red
and white barber pole" or "the
garage with the blue and green
door paneling."

FUN TO DO ALL YEAR THRU
The National Garden Bureau, the educational service of the

Garden_ Seed Industry, announces the publication of a leaflet
for children titled "Fun To Do All Year Thru," which. contains
a dozen ideas for children using seeds and flowers, gourds and
pumpkins.
The 16-page leaflet contains articles taken from the "Child-

ren's Corner" of the Bureau's press releases, each one illus-
trated, most of them with children doing what the articles de-
scribes.
Leaders of Cub Scout, Brownie Scout, and Bluebird organiza-

tions, chairmen of Junior Garden Clubs or of Horticultural
Therapy groups_ working with children, mothers, all will find
the leaflets' of interest to youngsters with whom they are
in contact.
To obtain a copy, send a large-size, stamped, self addressed

envolope plus 10 cents to National Garden Bureau, 1484 Chapin,
Birmingham, Mkt. Organizations desiring to purchase leaflets
in lots of 100 or- more should write to the address above for
Quantity prices.

NOTICE -

The season for hunting squirrels
"came in" October 5 and the sea-
son for hunting rabbits and par-
tridges begins on November 15th.

Get your "NO HUNTING"
signs at our office. Listing for the
complete season against hunting
and trespassing began this week
in our paper.
THE CARROLL RECORD CO.

Symptoms of Distress Arising from

STOMACH ULCERS
DUE TO EXCESS ACID
QUICK RELIEF OR NO COST

Ask About 15-Day Trial Offer!

Over five million packages of the
WILLARD TREATMENT have been sold
for relief of symptoms of distress arising from
Stomach and Duodenal Ulcers due to Ex-
cess Acid—Poor Digestion, Sour or Upset
Stomach, Gassiness, Heartburn, Sleep-
lessness, etc., due to Exam Acid. Ask for
"Willard's Message" which fully explains
this home treatment —trea-,at

TANEYTOWN PHARMACY

NEWSPAPER
ADVERTISING

AT YOUR
SERVICE

TO.HELP YOU SELL

.104111

 411•1111•111111•1

A1 Purpose Tacker t
For Men and Women •

POWER-PAK TACKMASTER by7Thrlthafe&
The ideal "All-Purpose" Tacker. ... Easy to operate ... for
tireless, steady operation by men or women. Weighs only
20 ounces! Snug stapling nose gets into "hard-to-reach'
areas. COMPACT AND PORTABLE. Fits into pocket, goes
with the operator from job to job. Has built-in Staple

• Remover. Fast trigger action ... Drives staples flush.
s‘Takes 3 staple sizes! Loads up to 140 Markwell

Car-
bon Steel Staples:
RH 3/16" leg, RHD 5/16" leg and RHL 3/8" leg Car- $09 5

Complete with 1000 Asst'd. Staples.......... . only U

The Carroll Record Company

YOUR HOME MERCHANTS
ASK YOU TO "BUY AT HOME"
1111.•=•••••••••••-•

UNCOMMONLY COMMON

There are few things you see more frequently than

the telephone. Virtually everybody has one.

This is what makes your phone so uncommonly useful.

Friends, neighbors, stores, doctors, business associates

—you name it—can be reached so easily by telephone.

You save time, trips to town and all kinds of trouble.

Your phone gives you convenience that's indispensable

—that can often make the impossible possible.

That's why low-cost telephone service is so uncom-

monly high in value.

The

Telephone Company of Maryland
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Mb ANNIVERSARY OBSERVED YOUR P.-T.A.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Vanfossen,
near town, were given a surprise
10th Anniversary celebration Satur-
day evening in the social room of
Krider's Church, Westminster, by
Mn. Vanfossen's daughter and son-
in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Robert Warner,
Westminster.
The decorations were appropriate

to the occasion with lighted candles,
wedding bells and fall flowers. The
3-tier wedding cake was baked by
Mrs. Russell Warner, Westminster.
Mrs. Vanfossen was presented with
an orchid corsage by her daughter,
Patty. The couple received many
lovely aa-id useful gifts. Delicious
refreshments were served. There
were thirty guests present.

FAREWELL TO OCTOBER

Farewell to October, with skies
bright and blue,

Farewell to her sun, warm and
mellow,

Farewell to her glorious color-
scheme, too,

Of flame red, and amber, and yellow.

Farewell to October, with days
sparkling clear,

Farewell to her breezes, caressing,
Farewell to this bountiful month of

the year,
A time of rich harvest, and blessing!

—by Zola Cantwell.

MONOCACY DRIVE-IN
TANEYTOWN, MD.

SHOW STARTS AT DUSK!

Fri., Sat., Sun., October 25-26-27

Burt Lancaster — Jean Simmons

"Elmer Gantry"

PLUS

Mamie Van Doren—Richard Coogan

"Vice Raid"

PLUS

&nest Borgnine— Anne Baxter

"Season of Passion"

Free donuts and coffee to all
on Friday nite!

11.11ENIIISEUID:OONEDOEUM=IIMS

I SPECIAL NOTICE g
o1 Bell's Snack Bar I

Will close for the season:
31(

on October 27 and will i

re-open in March.

tl I wish to thank my friends for iOE
Z their patronage during the sea- 1

I son and will look forward to
their business next Spring.

N
11

0 NELSON E. BELL
•

MITInnsi

DON 'TCAUGHT
With Your

F-0-6* DOWN
*Warp's FLEX-0-GLASS, that is.

Cover all openings NOW
(doors, windows, porches) that
let in cold winter drafts. Just
cut Warp's FLEX-0-GLASS
with shears, tack over screens
or frames for low-cost winter
protection. Warp's genuine,
crystal-clear FLEX-0-GLASS
lasts for years at a fraction
the cost of glass. Only 87g a
square yard at your local hard-
ware or lumber dealer.

WE HAVE THE GENUINE
'A TOP QUALITY

WINDOW
711„,../...00 •v MATERIALS
HOLD IN HEAT-KEEP OUT COLD

Cheaper than ulass—For Storm
Doors and Windows, Perch Letdown's

LEO-GLASS
LASS-0-NET

WYR-0-GLASS
'PSCREEN-GLASS
**FLEXO.PANE

The Reindollar Co.

Picture yourself at a P.-T.A. you'll
be:

Hearing about the school program.
Seeing exhibits and demonstrations

of schoolwork and teaching methods.
Learning how you can help your

child at home.
Chatting informally with teachers.
Meeting the parents of his class-

mates.
Join your local P.-T.A. now.

COMMUNITY AUCTION

Sat. morning, Oct. 26, 1963

1 1 :00 A. :\ J.
LOCATED

Two miles East of Taneytown on
Westminster - Taneytown Road, the
following will be sold:

Marble top bureau, plank bottom
chair, potbelly stove, over 30 bottles
(collector's items), iron kettles, wag-
on jack, wash bowl and pitcher, car-
nival glass, goblets, antique glass-
ware, crocks, jugs, brass chandilier,
cranberry scoop, executive chair, roll-
top desk, cook stoves, refrigerators,
cabinets, breakfast sets, space het
era, washing machines, new washing
machine motor, electric range, air
conditioner, ironer, chopping block,
sewing machine, overstuffed chairs,
platform rocker, shallow water pump,
1939 Buick, 18-5 gallon cans of plas-
tic floor emulsion, Silvertone Hi Fi
set, gossip bench, bedroom suite,
twin beds, chest of drawers, baby
crib, youth bed, cricket chair, table
model TV set, radio phono. combi-
nation, lots of records, small corner
cupboard, 2 girls bicycles, coffee
tables, end tables, flat irons, toys,
portable phonograph, tools, car top
luggage carrier, roll of fencing, roller
skates, ice skates, kerosene lamps, a(
table lamps, several pieces of maple Z
living room furniture, several pieces
of old money, deep fat fryer, ironing
boards; other items too numerous to
mention.

Terms: CASH.
HANK McNAIR, Auctioneer.

DEAN REED, Clerk.
Not responsible for accidents.

Anyone having anything to sell,
call PLymouth 6-6807 or FRanklin
4-4767.

10-17-2t

TANEYTOWN GRAIN MARKETS

WHEAT   $1.80
BARLEY   $1.10
OATS   $ .75
NEW CORN   $1.45

STILL TARGET

SHOOTING MATCH
FRIDAY, OCTOBER 25

7:30 P. M.

PRIZES: Turkeys and Hams

ONLY 12 GAUGE GUNS
Shells Furnished

TANEYTOWN ROD and GUN CLUB
MILE EAST OF TANEYTOWN ON MILL ROAD

VIDTIOID211.12411111131DaDltirISIMETtill=31(12111014110211EDZIKUIONDIrieririerir

TANEY INN
SPECIAL DINNER

SUNDAY, OCTOBER 27, 1963

ROAST TURKEY AND OYSTER

FAMILY STYLE

11:30 A. M. — 7:00 P. M.

AUDIERIDIOLTERUDIERLDIERUNIIINLIMMERVIERDIRAUNITTOAUDEADIERNIKIIMIERISIts.
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GUSS SHANK COMMUNITY AUCTION
THURS. EVENING, OCTOBER 31, 1963

AT 6:00 O'CLOCK P. M., D.S.T.

LOCATED AT 253 E. BALTIMORE ST., IN TANEYTOWN, MD.

4-Gun walnut gun case, 2-pc. living room suite, swivel chair, 5-pc.
breakfast set, metal cabinet, floor lamp, 2 table lamps, vanity lamps,
end tables, coffee tables, ash tray on stand, small table, foot stool,
electric stove, (NOTE — all above merchandise is like new); china
dolls, cuspidors, crocks, clocks, rope bed, high chair, electric fry
cooker, three televisions, 2 good refrigerators, good Tapan gas range,
double door wardrobe, desk, school desk, cook stove, oil drums, lot of
books, lot of new clothes, lot of records, victrola, piano, garden
tools, dishes, pots, pans, and other articles not mentioned.

Anyone having anything to sell bring in before noon on day
of sale.

GUSS SHANK, Auct.
Terms: Cash.
Not responsible for accidents.

AO
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WEEK-END SPECIALS
OCTOBER 24 — OCTOBER 25 — OCTOBER 26

4111111MIIIMI 1111M1nnra urn 11111111111101111

THIS COUPON WORTH

100 EXTRA STAMPS with a $7.50 order
or more at DOUGHERTY'S this week. Tobacco not included!

Name

Address

OFFER EXPIRES SATURDAY, OCTOBER 26, 1963
••• *.it-t-tit get IP 9, 9_9 9 9 /MM." Att”.1.919.9.9A9Atite.-9-9.1 !AAA 99.

SWEET CLOVER
Fall Festival Vegetables

RED KIDNEY BEANS

WHOLE GRAIN GOLDEN CORN

SWEET PEAS

Chiefs Delight Loaf

CHEESE

CUT GREEN BEANS
Mix or Match 7 No. 303 9 5c

cans
for

Musselman's

49c Applesauce 2 for 29c

Indian River

GRAPEFRUIT
3 for 25c

FRESH

Brussels Sprouts
25c pint box

Dougherty's Superette

Ill
NEW IN TOWN?

You're only a stranger until you make your

first friend, and Your banker can be one of your

best friends.

Helping you arrange credit is only one of the

many ways in which we can help you get started.

Come in today ... and make us your first friend

The Monte Trust Company
(Member of the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation)

TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

 -3111111111re .7111.  
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:ASSA,

A PRACTICAL
PLEASURE FOR
ONE AND ALL!

People in all walks of life take pleasure in the
practicality, protection and prestige that our
CHECKING ACCOUNT service provides.
They pay bills, send monetary gifts by mail—
have automatic cancelled-check receipts for
payments, tax-deductible contributions.-busi-
ness expenditures. Join tilem: Open your
account here now!

First National Bank
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

MEMBER FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM

(Member a the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation)
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Our
late Fall
special
Save $2 now by purchasing the two
products that will give you a richer,
thicker lawn next year.

Turf Builder — America's most
wanted grass fertilizer.

Halts --- America's
crabgrass preventer.

You'll be way ahead next year if you
apply both aids to your lawn right now.

SAVE

$

best known

Together reg. $12.90

Now only
$10.90

Covers 2500 sq. ft.

II REINDOLIAR BROS. & CO.
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

PHONE: 756-6603

On the Square Taneytown Phone PL 6 6226
We Give UNITED Stamps


