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COMMUNITY LOCALS
Mr. Chester

home from the hospital after under-
going surgery.

Neal has returned

Mr. Harry LeGore and Mr. Rex
Swinehart of North Baltimore, Ohio,
spent several days with Mr. and Mrs.
Clarence LeGore.

Mrs. Samuel Ott visited on Wed-
nesday evening of last week with Mr.
and Mrs. Edgar Fleagle.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Chits of
Riverdale Farm were Sunday dinner
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Ray Boyle of
Baltimore.

Mrs. Thomas McDermott and son
Jimmy, of Akron, Ohio, came Friday
to spend some time with her sister,
Mrs. Charles Hahn.

Pastor .and Mrs. Miller and their
new son, Timothy William, returned
home to the Lutheran Parsonage this
morning (Thursday).

Mr. and Mrs. Theodore Jester and
daughters and Dr. and Mrs. E. A.
Thompson and family are vacationing
this week at Ocean City, Md.

Mr. Harold Mehring is vacationing
this week with his brother and sister-
in-law, Dr. and Mrs. Wilbur .Mehring
at their cottage at Deep Creek Lake.

Miss Mary Reindollar attended the
Irving College Reunion Clu.b, held at
Allenberry, last Saturday. She was
accompanied by her brother, Mr.
Wallace Reindollar.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Speak, Kevin
and Dawn and Mr. and Mrs. Clar-
ence Albaugh enjoyed a picnic lunch
at the Washington Monument State
Park on top of South Mountain on
Sunday.

Wm. A. Copenhaver entered the
Bethany Theological Seminary, Oak-
brook, Illinois, this week. He plans
to complete a 3-year course in that
college.

$134.00 was realized in the solic-
itation of Taneytown District for the
Carroll County General Hospital Aux-
Marie's fifth Silvery Moon Ball Pro-
gram. Ball will be September 28th
at the Westminster Riding Club.

Miss Mary Ellen Stonesifer and
Mr. Merle Weant of Taneytown were
among the 42 All-Stars tapped on
August 8th in a candlelight service
for their high ideals, leadership qual-
ities and good character; during
State 4-H Club Week, August 5-9,
at the University of Maryland, Col-
lege Park.

Dr. and Mrs. James Fl Light and
children, Sheldon, Matthew and
Jams, of Terre Haute, Ind., arrived
on Monday for a visit with the chil-
dren's grandparents, Mr. and Mrs.
Chester Neal, before leaving for a
year in England where Dr. Light will
lecture at the University of Keele, at
Stafford, England.

Local persons hospitalized at the
Annie M. Warner Hospital, Gettys-
burg, Pa., include: Mrs. Nettie Al-
baugh; alsq Mr. Daniel Null, who was
taken sick on Monday and rushed in
the ambulance to the hospital; and
Mrs. Samuel Ott who had the mis-
fortune to fall in her home last
Thursday evening breaking her hip
and wrist.

Visitors at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. D. Frank Hannan, Sr., of near
town, on Sunday afternoon were: Mr.
and Mrs. Paul Hofstetter and chil-
dren, Suzanne, Paula, Mike and Tom-
my of Pine Beach, New Jersey, and
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Harman, Jr.,
Calvin,' Richard, Esther, Donald,
Timothy, Sharron, Brenda, Mary El-
len of near town.

The third reunion of the descen-
dants of the late Samuel and Clara
Stambaugh was held on Sunday,
August 18th, at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Ralph A. Dinterman with 72
members present. The officers elect-
ed for next year were: President —
Ralph Dinterman; Vice-president —
John Duble; Secretary — Mrs. Nancy
Grimes and Treasurer — Mrs. Ruth
Fisher.

Recent visitors of Mr. and Mrs! Roy
Speak, Kevin and Dawn were: Mrs.
Ethel Speak, Mr. and Mrs. Robert
Speak, Johnny and Stevie, Miss Eliz-
abeth 'Renner, Ladiesburg, Mr. and
Mrs. John Harbaugh, New Midway,
Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Speak, Jay,
Mark and Kathy, Walkersville; Mr.
and Mrs. Clarence Albaugh, Mr. and
Mrs. Grant Harman, Brian and Blaine
and Mr. and Mrs. Laverne Albaugh
and I3,onnie, near town. •

SFC (E-7) Reese Tracey arrived at
Friendship Airport on Sunday morn-
ing from Vietnam for a 30-day
leave. Through the efforts of the Red
Cross, Sgt. Tracey was able to come
home for the funeral of his brother,
who was a drowning victim while
participating in swimming exercises
with 28 lifeguards at Daytona Beach,
Florida. He will visit with relatives
at Hampton, Va., and at the home of
Mr. and Mrs. Wilbur Naylor, Taney-
town.

Mrs. Howard S. Baker entertained
her mother, Mrs. B. T. Kanode of
Lewistown, Md., to a fried chicken
dinner the past Saturday at her
home. The occasion being her 86th
birthday. The following were present:
Mrs. B. T. Kanode of Lewistown,
Md.; Mr. and Mrs. Truman A. Whit-
more, Sr., of Media, Pa.; Mr. and
Mrs. Howard C. Fisher, children,
Alice May and Anthony of near
Frederick. She received many cards
a.nd gifts. A birthday cake was baked
by Mrs. Fisher.

(Continued on Page Four)

Scouts to Have Paper Drive
Saturday in Taneytown

Another collection of rags, mag-
azines, and newspaper § will be con-
ducted this Saturday, August 24th,
by Boy Scouts of Troop 348, Taney-
town, who are sponsored by Hesson-
Snider Post 120 of the American Le-
gion. Bundles securely tied contrib-
ute greatly to the success of the col-
lection, although Scouts will gladly
pick up from cellar or garret if their
attention is drawn to the need for
same while the drive is going on.

Besides Taneytown itself the roads
to Mayberry, Copperville, Crouse's
Mill, Bridgeport, and the Baptist rd.
to Starner's Dam will also be covered.
In case of bad weather, necessi-

tating postponement, a new date will
be announced.

Summer Program at Natural Dam
The meetings on every Thursday

have continued at Natural Dam Rec-
reational Area, with swimming and
some boating followed by a business
session and wiener roast, occasion-
ally concluded with an outdoor game.
The cooperation of parents who have
assisted the leaders in transporting
boys up and back has been and con-
tinues to be much appreciated.

Advancement and Patrol Activities
Advanced to Second Class rank at

the July Troop board of review con-
ducted under the direction of Chair-
man Francis E. Lookingbill were:
Samuel Cassell, Brett Fleagle, Sam-
uel Fleming, Richard Greene, Jack
Howarth, and Edward Thompson.
The rank of First Class was earned
by James Frock and Philip Martin
who at camp triumphed over the
Morse signaling bugaboo, while the
honor of Life Scout was also awarded
to Thomas West.

Besides the Red Cross certificates
for the Standard course, the Scout
First Aid merit badge was completed
by Robert Miller, Frock, Philip Mar-
tin, Ronald Martin, Leroy ,Smeak, and
Thompson. The Red Crass course was
also completed by Samuel Bower,
Carroll Foreman, and Thomas West.
Other merit badges won in recent
weeks have been Reading and Life
Saving by Bower; Corn farming,
Dairying. Farm arrangements, Fish-
ing, and Home repairs by Fleagle;
Fishing and Home repairs by Flem-
ing; and Basketry, Cooking, and
Fishing by Philip Martin.
Camping trips to local spots were

reported last week by the Flaming
arrow patrol under Patrol leader
Thomas West with five members and
four visitors present; and by the
Foxes under Patrol leader Frock with
four members and three visitors pre-
sent.

Terry Bell has returned to Troop
membership in the Panther patrol,
and Duane Wiles has been admitted
as a new member in the same group,
which is under the leadership of
Ricky Clingan.
The Foxes continue to lead in the

annual patrol contest, with a 242
score as reported at last Scoutmeet-
ing, and the Flaming arrows stood
second at 225.

While an occasional meeting and
swim will continue to take place at
Natural Dam after the start of the
school year, soon the Troop will be
returning to the meeting room which
has so generously been made avail-
able for many years through the
courtesy of Mrs. John Hoagland. The
patrol contest race will then take on
a faster pace once the swing into the
routine of school has been negotiated.

Paper Drive
Scouts able to help with the scrap

collection are requested to report
promptly by 7:30 A. M. Saturday.
In the event of rainy weather, a new
date will be selected and published.

4-H CLUB MEETS

The Pleasant Valley Boys' 4-H
Club met Tuesday evening at the
home of Helen Warehime. Reports
were heard on the paper drive, booth
and exhibit at the recent Carroll
County 4-H, FFA Fair.

Linda, David and Steven Griswald
and Sandra and Sylvia Stonesifer
told of their placings at the recent
field days. The group discussed im-
provements to the Carroll County
Fair and offered several recommen-
dations.

Linda, David and Steven Griswold
and Sandra, Sylvia and James Stone-
sifer plan to exhibit their projects
at the Maryland State Fair held in
Timonium.
At the recent Carroll County

Campfire, Sylvia Stonesifer, Helen
Warehime, Gene Curfman and Linda
Griswold were taken into the Older
Youth. Members who participated in
the Club's skit were: Linda and Ste-
ven Griswold, Helen Warehime and
Sandra and Sylvia Stonesifer.
The next meeting will be held at

the home of Jack Richards on Sep-
tember 17th.

REAL "FREE-LOADERS"!

Do you know "Free mailings sent
out by House and Senate Members
cost the taxpayers $4.9 million last
year, dwarfing the $1.2 million of a
decade ago."
One would be completely naive to

refuse to admit most of this Con-
gressional "free mail" was actually
self promotion for the members send-
ing it. In other words, it was direct
mail advertising where the Congres-
sional advertiser didn't pay the Post
Office a single penny for handling it!
But you don't hear any Post Office
officials advocating Congress appro-
priate money to pay for its own
"gravy train." No. Private paying
users of the U. S. Mails are expected
to bear the cost of handling the mail
advertising of politicians with whose
policies they may completely dis-
agree.

C. E. News

Roger L. Boone, Miss Joyce Dell
and Mr. and Mrs. Roy B. Kiser, at-
tended a luncheon meeting at the
Howard Johnson's Restaurant, Pu-
laski Highway, Baltimore, Saturday.
Plans were formulated for the Md.
State C. E. Convention to be held at
the Brethren Service Center, New
Windsor, Md on Saturday, October
26, beginning at 9:30 A. M. with
banquet in the evening. The program
will consist of conferences, music,
communion, recreation, Alumni tea
and Banquet. Register now with Mr.
Warren Utermahlen, Carroll County's
Registrar. Adults, $1.00, High School,
50c; Juniors, 25c. (More about the
program later.) Plan now to attend.
The regular Carroll County C. E.

Executive meeting was held at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Sterling Dell,
Finksburg, on Monday evening with
15 members and guests present. Re-
ports on the Gallillean Service at the
Community Pond, Westminster, and
the annual C. E. Day at Harvey
Stone Memorial Park, Western
Maryland College campus were heard,
a new adult C. E. Society at Wake-
field. Miss Joyce Dell, Finksburg,
will have charge of the September
C. E. Rally, place and date to be an-
nounced. Two letters of thanks were
read by Mrs. Kiser, secretary. Mr.
Warren Utermahlen, Taneytown, was
named registrar for Carroll County
for State Convention at New Wind-
sor. Contacts to different congrega-
tions who have no Youth Activities
will be made for Christian Endeavor,
since it is International, Interacial,
and Interdenominational, for all
ages, for "Christ and the Church."

Christmas Seals Arrive

The arrival of 35,000 sheets of 1963
Christmas Seals, weighing 399 lbs.,
signaled the season's first flurry of
pre-campaign activity today at the
headquarters of the Carroll County
Tuberculosis Association, Times
Building, Westminster.
Mrs. Francis Nelson, President of

the iSmallwood Homemakers Club
with Mrs. James Gartland and Mrs.
Paul J. Orendorff were on hand to
receive the bundles of Christmas
Seals, store them, and start prepar-
ations for the annual mailing to take
place November 15. Funds contrib-
uted for the Seals, which will be
mailed to all Carroll County resi-
dents, are used by the Association in
its drive to combat Tuberculosis and
control other respiratory diseases.
The traditional Christmas Seal

mailing is done entirely by volunteer
help, according to Robert Lee Miller,
President of the Association. "This
saves hundreds of dollars and thou-
sands of hours of staff time, he said,
"money that the Association puts in-
to its program of activities to wipe
out tuberculosis and fight other res-
piratory diseases."

Volunteers will be busy from now
until November 15, pasting labels and
stuffing envelopes and doing the num-
erous things needed to get ready for
mailing day. Asked whether the
available force was sufficient to do
the job, Mr. Miller said, "There's
always room for more, and there's
no more soul-satisfying work for
people to turn their hands to.

WATCH SCHOOL BUS—
CHILDREN

With the opening of schools fast
approaching, motorists are reminded
to drive slowly and carefully in the
general areas of schools and on our
highways where school buses trans-
port children.
School buses in Carroll County

drive a total distance of over 6,1)00
miles each school day and transport
more than 9,000 children. Many of
these pupils are six years of age or
less. For them the challenge of facing
traffic coming from two directions is
great. These youngsters will no doubt
make many mistakes while awaiting,
boarding and leaving their buses.
Motorists cannot afford any errors
and are urged to drive with utmost
care.

State law requires that drivers of
any vehicle "shall stop upon meeting
or overtaking any school bus which is
stopped on the highway for the pur-
pose of receiving or discharging pas-
sengers. He shall come to a complete
stop at least ten feet from the front
or rear bumper of the bus and remain
stopped until all passengers are re-
ceived or discharged and the school
bus has started again."

It might be noted that vehicles ap-
proaching a school bus from the op-
posite direction on a dual highway
are not required to stop.

POPULATION GROWING BY
LEAPS AND BOUNDS

35th Wedding Anniversary
Celebration

Mr. and Mrs. Carel E. Frock, Tan-
eytown, were the guests of honor at
a surprise celebration for their 35th
Wedding Anniversary on Sunday,

August 18th at the Parish House of
Grace United Church of Christ of
which they are members.
Mr. Frock is the son of the late

Jesse W. and Sarah Fink Frock. Mrs.
Frock, the former Alice Brown, is the ,
daughter of Oliver H. Brown of May-
berry and the late Gareth Nusbaum
Brown.
The couple was married August

18, 1928 by the late Rev. S. R. Kresge
at Baust Reformed Church.
Mr. and Mrs. Frock have one

daughter, Mrs. Robert Flickinger, of
Taneytown, and two grandchildren,
Judith Ann and Blaine Allen Flick-
inger.
Mr. Frock is the Superintendent of

Public Utilities in Taneytown.
Those who assisted Mrs. Flickin-

ger in serving on Sunday were: Mrs.
Charles Eckard, Miss Catherine
Frock, Mrs. J. Elwood Frock, Mrs.
Henry L. Miller, Jr., and Mrs. Glenn
Matthias. Mrs. Harry Mohney and
Mrs. Raymond Perry were in charge
of the gift table and Miss Betty Ohler
presided at the guest book.
Among the approximately 140

guests present were: Mrs. Frock's
father. Out of town guests were from
Hanover, Littlestown, Gettysburg,
Silver Run, Union Mills, Westmin-
ster, Baltimore, Aberdeen •and Silver
Spring.

A machine known as a demograph,
on perpetual exhibition in the lobby
of the Department of Commerce,
counts the new babies being born
throughout the country and the new
U. S. citizens coming in from other
countries, and it also takes into ac-
count the deaths, giving the exact
population figure every minute of the
day and night. As you stand and
watch it, the figure changes. The•
population grows by geometric pro-
gression. Mathematicians figured out
the formula for the population
change, and this information was
placed in the machine, and the ma-
chine does the rest. If you had
glanced at the demograph at 1:15
P. M., August 1, 1963, you would have
seen that the U. S. population at that
moment was 189,478,936. Now, it's
more. In fact, the population figure
has increased while you've been read-
ing this. A miniature demograph will
be exhibited at the 1964 — 65 New
York World's Fair.

Meeting of Lions Club

At the last regular meeting of the
Taneytown Lions Club the following
business was considered.
Harry Dougherty, the general

chairman of the "Crab Feed," Aug-
ust 27, reminded the committees of
their duties. The committee on the
Calendar Project reported. The Lions
are a Community Service Organiza-
tion and we would like to have the
community respond to our undertak-
ings.
John Shorb who visited Maryland

Boys' State for several days, and who
was sponsored by the Lions, gave a
report. The program on which he re-
ported simulated the actual condi-
tions of a dictatorship in order that
the boys could make a comparison
with a democratic form of govern-
ment.

After Merwin Fuss gave the pro-
gram for the coming year, Merle
Ohler showed beautiful slides of a re-
cent trip through the West and Can-
ada.

BOWLING BROOK OPEN HOUSE
A SUCCESS

Middleburg, Maryland

The open house held at the Bow-
ling Brook Home for Boys on Sun-
day, August 11th was attended by ap-
proximately 200 visitors, who were
greeted by Superintendent and Mrs.
DePew along with Mrs. Bowers,
housemother. Guests were escorted
through the home and around the
grounds by the boys, who were con-
sistently complimented for the way
they handled themselves and for the
pride which they Showed in their
home. There were visitors from other
states as well as from local and dis-
tant Maryland communities. Members
of the home's Board of Trustees in
attendance were: E. Miller Richard-
son, Executive Director; Scott S.
Bair; and Carroll L. Crawford. Mr.
H. E. Koontz who was subsequently
named to the Board was also in at-
tendance.
The open house afforded an op-

portunity for renewal of many old
acquaintances. Many visitors took ad-
vantage of the opportunity to visit
the adjacent horse training stables
operated by Henry S. Clark.
The superintendent encourages

continued interest in the home by the
public and is interested in seeing
even more visitors next year and in
the interim.

MARYLAND SAVINGS BOND
SALES CONTINUE UPWARD

Sales of Series E and H Bonds in
Maryland during the month of July,
of $6,564,770. showed an increase of
11.4 per cent over July a year ago, it
was announced by State Chairman
Charles P. McCormick, today.

Total sales for the seven months —
January through July — amounted
to $46,665,533. bringing the State's
achievement up to 63 per cent of its
yearly goal of $74,100,000. The seven-
month's sales also showed an increase
of 12.2 per cent over the comparable
1962 months.
Somerset County continues to lead

the State with 76.2% achievement;
Howard County is second with 76.1%;
Prince Georges County, third, with
66.3%; Baltimore County, fourth,
with 64.9%, and Baltimore City with
64.6% of quota made, is in fifth
place.
Mr. McCormick noted that much of

this success is attributed to the re-
cent Freedom Bond Drive, partic-
ularly to the Payroll Savings Cam-
paigns conducted in industry through-
out the State.
To date, 140 payroll savings cam-

paigns have been completed, with a
total of 14,202 new savers, represent-
ing 76 per cent of the State's pay-
roll savings goal.
Of the 26 local Service Clubs re-

porting Bond purchases, 12 have
qualified for Treasury Awards in
connection with the Bond-per-Family
Program conducted, in which 50% or
more of members represented, pur-
chased a Savings Bond. These are:
7 Kiwanis Clubs; 3 Lions Clubs, and
2 Optimist Clubs.

Key Club International
Elects New Officers

Chicago, Illinois, July 31, 1963 —
Kenneth S. Cohen, 17, a member of
the Key Club of Ewing Township
High School, Trenton, N. J., was,
elected president of Key Club Inter-
national at the close of the 20th an-
nual convention of the organization
in Pittsburgh, Penna., July 7-10.
This information was received by
Oliver T. Leakins, President of the

"SPICE 'N' EVERYTHING NICE"

With all my heart. I wish you every
morning

A smile that shall last until the next day's
dawning.

I wish you health—life's greatest wealth;

I wish you always near so that I may help

to cheer
Each future day and in some way—help to

bring you happiness!

KENNETH S. COHEN

Kiwanis Club of Taneytown,
which sponsors the Taneytown II. S.
Key Club.
Cohen will head, for a year, a

high school service organization of
65,000 boys in 2500 high schools in
the United States and Canada. Key
Clubbers perform useful service pro-
jects in their schools in much the
same manner that Kiwanians serve
their communities.
Cohen is the son of Mr. and Mrs.

Leon Cohen, 1831 Pennington Road,
Trenton, New Jersey. During the
past year he served as a Key Club
International Trustee. He has been a
lieutenant governor of his Key club
district, and a member of his school's
student council. He served as vice-
president of the forensic club and
of the junior class. He received a
Degree of Distinction in National
Forensic League competition.
Also elected were two vice-presi-

dents: Del D. Borgsdort, of Detroit,
Michigan, a member of the Redford
High School Key Club, and Ted Hor-
ton, Peterborough, Ontario, Kenner
Collegiate Vocational Institute.
David A. Keyko, Runnemede, N. J.,

a Key Clubber at Triton Regional
High School, was elected secretary.
Twelve trustees were also elected.

They are: Brad F. Anderson, Bill-
ings, Montana, Billings West High
School; Ernest A. Childs, Knoxville,
Tenn., Knoxville Cen. H. S.; Wm P.
Harman, Elkins, W. Va., Elkins High
Central High School; Wm. P. Har-
man, Elkins, West Va., Elkins High
School; Tommy W. Lawhorne, Jr.,
Sylvester, Georgia, Worth County
High School; Barrie Lennox, Winni-
peg, Manitoba, Vincent Massey Col-
legiate; A. Wayne Lord, Mobile, Ala-
bama, University Military School;
Lawrence E. Richter, Jr., Mount
Pleasant, South Carolina, Bishop
England High School; Barry Roun-
tree, San Angelo, Texas, Central
High School; Marion M. Rundell,
Pineville, Louisiana, Pineville High
School; F. Bradford Stillman, Vir-
ginia Beach, Virginia, Frank W. Cox
High School; Win. D. Tyler, Little
Rock, Arkansas, Central High School;
and James F. Utley, Hollywood,
Florida, South Braward High School.

Selected at the convention was the
Key Club considered to have the best
"Single Service Activity" during the
1962 — 63 school year. First place
went to the Key Club of Thornton
Fractional South High School, Lan-
sing, Illinois, for the establishment
and operation of a "Teen Center" in
Lansing. Second place went to the
Key Club of Maine Township High
School, Park Ridge, Illinois, and
third was the Key Club of William
Allen High School in Allentown, Pa.
Best all around clubs in both ser-

vice work and administration with
more than 25 members were: Baldwin
County High School Key Club, Bay
Minette, Alabama — first place; and
Central High School Key Club, Knox-
ville, Tennessee — second place. In
clubs with 25 members or less, the
winners were: Ferriday High School
Key Club, Ferriday, Louisiana —
first place; and Sprayberry High
School Key Club, Marietta, Georgia
— second place.
The 2,000 young men attending the

convention approved the theme:
"Render Dedicated Service" to guide
them in their service work during
the school year ahead.
The 1964 Key Club International

Convention will be held in Dallas,
Texas, in early July. a

RALLY DAY AT
FRIZELLBURG

The annual Rally Day Service at
the Frizellburg Church of God, Friz-
ellburg, Md., will be held this coming
Sunday morning, August 25, 1963 at
9:45 A. M.
Mr. Charles Hersh of Greenmount,

Md., who is a Christian Laymen will
be the special speaker for the morn-
ing service. There will also be con-
gregational singing and special num-
bers by our own talent.
The public is cordially invited to

attend this service and help reach
our goal.

The most encouraging thing about
the future is that it can only come
one day at a time.

Want to test your memory? Try
to recall what was worrying you last
Monday.

Last week, it again was "Under-
neath The Stars" for "The Festival

of Music" of the Park and Municipal
Concert Bands under the direction of
Mr. Gerald Eyth which was the last
Concert of the Summer months. It
was a delightful program plus the
audience singing along with Alex
Martin leading to numbers of pop-
ularity such as, "In the Good Old
Summer Time," "Row, Row, Row,
Row," "By The Light of The Silvery
Moon," "Wait Till The Sun Shines,
Nellie," "Take Me Out To The Ball
Game," and "When Irish Eyes Are
Smiling!" There was a huge aud-
ience and everyone seemed to enjoy
the entire evening.

Visiting "The Flag House" again
last week after a lapse of a few years
was much more interesting. First of
all, there is a grand little lady by the
name of Miss Marion Butterwick who
takes the guests around and explains
every detail so beautifully. Every
school teacher should take her pupils
for the day for it would mean just
that to view all the interesting ar-
ticles on display. It is truly
Hist o ry to the last word! The
pupils would learn much. There is a
Map made of native stone of the in-
dividual states and presented to the
Flag House. Bronze stars represent
Alaska and Hawaii. The idea orig-
inated with the late Arthur P. Sewell,
first Curator of The Flag House. The
Map was dedicated on June 18, 1961.
U. S. Naval Sea Cadets, Boy Scouts
and Girl Scouts served as Guards of
Honor. This Map is built in the
ground on the side of the yard of the
house and it really brings chills and
thrills when you stand there and gaze
upon such a wonderful work of art
and looking down at each state with
it's special stone.
The House stands at the corner of

Pratt and Albemarle Streets and was
built in 1793 and it has become fam-
ous because it was the home of Mary
Young Pickersgill, a widow, lived
there with her mother, Rebecca
Young and her daughter, Caroline,
aged fourteen. They were gentle wo-
men in modest circumstances. Mrs.
Young, had lived in Philadelphia and
advertised as a "maker of colors"
for the Army and Navy. There she
made "The Grand Union Flag," the
one with double crosses for General
Washington. Mary is listed as a
maker of ."ships banners and flags"
in the Baltimore Directory of the
period. The large flag for Fort Mc-
Henry was ordered to be made the
largest flag possible so as the Eng-
lish would see it. Two nieces were
pressed into service to assist with
the sewing and one signed the receipt
for the flag for the sum of $405.90
which you will see and read in the
glass case right there. Mary Picker-
sgill lived in this house from 1807
1857 and it has been furnished as it
might have been then in the time of
the War of 1812. Her husband re-
turned to England and died but the
piano and sideboard is right there.

I The Empire clock in the parlor was
I Mary's when she lived there. There
I is a portrait over the mantel in the
, front bedroom of Francis .Scott Key
and the desk of faded mahogany was
Mary's own. There is such a homey

'atmosphere when one enters this lit-
tle old house for the exterior bricks
are the very same as those days of
yesteryear. Every American should
visit this house. There were a num-
ber of cars from the various states
of these United States right there. To
think we are so close and yet there
are thousands of Americans who have
never really bothered seeing "The
Flag House."
As I came out of the house, I saw

a large building on the same side
marked, "Giovanni Pizza Pie" and
much else. I walked over and entered
and had a talk with the two brothers
who are owners of the business and
the famous makes of their products.
The name of the brothers is "Guer-
rero" and they're surely in the know
how, which I observed as I was taken
through the immaculate plant. Many
of Italian products being distributors
of "Gioia" Macaroni and "Giovanni"
products. So different after the cook-
ing of the Spaghetti from the ord-
inary brand. Just 17 inches long and
thick Wholesome pieces. The grand
"Gioia" Spaghetti Sauce is truly
different from all others as it has a
meat foundation and all you do is
heat in a separate pot and then serve
over the Spaghetti. Ummmmmmm
good! There is the Frozen Ravioli
ready to serve in five minutes and
the touch of Italy Manicotti Cheese
sticks in the Aluminum Tray ready
to bake. That ice box was tremen-
dous, folks and I am confident that
those nice brothers will permit you
to go through the ware-house when
you visit the Flag House. Be sure
when you go to any store, demand
your grocer to purchase these pro-
ducts. Don't forget the Pizza pies,
too! Everything is just dee lich - -
ious! SO DIFFERENT. •
Have a grand week-end, Folks. Re-

lax right there on your porch. Un-
til next week-end D. V.

I am,
Faithfully,
YOUR OBSERVER.

BIRTH ANNOUNCEMENT

We are happy to announce, through
the Grace of God, the birth of our
son and brother, Timothy William, on
Sunday, August 18, at 1:02 A. M., at
the Church home and Hospital, Bal-
timore, Md.
Pastor and Mrs. Howard W. Miller,
Susan and Chris.
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CUT IT OUT — NOT DOWN

The most searing indictment of our

foreign aid program —"after going

through ten different administrators,

five major reorganizations and more

than 100 billion tax dollars"— comes,

logically enough, from the man who

probably knows it best.

In his article, "Let's Stop ending

US Dollars to Aid Our Enemies," in

the August Reader's Digest, Author

Charles Stevenson quotes the sum-

ming-up of Chairman Otto E. Pass-

man of the House Appropriations

Committee after 1,000 hours of of-

ficial hearings:
"The trouble" is, says Rep. Pass-

man, "that too much of our foreign

aid has deteriorated into a subsidy of

Communist takeover. And the spend-

ers are so power-hungry, they so

withhold the truth from the public,

they are so beyond the normal con-

trols of Congress, that there seems

no way to confine assistance to help-

ing people help themselves unless we

kill the entire operation and start

over."
But, as Mr. Stevenson says, in spite

of the mountainous evidence that our

"aid" largesse has done us more

harm than good, President Kennedy

is insisting that Congress provide

$4.5 billion more for another year,

and Secretary of State Rusk charges

that anyone who tries to cut down

this request is playing the Communist

game!
And yet the record, as revealed by

Chairman Harry F. Byrd of the Sen-

ate Finance Committee, shows the

administrators have not been able,

since 1958, to spend the aici money

they have been given, and had, in

fact, amassed the staggering sum of

$21,273,000,000 as of last June in un-

expended balance. This, the Senator

pointed out, would keep the aid

spenders busy for years without an-

other cent from Congress.
Mr. Stevenson, •in the report that

Reader's Digest is now filming for

TV presentation, cites the fantastic

history of our forkign aid blunders in

India, Poland, Yugoslavia, Burma,

Cambodia, Ceylon, Brazil, Egypt,

Algeria, Indonesia — and notes that:

"What we do has so eased the pres-

sure on Russia to feed its dependent

states that it is able now to use its

own wheat to spearhead its infil-

tration of Latin America." Our gifts

to the Poles, he says, "enabled them

to send $13-million worth of aid to

Castro's Cuba and. $15-million worth

to North Vietnam . ." The latter is

said to include arms for shooting

American soldiers in South Vietnam.

The briefest recital (even without

TV presentation) of the ill-will and

geophysical embarrassment we have

purchased at unbelievable cost should

stir every American to violent pro-

test and the demand that Congress

put an end to foreign. aid.

The time has come, not merely to

cut it, but to cut it out!

—U. S. Press Association

"GRASS ROOTS OPINIONS"

ODESSA, TEX., AMERICAN:

"Shouldn't we strive to abolish gov-

ernment operation of businesses

(socialism), government control over

agricultural production (facism), and

governmental redistribution of the

wealth (communism)? If the Amer-

ican capitalist system fails, there

will be no other nation to save us —

as we have saved so many others. On

the other hand, if we will rededicate

ourselves to capitalism, in America,

it will provide the beacon light of

freedom and abundance that may

save the whole world. The rewards of

capitalism await us. Are they worth

your effort?"

WAILUKU, HAWAII, MAUI

NEWS: "Vandals should think twice

about the consequences before going

off the deep end in destruction of

property and disorderly public con-

duct . . . . including giving heed to

the welfare and shame of their fam-

ilies when they are hauled in by the

police."

ANDERSON, S. C., FREE PRESS:

`. . . while you are being bled dry

by high taxes, the electric Co-ops go

practically tax free  while they

are certainly no symbol of the true

American free enterprise system, the

electric Co-ops are certainly entitled

to the dubious distinction of being

the 'free-eat enterprise' in this coun-

try today. By the same token, we

will have to reach the conclusion that

their type of 'free-eat enterprise' is

very close to the type of 'free en-

terprise' existing in Russia today."

PORTLAND, ME., PRESS-HER-

ALD: "Turning over the railroads

to the Federal Government probably

would please the unions, since they

might think they could win from

Washington an arrangement rail

managements would never concede.

Apart from this, mere federal con-

trol will not settle the basic issues

involved, and if Congress is'forced

to act, it may act in a way that will

not please the unions."

SISSETON, S. D., COURIER: "The

American Medical Association now

claims there is no physical value in

sun tanning. In fact, exposure to the

sun is damaging the skin. 'Sunlight

speeds wrinkles and aging and ex-

cessive exposure over a period of

time can cause serious skin condit-

ions.' Doctors advise their patients to

to take precautions to reduce skin

damage from tanning as •much as

possible. Sunburn should be treated

as any burn."

CHICO, CALIF., ENTERPRISE-

RECORD: " A year ago, some of the

testimony offered by experts warned

that proposed amendments to the

Pure Food and Drug laws would not

contribute much to the protection of

the public but might well hinder the

development of new drugs to cure

man's ills and ease his pains. The

tragic thalidomide cases were in the

public eye at the time. The photos

of deformed children were more

moving than were the rational ar-

guments. It was even lost sight of

that thalidomide has been barred

from sale in this country under laws

already on the books."

ALTOONA, PA., MIRROR: "If

we want a world of plenty, let us

restore freedom and responsibility

wherein each individual must provide

for himself and his family and has

the added incentive of knowing that

he may enjoy the fruits of his ef-

forts. The socialist cliche of 'redis-

tribution of income,' so popular in

our time, is false — always has and

always will lead to bitter disappoint-

ment and hard times."

* SANDPOINT, IDA., NEWS-BUL

LETIN: "This country is hopelessly

committed to the social security

program which is taking a bigger and

bigger bite out of every pay check

in the land. If Mr. Kennedy were to

get his way about charging so-called

`medicare' against social security it

would mean another big chunk out of

every wage earner."

NASHVILLE, TENN., NATIONAL

BAPTIST UNION-REVIEW: "To be

able to forget one's self and go down

the street, go out in the country,

dwell among the trees, hills, flowers,

animals, springs, brooks, rivers and

let them say something to you, and

then have sense enough to say some-

thing to them — — And come away

with a-glowing sense of appreciation

for having had the privilege to com-

mune with the Infiniteis - - - in it-

self an achievement."

$5,000 OFFERED
EVERY WEEK

Your Social Security number may
be worth a big cash prize right now.
Send in your number, name and ad-
dress on a postcard to Box 1935, Bal-
timore 3, Maryland. Then see the
Baltimore News-Post every day for
list of winning numbers. $5,000 of-
fared weekly. Daily prizes plus big
Monday jackpot worth at least $500.
Enter your number today   and
watch the

BALTIMORE NEWS-POST

on sale at your local newsdealer
DELMAR E. RIFFLE, Agent

It is urged that we help make the

disabled able by giving repairable

household discards to nonprofit Good-

will Industries. Good-will trains

handicapped people, making them

able to hold jobs in regular industry.

Executive Vice President Lee

Shield of the American Life Conven-

tion warns: "Slavery can be the lot

of any people who drift far enough

down the road of government-in-hus-

iness. When government combines ec-

onomic power with a vast political

power, it has the means of telling us

where we will work, where we will

live, and what we will say and do."
0 

Selfish individuals contribute very
little toward a better world.

PROGRAM SCHEDULE
WFMD Frederick, Maryland

93 on your A M Radio Dial

4:58 Sign On
5:00 Getting Up Time
5:25 Ministerium
5:30 World News
5:35 Getting Up Time
6:00 World News
6:05 Getting Up Time
6:30 World News
6:35 Weather Forecast
6:40 Getting Up Time
7:00 World News
7:05 Getting Up Time
7:30 World & Area News
7:35 Getting Up Time
7:55 Community News
8:00 World News Roundup
8:15 Morning Show
8:30 World & Area News
8:35 Morning Show
9:00 CBS News
9:10 Arthur Godfrey
10:00 CBS News
10:10 House Party
10:30 Gary Moore
10:40 Clooney & Crosby
11:00 CBS News
11:10 One Woman's

Washington

MONDAY THRU FRIDAY
11:15 Happy Johnny
11:30 News Headlines
11:32 Happy Johnny
12:00 World & Area News
12:05 Agriculture News
12:10 Happy Johnny
12:30 Weather Forecast
12:35 Happy Johnny
1:00 CBS News
1:08 Happy Johnny
1:30 Woman's World
1:35 Afternoon Show
2:00 CBS News
2:10 Afternoon Show
2:30 Woman's World
2:35 Afternoon Show
3:00 CBS News
3:10 In Hollywood
3:15 Bob Helder Show
3:30 Woman's World
3:35 Bob Helder Show
4:00 CBS News
4:10 Bob Helder Show
4:30 Sidelights
4:35 Bob Helder Show
5:05 World News
5:10 Evening Show

5:30 News Headlines
5:32 Evening Show
6:00 CBS News
6:05 Local Area News
6:10 Sports News
6:15 Barber Shop Favorites
6:20 Dinner Date
6:30 News Headlines
6:32 Dinner Date
6:45 Lowell Thomas
6:55 Sports Time
7:00 CBS News
7:10 Observations U.S.A.
7:13 Worldwide Sports
7:30 News Analysis
7:35 Easy Listening
8:00 The World Tonight
8:15 Night Sounds in Music
9:00 CBS News
9:10 Night Sounds in Music
10:00 CBS News
10:10 Night Sounds in Music
10:45 Armed Forces Review
11:00 ,World & Area News
11:05 Weather & Sports
11:10 Be Still & Know
11 :15 Sign Off

4:58 Sign On
5:00 Getting Up Time
5:25 Ministerium
5:30 World News
5:35 Getting Up Time
6:00 World News
6:05 Getting Up Time
6:30 World News
6:30 Weather Forecast
6:40 Getting Up Time
7:00 World News
7:05 Getting Up Time
7:30 World & Area News
7:35 Getting Up Time
7:55 Community News
8:00 World News Roundup
8:15 Saturday Show
8:30 Better Living
8:35 Saturday Show
8:55 Sound Story
9:00 CBS News
9:10 Saturday Show
9:30 The Week in Space
9:35 Saturday Show
10:00 CBS News
10:05 Sports News
10:10 Saturday Show
10:30 This Week in Business
10:35 Saturday Show
11:00 CBS News

SATURDAY
11:06 Sports News
11 :10 Gospel Light Program
11:30 News Headlines
11)32 Happy Johnny
12:00 Wogld & Area News
12:05 Agriculture News
12:10 Happy Johnny
12:30 Weather Forecast
12:35 Happy Johnny
1:00 CBS News
1:05 Sports News
1:10 Music with Lew Wade
1:30 Time to Travel
1:35 Music with Lew Wade
2:00 CBS News
2:05 Sports News
2:10 Music with Lew Wade
3:00 CBS News
3:05 Saturday Show
3:30 It's New
3:35 Saturday Show
4:00 CBS News
4:05 Saturday Show
4:30 Calling America
4:35 Saturday Show
5:00 CBS News
5:05 Saturday Show
5:30 At Your Leisure
5:35 Saturday Show
6:00 World News

6:05 Local & Area News
6:10 Sports News
6:15 Dinner Date
6:30 European Diary
6:35 CBS News
6:45 Chamber of Commerce
6:50 Congressional Report
6:55 Sports News
7:00 CBS News
7:05 News Analysis
7:10 Annapolis lnaex
7:25 A.M.A. Program
7:30 In New York
7:35 Easy Listening
7:55 Sports News
8:00 The World Tonight
8:15 All Kinds of Music
8:30 World Music Festival
10:00 CBS News
10:10 Music Till Midnight
10:30 News Headlines
10:32 Music Till Midnight
10:45 Pat Boone
11:00 World News
11 :05 Music Till Midnight
11 :35 The Navy Swings
11:50 World & Area News
11 :54 Weather & Sports
11:57 Be Still & Know
12:00 Sign Off

6:53 Sign On
6:55 Rock of Ages
7:25 World & Area News
7:30 Church of the Air
7:55 Community News
8:00 World News Roundup
8:15 Sunday Music
8:30 Sports News
8:35 Children's Chapel
8:50 CBS News
9:00 Your Story Hour
9:30 Science Beat
9:35 Sunday Music
9:55 Sports & Weather.

Roundup
10:00 CBS News
10:05 Sunday Music
10:15 World of Folk Music
10:30 Moscow Scene
10:35 Sunday Music
10:45 Sacred Heart Hour
11:00 Church Service
12:00 CBS News
12:05 Sports News

12:10
12:15
12:30
12:35
12:45
1 :00
1 :05
1 :10
1 :30
1:35
1 :55
2:00
3:00
3:05
4:00
4:05
5:00
5:05
5:30 White House

Correspondent
5:35 To Promote Good Will
6:00 CBS News
6:05 Sports News
6:10 Johnny Dollar

SUNDAY
Salute to Our Servicemen 6:35
The New Life 7:00
Foilow Up 7:05
Anatomy of a Headline 7:10
Hymns of Faith 7:25
CBS News 7:30
Sports News 7:35
Sunday Music 8:00
Special from Lomion 8:15
Sunday Music 8:30
CBS News 8:45
Sunday Music 9:00
CBS News 9:05
Sunday Music 9:10
CBS News 9:35
Sunday Music 10:00
CBS News 10:10
Sunday Music 10:15

10:20
10:35
11:00
11:04
11 :06
11 :10

Suspense
CBS News
Sports News
Washington Report
Headliner
News Analysis '
Heartbeat Theatre
The World Tonight
Alexander Kendrick
Near East Report
University Explorer
CBS News
Quotes of the Week
Leading Question
Capitol Cloakroom
CBS News
Take a Giant Step
Social Security
The Bible Speaks to You
Salt Lake City Choir
World & Area News
Weather & Sports
Be Still & Know
Sign Off

1
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Use The Taneytown Memorial Park this Summer

Every One is Welcome

Any one desiring Reservations for use of Pavilions

Please contact

HARRY DOUGHERTY

Taneytown, Md. Phone PL 6-6226--6129
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All Purpose Tacker
For Men and Women

POWER-PAK TACKMASTER by Wialthweit
The ideal "All-Purpose" Tacker... Easy to operate... for
tireless, steady operation by men or women. Weighs only
20 ounces! Snug stapling nose gets into 'hard-to-reach'
areas. COMPACT AND PORTABLE. Fits into pocket, goes
with the operator from job to job. Has built-in Staple
Remover. Fast trigger action...Drives staples flush.
• Takes 3 staple sizes! Loads up to 140 Markwell
RH 3/16" leg, RHO 5/16" leg and RHL 3/8" leg Car- $095
bon Steel Staples.
Complete with 1000 Asst'd. Staples_ ....... only U

For Sale at---

The Carroll Record Co.
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND
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has programming for every member of the family.

NEWS on-the-air
MUSIC through-out the day
SPORTS — high school, college, professional

Special Features of Public Interest

Dial: 1470 kc WTTR - AM

100.7 mc WTTR - FM

WTTR AM-FM
13
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TIRE SALE 
...

I I
0 0
11 13
0n SPECIAL PRICES ON ALL SIZE TIRES B
31 BALANCE OF THIS MONTH. a

I Take advantage of this very Special Sale I
A.

3S4 of First Grade Tires, Firestone and Lee, 35t
2:

li tE. during our opening month of our new, re-

built Service Station.
I

0 3tE
:: 11

GAS, OIL AND BATTERIES o=
E a

Eyler's Shell 
Service Station

I 

TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

Phone: PL 6- 5171 I
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PUT MORE EGGS
IN HER FEED!

Many farmers in this community can tell you there is
a difference in the rations they get ground and mixed
for their chickens and livestock.

You supply the grain. The difference comes in the kind
of concentrate used and the right amount for proper
balance.

If you believe there is a difference in results you get,
you ought to try out our Check-R-Mix Service. Here is
why we think you'll like it:

1. We balance all rations according to formulas tested
and approved at the Purina Research Farm. We don't
add more Purina Concentrate than is needed. We add
just enough to give you lowest practical cost in the
feedlot, dairy barn or henhouse.

2. We do quick and careful grinding and mixing.

3. We will pick up and deliver on call
when you are busy in the fields.

4. We can deliver in bag or bulk, and
we'll put the Check-R-Mix rations
where you want them.

Give us a call. Prove to yourself. ... Purina Check-R-
Mix feeding can cost you less.

Taneytown Grain Ca Supply Co.
PHONE: PL 6 - 6666
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

Your Advertisement

Should Appear

Here IMO 111= IMO

Many Readers Will See It!
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I CURRENT EVENTS
FIFTY YEARS AGO

The primaries this Fall will be held
on Monday, September 8th, and will
be preceded by one sitting of the
Registrars on Wednesday of the week
previous.
Mrs. Charles Davidson and two

sons, Ralph and Edgar of Philadel-
phia, are visiting her son, Raymond
Davidson and family.

Charles B. Kephart, of this Dis-
trict, was selected by the Republican
conference in Westminster last Fri-
day as the candidate for County
Treasurer.

Marlin E. Reid, who for a number
of years was employed at the Model
Bakery, this place, has taken a posi-
tion with a bakery in Baltimore. His
wife and children accompanied him to
the city and are visiting relatives.

Geo. Overholtzer entertained last
Sunday, in honor of Mrs. Laura
Milne, who returned to her home in
Verden, Okla., last Tuesday. W. H.
Overholtzer and wife, and Miss Jen-
nie Anderson of Wichita, Kan.; Mrs.
Emanuel Overholtzer, J. D. Overholt-
zer and wife, Morris Overholtzer and
wife, Norman Fox, wife and sons,
George and Russell; Jacob Fringer,
wife and children, Retta, Earl, Marg-
uerite and Ruth; Mrs. Henry Lam-
bert, Miss Mabel Lambert and Jos.
Harrier. W. H. Overholtzer and wife,
and ,Miss Jennie Anderson will re-
turn to their home in Wichita, Kan.,
in a short time.
NEWCOMER — Wm. H. Newcom-

er, 36 years, a young farmer living
on the farm of Judson Hill, near Har-
ney, died on Wed., August 20th, of
general peritonitis. He leaves a
widow, (who was Miss Herr) and
two small children; also is survived
by his father and mother, Mr. and
Mrs. Bendigo Newcomer; five bro-
thers and one sister: Augustus, of
New Windsor; Samuel, Geo. and Theo
of Taney-town, and Jeremiah 'and An-
Me at home. Funeral services were
held Saturday in St. Paul's Lutheran
Church, Harney and interment made
in the Lutheran cemetery at that
place.

Special Notices
Cord Wood at private sale; about

75 cords of Oak at my farm tenan-
ted by Jesse G. Angell, who will give
price. — Samuel Galt.
The Mayberry Band will hold their

festival on the evening of August 30
in Driver's Grove.

• Some day,
every_ TV will be

designed to deliver
this performance!

SEE IT NOW
HERE!

r,
I(
UNBELIEVABLE
PRICED AT ONLY

$139.95

\ including stand

NEW

SYLVANIA
SUBURBANITE V
• Brand-new POWER

STREAM Chassis
• Exclusive POWER

THROTTLE* Circuit
• EXCLUSIVE 19-inch , MODEL

Bonded Picture Tube, 19Po9wil
,measured diagonally
• 174 sq. inches of picture
• "OUT FRONT" Sound

'Patent Pending

FRITZ'S RADIO & TV
11 George Street,

TANEYTOWN, MD.

PHONE: PL 6-5131

8-15-2t

INSURED SAFETY

for your savings account.

START YOURS NOW!

AUGUSTA
Building and Loan Ats'n.

Westminster: Shopping Center
Baltimore: 420 N. Howard St.

Dundalk: 7 Center Place
Annapolis: 6 West Street

Taneytown Jr.-Sr. H. S.
Homeroom Roll

7A—Class Roll & Homeroom 102
Ruth Airing
Sandra Airing
Victoria Baker .
Georgianna Chronister
Brenda Clem
Esther Harman
Linda Simpson

Catherine Stonesifer
Dorothy Windisch
Donald Adkins
Allison Baker
Larry Bankert
Roy Bauerlien
Ralph Ghronister
Gary Eckard
Larry Eckenrode
Brett Fleagle
Richard Foster
Ray Haines
Robert Haines
Donald Minor
Tommy Riffle
Dennis Rinehart
Harold Wilson
Paul Heffner
Bennie Green
David Baumgardner

----
7B—Class Roll & Homeroon 105
Kenneth Bauerlien
Jeff Blanchfield
Westley Hall
Jack Howarth
Charles Jenkins
Barry Kint
Terry Kiser
Larry Motter
Freeland Shaffer
Drew Welk
Jimmy West
Charles Young
Robert Young
Leonard Miller
Susan Bell
Bonnie Bowers
Dianne M. Cook
Sherry Ditzler
Shark4te Ebaugh
Victoria Frock
Linda Hahn
Brenda Hess
Diane Hess
Doris Lookingbill
Shirley Milburn
Sharon Minor
Barbara Stambaugh
Ann Tankosic
Bonita Vaughn
Jesse Bono

7C—Class Roll & Homeroom 201
Brenda Anders
Mary Bailey
Linda Eckenrode
Connie Foreman
Linda Glacken
Barbara Hitchcock
Sharon Kelly
Pamela Livesay
Susan Miller
Barbara Morrison
Bonnie Overholtzer
Linda Shorb
Lois Smith
Barbara Stambaugh
Marjorie Stutzman
Christine Wiles
Teresa Zent
Peggy Rodkey
Linda Van Fossen

John Brauning
Samuel Cassell
Douglas Dayhoff
Gary Etzler
Robert Eyler
Steven Garner
Edward Green
Ronnie Hess
James McKinney
Donald Sandruck
Michael Selby
Jay Shorb
Kevin Speak
Steven Wantz

8th Grade Classroom Roll
8A Homeroom 209

Shirley Albaugh
Patsy Baumgardner
Margaret Becker
Darlene Bowers
Sharon Dull
Susan Fogle
Dorothy Frye
Linda Goins
Linda Harner
Vivian Kint
Iris Leatherman
Virginia Null
Juanita Smith
Donna Uebel
Paula Walkling

David Bailey,
Roger Brown
Maurice Buckley
Larry Carr
Richard Eckard
Michael Fair
Robert Frye
Richard Glass
Rudolph Hansen
Donald Hess
Russell Kint
Danny Little
Ronnie Miller
William Matter
Harold Wantz

8th Grade Classroom Roll
8B Homeroom 202

Mary Jane Blettner
Darlene Bowers
Esther Carr
Beverly Fair
Sharon Feeser
Sheila Green
Pamela Hahn
Doris Hawk
Debbie Hommerbocker
Shirley Keilholtz
Anne King
Margaret Laird
Cathy Parrish
Linda Schaffer
Donna Simpson
Juanita Smith
Joan Stonesifer
Linda Weant
Joyoe Zentz

Charles Adams
James Bailey
Elvin Green
Dennis Guyton
Gordon Jenkins
John Lawrence
Fred Lieb
Stephen Lippincott
Pat Milligan
Jerry Nusbaum
Francis Pittinger
Arthur Ridinger
Carroll Shaffer
Roy Stambaugh
Duane Wiles 
Bernard Tankosic

9th Grade 9—A Homeroom 109
Bonnie Blair
Treva Bowers
Beverly Fogle
Joanne Glass
Parry Glass
Judy Green
Shirley Hahr!
Bonnie Horning
Stephen Homan
Susan Kiser

Dianne Loftice
Barbara Neiderer
Diana Stitely

Carroll Adkins
Ronald Adkins
Wayne Baker
Charles Bankert
James Brown
James Buckley
Ronald Delauder
Randy Ditzler
Thomas Eckenrode
Ronald Eyler
Larry Fogle
James Foster
Paul Hahn
Ronald Hahn
Calvin Harman
David Leister
Fred Little
Douglas Reaver
Ronald Jenkins
Wayne Wilson

9th Grade 9—B Homeroom 101
Doris Bowers
Christy Brown
Wanda Fogle
Brenda Gibson
Becky Hahn
Beverly Hahn
Bonnie Harmon
Linda Lloyd
Judy Welty
Gordette Holder

Calvern Adams
Robert Airing
Ronald Brown
Thomas Coale
Terry McKinney
David Rodkey
Richard Rodkey
William Shorb
Clinton Stonesifer
Gary Wantz
Larry Welty
Joseph Fleischman
Kenneth Haines

9th Grade 9—C Homeroom 106
Trudy Barnes
Alice Barnhouse
Susan Copenhaver
Sharon Ebaugh
Ruth Graybill
Peggy Hahn
Terrie Hess
Susan Laird
Janet Montgomery
Connie Mummert
Anne Ricketts
Esther Rinehart
Linda Smith
Peggy Jo Smith
Delores Utz
Pat Wargny
Diana Windisch

Henry Alexander
Donald Bollinger
Thomas Brown
Phillip Fleagle
Patrick Gartrell
Fred Halter

Robert Howarth
Phillip Martin
Charles Null
Richard Reindollar
Robert Reindollar
Gary Shirk
George Shoemaker
Leroy Smeak
Myron Smith
Kenneth Strickhouser
Robert Wilson
Raymond Wojthowiak

10th Homeroom-205 Section 10—I
Joanne Bailey
Donna Bauerliene
Ellen Bowers
Linda Clem
Joan Dinterrnan
Melissa Dull
Carolyn Formwalt
Sandra Green
Beverly Hawk
Gale Holder
Kathryn Jenkins
Susan Jennings
Lore Lieb
Beverly Miller
Connie Nusbaum
Carolyn Specht
Linda Riffle
Karen Skiles
Helen Warehime
Joan Decker

Douglas Baker
Paul Clingan
Jerry Devilbiss
Floyd Fogle
James Frock
Ralph Green
Ronald Haines
Robert Koons

Louis Lanier
Gary Neiderer
Karl Nusbaum
Robert Raab
Ray Seitler
Sheldon Shealer
David Sowers
Richard Strickhouser
Douglas Wantz
George Warner
Wayne Wilson
Bryan Nelson
Gerald Keeney
Larry Gigeous

10th Homeroom-110 10-11
Lena Baker
Nina Bell
Linda Cook
Sylvia Dayhoff
Patricia Feeser
Helen Goodermuth
Eleanor Haines
Barbara Harvey
Linda Heffner
Margaret Hird
Karen Holder
Cynthia Johnson
Florence Lloyd
Barbara Minor
Bonnie Ohler
Barbara Kiser

Groups of 24 or more — enjoy free'adMission to

the Races and Fair,

Room, and see the

for just $5.00 per

reservations.

cuttatt ,4„„

have dinner in the Flamingo

evening stage show . . . all

person. Call CL 2-4210 for

Miriam Reindollar
Sandra Selby
Linda Stambaugh
Thomas Baumgardner
Ricky Clingan
Dennis Fair
Thomas Gartrell
James Green
William Grey
Marvin Koons
Richard Logue
Howard Mills
William Overholtzer
Ronald Ridinger
George Selby
David Shorb
Ralph Staub
Daniel Study
Lamar Wagerman
Daniel Wilhide
Wayne Wilhide
Windell Sowers
Williard Candler
Eddy Baker

11th Homeroom-206 11—I
Donna Airing
Gale Crabbs
Mary Louise Baker
Anne Blair
Connie Crawl
Connie Dull
Lena Fink
Tinia Fleagle
Linda Gibson
Donna Hively
Linda Hahn
Carol Hansen
Irene Haycraft
Jacquelyn Jester
Margaret Mason
Nancy Myers
Linda Ohler
Dorothy Pittinger
Ellen Ridinger
Diana Smith
Nina Trankley
Deborah Wiley
Ricky Airing
Byron Barnes
Samuel Bower
Barry Dayhoff
James Dayhoff
Richard Frazier
Richard Glass
Joseph Hahn
David Kelly
Edwin Koons
Alan Laird
Kenneth Leister
Daniel Minor
James Ramsburg
Thomas West

11th Homeroom-208 11—II
Linda Baker
Patty Barnhouse
Edith Bowers
Judy Deal
Shirley Dinterman
Rebecca Gartrell
Toby Gladfelter
Connie Hahn
Patsy Hahn
Eileen Haycraft
Barbara Hopkins

Margaret Knouse
Carole Koons
Barbara Matter
Cynthia Nusbaum
Brenda Plaine
Joan Reindollar
Barbara Uebel
Jeanne Willet
Phyllis Glass

Ronald Anders
Terry Bell
John Dickinson
Richard Feeser
Oscar Fogle
Ronald Frock

Ed Howarth
Gerald Knouse
Thomas Lawrence
Thomas Mason
Ronald Martin
Dwight Perry
James Montgomery
William Shank
Daniel Shriner
John Shriver

12th Homeroom-107 - 12 —I
John Click
Joan Clingan
Vicki Cutsail
Marian Dunham
Robin Fair
Peggy Fleagle
William Foglesong
Beverly Harrier
Oliver Glass
James Hahn
Jessee Hansen
Norma Horning
Genevieve Kiss
Robert Miller
Keith McCurley
Carol Piez,onki
Barbara Pittinger
John Shorb
Linda Singer
John Speak
Nancy Stine
Susan Welty

12th Homeroom-204 12-11
Dotty Bailey
Nancy Baumgardner
Joan Cassell
Carroll Crum
Laura Dom
Travis Dutterer
Diana Fair
Freres Flohr
Carroll Foreman
Larry Guyton
Harriett Harner
William Halter
Faye Hilterbrick
Janet Kint
Rosa Liller
Charles Mason
Martin Nusbaum
Carol Remsburg
Richard Ridinger
Nancy Robertson
Wayne Staley
Nancy Wargny
Audrey Wilhide
Bonnie Wood

TIMONIUM FAIR
AUGUST 26th thru
SEPTEMBER 4th

BIGGER AND BETTER THAN EVER! k.
Come see the exciting draft horse pulling contests —
farm machinery displays— horse and pony shows —
daily livestock judging and exhibits.

* FREE PARKING!

* Interesting exhibits, gala midway, kiddie rides!

* Art exhibits, clothing and fashion shows!

* Stars of Grand Ole Opry, as heard on WBMO —
nightly at 8!

a•!rei
DAILY DOUBLE
TWIN DOUBLE

MON., AUG. 26—Selection of Farm Queen-8
P.M.

TUES., AUG. 27-4-H Square Dance-8 P.M.
WED., AUG. 28 thru MON., SEPT. 2—Free

Grandstand Show with Stars of Grand Ole
Opry, as heard on W8MD-8 P.M.

TUES., SEPT. 3—Light Weight Horse Pulling
Contest-7:30 P.M.

WED., SEPT. 4—Heavy Weight horse Pulling
Contest-7:30 P.M.

Daylight Thoroughbred RACING
AUGUST 26th thru SEPTEMBER 21st

Nine races daily, with all racing completed by 5 p.m.
Modern betting facilities — plenty of free parking. For
reserved seats, call CLearbrook 2-0200. Post Time 1:30

AIR-CONDITIONED DINING ROOM AND COCKTAIL LOUNGE
Phone: CLearbrook 2-4210 for reservations.

DIRECTIONS: Just north of Baltimore on
Route 45 — To‘c Ealtimore Beltway Exit
26. B8,A, McMahon buses.

MARYLAND STATE FAIR AND

AGRICULTURAL SOCIETY, INC.

HOWARD W. CLARK, President
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CORRESPONDENCE
Latest Items of Local News Furnished
By Our Regular Staff of Writers
We desire correspondence to reach our

office on Wednesday, if at all possible. It
will be necessary, therefore, for most let-
ters to be mailed on Tuesday morning.
Letters mailed on Wednesday may not
reach us in time.

HARNEY

Services Sunday, August 25 at St.
Paul's Lutheran Church, Worship at
9:00, Sunday School at 10:00, Pastor,
Rev. John Fry.
Recent visitors with Mr. and Mrs.

Marlin Six, Barry, Brett and Belinda
were Mr. and Mrs. Lewis Baer and
Shawn, Taneytown and Mrs. Edna
Snider.
Jerry Strickhouser spent several

days last week with his grandmother,
Mrs. Alice Marker, Frizellburg.

Visitors last week with Mr. and
Mrs. Theodore Ridinger, Richard and
Ronald were Miss Judy Strickhouser,
Littlestown, Rt. Pa., Mr. and Mrs.
Walter Clingan, Ricky and Judy, Mr.
and Mrs. Russell Wantz, Jr., Mrs.
Luther Fox, Mrs. Edna Snider, Miss
Sherry Hess, Mr. and Mrs. Reynold
Ridinger, Mrs. Ray Slaybaugh, Sha-
ron and Lisa, Mr. Robert Strick-
houser, Mrs. George Clingan and
Stevie, Mr. Fred Spangler, Mr. and
Mrs. Ralph Vaughn, Bonnie and
Vonnie.
Mr. and Mrs. Franklin Koontz and

sons, Bonneauville, Pa., visited Tues.
evening with Mrs. Effie Fream and
Mr. and Mrs. Howard Kump.
Mrs. John Ridinger is now a citizen

of the United States.
Mrs. Annie Kiser and Mrs. Nevin

Ridinger took Leona Krebs to Han-
over Hospital last Wednesday.

Visitors during the week with Ber-
nice and Georgia Hiteshew were Mrs.
Luther Fox, Mrs. J. Walter Kump,
Mrs. Ballard Smith and Linda, Mrs.
George Shriver, Mrs. Harvey Wantz,
Miss Mary Haines, Mrs. Samuel
Valentine, Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Frock
and Ronald, and Mrs. Esther Fuss.
Mr. and Mrs. Orville LeGore and

two daughters have returned to their
home in Corbin, Kentucky after
spending the week with brothers and
sisters and attending the Bowers and
LeGore Reunions.
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Shildt attend-

ed the Bowers Reunion last Sat.
Callers with Mary Haines Sat-

urday morning were Mr. and Mrs.
Robert Moran and Mrs. David
Michael, Baltimore.
Callers at the home of Mr. and

Mrs. Charles W. Bridinger over the
weekend were, Mr. and Mrs. Carl
Oyler, Gettysburg, Pa., Miss Elaine
Bridinger, Littlestown, Pa., and Rob-
ert Reifsnider.

Visitors over the weekend with
Mrs. Marion Haines and family were
Mr. and Mrs. William Michael, son
Billy, Mr. and Mrs. Robert Moran,
daughter Joyce, Mr. and Mrs. Leon-
ard Habicht, Mrs. Mary Rodrick, Mrs.
David Michael, all of Baltimore, Mr.
and Mrs. Claude Fissell, Gettysburg,
Rt. 5. Pa., Mrs. Wesley Mummert
and Jimmie and Mrs. Elwood Strick-
houser.
Week-end visitors with Mr. and

Mrs. Clyde Frock were Mr. and Mrs.
William DeGroft, Union Bridge, Mr.
and Mrs. John Frock, Mummasburg,
Pa., Miss Reta Beck, Spring Grove,
Pa., and Mr. and Mrs. William Simp-
son, Linda and Brenda, Taney-tow-n.
Weekend guests with Mr. and Mrs.

Wesley Mummert, Connie and Jim-
mie were Mrs. Mary Rodrick and
Mrs. David Michael, Baltimore. Other
visitors were Mr. and Mrs. William
Michael, son, Billy, Mr. and Mrs.
Robert Moran and Joyce, Mr. and
Mrs. Leonard Habicht, all of Balti-
more, Mr. and Mrs. Lester Spangler,
Barlow, Pa., Mr. and Mrs. Robert
Strickhouser, Mr. and Mrs. Erman
Chipley and Mr. and Mrs. Elwood
Strickhouser, Kenny and Jerry.
Weekend guests with Mr. and Mrs.

Elwood Strickhouser, Kenny and
Jerry were Mr. and Mrs. Robert Mor-
an and Joyce and Mr. and Mrs.
Leonard Habicht, Baltimore.
Mr. and Mrs. Morris Haines and

son and Mary Haines attended the
picnic at Gist, Md., Saturday eve.
They enjoyed the supper very much
and was so nice to meet old friends
they have, not seen for so long. They
also called on Mrs. Frank Ross.
Last Sunday a very nice birthday

dinner was held at the home of Mr.
and Mrs. David Yealy and family,

in honor of Mrs. Florence Null. Mr.
and Mrs. Charles Bierkamp were the
dinner guests from Philadelphia, Pa.
Mr. and Mrs. Luther Fox attended

the Sterner Reunion Sunday at
Arendtsville, Pa.
A get together of the Selby family

was held Sunday at Natural Dam,
Pa. Those present were Mr. and Mrs.
Kenneth Selby, Richard, Robert and
Donna Dove, Gettysburg, Pa., Mr.

and Mrs. Sterling Overholtzer, Mel-
anie and Angela, Taneytown, Mr.

and Mrs. George Crabbs, Mrs. Mary

Sines, Pete, Jeff, Bonnie and Robin,

Joe Lingg, all of Hagerstown, Mr.

and Mrs. James Crabbs, Glen Burnie,

Mr. and Mrs. Denver Crabbs and

Mikie, Mr. and Mrs. Lester Crouse

and James, Larry Pitts and Myles
Schrocker, all of Baltimore, Mr. and

Mrs. Robert Eckenrode and Denise,

Mrs. Eleanor Hooper, Dale, Gary,

and Debra, Westminster, Mr. Nor-

man Selby and Allen, Mr. and Mrs.

George Selby and Sandra, Mr. and

Mrs. Carroll Selby, Mikie, Pamela

and Jeff, Bonnie Overholtzer, and

Mr. and Mrs. Francis Selby, Stevie

and Allan all of here.
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Shildt visited

their son and family, Mr. and Mrs.

David Shildt, Littlestown, Pa., •Sun-

day evening.
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Oyler, Gettys-

burg, Pa. and Mr. and Mrs. Charles

W. Bridinger spent Sunday evening

with Mr. and Mrs. C. Lynn Strick-

heuser, Littlestown, Rt. 1, Pa.
Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Wantz at-

tended on Sunday afternoon the

World War I Veterans picnic of
Gettysburg, Pa. at the home of Mr.

and Mra. Frank Merriken, near Bar-

low, Pa.
Sunday supper guests with Mr. and

Mrs. George Valentine, Littlestown,

1

Rt. 2, Pa. were Mr. and Mrs. Stock-
ton Rouzie, Frederick, Mr. and Mrs.
Edward Cluck, sons, Barry and
Brian, Littlestown, Rt. 2, Pa., Mr.
and Mrs. Gary Valentine, Hanover,
Pa., Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Valentine
and Mrs. Esther Fuss. The occasion
being Mr. S. Valentine's birthday.

Mrs. Effie Fream was a guest at
a picnic supper Sunday with Mr. and
Mrs. George Fream and Diane,
Baptist Road.
Sunday dinner guests with Mr. and

Mrs. Harry Angell were Mrs. Angell's
daughter, Mrs. Austa Perrine and
Mr. Daniel Lenker, Millersburg, Pa.,
and Mrs. Loretta Umholtz.
Sunday afternoon visitors with Mr.

and Mrs. Ballard Smith and Linda
were Mrs. Bonnie Dotson, daughter,
Emma Sue, Taneytown.
Mr. and Mrs. David Yealy, Mrs.

Florence Null, Mrs. Margaret Sentz,
Miss Joyce Yealy and Sonny Shoe-
maker attended on Sunday the Null
and Reaver Reunion, Memorial Park,
Taneytown.
Jimmie Mummert is spending a

few days this week with his grand-
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Delbert Spang-
ler.

HOOPER'S DELIGHT

Mrs. L. C. Stitley, Mrs. Raulin
Hancock and sons', enjoyed lunch at
the Geiman sisters on Saturday, of
Westminster.
Sorry to hear the accident of Mr.

David Ensor, who is in Carroll Coun-
ty General Hospital, hope he soon re-
covers.

Mrs. Fred Farver and son, Jody of
Westminster, is spending a few days
with her husband, Fred Farver of
Flat Rock, Michigan.
Jerry and Jackie Farver of West-

minster, is spending the Summer with
their grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. H.
0. Farver and Mr. and Mrs. W. Bar-
ber and son.
Bob Cover and sister, Nola, of

Bronx. N. Y., is spending a few days
with their grandparents, Mrs. L. C.
Stitley.

Miss Frances Gregg and friend and
Bev. Clinton and friend called on
Miss Faye Jean Farver on Sunday.
Mr. and Mrs. Raulin Hancock and

sons spent Saturday with Mr. and
Mrs. E. J. Hancock.
Mr. and Mrs. W. Barber and son,

Mrs. H. 0. Farver and grandsons,
Jerry and Jackie Farver, enjoyed the
Firemen and Auxiliary picnic last
Sunday, which was held at the Le-
High Park of Union Bridge.
Mr. and Mrs. W. Barber and son,

Ricky and Jerry and Jackie Farver,
called on Miss Mary Farver on Satur-
day evening.

Miss Vicki Lynn Farver is spend-
ing a few days with Mr. and Mrs.
J. Click.

Mr. and Mrs. H. J. Farver and
daughters, Faye Jean, Vickie Lynn
and Kenneth Stephan enjoyed the
water at Bay Ridge on Sunday.

Mrs. Harry 0. Farver and Mrs. W.
Barber and son, Ricky, called on Mr.
and Mrs. Melvin Snyder and daughter
of Frederick on Thursday.
Those visiting the Barbers' and the

Farvers' on Sunday and during the
week were: Mr. and Mrs. James
Boone, Mrs. Mary Crabbs, Mrs. Allen
Stansbury and daughter, Mr. and
Mrs. H. J. Farver and daughters,
Faye Jean and Vicki Lynn, Mrs. El-
mer Hooper, Melvin Snyder and
daughter, Melanie, Patsy Stansbury,
Pannie and Frankie and Dugil Batta-
gin.
Mrs. Allen Stansbury and Mrs. Le-

Roy Day and two other ladies are
spending a few days at Ocean City.
We had a nice rain last night.

KEYSVILLE-DETOUR

Greetings to you:
There was a Surprise Baby Shower

held at the home of Mr. and Mrs.
Carroll Wilhide near Detour on Sun-
day evening for their daughter-in-
law, Mrs. Richard Wilhide of Forest
and Stream Club Road, with relatives
and immediate neighbors attending.
Cassie received many lovely gifts for
her "little Wilhide" and was especi-
ally surprised to see so many of her
"folks from Clear Spring.
Sunday visitors with Mr. and Mrs.

Edward Coshun and family near
Detour were Mrs. Bernard Hoff, Sr.
and daughter Ruth, Mr. and, Mrs.
Bernard Hoff, Jr., and children, Mr.
and Mrs. William Haygood and Billy
and Mr. George Frank of Annapolis
and Mr. and Mrs. Douglas Hoff and
ohildren of Washington.

Miss Andrea Priest of Forest and
Stream Club Road spent the weekend
visiting with Miss Becky Green in
Union Bridge. I understand Becky
recently became the owner of a horse.
Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Wilhide of

Keysville-Taneytown Road and her
sister, Miss Elizabeth Yoder of White
Hall,. with Mrs. Mark Baumgardner
of Keysville, traveled as far as the
Smokies last week. They were gone
from Tuesday through Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. William Weishaar
and Randy of Forest and Stream
Club Road attended the Rinehart Re-
union on Sunday the 11th at Meadow-
view in Westminster.

Don't forget the Hymn Sing at
Rocky Ridge next Sunday, the 25th,
about 7:30 p.m. This is arranged by
the Union Bridge Lutheran Men's
Chorus, and everyone is welcome.
Two Keysville Lutheran Sunday

School classes, those taught by Mrs.
Rachel Bostian and Mr. Lloyd Wil-
hide, and some of their friends spent
most of Saturday on a picnic at the
Bay Bridge Park near Annapolis.
Thursday evening visitors at the

home of Mr. and Mrs. Wilbur Thomas
of Taneytown were: Mrs. Carroll
Wilhide, Mrs. Emory Yoder, Jane and
Beth Wilhide and Sandra Fry of De-
tour. Mrs. Thomas is the former Miss
Mabel Sharrer.
There were two baptisims at Keys-

vine Lutheran Church on Sunday.
They were Shirley Renee, daughter of
Mr. and ,Mrs. Myron Wilhide near
Detour, and Jonathon David, son of
Mr. and Mrs. John Lambert, near
New Midway.
Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Fleharty and

children of Keysville Road, were
week-end visitors with her father,
step-mother and step-brother, Mr.
and Mrs. Elmer Wolfgang and Steve
Henshaw of Ginter, Pa.
Monday afternoon visitors at the

William Weishaar home near Detour,
were: Mrs. Weishaar's aunt and

uncle, Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Kauff-
man of Baltimore.

Miss Sarah Yoder of Rockville, Was
a luncheon guest of her cousins, Mr.
and Mrs. Carroll Wilhide, Jane and
Beth, near Detour, on Saturday the
10th. She also called on Mr. and Mrs.
Richard Wilhide and Mr. and Mrs.
Myron Wilhide, Denise and Renee..
There's a new house under roof in

New Midway diagonally across from
the road from Detour. The addition
to the grade school there is really
good looking. It surely will add to the
effectiveness of the school to have
the additional space. This is a very
attractive little community. We have
often remarked on the cleanliness
and neatness of the houses and yards
and gardens. New Midway-ites can be
proud of their little town.

Visitors early Sunday evening with
the Carroll Wilhide family near De-
tour were his brother and sister-in-
law, Mr. and Mrs. Mehrle Wilhide and
friends, Mr. and Mrs. Mace of York,
Penna. These folks were returning
from a trip they had made to Va. and
also called on Mrs. Wilhide's brother,
Raymond Warner; near. Keymar.
The Public •Sale of the Estate of

Mrs. Mary Lambert near Woodsboro,
will be this Saturday, the 24th. The
Keysville Lutheran Church Women
will have the refreshment stand and
will appreciate any donations and
purchases. The proceeds will again
go to the Building Fund. You may
contact Mrs. Mae Baumgardner, Mrs.
Kathryn Stine or Mrs. Ruth Wilhide.
Mrs. Emory Yoder and her daugh-

ter, Miss Elizabeth Yoder, who have
been visiting at the Carroll Wilhide
home near Detour, were Monday
over-night guests with Mr. and Mrs.
Walter Gill of White Hall. Mrs. Yo-
der had her glasses changed this trip.
Happy birthday wishes to Libby

Coshun on the 22nd and belated birth-
day wishes to her brother, Terry on
the 15th. Libby and Terry are chil-
dren of Mr. and Mrs. Edward Coshun,
near Detour.
Sunday evening visitors at the Wm.

Fleharty home near Detour were her
sister and friend, Miss Carol Wolf-
gang and Mr. Wm. Burr of Wash-
ington.
During the week beginning Aug-

ust 12, Mrs. Virgie Ohler of Keys-
ville, moved to her new trailer home
in Taneytown on the property of her
son and daughter-in-law, Mr. and
Mrs. Richard Ohler of Middle Street.
Mrs. Ohler was only 6 years old
when she and her family moved to
the house in Keysville and on the
11th there was a family gathering
for their last Sunday there together.
Those present were: Mr. and Mrs.
Upton Austin, Mr. and Mrs. Karl
Austin, daughter, Kim and son,
Craig, Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Austin,
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Ohler, daugh-
ters, Linda, Bonnie, Patti, Debby and
son, Dennis, all of Taneytown; Mr.
and Mrs. Wayne Crum and son, Todd
of Frederick, Mrs. Wm. Topper,
daughters, Cherl, and sons, Thomas,
Nevin and Kevin of Emmitsburg, Mr.
and Mrs. Joseph Ohler, sons, Joseph
and Steven of Thurmont, and Mr. and
Mrs. Dennis Overholtzer, daughters,
Kathy and Cindy and son, Michael of
Harney.
On Monday, Mr. and Mrs. Carroll

Wilhide, Jane and Beth of Detour,
and their neice, Sandra Fry of Bal-
timore, left for a trip to New York
State. They will be gone about a
week and may get as far as Niagara
Falls. They also plan to visit with
relatives and friends on the way.
One point of interest they plan to
see is the Corning Glass Works at
Corning.

— Marlys Fleharty.

FRIZELLBURG

The folks in the "Burg" and sur-
rounding community were sorry to
hear of the death of their neighbor
and friend, Mr. S. Lease Warner. He
was loved by all who knew him. He
will be missed in his home and com-
munity. We extend our heartfelt
sympathy to his !bereaved wife and
family, also to his mother Mrs.
(Warner) Wanner.

Mrs. Walter Marker, Misses Helen
and Sally Mae Marker of this place
and Kenneth Strickhouser, Harney,
enjoyed a nice trip to Williamsburg,
Jamestown and Luray Caverns, Va.,
Monday, Tuesday and Wednesday,
during the week of August 12th. On
Friday they toured and visited with
friends in Annapolis, Md.

Miss Lamore Sullivan visited with
Miss Dorothy Barber, Wakefield, on
Sunday.

Rally Day services this Sunday
morning at the Church of God' at9:45
A. M. Mr. Charles Hersh of Green-
mount will be the guest speaker. Lo-
cal talent will furnish special music,
Mr. Howard Carr, supt.
The Frizellburg and Wakefield

Churches of God enjoyed an evening
of fellowship at the Taneytown Mem-
orial Park on Thursday evening. A
base ball game was played and Wake-
field won 7 to 0. Devotions were in
charge of the Wakefield Pastor, Rev.
Argyl Dick. A watermelon party fol-
lowed with 110 persons attending.
This Sunday evening service at the

church of God 7:30, Rev. Henry J.
Heydt of N. Y. will be the guest
speaker. This service which will con-
tinue through the week, each evening
at 7:45.
Mr. and Mrs. Arthur K. Myers and

family of Briarcliff Manor. New
York, are visiting with their parents.
Mrs. Norman T. Myers and Mr. and
Mrs. H. K. Myers. The boys, Thomas
and Wm., are attending camp this
week at Camp Nawakwa, Penna.

Linda Bowen with the Roland Rill
family took a trip over the Skyline
Drive on Saturday. Carrie Lee Rill
is spending several days this week
with Linda.
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Coe and

family motored to White Ferry on
Sunday, and visited with Mrs. Joseph
Haines and family at Germantown.
,Mrs. Earl Fox and daughter.

Teresa, of New Windsor, visited in
the Coe home on Monday.

Services in Emmanuel (Baust)
Lutheran Church this Sunday morn-
ing are as follows: Worship at 9:30
A. M., Church School at 10:30 A. M.,
Rev. J. H. ,august Borleis, pastor and
Kenneth R. Lambert, Supt.
On Tuesday evening (in the rain)

Trinity Lutheran Church men played
a softball game with Baust Lutheran
Church men on the Taneytown High

School diamond. Trinity won with the
score 5 to 4. The same teams will be
playing again on Thursday evening,
Aug. 29, at 6:30 on the High School
diamond.
Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Morelock, Han-

over visited on Wednesday in the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Allen More-
lock, Tyrone Road.

There will be no services in Em-
manuel (Baust) United Church of
Christ on Sunday; Rev. and Mrs.
Robert V. Johnson and daughter Cyn-
thia are visiting friends in Ruffs-
dale, Penna.

Miss Sylvia and Sandra Stonesifer
sang on Sunday at the Worship Ser-
vice of the S. S. of St. Mary's United
Church of Christ, Silver Run. They
were accompanied by Mrs. Denton
Wantz.
Miss ,Shirley Bare and Mrs. Allen

Morelock enjoyed a bus trip to Wil-
liamsburg and Jamestown, Va., this
week-end. They attended the pageant
"The Common Glory", given at the
amphitheatre on the William and
Mary College campus.
Approximately 150 attended the

Werking - Otto reunion, held at Big
Pipe Creek Park on Sunday, August
18. Basket flinch was enjoyed at noon
and a program was given in the af-
ternoon with Rev. Nevin Smith a
member of the clan as speaker.
The Lutheran Church Women of

Emmanuel (Baust) Lutheran Church
met on Wednesday evening, August
14th, at the home of Mrs. Amanda
Bair, with Mrs. 'Clarence Master as
the leader. She chose for the lesson
topic, "Employed Women and the
Church." The scripture was read, re-
corded in Galatians 3-23:28, followed
with prayer. Mrs. H. K. Myers, Mrs.
Charlotte Shorb and Mrs. Geo. San-
ner acted as panel for Units II and
III: "Women in the Total Labor Pic-
ture," "Why do Women Seek Paid
Employment?" and "Some Results of
Womens' Working." Other members
participated in "Employed Women
and the Church." A discussion fol-
lowed. Mrs. Geo. Sanner was in
charge of the business meeting. An-
nouncement was made of the U. L.
C. W. Assembly to be held October
17 at St. Mary's, Silver Run, with
supper at 5:30 and work-shop to fol-
low from 7 to 10. Birthday noted was
Mrs. Bessie Freet. Hymns, during the
meeting were: "Take my Life and
Let It Be," and "Lord Dismiss Us
With Thy Blessing." The September
meeting will be in the form of a cov-
ered dish supper at 6:30 and White
Elephant Party. The hostess served
delicious refreshments to 13 members
and one guest.

Approximately 43 members and
friends of the Never Weary Class en-
joyed a watermelon party on the
lawn of Mrs. Walter Marker, Satur-
day evening. Games were played and
prizes were awarded and watermel-
ons disapeared like magic.
Jerry Strickhouser of Harney, vis-

ited with his grandmother, Mrs. Wal-
ter Marker, several days this week.
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Myers, Jr.,

son, Mark, Mrs. Walter Myers, Sr.,
Mrs. Bessie Freet of this place, Mr.
and Mrs. Luther Zimmerman, May-
berry, Mr. and Mrs. Sterling Zimmer-
man, Westminster, attended the Haw-
kins and Moeline wedding and re-
ception, Sunday afternoon, August
18th in the Woodsbaro Lutheran
Church.
Mrs. Harry Cashman is spending

this week with her sister, Mrs. Carrie
Caylor of Uniontown.
Rev. and Mrs. James D. Robb and

daughter, Dessiree of near Pitts-
burgh, Pa., Mr. and Mrs. R. B. Robb
of Vienna, Va., Mr. and Mrs. Harry
Berwager, Mr. and Mrs. Russell Bar-
wager, Hanover, Pa., and Mrs. Cath-
erine Coxon of Baltimore, visited at
the home of Mr. and Mrs. John Ber-
wager and family on Sunday.

ROCKY RIDGE

A party was held August 11.th at
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Raymond
Hilterbrick of Taneytown in honor
of his sister, Mrs. Iva Ridinger, who
is visiting them from Lakeland Fla.
Those attending were: Mr. and Mrs.
Harlan K. Albaugh of Sykesville;
Mr. and Mrs. Thurman Albaugh of
Glenelg; Miss Jeanie Burky of Ger-
mantown; Mr. and Mrs. Otis Smith,
Marion, Joann, Susan, Mrs. Donald
Martin, Donna, Melissa, Mr. and Mrs.
Geo. Albaugh, Mr. and Mrs. Clinton
Crushong, Mary Catherine, all of
Union Bridge; Mr. and Mrs. Gail-
and Puttnan, Russell Putman of Key-
ar; Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Albaugh of
andallstown; Mrs. Harry Affeldt,

Miss Joy Clarkson of Ellicott City,
Mr. Raymond Smith, Mr. and 'Mrs.
Mehrle Simpson, Jeanne Simpson of
Mt. Pleasant; Mr. Horace A. Smith,
Mrs. Edith Gruber, Mr. and Mrs.
Chas. Keeney and children, Chas, Jr.,
Carl and Emma Lou of Rocky Ridge.
Mr. and Mrs. Roland D. Wilson

and family of Taneytown and Mr. and
Mrs. John N. Cavell and family, Mr.
Kenneth Cavell and Miss Judy Ann
Pittenger of Boyds, spent Sunday
with Mr. and Mrs. Harvey M. Pitten-
ger, Sr., and also visited Mr. and
Mrs. Charles H. Setherly and family.
Mr. Harvey M. Pittenger, Sr.,

spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. Wm.
Rogers of LeGore.
Mr. and Mrs. Harvey M. Pittenger,

Sr., attended Utica picnic and festi-
val on Saturday evening.

FAIRVIEW

We are sorry to learn Mr. Clarence
Jackson was rushed to the Carroll
County General Hospital last week
in a critical condition, due to the ac-
cident on Sunday, August 11. We
wish him a speedy recovery.
Mr. and Mrs. Levi Frock had as

dinner guests in their home on 'Sun-
day the latter's parents, Mr. and
Mrs. Grant Baker, near Keymar, Mr.
and Mrs. Donald Carl and sons,
David and Daniel, also called at the
same hothe in the afternoon.

Steven Frock returned home Sat-
urday night after spending a week
in the home of his uncle and aunt,
Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Fogle and family,
near Wolf's Mill.
Mrs. Mabel Smith called on het

parents, Mr. and Mrs. Grant Baker,
on Friday evening, also Mr. and Mrs.
John Thomas Baker and son, Doug-
las, spent Sunday evening in the
same home.
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Adkins and

daughters, Mary Catherine and Joyce,

held a picnic lunch at their home near
Keymar, on Sunday. Those attending
were: Mr. and Mrs. Russell Adkins
and children, Donnie, Carroll and
Miriam, Mr. and Mrs. Charles Ad-
kins and children, Esther, Carolyn
and Ronnie, Mr. and Mrs. Roy Ad-
kins, Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Topper and
children, Troy and Dennise, Barbra
and Marlene DeGroft and Lois
Smith.
Mrs. Mabel Smith of Keysville,

spent a few days of last week with
her daughter and family, Mr. and
Mrs. John Williams of Taneytown.
Tommy and Linda Eckenrode are

spending a few days in the home of
Mr. and Mrs. Grant Baker and grand-
son, Michael Duble.

Bible In The Schools
I'd like to see the Bible placed
Where the Bible used to be,

Upon the top of teacher's desk
For every child to see;

I'd like to hear the teacher say,
As my teacher used to do;

"before we work or play, dear ones,
I want to read tto you."

I'd like to see her face light up
At each resplendent word,

And watch the children's souls shine
out

At the message they had heard;
I'd like to see the sweet content

Fill that dear room, each nook,
And know that joy had come to each
When teacher reads the book.

I'd like to see the teacher stand
before the class again

And lift with reverent care the book
That makes God's purpose plain,

And ere the youngsters went to work
I'd like to hear her voice

Repeat those words of truth and
faith

That makes one's Soul rejoice.

Yes, I'd like to see the Bible placed
Where the Bible used to be;

I'd like to hear it read aloud
In the schoolrooms of the free.

I want my children taught to know
God's matchless gift of love.

The book of books is Wisdom's gate
To knowledge from above.

—Author Unknown.
He could not of been over four,

the little boy who stood in, front of
the lost and found desk. He hardly
reached the top, and there were
traces of hastily wiped tears on his
chubby face as he inquired, "Has any
mother been turned in this morning?"

BOWERS REUNION

Earl Bowers was re-elected Pres-
ident of the Bowers family reunion
at the 36th annual gathering on Sat-
urday at Taneytown Memorial Park.
Lloyd Bowers is the newly elected
Vice-president. The folloWing offi-
cers were retained: Miss Genevieve
Baumgardner, Secretary; Mrs. Char-
lotte Sentz, Assistant Secretary; and
Charles Schildt, Treasurer.
The program included a song,

"America" by the group, scripture
and prayer by Rev. Thorton Black,
group singing led by Mrs. Theresa
Esbach, songs by the children, mes-
sage by Rev. Warren Echbach, and
closing song, "Blest Be The Tie
That Binds" by the group.

Prizes were awarded to Mrs. Mag-
gie Cutsail and Edward Copenhaver,
the oldest persons present; Wm. Ed-
ward Tyler, youngest person; Mr.
and Mrs. Harvey Lockner, longest
married; Mr. and Mrs. James Storey,
most recently married. The Richard
Sentz family received a prize as the
largest family present, and Mr. and
Mrs. Harry Legore for travelling
500 miles, the greatest distance.

Nearly 150 persons were present
for the evening meal, following an
afternoon of recreation. The 1964 re-
union will be held at the same place
the third Saturday in August.

Some of the things you have learn-
ed. by experience are the things you
should never have learned at all.—
Reporter, Milwaukee, Wisc.

People who can't keep from critic-
izing the younger generation usually
can't remember who raised it.

The easiest way to get in trouble
is to be right at the wrong time.—
Bugle, Langford, S. D.

DIED

MRS. NEWTON E. SIX
Mrs. Bertha May Six, 86, widow of

Newton E. Six, died at 7:15 A. M.
Tuesday at the home of a daughter,
Mrs. Wilford Smith, Taneytown, Mrs.
Six was a daughter of the late Jago
and Cecilia Weller Colliflower. Her
husband died nine years ago. She was
a member of Graceharn Moravian
Church. Snrviving are four children:
Mrs. Smith; Wm. J. Six, Frederick;
Newton E. Six, Middleburg; Mrs.
Paul Hahn, Thurrnont; five grand-
children; a brother and two sisters,
Wm. C. Golliflower and Mrs. Ida
Cunningham, Baltimore, and Mrs.
Fred Fulmer, Newfoundland, Penna.
Funeral services will be held at the
Fuss Funeral Home, Taneytown, on
Friday, at 2:00 P. M. with the Rev.
Frederick Morgenstern, her Pastor,
officiating. Burial will be in Keys-
the funeral home this (Thursday)
evening.

S. LEASE WARNER
S. Lease Warner, 58, Westminster

Rt. 7, died at the Carroll County
General Hospital, Westminster, at
8:30 A. M. Saturday after being ad-
mitted Friday night following a heart
attack. He was the distributor of the
Mobile Oil Co. and a dealer for the
International Harvester Motor Truck,
at 538 Baltimore Boulevard, West-
minster. He was the son of Mrs. Min-
nie M. Warner Wanner, Washington,
and the late Amos 0. Warner, Friz-
ellburg. Besides his mother he leaves
his wife, Margaret E. Warner; two
children, Robert E. Warner and Mrs.
Betty Mathias, both of Westminster;
a brother, William 0. Warner, Willow
Farms Dairy, Frizellburg, and two
sisters, Mrs. Guy Reifsnider, West-
minster R. D., and Mrs. Chas. Reck-
ert, Washington.

Funeral services were held at the
Faaffell Funeral Home on Tuesday
morning. The Rev. Stephen D. Mel-
yeller, Pastor of St.. John's Catholic
Church, officiated. Burial was in
St. John's cemetery.

COMMUNITY LOCALS
(Continued from Page One)

Miss Nancy loiter and Miss Carol
Cannon of Frederick, spent the week-
end with Miss Jeanne Howarth. The
young ladies spent Sunday at Fuller
Lake in Penna.

A special meeting of the Taney--
town Jaycettes has been called for
Thursday, August 22, at the Taney-
town Grain and Supply building. The
meeting will start at 7:30 and every-
one is urged to attend.

Mr. and Mrs. Harmon Albaugh and
sons, Tommy and Jimmy of Glen
Burnie and MT. and Mrs. Stoner
Fleagle, daughter, Peggy and son,
Phillip, of Mayberry, were callers
over the week-end of Mr. and Mrs.
Edgar Fleagle.

Mr.. and Mrs. Charles Cluts of
Riverdale Farm were Saturday eve-
ning dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Hugh Heaps and family of Silver
Spring. They were joined by Mr. and
Mrs. T. Jerome Heaps of Street, Md.,
and Mr. and Mrs. Malcolm Heaps and
family of Collegeville, Penna.

Mrs. Mary A. Little has been vis-
iting with her son-in-law and daugh-
ter, Mr. and Mrs. E. Raquet Win-
chester and family of Wakefield
Meadows, Bel Air, Md. Mrs. Little
also visited in Atlantic City, N. J.,
Chester, Pa., Baltimore, Md., and
took her first flight by air to visit
her cousin, Mr. and Mrs. J. Ralph
Kellenberger, Lynhaven, Va.

A Workshop on flower arrange-
ments, the first of a series of four,
was held by the Silver Fancy Garden
Club at Memorial Park, Taneytown,
Md., on Thursday, Aug. 15, 1963, with
Mrs. Andrew Eyster, President, con-
ducting the class. The next class,
to which the public is cordially in-
vited, will be held at the same lo-
cation on Thursday, August 22, 1963
at 9:00 A. M. Persons attending are
requested to bring a container suit-
able for a dining room table, a pin
point holder and any kind of flowers.

THANKS!.

Many thanks for the generous re-
sponse in ads, sponsors and patrons,
in Taneytown, made to the Carroll
County General Hospital Auxiliary,
"Silvery Moon Ball Program." Ball
Saturday, Sept. 28, in Westminster
Riding Club. Tickets now available.

MRS. ROY B. KISER, Solicitor.

CARD OF THANKS•

I wish to express my sincere
thanks and appreciation to all my
friends, neighbors and relatives for
the many cards, gifts, flowers and
visits I received while at the Annie
M. Warner Hospital and since my re-
turn home.

NELLIE M. FENLON.

CARD OF THANKS-

We wish to express our 'sincere
thanks to our friends and relatives
for the gifts, cards, visits, prayers
and other acts of kindness shown us
during our stay at the Annie War-
ner hospital and since our return
home.

MRS. ROBERT D. BOONE
and SON, JOSEPH ROBERT.

CARD OF THANKS.

I want to thank each and every
one who sent me cards while in the
hospital and since my return home.

EDWARD F. WARNER

"CITIZENS OF TOMORROW"

Pictured above are: Mary,
4 years and Charles, 2 years,
children of Mr. and Mrs.
Bernard Decker, Rt. 1-M,
Taneytown, Maryland.

SIX REUNION and PICNIC

The family of the late Albert R.
and Bessie Roop Six, held their an-
nual picnic and reunion in Baker
Park, Frederick, Md., on July 28th.
Those attending were: Mr. and

Mrs. Harry Clabaugh, Mr. and Mrs.
Arthur Clabaugh and family, Ellie
and Gregg, Mr. Charles W. Six and
daughters, Mr. and Mrs. Carroll Wiv-
el and family, Chris. and Alex, Mr.
and Mrs. Charles Cool and Allen,
Brenda, and Johnny, Mr. and Mrs.
Marlin R. Six, Sr., Mr. and Mrs. Don-
ald Hess and Donnie. Diana and Sher-
tie, Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Six and Ste-
ven, Randy, Jeff and Kathy, Mr. and
Mrs. Marlin Six, Jr., and Barry,
Brett and Belinda, Mr. and Mrs. Lar-
ry Six and Yvonne, Mr. and Mrs. El-
lis Martin, Mr. and Mrs. Richard
Vencile, Mr. and Mrs. Carroll Six and
Wayne, Mr. and Mrs. Francis Long,
Mr. and Mrs. Lindsay Hurst and
Linny the 3rd, Mrs. Samuel West
and sons, Thomas, James and Robert.
Guests included were—Mrs. Emma
Stenour and Robert Martin. Most re-
cently married couple—Mr. and Mrs.
Richard Vencile. The longest distance
— Mr. and Mrs. Hurst and son of
Bay Side, New York, and the young-
est member — Johnny Cool.

Ulcers are things you get from
mountain-climbing over mole hills.—
Press, Vista, Calif.

If the best things in life are free,
how come we have to pay 30 much
for less than the best?

Laws and commandments, in some
people's opinions, were made to guide
some other fellow always.

•
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SPECIAL NOTICES

FOR SALE - Black Coat with
mink collar; like new! Terms: $25.00
cash. Phone: PL 6-6738.

CARPETS clean easier with the
Blue Lustre Electric Shampooer only
$1 per day. Reindollar Bros. & Co.

WHITE PAINT SALE - at your
Soathern States Cooperative Agency
now. Save money on Unico quality
self-cleaning White House Paint.
Regularly $6.35 gal. . . now only
$4.95. Limited-time sale. . . get yours
-now. Southern States Taneytown Co-
operative, Inc., Taneytown, Md.
Phone PL 6-6711.

FOR SALE - McCormick Deer-
ing 13x7 grain drill, in good con-
dition. Phone: 756-6164. William I.
Amoss, Taneytown.

22% OFF ON HOUSE PAINT -
That's what you get during Southern
States White Paint Sale. Save $1.40
per gal. on Unico quality self-clean-
ing white house paint. Regularly
$6.35 gal. . . . now only $4.95. Lim-
ited-time offer. Get yours now.
Southern States Taneytown Cooper-
ative, Inc., Taneytown, Md. Phone
PL 6-6711.

NOTICE - I have three large ap-
ple trees-will give them to someone
if they move them. Phone: TI 8-6581.

SAVE ON WHITE HOUSE
PAINT - Get $1.40 off per gal, on
quality Unico self-cleaning White
House Paint. Regularly $6.35 gal.
. . now only $4.95 gal. Limited-time

offer. Southern States Taneytown
Cooperative, Inc., Taneytown, Md.
Phone PL 6-6711.

NOTICE - We are authorized by
the company to sell all of the 1963
Lawn-Boy mowers at 20% discount
off a list price to make way for
1964 models. Brown Equipment Co.,
Past Baltimore Street.

PAINT YOUR HOUSE NOW AND
SAVE. Now during Southern States
White Paint Sale, you can get qual-
ity Unico self-cleaning White House
Paint at $1.40 per gal. discount. Reg-
ularly $6.35. . . . for limited time
only $4.95. Get yours now. Southern
States Taney-town Cooperative, Inc.,
Taneytown, Md. Phone PL 6-6711.

TURKEY and OYSTER Supper
will be held at Grace United Church
of Christ on Saturday, October 5th,
beginning at 3:30 P. M.

8-22 & 9-5-19-26 & 10-3

FOR SALE - 5 Acres of Corn,
wonderful for silage.-Ray Copen-
haver, PL 6-5734. 8-22-2t

FOR SALE - Timothy Hay, 50c
bale. Phone: PL 6-6724. 8-22-2t

FOR SALE - Tomatoes, at 81
York Street.

FOR SALE - Kelvinator refrig-
erator, in good condition. See it at
81 York Street.

FREE - Puppies. E. Howarth, 322
East Baltimore St., Taneytown.

WANTED - Young man to help
on Egg Route -Apply at The Rec-
ord Office giving reference. 8-22-2t

LOST - Black Cat. -Finder re-
turn to Mrs. Lloyd Dickinson, near
Otterdale Mill. Phone: PL 6-4788.

FOR SALE - Spotted Poland
China Pigs, 8 weeks old. Roy Baum-
gardner, near Keysville. Phone PL 6-
4873.

FOR RENT - 3-room Apartment
on Middle St. - C. L. Older. Phone
PL 6-6409. 8-15-3t

FOR SALE - 10 acres Corn, won-
derful for silage.- Franklin Fair.

8-15-2t

& H GREEN STAMPS - will be
given on ALL Merchandise, inclu-
ding delicious Breyer's Ice Cream,
Baumgardner's Bakery. 8-15-tf

WILL KEEP - Children while
parents work. Call 127 E. Baltimore
St. Mrs. Catherine Weishaar. 8-15-2t

WANTED - Kitchen work in res-
taurant. No Sundays. Mrs. Mildred
Parker.

WILL BUY - good clean mixed
Hay; also Timothy and clean Straw.
.Jos. A. Greene, Walnut Grove Road.
Phone PL 6-6517. 8-15-3t

FOR SALE - Seven Puppies, Bas-
set and Beagle mixed, 8 wks. old. $10
•each. Just in time for hunting season.
Phone PL. 6-6508. 8-15-tf

SAVE on your home furnishings
now during our August Furniture
Saleorama! Also for the new brides
-see our 3-room group at lowest
prices. COMMUNITY HOUSE FUR-
NITURE, on the Square, Taneytown.

8-8-4t

FOR FUN in the sun - make the
Taneytown Pharmacy your headquar-
ters for bathing caps, sun glasses and
sun tan preparations. Free S & H
Green Stamps. 7-11-8t

FOR RENT - Second Floor Apt.,
5 large rooms and bath. Immediate
possession. Elwood Baumgardner.
Phone: PL 6-6151. 6-27-tf

SEE US - for Chick and Pullet
orders, anytime. -Taneytown Grain
& Supply Co. Phone: PL 6-6666.

3-14-tf

BE PREPARED-For the unex-
pected. Let us insure you adequate-
ly.-Perey M. Burke, 231 E. Main St.,
Westminster, Md. Phone: Tilden 8-
6620. 4.15-ti

CARD PARTY - Every Monday
night beginning at 8 P. M. Harney
V.F.W., Harney, Md. 9-4-ti

NOTICE-Dial PL 6-6548 for your
Sand, Stone, Blocks and General
Hauling. Fertilizer and Lime. -
Thurston Putman. 7-21-tf

FOR SALE-New and used Type-
writers and Adding Machines, Rib-
bons and Carbon Paper. Also Ma-
chines for rent-Charles L. Stone-
sifer, Representative of Remington
Rand, Inc., Taneytown, Md., phone
PL. 6-6660 or PL. 6-6789. 5-9-tf

CHURCH NOTICES

St. Joseph's Catholic Church, Fred-
erick St. Rev. Joseph A. Kenney,
Pastor. Sunday Mass, 8 and 10:30;
Week day Mass in the convent 7:00
o'clock Sept.-June except Friday Mass
for the Children 11:30 a. m. in the
church. First Friday 11:30 a. m., 5:15
p. m., First Saturday, 8:00 o'clock.
Sodality first Wednesday in month
7:30 p. m. followed by business meet-
ing. Meeting: Holy Name Society
meeting 8 p. m. every third Thurs-
day Business Meeting following
Instruction for children attending
public schools after the Masses
on Sunday. Confession Saturday
at 4-5 p .m.; 7-8 p. m. Baptisms
Sunday 11:30 a. m. C. Y. 0., Saturday
7:30 p. m. Novena to Our Lady of
Perpetual Help. followed by bene-
diction. Meeting and Social in Parish
Hall 8 P. M. - 11:30 P. M.

Holiness Christian Church-Key-
mar, Md. Rev. Wilbur M. Whalen,
Minister-Sunday School, 9:30 a.m.;
Morning Service, 10:30 a.m.; Young
Peoples Service at 7:00 p.m.; Even-
ing service at 7:30 p.m.: Every Tues-
day night at 8:D0 p.m., Bible Study;
Friday night Cottage Pray Meeting.
Would be glad to come in to your
home. I was glad when they said unto
me, let us go into the house of the
Lord! A cordial welcome is extended
to the public-Pastor Whalen

Walnut Grove Dunkard Brethren
Church at Kump's-Sunday School,
9:30 a.m.; preaching, 10:30 a.m. How-
ard Surbey and Guy Dayhoff, Minis-
ters.

Piney Creek Presbyterian Church.
Rev. Wm. Yates, D. D., Pastor.-
August 25, No Church Service or
Church School.

Uniontown Lutheran Parish -
Emmanuel (Baust) Church-Wor-

ship 9:30 A. M., Church School 10:30
A. M.

St. Paul's, Uniontown - Church
School 9:30 A. M. Worship 11 A. M.

St. Luke's (Winters) Church -
Church School 10:00 A. M., Worship
11:00 A. M.
Mt. Union Church-Church School

930 A. M. No Worship service.
Rev. J. H. August Borleis, pastor.

Mayberry Church of God - Sun-
day School at 10:15 A. M. Worship
Service at 11:00 A. M.

Trinity Lutheran Church, Taney-
town, Md. Howard W. Miller, pastor.
There will be no services this Sun-

day, August 25. Be sure to worship
in another of the community's
churches.

Piney Creek Church of the Breth-
ren, Rev. Warren M. Eshbach, pastor-
-Sunday School 9:30 A. M., Church
Service 10:40 A. M. Choir rehearsal
7:00 P. M. Wed. Women's Fellow-
ship, 1st Tues. of month. Jr. High
Fellowship, 2nd Tuesday and 4th
Monday of every month.

Messiah Evangelical United Breth-
ren Church-Pastor, Rev. Paul E.
Rhinehart D. D., pastor, 25 Middle
St., Taneytown, Md. Mr. Ray Copen-
haver, Supt. Mrs. Doris Garvin, or-
ganist.
Sunday, August 25th: 9:15 A. M.,

Sunday School; 10:15 A. M., Wor-
ship and Sermon. The Preacher will
be announced and introduced at the
service. There will be a supply next
Sunday, September 1st, name will be
announced The Pastor expects to be
in the pulpit on, September 8th, the
Lord Willing.
Monday, August 26-8:00 at the

parsonage: Pastor-Parish Corn, of
the local church will meet. The Com-
mittee: Mr. Ray Copenhaver, Mr.
Frank Dunham, Mr. Arthur Garvin,
Jr., Mr. Jackson Scott, Mrs. Shirley
Clem, and the Pastor. Mr. James
Trenary, the Alternate Del. to Con-
ference will sit in.

BRING YOUR FILMS to US for
EXPERT printing and developing,
24 hour service on black and white-
48 hour service on COLOR Work.
Complete stock of Films - Flashbulbs
- Cameras and Flash outfits-Taney-
town Pharmacy-Free S &H Green
Stamps. 3-29-tf

CARD PARTY - Every Saturday
night, Harney Vol. Fire Co. Hall at
8 P. M. (EST). 9-29-tf

NOTICE-- To my garbage custom-
ers: We take care of collection of
cans, bottles, glass, garbage, and pa-
per. Other articles such as tree and
shubbery trimmings, wire, old roofing.
building partitions, bricks and plaster
will be collected and charges will be
made accordingly.-Walter Benschoff
Taneytown's Garbage Collector.

8-25-ti

I HAVE FOR SALE a large selec-
tion of nice Building Lots at edge
of Taneytown. Many with city water
available. R. L. Zentz, Broker, Tan-
eytown. Phone 756-6960. 5-2-tf

FOR SALE-USED FURNITURE:
Frigidaire window fan, metal cabi-
nets, wardrobes, dressers, chest of
drawers, desks, chests, chairs, tables,
rockers, lot of lawn chairs, glider,
child swings, organ stools, Edison
victrola, records, record player,
radios, stands', coffee table, beds,
springs, baby cribs, play pens, walk-
ers, training chairs, strollers, Sunbeam
mixer, toasters, bird cages & stands,
yard cart, wagons, bicycles, tricycles,
electric floor polisher, lamps, dishes,
sewing machine, portable picnic table,
rotary mowers and reel type; etc.
Mowers sharpened and repaired.
Abra's Garage, Keymar, Md. Phone
SPruce 5-3252. 6-13-tf

HOME APPLIANCES Repaired-
Also lawn mower and engine repairs;
also automobile repairing. Earl Mont-
gomery, near Kump's Station, on the
Bert Koontz Road. 2-21-tf

REDUCED PRICES - All Alum-
mum Storm Doors and Windows. The
new Air Master products, triple track
Alcoa aluminum. - Ohler's Metal
Shop-phone: PL 6-6138, Taneytown.

9-27-tf

FOR WEDDING Invitations and
announcements, reception cards, en-
gagement announcements, napkins,
birth announcements, complete selec-
tion, see-The Carroll Record Co.

8-11-ti

August 27-at 8:00
in the church. Ladies
mind that we will be
Gettysburg Church
September 3rd at 8:00
tysburg.

Taneytown United
Church, Rev. William
pastor.
Sunday, August 25, 1963. There

will be no Church School or Worship)
Service this day. Tuesday at 7:30,1
the Berean Class will meet at the
home of Miss Liza Carpenter.

Baust United Church of Christ-
Rev. R. V. Johnson, pastor, No ser-
vices this Sunday, August 25.

Taneytown Charge of the United
Church of Christ-William F. Wiley,
B.D., pastor.
Grace Church, Taneytown - 9:15

A. M., Sunday Church School; 10:30
A. M., Divine Worship, The Rev.
Roy W. Joellenbeck, Chaplain at Mor-
gan State and Towson State Colleges
of Baltimore and Towson, Md., will
be the guest preacher.
ATTENTION COLLEGE STU-

DENTS - The Potomac Synod
Committee on Campus Ministry will
hold a Workshop on Sunday, August
25th (this Sunday) from 4:00 to 8:30
P. M., at Hood College, Frederick,
Md. Students of all classes in college
are invited. Supper will be served at
75c. The theme will be, "The Lord-
ship of Christ and the College Com-
munity," with The Rev. Dr. Charles
D. Spotts, adjunct professor of Chris-
tian Education at the Lancaster Sem-
inary, as the key leader.
Grace Church, Keysville - 9:00

A. M., Divine Worship, The Rev.
Roy W. Joellenbeck, Chaplain at Mor-
gan State and Towson State Colleges.
10:00 A. M., Sunday Church School.

The Pipe Creek Charge - Union-
town, Maryland. - Uniontown, 9:00
A. M. Worship, 10:00 A. M. Church
School.
Pipe Creek - (Brick), 10:10 A. M.

Worship, 11:10 A. M. Church School.
St. James (on Marston Road) -

10:00 A. M. Church School, 11:15
A. M. Worship.

St. Paul's Lutheran Church, Har-
ney-Rev. John Fry, Supply Pastor.
Worship Service 9:00 A. M., Sunday
School 10:00 A. M.

Keysville Lutheran Church, Rev.
Donald C. Brake, pastor. Worship
Service. 9:30 A. M.; Sunday School,
10:30 A. M.

Hampstead Youth For Christ -
The August 24th Hampstead Youth

for Christ rally will combine a teen
film, a teen talent national winner,
and a teen team member who just
returned from South America. The
the Greenmount Church, one mile N.
rally will be held at 8:00 P. M. in
of Hampstead on Route 30, Saturday,
August 24.

GOVERNMENT WASTE-OF-THE-
WEEK

P. M. WSWS
please keep in
the guests of
on Tuesday,
P. M. at Get-

Presbyterian
M. Hendricks,

Competitive buying is the taxpay-
er's friend. Both the Navy and the
Air Force purchased identical air-
craft engine bearings at the same
time, but the Navy paid three times
as much for them because it did not
buy through competitive bidding, ac-
cording to a report by the Comptrol-
ler General.

ZIP - VIM - VIGAH!

Doubtless many of you read the
"Take a letter" editorial (Evening
Star, July 22, 1963). But, for those
of you who may have missed it (and
who may be equally disgusted with
paying more and more for less and
less postal service), we're reprinting
it below: "Ever since Mr. Summer-
field changed the mailboxes from
olive drab to red-white-and-blue, the
Post Office Department has been
getting cuter and cuter.
"Lately, under J. Edward Day"

(ed note: 'the recently departed,)

"the witty Californian, the depart-
ment has become just too precious
for words - at least for words that
make any sense. Instead, It has
turned to catchy initials, clever ab-
breviations that, unfortunately, don't
stand up under close scrutiny.
"Take ABCD, which stands for Ac-

celerated Business Collection Delive-
ry. It's easy enough to remember,
but what in the world does it mean?
"Then there's ZIP. The department

claims this stands for Zoning Im-
provement Program, but of course it
doesn't improve the zoning at all.
What it is, actually, is a System for
Aiding Postmen, or SAP.
"The latest Post Office rib-tickler

is VIM, which, we are solemnly told,
stands for Vertical Improved Mail.
This is nonsense. Your mail is neith-
er upgraded nor up-ended by the new
process. The same old bills still lie
there on your desk, flat and un-
pleasant. In reality, VIM is a dumb-
waiter device for delivering mail
faster in skyscrapers - Dumbwaiter
Operations for Postal Efficiency, or
DOPE.
"Where it will all end, no one can

say, but after VIM, the next step
for the New Frontier is obviously
VIGAH: Vertigo Induced by Gov-
ernment Alphabetical Hysteria."

END OF SUMMER

The sunny days of Summer
Are filled with work and play.
But now that Summer's ending,
They're slipping fast away.
Yes, Summer's gently fading,
And Fall is in the air,
The signs are all around us,
We see them everywhere.
Bright goldenrod is blooming,
Green leaves are changing hue,
The very sky is wearing
A cooler shade of blue.
Late Zinnias and Asters,
In colorful array,
Around the house and garden
Put on a bright display.
The hickory nuts are falling
From tall and stately trees,
The corn awaiting harvest,
Is rustling in the breeze.
Yes, 'tis the end of Summer,
And advent of the Fall,
It is God's will and pleasure,
His hand is over all.

- Zola Cantwell

PUBLIC SALE REGISTER
AUGUST

31-10 A. M. Mrs. Ella E. Yingling,
between Ladiesburg and Keymar.
Antiques, Books and Farm
Tools. Glenn Trout and James
C. Trout, Aucts.

SEPTEMBER

7-10:00 o'clock. Mr. and Mrs. Ar-
thur C. Lowman, Quaker Hill,
Road., % mile from Union
Bridge. Antiques and House-
hold Goods. Guss Shank, Auct. s

14-10:00 o'clock. Administratrix's
Sale of valuable personal prop-
erty, near Pleasant Valley, of
Bertha V. Hahn Kain, deceased.
Wm. B. Dulany, Attorney; Guss
Shank, Auctioneer.

19-11 o'clock. Harold Sauble, 5%
miles W. of Westminster at Ty-
rone. Dairy herd and furniture.
Allen Hill, Auct. Sidney Lease,
Clerk.

28-10 A. M. Carrie Fuss Long, Em-
raitsburg. Antiques and House-
hold Goods. Calvin Amoss, Auct.

OCTOBER

5-11 A. M. M. Eugene Vaughn,
24 miles N. of Taneytown on
Baptist Rd. Feeder Pig and
Shoat Sale. Calvin Amoss, Auct.

Make Sea-Shell Jewelry

When you're ambling along
the water's edge this summer,
look for unusual sea shells. Col-
lect the ones that strike your
fashion fancy-and you will be
ready to start a summer fun
project, making your. own cos-
tume jewelry.
To make a sea-shell pin, select

a large shell for the base. Glue
small shells in the large one with
epoxy glue. Next, spray the pin
with gold or silver paint. Add
artificial pearls, or rhinestones,
and glue a pin fastener to the
back of the base shell.

To make earrings, just glue
small shells to earring backs and
the job is neatly finished. Or, you
can make a mermaid's necklace
by drilling two holes in a shell
and running a fine gold or silver
chain through. Elmer's Epoxy
Glue is ideal to use when creating
your sea shell costume jewelry.

Detailed instructions for many
more do-it-ynurself projects spa
pear in McCall's Needlework and
Crafts Magazine, now available
at most pattern counters and
newsstand.

4-nrs Find It Pays to Keep
Electrical Equipment Tip-Top

Just as electricity revolutionized American industry
before the turn of the century, it has within the past
two decades revolutionized communication, recreation
and housekeeping. Millions enjoy more leisure hours,
better health and safety.
Meanwhile young and old have

had to learn to use the hun-
dreds of new electrical items.
Knowing how to maintain and
repair lamps, motors, appliances
ana power tools-to name a few
-is a- distinct advantage and
money-saver. Families realize
that electricity actually is a
silent servant, and if properly
treated will give dependable
service 24 hours every day of
the year.

Learn About Electricity
Keeping pace with the grow-

ing use of electrical power and
equipment are the nation's 4-H
Club members. The national 4-H
electric program was launched
about the same time hundreds
of new electrical items reached
the market for farm and home
use.
Now in its 28th year, the pro-

gram covers up-to-date projects
spelled out in an expanding
series of why-and-how-to-do-it
guide sheets. Subjects range
from basic cord repair to com-
plicated wiring systems and
electronic devices.
According to 4-H boys and

girls completing electric proj-
ects, what they learned and ap-
plied resulted in more utility,
comfort and enjoyment in the
home. Dollar savings or in-
creased values also were re-
ported.
Said a recent national 4-H

scholarship winner: "From the

time I was a little boy, I
watched my father wire light
  sockets, put in

receptacles and
repair appli-
ances. I wanted
to know what
electricity was;
why it could
only be seen in
light bulbs; why
it could shock
a person, and
answers to
countless other

questions about this mysterious
servant."

Apparently the young man
found many of the answers in
tackling some 1,300 different
electrical jobs during his 4-H
membership.

Offer $500 Scholarships
Sponsor of the 4-H electric

program since its inception is
the Westinghouse Educational
Foundation. Besides helping to
develop the wealth of educa-
tional material made available
to electric club members and
leaders, Westinghouse annually
provides funds for county medal
awards, trips to the National 4-H
Club Congress in Chicago for 50
state winners and six $500 col-
lege scholarships, an increase
of $100 each over last year.
Current enrollment in all 50

states is around 160,000, accord-
ing to the Cooperative Exten-
sion Service.

Electric Medal

Cheers for Peanut 3utter and Jelly

SCHOOL DAYS . . . and youngsters vote again for their per-
ennial lunch box favorite - peanut butter and grape jelly -
of course!

Mother approves too because this duo is quick-n-easy to pre-
pare, economical and nutritious. Peanut butter is 26% protein,
the nutritional element needed for proper growth, and rates high
in the B vitamins and iron as well. The jelly helps supply plenty
of energy needed for top performance during a hectic school day.
Try these new ideas the next time you team peanut butter

and jelly.
DAFFY DOUGHNUTS - Cut plain or sugared doughnuts in

half crosswise. Spread one cut side with peanut butter, the other
with grape jelly. Sprinkle peanut butter with a few raisins. Put
together as for a sandwich.
FOUR STRIPER - For one sandwich, combine 2 tablespoons

peanut butter, 1 tablespoon jelly and 1 teaspoon lemon juice.
Spread on white bread. Top with a slice of whole wheat bread.
Cut in four strips. Wrap for school lunch with white and whole
wheat bread alternately, to get striped effect.
PEA N UT-JELLY ROLL - Use a roll instead of bread for your

sandwich. Split roll. Spread 2 tablespoors of peanut butter on one
half. Sprinkle with corn flakes or your favorite cereal. Spread 1
tablespoon jelly on the other half and put roll together.

Oven Cleaning a Breln 'this Way

r---
WOMEN! Worry no more about grease spattering the oven.
These new Hallmark ranges feature removable sides and back
panels that are coated with Teflon and can be easily cleaned
in the kitchen sink. Wipe with soapy sponge and grease and

burned-on food residue floats away!

Ask a homemaker what she
likes least about cooking, and
she'll probably say "cleaning the
oven."

Most women postpone the
chore, putting it off until the
coating of grease spatter is like
the hide of a rhinoceros. It's only
the most scrupulous housewife
who remembers to clean the oven
after using it several times.

New Hallmark electric ranges
by Hotpoint feature a solution to

the age-old oven cleaning prob-
lem - removable side and back
panels can be easily cleaned in
the kitchen sink, just like dishes.
Even more important, the three
oven - liner panels (sides and
back) are coated with "Teflon"
TFE - fluorocarbon finishes that
make them so slick practically
nothing will stick to the surface.
A quick wipe with a soapy cel-
lulose sponge floats away grease
and burned-on food residue--no
scouring necessary.

a
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jYoung People's Science Lab

What Makes Bread Dough Rise?

1. Puncture an opening in a
metal cover of a glass jar. In-
sert one end of a length of
rubber hose or glass tube
through the hole. Place melt-
ed wax around the hole to in-
sure an airtight connection.
Submerge the other end of the
tube in a glass of limewater.

2. Combine one cup of flour, one
tablespoon of sugar, one-
fourth package of commercial
yeast, and one-half cup of
water. Place this mixture into
the glass jar. Screw on the top
immediately.

8. Set this equipment in a warm
place. Soon the dough will
rise. Remove the lid, punc-

Source: Young People's

•

ture the mound of dough, and
quickly seal it again. The gas
that caused the bread to rise
escapes into the tube that
leads to the limewater. If this
gas is carbon dioxide, the lime-
water will turn milky.

Science Encyclopedia

BOYS & GIRLS!
Win a free trip to Cape Canaveral! Or the West Coast Missile

Base! Fly via American Airlines Astrojet! Simply write an essay
(100 words or less) on "Why I Want to be a Scientist." Send
entries to Suite 1700, 203 N. Wabash Ave., Chicago 1, Ill. before
midnight, Oct. 31, 1963. Open to anyone under 18 years of age.
Send as many entries as you like. Judges' decision final. Fifty
other prizes include complete sets of the 20-volume Young People's
Science Encyclopedia published by Childrens Press. Watch this
newspaper for names of winners to be announced in November.
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BEGINNING W/Th' THE
BURIAL PLACE OF ST JAMES
THE APO5TLE, /N SPANS
FAMOUS SHRINE CITY OF
EARLY CHRIS TENPOM,
SANTIAGO PE COMPOSTELA,
ONE CAN EMBARK UPON
AN UNFORGETTABLE 36
a4Y CRUISE APVENTURE...

//EAR THE SHRINE, THE LAVISH
BR/PAL SUITE OF THE HOSTEL.
PE LOS REYES CATOLICOS
CAN BE RENTEP FOR $8 A
PAY.  OTHERS FRO41 sr/.7.5 70
$5 A 0Ay... THE FAMOUS WY
BUILT BY KING FERO/NANO
ANO QUEEN /5A8ELL4 FOR
F7L6R/445 TO THE SHR/A,E WAS
RECENTLY RENOVATEP WITH
207H CENTURY COMFORTS AT
XI COST OF 02,500,000.

MS ENCHANTING CRINSE ON THE
.3EAU71FUL MOTOR SHIp KUNGSHCXM, OF THE
SWEP/SH AMERICAN LINE SAILS FROM NEW
YORK, APRIL /0, /964, TO COVER 8,5/5
FOLLOWS THE BLOSSOMING SPR/NG-
FLOWERS NORTH FR044 THE SOUTH
OF EUROPE WITH AN /77NERARY •
OF 20 PORTS OF CALL IN SPAN,
FRANCE, HOLLANG; ENGLANg
WALES ANO SCOTLANO.
FOR INFORMATION, CHECK
WITH YOUR LOCAL TRAVEL
AGENT:

_P • 11! tA:'

11011110111=111. 

FUME
U-710321•1•111EralLiZaa=in
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Protect Yetirscii How
From The Possible
SEED SHORTAGE

AHEAD
No doubt you've heard about it. Because of a
killing winter and spring drought, a critical
shortage of quality seeds for fall planting is
predicted. You may wonder. "How can I avoid
having to accept inferior seeds or varieties that
may cut my profits? Is there any way to pro-
tect yourself?" The answer is yes—if you act
without delay.

Reserve Your SS Fall Seeds Now
Your Cooperative has a plan whereby you can
reserve your top-quality Southern States Fall
Seeds now. No extra charge, no deposit re-
quired. Pay nothing til fall. Farmers with
less foresight may suffer. But come planting
time, you'll have top-yielding, money-making
Southern States Seeds. A phone call now will
reserve yours.

Southern States
Taneytown Cooperative

TANEYTOWN, NI D.

var

Your Southern States Cooperative Agency
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Public Sale 389

M of ANTIQUE and MODERN GUNS, NEW BOLEN'S
O • LAWN and GARDEN EQUIPMENT, HOUSEHOLD

GOODS, STORE EQUIPMENT AND OTHER
ANTIQUES

38£
22 SATURDAY, SEPTEMBER 7, 1963

AT 10:00 O'CLOCK A. M., D. S. T.

The undersigned, moving to Hawaii, will offer at Public Sale on
pc the premises located on Quaker Hill Road, 1/2 mile from Union
J1k= Bridge, Md., the following:

ANTIQUE GUNS AND OTHER ANTIQUES
Remington model 4 single shot 22 cal. rifle, Remington model 6

single shot 22 cal. rifle, Stevens Favorite single shot 22 cal. rifle,
13 Hopkins and Allen single shot 22 cal. rifle, Colt New Police revolver,3SE
/I 32 S & W cal. Sears 1910 model; 5-H. P. gasoline engine and carriage,
131 John Deere one and one half h. p. gasoline engine, 2 buggy lanterns,
IV Session metal case mantle clock, stone ware jug, Antique dentist
5 tool cabinet, old dentist drill motor, 41/2" Civil War cannon ball, Ed-
• ison mino-graphs salesmans case, 2 copper flower vases, Kodak13 folding camera, Civil War brass buckle and belt, Civil War book,
n • "The Boys In Blue," first edition; copper powder flask, 3 bullet
38£ moulds, leather shot bag, old scales, 1870 period Marine dressZ1 • helmet.
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USED GUNS
Stevens 12 gauge double barrel shot gun, Western Field double

barrel shot gun, half stock Kentucky rifle 40 cal., with mold; Mau-
ser bolt action single shot 22 cal. rifle, Mossberg bolt action single
shot 22 cal. rifle (clip), Winchester single barrel 16 gauge shot gun,
L. C. Smith double barrel shot gun 12 gauge, Sportorized 1917 En-
field 30-06 bolt action rifle, with Weaver B.4 scope; Mauser 7 M. M.
bolt action sporter rifle, with Weaver K.4 scope; Remington model
512 22 cal. bolt rifle tubular, metal gun case, collection of Americans
Rifleman magazine 1950 to present, collection of American guns and
Ammo 4 years, 6 American Gun Digest Books, assorted smokeless
and black powder.

NEW BOLEN'S LAWN and GARDEN EQUIPMENT
and STORE MERCHANDISE

New Bolen's 600 husky tractor, elec. start with 32" rotary mower,
new Bolen's super Mustang rotary tiller, new Bolen's orbit air ro-
tary mower 22", new Bolen's 24" suburban riding mower, new Moto-
Mower rotary mower 20", new R. C. A. Victor 6 transistor radio,
complete case etc.; new Onida Melanine dinner ware set, several new
Westclox watches, new cigarette lighters, Westinghouse coffee
maker, new ,Savage model 340 30-30 cal. rifle, new savage model 124
M 22 mag 410 over and under, new Colt Buntline 22 cal. revolver,
case of 24 Mobil No. 30 motor oil. — NOTE: the above merchandise
is all New Store Equipment.

USED STORE EQUIPMENT:
Full keyboard Wales adding machine, Neon electric store display

clock, 10-unit metal shelving (store type), 8" show case, with lights;
several re-built jeweled watches, used C transistor radio, 15-gal.
aquarium reflector piston-type heavy duty aquarium pump, 3-gallon
aquarium.

HOUSEHOLD GOODS, etc.
Kelvinator electric stove, G. E. automatic washer, chrome break-

fast set and four chairs, six-pc. dining room suite, Admiral 21" TV
set, Sylvania 17" TV set, with stand; TV antenna, pipe, rotor and
control, 2-pc. living room suite, morris type re-dining chair, youth
bedroom suite % bed, chest drawers, youth roll top desk and swivel
chair, solid oak book case, with glass doors; oak chest of drawers,
solid oak 3x5 heavy work desk and 6 drawers, book case, oak cup-
board, 2 mahogany end tables and coffee table, round plate glass mir-
ror, solid oak roll top desk, mahogany chest of drawers, Zenith all
speed record player with twin speakers, Stewart Warner radio, Phil-
co radio, old Airline radio, Hollywood bed and head board, metal %
bed base, headboard for % bed with sliding doors, floor lamp, desk
lamp, table lamps, medicine cabinet, utility cabinet, kitchen cabinet,
picture frames, music stand, singing canary, cage and stand; milk
glass punch bowl and 12 cups, other dishes, Stauffer Magic Couch
reducing machine, 20" boys bicycle, 24" boys bicycle, electric iron,
electric fan, 1 case oil, clothes hamper, German Leitz 35 MM camera,
lead pot, 30 lb. pure lead ingots, B & D 1/4" drill stand, horizontal;
B & D 1/4" drill sanding table attachment, B & D 1/4" drill, power
hone attachment; mechanic and carpenter hand tools, Syncro jig saw,
set of drafting tools, Sunbeam elec. mower, IA," elec. drill stand, Sun-
beam electric Orbital sander, 2 flexable shaft machine with motors,
one large one small; model steam engine, H. 0. train power supply,
large charcoal grill, with elec. spit and hood; 100 ft. heavy exten-
sion cord and reel, mowing scythe, axe, step ladder, work bench,
aluminum rose trellis, garden tools, fishing rod, ice cream freezer,
lumber and plyboard, other articles not mentioned.

MR. and MRS. ARTHUR C. LOWMAN, Owners.
Union Bridge, Maryland

NOTE: All Merchandise is in Excellent Condition.
Merchandise can be inspected Sept. 5 and 6 from 6 to 9 P. M.
TERMS: Cash on day of sale.
Not responsible for accidents. — Lunch rights reserved.

GUSS SHANK, Auctioneer.
CARL HAINES, Clerk. 8-22 & 9-5

„

Attention all newcomers -
Welcome to Westminster!

Call S. H. Tevis and Son's
today for our free gift offer!

New faces, new families, new homes join our community every
day. Unfortunately, we cannot call on all newcomers to welcome
them here personally, as we would like to. Instead, we are taking
this opportunity to say, "Glad to have you
here," and offer a useful, free gift to anyone-
who has just moved in.

Our business is your heating comfort. We
deliver only Gulf Solar Heat®, the world's
finest heating oil—and we provide all the
modern heating services that assure you and
your family of complete, peace-of-mind
warmth and comfort the year-round.

Call us today, and we'll gladly "put out the
welcome mat" for you, our new neighbors. heating oil

S. H. TEVIS & SON
WESTMINSTER, MD. — PHONE 848-4433

3-HR. PARKING ZONE PERMIT
CITY OF TANEYTOWN

APPLICATION

NAME  

STREET  

MAKE OF CAR  

LICENSE #  

COLOR OF CAR  

(MAKE APPLICATION WITH THE CITY CLERK)

8-8-tf
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Teeter
Phone:

Gettysburg
EDgewood
4-3165

Westminster
TI. 8-6867

CRUSHED STONE.

If It's Crushed Stone, Call Teeter
TEETER STONE, INC.

WESTMINSTER, MD. GETTYSBURG, PA.

WE HAVE IT! NEW MONARCH PORTABLE
BY REMINGTON GIVES YOU 12 EXTRA FEA-
TURES NEVER BEFORE ASSEMBLED
ON ANY PORTABLE UNDER $10092

Single Key Sets
••• Columns & Indents!
22-color Ribbon &

Stencil Control!
2 Erasure Table on

Cylinder!

A Removable Top
Cover!

c Calibrated Scale on
Paper Bail!

g Calibrated Paper
Tsblel

7 Card & Writing Line
Scale!

Adjustable Paper
Edge Guide!

9 Variable Line Spacer!
iCoacVge Centering

11 Touch Regulator!

12 Lighter Weight!

OUR PRICE
ONLY

Charles L. Stonesiter

5 [Plus
• Tax

TANEYTOWN, MD.
DEALER

REMINGTON RAND PORTABLE TYPEWRITERS
AND ADDING MACHINES

RIBBONS AND CARBON PAPER

Open Evenings by Appointment

Cooky Jar Special —

Pineapple Spice Dr6ps

Juice and cookies are the favorite between meal snack while
kids are on vacation. Canned crushed pineapple, raisins and wal-
nuts add texture interest to these spicy oatmeal cookies. Toasting
the oats first gives these stir and drop cookies delectable flavor.
Pineapple juice, noted for having "nature's most refreshing fla-

vor", is readily available in 5 can sizes. You'll find it in sizes rang-
ing from the single serving 6-ounce can to the generous gang'
size 46-ounce can.

g rolled 1 teaspoon cloves
PINEAPPLE SPICE DROPS

Pi CUPS quick-cooking

11/2 cups sifted flour
oats 3/4 cup shortening

1 egg

1 teaspoon salt 
1 (81/2-ounce) can crashed1 cup sugar

pineapple
teaspoon soda

1 teaspoon cinnamon 
`.,

.:^* 
cup seedless raisins1/2 . 

1 cup chopped walnuts
Spread oats on cooky sheet and toast in moderately hot 0V61111

(375 degrees F.) until light brown, 5 to 8 minutes. Resift flour,
with sugar, salt, soda and spices. With pastry blender or withll
finger tips, blend shortening into dry mixture .until crumbly.,
Stir in lightly beaten egg, well drained pineapple, raisins, oatsl
and walnuts. Drop by teaspoonfuls onto ungreased baking sheets:
Bake in moderately hot over 075 degrees F. 15 rainutes. Italia'
about 51, rtzen coolsiea: ::.;4-,,uy...u.L 1:.4-\44, .:-:.. .4̀,...,...1 ,.... - --°
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Conversion
Lesson for August 25, 1963

Bible Material: Genesis 26 through
28
Devotional Reading: Psalm 121

IF GOD does not speak to people
A in dreams today, one reason
may be that few people in our
lime would accept a dream as a
message from God. But there was
a time when not every dream
but special dreams were taken to

be revelations
from God. Cer-
tainly, the least
we can say about
such a story as
this one about Ja-
cob at Bethel is
that this man be-
lieved that God
had actually spok-
en to him and
made him a mag-

nificent promise; and he names
the place "Beth (house) El (of
God)" the place, or a place, where
God lived. We can learn some-
thing about religion from the way
Jacob reacted to what he under-
stood to be a vision of God. One
question will bring this story right
clown to ourselves: Was Jacob
converted by this experience, or
not?

Jacob needed conversion
Conversion is an important

*word. It means a turning around,
a 180-degree turn; it means turn-
ing from evil to good, from dis-
obeying God to obeying God, from
hating or denying God to loving
Him with all the heart. Now if
you had asked any of Jacob's
neighbors at that time, before he
started his journey back east to
see his relatives in the Euphrates
Valley,—if you had asked them
what they thought of Jacob, they
could have said little good of him.
Indeed, his own family were
against him. He had tricked his
brother into giving him his birth-
right, and then he had stolen the
blessing their father intended for
Esau. In revenge, Esau had sworn
to kill his younger twin Jacob;
and Jacob had had to leave home
to seek safety far away. We know
his father had plenty of animals
he could have offered Jacob to
ride; but he didn't offer one.
Jacob had to walk, and we may

aucss he made a hiking record.
The point is, in Billy Sunday's
famous words, Jacob at this time
was so low down he had to reach
up to touch bottom, and so crook-
ed he could hide behind a cork-
screw. "The world's my orange
and I intend to squeeze it" might
have been his motto; for he had
never been known to do an un-
selfish thing in all his life. If ever
a man need to be converted, it
was Jacob. rs

Discovery of God
Conversion always begins with

a meeting between God and a
man. The meeting may take place
in many ways; but none stranger
than this dream at Bethel. One
thing Jacob learned that night
which he had not realized before.
It was a lesson even Abraham had
a hard time learning: God is ev-
erywhere. Jacob thought he had
turned his back on God. He be-
lieved in Him of course; he never
had been an atheist. But some-
how he thought God must be con-
fined to one district, as human
beings are. If you run far enough
and fast enough, you can escape
from most people. If you shut the
door and draw the bolts, you can
keep many people out. But there
is no door yet made which can
keep God out. He is on both sides
of all doors, He is everywhere.
He is the God of the traveler and
of those who stay at home. This
is a great discovery, and Jacob
was awed by it.

Promise with an if
Jacob sounds pious enough. He

promises to pay tithes, and that
was good. So it is sometimes said
that this experience at Bethel was
Jacob's great turning point, his
conversion. On the other hand,
there is some reason to doubt that
anything radical happened to him.
True, he discovered something
very important about God; but
knowing about God is not yet con-
version. ("The devils believe, and
tremble.") When you look at it
closely, you find that this vow of
Jacob's to give God a tenth was
a promise with an If. IF God will
arrange everything right for me,
and IF He will do for me what I
want done (he says in effect),
THEN He will be my God and I
will give Him ten per cent of all
profits. Furthermore, Jacob is so
far from offering himself to God
that in the years just ahead he
is going to cheat his own flesh
and blood relatives, just as he did
before. He is going to be out for
Jacob first. He is changed very
little by this dream, and till he
is changed we can hardly call it
conversion.
(Based on •utilnes copyrighted by

the Division of Christian Education,
National Council of the Churches of
Christ in the U.S. A. Released by
Community Press Service.)

Dr. Foreman

Harris M. Frock
TI. 8-7505 Westminster, Md.

Agent for
Virginia S. Griffin

Realtor
TE. 3-1555 Reisterstown, Md.

FIRST TIME OFFERED — 73 acre
dairy farm near Uniontown, Md.,
This is a beautiful farm, lovely
house in a nice setting. Can be
bought with or without cattle and
equipment. By appointment only.

SIX rooms and bath aluminum siding
house on 100x160 ft. lot with city
water. Have you wanted a home in
town that has country atmosphere?
If so, you must see this one.

New Listing — UNION BRIDGE —
2-Apt. Brick House, 4 garages.
Broadway & Whyte St. Nice invest-
ment property.

New Listing — 103 N. Main St. --
MANCHESTER — 5-room House
and bath. This is a nice small house.
Priced to sell.

THE FARM THAT WAS
LISTED IN THIS SPACE

HAS BEEN SOLD.

NEAR WESTMINSTER — 63-Acre
farm with 10-room house (5 bed-
rooms).

IN MANCHESTER—a beautiful 21/2
acre building lot. One of the fin-
est locations in town.

CRANBERRY-10 room house, bath,
1% acres of land. Priced to sell.

TWO nice wooded lots on Woodland
Drive, near Hook Road.

FRIZELLBURG — Five-room house
and bath; frame and aluminum sid-
ing. Second floor can be expanded.
Real nice home in small community.

NICE lots for sale between New
Windsor and Uniontown.

For investment properties or busines-
ses call us.

LET US LIST YOUR FARM.
WE NEED SMALL FARMS.

TI. 8-7505

WORLD'S
LARGEST
AUTO INSURANCE COMPANY

Call:
STATE FARM MUTUAL State Farm AgentAUTOMOBILE ,
INS/RANCE COMPANY'

756- 6733
ARTHUR GARVIN, JR.

8-9-tf

CUSTOM SLAUGHTERING
Beef
Lamb

Veal
H A H N' S

Amana Food Service
WESTMINSTER
Tilden 8-4040

1-22-ti
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t: OUR SAFE - T - RATE POLICY Tif
n SAVES CAREFUL DRIVERS 0

REAL MONEY

$28.80 Yearly' I
($14.90 for 6 months) C:

7c1 10/20,000 BODILY INJURY
ts
5.000 PROPERTY DAMAGE

9 6-tf (This liability policy will auto-- matically meet minimum finan-
cial responsibility laws of any
State or Canadian Providence.)

LESS A )4f

DISCOUNT FOR TWO CARS :3
DISCOUNTS FOR 'COMPACT
DISCOUNT FOR FARMERS

30%
DISCOUNTS FOR ACCIDENT-

FREE DRIVING
*Most car owners with clear
record, no drivers under age 25
and less than 10 miles to work.

$30,000.00. Shown on Saturday, juiTHE BEST BUY FOR I
Sunday and eve. after 6 P. M.

C. L. GARTRELL

Is 1111 I I MINOS I OEM 1 I 1=01/11,

z

I FOR SALE II
ID 1E,
al. Real good 84-acre Farm, 8-room 'm

I House with conveniences, a nice
place to live, good outbuildings.
Priced with 1/2 of this years
. 4. crops and some machinery at 2

a.
Route #1,..:

I TANEYTOWN, MD.
PHONE: Fieldstone 6-7572

isammisamossammisimmii

,
;

J. ALFRED
HELTEBRIDLE
TANEYTOWN, MD.
PHONE: PL 6 5141

essomarmamesensumamosai

CAREFULL DRIVERS—Call 1

Young People's Science Lab J

Making A Compass

1. Magnetize a darning needle
by stroking the length of it
about thirty times with the
north end of a bar magnet. By
stroking from the eye to the
point the latter will become
the south pole.

2. The magnetic needle must be
put into a situation now where
it can freely turn until it lines
up with the magnetic poles
of the earth.

3. It may be inserted through a
cork and floated in a glass dish
partly filled with water. Or
the needle may be fastened to
a cardboard suspended by a
silk thread in a pint jar.

4. Be sure no other magnet or
iron object is near. They
prevent the compass fr-2
functioning properly.

B. The point of the needle will
point south—the south-seek-
ing pole. The eye of the needle
will be the north-seeking pole.

Source: Young Peoplc'L ..ience Encyclopedia

BOYS & GIRLS!

Win a free trip to Cape Canaveral! Or the West Coast Missile
Base! Fly via American Airlines Astrojet! Simply write an essay
(100 words or less) on "Why I Want to be a Scientist." Send
entries to Suite 1700, 203 N. Wabash Ave., Chicago 1, Ill. before
midnight, Oct. 31, 1963. Open to anyone under 18 years of age.
Send as many entries as you like. Judges' decision final. Fifty
other prizes include complete sets of the 20-volume Young People's
Scien,:e Encyclopedia published by Childrens Press. Watch this
newspaper for names of winners to be announced in November.

viM10.110:=041111INDIOM:35=i11110110110::01=111•111)1(223901131

Crab and Shrimp Feed
AUGUST 27, 1963, 6:00 P. M.

TANEYTOWN MEMORIAL PARK

All You Can Eat $3.00
(INCLUDING TAX)

BEVERAGES ON SALE

LADIES INVITED

— BENEFIT OF —

TANEYTOWN LIONS CLUB

Benefit of COMMUNITY PROJECTS

TANEYTOWN ORGANIZATIONS
Taneytown Chamber of Commerce meets

on the 3rd Monday in each month at
the Taney Inn at 8:00 o'clock. Frank
Dunham, President; 1st Vice President.
Merle Ohler; 2nd Vice President, Rob.
ert Zentz; Secretary, Donald Smith,
Treasurer, Murray M. Baumgardner, 44
Executive Committee, Merwyn C. Fuss g
and Charles R. Arnold.

The Taneytown Vol. Fire Company meets g
2nd Monday of each month in the 13
Firemen's Building from April thru
Sept. at 8:00 p. m. and October thru
March at 7:30 p. m.; President, John
Perry; Vice President. Howard Welty:
Secretary, J. Wendell Garber; Finan-
cial Secretary, Harry Dougherty, Jr.;
Treasurer, Stanley King; Trustees.1
Birnie Staley, Norville Welty, Meredith I
Gross. Charles Lookingbill and Ken-1
neth Houck; Chief, Wilbur F. Miller, Jr. I

The American Legion — Hesson-Snider g
Post No. 12e meets third Thursday of 04"40f.220,0223:1•2:01t130”:0f120.1q3(1.220-t:MT.:20..*40._:20.120!.:20,120-t=31:each month at 8:00 P. M. in the Legion
Home. All service men welcomed.
Commander, Paul Rodkey: Adjutant
Clarence Hamer; Finance Officer, Stan-
ley King; Service Officer, Neal Powell.
You are eligible to belong to The
American Legion if you served honor-
ably in the Military Forces at any
time during one of these three periods:
April 6, 1917, to Nov. 11, 1915; or Dec.
7, 1941, to Sept. 2, 1945; or June 25.
1950, to July 27, 1953.

i14233:1134=402:43=-40:Vii=a)lari0:34)nri02:40:fii

New Brick 3-Bedroom Ranch-Type Homes 5
IN TANEYTOWN

Monocacy Valley Memorial Post 6518, Har-
ney, Md., meets on 1st and 3rd Tues-
day of each month in the V.F.W. Hall,
Harney, Md. Commander, Kenneth
McKinney; Adjutant, Robert Reck;
Quartermaster, Raymond Claybaugh.

The Taneytown Junior Chamber of Com-
merce, Taneytown, Md., meets the
second Thursday of each month at
The Raft Restaurant. President, Dean
Nusbaum; First Vice President, Robert
Bowers; god Vice President, John
Reever ; Secretary, George Fream;
Treasurer, Dean Brown.

Hesson-Snider Unit 120, American Legion
Auxiliary meets the first Thursday of
each month at 8 p. m., at the Post
Home. Pres., Bernice Rodkey; 1st Vice
Pres., Catherine Shank; 2nd Vice
Pres., Betty Jane Houck; Sec., Lois
Wetzel; Treasurer, Mae Long; His-
torian, Irene Unger; Sergeant at Arms,
Margaret Ritenour; Color Bearers,
Catherine Myers and Marie Ott; Chap-
lin, Regina Foreman.

ffarney Volunteer Fire Company meets
2nd and 4th Monday of each month in
the Firemen's Building at 7:30 P. M.
President, Fred Spangler; Vice Presi-
dent, Wilbur Relfsuider; Secretary,
Melvin AMOSS Treasurer, Elwood
Strickhouser; Chief. David Hess. Sr.;
Trustees—Donald Hess, Chester Moose,
Walter Clingan.

All other Fraternities and organizations
are invited to use this directory for the
public information It carries. Cost for
one year only 4;3.90.

FEET ACHE, ITCH?
1/4 of all your bones are in the feet.

No wonder they ache, swell, perspire,
itch. Bathe feet twice daily with
T-4-L Solution for relief of the 52
bones, 66 joints plus ligaments. Curbs
athlete's foot, too (sloughs off infec-
tion—watch healthy skin replace it)
or your 48e back at any drug store
if not pleased IN ONE HOUR. TO-
DAY at TANEYTOWN PHARMACY.

SKIN ITCH
DON'T SCRATCH IT!

Scratching spreads infection, caus-
ing MORE pain. Apply quick-drying
ITCH-ME-NOT instead. Itching quiets
down in minutes and antiseptic ac-
tion helps speed healing. Fine for
eczema, insect bites, foot itch, other
surface rashes. If not pleased, your
480 back at any drug stora. TODAY
at TANEYTOWN PHARMACY.

Several To Choose From
ATTRACTIVELY PRICED

J. S. Clagett
REAL ESTATE

Phone: PL 6 - 6519 — Taneytown, Md.
10-12-tf

Brides' delight.., our beautiful

FLOWER .
WEDDING LINE
db.

•kii•

with 5 exclusive new Rzvency Scripts

4.cbszei_A.4, Midzooltd ..ffiez,tinowo

4.aora%/fht Kaee,„.
4104tENTIP 1

ege. and aNd.. "4-„4'in,
REPAISII

911r. on glro. CiD.Jora e0u5rit0w

mama

.976-. and 267 2r/A,11- Zrocierici

PLOILIDIAai

When you choose from our fasnous Regency Flower Web

ding Line you need have no qualms about quality—this rick

Raised HELIOGRAVING* has all the distinction of the fo-

sse craftsmanship—yet costs about half as much as you'd

good Do see the many other elegant type styles... for your

complete wedding stationery needs. *lieliogravityi—opt to

66 analustod with oryfrovind.

0...

The Carroll Record Company, Inc.
DIAL PL 6-6600 Taneytown, Md.

WO'

Southern States

White Paint Sale
Now you save 22% on the paint that keeps
your house so clean and white it can actually
pass the white-glove test. No. 201 actually
cleans itself. Automatically with each rain,
dirt and grime wash away like magic. After a
heavy shower, give your No. 210-painted
house the white-glove test where the water
has hit the siding long and hard. Look—the
glove stays white! This wood-saving, money-
saving, quality paint lasts longer too. Re-
painting is less frequent. Levels and hides
well too. Fume-resistant, mildew-fighting,
lead-free, non-toxic. Sale runs through
August 31 only—so get your paint now with-
out delay.

$1.40 off Per Gallon on
SS Unico No. 201 Self-Cleaning

White House Paint

Sale Only

'4.95 GAL.
Regularly $6.35

SouthernStatesTNaEnyeto MCDooperative, IncTA .
Phone PL6-6711

Your SOUTHERN STATES COOPERATIVE AGENCY

8-15-2t
,4311OON11111210216M14011111111•101(03101310113131111NIMMIMIXIMIGIIM.
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Bible 'Conference at
Frizellburg

The fourth annual Summer Bible
Conference at the Frizellburg Church
of God, Frizellburg, Md., will begin
Sunday evening, August 25, at 7:45
P. M.
Henry J. Heydt, TH.D., President

of the Jewish Missionary Training
Institute of the American Board of
Missions to the Jews, Inc., will be
the conference speaker. Dr. Heydt,
after serving a pastorate in the Mo-
rovian denomination, founded the
Lancaster School of the Bible and be-
came it's first president. In his pre-
sent capacity, Dr. Heydt is contin-
ually teaching the Word of God to
Jewish converts and is well known as
a conference speaker.
The conference will continue

through Friday, August 30, at 7:45
each evening. There will be congrega-
tional singing and special numbers.

Dr. Heydt has chosen for the theme
of the conference, "Christ in the He-
brew Scriptures." The subjects for
the respective evenings are as fol-
lows: Sunday—"The King of Kings
in the Song of Songs:" Monday—
"What the Prophets Sought:" Tues-
day—"The Day Abraham Met
Christ:" Wednesday—"Early Days
of the Messianic Promise:" Thurs-
day—"The King on Zion's Hill:" Fri-
day—"The Kinsman Redeemer."
The Public Is Invited.

WITH THE ARMED FORCES

GOODFELLOW AFB, Tex. — Air-
man Second Class Loy W. Hott of
Keymar, Md., has completed a spec-
ial United States Air Force course
for communications technicians here.
He is being reassigned to a perm-

anent be for duty in his new tech-
nical specialty.
The airman, a graduate of Walk-

ersville (Md.) High School, is the
son of Eugene D. Hott of R.F.D. 2,
Keymar. His mother, Mrs. Betty L.
.Davis, resides at 512 Sandusky, To-
ledo, Ohio.

"Miss Maryland" Ball Set
for September 21

The Taneytown Jaycees have an-
nounced that their third annual "Miss
Maryland Ball" will be held Saturday
night, September 21, in the V. F. W.
Home, Westminster.

Guest of honor will be the new
Miss Maryland for 1963-64, Miss
Carolyn Bond Wright, of Bel Air.
Dancing will continue from 9:00 'till
1:00 to the music of the "Sportsmen."
Proceeds will go toward the many
community projects sponsored by the
Jaycees.

"In case of a nuclear attack, we
have decided to jump under the office
wastebasket. Nobody has been able
to hit it in 20 years."—W. C. Colburn,
Blackstone (Va.) Courier-Record.

MONOCAGY DRIVE-IN
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Fri., Sat., Aug. 23-24

! 3 ELVIS PRESLEY SHOWS !

"Girls — Girls — Girls"
"Blue Hawaii"
"Flaming Star"

Sun., Mon., Tues., Aug. 25-26=27

! THIS IS SOME SHOW !

"Dr. No."
ALSO

"House of Women"

Wed., Thurs., Aug. 28-29

OUR LAST

"BUCK NITE" SHOW!

"The War Lovers"
with STEVE McQUEEN

ALSO

"The Trouble With Harry"
is SHIRLEY MACLAINE

1

Old-Timers

BALL GAME

Sunday, August 25th

AT HARNEY

2:00 O'Clock

HARNEY CLUB
VS

OLD-TIMERS

HYMN SING

Sunday, August 25,

7:45 P. M.

IN MT. TABOR PARK
ROCKY RIDGE, MD.

Everyone Welcome
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KOONS FLORIST
Cut Flowers, Designs

Corsages
311 LUITLESTOWN, PENNA.
t:

AREA CODE 717
V Phone 359-4824

TANEYTOWN GRAIN MARKETS

WHEAT   $1.62
BARLEY   $1.00
OATS   $ .75
CORN   $1.50

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
This is to give notice that the sub.

scriber, has obtained from the Or-
phans' Court of Carroll County, in
Maryland, letters as Petitioner on the
personal estate of
MARIANNA ELIZABETH HESS,

late of Carroll County, deceased. All
persons having claims against the
deceased are warned to exhibit the
same with the vouchers thereof, leg-
ally authenticated, to the subscribers,
on or before the 30th day of Sept.,
next; they may otherwise by law be
excluded from all benefits of said es-
tate.

Given under my hand this 17th day
of August, 1963.

DAVID W. HESS, SR.,
Petitioner of the Estate of said dec'd

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

This is to give notice that the sub-
scriber has obtained from the Or-
phans' Court of Carroll County, in
Maryland, letters of Administration
on the personal estate of

EMMA OLIVE GARNER
late of Carroll County, deceased. All
persons naving claims against the
deceased are warned to exhibit the
same with the vouchers thereof, leg-
ally authenticated, to the subscriber,
on or before the 30th day of March,
next; they may otherwise by law be
excluded from all benefits of said
estate.

Given under my hand this 20th day
of August, 1963.

CLYDE L. HESSON, Adm.
8-22-5t

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

This is to give notice that the sub-
scriber has obtained from the Or-
phans' Court of Carroll County, in
Maryland, letters Testamentary on
the personal estate of

CARRIE V. WAGNER,
late of Carroll County, deceased. All
persons having claims against the
deceased are warned to exhibit the
same with the vouchers thereof, legal-
ly authenticated, to the subscriber,
on or before the 1st day of March,
next; they may otherwise by law be
excluded from all benefits of said
estate.

Given under my hand this 29th day
of July, 1963.

Earl B. Wagner,
Executor.

8-1-5t

DR. D. L. BEEGLE

DR. JOHN BEEGLE

CHIROPRACTORS

Emmitsburg Tel. # HI 7-4681

Gettysburg Tel. # ED 4-5500

NOTICE
All property owners are re-

quested to mow all weeds, gras-
es, etc., on their lots in Taney-
town.

Inspection of all properties
will be made and anyone guilty
of neglecting this request will
be dealt with according to Ordi-
nance pertaining to this sit-
uation.

I Mayor & City Council t

of Taneytown 
6-6-tf
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Here Dr. Paul E. Nystrom (center) receives silver platter
from Maryland Cooperative Milk Producers, Inc. President Ed-
gar G. Emrich. At left is Mrs. Nystrom.

CAFETERIA MANAGER NEEDED
apply

TANEYTOWN JR.-SR. HIGH SCHOOL

TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

PHONE: 756 - 6345

8-22-2t
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Lawn tip of the week

Don't wait until crabgrass
takes over your lawn
completely. Stop it now,
before it crowds out good
grasses. The surest way?
Use cLouT6. Very easy
to apply. Just phone, ask
for CLOUT. We deliver.

1

-A1-- Clout

CLOUT to treat 5000 sti ft 6.95

Reindollar Bros. 0. Co.

LYOUR HOME MERCHANTS
ASK YOU TO "BUY AT HOME"

WEEK-END SPECIALS
AUGUST 22 — AUGUST 23 — AUGUST 24

FRESH FROZEN

Shrimp medium size

s. c.
CATSUP 2 for 29c
S. C.

KIDNEY BEANS 2 for 23c

Spruce

Pineapple Tidbits 7-oz. can 10c

N. B. C.

RITZ SNACK PACK 33c

$1.39 2-lb.
box

iists;tee 4 packs of 2 89c
Leadway

CRUSHED PINEAPPLE 4 for $1.00
COUNTRY CORN FLAKES 4 for $1,

THIS COUPON WORTH

30 EXTRA FREE STAMPS
ON EACH PKG. OF

ANN DALE COOKIES

HI SSII II • III II II IS S 11 IS SI II

RIPE = 
i FRESH 

I

•
FROZEN

I BANANAS I! Cauliflower =I French Fries
10c lb. II 29c head I i4 lb. pkgs. $1.1

SS tI— IS U.S11111111=111101111M1=11111.1.111WIIIIMINII • anntem1111111osesemosseminele

Dougherty's Superette
On the Square Taneytown

We Give UNITED Stamps

Phone PL 6 6226

Sure . . . You Cah,

ganh Irons your

• "lounge Chair

When you use our handy forms to bank
by mail, you can stay in your lounge chair
while the U. S. Mail delivers your transac-
tion and rushes the proper acknowledgment
back to you. You can lounge, safe in the

' knowledge that your banking business is
being speedily transacted.

The Etirnie Trust Company
(Member of the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation)

TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

,Where keepsakes keep best
Your home was built to accommodate people.
Our Safe Deposit vault was built to accom-
modate irreplaceable personal possessions:
to safeguard them against fire, theft, other
home hazards. •
Co
•
st of renting a Safe Deposit Box with us

is merely nominal, considering what you
might lose without it. Act soon!

First National Bank
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

MEMBER FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM

(Member of the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation)

Peach Tarts Are Tempters

1/2 teaspoon▪ cream of
tartar

Dash salt
egg whites
teaspoon vanilla
cups sliced peaches,
fresh, frozen or •
canned, drained

For tarts, empty contents of package into bowl. Sprinkle cold
water by tablespoons over mix; stir lightly with fork until just
dampened. Form into ball. Divide in half. Roll one half out on
lightly floured board to 1/8-inch thickness. Cut into four 5-inch
circles. Follow above procedure with other half of dough. Shape
over bottoms of Medium-sized muffin cups; pleat edges; prick well.
Bake in preheated hot oven (425°F.) 10 to 12 minutes. Cool.,"
For topping, place all ingredients except vanilla in top of double

boiler. Beat 1 minute. Cook over bo:ling water, beating constantly-
with rotary or electric beater about 7 minutes or until topping
stands in stiff peaks. Remove from heat; add vanilla; beat 2 more
minutes. Fill shells with peaches. Cover tarts completely with
topping. Broil 2 to 2 minutes or until lightly brown. Cool, then
chill in refrigPrator serving time.

Tarts are always nibblin' tempters, and when they're filled
brimful with blushing peach slices, who can resist? Make the shells
easily with your favorite pie crust mix and top the tarts with a.
flourish of airy, meringue-like topping.

PEACH TARTS
Makes 8 tarts

Tarts:
One 10-oz. pkg. Flako Pie

Crust Mix JeA

4 tablespoons cold water '
Topping:

1-1/2 cups sugar
1/4 cup water

2
1/2
4


