
Another thing that given
an inch will take a yard is
crabgrass. THE CARROLL RECORD  The best things in life are

free. But there will always be
those who would appreciate
them more if they weren't.
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COMMUNITY LOCALS 
Mr. James Baumgardner is a

ient in the University Hospital,
timore, Md.

pat-
Bal-

Mrs. Howard Perkins, near Fred-
erick, was a luncheon guest on Mon-
day of Mr. and Mrs. Roy Speak.

Mrs. Georgia Stambaugh and
daughter, Sandy, of Kingsport, Tenn.,
visited with Mrs. Artie Miller on
Monday.

The Women's Guild and the Church-
men's Fellowship of Grace United
Church of Christ will meet this eve-
ning (May 2) at 7:30 P. M. in the
Parish House.

CWO Loy LeGore and Mrs. LeGore
and children, Jeff and Gregg, left for
El Paso, Texas, after spending the
Easter holidays with his parents, Mr.
and Mrs. Clarence LeGore.

May commenced yesterday (Wed.)
with what we hope will be the last
snowfall of the season. There was no
accumulation of snow on the ground
but it looked very wintry for a while.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Renner, Mas-
ter Dennis Wolf and Mr. and Mrs.
Franklin Stottlemyer, Rocky Ridge,
were Monday evening visitors of Mr.
and Mrs. Roy Speak, Kevin and Dawn.

The Pythian Sister Past Chief Club
will not hold their meeting on May 7
as planned due to a District Conven-
tion in Hagerstown, but will be held
instead on Tuesday evening, May 14,
at the home of Mrs. Marlin Six.

Mr. and Mrs. George Six and fam-
ily of Keymar and Mr. and Mrs.
Leonard Shaffer of Greenville spent
Sunday evening with Mr. and Mrs.
Benjamin Rock, Jr., and family of
near Taneytown.

' Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Tracey of
Taneytown and Mr. and Mrs. Robert
Fletcher and daughter, Tracey Ann
of Baltimore, are spending some time
with the Traceys' son and family,
Mr. and Mrs. Nelson Tracey and
family of Hollywood Hills, Florida.

Mrs. A. D. Alexander spent the
week-end with her daughter, Miss
Mary Louise Alexander, in Arlington,
Va., and attended the Spring Concert
at Yorktown High School, given under
the direction of Miss Alexander who
is music teacher there.

Sunday evening supper guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Speak and family
were Mr. and Mrs. John Harbaugh,
New Midway. They were joined later
in the evening by Mrs. Ethel Speak,
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Speak and Stev-
en, Ladiesburg, and Mr. and Mrs.
John Speak, near town.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy B. Kiser, Mr.
William DeBerry and Mrs. Bessie
Myers, Detour, attended the Turkey
and Ham Supper in the EUB Church,
Thurmont, on Saturday evening. They
also visited graves of relatives in the
EUB Cemetery and the Creagers-
town Cemetery.

Mrs. J. H. Francis and daughter,
Mrs. D. E. (Helen) Laird and family
spent the week-end in Milford, Conn.,
visiting Mrs. Francis' son and family,
Mr. and Mrs. W. R. Francis. Mrs.
Francis and Mrs. Laird left on Tues-
day aboard the Queen Mary for an
extended visit with relatives in var-
ious points in England.

The Federation of Republican Wo-
men will meet at Taney Inn Tuesday,
May 7, at 8 o'clock. A very interest-
ing meeting is planned, the speaker
being Mr. Jacob Yingling, a member
of the House of Delegates. Several
very timely events will be discussed
—mainly "The Redistricting of Car-
roll County." Please plan to attend.

Don't forget the Food Sale this
Friday morning beginning at 9:30
A. M. in the Municipal Building, Tan-
eytown. Benefit of Carroll County
General Hospital Auxiliary of Taney-
town District. Delicious foods such
as homemade bread, rolls, buns, pies,
cakes, salads, chicken corn soup and
vegetable soup, etc. Please patronize
this sale for a good cause.

A2/C Larry W. Keefer of St. Pet-
ersburg, Fla., who was stationed at
Mississippi Air Base spent from
Tuesday to Friday with his grand-
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Walter Hilter-
brick. He left on Friday for New-
foundland where he will be stationed
for a year. Those who spent Wednes-
day evening at the Hilterbrick home
were Mrs. Ruby Fissel and son, Tom-
mie, of Gettysburg •and Mr. Bub
Reedy of York, Pa.

The Rev. William F. Wiley, Pastor
of Grace Churches of Taneytown and
Keysville, and The Rev. Edmund P.
Welker, Pastor of the N. Carroll
Charge, will attend together the
Roslyn Conference of the United
Church of Christ, which Conference
Grounds are located near Richmond,
Va., on April 30, May 1 and 2. This
is an annual conference held for the
ministers and their wives of the Po-
tomac Synod, an acting conference
of the United Church of Christ.

Mr. and Mrs. Chester Neal return-
ed on Tuesday after a three-week
trip to Indiana, Kentucky and Illinois.
In Terre Haute they visited Dr. and
Mrs. J. F. Light and their grand-
children, Sheldon Matt and Jama
Light. In Kentucky they were the
guests of Mrs. Neal's brother and his
wife, Mr. and Mrs. Geo. B. Norton,
Jr., of Morganfield and Mr. and Mrs.
Acton R. Anderson of Mayfield and
Mrs. Ora L. Wallace of Paducah. En-
route back to Terre Haute, where
they spent another week with their
grandchildren, they travelled through
Illinois, visiting here and there with
old friends.

(continued on page four)
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HIGH SCHOOL HIGHLIGHTS

NOTICE!
Tane3itown Jr.-Sr. High School is

not sponsoring parties or social ac-
tivities following the Jr.-Sr. Prom,
Class Night or Commencement. The
School assumes no responsibility for
parties or activities following the
above programs.

Bill Shorb, a student in the 8th
grade at Taneytown High School,
placed third in the CaAoll County
Spelling Bee held on Tuesday.

In connection with School Spirit
Week at Taneytown High, the Student
Council presented an assembly on
Thursday. Speaker for the program
was Lt. Col. Albert Clark, who spoke
on his experiences with the orphan-
ages in Korea. This was quite perti-
nent since the Student Council has
adopted a war orphan from Korea.

Parents are asked to set aside Mon-
day, May 13. This will be the final
P.-T.A. meeting for the year. The
music department will present the
program.

Grading period ended on Tuesday
and report cards will be distributed
on Friday, May 10.

Beginning in September 1963 the
Schools for Practical Nurses at
Springfield State Hospital, Sykesvil-
le, and Eastern Shore State Hospital,
Cambridge, will admit qualified appli-
cants directly to the schools without
any previous hospital experience. The
same will also be true in the Psychi-
atric Aide Schools at Rosewood,
Spring Grove and Crownsville re-
spectively. This policy was approved
at the meeting of the State Board of
Health and Mental Hygiene.

Previously all applicants to any of
the schools had to be chosen from
among those already employed in the
hospitals as attendants. In general,
a high school degree is preferred.
However, a law was passed by the
last General Assembly permitting
those with two years of high school
to apply for training as a practical
nurse. Additional qualifications are
determined by intelligence and apti-
tudes tests and personal interviews.
Both men and women are admitted
to the school, and tests and inter-
views take place prior to admission.

All students are paid $2,740 per
year while in training which lasts
one year. The graduate psychiatric
aide receives instruction and practice
in general nursing as well as psychi-
atric nursing. He has the opportunity
to advance in the career system of
the Department of Mental Hygiene
hospitals to reach a salary of $5,365.
The practical nurse graduate is eli-
gible for the same promotional and
salary opportunities as well as being
eligible for licensure.

Applications are available now. All
those who are interested should con-
tact the Director of Nurses at the
closest State mental hospital, or the
Director of Nursing at the Depart-
ment of Mental Hygiene office in
Baltimore.

The State FHA meeting was held
at Lord Baltimore Hotel, Baltimore,
Saturday. Attending from the Taney-
town FHA were Betty Stonesifer,
president; Gloria Copenhaver, vice
president; Bonnie Harman, Mrs.
Clark, advisor, and Mrs. Paul Beale.

TO BE OR NOT TO BE - - -
THIS IS THE QUESTION!!

On May 21, this question will be
answered by all wheat growers, large
and small, across this great Nation
of ours.
To be under the complete control

of the Secretary of Agriculture and
his subordinates or not to be — this
best sums up the whole issue of the
wheat referendum.
Here in Maryland there are over

9,400 potential voters in this refer-
endum. Each one of us must inform
ourselves on the true issue and let our
conscience guide us in making the
final decision.
The time is coming closer each day

—May 13th is the deadline for you
so sign up and make yourselves eli-
gible to vote on the 21st.
Mr. Freeman. and Mr. Cochran

have ideas which would lead to the
destruction of small farms and the
entrance of a more socialized agri-
culture. Their views are dangerous
and curtailment of these ideas is of
the utmost importance. We farmers
comprise approximately 7.8 per cent
of this nation's population and yet
each one of us can produce enough
food and fiber apiece to feed and
clothe and equip 28 people. In Rus-
sia, with governmental control, 50
per cent of their population are in-
volved in agriculture and yet the
other 50 per cent are reported to be
starving and without the barest es-
sentials. The Secretary's control is
at present forcing more and more
small farmers out of the industry.
Our nation will indeed be in sad
straits if we let Washington beaure-
crats control the belts of this great
and prosperous land.
Only wheat is directly involved at

the moment, and only wheat pro-
ducers can vote; but all farmers,
consumers and taxpayers will be af-
fected by the outcome. The result
will affect our relations with other
countries, our taxes and perhaps even
the future direction of policy toward
nonfarm groups.

Let's take the opportunity to ex-
ercise our right to vote NO for the
sake of our American farmers and
our American heritage!

—Mrs. James Ensor.

SOUTHERN STATES FARM
ADVISORY MEETING

The Farm Home Advisory Commit-
tee of Southern States Taneytown
Cooperative held a Demonstration
Meeting on "Party Ideas and Cake
Decorating."
The meeting was held in the store-

room of our local store on Monday
evening, April 29th, at 8:00 P. M.
The members of the Keysville Home-
maker's Club were our guests along
with our Board of Directors and their
wives, the manager of our store, Mr.
George Flohr and the members of our
committee: Mrs. Gilbert Stine, Mrs.
Mark Baumgardner, Mrs. Clyde Wil-
hide, Mrs. Martin Rodkey and Mrs.
Martin Zimmerman were present.
The cakes made from Southern

States Farm Family Flour were
beautifully decorated by Mrs. Kath-
ryn Coshun. A demonstration on Par-
ty Ideas was presented by Mrs. Mil-
dred Stine and Mrs. Mae Baumgard-
ner, carrying out a theme for each
month of the year. Some very beau-
tiful favors were made by these
ladies.
With our "Party Ideas" of favors

and beautiful cakes, no party is com-
plete without a liquid refreshment.
Mrs. Ruth Wilhide gave us a demon-
stration on the making of punch,
which was delicious. After our dem-
onstrations, several door prizes were
given away. Refreshments of cake,
punch, nuts and mints were served
to everyone present.

GIRL SCOUT PROGRAM CHANGES

Mrs. Blanche Lookingbill, Mrs.
Genita Conover, Mrs. Melba Fair and
Mrs. Zola Cantwell attended the Girl
Scout Program Change training
classes held in the Westminster Meth-
odist Church at Westminster and have
successfully completed the course.
The purpose of the whole thing was

to instruct leaders, assistants, and
other Girl Scout workers in the
change over from the old program to
the new, which will begin in Septem-
ber 1963 when the new handbooks
are available. A number of changes
have been made, all of which promise
a much more flexible and challenging
program for both the girls and their
leaders in the future.

BIDS ASKED FOR ROADS

John B. Funk, Chairman-Director
of the State Roads Commission, said
recently that the Commission has
asked for bids for work on a section
of U.S. Route 15 in Frederick County.

Specifically, he said, the contract
calls for: Grading, drainage and sur-
facing of U.S. 15 from Tuscarora
Creek to the Lewistown By-Pass, a
distance of 3.8 miles. Bids will be
opened May 14.
When completed, this project will

complete construction of the first
lane of an ultimate dual from Fred-
erick to Emmitsburg.

Addition of the second lane of
Route 15 is scheduled to begin next
year.
Work now in progress on Route 15

includes the 3.2-mile section from
Putnam Road to the Thurmont By-
Pass.

SENIOR GIRL SCOUT TROOP 723

Ever since January, the Senior Girl
Scouts have been giving of their spare
time working as Junior Volunteer
Nurses' Aides at Annie M. Warner
Hospital in Gettysburg. The girls
performed simple but time-consuming
tasks, such as making beds, cleaning
units, arranging flowers, serving
meals, and feeding certain patients.
Most of the Scouts have now com-

pleted their required 30 hours. They
will be eligible to receive their bar
in the Community Service Program
in Scouting. The girls who partici-
pated are Joan Cassell, Marian Dun-
ham, Diana Fair, Robin Fair, Fay
Hilterbrick, Carol Piezonki, Carol
Remsburg, Nancy Wargny and Joan
Clingan. Both Marian and Fay plan
to work at Frederick Memorial Hos-
pital during the summer as nurses'
aides.

Five Generations

Shown above I. to r. great grand-
mother, Mrs. Kathryn Coxin; grand-
mother, Mrs. James D. Robb; mother,
Mrs. Raymond Soles; great great
grandmother, Mrs. Mazie Sullivan of
Frizellburg, sitting in chair holding
her great great granddaughter,
Yvette Soles, of near Pittsburgh,
Perms. The baby was one month old
when picture was taken— is now 9
months old.

A nation deprived of liberty may
win it, a nation divided may reunite,
but a nation whose natural resources
are destroyed must inevitably pay
the penalty of poverty, degradation,
and decay.—Gifford Pinchot.

Covered Dish Dinner

The Carroll County Sub-League of
the Woman's General League of Get-
tysburg, held a covered dish dinner,
Monday, April 29, in the Grace Lu-
theran Church, Westminster, Md.
Mrs. Stanley Jennings gave the in-

vocation before the meal.
Following the singing of a hymn,

Pastor Howard Miller led the group
in prayer.

Mrs. Hubert Null with the help of
Miss Cornelia Kroh introduced three
seniors from Westminster High
School — Sandra Curd sang two se-
lections accompanied by Dorothy El-
len Flickinger. Carol Gesell played a
piano selection from "Exodus."
The president, Mrs. Lloyd Wilhide

had a short business meeting. Luther
Ritter, a member of the Board of Di-
rectors of Gettysburg College gave
very interesting statistics of the Col-
lege. The College Choir will tour
Europe this summer. In the near fu-
ture a new stadium will be built.
Bruce Wayne Baumgardner was

named for the Book of Jewels.
Rev. Augustus Boreleis, from the

Uniontown Lutheran Charge, told of
his experiences serving 28 years as
an Army Chaplain. He was stationed
in the Hawaiian Islands for a number
of years. In a most unique manner he
shared many slides from the Islands
with the group.
Pastor Falkenstein closed the meet-

ing with the benediction.

CARROLL COUNTY TB ASSN.
HOLDS ANNUAL DINNER

The Carroll County TB Associa-
tion held their annual dinner meeting
at Miller's Dining Room on Thursday
evening, April 25. Robert Lee Miller,
Sykesville, president of the organiza-
tion, presided at the meeting. Mr.
Miller announced at the meeting that
the 1962 Christmas Seal Campaign
was the largest Seal campaign in
Carroll County with a total of
$11,818.75.

Pres. Miller introduced the guests
and recognized Mr. Earl Griswold,
professor of Sociology at the Western
Maryland College who is conducting
a survey of Tuberculosis in Carroll
County. The grant of $850 which the
Carroll County TB Association is sup-
porting will be to cover the financial
part of the survey. Miss Shirley
Stauffer, an honor student from the
college, will begin the study immedi-
ately.
The speaker of the evening was Dr.

Richard Riley, professor of the De-
partment of Environmental Medicine
from the Johns Hopkins University.
Dr. Riley was introduced by Mr.
Frank T. Jones, Executive Director
of the Maryland TB Association, Bal-
timore.
Mr. Miller also recognized the press,

all volunteers and all who are so
willingly giving their time and efforts
to help combat Tuberculosis in Car-
roll County.
The business meeting was held im-

mediately after the dinner meeting
and the following officers and Board
of Directors were elected for office
for the year 1963-64. Pres. Robert
Miller will again serve as head of
the Association with Mr. Edwin W.
Shauck and Mr. Preston G. Coffman
as Vice Presidents. Mrs. A. Millard
Roelke will be Secretary and Mrs.
Paul H. Smith as treasurer. Mr.
Samuel Jenness, Mr. Willard Uhler
and Mr. Charles L. St,onesifer as the
Executive Committee and the follow-
ing as Board of Directors. Raymond
P. Buchman, Mrs. Paul E. Lawyer,
Mr. George Otto, Mrs. Virginia Min-
nick, Mrs. Francis Crawford, Mrs.
Wm. B. Culwell, Miss Ann S. Reif-
snider, Dr. Phillip Mercer and Mr.
Edmund L. Carr.

BANKERS CONVENTION

A. Leroy Nichols, president of the
Maryland Bankers Association and
president of the Nicodemus National
Bank, Hagerstown, has announced
that speakers at the organization's
convention at Chalfonte-Haddon Hall,
Atlantic City, N.J., May 3-7, will be
Thomas W. Gormly, vice president,
Pittsburgh National Bank, Pitts-
burgh, Pa.; Ira M. Hayes, director,
retail methods department, cash reg-
ister sales, National Cash Register
Co., Dayton, Ohio; Ragnar D. Naess,
senior partner, Naess and Thomas,
New York City; Tom Collins, public-
ity director, City National Bank and
Trust Co., Kansas City, Mo., and
Marvin McLain, assistant legislative
director, American Farm Bureau Fed-
eration, Washington, D.C.
Speaker at the luncheon for the

ladies attending the convention will
be Morton Hunt, author of the best-
seller, "Her Infinite Variety."
Joseph F. Matthai, Jr,, vice presi-

dent, Maryland National Bank, Balti-
more, is chairman of the Association's
convention committee. Vice president
of the bankers' organization is Ver-
non T. Pittinger, vice president of the
Equitable Trust Co., Baltimore. At-
tendance is expected to be about 650
and bankers from all parts of Mary-
land as well as from nearby Eastern
cities are expected to attend the con-
vention.

Carroll County bankers registered
for the convention include Raymond
P. Buchman, president, and Joseph
W. Allender, director, Hampstead
Bank; Celius L. Brown, president,
Sykesville Bank; E. Elwood Baum-
gardner, vice president, Harry B.
Dougherty, Sr., director, Clyde L.
Hesson, cashier, First National Bank,
Taneytown; Norman B. Boyle, chair-
man of the board, Scott S. Bair, di-
rector, John R. Brown, director, John
A. Bankert, vice president, D. Eugene
Walsh, director, andClifton W. War-
ner, president, Carroll County Bank
and Trust Co., Westminster; John
P. W. Beard, chairman of the board,
David H. Taylor, director, J. Pearre
Wantz, president, Union National
Bank, Westminster.

JOHN M. SKILES ELECTED
PRESIDENT OF JAYCEES

At the annual April election meet-
ing, John M. Skiles was elected
President of the Taneytown Jaycees.
Also elected to office at this time
were Dean Brown, 1st Vice President;
Wayne Baumgardner, 2nd Vice Presi-
dent; Cecil Lewelling, Secretary;
Robert Bowers, Treasurer; Larry Lit-
tle, Elwood Myers and Donald Smith,
Board of Directors; and Dean Nus-
baum, State Director. These officers
will take office July 1.
Guests present at the meeting were

Charles Bowling, Pat Carr, both
candidates for the office of State
President; Paul Fowler, Ron Mackey,
candidates for National Directors;
Jim Simpson, Past National Director;
Bill Kimball, President of Mid-Mont-
gomery Jaycees; John Apple and
Paul Wardenfelt of Westminster Jay-
cees. The candidates for state office
presented their platforms and solicit-
ed the local chapters support for their
election.

Richard McPartland was inducted
into our club. Cecil Lewelling was
presented a SPOKE certificate for
outstanding efforts by a first year
Jaycee. This certificate is awarded
by the United States Junior Cham-
ber of Commerce. Patrick Hobbs will
also receive the above award. Our
membership accepted the invitation to
use the building beside the First
National Bank as our headquarters.
Eleven couples are planning to

attend the 1963 State Convention in
Frederick, Md., May 3, 4 and 5. Dean
Brown will represent Taneytown in
the State SPOKE contest and James
Fair will represent Taneytown and
District II in the Speak-Up Jaycee
contest Saturday morning.

Along the Monocacy

Last Sunday we visited my broth-
er, whose farm is beautifully situ-
ated on the Monocacy River. The
name "Monocacy" is of Indian origin,
due to the fact that Indians—notably
the Tuscarora tribe once roamed the
land along the river hunting deer and
wolves, and fishing in its placid wat-
ers. Even today, it is a favorite
spot for fishermen.
On this particular day, the Monoc-

acy was very peaceful, as it flowed
smoothly along. It was quite low
due to the lack of rain. But it is not
always like this, for like all large
rivers, the Monocacy is changeable.
Its moods vary. I have seen it go on
real rampages, overflowing its banks
and flooding the lower meadows on
my brother's place. In the winter
time, of course, it is locked in ice
and snow.
But the Monocacy is always beauti-

ful, especially now that the Virginia
Blue-bells and other wild flowers are
in bloom. The Blue-bells look just
like what the name implies. They are
a delicate shade of blue, and thrive
only in certain areas. The banks of
the Monocacy provide the ideal place
for them. They are rather tall flow-
ers, and quite showy. The carpet of
blue that met our eyes was truly
lovely. We saw another rather rare
flower, known as the Star of Beth-
lehem. The waxy white flowers, 4
or 6 on each stem, do look like stars.
Another flower, called Dutchman's
Breeches, is also "white and bears an
amazing resemblance to a wide pair
of trousers. The names for these wild
flowers may not be scientifically cor-
rect, but they are very apt. Nestling
down among the Blue-bells, we spied
lots of shy little violets. Some are
pure white, while others are a sunny
yellow. Most violets, however, are
some shade of lavendar, ranging from
very pale tones to a deep velvety
looking purple. We saw lots cif
Spring Beauties, too. These are deli-
cate pink and white flowers. Grow-
ing in the water were quite a few
wild water lilies.
On the opposite side of the Monoc-

acy, at this particular point, is a
steep hillside—almost a cliff—with
lovely rock formations and beautiful
trees. Some of our party waded
across to explore it. They reported
many kinds of moss and wild ferns
growing over there.
With our binoculars, we saw sev-

eral vireos and a Baltimore Oriole.
We heard some warblers, but didn't
see any. These tiny transient birds
come through in May. I imagine the
lively chatter of our group scared'
most of the birds away.
We came back from our little jaunt

quite refreshed. This type of thing
is good for anyone, especially in this
frantic, hectic age. There is no better
place to enjoy it than along the
beautiful Monocacy.

—Zola Cantwell.

PARENTS TO VISIT SCHOOL

Parents of children who will enter
the First Grade in September will
visit the Taneytown Elementary
School on Wednesday evening, May
15, at 7:30 P. M. They are asked
to bring the child's birth certificate,
immunization and vaccination records,
if available. Children are not to be
brought at this time as parents will
be presenting records and a special
program has been prepared for them
only.

ANOTHER FOREIGN-AID
RECIPIENT THUMBS NOSE

At Genoa, Italy, a giant Soviet
tanker was launched the other day.
Named the "Leonardo Da Vinci." the
tanker was launched with all the
pomp and ceremony of such occasions.
It is first ke six new 18,000-ton tank-
ers the Soviets will use in their drive
to oust America from the oil markets
of the Free World. (Italy has re-
ceived some $5,755,000,000 in foreign
aid from the United States.)

Most of us know how to say noth-
ing. Few of us know when!

"SPICE 'N' EVERYTHING NICE"

With all my heart, I wish you every
morning

A smile that shall last until the next day's
dawniag.

I wish you health—life's greatest wealth;
I wish you always near so that I may help

to cheer
Each future day and In some way—help to

bring you happiness!

This Column will be about an aged
couple I know and it will make you
think and think and think especially
if you have relatives that are up in
years.

I'll call the couple, Mr. and Mrs.
Jones. The Jones family have three
married daughters and one married
son, all doing very nicely, with lovely
homes and grown children. Mr. and
Mrs. Jones are now at the ages of 82
and 84 and are living in the city in a
little home they bought years ago
due to the fact that the youngest
daughter was living right around the
corner. They sort of felt secure with
one daughter near. Without Mr. and
Mrs. Jones being told of the fact, this
daughter moves away to the very end
of the city and in a County. Mr. and
Mrs. Jones felt so alone.
Now as the years are creeping up

with "Father Time" taking hold of
the aged hands, they find they cannot
keep house any longer and would
love to be with one of the four chil-
dren. It was truly passing the buck
from one to the other by saying,
"Well, you keep Mother and Dad for
three months and we will all continue
to take turns like that!" The other
three did not agree to this set up and
the one in the County being near the
Highway said, "Well, Dad will be
walking on the Highway and he
might get killed and I would be a
nervous wreck from the awful strain
of anxiety!" The other daughter who
is a widow and in a large apartment
on the third floor said, "Well, I could
not afford to have them live with
me!" Another daughter who is a
R. N. and whose husband has an ex-
cellent position as an Executive said,
"Well, I am not going to give up
nursing and my husband's job is sort
of shaky, besides that Dad smokes
and there are holes in my carpet and
furniture when they come to visit us
on a Sunday!"
The only son said, "Well, I cannot

have them for I am supporting my
wife's Mother and that is all I can
do!"

It all made me think of that story
and picture called, "Over The Hill
to The Poor House!"
I talked with the little Mother over

the phone and she broke down telling
me of all she had gone through with
the children and then she said sweet-
ly, "But I am not complaining, Irene
but it makes my heart ache to think
not one of our children wants us! I
know of many things this Mother has
done for those children for years
since 1933. My heart ached for this
dear little woman and my thoughts
went back to the days of my own Be-
loved Mother whom we all wanted
and there were eight children. I
thought of the Ten Commandments
and the very one, "Honor Thy Father
and Mother: that thy days may be
long upon the land which the Lord
God Giveth thee!"
I just do not understand, Folks as

even a few years ago, many children
would feel that it was their duty to
take care of their parents but it does
not mean anything today.
Now, this couple would like to take

two rooms and furnish it themselves!
Perhaps there are many other sad
cases like this. Nothing could be
worse!
The other day while in the Hecht-

May Company, the Doves were taken
down from the ceiling and one drop-
ped in back of the counter where I
stood at the Max Factor Counter and
the nice sales girl handed it to me. I
(thought of the Dove for Peace and
Purity and it appeared almost real!
Such little things, Folks in life!
Now, here is to the "TAURUS"

individual those born from April 20
to May 20 inclusive. Venus is the
ruling planet which gives these peo-
ple much charm and beauty to the
late years in life. They are wonder-
ful home builders and have talent for
anything artistic. They have broad
shoulders and really can shoulder
much responsibilty. When they re-
main at one position through life,
they usually go to the very top and
many a bank has as it's President a
Taurus individual. They are the
strength of the entire Zodiac as they
are powerfully strong. These people
do not like contradictions if they are
positive that they are right regard-
less of the subject. They must be
careful of choosing the right mate in
life. December is the ideal mate al-
though there are others with whom
they get along beautifully. Taurus
people expect kindness and consider-
ation from others and are very dis-
appointed when this is not shown.
They make fine leaders in any type
of business as they are loaded with
talent in every capacity.
So long, Folks until next week D-

V. Have a grand week-end and be so
careful when you drive.

I am,
Faithfully,
YOUR OBSERVER

GOVERNMENT WASTE-OF-THE-
WEEK

The Government's $55 million
stockpile of castor oil now stands at
214 million pounds, more than a
pound for every man, woman, and
child in the United States. The Jan-
uary report of the Government's
stockpile inventories showed that it
has 164 million pounds more than the
maximum projected need. This is a
dose of Government waste which is
indeed too hard to swallow; as a mat-
ter of curiosity how long has it been
since you swallowed a pound of cas-
tor oil?
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INCOME TAX: A GROWING

MONSTER

When the income tax was inaug-

urated 50 years ago, objectors were

soothed with the declaration that it

was "inconceivable" ,the tax on in-

comes would ever go over 2 percent.

Today's individual Federal income

tax rates range from 20% to 91%.

When the levy first went into effect,

less than one person in a hundred

was affected. A married man's ex-

emption was $4,000. Even in 1929, a

married man with two children and

a net income of $5,000 paid only $3

in income tax. In the income tax's

first year, the Federal government

collected $28,000,000; this year it is

iestimated the individual income tax

will produce almost 2,000 times that

much — $52,G00,000.000.

There's a crying need for a tax

cut - - and a cut could be made if

there is a cut in Federal spending.

This subject was discussed last week

in Washington by a special committee

of top business leaders appointed by

Treasury Secretary Dillon, with th3

approval of the President. Those ap-

pointed were: Henry Ford IT, Pres-

ident Mark Cresay, Jr., of Westing-

house, President Stuart T. Saunders

of N. & W. Railway, Chairman Fra.-

zier B. Wilde of. Connecticut Life,

and Sam Fleming of Nashville, for-

mer president of American Bankers

Association. Each of these five chose

one associate, bringing the commit-

tee membership to a total of ten. Ad-

im7r_istration spokesmen insist that

the appointment of this special com-

mittee to meet together and make a

report on the subject of Federal tax-

ft: was in no way a retreat from the

Kennedy program.

Our guess last week was that the

Senate Finance Committee would

soon start consideration of the tax

bill, now that the House Ways and

Means Committee had finished its

work on it. When, and if, the Senate

connnittee takes it up, the early

hearings would no doubt be only of a

general nature.
—J. Glenn Beall

GRASS ROOTS OPINIONS

ONARGA., ILL., LEA DE R-

REVIEW: "That the chemical indus-

try spends more a its own money on
research and development than any

other, is indication of its acceptance

of responsibility to continue to spark

progress   As General John E.

Buil, president of the Manufacturing

Chemists' Association, has said, reg-

ulators and legislators' should recog-

nize that without a healthy, prosper-

ous industry there can be no effect-

ive contribution to solving the coun-

try's economic and public interest

problems.' This, we would think is

the golden text for Chemical Pro-

gress Week, 1963."

"Government by decree took

another step forward . . . with the

announcement that the secretaries of

agriculture and interior have ap-

proved regulations giving them

powerful new authority over grant-

ing permission to the crossing of pub-

lic lands by the transmission lines of

utility companies." —Wyoming State

Tribune.

'The Administration's recent tax

ihroposals would tend to raise the oil

industry's total domestic tax burden

perceptibly above the average for all

industries, accOrding to a study by

the Petroleum " Industry Research

Foundation, Inc.

According to Newsweek, Secretary

of the Treasury Dillon offers these

budget estimates: Fiscal 1964, $11.9

billion deficit; fiscal 1965, $8 billion

deficit; fiscal 1966, $4 billion deficit;

fiscal 1967, a balanced budget.

PUBLIC SALE
OF CATTLE, HOGS, FARM MACHINERY,

and HOUSEHOLD GOODS

SATURDAY, MAY 18, 1963 — 10:00 A. M.

Located between Taneytown and Westminster. Md., on Route 97,

about 41/2 miles from Westminster, Maryland.

Having sold my farm will offer at Public Sale the following:

CATTLE, Mixed Herd
Two first calf heifers, calves just sold; one heifer will be fresh in

June, one cow carrying fourth calf, will be fresh in June, will be TB

tested wi:fnin thirty days of sale.

HOGS
7 head of hogs, weighing 125 to 150 lbs.

Some HAY and STRAW. Some LAYING CHICKENS.

FARM MACHINERY
Int3rnational Harvester hay baler, Model 45, (like new)

1953 Farmall Super C tractor, mounting plows, corn worker and

planter, New Holland rubber tire wagon (like new); tractor mower,

New Ideal manure spreader, (95 bu., 
wagon,

new); 3-section spring-

tooth harrow, disc harrow, (like new); side delivery rake, hammer

mill, garden tractor, all attachments, with trailer;

MISCELLANEOUS

Platform Scales, elec. brooder stove and chicken feeders, black-

smith anvil, elec. fence post, barb wire, sawed post and split post,

two emory wheels, work bench, vice, paint, deep well, pump, garden

hose, electric sprayer, burlap bags, chicken coops, iron watering

trough, iron hog trough, 32-ft. double ladder, picket fence, old pipe,

old iron, shutters, couster towel, asbestos shingles, floor tile, ply

wood, stove.
ANTIQUES and HOUSEHOLD

Large cut glass bowl on stand, old pitcher, 5 large meat plates,

large covered soup bowl, with silver ladle; all Havaland china, cut

glass water set, (at least 75 yrs. old); cut glass wine and whisky

glasses, old sugar bowl and creamer, pitchers, rose bowl, mustard

jug, old vases, lots of other old dishes. The above is all in A-1 con.

FURNITURE
Old time china closet, brass bed, old brass clothes tree, brass lamp,

(real old); old rockers, lot of old books, old pictures, frames, day bed,

chests, dressers library table, sec. book case, floor lamp, tools of all

kinds, Hot Point refrigerator, 3 yrs. old); 17-ft. deep freeze, 4-burn-

er oil stove, lawn furniture, picnic table, old wheels, old cupboard,

radio and record player, (floor model); fire place irons and screens,

coffee table, rugs, metal folding Ipicnic table, lots of dishes, pots and

pans, fruit and country bacon, crocks of all sizes, many other' articles

too numerous to mention.

Terms of sale: CASH.

MR. and MRS. CARSON G. RITENOUR
Owners

Not responsible for accidents
Lunch rights
GUSS SHANK, Auct.
CARL HAINES, Clerk 4-25-5-2 & 16

11
1

1
1
1
1
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PUBLIC SALE

OF HOUSEHOLD GOODS, ETC.

SATURDAY, MAY 4, 1963, at 11:00 O'Clock A. M.

The undersigned, having sold his home, will offer at Public
Sale, located on York St. in Taneytown, Md., the following:

HOUSEHOLD GOODS

Frigidaire elec. stove (good condition), Westinghouse refrig-
erator with freezer top (like new), 10-pc. dining room suite (very
good), 3-pc. living room suite (A-1 condition), 2 6-pc. water fall
bedroom suites (good condition), cabinet type radio and record
player combined, bookcase and desk combined, over-stuffed rocker,
leather rocker, telephone stand and chair, cedar chest, blanket chest,
trunks, Rayo lamp, elect, lamps, floor lamps, magazine rack, Ken-
more elect. sweeper, bench, jardinere, cane stool, wicker rocker,
fernery, Bowgs clock, toaster, mixer, deep fryer, meat slicer, elect.
clock, radio, mirror, card table, bathroom sets, picture frames, rugs,
baby gate, crocks, jars, dishes of all kinds, pots and pans, homemade
quilts, bed clothing, new sheets, curtains, homemade crocheted bed-
spread, oil heater, step ladder, meat bench, quilting frames, garden
plow, porch rockers, lawn roller, garden tools of all kinds, other
small tools; other articles too numerous to mention.

Terms of Sale: CASH.
Not responsible for accidents.
Lunch rights.

RAYMOND F. DAVIDSON, Owner.

GUSS SHANK, Auctioneer.

CARL HAINES, Clerk.
4-4, 18, 5-2
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ATTORNEY'S SALE
OF

TANEYTOWN RESIDENTIAL REAL ESTATE

Located at 43 West Baltimore Street, Taneytown, Maryland
By virtue of the Power and Authority in the mortgage deed

from Lawrence L. Dunn and wife to First National Bank, Taneytown,

Maryland, dated July 1, 1959, recorded among the Land Records of
Carroll County in Liber No. 30'7, folio 17 &c., which said mortgage is
in default and has been placed in the hands of the undersigned At-
torney Named in Mortgage for the purpose of foreclosure and col-

lection, the undersigned Attorney will sell, on the premises, on

THURSDAY, MAY 9, 1963
at 6:30 o'clock P. M., the following Real Estate:

All that lot or parcel of land fronting 491/2 feet on West Balti-
more Street and running back, with a uniform depth. 340 feet to the

middle of a private alley 11 feet wide and containing 62 square per-

ches of land, more or less; being the same land conveyed unto Law-

rence L. Dunn and wife by Carroll F. Newcomer and wife by deed

dated July 1, 1959, and recorded among the Land Records aforesaid
in Liber No. 307, folio 15 &c. This parcel of land is improved by a

21/2 STORY FRAME DWELLING

This dwelling is improved with cenrtal heating system, connect-
ed with Town sewage disposal system; el. cur., comp. roof. Frame
garage.

TERMS OF SALE: One-third of the purchase money in cash
on the day of sale or upon ratification thereof by the court and the
residue in two equal payments of one and two years from the day of
sale, with interest from day of sale, the credit payments to be secured
by the notes of the purchaser or purchasers, with approved security,

or all cash at the option of the purchaser. A deposit of $1500.00 will
be required on day of sale. Taxes to be adjusted to date of settle-
ment. Attorney will pay for internal Revenue Stamps on deed. Prep-
aration of deed, state stamps and other expenses of transfer and re-

cording to be paid by purchaser or purchasers.

RALPH G. HOFFMAN
Attorney Named in Mortgage
23 Court Street
Westminster, Maryland
Tilden 8 - 4444
TEnnyson 3 - 1114

Auctioneer, GUSS SHANK.

LEIMUIMIMMIE• )„, y.4 • • >ot . • )*4 )0( q.t. •

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

This is to give notice that the sub-
scriber has obtained from the Or-
phans' Court of Carroll County, in
Maryland, letters of Administration
m the personal estate of

EDGAR R. WILHIDE

late of Carroll County, deceased. All
persons having claims against the
deceased are warned to exhibit the
same with the vouchers thereof, leg-
ally autheticated, to the subscribers,
on or before the 14th day of Novem-
ber, next; they may otherwise by
law be excluded from all benefits of
said estate.

Given under our hands this 9th day
of April, 1963.

PARK W. PLANK,
CHARLES A. STANSBURY
Admrs. of estate of said Dec'd.

R. G. Hoffman, Attorney
Court St., Westminster, Md.

5-2-4t

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

This is to give notice that the sub-
scriber has obtained from the Or-
phans' Court of Carroll County, in
Maryland, letters Testamentary on
the personal estate of

JOSEPH ASHCROFT,

late of Carroll County, deceased. All
persons having claims against the de-
ceased are warned to exhibit the
same, with the vouchers thereof, leg-
ally authenticated, to the subscriber,
on or before the 7th day of Nov.,
next; they may otherwise by law be
excluded from all benefits of said
estate.

Given under my hand this 12th day
of March, 1963.

GERARD V. ASHCROFT,
Ex'rx of the estate of said Deceased.
D. C. Sponseller
Westminster, Maryland

5-2-4t
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FROZEN FOOD
LOCKER

RENTING
Otterdale Mill, Inc.

Phone PLymouth 6-4786
OTTERDALE MILL ROAD

TANEYTOWN

Open week-days 8 a. m.'to 9 p. m.
Sundays and Holidays 9 a. m. to
12 noon and 7 p. m. to 9 p. m.

Moto: •ototo toto ototototot.

• WEcHAVE IT! NEW MONARCH PORTABLE
BY REMINGTON GIVES YOU 12 EXTRg FEA-
TURES NEVER BEFORE ASSEMBLED
ON ANY PORTABLE UNDER $100E2
i. Single Key Sets 7 Card & Writing Line

Columns & Indents! ' Scale! OUR PRICE
2-color Ribbon & Q Adjustable Paper ONLY
Stencil Control! Edge Guide!

2 Erasure Table on
Cylinder!

A Removable Top
Cever! ^
Calibrated Scale on
Paper Bail!
Calibrated Paper

'w Tablet

9 Variable Line Spacer!
Carriage Centering
" Lock!

11 Touch Regulator!

12 Lighter Weight!

Charles L. Stonesifer

5 Plus
• Tax

TANEYTOWN, MD.
DEALER

REMINGTON RAND PORTABLE TYPEWRITERS
AND ADDING MACHINES

RIBBONS AND CARBON PAPER

Open Evenings by Appointment

14.40101010 0to1010t0l0t4tO1uto4O10toto104 0:0:444,4444040VP 0101444444,01010eototoot0101o101010

DR. MARVIN KASIK
OPTOMETRIST

*Eyes Examined * Glasses Fitted

* Contact Lenses

Adults and Children

WESTMINSTER SHOPPING CENTER

Westminster, Md. TILDEN 8 - 3322
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RDINANCE No.188
AN ORDINANCE repealing Ordinance No. 158, passed on July 17, 1950, and re-enacting the same,

with amendments excepting certain vehicles from the effect of prohibitions herein set forth.

SECTION 1. BE IT ENACTED AND ORDAINED by the Mayor and City Council of Taney-

town, Maryland, that Ordinance No. 158, passed by the Mayor and City Council on July 17, 1950, be, 
and

the same is hereby repealed and re-enacted, with amendments, to read as follows:

SECTION 2. That it shall be unlawful to park any motor vehicle, or other vehicle, on any street
 or

parts of any street designated as an area of restricted parking by readily visable posted signs stating s
aid

restriction, for a period longer than three hours between the hours of 8 A. M. and 8 P. M., excepting S
un-

days and holidays.

SECTION 3. That any person or person charged with the violation of the provisions of this Or
di-

nance shall, upon conviction thereof, be subject to a fine of not less than One Dollar ($1.00), nor more t
han

Fifty ifollars, and costs, or imprisonment upon the failure to pay said fine.

SECTION 4. AND BE IT FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED That the prohibitions set

forth in this Ordinance shall not apply to any person or persons parking their vehicles in front of ally bu
ild-

ing used by said person or persons as his or their dwelling, provided said vehicle shall be properly identified

by appropriate marking there on, as belonging to said person or persons.

SECTION 5. AND BE IT FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED that all Ordinances or

Parts of Ordiance be, and the same are hereby repealed insofar as they conflict with the provisions of 
this

Ordinance.

SECTION 6. AND BE IN FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED that this Ordinance shall

take effect upon the day and date of its passage.

PASSED by the Mayor and City Council of Taneytown this 22nd day of April, 1%3.

HENRY I. REINDOLLAR, JR.,
Clerk.

APPROVED this 22nd day of April, 1%3.
RAYMOND J. PERRY,

Mayor.

IORDINANCE No..189
AN ORDINANCE RELATING TO THE REGULATION OF STORAGE OF PETROLEUM

AND PETROLEUM PRODUCTS IN ABOVE-GROUND TANKS OR VESSELS.

SECTION 1: BE IT ENACTED AND ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

OF TANEYTOWN That no person, firm or corporation shall construct, erect or maintain any above-

ground tank or other vessel exceeding ten (10) gallons in capacity, in which shall be stored petroleum or

petroleum products, within the limits of the City of Taneytown, without first obtaining therefor a permit

from the Mayor and City Council of Taneytown.

SECTION 2: AND BE IT FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED That no permit shall be

issued by the Mayor and City Council, if after due consideration of the size, location, nature and purposes

of such tank or vessel, they shall deem it detrimental to the peace and good order of the City, to the security

of persons and property or to the health, comfort and con„venienee of the citizens thereof.

SECTION 3: AND BE IT FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED That 'when any permit

shall be issued permitting the above-ground storage of petroleum and petroleum products the Mayor and

City Council may impose as a condition of such storage such limitations or requirements as they may deem

a, necessary and proper for the preservation of peace and good order, to secure persons and property from

fi danger and destruction and to. protect the health, comfort and convenience of the citizens of the municipality.

SECTION 4: AND BE IT FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED That any person, firm or

corporation violating the provisions of this Ordinance, from and after the date of its passage, shall, upon

conviction thereof by any Trial Magistrate or other proper Judge or Magistrate, be sentenced to pay a fine

of not less than Five Dollars ($5.00) nor more than Twenty-five Dollars ($25.00) for each violation and

that each day that any unauthorized tank or vessel shall be used for the storage of petroleum or petroleum

products shall be considered a distinct and separate violation of this Ordinance.

SECTION 5: AND BE IT FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED That this Ordinance shall

not be applicable with respect to any above-ground tank or vessel used or erected to be used for the storage

of petroleum or petroleum products erected or constructed prior to the date of the passage of this Ordinance

m

4- 11- 4 t

3112a$24310131drilaS

311

st

PASSED by the Mayor and City Council

APPROVED this 22nd day of April, 1963.

of Taneytown this 22nd day of April, 1963.

HENRY I. REINDOLLAR, JR.,
Clerk.

RAYMOND J. PERRY,
Mayor.
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CURRENT EVENTS I
FIFTY YEARS AGO

Rev. L. B. Hafer has exchanged
his team for a five-passenger car
which he expects to use in pastoral
work as well as on trips of longer
distance.
John W. Eckard has taken the po-

sition in Riffle's grocery store vaca-
ted 13y Geo. Buffington who has ac-
cepted a position in Westminster.

Oliver T. Shoemaker and Samuel
J. Renner have purchased automo-
biles and joined the fleet. There are
others reported to 'be considering
like action.

Copperville — Oregon school vis-
ited Otterdale school on Wednesday
afternoon. The children report having
a good play, afterward gathering
woods flowers Samuel Flickinger
and wife are spending the week in
Hanover, with their daughter, Mrs.
Thomas Weishaar, and other rela-
tives, as a recuperation to Mr. Flick-
inger's long spell of sickness .....
Our people are busy, some have
planted corn and others are getting
ready; some are turning over the
sod which is almost wet enough to
form balls.

Keysville — Mrs. Addie Burns of
Alaska has returned home after a
two months pleasant visit with her
uncle, Edward Shorb and other rel-
atives.   G. P. Ritter is improving
one of his town properties by build-
ing a stable for one of his tenants,
C. E. Six   Miss Olive Fennel and
Carroll Hess of Taneytown; Harry
and Charlie Cluts, Roy Kiser and
Charlie Devilbiss spent Sunday after-
noon at Peter Baumgardners'.

SPECIAL NOTICES
Get Your Bicycle, Bicycle Sundries

and Bicycle repairing done at J. T.
Waritz's.
For all Kinds of swings, churns,

butter workers, new Holland Mill
plates, address the Washing Machine
man or phone him. L. K. Birely, Mid-
dleburg.
Spring Wagon — W. H. Rodkey at

, Uniontown—will sell it at a reason-
able price.

2.1 Is I 4111M81184111=08.1

I FOR SALE .
Real good 84-acre Farm, 8-room
House with conveniences, a niceI 

 1

place to live, good outbuildings.
Priced with i/2 of this Years
crops and some machinery at

I$30,000.00. Shown on Saturday,
Sunday and eve. after 6 P. M.

C. L. GARTRELL

I 
PHONE: FIeldstone 6-7572

TANEYTOWN, MD.

I

Route #1,

isamissommoliummosamma

INSURED SAFETY

for your savings account.
START YOURS NOW!

AUGUSTA
Building and Loon Ann.

Westminster: Shopping Center
Baltimore: 420 N. Howard St.

Dundalk: 7 Center Place
Annapolis: 6 West Street

:••<,

' PITTSBURGH

RUBBERIZED

WALLHIDE
WALL PAINT

300
CUSTOM MIXED

MAESTRO COLORS
SPECIAL PRICE

As Low As

$4.98 Gal.

Taneytown Grain &
Supply Co'Phone PL 6-6666

PITTSBURGH
PLATE GLASS
COMPANY

TANEYTOWN ORGANIZATIONS
Taneytown Chamber of Commerce meets

on the 3rd Monday in each month at
the Taney Inn at 8:00 o'clock. Frank
Dunham, President; 1st Vice President,

• Merle Ohler; 2nd Vice President, Rob-
ert Zentz; Secretary, Donald Smith;
Treasurer, Murray M. Baumgardner;
Executive Committee, Merwyu C. Fuss
and Charles R. Arnold.

The Taneytown Vol. Fire Company meets
2nd Monday of each month in the
Firemen's Building from April thru
Sept. at 8:00 p. m. and October thru
March at 7:30 p. m.; President, John
Perry; Vice President, Howard Welty;
Secretary, J. Wendell Garber; Finan-
cial Secretary, Harry Dougherty, r.;
Treasurer, Stanley King; Trustees,
Birnie Staley, Norville Welty, Meredith
Gross, Charles Lookingbill and Ken-
neth Houck; Chief, Wilbur F. Miller, Jr.

The American Legion — Hesson-Snider
Post No. 120 meets third Thursday of
each month at 8:00 P. M. in the Legion
Home. All service men welcomed.
Commander, Paul Rodkey; Adjutant
Clarence Harner; Finance Officer, Stan-
ley King; Service Officer, Neal Powell.
You are eligible to belong to The
American Legion if you served honor-
ably in the Military Forces at any
time during one of these three periods:
April 6, 1917, to Nov. 11, 1918; or Dec.
7, 1941, to Sept. 2, 1845; or June 25,
1950, to July 27, 1953.

Monocacy Valley Memorial Post 6918, Har-
ney, Md., meets on 1st and 3rd Tues-
day of each month in the V.F.W. Hall,
Harney, Md. Commander, Roy B. Over-
holtzer: Adjutant, Raymond Clabaugh;
Quartermaster, Ralph Vaughn.

The Taneytown Junior Chamber of Com-
merce, Taneytown, Md., meets the
second Thursday of each month at
The Raft Restaurant. President, Dean
Nusbaum; First Vice President, Robert
Bowers; 2nd Vice President, John
Reever; Secretary, George Fream;
Treasurer, Dean Brown.

Hesson-Snider Unit 120, American Legion
Auxiliary Meets the first Thursday of
each month at 8 p. m., at the Post
Home. Pres., Bernice Rodkey; 1st Vice
Pres., Catherine Shank; 2nd Vice
Pres., Betty Jane Houck; Sec., Lois
Wetzel; Treasurer, Mae Long; His-
torian, Irene Unger; Sergeant at Arms,
Margaret Ritenour ;M Color Bearers,
Catherine Myers and Marie Ott; Chap-
lin, Regina Foreman.

Harney Volunteer Fire Company meets
2nd and 4th Monday of each month in
the Firemen's Building at 7:30 P. M.
President, Fred Spangler; Vice Presi-
dent, Wilbur Reifsnider; Secretary,
Melvin Amoss • Treasurer, Elwood
Strickhouser; Chief, David Hess, Sr.;
Trustees—Donald Hess, Chester Moose,
Walter Clingan.

All other Fraternities and organizations
are invited to use this directory for the
public informatibn it carries. Cost for
one year only $3.00.

Harris M. Frock
ri 8 - 7505 Westminster, Md.

Agent for
Virginia S. Griffin

Realtor
TE 3 - 1555 Reisterstown, Md.
NEW MIDWAY — New Stoneface
house on 1 acre of ground, 3 bed-
rooms, large living room, kitchen
and dining area, 2-car garage.

NEAR WESTMINSTER — 63 acre
farm with 10-room house, (5 bed-
rooms.)

New Listing — UNION BRIDGE —
2-Apt. Brick House, 4 garages.
Broadway & Whyte St. Nice invest-
ment property.

New Listing — 103 N. Main St. —
MANCHESTER — 5-room House
and bath. This is a nice small house.
Priced to sell.

CARROLL COUNTY—New Listing.
60-acre Dairy Farm, Balto. market,
8-room frame house with bath,
nice condition. Barn, machine shed,
2-car garage, concrete silo and
other outbuildings. Farm equipment
included: pickup truck, three trac-
tors, combine, baler, corn picker,
many other pieces of equipment;
plus 20 tested cows, one heifer,
200 chickens, many other extras.
Priced to go, $32,500.

FRIZELLBURG — Five-room house
and bath; frame and aluminum sid-
ing. Second floor can be expanded.
Real nice home in small community.

LET US LIST YOUR FARM.
WE NEED SMALL FARMS.

TI 8 - 7505
9-6-tf

WORLD'S
LARGEST
AUTO INSURANCE COMPANY

Call:
STATE FARM MUTUAL State Farm AgentAUTOMOBILE
INSURANCE COMPANY

756-6733
ARTHUR GARVIN, JR.

8-9-tf

NEW IDEAS FOR A NEW ERA

INSURANCE?

check 4V

NATIONWIDE
for new ideas!
• AUTO INSURANCE
O FIRE INSURANCE

O LIFE INSURANCE
O HOMEOWNERS

O EDUCATION

O MORTGAGE

O ACCIDENT & SICKNESS

O RETIREMENT

Nationwide has new ideas in
protection to fill any insur-
ance need at a cost you can
afford. Check the plan that
interests you and contact:

J. Alfred Heltebridle
Reliable Insurance Since 1938

Phone PLymouth 6-5141
TANEYTOWN, MD.

*"-•

ATION WIDE
5511055101 MUM INSAININCI COMPANY

NADONVIDI MUM 1151 IMMO( COMPANY

* INSVIIINCI COMPANY
nen Phu Celsolys

Plan now now for next winter's comfort
with S. 111 TEVIS 86 SON'S

new otli set`mi---varming plan
Right now is the best time of year
to make sure of your family's com-
plete heating comfort throughout
the next home heating season.
Look at all you get with our new
Housewarming Plan — yet pay_ no
morel

1. Choice of equipment service
plans— Choose the plan to fit your
needs, from low-cost efficiency
tune-up to complete coverage.

2. Easy payment plan —No more
big mid-winter fuel bills. At no ex-
tra cost to you, we divide your esti-

mated annual heating costs into
equal monthly payments.

3. Automatic,delivery — You don't
have to call us, or even be at home.
We deliver Gulf Solar Heat® "au-
tomatically" to make sure you'll al-
ways have an adequate supply.

4. Gulf Solar Heat -- The world's
finest heating oil, burns clean and
hot to give you more usable heat in
your home.

Special price now in effect on com-
plete heating equipment condition-
ing. Call us today.

S. H. TEVIS & SON
WESTMINSTER, MARYLAND PHONE 848-4433
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Corrair Monza Club Coupe

   OP".•
• ̀ X..  WO,

Who needs muscles?
Do you know how easy it is to take a corner
with a Corvair or park one? Turn this
newspaper sideways and it will give you a
pretty good idea. The wheel handles just
about that easily.
The Corvair's engine is in the rear, for

not only greater traction, but more balanced
weight distribution. And that's what makes
the steering so completely effortless.
The engine is air cooled, too. No radi-

ator. No water or antifreeze. No boiling
over or freezing up to worry about. It takes
the weather and the terrain as it comes.

TRADENTRIIVEL
TIME

AT YOUR CHEVROLET DEALER'S

9

So think about those trips to the beach
this summer, those bright sunny days and
balmy moonlit nights.
And besides, looking at it from a very

practical point of view, it's Trade 'N'
Travel time right now at your Chevrolet
dealer's. He's got some beautiful buys.
But you had better hurry before somebody

muscles in ahead of you. Spring's here.
Summer's coming fast. And with these sporty
good-looking Corvairs selling the way they
are, he who hesitates will want to kick
himself.

CHECK HIS TNT DEALS ON CHEVROLET, CHEVY II, CORVAIR AND CORVETTE

10 WRY CHEVROLET INC.
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND
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CORRESPONDENCE
latest Items of Local News Furnished
By Our Regular Staff of Writers
We desire correspondence to reach our

office on Wednesday, if at all possible. It

will be necessary, therefore, for most let-
ters to be mailed on Tuesday morning.

Letters mailed on Wednesday may not
reach us in time.

FRIZELLBURG

Services this Sunday morning at

the Church cf God, preaching at 9:00,
Rev. Fred Horner, pastor. Sunday
School following at 10:00, Mr. How-
ard Carr, superintendent. C. G. Y.
A. of the Church of God held their
Spring Social at the Community
Pond, Westminster; on Sunday after-
noon.

Services this Sunday morning at
Emmanuel (Baust) Lutheran Church,
worship at 9:30, Rev. J. H. August
Borleis, D. D. Pastor. Church School
at 10:30 A. M., Mr. Kenneth Lambert,
Supt. A guest teacher from Trinity
Lutheran Church, Taneytown, will
teach the Bible Class.

Mrs. Elizabeth Bachelor of Balti-
more, was a week-end guest of Mr.
and Mrs. Armistead Mason_

Mrs. Delmar Warehime and Mrs.
Walter Myers, Jr., attended the cov-
ered dish dinner sponsored by the
L. C. W. of Grace Lutheran Church,
Westminster, on Tuesday. The Rev.
Henry Einspruch of Salem Hebrew
Lutheran Mission of Baltimore, was
the guest speaker.

Mr. and Mrs. Phillip Crawmer and
Mrs. Sarah Hoover of Westminster,
were Friday evening dinner guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Scott Sullivan and
daughter, Lamore. The occasion was
the 22nd Wedding Anniversary of the
Crawmers'.

Mrs. Wm. Flickinger was very
much pleased with her sale on Sat-
urday. She wishes to thank Mr. and
Mrs. Wm. DeGroft for their kind-
ness in helping her through the Sale.
A friend in need is a friend indeed.
Mrs. Clifford L. Sullivan and son

of Westminster, Mr. and Mrs. Harry
I3erwager of Hanover, visited at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. John Berwager
and family on Sunday, Mrs. Cather-
ine Coxon of Baltimore was a week-
end guest in the same home.
Mr. and Mgs. Bernard Zimmerman,

Jr., and family of Frederick, visited
Mrs. Bessie Freet and Mrs. Grace
Myers, on Sunday afternoon.
Mr. and Mrs. Daniel Jenkins and

family, near New Windsor, were Sun-
day evening guests of Mr. and Mrs.
John Hyle and daughter, Denise.
The Pleasant Valley Boys -H Club

toured the farms of their Club
members, Sunday afternoon.
A capacity audience attended the

musical program held on Sunday eve-
ning in Emmanuel (Baust) Church.
The following program was given —
organ prelude—Mrs. Denton Wantz;
hymn, "Stand Up For Jesus;" scrip-
ture and prayer, Rev. Robert V.
Johnson; duet—Gail Crabbs and Deb-
bie Wiley, United Church of Christ,
Taneytown; Men's Chorus, St. Mat-
thew's Lutheran Church, Hanover,
Penna.; duet — Mr. Frank Dunham
and daughter, E. U. B. Church, Tan-
eytcwn; organ offertory—Miss Peg-
gy Fleagle; hymn—"Faith of Our
Fathers," .choir—Piney Creek Church
of The Brethren; piano duet—Mrs.
William F. Wiley and daughter; solo
— Dottie Martin, accompanied by
Miss Valerie Nusbaum, Wakefield
Church of God; Teen-Tones, Taney-
town High School, accompanied by
Miss Jeanne Willet; Mens Quartette,
accompanied by Mrs. Henry Reindol-
lar, Trinity Lutheran Church, Taney-
town; hymn—"What A Friend We
Have In Jesus." Benediction by Rev.
Johnson. Ushers were: Byron Baer,
James Myers, Kenneth Feeser, and
Calvin Bloom. Greeters were: Mrs.
Lewis Baer and Mrs. Ralph Koons.
Acolyte was Gene Gonder. The com-
mittee wishes to thank all who helped
in any way to make this program a
fine success.

Services in Emmanuel (Baust)
United Church of Christ parish hall"
next Sunday will include S. S. at 9:30
A. M., Church Worship at 10:30 A.
M. Special music during the Sunday
School, Worship will be a duet by gell, Taneytown R. 1; Mr. and Mrs.

Peggy Rodkey and Linda Van Fos- Luther Angell, Mrs. J. Walter Kump,

sen with J. Robert Waddell, superin- Mrs. Wade Weant and Evone and Mr.

tendent in charge. Choir rehearsal on 
and Mrs. Ralph Vaughn.

Thursday at 8:00 P. Mi; confirmation
class on Friday evening; Aid meeting
on Tuesday, May 7 in the parish
house. Consistory on Tuesday, May
7th at 8:00 P. M. in the Pastor's
study; mother- daughter banquet on
Wednesday, May 8th at 6:30 P. M.
in the Kingsdale Fire Hall.
The Carroll County Laymen's Din-

ner of the United Church of Christ
was held on Thursday evening in the
fellowship hall of St. Mary's, Silver
Run, Rev. Christopher Noss, pastor.
Those attending from Emmanuel
(Baust) were: Rev. Robert V. John-
son, Donald Van Fossen, Wm. Maus,
Denton Wantz, Wilbur Long, Ralph
Dutterer, Monroe Simpson, Howard
Maus, Raymond Baker, Monroe
Wentz, Norman Graham, Stoner
Fleagle, Chas. Little, Martin Rodkey
and Noah Warehime.

Mrs. Margaret Myers and Mrs.
Walter Senft visited on Thursday
with Mrs. Allen Morelock.
Sunday evening visitors at the

home of Mr. and Mrs. W. Glenn
Haines and family were: Mr. William Sunday evening, May 5, at 8 P. M.

B. Yingling, Westminster; Mr. and will be the annual Mission Study pre-

Mrs. Rauland Roop and family of sented by the Lutheran Church WO-

near New Windsor. The occasion men at the Keysville Lutheran

was the celebration of the birthdays Church. Mrs. Norval Shoemaker of

of Mr. Haines and Mr. Roop. Red Lion, Pa., will present slides

Those from the "Burg" who at about Hong Kong and the Union

tended a surprise Bridal Shower for Bridge Lutheran Parish Men's

Miss Patsy Lambert at the home of Chorus will sing. Refreshments will

Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Zimmerman, be served by the Fellowship Commit-

Silver Run, on Saturday evening tee. It should be a most interesting

were: Mrs. Charlotte Shorb, Mrs. meeting, and ..the public is cordially

Bessie Freet, Mrs. Walter Myers, Jr., invited •to attend. LCW members

and Mrs. Walter Myers, Sr. please note:, there will he no monthly

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Coe and meeting on Monday the Gth. Any

family visited •at the home of Mr. announcements will be made Sunday

and Mrs. Lester Zeigler and family,

near Littlestown; Sunday afternoon. Sympathy is extended to the fam-

The Never Weary Class of Emmen- Hy of Mrs. Raymond (Elizabeth)

uel (Baust) Lutheran Church will Myers upon her death last lAre.dnes-

meet at the home of Mr. and Mrs. day evening. Burial took place in the

Norman Welk on Tuesday evening, Keysville L nion Cemetery on Sunday

Callers Sunday afternoon on Mr.
and Mrs. Samuel Valentine were Mr.
Ed Bittle, Mrs. George Hair, Mr. and
Mrs. Guy Orbaugh, Batlimore, and
Mr. and Mrs. Edgar Aulthouse, Get-
tysburg, Pa.
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Spangler, Bobby

and Debbie, and Mr. and Mrs. Dalbert
Spangler motored Sunday afternoon
to the upper part of Adams County
viewing the apple blossoms.
Mr. and Mrs. Edward Cluck, son

Barry, Littlestown, R. 2, Pa., visited
Sunday afternoon with Mrs. Esther
Fuss. Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Valen-
tine were supper guests in the same
home.
Mr. and Mrs. Nevin Ridinger were

Sunday supper guests with Mr. and
Mrs. Stuart Dom.
Monday evening visitors of Mr. and

Mrs. Clyde Frock were Mr. and Mrs.
Samuel Valentine.

KEYSVILLE-DETOUR

May 7th. The United Lutheran afternoon. Elizabeth was a fine per-

Church Women will meet on Wednes- son who was well liked by everyone

day evening, May 8th at the home of and will be sorely missed by all.

Mrs. Sterling Zimmerman, Westmin- Flower Committee for May for

ster. Keysville Lutheran Church will be

o  Mrs. Rachel Bostian, Chairman; Mrs.

HARNEY Mervin Conover, Mrs. Beatrice De-
Berry, Miss Frances DeBerry, and

Catechetical Class Saturday, May 4, Mrs. Emma Devilbiss.

at 1:30 at St. Paul's Lutheran Church. 
Happy first anniversary to Mr. and

Services Sunday at St. Paul's Luth- Mrs. Richard Wilhide of Forest and

eran Church. Worship at 9:00, Sun- 
Stream Club Road on May 6th, and

day School at 10:00. Pastor, Rev. very Happy Birthday Wishes to Mrs.

John Fry. Wm. E. Ritter of Taneytown, for her

Reminder of the annual Mother- 90th birthday on May 8th.

Daughter Banquet Wednesday, May Homemaker's Open House at the

8, at 6:30 at the Parish Hall. Anyone Ag C
enter on Thursday the 9th, from

wishing to attend please contact Mrs. 10:00 A. M. to 3:00 P. M. and the

Wesley Mummert, Mrs. George Cie- Embassy Tour on Saturday the 4th.

baugh or Mrs. George Marshall no Don't forget the Bake Sale on May

later than Sunday, May 5. 1 10 from 6-9 P. M. in the Union

Wednesday evening visitors with Bridge, which will be held by the

Mr. and Mrs. Delbert- Spangler were Terra Rubra Girls' 4-H Club.

Mr. and Mrs. Edgar DeGroft, Littles- Sorry to hear Mr. Jacob Myerly of

town, Pa. 1 Detour is back in the hospital in

Mrs. Nevin Ridinger spent Thurs- Frederick. I understand he has double

day afternoon with Mrs. Russell Pneumonia. Do hope he will soon be

Wentz, Jr. Mr. and Mrs. Ridinger feeling better again.

were supper guests with Mr. and Mrs. Mr. and Mrs. Carroll Wilhide of

Wantz in the evening. Detour visited last Thursday with

Recent visitors with Mr. and Mrs. Mr. and Mrs. Ru
ssell Durboraw and

Luther Fox were Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Durboraw of

LeGore. Gettysburg, Penna.; Mrs. M e 1 v in

Mr. Ernest Fream, Greenville, vis- Durboraw is a recent appendectomy

ited his mother, Mrs. Effie Fream, patient. 6 ,

Thursday evening. , Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Weishaar and

Mrs. Morris Haines and Tommy, Randy and Mr. and Mrs. James

Walnut Grove, visited Thursday af- Weishaar and Bobby of Detour, a-

ternoon with Mr. and Mrs. Ballard long with Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Cling-

Smith. an of Thurmont, visited Sunday eve-

Visitors during the week with Mr. ning with Mr. and Mrs. Paul Wild-

and Mrs. Theodore Ridinger, Richard isan and new baby son of Reisters-

and Ronald, were Miss Judy Strick- town.
houser, Miss Linda Hess, Littlestown . Next week the first-graders-to-be

R. 1, Pa.; Mrs. Mary Clutz, Mr. and will be visiting school at Elmer Wolfe

Mrs. Ralph Vaughn, Mr. and Mrs. in Union Bridge. Our Bruce will go

Russell Wentz, Jr.
' 

Mr. Harry Spran- on Monday to visit in Mrs. Arnold's

kle, Mrs. Clarence Baker, Mrs. Luther room. This. is a fine practice for it

Fox, Mrs. George Clingan and Stevie, gives the hildren a chance to see

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Clingan and what actually goes on before they.

Judy, Mrs. Harvey Wantz, Mr. and start next Fall. On Tuesday evening,

Mrs. Delbert Spangler and Mr. and May 7, at 7:30 P. M. there will be an

Mrs. John Ridinger and Patty. 1 Orientation Meeting for the parents

Mr. Harry Angell returned home of these first graders at the school.

Saturday from the Annie Warner Did you all remember to phange

Hospital and is improving slowly, your clocks last Saturday evening

Mrs. Anna Kiser spent Saturday before you went •to bed? I can re-

and Sunday with Mrs. Leona Krebs, member at least two times that I for-
Irish-town, Pa. got it myself but with Bill having to
Mr. and Mrs. Nevin Ridinger were change the clocks at the Telephone

supper guests Saturday with Mr. and Office at midnight this year, ours
Mrs. George Bower. : were remembered to.
Saturday evening visitors with Mr.

a 
Speaking of time changes, the time

-and Mrs. Ballard Smith and Linda also changes for the services at
were Mr. and Mrs. Theodore Simp- Keysville Lutheran Church on the
son, Linda and Brenda, Taneytown. 5th. Church Service will be held at

Callers over the week-end with Mr. 9:30 A. M. and Sunday School at
and Mrs. Charles Bridinger were Miss 10:45 A. M.
Elaine Bridinger, Littlestown, Pa.; Miss Stella Scott of Laurel was a
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Oyler, Gettysburg, week-end visitor with her niece and
Pa.; Mr. and Mrs. Elmer LeGore, Mr. family, Mr. and Mrs. Cecil (Bob)
and Mrs. Robert Strickhouser, Robert Priest and Angie of Forest and
Reifsnider, Dennis Overholtzer, Mr.
and Mrs. Clyde Frock and Mr. and 

Stream Club Road.

Mrs. Floyd 
Strickhouser.Mr. and Mrs. Richard Wilhide, near

Mrs. Mary Clutz visited at the ' 
.Detour, were Sunday afternoon vis-

home of John Waybright and son, 
itors with Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Dol-

Fred, Sunday. Other visitors were 
ly of Fai

'
rfield
'

Penna.

Mrs. Catherine Hall and son, Terry.. mi m
The news just reached me that

Sunday dinner and supper guests 
ss acie Forney of Keysville,

of Mr. and Mrs. Reynold Ridinger 
died Tuesday morning, April 30,

and Mr. and Mrs. Ray Slaybaugh and 
at the home of Mr. and Mrs. Charles

daughter were Mr. and Mrs. George 
rawner on Baumgardner Rd. In the

Rebert, Littelstown, Pa. 
morning I had taken the Altar flow-

Sunday visitors at the home of Mr 
ers to her and been told that she had

and Mrs. David Yealy were Mr. and. 
become a "terminal case" and no

Mrs. John Staub, Littlestown, Pa.; 
longer knew anyone but Mrs. Brawn-

Mrs. Esther Hahn and Miss Thelm 
er who has been caring for her the

Hahn, Taneytown. 
past seven weeks. Bill and I did not

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Shildt were 
know Macie well but we have heard

Sunday dinner guests with Mr. and 
so much about her and she was a

Mrs. Lloyd Bowers and family and 
sort of " institution" around here, so

sister, Mrs. Virgie Bowers, Littles- 
'her loss will be felt by many. We'd

town R. 1, Pa. Other guests at the 
like to extend our sympathy to the

Bowers' home were Mrs. Mary Bow- 
Brawners, Mace's sister and family

ers, daughter, Linda, and boyfriend and to all her many friends who loved

James Storey, Westminster, R. 7. 
her.

Sunday afternoon visitors with Mr. 
Miss Helen Fossett, who makes

and Mrs. Marlin Six, Barry, Brett and 
her home with the Maynard Ausher-

Belinda were Mrs. Luther Fox and 
man family of Forest and Stream

Mrs. Edna Snider. 
Club Road, represented the Terra

Mr. and Mrs. George Valentine, Rubra
 Girls' 4-H Club at the "Queen

Littlestown R. 2, Pa., called on their 
for a Night" dance at the Ag Center

parents, Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Val- 
sponsored by the Taneytown 4-H

Mr. and Mrs. Franklin Koontz and 

Club.
A Copper Party was held Sundayentine, Sunday afternoon.

family, Bonneauville, Pa., visited Sun- afternoon at the home of Mrs. James

day morning with Mrs. Effie Fream Weishaar of Detour.

and Mr. and Mrs. Howard Kump. Mrs. Richard Wilhide, Miss Jane

Visitors Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. Wilhide and Miss Becky Houck of

Harry Angell and Mrs. Webster Keit- near Detour were among the ' many

er were Mr. John Radle and family, who attended
 the annual Eisteddfod

Harrisburg, Pa.; Mrs. Doris Hoffman, Friday 
evening in Alumni Hall at

New Cumberland; Mr. and Mrs. Ben Western Maryland College in West-

Hess, Mrs. Elizabeth Downes, Mr. minster.

Smith Downes, Carlisle, Pa.; Mr. and Mrs. Maynard Ausherman near

Mrs. Lloyd Brantner, daughters, Jan- Detour visited Monday with Mr. and

ette and Barbara, Gettysburg, Pa.; Mrs. Noah Warehime of Mayberry.

Mrs. Austa Perrine, Mr. Daniel Len- Dr. J. Frank Fife was the guest

ker, Millersburg, Pa.; Mr. Albert An- speaker at Keysville Lutheran
Church on Sunday and the choir sang
a lovely anthem, "Teach Me To
Pray."
Last Tuesday on their return from

a visit to White Hall, Mrs. Carroll
and Mrs. Richard Wilhide of Detour,
also visited with friends, Mr. and
Mrs. Edgar Currens of Hampstead.
Mr. and Mrs. Edward Coshun of

Detour, drove to Annapolis on Sun-
day to visit a friend in the hospital
and attend an Antique Show. Im-
agine their distress to find their
friend, Mr. Bernard Hoff, had died on
Saturday evening. Our sympathy is
with them, also upon the loss of a
very dear friend.
Mr. and Mrs. Hugh Engel of Fred-

erick, were week-end visitors with

her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Wil-
hide of Keysville-Taneytown Rd. Sun-
day evening visitors in this same
home were Mr. and Mrs. Gregg Kiser

of Keysville Rd. and Mr. and Mrs.
Richard Wilhide of Detour.
Sunday dinner guests with the

Maynard Ausherman family near De-
tour were their son and family, Mr.
and Mrs. Lamar Ausherman, Ricky
and Teresa of Taneytown and eve-

Greetings to you: fling visitors were Mr. and Mrs. Gil-
more Ausherman and Terry of Fred-
erick, as well as Mr. Carlton Fleming
and son.
A Birthday Party was held at the

William Fleharty home on Sunday
afternoon for their daughter Ellen
who was 7 on the 25th. There were
ten guests present and ' everyone
seemed to have a good time. 

,

Mrs. Richard Wilhide visited last
Friday with her parents, Mr. and
tIrs. Daniel Seibert of Clear Spring,

Md. On ii&• return home, she trisitee
xith Clay Halm at the Western Md.
Hospital in Hagerstown. She was
glad to.find him in good spirits, hap-
py to have visitors, and just a srnal
drainage yet from his incision. Clay
is another of those who so appreci-
ates cards.
Sunday dinner guests with Mr. aw,'

Mrs. Charles Stonesifer and family

of Keysville were: Mr. and Mrs. Sam-
uel Donely, Jr., and children from
Shephenistown, W. Va. Afternoon
visitors were: Mr. and Mrs. Russell
Stonesifer and son, Fred of Keysville,
Mr. and Mrs. Johnny Watkins of Em-
mitsburg and Mr. and Mrs. Clarence
Stonesifer of Keysville visited in the
evening.

Mrs. Chas. Stonesifer and Mrs.
Harold Thomas were among those at-
tending the "Party Demonstrations"
given by the Southern States in Tan-
eytown on Monday evening.
Saturday overight guests with Mr.

and Mrs. Carroll Dougherty of De-
tour, were their son, Larry and his
roomate, Bob Dryden of Md. Univer-
sity, as well as the Misses Beeky
Dryden and Dianne Disque of Wil-
mington, Del. They were joined by
Dr. J. Frank Fife for lunch on Sun-
day, after the service at Keysville
Lutheran Church.

—Dharlys Fleharty

ROCKY RIDGE

Francis E. Springer of Rocky
Ridge, son of Mrs. Anna Springer
and the late Robert springer, is one
of four Frederick County students to
be honored as having received cer-
tificate awarded for an academic av-
erage of 3.5 or above out of a pos-
sible 4.0 point. Lawrence A. Dorsey
of Woodsboro, also appeared on the
Dean's list.
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Long and

daughter of this place were guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Keepers on Sun-
day, April 14. Little Pamela Long
celebrated her second birthday on
last Sunday.
The temperature was down to 32

degrees on the 25th of April.
Mr. and Mrs. Harvey M. Pittenger,

Sr., and Mrs. Charles H. Setherly
spent Friday with Mrs. Roland D.
Wilson and family of Taneytown.
Mr. and Mrs. Ray Wachter and

children, Shirley and Eugene of Key-
mar, Md., Mr. and Mrs. Donald Ey-
ler and son, James, of Walkersville,
Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Bowman and son
James, and Mr. and Mrs. Donald
Mackley and son, Donnie, of this
place spent Sunday at this place
with relatives.
Mr. Harvey M. Pittenger, Sr., vis-

ited Mr. and Mrs. Grier Keilholtz of
Taneytown, recently.
Mr. and Mrs. Roland D. Wilson

and children of TaneytOwn and Mr.
and Mrs. John N. CaVell and sons,
Dennis, Christopher and Norman and
Miss Judy Ann Pittenger of. Boyds,
spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. Har-
vey M. Pittenger, Sr., and Mr. and
Mrs. Charles H. Setherly and family.
Mr. and Mrs. Donald Myers and

sons, Vincent and Tony, of near Em-
mitsburg, spent one day visiting
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs.
James R. Sayler and family.

FAIRVIEW

Oh, what a glorious rain we are
getting, which stfirted late Monday
afternoon. In looking out the window
we can see our neighbors garden
which has shot up over night, which
lets us know this rain is sinking in.

Mrs. Jennie Frizzell and grand-
daughters, Hazel and Shirley, visited
with the former's brother and wife,
Mr. and Mrs. Grant Baker.
Mr. and Mrs. Russell Frock of

York, Pa., Mr. and Mrs. Donald Carl
of Mayberry, Mrs. Levi Frock, Mrs.
Bernice Frock and son, Terry, vis-
ited James Frock in the Johns Hop-
kins Hospital on Sunday. We found
Jimmie in good spirits considering
having three operations in the past
three weeks. Anyone wishing to send
Jimmie a card this is his address:
James William Frock, Halsted floor
3, room 319, Johns Hopkins Hospital,
Baltimore, Md. He has been there for
the past five weeks and will be there
for some time to come. He appre-
ciates all the mail he gets.
Mr. and Mrs. Chas. Carbaugh and

family moved on Saturday from
Washington, D. C., to the home of his
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Levine Car-
haugh of this place until -he can find
something suitable for his family.

Mrs. John Shorb called on Mr. and
Mrs. Grant Baker and daughter,

Mabel Smith, on Monday.
Donald Carl and sons, David and

Daniel spent Monday evening in the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Charles Frock

and family. ,
Mr. and Mrs. Levi Frock called on

Mr. and Mrs. Grant Baker on Wed-

nesday evening. They also visited in

the home of Mr. and Mrs. Noah
Babylon, near Baust Church on Sat-

urday evening.
Have You?

Have you lifted anybody
from the wayside dust today,

As you went about your business
in the old familiar way?

Have you brightened anybody
with the sunshine of your smile,

As you trod your path of duty
in the old familiar style?

Have you talked to anybody
through your sunny hours of life,

Of the happiness of labor
and the sweetness after strife?

The Selby and Rowe Reunion
which had been held at Memorial
Park, Taneytown, the past several
years was voted to be held at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Franklin
Baker on the old Bauchman Valley
Road, the last Sunday in July. As of
now the time and place of this Re-
union has been changed to the last
Sunday in May, which will be May
26, at the Memorial Park at Taney-
town. Please keep this time and
place in mind and let us make this
the biggest and best Reunion ever.
Hope to see all kin folk then.
Watch your step. Whether we will

or not, we cannot journey without
leaving foot prints, and others will
follow where we go because we have
marked the way.

HOOPER'S DELIGHT

Bethel Methodist Church, Sam's
Creek, morning worship at 9:1S
X. M., Sunday School at 10.00
A. M. Everyone is welcome to attend.
Those who visited at the home of

VII-. Charles Snyder and brother,
Ross, during the week were: Mr. and
Mrs. H. Snyder, Mr. and Mrs. Frank
Snyder and son, Frankie, Mrs. Mary

I Crabbs, Mrs. Allen Stansbury and
daughter Cherrie; Mrs. H. 0. Farver,
Mrs. Willard Barber and son Ricky,
Mr. Tom Lescleet and Kelly Snyder.
Mr. and Mrs. Willard Barber, son

Ricky and Mr. and Mrs. H. '0. Far-
ver enjoyed a trip up to Sheppard
and Myers' Dam on Sunday evening.

Miss Faye Jean Farver has been
housed up with rpluersy, hope she
soon recovers and gets back to
school.

Mrs. L. C. Stitely has been laid up
with a bad cold, wish her a quick re-
covery.
Mr. and Mrs. Willard Barber and

son Ricky called on Miss May Farver
on Sunday evening.
We are all so glad to get this

wonderful rain which was needed
very badly. I hope it continues for a
few days.

Those who visited the Barber and
the Farvers' on Sunday and during
the week were: Mr. and Mrs. James
Boone, Mr. and Mrs. Skippy Cooney
and sons, Mr. and Mrs. Fred Farver
and sons, Mr. and Mrs. L. Testman,
Mr. and Mrs. J. Crumpacker and
family.

Mrs. Willard Barber and son, and
Mrs. H. 0. Farver called on Mr. and
Mrs. Edgar Taylor and family last
Saturday.

Sorry to hear of the death of Mrs.
George Leister who passed away on
Monday morning. The family has our
deepest sympathy.
Sorry to hear Mrs. "Dick" Garner

is back in Maryland General Hospit-
al, also Mr. Allen Hobbs at Univer-
sity Hospital, Baltimore, we wish
them a speedy recovery.

Miss Vicki Lynn Farver was one of
the parties from Liberty Elementary
School to witness the ball game at
the Baltimore Stadium on Saturday
and enjoyed every minute of it.

Skippy — a black and white Cock-
er Spaniel dog has disappeared from
his home last Sunday night. He is a
male, has a blind right eye and a
stubby tail. Anyone knowing of his
whereabouts can contact Willard
Barber on the Dr. Stitley Rd. They
would be very pleased to have him
home.

DIED

MISS MACIE E. FORNEY

Miss Made Elizabeth Forney, 77,
died Tuesday morning at the home
of Mr. and Mrs: Charles Brawner,
Taneytown R.D. 2, where she resided.
She was the daughter of the late

James and Ellen Stambaugh Forney.
She is survived by a sister, Mrs.
Russell Moser, Littlestown R.D. 1.
She was a'member of Keysville Luth-
eran Church and the WCTU.

Funeral services will be held today
(Thursday) at 2 P. M. at the C. 0.
Fuss and Son Funeral Home, Taney-
town. The Rev. Howard W. Miller
will officiate. Burial will be in Keys-
ville Cemetery.

CONNIE F. KNOX

Connie Frances Knox, aged four
months, 29 days, daughter of John
V. and Mary Hahn Knox, RFD 2,
Taneytown, died Wednesday morning
at Johns Hopkins Hospital, Baltimore.
- In addition to her parents, she is
survived by her paternal grandpar-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Knox, and
maternal grandparents, Mr. and Mrs.
Jacob Hahn.
The body is at the C. 0. Fuss Fu-

neral Home, Taneytown, were friends
may call Friday evening. Services
will be held at St. Joseph's Catholic
Church, Taneytown, Saturday at
11:30 A. M., Rev. Francis P. Wag-1
ner officiating. Interment in church
cemetery.

MRS. RAYMOND D. MYERS

Mrs. Catherine Elizabeth Myers,
45, wife of Raymond D. Myers, De-
tour, died Wednesday evening, April
24, 1963, at Frederick Memorial Hos-
pital.
Mrs. Myers was a daughter of John

L. and Jessie Kershaw Smith, Liber-
tytown. She was a member of Keys-
ville Lutheran Church and the United
Lutheran Church Women and was a
teacher in the church school. In ad-
dition to her husband and parents,
she is survived by a son, Wayne,
Hanover, Pa.; a grandson, three sis-
ters and five brothers.

Funeral services were held at the
Creager Funeral Home, Thurmont, on
Sunday at 2 P. M. with the Rev. Ed-
ward H. Fisher officiating. Burial
was in Keysville Cemetery.

MRS. EDGAR D. RIPLEY

Mrs. Fannie S. Ripley, 66, McKin-
stry Mill Road, New Windsor R.D.
2, wife of Edgar D. Ripley, died at
4 P. M. Wednesday, April 24, 1963,
at the home of her son, Carroll E.
Ripley, near Winfield.
Mrs: Ripley was born in Virginia,

a daughter of the late George and
Ida Saville. In addition to her hus-
band and her son, she is survived by
two other sons, Ralph S., New Wind-
sor R.D. 2, and Allen B. Ripley,
Taneytown; two brothers and two
sisters, S. R. Saville, Roanoke, Va.;
Fran Saville and Mrs. Mattie Deisher,
Eagle Rock, Va., and Mrs. Mollie
Rauch, Covington, Va., and three
grandchildren.

Funeral services were held at the
Waltz Funeral Home, Winfield, Sat-
urday at 11 A. M. The Rev. W.
Daniel Rich, pastor of Linganore
Methodist Church, officiated. Burial
was in Linganore Cemetery.

MARK TEETER
Funeral services for Mark Teeter,

three-year-old son of Dr. and Mrs.
James Teeter, Waynesboro, Pa., were
held at the residence Tuesday after-
noon, followed by graveside services
at Pipe Creek Cemetery, near New
Windsor. The child was killed Satur-
day when an automobile struck the
tricycle he was riding in front of hi:
home. Dr. and Mrs. Teeter formerly
lived in Taneytown. Survivors include
his parents and three brothers, Tim-
othy, Paul and Jonathan.

CARD OF THANKS

We wish to/ extend sincere thanks
and appreciation to our neighbors,
relatives and friends for their many
acts of kindness shown us after the
death of our husband and father; for
cards, prayers, floral tributes and
expressions of sympathy. Again,
ninny thanks.

MARY FLICKINGER
AND FAMILY.

COMMUNITY LOCALS
(continued from first page)

Mrs. Flora Brown spent the week-
end with her sister-in-law, Mrs. Annie
Heltibridle, and Mr. and Mrs. Charles
Rabenstine, Littlestown, Pa.

Mr. Arthur Slick visited on Monday
with his granddaughter, Jean Slick,
at York Hospital, York, Pa.

Harry LeGore and wife of North
Baltimore, Ohio, spent the past week-
end with relatives in this community.

Mr. Kenneth M. Trayer of Balti-
more visited briefly on Saturday with
his cousins, Mr. and Mrs. Elmer D.
Ohler.

CARD OF THANKS

I wish to express my sincere thanks
to my friends and neighbors for the
many acts of kindness shown since
the fire at my house; to those who
prepared food and brought it in and
to those who asked us out to meals;
to those who came in and helped us
clean and paint my house; to those
who did my washing and ironing;
to Harney, Gettysburg, "Taneytown
and Barlow Fire Companies. I es-
pecially want to thank Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Baker for calling the fire
alarm. All these many acts of kind-
ness were so greatly appreciated.
Again thanks to all who helped in
any way.

MRS. THELMA C. YINGLING
AND CHILDREN, DANIEL,
DONALD AND DONNA.

Taneytown Fire Co.
Taneytown, Md.
To all V. F.:

Just a note of appreciation for as-
sisting us on our fire on Thursday.
Without your help and speed our
home most certainly would have been
extensively damaged.
May we again say many thanks

and you certainly are to be commend-
ed for your speed in answering our
alarm.

JEAN and HARRY HOHMAN

SURPRISE BIRTHDAY PARTY

A surprise birthday party was
held at the home of Mr. and Mrs.
David Forney of Copperville, on Sun-
day, April 28th, in honor of Mr. For-
ney's 69th birthday. Those attending
were: Mr. and Mrs. David Forney,
Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Bollinger, Tre-
vanion; Mr. and Mrs. Robert Andres,
daughter, Joan, son, Harry, of Gettys-
burg, Pa.; Mr. and Mrs. William For-
ney, sons David, Melvin, Phillip and
Timmy, of Hopewell Pa.; Mr. Roland
Forney, daughter, Karen, of Union
Bridge, Md.; Mr. and Mrs. Carroll
Forney, daughter, Genevie, of Tan-
eytown; Mr. and Mrs. Paul Stauffer
and son, Carroll of Otterdale; Mr.
and Mrs. Kenneth Forney, -daughter,
Sue; son, Tommy, of Taneytown; Mr.
and Mrs. Glenn Wantz and daughter,
Cathy, son, Kevin, of Trevanion; Mrs.
Martha Winter, Mr. and Mrs. Harold
Winter and son Barry, all of York,
Pa.
Mr. Forney received many nice and

useful gifts which were very much
appreciated. In departing they all
wished Mr. Forney many more happy
birthdays.

MAIL SERVICE TO BE CUT,
UNLESS - - !

Postmaster General Day warned
congress to expect a sharp cutback in
mail service if an economy-minded
House cut of 92 million dollars in
postal appropriations for the coming
year is not rescinded. He told a Sen-
ate subcommittee that unless the a-
mount is restored - -

All Saturday mail deliveries may
be suspended;
There might be no deliveries to
new homes and office buildings;
Tenants of the vast number of
new "high-rise" buildings mtght
have to go to the post office to
pick up their mail; and
Parcel post service might be drop-
ped completely.

CARROLL COUNTY STUDENTS
HONORED

College Park, Md.—More than 577
University of Maryland students will
receive certificates of academic excel-
lence for high scholarship last
semester.

Certificates will be awarded to
those students who achieved an aca-
demic average of 3.5, or above, out
of a possible 4.0 points, for the last
semester. The names of these stu-
dents appear on the "Dean's List."
Of the 577 students to be honored,

five are from Carroll County. Re-
ceiving certificates are: John G. Lieb,
Engineering, Keymar; Daniel L.
Thomas, Engineering, Manchester;
Linda J. Graf, Agriculture, Mt. Airy;
James R. Eyler, Arts and Sciences,
Westminster, and Ralph G. Mullinix,
Agriculture, Westminster.

WITH OUR ARMED FORCES

U. S. FORCES, GERM ANY
(AIITNC) — Army PFC Carroll B.
Garland, son of Mr. and Mrs. Simon
L. Garland, Taneytown, Md., recent-
ly was assigned to the 18th Artillery
in Germany.

Garland, a mechanic in Service
Battery of the artillery's 3d Howit-
zer Battalion, entered the Army in
December 1961 and completed basic
training at Fort Gordon, Ga.
The 22-year-old soldier attended

Charles Carroll High School.

USS Franklin D. Roosevelt (FR
TNC) — Wayne A. Fair, shipfitter
third class, USN, son of Mr. and Mrs.
Wilbert L. Fair of Route 2, Taney-
town, is serving aboard the attack
aircraft carrier USS Franklin D.
Roosevelt, which returned to May-
port, Fla., April 22, after spending
seven months in the Mediterranean.
The Roosevelt was part of the Sixth

Fleet, America's major element of
seapower in the European area. Dur-
ing the cruise, the carrier, visited
Rhodes, Athens, Istanbul, Genoa, Li-
vorno, Naples, Cannes and Barcelona.
The Roosevelt is scheduled to spend

30 days in Mayport to enable the
crew to take leave.
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SPECIAL NOTICES

CARPETS clean easier with the
Blue Lustre Electric Shampooer only
$1 per day. Reindollar Bros. & Co.

FOR SALE — 1 Boy's White Sport
Coat, size 16; like new. Call after
5 P. M. Mrs. Thelma Reif snider,
Commerce St., Taneytown, Md.

5-2-2t

ANNUAL LAWN FESTIVAL —
Saturday, August 3, 1963. Grace
United Church of Christ, Keysville.

5-2-2t

REMEMBER MOTHER on HER
day, May 12th, with a gift from The
Taneytown Pharmacy. We have a
complete line of leading Cosmetics,
Perfumes, Spray Colognes, Bath
Powders, etc.; fresh shipment of
Whitman's and Schrafft's Box Choco-
lates; Nylon hose, Costume Jewelry,
Mother's Day Cards, etc. Free gift
wrapping and S&H Green Stamps.
Taneytown Pharmacy. 5-2-2t

The Mother's Day Bulletin "in mem-
ory and in honor" of our mothers is
being sponsored by the Graceful
Workers Sunday School Class. Those
interested in listing their mother's
name please contact one of the fol-
lowing: Mildred Anders, Catherine
Clingan, Pauline Koons or Irene
Hesson.

FOR SALE — Sacrifice, beautiful
156-acre level dairy farm, 2% miles
from heart of beautiful Taneytown,
Md. Five churches, 2 banks, stores,
fire department, self-service laundry,
doctors; school bus at lane. Loads of
road frontage. Only about 4 acres
wooded. Shipping milk to Sealtest.
Large dairy barn, new loafing barn,
wagon sheds, corn houses, garages,
meat houses, chicken houses, trench
silo, other buildings; all metal roofs;
8-room brick house, attic and base-
ment, small brick tenant house. Two
wells and pumps, one new drilled one.

Call: NO. 6-1899, by appointment
only.

FOUND — Brown Puppy with
black face. Phone: PL. 6-6552.

FOR SALE — Duroc spring pigs,
either sex; Duroc service boar; also
Guernsey heifer calves. J. Herbert
Frantz, Waynesboro R. 4, Pa.

WILL KEEP children in my home.
Mrs. Gene Spangler, Harney, Md.
Phone PL. 6-6584.

FOR RENT — Pasture for heifers.
Apply Robert E. Bankard.

LIKE GOOD BEEF? — Special
this week-end, CHOICE steaks, 79C
lb.; Chuck roast, 490 & 550 lb.;
Soup beef, 29q lb.; Bacon, sliced, 3 lb.,
$1.00; 50-lb potatoes, 990. Friday,
Saturday and Sunday only. Center
Meat Mkt.

I HAVE FOR SALE a large selec-
tion of nice Building Lots at edge
of Taneytown. Many with city water
available. R. L. Zentz, Broker, Tan-
eytown. PL. 6-5301. 5-2-tf

FOR SALE — Eleven pigs, $7 a
piece. Phone: PL. 6-6386.

CHILDREN'S GYM SETS-814.95
up. Reindollar Bros. & Co.

GARDEN PLANTS and flower
plants; fine stock, reasonable prices.
Reindollar Bros. and Co. 5-2-3t

FOR SALE — Auto Crib-Car seat
combination, like new. Phone: PL.
6-6459. 4-25-2t

FOR SALE — 1 white evening
gown and 1 blue evening gown, size
11; each worn one time. Call PL.
6-6307 after 4 o'clock. 4-25-2t

WILL KEEP children while moth-
er works. Apply 65 West Baltimore
St., Taneytown, Md. 4-25-2t

FOR SALE — Ferguson Farm
Tractor, A-1 condition. Mrs. Mary
Butler, W. Balto. St. 4-25-3t

FOR SALE — Small Hotpoint Re-
frigerator in good condition, priced
cheap. Phone: 756-6948. 4-25-2t

FOR SALE — Shrubbery, flowers
of different kinds from now on. Sell
cheap. Going out of business. Mrs.
Bessie Eckard, near Pipe Creek Park.

HELP WANTED — Office in Tan-
eytown area needs quiet, mature lady
over 40 with past experience in typ-
ing, correspondence, good at figures,
willingness to learn under patient
trainer and accept responsibility. 4
hours or less, 5 mornings a week,
could develop to full time if desired.
Top pay upon completion of training.
Reply in own handwriting giving
background details to Box 451-S, c/o
The Carroll Record. Replies held in
strict confidence.

WANTED — Employment for %-
day weekly every Friday — Light
Housework. Write to Box 451-M,
Taneytown, Md. 4-18-3t

CLOSING OUT SALE — 20% off
most items while they last. C. G.
Bowers Grocery, Taneytown, Md.

4-25-2t

WANTED — Salesmen and Route
Supervisor  five and six day week

salary equated to performance
with no maximum limit   apply
in person. — Baumgardner's Bakery,
Taneytown, Md. 4-25-ti

PLANTS FOR SALE — Ageratum,
Aster, Alyssum, Carnation, Coleus,
Dahlia, Dianthus, Marigolds, Petunia,
Pansy, Phlox, Snagdragon, Stocks,
Sage, Verbenia and Zinnia; also Cab-
bage, Peppers, Hybrid Tomato in jiffy
pots and flats, and Canning Tomato.
Twin Lot Gardens, 1/4 mile East of
Taneytown; Lewis R. Baer, prop'r.
Phone 756-6446, Taneytown, Md.

4-18tf

FOR SALE — Bendix Ironer, de-
luxe model. Phone PL. 6-5361. Taney-
town, Md. 4-18-3t

RADIO & TELEVISION Repair-
ing. We also repair Garden Tractors
and Lawn Mowers and other small

• equipment. 21/2 miles north of Taney-
town on Walnut Grove Road. See

M. Clabaugh. 4-11-4t

SEE US — for Chick and Pullet
orders, anytime. —Taneytown Grain
& Supply Co. Phone: PL 6-6666.

3-14-ti

CHURCH NOTICES

St. Joseph's Catholic Church, Fred-
erick St. Rev. Francis B. Wagner,
Pastor. Sunday Mass, 8 and 10:30;
Week day Mass in the convent 7:00
o'clock Sept.-June except Friday Mass
for the Children 11:30 a. m. in the
church. First Friday 11:30 a. m., 5:15
p. M., First Saturday, 8:00 o'clock.
Sodality first Wednesday in month
7:30 p. m. followed by business meet-
ing. Meeting: Holy Name Society
meeting 8 p. m. every third Thurs-
day Business Meeting following
Instruction for children attending
public schools after the Masses
on Sunday. Confession Saturday
et 4-5 p .m.; 7-8 p. m. Baptisms
Sunday 11:30 a. m. C. Y. 0., Saturday
7:30 p. m. Novena to Our Lady of
Perpetual Help. followed by bene-
diction. Meeting and Social in Parish
Hall 8 P. M. — 11:30 P. M.

Holiness Christian Church—Key-
mar, Md. Rev. Wilbur M. Whalen,
Minister—Sunday School, 9:30 a.m.;
Morning Service, 10:30 a.m.; Young
Peoples Service at 7:00 p.m.; Even-
ing service at 7:30 p.m.; Every Tues-
day night at 8:00 p.m., Bible Study;
Friday night Cottage Pray Meeting.
Would be glad to come in to your
home. I was glad when they said unto
me, let us go into the house of the
Lord! A cordial welcome is extended
to the public—Pastor Whalen

Walnut Grove Dunkard Brethren
Church at Kump's—Sunday School,
9:30 a.m.; preaching, 10:30 a.m. How-
ard Surbey and Guy Dayhoff, Minis-
ters.

Piney Creek Presbyterian Church.
Rev. Wm. Yates, D. D., Pastor.—
Church Service, 9:30 a.m.: Church
School, 10:30 a.m.

Uniontown Lutheran Parish —
Emmanuel (Baust) Church—Wor-

ship 9:30 A. M., Church School 10:30
A. M.

St. Paul's, Uniontown — Church
School 9:30 A. M. Worship 11 A. M.

St. Luke's (Winters) Church —
Church School 10:00 A. M., Worship
11:00 A. M.
Mt. Union Church—Church School

9:30 A. M. No Worship service.
Rev. J. H. August Borleis, pastor.

FOR WEDDING Invitations and
announcements, reception cards, en-
gagement announcements, napkins,
birth announcements, complete selec-
tion, see—The Carroll Record Co.

8-11-ti

BE PREPARED—For the unex-
pected. Let us insure you adequate-
ly.—Percy M. Burke, 231 E. Main St.,
Westminster, Md. Phone: Tilden 8-
6620. 4.15-ti

HOME APPLIANCES Repaired—
Also lawn mower and engine repairs;
also automobile repairing. Earl Mont-
gomery, near Kump's Station, on the
Bert Koontz Road. 2-21-tf

RELIABLE SERVICE by Har-
aian's TV and Radio Repair Shop,
3 n Crouse's Mill Road, Taneytown,
Md. Service call $2.00 within 5 miles.
Phone 756-6948. 8-24-tf

DE KALB HYBRIDS—Seed Corn,
Sudax, Sorghum and Baby Chicks.
Order your spring needs now. Alvin
G. Dutterer, Silver Run, Fieldstone
6-7288. 3-21-ti

REDUCED PRICES — All Alum-
inum Storm Doors and Windows. The
new Air Master products, triple track
Alcoa aluminum. — Ohler's Metal
Shop—phone: PL 6-6138, Taneytown.

NOTICE--Dial PL 6-6548 for your
Sand, Stone, Blocks and General
Hauling. Fertilizer and Lime. —
Thurston Putman. 7-21-tf

NOTICE— To my garbage custom-
n.s: We take care of collection of
cans, bottles, glass, garbage, and pa-
per. Other articles such as tree and
shubbery trimmings, wire, old roofing.
building partitions, bricks and plaster
will be collected and charges will be
made accordingly.—Walter Bonschoff
Taneytown's Garbage Collector.

8-25-tf

CARD PARTY — Every Monday
night beginning at 8 P. M. Harney
V.F.W., Harney, Md. 9-4-ti

CARD PARTY — Every Saturday
night, Harney Vol. Fire Co. Hall at
8 P. M. (EST). 9-29-ti

FOR SALE — Used Furniture.
Home Comfort range, very good; oil
heaters, utility cabinets,, base cabi-
nets, wardrobes, dressers, chest of
drawers, breakfast set, refrigerator,
drop leaf table, chairs, stands, china
closets, desks, high chairs, play pens,
cribs, nice kitchen cabinet, radios,
record players, lamps, dishes, blanket
chest, beds, springs, sled, bicycles, etc.
Mowers sharpened and repaired. Used
mowers for sale. Abras Garage, Key-
mar, Phone SP. 5-3252. 1-31-ti

BRING YOUR FILMS to us for
EXPERT printing and developing;
24 hour service on black and white-
18 hour service on COLOR Work.
Complete stock of Films - Flashbulbs
- Cameras and Flash outfits—Taney-
town Pharmacy—Free S &H Green
Stamps. 3-29-tf

FOR SALE—New and used Type-
writers and Adding Machines, Rib-
bons and Carbon Paper. Also Ma-
chines for rent.—Charles L. Stone-
sifer, Representative of Remington
Rand, Inc., Taneytown, Md., phone
PL. 6-6660 or PL. 6-6789. 5-9-tf

New Deluxe

1st Floor Apartment

FOR RENT

on York Street

Large Living Room, 2 large Bed-
rooms, large Kitchen and Dinette,
Laundry Room and full Bath with
Radiant Electric Heat. This apt.
is all new and strictly private.
Available at once. Phone: PL 6-
4988 or PL 6-5761.

Keysville Lutheran Church, Rev.
Donald C. Brake, pastor. Worship
Service, 9:30 A. M.; Sunday School,
10:30 A. M.

Trinity Lutheran Church, Taney-
town, Md. Howard W. Miller, pastor.
Sunday, May 5, Sunday Church

School 9:00 A. M., The Service 10:00
A. M., Young Adults Discussion
Group 7:30 P. M.; Tuesday, The
Church Council 8:00 P. M.; Wednes-
day, Lutheran Church Women 8:00
P. M., Constitution Committee 8:00
P. M.•, Thursday, Confirmation I 4:00
and 6:00 P. M. Youth Choir 7:00
P. M., Senior Choir 8:00 P. M.; Fri-
day, Confirmation II 4:00 and 7:00
P. M.

Messiah Evangelical United Breth-
ren Church—Pastor, Rev. Paul E.
Rhinehart, D.D., Taneytown, Md.

Services Sunday, May 5, 1963,
9:15 A. M. Sunday School, Mr. Ray
Copenhaver, Supt. 10:15 A. M. Wor-
ship and Sermon, the Pastor preach-
ing; 7:45 P. M. Youth Fellowship and
Catechetical Instruction. Wed. 6:45
P. M. Children's Choir and Fellow-
ship. Thurs., 8:00 P. M. Choir Re-
hearsal. May 8 and 9, Wed. and
Thurs. of this week, the Women's
Society of World Service will meet in
its Annual Convention in Chambers-
burg, Pa. All of the Churches of
Penn. Conference are in this Conven-
tion.

Taneytown Charge of the United
Church of Christ—William F. Wiley,
B.D., pastor.
Grace Church, Taneytown — 9:15

A. M., Sunday Church School; 10:30
A. M., Divine Worship, sermon:
"Christian Family Living." This Sun-
day ushers in the observance of Na-
tional Family Life Week. 7:30 P. M.,
Youth Fellowship with the presenta-
tion and discussion on the topic,
"Teenage Smoking." Tues., 7:30 P.
M., Consistory Meeting. Wed., 7:00
P. M., Junior Choir Rehearsal; Senior
Choir Rehearsal at 8:00 P. M. Thurs.,
May 9, 7:30 P. M., Sunday Church
School Officers and Teachers Meet-
ing. Women's Guild and Churchmen's
Fellowship meets Thurs., May 2, 7:30
P. N. Sun., May 19„ 6:30 P.M., Youth
Fellowship's Parents' Nite Supper
Meeting.
Grace Church, Keysville 9:00

A. M., Divine Worship, sermon:
"Christian Family Living." The week
of May 5 is National Family Life
Week. 10:00 A. M., Sunday Church
School. Both Churches of the Charge
will observe The Festival of the
Christian Home (Mother's Day) at
the services on Sunday, May 12.

Taneytown United Presbyterian
Church, Rev. William M. Hendricks,
pastor.
Sunday, May 5, 1963, 8:45 A. M.

Church School. 9:45 A. M. Morning
Worship. Anthem, "Light My Way"
by St. Claire. Sermon: "The Pre-
eminent Christ." Wednesday at 7:30,
Choir Rehearsal. Wednesday at
7:30, Session meeting at the Manse.

Uniontown Circuit Churches of God.
Uniontown—Bible School 9:30 A.

M. Worship Service 10:30 A. M.
and 7.45 P. M.; Prayer Meeting and
Bible Study Wed., 7:45; ETTA Class
Monday, 7:45.
Frizellburg—Worship Service 9:00

A. M., Bible School 10:00 A. M.,
CGYA 6:30 P. M.; ETTA Classes
Monday, 7:45 P. M.; Prayer Meeting
and Bible Study Thursday, 7:45.
Fred E. Horner, Pastor.

Piney Creek Church of the Breth-
ren, Rev. Warren M. Eshbach, pastor
—Sunday School 9:30 A. M., Church
Service 10:40 A. M., Lenten Service
7:30 P. M. Choir rehearsal at 7:00
P. M. Wednesday. Women's Fellow-
ship, 1st Tues. of month. Jr. High
Fellowship, 2nd Tuesday and 4th
Monday of every month.

Baust United Church of Christ,—
Rev. R. V. Johnson, pastor. Sunday
School at 9:30 and Worship Service
in the Parish House.

The Pipe Creek Charge — Union-
town, Maryland. — Uniontown, 9:00
A. M. Worship, 10:00 A. M. Church
School.
Pipe Creek — (Brick), 10:10 A. M.

Worship, 11:10 A. M. Church School
St. James (on Marston Road) —

10:00 A. M. Church School, 11:15
A. M. Worship.

St. Paul's Lutheran Church, Har-
ney—Rev. John Fry, Supply Pastor.
Worship Service 9:00 A. M., Sunday
School 10:00 A. M.

Mayberry Church of God — Sun-
day School at 10:15 A. M. Worship
Service at 11:00 A. M. Rev. Mc-
Cann will be speaker and show pic-
tures Sunday evening at 7:30 P. M.,
May 5.
Rev. Ralph Jamison, pastor.

Hampstead Youth For Christ —
Widely travelled evangelist-pastor,
Dr. G. R. Paterson, a native of Edin-
burgh, Scotland, for three years
pastor of the Fagg's Manor United
Presbyterian Church in Cochranville,
Pa., who spent two months preaching
in Scotland last year and expects to
have a three-month exchange pastor-
ate with a Scottish preacher next
year, will be speaking at Hampstead
Youth for Christ 8 P. M. Saturday,
May 4, 1963, in the auditorium of the
Hampstead School, Main St., in
Hampstead, Md.

"Highway sign in North Haven,
Conn.: 'Driver who has one for the
road has state trooper as chaser.'"
—Harold S. May, Florence (Ala.)
Herald.

"These International Treaties are
like our poor relations, one never
hears of them until they're broke."
—John L. Teets, Richwood (W. Va.)
Nicholas Republican.
 -0 

"Woman may be physically weaker
than man, but she can put a cap on
a fruit jar so tight he can't get it
off." — J. Dennis Losness, Cornell
(Wis.) Courier.

"If we don't beat the Russians to
the moon, we may beat them into
bankruptcy." — H. R. Smith, Brook-
ville (0.) Star.

Education isn't play—and it can't
be made to look like play. It is hard,
hard work. But it can be made in-
teresting work.—Thomas A. Edison.

A Bridal Shower

A surprise Bridal Shower was
given Patricia Lambert of 6 Fair-
ground Avenue, Taneytown, Md., on
Saturday evening, April 27th, at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Zim-
merman, Silver Run. Mrs. Larry
Petry of Annapolis, Md., was also a
hostess.

Miss Lambert will be married on
June 8th to A/2C Leslie W. Null of
Tyndall Air Force Base, Florida.
Those attending were: Mrs. Don-

ald Albaugh, Mrs. Edgar Strevig,
Mrs. Robert Waddell, Mrs. Kenneth
Lambert, Patricia Lambert, Joyce
Myers, Mrs. Lloyd Flickinger, Mrs.
Norman Putman, Mrs. Bessie Freet,
Mrs. Grace V. Myers, Mrs. Walter
Myers, Jr., Mrs. Audrey Buffington,
Mrs. Wayne Rohrbaugh, Mrs. Char-
lotte Shorb, Mrs. Harold Myers,
Tamara Myers, Mrs. Freda Lambert,
and Mrs. Sterling Zimmerman.

Patricia received many lovely and
useful gifts.
Also present were: Kenneth Lam-

bert, Walter Myers, Jr., Mark Myers,
.Harold Myers, Norman Putman, Lar-
ry Petry, Sterling Zimmerman and
Vernon Zimmerman.

SOCIAL SECURITY

Monthly old-age, survivors, and dis-
ability insurance benefits in Carroll
County now top $375,222, Albert H.
Barouh, Field Representative of the
social security office in Baltimore,
said on releasing his annual county
benefit data report.
The new monthly figure represents

an increase of 10.2 percent over the
corresponding period last year.
"This increase can be attributed to

the changes in the law in recent years,
as well as to the growth of our aged
population," Mr. Barouh said. "This
money stimulates county business;
most of it is spent for food, clothing
and shelter.
"There is no longer any doubt. So-

cial Security benefits are helping to
stabilize the income and spending
power of many residents in Carroll
County."
Monthly benefits first became pay-

able in January 1940, and they have
continued without interruption for
23 years, accompanied by a steady
growth in the number of beneficiaries.
Mr. Barouh noted that as of December
31, 1962, some 6,059 Countians were
collecting about $4,502,644 annually
from social security, an increase of
10.3 percent over 1961.
More people in Carroll County, he

said, could draw social security bene-
fits if they knew more about the law,
and for that reason they are urged to
visit or call the local social security
office whenever they have a ques-
tion concerning their benefits or re-
sponsibilities.
As of January 1963, in the nation

at large, more than 18 million bene-
ficiaries were receiving payments at
the rate of $1.2 billion per month.
The average monthly old-age re-

tirement benefit in January was
$76.30 for all States, while in the
State of Maryland the average was
$75.05, Mr. Barouh said.
The following table shows the num-

ber and amount of each type of mon-
thly benefit paid in Carroll County,
as of December 31, 1962.

Number of Total of
Beneficiary Grp. Beneficiaries Pymts.
Retired Worker 3427 $243,370
Wife or Husband 936 34,984
Widow or Widower 554 33,289
Mothers and Children 797 41,123
Disabled workers and
dependents 334 21,703

Dependent Parents 11 753

Temper makes a man speak his
mind when he should be minding his
speech.

"A thing of beauty sometimes
proves to be an expense forever."—
Margaret K. France, North Industry
(0.) Observer.

It has long been established that
crime doesn't pay, but we will prob-
ably always have some people foolish
enough to keep on trying to use it
for collection purposes.

SKIN ITCH
DON'T SCRATCH IT!

Scratching spreads infection, caus-
ing MORE pain. Apply quick-drying
ITCH-ME-NOT instead. Itching quiets
down in minutes and antiseptic ac-
tion helps speed healing. Fine for
eczema, insect bites, foot itch, other
surface rashes. If not pleased, your
48' back at any drug store. TODAY
at TANEYTOWN PHARMACY.

FEET ACHE, ITCH?
1/4 of all your bones are in the feet.

No wonder they ache, swell, perspire,
itch. Bathe feet twice daily with
T-4-.L Solution for relief of the 52
bones, 66 joints plus ligaments. Curbs
athlete's foot, too (sloughs off infec-
tion—watch healthy skin replace it)
or your 480 back at any drug store
if not pleased IN ONE HOUR. TO-
DAY at TANEYTOWN PHARMACY.

PUBLIC SALE REGISTER
MAY

4-11 A. M. Raymond Davidson,
York St., Taneytown. Household
goods. Guss Shank, Auct. my

4-12 noon. Albert Drechsler, Un-
iontown. Automobile and house-
hold goods. Calvin L. Amoss,
Auct.

9-6:30 P. M. Ralph G. Hoffman.
Attorney. Real estate in Taney-
town. Guss Shank, Auct. my

11-10 A. M. Charles F. Black and
Carolyn G. Smith. Administra-
tors. Antiques, household goods,
etc. 4% miles from Westminster
on Taneytown and Westminster
Road. in Frizellburg, Md. Guss
Shank, Auct. my

18—Mr. and Mrs. Carson G. Riten-
our, midway between Taneytown
and Westminster, w. side Frizell-
burg. Farm machinery, etc. Guss
Shank, Auct. my

25—Bossy S. King, 726 Baltimore St.,
Hanover, Pa. Household goods.
Guss Shank, Auct.

Carroll County Hospital Administrator Arrives

Left to right, top row: Richard, age 16, and Mrs. Dorothy Mc-
Ferron. Front row, 1. to r.: Lynnea, age 13, Danny, age 10, and
Joseph R. McFerron.

It was announced by Atlee W.
Wampler, Jr., President of the Car-
roll County General Hospital, that
Mr. Joseph R. McFerron, the new
hospital administrator arrived in
Westminster and assumed his official
duties as of May 1, 1963.
Mr. McFerron, formerly living in

Cleveland Heights, Ohio, will be join-
ed by his wife and family sometime
after the middle of June; following
the closing of the Ohio School session,
and the completion of their new home
here on William Avenue.
Mr. McFerron graduated from Gen-

eva College in 1941 and received his
B.S. degree at the University of
Pittsburgh several years later. Dur-
ing this period he was associated with
various hospital facilities as a lab-
oratory technician, finally culminat-
ing in his appointment as Laboratory
Director of VA Hospital of 500 beds

in Butler, Pa., a position which he
occupied from 1946 to 1955.
Mr. McFerron then attended the

Columbia University School of Public
Health and Administrative Medicine
receiving his M.S. degree in Hospital
Administration in 1957.
Following this he took his required

year of residency at Muhlenberg Hos-
pital in Plainfield, New Jersey, where
he served with considerable distinc-
tion. He then accepted the position
of Assistant Administrator at Doc-
tor's Hospital, Cleveland Heights,
199-bed facility. Here for the past
six years he has had broad experience
in all of the varied facets of modern
hospital management and is therefore,
uniquely qualified, along with his
laboratory background to serve in his
new capacity as Administrator of the
Carroll County General Hospital, Inc.
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TANEYTOWN MUTUAL FIRE INSURANCE CO.
• (OFFICE— 32 EAST BALTIMORE ST., TANEYTOWN, MD.)

LOWEST INSURANCE RATES ON FARM PROPERTY

Also "Package" Homeowner Policies — Fire, Windstorm, Theft,
Glass Breakage, etc., on your Home and Contents; and including
insurance if you are liable should someone be injured on your prop-
erty. Let us quote low rates without obligation.

ff
HOURS: 9 A. M. — 4:30 P. M. Daily including Saturday

(CLOSED THURSDAY AFTERNOONS)
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THE LITTLE-PHLOXE.S,

Bright Eyes is the name of this little annual phlox, so easy
to grow, so willing to bloom, so satisfactory as a cut flower.
Seeds need only to be planted to grow and produce.

!..e you're accustomed to thinking of phlox in terms of the
foot-and-a-half-high perennial with its brilliant blooms in mid-
summer, lower your sights and consider the little phloxes which
are annuals.
As easy to grow as scattering the seeds on almost any kind

of soil, asking only a sunny
spot, these little fellows offer
rich rewards. Their flowers are
bright and gay, they continue
to bloom over a long time, and
they make delightful bouquets,
lasting well in water.

If you need a bed of solid
color or a path planting which
you'd like to have appear as a
ribbon of color, the little phloxes
are ideal to use.
It is possible to buy seeds

that will produce plants with
flowers all one color or mixed
colors. T h e variety Snowball,
for instance, has white flowers,
Isabellina has primrose yollow
ones — and so on through the
phlox colors which include pink,
scarlet and crimson as well as
salmon shades.
The smallest phloxes c ome

in mixtures called Dwarf
Beauty of Dwarf Star A selec-

tion from the Dwarf Beauty
strain is called Bright Eyes and
is illustrated above. "Star" in
the name of an annual phlox,
refers to pointed petals of this
particular strain, which makes
individual florets look like tiny
stars. Twinkle is a variety of
star phlox that won an All-
American Selections award for
its excellence.
There are also annual phloxes

which are tetraploids and thus
are taller and have larger flo-
wers. There is a tetraploid mix-
ture offered and also such var-
ieties as Glamour, a medium
salmon in flower color with
the center of the bloom cream.
Try some of these little

phloxes in your garden this
summer and you'll agree that
they furnish an enormous
amount of bloom for little effort.

DOLLARS SENT
AWAY FOR

PRINTING
Never Come Back
Let Us Do Your Printing
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THRU FRIDAY
5 Happy Johnny
O News Headlines
2 Happy Johnny
00 World & Area News
5 Agricultune News
0 Happy Johnny
30 Weather Forecast
35 Happy Johnny
00 CBS News
8 Happy .Tohnny
O Woman's World
35 Afternoon Show
00 CBS News
0 Afternoon Show
O Woman's World
5 Afternoon Show
O CBS News

3:10 In Hollywood
3:15 Bob Helder Show
3:30 Woman's World
3:35 Bob Helder Show
4:00 CBS News
4:10 Bob Helder Show
4:30 Sidelights
4:35 Bob Helder Show
5:05 World News
5:10 Evening Show

has programming for every member of the family.

* NEWS on-the-air

* MUSIC through-out the day

* SPORTS — high school, college, professional

* Special Features of Public Interest

Dial: 1470 kc WTTII • AM

100.7 mc WITR • FM

8:50 CBS News
9:00 Your Story Hour
9:30 Science Beat
9:35 Sunday Music
9:55 Sports & Weather

Roundup
10:00 CBS News
10:05 Sunday Music
10:15 World of Folk Music
10:30 Moscow Scene
10:35 Sunday Music
10:45 Sacred Heart Hour
11:00 Church Service
12:00 CBS News
12:05 Sports News

PROGRAM SCHEDULE

WFMD Frederick, Maryland
93 on your A M Radio Dial

MONDAY
4:58 Sign On 11:1
5:00 Getting Up Time 11:3
5:25 Ministerium 11:3
5:30 World News 12:
5:35 Getting Up Time 12:0
6:00 World News 12:1
6:05 Getting Up Time 12:
6:30 World News 12:
6:35 Weather Forecast 1:
6:40 Getting Up Time 1:0
7:00 World News 1:3
7:05 Getting Up Time 1:
7:30 World & Area News 2:
7:35 Getting lip Time 2:1
7:55 Community News 2:3
8:00 World News Roundup 2:3
8:15 Morning Show 3:0
8:30 World & Area News
8:35 Morning Show
9:00 CBS News
9:10 Arthur Godfrey
10:00 CBS News
10:10 House Party
10:30 Gary Moore
10:40 Clooney & Crosby
11:00 CBS News
11:10 One Woman's

Washington

5:30 News Headlines
5:32 Evening Show
6:00 CBS News
6:05 Local Area News
6:10 Sports News
6:15 Barber Shop Favorites
6:20 Dinner Date
6:30 News Headlines
6:32 Dinner Date
6:45 Lowell Thomas
6:55 Sports Time
7:00 CBS News
7:10 Observations U.S.A.
7:15 Worldwide Sports
7:30 News Analysis
7:35 Easy Listening
8:00 The World Tonight
8:15 Night Sounds in Music
9:00 CBS News
9:10 Night Sounds in Music
10:00 CBS News
10:10 Night Sounds in Music
10:45 Armed Forces Review
11:00 World & Area News
11:05 Weather & Sports
11:10 Be Still & Know
11:15 Sign Off

4:58 Sign On
5:00 Getting Up Time
5:25 Ministerium
5:30 World News
5:35 Getting Up Time
6:00 World News
6:05 Getting Up Time
6:30 World News
6:30 Weather Forecast
6:40 Getting Up Time
7:00 World News
7:05 Getting Up Time
7:30 World & Area News
7:35 Getting Up Time
7:55 Community News
8:00 World News Roundup
8:15 Saturday Show
8:30 Better Living
8:35 Saturday Show
8:55 Sound Story
9:00 CBS News
9:10 Saturday Show
9:30 The Week in Space
9:35 Saturday Show
10:00 CBS News
10:05 Sports News
10:10 Saturday Show
10:30 This Week in Business
10:35 Saturday Show
11:00 CBS News

SATURDAY
11:05 Sports News
11 :10 Gospel Light Program
11:30 News Headlines
11:32 Happy Johnny
12:00 World & Area News
12:05 Agriculture News
12:10 Happy Johnny
12:30 Weather Forecast
12:35 Happy Johnny
1:00 CBS News
1:05 Sports News
1:10 Music with Lew Wade
1:30 Time to Travel
1:35 Music with Lew Wade
2:00 CBS News
2:05 Sports News
2:10 Music with Lew Wade
3:00 CBS News
3:05 Saturday Show
3:30 It's New
3:35 Saturday Show
4:00 CBS News
4:05 Saturday Show
4:30 Calling America
4:35 Saturday Slow
5:00 CBS News
5:05 Saturday Show
5:30 At Your Leisure
5:35 Saturday Show
6:00 World News

6:05 Local & Area News
6.10 Sports News
6:15 Dinner Date
6:30 European Diary
6:35 CBS News
6:45 Chamber of Commerce
6:50 Congressional Report
6:55 Sports News
7:00 CBS News
7:05 News Analysis
7:10 Annapolis lnaex
7:25 A.M.A. Program
7:30 In New York
7:35 Easy Listening
7:55 Sports News
8:00 The World Tonight
8:15 All Kinds of Music
8:30 World Music Festival
10:00 CBS News
10:10 Music Till Midnight
10:30 News Headlines
10:32 Music Till Midnight
10:45 Pat Boone
11:00 World News
11:05 Music Till Midnight
11:35 The Navy Swings
11:50 World & Area News
11:54 Weather & Sports
11:57 Be Still & Know
12:00 Sign Off

6:53 Sign On 12:10
6:55 Rock of Ages 12:15
7:25 World & Area News 12:39
7:30 Church of the Air 12:35
7:55 Community News 12:45
8:00 World News Roundup 1:00
8:15 Sunday Music 1:05
8:30 Sports News 1:10
8:35 Children's Chapel 1:30

1:35 Sunday Music
1:55 CBS News
2:00 Sunday Music
3:00 CBS News
3:05 Sunday Music
4:00 CBS News
4:05 Sunday Music
5:00 CBS News
5:05 Sunday Music
5:30 White House

Correspondent
5:35 To Promote Good Will
6:00 CBS News
6:05 Sports News
6:10 Johnny Dollar

SUNDAY
Salute to Our Servicemen 6:35
The New Life 7:00
Follow Up 7:05
Anatomy of a Headline 7:10
Hymns of Faith 7:25
CBS News 7:30
Sports News 7:35
Sunday Music 8:00
Special from London 8:15

8:30
8:45
9:00
9:05
9:10
9:35
10:00
10:10
10:15
10 :20
10:35
11:00
11:04
11:06
11 :10

Suspense
CBS News
Sports News
Washington Report
Headliner
News Analysis
Heartbeat Theatre
The World Tonight
Alexander Kendrick
Near East Report
University Explorer
CBS News
Quotes of the-Week
Leading Question
Capitol Cloakroom
CBS News
Take a Giant Step
Social Security
The Bible Speaks to You
Salt Lake City Choir
World & Area News
Weather & Sports
Be Still & Know
Sign Off

Brides' delight.. our beautiful

FLOWER
WEDDING LINE

with 5 exclusive new P.,:,T2vcy Scripts
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When you choose from our famous Regency Flower Web.

ding Line you need have no qualms about quality—this rich,

raised HELIOGRAVING* has all the distinction of the fin-

est craftsmanship—yet costs about half as much as you'd

guess! Do see the many other elegant type styles... for y
our

compile wedding stationery needs. offellograving—aut se

confused with engravinj.

Chao to two weeks Jolivoryi

The Carroll Record Company, Inc.
DIAL PL 6-6600 Taneytown, Md.
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Terms of Sale: CASH.

3:E
•

PUBLIC SALE
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CALVIN L. AMOSS, Auctioneer
EUGENE DEVILBISS, Clerk 4-25-2t
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OF HOUSEHOLD GOODS

SATURDAY, MAY 4, 1963 at 12 O'CLOCK NOON

The undersigned will offer at Public Sale located in Uniontown,

Carroll County Maryland, the following:

1954 FORD CAR

HOUSEHOLD GOODS
4-pc. bedroom suite (cherry), bed and springs, 10 pc. dining room

suite, extension table, floor lamp, table lamps, (pair like new);

round solid table, small tables, kitchen cabinet and cupboard, two

antiq,ie trunks, antique picttize frames and mirror, straight chairs,

dishes, pots, and pans, silverware, jars, rugs, reed and linoleum,

ironing board, window screens, glider, 275 gal. oil tank, 2 oil

Heatrolas, garden tractor, 5 tier battery and incubator, hand plow,

1952 Ford car parts, butchering equipment and other articles too

numerous to mention.

ALBERT DRECHSLER, Owner
Not responsible for accidents.

Lunch Rights, Bake Sale — Lutheran church (St. Paul's)

Ar7crie having anything to sell bring to sale by 11 o'clock
Satarday morning.
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NOTICE
SE

SCHOOL APPLIANCES ARE BEING EXCHANGED

Come in and pick out a bargain. Ranges, Refrigerators, Washers,

▪ Dryers and a Food Freezer. Once a year extra specials — New

u Warranty. — Potomac Edison Co., Taneytown.— S. E. Remsburg.

3:£
tt • Telephone: PL 6 - 6644.

SE
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"MISS TANEYT OWN" BEAUTY CONTEST
THURSDAY, JUNE 13, 1963

RULES

1. Must be at least 16 years of age.
2. Must be single. f

3. Must wear evening dress.

4. Submission of application is evidence of full and honest in-

tention to enter contest.

5. Withdrawals cannot be accepted.

6. Judging will be based on beauty, poise and personality.

Fill out attached application and return to Dorothy Lookingbill,

64 York Street., Taneytown, Md. Phone: PL 6 - 6961. Additional

information and classification may be obtained from Mrs. Look-

ingbill or at Dougherty's Superette (on the square), in Taney-

town, anytime. Applications must be in by Saturday, June 1, '63.

PRIZES

Queen will receive $50.00, large trophy and possession of crown

for one year.

1st runner-up will receive $35.00

2nd runner-up will receive $20.00

Each contestant will receive a gift

APPLICATION BLANK

NAME  

ADDRESS  

AGE   SCHOOL (if any)  

Signature of Applicant

How to help MOM wash the dishes.
With an electric dishwasher, of curse.. . the Mother's Day gift she'll appreciat

e

all year long. After meals she'll be out of the kitchen within minutes after th
e

rest of the family. It will make every day Mother's Day this year. And an electri
c

dishwasher will not only save her time,

but will also sanitize her dishes and help

protect family health. Help MOM wash

the dishes . . . buy her an electric dish-

washer for Mother's Day.

See your Electrical Appliance Dealer

POTOMAC EDISON

%04 >.t. $..( $04 ).4 $40( 04 .< )0(,). ).i )04. i.d. yo4 5.( ,4. y., ).4. 5. • )., 5.
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International Undo=
Sunday School Lessons

BY DR. KENNETH J.- FOREMANc,

To Be Forgiven
Lesson for May 5, 1963

Bible Material: Psalms 32; 51; 103:8-
14.
Devotional Reading: Psalm 130.

WHY is it that when a sermon
or a Sunday school lesson is

to be on the subject of Forgive-
ness, or anything connected with
it, the Bible passage selected is
nearly always from the Old Testa-
ment and not the New? The an-

swer is obvious:
the Old Testa-
ment, and espe-
cially the book of
Psalms, has the
clearest and most
moving account of
God's forgiveness,
and especially the
experience of be-
ing forgiven, that
can be found inDr. Foreman

the Bible.
This fact alone suggests much. It

means, for example, that forgive-
ness is not something peculiar to
our own religion. All religions de-
sire a forgiving God; the difference
between these and Christianity is
not that people in other religions
don't care whether they are for-
given or not, but that they do not
understand, as followers of Christ
know, what kind of God it is who
forgives, and why He forgives at
all.

Two m.sunderstandings
The forgiveness of God can be

misunderstood in many ways. Let
us glance at two of them. One is
to suppose that He is a sort of
vast forgiving machine. This is
the age of automation, when ev-
erything works by push-buttons.
When the electric power goes off,
a switch untouched by human
hands will put your house on an-
ether power line. When the plane-
in which you are flying starts to
slide down, the automatic pilot
will bring it right back up again.
Some people think God is like this,
forgiving automatically, some
would say even before a man re-
pents. Others think of repentance
as a sort of automatic switch: the
minute a man says "I'm sorry"
out comes forgiveness from heav-
en like candy from a machine. But
it isn't like that at all. Another
mistake is to suppose that God's
forgiveness is a sort of reward, as
if God said, after all, that sinner
is a pretty good man—above the
average, in fact. Such goodness
deserves some recognition, so I
am going to reward him by forgiv-
ing him. It isn't like that either.
To be forgiven is a gift of God.
"I did not hide"
- The poet who wrote Psalm 32
knew from experience something
very important. He had tried for
a time that old dodge, pretending
to himself that he had not sinned
at all. Nothing could be more ut-
terly absurd, when you think of
it, than trying to hide away from
God. Nothing can be more impos-
sible than to pretend it never hap-
pened. Nobody can go off and shut
a door behind him and fancy that
God will get no nearer than that
door. Modern psychiatry agrees
with the ancient psalmist that =-
admitted sin, hidden guilt, is ac-
tually a serious menace to health.
Psalm 32:3 and 4 describe a sick
man. Doctors cannot cure such a
case. The patient himself has the
key to the cure, and this poet
found it. "I acknowledged—" he
says, "I did not hide;" "I will
confess."
"Love surrounds Him"
Forgiveness is a kind of mira-

cle after all. For we know that
forgiveness is no good if the for-
giver is determined never to for-
get. But how can God forget? Fur-
ther,—and this is something that
perhaps even angels may not
understand—the question, Why
should God forgive at all? has no
final answer that leaves us without
further questions. Would it not be
simpler for God to start all over
again with some other race, a
race that could not possibly sin?
Why does God keep patching up
human beings when he does not
have to?
The truth is, God does much

better than patch people up. He
makes them over. The forgiveness
of God has a strange quality about
it. Ordinary forgiveness leaves of-
fenders about as they were. God's
forgiveness does something won-
derful to the sinner. Read over
this 32nd Psalm again and again.
What sort of man is this who
speaks with such profound en-
thusiasm about being forgiven?
He does not sound in the least
like a man who rejoices that his
slate has been wiped clean so
that he can start all over again.
He is not at all thinking of God
as a forgivim, 'thine. He has
penetrated to the secret—not that
he understands it, but he knows
it • God forgives because He loves.
What guarantees against future
sin0 Nothing in me, only love in
Him.
(Based oi. outlines copyrighted by

the Division of Christian Education,
National Council of the Churches of
Christ in the U. S. A. Released by
Community Press Service.)

The Taneytown Volunteer
Fire Company will conduct their
annual solicitation for funds from
April 15th to May 15th. It is
hoped the people of this com-
munity will be generous when
the canvassers contact them for
donations which are requested
merely to keep the company in a
position to meet any emergencies
that arise, also keeping in mind
that these men, give freely of
their time for this worthy cause.

CUSTOM SLAUGHTERING
Beef
Lamb

Veal
H A H N' S

Amana Food Service
WESTMINSTER
Tilden 8-4040

1-22-ti
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Corsages

LITTLESTOWN, PENNA.
33

Phone 359-4824
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Cut Flowers, Designs
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FOR SALE

!
:8 Large ROOMS, Great Hall, 11/21.

!Baths, Oil Heat, Carriage House,
could be converted into apart-.

BEAUTIFUL

19th CENTURY

BRICK MANSION

1 CORNER of BALTIMORE ST.

and MILL AVENUE

TANEYTOWN, MD.

Inspection by Appointment.

S. E. FLANAGAN & SON

Westminster, Md.
Phone TI. 8-4020

2-71
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•ments.

HANOVER
BUSINESS DIRECTORY
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E. B. GELMAN
Paint and Sporting Goods

Painting and Paper Hanging

PAINTING CONTRACTOR

Littlestown - Hanover Road

Dial 359 - 5525
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'43Z::=3C1:30:23323%=0:23=0=3:1:13a:23:42:0

MYERS MEMORIALS

Superior Memorial

Craftsmanship

Telephone: ME 2 - 3151

261 Third St., HANOVER, PA.

033033000:33i11=19£3303.30:33:£3203301:3031

330:30330330133191=30330333:1=0:30330

Luminal Paints

JOHN S. THOMAN

PAINT , & WALLPAPER STORE

Cor. Frederick & Centennial Ave.

ME 7 - 6113

MAinAlUXUOUr$13S2=MiitiliMiU3SiUMUN
 - -
M03:03:0320.3303330303303303303333=0:30

Beauty Culture
A Well Paying Career

Beginners and Advanced Courses
DAY or NIGHT CLASSES

PEG HORN'S SCHOOL

OF BEAUTY

17 Center Square. Ph. ME 7 - 1088
0310:30.330:3013033.0330.3331£33)MUOU031

0.330:301:33:02033013032.0330=0:301:36133031

HEALTH FOOD STORE

Diabetic and Low Calorie Foods

Allergy and Salt Free Foods

Natural Foods — Vitamins

143 Baltimore St. Ph. ME 7 - 723e

320=0:33=M30=0:3031:33E333S£UO3:03:311120

03:301,33.3330£330/431£140:303330.3330131£3=34413

MENCHEY MUSIC SERVICE
430 Carlisle St. Ph. 637 - 2186
"Menehey Means Music"

11211111211211120121112K
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Records spun by WSBA Disc Jockey at the

RECORD HOP on
fr;

EVERY FRIDAY NIGHT

8:00 P. M. to 11:00 P. M.6,1

31
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• Sponsored by HARNEY VOLUNTEER FIRE CO.

40• :3403frftril:£3UOUri0:310.134033ii0:3403110U-61.13:103341=43:1334-3:1331-03140

RECORD HOP

HARNEY FIRE HALL

HARNEY, MARYLAND

Refreshments on Sale
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ADMINISTRATORS SALE OF VALUABLE(. 0
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Terms: CASH. Immediate removal
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WESTMINSTER, MD, GETTYSBURG, PA.

Phone:
Gettysburg
EDgewood
4-3165

Westminster
TI. 8-6867

CRUSHED STONE.

if It's Crushed Stone, Call Teeter
TEETER STONE, INC.

Teeter

O.* **.22..2332.:33'3.=

fr\ka
417 aedere.

•
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OBRO

Staples, Pins and Tacks

3790 Complete with 1000 Staples

ow," r‘ war% re

PACEMAKER
St:fp1C,S, ;i13 and Tack,

$1v5 $25o $325
Complete with 500 Staple.

TACKAAASTER

Gun Type Tacker
Ors Complete with 1000 Staples

FOR OFFICE

FACTORY

. HOME

STUDENT, ITC.

For Sale Sale at--

STA-PLYER
$495 Complete with 500 Staples

The Carroll Record Co.
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

Grand National Winner—Cherry Pie

A young high school girl from Hawaii, Myrna Yee of Oahu,
won the 1963 Grand National Prize from among thousands of
other participating Home Economic students. More than twice the
number of students participated in 1963 than were entered last
year. Miss Yee won a $1500 scholarship sponsored by the Na-
tional Red Cherry Institute. Here is the actual pie and her recipe:

Tropical
1 1-pound can (2 cups)

water packed tart red
cherries

1/2 cup granulated sugar
2-1/2 tablespoons cornstarch

Dash salt
Few drops red food

coloring
1/4 teaspoon almond extract

Cherry Pie
1 3-1/2-ounce can (1-1/3

cups) flaked coconut
1 9-inch baked pie shell

Meringue
3 egg whites, at room

temperature
Dash salt

6 tablespoons sugar

Drain cherries thoroughly, reserving liquid; add water to liquid
to make 1 cup. Combine 1/2 cup sugar, cornstarch and salt. Add
liquid. Cook, stirring constantly, until thick and clear. Remove
from heat, add coloring, extract and cherries; cool to room tem-
perature. Add 1 cup coconut. Spoon into baked crust. Beat egg
whites and salt to form soft peaks; add 6 tublespoons sugar grad-
ually, beating until stiff peaks form. Sprerd meringue over filling.,
sealing to edges. Sprinkle with remaining coconut—Bake at 33t;*
12 to 15 minutes. Yield 1--9 inch pie.

PERSONAL PROPERTY
••..
3iU

IN THE VILLAGE OF FRIZELLBURG, CARROLL
• COUNTY, MD., MIDWAY BETWEEN TANEYTOWN 

At
A;1

e• AND WESTMINSTER, MD., ON ROUTE 97 /*A1 OF VERNON C. BLACK, Deceased;.•
U R
pt

Pursuant to an order of the Orphans Court of Carroll County passed v‘on January 7, 1963, the undersigned Administrators will offer at• Public Auction on the aforesaid premises
M;

.4 SATURDAY, MAY 11, 1963 — 10:00 A. M. v:
re

31 0
U The following described personal property: U

•

t ANTIQUES and HOUSEHOLD GOODS 0
:2 Aek) 6 reed bottom chairs, flower hand U painted on back; drop-leaf table, liF
hl old secretary, clothes tree, hanging lamp, lanterns, buggy lanterns, be

rt 
et butter paddle, flat irons, pie cupboard, old crocks and jugs, old but-

tons, baskets, blanket chest, wash stand, trunks, iron stone china, 
!

• Blue Willow goblets, Hot Point Elec. Refrigerator, Frigidaire refrig-
erator, Frigidaire electric stove, Electrolux vacuum cleaner, porcelain

U top breakfast set, round wal. extension table, buffet, china closet,
living room suite, (good condition); coffee table, radio, Philco TV
set, clocks book shelf, pictures, mirrors, knee hole desk, chest of

Adrawers, nds chest of drawers, night stand, wardrobe, beds, seven-
way floor lamp, chairs, straight and rockers; Apex washing machine,
double wash tubs, lawn chairs, swing, lawn bench, boys bicycle, (like
new); victrola and records, cot, wheel barrow, platform scales, paint
and brushes, step ladder, push mower, reel power mower, digging
iron, garden tools, lots of small tools, rugs, linens, bed clothing, Af-
rican, collection of salt and pepper shakers, electric mixer, deep fry-
er, many other dishes, pots and pans, other articles too numerous to
mention.

WM. B. DULANEY, Attorney CHARLES F. BLACK,
123 E. Main Street, CAROLYN G. SMITH,
Westminster, Maryland ADMINISTRATORS OF
Tilden 8-3333 VERNON C. BLACK, Deceased

El(••co/
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Not responsible for accidents
Lunch rights
GUSS SHANK, Auctioneer
Taneytown, Md., PLymouth 6-6242

MARY WASHINGTON'S cmr—ir-T)
L'aking fim

#6

No need to have "Another Flour" on hand . . . Washington
Self-Rising Flour . . . the same wonderful Washington Self-
Rising Flour you use for homemade hot biscuits makes the sauci-
est gravy and crispiest fried chicken ever. Tender flaky pie crust
and smooth, rich sauces come out of the same bag, too. And just
look how easily it is done!

PIE CRUST (2 crust pie)

2 cups sifted enriched Washington Self-Rising Flour
1/2 cup shortening
2,i3 cup cold water
Cut shortening into flour until mixture is coarse. Sprinkle with

water and toss lightly with a fork. Turn onto a floured surface
and press dough together. Divide dough in half and roll out
thinner than for a crust made from all-purpose flour. Fit into an
8 or 9-inch pie pan. For a 2-crust pie, add filling and cover with.
other pastry round. Seal edges, vent top and bake according to
filling instructions.

For Single Pastry:
After rolling dough, fit into pie pan and trim edge one-inch

larger than pan. Fold to form rim and flute edge. Prick bottom
of pastry with fork. Bake at 425° F. about 10 minutes or until
golden. Cool before filling. Makes two single pastries.

SELF-RISING FLOUR GRAVY
4 tablespoons pan fat
4 tablespoons enriched Washington Self-Rising Flour
2 cups milk, soup stock, water, or fruit juice
seasonings to taste
Blend flour into fat over low heat until mixture thickens.

Gradually add liquid, stirring constantly, until gravy is smooth
and thick. Season to taste. For a thinner gravy, use 3 table-
spoons of self-rising flour.

CREAM SAUCE

Use 4 tablespoons of melted butter or margarine in place of
pan fat in gravy recipe. Use milk for liquid. Follow above
instructions.

A valuable addition to any kitchen library is the 40 page book
containing these and dozens of other recipes which may be ob-
tained free of charge by writing Mary Washington, 3261 K Street,
N.W., Washington 7, D. C. If you have any baking questions,
send them along and they will be answered in future columns.

KITCHEN HINTS
Stale cake or cookies (if there is any!) can be crumbled and

•used over fruit desserts and puddings. Day-old pound cake is
delicious toasted and served with ice cream ... WHEN USING
PARSLEY AS A GARNISH, BE SURE TO HAVE YOUR
FAMILY TRY ITS DISTINCTIVE FLAVOR. PARSLEY IS
ONE OF OUR HIGHEST SOURCES OF VITAMIN C . . .
There is no need to peel an onion that will be sliced. Outer skin
will fall away from each slice as it is cut . . . TO PREVENT
DISCOLORATION WHEN CUTTING APPLES, PEARS AND
BANANAS FOR SALADS—BRUSH WITH LEMON JUICE.

4240224321221-312243121402240214022•022402243122•022402240224022402210142.
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New Brick 3-Bedroom Ranch-Type Homes Atu
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MONOCACY DRIVE-IN
Friday, Saturday, Sunday, May 3 — 4 — 5

! GIANT DOUBLE FEATURE !
ELVIS PRESLEY as

"KID GALAHAD"
— Also —

"SATAN'S SATELLITES"

Adults, 65¢ Children, Free
sHOW STARTS AT DUSK

•

•
•
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Place your order

shoulder or wrist

and boutonnieres

Junior - Senior

now for

corsages

for the

Prom

ORDER BY MAY 3

THE FLOWER SHOP

27 FREDERICK ST.

PHONE: PL 6-6320

I, II

I 
BASEBALL

I

I 

Sunday, May 5

TANEYTOWN
1VS

I 

McSHERRYSTOWN

at 1
I Taneytown Mem. Park i

2:30 P. M.

I
11111MINIOMMINIRIMNIIIIIMIIIIIIID•asill

LOIMMIIMM II 411111.10,

I HYBRID SEED CORN I

PIONEER

• HIGH YIELDING

I GOOD STANDING

90 to 120 day maturities

Available throughout the

planting season.

PAUL F. BROWER .
PHONE PL 6-5484

TANEYTOWN, MD.

5-3-tf I

11111111111111111 INII I II II

Clean, hard,
green feed

-nutritionally
power-packed

for fop
results!

RABB, ,0
RATION I 

•

•

•

•

•

•

FOR SHOW. MEAT
OR FUR . . . FEED WAY N E
Valuable merchandise prize and
rabbitry item coupons in every baq.

THE REINDOLLAR CO,

TANEYTOWN, MD.

M

Protect
your boating

investment

with the new Superior Out-
board insurance policy.* Gives
you complete protection for
your outboard motor, out-
board boat, boating equipment
and trailer.

Boating accidents can be ex-
pensive. For only a small frac-
tion of the original cost of your
equipment, you may avoid the
financial loss that can be
caused by: loss or damage by
fire, theft, explosion, collision,
or windstorm; collision dam-
age for which you are legally
liable to another boat; loss or
damage while hauling the boat
or loading or unloading it
from trailer and many other
causes.
'Approved and recommended by Out-
board Boating Club at America.

For details phone or write:

ROBERT L. ZENTZ
TANEYTOWN, MD.

PHONE PL 6-5301

representing
FEDERAL MUTUAL

INSURANCE COMPANY
A Division of KEMPER !nsurance

Chicago 6 .

4-25-3t

TANEYTOWN GRAIN MARKETS

WHEAT ............ . ..............._  $1.90
BARLEY $1.10 
OAT i   $ .75
CORN   $1.40

WHY MOTORISTS PUSH
THE PANIC BUTTON

The frenzy on our freeways make
some motorists tense. What causes
this tension and is it good or bad?
Here is an article every motorists
. . . and passenger should read. Don't
miss the revealing facts on what hap-
pens to drivers . . . In May 5th
issue of

THE AMERICAN WEEKLY

Magazine in Colorgravure exclusively
with

THE BALTIMORE AMERICAN

on sale at your local newsdaler
Delmar E. Riffle, Agent

DOLLAR SALE
MAY 2 — MAY 3 — MAY 4

Musselman

APPLESAUCE 8
Blue Ribbon

303 calls $1.

MARGARINE 7 lbs. $1.00

Waldorf

TOILET TISSUE 12 rolls $1.00

BC - BN - BT

Breakfast Drink 3 for $1.00

USDA Good

Round Steak

DUTCH FARMS

Frozen

French Fries
6 pkgs. $ 1.00

DUTCH FARMS

Frozen

LIMA BEANS
5 for $1.00

Hahn's HAMS 47c lb. Hahn's BACON
whole or half

79c lb'

55c lb.
No.!

IFSIOSBIBISSEM8181903160318181018181806181018188FA•

CRISP ICEBERG FRESH 
FRESH

if

gII 
 
LETTUCE Cucumbers Pineapples

2 lge. heads 29c 3 lge. size 25c 29c each
g
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Dougherty's Superette
On the Square Taneytown

We Give UNITED Stamps

Phone PL 6 6226

AMERICAN HARDWARE STORES........
z:,1SPRING.......

MIMS 
OF 
 OAIVINS

SALE:
• • •

WE'VE 500 STORE, TRUCK-LOAD BUYING POWER!

OUR BIG SPRING SALE STARTS FRIDAY, MAY 3rd

AND ENDS MAY 11th

See the bargains below, and many others in our store

on display.

OUR 7" SHOP—RATED
ELECTRIC SAW

2738

GAL. WHITE
HERITAGE HOUSE PAINT

4.88

DU PONT LAWN
WEED KILLER--8 OZ.

1.2.5

50—FT. (=ARDEN HOSE
& FREE NOZZLE

4•49

BERNZ BLCWTORCH
CYLiNDERS

GAL. HERITAGE LATEX
FLAT WALL PAINT

3.88

REINDOLLAR BROS. & CO.

a

PO YOU FEEL
STRAW /N((
STRAW
Ma? o

0

If you have recently moved to our 
community,

you may still feel strange because you 
aren't

used to us, yet. We are glad you are 
here and

want to help you get settled right away.

Come into our bank and tell the first 
employee

you see that you are new here ... and 
see how

fast you will make a whole new set of friends

... and who can feel strange with their 
friends?

The Birnie Trust Company
(Member of the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation)

TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

PitoTte44
through SERVICE

That is the theme of the Centennial marked by
the Nation's commercial banks this year. •

Much of the past century's great advance in bank-

ing service, and thus in progress for countless

Americans, can be traced to the National Cur-

rency Act of 1863 — which produced the dual

banking system of state and national banks. So on

the 100th anniversary of that Act and that system,

there is much to celebrate!

First National Bank
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

MEMBER FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM

(Member of the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation)

HEADQUARTERS FOR

MOTHER'S DAY FLOWERS

Including: Potted Plants, Novelties and Carnations.

CORSAGES BY ORDER ONLY!!

NONE LATER THAN MAY 9th AT 12 NOON

F. E. SHAUM'S MEAT MARKET

... for better TV reception—in color,

black and white—FM Stereo—anywhere
DEVELOPED BY THE UNIVERSITY OF ILLINOIS, adapted to Air Force

satellite communications, the JFD log-periodic LPV masses 
unpre-

cedented power, to reach out for every picture detail. Focuses 
with

unmatched precision, to bring in only the signal you're tuned to—

without noise, snow or ghosts—regardless of distance or terrain.
 Get

better reception than you thought possible with your present set. Be

glad to show you.•

Ei,cius,v.iy by .320Mecir;i?2:83.,TZ-1.1°,AL1.8.,,:4V1t:;,gg.'s 2=1,1:Z-ling. P`°°"`"

JFD PERIODIC LPLOG

NOW AT ...

FRITZ'S RADIO 86 TV
11 George St., Phone: PL 6 - 5131


