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_ COMMUNITY LOCALS 
Mr. Edgar Fair, who was taken ill

on Sunday, is improving.

Stewart F. King, Taneytown Route
2, who has been quite ill is improving
nicely.

Hesson-Snider Post American Le-
gion will hold an Open House Friday
evening, March 2nd.

Mrs. Edward Howarth returned
home Tuesday after two weeks at the
Annie Warner Hospital, Gettysburg.

Mrs. Kenneth Koutz entered the
Woman's Hospital, Baltimore, Tues-
day, and underwent an operation on
Wednesday.

Mrs. John Griffin, Mrs. D. Blundell
Taylor and Miss Nellie Kelly, Balti-
more, were guests on Sunday of the
Misses Brining.

Mrs. Elma Shoemaker returned
home Saturday from a week's visit
with her brother and sisters, and their
families, at Thurmont.

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Hesson and
Miss Mary Fringer were dinner guests
on Tuesday of Doctor and Mrs. Mau-
rice Wentz, York, Pa.

Miss Amelia and Elizabeth Annan,
spent from Tuesday until Sunday with
Mr. and Mrs. J. B. Mowbry-Clarke and
daughter, Hester, at Bethesda.

Mrs. G. Wilbur Naylor, Sr., spent
from Wednesday until Sunday evening
with her son-in-law and daughter and
their son, Arthur, at Takoma Park.

The Rev. and Mrs. Stanley B. Jen-
nings and daughters, Kathy and Su-
san, were supper guests last Thursday
evening of Mr. and Mrs. C. C. Hess.

Merwyn C. Fuss will address the
Brotherhoods of the Georgia-Alabama
Synod at their annual Convention at
Savannah, Georgia, Friday and Satur-
day.

Mrs. Emma Rodgers, who was bed-
fast with bronchitis for several days,
is better and is now able to be up.
Mrs. Myrtle Koons is taking care of
her.

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Zollickoffer,
Uniontown, recently bought the home
of Mrs. Mamie Storm on Franklin St.,
Taneytown, and .plan to occupy it in
the spring.

Mrs. Ella Rapp, a guest at the Na-
tional Lutheran Home, Washington,
D. C., and a former near Taneytown
resident observed her 91st birthday,
on Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Henry H. Alexander
have announced the birth of a daugh-
ter, Carol Ann Alexander born Febru-
ary 23rd at the Maryland General
Hospital, Baltimore.

The regular meeting of the Amer-
ican Legion Auxiliary will be held
this (Thursday) evening at 8 o'clock.
Mrs. Mabel Needy, District Vice-
.president, will be present.

The three Presbyterian churches,
Emmitsburg, Taneytown and Piney
Creek together are having a reception
and shower for their pastor and wife,
the Rev. and Mrs. Gideon E. Galam-
bos, this evening (Thursday) at the
social hall at Piney Creek church.

Week-end guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Harry Mohney were Mr. and Mrs. N.

et.. R. Palmer, of Sweet Hall, Va., Miss-4
Elizabeth Palmer, Frederick, and Miss
Martha Harmon, of town. Saturday
evening they all motored to Hershey,
Pa., to see the beautiful Ice Capades.

During the storm on Saturday Mrs.
Thurlow Null, near Harney, received
a hip injury. She was at the Annie
Warner Hospital, Gettysburg, from
Sunday until Tuesday. Her daughter,
Mrs. Charles Russell, of Pampa, Tex-
as, arrived by plane on Monday to
help care for her.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Crist, Janet and
David, of Shoemakersville, Penna.,
and Mr. and Mrs. Paul Balthaser and
Beth, of Reading, Penna„ were dinner
guests Sunday of the Rev. and Mfrs.
Arthur W. Garvin. Rev. Floyd Ank-
erberg, of Chicago, Ill., also spent
the week with the Garvins.

Sterling Fritz appeared on WMAL-
TV last Friday evening. Mr. Fritz was

'shown receiving a large, beautiful
trophy that was awarded him for a
high score of 755 points in a 5-game
tournament of bowling. He was the
highest scorer in a field of 184 en-
trants at a Rockville Bowling Center
on February 12th. Mrs. Fritz and son
Leon were in the studio in Washing-
ton to see their husband and father
receive the award.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer D. Ohler and
mother, Mrs. Harry Ohler have re-
turned home from a very pleasant trip
to Miami, Florida. On their way
south they visited St. Augustine, Day-
tona Beach, Orlando and Lake Wales.
On their way home they traveled west
to Fort Myers, then north through
Sarasota, St. Petersburg and Tampa.
On their last day in Florida they vis-
ited Silver Springs. The weather was
pleasant. Mrs. Ohler who is in her
81st year stood the trip especially well
and seemed to enjoy every bit of it.

CARD OF THANKS

I'd like to take this opportunity to
thank the ladies of the Auxiliary who
helped so wonderful on Saturday to
make our supper a success. Also to
those members and social members
who gave their time and effort for
this event. Thanks again.

ROY B. OVERHOLTZER,
Post Commander

V.F.W. 6918, Harney.

11 HIGH SCHOOL HIGHLIGHTS

Agriculture Class Judges Swine
The agriculture class under the

direction of their teacher, Mr. Reese
Poffenberger, participated in the
Hampshire Swine Judging Contest
sponsored by the Purebred Hamp_
shire Breeders Association in Freder-
ick, Md„ on February 22.
Boys in 4-H and FFA work were

eligible to enter. As no definite area
was designated in which a contestant
must live, boys entered from Ohio and
Virginia.
Judging from the Taneytown chap-

ter were Larry Barnhart, Lavern Al-
baugh, Charles Becker, Henry Lip-
pincott, Leroy Barnes Ray Cluck,
Daniel Ridinger Albert Angell, James
Colson, Clarence Hyser, William Crap-
ster, and Glen Copenhaver. James Col-
son won fourth place and was award-
ed a purebred Hampshire gilt. Col-
son's score of 174 points was only 6
points below the first award winner.

Mrs. Edmund Welker, Mr. Victor
Makovitch, and Mr. Ned Musser on
Monday attended a meeting of county
science teachers at the Medical Cen-
ter in Westminster. The topic of the
session was "Strengthening the
Science Program in our Schools".
Miss Arlene Naylor has been noti-

fied, by the D. A. R. that she is the
Taneytown school winner in the re-
cent D. A. R. Good Citizenship Essay
Contest for senior girls. She and her
mother, Mrs. Wilbur Naylor, will at-
tend the D.A.R. Good Citizens Pro-
gram at the Historical House, West-
minster, on March 9 at which time
pins will be awarded and the county
winnpr named.

Key Club News
A movie entitled the "Objectives of

the Kiwanis Club", was shown to the
Key Club on February 24 by Kiwan-
ian Miles Reifsnyder.

Connie Arvin, Larry Feeser, Jack
Mooney, and Mr. Andrew Mason at-
tetnded a Division meeting in Balti-
more at Patterson Park High School
on February 28.
Ten members will attend the Cap-

ital District Convention on March 9,
10 and 11 at the Shoreham Hotel in
Washington, D. C. These represen-
tatives will be John Reever,
Lamar Hilterbrick, Jack Mooney,
Glen Copenhaver, Robert Fuss, John
Skiles, Robert Clingan, Larry Feeser,
and Ronald Welker:.
The Kiwanis Clu breceived help at

the Shrimp and Oyster Feed on Feb-
ruary 29 from the following members:
Glen Copenhaver, Frank Henshaw,
Jack Mooney, John Reever, Leonard
Wantz, George Crouse, and Larry
Feeser.
Larry Ohler was elected junior class

director to the Board. The Board met
at John Reever's home on February
26.

MEETING OF THE JUNIOR

CHAMBER OF COMMERCE

A meeting of the newly organized
Junior Chamber of Commerce was
held Monday evening at the American
Legion Home, at which time copies
of the Constitution and By-Laws were
presented and approved by the mem-
bers.
A membership drive was begun by

the chapter with Elwood Harner,
Harry Dougherty, Jr., and Delmont
Koons serving as the committee. Mem-
bership is open to all young men be-
tween the ages of 21 and 35. Those
who wish to become charter members
are requested to have their dues paid
by March 15. Join now and receive
leadership training and many other
advantages the Jaycees have to offer
that will be beneficial to you and to
the community you servet.
Plans are in process for a charter

night and banquet to be held in the
near future. More information as to
the date will be available after the
regular board meeting, whicli will be
held March 20.
To supplement the treasury fund a

screw driver campaign is being put
on with Robert Waddell as chairman.
The screw drivers come sets of seven
plus a metal rack or storing. Each
set will sell for one dollar.
The next Inembership meeting will

be held March 26.

HARNEY 4-H NEWS

February 28, the Harney 4-H Club
held their monthly meeting at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Luther Angell
with 15 members present.
The meeting was called to order by

the president Clyde Weant, by repeat-
ing the 4-H Pledge. The roll call wasto name in what ways is electricity
being used on the farm. There will bea district meeting at the Taneytown
High School on Tuesday March 6, dur-ing National 4-H Club Week. The
Harney Club will participate in this
program. There will be a Citizenship
Tour to points of interest in Wash-ington on Safurday, March 10. This
event is state-wide.
Gene Angell gave a demonstration

on wiring an electric lamp.
Delicious refreshments were served

and enjoyed by everyone. The next
meeting will be Parents' Night and
will be held in the Harney Theater.

YOUNG REPUBLICAN CLUB WILL
DINE

The Young Republican Club of Car-
roll county is having a banquet at
the American Legion Home, West-
ster, Apr. 19 at 7 p. m. The speaker
will be Charles McWhorter chairman
of the National Federation of Young
Republican Clubs. Tickets may be
secured from any young Republican
member or reservation may be made
by calling 1163-W.

••••

$1.00 Al' BIB IN ADVANCE

ANNUAL BANQUET SPRING MUSICALE

Lutli-OF BASEBALL CLUB March 11th

Meeting NW on
Saturday Evening

Real indications of the coming of
Spring was manifested last Saturday
evening when an enthusiastic group
of baseball fans dined in the Parish
Hall of Grace Reformed church. The
ladies of the Women's Guild served
the sumptuous repast.
Elwood Baumgardner acted as mas-

ter of ceremonies and introduced the
speaker, Mr. Andrew Mason, princi-
pal of Taneytown High school, who
spoke on "Playing the Game." He
stressed during his\ remarks that "fair
play is an important practice in the
game of baseball as it is in the every-
day walk of life."
Harry Clingan was presented a

Sunbeam shaver for his untiring ef-
forts in making baseball possible for
Taneytown. The club also presented
a cuff links and tie clasp set to Au-
gustus Shank for his services as field
manager and coach of the Taneytown
team.
Mr. Shank told of the high hopes he

has for the club the coming season
with the acquisition of several new
players. The club which has stepped
up into higher "society" by entering
the Pen-Mar League will have four
pitchers and two catchers and a well-
round group of players for this sum-
mer's games.

Fifty-three persons were present.
With enthusiastic support the Taney-
town Baseball Club will give a good
accounting of itself this summer.

MEETING OF T. B. ASSOCIATION

The Board of Directors of the Car-
roll County Tuberculosis Association
met on Monday evening with interest-
ed persons from Howard County to
discuss the possibility of organizing
the work on a bi-county basis. Rev.
Frederick R. Seibel presided.
Dr. Theodore R. Shrop, Health

Officer of Howard County, Mrs. Doro-
thy Herbert, Public Health Nurse, and
Mrs. Henry Miller, president of the
Civic Women's Club, represented How-
ard County.
Board members present from the

Carroll County Tuberculosis Associa-
tion were Mrs. Paul Lawyer, Mr. P. G.
Coffman, Mr. Raymond Buchman,
Mrs. Arthur B. Shipley, Mr. Ernest
Dunbar, Mr. Charles Stonesifer, Mr.
Francis Gates and Mrs. Dorothy Rine-
hart, administrative secretary.
Representing the Carroll County

Health Department were Dr. George
Schochet, Health Officer, and Miss
Maude Hanahan, supervisor of Public
Health Nurses.
Present from Maryland Tuberculo-

sis Association were Mr. Frank
Jones, Executive Director, William B.
Matthews, Executive Secretaw, and
Mr. G. Frederick Pritchett, Director
of Field Services.

It was concluded after discussion
that representative from Howard
County would meet with a larger
group of interested people from their
county. If favorable reaction to the
plan is evidenced, a joint meeting of
representatives from the two counties
will be held at a later date to formu-
late plans.

PIANO AND VOICE RECITAL

The music department at Western
Maryland College has announced sev-
eral recitals to be held during the
coming weeks.
A joint piano and voice recital will

be given by the Misses Fairy Frock
and Nancy Kemmerer, on Friday,
March 2, at 8 p. m., in the recital
room of Levine Hall.
On Tuesday, March 6, David Bal-

corn, baritone, will present a recital
at 4:15 p. m.

Charlotte Ridgely, soprano, will
present her recital on Sunday after-
noon, March 11, at 3:30 p. m., and
Betty Ely, soprano, will be heard on
Tuesday, March 13, at 4:15 p. m.

All the vocalists are senior students
of professor Alfred deLong. Miss
Frock studies piano under professor
Oliver K. Spangler. All the programs
will be given in the recital hall of
Levine Hall at the College, and the
public is invited.

REGISTRATION OF
FIRST GRADERS

Registration of children who will
enter the first grade of Taneytown
Elementary School this coming
September will be held on Thursday,
April 5, between 9:30 and 1:00 in the
school library. Families new to the
community, whose childrenn were not
counted in last year's school census,
are asked to contact the school so
that our estimate of enrollment may
be as accurate as possible. On regis-
tration day parents are reminded to
bring the vaccination and immuniza-
tion records together with the child's
birth certificate.

SPECIAL WORSHIP SERVICE

There will be a special evening
service of music and choruses with
the showing of an outstanding re-
ligious film, called "Beyond Our Own"
in the Taneytown E.U.B. Church at
7:30 p. m., Sunday. This service fol-
lows the Sr. Christian Endeavor meet-
ing at 6:30 p. yr. The picture shows
the losing of one's faith in God be-
cause of conditions surrounding the
living conditions and then the way the
lawyer found the faith in God to re-
new his interest in serving his com-
munity. The public is cordially in-
vited to these services.

There will be a Spring Musicale,
March 11, 1956 at 7:30 p. m. in the
Lutheran Church, Taneytown, Md.,
sponsored by the Men's Brotherhood
of that church. Barring unforseen
developments such as sickness, etc.,
the following program is listed: Pre-
lude, Mr. Philip Royer, Supervisor of
Music for Carroll County, Professor
of violin and Director of the Little
Symphony Orchestra, Western Mary-
land College, Westminster, Md.; invo-
cation by the Reverend Stanley B.
Jennings, Pastor of Trinity Lutheran
Church, (Taneytown; Hymn, entire
congregation; Hampstead Methodist
Church, Little Jewels, this is a quar-
tet composed of small children; Pres-
byterian Church, Taneytown, Youth
Choir and Duet; Reformed church,
Taneytown, Ser. Choir, United Breth-
ren church, Taneytown, trio;St. James
Lutheran Church, Littlestown; Chil-
dren's Choir; Offertory, Mr. Philip
Royer; Lutheran Church, Emmits-
burg, Md., Youth Choir and Senior
Choir; Church of God, Uniontown,
Vocal Solo; Moravian Church, Grace-
ham, Md., Senior Choir; Remarks by
Brotherhood President followed by
hymn by entire congregation.
The public is invited to this pro-

gram and it is hoped that many will
want to enjoy this evening of wor-
ship through song. The committee
responsible for arranging and contact-
tacting various churches, choirs or-
ganizations, etc. is composed of El-
wood Harner, Chairman, James Fair,
Henry Reindollar, and George Naylor,
Jr., president of the Brotherhood.
There will be a short Fellowship

Period immediately following the pro-
gram for those participating in the
program in the Church School audi-
torium. The committee in charge of
this is composed of Mr. and Mrs. Per-
cy Putman, Chairmen, Mr. and Mrs.
Maurice Baker and Mr. and Mrs. El-
bert Crum.

A CONCERT

The concert at the Lyric Theatre,
Baltimore, by the National Symphony
Orchestra, on Tuesday evening, How-
ard Mitchell, music directdr, featuring
the noted violinist, Yehudi Menuhin
was a rare treat. The program was:
Overtiure to the opera, "Semiramide"
by Rossini; Symphony No. 7 'by
Prokofiev.
The second half of the program was

Concerto in D major for violin and
Orchestra, Opus 77 by Brahms.
Mr. Menuhin most graciously re-

sponded with an extra number to ovet-
whelming applause from the capacity
audience.
The Presbyterian Eye, Ear and

Throat Charity Hospital will receive
some benefit from the concert wo-
men of the Baltimore Presbyterial
were somewhat interested in its pro-
duction.
TaneFtown folks who enjoyed the

concert were the Rev. and Mrs. Gid-
eon Galambos, the Misses Annan and
Miss Anna Galt.

LIONS CLUB NEWS

The Taneytown Lions Club met on
Tuesday evening at Taney Inn with
President, Raymond J. Perry, presid-
ing. Wilbert N. Hess was in charge
of the music. Luther Clabaugh was
officially inducted into the club by
harry Dougherty.
Mr. Robert Murphy, State Repre-

sentative of the American Red Cross
spoke to the club on "Disaster and De-
termination on Who Gets Disaster
Help." He said that "disaster help is
based on need, not loss, and the final
determination is decided by local
persons of the area or people affect-
ed."
The nation-wide quota that will be

aimed at in the drive for funds begin-
ning March 1, is $90,000,000.
Guests present from the Walkers-

ville Club were: R. Ward Stouffer, W.
Nelson Stouffer, Harry Filler and
Walter Zimmerman From the New
Windsor Club were: Edwin A. Eqg-
lar, George Bucher John, and J. Jean
John. Orville E. Keffer was the guest
of Lion Raymond Baker and Robert
Miller was the guest of Lion J. Alfred
Heltebridle.

EXECUTIVE COMMITTEE OF
ELMER WOLFE P.-T.A. MEETS

PTA executive committee of the El-
mer Wolfe school met on Monday eve-
ning the 27th at the school. Thirteen
members were present. Further plans
for the sale of the tickets for the cook-
ing demonstration to be held by the
Potomac Edison Co., in Taneytown at
the school on March, at 7:30, were
made. Tickets will be 50 cents and
all the proceeds will go to the PTA
selling the tickets. Tickets will be
available at the following places:
Green's Grocery, Middleburg; Cla-
baugh's Store, Detour; Mrs. Carl
Keefer, Linwood; Yingling's Meat
Market, Union Bridge; C and M Ap-
pliance; Union Bridge; Lou's Beauty
Shop, Union Bridge and Elmer Wolfe
School. The Treasurer reported
$297.27 in the treasury. Frank Bohn,
President, turned over a letter con-
cerning school lunches to Mr. KAtnow-
icz for futher study. Paul Bowman
and Ira Albaugh were appointed to
the school program advisory commit-
tee. This is a county committee. Mr.
Kanowicz thanked the group for the
basket of fruit which had been given
to him during his illness follow-
ing his automobile accident on the
icy Sunday several weeks ago. The
general March PTA meeting program
is in charge of Mrs. Rickell. This
will be on the subject "Johnny Can
Read." Special music will also be on
the program.

PRESIDENT AVAILABLE
FOR SECOND TERM

Eisenhower Announces Decision
Wednesday

President 'Dwight D. Eisenhower
answered the long-awaited question
that Americans have been asking—
Will he be willing to run for a sec-
ond term if asked? He made his an-
nouncement on Wednesday, ending a
long period of uncertainty and specu-
lation„at a news conference held just
five months and five days after his
Sept. 24 heart attack.
"My answer will be positive—that

is affirmative", Eisenhower said.
In Congress, there was jubilation

among Republican legislators. GOP
National Chairman Leonard Hall call-
it "the best possible news for all
Americans".
In the business and financial world,

repercussions were sharp and immedi-
ate. Stock prices bounced up on the
New York Stock Exchange. Buying
orders poured in so that the ticker
was about 19 minutes behind an- hour
after Eisenhower's announcement.
The President declined to say at

this time whether he favors Vice-
President Nixon as his running mate
again.
However, he again had Warm praise

for Nixon and called him a dedicated
public servant.

BROTHERHOOD MEETING

The Brotherhood of Trinity Luther-
an Church will hold their meeting
this month on March 8, at 7:30 p. m.
Due to Lenten Services we have
changed the date hoping that it will
not be necessary to change from our
regularly scheduled time again. The
meeting will begin promptly on time.
The program will be as follows: Harry
Dougherty, Jr., leader; Scripture by
Crawford Banks, Prayer by Elbert
Crum and the topic will be 'presented
by Ralph Davidson. Mr. Davidson
will speak on "In Living a Life of
Prayer". A short business meeting
will be held immediately following
the presentation of the topic with a
fellowship period closing out the eve-
ning's activities.
Mr. Merwyn Fuss has recently an-

nounced that the Brotherhood of Trin-
ity Lutheran Church, Taneytown, tied
for tenth place in membership for the
year 1955 among all the Lutheran
Churches in our United Lutheran
Churches of America. Mr. Fuss is
presently serving his second term of
office as President of this great na-
tional organization. The officers of
our local Brotherhood urge all mem-
bers and men of the congregation to
attend these monthly meetings and
make this a strong organization of our
church.
A fine slate of programs under the

direction of Glenn Bollinger have
been arranged for the year 1956.
Some of the things to look forward to
are as follows: A meeting in complete
charge of our Cub Scouts, Movie,
Picnic, the inviting of other Brother-
hoods to participate in meetings,
sports night, family night, and a din-
ner meeting. Let's support these ac-
tivities and show the committees who
are working so hard that their time is
not being used to no avail. ,

MEETING OF HISTORICAL
SOCIETY

Mr. James W. Foster, director of
the Maryland Historical Society will
be the speaker at the meeting of the
Historical Society of Carroll County
to be held at the home of the Society,
206 E. Main St., Westminster, at 8
o'clock, Thursday, March 8. The sub-
ject will be "History is big Business"
and it will deal with current activities
in connection with efforts to spread
appreciation of county and state his-
tory. The following will serve on the
hostess committee: Mrs. A. Earl Ship-
ley, Westminster; Mrs. James
er, Union Mills; Mrs. A. H. Carpenter
and Mrs. M. Coyne, of Taneytown.

RED CROSS DRIVE BEGINS
TQDAY

A group of volunteer workers met
in the Taneytown Firemen's building,
Tuesday evening to make plans for
the Red Cross Drive for funds that
begins March 1st. The meeting was
sponsored by the Taneytown Lions
Club and was under the supervision of
Robert Feeser, local chairman of the
drive. Spearheaded by the Lions
Club, plans are being made to contact
everyone in Taneytown and surround-
ing communities. Instructions and
materials were given out.
Should anyone be missed or. if

found more convenient, your contribu-
tions can be left with Mr. Feeser of
Rob-Ellen Shop or Mr. Murray Baum-
gardner of The Birnie Trust Company.
Anyone wishing to volunteer in this

work of soliciting please contact Mr.
Feeser, chairman of the Taneytown
District.

---0 
MEETING OF GRAY LADIES

A meeting of the Carroll County
Gray Ladies of the American Red
Cross met at the home of Mrs. Ed-
ward Martin, Friday, Feb. 10 at 8 p.
m. There were twenty members pres-
ent and four visitors.
The Chairman, Mrs. Robert Baum-

gardner held an interesting business
meeting. Mrs. Melvin Meredith gave
a talk explaining the work of Wo-
men's Auxiliary of Springfield State
Hospital, Sykesville, Md.
The next meeting will be held in

Taneytown at the home of Mrs. Car-
roll Hess, April 6th at 8 p.

"SPICE 'N' EVERYTHING NICE"
(Your Chatty Column)

With all my heart, I wish you everymorning
ft. smile that shall last until the next daredawning.
I wish you health—life's grea.est wealth!I wish you always near so that I may helpto cheer
Each future day and in some way—helpto bring you happiness!
Despite the extremely cold day andsharp, biting wind, Your Observer

ventured 'down town' on Washing-ton's birthday for the big sales whichwere advertised to make note justfor this Column.
Parking the car at the "Boat Show"at the Armory, I ventured to bravethe wind and hugged my coat closer

around me as I walked the distanceto the shopping district. The bright
Mr. Sun did not help any and on the
special corners it felt as though I
was up in Alaska! As I walked along
"Antique Row"—there I saw that
grand Oyster House of Dunlop's as
of old and where I had not dined for
over two years. I thought that hot
eyster stew for which they have al-
ways been famous would warm me
and as I opened the door exactly at
10 a. m. I saw a different proprietor.
When I inquired about the other man
who had been there for so many years
with his lovely wife, he told me that
he passed away just two years ago!
However, when the stew came on it

was the very same—a delicious one
with big fat oysters so the name of
'Dunlop" will still be on the map!
As I continued to walk down How-

ard street, I noticed all the "Antique"
stores were closed with a little sign
on each front door, "Open at noon!"
Then, I took a long look at the grand
new Maryland General Hospital which
will soon be completed. The old part
then on the other side will be torn
down as soon as this is in readiness to
accept the patients.
The jam of cars was terrific as

though it was a parade as it was mov-
ing very slowly toward the shopping
district.
The "Virginia Dare" candy store

(CoLitinued on fourth page)

MARYLAND COOPERATIVE MILK
PRODUCERS ELECTS OFFICERS

Edgar G. Emrich of Emmitsburg,
Md., was announced as new presi-
dent of the Maryland Cooperative Milk
Producers, Inc., succeeding C. M.
Merryman, of Jarrettsville, Md., who
had retired after 15 years of service
on the Board of the organization, and
5 years as president. John S. Murphy,
Woodbine, Pa., was elected vice-
president and W. P. Sadler, Baltimore,
as Secretary-Treasurer. Chester G.
Ernst, Clear Spring, Md., was elected
to serve with the president and vice-
president on the executive committee.
This announcement followed meet-

ing of the 'Board of Directors of the
Assocaition, held recently for the pur-
pose, following the annual member-
ship meeting at the Lord Baltimore
Hotel, Feb. 25 at which time Edwin
0. Adams, Jr., Clarksville, Md.; Ches-
ter G. Ernst, Clear Spring, Md.; Hu-
bert J. Null, Taneytown, Md.; Daniel
B. Smith, Ijamsville, Md.; and Ross
S. Todd Bel Air, Md., were confirmed
for three-year terms on the fourteen-
man board.
Maryland Coouerative Milk Produc-

ers, Inc., is an association of approx-
imately 2300 dairy farmers mostly in
Maryland, but also in Virginia, West
Virginia and Penna., who supply
the distributors of milk in Baltimore
and its suburbs with more than 80 per
cent of the milk used in the Baltimore
metropolitan area.

KI-WIirES HEAR ATTORNEY

On Monday evening the Ki-Wives
of Taneytown heard Mr. David H.
Taylor, of Westminster speak on the
value of a will. The attorney pointed
out steps to be taken before consultnig
your lawyer and told of situations that
could be avoided by having a will.
Mr. Taylor then answered questions
that were, asked. During the busi-
nees meeting Mrs. Wallace Yingling
said the Ki-Wives have been invited
to be the choir for the Easter Sun-
rise Service at the Lutheran Church,
Taneytown. Each year this service
is sponsored by the Kiwanis Club. ,

Mrs. David H. Taylor and Miss
Helen Bankard were guests.
A thank-you note for the $25 check

given to purchase two cots for the
school for Retarded children, at
Westminster, was read.

HARNEY FIRE CO. AUXILIARY

Regular meeting of the Harney Vol.
Fire Co. Auxiliary was held on Tues-
day evening, Feb. 28, at which time
Mrs. Davis, Past President of the New
Windsor Fire Co. Auxiliary installed
the following officers for the coming
year: President, Mrs. Marlin Six, Sr.;
Vice-Pres., Mrs. Chester Moose; Sec.,
Mrs. Stuart Dom; Fin. Sec., Mrs. Nor-
man Welty; Treas., Mrs. Elwood
Strickhouser; Historian, Mrs. James
Hall and Chaplain, Mrs. Erman Chip-
ley.
31 members answered to roll-call.

There were 3 guests present. Enter-
tainment and refreshments were en-
iovPri site,. the meetine.. A special
meeting will be held March 14th, in
tne leire hall.

BROWNIE NEWS—TROOP 820

The cookie sale is now under way.
Brownies of Troop 820 are prepared
to do their part to raise funds for the
Girl Scout camp fund.
Each girl is asked to sell a minimum

of two cartoons of cookies. As soon as
one carton is sold another can be had
by contacting the leaders, either by
phone or at the regular Monday meet-
ing.

Since an early report must be sent
into the Baltimore Office, it is import-
ant that all sales so far be recorded
Monday and the money turned in.
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GRASS ROOTS OPINION

COVINGTON, TENN., LEADER:

"We feel that labor unions have serv-

ed useful purposes in the past. How-

ever, if they are to continue to serve

the best interests of the people, labor

leaders must realize that restrictive

tactics and leather-bedding' produce

not more jobs, but fewer jobs in this

age of mass-production, prefabrication

and automation."

OGALLALA, NEBR., NEWS: "Fi--

nancial statement of the major com-

panies show that the packers, by an

almost unbelievable elimination of

waste and development of profitable

by-products,, reflect an efficient job

and at a margin of a small fraction

of one penny for each dollar volume

of business".

NORWALK, CONN., HOUR: "The

common economic goal of the free

world, to discourage communism, is

removing barriers to the flow of cap-

ital. The opportunities are fabulous.

By strengthening capitalism abroad,

we are strengthening th'e free enter-

prise system, which is basic to our

own way of life."

PLAINFIELD, IND., MESSENG-

ER: "We do not need to look to the

federal government for help. Let's

learn again the fine art of taking care

of ourselves and our own."

HOMETOWN JUBILEE

Talented men, women, boys and

girls of this community will have
 an

opportunity to ' take part in the 
all

star comedy revue, HOMETOWN

JUBILEE, to be presented by the

Harney V. F. W. and Auxiliary on 
the

nights of March 16th and 17th.

Hometown Jubilee is a two-hour

fun-fest, a combination of music,

song, and comedy skits and pretty

girls in colorful costumes.

A Golden Wedding couple (or
 may

be couple married greatest 
number of

years) will be honored each n
ight of

Hometown Jubilee, and the show

takes them back through th
e years

with songs and sketches.

A Salute to the Red, W
hite and

Blue presents a stirring 
tribute with

the. chorus in bright military cos-

tumes. A stage full of yo
ungsters at-

tend Glamour School, and 
bring to all

the magic of make-believe. A
 tribute

to the churches of this 
community

adds a reverential note.

Three local citizens will 
imperson-

ate Bob Hope, Bing Crosby 
and Dinah

Shore. A pair of "country boys",

Tobias T. Ticklebush and his little

brother arrived for the Jubi
lee and

end up staging a show of 
their own,

both in the audience and on 
stage.

An old-time proposal scene 
between

Earnest Higginbottom and Miss 
Fan-

ny Farnsworthy is followed by an

ultra mode-n proposal, betwee
n Butch

and Babe, and the old time
 meller-

drammer will bring howls of l
aughter

over the sad plight of the Heroine,

the dastardly deeds of the 
Villain and

brave actions of the Hero.

Throughout the show the fast-step-

ping chorus line of pretty 
girls en-

chant with colorful costumes
, lovely

gowns, cute and clever routin
es.

Hattie Carbunkle is a famous 
fash-

ion designer who has designs
 on ev- I

e-yone. The high spot of the 
evening

is Hattie, with her Honey Bunny

oos, the darlings of the fashion

world. The rafters will ring when

•Clarilyn Mudrow. Rita Hayrack, 
Bet-

t Gobble and Irmintrude P
opgirdle,

all impersonated by men, 
step on

stage.
A professional director who 

has had

z:)ecial training in the production
 of

Hometown Jubilee will arrive 
approx-

imately two weeks prior to the 
enter-

tainment. She is a representative 
of

Redpath-Horner, famous old Chau-

tauqua company, which this 
year is

celebrating its own Golden Jubilee.

The Director will have charge of 
pro-

motion and production, including 
hold-

ir g rehearsal to teach the show 
meni-

hers of the cast.
Those who would like to take part

in Hometown Jubilee, including 
high

school and junior high school girls

for the chorus numbers, are asked 
to

contact Roy Overholtzer.
"Hometown Jubilee" promises to be

one of the biggest shows of its k
ind

ever presented here and it offers two

hours of good, clean fun for every

rr.emb.?,r of the family.

SAVE BY DUYIN 
By LOUIS LUDWIG

THERE are many' solid living

I values, as well as a lot of in-

teresting developments, in keep-

ing the furniture of your home

up-to-date in terms of you and

your family.
Many families buy furniture with

the expectation of having it last a

lifetime. Good furnitgre can, of

course—but furniture was made

for man, and not man for furni-

ture.

Many fine homemakers,

however, operate on a differ-

ent plan. They budget each

year for at least one, some-

times several, pieces of new
furniture. Families grow and

contract with the years, and
the entertainment of friends

and relatives grows and con-
tracts.

* * *

In studying furniture needs a

homemaker should always think of

her back. Dusting is a back-break-

ing job, and the less' there is the

better. Present furniture which re-
quires too much dusting should be
irrevocably slated for replacement.
So should furniture with promi-

nent scars. Ditto for furniture
which is no longer comfortable.
In modernizing your furniture

don't be afraid of mixing period
with modern. There are very, very

few well-executed rooms that are
strictly in one period. A good dec-
orator will combine pieces from
several different periods. Many
eighteenth-century pieces combine
well with modern because both
emphasize straight lines.

If you are at all doubtful of
what is appropriate, consult the in-
terior decorating department of
any reputable store. It is also al-
ways worthwhile to buy at such
a store, slice chicanery has long
been rife in the furniture trade.
A reputable store will stand
squarely behind its merchandise.

• * •

A leading interior decora-
tor gives these recommenda-
tions: "Pick furniture that is
appropriate. This means
'matching in' your new piece
with the old pieces; also with
the draperies and the floor cov-
ering. Select styles that har-
monize well. Remember that
there are good and bad ex-
amples of any period—insist
on getting the good. Buy pieces
that will fit your rooms, pieces
that are neither too large nor
too small.

* * •

An annual furniture budget, no
matter how small, will work won-
ders in keeping your home a real
"design for living."

MARYLAND WILDL;FE

Prepared by the MARYLAND GAME & INLAND FISH COMMISSION

GREEN SUNFISH

(Lepomis eyanellus)

RANGE: Found in almost every

State, and plentiful in many

waters of Maryland where it is

found generally along with the

bluegill and .other sunfishes; many

anglers catch them at Loch Raven

and other similar Maryland waters

and mistake them for bluegills.

DESCRIPTION: Is similar ,to the

common sunfish or pumpkin seed,
but has a much larger mouth than
that species and the bluegill;
average length around 5 to 6
inches. Rather a dark body with
tiny green specks; dark blotch on
dorsal and anal fins; white or
orange edge on fins; red eye.

BREEDING: Spawning habits
somewhat similar to those of other

in colonies in shallow water; male
guards the nest.

MANAGEMENT: Need little if
any protection if in proper habitat;
in fact has a tendency, like blue-
gills, to become overcrowded and
need thinning out by angling or
other means; scientists seem pretty
well agreed that members of the
sunfish family, with the exception
perhaps of the smallmouth and
largemouth black bass, need no
closed season.

HABITS: Eats insects, small fish;
garden worms favorite bait.

VALUE: Small but very good to
eat; no commercial value, but does
supply an army of anglers, young
and old—along with bluegills. com-
mon sunfish and other pan fish—

sunfishes; inclined to build nests with healthy outdoor recreation.

BY CHARLES B. ROTH

If Advertising Stopped
TAKE one minute, please, will
-I- you, to ponder on this subject:
Suppose every bit of advertising
were suddenly to stop, every bit
of it. What would happen?
One man in New York City, a

noted advertising man named Har-
old E. Fellows, did that, and his
conclusion is this: -It would be
more catastrophic than if Amer-
ica's principal cities were de-
stroyed 'by atomic bombs. For
this would be total destruction, not
only of cities, but of the entire
nation as well."

« «

You may think that Mr. Fel-
lows has gone pretty far in
making this statement. But if
you think of the effect of the
stoppage of advertising you
won't.

* •

The first thing that would hap-
pen, of course, is that those who
work directly or indirectly in ad-
vertising would immediately be
thrown out of work—the printers,
the writers, the suppliers of ink
and paper and presses, and oth-
ers who depend for a livelihood
upon that industry known as ad-
vertising. There are many mil-
lions of them. They would be the
first to fall.

But not the last. For presently
factories all over the country
would close down; no business.
Their employees, representing the
bulk of America's 60-odd million
workers, would be jobless. So
stores would begin closing, from
big city department stores to small
town grocers. Bread lines would
form.

Well it has been said that "man
does not live by bread alone."
He needs communication, com-
munion with his fellows, but ere
long he wouldn't have that. The
radio and TV stations would soon
go off the air and then one after
another newspapers would 'sus-
pend publication.

* * •

Then what would happen? It
would be the return to the
Dark Ages, and mankind
would slip back to where he
was there, Ito a wolfish, ani-
malish existence, degraded,
impoverished.

• *
•

All because .all advertising
stopped!
But don't worry too much about

this. Advertising is not going to
stop. It is going to increase, not
only in kind and amount, but in
its essential service to humanity.
That is what advertising really

human service institution.

Turkeys Chicks • Ducks >

AS HATCHED OR SEXED

* New Hamps. ' Wh. Rocks

* Leghorns * Sex Links

* Wyandotts * W:s an. Crosses

* In-Cross Hybrids

* STARTED CHICKS and

STARTED PULLETS

Write for Free Catalogue

and Price List

Milford Hatchery
Liberty Rd., Randallstown, Md.

Oldfield 3-5075

1-19-tf

Notice of

ANNUAL MEETING

The annual meeting of the stock-
holders of The Birnie Trust Company
will be held at the office of the Com-
pany in Taneytown, Md., on Monday,
March 12, 1956, between the hours of I
9 and 10 o'clock, A. M., for the elec-
tion of ten Directors to serve for the I
ensuing year, and for the transaction
of such other business as may proper-
ly come before this meeting.

THE BIRNIE TRUST COMPANY

CHARLES R. ARNOLD, Secretary. I

2-23-3t

STROUTSELLS REAL
ESTATE

Greatest advertiser of coun-

try property. Haw made over

76,000 sales of 'Homes — Farms —
Acreage. Buyers from all over the

World. Free open listing.

E. A. STROUT REALTY AGENCY

ROBERT L ZENTZ, Rep.
Uniontown Road

TANEYTOWN, MD.

Phone Taneytown 5301
12-1-tf

•
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FOOD SALE =
I SATURDAY, MARCH 3, I

at 10 a m. •

▪ FIRE HALL, TANEYTOWN I

!Grace Workers Class of Grace E.:
Benefit of

and R. Church.
le

I BAKED GOODS, SOUP,
CANDIES 110

2-23-2t1 cI

Ask the Welcome Wagon
Hostess About

The Carroll Record
— THE —

NVelcome NVagon
Hostess Is Your
Friendly Neighbor

. . . with greeting to families in your
community cai occasion of Births, En-
gagements, Changes of Residence, Ar-
rival of Newcomers.

TANEYTOWN

Phone Welcome Wagon

Taneytown 5524

no cost or obligation
11-10-tf

11-111111-164-1111-4111-11-1rolrilre rirmiria,.4
"To Buy or Sell" 19

REAL ESTATE 
.?:.

0,
p•

: 
see

:. I. S. CLAGEIT sod

e.

E Salesman for Z

P. B. ROOP Z
•
be Harney Rd. Phone 3671

: TANEYTOWN, MD. Z

t 
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goi
IFILILWILLt.t.c.kte /VA fatitVALII?e,p

o rot otoMoto oi0$44ototetelotelototolototot otototot calotstohnoto opctotottnototO

PUBLIC SALE
Iaving sold farm and discontinuing farming, will sell at Public

Sale, (7 miles S. W. of Taneytown, Carroll County, Md., 11/2 miles
N. W. of Detour, on "Six Bridge (hard) Road", g miles S. of Emmits-
burg), on

the following:

41 REGISTERED AYRSHIRE DAIRY CATTLE 41
24 Cows and 1st-Calf Heifers; 4 Bred Heifers; 5 Yearlings; 8 Heifer
Calves (5 to 8 months). This is a good farmer-breeder's herd. High
producing herd, even though no production records are available, herd
has been culled heavily for years. Rave used the best bulls in the
Md. Artificial breeding unit since 1948. Several freshened recently
prior to sale. Four are due in April, 1 in May, 2 in June, 2 in July,
7 in August and others in early fall. There are 11 granddaughters of
the Double Approved and Excellent Neshaminy Preferred, sire of 48
daughters with 126 records avg.: 12, 081 M 4.21% 512 F. Herd is
Bangs Certified. T. B. Accredited. Calfhood Vaccinated. Vaccinated
against Shipping Fever. Blood and T. B. test 30 days prior to sale.
Catalogs available. Cows will be sold at 1 p. m. (Under cover if in-
clement weather).

THURSDAY, MARCH 22, 1956,
Beginning at 10 a. m. (sharp)

DAIRY EQUIPMENT
2 Surge Milking Units and Pails (used 2 years); pipe line and stall
cocks for 24 cows; 2-unit Surge Pump; Wilson Electric cooler;
Surge "Dairy Maid" elec. water heater (practically new); double
wash tank, used two years; six 10-gal, milk cans, used 1 y,..; eight
7-gal. cans; Stewart elec. clippers; 2 Wheelbarrows, 1 rubber tire;
scrapers, forks, etc.

MACHINERY, IMPLEMENTS AND FEED
International Farmall Super M Tractor; International Farmall H
tractor, both like new; International cultivators for H or M; Mc-
Cormick-Deering mower, 7 ft. with hydraulic attachment, nearly
new; Ontario 7-13 disc grain drill, new; John Deere 14 in. tractor
plows #52; 32 disc harrow; Oliver 4-section lever harrow; 8 ft.
cultipacker; New Idea side delivery rake; McCormick-Deering 8 ft.
grain binder; 22 in. cylinder Frick steel thresher, good condition;
100 ft. rubber 7 in. drive belt; Dillinger 12 in. hammer mill; 60 ft.
rubber 7 in. drive belt; Blizzard ensilage cutter No. 600, up and down
pipe; Case hay loade7; Lavelle conveyor 24 ft.; flat bottom rubber
tire wagon; 2 farm wagons with beds; McCormick-Deering tractor
manure spreader; Clipper seed 'cleaner No. 1; power double-feed
corn sheller; hay fork, rope and pulleys; log and tractor chains; IA H.
P. reversible elec. motor; 36 ft. extension ladder; cross cut and hand
saws; 2 coal brooder stoves, feeders, fountains; harness of all kinds;
forge; anvil; vise; shovels; scythes; picks, axes, digging iron, heavy
block and tackle; steelyards; bag truck; iron kettle, lawn mower;
hay, ensilage, straw, McCormick-Deering corn planter fertilizer at-
tachment, trailing type. etc.

HOGS AND CHICKENS
2 Yorkshire sows and 2 Yorkshire gilts to farrow in April; 22 York-
shire shoats weighing about 125 lbs.; 375 R.O.P. Rhode Island Red

pullets, laying heavy.

HOUSEHOLD
3-piece walnut living room suite, davenport, wing and club chairs,

new floral tapestry upholstery; white enamel Home Comfort range,

waterfront, coal or wood, like new; Westinghouse electric range,

Chromlox units, good condition; 11 ft. extension table, (walnut round-

ends); Sellers kitchen cabinet;York piano, Weaver, excellent condition;

4 rockers; 3 wardrobes, antique chest of drawers, cherry; new brown

enamel iron bed and spring; white iron bed and spring; 1 dresser

with mirror; mattresses; heatrola, coal or wood; 4 hickory, round

back, plank chairs; 7 straight plank chairs; love seat and 2 ch
airs,

hard wood frames; lawn chairs; folding Army cot, 6 ft. 9 in.; 
round

mahogany stand; 2 linoleum rugs, 9x12 and 9x15; dinner set, se-
vice

for 12; dishes, cooking utensils, ornaments, picture fr
ames, cherry

seeder, apple peeler; crocks, jars, potatoes by bu. and 
etc.

TERMS: Cash in full day of sale. No goods to be removed until

settled for

ROY B. and HILDA S. KISER, Owners.
DETOUR, MARYLAND •

Phone Union Bridge 3143

Tom Whittaker and Earl Bowers, Auctioneers.

Carl Haines and Ralph Weybright, Clerks.

Members of Carroll Co. Christian Endeavor Union will serve Lunch
2-9 & 23 & 3-1-8-15

ite$8181818$3101810188818$908$980093819181E4008S90
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HERE'S NATIONWIDE
PROTECTION AGAINST

UNINSURED DRIVERS!

CONTACT:

J. Alfred Heltebridle
FRIZELLBURG, MARYLAND
Phone: Westminster 024W1

Phone: Taneytown 5141

FARM

It's called ALTERNA-
TIVE COMPENSA-
TION, and there's no
other coverage like it!
Protects you against
the uninsured driver

\ ...provides a prompt
settlement for bodily

\ injury to you or
\ any relative living
\ with you . . . no

matter what the
circumstances of

the accident. Add it to your Nation-

wide liability policy now and get

complete peace of mind. A Nation-

wide first . . . because Nationwide

is built on the idea of better and

newer coverages to more people at

less cost.

BUREAU MUTUAL AUTOMOBILE INSURANCE COMPANY

. of Ohio has changed its name to

ATION WIDE
MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY

HOME OFFICE • COLUMBUS, OHIO

Donated by the people of Carroll
arded children, this nine-passenger
pecial classes set up for them this
youngsters for now each day brings
.;ootten. This vehicle will be driven
Aitute driver. Operating expense

County through their contributions during the recent campaign for re-

Chevrolet station wagon is being used in transporting the children to the

ycar. Joy and happiness is written on the faces and in the hearts of these

new experiences, companionship, and opportunity—they are no longer for-

1r, Mr. Wagner Miller (shown at right) with Mr. Calvin Strine as sub-

and amortization wll be taken care of by th2 School Board.

S.

S.
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CURRENT EVENTS
FIFTY YEARS AGO

Eight dwellings will be built for
sure in Taneytown this year as fol-
lows: by Jacob H. Koons, on Baltimore
St.; by Ernest Bankard and John W.
Stouffer, on George St.; by the Re-
formed Parsonage and John A. Ying-
ling on Emmitsburg St., by Samuel H.
Little and John A. Null on Middle
St., by A. Cashman, on Baltimore St.
Four or five of these will be double
houses. There are also about four
more dwellings in prospect, for the
year, not definitely decided on at pre-
sent.

Myerly--Formwalt. On Thursday,
Feb. 22. a very pretty home wedding
took place at the residence of ,Jos.
Formwalt, near Tyrone, the contract-
ing parties being his eldest daughter,
Lillian Aola, and W. Sterling Myerly,
a sop of Calvin Myerly, of Frizell-
burg, Md. They were attended by
Mr. Guy Haines, bestinan, and Miss
Maggie Formwal, sister of the bride,
was bridesmaid. The ceremony was
performed by Rev. F. A. Cook, the
bride's pastor. Following the cere-
mony a reception was held and a wed-
ding luncheon served. The happy
couple left on the ast mail train for
a tour of Baltimore, Annapolis and
other places of interest. They will be
at home in Tyrone after April 1st.
Those present were: Mr. Jos. Form-
walt and wife, Wm. Formwalt and
wife; Guy S. Formwalt and wife,
Chas. Geiger and wife, Geo. D. Har-
man and wife, Roy Keefer and wife
Theo. Fowble and wife, Arthur Mas-
ter and wife Edw. Flohr and wife,
Arthur L. Copenhaver and wife, Mrs.
Calvin Myerly, mother of the groom,
and Mrs. Martin Eakle Misses Flor-
ence M., Margie B., C. Romaine, Grace
L. Formwalt, Bessie Myerly, B. Mae
Harman, Carrie Myers, Emma Crowl,
Daisy and Grace' Formwalt and Vera-
tas Eakle, Messrs. D. H. Hahn, Gil-
more Fowble, Marshall Myers, Guy
Haines, Harry R. Paul G. and Maurice
Formwalt, Pius SponseIler and Ernest
Fream.
Lincoln Ballots Cast in Carroll coun-

ty in 1860. A few years ago I publish-
ed the names of the persons who voted
for Abraham Lincoln in Carroll Coun-
ty, Md., in 1860. Inadvertently, some
narnes were omitted that should have
been in that roll of honor. The follow-
ing are the names of those persons
who braved the buffeting and insults
of party ire: Taneytown, Thomas D.
Thomson, Jos. M. Thomson, Daniel
Frock, Peter Marks, Benj. Fleagle,
Daniel Fleagle. Henry Shriner.

Among those who lived around Ot-
terdale sixty years ago were: Richard
N, Hess. William Fogle Shoemaker,
Seward Ridingelr Levi Sell, Susan
Ridinger, Santuel Hawn, Mollie Sny-
der, John Byers, Samuel J. Wive11,
Lewey Hemler, William Harmon, De.
Gardner, Stricker Angell, Jere Over-
holtzer, William Witherow and Sam-
uel Hocker. (Contributed by Melvin
T. Hess, 1-M, Taneytown, Md.)

"LITTLE FOXES"

A little more patience, a little more
charity for all, a little more devo-
tion, a little more love; and the race
will be ripe for a great burst of light
and life.—Elbert Hubbard.

Seeing that we have to attain to
the ministry of righteousness in all
things, we must not overlook small
things in goodness or in badness, for
"trifles make perfection" and "the
little foxes spoil the vines."—Mary
Baker Eddy.

The size of a man can be measured
by the size of the thing that makes
him angry.—J. K. Morley. \

Sandy MacGregor° says: Rainy day
or sunny ye"11 be glad ye saved your
money. Sign up for Savings Bonus
today, the easy payroll savings way.

New Comfort!
New Economy!*

OIL BOILER
• QUIET—smooth-runningl
• HOT WATER—from the

same unit!

• CLEAN—no oil smell or
soot!

• Completely AUTOMATIC!
'Home owners report fuel savings up
to 50%.

Phone for FREE
home heating survey

GENERAL (M ELECTRIC

WANTZ BROS., Inc.
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Phone 4541
2-16-4t

'PERCY M. BURKE
For all Your

INSURANCE net:dm

231 E. Main St.,

WESTMINSTER, MD.
Phone 112C

FOREST TREE SEEDLINGS FREE!
TO LANDOWNERS

The Department of Forests and
Parks is again furnishing forest trees
seedlings to landowners in Maryland.
These trees are furnished free for re-
forestation, soil and water conserva-
tion. Mar. is tree planting time in the
Northern Maryland district, which is
comprised of Baltimore, Carroll, Ce-cil, Harford, Kent and Queen Anne's
counties.

Species available this year are:
White pine, loblolly pine, Norway
spruce, Scotch pine and a limited sup-
ply of Virginia pine, yellow popular,
and black locust.
Upon receipt of request from the

landowner, a representative of the
Department of Forests and Parks wilt
examine the planting site and make
recommendations as to what species is
best suited for the site, the number
of trees needed, the best time to plant,
how to plant, and the care of trees
before and after planting.
The minimum order is 250 trees

or enough to reforest 1/4, acre of solid
planting. Furnishing trees for small
residential lots is not permitted as
this would be considered as orna-
mental planting and not a conserva-
tion practice.
A mechanical tree planter is avail-

able for use on larger areas. This
machine and all labor is available at
a cost of ten dollars an acre, with a
minimum charge of $25.00.

District Forester William A. Parr
said that landowners should apply
promptly to any employee of the De-
partment, -the District Office at Bel
Air, or to their county agent, to be
assured of getting trees this spring.
All tree orders are taken on a first
come, first served basis.

It's actually easy to save when you
buy U. S. Savings Bonds on the pay-
roll savings plan right where you
work. It's automatic, systematic.
Sign up now.

THE GOLDEN AGE—
There are legends which tell of a Golden Age
When wisdom and innocence set the stage;
But mythology says the senses caused the Fall,
That selfishness was back of it all.
Man was etheric when he first came;
He gave to the animals their name;
But, greed and passion it was, I find,
Which caused him to fall and change his mind.
He had not yet, through selfishness and pride,
Forgotten Him who was by his side;
So, a patriarch he was content to be,
For he did not crave no-to-ri-ety.
But as civilization prospered, he went down—
He gave a pound of peace for an ounce of renown;
As a patriarch, he was happy and free;
So, his pristine State was much better, you see.
Our present lifespan is only a day,
Compared with the years man is on his way
Back to God, and the things he has lost,
But he shall find Him at a terrible cost.
The Greeks and the Roinans placed the day
Under Saturn, when the "Golden Age" held sway;
They also said that it would return
When life's many lessons we all shall learn.
That return will mean a Paradise for all
Who dwell on this "terrestrial ball";
This earth shall be what God wants it to be,
The home of the soul through eternity.
The earth was common property in that day,
And, God intends to keep it that way;
It produced spontaneously, we are told—
That is why it was called the age of gold.
The land flowed with milk and honey, it is said,
Man did not toil for his daily bread;
Beasts of prey were at peace with all, they say
Because God told them to act that way.

Nothing can change God's great plan
To make earth a Paradise for man;
To round him out like Jesus of Galilee.
Is the way God intends that man shall be.

The "Age of Gold" has no counterpart in this;
It will be an eternal era of exquisite bliss;
Men shall know God, as in days of old,
And the truth about Him shall be told.

DAVID THOMAS REINDOLLAR,
2656 Edmondson Ave.,

Baltimore 23, Md.
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WFMD
NOW SIGNING ON AT 5:00 AM WITH INCREASED COVERAGE

930 on your dial

TANEYTOWN COMMUNITY PROGRAM
9:00 to 9:30 AM Thursdays

Weather forecast Monday thru Saturday
at 6:55 AM from Friendship

Int. Airport sponsored by

WOLF MOTOR CO., Westminster, Md.

AP News and Weather throughout the day
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Better and More Comfortable Vision
it is soggested that you visit the Professional offices of

DR. ARTHUR G. TRACEY, Optometrist
RERALL BUILDING, HAMPSTEAD, MARYLAND
Write or telephone Hampstead 011 for appointment

TUESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY SATURDAY

9 tu 12 a. m. 9 to 12 A. M. 9 to 12 A. M.
1 to 5 P. M. 1 to 5 P. M. 1 to 5 P. M.

9 to 12 A
1 to 5 P.M.
6 to 9 P.M.

EVENINGS BY SPECIAL APPOINTMENT

e

Now you can get up to

h.p. in a
Here's a big 312 cubic inch powerhouse with the most displacement in the low-price field.
Most torque, too. For you that means the greatest response—quickest getaway, swiftest
passing power. Teamed with Fordomatic in any Fairlane or Station Wagon model, this 225-h.p.
Thunderbird Special V-8 is the silkiest, quietest, thrillingest engine you have ever commanded.
It gives you more "go" for your dough—and you can order it now! Come in and see us today.

You can order it now! Get more Go for your dough!

Crouse Motor Sales
FORD DEALER

Phone 4331 Taneybwn, Md.
"Insure with Confidence"
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CORRESPONDENCE
Latest Items of Loa News Furaishe6

By Our Regular Staff of firitars
We desire correspondence to reach our

'thee on Wednesday, if at all possible. It
will be necessary, therefore, for most let-
ters to be mailed on Tuesday morning.
Letters mailed on Wednesday may not
reach us in time.

ROCKY RIDGE

The Mt. Tabor Sunday School will
hold a fried chicken supper in the
Firemen's Hall, on April 14.
Mr. and Mrs. Emma Wilson, Mr.

and Mrs. James Harry and children,
Diane and David, of Oakland; Miss
Myrtle Reck, of Uniontown, visited on
Sunday in the home of Mr. and Mrs.
Ralph Reck.

Mrs. William Johnson of Vance-
burg, Ky., is visiting her son-in-law
and daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Albert
Stambaugh.
Mr. and Mrs. George Schaffer, Sr.,

Mr. and Mrs. George Schaffer Jr., and
children, Beckie and Betty Lou, of
Germantown, Mrs. Frank Welch and
daughter, Nannie, of Thurmont, visit-
ed on Sunday with Mrs. Ethel Mum-
ma and Mr. and Mrs. Charles Mumma.
Mr. and Mrs. H. K. Albaugh, son

Ray, of Henrytown;Mr. and Mrs. Gay-
land Putman and son, Russell, of De-
tour, were recent visitors of Mr. and
Mrs. Charles Gruber.
A family night will be sponsored

early in March by the Rocky Ridge
Girls 4-H Club when they will invite
as guests families in the community
with daughters eligible for 4-H mem-
bership. A program will be planned

and refreshments served by a commit-

tee headed by Frances Susanne Hogt

and Catherine Stambaugh. Plans were
discussed at a meeting held February

with ten members present including
leader and assistant leader. A demon-

stration was given by Mrs. Stam-

baugh. President Patty Morgan ap-

pointed a sunshine committee compos-

ed of Barbara Miller and Catherine
Stambaugh. A fruit basket will be

sent to Melissa Miller. On 4-H Sun-

day, March 4, the club will attend

Thurmont Methodist Church in a

group. Patty Morgan and Mae Warner

will play in a basketball game on Rec-

reation night, March 6.
On February 14 the Women's Guild

of Mt. Tabdr Evangelical and Re-

formed church held its monthly meet-

ing in the firemen's building. The
meeting was opened with scripture

reading and prayer by Mrs. Kathleen

Miller, followed by the hymn "More

Love to Thee". The topic being com-

mitted to Christ was presented by

Olive and Pauline Dubel, Mrs. No-
vella Dinterman and Mrs. Catherine
Stambaugh. The business meeting was
conducted by the President, Mrs.
Stambaugh. Plans were made to hold

a chicken and waffle supper in the
Firemen's hall, March 17. The meeting

was closed with prayer. The names of
Secret Sisters were revealed and new
names drawn for the year. A Valen-
tine party was held. Games were
played and refreshments were served

to about 25 members and their fam-
ilies.

Mrs. Lloyd Wiley apd son, Norman
of this place called Sunday on Mr. and
Mrs. David Bowers, Middleburg.
A party was held at the home of

Mr. and Mrs. Lesie W. Fox, on Feb.
14, in honor of the birthday of Calvin
Troxell. Those present were Mr.
and Mrs. Russell Troxell, Mr. and
Mrs. John Troxell, Mrs. Floyd Wiley,.
Mrs. Daisy Simpkins, Mr. and Mrs.
Wade Harner and daughter, Beverly,
Theodore, Marion, Roger, Bernard,
and Robert Troxell and Mr. and Mrs.
L. W. Fox. Many gifts were received
and refreshments were served.

liaja BARNEY

„as

Services at St. Paul's Lutheran,
Sunday, March 4th: Worship, at 9 a.
m.; Sunday School, at 10 a. m.; Cate-
chetical Class, Saturday, March 3, at
1 o'clock, Lenten Service, Friday eve-
ning at 7:30 instead of Thursday.
Rev. C. E. Held, Pastor.
The flowers in the altar vases last

Sunday at St. Paul's were in honor of
Mr. and Mrs. John Waybright's 50th
wedding anniversary put • there by
their children.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Shriver, Hanov-
er, Mr. Simpson Shriver, Littlestown,
and Mr. Emil Busch, of Jessup, Md.,
were last week visitors at the home of
Mr. and Mrs. E. P. Shriver, near here.
Mr. and 11rs. Geo. Shriver and son,

John, visited Mr. and Mrs. John Heck
and family, Mechanicsburg, Pa., on
Saturday evening.

Mrs. Luther Fox, Mrs. Samuel Val-
entine and Mr. Elmer Shildt and son,
Junior, visited with Mrs. Haines and
daughter, Mary, Monday evening.
On Saturday afternoon during the

high wind and rain storm which pass-
ed through this part of the country
the Harney Vol. Fire Co., was called
to the home fo Mr. Estie Kiser to put
out a chimney fire. The fire was put
under control with very small dam-
age. Mr. Kiser wishes to thank the
Company for their splendid work.
Mr. and Mrs. .John Waybright, of

near here celebrated their 50th wed-
ding anniversary, Tuesday, Feb. 28.
Mr. and Mrs. Waybright lived in this
community all their lives and we wish
them many more years of happy life
together.

Quite a few folks in this vicinity
are ill at this writing. We wish each
and every one a speedy recovery.
The Harney Fire Co. held their reg-

ular meeting Monday evening, Feb. 27
with the president, Fred Spangler pre-
siding. Scripture the 3rd chapter of
St. John, 1st to 16th verse. Minutes
of last meeting read and approved all
bills accepted and ordered paid. There
were 31 members present. Next meet-
ing will be held March 12th. Former
Chief Green, of Westminster Fire Co.
who is now instructor of fire fighting
and prevention for the Universitor of
Maryland gave an interesting talk to
the Harney Co.
. Mrs. Howard Kump visited Mrs.
Geo. B. Marshall, Wednesday after-
noon.
Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Eckenrode, of

Bonneauville, visited Mrs. Hannah
Eckenrode, Saturday afternoon.
Among the callers of Samuel D.

Snider and sister, Ruth the past week
were: Mr. and Mrs. Frank Swain,
Mrs. Earl Baumgartner, and M

Ella Null, of Baltimore; Rev. Charles
E. Held, Gettysburg R. D. and Mrs.
Carl Baumgardner, and daughters,
Carol and Ellen Jane, " Littlestown,
Pa.
Mr. and Mrs. Harry Ciutz, Mrs.

Daniel Yingling and children, Audrey
and .Donna, were supper guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Aaron Biesecker and
Charles Thomas, of Baltimore, Md.
Sunday evening; the Biesecker home
was in the midst of the storm that
hit Baltimore Saturday evening. -
Mrs. Mary Haines, Mrs. Nevin Rid-

inger and Miss Mary Haines attended
services at the EUB church in Taney-
own Sunday evening.
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Swain, Mrs.

Ella Null and Mrs. Nellie Baumgard-
ner called at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Elmer LeGore one day last week.
Week-end guests at the home of Mr.

and Mrs. Vaughn Peck were: Mr. and
Mrs. Aide Whitmore, Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Thomas, Westminster; Mr.
and Mrs. James CrabbA and Mrs. Mary
Snyder, of Glen Burnie, Md.; Mr.
and Mrs. Kenneth Sleby and sons,
Robert and Richard, Gettysburg R. D.;
Mrs. Oneida Eckenrode and children,
Larry, Mildred and Debbie. ,
Mil'and Mrs. Charles Sheely, Get-

tysburg, called on Mr. and Mrs. Harry
bprankle and Atwood Hess, on Thurs-
day evening.

Mrs. Laura Welty, Mr. and Mrs.
Clyde Welty and Henry Culliflower,
visited Sunday afternoon with Mr. and
Mrs. Earl Welty and son, Larry; Mr.
and Mrs. Norman Welty and daughter
Judy, visited in the evening.
Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Shildt and son,

Junior, visited, their daughter, Mary
Catherine, at Shippensburg State'
Teachers College:
Mr. Merle Ridinger, Baltimore,

spent last • Thursday with his sister,
Mies Gertie Ridinger.
Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Hasley, Get-

tysburg, and Mr. and Mrs. Erman
Chipley, attended the Ice Capades, at
Hershey, last Saturday everting.
Mrs. Annie Little who has been

spending some time at the home of
Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Valentine and
Mr. and Mrs. M. 0. Fuss, returned to
her home in Taneytown, Monday eve-
ning.
Mr. and Mrs. M. 0. Fuss and Mrs.

Annie Little, spent Sunday afternoon
with Mr. and Mrs. Edgar Aulthouse,
Gettysburg R. #1.
Mr. Theodore Simpson and daugh-

ters, Mr. Ralph Young, of Westmin-
ster; Mr. and Mrs. Claude Haines and
son, Keeny, of Sykesville; Mr. and
Mrs. Jacob Snyder, daughters, Conine
and Patsy, of Reese, Md.; Mr. and
Mrs. Morris Haiens and Miss Gertie
Ridinger, Taneytown, were last week

visitors with Mrs. Margaret Haines

and daughter, Mary.
Mrs. Marlin Six, Sr., Mrs. Nevin

Ridinger, Mrs. Harry Sprankle and

Atwood Hess, spent last Thursday in

Hanover.
Mrs. Jessie Slick from near St.

James Church, spent Thursday with

Mrs. Elmer LeGore and Mrs. Ida

Strickhouser.
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Deberry, Key-

mar, entertained to a shrimp feed on

Sunday evening: Mr. and Mrs. Marlin

Six, Sr. and son, Larry; Mr. and Mrs.

Geo. Six kid sons, Stevie and Randy;

Mr. and Mrs. Marlin Six, Jr., and Mrs.

Donald Hess and children, Donnie and

Diane.
Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Gantz, of

Waynesboro, Pa., spent Sunday after-

noon with Mr. and Mrs. Harry Spran-

kle and Atwood Hess.
Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Cline and son,

David, Charmain, Pa.; Mr. and 'Mrs
.

Harry Cline, Greenstone, Pa., Mr. and

Mrs. Floyd Strickhouser and Mr. and

Mrs. Luther Fox, spent Saturday 
eve-

ning with Mr. and Ws. Harvey

Wantz.
Mr. and Mrs. Luther Valentine, Wil-

mington Del., spe-iit the week-end

-,vth Mrs. Claude Conover also called

m other relatives in Harney.
Mrs. Harry Angell, visited Mrs.

.tfie Fream last Wednesday after-

noon.
Mrs. Geo. B. Marshall spent Monday

evening at the home of her brother,

William Fuss and family, Littlestown.

Dinner guests at the home of Mr.

and Mrs. Vaughn Peck on Sunday

were: Mr. and Mrs. James Crabbs, and

Mrs. Mary Snyder, of Glen Burnie,

Md.; Mr. Norman Selby and sons,

Francis and Allen, Harney; and Mr.

and Mrs. Earl Johnson and daughter,

'..ouise, Middleburg, Md.
.Mr. and Mrs. Charles Shildt, visited

Sunday evening with their son, David

ind family, in Littlestown.
Mr. and Mrs. Luther Fox, Harney,

_pent Sunday afternoon with Mr. and

Mrs. Elmer LeGore and Mrs. Ida

Strickhouser.
Miss Dolores Haines, of Mayberry,

,pent from Friday until Monday with

laer schoolmate, Miss Shirley 
Valen-

tine.
Mr. and Mrs. George Valentine, en-

ertained to dinner Sunday Mr. Rob-

-nt Strickhouser, Miss Dolores H
aines

ind Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Valentine.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Shildt, s
pent

aturday evening in Hanover on bus-

ness.
Visitors at the home of Mr. and

Mrs. Harry Wolff over the week
-end

were Mr. Simpson Shriver and 
Mr.

Ind Mrs. Dallas Shriver, 
Littlestown;

Mr. Earlington Shriver and John 
Cor-

ler!.
Week-end visitors at the home of

Mr. and Mrs. hester Moose and son,

iene, were: Mr. and Mrs. Mark 
Moose

aid daughter, Karen, Bal
timore; Mr.

ind Mrs. Frank Moose, children
, Jim-

nie and Steven, Richmond, Va.; Mr.

aid Mrs. Merle Moose, daughter,

Meryl, Gettysburg, and Mr. and Mrs.

.)ale Moose and daughter, Debra, Tan-
r‘ytown R. #1.
Mr. and Mrs. Elmer LeGore, at-

;ended the funeral of Mrs. LeGore's
Lunt, Mrs. Florence ,Schmers on Sat-
irday afternoon, who passed away in
3altimore, and was buried in Ever-
:Teen cemetery, Gettysburg.
Mr. and Mrs. Stockton Rouzie, of

l'rederick, and Mrs. Cletus Reever,

isited Sunday afternoon at the home

)f Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Valentine.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Kump and Mid.

nd Mrs. Howard Kump, visited Mr.

nd Mrs. Eugene Cline and son, Day-

d, of Charmain.

Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Wantz, visit-

d Mr. George Kump, of Hampstead,

lunday afternoon.
Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Overholtzer,

iotored to Waynesboro, Sunday af-

ternoon to visit Mrs. Overholtzer's sis-
ter, Mrs. Herman Tharp who has
been very ill. They also visited Mrs.
Overholtzer s aunt, Mrs. Beatrice
Kauffman who has been bedfast for
several years. On their way home
they stopped to chat with Mr. and
Mrs. Wilbur Reifsnider, at Blue
Ridge Summit.
...j1r. and Mrs. Kenneth Vaughn, Em-
mitsburg, .and Mr. and Mrs. Russell
Wentz, Jr.., attended the Ice Capades,
at Hershey, Pa., Saturday evening.

Mrs. Marlin Six, Sr., Mrs. Nevin
Ridinger, Mrs. Harry Sprankle and
Atwood Hess, spent Friday in Har-
risburg.

FRIZELLBURG

Services this Sunday morning at
Emmanuel Baust Lutheran church will
be worship at 9:30, S. S., 10:30. Rev.
Donald Warrenfeltz, pastor.
Midweek Lenten service at St.

Paul's,  Uniontown, Wednesday eve-
ning, A film "Ambassador in Bond"
will be shown.
The Never Weary Class will be held

at the home of Mrs. Delmar Ware-
hime, March 6. The women of the
church will meet at the home of Mrs.
Ralph Starner, Westminster, March
15. Invite a friend, a neighbor, or a
stranger:
The Biscoes, of Baltimore visited at

the home of Mr. and Mrs. George San-
ner and family on Sunday. Callers
were Mr. and Mrs. James Cory and
children of Towson.

Mrs. J. Lewis, Baltimore, is spend-
ing this week at the home of Mrs.
Irene Welk and daughter Emily.
Mr. and Mrs. Harry K. Myers and

Mrs. Clarence Myers visited Monday
at the home of Mr. and Mrs. George
Motter, Rocky Ridge, Mrs. Motter
had the misfortune to fall recently,
fracturing her arm. She has our sym-
pathy.
Gary Sanner, Phyllis Dutterer and

Lynn LeFevre are at home from
school with the measles.

Mrs. Edward Haifley is on the sick
list.

Mrs. Walter Myers, Jr., who 'had
been bedfast for the past three weeks
is able to be up and around.

Janie Culberson was sick a few
days last week with swollen glands
and sore throat.
Due to the bad weather on Friday

evening the last "Week of Prayer"
meeting was held Monday evening at
the home of Mrs. Irene Welk and
daughter Emily. Mrs. Florence Welk
was leader. These meetings were
well attended each evening.
Sunday School this Sunday morn-

ing at the Church of God at 10 o'clock.
Mr. and Mrs. Chas. Stambaugh,

Mrs. Catherine Wise and daughter,
Sandra, of Harney, visited at the home
of Mr. and Mrs. John Berwager and
family on Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Gene Haines and fam-
ily moved into the Warehime apart-
ment on Friday."
Mr. and Mrs. Allen Morelock, Mr.

and Mrs. Robert Waddell and son,
Jerry, were dinner guests of Mrs.
Emma Rodkey, Uniontown.

Services this Sunday morning in
Baust E. & R. Parish House will be:
Church School, at 9:30; Worship, at
10:30; the Aid Socitey will meet on
Tuesday evening, March 6, in the
Parish House; the Consistory will
meet at the same time in the parson-

age. Rev. M. S. Reifsnyder, Pastor.

FEFS'ERSBURG
(A Voice from Carroll)

The Baltimore stores are feeling

the bad effects of the prolonged strike

of the Transit Company which has
been in progress for four weeks. For
once, a labor union is not blamed,

but company officials are accused of
delay in reaching an agreement. The

effect of the strike has reached out
into the counties for people have

learned that the streets in Baltimore

can hold just so many cars and no

more and that finding a place to park

one's car is impossible, Rather than

irati.le traffic, people are staying out

of the city unless a trip is necessary.

With Easter shopping in the offing the

city stores are in a desperate situa-

tion. One can be sure that all the

pressure possible will be brought to

bear on the Transit Company and the

labor union to end their differences at

top speed. Although up to the pres-

ent time, speed has been clocked to a

minimum in the dispute.
According to scientists, spots on the

sun are responsible for the crazy

weather the world has been enduring

for the past month. Europe is tryin
g

to cope with the worst winter in mem-

ory. but even when the deep freeze

disappears, floods will take its place

and everyone will feel the effect for a

couple of years. Here in the U.S.A.

we are having all kinds of we
ather

trouble too. On Saturday the wind

played havoc with roofs, trees and

power lines, in Carroll and surround-

ing counties. There may be a 
warn-

ing in the changing weather 
pattern.

We complain too often about the

farmers raising too much food, 
but

who knows but what the sun might 
be

going through some kind of 
evolution

that would effect .the world's 
climate

to such a degree that no 
crops could

be raised for several years. 
Remem-

ber the seven lean years of 
Bibical

history? Instead of fussing over the

abundance of food and the cost of

storing surpluses, we might be doing

ourselves a favor if we found a way

to put away surplus food for an un
-

forseen weather. emergency. It al-

ways has struck a chill of forboding in

my mind whenever I have read or

heard our leaders boast or condemn

ur abundance, especially concerning

food. When one notices how quickly

the weather can ruion a crop and how

little control man has over the sun, it

would be wiser to take gdod care of

our abundance while we have it. 
Men,

may at times feerthat he is the 
mas-

ter, but it only takes nature on 
the

rampage for a few minutes to teach

him otherwise.
Next to growing old, the dating per-

iod in anyone's life is probably the

most frantic and heart-breaking.

kdults never realize this until their

boy and girl reaches the dating per-

iod. Then the family seems to disin-

tegrate. Up until this period Mother

and Dad knew all answers and son and

daughter thought their parents did

too, but when dating starts, some how

the parents become back numbers and

hey don't know anything from their

-eenagers point of view.Each batch 
of

lating youngsters feel that they alone

o th . discoveredee dating 

Theyawtifwaited ited for the telephone

ea withn, t all  b eolfreiltes com-

plications.thatto ring and waited in vain. They
can't believe that Dad was ever too
shy to call a girl and ask her out to
a movie. They can't believe that
their special dream-boat of today will
probably turn out to be a drip in a
couple years and the shy, slow-dater
will be the future man of distinction,
or a poised business woman in the fu-
ture. But we were just the same in our
teens. (It seems so long ago.) We
wanted life to give us every thing at
sixteen. We weren't content either,
to grow up gradually. If there is any
difference In dating today and that of
yesterday it is in competition. Today
boys are fewer in number and less
aggressive that girls. It is a pity that
this is true, because the social rule is
still the same—a girl has to wait until
a boy asks her for a date and some

, boys just don't get around to going
out with girls until later. There seems
to be a code among modern teenagers
that didn't exist years back. They
don't try to steal each other's dates.
The old code of "Anything is fair in
love and war", is out the window.
While dating is a normal and healthy
stage in growing up, never-the-less
any household blessed with boys and
girls, is thrown into somewhat of a
turmoil when dating begins.
The Daniel Boones seem to be win-

ning over the Davy Crocketts. There
are 149 people named after Davy
while 221 are called Daniel Boone.
There are three things people hate

to spend their money on. They are
food, school teachers and ministers.
People stint on their food bpdget to
buy cars, fur coats, trips fo beauty
salons and most any luxury item and
yet without food a person will die
within a week. The teachers are de-
nied a decent salary and yet in their
hands rests the future leaders of our
nation. The minister also is denied a
salary big enough to keep ,up the dig-
nity of his office and yet he is the per-
son that looks after the spiritual life
of the community he serves. And the
spiritual value or any country guides
its destiny. The truth of the matter
is that we have our values mixed up.
First things should come first, but we
are putting them last.
Whoever eats the bread that anoth-

er has reaped and kneaded is under an
obligation to his brother, and cannot
say he owes him nothing. The poor-
est of us has received from society
much more than his own single
strength would have permitted him to
wrest from nature. Emile Souvestre.

I hope I am not alone when I say
that when the basketball season is
over in our local school I will breathe
a little prayer of relief. Not that I
have anything against the game but
I think that it takes top priority over
everything else and keeps not only
the students in a state of tension, but

it also upsets the r9utine of most
}Wines.
We see by the papers that a group

of doctors are interested in building

a small hospital in Carroll providing

they receive sufficient support from

the public. Our county is certainly

rich enough to build a hospital for its

citizens and from all evidence when I

was a patient at the Annie Warner

Hospital in Gettysburg there are

enough patients from our county to

justify building one for ourselves. So

many people ask me why I went to

Gettysburg hospital instead of Balti-

more. The main reason was the con-

venience. No traffic to worry about

j and it was close to home. This is one

reason why a hospital in Carroll

would prove popular, especially with

maternity patients. As for the med-

ical and surgical care one receives in

a small hospital, the standard is just

as high as a large hospital. With the

doctor shortage being what it is, a
hospital located in our county would

help much toward attracting more

doctors to our community. Since Car-

roll County is attracting more and
more people from the cities, some-

thing must soon be done to give our

county better medical 4acilities. A
hospital would certainly help.

I would not give a fig for a man s

religion if his neighbors and commu-

nity are not benefitted by it.—Ruth

Roelke.

HOOPER'S DELIGHT

Sunday School at Bethel Methodist

Church at 10. Everyone is welcome

to attend.
1 Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Hancock and

; daughter, Mrs. L. Lescalleet and

daughter, spent Friday with Mr. and

Mrs. Merle Haile and fartfily, of Balti-

more.
Mrs. L. Lescalleet and daughter, of

Hagerstown, spent a few days with

Mr. and Mrs. Hancock.
Sorry to hear Mrs. Howard Pickett

is ill in Frederick Memorial Hospital.

We wish her a speedy recovery. Oth-

ers on the sick list are children of Mr.

and Mrs. Edgar Taylor is housed -up

with a bad case of measles and cold.

Carter Ray is ill with virus pneumo-

nia, also wish them speedy recovery.

About an inch of snow fell on hur

section Friday evening changing to

rain all night and on Saturday a wind

storm came through and did lots of

damage to Mr. Paul Vosburgh house

took off roof and television aerial,

also took Dallas Kehne wagon shed

and porch from house.
Mrs. Dallas Kehne and Mrs. Harry

J. Fervor and daughter, Vicki, were

shopping in Frederick on Washing-

ton's birthday. Vicki Lynn Farver

celebrated her 5th birthday, also the

same day.
Mrs. Gladys Hancock and son, Har-

old, Mrs. Willard Barber and Mrs.

Harry 0. Farver, visited Dr. and Mrs.

L. C. Stitley on Saturday afternoon

and enjoyed coffee, doughnuts and cof-

fee cake.
Sorry to hear Mrs. Ralph Franklin

had a misfortune for a cow to step

on her foot and injured it badly. Hope

she soon recovers.
Mrs. Harry J. Farver and daughter,

Vicki, called on Mrs. J. Click on Fri-

day Mr. and Mrs. Dallas Kehne

and son, David; Mr. and Mrs.

W. Barber called on Mr. and Mrs.

rlarry J. Farver and daughters, on

Saturday night and Mr. and Mrs. D.

Stephan and family called at the same

place on Sunday afternoon.
Mr. and Mrs. F. Stair and son; of

Hanover, spent Sunday with Mr. arni

Mrs. R. Hancock and son.
Mr. and Mrs. H. J. Farver anci

daughters, Faye and Vicki, Mr. am.

Mrs. Fred Farver and sons, Jerry am.

Jackie, and Robin Diehl, spent Sunday
with the Barbers and the Farvers.
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Franklin, spent

Sunday with •Mrs. Franklin's parents,
Mr. and Mrs. Williams and family.
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Pickett and

sons, spent Saturday with Mr. and
Mrs. Tom Pickett,

UNIONTON% N

The Bethany Circle of the Church
of God met in the church basement on
Thursday evening with 28 persons
present. Devotions were led by Pa-
tricia Lambert. Two new members
were enrolled and a short business
session was held. Refreshments were
served by the Smiths
Those who spent Sunday at the

home of Mrs. Emma Rodkey were:
Mr. and Mrs. Allen Morelock, Mr. and
Mrs. Denton, Wantz, children, Jean
and James, of Tyrone; Mr. and Mrs.
Robert Waddell, son Jerry; Miss Joan
Stiley, of Taneytown; Philip Lawyer,
Silver Run; Mrs. Amie Stuller, Mrs.
Alverta Haines, Mr. and Mrs. Leo
Heltibridle and daughter, Pamela
Sue and Mrs. John Heltibridle. Those
who spent Sunday evening at the same
home were Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Crouse
and daughter, Evelyn.
The Uniontown Improvement Asso-

ciation wilt meet March 13, 1956 in
the Myers Engler storeroom at 8
o'clock. Come out to your town
meeting.
The proceeds from the bake sale at

the Myers Engler apartment totaled
$178.03. This is to go to March of
Dimes.

Mrs. C. Levine Zepp had the mis-
fortune to fall and tear a ligament in
her foot.

DETOUR-KEYS VILLE

The Mother's Club of the Elmer
Wolfe School will meet on March 7th
(Wednesday) at 1:30. This is an im-
portant meeting and all the mothers
of the children in the 1st, 2nd and
3rd grades are urged to attend be-
cause .the officers for 1956-57 are to
be elected.
Mr. and Mrs. C. E. Priest and fam-

ily and Harwood Tydings were dinner
and supper guests on Sunday of Mrs.
Priest's aunt, Miss Stella Scott, of
Laurel.

Mrs. Maurice Wilhide spent a day
last week as guest of her daughter
and husband, Mr. and Mrs. Charles
Minnick.
The wind did a lot of damage to

roofs and television aerials on Satur-
day. Part of the roof and all of one
chimney and television aerial were
taken off at the Edward Coshun home,
the roof on the barn on the Gilbert
Stine place was damaged a great deal.

Mrs. Weishaar and Nancy Thomas
have been on the sick list. Nancy is
much better now after having had the
measles.
A good number of persons attended

the Mission Study program at the
Keysville Lutheran church on Monday
evening.
The Junior and High School Chris-

tian Endeavor Societies will meet on
Sunday evening at the church at 7:30.
Betty Shibley and Charles Young will

be the leaders of the High school
group.

Quite a number of persons from
this section went to the Dairymen's
meeting at the Lord Baltimore Hotel

on Saturday.
Mrs. Coulson, of Hanover, Pa., vis-

ited with her daughter Mrs. Arthur
Clabaugh and family, of Detour, sev-

eral days last week.

GARDEN CLUB NOTES

On Thursday, Feb. 19, the regular

meeting of the Silver Fancy Garden

Club, was held at the home of Mrs.

Thomas Frailey, in Ernmitsburg. Mrs.

Hewitt MacPherson was acting secre-

tary in the absence of Mrs. Mary

Coyne. Mrs. Lloyd Crouse and Mrs.

Chas B. Shaughnessey were co-hos-

tesses. Tea, cakes and cookies were

served.
Mrs. Allen Feeser was the program

chairman and introduced Mr. Marvin

P. Myer as guest speaker. Mr. Myer

is a member of the Maryland State

Board of Natural Resources Game and

Fish Commission Public Relations

Dept. His subject was the conserva-

tion of wild birds and inland Fish. Af-

ter his lecture, he showed two reels o
f

film. One pertaining to birds and

the other to fish.
The next meeting will be March 15

at the home of Mrs. Archibald Car
-

penter in Taneytown. Mrs. Hewitt

MacPherson will be program chair-

man and Mrs. Mary Coyne will act as

co-hostess with Mrs. Carpenter.

DIED

MRS. BLADEN HANKEY

Mrs. Anna V. M. Hankey, 73, widow

of Bladen Hankey, who resided with

her niece and nephew, Mr. and Mrs.

Denton Powell, Union Bridge R. D. 1,

died Saturday at 11:05 p. m. at their

home following an illness. Her hus-

band died in April, 1945. She was a

daughter of the late Matthew and

Lydia Ann Brown Hamer. She was a

member of Grace Reformed Church,

Taneytown.
Surviving are two stepsons Wilmer

Hankey, near Biglerville, and Grant

Hankey, Littlestown; one brother,

Wade Harner, Sr., Taneytown, and 
one

sister, Mrs. Geary Angell, Pleasant

Valley.
Funeral services were held Tuesday

at 2 p. m., in Grace Reformed church.

The Rev. Morgan R. Andreas, her

pastor, officiated. Burial was in the

Taneytown Refprmed cemetery.

JOHN D. STUDY

John D. Study, aged 57 years, Get-
tysburg Route 5, died in a fire that
destroyed his home last (Wednesday)
nighti He was unmarried and lived
alone. •
He was the son of the late John

Calvin and Emma Ellen ,Reid Study,
r-le is survived by four sisters, Mrs.
Virgie Pittenturf, Mrs. Jesse Hooper
)f Littlestown, Pa.; Mrs. William
Sentz and Mrs. Walter Eckard, Tan-
eytown and one brother, U. Ra
Study, of Littlestown R. D.
Funeral services will be held Sat-

urday at the Peters Funeral Home
Gettysburg at 2 o'clock in charge of
Rev. Morgan Andreas. Interment wil
`)e in Grace Reformed cemetery
Taneytown.

CARD OF THANKS

I wish to thank all my frilids and
neighbors for their cards, gifts, flow-
ers, and visits while I was in the hos-
pital and at home.

MRS. SOFIJA LIEPINS.

CARD OF THANKS

We wish to extend our thanks and
appreciation to all our friends for the
lovely flowers and cards and gifts, for
our 50th anniversary. Thanks again.
MR. and MRS. JOHN WAYBRIGHT

CARD OF THANKS

I wish to express my sincere thanks
and appreciation to everyone who re-
membered me with lovely cards, hank-ies and flowers, also for the lovelyfruit boxes I received while I was sick.Again many thanks.

MRS. ALBERT WILHIDE._
CARD OF THANKS

I wish to express sincere thanksand appreciation to all those who sokindly remembered we with cards,
flowers, gifts and visits while I was inthe hospital, and since my return
home; also for the many other acts of
kindness. Thanks again.

DAVID L. SHARRER.

CARD OF THANKS

We wish to express sincere thanksto relatives, friends and neighbors for
flowers, cards, also pallbearers, for
their many acts of kindness during
the illness and following the death of
our brother. ,

THE RUSSELL MOSER FAMILY
and MACIE FORNEY.

TO THE CONGREGATION OF THE
TRINITY LUTHERAN CHURCH,

TANEYTOWN, MD.

I am going to the National Luther-
an Home, Washington, D. C., through
our Ilastor Rev. Stanley B. Jennings
who took much of his extra time of
his church work and was successful in
getting me in the home which took
much work and time. The Rev. and
Mrs. Stanley Jennings and family
were very kind to me at Christ-
mas—gave a fine box of cakes and
candies and other fine home-made
food after Christmas.

EDW. N. WINTER.

CARD OF APPRECIATION

We wish to extend our sincere
thanks for all the donations, which
were given to us. The bake sale was
very successful.
TANEYTOWN BASEBALL CLUB
 Co—

"SPICE 'N' EVERYTHING NICE"

(Continued from First Page)
had a huge birthday cake in the win-
dow beautifully decorated with the
name of our first President and the
date of his birth all done in white and
pastel green.
The fur stores were packed—every

one as though they were giving some
thing away. On one store window
was "We cannot tell a lie!" And there
it was fantastic values in all kinds of
fur coats! (And they really were sell-
ing them, too!) The crowd upon the
streets wele tremendous—never have
I seen such a mob only at Christmas
time. Hundreds must have been at
the stores when they opened at 9
o'clock as most of the women were
carrying many bundles. What im-
pressed me more this year than last
year were the number of men shop-
pers.
A big feature in one store and that

Tuerke's was in the gift department
down stairs rather a few steps from
the first floor in the rear was a very
handsome $10.00 hand painted tray
for $4.95. There was a black Bar-
becue Grill marked down for $3.95: A
$24.00 Barometer Clock for $10.95 and
much else. As I wanted to brouse
around in all the stores, I did not see
all the fine items which were on for
this special sale.
Even the dime store had their 20

cent hot dog sandwiches for the price
of half—just ten cents!

Julius Gutman store was so crowd-
ed that one had to elbow their way
around the store as the sales in every
department were just about half of
the everyday and the women and men
were holding up their merchandise to
be wrapped awaiting in turn. Every-
one seemed to be in such a jovial mood
and there were hundreds of shoppers
who had not been in town since the
car strike started. The merchants
must have planned this special day
months ahead due to the manner in
which tickets were drastically marked
down on each garment.
Taxi cabs were crowded returning

to the Boat Show, I got in one and I
was number six in that cab but the
Cabbie did not mind as I was going
such a short distance.

If you ask me, Folks—it was surely
"BARGAIN DAY" down in old Balti-
more on Washington's Birthday! Who
says, "IT DOES NOT PAY TO AD-
VERTISE"?
The Boat Show was thrilling and

there were hundreds going in at 2 P.
M. that it reminded me of the Circus
entrance. The City children were out
of school for and in honor of our First
President and that is the way it should
be in any County or City in these
grand United States. Eh?
Hope you have not missed Arthur

Godfrey' and his Gang up in Lake
Placid, N.Y. on T.V. I learned more
through that Show about Lake Placid
than all the reading in magazines.
Godfrey announced that the snow was
there until April! What a grand vaca-
tion that would be!

Ladies, if you want your floor to be
thoroughly clean purchase a box of

"SOILAX" and follow directions on
the package by placing a small part of

the powder in the water which turns
green. It seems when mopping or

scrubbing Soilax just eats the dirt
away! Am sure you will be pleased

with that one.
So long, Folks. Have a grand week-

end. Be good and be careful. Drive

slowly and enjoy the days which are

getting longer. Until next week D.V.

I am,
Faithfully,
YOUR OBSERVER.
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SPECIAL NOTICES
FOR SALE - Good Baled Timothy

and Clover Hay.-Thomas P. Robert-
son, Crouse Mill Road, Taneytown.
Phone 4957. 3-1-2t

FOR SALE - Five 17-in Tires,
Tubes and Wheels.-Phone 4755.

NOTICE-Lawn Mowers sharpened
with machine.-Abra's Garage, Key-
mar. Phone Union Bridge 3252.

3-1-9t

FOOD SALE-Saturday, March 10,
10 p. m., at Firemen's Building. Spon-
sored by Pythian Sisters. Bring con-
tainers for soup.

FOR SALE-I'm now taking orders
for Baby Gay Shoes, 100% wool felt,
fit infants up to six months. Colors,
white, pink and blue, make a nice gift
for the new baby. Gift wrapped.-
Mrs. Thomas Lambert, Taneytown
Md., Phone 4837. R. F. D. #1.

FOR SALE-12-ft. Metal Boat and
an Evin Rude Sportsman Motor in
perfect condition.-Mervin E6. Wantz.

FOR SALE-800 Locust Posts, 30
tons good mixed hay. - Walter S.
Eckard, Union Bridge, Rt. 1.

FOR RENT-Second floor Apart-
ment, five rooms and bath, fully in-
sulated and centrally located in Tan-
eytown. Will be newly decorated and
available April 1st. Garden plot and
car space in garage included. No chil-
dren or dogs.-Telephone Taneytown
4014 Mrs. Elmer D. Ohler.

SPECIAL-Used Frigidaire Auto-
matic Washer, used Laundall Auto-
matic Washer, also used Universal
Range, all in good working condition.
-Mid-Town Electric.

FOR SALE-400 Bales Hay, Tim-
othy and mixed by the bale.-Apply
Harvey Shorb, Keymar, Md. 3-1-2t

FOR SALE-3 small Shoats, Hanip-
shire and Spotted Poland China cross.
Ready to go $25.00-Stoner Fleagle,

4 Mayberry, Rt. #1 Westminster.

FOR SALE-One hind Quarter and
two front quarters of Beef. Will
freeze and wrap if desired. Front 25c
per pound; hind 29c.-C. C. Berke-
meier, Taneytown, Md. Route 1, Phone
3755.

FOR SALE-1951 Ford Pick-up
with cattle racks, excellent condition,
32,000 mileage; also several cans of
Lard.-J. Elvin Study, Keymar. Call
evenings after 5 o'clock. 2-23-3t

FOR SALE - Double-oven Electric
Range, $150.00; Bottled Gas Range, I
$45.00; Hot Point Washer, $55.00;
Refrigerator, $95.00; Large Reach-in
Refrigerator, $200; all in excellent
condition. See-S. E. Remsburg, P. E.
Company, Taneytown 5244. 2-23-3t

WANTED-Landscaping and Haul-
ing, also Rototilling-Gordon & Groft,
335 Lumber St., Littlestown Pa.
Phone 284J. 2-16-tf

f 

BABY CHICKS-Day old or start- I
ed. Pure Mt. Hope White Leghorns
from 1st generation breeders, also
Cobb's Pedigreed Six Link and Whit-
taker strain of New Hampshire. All
Chickes Penna., approved, Pullorum,
Typhoid clean-Phone or call at The
Reindollar Co. 2-9-8t

FOR SALE-Modern white enam-
eled Gas Stove in excellent condition.
Has four burners, oven, broiler and
storage space. Priced for quick sale.
-Phone Taneytown 3272. 2-9-4t

DE KALB CHIX are bred like De- I
Kalb seed corn to make you more
money. Get top performance by or-
dering DeKalb Chix or De Kalb Sed
Corn today.-Mr. E. Everett Hess,
Taneytown, Md., R. D. #2. Phone
3922. 1-19-8t

IMPROVED MILKING Machines, I
Milk Cooling Tanks, Ventilation, Wa-
ter Bowls, Stanchions, etc., are here.
-John Roop & Sons, Linwood. Phone
Union Bridge 4403. 11-4-tf

NOTICE-Dial 3483 for your Sand,
Stolle, Blocks and General Hauling.
Fertilizer and Lime.-Thurston Put-

7-21-tfman.

KEEP YOUR TOWN CLEAN! A
regular collection of Garbage, etc., is
being made twice a week (Tuesday
and Saturday). If you desire this
service, write Walter Benschoff, Tan-
eytown, Md. 1-5-tf

PAPER HANGING and all other
joas of interior dec,-;-ating including
P:aster Repairs. Call Ralph -David-
son for a look at latest Wall Paper
Samples -Taneytown 4792. 11- •i-t.1

FOR SALE-Used Frigidaire Re-
frigerators, $10 down.-Potomac Edi-
son Co. 3-31-tf

CARD PARTY - in Rocky Ridge
Fire Hall, March 9, 8 p. m. Plenty of
Prizes. Benefit of Rocky Ridge Fire
Company. 2-23; 3-1-8

BABY CH1CKS.--New Hampshire
and Rock !lamp, cross, each week
All state blood tested.-Stonesifer's
Hatchery, Keymar, Phone Taneytown
4931. 7-2 -t1

FOR SALE-Patz Barn Cleaners,
and Silo unloaders.-J. H. Ommert,
Phone 4364. 10-20-tf

CARD PARTY - Every Monday
night beginning at 8 p. m., in the V.
F. W. Hall, Harney, Md. 9-8-tf

BE PREPARED-For the unex-
pected. Let us insure you adequate-
ly.-Percy M. Burke, 231 E. Main St.,
Westminster. Md. Tele. 11?0. 4-15-tf

CARD PARTY - The annual Card
Party, sponsored by the Taneytown

• High School, will be held at the school
on Thursday, April 5. 2-16-4teow

FOR SALE-Soybean Hay, Orchard
Grass Hay and Oat Straw. Price
reasonable. After 5:30 p. m., Vine-
wood 5-4112. 2-23-2t

BIG PARTY every Friday night at
8 o'clock E. S. T. in Harney Fire Hall.
Benefit of Harney Volunteer Fire
Company. Big Cash Jackpot. 9-29-tf

- --
2nd FLOOR OF OPERA HOUSE

for rent. Suitable for public meet-
ings, dances and social gatherings.
Phone Taneytown 3272 or contact
"Eciw a rd S auble. 7-29-tf

CHURCH NOTICES

St. Joseph's Church, Frederick St.Rev. Stephen D. Melycher, Pastor.Sunday Masses, 8 and 10:30; Week-day Mass, 6:30; Holy Days Masses,6 and 8; First Fridays, 6:30; Confes-sions on Saturdays, 4-5 and 7-8, alsoSunday before Mass, Confessions onHoly Days and First Fridays beforeMasses; Baptisms on Sunday, 11:30.
Walnut Grove Dunkard BrethrenChurch at KurnpN.-SundaT3 cAh.ot at9:30 A. M ; Preaching, 

hin

1-13ward Surbey, Minister.
St. Paul's Luth. Church, Harney-9 a. m., worship and sermon; 10 a.m., S. S.; Thurs., 7:30 p. m., Lentenservice; Sat., 1 p. m. Catecheticalclass.
Mt. Joy Luth. Church-9:30 a. m.,S. S.; 10:30 a. m., worship and ser-mon; Wed., 7:30 p. m.

' 
Lenten service;Sat., 2 p. m., Catechetical Class. Chas.E. Held, Pastor.

Church of God, Uniontown Circuit.Rev. John H. Hoch, Pastor. Union-town.-S. S., 9:30 a. m. Mr. SterlingSmith, Supt. Preaching service, 10:30a. m. The Bethany Circle will conductthe service with Mrs. Katherine Cor-bin giving the message. Prayer meet-ing on Wednesday evening, 7:30 p. m.Leader: Mrs. Katherine Corbin.Wakefield-Sunday School, 10 a. m.Mr. Charles Hahn, Supt. Prayer Meet-ing and Bible Study on Friday eve-ning, 8 p. m.
Frizellburg-Sunday School, 10 a.m. Mr. Howard Carr, Supt. RevivalService, 7:30 p. m. Dr. William Cun-ningham, preaching. The Gospelaireswill sing. Prayer Meeting and BibleStudy on Thursday evening 8 p. m.Mayberry-Sunday School, 11:15 a.m. Mr. William Lawyer, Supt.
Trinity Lutheran Church, Taneytown, the Rev. Stanley B. Jennings,Pastor.-9 a. m., Church School, AnActive Class for Every Age; 10 a. m.,the service, sermonette for children.Sermon, "Jesus Faces a SpiritualVacuum." 6 p. m., Junior CatecheticalClass; 6 p. m., Senior CatecheticalClass. Activities fo the week: Tues-day, March 6, 7:30 p. m., Meeting ofthe Church Council; Wednesday, Mar.7:7:30 p. m., Wednesday evening Len-ten Service; Sermon, "Jesus Prayerof Confession." Wednesday, Mar. 7,8:30 p. m., Senior Choir Rehearsal;8:30 p. m., Meeting of the Mite So-ciety; Thursday, Mar. 8, 7 p. m., YouthChoir Rehearsal; 7:30 p. m., Meetingof the Brotherhood.

Taneytown Evang. United BrethrenCharge. Rev A. W. Garvin, pastor.Taneytown-S. S., 9:30 a. m.; wor-ship, 10:30 a. m.; Sr. C. E., 6:30 p.m.; Evening service, 7:30 p. m., withthe showing of "Beyond Our Own",an outstanding picture of regainingone's faith; Wed., 3:30 p. m., Jr. Biblestudy and choir practice; 7:30 p. m.,Intermediate class, Bible study andprayer service. There will be choirpractice following Bible study, 8:30 p.m.
Barts-No Services.
Harney-Worship, 7:30 p. m.

Uniontown Lutheran Parish. Don-ald Warrenfeltz, Pastor. Baust-Wor-ship, 9:30 a. m.; S. S., 10:30 a. m.
St. Paul-S. S., 9:45 a. m.; worship,11 a. m.; ,Luther League, 7:30 p. m.
Mt. Union- S. S., 9:30 a. m.; C. E.,

10:30 a. m.
Winters-S. S., 10 a. m.; worship,
11 a. m.

Keysville Evangelical Lutheran-
s. S., 9:30; Worship Service, 11:00;
Christian Endeavor, both Societies,
7:30 p. m.

Keymar Holiness Christian Church.
Rev. Paul E. Freeman, Pastor-9:30

BARGAINS-3 International Milk-
ers $100; Pump $75; Baltimore or
Washington Milk Cans, $1 and up; 10-
can front opening Milk Cooler, $395;10-can Verticoil Cooler, $195; Kelvi-nator Beverage Cooler $49; new Uni-
versal Milkers, Wilson Milk Coolersand Freezers; Hudson and LoudonFeed Trucks, Stanchions, WaterBowls, etc.-John Roop, Linwood,
Phone Union Bridge 4403. 11-4-tf
FOR SALE-Timothy Hay and

Alfalfa •Hay; also Holstein Cow, 3rd
generation of artificial breeding, now
fresh, with 2nd calf.-Wm. Sell, Ot-
terdale Mill. 12-15-tf
STONERITE ROOFING (Ashes-

tosized Aluminum) will close up theleaks in metal and asphalt roofs.
$3.ct0 per gallon at The Reindollar
Company. 11-17-tf
HAVE YOUR NEXT SUIT Tailor

made.' 300 patterns to select from-
Rob-Ellen Shop. 2-2-8t-eow

FOR WEDDING Invitations and
announcements, reception cards, en-
gagement announcements, napkins,
oirth announcements, complete selec-
tion. see-The Carroll Record Co.

8-11-ti

FOR SALE-New and used Type-
vriters and Adding Machines. Rib-
ons and Carbon Paper. Also Ma-
tunes for rent.-Charles L. Stone-
:ter, Representative of Reminetor
Rand. Inc. 5-9-tf

LADIES-Do you want healthy
uxurious Potted Plants fc,r the win-
er? Use E. C. A. (Bacterial Corn
)(is, Activator) a plant culture teem
ng with Soil Bacteria. 50c per lb
viii take care of all of your indoor
'owers, all winter. Many other us-
s. in and ask about :t -The
ieindollar Company, Mono Taney-
own 3303. 12-1-d

SEE-The Reit-410114r Company.
headquarters for Baugh's Plant Food
Ind Soil Builder Fertilizers. The old-

brand in America. 3-4-ti

CARD PARTY - Every Saturday
night, Harney Vol. Fire Co. Hall at
S p. m. (EST). 9-29-tf

NOTICE-Hauling of all kinds.-
Call Marlin Fair, 5313 after 4 o'clock
in evening. 2-2-9t

CHICKS-Hall Brothers Chicks are
tearly producing outstanding records.
You can cash in on this bigger Egg
srofit. too-Prove to yourself what
l0.D00 annual buyers of Hall Brothers
-hicks already krow. Come in and
)lace your order today at the Taney-
'own Grain & Supply Co. 3-4-tf

a. m., Sunday School; 10:30 a. in.,
Worship; 7:00, Young People Meet-ing; 7:30, Song and Praise Services;
7:45 p. in., Tuesday Prayer Services.
Grace Evangelical & ReformedChurch Charge. Rev. Morgan An-dreas, Minister. Keysville-No Sun-day Church School and no Lord's DayWorship scheduled.
Taneytown-9:15 a. m., SundayChurch 'School for all ages. 10:30 a.in., The Lord's Day Worship withthe showing of the denominationalfilm, "The Secret of the Gift", in theparish house. The congregation ofKeysville will join in viewing the filmas a charge. Tuesday, at 7:30 p. in.The Golden Rule Class meets at thehome of Mrs. Harry Mohney. The con-sistory meets in the Primary-Juniorroom. Wednesday at 3:45 p. m., Cai.e-

chetical Class meets for church mem-bership instruction. 6:45 p. m., Chil-dren's Choir rehearses. 7:30 p. m.,Mid-week Lenten Worship. 8:30 p. m.,
Rehearsal for the Senior Choir. Thurs-day at 7;30 p. m. Sunday Church
School teachers and officers meet.

Presbyterian Church. Rev. Gideon
E. Galambos, Minister. Piney Creek.
9:30 a. in., worship service; 10:30, S.
Ch. S. Saturday night at 6:30 p. in.,
there will be a birthday dinner for
families and friends from the three
churches. Monday night at 7:30
Westminster Youth Fellowship.
Emmitsburg-10 a. m., S. Ch. S.;

11 a. m., Worship Service. Wednes-
day night, Lenten Service, at 7:30 p.
m.
Taneytown-10 a. m., S. Ch. S.

7:30 p. m., Worship Service. Tuesday
night Brotherhood meeting in the
church. Reception with Mrs. George
W. Ingram.

TANEYTOWN H. S. ALUMNI
ASSOCIATION MEETS

The Taneytown H. S. Alumni As-
sociation met in the Taneytown High
School on Monday evening. President
Waddell presided over the meeting
which was very poorly attended.
The contents of the annual letter

which will soon be sent to all Alumni
was discussed. This gives the report
of the past year's activities, financial
statement, and the calender of events
which are scheduled for 1956. It also
solicits the cooperation and support
of all Alumni. Dues are payable now,
with the minimum remaning at $1.00,
and they may be sent to: Taneytown
H. S. Alumni Assoc., r% Box 384, Tan-
eytown, Md. Membership cards will
then be issued. It is the sincere hope
of all those interested in keeping this
very worthwhile organization alive,
that there can be at least 300 paid
members this year. It is realized that
due to the crammed schedules of so
many people around our town, that
they feel they cannot give much of
their time in attending meetings, etc.
But it is hoped that they will remem-
ber that their dues money alone can
be a great help in keeping the Asso-
ciation in a position to do good for
their schools and the Alumni them-
selves.
Plans for the annual banquet were

discussed. The music committee re-
ported that Bob Kersey's orchestra
has been engaged for the dance which
will follow the banquet. Menu and
serving committee reported that the
Ladies Auxiliary of the Fire Com-
pany will serve the meal again this
year. Program and class reunions
were discussed and since those classes
holding reunions usually want time on
the program, the officers and interest-
ed members of those classes should
soon begin plans and notify the Pres-
ident, Robert Waddell, what part they
plan to take. This has become one of
the highlighting parts of the annual
banquet and it is hoped that the class-
es of '46, '41, '36, '31, '26, etc., will
take advantage of the opportunity. It
makes it possible for any class to have
a real affair, including banquet, pro-
gram, time to talk old times over,
and dance, without the usual terrific
costs involved. The banquet will be
held this year on Saturday, June 2.
Harry Dougherty, Jr., business

manager of the basketball team, -re-
ported that a very active year for the
Alumni boys is drawing to a close.
The team played 21 games, winning
13 and losing 8. Four games still re-
main on their schedule to play. -
The next regular meeting will be

held on Monday evening, March 19 in
the High School.

LETTER TO THE EDITOR

Gentlemen:
The Retail Merchants Association of

Westminster, have always been vital-
ly interested in the proposition of a
suitable hospital for the people of
Carroll County. With this in mind, we
would like to call your attention to
these basic facts:
1-The liberal gift of Mr. Scott

Bair will become invalid if nothing is
done by 1960.
2-Should this gift be allowed to

become invalid by default then the act
of the State legislature enabling the
County to match the gift of Mr. Bair,
and others, would also become invalid.
3-Without the above sums, the

County would not be in position to
qualify for matching Federal Funds
under the Hill-Burton act.
4-The continued increase in popu-

lation growth of Carroll County make
the need of a hospital more urgent.
5-The growth of population of our

surrounding areas continue to over-
crowd the existing hospital facilities
of these areas.
6-We feel that the citizens of our

County will support a hospital with
their gifts and cooperative efforts.
In view of these basic facts, we are

suggesting that immediate action is.
needed to promote this project. With
the Medical Society taking the lead in
requesting the County Commissioners
to appoint a committee, or to form a
Hospital Corporation, that will furnish
the leadership, necessary to accom-
plish the completion of a suitable
hospital and for its efficient manage-
ment. This leadership group to work
under the advice, guidance, and recom-
mendations of the Carroll County
Medical Society.

If people would confine their talks
to subjects that are profitable, that
which St. John informs us took place
once in heaven, would happen very
frequently on earth,-silence for the
space of half an hour.

-Mary Baker Eddy

1956-1957 LICENSE PLATES

Applications for new 1956-1957license plates for passenger cars and
motor cycles were mailed to owners.
beginning Feb. 21 and all should be in
the mail by Feb. 24, according to
Frank Small, Jr., Commissioner of
Motor Vehicles. The new plates will
be placed on sale Monday, Feb. 27, and
may be displayed on and after March
1 according to law.

Attention of the motorist is called
to the NOTICE enclosed with the ap-
plication, explaining the correct fees
to be remitted instead of those print-
ed on the application. When a $20.00
fee is shown - remit $15.00 and when
a $30.00 fee is shown - remit $23.00.
The applications for motor cycles will
show a fee of $8.00, but owners should
remit $5.00, the same as last year.
A self-addressed envelope will be
furnished for the convenience of ap-
plying through the mail, which the
public is asked to do immediately, in
order to avoid the inconvenience of
waiting in line.
Two plates will be issued, one to be

displayed on the front srnd one on the
rear.

If the address on the application is,
for any reason, incorrect, owners are
requested to furnish the correct ad-
dress in the space provided for that
purpose.

Applications for trucks and all oth-
er classes will not be mailed out un-
til about March 30.

WITH OUR ARMED FORCES

Army Pfc. David K. Warehime, 20,son of Mr. and Mrs. Roger Warehime,Rt. 5, Westminster, Md., recently wasassigned to the 9th Infantry Divisionin Germany.
Warehime, a member of companyD of the division's 39th Regiment, en-tered the Army in October 1954 andcompleted basic training at Fort Jack-son, S. C.
He attended Westminster HighSchool.

Pvt. Hezekiah U. Albaugh, 20, sonof Clarence Albaugh, Union Bridge,
recently completed a winter training
program on Mount Fujiyama, Japan.
The Army uses the snow-coveredslopes for training with winter field

equipment, including skis, snowshoes,and the all-purpose tractor, theweasel.
Albaugh, a rifleman, in the 1st Cal-valry Division's 8th Regiment, enter-

ed the Army in Oct. 1953 and received
basic training at Fort Knox, Ky. He
arrived in the Far East in June 1954.
Albaugh is at 1952 graduate of

Walkersville High School.

Pvt. David P. Putman, son of Paul
H. Putman, Rt. 2, Union Bridge, Md.,
recently completed ten weeks of ad-
vanced training under the packet
platoon system at the Armored Re-
placement Training Center, Fort
Knox, Kentucky.
Pvt. Putman was trained to drive

the Army's medium tank. He passed
the .30 and .50 caliber machine gun
proficiency tests and qualified as a
gunner in the firing of the 90 mm.
tank gun.
Under the packet platoon system of

training each trainee becomes a
permanent member of a tank crew.
The 21-year-old soldier entered the

Army last August and completed
basic training at Fort Jackson, S. C.

DEDICATED SHERIFF SAVES
SUSPECT FROM PRISON

Erie Stanley Gardner tells how a
dedicated sheriff saved a bank hold-
up suspect from imprisonment by dil-
igent police work. Read how this
sheriff meticulousy traced a slim clue
that cleared the suspect in March 11
issue of

The American Weekly
Magazine in Colorgravure with the

BALTIMORE
SUNDAY AMERICAN

Order from Your Local News&aler
RIFFLE'S NEWS AGENCY

Delmar E. Riffle
Taneytown. Md Phone 6551

AUTO LICENSE BLANKS MAILED

All applications for 1956-1957 li-
cense plates for passenger cars and
motor cycles have now been mailed by
the Department of Motor Vehicles,
says the Honorable Frank Small, Jr.,
Commissioner.

If you have not received your appli-
cation for either of these two classes,
due to change of address or any other
reason, notify the Department in writ-
ing, giving your full name, new and
old address and title number, if possi-
ble, which may be found on the last
line of your registration card to the
far right.

Applications should be returned
promptly in envelope furnished, as the
new plates must be displayed by mid-
night, March 31. Fees given on no-
tice enclosed with application should
be remitted.

In every piece of
Job work we do,
we employ the
latest Wept; of the
printing art to de-
velop your sales
arguments and to
emphasize your
selling points. It
Increases your re-
turns materially.

Lat,

STORES
STOCK UP

 AND SAVE!
Here's Proof Your Dollar Buys More

S
See What 1
a Dollar
Will Buy!

Ideal
PEANUT BUTTER 

3 ;oa,$1.00
Ideal Condensed

TOMATO SOUP 10 100

SPAGHETTI tans $1"
Ideal Prepared •

Ideal

PORK & BEANS
Libby's or Ideal

SAUER KRAUT
Large, Tender

FARMDALE PEAS
Ideal Blue Label

FANCY PEAS
Ideal Tiny Whole

WHITE POTATOES
Seaside Brand

LIMA BEANS
Ideal

KIDNEY BEANS
ideal

CUT BEETS
Ideal Pure Strawberry IV' •

PRESERVES
Glenwood Assorted Aff

JELLIES
Dole's •

PINEAPPLE JUICE
B-C Cocktail or

HAWAIIAN PUNCH 3 =I"
Caper

DOG FOOD 8 =1"
You Save 15c

STATLER TISSUENY''' Sir

9
6
7
6

16-oz
cans

27-oz
cans

16-oz
cans

16-oz
cans

9 16"-oz
cans

9 16-oz
cans

9 16-oz
cans

9 16-oz
cans

4 12-oz
jars

5 12-oz
gls

4 46-oz
cans

$1" .
$1"
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00

$1"

4 for 25c Size Juicy Florida

GRAPEFRUIT 6for 29
Juicy Fla. Valencia

ORANGES 5 b-lab 39c
APPLES U.S. No. 1 - -lbbag 49.Eastern

Fresh Slaw, Soup or Salad Mix 2 pkgs 29c
Fla. Radishes 2 pkgs 13c Large Peppers 2 for 15c

U. S. No. 1 Maine Russet Mealy

BAKING POTATOES
10.949cExtra

Special!

IDEAL FRENCH FRIED POTATOES
IDEAL BROCCOLI SPEARS
IDEAL FORDHOOK LIMAS
IDEAL BRUSSEL SPROUTS

Sart.
10e

2 9-oz pkgs 29c
2 10-oz pkgs 45c
2 10-oz pkgs 45c
2 10-oz pkgs 49c

SupremeEnrichedBreadtr:;15c
HOT CROSS BUNS pkg0f8on1y9c

Trying Chickens .47 lb.

Crab Meat Claw 89c Reg. 99c

Lancaster Ready to eat Hams Mule .55 lb.

Special Sliced Bacon Sale
Fire Side .33 lb. - Wilson Corn King .39 lb.

Lancaster .49 lb.

PERCH Fillet

OYSTERS standards
selects

HADDOCK Fillet

Cleaned WHITINGS

.35 lb.

.99 pt.
$1.09 pt.

.39 lb.

19c lb.

Farnly Size 2-lb. niece BOLOGNA .85
Prices Effective March 1-2-3, 1956. Quantity Rights Reserve&
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Farming successfully means train-

ing carefully, these days. Save to put

that bright lad through agricultural

college by investing regularly in U. S.

Savings Bonds. Since E bonds re-

turn four dollars for three in less

than 10 years, you can save enough

for three years of schooling and the

increase in value will pay for the

fourth year.

Sandy MacGregor says: If ye'd be
happy, salt away a part of your pay
on the payroll savings plan. 'Twill
bring ye a braw, bricht future.

TIMBER GROVE FARMS Guaran-
teed Dispersion of Registered Aber-
deen Angus cattle at Timber Grove
Farms, Owings Mills, Md., on Rt. 140,
north of Baltimore.

Featuring the Get and Service of
the $18,000 Ankonian 3255th. Satur-
day the 10th of March, 1956, begin-
ning promptly at 10:00 a. m.

100 head great producing cows with
calves at foot; bred and open heifers;
famous families, top breeding. This is
one of the mightiest herds of the
East and the largest herd in Mary-
land.

Opportunities for breeders and
farmers alike, all to be sold in one
day. No doubt there will be many
bargains. Bang's certified and T.B. ac-
credited.

JEROME GEBHART, Owner

For information write Dave Can-
ning, Sale Manager, Canning ;And
and Cattle Company, Box 11115,
Staunton, Va. Phone 6-0811. 3-1-2t

There's no better way to protect
your future than by investing in
America's future. Buy U. S. Savings
Bonds regularly.

For your own security—and your

country's too—invest in U. S. Savings
Bonds.

er

PENALTY

FOR THROWING
TRASH
KEEP

MARYLAND
BEAUTIFUL

Over 700 of these signs have been

ordered throughout the State by

individuals, publi, and private or-

ganizations through their County

Commissioners. They are being

erected on our County roads in co-

operation with the Governor's Com-

mittee to Keep Maryland Beautiful.

LITTERBUGS BEWARE! F

ffinproving 5mi1y and Community livingn6

CLUB WEEK MARCH 3-11

131£1668180181E48

YOU ARE INVITED TO THE

'FASHIONS
. IN

HOMEMAKING'
FASHION SHOW & COOKING SCHOOL

to be held

THURSDAY, MARCH 8, 1956

at 7:30 P. M.

At the Taneytown High School

PRIZES

FREE RECIPES
* * *

A COMPLETE FASHION SHOW

Plus

'WIFE SAVING' HOMEMAKING IDEAS

* BAKING * BROILING

* ECONOMY HINTS

* COOKING SHORT CUTS

* MODERN HOME LAUNDRY METHODS

And other suggestions for easier Living

* * *

Sponsored by

SEVEN LOCAL P.-T.A. GROUPS

Presented by

THE HOME SERVICE DEPT.

OF THE POTOMAC EDISON CO.

* * *

TICKETS MAY BE PURCHASED

FROM ANY P.-T.A. MEMBER OR

AT THE DOOR ON MARCH 8

Money isn't everything, but try do-

ing without it! There's nothing like

regular savings in U.S. Savings Bonds

to keep your future comfortable.

Sandy MacGregor says: It's sound
Scots sense to buy Savings Bonds
where ye work or where ye bank. The
payroll savings plan makes it auto-
matic.

4

'

WHERE YOU BUY
iS JUST AS IMPORTANT AS

WHAT YOU BUY
MAKE SURE YOUR DEALER OFFERS:

DELI VERY
AT YOUR CONVENIENCE

INSTALLATION
ACCORDING TO FACTORY RECOMMENDATIONS

1-40 ME

DEMONSTRATION
BY TRAINED PERSONNEL

SERVICE
BY SKILLED EXPERTS

DELIVERY—INSTALLATION—DEMONSTRATION

AND SERVICE

ALL AVAILABLE ONLY AT YOUR LOCAL

ELECTRIC APPLIANCE DEALER AND THE

POTOMAC EDISON CO.

MNAOSII

New Heavyweight
Champs

Teeter
CRUSHED STONE

Phone
Gettysburg

696
or

Westminster
918

If It's Crushed Stone, Call Teeter

JOHN S. TEETER a SONS
WESTMINSTER GETTYSBURG, PA.

NOTICE of SCHOLARSHIP EXAMINATIONS

Examinations will be given on March 24, 1956, at the Westminst
er

High School, 9:00 a. m. Scholarships are by appointment of County

Senator after examination. Openings for appointment exist as fol-

lows:

1. Johns Hopkins University—College of Engineering (2 avai
l-

able (Male) for Carroll County with $200.00 additional emol-

ument).

2. Johns Hopkins University—Engineering-2 available (Male)

on "at-large" basis.

3. Johns Hopkins—College of Arts and Sciences. 8 availab
le

(Male) on state-wide basis.
NOTE: • Consult high school principals for instruction as 

to

securing admission to Hopkins University.

4. St. Johns's College-2 available-1 full scholarship (Value

$1,500.00) and 1 tuition (Value $850.00) (Male or Female).

5. Hood College-1 available (Female) for Carroll County.

Covers room, board, and tuition. '(Secure information 
from

high school principal regarding admission to Hood Coll
ege).

6. University of Maryland-1 scholarship available (Value

$165.00) Male or Female.

7. Maryland Institute-1 scholarship available in night or
 Sat-

urday school—Male or Female.

8. Washington College, Chestertown-1 tuition-textbook 
schol-

arship available—Male or Female.

9. Western Maryland College-1 senatorial (board and
 tuition)

scholarship available—Male only.

10. Peabody Conservatory of Music, Baltimore-1 senatorial

scholarship available—Male or Female.

Names of those who intend to take the examination shoul
d be sub-

mitted through local high school principals to the Board
 of Education

by March 9.

•

SAMUEL M. JENNESS,

Supt. Carroll County Schools.

7-- 7 „
New '56 Chevrolet Task-Force Trucks

Champs of every weight class!

New models to do bigger jobs—rated up

to 32,000 lbs. G.V.W.! New power right

across the board—with a brand-new big

V8 for high-tonnage hauling! New auto-

matic and 5-speed transmissions!

J.7.1

New Middleweight
4 Champs

'OW
New Lightweight

Champs

Meet today's most modern truck fleet! It offers new champs of

every weight class, including four new heavy-duty series. It

brings you new power for every job, with a modern short-

stroke V8* for every model.
Then there's a wider range of Hydra-Matic models and

Powermatic, a new six-speed automatic, plus new five-speed

manual transmissions.f
Come in and see these new Chevrolet trucks!

*V8 standard in L.C.F. and Series 8000 and 10000 models, an extra-cost option

in all other models.
tExtra-cost options available in a wide range of models (five-speed transmission

standard in Series 9000 and 10000).

Anything less is an old-fashioned truck!

3-1-2t

TIIE

POTOMAC EDISON CO.
otneles.S0:02,4,40tWVA

OHLER'S CHEVROLET SALES
TANEYTOWN, MD
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Sunday School Lessons ZA.
BY DR. KENNETH J. FOREMAN

Background Scripture: Luke .19:28-
20:47.

Devotional Reading: Revelation 21:22
—22:5.

Christ and the City
Lesson for March 4, 1956

CENSUS takers have long been
dividing us Americans into

"Rural" and "Urban." The fact is,
wherever we may live, if we are
not in a city we are in many ways
affected by cities. The magazines
and papers we read are often pub-
lished in cities. Most of the things
a farmer uses—tractors, combines,
fertilizer, tools, came from cities.
Our clothes were
made in cities, our
laws were made
there. Your casket
may have already
been made in some
city. There is a
state in America
which has just one
large city. A for-
mer resident of
that state told the Dr. Foreman
writer that very few small towns
there amounted to anything, be-
cause all the young people in the
state who had any ambition struck
out for that big city as soon as they
could. One way or another, we are
all becoming "urban" pretty fast.

Enthusiasm Is FragiIe
The largest city Jesus ever saw

brought tears to his eyes, and no
wonder. Some of the things he saw
are true of cities and of urban civi-
lization today. They are true of our
American way of life, 20th-century
style. One was the swiftly rising,
and as swiftly falling, enthusiasm
of the crowds. There they came
with joyful shouts of welcome on
Palm Sunday morning; and by Fri-
day morning somebf the same mob
wotild be screaming, "Crucify
him!" City people take quickly to
new ideas and new heroes — and
quickly drop them. They will strew
tons of ticker-tape and torn-up tele-
phone books (for lack of palm
branches) on some returning hero,
but in six months' time won't be
able to remember his name. Ex-
plain it as you like, the fact is that
urban enthusiasms are fragile.
That goes for most of us. What we
live for in our urban America is
mostly excitement. We live from
headline to headline, from thrill to

thrill. Advertisers do their best to
stir us up. They talk of "exciting"
new colors, exciting new fashions,
even (believe it or not) exciting
new toothpaste. The advertisers
know Etat if we can really be per-
suaded that a thing is exciting,
we'll buy it! We would rather lis-
ten to a new idea than a true one.
That's city fever.

Mass Man
In the days of Davy Crockett,

whose ghost, we trust, will have
been laid to rest before these lines
meet the public eye—in the days of
Davy C. and of Dan'l Boone, nearly
all Americans were living in the
country, as we would call it today.
Even the cities were small. Those
were the days of rugged individual-
ism. When a neighbor came within
.50 miles of Daniel Boone, he thought
the woods were getting too crowd-
ed, so the legend has it—and moved
on. Nowadays in our more urban
era, we have come to the time of
"Mass Man" as philosophers call
him. The city is the Land of Fol-
low-my-Leader. It is the dwelling-
place of the Joiners. Mr. Boone did
not belong to many societies; but
where is the man today who is hap-
py without belonging to enough
clubs and societies to keep him out
every night? Mass Man is a rather
sad spectacle. Jesus wept over him
there in Jerusalem. The people of
that city were like sheep, doing,
saying, even thinking what their
Scribes and Pharisees told them to.
The men of Jerusalem would not
look for themselves, they "knew
not the time of their visitation."
They did not know when God was
knocking at their door. If Christ
came to America today, would
Mass Man recognize him? Or
would he be under suspicion be-
cause he would not fit the universal
pattern?

Den of Robbers
The city over which Jesus wept

was the site of a magnificent Tem-
ple, built as a place of worship.
But when Jesus visited it, he found
a cattle-market going on in the
very middle of it. What should
have been worship had turned to
money-making. So it is too often
with an urban civilization. Built
on business, on the market-place,
it tends to turn everything into a
market-place. Art is commercial-
ized; so is education, so are ath-
letics, politics, sometimes religion.
If the reader thinks this is exag-
gerated, let him look around during
this month and see some every-
day examples of how religion is
comniercitIlized in America. We

. are alproL ching the joyful Chris-
tian L'stiva of Easter. How many
thotra.tds of people in our land
are 1:lanni":.g to make money out
of it
(Based on ou°!ines copyrt...nted by the
Division of Chris:Ian Education. Na-
1,onal Council of the Chnrches of Christ
In the U. S. A. Released by Community
Fress Service.)

ceet'80hinh
by

G. H. ENFIELD

THOUGHTS FOR THOUGHT
•

I It isn't difficult to get, the approval
of conscience when conscience hasn't
been disciplined to discriminate.

It is good when we must go down
on our knees and call out into space
for the help of the Invisible.

Liberties are bought frequently with
the price of blood.

There are two kinds of regrets: Re-
grets of what one may have done;
regrets of what one may not have
done.

Multitudes of little things kindly
done awaken more happiness than
their • combination into our one large
blessing.

Did it ever occur to investigators
that even investigators sometimes
bea investigation?

Everything is not made more beau-
tiful by coloring. This is so of Truth.

An act is not necessarily righteous
and justified because it is done in the
name of religion.

The language read and understood
by all men is written upon the face.

The one thing borrowed more than
any other and kept by the borrower
is worry.

I don't know what has happened
when a generation allows itself to be
terrorized by its own children.—Paul
Harvey, the commentator.

WILLIAM WINCHESTER CHAP-
TER MEETS

The William Winchester Chapter
Daughters of the American Revolu-
tion met on Friday, Feb. 10, at 2 P. M.
at the home of Mrs. F. LaMotte Smith,
Westminster, with Mrs. Robert Gist
and Mrs. Smith co-hostesses. Mrs.
Wesley A. Pickens, Regent, conducted
the meeting which was opened with a
prayer by the chaplain followed by
the pledge of Allegiance to the Flag.
Mrs. Frank T. Parish, Sec. read the
minutes of the January meeting and
Mrs. F. Donald Shriver presented the
treasurer's report. •
Mrs. James T. Marsh read the Pres-

ident General's message in which Miss
Carroway states, "Young people es-
pecially must be taught the back-
ground and workings of our Constitu-
tional Republic, the advantages and
blessings of our American Way of
Life, so that they will zealously wish
to protect and preserve them for pos-
terity." Mrs. Sherwood Kay read the
National Defense news from the Press
Digest.
The members voted to extend the

Good Citizenship medal project to one
more student during this year. The
recipients of these medals are select-
ed by the faculty and the medals are
presented not in the sense of a prize
but in recognition of the effort put
forth by the students in the field of
American Citizenship. The require-
ments for the award of the medal to
a boy or to a girl are based upon five
qualities—Honor, Service, Courage,
Leadership and Patriotism.
Mrs. David H. Taylor, Historian,

has extended the History Medal pro-
gram to three intermediate schools,
Charles Carroll, Uniontown and Me-
chancisville. Top ranking history stu-
dents are selected to participate in
an essay contest which determines the
winner of the medal, in each school,
The medals are woe s e nted at a spring
assembly or on promotion night.

Mrs. Arthur G. Turner, Senior pres-
ident of the Terra Rubra Society, Chil-
dren of the American Revolution an-
nounced that the meeting, postponed
because of inclement weather, would
be held at Thorndale near Taneytown
on Saturday, Feb. 18, at 1:30 p. m.
Ted and Meg Parish will be host and
hostess, and D.A.R. members are in-
vited. The State Society C.A.R. will
hold their annual conference on March
10th at the Catonsville Methodist
Church, Castle Thunder will serve as
the hostess Society.
The chapter has again fulfilled the

requirements necessary to receive the
National Gold Honor Roll Certificate
of Award. Seven sterling spoons from
the McIlhenny family were presented
to the D.A.R. State Chapter House by
Miss Cecelia Shower, Manchester.
Governor McKeldin has issued a pro-

clamation designating February as
American History month. The Wil-
liam Winchester chapter will be rep-
resented in "A Chat with Gladys" ov-
er WTTR on Washington's birthday
presenting Historical facts from a
press release by the National Socie-
ty. February 29th is DAR Civilian
Defense Day at the State Chapter
House, Baltimore, Md. Speakers
have been secured for both morning
and afternoon sessions and members
are urged to attend this meeting.
LEARN YOUR ROLE IN C.D.

Miss Lillian Shipley, Curator of the
Carroll County Historical House was
introduced by Mrs. F. Donald Shriver.
She spoke briefly concerning the many
hidden histories now at the Historical
House. Some of them are files and
magazines froin the collections of Mr.
Leland Jordan, Mr. John Mitten and
Miss Mary Shellman. The need for
v,plunteer workers to assist with the
sorting and filing of reference mater-
ial is a pressing one. Miss Shipley also
read z most interestinv paper, written
by Earl D. Wantz, which was _largely
compiled from material secured at the
Historical House. The paper, West-
minster in the Gettysburg Campaign
tells of the important part the town
played as a supply center for the com-
bat troops and as relief center for the
wounded moving south.
Guests were Mrs. Edwin M. Mellor,

Mrs. Garrett Weersing and Miss Lil-
lian Shipley. Following the program
Mrs. Gist and Mrs. Smith served tea.
Mrs. Jas. Marsh presided at the ta-
ble.
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TANEYTOWN ORGANIZATIONS
Taneytown Chamber of Commerce meetson tne 4th Monday in each month inthe Municipal building at 8:00 o'clock.Merwyu C. leuss, Pres.; lot Vice-Free.,David Smitio; Second Vice7Pres., Car-roll L. Wantz; Secretary, Bernard J.Arnold; Treasurer, Chas. R. Arnold.

Taneytown Fire Company, meets on the2nd Monday each month, at 7:30 p. m.in the Firemen's Building. President.Donald Ciingan; Vice-Pres., David
Smeak; Recording Secretary, Chas.Smith; Financial Secretary, AugustusShank; Treasurer, David Smith;
Trustees, Wilbur F. Miller, Jr., David
Hilterbrick, Richmond Miller; Chief,Chas. D. Baker.

The American Legion — Reason-Spider
Post No. 120 meets third Thursday ofeach mouth at 8:00 P. M.. in the LegionHome. All service men welcomed.
Commander, James D. Fiscus; Arju-taut; Stanley W. King: Treasurer.
Robert Wantz; Service Oflicer„ Fran-cis E. LookingbIll.

Monocacy Valley Memorial Post 6918, Har-ney, Md., meets on 1st. and 3rd. Tues-day of each month In the V.F.W. Hall,Harney, Md., Commander Roy B. Over-
holtzer ; Adjutant, Ralph Vaughn;
Quartermaster, Harold Bell.

All other Fraternities and organizationsare invited to use this directory, for thepublic information It carries. Cost for oneyear only $3.00.

SPECIAL WINTER DISCOUNT
Now In Effect

••••

Joseph L. Mathias & Sons
MONUMENTS

DISTINCTIVE DURABLE

WESTMINSTER, BALPIMORE,
HANOVER

OUR 50th YEAR
"Build While you Live"

Phone Westminster 127

"Only A Monument Can Tell
The Story Forever"

12-8-tf

KOONS FLORIST
Cut Flowers Designsot•

Corsages
• Li ITLESTOWN, PENNA.

• • • • 6 I 3.11114-6-6Milm
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•Phone 140

mut" 11/.111Lkflitrn 11._t_t_tit/LI.

Hone tomorrow: one small patient.
The nurses will miss her but theik're glad

she's well. Medical care came quickly to this
little girl. Her own doctor attended her.

And the doctor's bill? BLUE SHIELD will help
pay it. Her wise parents have seen to that.

BLUE SHIELD is the remarkable non-profit
organization that protects BLUE CROSS sub-
scribers against the expense of surgical, med-
ical, and obstetrical care. Sponsored by over
1,920 participating physicians, BLUE SHIELD
has the active support of your local medical
profession in providing realistic, low-cost pro-
tection to subscribers.

BLUE SHIELD rounds out the protection
offered by BLUE Otoss. To the hospital care
benefits BLUE CROSS provides, BLUE SHIELD
adds surgical and medical benefits and, to the
wife in a family membership, a liberal mater-
nity allowance. BLUE SHIELD lets you choose
your own doctor. BLUE SHIELD pays the full
scheduled benefit for the surgical, medical, or
maternity care you need.

Don't let worry over unexpected surgical
and medical expenses trouble you another
day. If there is a BLUE CROSS group where
you work, ask your employer about BLUE
SHIELD. If there is no BLUE CROSS group, and
there are five or more people where you work,
ask your employer about getting this essential
protection. You can get information yourself
by phoning your nearest BLUE SHIELD office,
or by writin,- 'nr i free booklet to: BLUE
SHIELD, Dept 1 01 4 200 West Baltimore St.,
Baltimore 1, Maryland.

Riff Sf1/EL/I®
Maryland Medical Service, Inc. 0

200 W. BALTIMORE STREEl, BALTIMORE 1, MD.
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of your daily requirements of important Niacin

Nowin BONNIE BREAD
Also more of your daily requirements of:

Protein • Iron • Calcium • Vitamin "B-1" • Vitamin "B-2"
Vitamin "D" • Vitamin "E"

*NOW ONLY EXTRA ENRICHED BONNIE BREAD
GIVES YOU MORE OF YOUR DAILY
VITAMIN AND MINERAL REQUIREMENTS!
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Attitude of Farm
Youth Is Sampled
No, On Drinking; Yes
On Attending Church
What are some of the social at-

titudes of America's young farm-
ers? A poll conducted by rural so-
ciologists at the Pennsylvania
University shows they frown on so-
cial drinking and advocate regular
church attendance, among other
things.

The poll, which sampled 2,807
sophomore boys and girls in 74

A sampling of opinion among
rural youth in Pennsylvania indi-
cates that our young farmers be-
lieve that regular church attend-
ance is a requirement for those
who would be community lead-
ers.

different rural high schools, re-
vealed that:
I. Drinking of alcoholic bever-

ages was disapproved by 76 per
cent.

2. Regular church attendance
was advocated by 62 per cent who
felt it a requirement "in order to
be a community leader." A total
of 49 per cent disapproved Sab-
bath labor.
3. On Sunday movies, 40 per

cent approved, 39 per cent ob-
jected, 21 per cent remained un-
decided.

4. Card playing was approved
by 45 per cent, "loafing up town"
was approved by 55 per cent, danc-
ing won approval of 87 per cent,
and 54 per cent approved the use
of tobacco.

5. Divorces in cases where a
couple can no longer remain hap-
pily married were approved by 56
per cent.

6. Makeup for girls won ap-
proval of 63 per cent.

7. High school students should
be allowed to spend their money
as they see fit, according to 56 per
cent.

Research on Fertilizer
Carryover Reported
Every farmer who pays off a

fertiliter bill naturally wonders
just how much of this year's ferti-
lizer will carry over into next
year's fields.

It's been B guessing game untilr .
recently. Now, agronomists at

' Iowa State College have conducted
research to determine the amount
of carryover and have come up
With some figures which make fer-
tilizer savings possible.
Nitrogen carryover, the Iowans

have found, amounts to 25 per cent
on the average. It may go higher
following a dry year, or it may be
less after a good crop or in sandy
soils.

Phosphorus generally has a
higher carryover than either nitro-
gen or potash. The rule-of-thumb
figure given by researchers is
about 40 per cent phosphorus car-
ryover where 40 pounds of soluble
phosphorus is applied, or as high
as 60 per cent when 80 pounds or
more is applied.
Many farmers apply phosphorus

to small grains with the expecta-
tion that it will carry over at
least the first hay year. Research-
ers found this a sound idea. Where
phosphorus is applied to corn, the
corn is followed with small grains
and legumes, there will be some
carryover and though probably not
enough for maximum legume
yields.

Potash will usually last two
years at average application rates.

Bargain Seed

Buying "bargain" seeds is a
practice that often pays off in

poor stands and low harvest
yields. Even a high price does
not always assure quality, either.

The safest bet is to always buy

certified seed—even though it
may cost more.

PROCEEDINGS ORPHANS' COURT

Report of sale of real estate filed by
Robert Monroe Clary, executor of Ella
V. Clary, deceased, was finally ratified
by the Orphans' Court.

Stanley A. Myers, et. al. adminis-
trators of the estate of Mary E. My-
ers, deceased, received order to sell
goods and chattels.
Theodore F. Brown, executor of the

estate of Arthur P. Reese, deceased,
filed report of sales of real estate and
goods and chattels.

Lillian P. Miller, administratrix of
the estate of Bradley C. Miller, filed
report of sale of goods and chattels

and settled her first and final account.
Lillie B. Houck, et. als., administra-

tors of the estate of Mamie E. Houck,
deceased, settled their first and final

account.
Carroll County National Bank of

Westminster, executor of the estate

of John Albert Galt deceased, filed in-

ventory of addtional goods and chat-

tels.
Walter M. Yingling, executor of the

estate of Gertrude I. Dickensheets,

deceased filed report of sale of real

estate.
John H. Roberts administrator of

the estate of Lydia Ann A. Davidson,

deceased, settled his first and final

account.
Earl J. Davidson, administrator of

the estate of Harry Kenneth David-

son, deceased, settled his first and fin-

al account.
Herman W. Rahe, executor of the

estate of Helen B. Pennington, de-

ceased, filed inventories of goods and

chattels and real estate.
Letters of administration of the

estate of Joel W. Cock, deceased, were

granted unto Blanche G. Cock.
The last will and testament of Ar-

banah Mae Beegle, deceased, was ad-

mitted to probate and letters testa-

mentary were granted unto Glenn R.

Beegle, who received order to notify

creditors.
John R. Shipley et. al., executors

the estate of Florence R. Shipley, de-

ceased, filed inventory of real estate.

John R. Shipley ,et. al. executors

of the estate of Reas Shipley, deceas-

ed, filed inventory of real estate.
Earl D. Young, executor of the es-

tate of Bessie D. Mehring, deceased,

settled his first and final account.
Letters of administration on the es-

tate of Earl J. Babylon, deceased,

were granted unto Theodore F. Brown

who received order to notify creditors.

Nina V. Thomas and Franklin Dav-

is, administators pendente lite of the

estate of Grace W. Parlett, deceased,

filed report of sale of goods and chat-

tels, and filed their final account, mak-

ing distribution to the duly appointed
executor.

Ancillary letters of administration

on the estate of Elsie Durbin Smelser

Cross, late of Washington, D. C., were

granted unto Jewell Glenn Cross, who
received order to notify creditors and
warrant to appraise real estate.
Peter Wolf, executor of the estate

of George W. Wolf, deceased, settled
his first and final account.

Charles W. Rothenberger, adminis-
trator of the estate of David William
Rothenberger, deceased, settled his
first and final account.

Letters of administration on the es-
tate of Nannie E. Whitehill, deceased,
were granted unto Earl D. Young,who
received order to notify creditors and
warrants to appraise real and person-
al estate.
The last will and testament of Nor-

man E. Bohn, deceased, was admitted
to probate and letters testamentary
were granted unto Norman G. Bohn,
as acting executor, who received order

to notify creditors and warrants to
appraise.
Glenn R. Beegle, executor of the es-

tate of Arbanah Mae Beegle, deceas-

ed, filed inventory of debts due.
Alice E. Billmyers, administratrix

of the estate of Mary E. S. Billmyer,

deceased, filed inventory of goods and

eltgt@lis.
Marian 13. Case, administratrix of

the estate of Marion B. Case, deceas-

ed, filed niventories of goods and real

estate.
Charles Mehring, et. al. executors

of the estate of Annie E. Mehring,

deceased, filed report of sale of goods

and chattels.
Charles W. Gill, Jr., legal represen-

tative of the estate of Charles Gill,

received order to withdraw funds.

— 0—One of the best rulesof conversa-

tion is, never to say a thing which

any of the company can reasonably

wish had been left unsaid. —Swift

Think twice before you say noth-

ing. —H. G. Hutcheson

.7Sizzy Joe
l y

Special This Week

Dresses (Plain) Cleaned and ;
Pressed

$1.00 each, 2 for $1.95 ,

Special Next Week

Trousers and Skirts (Plain) 4̀‘.
Cleaned and ,Pressed Nts

50c each, 2 for 95c

Route Service Wed. and Sat.

every week in Ns
'Taneytown, Uniontown, Union s'

Bridge, Middleburg, Keymar and s.

NsEmmitsburg.

WE DO

..Shoe Repairing & Laundry Service.'

BIZZY BEE CLEANERS

HANOVER, PENNA.

Phone Han. 3-0252

•

00 We give S & H Green Stamps

TOWNE THEATRE
LITTLESTOWN, PA.

TONITE (THURS.) 7 & 9 P. M.

ERROL FLYNN—JOANNE DRU

"THE WARRIORS"
in Cinemascope and Color

FRI. 7 8z 9, SAT., 5:30, 7 & 9

REX BEACH'S Thriller!

"THE SPOILERS"
in Technicolor with

Anne Baxter—Jeff Chandler
Rory Calhoun—Barbara Britton

SUNDAY 2, 4, 7 & 9 P. M.

MON. & TUES., 7 & 9 P M.

Jane Wyman—Rock Hudson

"ALL THAT HEAVEN

ALLOWS"
in Technicolor

WED. & THUR. 7 & 9 P. M.

Tony Curtis—Pat Crowley
Ernest Bargnine—Paul Kelly

"THE SQUARE JUNGLE"

TANEYTOWN GRAIN MARKETS

Wheat  $1.95 per bu.
Corn  $1.40 per bu.
Barley  $1.00 per bu.
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THE RECORD OFFICE

Taneytown, Md..

NOTICE OF ELECTION -
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An election will be held at the of- titt
fice of The Reindollar Company, on
Monday, March 19, 1956 between the
hours of 1 and 2 o'clock, P. M., for •:JL.::
the purpose of electing eight Direc-
tors to serve for the ensuing year.

NORMAN R. HESS,
3-1-3t President M
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CONDITIONS
DRY COWS

for

MORE
MILK
after calving
If you're not feeding your
dry cows a good dry cow
ration, you'll probably help
yourself two ways by feeding
Purina D & F Chow for 60
days before calving.

1. Cows will be in better
condition calve and
clean easier with less
udder cake.

2. The extra condition will
make up to 2,000 lbs. more
milk per cow in the next
lactation.

; MICRO
-MIXED.

,r11/9:"r
•Tho---.011
PURINA

& F
CHOW

•
0
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Taneytown Grain &
Supply Co.
Phone 3871
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Big Party and Open House
FRIDAY, MARCH 2, 1956

at 8:00 P. M.

AMERICAN LEGION HOME, TANEYTOWN

Benefit Drum and Bugle Corps

5 Cent Game—Valuable Prizes
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SALMON

SPAGHETTI

z

M 2

I I

Pink 1 can .55

MARCH 3 MARCH 5

Franco American 2 Cans 29c I

CHEESE Velveeta 2-1b. box .85 I

Vegetarian Vegetable Soup "Campbell's" 2 Cans 27c i

Sauer Kraut "Silver Floss" 2 cans .35
411

TUNA FISH Breast of Chicken Solid Pack 1 Can 37e I

PEACHES Delmonte

SWEET MIXED PICKLES Langs

CABBAGE

GRAPE FRUIT

New

Seedless

1 can .33 I

1 Jar 47c

2-1b. .09

4 for 29c I

0 u ERTy's
OREM VANE

-=-••=----0GROCERY
TANLYTOW,N, MD,PHONE 3021
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Three Sounds That
Spell PROTECTION!

,..
.1*. CLICK -- CLICK __---- CLICK —
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The bolts in our massive time-locked vault door

our key and your key to an individual steel compart-

ment—all must turn before your private safe deposit

box is "unlocked." Here, your important papers and

other valuables are thoroughly safeguarded twenty-

four hours a day!

WHY NOT RENT THAT SAFE DEPOSIT

BOX WITH US SOON? COST IS AS

LITTLE AS A FEW CENTS A WEEK.

First National Bank

r
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EH*:
TANEYTOWN, Md.

Member Federal Reserve System

Member of The Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation)

ALL

WEATHER

BANKING FOR

FARMERS
You outwit the weather when you bank

by mail. Rain, snow, sleet, ice, slippery

roads — nothing bothers you when you

make your deposits this easy way.

Well be glad to answer any questions

about how you can do your

banking-by-mail from your farm.

The Birnie Trust Company
TANEYTOWN, MD.

(Member of the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporatio
n)

TREE
BANDANNA

when you buy fawn

WOIMN
HORSEHIDE, BUCKSKIN OR PIGSKIN

WORK GLOVES

Soft, tough, long wearing, and you get
a big bandanna free with every pair.

While supply lasts —

Reindollar Bros. EK, Co.
HARDWARE • PAINTS • APPLIANCES

ESTABLISHED 1897 Taneytown, Md. TELEPHONE 4564

:22:2213:2112:1=221==================

WESTINGHOUSE, CROSLEY, NORGE

APPLIANCES

NOTICE
Buy where services is guaranteed.

Easy rferm7, No down payment

Phone 3041 Taneytown, Md. 11

Mid=Town Electrical Service
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