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CARROLL COUNTY FAIR
AT TANEYTOWN.

All Plans well under way for
the Year's Big Event.

All plans are progressing for the
opening of the Carroll County Fair,
Sept. 11, and the outlook for a good
fair is said to be very bright, for free
attractions, the exhibits, the races,and
every feature that goes to make up a
county fair.

There will be three free attractions
this year; the "Three Valiers," ver-
satile entertainers, using dogs and
pigeons in their funny stunts; "Fool-
ish, Wise and Freckles," the chief
actor being a mule; "The Phunny
Ford," a riot of fun with a Ford car.
The night shows will be especially at-
tractive, with a wonderful display of
Fireworks, Wednesday and Thursday
nights, and music and dancing.
The racing program will also be

strong, and the exhibits in all depart-
ments promise to be unusually large
and varied. In brief, the program of
the four days will be as follows;

Tuesday, Sept. 11, 1:30 P. M., races.
Performances before grandstand.
Dancing in the evening and Free At-
tractions. No admission charge Tues-
day night.

Wednesday, Sept. 12, 1:30 P. M.,
races; performances before grand-
stand. Evening, fireworks. Special
free attractions at 8:15, Midway open.

Thursday, Sept. 13, 1:30 P. M.,
races. Free performances before
grandstand. Evening; special attrac-
tions at 8:15; Midway open.

Friday, Sept. 14, 1:30 P. M., races.
Free performances. All school chil-
dren admitted free until 4 o'clock, P.
M. Fat hog auction. Dancing in the
evening.
The gates will open each day at

7:00 A. M., and close at 11:30 P. M.
An ample police force will be present
each day and night, with authority to
keep the peace and make arrests.

Baseball in Taneytown on Saturday.

There will be a real game of base-
ball in Taneytown, on Saturday af-
ternoon at about 2:30, with the strong
Westminster team. The exact line-
up of the Taneytown can not be defi-
nitely stated, but it will include Moul,
last year's catcher, and likely Cromer
also of last year's team, and perhaps
Minnick for pitcher. The other six
will be Taneytown players.
A good attendance is asked. There

is not likely to be any admission fee
to the ground, but a liberal offering
will be necessary with which to meet
the expenses. Should this game be
well patronized, perhaps other games
will be arranged for.

A Very Poor Corn Crop.

Our attention has been called to a
misstatement made in the Record a
few weeks ago, that there would be a
"normal crop of corn." This is now
very clearly wrong. The first esti-
mate was made on the appearance of
the stalk growth, which is more lusty
than usual; but, the ears are not
there.
The best judges now say the crop

will not average more than half nor-
mal, if it does that; and some farm-
ers will fall far below that. Besides,
the ears that are on the stalks are
mostly small and many stalks have
no ears at all. This is true both of
field corn and the canning variety.
The extreme wet weather and the
heat, coming together on alternate
days. was likely responsible for un-
healthy growth. Besides, there is a
very large acreage on low ground
that is not worth harvesting at all.

A Smutty Story Analyzed.

This week F. W. Oldenburg, Exten-
sion Agronomist of the Agricultural
college, has been in the county work-
ing with County Agent, L. C. Burns
in giving demonstrations on treating
wheat with Copper Carbonate dust to
control stinking smut. For several
years this work has been conducted in
the county with great results accom-
plished. Mr. Oldenburg discussed dif-
ferent forms of dust and demonstrat-
ed the treating of wheat in the way
he recommends it to be done.

Meetings were scheduled as follows
Thursday, August 30, at 10:30 A. M.,
at Englar and Sponseller's Mill, Lib.
erty St.; Thursday, Aug. 30, at 2 P.
M., Hampstead Milling Co.; at 3 P.
M., at Manchester, J. H. Brown's
Feed Store; Friday, Aug. 31, 9:30 A.
M., Woodbine, L. M. Delashmutt &
Sons Elevator.

Similar demonstrations will be held
in the county prior to seeding this
Fall. There will be a Smut exhibit
booth with all the literature available
on the subject at your County Fair.
This wil be a good place to get and
learn methods of using the Copper
Carbonate dust to control stinking
smut. According to reports from the
County Agent's office, there will be
much wheat treated in Carroll County
again this year. Dust can be secured
from most all grain elevators in the
county, as well as a number of feed
stores and drug stores.

New Designs for Desk Blotters.

We have added to our stock, sever-
al handsome patterns of colored blot-
ters for desk tops, and for making up
into various forms of Christmas
novelties for the writing desk. We
have had numerous calls, of late, for
such blotters, and are now prepared
to supply them. They can also be
cut up into handsome advertising
blotters, any size, and printed to suit
customer.

Get your "No Trespassing" signs
at the Record Office.

SOME PRINTERS' ERRORS

And Incidentally, one in The Record,
Last Week.

Last week, in our first editorial un-
der the caption of "The Record in the
Campaign," the type made us say—
"for the information of those who may
not be acquired with our attitude", in-
stead of "may not be acquainted." This
was a bad one, but still not quite the
equal of those that appear below,
clipped from The American Press,
N.Y.
Robert Barker and Martin Lucas,

the two King's printers in the reign
of Charles I, will live on in story be-
cause for some reason or other the
word "not" was omitted from the
Seventh Commandment in the so-call-
ed Wicked Bible.
The blunders of the printer, unlike

those of the physician or lawyer
have an extraordinarily long life. Of-
ten an omitted letter in an advertise-
ment or a story will bring the ad or
story to the attention of millions of
people who would otherwise never
have seen it.
For instance, this classified ad re-

cently appeared in a daily newspa-
per: 'For Rent—Room with one
large widow." Reprinted in other
newspapers, the ad with its one
omitted letter brought chuckles to
many more than the readers of the
newspapers in which it originally ap-
peared.

Occasionally in the attempt to cor-
rect a typographical error an even
worse mistake is made. A newspaper
once described a Colonel who fought
in the Civil War as a "bottle-scarred
veteran." In a subsequent edition it
tried to correct the error, but the re-
sult was that the correction read a
"battle-scared veteran."

Another editor was made to say
that at a wedding "the roses were
punk." When he tried to explain
later that he didn't mean to cast
aspersion on the roses, the intended
correction read thus: "We didn't in-
tend to say the roses were punk.
What we meant was that the noses
at the wedding were pink." The
editor is reported to have left town.
An undertaker in an Ohio town let

the end of a rough box fall on his
foot, breaking the great toe. The
newspaper report said, "Mr. Mann
had to employ a doctor to reduce the
smelling."
A swell wedding took place in a

New York city, and after giving a
full report of all details of the event
one newspaper said: "The wedding
breakfast was survived by"—and then
followed the names of the young la-
dies who had "served" the refresh-
ments.

Lost and Found Articles.

The automobile is responsible for a
condition that comparatively few take
into consideration. Articles lost on
the public highways stand a much
slighter chance of being returned to
their owner now, because they may
be found by an auto driver living
hundreds of miles away, and taken
along. Of course, the proper thing
to do is for the finder to take the ar-
ticle—if valuable—to the nearest
newspaper office, and advertise it;but
even then, the chance of recovery is
much less than before the advent of
the auto.

It may not be convenient to hunt
up a newspaper office, five or ten miles
away; besides the loser may also be a
non-resident of the community, and
finder and loser going in opposite di-
rections at 40 miles an hour. And to
add to the uncertainty, the loser may
not have an idea as to where his loss
occurred.
But, the finder should make a real

effort to find the owner, before exer-
cising finders' rights, and the best
plan is to leave the found article in
the hands of some responsible person,
and advertise it in some newspaper in
the community where the find occur-
red.

Road Work in Frederick County.

The Frederick News, last week, re-
ported that much of the road repair
work in the county, done since the
early rains, has been washed away by
later rains as fast as the repairs were
made. This has been especially true
in Urbana district.

Other sections of the county where
road improvements is taking place in-
clude a macadam road of 2 3-10 miles
from Walkersville to the Emmitsburg
pike, which was started Tuesday un-
der the supervision of T. E. Russell,
and is being built by the county. From
Rocky Ridge to Motter's station, 3%
miles of road is being oiled and chip-
ped by E. C. Valentine, Frederick;and
the road leading north on the Johns-
ville pike to Beaver Dam church, a
distance of two-tenths of a mile, is be-
ing made on the two to one plan, a
stone road.

Near Daysville the county is re-
buildings a 20-ft. concrete bridge
which was washed out last week when
the bridge wall went down as the re-
sult of rain. The bridge had to be
torn out, and a new one built.

Early in the Spring road machinery
was in Middletown district, where sev-
eral roads were oiled and chipped and
some new road built. Other sections
of the county also came in for their
share of repairs and work had been
progressing nicely until greatly in-
creased by the rain which necessitated
repeated improvement to the same
sections.

G. W. Crabbe at New Windsor.

(For the Record).

There will be a Union Service in the
M. E. Church, New Windsor, Sunday
evening. Sept. 2, at 8 o'clock. Attroney
G. W. Crabbe wlil speak. He is a
consecrated Methodist lawyer with a
ringing message. Come out to hear
him, you'll never know its hot while
he is speaking.

PLAN FOR DEDICATION
OF FORT M'HENRY.

Great Celebration now in Course
of Preparation.

With the booming of artillery, the
heavy guns on battleships, the rattle
of musketry, the echo of bugles and
the plaudits of thousands, Fort Mc-
Henry will be dedicated as a national
shrine on September 12 by the people
of Baltimore with the aid and co-op-
eration of the entire national govern-
ment.

It would be useless to go into de-
tails at the present writing to tell of
what will be the ceremonies for the
day. However, it can be said that
the entire program at the fort will be
preceded by a military parade in
which will take part sections of all
departments of the fighting arms of
the United States.

While the ceremonies are in prog-
ress at Fort McHenry the harbor will
be filled with United States war craft.
Speakers of prominence high in the
service of both Army and Navy and
the executive branches of the Govern-
ment will take part.

It is estimated that from eighty to
one hundred thousand persons from
Baltimore, the State of Maryland and
other sections of the country will
throng Fort McHenry for the observ-
ance. Plans have been formulated
for the care of as many thousands of
persons as will want to be present.

Invitations have been sent to the
mayors and citizens of the towns of
Maryland and Pennsylvania which
came to the aid of Baltimore in its
time of distress. The Governors of
the States of the Thirteen Original
Colonies have also been requested to
be present and from replies received
it has been anticipated that the out
of the city and state official repre-
sentation will be large in number.

While these preparations are be-
ing made the Government has begun
its work on the restoration of Fort
McHenry. This old fortress from
whose shores Francis Scott Key saw
the waving American flag at dawn
through the smoke of battle, inspir-
ing him to write the immortal Star-
Spangled Banner is being made to
conform with old pictures and draw-
ings of the Fort.
The unsightly wooden gateway

which blocked the view of the inter-
ior has been torn down and from
Fort Avenue one may now see the
Francis Scott Key monument in bas
relief. Over the entrance an arch
has been erected of the original stone
used in the walls of Fort McHenry.
Old buildings are being restored and
the restorers have found the old fort
well.
On a spot near the waterfront in

the fort a reviewing and speakers'
stand will be erected within the next
week. From this stand Mayor Broen-
ing, Governor Ritchie, General Persh-
ing, General Sumrnerall, the Secre-
tary of War, the Secretary of Navy,
Governors of states and mayors of
cities will review the regular army
troops, the Fifth Regiment, 110th.
Field Artillery and members of
Veteran Associations who will parade.

Following the speaking and water
pageant the out-of-town guests and
the crowds will inspect the fort. At
night the war societies will dine at
the Southern Hotel. The thousands
of sight-seers are asked to stay and
view the display of fireworks from
the battleships.

Newspaper Problems.

A mistaken idea with some people
is that the newspaper is an individual
proposition. If they don't like the
editor, they feel they must knock the
paper and stand in the way of its
success, whenever possible. They do
not realize that the local paper is just
as much a ',art of the community as
the schools, churches or anything
else. The newspaper is different
from any other business; it is a com-
munity affair. It is for service to the
people and not for any individual.
You may not like the editor and the

editor may not like you any too well
—but the paper he is responsible for
does just as much for you as the
service rendered others. There is
nothing personal with it; it is here
for a purpose and that purpose is to
do what good it can in every way it
can an.d the greater the support of
those it undertakes to serve the better
service it can render. It takes the
people to make a good newspaper and
without the help of the people no one
can run a successful newspaper. It
requires money to operate any kind
of business, even the churches and the
papers are no exception, and for this
reason they must have the financial
support of the business interests as
well as the good will.
Few newspaper publishers make

more than a comfortable living, and
scarcely one is reported wealthy from
money made in the newspaper busi-
ness. They deserve to be trusted and
to be understood by the people—it is
the editor and not the plant that
makes a newspaper useful in a com-
munity, though a liberal patronage is
necessary if the paper is to be a cred-
it to the town.—Newbern (N. C.)
Journal.

0_.

Organized labor was advised to
continue to adhere to a non-partisan
political policy during the present
presidential campaign in a statement
issued August 7 by the Executive
Committee of the Federation of Labor.

Use the same care and judgment in
selecting candidates for public office
you would exercise in choosing per-
sons to help you in your private busi-
ness.

BOY SCOUTS IN CAMP

Along the Monocacy Just over the
Pennsylvania Line.

A large group of Boy Scouts from
the Francis Scott Key Council com-
posing Frederick and Carroll counties
has availed itself of the opportunity
to attend the camp conducted by
Troop No. 19, of Union Bridge, un-
der the leadership of Scoutmaster
Wilbur S. Brandenburg, assisted by
Scout Executive George G. Whitney,
Frederick.
The camp is one of the best organ-

ized troop camps of the Council, it
was stated, and is located on the
Monocacy river, north of Taneytown,
just over the Pennsylvania state line.
It is situated in the growth of shag
bark hickory trees. On the slight
rise along the river bank the boys
are housed in pyramid tents and sleep
on cots. A colored cook provides
wholesome and well cooked meals.
Adequate provision is made for over-
sight, while the scouts are in the wa-
ter, and well selected work and activ-
ities keep the boys occupied. Mr.
Brandenburg is assisted by Scout-
master, Wilmer H. Long, of Sabillas-
ville and Clyde S. DeHoff, of New
Windsor together with Assistant
Scoutmaster, C. L. Easterday, of Un-
ion Bridge, and George Crawmer as
life guard.
The following scouts are in camp

at the present time:
Union Bridge—P. Gernand, patrol

leader; R. Etzler, Bradley Bowman,
senior patrol leader; A. Selby, S.
Grimes, L. Mackley, C. Strawsburg;
J. Kiss, W. Crawmer, 0. Frock, C.
Engel, J. Saylor, R. Shilling, T. Kiss,
P. Selby, H. Myers, J. Six, C. Hesson,
patrol leader; G. Selby.
New Windsor—C. Bittiner, patrol

leader; R. Boyer, J. Baker, M. Hyde,
G. Babylon, C: Lovell, C. Hoff.

Sabillasville—J. Curf man, P. Wise,
patrol leader; H. Naylor, J. Ratas, C
McCain, E. Wolf, Q. McKissick.
Emmitsburg—Francis Hoke.

Proceedings of the Orphans' Court.

Monday, Aug. 27, 1928.—Guy A.
Dice, executor of Cornelius F. Dice,
deceased, settled his first and final
account and received order to deposit
funds.

John W. Baker, executor of Cecelia
A. Baker, deceased, received order to
transfer stocks.

Elva M. Zepp and Treva E. Zepp
(Sholl), administratrices of Leanna
M. Zepp, deceased, settled their first
and final account.

Letters of administration on the
estate of Charles A. Dorsey, deceased,
were granted unto Harry H. Har-
baugh, who received order to notify
creditors under Chapter 146 Acts 1912
Tuesday, Aug. 28, 1928.—The dis-

tribution made among the creditors of
Charles M. Masenhimer, deceased,was
ratified by the Court.
Louis Anderfuhren, executor of El-

la M. Anderfuhren, deceased, settled
his first and final account.
Fannie S. Schweigart, executrix of

John S. Schweigart, deceased, re-
turned inventories of personal prop-
erty and money.

Bessie B. Lockard, executrix of
Hester A. R. Reaver, deceased, set-
tled her first and final account.
Note:—Monday, September 3rd.,

being a Holiday, the Court will not
be in session. The office will be clos-
ed.

Shoe and Leather Studies.

Each of us buys, theoretically at
least, three pairs of shoes a year.
This means some 350,000,000 pairs an-
nually. Half of the hides and skins
that go to make leather for these
shoes are imported, principally from
Asia, South America, and Africa,
where people do not wear shoes so
much. The United States is not self-
supporting in the matter of leather
and leather goods, and in case of war
the chances are that many of us would
have to go without shoes if imports
of raw materials were interrupted.
The U. S. Department of Agricul-

ture believes that our dependence up-
on foreign supplies can be very great-
ly reduced through better practices in
the domestic production of leather-
making raw materials, through more
judicious or common-sense selection
by the public of leather goods, and
finally through proper care of such
leather goods, with elimination of
their abuse and misuse. The hide,
leather, and tanning investigations
carried on by the department all aim
at conservation along these lines.
Each year millions of dollars are

lost in this country in hides and skins,
much of which can be prevented by
the application of correct methods of
preparation and marketing, which
would result in making available to
the tanner not only more hides and
skins but better ones, from which in
turn would result more and better
leather.

Marriage Licenses.

Sheridan Snowden and Julia
Brightwell, Mt. Airy.
Leo Tomcany and Eloise M. Miller,

Dayton, Ohio.
Melvin Schwartz and Gladys Straus-

baugh, York, Pa.
Wm. M. Fritz and Margaret E.

Smith, Frederick.
Harry B. Stouffer, and Carrie V.

Burgon, Cumberland, Md.
Henry J. Shearer and Emma Rahe,

Lineboro, Md.
James H. Everly and Dorothy M.

Gill, Yeagerstown, Pa.

Tomato Crop to be Short.

The tomato crop on the Eastern
Shore promises to be very small. The
opening of the canning season com-
menced this week with indications of
about a half crop, on account of tor-
rential rains and hot sun. In many
sections the plants were drowned out. I

POLITICAL NOTES OF
THE PAST WEEK

Condensed Clippings from Around
the Political Horizon,

The Apopka Chief (Florida) Major
Hall's fine weekly paper, is running
a series of page ads boosting Hoover
and Curtis, paid for by a group of
Orange County Democrats.

Gov. Smith, who has met with a
fine reception in wet New Jersey, is
anxious to begin his western tour and
try out sentiment in the dryer coun-
try. He is confidently expected to
draw large crowds everywhere.
The women voters are giving the

Smith forces concern in Virginia, as
their hostility in the small towns and
rural seceions is said to be very pro-
nounced. Varney, the Prohibition
candidate, may get the anti-Smith
votes, rather than Hoover.

Secretary Hoover, it is said, will do
most of his campaigning in the
East, and perhaps in the South, and
will not again go west until on his
way to California to vote.
That Hoover will carry the counties

of Maryland, and Smith Baltimore
city, is the present general opinion.
Which side will have the heaviest
majority, is the problem.

It is said that Mr. Hoover will make
only three or four speeches in the
East before starting on his Western
tour in October.

Senator Robinson made his speech
of acceptance of the Democratic nom-
ination for vice-president, on Thurs-
day night, at Hot Springs, Arkansas.
The notification address was made by
Claude G. Bowers, of New York. Rob-
inson blamed Herbert Hoover for fail-
ure of farm relief legislation, and
backed Gov. Smith in his stand on
prohibition.
Governor Smith's advisers want

him to make many speeches, far and
wide; but he is said to favor the plan
of meeting many people rather than
doing much talking, and especially
not to make short speeches that can
mean very little.
Both parties appear to have set

$4,000,000 as the limit of their cam-
paign expenditures; but it is hardly
likely that either will stop at that
figure if it seems necessary to spend
more.

Chesapeake Bay Fish Number 200
Species.

The brakish waters of Chesapeake
Bay produce per square mile more
than three times as much fish as
Georges Bank, the famous ocean fish-
ing grounds off the New England
Coast, according to a statement issued
by the Bureau of Fisheries, Depart-
ment of Commerce, on August 14. The
statement follows in full text:

Chesapeake Bay and its tributaries
contain about 2,700 square miles and
produce about 11 tons of fish per
square mile, whereas Georges Bank
with an area of about 7,000 square
miles produces only three tons to the
square mile.
More than 50,000,000 pounds of edi-

ble fish are annually taken in the
Chesapeake and in addition up to 300-
000,090 million pounds of menhaden.
The value of the former is more tlian
$3,000,000, while the products of the
menhaden industry, chiefly foodstuffs,
amounts to another $2,000,000. About
40.000 persons, the bulletin shows,
earn their livelihood in some activity
connected with Chesapeake Bay fish-
ing. The property, boats and gear of
the commercial fisheries represent an
investment of around $12,000,000,
while that of the menhaden industry
is about $5,000,000.
More than 200 distinct species of

fish have been recorded as inhabiting
the waters of the Chesapeake. After
the first of November practically all
of these disappear, leaving only a few
species such as the rock cod, the
white perch and the common eel. Just
where these fish migrate to even the
Bureau of Fisheries experts do not
profess to know. The shad and the
herring are the first to come back af-
ter their winter sojourn. The former
fish is the aristocrat of the Bay and
represents fully half of the value of
the total catch each year. In point
of quantity the alewife easily ranks
first.

With the exception of the sea bass
and the tautog, which are caught by
hand, practically all the commercial
fishing in Chesapeake Bay is done
with nets, the pound net being the
most widely used.

Ages of Candidates.

There is less than a year's differ-
ence in the ages of Hoover and
Smith. The former will be 54 this
month. Smith is seven months his
senior.
The President oldest at the time of

his inauguration was William H. Har-
rison (68) and the youngest was
Roosevelt (42).
Others in their sixties when inau-

gurated were Adams, Jackson, Taylor
and Buchanan. Others in their for-
ties were Polk, Pierce, Grant, Gar-
field and Cleveland.

Nineteen of our Presidents were in
their fifties when sworn into office.
As for the present vice-presidential
nominees, Curtis is 68, and Robinson
will be 56 in August.

J. Calvin Strayer Dead.

J. Calvin Strayer, former National
President of the P. 0. S. of A., and
well known coal dealer in York, Pa.,
died on Thursday at Johns Hopkins
Hospital, Baltimore, due to kidney
trouble. He was active in Democrat-
ic politics as well as in firemen's and
lodge circles in York.

BOOTLEGGER'S SENTENCE

Increased by Judge McPherson in
Adams County Court.

Judge McPherson, of Gettysburg, is
not inclined to be lenient with boot-
leggers.Recently, while he was taking
a trip to Europe, Judge W. R. David-
son of the Franklin county Court,
presided during his absence in the
Adams County Court. On his return
home, Judge McPherson last week,
called Harry Eline, well known Adams
county bootlegger, before him, who
had been sentenced to jail for six
months and to pay a fine of $500.,and
told him that the sentence was "en-
tirely too lenient."
The Judge informed Mr. Eline that

as the Court term under which he
was sentenced had not expired, he had
the authority to increase it, which he
did, making the time fifteen months
instead of six months.

Eline, was named from the witness
stand by "Chrity" Lawrence, convict-
ed slayer, at the last term of court as
the man from whom the latter pur-
chased liquor which indirectly result-
ed in the murder of John Lawrence,
of Irishtown, during a drunken brawl.
The first sentence was imposed

July 23, and the April term of Court
did not close until last Friday.

"Inside" Information for Women.

Cooked liver makes a good salad,
combined with sliced cucumbers.

Pineapple and cream cheese sand-
wiches are dainty for afternoon tea.

Broiled peaches, either fresh or
canned, are appetizing to serve with
meat or for dessert.
Always successful for a porch sup-

per is a menu consisting of egg salad,
cress sandwiches, iced tea, and any
fruit shortcake.

Cottage cheese contains all the con-
stituents of milk excepting the cream.
It is therefore high in food value and
is a particularly rich source of pro-
tein and minerals.

In summer time give the refrigera-
tor extra care, and wash it thorough-
ly with hot water and soda once or
twice a week. See that anything
spilled is promptly wiped up, that the
drainpipe is not clogged or slimy, and
that the ice chamber is clean. Keep
the doors shut tightly and do not open
them oftener than necessary. Do not
wrap the ice in paper or cloth.

Havre de Grace to Mark Removal of
Bridge Toll.

Removal of the toll on the Susque-
hanna river bridge, at Havre de Grace
and Perryville, will be celebrated Sep-
tember 29, by the former town. Gov.
Ritchie and Senator Millard E. Tyd-
ings will attend the event.
John N. Mackall, chairman of the

State Roads Commission, on Thursday
said the toll would be removed at that
time, as the debt incurred by the
State in double-decking the span last
spring would be paid.
Although the bridge, which was

bought by the State a number of
years ago, practically was paid for
last year, the heavy traffic necessitat-
ed the addition of another deck, so
that traffic moving east could cross
one way and the wesbound traffic the
other.

825,000 for Best Enforcement Plan_

W. C. Durant, motor car manufact-
urer, has offered $25,000 for "the best
and most practical plan to make the
18th. Amendment effective". As ex-
plaining his offer, he says;
"It is my belief that the majority

of our people do not want the Eight-
eenth Amendment abandoned. The
people want it enforced and obeyed.
"In order to give expression to the

soundest thought in the country on
the subject, I offer a prize of $25,000
for the best and most practicable
plan to make the Eighteenth Amend-
ment effective."
The statement said the prize would

be awarded by a committee of prom-
inent men and women now being se-
lected. Competitive offerings must
be submitted prior to December 1st.

411 Bushels to the Acre.
., 1=•••••••=1•11

Bloomsburg. Aug. 29.—The first
400 bushel potato yield of this year
in Columbia County was recorded to-
day on the farm of J. E. Miller in
Greenwood Township. His Irish Cob-
blers yielded 411 bushels to the acre,
the third time in the State that that
variety of potatoes has made the cov-
eted mark.
With expectations of a 1,000,000-

bushel yield of late potatoes in the
county, many of the larger growers
are interested in steps being taken
to form a marketing organization for
the crop, which previously had been
handled individually.

Roop Reunion.

The following is the program for
the second annual Roop reunion, at
Meadow Branch Church, near West-
minster, Sunday, Sept. 2, 1928: 10:30
Sermon by Elder W. E. Roop; 12:00
M., basket lunch; 2:30 P. M., Special
music led by Rev. J. Walter Young;
address by President, Rev. J. D. Roop
Jr.; address T. B. Roop, attorney of
Christiansburg, Va.; report of histor-
ian, G. Herbert Englar; report of
secretary, Miss Anna Roop; report of
Treasurer; Special Music; Benedic-
tion.
—0

Registration Days.

Registration of voters will be held
this year, in all districts and precincts,
on Tuesday, Oct. 2, and Tuesday, Oct.
9th. Keep these dates in mind. As
there will likely be an unusually large
registration this year, and numerous
transfers. these days will be busy
ones. Later we will give another
announcement.
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THE CANDIDATES.

For President and Vice-President.
HOOVER AND CURTIS REP.

SMITH AND ROBINSON DEN'

For U. S. Senator.
WM. CABELL BRUCE DEM.

PHILLIPS L. BOLDSBOROUGH REP.

For House Representatives.
',INWOOD L. CLARK REP.

WILLIAM I'. COLE DEM.

The Quiet Vote this Year.

The quiet vote this year promises

to be more numerous than ever, be-

cause a lot of party voters intend to

"cut" their candidate, and do not

want it to be common knowledge,for

the reason that voting a "cut" ticket

is held by the regulars to be an act of

treachery toward the party; so, the

"quiet" vote is the best way to satis-

fy one's conscience, and at the same

time save one from harsh criticism.

Our form of ballot effectually guar-

antees secret voting—perhaps to a

greater degree than its originators

intended—and that explains why the

registration with declared party af-

filiation, does not always correspond

with the votes cast; for the voter is

not compelled to declare his affilia-

tion, nor make known to anybody,

how he votes.
A few always come out openly and

independently, beforehand, and let it

be known that temporarily, at least,

they intend to jump the dividing

fence. Some do it boastfully, others
conscientiously, and some for a spec-

ial personal reason,all not caring how

their party loyalty is regarded; but,
especially when the reason for the
jump is due to a cause that one does
not care to advertise, he keeps mum
about it, regarding his act as his
own private business entirely.

So, the secret ballot, that was de-
vised chiefly in order to prevent the
purchase of votes, as well as to make
"party" voting very difficult to cer-
tain illiterates, now makes it easy for
independent, quiet voting, that was
never a main object of the so-
called "Australian" ballot.
And this is one of the reasons why

figuring closely on the result, this
year, is impossible—there are too
many whose party labels can not be
depended on to represent their acts in
the secrecy of the voting booths.

The Low Price of Wheat.

The low price of wheat seems to
hinge on the large surplus of stocks
carried over, and on the prospects for
a heavy crop this year, as well as on
general favorable crop reports from
the other wheat producing countries
of the world. In other words, it .is
the working out of the rule of a sup-
ply exceeding the demand, and the
low prices always following such a
condition, no matter what the product
may be.
We have the same condition with

the price of potatoes, but nobody ever
takes much account of the potato mar-
ket—except the comparatively "few
who grow potatoes as a main crop.
When all who have a patch of ground
grow a good crop for their own use,
they are off the market as buyers.

• The same rule applies with apples,•
peaches, berries and all other like

growths. 'An abundance means many
competing for a market, and prices

tumble below a profitable level for the
growers. Briefly stated, any thing

that is very plentiful, is cheap.

Gold, diamonds, furs and many

other articles are high in price be-

cause of their scarcity, or of the dif-

ficulty in marketing them. And the

very fact that a thing is rare, or hard

to get for any reason, creates a de-

mand for it on the part of many.

The "law of supply and demand,"

so commonly mentioned as to be dis-
believed in very often, operates for

the reasons given—the simplest and

most obvious reasons that could be
imagined—and there is no known safe

or national way of interfering with

the operation of the law.
We complain of the low price of

wheat and corn and other items of
farm produce, not because they are in
any way different from the price of

potatoes, but simply because the de-
pendence for farm prosperity ?ests

most on wheat and corn prices being

up to a profitable level, because they

are main crops.
The merchant and manufacturer feels

the operation of the same law. If a
storekeeper buys a stock of something

for which the demand drops, he must

sell at a sacrifice or lose the entire
investment. Or, if a large stock of
heavy winter clothing is laid in, and

the winter happens to be very mild,

he finds his money tied up in a stock
that will not move, because the de-
mand does not exist.

So, here we have a pretty clear
simple lead up to the difficulty in fix-
ing a price for the wheat and corn of
the farmers. How is it to be done,

and who is to pay the difference be—
tween the specially fixed price and the
natural market price? And what of
the still greater over-production that
would result from a guaranteed prof-
itable price?
And suppose there is a profitable

price fixed for some farm products,
why not for all of them? And why
not have the same governmental price
fixing process for everybody's com-
modity—manufacturers and mer-
chants—when there is a profitless ov-
erproduction? No wonder that both
great political parties are concerned
over the question, which is actually
one of trying to find a means of avert-
ing the action of natural laws, almost
as fixed as that of gravitation.

Changes in Recent Year.

Great changes have taken place
within the last few years, as the re-
sult of which a higher standard of
living is being maintained by people
everywhere. The autc,mobile and the
motion picture have revolutionized
tonditions within the last quarter of
a century, while the radio of more re-
cent development has been equally as
powerful in changing the lives of the
people.

Aviation has not yet reached the
stage where it greatly affects the per-
sonal lives of the public generally
but as time goes on and distance
more and more is annihilated, the
aeroplane will exert a tremendous in-
fluence on the personal lives of all of
US.

While these are the more spectacu-
lar forms of progress there are count-
less other innovations that have unit-
ed to change completely standards
of living as compared with those that
prevailed at the beginning of the
present century.
Today persons in the most humble

circumstance have comforts and con-
veniences which a few decades ago
would have been considered luxuries.
Life in every way, so far as it is in-
fluenced by the inventive genius of
man, is more pleasant than ever be-
fore. We are indeed living in a gold-
en age.

Similar progress has been made in
the science of personal economics.
The service extended to the average
family today by savings banks and
investment houses makes it easier for
them to save scientifically than ever
before. Budget systems have been
worked out and children are not only
being taught to save through the
school savings banks but they are be-
ing taught in the classroom the deep-
er meanings of thrift. There are op-
portunities today which did not exist
twenty-five or fifty years ago and
those who are doubtful as to proposed
investments have every facility for
investigation.
In the days of our forefathers

when every comfort was dearly
bought and when life held few luxur-
ies, saving called for a vast amount
of pluck and stamina. Today, life's
conveniences and comforts are so eas-
ily obtained and there are so many
helpful facilities for those who want
to save that valid excuses for anyone
not getting ahead are indeed rare.—
By S. W. Straus, President American
Society for Thrift.

The Passing of the Drunkard.

The prohibition regime in the Unit-
ed States has accomplished one of its
major purposes, beyond dispute; it
has almost eliminated excessive
drinking.
There are plenty of people who de-

light in telling us what a great num-
ber of bootleggers there are; how
many stills there are; how terrible
are the "parties" thrown by the
youth of the day; how wet the ordi-
nary convention is, etc., etc., ad infini-
tum.

Very little of this can be proved,
of course, but since the average man
is in no position to disprove it, the
wet viewer-with-alarm considers that
he has a clear field, and makes the
most of it.
Admitting all that he says, and

imagines, however, the fact remains
—apparent to all men—that the day

of the drunkard has nearly passed.
But we do not have to reason our

way to our conclusions. We can see
them. Where has the town drunkard
gone? A few who got their start
back before 1920 remain with us. Not
many.
Where is the man whose children

used to meet him at the door of his

place of employment on Saturday af-
ternoon so they could get shoes before
he got to a saloon? There used to be
a lot of that in Houston. It isn't
here now.
Where are the wives who dreaded

the home-coming of liquor-besotted
husbands, who lived in constant dread
under the menace of alcohol, who
were dragged about from place to
place as alcoholic husbands were
able to get jobs which they could hold
only for a short time? There are a
few left in Houston; not many. Some
years ago their names were legion.
Where is the shop force disrupted

every Monday morning because of the
week-end debauch of some of its
members? Where is the old lawyer
or doctor drinking himself into his
grave? Where is the newspaper of-
fice with its ever-present quota of in-
ebriates drinking their way to ruin?

All this has virtually vanished. The
great peril of liquor has been remov-
ed. * * *

If those people who insist on glu-
ing their eyes to the things prohibi-
tion has not accomplished would look
for a while on these other things that
prohibition has accomplished, they
could understand better why there are
plenty of people to maintain the pro-
hibition regime in the United States.
—Houston Chronicle and Herald.

International Aid Asked to Prevent
Liquor Smuggling.

The need of international co-opera-
tion to prevent -the smuggling of li-
quor into the United States was em-
phasized and an invitation to those
nations from which such smuggling
has been practiced to aid the United
States in checking the traffic was ex-
tended by the Commissioner of Pro-
hibition, Dr. J. M. Doran, in an ad-
dress delivered before the Internation-
al Congress against Alcoholism, in
session in Geneva.
Dr. Doran declared he regarded the

suggested co-operation as a proper
and logical step by the world powers
in order that countries attempting to
enforce prohibition inhy be in a posi-
tion to deal with their problem as an
internal one. He proposed, as one
means of extending co-operation, es-
tablishment of a requirement that all
ships be required to show authenti-
cated landing certificates for liquor
cargoes, thus proving that the ex-
ported liquor had actually been dis-
charged at the port to which it was
destined in the original clearance pa-
pers.
By this method, Dr. Doran said, il-

licit trade could be recognized quickly
and "illegitimate trade would be
driven from the society of nations."
The Commissioner informed the

Congress that there were at least 25
ports in foreign countries which were
used almost exclusively as bases for
the exportation of liquor to be smug-
gled into prohibition countries.
Dr. Doran's address is very much

in detail, as published in The United
States Daily, Washington—quite too
lengthy for use in our columns, but it
is a very fair and convincing appeal,
from the point of view of this country,
to the foreign countries from which
smuggling operations are conducted,
and closed with an appeal to other
nations to assist the United States in
the enforcement of prohibition by giv-
ing their co-operation.

The Radio in Politics.

Politics has an odd way of creating
new and embarrassing problems for
those who first venture into its mazes.
Radio broadcasters, playing a new but
prominent role in the present cam-
paign, are beginning to realize this
as the battle progresses. Not long
ago they heard sharp words from
Governor Smith, who disapproved of
the time allotted him on their pro-
grams.
More recently similarly bitter com-

plaints have come from the Republi-
can side—not, however, from the can-
didates. The protest was aroused by
an inept director who, after the
broadcast of Senator Curtis' accept-
ance speech, startled thousands of
listeners by announcing, "It's the
Boloney." After a moment's silence
he hastened to explain that the words
were the title of a forthcoming musi-
cal selection, not a comment on the
address.
But the thing had been done. Tele-

grams of protest poured in, accom-
panied by a few in approving vein
from delighted Democrats. Probably
the announcer was guilty of nothing
more than a tactless error. Radio
announcers will probably agree with
others in public life that the states-
man who said, "Politics is, after all,
a simple thing," spoke with more op-
timism than wisdom.—Phila. Ledger.

A Fellow Newsboy
It was raining. A little Lewsboy

hurriedly turned a corner just in time
to bump into a larger newsboy com-
ing around in the opposite direction
The little fellow fell and dropped his
papers into the gutter—ruined! The
other assisted the wee fallen broth r
to his feet, brte,hed him off—arti
divided his papers with him. Hot:.
departed in high spirits.—Columbt
Dispatch.

5c MAKES YOU A
SMOKE KING

—if you know the cigar to buy

Don't ever let anybody tell you
there's no enjoyment in a 5c cigar.
Here's one that's been knocking that
idea sky-high for many years:
Havana Ribbon. Any challengers?

Nickel cigar brands come and go.
But Havana Ribbon keeps right on
winning smokers by the thousands.
Unquestionably the greatest five-
cent cigar value the world has ever
knoivn! But let Havana Ribbon
tell you its own story. One nickel
brings it to you. One puff starts
it. And the first thing it says is that
here actually is a five-cent cigar
that contains something you usually
find only in higher priced cigars:
Ripe, long-filler tobacco. No bitter,
under-ripe top leaves of the plant.
No flat-tasting, over-ripe bottom
leaves. No loose ends to fray or
crumble. Full-flavored, mellow-mild
ripe leaves only. Smoke so smooth
you like to hold on to every satisfy-
ing mouthful! At cigar counters
everywhere. Also sold in Practical
Pocket Packages of five cigars.

Odo7ous Onion Liked
by All World Races

Onions seem to be almost as old as
the hills. They are mentioned in the
Bible a'S one of the things longed for.
by the Israelites in the wilderness and
complained about to Moses. Herod(,
tits says that in his time there was
an inscription on the Great Pyramid
stating the sum expended for onions,
radishes, and garlic, which had been
coltsumed by the laborers during its
erection, as 1,600 talents. Ancient pic-
tures show priests holding onions in
their hands at the altar.

Early explorers, including Colum-
,bus, brought onion seed to the New
world. New Englanders were raising
them as early : as 1634, and General
Sullivan, in 1779, in his raid against
the Indians in central New York. de-
stroyed many onion fields belonging
to the savages. Nineteen states now
produce large commercial crops of
onions. Texas scents up the whole
Gulf of Mexico and the eastern side
of the Atlantic with her onion-laden
vessels bound for New York.—Peter
R. Sterling in National Republic
Magazine.

Weather Has Little
Influence on Tides

Contrary to popular belief, especial-
ly that long cherished by tmtny sea-
men, tides do not exert any influence
on the weather, according to mete-
orologists of the weather bureau,
United States Department of Agricul-
ture.
As a flatter of fact, close observ-

ers have discovered that certain ex-
treme weather conditions affect the
tides to some extent. Tides ebb and
flow at every point on the coast With
clocklike regularity. Nevertheless, the
weather continues to be fair or foul,
irrespective of those tides. On the
other hand, conditions of very low
barometric pressure and very strong
winds from favorable directions cause
either unusually low or unusually
high tides, as the case may be. This
is the influence of the weather on the
tides, and the -weather is not the re-
sult of any tidal influence.
Even when there is, as meteorolog-

ists understand, a very insignificant
outflow of air from a region into
which the tide is rising, or a corre-
sponding inflow of air as the tide sub-
sides, this 'does not constitute a sig-
nificant feature of the weather.

In Bad Company
When a vote is to be taken on some

important measure a congressman who
cannot be present "pairs" himself
with some representative who would
vote "aye" to the congressman's "nay,"
or vice versa.
Once a Democratic member of the

house received a letter from an active
politician of that party in his district,
calling attention to the fact that he
was reported in the Congressional Rec-
ord almost every day as being "paired"
with a Republican.
"I don't doubt your loyalty to the

party," read the letter, "but I think the
boys would like it a good deal better
if you paired with Democrats in
of Itenublicans."—Harper's Magazine.

Pressing Business
want to speak to Mr. Jones"

said the voice over the wire.
"I'm sorry, sir, but Mr. Jones is in

conference." the private secretary re-
plied sweetly.
And at the same moment Mr. .h.nes

was in deep conference with a friend
:it Merchant and Bishop streets. He
declared, very confidentially and not
for publication:
"Yeah, it's sure wonderful how

quick they can dig a big hole in the
ground like that. I see they're put-
ting in the foundation already. Won-
der how they are going to get rid of
Unit water, though ?"—Honolulu Star-

Almond Raising
Almonds comprise the most impor-

tant crop of the island of Majorca,
where many varieties are cultivated,
and the industry is so prosperous that
as old olive trees die they are replaced
by almonds.
When the almonds are almost ripe

they are knocked off the branches by
long bamboo poles and then picked up
by women and children. The nuts
are separated from the husks after dry-
ing, and the shells are then broken by
hand or machinery and the kernels
extracted.
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Taneytown's "Leading Fashion Store"
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TANEYTOWN, MD.
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% Here you will find the answer to your -g4
I School problem for Clothing and Ac- LT

cessories. Here you will get the high-
estquality Merchandise at lowest15

Bi prices.!hi  
gi
95 Dress Materials New Shirts, Ties, Belts

DEPaRTMENTSTORZ

in Prints, Plain and Printed
Voiles, Percales and Ginghams.
All washable and new in designs
• and colors.

%
• Stockings and Hose for

Ilas School.
I Silk, Rayon and Lisle Hose.

All colors in silk and silk and
• rayon hose. Fancy short hose for
• the children.

%
Scarfs, Fancy Pins,

Garters
and all those
for girls.

IC

and other accessories for the
the boys.

Shoes and Slippers
for school wear that are durable,
stylish and modestly priced. For
the girl either high or low heel
pump or tie oxford in patent,kid
or colors. For the boy good
sturdy oxfords and shoes in black
and tan.

Fall Hats aid Caps
have arrived and we are show-

ing the best styles and quality in
other school needs Hats and Caps, at very reason-

able prices.
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—OFFICERS----

EDW. 0. WEANT, President. G. WALTER WILT, Cashier,
E. H. SHARETTS, Vice-Pres. CHAS. R. A RN 0 I, D, Asst. Cashier

—DIRECTORS:—
FDW. 0. WEANT J J WEAVER. .11i

• EDWIN H. SHARETTS MILTON A. KOONS
G. WALTER WILT GEO. A. ARNOLD

ARTHUR W. FEESER

THE BIRNIE TRUST CO.
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Capital Stock; $40,000.00
Surplus $100,000.00
Undivided Profits $22,000.00

ON THE HONOR ROLL OF BANKS

Love--And Mushrooms
Old Si Chestnut says: "Love is a good deal like mushrooms.

You can't tell whether it is the real thing until it is too late."
But it is different with Banking. You may know what you

are doing right from the start. Select a good, reliable Bank like
ours, one that has stood the test, and you will be taking no chances.
We protect our depositors and offer every modern banking facility.
You cannot go wrong.

Resources Over $1,400,000.00.
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NOTICE!

YOUR DEAD ANIMALS
REMOVED PROMPTLY

Call "LEIDY"
WESTMINSTER. MARYLAND

PHONES 259 - 156-J

Always on the Job.
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jr:rsiECg, OFFICIALLY CERTIFIED

BARRED PLYMOUTH ROCKS

— EGGS, CHICKS AND BREEDING STOCK —
— FOR SALE YEAR ROUND —

Plant Under Supervision of the
Delaware State Board of Agriculture

A. C. Jones Poultry Farm, Georgetown, Del.
PHONE ISo

insanity Not Often
Caused by Overstudy

"It is a fallacy to believe that over
study causes insanity. Overstudy like
any mental overwork causes a state
of exhaustion and brain fag. Too
much study, which prevents the en-
joyable realities of play and recrea-
tion, will not cause a mental break-
down in a person who is not liable
to insanity," states Dr. Alexander S.
Hershfield, Illinois state alienist.
"It is admitted that among those

students who devote too n uch time
to learning and to making high grades
there are many who are normal men-
tally. Mental disease and oyerstmly
are common enough to be found to-
gether occasionally. A well-balaneed
boy or girl finds sports. friendships
and sex of sufficient importance to

act as an antidote to overstudy and
general school grind. In fact. it is
normal for youth to find study irk-
stone when if interferes with its tun.
"Insanity resulting from overstedy

is merely a coincidence. and closer
examination of such a case will usu-
ally show other causes."

Pencil Sharpening
A drawing master states that he Is

often able to judge the characteristics
of his pupils by their manner of
sharpening it pencil. The artistic in-
dividual usually makes a tine tapering
point, the business-like person a short,
stubby one. Those who sharpen a
pencil towards themselves on a thumb
are 'Men secretive. The untidy per-
son reduces his pencil-end to shape-
less irregularity, while the very hap-
py-go-lucky one harks away In care-
less fashion and finishes with about
half the length he started with.

Crow Stuck to Home
Arthur Wardell's tame crow, Bill.

entertained a visitor at Norway, Maine.
A black brother, evidently just back
from the South, called on him. After
a few minutes of conversation, the vis-
itor flew away. Bill escorted him as
far as the woods, then turned and
went back to his old perch behind the
house. finding home ties strongest and
old friends best.



STREET RECALLS
FRENCH NOBLEMAN

New Orleans Financial Center

Carondelet's Monument.

New Orleans, La.—Wherever cotton

Is traded the world over business men

rare alert to daily development in a
New Orleans street which bears the

tame of a French nobleman famous

as a public benefactor.
Carondelet street, where the New

Orleans Cotton exchange is located,

extends fifty-one squares from Canal

street to Robert, west end. The first

six blocks from Canal to Poydras

street encompass the city's financial,

district, where the daily turnover

runs into hundreds of thousands of

dollars. Midway in these six blocks

is the cotton exchange, at Carondelet

and Gravier streets. From this build-

ing Secretary Henry G. Hester sends,

out his reports which affect the mar-

ket wherever the staple is known.

The French nobleman for whom the

street is named was christened Fran-

cisco Luiz JEIestor de Carondelet,

Seigneur d' ilaine St. Pierre de Nos-

ties. Born in Flanders in 1747, he

came to Louisiana in 1791 for a six-
year stay. During this time he served

as governor. Then he went to Peru
from Louisiana to serve as viceroy.— —
Baron Carondelet recognized the

advantages that would accine to New

Orleans from construction of a canal
linking the Mississippi river with

Lake Pontchartrain. Giving much of

his personal fortune and lending his

slaves for the work, Baron Caron-

delet was the dynamic force behind

the movement for the canal, although

a yellow fever scourge prevented the
consummation of his plan. Canal

street, now ranked as one of the fa-
mous thoroughfares of the world,

marks the site of the nobleman's un-
dertaking.
For his many benefactions Louisi-

ana welcomed him as governor. New
Orleans paid him tribute with Caron-
delet street, Baroness Carondelet
street, now Baronne street, and Canal
street, named for his work.

Plans a Dictionary
of Good Grammar

Lincoln, Neb.—To do with grammar

what dictionary writers have done

with words is the idea behind a book

written by Maurice H. Weseen, asso-

ciate professor of English in the Uni-
versity of Nebraska. He has tried to
make correct grammatical usage as
easy as correct word usage.

Alphabetizing the stumbling blocks
In English, Professor Weseen has tak-
en the most accepted terminology in

an effort to aid in standardization of
English, which, he says, "can be ac-
complished only through a long and
slow process of elimination and sur-
vival."
The material for his latest book,

"Crowell's Dictionary of English

Grammar," was gathered during 12

years as an instructor of English in

Iowa State college and at the Uni-
versity of Nebraska.
He drew the illustrations from ev-

ery day speech and writing.
"Quotations from Shakespeare and

Milton often are of little value to the
person who seeks to settle in his own
mind some doubtful or disputed point
of usage with reference to a practical
problem of today. For that reason

have emphasized American usage,
both in the giving of examples and
in the citing of authorities, and have
referred only incidentally to English

usage for purposes of comparison."

Girl's Purse, Lost From
Plane, Found on Roof

Washington.—A pocketbook which

was lost by Miss Barbara Pearson of
Ashland, Pa., while viewing Washing-
ton from an airplane was recently re-
covered by William Owens, a tin-

smith employed in the office of public
buildings and public parks of the na-

tional capital.
The purse was found on the roof of

temporary building No. 5, located at
Twentieth and C streets. It was
turned over to Inspector Wright, in
charge of the public buildings guard
force, who said it would be sent to
Miss Pearson by registered mail. The
pocketbook was identified by a cer-
tificate of flight made out in Miss

Pearson's name by the Washington
airport. It also contained $4.75 in

money, a vanity case and two keys.

Takes Out Squeak
New York.—There's such a thing as

being altogether too sarcastic about

unsatisfactory new shoes. A furni-

ture merchant put his in his show win-

dow with placards telling what he
thought about them. The shoe dealer

obtained an injunction.
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Judge Marries 5,000
Couples in 25 Years

Fresno, Calif.—George Wash-
ington Smith, who has been a
justice of the peace here since
1903, has just set what he be-

lieves to be a record as a "mar-
rying justice" in officiating at
his 5,000th wedding.
Smith began his career as a

marrying justice January 18,
1903, and has kept a record of
the ceremonies. His records
show that the greatest number
of marriages performed in one
year was 394, and that 49 was

the most in any single month,
while the record day brought
eight couples to his office.
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Tells of Witnessirg
Volcano in Eruption

Joseph H. Sinclair, representing

the American Geographic society, has

returned to this country from a hard

trip of exploration through Ecuador,

where he had a terrific experience in

an endeavor to reach a smoking vol-
cano which had erupted, the whole

country for miles around being del-

uged with a flow of lava. The na-

tives had a wholesome superstitious
fear of the great pile and could not

be induced to guide the explorer as

near as he wanted to go, but by his

own efforts and alone he managed to

get within seven miles of the cone

and this was near enough for him to

witness a number of explosions which
repeatedly changed the contour of the

crater's rim. Little or nothing had

been known about the volcano and he

ycured valusble data concerning its

character and location.

Mr. Sinclair pointed out that he was

not the first white man to see the vol-

cano--a mountain which the natives

call Reventador, meaning "Eruptor."

Near the place the explorers came on

a lone white man who could not tell

them how long he had been there nor

why he had penetrated so far from

civilized association. Nor would he

go with them to the mountain. He,

too, had been infected by the supersti-

tion of the natives, which holds that

whenever a human sets foot on the

side of the tall volcano Reventador

becomes "muy brava," or very brave.

Immunity to Poisons
Not Yet Understood

One of the most fascinating chap-

ters in animal poisons is the subject

of natural Immunity, the fact that

softie animals are immune to the poi-

sons of others and remain unhurt ii

stung or bitten by the poisonous ani-

mals, whereas all other sorts of beasts

succumb.
A case In point is that of desert ani-

mals, which are unharmed by a scor-
pion's sting. The desert fox, the kan-

garoo rat and other inhabitants oh

deserts where scorpions abound are in

this happy position. Their cousins,

Hying far away from the desert, would

at once be seriously injured by a scor-

pion's sting, whereas the desert breeds

remain unhurt. It. is to be supposed

that in the far distant past, before

the desert animals had this complete

immunity to scorpion venom, those

which were stung and could not resist

died, leaving no offspring. Their

luckier brothers, who happened to have

a hardier constitution, survived and
left behind them a resistant race ol
descendants.—The Forum. •

Created Cinderella
It was just three centuries since

Charles Perrault, creator of Cin-

derella and Red Riding Hood, was

born. Perrault, a Frenchman, never
dreamed that the fairy children 01‘.

his brain would become immortal. Ile

wrote poetry of an exceedingly dull

order, and it was by his poems and

not by his fairy stories that he hoped

to win fame. Perrault conceived and

wrote his stories, which he called

"Tales of Mother Goose," to please

his little son, just as Lewis Carroll, a
mathematician, told the tale of Alice

in Wonderland to amuse two little

girls. Cinderella and her glass slip-

per was one of Perrault's favorite

heroines. Some people have tried to

insist that Cinderella's slipper of

"verre," or glass, was meant to be a

slipper of "vair," or fur, but one can-

not imagine Cinderella in anything but

a crystal slipper.

What Is a Peddler?
The word peddler is derived from

an old English word, "ped." as in

Spencer's "Shepheard's Calendar." "A

bask is a wicker ped wherein they use

to carry fish." It has no connection

with the Latin pedis, a foot, as often
reported. A peddler is, therefore, one

with a ped, basket, or pack, and it has

been held in law, one who has the

identical article he sells in his "ped."

It is, simply speaking, Incorrect, there-

fore, to call an itinerant merchant,

who simply takes orders for goods

bought from seeing samples he car-

ries, a peddler.

Airplanes Cut Journey
An airplane service for gold dig-

gers and others concerned with the

newly discovered fields in New Gui-

nea is the latest aerial development.

The new fields are on a 2,000-foot high

plateau, 00 miles from the coast, a
cross-country journey of six days,

and a fleet of airplanes has reduced
the trail to one Of 50 minutes. All

supplies for the fields are now car-

ried by air, the machines returning

to the coast with cargoes of gold and

passengers.

Waterproof Glue
Casein glues are exceedingly resist

ant to the action of water and retain

a very high percentage of their orig.
inal strength, even after long immer-

sion under water. They are compara-

tively inexpensive, and the materiah

from which they are made are readils

available in the market. They are ap

plied cold and will set without th(

application of heat.

The Biggest Crater
Two young Swedish students of ge-

ology named Wadell and Ygberg, aftel

an expedition in Iceland, have dis-

covered what is believed to be Hi(

largest crater in the world, measur-

ing five miles long and a quarter mil(

wide, and further claim to have ills

covered warts springs.

TELL STRAME TALES
OF CHINESE OVIOSTS

White Men Plan to Investi-
gate Queer Doings.

Shanghai.—Three Shanghai men

who don't believe in ghosts have left

the city for Hongkong, where they
plan to investigate the alleged ghosts

of Sung Huang hill, in Kowloon, the
place where the last emperor of the

Sung dynasty is said to have hidden
himself from his pursuing enemies.

The three nonbelievers are H.Rich-
mond Curley, J. B. Borman, and Alex-
ander V. McDonough. They claim

that their curiosity has been aroused
by the persistent reports from Hong-

kong of the strange carryings-on of

the "ghosts of Sung Huang hill."

"Ghosts don't exist and we propose

to prove it to the satisfaction of all

persons in Hongkong and Kowloon

who think otherwise," Curley, spokes-
man for the trio, declared.

Stories Accepted.

Chinese residents of Shanghai who

formerly lived in Kowloon take much

stock in the ghost stories of Sung

Huang hill. In all seriousness they

will tell of strange moans and groans

in the dead of night; of wild cries of

tortured men and women, and of

white robed forms flitting mysterious-

ly about the place.
Lee Chai-ling, an intelligent, edu-

cated Chinese of the international set-

tlement, formerly a tea merchant in
Kowloon, swears to the truth of the

following story of the haunted hill,

which, he says, he personally wit-

nessed:
In 1924 three children disappeared

while playing in the vicinity of the

place. A group of Chinese determined

to investigate. Their leader was a

powerfully built, fearless .Cantonese

named Lo Hai-ching.

Lo Disappeared.

Lo led the party to within 35 feet of

the place. He was about 10 feet in

advance of the others when there

came a piercing scream from the rear.

All heads turned. They could see no

one. Turning back, to their con-

sternation they could find no truce of

Lc. He had disappeared completely.

The party fled in all directions.
Two days later Lo's headless hody

was found in the bay. The mystery

never has been solved.
The latest story from the haunted

hill has it that a prominent Chinese

woman was lured to the hill by a
young man and an old man. A charm

seemed to have enveloped her and she

followed them blindly. A bewildered

servant was with her. The servant

relates that his mistress followed the

two men to the edge of the precipice,

where the men disappeared.
The woman then exclaimed to her

servant that there was something

strange behind them. The servant

looked. There was nothing. He

turned back and his mistress was

gone. Her body was found in the

wider.

Emir of Afghanistan
Gets Knife, Fork Habit

Kabul, Afghanistan.—The court of
Amanoula, doughty, westernizing

emir of Afghanistan has adopted
knives, forks and a bookful of Ameri-

can table etiquette through the act of
an American woman, Mrs. Jackson

Fleming of New York.
It was Mrs. Fleming who gave to

Mine. Hourschid Bey, Turkish fem-

inist lecturing in the United States,

a standard book on American etiquette
when she learned that her Turkish

friend had been appointed matron of
honor to Queen Sureya.
Mine. Hourschid Bey came to Kabul

last year with Mrs. Fleming's gift un-

der her arm to support her in her task

of modernizing the veiled ladies of the
court from the queen down. When

the emir's eye fell on the book, he de-
clared that it was just what he had
been looking for, pored over it for a

week and then had it translated into
Persian undes his personal supervision.

Since then knives and forks have been

In current and increasingly manage-

able use in the Afghan palace.

Rabies Is Classed as
Children's Disease

New York.—Itabies may be classed
as a disease of childhood, along with
whooping cough and scarlet fever.

Six out of ten deaths from this dis-

ease were among children under fif-

teen years. Of these deaths seven out
of ten were small boys. The period
between five and ten years has the
highest mortality from this cause, ac-

cording to statistics of the Metro-

politan Life Insurance company.

The reason for this high mortality

among children is twofold. First, nat-

urally, children are more exposed to

rabid dogs than adults, because of

their habit of making pets, even of

stray dogs. Secondly, the period of
development of the disease has been

found to be shorter and there is con-

sequently less time to get the child
inoculated with the serum which pre-

vents the development of the disease.

To Take on Picnics
London.—Gramaphone records that

can be rolled up, stamped on, scratched

or bent without injury have appeared

here. They are only a fiftieth of an
inch thick, made of a celluloid-like
substance.

Page Mr. Edison
West Orange, N. .I.—The town that

contains the home and the pi:int of

the inventor of the incandescent light

Is without adequate illumination after

sunset.
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Within Easy Reach of Every Family!
No matter how modest may be your income you can own FRIGIDAIRE. The

food it saves every month and our easy payment plan bring this efficient

electric refrigerator (the most widely used in the world) within your
easy reach.

According to the Department of Labor at Washington, one-tenth of the foods purchased

by the average family are thrown away—a loss caused largely by improper refrigera-

tion. If you are spending, say, $50.00 each month for supplies you may be losing
as much as $5.00 of that amount every time.

That $5.00 would not only pay for the small amount of electricity used by FRIGIDAIRE but in

comparatively few months, it would also pay off the purchase price of the FRIGIDAIRE

itself After that your FRIGIDAIRE can actually show a monthly Profit!

Frigidaire!
Our Easy Payment Plan

You can have all the economies and convenience of FRIGIDAIRE immediately—there is

no need to save the purchase money ahead of time.

FRIGIDAIRE prices are very attractive. You can get any model you want—

any size your family needs--by paying a very small amount down. The

balance will be made payable over such a long period of time that

you can meet the monthly installments with no inconvenience at

all to your pocketbook.

Call—or Mail the Coupon

The New Model FRIGIDAIRES are on

display in our shop. Before this Special Offer

closes, come in and select the model you

would like to buy, or mail the coupon for a

representative or complete information.

Union Bridge
Electric Mfg. Co.

Union Bridge, Maryland.

SPECIALLY REDUCED PRICES UNTIL

SEPTEMBER 1st. BUY TODAY AND

SAVE MONEY.

CLIP THIS COUPON AND MAIL

Gentlemen:—

Kindly send me your new FRIGIDAIRE

catalogue, together with price and easy payment

plan information.

Name 

Street Town 
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he
YELLOW
PENCIL
WITH THE
RED
SAND

Louise Rice, world famous graphologist,
can positively read your talents, virtues
and faults in the drawings, words and
what nots that you scribble when "lost
in thought".
Send your " scribblings" or signature

for analysis. Enclose the picture of the Mikado
head, cut from a box of Mikado pencils, and
ten cents. Address Louise Rice, care of

EAGLE PENCIL CO., NEW YORK CITY

Paper & Envelopes
for $1.00.

We have sold handreds of sets of our
$1.00 Stationer- Offer-200 sheets of paper
and 100 envelopes—for home use, Paper
51/2x8 1-2 with 6% envelopes, HammermIll
Bond grade.
Printed either in dark blue, or black

Not over 4 lines neat type, the same form
on both paper and envelopes. Envelepee
printed on back or ant. Unless other-
wise direct?d, orders for ladies will be
printed on back, and for gentlemen, on
front.

Instead of name, an old English initiai
later can be used, if desired. Initial sta-
tionery should have a box number, or
street address.
Mailed in neat box. Cash must be sent

with order. Write instructions, and copy
for the printing, very plainly, Mailed
without extra charge, in 1st. and 2nd,
Zones; when mailed to 3rd. and 4th. Zones,
add 5c; to 5th. and 6th, Zones, add 10c; to
the farther west add 15c.

Envelopes alone, 65c: miner alone, 75c.

THE CARROLL RECORD CO.,
TANEYTOWN, MD.

6 6 6
Cures Chills and Fever,

Interment, Remittent and
Bilious Feverdue to Malaria

It Kills the Germs

Think for Yourself
Don't be too much impressed by

what your neighbor is thinking and
doing. Democracy doesn't mean that
men shall be like bricks in a wall, all

the same size, shape and color. Don't
let anybody else make your opinions
for you. Don't be standardized. The
world is full of all kinds of standard-
ization now. Be as near right about
your opinions and your acts as you
know how. Don't waste your time by
looking over the wall into your neigh-
bor's dooryard.—Grove Paterson, in
the Mobile Register.

/kw high pressure fueling
• • • and
New high speed carhurelion

Supplementing the amazing abilities of Buick's improved

Valve-in-Head engine—providing brilliant new efficiency and

effectiveness at all engine speeds—are two wonderful new

Silver Anniversary Buick features . . .

A new high-pressure gas pump—completely eliminating the

old fashioned vacuum tank— assures a steady flow of fuel under

all driving conditions; and a new high-speed carburetor—the

most expensive employed on any motor car—produces unrival-

ed ease of starting, smooth operation and maximum economy.

The world-famous Buick engine—with these two new features

—attains the highest degree of efficiency of any automobile

engine ... and attains that peak efficiency with any grade of

fuel—low-test, high-test or in between I

Hair-trigger acceleration I Dazzling new swiftness Match-

less hill-climbing! Unrivaled ability to maintain a high pace

hour after hour and day after day

Take this new Buick out on the highway. Test it to the limit.

Prove to yourself—it's the great car of the world!

E SI LVER ANN !VERSA RN'

BUICK
WITH MASTERPIECE BODIES BY FISHER'

_

FRANK E. SNYDER, Union Bridge, Md.

WHEN BETTER AUTOMOBILES ARE BUILT . . . BUICK WILL BUILD THEM

• ART' MEMO RA ALS •
GRANITE. • MAR.hLE • BRONZE

JOSEPH • L • MATH IAS
wES TATEMISS • MARYLAND

Read the Advertisements

-- IN THE --

CARROLL RECORD

DR. W. A. R. BELL,
Optometrist.

Main Office Gor. Market and Church
St., Frederick, Md.
By Special Appointment, will be in

Taneytown, from 4:00 to 900 P. M.,
on the second and fourth Thursdays
of each month.

Phone 63W or call at

SARBAUGH'S JEWELRY STORE,
Taneytown, Md.

for appointment.
2-25-ti

‘111111Meir A



KEYMAR. FEESERSB LTRG. UNIONTOWN. 00tot0:44,04.40:0tototo:0:0:0:otoiolotots4 to•cd o etoto.oto.0:020:0:otototototototototototototetototoCVIECAIRROLLRECORD
FRIDAY, AUGUST 31, 1928.

CORRESPONDENCE
Latest Items of Local News Furnished
By Our Regular Staff of Writers
All communications for this department

must be signed by the author; nor for pub-
lication, but as an evidence that the items
sontributer are legitimate and correct.
stews based on mere rumor, or such as are
likely to give offense, are not wanted.
We desire correspondence to reach our

*Mee on Thursday, if :t all possible. It
wUl be necessary, thereiore, for most let-
ters to be mailed on Wednesday, or by
i'ast Mail, west, on W. M. R. it.. Thurs-
day morning. Letters milled on Thurs-
day eNening may not reach us in time.

NORTH EAST CARROLL.

Sunday School at St. David's
Church, on Sunday afternoon, at 12:45
Services 2:00, by Rev. A. M. Holling-
er. The Lutheran Missionary Socie-
ty will hold their 10th. anniversary
program, in the evening, at 7:30.
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Nace, and

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Nace, of this place,
and Miss Grace Trone, of Hanover,
motored to Atlantic City, over the
week-end.
Mr. and Mrs. Howard Bowman and

Mrs. Amanda Rinehart, spent Sunday
at the home of Mr. and Mrs. John
Sterner.
Mr. and Mrs. Mark Garrett and

son, Sterling, returned to their home,
on Saturday evening, after spending
three weeks in Illinois, visiting at the
home of their uncle, Mr. and Mrs. Al-
bert Werner. They enjoyed a very
pleasant trip, and did not have any
mishaps or delays.
Mr. and Mrs. Chas. Baumgardner,

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Sterner, and
Mr. and Mrs. Milton Sterner, motored
to the Du Pont gardens, at Wilming-
ton, Delaware, on Tuesday.
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Wentz, daughter

Miriam, spent Sunday morning at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. John Thiret.
Mrs. Amanda Rinehart spent Sat-

urday afternoon at the home of Cece-
lia Barnhart, of Pleasant Hill.
Farmers are busily engaged in

hauling away their sweet corn crop.
Gladys and Clair Nace spent the

week-end at the home of their grand-
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Howard Bow-
man.

NEW WINDSOR

Mrs. Ralph Roop, who has been in-
disposed, is spending some time with
her parents, D. E. Englar and wife.
The Brethren Sunday School post-

poned their trip to Druid Hill Park,on
account of infantile paralysis. They
treated their scholars to ice cream
and cake, on the campus, on Thursday
afternoon.
Mrs. James Marsh, who has been

visiting her relatives in Oklahoma,
fnr the past two months, returned
home on Tuesday.
Rodger Barnes, of Washington, D.

C., spent the week-end here, with his
parents.
The Misses Hibberd, who have spent

the summer here, at their home, here
returned to the city for the winter.
Frank Leizear and wife, of Rock-

ville, Md., spent part of the week
here, with J. S. Baile and family.

Miss Ruth Ann Nusbaum, who has
been visiting in Taneytown, returned
home, on Wednesday evening.
Miss Katherine Fiscel, who has been

in California, for the past two months,
Teturned home, on Monday evening.

William Fritz and Miss Margaret
Smith, of near Oak Orchard, were
married on Saturday evening last, at
the M. E. Parsonage, by Rev. Hayes.
Some of our local baseball fans en-

joyed the games at Frederick, this
week.
Mrs. C. E. Nusbaum returned home

from her vacation, at Ocean Grove.
Miss Virginia Myers, of Uniontown,

is visiting Miss Elizabeth Buckey.
 o 
DETOUR.

Mr. Harry Fogle and daughter, of
Uniontown, spent Sunday with friends
here.
Emory Warner, Mildred Coshun

and Kenneth Johnson, accompanied
Mrs. Maria Metzler and daughter, to
Altoona, where they spent the week-
end.

Guests at the home of Mr. and Mrs.
Jesse Weybright were: Mrs. George
Weybright and daughter, Mabelle, and
Mrs. Lucinda Oak, of near Dayton,
Ohio, and Miss Mary Weybright, of
Baltimore.
Mr. and Mrs. Ashton Phillips, of

Charles Town, W. Va., spent the week
end with Mr. and Mrs. Carroll Cover.

Guests at the home of Mr. and Mrs.
E. Lee Erb were: Mr. and Mrs..Har-
old Smeltzer and children, of Union-
town; Mr. and Mrs. Rowan Erb, Rock-
ville, and Kathryn Warehime, of York
Haven, Pa.

Sprignel Wiley, of Berkley, Cal.,
Herman Wiley, Cincinnatti, Ohio, and
Mrs. Ellen Smith, of York, Pa., are
visiting at the home of M. F. Wiley
and family. Mr. and Mrs. Edward
Norris and daughter, of Baltimore,
spent Wednesday at the same place.
Mr. and Mrs. Grenville Erb and

daughter, of Oxford, Pa., are spending
some time with E. Lee Erb and fam-
ily.
Mr. and Mrs. Wilbur Miller and

children spent Sunday with W. C. Mil-
ler and family.

MANCHESTER.

The first Daily Vacation Bible
School held under the auspices of the
Reformed congregation, at Lineboro,
the last two weeks, was a success.
The total enrollment was 57, in three
departments. The average attendance
was good. The closing exercises, on
Friday evening, were appreciated.
The annual picnic of Lazarus Union

S. S., of Lineboro, was held on Sat-
urday, at Forest Grove Park. It was
well attended, and all had a good time
The children were given Merry-go-
Round tickets, by the S. S., and all
members and friends were treated
with ice cream.
Mrs. L. H. Rehmeyer, who recently

was a patient in the Mercy Hospital,
Baltimore, is getting along as well as
can be expected.
Mr. Shull, of Philadelphia, was in

town, Monday, looking up tombstones
and records of ancestors.

Visitors at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Wm. F. Cover, last Sunday eve-
ning, were: Mr. and Mrs. Charles
Gardner, of Blue Ridge Summitt, and
their daughter, Mrs. Robert Hearine,
of Cleveland, Ohio; Mrs. Nellie Cover
Hively and sons; Mr. and Mrs. Carroll
Cover and daughter, of Detour. They
brought a fine lunch along with them.
All expressing themselves as having
a good time.
Mrs. Artie B. Angell and daughter,

Miss Margaret, of Baltimore, spent
Wednesday at the home of the form-
er's mother and sister, Mrs. Fannie
Sappington and daughter, Miss Cora.
The rebuilding of the Frederick

Mehring fertilizer factory is moving
along fine, and it is thought, will be
in operation in about two weeks.
Mrs. Ezra Harbaugh and little

daughter, of Westminster, are spend-
ing this week at the home of her
mother and brother, Mrs. J. C. New-
man and son, Wm.
Miss Mary Burkholder

' 
of Owings

Mills, is spending some time at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Upton Mehring
and daughter, Miss Mary.
On the evening of Aug. 22, Mr. and

Mrs. Calvin Fogle, brought a surprise
party to the home of Mr. and Mrs.
Wm. F. Cover,in honor of S. D. New-
man's birthday. Refreshments serv-
ed consisted of ice cream, cakes, po-
tatoe chips and coffee. All did jus-
tice to the refreshments.
Mr. and Mrs. John Leakins and

sons, David, Truman, Donald and
Oliver, spent last Sunday in Baltimore
Those who were entertained at the

home of Mr. and Mrs. R. W. Galt,
last Saturday and Sunday, were: Mr.
and Mrs. Wm. Potter, of Washington;
Mr. Richard Dorsey and daughter,
Miss Doris, of Baltimore. Mrs. Sam.
Hawk, of Littlestown, spent Saturday
at the Galt home. Mrs. Ezra Har-
baugh and daughter, were also callers
at the same place.
Miss Jane Long, of Taneytown,

spent last Tuesday and Wednesday at
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Edward
Haugh and daughter, Miss Dorothy.
Don't forget the Keymar Home-

makers' Club festival, next Monday
evening, (Labor Day). Come out and
swell the crowd.
Mrs. George Winemiller has re-

turned home from the Frederick City
Hospital, and is getting along as well
as can be expected.

Contractor E. C. Valentine has
completed the Keymar-Taneytown
road, from bridge to bridge; that is,
from Mr. Bloom's mill to the Bruce-
ville bridge. Report says that the
Keymar-Taneytown road will not be
built any further, this year. Hope
it will go through in 1929.
Dr. and Mrs. George Halley and

son, of Idaho, are spending some
time at the home of Mrs. Halley's
parents, Mr. and Mrs. John Forrest.
Miss Francis Sappington, of Hag-

erstown, who spent the summer at
the home of her grand-mother and
aunt, Mrs. Fannie Sappington and
daughter, Miss Cora, was accompan-
ied to her home by her aunt, Mrs.
Sterling Grumbine, of Unionville,last
Wednesday.
Mrs. Wm. Cover has been under

Dr. Diller's care, for the last five
weeks, suffering from a case of neu-
ritis, and has been confined to her
room most of the time since last
Tuesday evening.
The Keysville-Detour road is be-

ing built by contractor Valentine, and
is coming along fine. The foundation
is down from John Shorb's to the
cross roads, within one mile of Detour
and they will finish putting lime stone
from Mr. Shorb's to Keysville, by the
last of this week. If the weather
permits, next week, the road will be
finished from the hard road to Keys-
ville.
Mrs. Mary Mehring returned home

last Saturday. She visited Portland,
Maine, New York, and other places
of interest, and had quite an enjoya-
ble trip.
Mrs. Marshall Bell and mother,

Mrs. Maggie Zentz, spent last Tues-
day in Thurmont, at the home of
Mrs. Nora Ambrose.
Ralph Weybright has made quite

an improvement by giving his house
a coat of paint, which adds greatly to
the appearance; also built a fine gar-
age.

HARNEY.

Mrs. Joseph Wantz, of Harney,
Mrs. Alma Newcomer, of Taneytown,
Mr. and Mrs. Mahlon Stonesifer, of
Emmitsburg, were dinner guests of
Dr. and Mrs. Wetzel, of Union Mills,
last Sabbath.

Preaching Services at St. Paul's
next Sabbath, at 2:00; S. S., 1:00; C.
E. Society, 7:30.
The Canning Factory opened on

Tuesday, with quit* a force of hands
cutting and husking corn.

Mrs. Joseph Wantz spent Saturday
night in Taneytown, with her sister,
Mrs. Alma Newcomer.
Those who spent Sunday with E. R.

Kiser and faniily, were: Mr. and Mrs.
Guy W. Haines, daughters, Blanche,
Gladys, Loretta and Freda, and sons,
Woodrow, Wade and Ivan, of Balti-
more; Mr. and Mrs. Chas. Bentz,
Lloyd Crushon, of Graceham; Mr. and
Mrs. Ambrose Eckenrode, and Donald
Fink, of this place; Mr. and Mrs. Ros-
coe Rittase, of Gettysburg; Mark
Ness, of Emmitsburg.
Miss Marian Reck, of York, spent

the week-end with her parents, J. W.
Reck and family.
Raymond Eyler, of near Harney,

left, on Sunday, for York, where he
will take a business course at Thomp-
son's School.

Mrs. Fannie Humbert and Miss
Belva Koons, of Taneytown, and Mrs.
Ella Rapp and Miss Blanche Koons,
Longville, spent Sunday afternoon
with their cousins, Samuel D. and
Ruth Snider. Mrs. Sallie Slick, Tan-
eytown, spent a few days last week
at the same place.
Mrs. Mervin Patterson and daugh-

ter, Pauline, and son, Glen; Mrs. King
and daughter, Janet, and Paul Hann,
all of Two Taverns, spent Tuesday
with Mrs. Edw. Snyder.
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Harner, of

Hanover, spent Sunday evening with
Miss Lizzie Yealy.
Mr. and Mrs. Enoch Yealy spent the

week-end with Geo. Patterson and
family, of near Two Taverns.

Much of the dislike for the Fall sea-
son of the year, is caused by the
shadows cast by the tax and coal bills.'

A number of friends from Mt. Un-
ion visited Birnie Reifsnider, at the
State Sanitorium, on Sunday, after
Sunday School. He was very weak
and voiceless, but conscious and ask-
ed for prayer. Rev. Kroh called on
him on Thursday evening. We saw
Dorothy Bowman too, who was bright
and looking well, and enjoying the day
with her visiting parents.
The Sanitorium is a fine institution,

beautifully located, and well equipped.
Many buildings have been added, and
grounds more attractive, since our
former visit, some years ago. We
have heard that marvelous cures have
been wrought by the mountain air
and treatment; but some delay their
entrance until too late for permanent
benefit.
The new County Ambulance was

called to our locality, on Friday after-
noon, when it was found necessary t:
take Charles Angelucci, of Mt. Union
to John Hopkins Hospital, for treat-
ment of infantile paralysis, where he
was immediately examined and serum
injected.
The private kindergarten of Louise

Birely and her able assistant, Loma
Morris, con3is ting of fourteen pupils,
all of Urroa Bridge, had a picnic on
the lawn of her uncle, L. K. Birely's
home, on Saturday afternoon. A half
dozen neighbors were present to wit-
ness the playlet, "Mother Goose's
Goslings." and enjoy the sports. The
children ate their lunches all seated on
the ground, and a treat of ice cream
was donated by Fred Littlefield, and ,
cake by Earl Shriner. There was not
a dull moment and all departed at 5
P. M., with their class "Yell" given
in no uncertain manner.
Mr. and Mrs. Marion Eichelberger, 

;

and daughter, Shirley, of Cumberland,
spent the week-end with Mrs. E.'s
father, Lewis Biehl and relatives.

Mrs. Clara Delphey Appler, of Bal-
timore, and a friend, were guests of
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Philander
Delphey, on Saturday and Sunday.

Miss Clara M. Mackley, of West-
minster, as the guest of Ornie Hyde's
family, is making her annual visit to
friends in Middleburg‘

Miss Edith Frank, of Bethlehem,
Pa., is spending her vacation with her
grandmother and family, Mrs. Emily
Lynn.
Harry Lynn. of Baltimore, visited

his home folks, on Sunday.
L. K. Birely went to Washington, D.

C., on business, last Friday, traveling
by bus and R. R.
The Ever-ready Woman's Bible

Class of M. E. Sunday School picniced
at Blue Bird Park, along Big Pipe
Creek. on Tuesday. Rev. Richmond
and wife were in attendance.
The same class will hold a social in

the Church Hall, in Middleburg, next
Tuesday evening.
Truck loads of apples, peaches and

melons stop at our doors, and prices
are moderate, with fluctuations. One
neighbor bought a basket of twelve
cantaloupes for 50c, at the next house
the price had advanced to $1.10, but
as a special favor sold for $1.00, and
at the next door was offered for 75c,
and not choice fruit when cut. This
salesman promised to "call again,"
and we predict a variety of greetings
for -him.

MAYBERRY.

Mrs. Crushong, Mr. and Mrs. Ellis
Crushong. son Henry, and daughter,
Geneva, spent Sunday with Mr. and
Mrs. D. W. Culley, at Good Intent.
Mr. and Mrs. Garland Bollinger

spent Sunday afternoon with Mr. and
Mrs. Joe Coe.
Mrs. Peter Picket has returned to

her home, in Frederick, after a three
week's visit to V. E. Heffner and
family.
The Mayberry Church of God Sun-

day School is invited to meet on the
lot of Edward Feeser's, near the May-
berry school house, on Wednesday
evening. Sept. 5th. The treat will be
given from 6 till 8 o'clock. After the
treat there will be on sale cream,
lemonade, sandwiches and cake.
Everybody is invited to come.
Mrs. E. Cushong, Sunday visitors at

the home of Mr. and Mrs. Sterling
Flickinger and family were: Mr. and

rs. Sterling Zimmerman, sons Ver-
non and Edwin, Miss Pauline Hum-
erick. Charles Kump, and Mary Stone-
sifer, all of Mayberry; Mr. and Mrs.
Btu nett Flickinger, son John, of Un-
ion Mills; Mr. and Mrs. Preston
Blank, son Calvin, Noah Eckard and
Amos Blank, of Bachman's Valley.
Mr. and Mrs. Ellis Crushong and

daughters, Catherine and Geneva, and
son, Henry, spent Wednestay evening
with Mr. and Mrs. Edward Angel, of
Stumptown.

Miss Obel Bortner, of Hanover, is
visiting her old friends around here,
for a few days.

In this day, it is necessary to have
a cash balance, to be weighed in the
social scale.

DIED.
Obituaries, poetry and resolutions,charg-

ed for at the rate of five cents per line.
The regular death notices published free.

MR. GEORGE T. KERR.
Mr. George T. Kerr, agent of the

P. R. R., at Hanover, Pa., died sud-
denly from a heart attack on Thurs-
day afternoon of last week, while
visiting at the home of John E. Eline.
His age was 66 years, 9 months, 16
days.
For forty-six years he had been in

the employ of the • P. R. R., at
'Wrightsville, York and Hanover. In
1883 he was appointed agent at Tan-
eytown, and later was transferred
again to Hanover.
Mr. Kerr is well remembered in

Taneytown, where he was quite pop-
ular as well as efficient in his posi-
tion as R. R. agent. He was also,
later, one of the most popular and
most widely known agents at Hanov-
er, and where he held high position
socially, and in Fraternal and church
relations. His death occurred while
he had gone to inquire after the
health of one of his employees who
was ill.
In 1889 he married Miss Anna R.

Miller, of Keysville, who survives
him, with three children. Funeral
services were held on Sunday after-
noon, in charge of his former pastor,
Rev. Geo. W. Nicely, of Williams-
port. Burial services in Mt. Olivet
cemetery, Hanover.

Mr. and Mrs. G. Fielder Gilbert,
spent Saturday and Sunday at Central
Manor camp-meeting.
Rev. J. H. Hoch and family, return-

ed, Tuesday, from their vacation.
Miss Ella M. Heltibridle has had

her home newly painted, which is
quite an improvement.
Miss Mary Smith visited friends in

Frederick, the past week.
A ministerial meeting was held,

Tuesday, at the M. P. Church; quite
a number of ministers present. A
dinner was served at the parsonage
by the ladies.
Mr. and Mrs. C. Edgar Myers visit-

ed relatives in Hagerstown, for the
week-end.
Mr. and Mrs. Will Caylor, Samuel

Talbott and family, Roy Haines and
family, visited Conowingo, on Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Neil Roberts, who
were guests at H. H. Weaver's, and
other relatives, left Saturday, for
their home, in Lynchburg, Va.

Mrs. E. K. Fox, has had a severe
attack of grip, the past week.

Cortland Hoy and family, all left
for their home, in Philadelphia, on
Sunday.
Rev. M. L. Kroh and sister, Miss

Tillie Kroh, left, Monday, for Read-
ing, Pa. While there, Mr. Kroh
officiated at the marriage of his niece.
They returned on Thursday.
On Sunday, Mrs. Missouri Myers

and daughter, Miss Carrie, gave a
wedding dinner, in honor of Mr. and
Mrs. Ivan Myers. A number of rela,
tives and friends were present.

Visitors have been: Luther Hite-
shew, Monkton, Mrs. Harry Cover,
Westminster, with Nevin Hiteshew;
Howard Hiteshew and family, Balti-
more, at Snader Devilbiss'; Mr. and
Mrs. Carroll Weaver and daughter,
Miss Mary Louise, at H. H. Weaver's;
Mrs. Mary Eckard, Miss Louise Book,
Mr. Simpson, Wilmington, Del., at T.
L. Devilbiss'; Prof. Norman Eckard,
at Miss Laura Eckard's; Mrs. Robert
Davidson, Upperco, at W. G. Sega-
foose's; Joseph Weishaar, daughter
and son-in-law, Fairfield, Wilbur
Wantz and family, Union Mills, at
Charles Simpson's; Phillip Lemmon,
Will Hedger, and wives, Baltimore,
with relatives; Mrs. Benjamin Reight-
ler and daughter, Mrs. Elizabeth
Becker, Baltimore, at Mrs. M. C. Gil-
bert's; Mr. and Mrs. M. John Lynch
and sister, Mr. and Mrs. Guy Cook-
son, Mrs. Martha Singer, Mrs. John
Snader, at B. L. Cookson's; Mr. and
Mrs. Grenville Erb, New Oxford, Pa.,
at Miss Alverta Erb's, their daugh-
ter, Ethel, who has been here on a
visit, returned home with them; Mrs.
Ida Bair, Spring Grove, Pa., with a
number of friends from Union Bridge,
to see Miss S. E. Weaver, at Miss
Anna Baust's; Mrs. Eva Henry, Bal-
timore, at S. Repp's; Mr. and Mrs.
Harry Stultz, son Roland Stultz and
wife, Baltimore, at F. T. Bowersox's.
Mr. E. B. Garner's furneral was

largely attended, at the Bethel, last
Friday. Ministers taking part were:
Rev. S. A. Kipe, Rev. J. D. Clark,
Rev. J. H. Gonso and Elder W. P.
Englar.

Mrs. Emma Lee, Warfieldsburg, is
making her home at Theodore Haines'
for a time.

Birthday Surprise Party.

Mr. and Mrs. Howard S. Baker
gave a birthday surprise party in
honor of Mr. Baker's sister, Miss
LaRena Baker, on Thursday evening,
Aug. 23. Party games and dancing
were enjoyed by all until a late hour,
when refreshments were served.
Those present were: Mrs. A. V.

Young, Hagerstown; Mr. and Mrs. H.
J. Myers, Mr. and Mrs. Vernon My-
ers, Mr. and Mrs. Chas. Hilterbrick,
Mr. and Mrs. Harry Flickinger, Mr.
and Mrs. John Stambaugh, Mr. and
Mrs. Walter Keefer, Mrs. Mary Bak-
er, Mrs. Alven Dell, Mrs. Hollen-
berry, Mr. and Mrs. Wallace Eckert,
Mrs. John Byers, Mrs. Fred. Shank,
Mr. and Mrs. Claude Nusbaum, Mr.
and Mrs. William Erb, Mr. and Mrs.
Carroll Garber, Mr. and Mrs. Jacob
Strawsburg, Mr. and Mrs. Russell
Reinaman, Mr. and Mrs. Raymond
Coe, Mr. and Mrs. Harry Lambert,
Mr. and Mrs. Augustus Crabbs, Mr.
and Mrs. Howard S. Baker; Misses
U. S. Wertz, Dorothy Young, Min-
nie Smith, and Melva Nunemaker, all
of Hagerstown; Charlotte Myers,
Doras Myers. Betty Myers, Catherine
Baker, Vera Eckert, Ethel Clingan,
Mildred Baker, Margaret Baker, Iva
Brown, Catherine Brown, Mallon
Eckert, Pauline Dell, Naomi Hollen-
berry, Ruth Hollenberry, Lillian Dem-
mitt, Evelyn Brown, Ruthanna Flick-
inger, Anna Reinaman, Nora Baker,
Carrie Eckert, Helen Eckard, Gladys
Baker, Carrie Long and Cora Miller
of Woodsboro; Hilda Zepp, Mildred
Wantz, Reida Reinaman, May Lam-
bert, LaReina Baker, Elizabeth Hil-
terbrick, Daisy, Mabley and Helen
Haines, of Westminster; Catherine
Hilterbrick, Thelma Stambaugh,Ruth
Young, Pauline Hummerick, Mary
and Roberta Young; Messrs Wm. J.
Baker and Roland Baker, of Hagers-
town; Guy Myers, Fern Myers, Theo.
Leister, Kenneth Myers, Franklin
Baker, Donald Baker, Martin Ifitch-
cock, Kenneth Smith, William Eck-
ard, Edward Myers, Carroll Eyler,
Robert Koons, Chas, Coe, Clarence
Fuss, Ernest Lawrence, Melvin Reav-
er, Lloyd Reaver, Stanley Humbert,
Wilbur Lawrence, Clarence Reaver,
Albert Eyler and Chas. Grimes, of
Woodsboro; Chas. Hampshire, Donald
Reaver, Deerdorf, Lee Nusbaum,
Wilbur Carr, Ray Haley, William
Bollinger, Robert Devilbiss and Geo.
A. Drechsler, all of Westminster;
Grant Lambert, William Flickinger,
Mervin Koons, Wilmer Young, Wm.
Staub, Albert Barnhart, Ray Froun-
leiter, Russell Frounfelter, Roscoe
Six, Frank Unger, David Hilterbrick,
Otto Cross, Geo. Kiser, Earl Wallick,
Vernon Flickinger, Walter Barnhart,
Hershey Stambaugh, Chas. Flicking-
er, Martin Nusbaum, Howard Eyler,
Ralph Mort, Levine Carbaugh, Nor-
man Nusbaum, Harry Clingan, Le-
Roy Eckert, Walter Reaver, Chas.
Baker and Billie Baker.

FRESH FEEDS ARE SAFER.
No need to feed green food if you

use Rein-o-la Growing Mash for your
chicks. It is made fresh every week
and contains Barker's Mineral Mix.
No feed is made better, few are as
good. Price $3.50 per 100 lbs. Use
it and save money.—Reindollar Bros.
& Co- 6-15-tf

ig Carroll County Fair
TANEYTOWN, MD.

September 11, 12, 13, 14, 1928.
FINE LOCATION ALONG STATE ROAD.

Tremendous Program of Racing!
Large Exhibits of Cattle, Poultry, Farming Machinery, Fruits, Vege-

tables, Household Goods and Fancy Work.

FOUR DAYS OF INCTRUCTIVE DEMONSTRATION, WONDER-
FUL FREE ATTRACTIONS—TWICE DAILY.

Gorgeous Display of Fireworks—Wednesday and Thursday Evenings
FRIDAY—Children's Day. All School Children admitted free.

For Premium List and other information apply to

The Carroll County Fair,
TANEVTOWN, MD.

DANCING EACH NIGHT OF FAIR.
8-24-3t
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Gurley—Stull Reunion.

The fifth annual Gurley-Stull reun-
ion was held Sunday, Aug. 26, 1928,
at Everitt's Park, on the National
Highway leading from Hagerstown
to Cumberland. The crowd began to
arrive about 10:30 A. M., and contin-
ued gathering until late in the after-
noon, there being 96 registered.
Everyone enjoyed themselves by

talking, and the amusements in the
park, until dinner hour. A large ta-
ble was prepared with sumptuous Smith, Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Roop, Mr.
things to eat, to which every one help- and Mrs. John Shaum, Mr. and Mrs.
ed themselves. A few hours after Charles Hi Iterbrick, Mr. and Mrs.
dinner, ice cream was served to every Walter Smith, Mr. and Mrs. George
one. Shoemaker, Mr. and Mrs. Charles E.

Sell, Mr. and Mrs. Joe Frountfelter,
Mr. and Mrs. William F. Erb, Mr.
and Mrs. Roy F. Smith, Mr. and Mrs.
Jacob Strawsburg,Miss Grace Sullivan
Mrs. Elsie V. Brook, Baltimore; Mr.
and Mrs. Carroll Garber, Mrs. Mary
Baker, Mr. and Mrs. Howard Hull,Mr.
and Mrs. Augustus Crabbs, Mr. and
Mrs. Harry G. Lambert, Sr., Mr. and
Mrs. Lloyd Lambert, Harry Smith,
Ernest Myers, Mrs. Katherine Smith,
Mr. and Mrs. John Stambaugh, Mrs.
Nora Frock, Larena Baker, Gladys
Baker, Pauline Myers, Carrie and
Ella Frountfelter, Mary Smith, Mar-
garet Baker, Ethel Clingan, Kathryn
and Elizabeth Hilterbrick, Katherine
Baker, Ruthanna Myers, Thelma Sell,
Mildred Baker, Dorothy Thomson,
Thelma Smith, Mildred Wantz, Norma
Frountfelter, Janet and Mildred Hull,

Adams and daughter, Clara, of De- Anna Sell, Dorothy Stonesifer, Mary
tour, Md.; Mr. and Mrs. B. R. Stull, Lambert, Betty Rose Shaum, Thelma
Emmitsburg; Mr. and Mrs. Charles Stambaugh, Frances Sell, Virginia
Growden, Melvin and Alom Growden, Smith, Roy Haley Clarence Myers,

Elwood Crabbs, Roy and Charles
Frountfelter, Donald Reaver, Wilbur
Currens, Truman Hamburg, Hershey
Stambaugh, David Hilterbrick, James
Ditzler, Ellsworth Feeser, Charles
Baker, Clyde and Edgar Sell, Arthur
Hull, Scott and George Smith, John
Shaum, Tommy Smith, Billy Sanders,
Grant Lambert, Ralph Mort, Billy
Baker. baby Smith and others.
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Those present were: Oscar Gurley,
Lada Gurley, Mr. and Mrs. Harry
Dickens and children, Luther, Homer,
Taylor, Onolee and Hazel; Mr. and
Mrs. J. H. Fisher and daughter, Ruth;
C. K. Anderson, B. M. Anderson,Car-
roll Anderson, Bernard Anderson,
Charles Anderson, Elwood Anderson,
Mr. and Mrs. John Dickens, Mr. and
Mrs. William McLuckie and family,
Virginia Lee, Eleanor, Billy and
Kathryn Miller, Harriett Gurley,
Charles Gurley, Ivan Wentling, Marie
Gurley, Russell Wentling, Mrs. Ella
Rice, George L. Miller, Rena Mave,
Roy L. Gross, Mary Growden, Harry
Growden. Santford A. Gurley, Edwin
A. Gurley, Mr. and Mrs. W. G. Rice
and son, Russell; Mr. and Mrs. J. F.
Gurley, Mrs. Clara Bower, all of
Cumberland, Md.; Mr. and Mrs. Jacob

folks. The little ones enjoyed playing
in the water, also, pictures of each
family were taken.
One of the fourth generation was,

mother Baker, her daughter, Mrs.
Wm. Green ;her daughter Mrs. Tolbert
Alexander, and daughter, Vivian. A
sumptuous lunch spread on a long ta-
ble that seated all.
Those present were: Mrs. John Bak-

er, daughter, Martha, grandson, Ches-
ter Wolf; Mr. and Mrs. Stanley Min-
nick, Mr. and Mrs. J. Wilbur Baker,
daughter, Catherine, of Union Bridge;
Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Smith, daughters,
Louise and Lugarder, son, Elvin, of
Hagerstown; Mr. and Mrs. Chas.
Spielman, daughter, Helen, and Alice,
son John, of Linwood; Mr. and Mrs.
Wm. Green, daughter, Louise, and
Betty Lee, son John, and Preston, Mr.
and Mrs. Tolbert Alexander, daughter,
Vivian, of Sams Creek; Mr. and Mrs.
George Baker, daughters, Mary and
Louise, sons, Raymond, Charles, Mar-
cus, and Harry, and Mrs. Mabel
Smith, Mr. and Mrs. John Sharrer,son
John Henry, of Hagerstown; Miss
Grace Rodkey, of Tyrone; David
Stultz, of Uniontown.

BETTER GROWING MASH.
Rein-o-la Growing Mash for chick-

ens is now equal to the very best na-
tionally advertised feeds. Made over
Barker's formula with Barker's Min-
eral Mix it is guaranteed by them and
us. Freshly made every week. Only
$3.50 per 100 lbs. A trial is convinc-
ing.—Reindollar Bros. & Co.
6-1-5-tf

—Advertisements.

A Little Folks Party.

Mr. and Mrs. Bernard Shaum gave
a surprise party for little folks, on
Monday evening, in honor of their lit-
4th. birthday. Refreshments were
tle daughter, Betty Rose, it being her
served.
Those present were: Betty Rose

Shaum, William Baker, Charles Bak-
er. Emma Graham, Jean Frailey, Mil-
dred Baker, Hazel Hyser, Nadine Oh-
ler, Mary Frances Ohler, Betty Ott,
Josephine Elliot, Margaret Bowers,
Treva Boyd, Helen Boyd, Robert Fair,
John Henry Shaum, George Motter,
Wm. Copenhaver, Wm. Sanders. Thos.
Morrison, David Shaum, Mary Shaum,
Francis Shaum, Margaret Morrison,
Rita Sanders, Mark Sanders, Kather-
ine Arnold, Anna Sanders, Elizabeth
Shorb. Dan Smith, Roslie Reaver, Rita

Advertisement Rose Dumbauld.

all of Bedford Valley, Pa.; Walter B.
Stevenson, and Minnie R. Stevenson,
of Baltimore; Mr. and Mrs. Morris,
Barrick; Mr. and Mrs. Aaron Adams,
Mr. and Mrs. H. W. Stull, all of Rocky
Ridge; Mr. and Mrs. Sterner Cramer,
N. Z. Cramer, C. M. Cramer, Mrs. J.
W. LeGore, Louise LeGore, Mrs.
Walter LeGore, Maxine LeGore, Mr.
and Mrs. J. P. Feiser, Miss Frances
Feiser, all of Woodsboro; John Gurley
L. Frank Gurley, Philadelphia, Pa.;
Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Buhrman and
daughters, Marguerite and Madeline,
of Graceham.

A Lirthday Party.

j A birthday surprise party was held
' at the home of Harry G. Lambert,Jr.,
in honor of his birthday, Tuesday

' night, Aug. 28. Mr. Lambert receiv-
ed some useful gifts. At a late hour
all were invited to the dining room
where refreshments were served.
Those present were: Mr. and Mrs.

Harry Lambert, Jr., Mr. and Mrs.
Russell Feeser, Mr. and Mrs. Wilbur
Stonesifer, Mr. and Mrs. Albert

 o
A Pleasant Surprise.

(For the Record.)

On Aug. 26, as Elder and Mrs.
Thos. C. Ecker, of Kumn, Md., were

The Baker Family Reunion. ready to eat lunch, 16 cars from Lan-
caster Co., Pa., members of the West

The first Baker reunion of the late Conestoga Church where Elder and
John W. Baker, of Union Bridge, ' Mrs. Ecker had worshipped the past
was held on Sunday, Aug. 26, at the three years, drove in front of the
home of the oldest son, George, near i house, numbering 87 people in all,
Fairview, along Meadow Branch. The with their lunches, which Mr. and
day was spent in talking, with the; Mrs. Ecker were invited to join in all
old, and amusements with the young ' enjoying together, with a can of cream

that arrived shortly after.
All were given a hearty welcome

by Mr. and Mrs. Ecker. After lunch
and social conversation together a
number of hymns were sung with
short addresses by A. G. Fahnestock
and Elder Ecker, followed by prayer,
closing with the hymn "God be with
you till me meet again."

After bidding farewell all started
on their homeward journey, express-
ing themselves much pleased with
their trip. And extended a hearty
welcome to return again.

The Flohr Family Reunion.

The Flohr families met in their
Fourth reunion of the John Flohr de-
scendants and friends, at Mt. Tabor
Park, Rocky Ridge, on Sunday, Aug.
26th. They came from Vienna, Va.,
Washington, D. C., Baltimore, York,
*Gettysburg, Waynesboro, Hagers-
town, Thurmont, Emmitsburg,Wood-
bine, Sykesville, Westminster, Tan-
eytown and other places, about 400
strong.
The meeting was quite a success,

and the place was found to be fine
o  for the purpose. The meeting next

year will be at the same place, the
4th. Sunday in August. The officers
are; L. J. Flohr, Thurmont, chair-
man; Lewis S. Flohr, Baltimore, sec-
retary; J. E. Flohr, Taneytown,
treasurer.

Man So Nervous Feels
His Stomach Jump

"I got so nervous my stomach felt
like it was jumping. Vinol entirely
relieved the trouble. I feel better
than in years."—J. C. Duke.

Vinol is a compound of iron, phos-
phates, cod liver peptone, etc. The
very FIRST bottle makes you sleep
better and have a BIG appetite.
Nervous, easily tired people are sur-
prised how QUICK the iron, phos-
phates, etc., give new life and pep.
Vinol tastes delicious. .R_o,kdbe,

rt
Kinney, Druggist, Taneytown, Md.

ertiSse.:

Breaking It Gent!y
The Maid—Did 1 hear you say there

were a hundred pieces in the dinner
set?
The Mistress—Yes, a hundred

pieces.
The Maid—You'll find about a hun-

dred and twenty pieces now.
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SPECIAL NOTICES
SMALL ADVERTISEMENTS will be in-

serted under this heading at One Cent a
word, each week, counting name and ad-

dress of advertiser-two initials, or a date,

*stinted as one word. Minimum charge,

It5 cents.
REAL ESTATE for sale, Two Cents each

word. Minimum charge, 25 cents.
APPLY AT RECORD OFFIC.3 ads not

accepted-but will receive sealed replies.

No personal information given.
THIS COLUMN is tpecially for Wants,

Lost, Found, Short Announcements, Per-
sonal Property for sale. etc.
..ALL NOTICES In this column must be

uniform in style.

WANTED.-Butter, Eggs, Poultry,
Lard, Squabs and Calves at highest
prices. 50c a head for delivering
Calves. Highest prices paid for Hides
and Furs of all kinds.--Frances E.
Shaum's Produce. Phone 3-J 3-28-tf

FRESH COW AND CALF for sale
by Ralph E. Hess. .

SURVEY AND LEVELING, done
efficiently. Areas, Grading, Ditching,
etc., estimated.35 years experience.-
John J. John, County Surveyor,Phone
54, New Windsor, Md.

8-31-15t e.o.w.

FOR SALE.-Electric Washer, in
good condition; also Hog Feeder,good
as new.-P. H. Shriver.

FOR SALE.-20-bu. Seed Rye for
a short time. Price $1.75 b a.-Jere
J. Garner.

PRIVATE SALE of my property
in Mayberry. Call on me at Kings-
dale, Pa.-Leonard A. Babylon.

8-31-2t

SMALL FARM for sale, situate on
Keymar hard road.-Lawrence Hahn.

8-31-3t

ALL PERSONS indebted to LeRoy
& Scott M. Smith, on book account,
will please settled by Sept. 15, 1928.
If not, the accounts will be put in the
hands of an Attorney for collection.-
LeRoy A. Smith and Scott M. Smith.

COWS AND SHOATS for sale.-
Scott M. Smith.

LOST-2 Wire Chicken Coops; be-
tween Taneytown and a point west of
Middleburg. A liberal reward will
be given for their return.-Edw. H.
Essig.

FOR SALE-Ford Touring Car,
1922 Model, in good running order,for
sale cheap to quick buyer.-Scott M
Smith.

PULLETS FOR SALE.-Rocks and
Leghorns-thoroughbreds. - E. F.
Schildt, Rt. 2, Taneytown, near Wal-
nut Grove School.

FERNS AND POTTED Plants for
sale, during Fair week.-Mrs. Alma
Newcomer. 8-31-2t

PEACHES FOR SALE.-Picking
Elbertas now and next week. Come
to the orchard for your selection, at a
reasonable price.-New Windsor Fruit
Co., New Windsor, Md.

WILL PAY 11c lb., for 50 Cans of
Nice Bright Lard.-F. E. Shaum.

LOST POCKET BOOK containing
Money and Automobile License, be-
tween Bruceville and Crapster's gate.
Reward for return to Charles Stover,
Mid-Tan. Route 1.

WE OFFER thrifty housekeepers
and young folks starting housekeep-
ing, an opportunity to furnish or re-
furnish their home at real money sav-
ing prices. We operate on a small
expense and belong to a large chain
store. We buy for less, and sell for
less. Let us convince you. 3-piece
all over stuffed Parlor Suite, $69.50;
4-piece Bedroom Suite, $79.50; 10-
piece Dining Room Suite, $99.50. We
furnish four rooms very comfortably
for $396.00, including floor covering
for every room.-Home Furniture Co.,
P. 0. S. of A. Building, Littlestown,
Penna. 8-31-4t

SMALL FARM FOR SALE, near
Pine Hill, 37% Acres, about 3 acres
in timber. Apply to Maurice W.
Baker, Taneytown, Md. 8-24-2t

DON'T FAIL TO SEE the world's
finest Electric Washing Machine at
the exhibit of L. K. Birely, at the
Taneytown Fair. 8-24-3t

2 FINE HEIFERS for sale; close
springers.-L. K. Birely. 8-24-2t

PIC-NIC AND FESTIVAL. Tom's
Creek Sunday School will hold its an-
nual picnic and festival, Saturday.
Sept. 1st., afternoon and evening in
the grove adjoining the church. Con-
tests and prizes for everyone. Special
horse-shoe pitching contest for the
men with prizes. Supper will be serv-
ed on the grounds. Music by Detour
Band. 8-24-2t

WANTED.-Good reliable woman,
with a fair education, to take care of
a home and help along with business.
Must be straight in every way," with
reference; between 25 and 35 years of
age. Address Box 125, Waynesboro,
Pa. 8-24-2t

NOTICE TO TANEYTOWN and
community. You have already re-
ceived my circulars explaining my
Auto Awning and Curtain combined
I announce that on Saturday, Sept.
1st., one day only, you can have these
at a reduced price of $1.25 per pair.
I deliver anywhere by parcel post C.
0. D., and will have my demonstrat-
ing car on your streets on the above
date.-N. E. Bohn, Union Bridge, Md.

8-24-2t

GOOD THINGS TO. EAT.-Ham
broiled over the coals and other good
things to eat, at Piney Creek Presby-
terian Church Supper, Wednesday,
Sept. 5th. Ready at 5 o'clock. If
had weather, Thursday. Adults 35c;
Children under 12 years, 25c. 8-24-2t

PEACHES FOR SALE.-John W.
Kelbaugh, Pinehurst Fruit Farm,
Thurmont, Md. Phone 41F2.

8-10-tf

FAT HOGS WANTED, who has
them?-Harold Mehring. 11-11-tf

FOR SALE-Fine Homes, im-
proved by Brick and Frame Houses
and all improvements, in and out of
town.-D. W. Garner, Real Estate
Broker. 10-5-tf

This column is for the free use of all I
churches, for a brief announcement of
services. Please do not elaborate. It Is
always understood that the public Is in-
vited.

St. Mary's Lutheran Church, Silver
Run-Sunday School, 9:00; Preaching,
10:00; C. E., 7:00, and Evening Ser-
vice, 7:30. Rev. W. E. Saltzgiver,
Pastor.

St. Mary's Ref. Church, Silver Run
-Sunday School, 9:00;Morning Wor-
ship 10:00; Christian Endeavor, 6:30;
Evening Service, 7:30.

Reformed Church, Taneytown.-S.
School, 9:15; Service, 10:15; C. E.,
6:30; Service, 7:30.

Keysvillo-Sunday School, 1:00;
Service, 2:00; Harvest Home Service,
Sunday afternoon, Sept. 9th.

Emmanu.?l (Baust) 'Ref. Church.-
S. S.. 9:30; Morning Worship and
Sermon by the pastor at 10:30; Y. P.
S., 7:30; W. M. S. and Consistory will
meet on Tuesday, Sept. 4, 7:30.

Piney Creek Presbyterian-Morn-
ing Service with sermon by the pas-
tor, at 9:30; Sabbath School and Light
Bearers meeting, 10:30.
Taneytown Presbyterian-Sabbath

School, 10:00; Preaching Service,
11:00; C. E., 6:45.

Uniontown Circuit Church of God.
-Sunday School, 9:30; Preaching
Service, 10:30. Theme: "Real Relig-
ion". Sunday School and Preaching
Service, at Frizellburg Sunday after-
noon. C. E. and Preaching Service at
Wakefield Sunday evening.

Uniontown Lutheran Charge, Mt.
Union-S. S., 9;C. E., 7:00; Preach-
ing Service, 10:30; Catechetical Class
after service.

St. Luke's-S. S., 7:00; Preaching,
8:00.

St. Paul's-S. S., 9:30; C. E., 7:30.

Trinity Lutheran Church-All reg-
ular services, Sunday School and
Luther League, Rev. Dr. H. C. Alle-
man, of Gettysburg, will preach,
morning and evening.

Taneytown U. B. Church-Sunday
School, 9:30; Sr. C. E., 7:00; Evening
Worship, 8:00; Sunday, September 9,
Sunday School Rally, 9:30; Harvest
Home Service, 10:30.
Harney-S. School, 9:30; Morning

Worship, 10:30; The Ladies Aid So-
ciety will meet at the home of Mrs.
Marshall, Thursday evening, Sept. 6,
7:30.

Hirh Finance.

When the wealthy John D. McRock
died, he willed his enormous fortune
to his three old friends, Muss Rorris-
sey, Nuts McFuzzy and Moses Gold-
stein, on the condition that they each
place one hundred dollars of it in his
coffin.

After the funeral they were talking
it over.
"I put five twenties in his hand,"

said Muss, in between hiccoughs.
"And I put ten gold eagles in his

right hand pocket," said McFuzzy,
"Gold is more durable if he has a
hard trip."
"Oy", remarked Moses, rubbing his

hands softly, "I pud in my check for
tree hundred dollars ant took der
change."

.ctWi:1), Deadly
Cu:-are Poison Works

"curn re Is the deadly poison that
tips tne arrows of the South American
Indians," the explorer said. "A pin-
prick from one of their tiny and slow-
moving blow-pipe arri:ws tipped \vitt:
curare will kill a peccary, a jaguar or
U man.
"On the Amazon one day my Tu

canos killed a imaikey. The piece (it
monkey that was served to inc after-

ward happened to contain the wound.

There it was, the ragged curare-filled
wound made by the blow-pipe arrow.
I cut that bit away, you bet, but a
"rucano snatched it up, swallowed it
and laughed in my face.
"'How is It,' I asked him, 'that you

Call ea t wit bout harm the poison-load-
ed flesh of the birds and animals that
..t it ,luvs1kill with your curare-tipped ar-1. 

•'For- answer-and a vcry good an-
swer It seemed to me-the Tucano
took a pinch of curare from his
pouch; enough to kill a dozen per-
sons; and rolling it into a ball he
swallowed it down with his monkey
meat and manioc.
"Then I understood. Curare is a

poison that must be Injected directly
into the blood. It can be eaten and
digested with impunity."-Spriqgfield
Union.

leen of Genius Noted
for Large Appetites

It would appear that the man of ge-
nius usually requires a large supply
of substantial food. Intellectual work
deniands: full nutrition to repair the
waste of brain tissue. Scott was
wont to attribute his extraordinary
capacity for continuous work to his
good digestion and the wholesome re-
straints of his appetite In his youth.

have as keen an appetite now as
tiny man," he said, "but I know when
to stop."

Miraheau Is said to have been an
enormous feeder, eating as much at a
meal as would suffice three ordinary
men. Talleyrand was also a noted
eater. Goethe and Napoleon ate large
quantities of food, but cared little for
the quality. Bismarck was noted for
his appetite, which was Insatiable, but
his food was of the simplest.
Many stories are told of the gross

delight in food shown by the two Du-
mases, father and son, one of which
Is that the younger, being overtaken
by a storm, took refuge In a hotel near
Paris. Twenty-four turkeys were hang-
ing upon ttte spit.
"And all for a single traveler," ex-

plained the host.
"It is my father!" exclaimed Alex-

andre, junior. And he was right.

BY SMALL WINDMILLS

Stationed About Land They
Guide Him Around.

Hart, Mich.-Small windmills have

served as eyes for Kary McCauley,
forty-one, blind farmer of Ferry town-
ship, the last three years. The wind-
mills guide McCauley about the farm;

they take him from the house to the
barn or to the chickencoop; they also
guide him down the sand road two

miles to the village of Ferry.
McCauley lost the sight of his left

eye three years ago. His right eye al-

ways had been sightless. It was then

that he hit upon the plan of the wind-

mills to guide him. The small wind-
mills were placed at strategic points
about the farm and along the highway

to Ferry. The wind sets the mills in
motion and from the rattle he is able
to find his way.
On the infrequent quiet days when

there is no wind to make the wooden
vanes rattle he guides himself about
the farm by means of a wire stretched
from one building to another.

Repair Windmills Now.

There are no sidewalks in Ferry

township to tap with a cane and there
is only an occasional visitor to aid the
blind man in time of need but Mc-
Cauley frequently makes the two-mile
trip to town and back alone. He takes
the wagon trail. Windmills are placed
at intersections. He can hear the rat-
tle of the mills for several hundred
feet and knows where to turn.
. The windmills are being repaired
now. The winter winds have damaged
some and blown others down. Hunters
and boys not knowing of their pur-

poses have destroyed some. Hence the
mills must be replaced before Mc-
Cauley can go to town. •

Although always blind in the right
eye. McCauley at one time had excel-

lent vision and was a crack shot with
a rifle. He would suspend a flatiron
by a string, back away as far as he
could see the string, shoot the string
and drop the iron. Partridges on the
wing fell victims to his marksman-
ship.

Old Horse Helped.

In the days when the vision of Mc-
Cauley's left eye was -fading an old
horse, Bill, aided him in making a liv-
ing. A log chain was attached to the
harness and by its rattle -McCauley
was able to find his horse. He would
cut a cord of wood daily, haul it to
Ferry and sell it for $2.50. About
the time that McCauley lost the sight
of the left eye the horse died and Mc-
Cauley was confronted with new prob-
lems.
The blind man lives with his father,

Daniel McCauley, eighty-two. Despite
his age, the father works at clearing
land, but he is growing feeble. The
aged father and the blind son wonder
what the future holds for them. Most
of the day the son sits at the farm-
house waiting for the return of the
aged father. He still hopes, despite
the -word of doctors, that he will be
able to see again.
"Somewhere there must be a doctor

who can help me," he says. If not he
will have to go through life following
the rattle of the windmills.

Soon Lamb Will Be Sold
With Mint Sauce in It

Paris.-Soon the French house-
keeper will be able to buy her lamb
or mutton with the mint sauce al-
ready in it and chicken already fla-
vored with mace and thyme. In
France, land of famous cooks and
tasty sauces, poultry and meat are
now deliciously seasoned by hypoder-
mic injection.
The new method, discovered by Dr.

A. Gauducheau, makes use of a prin-
ciple of physiology and injects sauced
and seasoning directly into the blood
stream of chicken and other fowl. In
this way the flavoring penetrates to
all parts of the meat.
"Intra-sauce," is the name Doctor

Gauducheau coined for the fluid he
uses in this new sort of cookless
cookery. He has tried the method on
over 200 animals, using all kinds of
poultry and sheep and pigs.
In addition to flavoring, coloring

matter may be introducul In the
same way to get an even hue through-
out the meat, or different parts may
be flavored or colored differently.
Lean meats may be enriched by in-
jection of lards or oils. For this
purpose melted butter has been found
the best fluid.

Sightless Operators
Man French Phones

Paris.-Blind telephone operators
man switchboards at a number of
French offices.
Trained by the National Institute

for the Blind, they have conquered
all the difficulties, says the head of
the school, Prof. Pierre Henri. They
cannot work on boards with signal
lamps, but these are used only in big
central exchanges. On the smaller
boards the blind operators tell by the
sense of touch what numbered shut-
ter opens; they compile their own
record of calls in raised print, and
they record messages likewise, or on
a typewriter.

Most Accurate
Washington.-When it conies to ac-

curacy, the Oxford Bible puts in a
claim for first place. It contains 773,-
746 words and, as each new edition
Is published, a reward of $5 is offered
to any reader who can find a typo-
graphical error. TI:e average pay-
ments on this account amount lo one
a year.

he
TELEPHONE
DIRECTORY

will soon go to press

Now is the time to order
A new telephone
An extension station
An auxiliary line
Individual line service
Private branch exchange trunks
Extra equipment, [auxiliary bells, etc.)
Additional directory listings or changes
in listings

Advertisements in the directory

PLEASE don't wait until the last minute. Let us
have your order at once. Secure the service you

need without delay. Call us today and tell us about
your telephone needs.

(Che CHESAPEAKE AND POTOMAC
TELEPHONE COMPANY

PUBLIC SALE
••••••••••

The undersigned will offer at public
sale on the premises on the road from
Taneytown to Sell's Mill, on

SATURDAY, SEPT. 8th., 1928,
at 1 o'clock, sharp, the following de-
scribed real estate, consisting of

11 ACRES OF LAND,
improved by a 6-room weatherboarded
dwelling house, barn, wagon shed,hen
house and other necessary outbuild-
ings. Land is in good shape. This
property adjoins the land of Harry
Shipley, Maurice Overholtzer, Tobias
Harner and Edw. Angell.
TERMS made known on day of sale.

PERSONAL PROPERTY.
1 good horse, 1-horse wagon, falling-
top buggy, Standard Wincroft range,
kitchen cabinet, 6-ft. extension table,
lounge, organ, 6 cane-seat chairs,
rockers, lot kitchen chairs, lot cooking
utensils, 2 iron kettles, tubs, barrels,
buckets, corn sheller, harness, single
and double trees, 25 bushels potatoes,
etc.
TERMS CASH.

WM. C. ECKARD.
J. N. 0. SMITH, Auct.

NO TRESPASSING Public Sale
The name of any property owner, or

tenant, will be inserted under this heading

weekly, until December 10th., for 25 cents

cash in advance.

All persons are hereby forewarned
not to trespass on my premises with
dog, gun, or trap, for the purpose of
shooting or taking game of any kind,
/for for fishing, or in any way injur-
ing or destroying property.

Baumgard'r,Clar. FFormwalt, Harry
Brining, Benton Hess, Norman R.
Brining,Mrs. BentoShorb, Elmer C.
Conover, Martin E.Stonesifer, C. G.
Crebs, Elmer Teeter, John S.
Diehl Bros

Private Sale
- OF A -

DESIRABLE SMALL FARM.
I offer at private sale my small

farm containing
13 ACRES OF LAND,

more or less, situate near Greenville,

Also at the same time and place, I 
3 squares from hard road. Improved
by a good Barn and all good out-

will sell the following property: 1 new buildings; 6-room house. Possession
CONCRETE BLOCK MACHINE, will be given at once.

never used;1 Model incubator, 250-egg 8-24-2t WM. E. KRAMER,
size; oats sprouter, 2-horse plow, one
shovel, corn fork, 5-ga. oil can, old-
time sausage stuffer, 2 Ford auto
chains, Ford auto tire cover, chicken
feeders, 2 chicken coops, pitch fork,
scoop shovel, good bicycle, broad axe, DESIRABLE SMALL FARM
etc.
TERMS CASH.

FOR SALE

Fine 29 Acre Farm located along the
8-24-3t MRS. L. A. ECKARD. Taneytown and Emmitsburg State
  Road, improved by a

21/2 STORY FRAME DWELLING.

"LEST WE FORGET", First floor contains living room, par-

BEAUTY
PERMANENCE

CHARACTER

HAMMAKER BROTHERS
THURMONT '410 GETTYSBURG

6-22-eow

"Bed:a?:2"
wm.d "bedlam" had its origin

In the word Bethlehem. Bedlam is
the name givPn to the Hospital of St.
Mary of Bethlehem In London, Eng-
land. which Was fozinded in the Four-
teenth century. lit the Sixteenth ten
tury Henry VIII iirmed it into an in
stitution for the instme. and it be-
came infatimus for the brutal ill
treatment meted out to the in
It was indeed a mndimuse. and the
word bedlam has since been applied
to any frenzied tissemhly or mad
crowd.

"Old King Cole"
King Cole was a British king of

the Third century, who is said to have
taken Camulodunum from the Romans
and to have named it after himself.
Colchester. According to some of the
old chroniclers, he was the fattier of
the Empress Helena, mother of the
Emperor Constantine. He is the sub-
ject of a well-known nursery rhyme.

lor, dining room, kitchen and hall, 2
stairways; 2nd. floor 4 bedrooms, bath
and hall. All bedrooms have built in
wardrobes. Hot and cold water in
house. Corn crib, Bank Barn 36x56,
and wagon shed attached, summer
house, 2 poultry houses, hog house
and all other necessary buildings, all •
in good paint, and practically new
buildings. Fruit of nearly all kinds.
Apply to-
8-17-4t SAMUEL T. BISHOP.

High-class Races

Griest Park

YORK SPRINGS, PA.

Labor Day, Sept. 3rd.

The management has arranged an
extra fine program for the day.

OF

111

13 Farm Buildings
-- ON ---

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 6, 1928,
at 1 o'clock, sharp.

The undersigned will offer at public
sale on the premises situated % mile
south of state road and south of Edw.
Stuller's farm, 4 miles east of Taney-
town. These buildings being the
same that were sold by William T.
Phillips, sheriff of Carroll Co., Md. in
1925 to John M. Leppo against Wm.
H. Hann and Martha J. Hann, his
wife and to me directed, I seized all
the rights and titles.
No. 1. Corn crib, 8x6-ft. height, 9-ft

center ventilation.
No. 2 Closet 5%x4-ft.; high, 6-ft.
No. 3 Smoke House, 5x5; high 7-ft.
No. 4 Side building, frame, 2-story.

17%x101/2-ft.; 4 windows and side-
door; pine floors.
No. 5. 2-story log house, 24x17-ft.;

pine and oak floors, good; logs solid.
No. 6. Summer or brooder house,

good frame, 12x15-ft.; 10-ft. high.
No. 7. Poultry House, 18x8-ft.
No. 8. Poultry House, 15x8-ft.
No. 9. Poultry House, 25x12; 7-ft.

high, floor and 6 windows, good.
No. 10. Poultry House, 30x16%-ft.,

good; 7 windows.
No. 11. Poultry House, 20x16%-ft.,

good; 4 windows.
No. 12. Hog Pen, 11x8-ft.
No. 13. 2-story frame barn, frame

all full edged; siding chestnut. Would
make a good big wagon shed or large
hog house.
50 Locust and Chestnut posts.
14 Sash with glass, 12x20 all good.
Most of these buildings have been

erected since 1922. Anyone having
use for buildings will do well by at-
tending this sale.

Nos. 1, 2, 3 and 6 can be easy mov-
ed on truck as a whole.

Possession of moving buildings till
April 1st., 1929. Immediately after
the sale of buildings will offer the
land, 9% Acres more or less.
TERMS OF SALE.-All sums un-

der $10.00, cash. Sums above $10.00
note 6 month with interest. No
goods to be removed till settled for.

D. W. GARNER.
J. N. 0. SMITH, Auct.
JOS. HARNER, Clerk. 8-24-2t

Private Sale
Of a desirable property located in

Mayberry, Md. This is the property
owned by the late Ezra D. Stuller,
deceased, and will be sold by the Exe-
cutors, at private sale. Consisting of

3 ACRES OF LAND,

more or less; % Acre in Timber, im-
proved by 2%-story frame dwelling,
containing 4 rooms, pantry, basement

and cellar, front and rear porches full
length of house, stable and shed com-
bined; hog pen, poultry house, 2 car

garage, corn crib and smoke house,
good well of water at door.
These buildings are all under good

roofs and paint, located on hard road,

and close to Church, School and Store
convenience. Good fruit, electric line

by the door, and well adopted for

poultry or trucking. Possession April

1st., 1929. Apply to-

JOHN S. STULLER.
EDWARD E. STULLER,

8-24-3t Executors.
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Little Band-Wagon
Journeys

By L. T. MERRILL
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19.-The Final Struggle for
Slavery

A S THERE was no more important
American Presidential campaign

before or since, so there was none
that roused popular feeling to a high-
er pitch than that of 1860 when the
crucial issue of slavery was fought
out to a finish among four tickets.
Abraham Lincoln of Illinois had

been nominated by the Republicans.
The Democrats, split in two on the
slavery question, broke up their na-
tional convention, and two groups met
separately later. John C. Breckin-
ridge of Kentucky, Buchanan's vice
president and later a general and sec-
retary of war in the Confederacy, was
nominated for President by the ex-
treme prostaver3 faction of the Demo-
crats. Senator Stephen A. Douglas of
Illinois got the nomination of the
northern wing of the party.
A fourth group, an amalgamation

of elderly Whigs and Know-Nothings,
styling themselves the Constitutional
Union party, nominated John Bell of
Tennessee as a candidate of harmony
who w,uln have no notions and no
policy on the subject of slavery.
The canvass that ensued revived

some of the features of the famous
campaign of 1840. Log cabins, such
as were used in the Harrison cam-
paign, came back as symbols of the
humble origin of the Republican rail-
splitter candidate. Railsplitter em-
blems, rings and pins were popular.
Marching clubs took a prominent

part in enthusiastic and spectacular
torchlight processions. Northern Dem-

ocrats organized and paraded as Doug-
las Guards, Little Giants, Invincibles,
Ever-Readys. But most imposing were
the Republican Wide Awakes. In all
sections of the North they came to
adopt a fairly standard uniform, with
glazed hats and oil-cloth capes-a cos-
tume first affected by Hartford (Conn.)
marchers when they escorted Lincoln
on a visit he made to their city in
the spring of the election year. As
they swung along in the glare of
swaying torches, the Wide Awakes
sang:

"Oki Abe Lincoln came out of the
wilderness,

Out of the wilderness, out of the wil-
derness,

Old Abe Lincoln came out of the wil-
derness,
Down in Illinois."

Southerners were marching, too.
They organized companies of Breck-
inridge Minute Men. In some arts of
the South the impression spread that
the Northern Wide Awakes were a
military organization formed to sup-
port Lincoln by armed force. South
Carolina answered that fancied threat
by forming a secret society whose
members pledged themselves to arm
and march to Washington, if neces-
sary, to prevent the inauguration of a
"Black Republican" President.

Douglas, who had had close asso-
ciation with Southern leaders of his
party, appraised the seriousness of
the situation more truly than many
other Northerners.
"If the withdrawal of my name

would tend to defeat Mr. Lincoln," he
said in September, "I would this mo-
ment withdraw it."
Republican successes in the elec-

tions held in certain states during Oc-
tober confirmed the worst fears of
Douglas.
"Mr. Lincoln is the next President,"

he declared. "We must try to save
the Union."
Douglas, who had surprised his

friends and followers by taking the
stump in his own behalf, contrary to
the custom of the time for Presiden-
tial candidates, now canceled all fur-
ther engagements in his Northern
speaking tour and plunged into the
South in a desperate final attempt to
use the power of his eloquence to pre-
vent disruption of the Union. It was
an act of high redeeming statesman-
ship in a public career that had been
much shaped by expediency.
But in vain he pleaded that there

was no evil in the nation for which
the Constitution and "laws do not
furnish a remedy, no grievance that
can justify disunion." It was too late
to stem the tide of the inevitable.

Lincoln got 1,866,452 popular votes
and Douglas 1,375,157, with 847,953
for Breckinridge and 590,631 for Bell.
Seldom have the possible disparities

between popular and electoral votes
been so eccentrically demonstrated.
For while Lincoln had 180 electoral
votes, Douglas, who ran only a half
million behind him in the popular
poll, had just 12 electoral votes; while
Bell, with a total of fewer than 600,-
000 popular votes, had 39 electoral
votes. Seventy-two electoral votes
went to Breckinridge, whose popular
vote was less than two-thirds that of
Douglas.
Around their bonfires of victory in

the North, Republicans were singing
a new stanza of their campaign bal-
lad:

"Oh, ain't 1 glad I joined the Repub-
licans,

Joined the Republicans, joined the
Republicans,

Ain't I glad I joined the Republicans.
Down in Illinois."

Other crowds In the streets of South
Carolina towns were cheering a new
flag, red in color and bearing a pal-
metto and a star. The threat of se-
cession was beconi:ng an ominous fact.

Little Band-\VBand-W:4
Journeys

By L. T. MERRILL
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20.-The Wartime Election
of 1864

A S THE crucial wartime election
of 1864 approached, President

Lincoln was between two fires.
On the one hand were tile Demo

crats demanding a cessation of the
war and settlement around the con-
ference table, and blaming Lincoln's
administration for what was con-
strued to be too severe a policy
against the "copperheads."
At the other extreme were the

radical Republian faction, dissatistied
because they believed Lincoln's pol-
icy had not been vigorous enough, nor
the administration sentiment toward
the South sufficiently bitter.
Two unsuccessful generals were

brought forward to head election tick-
ets representing the respective dis-
satisfied elements.

Strangely enough, there was an-
other group, including such figures as
Horace Greeley, who while professing
to find Lincoln's administration satis-
factory, insisted even at such a crIti-
'cal juncture that no President ought
to be given more than one term, be-
cause none had been given two for
the last thirty years.

Lincoln, for his part, was willing to
,step aside if it seemed best for the
country. But his renomination by the
main body of Republicans was a fore-
gone conclusion. He had all but 22
votes of the Baltimore convention of
the party, styling itself the Union Na-
tional convention. Twenty-two Mis-
souri delegates wanted to nominate
General Grant, but switched their
votes to make the Lincoln choice
unanimous.
The platform demanded prosecu-

tion of the war to a finish and amend-
ment of the Constitution so that slav-
ery never could be re-established.
To help hold the loyalty of border

states and win over Democratic votes,
,Andrew Johnson, Democratic war-
,time governor of Tennessee, was made
Lincoln's running-niate. It was a
choice the party was to rue when
Johnson succeeded to the Presidency
.upon Lincoln's assassination.

' •
The radical Republicans, about 400

of them, met at Cleveland, nominated
Gen. John C. Fremont, and adopted a
severe platform. One of its demands
-was for confiscation of lands belong-
ing to Confederates, to be redistrib-
uted among Northern soldiers.
When Lincoln received reports of

.Fretnont's nomination and the Cleve-
land convention proceedings, he said
they reminded him of the Bible story
about the Cave of Adullam, to which
came "every one that was in distress.
and every one that was discontented
. . . and there were with him about
400 men."
The Democrats purposely delayed

their convention till late in August,
feeling that summer events on the
battlefield might further clarify the
political outlook. By the time they
assembled, Union -defeats in the war
together with imminent prospect of
another army draft, had Indeed
brought public feeling in the North to
a low ebb of discouragement. Peace-
at-any-price sentiment was gaining.

In late August the time was ripe
for Clement L. Vallandinghatn ot
Ohio, who once had been chased out
of the North for his defeatist maneu
vers, to recross the border from Can-
ada and, as a leading member of the
Democratic platform committee, to
give a strong peace-at-any-price tone
to the platform through a resolution
declaring that the war had been a
failure and that immediate efforts
must be made to bring about a cessa-
tion of hostilities.
To stand on this defeatist plank the

convention nominated Gen. George B.
McClellan, who had commanded the
Army of the Potomac. He refused to
stand there. Though accepting the
nomination, he vigorously repudiated
the Vallandingham plank, declaring
he could not look into the faces of t he
men he had led in the service and tell
them the sacrifices of their dead and
wounded comrades had been vain.
Northern military triumphs were al-

most immediately to make the peace
plank meaningless, anyhow. The ink
was hardly dry on McClellan's accept-
ance when the news came that Sher-
man had taken Atlanta, Farragut had
won the Battle of Mobile Bay, Sheri
dan had swept triumphantly through
the Shenandoah valley with his vic-
tories at Winchester and Fisher's
Hill.
The Republicans had been in deep

despair. Lincoln's advisers had been
telling him his defeat was almost cer-
tain. Convinced of the truth of their
gloomy prophecies, in late August he
had had his cabinet indorse a memo-
randum virtually promising to hand
the administration immediately over
to his successor, to save the Union, in
the event of Republican defeat at the
polls.
Then the tide suddenly turned. Mil-

itary victories heartened public senti-
ment. Fremont withdrew his candi-
dacy. The triumph of "Old Abe" over
"Little Mac" was assured.

But it was a close decision. Though
Lincoln had 212 electoral votes to 21
for the Democratic nominee, be ran
fewer than 500,000 votes ahead of Mc-
Clellan in a total popular vote of 4,-
000,000. A possible change of only
60,000 popular votes in a few strategic
or doubtful states could have reversed
the whole result and elected McClel-
lan.
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Painted Bricks Make
for Cellar Dampness

One of the biggest mistakes made
by home owners who have homes of
brick, or brickwork around their
houses, is to paint over this material.
If paint is put on bricks in a home

It may mean damp cellars. The tem-
perature of a cellar is seldom the
same as outdoors. In the summer It
is cooler and in the winter it is warm-
er. The difference in temperature on
either side of the bricks, added to the
fact that the larger part of the cellar
wall is beneath the ground, makes for
dampness within the basement.
Except after a beating rainstorm,

the outside of the bricks will not be
damp, because the constant circula-
tion of air outside dries them. Inside,
the air is more stagnant. The damp-
ness gathers on the bricks, and, as
bricks are porous, soaks into them.
If the bricks are unpainted this

dampness is drawn out of the bricks
on the outside, and evaporates, with a
resulting dry cellar. Paint these
bricks and the lead in the paint will
fill the pores of the bricks and pre-
vent the dampness from escaping from
the bricks to the outside, and that
will mean damp walls in the cellar.
It is far better to leave the bricks

their natural red and to know the
dampness of the cellar has some
means of being absorbed into the out-
er air.

City Dweller Finds
Comfort in Suburbs

The grand rush to the suburbs-
some of them ten miles out-is an irre-
pressible movement to restore "Home
Sweet Home"; the kind with a lilac
bush in the front yard and a place to
hang the wash in the back yard. The
old-fashioned ideal of home is not lost.
It has been hampered, but as soon as
city obstacles are removed-by easy
and rapid transportation to the coun-
try-the home is restored much as it
always has been.
The heart of man craves a little

loneliness, just a little; and the
suburbs afford it. It is not the loneli-
ness of the city where there is no
neighborly hobnobbing; but one which
may be broken voluntarily. Sociability
and segregation are nicely balanced.
You have as much as you want of
each, and when you desire repose, you
can withdraw beyond your own jon-
quils.
In the suburb one feels that the fam-

ily rooftree will last. It will not be
swept away by apartment hotels or
corner drug stores. It will be there
for the children. It will be there for
Thanksgiving and Christmas and wed-
dings, ay, arid funerals.-St. Louis
Globe-Democrat.

Brick's Good Qualities
In a building it is not possible to

have real beauty without strength.
The eye cannot be thoroughly satis-
fied if in the mind lurks the conscious-
ness that the architect's creation is
to be vanquished in the battle with
time. Time is powerless to mar th.e
beauty or to sap the strength of brick.
Generations may come and go, but the
sturdy brick walls of the homestead
stay on. Brick may reach a venerable
old age-it never reaches the state
of decrepitude. Brick comes from the
bosom of Mother Earth, in the form
of plastic clay; it is hardened by the
most powerful agency known in the
world-fire--and is 13-roof against the
further attacks of fire; it defies wind
and rain; it is as enduring as earth
itself.-Exchange.

Plain Preaching
Local people, boost your town; run

It up, instead of down.
Boosting Is the thing it needs if it

prospers and succeeds.
All its benefits are yours while your

dwelling here endures.
From a purely selfish view, boost-

ing is the thing to do.
But there's still another side-that

of having civic pride.
Citizens must every one lend a hand

and get things done.
Never knock; it doesn't pay; boost-

ing is the better way.
Do not kick, but boost, instead;

that's the way to get ahead.
This is how to build your town;

talk it up, but never down.-By the
Booster of the Tifton (Ga.) Gazette.

Cave Husband's Refuge
Eastbourne, England, can hardly

boast an interesting ecclesiastical his-
tory, and the most famous of its old-
time parsons seems to have been Jon-
athan Darby, says the London Post.
Parson Darby had been somewhat un-
fortunate in the choice of a wife, and
to repair the mistake sought peace for
study and meditation In a cave in the
cliff at East Dean. In this retreat he
stayed all the week, out of range of
Mrs. Derby's tongue, and issued forth
only on Sunday to conduct the service
In church.

To Develop the Arms
Stand erect, stretch your arms out

forward' and clench the fists tightly.
Holding your arms as stiff as possible,
bend wrists outward and inward 15
times, with precision of movement.
Next, holding your arms in the same
position and clenching the fists, twist
the forearms as far around as pos-
sible, first one way, then the other.
Repeat 15 times.

r ................•
; HOW
4, ONE'S VOCATION IN LIFE
+ MAY BEST BE DECIDED.-

: By experiment, research workers
are proving that the general in-
terests of men following the

t same vocations tend to be alike,
+ and that this group of interests

differs as widely from those men
in other callings as do the vo-
cations themselves. The general
prejudices of artists and per-
sonnel managers, for instance,

• have been proved to be almost
; diametrically opposite. There is
t apparently a distinct artist type
+ of mind, a doctor type, a per.
sonnet manager type, an engi-
neer type, quit aside from pro-
fessional differences.

+ Thus by recording and scor-
ing a man's likes and dislikes on
hundreds of miscellaneous sub-
jects, many psychologists now

t believe that they obtain an ob-
jective picture of his true inter-

+a ests.
e The theory is that one likes
; things one does easily. A man
+ therefore likes and succeeds in
+ an occupation in which the ma-

jority of his well-developed traits
may function and his poorly de-
veloped traits are not forced to
function. So the summary of
likes and dislikes of men in a
given occupation is probably a
summary measure of the traits
necessary for success in that oc-
cupation.-Thrift Magazine.

•
•
•
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How "Riot Act" Became
Part of Common Law,

"Reading the Riot act" was sug-
gested by the Riot act, which was
enacted by the British parliament in
1714 during the first year of the reign
of King George 1. Although laws had
been previously passed on the subject,
the Riot act was the first comprehen-
sive attempt to prevent or suppress
tumultuous, or riotous meetings. It pro-
vided that if twelve or more persons
were unlawfully assembled and dis-
turbing the peace, the sheriff, justice
of the peace, or mayor was commanded
to read the following proclamation in
their presence: "Our Sovereign Lord
the King chargeth and commandeth
all persons being assembled immedi-
ately to disperse themselves, and
peacefully depart to their habitations
or to their lawful business, upon the
pains contained in the act made in
the first year of King George for pre-
venting tumultuous and riotous assem-
blies. God save the King." If the per-
stuns refused to disperse and continued
together for an hour or more, they
were guilty of felony. Many of the
American states have enacted similar
laws. "To read the Riot act" literally
means to give notice to a crowd to
disperse under penalty of law. Popu-
larly it means to give warning, call
up for reprimand, or to rebuke se-

How Golf Clubs Are Made
The making of gulf clubs requires

the utmost care. The work is.general-
ty done under the close supervision of
a golf professional during the off sea-
son.

Various kinds of special woods are
used in .the clubs. Special second-
growth hickory is usually selected for
the shaft: It must be neither too
springy nor too stiff.

The new wood is sawed into square
sticks, which are picked over and over
again, then stowed away and seasoned
for two years before they are ready to
be turned and tapered and pointed to
perfection. Most of them are shaped
and smoothed and finished by hand.

The head is made of persimmon
wood.

How a Drop Falls
To watch a drop of water when it

falls is to attempt to penetrate tile
secret of fin obscure science, the law
which governs moving liquids.

Tile experiment best showing the
action of a falling drop may be made
by letting a drop of milk fall into
black coffee. When the drop falls a
crater forms around it and little
drops are projected from the edge of
the crater. After it has increased in
size and in thickness the crater low-
ers and widens its rolling brim, while
from the impact a liquid sphere, en-
veloped by the initial drop, collects
at the top of the column. Then the
column falls and disappears in the
center of a circular ripple of water.
-Washington Star.

How Pollen Is Carried
Two of nature's pollen carriers are

insects and wind, but in the forest
wind does by far the greater amount
of the work, says Nature Magazine.
The tree flowers having only stamens
shed their pollen, wither, and fall, but
from the seed-producing flowers grow
the fruits-keys of tile maples, sama-
ras:, of the elms, paddles of the ashes,
acorns of the oaks, the cone-like
winged seed beat•ers of the birches,
and the nuts of the hickories.

How Soap Is Wasted
The soap wasted by hard water

amounts to 17 pounds per 1.000 gal-
lons when water is 10 gt•ains hard per
gallon. This is estimated as an ex
pense of 70 cents. when it would cost
perhaps 2 cents per 1,000 gallons on
an average to soften such water.

How to Preserve Coconut
A coconut in its shell may be kept

almost. indefinitely if it is stored in a
cool place. It is not necessary to re-
move the nr:Ik.

'

MEDFORD PRICES
Children's Knit Caps, 10c each
Men's Winter Union Suits, 85c
Women's Winter Shirts or Drawers,

48c
Girls' Winter Coats, $2.98
9x12 Rugs, $3.15 each
Men's Overcoats, $'.98 each
Men's Sweaters, 98c
3 Rugs for 25c
Bed Blankets, 98c
Boys' Winter Shirts or Drawers, 15c
Boys' Union Suits, 48c
Men's Sheep Lined Work Coats, $6.98
Men's Work Coats, $1.98
Children's Bloomers, 121/2c
Men's Sweaters, 98c each
Women's Winter Coats, $1.98 each

Rain Coats, $2.25 each
Men's Cord Work Coats, $4.50
Sedan Tops, $3.98
Bed Room Slippers, 48c
Gasoline Irons, $1.65
Children's Sweaters, 48c each
Timothy Seed Bags, 20c each
Ash Sifters, 48c each
Coal Buckets, 39c
Wash Machines, $8.98
Ladies' Winter Hats, 39c
Clothes Baskets, 75o
Children's Hats, 10c each
Men's Shirts, 10c each
Galvanized Tubs, 39c
Spad Timers, 98c each
2 Bars Auto Soap for 25c

Child's Wash Suits, 39e
Pillows, 98c pair
Bed Mattresses, $4.98
Child's Bath Robes, 48c
Men's Linen Dusters, 39c
Women's Muslin Drawers, 10c pair
Women's Petticoats, 10c each
Bran, $1.75 bag
Cotton Seed Meal, $2.95 bag
Children's School Dresses, 48c
Lace Curtains, 98c pair
Towels, 5c each
Guns, $6.39 each
Boys' Knee Pants, 98c pair
Boys' School Suits, $3.98
Mattress Covers, $1.48 each
Ladies' Shirt Waists, 10c each

XXXX Sugar, lc lb
Romper Suits, 25c
Paper Collars, per boX 5c
Electric Irons, $1.98
Linen Collars, lc each
4 Jars Prepared Mustard, 25c
Bureaus, $13.35
6 Dining Chairs for $7.35
Rubber Collars, lc each
Girls' Shoes, 48c pair
2-horse Engines, $19.00
Vacuum Cleaners, $13.98
Women's Corsets, 39c
Women's Skirts, 39c each
Men's Suits, $4.98

Ribbon, 1c yard
Oak Lumber for sale, 2c ft
Overalls, 98c pr
Work Pants, 98c
Timothy Seed, $2.48 per bu
Barley, $1.00 per bushel
Children's Petticoats, 10c each
Horse Collar, $1.75
Bran, $1.75 per bag
Middlings, $2.35 per bag
Lime, $11.50 ton in 50-1b. paper bags
Dodge Guaranteed Batteries, $9.98
6 Bottles Vanilla for 25c
2-lbs. Peanut Candy for 25c

3 pr Men's Silk Hose, 25c
National Guaranteed Auto or Ra-

dio Batteries 6-11, fits nearly all cars
for $4.98
3-lbs. Seedless Raisins for 25c
2-lbs. Peanut Butter for 25c
9x12 Tapestry Rugs, $9.98
Child's Play Suits, 48c
Jar Tops, 25c dozen
Mason Pint Jars, 69c dozen
Mason Quart Jars, 79c dozen
Mason Half Gallon Jars, $1.09 dozen
Women's Shoes, 48c pair
Men's Shoes, 98c pair
Lot Nice Ribbon, lc yard
Garter Web, lc yard
Iron Fence Posts, 25c each

Rice, lc lb.
Salt Fish, 85c pail
Window Shades, 39c each
Gallon Can Syrup, 59c
3-1b. Box Crackers, 43c

Ajax Auto Oil, 29c gallon
Seed Wheat, $2.39 bu
Guns, $6.39
Lancaster Co. Seed Wheat for sale-
Ford repairs for sale
8x10 Glass, 39c doz
16% Dairy Feed, $1.85
24% Dairy Feed, $2.00
Boys' Suits, $1.98
Stock Feed Molasses, 16c gal
3 Cans Peas, 25c
Electric Irons, $3.98
Granulated Sugar, $5.75 bag
Men's Shirts, 48c

Carpet Binding, 1c yard
Balloon Tire Auto Jacks, 98c each
Galvanized Tubs, 39c each
Corsets, 39c each
Electric Power Wash Machines, $39
Ford Radiators, $7.98 each
25-lb. Box Dynamite, $4.75
50-1b. Box Dynamite, $9.50
Boys' Shirts, 25c each
Store Closes 6 o'clock every day
Wet Buttermilk, 4c lb
Dry Buttermilk, 10c lb
Ford Fan Belts, 10c each
14-1b. Bag Gold Medal Flour, $1.19
Floor Covering, 29c yd
24-1b. Bag Pillsbury, $1.25

House Paint, $1.69 gallon
Galvanized Roofing, $3.98 sq
Window Screens, 35c each
Pure Linseed Oil, House Paint, $2.98

per gallon
Strainer Discs, 59c box
6-113. Can Chipped Beef, $1.98
90-day Batteries, $4.98
18-month Batteries, $8.98
Allow 50c for old one
Auto Springs, 0.39 each
29x4.40 Balloon Tires, 1F3.98
30x5.25 Balloon Tires, $10.19
31x5.00 Balloon Tires, $7.98
31x5.25 Balloon Tires, $9.98
30x6.20 Balloon Tires, $17.98
32x6.00 Balloon Tires, $10.98
29x4.40 Balloon Tubes, $1.19
33x6.00 Balloon Tubes, $2.39
30x5.25 Balloon Tubes, $1.69
30x6.00 Balloon Tubes, $2.19
31x5.00 Balloon Tubes, *1.85
A. C. Spark Plugs, 33c
Bicycles, $19.75
3 Pairs Children's Hose for 25c
Clark's Cotton, 4c spool
Children's Shoes, 98c pair
Brooms, 29c each
Auto Springs, $1.39
Chevrolet Fan Belts, 25c
Coffee, 25c lb
12 Cans Tomatoes, 69c

Roofing Paint, 49c gallon
7-gallon Milk Cans, $2.39
71/2-gallon Milk Cans, $3.25-
10-gal. Milk Cans, $3.50
3 Blowout Patches, 25c
Carbide, $5.35 can
Chevrolet Radiators, $11.98
30x31/2 Tires, $2.98
30x31/2 Oversize Tires, $3.98
30x31/2 S. S. Tires, $5.48
31x4 S. S. Tires, $4.98
32x4 S. S. Tires, $6.48
33x4 S. S. Tires, $6.98
30x5 S. S. Truck Tires, $12.98
35x5 S. S. Tires, $27.50
32x41/2 S. S. Tires, 99c
30x31/2 Tubes, 79c
30x31/2 Oversize Tubes, 98c

31x4 Tubes, $1.29
32x4 Tubes, $1.39
33x4 Tubes, $1.49
30x5 Tubes, $2.49
32x41/2 Tubes, $2.75
3-lbs. Ginger Snaps for 25c
2-lbs. Macaroni, 25c
9x12 Rugs, $3.25
Cigars, 98c box
3 Large Boxes Corn Starch, 25c
All Cigarettes, $1.11 carton
Coal Oil, 11c gallon
Gasoline, 14c gallon, tax 4c
140-1b. Bag Coarse Salt, $1.25
Women's Hats, 39c each
3 Rim Flaps for 25c

Grain Bags, 20c each
9 Rolls Toilet Paper, 25c
Bathing Suits, 10c each
Medford Fertilizers growbiggercrops
Plow Shares, 59c
3 Pair Men's Silk Hose for 25c
Ford Fenders, 98c each
Women's Drawers, 10c
9x12 Rugs, $3.15 each

The Medford Grocery Co.,
MEDFORD, MARYLAND.

Prized by Numismatists
The Numismatist says: "From a

source believed reliable it is said that
live' nickels. in proof, of the Liberty-
_Item] type, dated 1913. were struck
mairly in that year. These are all the
genuine Liberty-head type dated 1913
that are known. None passed into cir-
culation 'rile five pieces were oh.
rained from the mint by a gentleman
who showed theni at the Detroit con
vention of m he A. N. A. in August.
1913. Nothing more was heard of them
until in December, 1923, when a gen
Ileman living in Philadelphia adver
ised in the Numismatist as follows:

'For sale, five 5-cent Liberty-head
1913 coins. proof, the only five-cent
Liberty-head coins of this design and
year in existence.' These were un
doubtedly the five referred to. There
is no record of the whereabouts of the
preser:t owner of these (-ohms."

Gave America Its Name
America is a name first applied with

little wat•rant to what is now North
and South America by Martin Walde-
seemuller, a young geographer of St.
Die, a town in the Vosges mountains.
In a Latin work, "Costuographiae In-
trocluctio," which Waldeseemuller
edited in 1507, he used the name
"America" in honor of Amerigo Yes-
pueci, whose narrative of the latter's
voyage of discovery in the New world
Waldeseemuller had read. "Because
Americus discovered it," Waldeseemul-
ler wrote, "it ought to be called the
land of Americus or Arnet•ica."

Parrots at School
A parrot school consisting of 1,500

pupils and having two terms a year
is run by Mr. \V. A. King, of Browns-
ville, Texas. The birds come from
Mexico and Central America and are
taught to speak English. During
school hours they sit on perches ris-
ing in tiers. Each class is provide I
with a gramophone with records con-
taining different kinds of sentences.
The term lasts about three months..

Examinations are held once a week
and each bird is carefully graded. If
a bird lags behind in its lessons it is
placed in a separate class and given
special training, and if at the end of
six weeks a parrot has not learned
to say the required number of expres-
sions or sentences it is "expelled."-
London Tit-Bits,

The World's Water
The amount of water on the earth.

is so large that the human mind can:
scarcely grasp its significance. Ac-
cording to scientific authorities, it is
327,000,000 cubic miles. Rivers and
lakes in all countries only total a
mere million cubic unites, the remain-
ing 326,000,000 miles being taken up.
by the five great oceans-Atlantic, Pa-
cific, Indian, Antarctic and Arctic..
Scientists tell us that if the earth
were not composed of huge mquntain
ranges-which project above the sur-
face of the oceans, and thus form the
countries in which we live-our globe
would be covered with water to a
depth of nearly two miles.



• Tied Uniform International

SuldaySchool
Lesson'

(By It e..V 117. \k A l'hIft I/ a.. Dean
Nloody Bible Institute nf ('hicago.)

e12A Western Newst,nr Union.)
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PAUL PREACHING IN THESSALON•

ICA AND BEREA

LESSON TEXT-Acts 11:1-15; I Thess.

5:12-23; Romans 15:18-20
GOLDEN TEXT-The entrance of thy

words giveth tight.
P7.151 A R Y TOPIC-Pa u 1 Finds New

Friends and Foes.
JUNIOR TOPIC-Paul Finds New

Friends and Foes.'
INTERMEDIATE AND SENIOR TOP-

IC-Paul's Use of the Scriptures.

YOUNG PEOPLE AND ADULT TOP-

IC-Paul. Organizer of Churches.

I. Preaching in Thessalonica (Acts

17 :1-10).
His method (vv. 1, 2).

He observed the divine order, "to

the Jew first," but whenever they

proved themselves unwort io h. turned

to the Gentiles. Ile went out fl the

Sabbath day so as to find them as-

sembled together.
2. His message (v. 3).

It was that Jesus is the Christ. In

order to prove that .lesus is the Christ,

he expounded unto them the Scrip-

tures. Concerning Christ he set forth

three propositions:

(1) "That Christ must needs have

Suffered" (v. 3).
The suffering Christ was not wel-

comed by the Jews (Ise. 53). They

were looking for a Messiah of a dif-

ferent type.

(2) "Risen from the dead" (v. 3).
This He proved by the Scriptures.

The resurrection ot Christ and the

bodily resurrection ot believers need

sound and practical exposition temlay.

(3) "That this Jesus, whom I preach

unto you, is Christ."
He declared that the historic Jest's

whom lie had pr (bullied had suf-

fered and risen from the dead, there-

fore He is the predicted Messiah

3. The attitude of the Jews toward

his preaching (vv. 4-10).

While some Jews believed and many

Greeks, the envy of certain Jews was

so aroused at Paul's success that they
gathered together the worthless fel-

lows of the town and created a riot.

They turned the preaching of Paul into

a specious lie. He preached the king

ship of Jesus (v. 7). Jesus is most as.
suredly coming to reign on this earth.

II. What He Preached at Thessa•

lonica (I Thess. 5:13-2(1).

He corrected certain doctrinal er-

rors which had crept into the church.

1. They were not to sorrow unduly

(v. 13).
Because they failed to- understand

the meaning of Paul's preaching con-

cerning the coining of the Lord they

were indulging in excessive sorrow.

They seemed to think that their loved

ones who had (lied would miss the

blessings and glory connected with the

return of the Lord.
2. The events associated with the

Lord's coming (vv. 13-18).

In this section he gives the reasons

why they were not to allow them-

selves to be overwhelmed with grief.

(1) The departed saints will come

back when Jesus comes (v. 14).
Immediately following the death of

believers their spirits go to he with

the Lord where they remain in the
state of blessedness until the Lord

shall return to this earth, bringing

them with Him.
(2) The bodies of the dead in Christ

shall come frem the grave (v. 16).
When the Lord comes there will be

a real resurrection of the dead in
Christ, before the change of the bodies
of living belie‘ers.
(3) Living believers will be caught

up together with those who have been
resurrected (v. 17).

3. The time of the Lord's coming is
unknown (3:1-11). We are commanded
to he ready, to watch.

III. Paul Preaching in Berea (Acts
17:10-15).

1. His method (v. 10).
He entered tile Jewish synagogue

and preached Christ.
2. The reception of the Gospel by

the Bereans (vv. 11, 12).
(1) They received the message

(2) They searched the Scriptures
daily for the truthfulness of the mes-
sage which they had heard.

3. The wicked action of the Jews
(vv. 13-15).

Wicked Jews from Thessalonlca fol-
lowed the missionaries and stirred up
the people against them, making it
necessary for them again to flee.

IV. Paul's Manner of Preaching
(Rom. 13 :18-20).

Wherever he went In tile Gentile
world he preached salvation through
faith in Christ. God accompanied his
ministry with mighty signs and won-
ders, with the object of making the
Gentiles obedient to the Gospel. Paul's
aim was to preach in new fields so
as not to bifild on the foundation of
another.

Jesus and Preaching
Jesus chose preaching as the meth-

od of extending the knowledge of
Himself throughout the world. He
taught His truth to a few men, and
then He said, "Now go and tell that
truth to other men."-Phillips Brooks.

At the Door
"Behold, I stand at the door, and

knock : If any man heat My voice,
and open the doer. I will come In to
him, and will sup with him, and ire
with My. • -Rev 3:20.

Girl of Ccntzzry Ago
and Today Compared

We look back with amazement mei

pity at the woman of 1828, it is said,

but, says the London Daily News, we

look with admiration also, for it is

out of their dreaming and striving

that our freedom has come. l'oor Miss

1828 offers a striking contrast between

the young winnen of that day and

.those of the present year.
Look at her standing there in her

stuffy thick clothing, her hideous

frilled "pelisse" with its puffed sleeves,

her face hidden by an ungainly flap-

ping, bonnet "as large as an umbrel-

la." Silo has been grounded in the
principles of religion and morality.

Her heao is stuffed with Mangnall's
questions, her fingers are sore with

working szsumplers," her body is stiff

with that s: range cult known as "de-

portment."
She is just sixteea years old and

ready to "come out" to a life of so-

cial .and domestic inanition. When

she dances, it is to pace soberly

through the measures of a minuet or

the quadrilles, for she has not yet

been introduced to the "sprightly

polka" or the glamorous waltz. Lit-

tle wonder that she breaks the mo-

notony of her days by occasional fits

of hysteria or a graceful swoon.

She had her vanities, poor dear-

her looks were one of her few inter-

ests. She was .as frightened'of corpu-

lence as is her modern sister. Rosy,

fresh cheeks were considered common,

and she deprived herself of adequate

food for fear of growing fat and "ma-

terial."

Greenland, Long Ago,
Colonized by Danes

Greenland was originally colonized

by Scandinavians, about the year 1000,

but the colony dwindled and became

extinct shortly before 1500, owing

chiefly to the inroads of the Eskimo.

The existing Danish colony was es-

tablished in 1721. The aborigines, says

the Smithsonian institution, are all

of U. Jim. stock and number altogeth-

er sismt 11,000, including a very large

propeisiob of mixed bloods, who, as a

rule, adhere to Eskimo customs Lino

langts ss.e.
os; number seems to be consider-

ably higher than in 1721, but the dif-

ference is largely, if not entirely, to

be accounted for by the increase of

the mixed-blood stock from European

intermarriage.

Theory of Arrhenius
Svante August, Arrhenius, the noted

Swedish chemist and physicist, be-

lieves that life is an interstellar ele-

ment and may be transmitted front

one slatmet .to another. According to

ctsiception, life is universally dif-

fused :mud is constantly emitted from

all IsSmitable worlds in the form of

sporcs. These spores traverse space

for years, and possibly ages. Tile ma-

jority of them are ultimately de-

stroyed by the heat of some blazing

star, but some few, he thinks, find a

resting place on bodies which have

alissmily reached the habitable stage.

Life, according to Arrhenius, may al-

so be transmitted from one heavenly

bo:ly to another by means of meteors.

-Pathfinder Magazine.

Historic Edifice
Kenilworth castle is in Warwick-

shire, England. It has figured promi-

nently in the history of the country.

In 1575 it was the scene of 19 days'
entertainment of Queen Elizabeth by

the earl of Leicester. The walls
originally inclosed an area of 7 acres.

The principal portions of the building

remaining are the gatehouse, now used

as a dwelling house; Caesar's tower,

the only portion built by Geoffrey de

Clinton now extant, with massive walls

16 feet thick; the Merwyn's tower of

Scott's "Kenilworth"; the great hall,

built by John of Gaunt, with windows

of very beautiful design, and the

Leicester buildings, which are in a
very ruinous condition.

Purist Enters Objection
An indignant purist, says the St.

Paul Pioneer Press, line publicly tak-

en to task a prominent Oregon attor-

ney for using the quotation, ascribed

to William Congreve, a dramatist of
the Eighteenth century: "Hell bath

no fury like a woman scorned." He
says- that there is no such language in

Congreve or anywhere else. The ex-
act quotation is: "There is no rage
like love to hatred turned, nor hath
hell a fury like a woman scorned."
This is one of such almost innumer-
able popular modifications of literature
which, despite the rage of the purist,
continue in use.

Silver in Olden Days
Whatever the difference in mechan-

ical aspects, in many respects our
modern life parallels closely the lives
of the ancients. The noble and aris-
tocratic Egyptians and Greeks had an
exquisite appreciation of the niceties
of life. One of their most cherished
treasures was their sterling silver,
which they had in abundance and from
which they drank and feasted. It was
their accredited tableware as It was
of the nobles of the Roman empire.
Cups and vessels of this precious
metal have come down to us through
the ages in a perfect state of preser-
vation.

Two Greatest Virtues
Education is what enables some peo-

ple to get along without intelligence.
Intelligence is what enables some peo-
ple to get along without education.
A few men possess both virtues; these
constitute our real leaders.-GriL

om-nrunit)
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Choose Best Time to
Mahe Home Alterations

Repair work and new construction
should be classed separately for a
number of reasons. Repair work of a
minor character is usually paid for on
a time basis; that is, the owner pays
a fixed rate per hour for the services
of the men engaged. When this is
done during a period of inactivity in
a given trade the most efficient work-
ers are ordinarily available, and they
are able to do a better job in less
time than less skilled men who might
perform the work during an active

• period.
Home owners from time to time em-

ploy building trades workers to do
outside and interior painting, to put
on new roofs, to make alterations and
additions to plumbing systems, 'to
overhaul and repair the heating ap-
paratus and to do interior remodeling,
such as changing partitions and lay-
ing tile floors in bathrooms. They also
require grading of grounds, the con-
struction of driveways and erection
or enlargement of garages and other
outbuildings. Then there are side-
walk repairs, laying of concrete or
masonry floors in the cellars, water-
proofing, replacing awnings and
screens and repairs to exterior wood-
work. The time chosen by the owner
for such work is of importance to
himself and to the community and
bears a close relation to the general
cost of living.

Cities Now Recognize

Need of Playgrounds
Although in the last quarter of a

century the United States has passed
from a predominantly rural people to
a predominantly urban people, the av-
erage American is "an outdoor ani-
mal."
As proof of this statistics show that

711 American cities today offer play-
grounds and recreation as a natural
and usual function of government, and
the profesSion of play leader, or recre-
ation director, numbers almost 16,000
persons.

Municipal playgrounds, parks, audi-
toriums, stadia, bathing beaches, golf
courses, opera and radio are to be
found everywhere, and public recre-
ation is about the last word in ths
evolution of positive functions sf ssss
eminent for the promotidn of the
piness of citiz('ns.

Home Ownership
As a trractical proposition home

ownership should appeal to every
family. When It is considered that
approximately one-third of our life
is spent in the home It is readily
obvious that home Is of paramount
importance. Paying rent, it has been
pointed out, is purchasing a home but
It is purchasing it for the other fellow.
Money paid out in rent over a period
of years represents home ownership
to some one. Modern methods devel-
oped in purchase plans have made It
possible for the average person to
eventually own a home with practi-
cally the same monthly outlay that
would be required as rent. In pur-
chasing a home one should be careful
not to undertake a proposition beyond
their means.

Preserve Highway Beauty
Action to preserve the beauty of the

highways in San Luis Obispo county,
California, has been taken by the
board of county supervisors in the
passage of an ordinance prohibiting
the erection of signs and billboards
along the county highways. Exception
is made for legal notices and recog-
nized direction signs for tourists,
while signs will not be permitted on
fences, trees, or on buildings helot:g-

ing to the county. Fines provitSsd
r?tnge from $25 to $200 or imprism.e-
merit for not more than 50 days, -sr
both, for violations.

First Sheep in America
Sheep were introduced from Mereo

into tile portion of the country now
known as Texas at a very early date.

In 1872 Mexican sheep were brougSt

in numbers into the state, but at tys
time the industry was not prosperomss.

In a report of the Department of Ag-

riculture for 1892 it was stated that
In a short period of 24 years the in-

dustry had developed to a great extent,

and that the yield of wool per head

had increased from 2.68 pounds to 6.8
pounds. This indicated that the in-

dustry was established before 1872.

Food Pilgrims Brought
The food that was brought over on

the Mayflower consisted of bacon,

hard-tack, salt beef, herring, cheese,

beer or ale. For luxusies they car-

ried butter, vinegar, mustard and per-

haps lemons and prunes. About 1630

the food of the colonists consisted of

fish and game, oysters, clams and mus-

sels, beans, pumpkins, peas, squash,

turnips, parsnips, onions, apples and

pears, grapes and huckleberries. Cran-

berries were not tlmen known.

Patent Office Busy
Every year !mire than 80A)00 appli-

cations are made for patents in the

United States, of which amount one-
half are granted. The number of ap-
plications has doubled in the lust 25
years. Abont 1,500.000 patents have
been granted during the history of the

Ualted States patent office. No other
country approaches thet record.

FAR Q U HAR
POTATO DIGGERS
For Large and Small Growers •-•
The Farquhar Elevator Digger contains every

modern device for rapid, clean digging. Puts the
potatoes in a neat compact row, ready for easiest and
quickest handling. They have been proven right by
-the hardest kind of field operation.
The Farquhar is the original rigid tongue digger-

can be backed, held over the row when digging on
hillside-and is light of draft. Built with broad front
roller or two wheel front truck. May be equipped with
level or hillside cleats; also road rim.

We also biild the "Success Junior," the plow
type digger for the smaller grower-the

farmer's choice. Illustrated Catalog,
describing both types of diggers, sent

to any grower.

The
"Success
Junior"
for the
small
grower

Harrows
Harrow-Rollers
Lime Sowers
Distributors
Cultivators

Shovel Plows
Weeders
Sprayers

Corn Planters
Corn Shellers

THE FARQUFIAR LINE:
Grain Drills Potato Planters

Potato Diggers
Transplanters
Threshers
Hay Balers

Cider Presses)
Engines
Boilers

Dairy Boilers
Sawmills

Traction Engines

"NON-WRAP" Manure Spreaders

Farquhar Pumps crncl Water Systems.
for Suburba-n and _Country Homes.

A.E3.FARQUHAR CO.LIMIT-ED
Largest Manufacturers of Agricultural Machinery in the East

Box 225 YORK, PENNSYLVANIA

Care of Oak Floors is Simple

By LEMIRA BEALE

Noted Interior Decorator

0AK floors so beautify the inter-
ior of any home that in many

of the great estates they are treated
with the care of a family heirloom.

In the famous palaces of Fon-
tainebleau and Versailles; in the
White house at Washington, in
many of the great art galleries of
this country and Europe, oak floors
enrich the beautiful interiors.
The same floors may be laid in

the average home at hardly any
greater cost than inferior substi-
tutes. Better still, the average
housewife can perpetuate the
beauty of her oak floors easily, if
she knows how.
In searching for the simplest

way of caring for oak floors many
housewives have adopted methods
that experts on floor finishes know
are ruinous to the rich gloss that
characterizes these floors.

Easily Cared For

The care of oak floors is simple
if all the wrong methods be avoid-
ed. Never use water, oil, kerosene,
turpentine, soap or other alkaline
cleansing agents.

If water has been spilled upon
the floor and it has turned white
in places, moisten a soft cloth with
a little alcohol and lightly rub the
spots, which should immediately

disappear. Do not repeat this oper-
ation too often, however, or the
finish will be entirely removed.
Shellacked floors sometimes take
on a clouded or grayish appearance
due to dampness in the air. This
condition can usually be greatly
improved by the same treatment
described above. If the finish has
become so dirty that it is necessary
to remove it entirely, first scrub
the floor with wood alcohol and
then bleach it with oxalic acid-
never use lye as it turns the wood
black and ruins the surface per-
manently. After all moisture has
evaporated the original finish may
be- applied.

Replacing Finish

If the finish has become badly
worn, thoroughly scrub it with a
brush and Sapolio and water
(never flood the floor). After it
has dried out, apply a thin coat of
varnish; or in case time cannot be
allowed for the varnish to dry, wax
may be substituted. Do not use
shellac on top of old varnish or
varnish on top of old shellac.

Waxed floors should be dusted
daily with a broom covered with
canton flannel. Keep a can of wax
on hand, and should the finish be-
come worn in the doorways or
elsewhere, apply a thin coat, rub-
bing well into the wood. Allow
the wax to dry for one hour and
then polish thoroughly. Before re-

waxing the floor, scrub it thor-
oughly with turpentine and a piece
of cheese cloth.
In finishing the floor, either wax

or varnish may be used. The wax
finish is preferred by many due to
its economy and ease in renewing
spots that show wear.

Best Method of Waxing

The best method of applying the
wax is to take cheesecloth and
double it, then fold into a sort of
bag. Put a handful of wax inside
and go over the floor thoroughly.
The wax works through the
meshes of the cheesecloth and
coats the floor evenly. After dry-'
ing for about 20 minutes, it is,
ready for polishing. Rub to a pol-
ish with a weighted floor brush,
first across the grain of the wood,
then with it. Then place a piece
of woolen felt under the brush to
give the finishing gloss. After
waiting an hour a second coat of
wax should be applied in the same
manner and rubbed to a polish.

Varnish finish is more expensive
than wax, but it gives a very hard
surface which at the same time is
elastic. One or two coats should
be applied after the paste filler.

When a high class finish is not
desired, an economical one may be
obtained by the use of light floor-
ing oil. It serves as a filler as well
as a finish.

Silver Utensils Once
Prerogative of Rank

In the early days of civilization

sterling silver was restricted to royal-

ty and the nobility. In fact, we are
told that at one peridd of England's
history the number of sterling silver

spoons and suchlike one could own

were actually restricted and governed
by statute. One could almost recon-

struct time regulatory table-one lord,
one spoon; one duke, four spoons;

one princess, one chest, and so on.

Sterling was displayed upon all cere-
monial occasions and these aristo-
crats of a far past day treasured

their silver to as great an extent as

the young bride of today.
Five hundred years ago, with the

advent of the Florentine republic, a
new era began. Foreign commerce
brought wealth to men of lesser 'sink.
who established magnificent homes
and (Bled them with works of art

and bcant y, chief' :Romig which Watt

sterling. Today sterlisng silver con-
tinues to be the inevitable tableware
for the person of discrimination. Its
use is not confined to the royal
houses. nor even to the tables of the
wealthy. It is available for every
home of taste and moderate means.

"Eird and f ish" Story
by Truthful Angler

"Several years ago one of my
friends was strip-casting vvith frogs
at night." relates Seth Briggs in Field
iitul Stream Magazine. "Ile made a
cast ot ahout sixty feet, started to
retrieve his line. and feeling a tug
struck herd. There was considerable
commotion on the end of the line, and
suddenly the fisherman became very

much excited. 'My line's going right
up in the air.' he shouted.
"Strange as this sounded, it was

true. The line had Indeed traveled
from the surface of the water to a

posit i'ti id most directly overhead.
Tile fisherman mammged to get hold of
the et., of the line. and dropping his
rod he started to haul in hand over
hand In an anitizingl short space of
time there was another occupant in
the boat. It proved to be a night
heron. hich hail nailed the frog."
Which only proves that almost any-
thing may happen on a fishing trip!"

Mean'ng of the Name Ida
Ida and Ada are practically synony-

mous. In early times, however, Ada
was believed to be derived from Adah,
meaning ornament, and the name
Ada!) was given to the wife of Lamech
in the Old Testament. But later ety-
mological authorities believe that Ada
Is merely a Latinized form of Ead,
meaning happy or rich, and the same
as the German Ida. Ida's gem is the
turquoise.
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TANEYTOWN LOCALS
p.

Items of news from town, or vicinity are
always wanted for this column. Especial-

accidents, sales of real estate, fires, im-
portant happenings, visits to or from the
eommunity social events, and all matters
of general interest to those at home, and
away from home.

Mrs. Earl Ecker is very ill at the
Frederick City Hospital. No visitors
allowed at present.

Mrs. Doty Robb attended the wed-
ding of Miss Myrtle Smith, at Quak-
ertown, Pa., Monday.

• Miss Carrie Mourer, of Westmin-
ster, visited at Mr. and Mrs. Robert
Clingan's, on Sunday.

Robert S. Reindollar and family,
Fairfield, Pa., visited at Harry I.
Reindollar's, on Sunday.

Dr. R. F. Wells has purchased the
brick dwelling property, on York St.,
from Raymond Ohler, and will occupy
it next Spring.

Rev. Paul L. Foulk, of Clarksburg,
W. Va., was a recent caller at the
home of his uncle and aunt, Martin
Conover and wife.

Col. Upton Birnie, wife and daugh-
ter, Margaret, of Washington, are
spending a vacation of several weeks
at Miss Amelia Birnie's.

Mrs. Chas. Sullivan, of near Cop-
perville, was taken to the Frederick
City Hospital, for treatment for a
goiter. She is improving.

Mr. David Mehring and Mr. and
Mrs. Harold Mehring spent the week-
end with Dr. and Mrs. Wilbur Meh-
ring, at Silver Springs, Md.

Prank Bentz and wife, their son
and daughter, and Kelly Harris with
his son and wife, all of Hagerstown,
visited Mrs. N. B. Hagan, on Sunday.

Be sure to attend the baseball
game, Saturday afternoon, at 2:30
between Taneytown and Westminster,
on the Taneytown High School
ground.

The open season for hunting doves
and squirrels commences this Satur-
day, and lasts until Sept. 30, inclu-
sive; then opens Nov. 10 to Dec. 31,
inclusive.

Mrs. Eugene Shoop and four chil-
dren, of Baltimore, spont some time
with Mrs. S.'s frotlwx and sister, Mrs
Jennie Clingan and Mrs. Geo. Rodg-
ers, near town.

The county ambulance will be in
Taneytown. this Saturday evening,
for one hour, for inspection, ,likely
from about 6 to 7 o'clock, but we are
not sure about the time.

We can now supply handsome col-
ored desk blotters, at a reasonable
price. See first-page announcement.
Particularly suitable for making up
into Christmas novelties.

Mr. and Mrs. M. Ross Fair and
daughter, Anna Mae,and Mr. and Mrs.
Franklin Fair, spent Sunday in
Washington, D. C., sight-seeing and
also called on Mr. and Mrs. Charles
Watson.

The supper at Piney Creek Presby-
terian Church, Wednesday, Sept. 5,
which will have ham broiled over the
coals, as its piece de resistance, will
include chicken with the other good
things.

Mr. and Mrs. Samuel H. Little, of
Bustleton, Philadelphia, called on a
few friends, last Sunday while pass-
ing through town. Both are looking
well. Mr. Little is operating a suc-
cessful printing business, in Bustle-
ton.

Firemen who have no way to get
to the picnic to be held in the Birnie
Grove, Monday, Sept. 3, will find ways
arranged for them by being at the
Firemen's Building between the hours
12:30 to 1:30 and from 5 to 5:30.
Supper will be served in grove at
5:45 to 6:45.

Chas. H. ("Abie") Stonesifer, a
former employee of Jas. H. Reindol-
lar's Coach shop here, some twenty-
five years ago, paid Taneytown a vis-
it, on Monday, on his way to his home
in Waynesboro, where he has a work-
shop of his own. His work is mostly
auto tops, and he is doing well.

One of the gratifying experiences
at our office, during this very hot and
oppressive summer, has been the grat-
ifying number of new subscriptions
received and the very numerous re-
newals of old subscriptions. This is
the time of year when all papers ex-
pect an increase to the "dropped" list,
and we feel that we are approaching
the close of it very satisfactorily.

Those who spent Thursday evening
last week, at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Walter W. Hilterbrick and fam-
ily, were: Rev. and Mrs. Geo. W. Eng-
lar, D. D., Pittsburgh, Pa.; Dr. and
Mrs. Jesse Englar and sons, Maurice
and Fred, Mr. and Mrs. Herman
Englar and son, Daniel, Westminster;
Joseph Weishaar, Fairfield; Mrs. Ida
Weishaar and son, Carroll, and Miss

.1Laura Smith, near Union Bridge;
-s Grace Marquaret, Tyrone, and

ThAela Shank, Taneytown.

Mrs. Martha Fringer, who was very
ill, is slightly improved, at this writ-
ing.

Mrs. Harry Feeser, Jr., spent Sun-
day and Monday with friends in Hag-
erstown.

Miss Mary Fink, of near town, was
taken to the Frederick City Hospital,
last Saturday.

Misses Betty Ott, and Jean Frailey
were guests at a party given by Tom
and Edw. Combs, of Emmitsburg.

Miss Virginia Ott entertained a
porch party, on Tuesday evening, in
honor of Miss Helen Roop, of York.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Elliot, Mrs.
Geo. Arnold and Mrs. Chas. Kuhns,
spent Monday with friends in York.

Mrs. T. M. Buffington spent from
Sunday until Thursday, in Baltimore,
with her daughter, Mrs. Lutie Yohe.

On Tuesday, Mrs. George Harner
was hostess at a Bridge luncheon
given at Johnson's Inn, to twenty-
four guests.

Miss Frances Rowe, nurse of the
Burnett Sanitarium, Fresno, Cal., was
a guest of Mr. and Mrs. Samuel C.
Ott, recently.

Misses Ethel Harner, Littlestown,
and Vada Lemmon, left Sunday on a
two weeks visit to Wm. Holman and
family, at Speonk, N. Y.

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Shanebrook
and two daughters, near Gettysburg,
spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. Wm.
J. Stover and family, near town.

Mr. and Mrs. David E. Lemmon
and family, of Pittsburgh, Pa., spent
the week-end with the former's par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Geo. W. Lemmon.

Mrs. Roy B. Garner and sons, John
and Fred, spent several days last
week in Washington. While there
Fred had his tonsils removed at a hos-
pital.

Mr. and Mrs. Mahlon Stonesifer,
near Ernmitsburg; Mrs. Josiah Wantz,
Harney; and Mrs. Alma Newcomer,
of town, spent Sunday with Dr. and
Mrs. G. Lewis Wetzel, at Union Mills.

Mr. and Mrs. Norval P. Shoemaker,
entertained at dinner on Monday eve-
ning, Mr. and Mrs. Andrew Bigham
and family, New Oxford; Mr. and Mrs.
Norval Shoemaker, Jr., and family,
Marysville, Pa.

Those who spent Sunday with Mrs.
Chas. Sullivan, at Frederick, were:
Chas. Sullivan and daughter, Romaine
Mrs. Mary Lockner and daughter,Mil-
dred, Mr. and Mrs. Jacob Hess and
son, Charles, all of near Otterdale.

The Taneytown-Keymar road has
been rebuilt from Keymar to Bruce-
ville bridge; while the Taneytown end
has been helped a little by scarifying.
It looks as though this is all the work
that will be done on this read this
year.

Thelma, daughter of Mr. and Mrs.
Harry Anders, near town, who was
operated on at the Annie Warner hos-
pital, Gettysburg, for the removal of
tonsils and adenoids, Tuesday, has
returned home, and is getting along
very nicely.

Mr. and Mrs. Luther Zimmerman,
of town; Mr. and Mrs. Harry Freet,
near town, spent Sunday with Mr.
and Mrs. Geo. Albaugh, at New Mid-
way. Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Al-
baugh, of near town, spent Sunday
evening at the same place.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles E. Keefer en-
tertained at dinner Friday evening,
Aug. 24th., the following: Mr. and
Mrs. Cyrus Leppo, Mrs. Elizabeth
Keefer, of Mayberry; Mrs. Cora Hoff,
of Hagerstown; Mr. and Mrs. John
Price and children, Ralph and Doro-
thy; Mrs. Charles Bostion, daughter
and son, Helen and Alton.

Miss Grace Witherow returned to
the home nf her parents, on Thursday
from a tour which included Niagara
Falls, New York, Toronto, Canada,
and Harrisburg, Pa. While in Toron-
to, Miss Witherow attended the Cana-
dian National Exhibition and from
there took a cruise through the
Thousand Islands of the St. Lawrence
river.

Mr. and Mrs. Wm. T. Kiser,
Eleanora and George Kiser, Mr. and
Mrs. John Harmon, Mr. and Mrs.
Frank Harmon and son, Frank; Frank
Ohler, all of Taneytown; Mr. and Mrs.
Robert Imhoff and daughter, Ruth
and son, Robert, of Mt. Washington;
Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Malkens, of Hol-
lins Station, were guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Leon Tanner, of Lake Roland,on
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Joseph W. Brown re-
turned, on Tuesday, after visiting
their sons, Omer and Howard in Kane,
Pa. They left home Aug. 10th., ac-
companied by Howard Brown and
wife, and were accompanied on their
return from Kane to Chambersburg
by C. Earl Brown, wife and sons,
Bobby and Jack, whom they also vis-
ited. They found the weather much
cooler in Kane, it being a very high
altitude.

Carroll County schools will open
next Monday, Labor Day.

Mrs. Jacob Strawsburg and Miss
Mildred Wantz, of near town, spent
the week-end with the former's
daughter, Mrs. Wm. Perago, at York.

The little son of Dr. and Mrs. Lewin
Hitchcock, Westminster, who was re-
moved to a Baltimore hospital a few
days ago suffering with infantile pa-
ralysis, is dead.

Wilson F. Crepps, died at his home,
in Custar, Ohio, on Tuesday of this
week, in his 80th. year. He was a
brother of the late Mrs. Tobias Reid,
and was a former resident of Littles-
town, Pa.

Monday, Sept. 3, (Labor Day) the
ruin] carriers will not go over their
routes. The Postoffice will only be
open for the dispatch of mails—mon-
ey order window will be closed during
entire day.—Harry L. Feeser, P. M.

Something went wrong with the
honey bee population of Taneytown,
last Sunday, as there was a pretty
general unrest among the little fel-
lows, both where there were hives and
where there were not. The commo-
tion kept up from early morning un-
til afternoon. It was like a swarming
time, and the bees were not in a
stinging humor, but they were noisy,
very active and seemed to have some
unusual disturbance on hand.

New books for the public library:
"The House without a Key," Earl
Derr Biggers; "Emily Climbs," L. M.
Montgomery; "The Big Mogul," Jos.
Lincoln; "The Forbidden Trail," Hon-
ore Willsie; "Padlocked," Rex Beach;
"The Blue Castle," L. M. Montgomery;
"Child of the North," Ridgewell Cul-
len; "Lindbergh," Geo. Buchanan
Fife; "Afternoon" Suzan Ertz; "The
Man from Smiling Pass", Elliot Roin-
stan; "In a Shantung Garden," L.
Jordan Miles; "Court of Inquest,"
Grace Richmond; "Turn of the
Hawk and Raven," G. B. McCutcheon;
"The Great Impersonation," Phillips
Oppenheim.

Electoral Vote Cards.

Electoral vote cards may be had at
The Record office. They are inform-
ing to have on hand as well as to mark
predicted election results on. A lit-
tle later, those who care to do so may
mark up a card and file it at the
Record office, and the ten closest esti-
mates will be published after the re-
sult of the election is known.

Doctors say that vegetables will
make one slender. An elephant is a
good example, because they are strict-
ly vegetarians.

Wets are bound to complain. They
criticize the dry law because it is too
strict, and then they criticize it be-
cause they say it can not be enforced.

Some folks can talk politics, and
talk sense. But it must be admitted
that success in doing so, means mas-
tering one of the fine arts.

SATURDAY, SEPTEMBER 1st.
WILLIAM FOX PRESENTS

"Dressed to Kill"
WITH

EDMUND LOWE
MARY ASTOR

COMEDY—

"Movieland"

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 6th.

"Ladies of the Night Club"
COLOR CLASSIC—

"Rose of Killarney"
PATHE NEWS

Taneytown Grain and Hay Market.

Wheat  $1.24@$1.24
Corn, old  $1.20@$1.20

QUALITY TIRES
POPULAR PRICES

For four years tolumous Tires have

been giving cur customers surprisingly

good service.

Made to give 20,000 or more miles

of safe transportation. We quote our

low prices on a few sizes:

30x31/2 Regular $6.35
30x31/2 Oversize $7.25

29x 4.40 Balloon $8.98

RADIUM CORDS.

30x33 Regular $5.90

29x4.40 Balloon $7.45

Come in and see our tires. A trial

will be convincing.

Reindollar Bros. & Co.

A

STOCK CATTLE SEASON IS ON.
Whatever you want, I have, Steers, Heifers, Bulls and

Cows. See me—I can save you money.

Stock Bull loaned to reliable farmers for their use.

HAROLD MEHRING.
(te.t.SWA,Ittltti—tWitt19,9 9,11Ere 9 9 9 9 te 9 9 9-91/Aitt-titett9.9-ttlt

/ AMViririMOMMThirialigrkliirialailaialfill Si re silliati)

1
*

i HIGHEST CASH PRICES 1
,.

.o• 
Paid for

FARMER DRESSED HOGS g,.;. HAHN BROS.

4:22===========tin====1:14=====

•
 •
 •
 •
 •
 
•
 •
 •
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
 •
 

X
r
E
L
M
O
C
 

Hesson's Department Store
(ON THE SQUARE)

Taneytown, Md.

New Merchandise for School
and early Fall Needs.

SHOES & OXFORDSDRESS GOODS.
A nice assortment of prints,

printed sateens, gingham cloth,
colored suitings, percales and
ginghams that will make dainty
School frocks and blouses. We
are headquarters for the Everfast
guaranteed color fast materials.
They are guaranteed fast to sun,
washing and everything.

McCALL PATTERNS.
A new lot of the latest styles

have just arrived. When you
buy the material for a new dress
don't fail to look over the new
September fashion book for the
style you want to make it after.
The McCall pattern is inexpen-
sive and easy to handle.

HATS AND CAPS.
New colors and styles for Fall

of the best quality Hats and
Caps at most reasonable prices.

Our stock has just been in-
creased with a number of the
new styles of lace and strap ox-
fords in tan and black calf and
patent leather for Fall demands.
A dependable line at the lowest
price and the best styles.

HOSIERY.
New numbers have been added

to our large stock of hosiery.
Pretty new shades of lisle and
silks for Fall. Humming Bird,
Silver Star and Kayser service
weight pure thread heavy guage
silk hose that are correctly styl-
ed and give honest service.

SCHOOL SUPPLIES.
A complete line of composition

books, note books, ink and pencil
tablets, fountain pens and lead
pencils, pencil box sets, note
book fillers, ink, compasses and
rullers now on display. A large
assortment of these always on
hand.

GROCERIES
Fresh clean merchandise always on hand

at the lowest prices.

3 cans Pork & Beans, 20c

Heinz Kidney Beans 15c
Crushed Corn

16 oz.

Pink Salmon 18e
12c Stringless Beans 10c

Jar Peanut Butter, 21e

16-oz Jar Good Mustard 15c
Easton's Mayonnaise 10,20 & 38c

Sliced Pineapple, No. 2%
Del-Monte Fruit Salad 25c

Can 25c

5 Cakes P. & G. Soap, 16c

3 Cakes Lux Toilet form Soap 20e 4 Cakes Octagon Laundry Soap
Ivory Soap Flakes 9c 25c

3 Pks Colgates Super Suds 25c

No. Can Broken Slice Pineapple, 21c

Rose Dale Apricots 22c Rose Dale Peaches, large can 20c
Large Can Apple Butter 23c Tall Can Milk 10c
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OFFICERS:
D. J. HESSON, President. 0. EDWARD DODRER, Treasurer
CALVIN T. FRINGER, Vice-Pres J. A. HEMLER, Asst, Treasurer.

DIRECTORS:
D. J. HESSON. NORMAN R. BAUMGARDNER.
NORVILLE P. SHOEMAKER. NORMAN R. HESS.
H. OLIVER STONESIFER. DAVID H. HAHN.
CALVIN T. FRINGER. 0. EDW. DODRER.

TANEYTOWN SAVINGS
BANK

TANEYTOWN, MD.

Capital Stock $ 25,000.00

Surplus and Undivided Profits 75,000.00
Resources 750,000.00

• Save a little every week, have a home of your own, a
good education for your children, protection in time of
• sickness or accident, these are some of the things you

can realize if you save part of your earnings and depos-
• it into a Savings Account with us.

4 per-cent paid compounded semi-annually.
SAFETY. SERVICE.
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Peaches Ripe Peaches
We are picking the Belle of Georgia this week, the

best white peach for canning.
The Elberta's will be ripe the last of this week and

at their best all next week.
The famous J. H. Hale the last of this week, and at

the very best all next week.
I let my peaches ripen on the trees for parties that

come to the orchards.
Put up tree ripened peaches and you have some-

thing good.
Try the Hale Peach this year and you will always

use them for canning.
Orchard 3 miles north of Gettysburg just off the

Biglerville road.
We are open evenings until 8 o'clock. If you can-

not come through the day.

0. C. RICE,
BIGLERVILLE, PENNA.

Residence Phone: Bell 11R2;C.V.29-21 Packing House C. V. 658-21
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Westminster, Md.
PHONE 345 2-24-tf
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Peaches. Peaches.
We will begin picking Elbertas, Hale and Belle of

Geotgia Sept. 1. This fruit is of exceptionally good size

and quality. Come to the orchard and get what you

want.

Turn north off the Lincoln Highway at McKnights-

town and you will come to the orchard.

H. C. OYLER,
Local Phone GETTYSBURG, No. 5.

18-4 Biglerville Exchange. :12t
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