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-NEVER BE TOO BUSY
.TO READ THE HOME
PAPER. READ IT
WHILE YOU REST! THE CARROLL RECORD GIVE US THE NAME

AND ADDRESS OF
YOUR BOY WHO HAS
GONE FROM HOME.
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COUNTY S. S.
CONVENTION.

Many Schools ot County Show In-
creased Membership.

The annual convention of the Car-
roll County Sunday School Associa-
tion was held on Tuesday in Centen-
ary Methodist Episcopal Church,
Westminster, Rev. R. N. Edwards,
pastor. Nearly all of the Sunday
Schools of the county were repre-
sented by delegates, and many pas-
tors also were in attendance.
At the morning session, Rev. W.

V. Garrett,pastor of Trinity Lutheran
Church, Taneytown, spoke on Sunday
School work. Most of the morning
session was given to group confer-
ences as follows: Children's division,
conducted by Miss Lilian E. McCor-
mick, Baltimore, and Miss Ethel
Steele, Westminster; young people's
division, the Rev. J. N. Link, Balti-
more; adult division, C. H. Gunders-
dorff, Baltimore; home department,
Mrs. A. W. Karne11, Philadelphia,and
Mrs. Samuel D. Haines, Westminster;
administrative, Rev. Maurice R.
Hamm, Baltimore; and George Math-
er, Westminster; teacher training,
Mrs. Frances R. Brawn, Baltimore.
The Rev. G. A. Dorman, pastor of

the Methodist Protestant Church,
Gamber, conducted the afternoon de-
votional services. An address was
delivered by Mrs. Karhell on the du-
ties of parents, and C. H. Gunders-
dorf told how a class of 400 men was
built up at St. Paul's Lutheran
Church, Baltimore, Rev. P. A. Heil-
man, pastor.
Mrs. Frances R. Brown addressed

the teacher training graduates of the
year, and State Secretary Abner H.
Brown, of Baltimore, presented di-
plomas and certificates.
County Secretary George Mather

exhibited a map showing the 13 Sun-
day School districts of the county
and the location of 107 schools. Sev-
enty schools have cradle roll depart-
ments, 24 home departments and 28
teacher training classes. Twelve
schools show a 10 percent gain in
membership during the year. Taney-
town had a 10 percent gain, not only
for the town, but for the whole dis-
trict. New Windsor has the largest
percentage of population in the Sun-
day Schools and made the largest per
capita contribution to Sunday School
work.

Taneytown Home-maker's Club.

The June and July meetings of the
Club were of especial interest. At
the former, a baby clinic was held.
Twenty-seven babies were examined
to find if they were needing medical
care in any way, or if they were, or
were not, developing as they should.
Dr. Stone and Dr. Cliff, of the State
staff, were the examining physicians.
Miss Manahan our County nurse, was
in attendance.

Miss Emerson was present in the
interest of forming a Girls' Club
under the extension service. There
was splendid attendance at this meet-
ing.
At the July meeting there was a

demonstration of the steam pressure
cooker. A chicken was properly cut
up for canning, and canned. Inci-
dentally, another benefit of our ex-
tension service was demonstrated.
The owner of this big beautifully
plump bird had learned how to de-
termine why it didn't lay eggs, and
never would lay enough to even pay
for her board. It was decided that
after September we would have fort-
nightly meetings, instead of monthly.

More About the Plank Road.

Mrs. Mary L. Motter, of Washing-
ton, writes us the following informa-
tion concerning the builder of the old
Plank road;
"Peter Grabill who built the plank

road was married to my father's sis-
ter (Rudisil). He was a fine looking
man, and of most pleasing manners.
I was under the impression that Abso-
lom Smith was his partner in the
building of the road. Uncle had the
farm, saw mill and the distillery; the
latter was his undoing. They moved
to Missouri. He bought timber land
and when he sawed the lumber it was
no good—called wind-shaken. Some
years later they came back, and he
died at his daughter's, the wife of Dr.
Rinehart, at Frizellburg."

The Piney Creek Cemetery.

(For the Record).

In the announcement of last Sun-
day's service at Piney Creek Presby-
terian Church, there was no mention
of the offering, or its object—repairs
to the cemetery wall.

In this very old Cemetery there are
good old names of people doubtless
tried and true, of whom we, of this
time, have not the slightest knowl-
edge.
Many Presbyterian families, who

in years gone by had large represen-
tation in this church have almost en-
tirely left the community.

Pride of ancestry is universal; we
cherish records of noble deeds; but
sometimes in the hurry and rush of
twentieth century life, we forget our
duty to these resting places of our
forbears. Pride demands that we do
not leave this privilege to a stranger,
so, "Lest we forget," the treasurer is
Mr. Truman Bowers.

It is said that but few people in In-
dia know how old they are, having
but little interest in their own age, or
that of others.

SUICIDE NEAR TANEYTOWN.
—o—

Mr. Charles H. Stonesifer Ends his
Life by Hanging in Barn.

Mr. Chas. H. Stonesifer committed
suicide, some time Wednesday, by
hanging himself in the barn at his
home, near Taneytown. The body
was found at about 5 o'clock, in the
afternoon, by his son, on going to the
barn to do some work, evidently some
time after the act had taken place.

Justice Davidson and Dr. R. F.
Wells were called, and after viewing
the body it was decided that no in-
quest was necessary, death having
been due to suicide.
Mr. Stonesifer, who has been oper-

ating a bread route for the Everhart
Bakery, left on his route, Monday,
for Thurmont, apparently in the best
of spirits. Just what happened dur-
ing all of the time, is somthing of a
mystery; but, he left his truck in
Thurmont, and was next found on
Tuesday morning in the barn on his
farm at Keysville, occupied by Harry
Welty. In the evening Mr. Welty
brought him part of the way home.
Mr. Stonesifer saying he would walk
the rest of the way.
He was not seen at his home, how-

ever, until found hanging in the barn.
Recently, he had some financial trou-
ble over the attempted sale of his
bread route, and other matters, and
this may have temporarily, unsettled
his mind.
He is survived by his wife, a

daughter of the late Mr. and Mrs.
Henry Hilterbrick, one son, Wilbur,
and his father, H. Oliver Stonesifer,
of Keymar; also by one brother, Wm.
J. Stonesifer, of Keysville, and one
sister, Miss Carrie, of Baltimore.
Funeral services will be held this

Saturday morning, meeting at the
house at 9:30, followed by further
services and interment at the Luth-
eran Church, Taneytown, in charge
of his pastor, Rev. W. V. Garrett.

Middletown Church Rededicated.

During this week, and ending with
Sunday, 26th., the Middletown Luth-
eran congregation, Rev. Wm. C. Day,
'pastor, held a rededication program,
celebrating at the same time the 185th
anniversary of the congregation.

Addresses were delivered by Walter
C. LeGore, President of S. S. Confer-
ence, Rev. John Weidley, D. D., Presi-
dent of Synod; Rev. W. L. Remsburg
and Rev. S. A. Hedges, of Middletown;
Rev. G. E. Williams, D. D., of Hag-
erstown; Rev. A. E. Cooper, Rev. Carl
Mumford, Rev. Clarence Neal, Rev.
Robert Long, Rev. H. C. Erdman; Rev.
J. A. Singmaster, D. D, Gettysburg
Seminary, and by the Pastor.
Various services were accompanied

by anthems and special music, quar-
tets, solos and choruses. The recent
improvements to the church comprised
a new roof, church and Sunday School
frescoed, art glass windows in gallery,
wood work refinished, new carpet and
other furnishings purchased.
The congregation dates back to

1740, and the first church building to
about 1750. The first Sunday School
was organized in 1827. The first
church on the present site was erect-
ed in 1772.

I. 0. 0. F. Home Dedication.

One hundred and twelve lodges
have reported to the committee in
charge of the dedication of the Odd
Fellows Home, Sunday, July 26, and
signified their intention of participat-
ing in the parade prior to the dedica-
tory ceremonies, which does not in-
clude the uniform branches of the
order.
In addition to the high dignitaries

of the order, Governor Albert C.
Ritchie, Mayor Howard W. Jackson,
of Baltimore, and other state officials
are expected to attend. Amplifiers
will be used to enable the crowd as-
sembled on the grounds to hear dis-
tinctly the addresses and other details
of the ceremony of dedication. In-
dications are that more than 2,000
Patriarchs Militant, the highest
branch of Odd Fellowship, in the line
of parade. The parade, which will be
divided in six divisions, is expected to
move off promptly at 1:30 P. M.

The License Tag.

We wonder how many auto drivers
ever stop to consider the significance
of the auto license tag they carry on
their car. It does not give him a
right to use the highways—he already
had that before there were autos. It
doesn't give him immunity from
further taxation—they are apt to
pass new laws hitting the auto for
other things besides tags.
What this tag should signify, and

the impression it should convey, is an
assurance to the public at large that
the man who is operating the car to
which it is fastened is fit to drive,that
the state has satisfied itself of his
ability, and that he will it, either
maliciously or by wilful negligence,
cause injury to others. A few per-
tinent changes in our state laws can
make the auto license tag mean all
that, and it would then convey a mes-
sage of some importance to everybody
on the highway.—Ellicott City Times.

Drop in Price of Wheat.

Harvesting in Canada, the Dakotas,
Minnesota and Montana, has caused
a glut in the wheat market, and
prices have dropped. Too much sell-
ing for the demand. Good rains in
the corn belt, together with the wheat
market depression, have also lowered
the price of corn and oats. The pre-
valence of good weather in the late
Spring wheat belt, has influenced all
grain price.

FARM OUTLOOK
BETTER THIS YEAR

Conditions More Favorable Than for
Past Five Years.

Officials of the Agricultural depart-
ment, and others whose business it is
to study the agricultural situation,
say that the present year is the best
since 1920, and that the general out-
look for farming is decidedly en-
couraging. There is more confidence,
less dissatisfaction, and more cheer-
ful prospects in general.
Farmers are reported to be in much

better financial shape, taking the
country as a whole, while the year's
crops and prices promise to show fair
returns. Some sections have been
hard hit by the drouth, and there are
local crop failures, notably in pota-
toes and hay, but the wheat crop has
been good, while the corn crop prom-
.ises well; and the purchasing value
of the dollar, while still below par,
has increased during the year.
The South is growing a fine cotton

crop, except in a few drouth sections,
and the West and Northwest have lit-
tle to complain off. Less improvement
seems to exist in the east, than else-
where, but financial standards are
best in the east.

Proceedings of the Orphans' Court.

Monday, July 20, 1925—Calvin E.
Bankert, administrator of David A.
H. Tagg, deceased, returned inventory
of debts due and settled his first and
final account.

Elsie L. Wilson, administratrix of
Frank G. Wilson, deceased, settled
her first and final account.

Charles Starner and Jacob D.
Starner, administrators of Calvin
Starner, deceased, reported sale of
personal property.
Edward 0. Weant, executor of John

T. Strevig, deceased, returned inven-
tory of current money.
Edna (Null) Beaver received order

to draw funds.
Mary S. Leigh, executrix of Martin

J. Leah, deceased, received order to
transfer stocks.

Tuesday, July 21, 1925—Letters of
administration on the estate of Jas.
T. Shorb, deceased, were granted unto
Sarah A. Shorb, who received warrant
to appraise and order to notify cred-
itors.
George L. Stocksdale, executor of

Andrew W. Cullison, deceased, re-
ported sale of personal property and
also sale of real estate on which the
Court issued an order ni. Si.

Letters of guardianship of William
A. Shorter, infant, were granted unto
Edith A. S'horter.
Annie M. Hood, executrix of Oscar

R. Hood, deceased, settled her first
account and received order to invest
funds.
Ruby R. Boone, guardian to Mar-

garet H. Merryman, infant, received
order to draw funds.

Boy and Girl Club Work.

College Park, July 22—Approxi-
mately three hundred boy and girl
club members from farms and rural
communities in every county of the
State are expected here August 6 to
11 to take part in the annual club
week. A program of instruction in
the production of farm crops and in
the raising of livestock and poultry is
being planned by E. G. Jenkins,State
Boys' Club Agent, for the boys. For
the girls an equally interesting pro-
gram is being arranged by Miss
Dorothy Emerson, Girls' Club Agent,
in the household arts.
Thousands of boys and girls

throughout the State are enrolled as
members in the clubs that will be
represented at College Park during
Club Week. All of them are engag-
ed in conducting some practical
demonstration to show what can be
accomplished in agriculture and the
household arts by using the best
known methods.
The 4-H Clubs, as they are known,

are organized in the various counties
by the county and home demonstra-
tion agents. The clubs usually hold
regular meetings and are given sys-
tematic instruction in the various
phases of agriculture and home work.
In many of the counties the club
members are given encouragement by
Farm Bureaus and other local farm-
ers' organizations as well as by
banks, business men's organizations
and public spirited individuals. For
several years, the club work in the
State, has received the support of the
Maryland State Bankers' Associa-
tion which annually appropriates
money for its advancement.

Bible Case in Washington.

A suit has been brought in Wash-
ington, D. C., involving a law passed
by Congress for the District, against
any teaching of "disrespect for the
Holy Bible." The suit has been
brought in a bin barring the payment
of salaries to teachers or to any pub-
lic school official in the city, who
teaches evolution. The suit is brought
by an avowed atheist, who has as his
purpose legalizing the teaching of
atheism, or to get a decision that such
teaching does not show "disrespect to
the Bible." The interests of the gov-
ernment will be represented by the U.
S. Department of Justice.

Paper is still 100 percent or more,
above its average prewar price, but
paper "scrap" is down about as low as
it ever sold at—from 20c to 25c per
100 lbs.

STATE ROAD WORK.

Various Contracts in Process of Com-
pletion this Year.

The Frederick News, says;
"The work of grading for concrete

shoulders between this city and Brad-
dock on the old National highway,has
been commenced. Three-foot shoulders
will be laid on each side and the ma-
cadam will be brought up to the
shoulders. The north or right side of
the road will be shouldered first and
three weeks later the macadam will
be brought up to the concrete. Later
the south or left side will be treated
in the same manner. The shoulders
will add six feet to the width of road,
making it 21 instead of 15 feet wide.
The macadam between the shoulders
will be patched and repaired where
this is needed.
"Grading for concrete shoulders

between South Mountain and Hag-
erstown, a distance of approximately
12 miles, has also begun. Both sides
"of the road of this stretch will be
shouldered, also adding six feet to
the width of the road.
"A concrete link of the Liberty-

New Windsor road is being laid. This
road from this city to Liberty is a
macadam highway and from the lat-
ter place to Oak Orchard, a distance
of about 3,000 feet has been concret-
ed. From Oak Orchard to New
Windsor, a distance of four miles,
will be concreted and at the latter
place it will connect with the West-
minster road, which runs to Baltimore
a distance of about 31 miles.
"Concrete shoulders have been laid

on one side of the road from West-
minster to Reisterstown, a distance of
11 miles. The other side will also be
shouldered. This road is the nearest
route from this city to Baltimore by
way of Emmitsburg.
"About 1,000 feet of concrete has

been laid on the gap between this city
and Washington by way of Buckeys-
town, near Dickerson station. This
route from Frederick to the National
Capital is 52 miles, the same distance
as the Ridgeville route. It is ex-
pected that the gap will be completed
by the middle or latter part of
August and will soon afterward be
opened to traffic.
"Grading has been started on the

one-mile gap beginning at Hyatts-
town on the route between this city
and Washington, by way of Urbana.
This gap starts at the intersection of
the Frederick and Montgomery coun-
ty line at Hyattstown and runs south
into Montgomery county. Work on
this gap is being_ pushed in order to
be completed as soon as possible.
When these stretches of one mile are
built, there will be three improved
state highways from this city to
Washington. Work on this gap,
however, has been delayed on account
of considerable rock encountered in
grading. This route is 43 miles
from Frederick to Washington, nine
miles shorter than the other two
routes."

Somerset County Refuses $35,000 for
New School Building.

The County Commissioners of Som-
erset county have r:fuzed to appro-
priate $35,000 for a new school build-
ing at Crisfield, or to increase the tax
rate, or take other means of raising
the money; and a movement has been
inaugurated to incorporate a private
company to sell $50,000 worth of stock
to provide funds for the erection of
the building. A bond issue that would
have relieved the situation was voted
down, at the fall election last year.
The County Commissioners, therefore,
are acting on the majority sentiment
expressed then.

It is said that school facilities are
inadequate in Crisfield, and that 300
children, last year, were able to attend
school only 90 days. The town voted
for the bond issue, but the Northern
county farming sections voted strong-
ly against it. If the stock subscrip-
tion plan carries, it is believed to be
the first instance of the kind in Mary-
land.

Pope Pius Urges Modesty.

The Holy Father renewed his con-
demnation of immodest un-Christian
fashions, on the occasion of receiving
a large Spanish delegation of pil-
grims which included many ladies
and young girls of the aristocracy.
His Holiness invited his guests to

join in a crusade, by example and
word, against the prevailing tendency
of today to go beyond the limit of
modesty in dress.

Since the first days of his pontifi-
cate Pope Pius XI has been an apostle
for modesty in women's dress. A few
months after his exaltation he gave
strict orders that no woman clad in
too worldly a manner should be ad-
mitted to his audiences.
While this order was in exact accord

with Christian teaching and tradition
through the centuries, there was some
objection. It was pointed out that
Pope Benedict XV had never issued
rules to govern women's dress, but
those who brought out this point fail-
ed to remember that in the days of
Pope Benedict women's fashions were
not so extreme. Others objected that
the women must follow the fashions
or be ridiculous.
But Pope Pius never wavered from

his stand, strong in his conviction of
right. Several ladies were refused
admittance to the Pontifical Apart-
ments because they had not observed
the rules of Christian decency in their
dress.

A radio sermon, last Sunday, con-
tained this expression, "we prefer to
go to the Garden of Eden for our
great-grand-parents, than to a men-
agerie."

1 SCOPES GUILTY IN
EVOLUTION CASE

An Appeal Will be Taken to a
Higher Court.

In a brief written opinion, Judge
Ralston refused to permit the jury to
hear the evidence of expert scientists
on evolution. The substance of his
opinion was that as the state of Ten-
nessee had by law made it unlawful
to teach evolution in the public
schools, the opinions of experts could
not change that fact. After a half-
hour of cross fire between the counsel,
and tart allusions to Judge Ralston,
the court was adjourned until Mon-
day.

Attorney Darrow, whose expres-
sions on Friday conveyed an attitude
of contempt for the Court, greatly
enraged the Tennessee bar Associa-
tion and the press of the state, and
Judge Ralston was cri4-icised for not
disciplining him. On Monday, Dar-
raw expressed his regret at having
made such remarks, ph.cing his re-
marks in the form of complet. apol-
ogy, which the Judga accepted, after
Darrow had be-in formally cited for
contempt of Court
The sensation of the day was the

placing of Wm. Jennings Bryan on
the witness stand, and his cross ex-
amination by Darrow who does not
seem to resent being called on athe-
ist, nor deny that he disbelieves most,
if mean, of the Old Testament.
Bryan's examination was stormy
from beginning to end, and finally
became so violent that Court was
suddenly adjourned.
Most of the evidence in the case was

mere publicity argument, and did
not go before the Jury. As a law
suit, the case is largely a farce,
and the theory of evolution discuss-
ed in such a spirit as to have degen-
erated into the calling of names, and
the asking of fool questions.
The case closed on Tuesday morn-

ing, and a verdict of guilty was
promptly rendered. Judge Ralston
imposed a fine of $100.00 fixed bail at
$500.00 pending the filing of an ap-
peal. In commenting on the verdict
Scopes said he had been "convicted
of violating an unjust statute."
As Scopes had admitted the charge

of teaching evolution contrary to
law, there was no other verdict pos-
sible, the only question being as to
the constitutionality of the law of
the state. A verdict could have been
arrived at in a day, had it not been
for the opportunity given to evolu-
tionists to gain publicity, through the
newspapers.
As one of the outcomes of the case,

a bill will be presented before Con-
gress providing that Federal aid be
withdrawn from all schools teaching
the theories of evolution.
The Philadelphia Ledger comment-

ed, caustically, on the disgraceful
features of the case, and particularly
on the part played by Bryan and
Darrow. It said in part;
"If these are leaders of the two

forces which met at Dayton, then the
whole issue is an empty quarrel. If
they are, in fact, the representative
champions of Science and of Reli-
gion, it is a shameful confession of
America's intellectual bankruptcy.

Neither is a true representative of
the cause in which he fights. William
Jennings Bryan is an aging politician
who does not represent the greater
Christian or religious forces of
America.

Clarence Darrow is a tired, dis-
illusioned and vitriolic advocate, who
made his reputation in the field of
criminal law. He may represent un-
belief, but he does not represent the
true Science which has no quarrel
with spiritual life and Religion.
The happenings at Dayton on

Monday were a disgrace to a civilized
Society, to Religion and to Science.
They were a humiliation to the Law,
to Tennessee and to the Nation. It
was time for the issues to be trans-
ferred to a higher tribunal and for
this small-town farce to end. It was
high time for the curtain to be rung
down on this hippodrome of self-ad-
vertisers in a publicity-crazed com-
munity and on this clownish travesty
that was making Science, the Church,
the Law and the State of Tennessee
ridiculous."

Loitery Advertising.

The solicitor to the Postoffice De-
partment states that propositions
wherein the merchants give tickets
with purchases made in their stores
entitling the holder to participate in
drawing for prizes are a lottery, and
that matter relating to it is unmail-
able under Section 213 of the Penal
Code of the United States. He also
states that so-called box sales in
which a number of boxes containing
articles of merchandise of different
values sold at a uniform price are a
lottery, and make advertising for the
same unmailable.
These instructions are very plain

but the trouble with them is that they
are not enforced. The conscientious
publisher obeys the law and loses bus-
iness. A man who is willing to take
a chance gets the advertising and, as
far as we know, no prosecutions have
resulted. Every publisher, however,
should obey the law and take no
chances.—N. E. A. Bulletin.

When our ancestors did away with
pack trains to replace them with the
stage coach, horse owners were fear-
ful that the horse would have its end,
since the coach could carry so much
more than could be packed on a horse.

MIXING OF CONCRETE.

Use Smallest Quantity of Water that
Will Mix Properly.

One can no more get good concrete
by mixing cement, sand, rock and wa-
ter indiscriminately than one can get
good bread by mixing flour,water and
yeast without attention to the pro-
portions or the manipulation.
While this fact is generally recog-

nized by experienced concrete users,
there is still much misunderstanding
as to the accuracy of mix required.
Particularly is this true with regard
to water. Many persons imagine the
amount of water in the mixture is
unimportant—that any concrete
which is really wet will harden prop-
erly.
Nothing could be less accurate. The

hardening of concrete is a chemical
process, and for the best results the
proportionp of materials must be
gauged as accurately as for a cook-
ing recipe. Concrete does not harden
by drying out; it hardens by the
chemical combination of the water
with the cement in it. Too much wa-
ter prevents the cement from hard-
ening properly, just as it prevents
glue or paste from sticking effective-
ly, yet a certain amount is absolutely
essential. The rule on ordinary work
is to use as little as will give a work-
able mixture. Concrete that has to
be shoveled will harden much strong-
er than concrete that can be poured.

Carefully performed experiments
have proved that concrete made with
too much water will have only a part
of the strength it might otherwise
have attained. Mix one bag of ce-
ment with sand and rock, and put in
even a pint more water than is nec-
essary, and you will weaken the fin-
ished concrete as greatly as though
you had left out two pounds of ce-
ment. After the concrete has solid-
ified, however, it should be kept moist
for ten days or so by sprinkling wa-
ter over it. This aids it greatly in
"curing" and the amount of water, so
it is sufficient to keep it moist, is un-
important.
The proper amount of water to use

in any concrete mixture is the small-
est quantity that will give a mix suf-
ficiently plastic for the work in hand.

Concrete must be mixed thoroughly,
and plenty of time should be taken to
insure that this feature is not slight-
ed. Under no circumstances should
the time of mixing be less than one
minute after the ingredients are all in
the mixer. The speed or energy with
which concrete is mixed does not
count so much as the time allowed
for the materials to be thoroughly
blended.
The sand and stone should be

graded carefully, and above all should
be free from organic material. Strong
concrete cannot be made from dusty
or dirty sand and stone. Gravel should
be washed and screened into sand and
pebbles.—Portland Cement Associa-
tion.

Extension Service News.

At last, the Bovine Tuberculosis
Eradication among dairy cattle in
Carroll County is under way. Dr. E.
B. Simonds with his force of veter-
inarians started to work, Monday.
These men have just completed clean-
ing up Baltimore County, which re-
acted about 20 percent. The plan is
to test all the 28.000 cows in Carroll
by October 15th., but this can only be
done by close co-operation upon the
part of the dairymen in having their
cattle stabled for the veterinarians.
The following veterinarians were

assigned to their respective districts;
where they will be assisted by the
men who solicited the names of cow
owners in their neighborhoods. Dr.
Gross, U. S., B. A. I., from Harford
County, Manchester District; Dr.
Gregory, U. S., B. A. I, of Westmin-
ster, Hampstead District; Dr. Brein-
inger, U. S., B. A. I, Eastern Shore,
Woolerys District; Dr. Henderson,
Carroll County, Westminster, Free-
dom District. Two more veterinar-
ians are expected in the near future
and will start New Windsor District,
Middleburg and Union Bridge Dis-
tricts. One of these men will be the
Harford County man.
The prompt removal of reactors,

and a thorough clean up at once, will
put the dairyman in position to re-
place reactors at once. Care should
be exercised by dairymen buying cat-
tle, and go slow and investigate, not
only T. B. test, but also quality of
cattle. Now is the time to improve
the dairy herd.

The three reel film "Weighed in the
Balance" has been shown at most of
the Farm Bureau meetings this
month. This is a very interesting as
well as an educational picture. All
the Farm Bureau meetings are open
to the public, you are invited to at-
tend these meetings.

The boy and girl club members are
getting ready for Club Week at the
University of Maryland, August 6th.
to 11th. All boys and girls doing
club work are invited to spend this
week at tbe University. The Farm
Bureau will pay transportation ex-
penses, taking the young Carroll
Countians to College Park in a bus.
County Agent Fuller will spend the
week at the University this year. All
club members should attend this
meeting.

Marriage Licenses.

John H. Werner and Blanche E.
Seigman, Codorus, Pa.

William E. Thompson and Viola
Catherine West, Frederick.

Clarence E. Eckenrode and Dorothy
H. Fuss, York.

William L. Donaldson and Helen M.
Eigenbrode, Waynesboro, Pa.
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All articles on this page are either orig-
inal, or properly credited. This has al-
ways been a fixed rule with tnill tallee. and
we suggest the adoption of it 11,- siur ex-
changes.

It is said that the majority of anti-

evolutionists are "dry," and that the

majority of evolutionists are "wet."

Very likely true; and there is noth-

ing to be proud of in the fact, for the

"wets." The line up of humanity

might be carried much further, and

with the same result.

Mr. Bryan may be a "has been" so

far as great influence is concerned,

but none the less, on questions of
righteousness—if not on all questions

of politics—he takes the best side. In

his whole public career, no sign of

moral degeneracy attaches to any of

his positions, and he has been entire-

ly free from entering into crooked

deals.

It may be a serious question,
whether man has "descended" or "as-
cended," no matter what his origin—
whether the Garden of Eden, or a
menagerie. There is evidence on both
sides, and an army of "expert scient-
ists" can not reach an agreement
adequate to satisfy the whole of the
present race. By the way, who is an
"expert scientist,' and how and
where did he get it?

The Westminster Times thinks the
Republicans of Maryland are playing
for a "first-class licking" at the next
election by entering upon a campaign
of mud-slinging between factions
representing candidates for Senator I
and Governor, and we guess The
Times is about right. We are not
strong for primary elections for pick-
ing the best men, but is seems to us
that this would be a good time for
Repub leaders, so called, to keep quiet,
and let the people—who are interest- !
ed enough—to pick the candidates, I
without having a knife-sharpening
time of it so long before the voting is
done.

Uncle Sam Sam Needs the Money.

Many printers and publishers are
finding fault with the present rates
of postage—the new laws passed in
order to secure revenue enough
with which to pay increased sal-
aries for postal employees. The job
is an easy one; but the critics should
remember that "Uncle Sam needs the
Money" and must get it from mail
patrons, by juggling with rates in
order to get more income with the
least amount of kicking.
The most unfortunate thing about

the new rates is, they do not seem to
be bringing in the hoped-for increas-
ed revenue. They are said to be, in
fact, insufficient to anything like
meet the increased expenditures.
President Coolidge and his postal of-
ficials were afraid of the job, but Con-
gress thought otherwise, passed the
present rates, and no doubt now feel
that they no longer have any respon-
sibility in the matter.
That is a fine way Congress has

about such things. It is easy to pass
laws to satisfy constituents, then let
the difficulties of the laws—the ob-
jections to them—be met by some-
body else. Passing a law, then "get-
ting the money," are often two very
different propositions.

"A Law Suit, Not a Prayer Meeting"

Clarence Darrow, noted lawyer and
counsel for Scopes in the evolution
case, who is reported to have but
slight leanings toward religion, ob-
jected to the opening of the court
with prayer, saying "This is a law
suit, not a prayer meeting." In our
humble judgment, the eminent coun-
sel did not gain anything worth while,
by indulging in such an expression.

Entirely aside from this particular
case, there might very appropriately
be much more real prayer in Court
than is commonly heard there, and
much less of specious "prayers" of
counsel. We think Mr. Darrow was
unfortunate in his joke, considering
the two varieties of prayers, and his
part in the case.
At any rate, his remark was a

gratuitous fling at a custom that re- ,

ligious folks regard very highly, and

the learned counsel might have been

big enough to have refrained from

his sarcasm, as the customary formal

prayer had nothing to do with the
legal side of the case, that he must

have thought was infringed upon—if
he had any thought at all about the
appropriateness of the remark.
The incident seems to us to have

been a fair illustration of the old say-
ing about trials, that when an attor-
ney has a bad case he always has the
alternative of abusing counsel on the
other side. Mr. Darrow accepted the
opportunity of finding fault with the
custom of the Court, perhaps for
want of something else to object to,
and perhaps because he consistently
disbelieves in prayer. In either case,
the effortwas wasted.

Personality.

One man can sell goods in certain
quantities to a certain number of
customers. Let him be "off the road"
for any cause and put a substitute on
the same rate with the same goods,
and he will return less orders. The
difference is largely in the "person-
ality" of the men—"the goods" do
not sell themselves.

Start out two men on a speaking
tour, each with the same message to
the public, word for word, and the
one will put his message "ever," to
a much greater extent than the other.
The difference is largely in personal-
ity, the messages, in themselves, do
not carry conviction.
One may read a profoundly logical

and forceful sermon, written by a
highly competent intellectual 'person,
and yet not be influenced so much by
it as in hearing the same material
personally delivered by a less noted
author. In a variety of ways, it is
the personal touch, the tone of a voice
the mannerisms of an individual,that
creates influence and carries weight.
We rather boast of our ability to

"see through" problems and intricate
debates, strictly on evidence plain be-
fore us; we deny that we are influenc-
ed by such things as oratory and
"personality," but, we thereby mis-
represent facts. We will read over a
circular, for instance picturing the
attractiveness of an investment, and
toss it aside with scarcely more than
passing interest; but, let the right
man see and talk to us personally,
on the same subject, and before we
know it, almost, we have made an
investment.
"Personality"—the human touch—

the human voice—the very appear-
ance of an advocate, counts for vast-
ly more than we think, or admit, and
this is the reason why one man is
worth more than another, and draws
a larger salary. We profess great
wisdom when we say, "No man is
worth $25,000 a year salary," but it
is merely a wisdom growing out of
ignorance. There are men—hundreds
of them, worth much more than that,
because they produce the results
justifying their salary.
"Personality" may be an accom-

plishment of value, or one of danger.
Some men use their personal quali-
fications—their "magnetism' we
sometimes say—for dishonest pur-
poses. There is a sort of hypnotism
attaching to some people, and it is
capitalized; it influences us, perhaps
only for the time while under its
spell, but for long enough for us to
tie ourselves to dangerous proposi-
tions. We simply let our admira-
tion overcome our calm judgment,
and surrender to a superior "person-
ality."

It is an extreme statement that
some can persuade others that "black
is white," but in effect the statement
is true. It is the old story of the
tempter, that started away back in
the Garden of Eden. Fortunately,
all men with strong "personality"
are not merely tempters. The most
of them, we believe, make proper use
of their power, and the world is the
better for them; but, it behooves all
of us to cultivate strong• personali-
ties of our own and not be easily
"taken in" by glib tongues and per-
suasive tones. We owe it to our-
selves, and to our circle of influence,
to be conservative enough to avoid
being easily placed on the "sucker
list."

The Coal Problem Again.

The present coal situation is merely
another chapter in a story that has
been familiar in this country, for
years— a fight between organized
miners and the coal operators, with
the consumers of coal ultimately
paying the price of the outcome, and
perhaps more besides. What this
country, and the whole world, needs;
is a substitute for coal, and it is like-
ly to be found. Already, the harness-
ing of water power and the use of oil,
have cut down coal demands, and
perhaps in the near future electricity
will largely solve the problem and re-
duce the use of coal to the extent that
threats of "strikes" will largely be a
negligible fear.
The whole situation between the

miners and operators is becoming un-
bearable, and a species of force that
the country as a whole has long been
weary of, with popular sentiment di-
vided as to where the blame rests.
Then, there is government operation
of the coal fields; but, relief in that
event is not by any means assured—
it would mean still greater political
influence by unionism, and trouble
for the government and candidates,
and coal users would still "pay the
price."
The situation is largely the same

on both sides of the Atlantic, as a big
problem. The Philadelphia Ledger
says of it editorially, in part, as fol-
lows;
"This is another summer of coal

troubles on both shores of the At-
lantic. King Coal's supremacy is
challenged in many fields by oil and
threatened in others by a coming
hydro-electric age, but he keeps the
power of troubling the waters of
statesmanship, politics and industry.
The situation in America and Great

Britain are similar. In both countries
wage agreements have been disas-
trous to miners and operators.
Every shipload of coal exported

from British ports in months has
meant the loss of a shilling a ton. On
this side, American soft-coal opera-
tors have been unable to compete with
nonunion mines. Their cost of pro-
duction has been too great.
In America the soft-coal industry

is a chaos. Ruin is staring British
mine owners in the face.
In American soft-coal fields tens

of thousands of miners are jobless.
Since last fall 67,000 British miners
have been thrown out of work by
closing pits. Scores of British and
hundreds of American mines are shut.

British operators cannot pay the
none too generous minimum scale and
keep their export business. Unless it
is kept, British miners go jobless.
They refuse, however, to surrender
the advantages they fought so long
and bitterly to get.
American soft-coal operators tried

to pay the 1924 scale and non-union
competition hamstrung them. Amer-
ican miners, like the British, refuse
to surrender their hard-won gains."

Scores of Chicks Die
needlessly on account of stale, musty
feeds. Depend on Rein-o-la Butter-
milk Starting Food. It will not fail
you. Always fresh.—Refindollar Bros.
& Co. 4-3-tf

—Advertisement

Prohibition Enforcement.

We have turned the corner in pro-
hibition enforcement and may expect
steady .improvement until a satis-
factory condition is established.
When prohibition came the gov-

ernment had various clearly defined
problems to solve. There was the
problem of caring for the vast amount
of bonded liquors existing. These
liquors were contained in a large
number of warehouses scattered over
the country, most of them being in-
adequately guarded. Robberies were
frequent and there was much evi-
dence indicating collusion. Whiskey
being transported by motor trucks
was seized in considerable quantities
by hi-jackers. Approximately eight
million gallons of bonded liquors were
released under permits for supposed
legitimate purposes during the first
year of prohibition. There was not
even any proper paper for the print-
ing of permits so that the counter-
feiting of these documents was not
difficult.
That problem was solved. By new

legislation, bonded liquors were con-
centrated in a few warehouses where
they could be adequately guarded.
Transportation of liquor by truck was
stopped. A permit system was evolv-
ed which reduced counterfeiting to a
minimum. Liquors released on per-
mit declined from approximately
eight million gallons to approximately
one and one-half million gallons.
The problem of home brew, which

it appeared at one time would be con-
siderable, solved itself because pala-
table home brew could not be made
and people simply stopped trying. It
is true that a good deal of wine is
made today in the large cities by for-
eign born people, chiefly by Italians
and Greeks.
The next important problem was

that of smuggled liquors. When Con-
gress added approximately three
hundred vessels to the Coast Guard
and signed treaties with other nations
largely increasing the powers of the
United States in dealing with smug-
glers, the problem of smuggling from
sea was practically solved and when
the control of Customs and Coast
Guard was put in the hands of the
same man who controlled prohibition,
the way was cleared for the solving
of the entire smuggling problem. Af-
ter all, the entire amount of liquor
smuggled in the United States in re-
cent years has totalled only a few
million gallons. Most of the stuff
bought as smuggled was redistilled
denatured alcohol.

This is the present big problem.
The arrest of a large number of peo-
ple in Philadelphia, where this traf-
fic centers, indicates that the govern-
ment is trying to take effective meas-
ures. It is doubtful if this problem
can be solved without additional leg-
islation. The control of the output of
denatured alcohol must be strength-
ened. It is interesting to note that
the production and output of dena-

tured alcohol in the United States has
increased largely since prohibition,
not simply because a great deal of
this commodity has been redistilled
for bootlegging, but because legiti-
mate industries requiring large quan-
tities of alcohol have sprung up upon
the ruins of German industries and
to supply an expanding demand for
goods of many kinds.

It is true that we have with us the
problem of moonshine, but it is be-
lieved that the consumption of moon-
shine will in time be restricted only to
the very lowest classes of people. The
product is almost unbelievably filthy.
It is a fact that much of the moon-
shine produced is prepared from mash
to which stable manure has been add-
ed to hasten fermentation. These
facts are coming to light and they
certainly tend to restrict consumption.
Many a "good citizen" is drinking this
product today in the belief that he is
getting "pre-war stuff," for it is easy
to color it, flavor it and bottle so that
it appears to be "good liquor.'—Board
Temperance M. E. Church.

The Best Feed in the World

is fresh feed, properly compounded.
Rein-o-la Buttermilk Starting Food is
made from sound grains only, and
made fresh each week. Try it and be
safe.—Reindollar Bros. & Co. 4-3-tf

—Advertisement

Important Agreement
The Webster-Ashburton treaty was

a treaty between the United States
and Great Britain, negotiated by Dan-
iel Webster and Lord Alexander Bar-
ing Ashburton in August, 1842. By
this treaty the frontier line between
the state of Maine and Canada was
definitely agreed to. By this treaty,
also, seven-twelfths of the disputed
ground and the British settlement of
Madagaska were given to the United
Stc,tes and only five-twelfths of the
grfAind to Great Britain, but it secured
a hotter military frontier to Canada
and included heights commanding the
St. Lawrence, which the award .of the
king of Holland, who had been chosen
arifier, had assigned to the Americans.
By the eighth and ninth articles pro-
visions were made for putting an end
to the African slave trade, and the
tenth article provides for the mutual
extraOition of suspected criminals.

Absurdity of Man
Really, Mien it comes to glory there

Is no limit to the absurdity of man.
A man will glory in a disease, a vice.
the wealth of an ancestor when he is
Ifinis311 poor or the poverty of an an-
cestor when he is himself rich; the
street in which he lives; the color of
his hair, of his eyes; the possession
of something which he picked up in
the street—even the abuse of some
one more notorious than himself. Men
will glory in anything, just as the
famine-struck will eat anything. Such
Is the appetite for glory. And why
Is It there? I say again, to make men
achieve, to make them write bad verse,
build hideous houses, put up impossi-
ble monuments, pass bad laws, and in
general destroy their kind.—Hiliare
Belloc in the New Statesman.

Telegraph Terrified Many
When Prof. Samuel F. B. Morse. in-

ventor of the practical telegraph In-
strument and code, first put them into
practice in 1845 many intelligent citi-
zens were actually terrified. Some of
the more skeptical spoke of hint as
being in league with the devil. The
first message sent over the line that
had been constructed for the practical
tryout was: "What bath God
wrought!" Morse was a painter, and
not an electrician, but he combined
the principles and devices that elec-
trical scientists had produced up to
that time and in that way won credit
for the idea. He met with great op-
position In getting the idea accepted.

The Cow-Tree
In Colombia there is a tree known

as the cow-tree. It is treated much
as we treat a cow, or, this vegetable
cow is bled; rather, its veins are cut,
that is to say, the bark of the tree is
incised. Immediately the laciferous
vessels thus bisected yield an abun-
dant 'flow of white liquid which as
regards its appearance. taste and flour-
ishifug properties hardly differs from
ordinary milk. Evaporated by gentle
heat. thls vegetable milk yields a de-
lightful sort of marzpan with a slight-
ly aromatic odor.—From the Wonder
Book of Plant Life, by Jean Henri
Fabre.

Words! Words!
Some very beautiful choral music

we heard recently reminded us of a
little speech Sir Henry Wood once
made to Sheffield 'Choristers. "Now
for your greatest fault!" he exclaimed.
"Words! Words are your master.
When you go and hear a bad comic
opera and ou listen with rapt atten-
tion to the principal -coriediaa, what
attracts you? You are able without
effort .to hear every word he sings.
You forget that he has no voice. Now
think when you are singing choruses
at the next festival what a delight it
will be to the public if they hear every
word you sing!"

Hall's Catarrh
Medicine claililmdofworhaittwe
rid your system of Catarrh or Deafness
caused by Catarrh.

Sold by druggists for over 40 years

P. J. CHENEY Ea. CO., Toledo. Ohio
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Capital Stock;
Surplus
Undivided Profits

$40,000.00
$50,000.00
$22,000.00

ON THE HONOR ROLL OF BANKS

Just Idle Gossip
Words spoken over the back yard fence in idle gossip

often ruin reputations, for a LIE usually travels so fast
that the TRUTH seldom catches up with it.

Idle rumorsu sometimes cause banks a lot of trouble.
That's why we guard this Bank's reputation so careful-
ly. We want our banking methods to be above reproach
in every detail. That's why we have the confidence of our
customers at all times. They know that their money depos-
ited in this Bank is SAFE.

Resources Over $1,200,000.00.
N8181818184803:4309030E*80803MaeaM Oto:OtOio:c1c4'40:4404C40:40:0V4OtotO4OictoisiOt

SHOES FOR WORK1 WE HAVE ALWAYS MADE A SPECIALTY OF
WORK SHOES.

For this season we are showing a wonderful line of
all leather shoes, guaranteed to give satisfaction and
the kind that are SOFT and EASY.

PRICES ARE FROM $2 TO $5.
Our line of DRESS OXFORDS run from the cheapest

to the best.

SHOES FOR THE WHOLE
FAMILY.

J. THOMAS ANDERS,
22 West Main St., Westminster, Md.
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FOR SALE

Property at Keymar
Modern 8 room dwelling

with bath and electric
light; also Stable, Garage,
etc.,and 11-2 Acres of land.
Apply to

L. S. BIRELY, Keymar, Md.
6-12-8t

$1.00 Stationery Offer.
It is socially proper as well as business-

like to use printed stationery. It is also
economical and apt to result in having pa-
per and envelopes en hand, when needed
We have filled hundreds of orders received
by mail for our $1.00 offer, and have not
had a single complaint.
200 sheets Hammermill Bond paper,

51/4x8% unruled, padded on request, with
100 size 61/4 envelopes to match.
Printed either in dark blue, or black.

Not over 4 lines neat type, the same form
on both paper and envelopes. Envelopes
printed on back, if desired.
Cash with order, when sent by mail.

Write instructions, and copy for the print-
ing, very plainly. When mailed to 3rd.
and 4th. Zones, and Sc; to 5th. Zone, or
further, add 10e.

THE CARROLL RECORD CO..
TANEYTOWN. MD.

GLASSES

I wish to announce to the people of
Taneytown and vicinity that I have
made arrangements for

HUDSON 8z BELL,
of Frederick, Md., successors of C. L.
Kefauver to continue the Optical ser-
vice which Mr. Kefauver gave in Tan-
eytown. Next visit

FRIDAY, AUGUST 21st., 1925.

and every 3rd. Friday in each month
thereafter, at Sarbaugh's Jewelry
Store. Mr. Bell, member of the firm,
who is a registered optometrist, and
who was associated with Mr. Kefau-
ver for some years has charge of the
Optical Department, guarantees ab-
solute satisfaction at reasonable
prices. Appointments can be made
before this date at Sarbaugh's Jewel-
ry Store. We do all kinds of Optical
repair work. Don't forget that our
Watch, Clock and Jewelry repair de-
partment is the best.

SARBAUGH
JEWELER,

TANEYTOWN, MD.
Main Store, Hanover, Pa. 3-13-tf

RATIFICATION NOTICE.

In the Orphans' Court of Carroll County,
JUNE TERM. 1925.

Estate of Luther Kemp, deceased.
- On application it is ordered, this 23rd.
day of June, 1925, that the sale of
Real Estate of Luther Kemp, late of Car-
roll County, deceased, made by John A.
Yingling, Executor of the last Will and
Testament of said deceased, and this day
reported to this Court by the said Execu-
tor, be ratified and confirmed, unless cause
be shown to the contrary on or before the
4th. Monday, 27th. day of July, next;
provided a copy of this order be inserted
for three successive weeks in some news-
paper printed and published in Carroll
County, before the 3rd. Monday, 20th. day
of July, next.
The report states the amount of sale to

be $5900.00.
THOMAS J. HAINES,
J. WEBSTER EBAUGH,
LEWIS E. GREEN,

• Judges.
True Copy Test:-

WILLIAM F. BRICKER,
Register of Wills for Carroll Co.

6-26-4t
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SSON'S DEPARTMENT SIO
n The Square, Taneytown, M

4

Semi-Annual Clearance Sale
July 18th., to August 1st., Inclusive.

EXTRAORDINARY VALUES IN EVERY DEPARTMENT. THIS SALE OFFERS YOU
AN OPPORTUNITY TO PURCHASE FIRST CLASS WANTED MERCHANDISE

FROM OUR STOCK AT GREAT SAVINGS FROM IT'S REAL VALUE
ACT NOW AND SHARE IN THE GREAT SAVINGS.

REDUCTIONS IN THE
DRESS GOODS DEPARTMENT

COLOR FAST LINEN, 89c yd.
A full yard wile, fine quality pure linen in all

the leading colors. Guaranteed fast to washing
or sun and kreaseless. Our regular $1.00 value.

COLORED INDIAN HEAD LINEN, 39c yd
These have been very popular for service wear.

They are here in all the leading shades. A ma-
terial that sells regularly at 50c. Our sale price
only 39c yd.

SPLENDOUR CREPES, 98c yd
Splendour Crepes have been very popular dress

materials because of their wonderful beauty and
the small cost. A silk and cotton fabric that
sells big at $1.25. Our Sale Price, 98e yd.

GLOW SHEEN, 79c yd
A silk and cotton Cloth, 36 in wide similar to

• the Splendour Crepe, but not as heavy, that sells
regularly from $1.00 to $1.25. Our Sale Price,
79c yard.

FLOWERED CREPES, 89c yd.
Beautiful patterns of 36-in, wide flowered

Crepes, the leading summer dress material that
has been selling at $1.00. Our Sale Price, 89c yd

NORMANDY VOILES, 421/2c yd.
• A fine woven, excellent quality Voile in the

leading colors and patterns that has sold all sea-
son for 50c.. .Our Sale Price, 421/2c yd.

DRESS VOILES, 321/2c yd.
A good quality dress Voile in very pretty pat-

terns and the leading shades, good width, that
sold during the summer at 40c. Our Sale Price,

• 321/2c yd.

ALL SILKS BY THE YD. REDUCED
▪ TAFFETA SILK, $1.39 yd.

We will offer our stock of Taffeta Silks that
have been selling for $1.50 and $1.75 regularly,at•

• : the Sale Price of $1.39 yd.

MESSALINE SILK, $1.39 yd.
Our 36-in Messaline Silk, a fine quality silk,

that sells regularly from $1.50 to $1.75 will be
offered during this sale at $1.39 per yard.

• CREPE DE CHENE, $1.39 yd.
During this sale all our Crepe de chene that has

been selling for $1.50 and $1.75 will be sold at
$1.39. Best quality full 38-in. wide.

:x:
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• GEORGETTE SILK, $1.39 yd.
Our stock of Georgette Crepes must go too at

this price during this sale only.

• CHARMEUSE SILK, $1.98.
A beautiful material full 38-in, wide that sells

regularly for $2.50 and $2.75. Our Sale Price,
$1.98.

SILK POPLIN, 79c yd.
Our sale price on this popular dress material

represents a real saving on its real value. Full
yard wide and excellent quality.

CHINA SILK, 621/2c yd.
A good light weight silk 27-in, wide in all the

leading colors that sells regularly for 75c. Our
Sale Price, 621/2c yd.

SILK PONGEE, 59c yd.
Full yard wide in colors, blue and gray.

SILK PONGEE, 69c yd.
A yard wide Silk Pongee in tan only. Our

Sale Price, 69c yd.

SILK PONGEE, 89c yd.

• An excellent quality yard wide Pongee in tan
only. Our $1.00 value. Sale Price, 89c yd.

LADIES' GINGHAM DRESSES, $1.39.

A lot of House Dresses worth from $2.00 to
$2.50, made from good quality Gingham and good
styles. Our Sale Price, $1.39.

GIRLS' GINGHAM DRESSES, $1.39.

These run in sizes from 6 to 15 years, and are
made from a good quality of Gingham. While
this sale is on only $1.39.

• GIRLS' GINGHAM DRESSES, $1.98.

This lot consists of very pretty dresses made
from excellent quality ginghams, and also a few

• from Indian Head Linen. A real saving at our
Sale Price of $1.98.

PERCALES, 19c yd.

Our entire stock of light and dark figured Per-
cales that sell regularly for 25c, will sell at our
Sale for 19c 3d.

SALE OF DRESS GINGHAMS
GOOD DRESS GINGHAM, 12qc yd.
A good quality 27-in wide Dress Gingham of

pretty plaid patterns.

32-in. WIDE DRESS GINGHAMS, 18c yd.
They are very good quality, nice patterns in all

• the leading shades and sells regularly, for more.
A real value at our Sale Price of 18c yd.

25c DRESS GINGHAMS, 221/2c yd.
Among these you will find all the reliable

brands in the 27-in and 32-in widths, latest pat-
terns, and pretty colors. Only during our Sale at
221/2c.

30c DRESS GINGHAMS, 26c yd
Beautiful patterns, best quality, in the 30 and

32-in. widths. Our Sale Price of 26c per yard,
represents a real saving.

SALE OF TABLE DAMASK
58-in. TABLE DAMASK, 421/2c yd.
A good Mercerized, heavy weight Cloth, con-

structed for durability in very attractive patterns.
During our July Sale only at 421/2c.

60-in. TABLE DAMASK, 55c yd.
An excellent quality Mercerized Table Damask

full 60-in wide in beautiful patterns. Our Sale
Price, only 55c yd.

64-in. TABLE DAMASK, 69c yd.
Full 64-in, wide, fine quality Mercerized Table

Damask in pretty patterns. Our Sale Price, 69c
yd.

72-in. TABLE DAMASK, 89c yd.

A high grade 72-in. wide Table Damask, heavy
weight. A regular $1.00 seller. Our Sale Price,
89c yd.

70-in. LINEN TABLE DAMASK, $1.59 yd.

A fine bleached Table Damask, pure Linen,
good weight and close weave. A real value at
our Sale Price of $1.59.

HEAVY SHIRTING, 18c yd.

Good heavy Shirting 28-in, wide in plain blue
or striped, excellent quality. Our Sale Price 18c yd

EXTRA SPECIAL FOR TUES-
DAY JULY 21st., ONLY

LADIES GOOD SILK HOSE 39c
Our regular 50c good quality

silk hose for ladies in all the lead-
ing colors and full sizes. Remem-
ber only on sale at this price
Tuesday, July 21st.

36-in. INDIAN HEAD LINEN, 27c yd.
Genuine Indian Head Linen and full 36-in, wide

only during Our Sale at 27c.

SALE PRICES ON ALL MUSLINS
BLEACHED MUSLINS.

27-in wide Bleached Muslin, 10c
36-in, wide good quality Muslin, 13c
36-in, wide fine quality Muslin, 16c
36-in, wide excellent quality Muslin, 181/2c.

UNBLEACHED MUSLINS.
27-in fair quality Muslin, 8c
36-in fair quality Muslin, 9c
36-in, good quality Muslin, 121/2c
36-in, fine quality Muslin, 15c
36-in, excellent quality Muslin, 18c
40-in excellent quality Muslin, 18c •
36-in extra fine and heavy Muslin, 20c

SALE PRICES OF SHEE'TINGS.

Our Sheetings are of very good quality, full
widths and very servicable.
6/4 Bleached Sheeting, Sale Price 39c
7-4 Bleached Sheeting, Sale Price 45c
8-4 Bleached Sheeting, Sale Price 49c
9-4 Bleached Sheeting, Sale Price 521/2c
9-4 Unbleached Sheeting, Sale Price 47c.
10-4 Unbleached Sheeting, Sale Price 521/2c
10-4 Bleached Sheeting, Sale Price 57c
10-4 Bleached Sheeting,extra heavy,Sale Price

SALE PRICES ON PILLOW TUBING

36-in Pillow Tubing, excellent quality 29c
40-in Pillow Tubing, excellent quality, 32c
42-in Pillow Tubing, excellent quality 34c
45-in. Pillow Tubing, excellent quality 36c

"RED STAR" DIAPER CLOTH, $1.75 BOLT.

The "Red Star" is recognized as the standard
of birdseye Diaper Cloths, in 10-yd pieces, and

27-in wide.

"KOTEX" SPECIAL SALE .45 BOX
72x90 SHEETS, 79c each

Made from good weight Muslin, and with cen-

ter seam.

81x90 SHEETS, $1.39

An excellent quality Muslin, full measurement

and hemmed. A real saving at our Sale Price

of $1.39.

6 SPOOLS 0. N. T. COTTON, 25c

SATTEEN BLOOMERS, 39c each

A regular 50c value in sizes 8 to 18 made from

a good quality Satteen.

SPECIAL FOR THURSDAY
JULY 23rd.

On this day and date we will
have our usual sale of short ends
of muslins, ginghams, shirtings
and dress goods, etc. Wonderful
values at a real saving. The val-
ues in these will be as great as
ever. Don't fail to be on hand at
the time. THURSDAY, JULY
23rd., at 8:30 A. M.
2 CANS MAVIS TALCUM

POWDER .35c
Just for this one day only, we

will sell two cans of this popular
Talcum Powder for 35.

MEN'S TURKEY RED OR INDIGO BLUE
HANDKERCHIEFS, 4 for 25c.

A good quality Handkerchief that usually
sells for 10c, size 18x18. A real value at our Sale
Price of 4 for 25c..

MEN'S WHITE HANDKERCHIEFS, 6 for 25c

A good quality full size Handkerchief worth
much more than our Sale Price of 6 for 25c.

MEN'S BALBRIGGAN SHIRTS & DRAWERS,

39c each.
Good quality Balbriggan Shirts in either short

or long sleeves in all sizes, also Drawers to match
in quality that represents a real saving at our
Sale Price of 39c each.

MEN'S ATHLETIC UNION SUITS, 49c SUIT.

Pajama Check, full collarette neck, pearl but-
tons and good size.

MEN'S ATHLETIC UNION SUITS, 69c SUIT.

Excellent quality Pajama Check, well made and
full cut. Our Sale Price, 69c Suit.

MEN'S BALBRIGGAN UNION SUITS, 75c.

Good quality Balbriggan Union Suits, short
sleeves, ankle length, full cut and sized right.

MEN'S BLUE WORK SHIRTS, 50c

A good quality, well made Work Shirt in sizes
14% to 17.

MEN'S HALF HOSE, 7c PAIR

They come in black only, and are well worth
this very low price.

MEN'S FOUR-IN-HAND TIES, 25c.

Excellent quality, good patterns and colors.

MEN'S SILK HOSE, 29c PAIR.

A wonderful value at this Sale Price. They
come in french, tan, cordovan, black and navy and
in the drop stitch.

HOYT'S COLOGNE, 2 BOTTLES 15c.

The regular 10c size genuine "Hoyt's" Cologne
at the special price of 2 bottles 15c during this
sale only.
SALE OF BOYS' KNEE PANTS SUITS.

Our entire stock of Boys' Suits, some with one

and some with two pairs of trousers, will be sold

at a big saving during this sale.

Boys' $5.90 Suits,
Boys' $7.00 to $7.75 Suits,
Boys' $8.25 to $9.00 Suits,
Boys' $10.00 to $10.50 Suits,
Boys' $12.00 Suits,
Boys' $13.00 Suits,
Boys' $15.00 Suits,

BOYS' COTTON PANTS, 69c
69c Only a few of these on hand, but

last, the above price will prevail.

SALE OF MEN'S DRESS SHIRTS
MEN'S DRESS SHIRTS, 89c.

A good quality Percale Shirts, Coat style good

size and pretty patterns.

MEN'S DRESS SHIRTS, $1.19.

Fine quality, full cut shirts, that are well made,

and of the leading patterns for this season.

MEN'S DRESS SHIRTS, $1.39.

Excellent quality Shirts with either collar at-

tached or neck band, good patterns full sizes.

MEN'S DRESS SHIRTS, $1.59.

Our regular line of $1.75 and $1.85 Shirts, with

collars to match or neck bands, in light or dark

patterns.
MEN'S DRESS SHIRTS, $1.79.

These are from our $2.00 line and represent the

best to be had for that money. They are well

made, full cut and of the best material.

MEN'S DRESS SHIRTS, $2.19.

Our line of $2.50 Dress Shirts of the leading

patterns and cloths, will be offered during this

sale at $2.19.

$1.90
$6.79
$7.69
$8.90

$10.49
$11.40
$12.50

while they

•

PALM OLIVE SPECIALS.
1 Bottle Palm Olive Shampoo and 2 Cakes Palm

Olive Soap, 49c

1 Tube Palm Olive Shaving Cream and 1 Can
After Shaving Talc, 49c

SPECIAL FOR TUESDAY,
- JULY 28th., only.

10-qt. White Enamel Water Pail .69
A 10-qt. Double Coated on

heavy steel base, acid proof,weld-
ed ears, heavy wire bail. Gener-
ally sold for from 90c to $1.00.
Special for this one day only 69c
LADIES' 1 STRAP TAN SCANDALS, $2.59
A ladies 1 strap tan Sandal with open work

made of all leather priced especially for this
sale at $2.59. Sizes 21/2 to 7.

LADIES' 1 STRAP BROWN CALF PUMPS,$2.29
These are of this year's stock excellent quality,

beautiful styles, cuban rubber heel. Our regular
$3.75 and $4.00 numbers.

MISSES' TAN 1 STRAP SANDALS, $2.39.
These run in sizes 12 to 2, and are of the new

shade of tan. They are well made and built for
comfort. Only during this Sale at $2.39.

GIRLS' TAN SANDALS, $2.19.

These are the same as the above only in sizes
8% to 11 1/2, and are especially priced for this
sale.

CHILD'S TAN 1 STRAP SANDALS, $1.79

As above a 1 Strap stitch down Sandal guaran-
teed all leather, in sizes from 5 to 8. Especially
priced for this sale.

MEN'S SCOUT SHOES, $1.69.

A light weight Scout Shoe that is worth much
more. Reliable make and quality, for our regu-
lar price. Especially priced for this sale.

MEN'S ALL LEATHER SCOUT SHOES, $2.39.

In all leather Scout Shoe eask for the feet, and
built for the maximum wear. Especially priced
for this sale.

MEN'S AND BOYS' TAN OXFORDS, $2.59.

A good style, light tan, lace Oxford, for men
or boys, neatly built and especially priced for this
sale.
MEN'S BLACK OXFORDS, $2.89.

A gun metal Lace Oxford, snappy style, well
made and all leather. The above price is good
only during our sale.

SPECIAL FOR THURSDAY.
JULY 30th.

For this one day only, we will
offer a blue and white enameled
Preserving Kettle, with white en-
ameled lining and enameled lid
to match as follows:
6-qt. Preserving Kettle & Lid, 79c
8-qt. Preserving Kettie & Lid,89c
10-qt. GRAY ENAMEL KETTLES, WITH LIDS

89c.
A 10-qt. Gray Enamel Preserving Kettle, with

lid to match. A regular $1.00 seller at our
Special Sale Price of 89c.

12-qt. GRAY ENAMEL KETTLES, WITH LIDS

98c.
A 12-qt. Gray Enamel Preserving Kettle, with

lid to match. A real value at $1.25. Our Sale
Price 98c.
1 GAL. ENAMEL PAIL, WITH TIN LID 29c.

Suitable for water or a lunch pail.

GRAY ENAMEL WATER BASINS, 10c.

Good size and quality.

GLASS WATER PITCHERS, 49c.

A good heavy, large size, clear glass, water
pitcher.
ASSORTMENT OF DISHES, 10c EACH.

An assortment of plain white Dishes, consist-
ing of dinner plates, meat plates, vegetable dish-
es, cups and saucers, bowls, etc. A real value at
this price.

GROCERY SPECIALS.
10-oz. TUMBLER PEANUT BUTTER, 23c
CAN BABBITT'S CLEANSER, 6c.
3 CANS BABBITT'S LYE, 35c.
16-oz. CAN OF GOOD COCOA, 15c.
2 CANS EARLY JUNE PEAS, 25c
PEPPERMINT & WINTERGREEN LOZEN-

GERS, 18c lb.
3 CANS VEGETABLE SOUP, 25c.
2 CANS SALMON, 25c.
1 CAN HEINZ KIDNEY BEANS, 15c.
3 CANS PORK AND BEANS, -25c.

I •
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TFIECARROLLREcORD
FRIDAY, JULY 24th., 1925.

CORRESPONDENCE
Latest Itemsof Local News Furnished
By Our Regular Staff of Writers
All communications for this department

must be signed by the author; nor for pub-
lication, but as an evidence that the items
eontributer are legitimate and correct.
items hed it mere rumor, or such as are
likely to give offense, are not wanted.
We desire correspondence to reach our

*dice on Thursday, if at all possible. It
will be necessary, therefore, for most let-
ters to be mailed on Wednesday, or by
Fast Mail, west, on W. M. R. R., Thurs-
day morning. Letters mailed on Thurs-
day evening may not reach us in time.

UNIONTOWN.

NORTH EAST CARROLL.
--

There was a large attendance at
St. David's Sunday School pic-nic,
held on Saturday. The receipts
amounted to $400.00.
Mr. and Mrs. Howard Bowman vis-

ited at the home of Mr. and Mrs.
Harry Leese, of Hanover, on Sunday.
John Bupp, who has been employ-

ed at the carpenter trade, for the past
few months in Florida, has returned
to his home again.
About 2 miles of road have been

gone over with the first layer of
Those present were: Edward F. Stanley Stover, of this place; Mrs. stone, from the Maryland and Penn-

Eyler and wife, Mr. and Mrs. Lee- Nora Weikert, near White Hall; Mrs. sylvania state line to Hanover. The
hart, all of Belfontaine, Ohio; Mr. Violet Dixon, near town; Mrs. Mary detour will be placed in the near fu-
and Mrs. Geo. H. Eyler, of Union Stonesifer, Harrisburg; Mrs. Naomi ture.
Bridge; Clarence Eyler and wife and Harner, Johnstown, and Mrs. Helen Farmers are busy cutting the oats
family, of Hagerstown; Mr. and Mrs. Weaver, of this place. The funeral and picking the beans for the canning
Frank Stone, of Pa.; Mr. and Mrs. was held from her late home on Sun- factory.
Baker Frailey, and family, of Thur- day afternoon, at 2 o'clock. Rev. D. Mr. and Mrs. Marcellus Yost and
mont; Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Wilhide, and Kammerer, pastor of St. Paul's Luth- sons, Norman and John, spent Sun-
Mrs. Emma Ohler, all of Emmits- eran Church (of which she was a life day at Spring Grove, visiting at the
burg; Mr. and Mrs. Guy Lehmany,of long member) officiating. Interment home of Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Miller.

Mr. and Mrs. George Selby spent Fayetteville, Pa.; Mr. and Mrs. Chas. in Mt. Carmel aemetery this place.
the past week in Littlestown. Spielman and family, of Detour;Mrs. The pall-bearers were: Robert Wil-
D. Myers Englar and Henry Sittig Robert Spielman, of Detour; Mr. and son, Ira Swartz, Charles Stonesifer,

have been on the sick list. Mrs. H. L. Broadwater and family, Emory Collins, Albert Stock and
Mr. and and Mrs. W. F. Romspert, all of Union Bridge. I Ernest Ohler.

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Romspert and son We have had some glorious rains
of Philadelphia, were in town last the past week which was badly need- 

Russel Sterner,

Saturday, calling on friends. Carroll
Smith, who spent several weeks in
Philadelphia, returned Saturday, ac-
companied by Willis Romspert, who
will remain some time.
Norman Otto who had been on a

busines trip to the West, joined his
family here, Sunday, and all will re-
main a short time.
Miss M. Nellie Weaver, daughter

of Mr. and Mrs. H. H. Weaver, and
Robert Blanchard, of Holtsville, N.
Y., were married at that place, last
Saturday. The bride has held a po-
sition at the Santarium there for a
number of years. The newly weds
will be at the home of her parents,
this week, for some stay.

Will Brodbeck and Mrs. George
Robison, were week-end guests of
Mrs. Martha Hollenberry, returning
to Philadelphia, on Monday, accom-
panied Mrs. Brodbeek and daughter,
Catherine, who visited here the past
three weeks.
Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Smith of Ports-

mouth, Ohio, are visiting M. A. Zol-
lickoffer. Guests at the same home,
last Friday, were: Mr. and Mrs. W.
J. Payne, Miss Mary Zollickoffer, of
Richmond, Va.; Mrs. Elizabeth War-
field, of Westminster; Mrs. Joseph
Byron, of Hagerstown. go, Ill., Mrs. Fannie Potter, Mr. and

Little Ethel Erb, has been visiting Mrs. William potter, of Washington,
her aunt, Miss Alverta Erb. were entertained at the home of Mr.

Miss Joanna McKinstry, has been and Mrs. R. W. Galt, last Wednesday.
a guest of Miss Fidelia Gilbert, this The Potter family arrived at this
week, place last Sunday.
A new metal roof has been put on Mrs. Nora Ambrose, of Thurmont,

tour school house, lately. and son, George and bride, of Detroit,
Miss Dorothy McCabe spent a few Mich., spent a few days, last week,at

days with Miss Ida and Harry B. the home of the former's sister and
Mering. brother-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. M. W.
Miss Arietta Colifell, of Hampstead Bell, this place.

has been a visitor at W. G. Sega- I McClellen Zent, St. Louis, Mo.,after
foos's, the past week. spending several weeks with his par-

Mrs. Mary Eckard and grand- ents, Mr. and Mrs. W. F. Zent, near
daughter, Miss Louise Booker, of this place, and his sister and brother-
Wilmington, are guests at Thomas L. in-law, Mr. and Mrs. M. W. Bell, this
Devilbiss's. place, left for his home last Tuesday.
Dr. J. J. Weaver and daughter, Mrs. John Strawsburg, Jr., and

Mrs. Fox opened up the home, on daughter, Louise, of Union Bridge,
Tuesday. They expect to spend some visited at the home of Mr. and Mrs.
time here, and their friends will be Wm. Cover, recently.
glad to have them back. I C. E. Valentine spent last Sunday
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Reindollar, of

Baltimore, have come to their
mor home, on Clear Ridge, for
usual vacaticn.

NEW WINDSOR.

sum-
their

Charles Engel, a well known citizen
of this district, died at a sanatorium
at Laurel, on Thursday. His remains
were brought here Thursday night.
At this writing no funeral arrange-
ments' were made. He was a son of
the late Peter Engel and had charge
of the C. E. Engel store at this place
for a number of years. He leaves
one son, Edwin Engel, of Union
Bridge.

Miss Hortense Henry, is critically
ill with typhoid pneumonia.

Miss Marie Baile entertained a
nesday evening.
On Sunday evening last, about 10

o'clock a Ford coupe driven by a Mr.
Cross, from Westminster, failed to
make the turn on the Union Bridge
road, as it comes on Main St., and ran
off the road knocking down the posts
on J. F. West's porch.
Miss McCauley, of New York, is

visiting at George Walden's.
Miss Thelma Smith is spending

some time with her sister, Mrs. Dr.
Diller, at Detour.
Arthur Dou and wife entertained

relatives this week from Whiteford,
Md., and Washington.
The Methodist Fete drew quite a

large crowd to town, on Saturday
night last.
Norman Otto and family, of Wash-

ington, Forrest Otto and family, of
Baltimore, and Stanley Schnauffer
and family, of Towson, Md., all spent
Sunday last at John G. Snader's.

0 
MELROSE.

Recent visitors at the home of Mr.
and Mrs. D. Cyrus Leese were: Mr.
and Mrs. Jacob Hilbert, Mr. and Mrs.
Granville Leese, Mr. and Mrs. Ray-
mond Miller, Mr. and Mrs. Harry Le-
Gore, Harry Bolden, John Leese, Mr.
Tobias Leese, Anna LeGore, Hilda
Leese, Catherine LeGore, Jacob Mon-
ath, Curvin Leese and Frank Meckley.

Claude Leese spent the week-end
visiting friends, in Hanover.
Sunday visitors at the home of Mr.

and Mrs. A. M. Keesey's, were the
following: Mr. and Mrs. L. L. Royer
and daughter, Margaret, of Wood-
lawn, Md.; Mr. and Mrs. John Garner,
children, Rachel and Sterling; Mr.
and Mrs. Ralph Laughman and Mrs.
S. Smith, near Manchester.

Misses Nellie Zepp and Grace Frock
spent Monday in York.

Mrs. Charlie Sanduck is spending
several days of this week, in Balti-
more, shopping.
The residents of Melrose are now

busily engaged in "nipping" beans,
every day and night, and quite a
number are employed at the factory.
The road from Maryland State line

to Hanover is reported as being
closed to traffic, on Tuesday. All
persons traveling in cars, trucks or
vehicles will have to detour, on ac-
count of re-building the road.

UNION BRIDGE.

George H. Eyler was very much
surprised on Friday, July 3, to have
his brother, Edward F. Eyler, wife
and daughter and husband, Mr. and
Mrs. Leehart, of Belfontaine, Ohio,
to visit him. They had not seen each
other for forty-three years. On the
following Sunday there was a family
reunion held at the old homestead,
near Detour, at which there were 40
present. There was quite a sumptuous
dinner served or the lawn to which all
did justice.

ed.
H. L. Broadwater has improved his

dwelling with a fresh coat of paint,
which makes quite an improvement.
Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Bohn visited

Mrs. Bohn's home folks, this week.
Carroll Eichelberger will move in

Mrs. Catherine Fowble's house, on
Belvue Heights.
Paul Markel, of Tulsa, Oklahoma,

is spending his vacation with his
mother. Mrs. John Weaver.
J. W. Little has sold his store

goods and property to a New York
firm. They took possession last Sat-
urday.
Mack McGuire will make sale of

his household goods this Saturday,
and leave for Ohio.
0. J. Stonesifer is having a new

gutter laid in front of his dwelling.

KEYMAR.

Mr. and Mrs. D. S. Cover, sons
William and John, of York, Pa. were
entertained at the home of the
former's brother and sister-in-law,
Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Cover, and also
Mr. Cover's niece, Mrs. Nellie Cover
Hively, last Sunday.
Mr. and Mrs. M. G. Barr, of Chica-

in Frederick.
Dr. Artie B. Angell, of Baltimore,

spent Tuesday at the home of his
mother-in-law, Mrs. Fannie Sapping-
ton.
Mr. and Mrs. Daniel Leakin, of Bal-

timore, Mr. and Mrs. James Leakin,
of Johnsville, were entertained at the
home of the former's brother and
sister-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. John
Leakin.
Mr. and Mrs. M. W. Bell, accom-

panied by the latter's parents, Mr.
and Mrs. W. F. Zent, motored to
York, last Sunday, and spent the day
with Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Fields.

BRIDGEPORT.

Harry Fleagle, wife and son, of
Westminster, visited Jacob Stam-
baugh and family, on Sunday.
Miss Addie Baumgardner has re-

turned to her home, at Four Points,
after spending a week with her sis-
ter, Mrs. R. B. Ohler.
Daniel and Eugene Naill were in

Baltimore, at Maryland University
Hospital, and had their tonsils re-
moved this week.
Emory Ohler and wife entertained,

on Sunday, George Wagerman, wife
and children and John Ohler and wife
of near Emmitsburg.
Mrs. Asbury Fuss entertained, one

day last week, the following: Miss
Mary Loney, of Baltimore; Mrs.
Aaron Veant; Mrs. Jacob Stambaugh
and children; Mrs. Louis Fuss.
Harry Baker and wife spent Tues-

day night with Mrs. B.'s brother,
Jones Ohler, at Harney, who is very

Don't forget Tom's Creek festival,
this Saturday evening. Music will be
present. Preaching 10 o'clock, Sun-
day.

KEYSVILLE.

The annual outing of the Christian
Endeavor Society was held in Balti-
more. last Thursday. Dinner was
eaten at Gwynn Oak Park, while the
afternoon was spent at Druid Hill
Park.

Miss Verna Weybright, Gettys-
burg, is a guest of her cousins, the
Misses Ritter.
C. R. Cluts and wife, entertained

the following, Sunday: Edgar Boller,
wife and daughter, Geraldine,of Loys;
Guy Boller, wife and family, of Rocky
Ridge.

Keysville was well represented at
the Sunday School Convention, at
Westminster, on Tuesday.
W. E. Ritter, wife and family,spent

Sunday at Lloyd Durborrow's, near
Gettysburg.

FIRST IN THE SUMMER
vacation kit, put a bottle of
CHAMBERLAIN'S
COLIC and DIARRHOEA

REMEDY
Invaluable for sudden and severe pains
in stomach and bowels, cramps, diar-
rhoea. When needed - worth 50 times

the cost for single dose.
--Advertisement

LITTLESTOWN.
•

Mrs. Blanche Zercher, wife Harry
Zercher, died at her home, Thurs-
day evening, July 16, at 6:20 o'clock.
She was aged 50 years and 9 days.
Mrs. Zercher suffered a stroke of
paralysis eight years ago, and had
never recovered from the effects. She
was a daughter of William and the
late Mary Stover. Surviving her are
her husband, father, daughters, Mrs.
Edgar Huff and Miss Gladys, at home
Also the following brothers and sis-
ters survive, George, Robert and

son of Warren
Sterner, of York, and grandson of
Mrs. Lucinda Sterner, of this place,
figured in an automobile accident on
Sunday, between Abbottstown and
East Berlin, while driving a Chever-
let coupe where he struck a Ford
coupe.
Mr. and Mrs. Millard Engle and

children, Betty and Bobby, spent Sat-
urday and Sunday in Frederick,where
they attended the funeral of Mr.
Engle's sister, Mrs. Reuben F. Hann,
who died at her home near Lime
Kiln, Md., on Thursday. She was
buried in Mt. Olivet cemetery in
Frederick.
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Overholtzer and

George Overholtzer, of Taneytown,
were Sunday visitors in this place.
James Staub, spent Saturday with

his daughter, Mrs. Curvin Carbaugh
and family, at Mt. Pleasant.
Mr. and Mrs. Guy Eline and chil-

dren, are spending several days at
Dick's Dam, along the Conewago.

MAYBERRY.

Mr. and Mrs. Allen Becker and
daughter, Velma and Marguerite,Guy
Becker and Miss Mabel Diehl, Miss
Arabella Smith, of York; Mr: and
Mrs. Elmer Miller, daughters Virgi-
nia, Dorothy and Betty Jane, and
Miss Viola Becker,of Glen Rock;Miss
Rosalee Crouse, of Littlestown, all
spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. Ja-
cob Hetrick and family.
Mr. and Mrs. Carrollton Jones and

three children, spent Sunday with
Mr. and Mrs. Edgar Fleagle; also
called on the latter's sister, Mrs.
Thomas Keefer and family, on Sun-
day evening.

Miss Rosalee Crouse, of Littles-
town, spent a few days with Miss
Obel Bortner.
Mrs. Henry Grushon is visiting in

the home of Ellis Crushong for a few
days.

Jessie Unger is suffering with a
bad case of mumps.

Misses Helen and May Hymiller
have the mumps.
Mrs. Howard Shoemaker and little

daughter, Vivian, are spending sev-
eral days with her parents, Mr. and
Mrs. David Zentz, of Thurmont.
A very large crowd attended the

Pleasant Valley festival, on Satur-
day.

HARNEY.

The A. 0. K. of the M. C. festival,
on Wednesday evening, was largely
attended. Of course, we have al-
ways had good festivals, and this
year has been no exception. The
Boys' Club Band from Hanover kspt
things lively with their fine music.
On last Saturday and Sunday,

Mr. A. M. Waybright and daughter,
Grace, accompanied by John Way-
bright and wife, visited friends on
the Eastern Shore.

J. C. Davis, of Philadelphia, com-
monly called Jack, is spending a short
time calling on old friends and re-
newing old acquaintances. He is
looking well.
The rain during the early part of

the week seems to have put new life
into everything. Corn and tomatoes
are looking fine, and with a few more
rains, a large crop of each is ex-
pected.
Plowing is now the order of the

day, and the recent rains has made it
go fine.

This Saturday afternoon and eve-
ning, the Lutheran Sunday School
will hold their pic-nic and festivel.
Mechanics are putting down the

cork in the altar and aisles of the
Lutheran Church.

Piano Bargains.
Overstock sale of Pianos. We are

offering Pianos and Players at great
reduction. Rolls, Records, Scarf and
bench free. Ask for prices.—Nace's
Music Stores. 7-17-3t

—Advertisement

LINWOOD.

Mrs. Frank Stevenson and two chil-
dren, of Westminster, are visiting
Mrs. James Etzler.
Harry Miller and family, of Balti-

more, were callers at the home of S.
C. Dayhoff, on Sunday.
Miss Katherine Gilbert, of Union-

town, was the guest of Miss Elizabeth
McKinstry, on Sunday.
Lee Hines and Carroll Brandenburg

of Baltimore, were here with their
home folks, over Sunday.

Miss Julia Wilhide, of Ladiesburg,
is visiting her sister, Mrs. Calvin
Binkley.
While working at the canning fac-

tory, Saturday afternoon, Claude
Etzler left a crate of canned goods
fall on his foot, disabling him for a
while.

Misses Ruth and Louise Englar are
spending some time with their broth-
er, Charles. Englar and family, of
Baltimore.
Mrs. J. W. Messier and daughter,

and Miss Melba Messier, of Union
Bridge, spent Monday in Baltimore.
Preaching, Sunday morning, 10:30;

Evening, 7:45. The service last Sun-
day evening was very interesting.
Come to both services, this Sunday.

 0 
TWO TAVERNS.

Mr. and Mrs. Filbur Clapsaddle
and daughter, of Hanover, spent Sun-
day with Mr. and Mrs. Howard Sny-
der.

It has just been known that Miss
Olivia Neuman was married Wednes-
day evening, to Mr. W. Shu, of Big-

Mr. and Mrs. Herbert Shriver and
daughter Leone, and son, James,
spent Sunday in Taneytown.
Mr. and Mrs. Edward Weikert and

family, spent Wednesday evening
with his parents.
Now that harvest is over, it seems.

as if everyone is getting ready for
the pic-nics.
Holy Communion will be held at

Grace Lutheran Church, this Sunday.
Mr. and Mrs. L. U. Collins and

family, spent Saturday in Littlestown.

DETOUR

Mr. and Mrs. E. L. Warner visited
in Altoona, recently.

Miss Clara Adams and Miss Vic-
toria Weybright, who had their
tonsils removed at Frederick City
Hospital, recently, are getting along
nicely.
Mr. and Mrs. Charles DeBerry,

spent Sunday at Luray Cave.
Mrs. James Schildt returned from

the hospital last week, and still con-
tinues very ill.
Mr. and Mrs. Weirick, of Freder-

ick, are visiting at the home of Mr.
and Mrs. L. D. Troxell and family.

Bankrupt Jews of the 16th. Century
were compelled to wear green hats,
so that people might avoid losses by
trading with them.

DIED.
Obituaries, poetry and resolutions, charg-

ed for at the rate of live cents per line.
The regular death notices published free.

MRS. JAMES SHILDT.
Mrs. Addie, wife of James E.

Shildt, died at her home near Detour,
on Thursday morning, aged 57 years,
7 months, 11 days. Funeral services
will be held this Saturday morning,
meeting at the house at 10 o'clock.
Further services and interment at
Rocky Ridge Church of the Brethren.

MRS. AMELIA ANGELL.
Mrs. Amelia, widow of the late Mr.

Samuel L. Angell, died at the home of
her daughter, Mrs. Charles Witherow,
Washington, on Thursday evening,
July 23, from a stroke of paralysis,
aged about 75 years.
Funeral services will be held at

Keysville Lutheran Church, Monday
afternoon, at 2:00 o'clock.
She is survived by two sons and

two daughters; Harry F. Angell, of
Harney; Mrs. Fannie Reifsnider, of
Baltimore; Arthur E. Angell,_of Tan-
eytown, and Mrs. Charles Witherow,
of Washington.

MR. WIL1AAM T. SMITH.
William Tobias Smith was born

September 10, 1856, and died July 15,
1925, at a hospital in Richmond, Va.,
after an illness of only a few days of
ptomaine poison. His remains were
interred at his home town, Perkins-
ville, Goodland County, Va.
He leaves his wife and twelve chil-

dren. He is also survived by two
sisters, Miss Ann Smith, of Bridge-
port, Frederick Co., Md., and Mrs.
Fannie Brown, of Washington, D. C.
The deceased was the youngest son

of the late Philip Smith and grew to
manhood in Taneytown District, but
later moved to Virginia, where he re-
sided the remainder of his days.

MR. JAMES M. STONER.
Mr. James M. Stoner,the well known

undertaker and former Sheriff of Car-
roll County, died at his home at West-
minster, July 17, following a stroke
of paralysis, aged 65 years, 3 months,
21 days.
He was a son of the late George

and Mary Stoner, Stonersville, Car-
roll county. He was married to Miss
Mary Roller, Hanover, who survives
with the following children, Mrs.
Clayton Myers, Baltimore; Mrs. Earl
Tyler, Baltimore; James L. Stoner,
Stroudsville, Ohio; William McKinley
Stoner, Baltimore; Clarence W. Ston-
er, Littlestown; two grand-children,
James M. Stoner, Baltimore, and
Evelyn R. Stoner, Littlestown; also
by four sisters; Mrs. Howard E.
Koontz and Mrs. John E. Eckenrode,
Westminster; Mrs. Mordecai W.
Babylon, Baltimore;, and Mrs. Lea
Robinson, Littlestown.
Mr. Stoner was an active member

of the following lodges. Moose,
Knights of Pythias, Red Men, Owls,
Eagles, Odd Fellows, Independent
Order of Mechanics, P. 0. S. of A
Lodge of Pleasant. Valley. He was a
trustee of Krider's Reformed Church
and a consistent member of that
congregation for fifty years. In
politics he was a Republican and
keenly interested in the activities of
his party.
The funeral was held Monday at

1:00 P. M., meeting at the house, with
further services in Krider's Reformed
Church, the Rev. J. W. Reinecke, as-
sisted by the Rev. Dr. R. S. Patterson,
officiating.
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SCHOOL HOUSE
BARN PAINTS
Gray Red

7-Don't Make a Mi.rtalCe
There are tots of 73arn Paints
but only one of

SCHOOL
HOUSE
QUALITY

T
HE little School House trade-
mark means a real pure Lin-
seed Oil Pai:,t. Only English
Red Oxide is used in the Red

shade—that's why it stays RED.
Sure! it works easy and goes a long
way, but try it yourself

Reindollar Bros. & Co,

THE ryirAreffaeszej? STORE

Western Maryland College
WESTMINSTER, MARYLAND.

ALBERT NORMAN WARD, D. D.. LL. D., President.

For Young Men and Young Women.

Unexcelled Location, Modern Curriculum,

Complete Equipment, Modern Rates.

Graduates from approved High Schools

admitted without conditions.

Catalogue upon application.
6-26-10t

ATTORNEY'S SALE OF

Valuable Farm
in Uniontown District, Carroll Coun-

ty, Maryland.

By virtue of the power of sale con-
tained in a mortgage from Anna H.
Miller and John B. Miller, her hus-
band, to the Carroll County Savings
Bank, of Uniontown, Md., a body cor-
porate of the State of Maryland,
dated March 12, 1921, and recorded
among the Real Estate Mortgage
Records of Carroll County in Liber
E. 0. C. No. 74, Folio 61 &c., the un-
dersigned Edward 0. Weant, Attor-
ney named in said Mortgage will sell
at public sale upon the premises in
Uniontown District, Carroll County,
Maryland, and hereinafter more par-
ticularly described, on
TUESDAY, AUGUST 18, 1925,

at 1 o'clock, P. M., all that valuable
farm containing

80 V2 ACRES and 22 SQ. PER.
more or less, improved by an elegant
Brick House, 9 rooms, good bank barn
with silo attached, wagon shed, dairy
with concrete floor, chicken houses,
hog pens, wash house, smoke house
and work shop. This is a very desir-
able farm as the buildings are all in
good repair, the land in a high state
of cultivation and sufficient meadow
land, orchard of fine fruit, ample
supply of timber, and the farm is well
watered. This desirable small farm
is located on the road from the Un-
iontown Pike to Roop's Mill, about 1
mile North of Roop's Mill, in Union-
town District, Carroll County, Mary-
land, and was formerly owned and

I occupied by Anna H. Miller and hus-
band, and is now occupied by Charles
F. Pohler.
TERMS OF SALE—Cash; other

terms may be made by agreement
with the Carroll County Savings
Bank and the purchaser.

EDWARD 0. WEANT,
Attorney named in Mortgage.

J. N. 0. SMITH, Auct. 7-24-4t

Chick Raising is Made Safe

by feeding Rein-o-la Buttermilk
Starting Food. Sound wholesome
grains only are used—no by-products
No possibility of damage on account
of shipping. Always good, always
fresh. 15 years manufacturing ex-
perience back of it. Try it.—Rein-
dollar Bros. & Co. 4-3-tf

—Advertisement

Two Good Short Ones.

The day before she was to be mar-
ried a negro servant came to her
mistress and ask her to keep in safe-
ty some money she had saved.
"But why should I keep it for you?"

asked the mistress. "I thought you
were going to be married tomorrow."
"Dat's just it. I don't want to keep

all that money around, wid a strange
niggah in de house."

Judge: "So you weren't doing any-
thing when arrested?"

Rastus: "No sah. Ah was jest walk-
ing along down de street and singing
a little song when dis big Irish po-
liceman come along and started to
beat me up."
Judge: "What were you singing?"
Rastus: "Just a little song called

"Ireland must be heaven, cause mah
mothah came from theah."

Old Mr. Carter Helped
by Simple Mixture

"After taking Adlerika I feel bet-
ter than for years. At my age (60)
it is ideal—so different from other
medicines." (signed) W. W. Carter.
Adlerika is a simple mixture of buck-
thorn bark, glycerine, etc., which re-
moves GAS in ten minutes and often
brings surprising relief to the stom-
ach. Stops that full, bloated feeling.
Brings out old waste-matter you nev-
er thought was in your system. Ex-
cellent for chronic constipation. R.
S. McKinney, Druggist.

Advertisement

Didn't Know How to Talk.

The kind of weather we enjoyed
during June—or rather, that some of
us didn't enjoy—brings to mind a lit-
tle story that was popular a few
years ago.
A well-known gentleman was in

the habit of saying the wrong thing
every time he went out in society,
so finally his wife insisted that he
talk about nothing except the weath-
er. He tried it one hot evening in
June, and when he got home his wife
was indignant.

"I'll never go out with you again,"
she said, "until you learn how to
talk."
"What have I done now?" he want-

ed to know.
"Done! Why, you asked Mrs. Up-

stage how her husband is standing
the heat, and he's been dead for more
than a year."



SPECIAL NOTICES
SMALL ADVERTISEMENTS will be in-

serted under this heading at One Cent •
word, each week, counting name and ad-
dress of advertiser—two initials, or a date,
wsunted as one word. Minimum charge,
15 cents.
REAL ESTATE for sale, Two Cents each

word. Minimum charge, 25 cents.
APPLY AT RECORD OFFICE ads not

.secepted—but will receive sealed replies.
No personal information given.
THIS COLUMN is *pecially for Wants,

Lost, Found, Short Announcements, Per-
sonal Property for sale. etc.
„ALL NOTICES in this column must be
sualform in style.

-- ---
HIGHEST CASH Prices paid every

day for delivery of Poultry, Butter
and Eggs. Specialty, 50c for deliv-
ery of Calves all day Tuesday or'Wed-
mesday morning.—Angell & Carbaugh
Successors to G. W. Motter & Son. 

WANTED.—Butter, Eggs, Poultry,
Lard, Squabs and Calves at highest
prices. 50c a head for delivering
Calves. Highest prices paid for Hides
and Furs of all kinds.--Frances E.
Shaum's Produce. Phone 3-J 3-28-tf

STRAYED AWAY, Tuesday, 21st.,
14 Geese, white and blue, nearly half
grown.—Elmer Motter, Route 3, Tan-
eytown. 7-24-2t

BIG CHICKEN SUPPER—The
Missionary Society and Light Brigade
of Baust Lutheran Church, will hold
a fried Chicken and Ham Supper, on
the lawn of Mrs. H. L. Rinehart, in
Frizellburg, on Thursday evening,
July 30th. If the weather is unfav-
orable, it will be held the following
evening. Music by the Pleasant
Valley Band.

CARLOAD of Tested Cattle will be
received this Friday, the 24th.—Ray-
mond Wilson, Keymar.

ROOFING, SPOUTING and Pump
Repairing. For service see—Wilbur
Z. Fair, Taneytown, Md. Phone
-38E13. 7-24-4t

FRESH COW for sale by R. T. Pit-
tinger, on old John Stoner farm,near
Fairview School.

THE DATE: Aug. 19th. Occasion:
Community Pic-nic. Place: G. R.
Shriver's Grove, on Emmitsburg and
Taneytown State Road. 7-24-2t

FOR SALE—Barley and Oats—P.
H. Shriver, Taneytown.

NOTICE to Pythians of No. 36. The
Grand Vice Chancellor will be at our
Castle for the purpose of installing
the officers, on July 28th.

RUBBER-TIRE BUGGY, nearly
new, for sale by H. C. Welty, Keys-
ville, P. 0. Keymar.

ROAN HORSE, good worker and
sound. Will sell cheap.—Harr Y C.
Welty, Keysville.

PUBLIC SALE, Wednesday, July
29, of Horses, Colts, Ponies, Vehicles
and Furniture at New Windsor, Md.
—Halbert Poole.

5 FINE PIGS for sale 8 weeks old.
—William Study, near Kump.

STRAYED—Yellow and White
Male collie Dog, partly clipped, an-
swers to the name of "Bugles". Re-
ward, if returned to—John E. Shoe-
maker, Phone 31F3, Taneytown.

19 PIGS, 6 weeks old, for sale on
farm near Bearmount School-House.
—H. E. Fleagle, Mayberry, Md.

•
BARRED ROCK COCKERELS.—I

have 35 extra Special Cockerels, di-
rect from J. W. Parks' best Pedigreed
stock. "Standard Mating," 12 weeks
'old—$2.50 each for immediate deliv-
er'.—T. Dewey Ritter, Taneytown,
Md., Box 103. 7-17-3t

FOR SALE—Piano $130; like new,
ean been seen at home of Birdie Hess,
Copperville, or write Mrs. I. Pitting-
er, 1413 Madison Ave., Baltimore, Md.

' 7-10-3t

32x4 SILVERTOWN Cord Tires,
special price, $16.95; 33x4 Silvertown
Cords, $17.95; 34x4 Vacuum Cup
Fabrics, $14.98. Stock is limited.
Buy now.—Reindollar Bros. & Co.

6-26-tf

TOM'S CREEK Sunday School will
hold a festival, on the church lawn.
on Saturday evening, July 25. Every-
"body come. 7-10-3t

PRIVATE SALE.—Small property
of 37 Acres near Keysville, formerly
owned by the late Dr. George W.
Roop. Apply to Mrs. Bertha A. Roop
or Curtis L. Roop. 7-10-3t

TIRE SPECIALS-30x3 Fabric,
$6.98; 30 31/2 Fabric, $7.98; 30x31/2
Cords, $8.98; Vacuum Cup Cords,
30x31/2, $9.98. All first quality and
big bargains.—Reindollar Bros. &
Co. 6-26tf

FOR SALE-1 Farquhar Grain
Separator, No. 3; 1% H. P. Gas En-
gine; several 8-in. Feed Grinders;
Parts for lots of Autos.—S. I. Mack-
ley & Son, Phone 15-J, Union Bridge,
Md. 6-26-tf

PIANOS—Singer, $75.00; Steiff,
$98.00; Kingsbury, $148; Heinecamp,
$198; Esty, $248; Radle, $298; Lehr,
$325; Hallet Davis, $348; Good Play-
er, 100 Rolls, $298; Beautiful New
Mahogany Player, 50 Rolls $398;
Electric Coin Player, $298. Large
Cabinet Victrola, 50 Records, $85.00.
—Cramer's Direct from Factory Piano
"House, Frederick, Md. 6-5-10t

FAT HOGS WANTED, who has
them ?—Harold Mehring. 44-3-tf

FOR SALE—Fine Homes, im-
proved by Brick and Frame Houses
and all improvements, in and out of
town.—D. W. Garner, Real Estate
Broker. 10-5-tf

WIPING RAGS WANTED.—Will
pay Sc per pound for large clean cot-
ton rags—calico, gingham or muslin
—old garments, free from buttons and
hooks, small scraps not wanted. Light
weight knit goods will do, if free from
lint. Not over 50 lbs. wanted, in all,
for prompt delivery—The Record Of-
fice, Taneytown.

Subscribe for the RECORD

Midsummer Care of Your Baby.

A bulletin just issued by the Bureau
of Child Hygiene of the State Depart-
ment of Health gives this advice to
mothers on the midsummer care of
the baby.
"For many years, the latter part of

the summer, from the middle of July
to the end of September, has been the
time of the year when there has been
the greatest amount of sickness and
death from intestinal diseases among
babies and young children.
"The experience of recent years in

many parts of the country has shown
that illness from these causes is not
necessary and can be prevented.
Where babies are brought up under
medical direction, if proper care is
given to their food, and to their daily
routine, this dreaded summer com-
plaint is largely done away with. In
many communities the danger to the
lives of babies is considerably less
even in hot weather than at other
times of the year.
"The precautions to be observed by

mothers in the care of their children
in warm weather are so simple that
they can be carried out easily every-
where. They can be summerized
briefly as follows:
1—"Intervals between feedings

should never be more frequent than
three hours, and most babies would
do better if fed at four intervals, that
is, five or at most, six times in twen-
ty-four hours. This gives an oppor-
tunity for the food to pass from the
stomach into the intestines, which
takes three or four hours, before ad-
ditional food is given. Cooled, boiled
water can be given freely in hot
weather between feedings.

2—"lVfother's Milk. No food is
comparable to mother's milk; it is
especially useful in hot weather.
Mother's milk is exactly suited to the
needs of the baby; it is practically
without germs and is usually given in
just the quantities that the baby re-
quires. A baby should not be weaned
duping the summer if it is possible to
feed it on mother's milk.
3—"Clean Cows' Milk. The next

best substitute for mother's milk is
clean cows milk diluted with water
according to the doctor's direction.
The mixture should be boiled for two
or three minutes and then cooled be-
fore feeding the baby. It is impossi-
ble to prevent germs from entering
cows xnilk, even if it is produced un-
der good conditions. Boiling will
practically destroy these harmful
germs and make the milk safer for
young children. When cows' milk is
used, it is especially advised that the
feeding intervals be four hours apart.
4—"Clothing. The baby and young

child should be dressed according to
the temperature and not according to
the season. During very warm weath-
er, when the thermometer hovers
around 90 degrees, a little baby re-
quires nothing but its napkin. A light
blanket or a dress should be at hand
to put on the bady if there is a sudden
fall in temperature.
5—"Sponging. Babies are made

much more comfortable during hot
weather if they are stripped and
sponged with tepid water two or three
times a day. Very young babies, es-
pecially in warm weather, should be
brought up under a doctor's care. The
mother should notify her doctor of
even slight changes in the baby's con-
dition.

"Intestinal disease can usually be
cured if treated promptly, but if al-
lowed to run on, it is always a serious
matter in hot weather."

Contesting Brookhart's Election.

The legal battle to oust Senator
Brookhart, of Iowa, and to seat his
Democratic contestant, Steck, is now
under way, the first step being the
recount of about 750,000 ballots,which
is expected to require about six
weeks time. Brookhart, insurgent
Republican was given a majority of
755 votes on first count, and 1385 by
a second count.

Steck rests his claims on the re-
jection of some 2000 ballots, marked
for him, but which were invalidated
under the state laws because of cer-
tain distinguishing marks on them.
Many of Steck's votes came from

regular Republicans, who refused to
support Brookhart because he bolted
the regular Republican ticket and
joined La Follette. Steck says that
many such regular Republicans,seek-
ing to vote the straight Republican
ticket with the exception of Brook-
hart, marked an "X" at the top of
the ballot for the Republican nomi-
nees and then marked an "X" before
Steck's name, with an arrow to at-
tract especially the attention of the
election official.
Under a strict interpretation of

the Iowa law, these "arrow" ballots
are considered mutilated and invalid.
Steck contends that the intention of
the voter was obvious, and that if the
committee allows the counting of the
"arrow" ballots he will be declared
winner. Brookhart men, on the oth-
er hand, say that virtually all such
ballots were counted for Steck, and
that the few that were thrown out
change the final result.

"Hobson's choice" is so called be-
cause of the practice of Thomas Hob-
son, of Cambridge, England, who in
1631 conducted a livery and required
every customer to take the horse
which stood nearest the door.

Some Rattler.

"Back where I come from," declar-
ed the backwoodsman, "my pap he
tamed him a rattlesnake; and you
wouldn't believe how fond that there
reptyle got of him. Followed him
around like a dog and et from his
hand. Folks come from miles away
to see. Pap took Rattles along when
we moved to town. One night a
burglar broke into the house and
throwed a gun on pop. Looked like
his time had come. But all of a sud-
den that there snake made a spring,
wropped hisself around the burglar's
arms and then rattled his tail out of
the window until a policeman come
and got the thief."—Country Gentle-
man.
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Madge Bellamy
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Charming Madge Bellamy was born

in Hillsboro, Texas, and received her

education in San Antonio. She is 5

feet 3 inches tall, weighs 112 pounds,

has dark hair and brown eyes. One

of the most beautiful of "movie"

stars, she has been seen in some of
the most popular pictures.
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RICKETS

RICKETS, or rhachitis. Is the result
of bad nutrition, affects all the

tissues of the body, and chiefly leaves
its nvirk on the bones—which it soft-
ens and then deforms.

It usually occurs before the third
year, but the bone deformities appear
later.

It is caused by food which is not
assimilated, but also by neglect of the
skin, bad air, Insufficient sleep, etc.
The children of the poor have it, but

so do those of the rich. In this coun-
try, it is common among negroes and
Italians, but not among Irish or Ger-
mans.
In the great European cities one

sees it everywhere. The urine of
rhachitic children contains phosphates
In abundance and the bones, being de-
ficient in lime, bend and break easily.
Rhachitic children have soft spots

in the bones of the skull; and the
membranous portions of the skull,
where you notice throbbing and pulsa-
tion in an infant, and which ought to
harden during the first few months of
life, remain soft.

All the bones of the skull, instead of
being firmly united, are loose and eas-
ily moved.
The face of a rhachltic baby is

small, and the head seems dispropor-
tionately large.
The liver, spleen and lymphatic

glands are enlarged, the muscles soft,
and the ligaments weak.
The child's appetite may be good, he

may even seem voraciously hungry,
but his food doesn't appear to nourish
him, he becomes fretful, gets diarrhea
and this alternates-with constipation.
He is sensitive, cries when touched,

his diarrhea is offensive, the appear-
ance of his teeth is delayed, and when
they break out, they are irregular and
of poor quality.
When he begins to walk, the weak-

ness of the bones of the legs becomes
apparent and they bend or break
easily; the joints are weak and he
falls frequently.
When he tries to move himself

with his arms, the arm bones bend
or break and there may be an out-
ward hump on the spine.
On the ends of the ribs there are

knobs or bead-like structures, the
breast bone projects and the child
becomes pigeon breasted.
The pelvis may become deformed

and, in females, this has a very im-
portant bearing upon the successful
delivery of .offspring, if Impregnation
should ever occur.

Rhachitic children are frequently
bow-legged, knock-kneed or flat-foot-
ed; they are also sensitive to bron-
chitis and croup, and die from these
diseases more frequently than children
who have better physical develop-
ment.
If they reach maturity, they are

short and poorly formed and their
limbs often reveal the marks of early
disease.

Rhachitic children should be taken
to the mountains or seashore, if possi-
ble, and should have abundance of
good plain food which they can as-
similate—which will be Indicated by
the change in their stools and in their
general nutrition.
Fats in the form of cod-liver oil,

or olive oil, should be given them;
also as much of eggs, milk and cereals
as they can dispose of. Treatment
with mechanical apparatus is impor-
tant to prevent deformities, and they
should have all possible benefit from
public parks, sea-baths, sleep, fresh
air, and life in the country when this
can 1-)c prov.

(g by George Matthew Adams )
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Pneumatic linings for automobile
cushions have been invented that can
be inflated to take the place of springs
and padded upholstery.

Famous Royal Cords
for Heavy and Extra

Heavy Service

THE reports you hear every
day about the remarkable

service of U. S. Royal Cords
indicate how well they are do.
ing the job.

Their Latex-treated Web
Cord construction gives them
wear-fighting quality that
stands up under the hardest
kind of service over all kinds
of roads.

For heavy service in all sizes
choose the U. S. Royal Cord;
for extra heavy service on larger
cars, buses and light trucks—
the U. S. Bus-Truck Tire; for
specially severe service on light
cars the U. S. Royal Cord Extra
Heavy in 30 x 31/2 Clincher
and 32 x 4 Straight Side.

Trade Mark

Buy U. S. Tires from
L. IL DERN, Taney-town, Md.
TANEYTOWN GARAGE, Taneytown, Md.
THURMONT GARAGE, Thurmont, Md.
W. H. DERN, Frizellburg, Md.

UNITED STATES TI

51ORT'S TIRE SHOP, Emmitsburg, Md.
UNION BRIDGE MACH WORKS, Union Bridge.
BAKERS GARAGE, New Windsor, Md.
WEST END GARAGE, Union Bridge, Md.

RES ARE GOOD TIRES

Notice to Carroll
County People!
The Directors of the Carroll

County Fair Association have
authorized our firm to sell the

Entire Farm
adjoining the Fair Grounds,
near Taneytown; therefore,
we will sell the

HOUSE, BARN AND
75 ACRES,

in addition to the

100 BUILDING LOTS

and small tracts, to be sold

SATURDAY, AUGUST 1.1925
HAMMOND & OGLE,

Auctioneers and Developers,
1213 Fidelity Building,

BALTIMORE, MD.

Victrolas Reduced.
On account of our stock being too

large we are offering the $110.00 Vic-
trola and ten records for $100.00. Oth-
er models reduced. Terms easy.—
Nace's Music Stores. 7-17-3t

--Advertisement

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.
This is to give notice that the sub-

scriber has obtained from the Orphans'
Court of Carroll County letters of admin-
istration upon the estate of

JAMES T. SHORE,
late of Carroll County, deceased. All per-
sons having claims against the deceased,
are hereby warned to exhibit the same,
with the vouchers properly authenticated,
to the subscriber, on or before the 21st.
day of February, 1926; they may other-
wise by law be excluded from all benefits
of said estate.
Given under my bands this 24th. day of

July, 1925.

SARAH A. SFIORB,
7-24-5t Administratrix.

Avoid Touching a Live Wire.

While touching a live wire is a
thing for all of us to avoid, street rail-
way linemen sometimes find it useful
to know just how to test wires by the
sense of touch. When a trolley line
is down and a repair crew arrives it
is not at all uncommon for a "hand
test" to be tried, in order to determine
whether or not the wire is a "live" or
a "dead" one.

Old linemen say that in hand testing
the workman may touch or tap the
wire with the back of the hand, but
never with the palm or the inside of
the fingers. The reason for this rule
is simple. If the wire is charged with
electricity, and one touches it with
the inside of the hand, the muscles of
the hand will be contracted toward the
wire, causing the hand to close tight-
ly about the dangerous strip of metal.

LOOK! LOOK!
25c Sale

JULY 24th. to 31st.
inclusive

2lbs. California Dried Peaches, 2.5c
2 15c Jars Peanut Butter, 25c
2 Cans new Pack Early June Peas,25c
2 Cans String Beans, 25c
2-lbs Extra good Ginger Snaps, 25c
2 15c Glasses of Jelly, 25c
12 15c Bottles Black Flag, 25c
2 15c Jars Sweet Pickles, 25c
2 Bottles Rosebud Cherries, 25c

20c Jars Relish, 25c
2 Packs Seeded Raisins, 25c
2-lbs Seedless Raisins, 25c
2 Quart Jars Cocoa, 25c
50 Pieces Penny Candy, 25c
1 4 ounce Bottle Vanilla, $5c
7 Rolls Toilet Paper, 25c
8 Cakes Toilet Soap, 25c
3 Packs Cccrn Flakes, 25c
3 Cans Pork and Beans, 25c
3-lbs. Soup Beans, 25c
5 Cans B. T. B. Cleanser, 25c
1 16 ounce Jar or Bucket Peanut But-

ter, 25c
3 Glasses Best Mustard, 25c
1-lb Best English Walnuts, 25c

RIFFLES'

No other lye ispacked so safely and conve-
!gently, or is so economical—not a bit wasted.
No other lye or soap cleans and disinfecta

SO easily and thoroughly as Banner Lye. IS
is not old-style lye. Odorless and colorless;
the greatest cleanser and disinfectant the
world has ever known. Use it for cleaning
your kitchen, cellar, sinks, dairy, milk-pans
and bottles, forsoftening water, and the labor
of washing and cleaning will be cut in half.

Makes pure soap
and saves money besides. _ A can of
Banner Lye, 5% pounds of kitchen grease,
ten minutes' easy work (no boiling or large
kettles), and you have 10 pounds of best hard
soap or 20 gallons of soft soap.
Banaer Lye Is sold by your grocer or druggist%

Write to us for tree booklet. "We: of Balmer Lye.

The Penn Chemical Works Philadelphia U SA
5-29-12t

iSmooth OUt
Hills With

ETNOLIN.THE WONDER MOTOR FUEC
Insure

MORE SPEED
GREATER MILEAGE
and decidedly

LESS CARBON

REXOUNE
MOTOR OIL

can be relied on for perfect
and complete lubrication at
all times.

SHERWOOD BROS. INC.



FORCED PULLETS ARE
BEST EGG PRODUCERS

James E. Rice of the Cornell uni-
versity experiment station issued a
bulletin relative to the possibilities of
feeding early hatched pullets during
the summer by retarded or forced
feeding.
By retarding is meant the idea that

feeding is necessary during the late
summer to check the early tendency
of laying, with the hope of getting a
larger egg yield In the early winter.
By forced feeding is meant the giv-

ing of a rich stimulating mash to in-
duce egg production.
Concerning the results of his work

Mr. Rice has certain findings drawn
from data which are submitted be-
low:

1. Forced pullets made a better prof-
it than retarded pullets.
2. Forced pullets ate less food per

hen at less cost per hen than retard-
ed pullets.

8. Forced pullets produced more
eggs of a larger size, at less cost per
dozen than retarded pullets.
4. Forced pullets produced more

eggs during early winter than retard-
ed pullets.

5. Forced pullets have better hatch-
ing results of eggs than retarded put-
lets.

6. Forced pullets made a better per-
centage of gain in weight than re-
tarded pullets.
7. Pored pullets showed less brood-

InTh than retarded pullets.
8. Forced pullets had less mortality

than retarded pullets.
9. Forced pullets showed better vig-

or than retarded pullets.
10. Forced pullets showed the first

nature molt earlier than retarded pul-
lets.

11. Retarded pullets gave better fer-
tility of eggs than forced pullets.

12. Hopper-fed dry mash gave bet-
ter results in gain of weight, produc-
tion of eggs, gain in weight of eggs,
hatching power of eggs, days lost in
molting, mortality, health and profit
per ben, than wet mash.

13. Wet mash and grain-fed pullets
consumed slightly less food at less
cost, and produced eggs at slightly less
cost per dozen than dry mash and
grain-fed pullets.

14. Wet mash and grain-fed pullets
produced slightly larger eggs of slight-
ly better fertility, and showed less
broodiness than dry mash and grain-
fed pullets.

15. Dry mash and grain-fed pul-
lets laid eggs of good size at an ear-
lier period than wet mash and grain-
fed pullets.

16. Hopper-fed pullets ate more than
hand-fed pullets.
17. Pullets having whole grain ate

more grit and shell than those having
a proportion of ground grain.

18. Pullets fed on grain were more
inclined to develop bad habits than
those having a mash.

19. Earliest producers did not give
as many eggs in early winter.

20. Early layers gained as rapidly
in - weight as those beginning later to
lay.

21. Prolificacy made by slight dif-
ference in weight of hen and weight
of egg.

22. The most prolific pullets did not
always lay earliest.

Give Pullets Best Feed
and Careful Attention

"The success of the poultryman is
measured very largely by the quality
of the pullets with which he replen-
ishes his flock," says Martin Decker,
poultry research specialist at the New
Jersey agricultural experiment sta-
tion.•
"Great care should be exercised to

keep the pullets growing uniformly
from hatching to maturity, as a check
or setback will cause them to mature
too late for winter laying. Develop-
ment is best promoted by free range
with an abundance of shade and green
food.
"We feed grain and keep mash be-

fore the growing stock continually,
The mash is composed of nearly the
same combination as our laying mash,
but the pullets tend to begin laying
too early if allowed too much of it.
We must figure on having the pullets
come into production about the middle
of October, or before cold weather
sets in.
"The pullets should be transferred

to winter quarters, gradually-a few
at a time. Do not put on the lights
until they have become accustomed to
their new surroundings. Then feed
the laying flock the following rations:

Mash
100 lbs. wheat bran
100 lbs. wheat middlings
100 lbs. cornmeal
100 lbs. ground oats
100 lbs. meet scrap

Grain
100 lbs. wheat
100 lbs. cracked corn
100 lbs. oats.

Hens Pasture Feeders
Hens are pasture feeders, though

seldom considered such on many
farms, in that they are fenced away
from good pasture. J. G. Halpin of
the poultry department of the Univer-
sity of Wisconsin says that a heavy-
laying hen will not last long unless
the bowels are kept in a laxative con-
dition. Most poultry keepers find green
stuff more practical than drugs. Green
feed adds the necessary bulk to the
ration and apparently assists in the
assimilati,- of mint:rats.

Pure-Bred Sires
Bring Improvement

Use of Better Bulls Increases
Milk Production.

(Prepared by the United States Department
of Agriculture.)

"No other great improvement in our
dairy herds can be obtained at so low
a cost as the improvement by the use
of better bulls." This comment is
made by the bureau of dairying, Unit-
ed States Department of Agriculture,
in the foreword of a new directory of
co-operative bull associations in the
United States.
The statement is based on the com-

parative milk and butterfat records of
large numbers of cows and of their
daughters sired by pure-bred bulls. In
milk production the daughters ex-
celled their dams by 14.5 per cent,
on an average, and in butterfat pro-
duction by 16 per cent. These figures
represent an increased milk yield of
966 pounds and an increased butter-
fat yield of 48 pounds. That the in-
creases are due to qualities inherited
from the pure-bred sires is a fair con-
clusion based on the knowledge that
In nearly every case the dams and
daughters were in the same herd and
received the same care.
The new directory shows that at

the beginning of this year there were
220 co-operative bull associations in
the United States. These associations
owned 1,003 carefully selected pure-
bred dairy sires. While the increase
in production because of good breed-
ing is very noticeable in the first gen-
eration, the benefits are also ac-
cumulative, though the gains are
usually less rapid in subsequent gen-
erations.

Ten Commandments for
Owners of Dairy Cows

1. Thou shalt feed the milk cows
enough-all they will eat.

2. Feed the cows according to their
production; about one pound of grain
to from three to four. pounds of milk.

3. Thou shalt grow a balanced ra-
tion for the cows on your farm; sweet
clover and alfalfa are necessary.

4. Feed the cows a ration made up
of several feeds for variety.

5. Thou shalt strive to provide a
succulent feed-corn silage is best.

5. Feed a bulky, palatable ration,
including salt.

7. Weigh and test the milk and esti-
mate the cost of the feed to determine
which cows are helping you pay the
bills.
8. Thou shalt not allow the cows to

stay out of doors until they are
chilled; provide a comfortable shelter.
9. Thou shalt not force the cows to

drink ice cold water-and water them
at least twice a day.

10. Thou shalt not covet thy neigh-
bor's cows, thou shalt not covet thy
neighbor's feed supply, nor his cream
check, nor his barns, nor anything
that is thy neighbor's, but shall plan
to produce plenty of farm-grown feed,
get a pure-bred bull, and hustle to out-
do thy neighbor at producing butter-
fat profitably that thy days may be
long and happy in the Land of the Da-
kotas.-J. R. Dice, North Dakota Ag-
ricultural College.

Prevention Best Remedy
for Chicken Diseases

When one goes into a chicken house
and hears the birds singing, it is a
pleasant contrast to the appearance
of a flock that is droopy, with pale
combs and indicating a general un-
healthy condition. The difference In
the majority of cases is not due to
one producer curing the disease and
the other not curing it, but rather to
the fact that one breeder prevents the
trouble that is affecting the other per-
son's flock.
Most cases of roup and similar con-

tagious diseases are the result of the
disease being brought to the farm with
new fowls which were not isolated
until they had been proved to be
healthy. Sometimes the disease comes
from an outbreak of a previous attack
after which the premises were not
properly cleaned up and disinfected.
Lice and mites can do a great

amount of harm if they have their
own way. The good poultryman does
not wait until they get a strong foot-
hold in the flock, but carries on a pre-
ventive war on such pests.

FARM FACTS-0
Keep liquid manure containers cov-

ered so flies and mosquitoes can't breed
in them.

• • •

Sweet clover and alfalfa are well
adapted to the upland portion of the
cut-over lands.

• • •

The raising of legumes presents the
only feasible method of supplying ni-
trogen to the soil.

• • •

Bury dead fowls deep in the ground
where dogs and hogs cannot get at
them, or better still, burn them to
ashes.

• • •

Poison gets woodchucks ten times as
fast as you can shoot them. Ask your
county agent for information about
poisons and methods

• • *

Cracked yellow corn contains more
heat and energy value for baby chicks
than rolled or pin-head oats, and is
considerably cheaper.

• • *

Dairymen find that it pays to keep
records of their cows. Some of the
boarders are being sold for beef and
better sires are being purchased.

African Oil Palm Has
Great Variety of Uses

Unlike the date and the coconut
palm, the oil palm is not at all well
known. Nevertheless, It is exceeding-
ly useful. In the Congo, writes Mr.
Isaac F. Marcosson in "An African Ad-
venture," and for that matter in vir-
tually all of the West Africa, it is the
staff of life.
Thousands of years ago the Egyp-

tians used the sap for embalming the
bodies of their kingly dead. Today the
oil palm not only represents the most
Important agricultural industry of the
colony-it has long since surpassed
rubber as the premier product-but it
has an almost bewildering variety of
uses. It is food and drink and shelter.
Fr= the trunk the native extracts
his wine; from the fruit comes oil for
soap, for salad dressing and for ma'r-
garine; with the leaves the native
makes a roof for his house; with the
fiber he makes his mats, his baskets
and his strings for fishing nets. The
wood itself he uses in building.
An oil palm will bear fruit within

seven years after the young tree is
planted. The fruit comes in what is
called a regime, which restunbles a
huge bunch of grapes; each fruit in
the cluster is approximately the size
of a large date. The outer part, which
is called the pericarp, is almost en-
tirely yellow oil incased in a thick
skin. Imbedded in the oil is the ker-
nel, which contains a finer oil. The
fruit is boiled down, and the kernels
are dried and exported in bags to
England, where they are broken open
and the oil in them used for making
margarine.

For hundreds of years the natives
have gathered the fruit of the palm
and have extracted the oil. The waste
at first was enormous; the blacks
threw away the kernels because they
were unaware of the valuable sub-
stance inside.-Youth's Companion.

Legends of First Man
Common to All Races

Almost every race of people has
legends regarding the first man and
woman. Among North American In-
dians myths are common. Traditions
trace back our first parents to white
and red maize; another Is that man,
searching for a wife, was given the
daughter of the king of the muskrats,
who in being dipped into the waters
of a neighboring lake, became a wom-
an. One of the strangest stories con-
cerning the origin of woman is told
by the Madagascarenes. Insofar as
the creation of man goes, the legend
Is not unlike that related by Moses,
only that the fall came before Eve
had arrived. After the man bad eat-
en the forbidden fruit he became af-
fected with a boil on the leg, out of
which, when it burst, came a beauti-
ful girl. The man's first thought was
to throw her to the pigs; but he was
commanded by a messenger from
heaven to let her play among the grass
and flowers until she was of marriage-
able age, then to make her his wife.
He did so, called her Barbara, and
she became the mother of all races of
men.

Fowl Names
The fat plumber was in a philosophi-

cal mood.
"There is simply no understanding

woman," he observed.
•"Whaddye mean?" the thin carpen-
ter asked, just to start the conversa-
tion.
"Well, for instance, a woman does

not object to being called a duck."
"No."

"And she even smiles if some one
happens to refer to her as a chicken."
"Too true."
"And most of them will stand for

being called squab, broiler or turtle-
dove."
"Yes, yes, but what's the idea?"

"It's just this," the fat plumber ex-
claimed, "a woman objects to being
called a hen, and a hen is the most
useful bird of the whole blooming
bunch."-Popular Poultry.

Ancient College Custom
A person who fulls to pass an ex-

amination is said to have been
"plucked." This meaning of the word
has a curious origin. In olden days
when degrees were conferred in Ox-
ford two proctors marched solemnly
down the hall and back. Tradesmen
with grievances-namely, unpaid bills
-would sit on the benches and pluck
the proctor's gown as he passed. If
the bill was big enough and the trades-
man proved his case, the undergradu-
ate was refused his degree. Hence
the term "plucked," which, now that
its origin is forgotten, is used for fail-
ing in examinations of any kind. The
proctors still march up and down the
hall, but of course their gowns are no
longed plucked.

Why the Strife?
We are told that Cineas the philoso-

pher once asked Pyrrhus what he
would do when he had conquered
Italy.
"I will conquer Sicily."
"And after Sicily?"
"Then Africa."
"And after you have conquered the

world?"
"I will take my ease and be merry."
"Then," asked Cineas, "why can you

not take your ease • and be merry
now?"-Sir John Lubbock.

Judge for Yourself
"How old is she?"
"I can't say, but on her last birth-

day, when they brought on the cake
with the candles, several of the vis-
itors nearly fainted with the heat."

. - r es pona c.:r
John McCormack, the famous sing-

er, receives a great many letters from
aspirants to musical fame.
At a dinner in New York Mr. Mc-

Cormack read a letter that had been
sent to him under the erroneous im-
pression that he taught voice produc-
tion. The letter, dated from the Mid-
dle West, ran:
"Friend John-Please let me know

your lowest rates for full correspond-
ence course in voice production. I have
no voice, but as the efficiency engineer
business is not what it was represent-
ed to me by the International Efficien-
cy School of Correspondence, I desire
to abandon same in favor of grand
opera, and if you can produce me a
fine tenor voice I will be glad to pay,
in addition to regular charges, a cash
bonus and a generous percentage of
salary receipts for a term of years. An-
swer by return."

PUBLIC SALE

fine farms & Apple Orchard
NEAR MAYBERRY, MD.

The undersigned, executor of Dr.
Luther Kemp, late of Carroll Co.,
Md., deceased, by virtue of a power
of sale contained in last will and
testament of said deceased, and also
by virtue of an order of the Orphans'
Court of Carroll County, Maryland,
will offer at public sale, on

TUESDAY, JULY 28, 1925,
at 1 o'clock, on the premises on the
Stone Road from Littlestown pike at
Mt. Pleasant to Marker's Mill, about
3 miles from the former, and 2 miles
from the latter, that very desirable
farm No. 1 of which the late Dr.
Luther Kemp died, seized and pos-
sessed, containing
144 ACRES, 3 ROODS, 34 PERCHES
of land, more or less. The improve-
ments consist of a fine Weather-
boarded Dwelling House, large bank
Barn, Wagon Shed, Corn Crib, Wash
House, Large Hog Pen, and other
outbuildings; a never-failing water
supply. The land is in a high state
of cultivation.

APPLE ORCHARD 22 ACRES.
On this farm is a fine young apple

orchard in good bearing condition.
The properties will be offered separ-
ately and as a whole. Also No. 2
Farm containing

11 ACRES 20 SQ. PERCHES
of land, more or less, improved by a
Weatherboarded Dwelling House,new
Barn, Wash House and all necessary
outbuildings. This farm will be sold,
the purchaser receiving the estate's
share of growing yellow corn, also
the right to put out fall crop.
TERMS OF SALE ON REAL ESTATE.

-One-third of the purchase money to be
paid on the day of sale, or upon the rati-
fication of the sale by the Court, and the
residue in two equal payments of 6 and
12 months, on the notes of the purchasers,
with approved security, bearing interest
from the day of sale, or all cash at the
option of the purchasers.

PERSONAL PROPERTY.
Also at the same time and place

will sell the following personal prop-
erty:
SAMSON MODEL M. TRACTOR,
power 10-20; gasoline engine, Lam-
bert, 21/2 horse power; Nonpariel
lime drill, tractor disc harrow, Oliv-
er tractor plow, 200 locust posts, lot
half inch galvanized piping.
TERMS OF SALE on personal. Sums of

$.5.00 and under, cash; on larger sums a
credit of 6 months will be given on note
with security bearing interest from day
of sale. No property to be removed until
settled for.

JOHN A. YINGLING.
Executor of Dr. Luther Kemp,
Deceased.

J. N. 0. SMITH, Auct. 7-3-4t

TRUSTEES' SALE
- OF -

VALUABLE REAL ESTATE
in Uniontown District, Carroll Coun-

ty, Maryland.

By virtue of a decree of the Cir-
cuit Court for Carroll County, passed
in cause No. 5611 Equity, wherein
John H. Utermahlen, et. al., are
plaintiffs and Margaret S. Flicking-
er, et. al are defendants, the under-
signed Trustees appointed by said
decree will sell at public sale on the
premises, located near Bearmount
School-house, in Uniontown District,
Carroll Cothity, on
SATURDAY, AUGUST 15, 1925,

at 2 o'clock, P. M., all that valuable
little farm of which William H. Uter-
mahlen, died, seized and possessed,
containing

38 ACRES, 2 Rds. and 33 SQ. PER.

OF LAND, more or less, which was
conveyed unto the said William H.
Utermahlen by John Utermahlen and
wife by deed dated December 23rd.,
1890, and recorded among the Land
Records of Carroll County in Liber
B. F. C. No. 72, Folio 130, etc., it ad-
joins the lands of Charles Black,
Charles S. Marker, David E. Myerly
and others; it is improved by a two-
story weatherboarded

DWELLING HOUSE,
bank barn, hog pen, chicken house,
and other necessary outbuildings;
there is good water at the house and
barn, there is an orchard of good
fruit, about 5 acres in meadow and 6
6 acres in timber land, the remainder
is tillable land. Except the land
which is now in growing crops, pos-
session can be given as soon as the
terms of sale are complied with.
TERMS OF SALE-One-third cash

on the day of sale or upon the rati-
fication thereof by the Court, the
residue in two equal payments of one
year and two years respectively, the
credit payments to be secured by the
notes of the purchaser, with approv-
ed security, bearing interest from the
day of sale, or all cash at the option
of the purchaser.

JOHN H. UTERMAHLEN,
MAURICE E. UTERMAHLEN,

Trustees.
THEO. F. BROWN, Attorney.
J. N. 0. SMITH, Auct. 7-17-4t

WE ALL AGREE-
7hat:-TOMORROW is a word too often used in

framing an excuse.
That:-SEEDS never grow until planted.
That:-DOLLARS do not increase unless they are

set to earning interest.
7hat:-TO WAIT for the ship to come in may re-

sult in a big disappointment.
That:-PUTTING AWAY a portion of your in-

come as soon as you receive it is the only
safe way to keep it.

7hat:-POSTPONING starting an account until
you have a large sum may result in never
having one.

That:-YOUR SURPLUS will grow faster here
than in your pocket.

This is just enough to get what
we are driving at

TANEYTOWN SAVINGS

BANK

liototioftiowerftiftotrikaire 
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High Street Stone Yards
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atzt7.,
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Local Phone 55-Y HANOVER, PA.
9-12-tf

For Memorials - a full line of various designs to
select from-Call and learn our prices.

D. M. MYERS, Prop.

REAL ESTATE FOR SALE
The time is now at hand for ad-

vertising FARMS and HOMES for
Sale with possession next Spring.

Let the Record
Help to secure a purchaser, through
the use of Private Sale advertise-
ments--from 2 to 4 inches of space
for about four weeks.

Try Again
later--about Sept. 1--if the first trial
does not bring you a purchaser. The

Cost is Small
for space ads. Do not use our
"Special Column" for Farm and
Home advertisements. The best im-
pression is created by using space,
and giving a reasonable amount of
description.

Advertise
out in the open, over your own
name, except for the best of reasons
for doing otherwise---it looks more
like business.
We can help you to get purchas-

ers from a long distance, who may
be looking for Carroll County Real
Estate--as many are.

The Carroll Record



MOVED UNIFORM INTERNATIONAL
— THE —

Sunday School CHRISTIATIL)TDEAVOR
Lesson Y

(By REV. P. B. FITZWATER, D.D., Delia
Of th• Evening School, Moody Bible Is-
*Wet. of Chicago.)

((E), 1925. Western Newspaper Union.)

Lesson for July 26

THE COUNCIL AT JERUSALEM

LESSON TEXT—Acts 15:1-35.
GOLDEN TEXT—"We believe that

through the grace of the Lord Jesus
Christ we shall be saved, even as they."
—Acts 15:11.
PRIMARY TOPIC—Jesus the Friend

of Little Children.
JUNIOR TOPIC—A Great Gathering

at Jerusalem.
INTERMEDIATE AND SENIOR TOP-

IC—The Council at Jerusalem.
YOUNG PEOPLE AND ADULT TOP-

IC—What Is Christian Liberty?

I. The. Controversy in the Church
at Antioch (vv. 1-5).

This difficulty was a most serious
one for it threatened the disruption of
the church into a Jewish and a Gentile
division. It was not a question of the
admission of the Gentiles into the
church. That had been settled some
years before when Peter received Cor-
nelius and his• household. The ques-
tion now was, on what ground could
they be received? Should Gentile con-
verts be required to keep the Mosaic
law as a condition of salvation? This
issue was brought on by the coming of
certain men from Jerusalem, who de-
clared, "Except ye be circumcised
after the manner of Moses, ye cannot
be saved (v. 1)." The question was so
difficult that Paul and Barnabas were
unable to put the men to silence.
These Jewish legalists had the letter
of the Scripture on their side. They
could point to the command in which
this was enjoined upon believers
(Gen. 17:14). Paul could not point to
any Scripture where it had been abro-
gated. If Paul could plead that Abra-
ham was justified before lie was dr-
-cumcised, his antagonists could an-
swer, "Yes, but after justification the
rite was divinely imposed." The
brethren at Antioch decided to refer
the matter to the mother church at
Jerusalem. Accordingly, Paul and
Barnabas and others were sent as a
deputation to Jerusalem. At an in-
formal reception by the church at
-Jerusalem they rehearsed the things
which God had done for them.

II. The Deliberations of the Conn-
(vv. 6-21).

1. Peter's Speech (vv. 6-11).
He argued that God had borne wit-

ness to His acceptance of the Gentiles
by giving the Holy Spirit to them as
unto the Jews (Acts 10:34-47). Since,
therefore, God had not made a differ-
ence it would be folly for them to do
so.

2. Paul and Barnabas Rehearsed
Their Experience (v. 12).
They told how God had set his seal

.cif approval on their preaching of sal-
vation by grace through faith, apart
from works, by the working of signs
and wonders thtough them.

3. The Argument of James (vv.
14-21).
He took the declaration of Peter and

showed how it harmonized with the
prophecy of Amos (Amos 9:11-15).
He showed that the reception of the
Gentiles was not in conflict with God's
plan, but in strict harmony therewith.
As set forth by James, God's plan is
as follows:
(1) To take out from among the

Gentiles a people for His name (v.
14). This is what is now going on-
-the preaching of the gospel to the ends
of the earth, and the calling out of the
-church.
(2) After the church is completed

and removed, the Hebrew nation will
be converted and restored to its own
land and privileges by the Lord Him-
self at His return (vv. 16-17).
(3) Following this will be the con-

version of the world through the
agency of converted Israel (v. 17, cf.
Rom. 11:15). He showed that there
is no conflict when the Scriptures are
rightly divided.
His judgment was that the Gentiles

should not be troubled with things that
are Jewish, but should be warned
against the perils of heathenism, such
as meat offered to idols, fornication
and blood.

III. The Decision (vv. 22-29).
The Mother church came to unan-

imous agreement and accepted the res-
lalution offered by James. The apos-
tles and elders not only sent a letter
stating the decision of the conference,
but took the wise precaution to send
influential men along with Paul and
Barnabas to bear the same testimony
by word of mouth. The letter denied
the authority of the Judaising teach-
ers (v. 24), and stated the method by
Which this decision had been reached
(vv. 25-27). They put the Holy Spirit
first.

IV. The Decision Delivered to the
-Church (vv. 30-35).
The church was called together to

hear the report. Its reading brought
rejoicing. They were now free to
prosecute the great missionary work.

Spiritual Growth
We must not expect spiritual growth

-when we persist in acting the fool.—
'Charles E. Jefferson.

To Shore Unknown
Let me dream that love goes with

us to the shore unknown.—Mrs. He-
mans.

Strong Body; Pure Soul
"A strong body Is good; a pure sent

Is better."---Burning Bush.

— From --

Moody _Bible Institute Monthly

Chicago, Ill.

July 26
The Progress and Achievement of the

Negro in America
Psalm 40:1-5; Proverbs 22:29
From a lecture given at the Moody

Bible Institute by Rev. John Little, of
Louisville, Ky., we gather the follow-
ing items of information and inter-
est.
The history of the Negro in Ameri-

ca is divided into three general parts.
The first period dates from the time
when about twenty Negroes were
landed on the coast of Virginia, a lit-
tle over three hundred years ago, up
to the time of the Civil War. During
that period, the Negro made three
distinct gains, namely, the value of
continuous labor, the knowledge of
the English language and an intro-
duction to the Christian religion
which has been accepted and gener-
ally adopted by the Negroes in
America.
The second period begins with the

Civil War and is known as the recon-
struction period. This lasted until
about the year 1900. During this
time, the Negro made some import-
ant improvements. He began and con-
tinued to establish three fundamental
institutions, namely, the home, the
church, and the school.
The strengthening of these institu-

tions has been the chief work of the
negro race during the third period,
which covers the past twenty-five
years. There has been, in that time,
a wonderful development of the Ne-
gro home. During the war many of
them made splendid wages and in-
vested their money in homes. They
have also greatly improved their
churches. The Negro has invested
more money in his church than in any
other institution. Dr. Little says
that while driving through Alabama,
he was impressed with the fact that
the church building where the Ne-
groes worshipped was the main in-
stitution of the whole neighborhood
and was well kept.
The educational problem has per-

haps been the greatest the American
Negro has ever faced. Hampton and
Tuskegee Institutes have figured
largely in the intellectual develop-
ment of the colored people. Hampton
Institute was founded about the year
1876. General Armstrong, the son of
a missionary, was sent to Hampton,
Va., to take charge. The first order
that he issued was that nobody was to
eat that did not work. Following
this order, the General began a sys-
tem of education that was• funda-
mental to the progress and prosper-
ity of the Negro race. A certain
amount of cooking had to be done, so
he established a cooking camp; they
must be clothed, so he established
sewing classes; it was necessary to
have vegetables so he started a gar-
den; the wagons must be repaired so
he established a repair shop. The em-
phasis laid upon industrial education
has been a great factor in the prog-
ress of the Negro in America.
The spirit of Christ has triumphed

over the spirit of prejudice and intol-
erance and as a result the Negroes in
America are making progress.

Old Legends Tell of
Men Who Lived Long

A belief in the longevity of the hu-
man race, at an early period of the
world, was the natural product of the
feeling of the ancients that they were
superior to each other, as well as
to a desire to live as long as possible.
In every religion of every period
there have been men who lived for
almost unknown ages.
In the Hebrew books Methuselah

lived for about a thousand years, but
his years are tame and insignificant
when compared to some of the an-
cients. On this subject the Hebrews'
imagination failed miserably when
compared to the imaginings of the
Hindus.
We find in the Hindu bibles bold

statements that during the early pe-
riods of the earth the average life
of man was 80,000 years, and that
Holy men often lived for a hundred
thousand years.
Of one king whose name was Yud-

hishthir, It is carelessly remarked that
his years were only 27,000, while an-
other king named Alarka reigned only
66,000 years, both being cut off be-
fore their prime, because at that pe-
riod many men were living to be
about a million years old.
The most remarkable case in Indian

history was a saintly old fellow who
lived In such a pure and virtuous way
that his days upon this earth were
indeed many.
He was two million years old when

he first became king and he reigned
6,300,000 years before he abdicated,
after which he lingered for one hun-
dred and some odd years before be-
coming the first saint of which we
know.
He went to heaven from the top

of a mountain named Ashtapada In
a fiery cloud.

King's Power Nominal
In Englund the veto is a remnant

of the more extensive power former-
ly exercised by the king, but which
has gradually been cut down until
only the negative power of disapprov-
al is left. Since 1708 the right has
never been exercised. Nonuse, how-
ever, does not imply that the power
does not exist at the present time,
although the system of responsible
cabinet government makes its use out
of place.

ABSOLUTE

AUCTION SALE
loo CHOICE BUILDING LOTS
AND SMALL TRACTS OF LAND

In one of the most Beautiful Locations in Carroll County,
will be known as

FAIR GROUND HILL
Located at TANEYTOWN, MD., will be sold at

Absolute Auction

SATURDAY, AUGUST 1st12:30 P. M. RAIN OR SHINE • ,

These beautiful building Sites are Fronting on the Boulevard a short
direct drive to Baltimore, located near Carroll Co. Fair Grounds, high
elevation, amidst refined surroundings and beautiful homes, so con-
veniently situated to Auto Bus Service makes it one of the most de-
sirable residential sections in the County.

THIS OFFER IS YOUR OPPORTUNITY
and should appeal to the investor as well as the homeseeker.

No Investment Better Safeguarded
The FAIR GROUND HILL restrictions prevent any unsightly and

inharmonious improvements, therefore making the value of your prop-
erty permanently safeguarded. TERMS---EASY Payments---Plenty
Time To PAY.

FREE!
CASH AWARDS AND OTHER PRIZES

Valued up to $300
will be given away free, SPECIAL MENTION among these awards is
a Lady's Platinum Diamond Shape Wrist Watch, latest pattern, also
Gentleman's Gold Watch. Every person attending this sale whether
you purchase or not may participate without obligation.

BAND CONCERT
Sale Authorized By
DIRECTORS CARROLL CO. FAIR

17-2t

HAMMOND & OGLE,
Auctioneers and Developers,

1213 Fidelity Bldg., Balto., Md.

rt 411P.....41b«...0411.~43111.6•Anp.••4

Off The Beaten Path
The real charm of touring lies in
leaving the main-travelled highways
and exploring the thoulands of allur-
ing side-paths. These dirt roads and
trails lead to spots of rare beauty
unvisited by the throng—where
better camp-sites may be found—
finer fishing and lovelier scenery.

Ina Ford car, you can enjoy the thrill

of exploration and discovery. It is
the one satisfactory means of travel
for these narrow roads—light—yet
so powerful that it will bring you
through—easy to handle—sturdy
and economical.

It will carry the whole family and
the saving in cost often pays for the
entire vacation.

Runabout - - $260 Tudor Sedan - $580
Coupe - - - - 520 Fordor Sedan - 660
On open cars demountable rims and starter are $85 extra.
Full-sire balloon tires $25 extra. AU prices f. o. b. Detroit.

SEE ANY AUTHORIZED FORD DEALER OR MAIL THIS COUPON

Touring Car

'2
F. 0. B. Detroit

Please tell me

Name 

Address 

City  State 

how I can secure a Ford Car on easy payments:

Mail this coupon to
7*(60Wiri/n/ZA

Detroit
N-11

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.
This is to give notice that the sub-

scribers have obtained from the Orphans'
Court of Carroll County, in Md., letters of
administration upon the estate of

MARY E. BIRELY,
late of Carroll County, deceased. All per-
sons having claims against the deceased,
ere hereby warned to exhibit the same.
with the vouchers properly authenticated,
to the subscribers, on or before the 14th
day of February, 1926: they may other-
wise by taw be excluded from all benefit of
said estate.
Given under our hands this 17th. day of

July, 1925.
LEWIS S. BIRELY,
EDWARD 0. WEA.Nr,

7-17-5t Administrators.

HORSES FOR SALE
We have 50 head. of Horses and

Mules for sale, some extra good lead-
ers.

Trostle & Poole Sales Stables.
4-3-tf HANOVER, PA.

Subscribe for The RECORD

Violin Instruction
Beginners and Advanced Pupils.
A nice line of Violins and Acces-

sories; also can furnish other musical
instruments, at reasonable prices.
For terms call or write—

JOHN R. SARBAUGH
3-6-tf Taneytown, Md.
SARBAUGH'S JEWELRY STORE.

Smut Diseases
Cause Big Loss

Variety Known as Markton
Discovered to Be Immune

From Ailment.

(Prepared by the United States Department
of Agriculture.)

An effort to supply farmers of the
oat-producing areas with varieties of
oats Immune from or highly resistant
to the smut diseases, which are very
widespread and cause annual heavy
losses to the crops, has been given
encouraging impetus by the discovery
recently of a variety immune from cov-
ered smut. The immune variety,
known as Markton, is a selection from
an unnamed variety of oats with yel-
lowish-kernels, obtained from Turkey
about twenty years ago. It has been
tested at the Oregon and Waslangton
stations, where it has not only proved
to be Immune from covered smut, but
has also shown the highest yielding
ability of any variety tested at these.
stations. The discovery of Immunity
from covered smut in a variety with
desirable kernel characteristic in com-
bination with high yielding power is
a decided step toward a solution of
the smut problem in oats.

Reduction of Crop.
In 1923 the smut diseases caused an

annual reduction in the total oat crop
of the United States estimated at 35,-
278,000 bushels, or 2.55 per cent. This
percentage of reduction varies in dif-
ferent sections, amounting to as much
as 10 per cent in Kentucky, 8 per
cent in Massachusetts and Arkansas,
between 5 and 6 per cent in Vir-
ginia. South Carolina, Georgia, Illinois
and Minnesota. Iowa, the greatest oat-
producing state in point of total bush-
els produced, suffered a loss of 1 per
cent,, which means a loss of more than
2,000,000 bushels. Oregon, where the
Immune variety Markton has been
grown commercially, showed no loss
in 1923.

Greatly Reduce Loss.
Hybrids of the Markton variety have

been developed by the United States
Department of Agriculture by cross-
ing with it a number of the best stand-
ard varieties. These have been sent
to four leading agricultural experi-
ment stations in the oat-producing
areas, where they will be tested for
their resistance to the disease. Marked
and Satisfactory progress has been
made by plant breeders in develop-
ing varieties of cereals which are re-
sistant to various diseases, and it
Is hoped that the annual loss to the
oat crop from smut diseases will be
greatly reduced by subsequent devel-
opment of resistant varieties.

Practical Suggestions
to Keep Calves Growing

The calf should be left with its
dam two to four days and get the
colostrum or "first milk." Then it
can be fed two to five pounds of the
dam's milk three times daily, which Is
preferable to feeding larger amounts
twice a day. Grain and hay can be
offered when the calf is ten days old.
Keep the feeding utensils, manger and
calf pen scrupulously clean and the
calf comfortable and thrifty.

Substitute one pound of skim milk
for one pound of whole milk daily un-
til the calf gets all skim milk, and
then feed six to ten pounds twice a
day. Gradually increase the amount

of hay and grain and add the finer
parts of silage if available after the
calf Is six to eight weeks old. See
that the calf has free access to fresh
water and salt. Do everything that
will encourage a most thrifty grovtyth.
Keep the calf free from lice and pro-
tected as much as possible from lice,
flies, and other annoyances.

Continue feeding skim milk if avail-
able. Good roughage like clover and
alfalfa hay and a good quality of si-
lage tends to keep calves growing best

during the first summer. Good pas-
ture may be substituted for silage If
calves can be turned into shaded pad.
docks or out only nights. Feed enough
grain to keep the calves in nice condi-
tion of flesh, which insures a good
rate of growth.

Cucumber Beetles Most
Destructive of Pests

Striped cucumber beetles, the most
destructive pests of cucumbers, mel-
ons, squashes and other vine plants,
are readily controlled by dusting the
young plants with a mixture of one
part of calcium arsenate and 20 parts
of gypsum, according to Dr. Carl J.
Drake, Iowa State c011ege.
Dust the young plants when they

first come up and follow with two or
three applications per week and again
after every rain. Ten to twelve ap-
plications during the season will usual-
ly hold the beetles in check.
The dust may be applied with a

shaker made by punching holes in the
bottom of a small can with an 8-penny
nail, or may simply be scattered by
hand. Circular No. 90, which de-
scribes in detail the common melon
and cucumber insects and gives con-
trol measures for each, may be se-
cured on request from the Bulletin
Section, Iowa State College, Ames,
Iowa.

Feed for Dairy Cattle
Soy-bean meal proved to be fully

as valuable as oilmeal as a feed for
dairy cattle in an experiment con-
ducted recently at South Dakota State
college. Feeding soy-bean meal in
moderate quantities did not have a
damaging effect on the butter made

from the milk, although if fed in ex-
cess it has a tendency to produce a
oat aalvi butter.



TANEYTOWN LOCALS
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Items of news from town, or vicinity are
always wanted for this column. Especial-
ly accidents, sales of real estate, fires, im-
portant happenings, visits to or from the
community social events, and all matters
of general interest to those at home, and
away from home.

Miss Mary Brining is visiting
friends in Boonsboro

Miss Virginia Miller, of Pittsburg,
Pa., is visiting at the home of George
K. Duttera and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Nace Stem, of Wil-
liamsport, spent Sunday afternoon,
with Mr. and Mrs. John W. Stouffer.

Clarence Eckard, wife and son,John
and Norman Eckard, wife and chil-
dren, motored to Pen-Mar, on Sunday
afternoon.

Mrs. C. M. Benner, who was oper-
ated on at the Frederick City Hospi-
tal, last Thursday, is getting along
very nicely.

Mr. and Mrs. John Bower, of Han-
over, Pa., spent Sunday with Mr. and
Mrs. William Bricker and other
friends in town.

Mr. and Mrs. William Naill have
taken two of their children to a
Baltimore Hospital for the removal
of their tonsils.

Mr. and Mrs. Gus Crabbs and Mr.
and Mrs. Oscar Sell were among the
number that spent Sunday at Tol-
chester Beach.

Miss Clara Reindollar, of Balti-
more, is spending some time with
Mr. and Mrs. M. A. Koons and other
friends in town.

Charles L. Stonesifer, Kenneth
Koutz and Edward Morelock, Spent
Sunday at Bay Shore, and enjoyed a
dip in the Bay.

Robert S. Reindollar and family,
and Miss L. Ada Reindollar, of Fair-
field, Pa., were visitors at Harry I.
Reindollar's, last Sunday.

Robert, son of Mr. and Mrs. Ernest
Bankard, was taken to Union Bridge,
on Sunday afternoon, and had his
adenoids and tonsils removed.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Albaugh and
children, of Walkersville, spent Mon-
day evening with Mrs. Albaugh's
mother, Mrs. Minervia Harman.

Hampstead now has a band that has
been named the "P. 0. S. of A." band.
It has 25 pieces and is under the lead-
ership of N. Vernon Hoffacker.

Mr. and Mrs. Wesley Shoemaker,
spent the week-end with Mr. and
Mrs. Guy Ditto. at College Park, and
also spent some time in Washington.

Mr. and Mrs. Steiner Englebrecht,
Mrs. Helen Englebrecht and Buddie
Harman, spent the week-end with
George Nau and wife, at Carlisle, Pa.

Mrs. John Shreeve and daughter,
Miss Margaret, left on Saturday
morning, for Cleveland, Ohio, to visit
her son, Philip Shreeve, wife and
family.

Mr. and Mis. Birnie W. Fair and
son, Theodore, Mrs. Margaret
Rentzell and Mrs. Laura Vaughn,
visited friends in Hagerstown, last
Sunday.

Maryland weather may be afflicted
with too much variety and too many
extremes—but we do have a very
large number of perfect days, and no
earthquakes.

Emmitsburg is complaining of a
big crop of mosquitoes this summer.
Taneytown, for some reason , has
suffered less from the pests than dur-
ing other years.

The contract cost of the Taneytown
school building is reported to be
$46,000. The building is expected to
be finished, ready for occupancy,
about January 1.

Mr. and Mrs. Jesse W. Fuss and
daughter, Pauline, and Mr. and Mrs.
Willis R. Zumbrun, of McKinstry's,
spent last Sunday at the home of Mr.
and Mrs. P. B. Englar.

Mrs. M. A. Koons spent several
days last week with her sister, Mrs.
Charles Eyler and other friends in
Baltimore, and on Friday attended a
Convention at Love Point.

Percy V. Putman, of Asheville, N.
C., arrived home on a two week's va-
cation, last week. He met with what
might have been a very serious acci-
dent, Monday morning, when he went
to his garage to get his car, and
while attempting to crank the car,
not knowing it was in gear, the car
ran forward, the bumper mashing one
leg against the brick wall, tearing a
gash in the skin nine inches long and
tearing the calf of the leg from the
bone; but fortunately the bone was
not broken. The wound, required
eleven stitches to close it. Fortu-
nately Mr. Putman had one leg inside
the bumper, or both legs would have
been caught. He is resting as well
as can be expected at this time.

George Wilbur Shipley, Jr., is vis-
iting his grand-parents, Rev. and
Mrs. G. Wilbur Shipley.

Mr. and Mrs. Geo. I. Harman had
as their guests, Wednesday and
Thursday of last week, Mr. and Mrs.
A. S. Dorsey, of Manitoba, Canada, a
half-sister of Mrs. Harman.

Mr. and Mrs. Jacob Null and
daughter, Grace, and son, Hubert,
spent Sunday with Miss Gladys Zepp,
at College Park., and Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Watson, of Mt. Rainier, near
Washington.

Mr. .and Mrs. Harold Mehring en-
tertained, to supper, Saturday eve-
ning, Mr. and Mrs. Harry Veit, son,
Theron, Dr. Percy Mehring,of Phil-
adelphia, and Mr. and Mrs. David
Mehring and son, Wilbur.

Mr. and Mrs. George L. Harner
and Mr. and Mrs. Clarence E. Dern,
visited Mr. and Mrs. W. 0. Ibach, at
Salona, Pa., on Sunday. Clarence
Ibach accompanied them home to
spend some time here.

A letter to the Editor from Rev.
Wm. E. Wheeler, D. D., Atchison,
Kansas, says: "I am taking my va-
cation this year up in Minnesota,
where the fish are as big as sharks
wait to be pulled out from the water.
Am going to drive up and spend four
weeks at this sort of thing."

The Editor received a Post Card,
this week, from Prof. H. E. Slagen,.
who is touring Great Britain and
France, accompanied by his wife. The
card is dated at Chester, Wales. He
says "We will attend the world Fed-
eration of Educational Associations,
at Edinburg, Scotland, July 20-28."

Large reflector danger signals were
erected here at the railroad crossing
approaches, on Monday. These re-
flectors are lighted up by the head-
lights of approaching cars. These
signals are being placed at all extra
dangerous places along the' state roads
—railroad crossings, curves, cross-
roads, etc.

Mr. and Mrs. D. M. Mehring enter-

tained, on Sunday: Mr. and Mrs.
Harry Veit, son Theron, Dr. Percy
Mehring, of Philadelphia; Mr. and
Mrs. William Mehring, son, Luther;
Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Mehring, Miss
Mary Reindollar, Mr. and Mrs. Nor-
man Baumgardner and daughter, Mr.
and Mrs. Harold Mehring and fam-
ily.

The visitors at the home of Theo-
dore Warner, on Sunday, were: Mr.
and Mrs. John Warner, of York; Mr.
and Mrs. Howard Diehl and children,
Emma and Ervin, of Abbottstown;
Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Pence and
daughter, Ruth; Mrs. Henry Erb,
George Diehl, Edward Warner, Er-
win Stambaugh, Mr. and Mrs. George
Brown and children, Milton, Arlene
and Viola.

C. E. Easterday, local manager of
the Union Bridge Electric plant, the
majority of the stock of which has been
sold to the Potomac-Edison Co., was
here last Saturday and bought quite
a lot of the old stock at $15.00, par
value $10.00. Mr. Easterday thinks
the new ownership will mean better
service in the future. A considerable
amount of this stock had been bought
up, some time ago, at a small advance
above par.

Those who spent Monday evening
at Geo. I. Harman's were: Harry
Lambert, John Harman and wife, of
Taneytown; Mrs. Carl Johnson, and
Miss Doris Myers, of town, and Miss
Ruth Reifsnider, of Union Bridge;
Miss Alice Adelsberger, of Emmits-
burg; Franklin Ohler, of town; Mr.
and Mrs. Harry E. Clabaugh and
daughter, Willieminia, of Ladiesburg;
Mr. and Mrs. Maurice E. Clabaugh
and daughter, Pauline, and sons,
Melvin, Lester and Stanley, of Mid-
dleburg.

Lachlan McArthur Cattanach, of
Baltimore, Md., graduated from the
Medical School of Johns Hopkins
University, receiving his degree on
June 9. On Oct. 1 he begins a two
year internship in the department of
surgery in the University of Virginia
at Charlottesville, Va. Dr. Catta-
nach has been engaged for the sum-
mer as the camp doctor and instructor
in first aid in Camp Acahela, the Boy
Scout Camp of the Ywoming Valley
Council of Boy Scouts, located near
Wilkes-Barre and will be in camp
from June 18 to Aug. 18.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Zeigler, Mrs.
Anna Brown, Miss Elizabeth Kiser,
Master Charles Brown, of York, Pa.;
Mr. and Mrs. C. J. Tanner, Mr. and
Mrs. Leon Tanner, Mr. and Mrs.
Robert Imhoff and daughter, Ruth,
Miss Bessie Arnold, Miss Katherine
Tanner, Leon, Elsworth, Eugene,
Sherman and Helen Tanner, of Mt.
Washington, Baltimore; Mr. and Mrs.
Loy Harman and family, Mr. and
Mrs. David Harman, Mr. Edgar Har-
man, of Morris Plains, New Jersey;
and Miss Alice Harman, Taneytown,
spent Sunday at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Wm. T. Kiser and family.

Frank Harman has been on the sick
list, since Sunday.

E. T. Ritter, of Hagerstown, visit-
ed several days at the U. B. Parson-
age. this week.

Dr. Artie Angell, of Baltimore, is
spending ten days with his mother,
Mrs. Nathan Angell.

Mrs. M. C. Fuss and daughter, vis-
ited her 'parents, in Littlestown, sev-
eral days this week.

Miss Ethel Wolfe, of Baltimore, is
visiting her grand-parents, Mr. and
Mrs. Chas. 0. Fuss.

Clifford Ott, who has been quite ill,
this week, threatened with appendici-
tis, is better this Friday morning.

Rev. W. V. Garrett has been elect-
ed Superintendent of Young People's
work by the Carroll County S. S.
Association.

Miss Elizabeth R. Elliot, Miss
Leila Elliot and Mrs. Mdigaret Fran-
quist, were visitors at Dr. Elliot's,
several days this week.

A large number of Taneytown Odd
Fellows are expected to attend the
dedication of the Home, at Freder-
ick, this Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Elvin D. Dern and
daughter, Miss Oneida, of Athens,
Ohio, and Miss Margie Baumgardner,
of Dayton, are here on a visit to rela-
tives.

A fire alarm was sounded on
Thursday morning, due to a small
oil-stove blaze at Sargent Bankard's.
The fire was extinguished without
the aid of the Fire Company.

The Ford automobile, recently stol-
en from Dr. N. A. Hitchcock, has
been found in a woods near Reisters-
town. The thief evidently wanted to
go to Baltimore, and was afraid to
try to sell the car.

A delegation of hooded Ku-Klux
paraded our streets, Monday night,
distributing circulars announcing a
public meeting in the movie Theatre,
Tuesday night. The meeting was
well attended by the curious.

Earl Longly, of near Belair, a
grand nephew of Mrs. Hezekiah
Hawk, met with an accident on
Wednesday which resulted in his
death. Mrs. Hawk went to Balti-
more to attend the funeral, which
will be held on Saturday.

Three girls from Carroll County,
left, Monday, to spend ten days at
Camp Royal, Edgewater, Md. Two
of them—Hazel Hess and Ruth
Young—were sent by the Taneytown
Lutheran S. S.; the other by the M.
E. Church, Westminster. There are
eighty girls at the Camp.

-

CHURCHCHURCH NOTICES.

Baust Reformed Church—Saturday:
1:00 Catechetical Class; 2:00 Mission
Band. Sunday: 9:30, Sabath School;
10:45 Holy Communion; 8:00 Young
People's Society.

Trinity Lutheran, Taneytown-9:00
Sunday School; 10:00 Morning Wor-
ship; 7:00 Union Christian Endeavor
Meeting in United Brethren Church
Service. Meeting S. S. teachers and
officers on Monday night.

Reformed Church Taneytown.—S.
School, at 9:15; Service, at 10:15;
Union C. E. and Evening Service at
United Brethren Church.

Keysville — Preparatory Service,
Friday evening, July 24, at 8:00; Holy
Communion, Sunday afternoon, July
26, at 2:00; Sunday School, at 1:00.

Manchester U. B. Charge, Miller's
—S. School, 9:30; Preaching, 10:30;
C. E. 7:30.
Bixler's—Vacation Sunday. Pray-

er-Meeting, Wednesday evening; Aid
Meeting, August 5th., Parsonage
lawn.

Uniontown, Church of God—Sun-
day School, 9:30; Preaching Service,
10:30; Theme, "Glorying in the
Cross." Sunday School and Preach-
ing Service at Frizellburg, Sunday
afternoon. Preaching Service at
Wakefield Sunday evening, at 8:00.
Everybody is invited to attend these
services. Come.

Manchester Reformed Charge,
Trinity—S. S., at 9:30; Worship, at
10:30; C. E., at 6:30.

Lazarus, Lineboro—S. S., at 1:00;
Worship at 2:00; Catechise on Satur-
day, at 10:00; Let all be there.

Uniontown Lutheran Charge, St.
Paul's—Sunday School, at 9:30; C.
E., 7:30.
Mt. Union—Sunday School, 9:15;

Junior Christian Endeavor, 10:30;
Sr. C. E., 7:00; Worship and Sermon,
8:00.

St. Luke's (Winter's)—S. S., and
Catechise, 9:30; Worship and Sermon
10:30; Woman's Missionary Society,
'hursday, July 30, at 2:30, at Mrs.
L. H. Weimer's, New Windsor.

Presbyterian, Town—S. School, at
9:30; Morning Worship, 10:30; Union
Christian Endeavor and Evening
Worship at U. B. Church.
Piney Creek—Preaching, at 9:30;

Sunday School, at 10:30.

U. B. Church, Town—S. S., at 9:30;
Preaching, 10:30; Union C. E., 7:00;
Sermon by Rev. Guy P. Bready, 8:00.
Harney—S. S. and Preaching; Un-

ion with Taneytown Church, at 9:30
and 10:30.

A DAY'S WORK

Sinclair Lewis relates the following
Incident. An English brother of the
craft remarked that he had spent a
very busy day correcting the proofs
of his new essay.
"Make any changes?" asked Lewis.
"I made one very important change.

I took out a comma."
The American smiled. "And is that

all you did today, take out a comma?"
"Oh, no," said the other. "After

deep reflection I put the comma back."
—Boston Transcript.

KEYS VILLE PIC-NIC
All-day Pic-nic and Eve-

ning Festival.

Saturday, Aug. 1
Sionesiler's Woods, near

Keysville,

Splendid Program in Afternoon.

Addresses by Revs. P. H. Wil-
liams, Murray E. Nessiand.,T. D.
Ritter.

PROGRAM BEGINS AT 1:30,

Ice Cream, Watermelons, Pop,
Bananas, Candy,Cakes, Peanuts,
Sandwiches, Coffee, for sale in
the new refreshment booth.

Music all-day and in the eve-
ning by the famous

DETOUR BAND,
7-24-2f

Maryland Farms
FOR SALE

Guaranteed to the End of Time.

Splendid farm lands are for sale,
and prices are not extreme, but rath-
er much lower than one would expect,
considering all the advantages offer-
ed.
The large cities and resorts are

easily and quickly reached; railroads
and motor bus service is excellent,
giving easy access to all markets.

HOSPITABLE.
Our people are kindly disposed,

hospitable and giving a cordial wel-
come to the new corner, and he is
made to feel at home here.

IMPROVEMENTS.
Since the war of the sixties, Mary-

land has steadily improved, disposing
of the old slave holders and wild ani-
mals, and made the fields to bring
forth two blades of grass where ,one
used to grow. However, improve-
ments are being made, and have been
to the road system; and as stated
above, Maryland has gradually come
to the front and stands second to
none.

/ D. W. GARNER,
REAL ESTATE BROKER,

TANEYTOWN, MD.

SATURDAY, JULY 25th.

REGINALD BARKER'S
PRODUCTION

"The Dixie Handicap"
WITH

CLAIRE WINDSOR,
FRANK HEENAM,

FLOYD HUGHES.

A true blue story of the blue
grass country. A story of Ken-
tucky thoroughbreds. Hits the
dramatic stretch in nothing flat.
It's a sure bet.
A story of the sweepstakes and

the love stakes. A bit o' the
old turf.
A drama of flying hoofs and

throbbing hearts.
The horse's heels clicked to the
melody of Virginia's romance.
Screened at the Latonia tracks.

COMEDY

"Uncle Sam"

THURSDAY, JULY 30th.

PARAMOUNT PRESENTS

RICHARD DIX

"Manhattan"
COMEDY—LARRY SEMON

"Hindoos and Hazards"

OPEN AIR SERVICES
Sionesiler's Grove, near

Keysv ille,

SUNDAY EVENING, AUG. 2
7 o'clock.

Special Music by the Keysville
Lutheran Choir.

Sermon by Rev. P. H: Williams,
Pastor Lutheran Church,

Keysville.

Taneytown Grain and Hay Market.

Wheat  $1.38@$1.38
Corn, new  $1.25@$1.25
Rye  ' $1.00@$1.00
Oats   .50@ .50
Rye Straw $7.00@$7.00
Timothy Hay  

Taneytown's "Leading Fashion Store"

TANEYTOWN, MD.

We present, for your consideration
and invite you to inspect the showing of
Bright and New Summer Merchandise,
which is now offered at surprisingly low
prices.

Summer Silks.
The most pouplar weaves at

lowest prices.
Tub Silks and Broadcloths, 36

in. in Fancy Stripes and printed
patterns.

Ladies' Silk and
Lisle Stockings

splendid qualities, very low
priced. Pure thread silk, light
weight lisle top and sole. Full
fashioned, smart Summer colors,
including white and black.

Women's and Children's
Smart Summer Footwear
That reflects the choicest of

the new models. Our collection
embraces shoes for all occasions,
everything from a •dainty dress
slipper to a street oxford. Prices
uniformly reasonable.

Men's and Boys' Shoes
and Oxfords

Latest styles in Tan and Black
Oxfords. including Patent Leath-

er.

Men's Heavy Work Shoes
The famous utility Tan Bluch-

er for comfort and service, all
our Shoes are lower in Price.

Crepe de Chene
and natural Pongee, Pure Linens,
Plain colors. Fancy Silk Figur-
ed Voiles in colors, neat, cool and
serviceable.

Men's Hose.
Men's full-fashioned quality

Hose. Long wearing perfect fit-
ting. In the wanted colors. Very
special.

Men's Hats and Caps.
Get your new Straw Hat now.

You can save money and get the
most popular rough straw and
smooth braid hats, with plain and
fancy bands, in latest yacht
shapes.

Men's Clothing.
Stylish and up-to-date in ap-

pearance, made to measure Suits,
guaranteed to fit. High-grade
Fancy Worsteds and Cassimers
stylishly cut.

Rugs. Rugs.
Special prices on all Rugs, in-

cluding 9x12 and 8x10 Brussels.
Wool and Fibre, Congoleum. Lin-
oleum and Matting Rugs. When
in need of a Rug call to see them
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Competitive Examinations
 FOR

SCHOLARSHIPS

to St. John's College and Washington College
will be held in the office of the Board of Education

Monday, Aug. 3rd., 1925,
AT 9:00 A. M.

SUBJECTS—English, History, Science and Mathematics.
7-24-2t
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STOCK CATTLE
Will have this week a lot of

Stock Steers---mostly 400 to
750 lbs.
Prices very low at this time.

H. F. COVER,
WESTMINSTER, MD.
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BIG BANANA AUCTION
Saturday Night, July 25th.

100 BUNCHES BANANAS

CENTRAL FRUIT CO.
Central Hotel Bldg.

TANEYTOWN, - MD.
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Special Notice.
Everybody welcome. Special Grand

Dance at

Tom's Creek Hall,
NEXT WEDNESDAY NIGHT,

JULY 29.

All Welcome! Come!

AUCTION!
BANANAS
Watermelons and Cantaloupes

Sneeringer's Store
BRUCEVILLE, Mo.

Saturday Evening, July 25


