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The annual convention of the Woman's
Home and Foreign Missionary Society,
Maryland Synod, Lutheran church, will
be held in Frederick, Oct. 25th to 27th.

A new daily bus line has been placed
in operation between Baltimore and
Sykesville, by way of Ellicott City. The
line will extend from Howard and Lex-
ington Ste., to Springfield Hospital.

Ex-Senator Beveridge, of Indiana,once
a prominent figure and orator in the
Republican party, but who in recent
years has been closely identified with the
"Bull Moose" party, has announced his
support of Mr. Hughes.

so..

The Hampstead Carnival will be held
Sept. 1 and 2. Addresses will be made
by prominent speakers, both Democrats
and Republicans. Prizes will be awarded
for agricultural, industrial and fraternal
displays, and many other things.

The Postoffice Department, unable,
owing to the war, to obtain a sufficient
supply of indelible ink pencils with
which to carry on the departmental work,
has issued an order that beginning im-
mediately all clerical labor must be car-
ried on with pen and ink.

Matilda Mehrins, 78 years old, widow
of Augustus Mehring, died last Thursday
at the home of her daughter, Mrs. J. H.
Sell, Jr., at Hanover, Pa. She formerly
lived at Middleburg, and was a daughter
of the late George Reifsnider, of Middle-
burg. She is survived by three children.

Just a few days after the summer's
wheat harvest had been housed, fire of
an unknown origin, last Friday night
totally destroyed the barn and contents
on the farm of William Rippeon, near
Unionville. The loss is estimated at
about $2,000. partly covered by insur-
ance. The fire started in the lower part
of the barn and was discovered about
9.30 o'clock. The farm machinery and
live stock was saved before the building
caved in.

Following early autumn Rev. Dr. Lu-
ther Kuhlman and Mrs. Kuhlman, of
Gettysburg, will be residents of York.
Dr. Kuhlman has been professor of
Biblical theology at Gettysburg Seminary
the past thirteen years but he is at the
present time under appointment as field
secretary of the board of foreign missions
of the general synod of the Lutheran
church, which duties he will assume
September 1. He has been president of
the board during the past twenty-five
years.
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Te Kaiser is spending a brief holiday
in personally helping to reap Germany's
bountiful harvest. He is not only setting
a patriotic example, but keeping himself
in good physical trim. Healthy, tanned
and divested of field gray and high orders,
the Kaiser is toiling whole afternoons in
the heat of the sun and wielding the im-
perial scythe in rye field with the muscu-
lar expertness of a peasant. Public
interest once more has turned from the
English offensive to the harvest, which is
considered of far greater importance to
the outcome of the war.

York has a bell which possesses a his-
tory second only to that of Liberty Bell
itself. At the present time it is attract-
ing considerable attention, having been
removed from its place in St. John's
Episcopal Church to the front of the edi-
fice while renovations are being made.
The bell was presented to the church by
Queen Carolina, of England, in 1774. It
rang the news of the Declaration of Inde-
pendence and called the members of
Continental Congress to their sessions in
the old state house in York's Centre
Square. It was cracked while tolling for
President McKinley's funeral, and since
that time has not been used.

For the first time in many years a high
School principal, Prof. Amon Burgee,
Who served as head of the Frederias
Boys' High School for more than two
decades, has gone to court to enforce
What he claims to be his right to retain
his position since the County School
Board, which sent him a letter asking
for his resignation has preferred no
charges against him. The suit was filed
by Attorney Leo Weinberg, it being a
n:rit of mandamus to compel the commis-
sioners to reinstate Prof. Burgee. The
court has fixed August 12 as the date on
or before which the Commissioners must
'thew cause why the order should not be
issued as petitioned.

,, Sterling Yingling, son of Edward Ying-
ling, of Westminster, who is employed at
the Hanover Shoe Factory, Hanover,
miraculously escaped death, Sunday
morning. He was returning from Sun-
day school at Trinity church when the
motor truck driven by Edward Walters-

passed,, on its way to Penn Groye
"Imp grounds. Mr. Waltersdorff called
to Yingling to join the party. The youth
Stood on the running board of the ma-
d-Sine and when in front of his boarding
Pace he jumped. Slipping as he jumped
ne Was thrown under the moving truck.The rear wheel of the vehicle passed over

Se
his left leg between the knee and hip,ctivtetrininglit aadeep gash about a foot long and

muscle and artery which re-
'Aldred twenty-four stitches to close. Hisr!ght shoe was torn from his foot leaving
?light bruises. Passengers on the trucknnrried to his assistance arid carried himto his home,

State Grange Fair Next Week.

Next week, from Tuesday until Satur-
day, the State Grange Fair, in Ohler's
Grove, near Taneytown, will be in prog-
ress. This is the only fair in Carroll
County, and this will be its 19th. pro-
gram. According to the published list of
attractions, as well as the expectations of
those in charge of the event, the present
fair will excel all others heretofore held.
Tuesday will be Boy Scout day, with a

long list of athletic and other contests,
addresses by Scout Masters, and others.
Wednesday will be Knights of Pythias

day, beginning with a parade at 10.30 in
Taneytown. Prizes will be awarded for
the best drilled, most men, and best
band. Addresses by prominent Knights
on the Fair ground.
Thursday will be Grange day, with ad-

dresses by prominent men from Maryland
Agricultural College. Grand concert and
readings by Jenny Lind Green, of Balti-
more, assisted by a big chorus. Excur-
sions will be run on this day by both W.
M. R. R. and the N. C. R.
Friday will be Republican day. Dr.

France, candidate for U. S. Senate, and
Wm. H. Lawrence, candidate for Con-
gress, and others, will deliver addresses.
In the morning there will be a list of
athletic contests.
Saturday will be Democratic day. David

J. Lewis, candidate for U. S. Senate, and
J. F. C. Talbott, candidate for Congress,
and others, will deliver addresses.
Free outdoor entertainment will be

furnished during the week by the "Six
Famous Flying Herberts" and Miss Irene
LaTour, contortionist, and her trick dogs.
Every day will have its special features
different from the other days.

New Pennsy Depot at Frederick.

Bringing the first official information of
the proposed construction of a new pas-
senger terminal for the Pennsylvani-
Railroad in Frederick, the following leta
ter was received on Tuesday by Secretary
O. C. Warehime of the Trade Board from
S. C. Long, general manager of the com-
pany:
"Referring to your letter of the 19th,

ult., and our reply of the 21st in which
we informed you that the question of im-
proved passenger facilities at Frederick
was a live subject and that we hoped to
advise you in the near future of further
action, we are pleased to inform you that
we are today instructing General Sup't
Latrobe to arrange for the erection of a
new passenger station. As soon as de-
tailed plans can be prepared, this work
will be proceeded with."
There have been many conjectures re-

garding the design of the new station.
Some time ago, information was gleaned
from a railroad official that the building
would be two stories in height. In the
first floor the ticket agent would have his
quarters, it was stated. Of course there
will be waiting rooms and other con-
veniences. On the second floor, accord-
ing to the informant, rooms would be
fitted up for the trainmen. Under the
present plan the freight crews remain
over night in the trains on the siding.
While nothing definite has been learned
regarding these plans, it is generally con-
ceded the old building will be completely
razed and a structure erected which will
be attractive and up-to-date in every par-
ticular and fill the needs of the company
here for many years to come.

New Feeder to Lincoln Highway.

A new Maryland feeder to the Lincoln
Highway, which passes through 'Southern
Pennsylvania, with Gettysburg as one of
its most attractive points, is promised by
the improvement of the Reisterstown
turnpike to Westminster and thence to
the Pennsylvania line. The work will be
done under the State aid plan, Carroll
county joining in the cost.
By the decision to apply to the State

for aid the Carroll county Commissioners
here ended a long controversy. For years
they have been exerting every influence
within their reach to induce the State
Roads Commission to select the Reisters-
town road, on the old National road run-
ning from Westminster, for improvement.
The commission, however, has preferred
the route from Westminster via Taney-
town and Emmitsburg to the Pennsyl-
vania line, where it meets an improved
road which leads directly to Gettysburg.
In addition to this Pennsylvania spur, as
an argument the commission sought to
provide a smooth highway to the Blue
Ridge Mountains and to the sanatorium
at Sabillasville. This route was originally
selected for improvement by the first com-
mission appointed by the late Governor
Crothers. It has already been improved
from Westminster to Taneytown. A
spur six miles long, from Taneytown to
Emmitsburg remains to be completed.
With the improvement of the road

northward from Westminster, passing
through Littlestown, Pa-, there will dis-
appear the tollgates which are nuisances
to modern tourists. The tollgate in Ma-
ryland is being rapidly relegated to the
waste heap. In addition to those in Car-
roll county, there are about half a dozen
scattered over Frederick and Washington
counties.—Balt. American.

•45.

Observed its 50th. Anniversary.

Grace Lutheran church, 'Westminster,
observed its 50th. Anniversary by a three-
day celebration, beginning with a service
on Saturday, August 5th., at which Rev.
H. C. Holloway, of Harrisburg, Pa., and
Rev. Ezra K. Bell, of Baltimore, ad-
dressed a large congregation. On Sun-
day, Rev. P. H. Miller, of Baltimore,
spoke and Rev. Holloway also made an
address.
There were at the time of the organiza-

tion of the church 22 charter members,
all of whom are dead, except Mrs. Wm.
A. Cunningham, who lives in Westmin-
ster. Of the members of the first church
council all are dead except Mr. 0. H. P.
Mathias. who was one of the first deacons.
He also lives in Westminster.
In the 50 years only six pastors served

the church, as follows: The Rev. H. C.
Holloway, the Rev. P. A. Stroble, the
Rev. John H. Earnest, the Rev. H. W.
Kuhns, the Rev. P. H. Miller and the
Rev. William H. Hetrick, the present
pastor.

REASSESSMENT LAW IS
DECLARED INVALID.

Appeal to be taken from the Decision

of the Frederick County Court.

The acts of the Maryland Assembly
delegating the power for a reassessment
of real estate in the counties, on which
the Maryland Tax Commission based its
action, were declared unconstitutional on
Tuesday in an opinion handed down by
the Frederick County Circuit Court,over-
ruling the demurrer to the bill of com-
plaint filed on July 19 by David Lowen-
stein and Charles Wertheimer, prominent
Frederick merchants, through their at-
torney, Leo Weinberg, against the State
Tax Commission, Alfred W. Gayer, sup-
ervisor of assessments, and the Board of
County Commissioners. The defendants
have 15 days in which to file an answer
to the bill of complaint.
There will be an appeal to the Court of

Appeals, which will be requested to hold
a special sitting and to hand down a de-
cision as early as possible in order that
the proposed reassessment may begin by
September 1, if the Tax Commission is
finally upheld.
The court was unanimous in its opinion,

it being signed by Chief Judge Hammond
Urner and Associate Judges Glenn H.
Worthington and Edward C. Peter. The
litigation in Frederick county has at-
tracted state-wide attention. Many coun-
ty officials of the various counties of the
state have held up action on the orders
of the State Tax Commission until a de-
cision had been reached in the case pend-
ing in Frederick County Circuit Court.
The contention of the complainants

that the act was invalid because the pro-
posed reassessment did not apply equally
throughout the State, was overruled. The
contention that Baltimore city was not
included in the reassessment plan was re-
ferred to by the court. The court ex-
plained that there are separate enact-
ments by which property in Baltimore
city is subjected to a continuing process
of revision in order that it may be assess-
ed for state and municipal taxes accord-
ing to its real value.
"The question of most serious concern

in the case," says the Court in its opin-
ion, "arises from the fact that the Legis-
lature, by the Act of 1916, has sought to
delegate to the State Tax Commission the
whole duty of formulating a uniform plan
of assessment. This is a duty which the
people imposed upon the Legislature.
The recent amendment to the Constitu-
tion declares that the General Assembly
shall by uniform rules provide for the
separate assessment and classification
therein directed.
"It is the plain purpose of the amend-

ment that land and the improvements
thereon shall be separately assessed, and
that improvements and personal proper-
ty shall be classified according to uniform
rules which the Legislature shall prescribe.
The mandate of the people to that effect,
as conveyed by the Constitutional amend-
ment which they adopted, is clear and
unqualified. It creates a duty which it
makes expressly legislative in its charac-
ter and which is, therefore, not capable
of being delegated. It affirmatively
charges the General Assembly itself to es-
tablish the uniform rules by which assess-
ments for taxation purpose shall be con-
ducted.
"The reassessment which the bill seeks

to have restrained has been ordered by
the State Tax Commission in pursuance
of a statute which lays down no rules to
guide the assessors in making the separ-
ate assessments and classification con-
templated by the constitutional amend-
ment, but commits that fundamential
duty to an agency to which the amend-
ment does not refer. In our judgment,
this attempted delegation of power and
duty by the Legislature is contrary to the
purpose and limitations of the Constitu-
tion as amended and therefore must be
held invalid."

Look Out for This Booklet!

A booklet has been issued by a "His-
torical Society" containing a great deal
of timely and interesting information con-
cerning Presidential Elections, giving
tables of statistics and many matters of
value for use during the Presidential
campaign. It is proposed to have this
booklet circulated widely by the news-
papers of the country, and for this pur-
pose it is offered to publishers at 1 cent
per copy. Aside from three or four pages,
the work is admirable, but these three or
four pages, in our opinion, contain an
artful defense of the liquor business. It
will be well therefore, far all publishers
who receive a package of these booklets
to examine them carefully before giving
them wide circulation.

Progressives to Maintain Party.

Leaders of the Progressive party, at a
conference last week in Indianapolis,
failed to secure a proper candidate for
President, but decided to appoint an
Executive Committee of 15 to perpetuate
the party, and also to adopt resolutions
criticising the National Committee for
indorsing Hughes. An effort to swing
the party to Wilson, met with failure.
Maryland was not represented at the
conference.

..o..
The large bank barn on the farm of

John T. Long, near Emmitsburg, was
struck by lightning Tuesday afternoon
during an electrical storm and totally
destroyed. The loss was estimated by
Mr. Long at about $3,000. All of the
farming implements, the wheat crop, hay
and oats that were in the barn were
burned. About $300 insurance covered
the contents of the barn and about $1,
000 on the building. A hog pen which
was near the barn was also destroyed,
but all of the hogs were gotten out in
safety. The fire started about 5 o'clock
and was still burning furiously at 9
o'clock that night. The wheat and hay
had packed down in the mow and had to
be scattered before the fire could be ex-
tinguished.

School Commissioners.

A regular meeting of the Board of
School Commissioners for Carroll county
was held in their office at the Court
House, Westminster, Md., on Wednes-
day, August 2, 1916, at 10 a. m. The
following members of the Board were
present: J. Pearre Wantz, A. W. Feeser,
Dr. Wm. D. Hopkins, J. M. Allender,
A. N. Zentz, and C. G. Devilbiss. The
meeting was called to order by the presi-
dent, J. Pearce Wantz. Present also at
this meeting were Prof. Maurice S. M.
Unger
' 

County Superintendent; Charles
Reed, Clerk to the Board, and Charles
0. Clemson, Attorney to the Board. The
minutes of the July meeting were read
and approved.
David Wantz of Myers District, came

before the Board and explained the ne-
cessity for building a new school house
and creating a new school district in
Myers District, near Band-Hall, in what
is known as Deep Run section. Mr. Wantz
represented to the Board that the patrons
of the proposed school were willing to do
a certain amount of work and furnish
material and money and also to provide
free a lot to be deeded to the Board of
School Commissioners. It was moved,
seconded and passed that a new school
house should be erected at this point, if
a suitable lot could be obtained and the
matter was referred to A. W. Feeser and
President Wentz, who were authorized
to select the site, together with the as-
sistance of the County Superintendent,
and to proceed with the erection of a
suitable school building if they saw fit,
Upon motions made, seconded, and

carried, the following matters were then
disposed of: For Bear Mount School the
following trustees were appointed: Harry
Myers, Oliver Brown and George Z.
Wantz.
Arthur W. Feeser was authorized to

examine the desks at Wisner'sschool and
to have repaired these that could be re-
paired and to report to the County Su-
perintendent how many new desks would
be needed.
The Board decided not to dig any wells

on school properties this year. C. G.
Devilbiss was authorized to look after cer-
tain repairs to school houses in New
Windsor District.
At the Uniontown School, it was re-

ported that a fund of $39 with some ac-
crued interest was held as part payment
for a new cement walk from the school
building to the public road. President
Wentz was directed to aave the cement
walk laid and to use as part payment
therefor, the money that the Uniontown
school now has for that purpose, however,
the total cost of the pavement not to ex-
ceed $78.
At the West End school house in West-

minster, Mr. Wentz was directed to have
a cement walk laid from Pennsylvania
Avenue to the school building and to have
certain necessary repairs made also.

Certain repairs at the Taylorsville and
Enterprise schools were referred to Dr.
Wm. D. Hopkins.
The following county scholarships to

Western Maryland College were then
awarded, namely:
To Miss Lillian W. Rinehart, Miss

Blanche Spurrier, Joseph W. Allender,
and Byers Unger.
To Charlotte Hall Military Academy,

Jesse E. Smith, of Westminster.
A number of current bills were then

presented to the Board and were ordered
paid.
The Board then adjourned to meet on

the first Wednesday of September, unless
another date is decided upon by the pres-
ident.

The Farmer and the Liquor Maker.

The liquor people are spending a great
deal of energy and money in advertising
the claim that their business has an im-
portant bearing upon the prosperity of
agriculture. Through newspapers, pam-
phlets and circulars they herald the state-
ment that they buy "hundreds of mill-
ions of dollars" worth of grain, fruits and
other products of the farm, and make the
claim that the farmers' income would be
reduced to that extent if the business
should be stopped.
The pity of it is that some farmers are

either so short-sighted, or so sympathetic,
that they accept the statements as true.
Let us see what relation this market bears
to the entire trade in farm products.
Without taking space to quote the figures
showing bushels and dollars, the census
and revenue reports show that liquor
makers buy only one and eight-tenths
percent of the grain the farmer sells. In
other words, for every dollar's worth of
the crops which he sells, the liquor
makers buy less than two cents' worth.
Then when we take into account the
millions of dollars paid back by the farm-
ers for distillers' and brewers' grains and
other by-products, even this two cents is
greatly reduced, because these feeds are
in competition on the market with the
farmers' remaining 98 cents' worth of
whole grain..

All this takes no account of the effect
the consumption of liquor has upon
humanity in reducing its ability to buy
the necessities of life; neither must we
neglect to take into account the taxes
made necessary by the liquor traffic.
Their boast about the revenue they pay
to Federal and local governments is sub-
terfuge; first, because this amount would
not pay the expenses which are thrown
upon the public as a result of the traffic.
Secondly, the money with which they
pay their revenue and license fees is first
taken from the public. As well might a
highwayman boast of giving you back a
dollar after having taken your wallet
containing a hundred. We are firmly of
the opinion that farmers could worry
along somehow even• if the manufacture
of liquor should stop tomorrow.—Penn-
syluania Farmer.

David McMurtrie Gregg, 83 years old,
the last of the Union officers holding the
rank of general at the battle of Gettys-
burg, is dead, after an illness of several
months. He was in good health up to
late last spring. Gen. Gregg probably
saved the battle of Gettysburg. This is
the opinion of military experts who have
studied Gen. Gregg's cavalry engagement
with Gen. Stuart.

MIRACULOUS WHEATS
OFFICIALLY DISCREDITED

Attempts to Foist off Old Varieties
Under New Names.

The following article from the U. S.
Department of Agriculture will be espec-
ially interesting at this time of the year,
and we regret that we could not well find
room for it an earlier time, as its reading
will have a tendency to save credulous
farmers from "getting bit" through mis-
leading claims made for seed wheat.—
(ED.)
The notion that there is a wonderful

wheat which will make the fortune of any-
one who plants it seems to be almost as
old as agriculture itself. In this country,
at least, such an assertion was made for
the so-called Jerusalem wheat as early as
1807, and, under the name of Alaska
wheat, this identical variety is still being
pushed upon the unwary at exorbitant
prices for seed. Almost equally exagger-
ated claims are made for the Stoner va-
riety, but this particular wheat has not
such a long history.

Because of the many attempts that
have been made by promoters to foist
those wheats, under one name or another,
upon the farmers of the country, the de-
partment has made careful tests of their
value. In Bulletin 357 of the department
the results of these tests are said to show
conclusively that neither of the wheats
possess any peculiar quality which justi-
fies high prices for the seed. Many va-
rieties grown commercially throughout
the country have, in fact, proved to be
somewhat superior to either the Alaska
or the Stoner.
The history of Alaska wheat goes back

in this country to the beginning of the
last century. In all probability it was
introduced before the Revolution, but
the first definite mention of it is in a let-
ter dated 1807, in which a certain Dr.
Keemie speaks of the great productive-
ness of the Jerusalem wheat, a small
quantity of which he had brought over
from Ireland. Dr. Keemie's description
of his wheat identifies it, in the opinion
of experts, with the Alaska wheat of to-
day. The chief characteristic of this va-
riety is that there are as many as seven
or eight branches on each head. This
provides the promoters with their great
argument—the more branches, they say,
the bigger the yields, and they have
found many people who believe them.
As a matter of fact, the so-called Alaska
wheat belongs to the Poulard subspecies.
Poulard wheats are grown to some extent
in the Mediterranean region of Europe,
but not to any commercial extent in this
country. The tests of the wheat made by
the department in a number of places
and under a number of different condi-
tions have never resulted in extraordinary
yields, and in many instances not even
fair yields have been obrained. Milling
tests have shown also that in this respect
Alaska wheat is not as good as many
other widely grown varieties.
These facts, however, have not pre-

vented the promoters at various times
from asserting that yields of from 100 to
222i bushels per acre can be obtained
from this wheat. In particular, they have
urged it as a valuable variety for the
worn-out farms of the East because with
such yields farmers can afford to use fer-
tilizers. According to one circular, the
wheat flourishes in dry countries because
its native home, Alaska, is dry; in cold
countries, possibly for the same reason;
and in hot countries for some reason not
slated.
These pretensions have been bolstered

up by fanciful explanations of its origin.
According to one authority the probabili-
ties are that the Jerusalem wheat, which
Dr. Keemie had in 1807, originated in
Palestine. A traveler brought a small
sheaf of it back with him to Ireland and
hung it as a sign above the alehouse
which he kept in Dublin. A farmer
chanced to pick up some seeds from the
sheaf, planted them, and some yearslater
sold the produce of several acres at about
$3.65 a pound. Some of this seed was
brought over to America and distributed
among the members of the Philadelphia
Society for the Promotion of Agriculture.
In this way it probably came to the
knowledge of Dr. Keemie. The members
of this society, however, do not appear
to have appreciated it, for it created no
stir in this country.
This is the most authentic explanation

of its introduction that we have. A fa-
vorite story with promoters is to the effect
that when the coffin of an Egyptian mum-
my 3,000 or 4,000 years old was opened
some wheat was found in it. The seed
was planted, but only a single kernel
grew. This, however, was a wonderful
yielder and very different from any other
wheat known. This story is responsible
for such narces as "Mummy," "Wheat
3,000 years old," "Egyptian," and
"Miracle." It is, of course, an absurd-
ity, for even' under the most favorable
conditions seeds of wheat do not keep
their vitality more than a few years.
In 1908 this wheat was brought forward

again, this time not as a product of
Egypt, but of Alaska. It was asserted
that an Idaho farmer had found in a
scheduled spot of the Alaskan coast a
wheat plant with a branched head. He
had brought back one head, sowed its
seed that fall (in 1904), obtained 7 pounds
to sow in 1905, and by 1906 had 1,545
pounds, an increase of 220 fold. From
this it was argued that 1 bushel of seed
per acre would produce 220 bushels. A
seed-grain company had obtained the seed
from the farmer and would dispense it
at the rate of $20 a bushel.
Upon investigation the department

found that about 700 acres of the wheat
were being grown for the company in
Idaho. The average yield per acre was
estimated, not at 220 bushels, but at 25
bushels. Under identical condititions
well-known wheat varieties of the Pacific
Northwest were yielding fully as much or
more, and good farmers in the neighbor-
hood were not growing the wonderful
wheat.
This investigation was followed by a

warning notice from the department and
also by a fraud order from the Poet Office
Department against the advertising ma-

leolitimied on Eighth Pace.)

Orphans' Court Proceedings.

MONDAY, Aug. 7th., 1916.—Noah W.
Rill, administrator of Gabriel Harner,
deceased, settled his first and final ac-
count.
The last will and testament of Laura

V. Gallaway, deceased, was admitted to
probate and letters testamentary were
granted unto William Gallaway, who re-
ceived warrant to appraise and order to
notify creditors.
Harry M. Powers, administrator of

Edgar Powers, deceased, reported sale of
personal property.
Letters of administration upon the es-

tate of Mary K. Adams, were granted
unto William W. Adams, who received
warrant to appraise and an order to notify
creditors.
TUESDAY, Aug. 8th, 1916.—The last

will and testament of James Roop, de-
ceased, was admitted to probate and let-
ters testamentary were granted unto
George H. Roop and Edna Irene Main,
who received warrant to appraise and an
order to notify creditors.
The Westminster Deposit and Trust

Company, guardian of George Thomas,
settled its first and final account.

Letters of administration upon the es-
tate of Jacob H. Shanebraok, deceased,
were granted unto N. Clayton Shane-
brook, who received warrant to appraise
and an order to notify creditors.
Frank Shaeffer, administrator of Ernest

E. Shaeffer, deceased, returned an inven-
tory of personal property, received an
order to sell same and settled his first and
final account.

A Trip to Muddy Creek Pic-nic.

(For the REcoan.)
A party of thirty-one, members of

Baust Reformed church, attended the
Muddy Creek pic-nic, near Ephrata, Pa.,
last Saturday; Rev. Martin W. Schweitzer
is pastor there. The trip was made in
six automobiles, Rev. Paul D. Yoder with
his Ford, acting as pilot for the party.
The other drivers and cars were David
Carbaugh, Ford; Jesse Spangler, Hud-
son; John Marker, Buick; Abram Dod-
rer, Buick; and Jesse Halter, Davis.

All were delighted with the trip. Mak-
ing allowances for a few interruptions in
the way of punctures, etc., the run was
made in a little less than five hours, a
distance of about 90 miles.
Lancaster county is said to be the gar-

den spot of the world, but it has nothing
on Carroll county this year for corn. One
has to make several days' journey to find
as promising corn as we have here. The
tobacco fields of Lancaster county at-
tracted great attention. Outside of that
Carroll county can hold its own.

Garrett county is not noted for its pro-
duction of wheat, but it nevertheless
makes some big records. Senator
Speicher; who has a fine farm at Acci-
dent, made a yield of 45 3-5 bushels per
acre in a field of 12 acres.

DIED.

Obituaries, poetry and resolutions, charged
for at the rate of five cents per line. The
reglnar death notices published free.

YERS.—Mr. Charles S. Myers, of near
Mt. Union church, died on Thursday,
August 10, 1916, aged 75 years. He is
survived by his widow and three children,
-Miss Bell I., Howard and Hoffman
Myers, all at home. The funeral will be
held at his home on Sunday, at 10 a. m.,
Rev. W. E. Saltzgiver officiating. Inter-
ment at Pipe Creek cemetery.

FOREMAN.—Mr. David H. Foreman
died suddenly in Union Bridge, last Sun-
day morning, while out taking a walk. He
was a son of the late Mr. and Mrs. David
Foreman, of near Taneytown, where he
lived until a young man. His silfe was
Fannie Crabbs, of this vicinity, and he
leaves a son and daughter. Also the fol-
lowing brothers and sisters, Charles A.,
and Joseph Foreman, Mrs. William
Miller, Mts. Abram Thomson, Mrs. J.
Henry Hawk and Mrs. Laura V. Fair.
Funeral services were held at Mt Union

Lutheran church, by Rev. W. 0..Ibach,
on Tuesday. His age was 59 years, 2
months, 6 days

ADAMS.—Mr. William Adams died at
the home of his son, Ross, at Middle-
town, on Tuesday at ternoon, Aug. 8th.,
1916, in his 81st year. He had been sick
for several weeks. Besides his son, Ross,
he leaves four other sons: John and
William Henry, of Woodsboro; Alex-
ander, of Buckeystown, and Jacob, of
Detour; also three daughters, Mrs.
Geneva Houck, of Keysyille; Mrs. Harry
Albaugh, of Detour, and Miss Sidney
Adams, of near Detour. Mr. Adams was
very well known in the section of Detour,
as he had been a farmer there for many
years. Funeral services were held at
Rocky Hill, on Thursday morning; in-
terment in Rocky Hill cemetery.

IN REMEMBRANCE

Of our dear uncle, David Fogle, who departed
this life August 3, 19N, aged Si years,

3 months, 4 days.

Sad is our home, oh God, how dreary.
Lonesome, lonesome every spot;

Listening for his voice till weary,
Weary for I hear it not.

Yes, I miss him : oh, I miss him
When I see his vacant chair,

And how sad the home without him,
For uncle David is not here.

fly his niece, Esmi.i.A M.

Lonely the house and sad the hours,
Since my dear uncle is gone;

But a brighter home than our,
In heaven is now his home.

By his nephew, EL WA, RD FOG I.F..

(Ione from us to heaven;
But he turns and waves his hand.

Pointing to the glories over its
In that bright and happy land.

Oh, may we meet our uncle
Where friends no more shall weep;

For those who die in Jesus
Their death is only sleep.
By his grand-nephew, M EIS IN T. Hiss.

CARD OF THANKS.

The thanks of myself and family are hereby
gratefully extended to all friends and neighbors
who so greatly helped us during the illness and
death of David Fogle.

M ELN IN T.
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THE CANDIDATES.
For President.

CHARLES E. HUG HE,4 REPUBLICAN

WOODROW WILSON DEMOCRAT

For Vice-President.
CHARLES W, FAIRBANKS REPUBLICAN

THOMAS R. MARSHALL DEMOCRAT

For U. S. Senator.
JOSEPH IRWIN FRANCE REPUBLICAN

DAVID J. LEWIS DEMOCRAT

For House of Rep's.
WILLIAM H. LAWRENCE REPUBLICAN

JOSHUA F, C. TALBOTT DEMOCRAT

TIIE HANU-SHAKIM; politician is now
having his inning at the country pic-nicss,
and is smiling for votes on a "good fellow"
reputation.

W IIENEVER ANYBODY says anything
about the Carroll County increase of 8
cents in the tax-rate being due to the lose
of liquor license revenue, ask him—How
about the increase of 7 cents in Frederick,
and 21 cents in Washington county,where
license revenue has not been lost ?

SENotNo un,Assi-rs., to our soldier boy
on the border, is neither complimentary
to the character of our troops, nor a wise
thing to do for their own good. Some-
how, "cigarette smoking soldiers" does
not sound very creditable as a general
recommendation, nor as establishing
physical fitness.

— —.0.

Are They "Soft," or What?

We wonder whether, after all, this
country could, or would, raise a big ef-
fective, fighting army ? Whether each
community furnishing troops would not
go into hysterics and put up all sorts of
wails and protests over the hardships the
troops would be called on to endure ? We
wonder, too, just what sort of mental at-
titude many of those who join our state
Regiments, during peace, have toward
the possibility of their being called out
into sober actual service ? Whether they
Join "for fun," or whether there is any-
thing patriotic in the act ?

General Funston is said to have re-
cently remarked "What is the matter
with Americans nowadays? Have they
got soft, or what is it ? I have seen the
day when day coaches would have been
a luxury." His expression was called
for by the fact that some Companies re-
quested Pullman cars in which to go to
the border, and in various ways are pro-
testing against the lack of luxuries and
home comforts. *
We wonder how much of this "softness"

originates with the soldier boys, and how
much of it is due to the gushing tenden-
cies of their relatives and friends, who
apparently do not see much of calm sac-
rifice and country service in being called
to the front, but who are willing enough
for the boys to parade and play soldier
for amusement—and "the honor."

It is a pretty serious question, we think,
as to whether we haye a nation of strong-
hearted men and women who under
stress are capable of sniffing and urging
duty, rather than acting in such a way
as to encourage a make-believe army,
lacking stamina ? How would Ameri-
cans of the state troops class show up on
the battle fields of Europe, in comparison
with like material over there ?
The "folks back home" have a right

to be concerned about, and in a way
sympathetic for, the "boys at the front,"
but they have no right to feminize them,
and try to make them discontented, suf-
fering heroes. Wars are not won by
Jully-fishes, either at home or in the
field, nor are they won by those "too

proud to light." General Funston's query,

"Are they soft. Or what ?" is a pertinent

one.

The Collectioe of Taxes in Carroll

County.

Apparently, the tax-payers who active-
ly interested themselves in a new plan of
collecting taxes in Carroll county, think-
ing thereby to save the county a lot of
money, made a miscalculation on results.
In their original proposition, the County
Treasurer was to act as tax-collector,
with a reasonable compeesation added to
his salary, and with perhaps some extra

&Lori* help in the rush seasons of the

year. It was argued that by giving his

full time to the dual office, he could do

practically all of the work, with but very

little assistance.
The plan did not suit the powers,

partly perhaps because the County Treas-

urer was a Republican; but in response

to sentiment the one-collector plan was

put through, a new offfee being created—

Tax Collector. Now it appears that the

new collector has two assistants—making

three to do the work that some thought
one Treasurer ought to do—and tax-pay-

ers are beginning to wonder whether the
old plan, of fourteen collectors, might

not as well have been left alone, so far as
a saving to the county is concerned. It is
reported that these assistants, or clerks

to the collector, get $5.00 per day.
There were a few, at least, who argued

that for about $500.00 additional, the
County Treasurer would be amply paid
to do the collecting work, and to all such
the present experience must be something
of a shock. As this extra force is some-
what crowding the Commissioners' office,
perhaps the exigencies of the situation
may call for an enlargement of the Court
House ? At any rate, it seems that
decapitating fourteen office holders at
one dab, is not an easy thing to get
away with, and that man innocently
"proposes" a good many things that
politics "disposes" in quite an unex-
pected way.
But, it may be just as well to wait a

while and see how the new plan works

out. It is pretty evident that the people
started something not intended, and that
it will be necessary for some to change
their minds very materially as to what
the collecting of taxes is worth, or else

make another trial, when the legislature
meets again, to place the job on another

basis than the present one.
Later on, we may have something to

say of another phase of the situation;
but for the present will wait and see
whether the list of clerks grows any
larger, how the plan in general works,
and perhaps get more light on the
necessity for an increase in the tax rate.

Fads in School Methods.

There is a tendency to knock the public

school systems of the country, on the
scare of "too much expense," which,

taken alone, is pretty apt to represent
mere penuriousness, and not the broad
spirit of liberality and sympathy with
which our schools should be properly re-

garded. But, there is another eort of
criticism with reference to school systems

that we think much more strongly

grounded, and that is with reference to
many of the new .frills and fancies that
have in recent years been hung on ti

public school requirements.
'We do not believe that it is properly

part of our free schools at public expense
to furnish such courses as domestic
science, music, art, advanced chemistry,
and the like; but rather that the state
does its whole duty when it teaches the
basis elements of an education in a thor-
ough manner. It is a fact that even in

our higher schools of learning, such ac-
complishments as writing and spelling

are largely left out, to the end that even

college graduates are often unable to

write an intelligible letter, and many of
them not a lengthy article tit to print,
psrfect in grammar, spelling and punctu-
ation.
The advocates of "higher education"

and new-fangled methods are usually en-
thusiasts for their fade, and to secure
management of school affairs over those
who are more "old-fashioned," but who
may neverthlese be not far wrong in their

general conclusions as to what constitutes
a proper amount of public expense educa-
tion. It is perhaps true that there has
set in a sort of mania for "nea things"
from our public schools that has partly,
at least, improperly overshadowed and
minimized the solid merits of the almost
unchangable elements of an education.

We not only provide free college
scholarships for those public school pupils
who excel in their studies, but at the
same time try to nullify the prize value
of these scholarships by trying to com-

pete with the Colleges themselves. Then,
we have state High Schools, as part of
our public school system, but are not
content, apparently, with keeping a line
of division between these and the com-
mon schools,. At any rate, taking the
school situation as it is today, there is
very reasonable doubt whether those who
now come through the schools are as well

grounded in the "three r's" as they were

thirty or forty years ago, when these

branches were emphosized and taught
thoroughly.

General Wood, U. S. A., Favors Swiss
Military System.

"The military system of Switzerland
and Austria appeal to me very strongly as
models which we could follow to our ad-
vantage in all which pertain:: to military
training. Switzerland has had her system
in operation long enough to make its ap-
plication general, and as a result, while a
peaceful, orderly country, she stands al-
ways ready to defend her rights and to
guard her territory. She is absolutely
free from all indication of militarism, as
ordinarily understood, and yet every man
in Switzerland who is physically fit has
received a sufficient amount of training

to make him an effective and efficient

soldier; that this has served to benefit
and uplift the people is conclusively
shown by her low criminal rate, which is
only a fraction of ours, and by the ad-

milted conservation of her people, their ; . Working Your Eight Hours.

law-abiding habits, their patriotism and

their respect for the rights of others.
Contrast her position today with that of
another small European country, which,

unlike her, had not made due prepara-
tion.
In both Switzerland and Austria a large

amount of instruction is given through
the public schools or during the school
period of the youth—so much, indeed,
that only two or three months of inten-
sive training in camp are necessary to
complete the training of the soldier. The
officers take a longer and more intensive
course but the system in both countries
is worked out so that there is practically
no interference with the industrial or ed-
ucational careers of those under training.
There has been little or no interest in

this country in this great question of mil-
itary training. There has been a general
haphazard policy and a blind dependence
upon the voluneers; in other words, a
dependence upon someone else doing
one's work. It is an illogical system.
There is no reason why one group of the
population should assume that another
group is going to voluntarily perform
their military duties.
The obligation to militry service is uni-

versal. It is a tax upon which all others
depend, and a nation which fails to

recognize this prepares its own downfall.
This general training can all be effected
as has been done in Switzerland and
Austria without a trace of militarism,
without any departure from ideals, and
with a great resulting improvement in the

morals, physique arid character of our

yc.utli.
In Switzerland and Austria the training

of young boys is principally of a calis-
thenic character. Later on they pass to
rifle shooting and military formations.
The final finish is put upon them in
training at the camps which immediately
precede their entry into the first line of
the country's defence.
You must not think that war is one of

the great destroyers of human life. It
does take many lives, but it is among the
lesser causes of loss of life. Our indus-
trial casualties of all kinds amount to
something over 450,000 a year. Of these,
about 78,000 or 79,000 result fatally—and
a loss rather exceeding the average loss
of life of two years of the Civil War.
Most of these accidents are preventable.
The public interest in life-saving is not
sufficiently keen to insist on adequate
legislation to this end. The losses in the
war are more dramatic, more startling,
but the lives lost in every-day work in
the struggle for existence exceed them
vastly in number and run on without
ceasing during both peace and war.
The following is a little illustration of

the case of our own country, namely, in

ten peaceful Fourths of July (the last
July 4, 1910), approximately 1,800 per-

sons were killed and something over 35,-
000 wounded in celebrating the success of
a war which ended nearly 130 years ago.
The number killed equals the number
killed in battle or who died of wounds in
the Spanish-American war, the Philippine
rebellion and the Indian wars of a num-

ber of years preceding. The wounded of
these ten peaceful days aggregate seven
and a half times the wounded of all these
wars. I tell you these things not to prove
war is any less dreadful, or that you

should strive less to avoid it, but simply

to present to you the truth with reference
to the causes with brings about the loss of
life.
Do not give up your ideals. Strive for

universal peace, but while striving do
not forget the conditions under which

you are living, and, however much you

may hope to obtain a condition of world
peace, remember that there is no evidence
of it today and that if we want to preserve
the institutions which have been handed
down to us we must be ready to defend
them."

in0-s•

The Country's War Strength.

The Census Bureau reports 21,000,000
men in the United States between the
ages of eighteen and forty-five but this
does not mean that that number of even
untrained soldiers would be available for
a great war, large deductions being nec-
essary for various reasons. The total of
alien whites, Chinese and Japanese, for
example, is estimated at 1,888,000. Then
there is the large total of the physically
unfit which only medical examination
could determine. There would be a fur-
ther large deduction of those in trades
and occupations necessary to the susten-
ance of the country and the maintenance
of the army, in the course of all wars

there being a busy industrial population

more needed at home than at the front.

Manifestly the deduction of aliens, the

physically unfit, and the indispensable

industrial workers would cut the great

total in half.
Russia's fighting strength is estimated

at about eighteen millions, Germany's at
something under eight millions, and Aus-

tria's at about five millions, war has

probably offset the extra deduction of in-

dustrial indispensables by her call for

youths under eighteen and men over forty-

five. Only about eight per cent, of a

country's population is supposed to be

available for war under ordinary condi-
tions. Computation from such a basis
would bring Germany's war strength
down to about five millions and the ac-
tual availables of the United States to
about eight millions—considerably less
than half of our male population of mili-
tary age yet a greater army than any
country except Russia could provide. —
Exchange.

Generally speaking, a man 60 years old
has slept twenty years, played twenty
years and worked twenty years. That is to
say, he has divided each day of hie life as
follows: Eight hours for sleep, eight
hours for pleasure and recreation, and
eight hours for work.
Of course, there are exceptions to this

rule; but the man who violates this di-
vision of his day for any considerable
length of time in the end likely will pay
the piper. If he sleeps too much, he's a
dope, if he plays too much, he vegetates
and disqualifies himself for work; if he
works too much, he breaks down.
Only a third of one's life seems a small

proportion to devote to work. It would
seem that a man could not accomplish
much who devotes two-thirds of his life
to sleep and recreation, and some men
do not accomplish much; but that is be-
cause they do not make the most of their
working hours.
The secret of successful accomplish-

ment in the day's work—the secret of
success in your life's work, lies in indus-
try. While you are working, work—
don't dilly daily arid gather wool and
chew your pencil and run to the window
when you hear the fire engine coming.
Keep eternally on your job in the office
from the time your hang up your hat in
the morning until the clock strikes at
quitting time. Make a chip fly every sec-
ond—concentrate every ounce of mental
or physical energy on the work at hand
—let there be no lost motion, no cerebral
vibration—maintain yourself at the high-
est degree of efficiency.

If you do this for eight hours every day
you'll be heard from ere you are long on
the job—men will marvel at your achieve-
ments—you won't have much competition.
The reason why one man can do in two
hours what another man accomplishes
with difficulty in eight is not hard to find
if you watch both workers for a few
minutes.—From the Boston Post.
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England's Navy.

The Germans counted on the breaking
up or the Empire, but the Dominions
have rallied magnificently to the support
of Great Britain, and so has the great
dependency of India. The Speaker of
the House of Commons said recently,
when addressing the French Deputies:
"Please remember that you are here seeing
only the heart of the Empire and a small
portion of its body. A. large part of its
strength lies in the vast dominions re-
motely situated in both hemispheres.
India, Canada, Australia, South Africa,
New Zealand, to name only a few, have
sent the best of their sons to join you and
us in the great cause for which we are
struggling."

It is the fleet which has made all this
possible, for by it the armies of the Em-
pire are transported from one end of the
world to the other. Under its aegis,
food and munitions are conveyed where
they are most needed. All the while the
British Isles are securely protected from
the enemy, and England is enabled to
carry on her trade and industries, on
both of which her Allies so largely de-
pend. The Spanish paper, El Liberal,
says, speaking of the landing of the Rus-
sian troops in France, "We see here the
action cf the greatest force of this war—
the British fleet. Its silence and invisi-
bility have induced many to believe it in-
active. But it is the great connecting
nerve of the allied powers. Thanks to it.
there are English soldiers in France,
French and English soldiers at Salonika,
and now Russians in France. By it the
German fleet is shut up and well nigh re-
duced to impotence. The exploits of
German submarines appear futive play
when one thinks of their powerlessness to
prevent these gigantic movements of
troops over the world's seas."
When war broke out the German flag

flew over all the seven seas. Now her
great mercantile marine has disappeared.
—Catherine Storrs, in August Southern
Woman's.

No Future in Government Jobs.

In the August American Magazine
James Hay, Jr., says that government
jobs in Washington have no future and
yet thousands of persons want them.

"One day near the close of this session
of Congress," he says, "I asked thirty
members of the House of Representatives

how many applications they had received
that day, either personally or by letter or

telegram, for government jobs. Each of
these representatives, purposely picked to
cover all sections of the country, had on
his desk from two to twenty-one requests
for federal employment. The average
was five.
"A twelve hundred dollar man, whose

family consists of his wife, his fifteen-
year-old daughter and himself, told me
this:
" 'I don't mind confiding to you that
we are able to have a roast of beef in our
apartment only once a year. I haven't
been to a theater for five years. Nor has
my wife. We can't afford to go to mov-
ing pictures more than once or twice a
month—and sometimes, when bills are
piling up. I doubt if we ought to go at
all.' "

Liver Trouble.
"I am bothered with liver troubleabout

twice a year," writes Joe Dingman,
Webster City, Iowa. "I have pains in
my side and back and an awful soreness
in my stomach. I heard of Chamber-
lain's Tablets and tried them. By the
time Iliad used half a bottle of them I
was feeling fine and had no signs of
pain." Obtainable everywhere.
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(,The great banKingf, institution pic-
tured here was the first to undertaKe
what is today the principal function
of all banKs — the Keeping of deposi-
tors' money safe and accessible.

11 The ability of a banK to perform this
function—Keeping depositors' money
safe and accessible—represents its
value to the people of the community
which it serves.

Money deposited with us is safe, and
yet it is at all times accessible. It is
where you can secure it at any time
it may be needed, and where you
are assured of its being in safe hands
until you want it returned to you.

41. A savings account means the culti-
vation of the habit of thrift.

11. Start a banK account with us today. a a
a

The Birnie Trust Company
TANEYTOWISI, MD.

Preparedness at Mathias9
It is Preparedness Day every day at Mathias'. Problems of monument

design and finishing measured, weighed, mastered. Fortified to guard your
interests, rigidly upholding quality, keeping down prices.

RIGHT NOW our Summer Stock is at the height of completeness and
excellence, and selections can be made in ease and comfort after the Memo-
rial Day rush.

Memorials need not be expensive to be effective, as you will be convinced
by viewing the many concrete examples of Mathiae' moderate prices
for worthwhile Monuments, Headstones and Markers.

JOSEPH L. MATHIAS,
East Main St., Opposite Court St.,

Phone 127 WESTMINSTER, MD.,
200 Monuments and Headstones to Select From



LIVE STOCK

HUSBANDRY

FEEDING FOR BEEF.

Results of an Experiment at the Kan-

sas State Agricultural College.

Announcement of results of calf feed-

jug and blackleg serum experiments

that are expected to put the cattle in-

dustry in Kansas on a paying basis

and incidentally place millions of dol-

lars in the pockets of Kansas farmers

was the feature of the fourth annual
Cattlemen's meeting at the Kansas

State Agricultural college. The meet-

ing was attended by several hundred

of the leading live stock men of the

state.
Corn and Kaffir for beef production

Were compared in tests covering a pe-

riod of six months and conducted un-

der the direction of W. A. Cochel, pro-

Among the beef breeds of cattle
none stands higher than the Short-
horn. As a producer of high grade
market beef it ranks with the
topnotchers, and the milking strain
of this breed is popular with farm-
ers who prefer dual purpose cattle.
The illustration shows the head of
a pure bred Shorthorn bull of the
beef type.

fessor of animal husbandry. One hun-

dred high grade Hereford calves were

used, being divided into six lots, each

of which was given a different feed

combination.
The greatest profits were made in

Corn combinations. Shelled corn, cot-

tonseed meal, alfalfa hay and silage

proved most remunerative. The aver-

age profit per steer was $15.26 and the

total gain in weight 436.3 pounds. In

the lot fed ground corn, cottonseed

meal and alfalfa hay a gain in weight

of 441.9 pounds was recorded, but the
higher feed values reduced the profit

to $13.25 for each animal.
The Kaffir combination that brought

the best results consisted of ground

Kaffir, cottonseed meal, alfalfa hay

. and silage. The gain in weight shown

• was 424.1 pounds and the profit $13.14.

• Announcement was made by Dr. F.

S. Schoenleber, professor of veterinary

Medicine, that his department has per-

fected a practical method of absolutely

preventing, stopping and controlling an

outbreak of blackleg among cattle.

"A hyperimmune serum has been per-

fected," said Dr. Schoenleber, "which

will immediately stop the progress of

the disease in a herd and which, when

used in connection with blackleg virus,

will immunize the animal against the

disease. This serum and virus has been

used successfully on more than 20.00C

calves."

SAVING THE FLEECE.

Care In Shearing and Tying Saves

Money For the Sheep Farmer.

Now that the wool crop is sold or

ready for sale can you tell how much

you lost by improper methods in shear-

ing and caring for the fleeces? Wool

men agree that the lack of proper care

In shearing altd. tying the fleece often

makes it necessary to cut the price of

wool 2 to 3 cents a pound. Frequently

half a pound to a pound of "tags" have

to be thrown out of a seven or eight

pound fleece, and the slower grading

made necessary for the buyer reduces

the figure he 14 willing to pay.
It is quite an art to know how to

shear so that the fleece will fall away
from the shears in a loose blanket
Which can be rolled up with the clean

White or flesh side out. This brings

the belly and neck wool at the center.
If the fleece is rolled from the rump a

better looking finished roll will result.
Wool dealers are now much more

particular than formerly about tying
the fleeces with a wool twine instead
Of a binder or sisal twine of any kind.

If vegetable fibers break off and mix
With the wool they hurt the quality of
the yarn, since they do not take the
dye, but appear as off colored specks in
the finished cloth. From now on wool
is going to be worth too much to use
makeshift methods in shearing and
Preparing it for market. —Farm end
Pireside.

Silage as a Horse Feed.
Horses cannot consume as large quan-

tities of silage as cattle, and it is im-
POrtant that only silage of good quality
be given them. At the Missouri expel,
huent station silage has been experi-

• Mentally fed to horse 4 during the last
two winters with very favorable re-
Belts. There was one exception, that
being the ease of a three-year-old mare
which refused to eat the silage at first
When her other feed was reduced she
began to eat it, but soon after trd to
be taken out of the test because of hav-
ing distemper .and indigestion. With
this exception the horses that were fed
the silage were more thrifty, came
through the winter in better condition
1,d cost leas than those fed the usufil
wintering rations.

OP... 4+ 46 + 4. + +

• 4.

• THE STOCKMAN.
4,
• If the harness is badly adjusted +
+ the team cannot travel straight +

+ It is as natural for pigs to eat +

4. grass as it is for any other ani-
• mal to do so.
4; Change the sheep from one pas- +
• ture to another to keep a fresh 4*
1.1. bite on tap.
4* Be sure that the wbiffietrees

are wide enough to protect the 4.
f horses' legs from the wear of the +
• traces.
4. The cleaner the feed the more 4.
• rapid and healthful the growth +
• of the pigs.
4* Be sure that the ram has fresh •
4. water every day and all he will +
• drink,

4.+++++++++4. +4+4.4+4

FINANCIAL AID FOR
BOYS' PIG CLUBS

[Prepared by United States denartment of
agriculture.]

Material assistance is being rendered

to boys' pig clubs in many states by

bankers who realize that the business

Interests of the community can be per-

manently improved through this means.

A favorite scheme is for a local bank

to lend money to deserving club mem-

bers on their personal notes. This
money is used to secure a well bred

Pig, and the note is paid when the ani-
nial is sold for meat, or, in the case of
a breeding sow, when its offspring is
sold. The arrangement is a purely
business one, and there is no question
of giving or receiving charity. Not the
least beneficial result of this arrange-
ment is its effect on the character and
attitude of the Pig club boy.
To such an extent is this practice

carried on in some communities that

SOW WITH LITTER OWNED BY A PIG CLUB

BOY—HIS START IN THE ma BUSINESS.

one Texas bank has placed 326 pigs
among the Pig club members of its
county. In discussing this matter. the
president of the bank stated that as a

result of the acquaintance made in se-

curing and placing these pigs the bank

had secured new patrons who had de-
posited over $75,000 in individual de-
posits. Furthermore, the boys who are
being helped now to get on their feet
financially will in a Short time be mak-
ing big shipments of bogs to market
each year. . The .money brought into
the county in return will mean an in-
crease in general prosperity, in which
the banks will have their share.

SILAGE FOR LAMBS.

Result of a Feeding Experiment at the
Nebraska Station.

The purpose of a recent Nebraska
lamb feeding experiment was to find

out the comparative value of corn and

alfalfa hay fed in various forms with

and without corn silage. The addition

of corn silage to a ration of shelled

corn and alfalfa hay increased the

daily slight gain per lamb and increas-

ed the cost of production 5 cents per

100 pounds. but did not affect the net

profit The addition of silage to ground
corn and ground alfalfa did not in-

crease the gain, but reduced the cost

of 100 pounds gain 31 cents.
Whole grain and bay in conjunction

with the silage was the more econom-

ical of the two rations. Lambs on

ground corn and ground alfalfa hay

made daily gains of 0.371 pound at a

cost of $6.12 per 100 pounds, while

those on shelled corn and alfalfa hay

made daily gains of 0.393 pound at a

cost of $5.11 per 100 pounds. Grind-

ing the two feeds and mixing together

did not produce sufficient added gain

to pay for the cost of grinding.

In a test to compare good versus

poor alfalfa hay as a supplement to

corn in mutton production it was

found that good alfalfa was worth

double the value of poor alfalfa hay.

Corn and alfalfa hay made the best

gains at the least cost in an experi-

ment of four lots of lambs receiving

different rations. The other three ra-

tions were corn, alfalfa and silage,

ground corn and ground alfalfa and

corn, linseed meal and prairie hay.

The most expensive gains were in the

prairie bay lot. The actual cost of the

feed in this experiment was corn, 60

cents; alfalfa per ton, $10; ground al-

falfa, $12; silage per ton, $3.50; oil-

meal, $35; prairie hay, $10.

Feeding the Colt.

There is no time in the animal's life

when gains can be made as cheaply as

the first year and no time when short

feed and exposure will so effectually

stunt the growth. A colt properly fed

and taken care of until a year old

should weigh more than half as much

as he will when full grown. It will be

hecessary to grain the colt more heav-

ily as the milk is taken away. Oats

have always been preferred by horse-

men for colts. They are a splendid

feed and superior to any other single

grain. The colt likes a mixture of

grains, so that by feeding a combina-

tion of corn, bran, oats and oilmeal

good results can be obtained. Feed

about 50 per cent oats, 35 per cent corn,

15 per cent bran and a little oilmeal,

and the colts will thrive and grow like
weeds. — Oklahoma Agricultural Col-

lege.

; S. D. MEHRING
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Whit You Possess TODAY
is Evidence

Of What You Did Without
YESTERDAY

And in the years to come—in accordance with what you are

saving now—you will be financially independent or financially

-broke."

WHICH WILL IT BE WITH YOU ?

Are you not better able to breast the storms of
life now than you will be 25 or 50 years hence?
Do without the luxuries now that you may

have them later in life.

IF YOU ARE INTERESTED IN GETTING ON IN THE

WORLD WE WOULD BE PLEASED TO HAVE YOU CALL.

TANEYTOWN SAVINGS BANK
TANEYTOWN MARYLAND
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•
• Men's, Women's and Children's Shoes ** •
• *
* we have ever carried. Come in and look them over it
• before buying. •
* ot
• •
* We have special good values in Ladies' Shoes, at $2.00. Also lc

* 
•
0• great values in Boys' and Girls' School Shoes.

• •
* We are agents for the Best Line of Men's Heavy Work Shoes *

• on the market, from $1.50 to $3.25 per pair. 
•

* *
• •
* Everything that is new and up-to-date will be found here. *
• •
* Remember we are headquarters for *
* 

•
• NECKWEAR, COLLARS, SHIRTS, UNDERWEAR, *
* 

•
• HOSIERY AND GLOVES. *•

*•
4:

4(
•

READY FOR SPRING
We have for your inspection the largest assortment of

WM. C. DEVILBISS,•

•

• 22 W. Main Street, WESTMINSTER, MD.•
••*•.er•welt•ir•n•Iteire*•wen.eicelts*•*•*•wen•n•n•*•
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Classified Advertisements.
nentisirs.

J. S. MYERS, J. E. MYERS

Westminster, Md. New Windsor, Md.

Drs. Myers,
SURGEON DENTISTS,

Are prepared to do All Kinds of
Dental Work, including

ALUMINUM PLATES.

DR. J. W. HELM,

SURGEON DENTIST,

New Windsor - - Maryland.

Will be in Taneytown 1st Wednesday
of each month.
. I have other engagements for the 3rd
Saturday and Thursday and Friday, im-
mediately preceding. The rest of the
month at my office in New Windsor.
Nitrous Oxide Gas administered.

Graduate of Maryland Universty, Balti-
more, Md.

C. Ss P. Telephone. 5-1-10

ostostostostostostopostostokolgostost
sc 0
It° Both Phones Opposite R. R
o 0

9 g

Littlestown, Pa.
Buggies, Surreys, Jenny rinds, ;

Manufactured 
and Spring Wagons ;

• manuractured in every part /go
r

mo 'rem top to bottom.

o To my Patrons and the Pub- g
IS lie Generally:- It is no longer a ir
O question of economy whether to ,ch.18
o buy a home-made vehicle or not ?
g but the question is, Where will I 0
x be able to get such work ?0
X have a large stock of finished Acl,

all home work, or will build to
order. Repairing promptly g

o done. Correspondence invited, :I
o • or, visit my shops.

itolsolsoliollo1foleolto1soleo1eolsolto

The

Advertised
Article

is one in which the mer-
chant himself has implicit
faith--else he will not ad-
vertise it. You are safe in
patronizing the mer-
chants whose ads appear
in this paper because their
goods are up to date and
not shop worn. : :

A Burning Glass In the Eye.

In the front part of each of our eyes

is a convex lens of great power and

clearness. It acts exactly like a burn-

ing glass. If a person was made to

look at the sun, say, for half a minute.

his eye would actually start to burn

up. The lens would focus the rays of

the sun on the retina, and that part of

the eye would immediately scorch and

later would burn to a crisp. This can

happen, however, only when one looks

at the sun directly or in a mirror. If

one holds a pin between the sun and

the eye and looks at the pin, although

the sun is in a direct line with the eya

and although its rays are entering th-

eye, the eye is not hurt, because the

rays are not focused inside the eyeball.

This is the wonderful property the lens

has, that of focusing objects at differ-

ent distances. The means by which it

does this are its power to change its

curvature.

Riding a Colt.

If a young colt is ridden or driven

several miles over cobblestones or even

over a pike or gravel road be may be

stove up for life. A colt's legs and

feet are filled with soft and tender !

bones, and his muscles and sinews are

easily stretched and torn. Bones are

not iron, and they easily crumble un-

der strain and pressure, and tendons

often pull loose from where they are

grown to young bones, and they can.

not be grown back again. It takes a

colt of almost iron legs even at two

years old to early the lightest boy and

run fast as far as a mile.

Always.
Time haunted her. She laughed at

him, she resorted to a thousand devices
whereby to discomfort him, but he was
not to be shaken off. At length she
lost her temper.
"Can't you see." she flared out re-

luctantly. "that there's no room for you

where beauty dwells?"
"There is always." Time rejoined.

touching his scythe significantly, "room

for one mower!"—Puck.

Mutual Forbearance.

"You and your wife seem to gel

along nicely."
"Fairly well. We had an wider-

standing from the, start, I. wasn't te

expect a dollar to buy more than, a

dollar's worth of goods; and she wasn't

to tell me about the fine men she might

have married."

Very Thoughtful.

Mrs. Comler (on a tour of inspection

through her friend's house)—Gracious!

Why do you have such a high bed for

your litle boy? Mrs. Houseler—So we

can hear him if he falls out. You

have no idea what heavy sleepers my

husband and I are.—Chicago News.

The Result.
"Money, after all, is nothing but

trouble."
"Maybe that is why so many are

given to borrowing trouble."—Balti

more American.

Breaking It Gently.

Beginner—Now you've seen my style

do you think you can tell me what sort

of golfer I shall make? Professional

—Yes, sir, if you can stand the shock.—

Exchange.

TAKING CARE OF FURNITURE

Simple Methods Constantly Employed
Will Keep it Looking Its Best

for Many Years.

White furniture and wood work can
be beautifully cleaned with whiting;
wring a flannel cloth from hot water,
dip in whiting and rub well to remove
all stains, then wash off the whiting
with clean, warm water, dry with a
soft cloth; the rubbing strokes should
always be with the grain of the wood.
Wicker furniture should be cleaned

with a strong solution of salt and
water. Soap should never be used on
wicker, as it produces a yellow tinge;
where very shabby-looking, wicker may
be refreshed by being painted. The
paint used should be well mixed and
thinned to the proper consistency. If
too thick it is apt to remain on the
wicker in lumps.
Furniture upholstered in leather

cloth will last much longer if the cov-
ering is occasionally revived with the
following mixture: Take one part best
vinegar, two parts of boiled linseed
oil, shake well together. Apply a little
on a soft rag and afterward polish
with a silk duster or an old chamois
leather.
When cleaning upholstered furniture

It is often either impossible or incon-
venient to move it out of doors. In
such cases place a wet cloth over the
piece of furniture and then beat It
changing the cloth several times dur-
ing the process. The dust will adhere
to the cloth and will not rise in the
TOOTH.

Try rubbing your furniture which
has grown streaked and dull with a
flannel dipped in equal parts of tur-
pentine and kerosene oil. It polishes
quickly and much more cleanly than
the expensive polishes.

EFFICIENCY IN THE KITCHEN

Standardizing of Equipment Will Be
Found to Work Wonders in

Lessening the Labor.

The thinking housewife who puts
her housework on a systematic basis
is bound to standardize conditions,
thereby accomplishing more and bet-
ter work with the least expenditure
of time, energy and money. Stend-
ardizIng means working at the right
height with the proper tools under
the best conditions of light, ventila-
tion and comfort.
How many women stoop unneces-

sarily over kitchen tables, sinks, wash
tubs and ironing boards? We waste
time and needless walking in poorly
arranged kitchens, whereas, if our
main working equipment was placed
In right relation to our smaller equip-
ment, much waste motion would be
done away with.
Think over carefully the efficiency

of your kitchen and try by rearrang-
ing the equipment you have, to do
more work and better work in less
time.—Miriam M. Haynes, Colorado
Agricultural College, Fort Collins,
Colo.

Stuffed Tomatoes.
Twelve large, smooth tomatoes, one

teaspoonful of salt, a little pepper, one
tablespoonful of butter, one of sugar,
one cupful of bread crumbs, one tea-
spoonful of onion juice. Arrange the
tomatoes in a baking pan. Cute thin
slice from the smooth end of each.
With a small spoon scoop out as much
of the pulp and juice as possible with-
out injuring the shape. When all have
been treated in this way, mix the pulp
and juice with the other Ingredients
and fill the tomatoes with this mixture.
Put on the tops, and bake slowly three-
quarters of an hour. Slide the cake
turner under the tomatoes and lift
gently on to a flat dish. Garnish with
parsley and serve.

Ham and Sweet Peppers.
Canned or sweet peppers are very

nice to combine with minced ham. Put
the ham through a meat grinder, also
some sweet peppers. To three cup-
fuls of meat use half a cupful of pep-
pers. In a deep bowl mix the ham,
peppers and one tablespoonful of
minced parsley. Put into a deep bak-
ing dish, sprinkle the top with bread
crumbs and bits of butter, and bake
In a quick oven half an hour.

Stuffed Green Peppers.
Cut stem end off, scoop out seeds,

put cups thus cleaned into cold water,
and when they have boiled 15 minutes
take off the stove and drain. Mix
stuffing as follows: Equal parts of
pressed hem and bread and small
onion run through meat chopper.
Stuff peppers with this mixture, put a
piece of butter on top of each and
bake 15 minutes in pretty hot oven.

Hot Water Without a Fire.
It is disagreeable to keep a fire dur-

ing the warm summer months merely
for hot water. Have the firmer make
a jacket out of galvanized iron, give

it a lining of asbestos and place it
around the hot water tank. The iron

is of such width that two pieces will

cover the entire tank and extend far

enough above to hold a layer of ashes.

The water will stay hot 24 hours.

Cream of Celery Soup.
Wash and scrape one head celery,

simmer in one pint of water until soft,
mash in same water. Cook one table-
spoonful of onion in one pint oa milk
ten minutes, add to celery, strain and
put on to boil. Cook one tablespoonful

of flour in one tablespoonful of butter

until smooth. Stir into soup, add salt,
pepper and strain.

For the Pastry Cook.
To prevent pie crust from soaking,

"I think not I can pronounce his glaze the under side with beaten
lame."—Browning's Magazine. whites of eggs,

Not Qualified.

"Is he a composer of classical mu-

sic?'

A FLOWER GARDEN
FOR EVERY HOME

What To Plant And How To Plant It

B. W. ANSPON

Maryland State College of Agriculture.

There is a certain delight one se-
cures when showing ones friends
around the garden, pointing out those
plants that are truly our own, those
that we have grown from seed. Many
of the perennials left alone and their
seed allowed to drop around them, will
produce seedlings in great numbers.
Such plants are usually so small and
come up so late in the season that
they are of little use to the amateur.
A much better way Is to sow the
seed now in prepared frames or beds,
transplant them and give them the
best attention in order to grow strong
plants quickly.

First of all, prepare a cold frame in

a well drained place. Fill in good soil
and see that it is well pulverized.

If the soil is not rich, add well rotted

manure and a little sharp sand. Spade

up and work thoroughly, so as to have

a good seedbed. Rake and smooth

the soil, then firm lightly by pressing

down with a board. Sow the seeds
In rows four inches apart. To keep

the varieties separate, use small plant

labels. Insert a label on which the

variety is written, then sow the seed

thinly. After sowing, cover the seeds

according to the size of the seed.

Large seed, like Hollyhock, eau be

covered to a depth of half an hide

Do this by shifting light soil over the

seeds. Fine seeds, like Shwa of Ori-

ental poppies, want no covering what'

ever. Merely press these down into

the soil. Water with a fine hose, so

as not to wash out the seeds. Now

place the sash over the frame. To

give shade, cover glass with a thin

coat of white wash. A still simpler

method is to wet the glass and throw

fine dry clay over the glass. This will

stick on the wet places, giving a good

shade. It has the added advantage of

being easy to wash off. Give the frame

a little air on all bright days. Do this

by lifting one end of the sash and

placing a four-inch strip under the

sash. Water carefully every morning.

When the seedling's appear, which is

usually in about a week's time, give

more air. Keep weeds pulled and cul•

tivate the soil between the plants fre-

quently. As soon as the plants are

large enough they should be trans-

planted. Three to six inches apart

will be sulicient room for most of

them. Re nove the sash altogether,

so as to S atlen the plants. It is well

to shade the newly set plants. This

can be d me by driving down stakes

three feat long at each of the four

corners of the bed and stretch a sheet

of burlap or similar material over

them. Keep the plants growing by

frequent watering and stirring of the

soil. By September, the plants will

be large enough to set out to their per-

manent places.
A few of the perennials that can be

sown now are:
Aconitum (Monkshood).

Alyssum (Goldentuft or Madwort).

Aquilegla (Columbines).

Asters Hardy (Michaelmas; Daisies,

Bellis Perennis (English Daisy).

Boltonia (False Chamomile).
Callirhoe (Poppy Mallow).
Campanulas (Bell Flowers).

Centaurea (Hardy Corn Flower-S.

Chrysanthemum (Shasta Daisy).

Coreopsis.

Dianthus Barbatus (Sweet William).

Delphiniums (Lark Spurs).

Digitalis (Fox Glove).

Gaillardia (Blanket Flower).

Gypsophila (Baby's Breath).

Helianthus (Sunflower).

Hibiscus (Mallows).

Liatris (Blazing Star).

Lupines Polyphyllus (Hardy Lts

Dimes).
Myosotis (ForgetMe-Nots).

Papaver Medicanle (Iceland Pop.

pies).
Papaver (Oriental Poppies).

Platycodon (Balloon Flower).

Pyrethrum Roseum (Colored Daisy)

Rudbeekia (Cone Flower).

Salvia (Hardy Sage).
Seabiosa (Pincushion).

GUARD AGAINST POOR CLOVER

SEED.

Crimson clover seed loses its vital•

ity very rapidly, so that seed which

is two years old is worthless. When
buying, therefore, seed of guaranteed
germination should be purchased.

First class crimson clover seed weighs

60 pounds to the bushel.
Complete failure, due to lack of in.

oculation, is quite common, even

though the field may have a perfect
stand. For inoculation take soil, spade

deep, from a field which has grown

crimson clover and broadcast it, about

2 bushels per acre, over the land which

is to be seeded to crimson clover and

harrow in immediately, in order to

prevent killing of the bacteria by sun.

light.

GARDENS.

Keep up a succession of garden

crops. Continue to plant beans, to.

matoes and sweet corn. Tomatoes

should be staked and pruned. The

ehoote appearing in the axils of the

leaves should be removed as rapidly

as they appear. All garden crops

should be cultivated often and shal-

low. Horse cultivation is best. It

this is not practicable, wheel hoes

;should be secured. A small outlay in

good garden tools saves much time

and labor.
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UNIONTOWN.

Carroll Weaver, wife and daughter,
Mary Loise, of Baltimore, are guests of
Harry and Mrs. Weaver. Carroll has a
week's vacation; Mrs. Weaver and daugh-
ter will remain for the month of August.

Miss Rosa Kahler, of New Windsor,
spent the past week with her sister, Miss
Ella Wilson.
Miss Mary Strawniski, of Baltimore,

and friend were guests in the family of
Samuel Iiiltebridle, the past week.
On Monday, Rev. T. H. Wright, pas-

tor of M. P. church, went to Fawn Grove
Pa., to attend "Home Coming" week, at
request of friends will fill the pulpit of his
home church on Sunday morning. While
there will be the guest of Dr. Hawkins
and family and daughter, Ella. There
will not be any service in M. P. church
on Sunday night.
On Sunday, Burner and Mrs. Cookson,

were given a motor trip to Penn Grove
camp meeting by Edgar Myers, wife and
daughter, Virginia.

Jervis, son of Rev. J. G. Hill, former
pastor of M. P. church, spent few hours
in town on Wednesday evening, seeing
some of his friends. Jervis is a Professor
at Dickenson Seminary, in the Depart-
ment of Agricultural, at Williamsport.
Pa.
On Sunday, Samuel Repp, wife and

children, with Obediah Fleagle, motored
to Emory Grove camp meeting ;also visit-
ed the family of J. C. Wailes, near Fink-
burg. Mrs. Ellen Fleagle Segafoose, is a
guest of Samuel Repp and family.
Norman Eckard, of Baltimore, spent

Sunday with his mother, Mre. Ann Eck-
ard and sister, Laura.
Ralph Rornepert, of Philadelphia, Pa.,

is spending his week's vacation with his
parents, Frank Romspert and family.
Miss Pearl Messer, of Philadelphia, is also
a guest of the family.

Levi Woods, of Baltimore, is visiting
his sisters family, Mrs. Theodore Eckard.
G. A. Thebus, wife and sons, Daniel

and George Albert, of Gaithersburg, Md,
visited their nieces Mrs. Charles Waltz
and Miss Lena Dunsing, the past week.
Mrs. Lizzie Wright, of Bark Hill, is

visiting in the family of her brother,
Solomon Myers.

Mrs. James O'Mears and grandson,
James Kelly, of Glyndon, were guests in
the home of Mrs. Clayton Hann, during
the past week.

Mrs. Martha Culbertson is visiting
friends in Hagerstown. Her sister Miss
Jennie Davidson, of Baltimore, is caring
for their father, Robert Davidson, who
on Monday. passed his eighty-second mile
stone. While he is not confined to his
bed, yet he is not in very good health.
The Misses Dora and Katherine Heine,

of Washington, D. C., spent a week with
their great-aunt, Mrs. Rebecca Myers.

Miss Mary Baumgardner, of Keysville,
is spending a few days with her school
friend, Miss Hilda Englar.

Mrs. Alice L. Brough, who is spending
the month in Westminster, was home a
few days attending the Lutheran bazaar.
On Monday, Aug. 7, Mrs. D. Myers,

Englar entertained her grandfather, Geo.
Belleson, it being his 86th. birthday, her
mother, Mrs. Rose Repp and Mrs. Matil-
da Bostian and daughter Florence, of
Clemsonville, and Richard Bostian, of
Richmond, Virginia.
Mrs. George Selby entertained her niece

Miss Cleo Singer, of Union Bridge, dur-
ing the past week.

Mrs. D. Myers Englar is spending the
week with her mother, Mrs. Rose Repp,
near Johnsville.
Mrs. Harry Fogle and daughter, Miriam,

spent Saturday at Pen-Mar, also visited
her husband, who is employed there this
season.
Miss Daisy M. Fornawalt, of near Un-

iontown, spent last Saturday and Sunday
with her sister and family, Mrs. W.
Bassett Shoemaker, near Bridgeport.

--
BARK HILL.

Sunday school at 9.30 a. m.; C. E. at
7.30 p. In.
The festival held on the church lawn,

on Wednesday night, was well attended
and a financial success.
Mrs. Florence Theal and daughter,

Helen, left for their home in Lancaster,
Pa., on Monday last.
Rev. John Townsend, pastor of the

M. P. church (colored) preached in the
chapel on Sunday night.
Frank Boone, wife and two children, of

Union Bridge, were visitors at John
Rowe's, on Sunday.
George Bostian, wife, and son, William,

went on the excursion to Atlantic City,
on Sunday.
Mrs. Marcus Wolfe and three children,

of Washington, D. C., are visiting rela-
tives here.
The following persons were guests of

Mrs. Levi Rowe, on Sunday: George E.
Englar and daughter, Bernice,of Waynes-
boro; Jesse G. Rowe, wife and children,
Beatrice, Helen and Jesse, and Lloyd
Shipley, wife and children, Catharine
and Charles, and Walter Shipley, Of
York; Mrs. Florence Theal and daughter,
Helen, of Lancaster; Miss Hilda Rowe,
of Baltimore; Thomas Rowe, of West-
minster, and Mrs. Martha Mathews.

Miss Grace Sullivan, of Uniontown,
was a visitor at Levi Rowe s. on Tuesday.

—.vas

TV RON E.

The Young People's Society pic-nic,
which was held last Thursday, was a
grand success. The amount taken in at
the supper table and-stand was $213.51.
John Halter, Sr., of Silver Run, is

spending a week with his daughter, Mrs.
Margaiet Utertnahlen.
Mrs. David Hahn and daughter, Mary.

spent Sunday at Atlantic City.
Miss Sadie Flickinger spent Sunday

with her parents, Win. H. Flickinger
and family.
Jacob Rodkey, Levi Maus and Noah

Babylon attended the pic-nic at Muddy
Creek, Lancaster county, Pa., Saturday.
John Halter, Sr., Mrs. Margaret Uter-

maiden and daughter, Mary, spent Tues-
day with Ira Rodkey and family.

UNION BRIDGE. H AR N Es'.

David H. Foreman fell to tile pavement Howa:a iiarner, wife and daughter,
in front of his home, on Elgar St., Sun- , and James Hunt, of Cumberland, Md.,
day morning, Aug. 6, about 6.30 o'clock, are spending a few days at Charles E.
and expired almost instantly of valvular Hamer's, near this place.
disease of the heart, with which he had
been afflicted about two years. He was
a quiet and estimable citizen,whose worth
was well attested by the very large con-
course of people who gathered to his
obsequies. He was born in Carroll coun-
ty, May 30, 1858. His parents being the
late David and Eliza Shoemaker Fore-
man. He leaves a wife who was Miss
Fanny Crabba and two children, Leonard
and Helen Foreman, both living at home,
also four sisters, Mrs. Laura Fair, Mrs.
Susan Miller, Mrs. Barbara Thomson and
Mrs. Fanny Hawk, and two brothers,
Joseph and Charles Foreman. He was a
member of Olive Council No. 50, 0. U.
A. M., who turned out in a body at the
funeral which was held at Mt. Union
church, Tuesday morning, Rev. W. 0.
Ibach having charge of the religious
services. Burial was in the church cem-
etery.
Mrs. Ella Hoover. of Baltimore, was in

town last week visiting friends, and on
Wednesday attended the funeral of her
cousin, James Roop.
Erby Lindsey and his sister, Miss Leah,

and Miss Bertie Fogle and her cousin,
Howard Haines, motored to town Sunday
in Mr. Lindsey's car and spent the day
with W. W. Fogle and wife and Charles
Minnick and wife.
Raymond Strawsburg loaded his house-

hold goods on a car, Tuesday, and in the
evening left with his family for Hagers-
town, where he has secured employment
at the Security Cement Works. He had
been working for the Tidewater Co.
Joseph Delphy spent Tuesday night at

his daughters, Mrs. O'Connor. He and
wife are now spending some time at
Bradley Stitely's, a nephew of Mrs.
Delphy.
Communion services at Keysville Luth-

eran church, Sunday, Aug. 13, at 10 a.
in.; l'reaching at Rocky Ridge, at 2.30
p. in. Rev. W. 0. Ibach, pastor.
Stanley Minnick and wife will move in-

to the house vacated by Raymond Straws-
burg. on Tuesday.
The Westminster Cornet Band (color-

ed)who played for the Bark Hill (colored)
Sunday School picnic, Thursday, came to
town in their band wagon in the morning
and gave our town a fine sample of their
music, playing a number of pieces while
here.
Mrs. Leonard Foreman was taken to

the Maryland University Hospital, Balti-
more, by Dr. Alexander last Sunday for
treatment.
We have had a number of sales in town

recently and more are advertised for the
future, the people making them claiming
that because of high prices they can do
better boarding than keeping house.

-

LINWOOD.

Joseph Englar, R. Lee Myers and wife,
and Mrs. Clara Englar autoed to Union-
town, Pa., on Wednesday morning, ex-
pecting to return on Saturday.
Mr. Langdon, of Myersville, who will

again take charge of Priestland school,
this Fall, and Miss May Seiss, of Rocky
Ridge, were guests of Mrs. Samuel Brad-
enburg, over Sunday.

Miss Elsie Baumgardner, of Keysville,
will teach the Linwood public school, be-
ginning in September.
The Brethren lawn fete. Saturday eve-

ning, was largely attended, the road
through our village being completely
blockaded with autos and vehicles.
Carroll Stem and gentleman friend. of

Baltimore, were week-end guests of his
parents.
Margaret and Marion Gilbert returned

to Hagerstown, on Thursday.
Miss Alice Englar, of Westminster, has

been a guest at Linwood Shade since last
Friday.
Mrs. Emily Messier, who was paralyzed

several years ago at the home of her
daughter, Mrs. Brad. Stitely, has been
able to be ?nosed to the home of her son,
Lnuis, until Sept. 1st.
Misses Grace and Edna Bovey, and

Flora Roller, of Hagerstown, are visiting
Miss Lotta Engler.
Jesse Garner and wife, and sister, Miss

Emma, will leave for Mt. Lake Park, on
Saturday.
Rev. Earle Riddle left for Hagerstown.

on Wednesday, where he was married on
Thursday evening to Miss Bessie Wit-
more, by Rev. Tombaugh. They will go
to Mr. Riddle's home in Indiana, and
before returning Sept. 1, will attend the
Brethren Conference at Winona Lake.
There will be no services in the church
here, during his absence.

Cure For Cholera Morbus.
"When our little boy, now seven years

old, was a baby he was cured of cholera
morbus by Chamberlain's Colic, Cholera
and Diarrhoea Remedy." writes Mrs.
Sidney Simmons, Fair Haven, N. Y.
"Since then other members of my family
have used this valuable medicine for colic
and bowel troubles with good satisfaction
and I gladly endorse it as a remedy of
exceptional merit." Obtainable every-
where.

—seas- --
UNION MILLS.

Edwaid H. Brown has purchased the
Burgoon property from J. Wilmer Frock,
and will occupy it next Spring.
John W. Humbert and wife entertained

at dinner last Sunday, Rev. S. C. Hoover
and family, Mrs. Hoover and Miss Sarah
Hoover, of Lancaster; John Seidt and
wife, of Baltimore; Addison Humbert
and family, Henry Troxell and wife,
David Humbert and wife, of Medford;
John King and family. Sterling Bixler,
wife and son, and Mrs. John Flickinger.
Mrs. Ellen Erb, of Gettysburg, spent

several days last week with relatives here.
Herbert Yingling, of Baltimore, was a

recent guest at the home of his parents,
E. J. Yingling and wife.
James McCall, wife and daughter, Ruth,

are the guests of Edward Croft and wife.
The body of David Masenheituer was

brought here, tom his home in Westmin-
ster, on Thursday, and services were held
in the M. E. church, after which inter-
ment was made in the adjoining ceme-
tery. Deceased was aged about 62 years,
and is survived by his widow and two
children, Paul D. Masonheitner, of this
district, and Mrs. John Weller, of West-
minster.
Three cows belonging to Miss Rebecca

Earhart have tuberculosis, and were
ordered to be killed. Miss Earhart sus-
pected her cattle, and called in a veter-
narian, who found them infected.
John W. Humbert has purchased the

cider mill from A. W. Feeser.
Mrs. Norman Earbart and two children

are visiting relatives here.

Rev. L. A. Bush and family, who were
spending some time at Jacob Newcomer's,
was summoned home last week to con-
duct a funeral service.

The Masonic fishing club, of Gettys-
burg, are at their camping ground on the
Reck farm for a ten-days' outing. This
is a popular club and people generally
are glad to have them in the community.
We are informed that the Bishop prop-

erty will be sold, September 9.
Dr. Elliott is having a new coal and

wood house erected on his property.which
will be quite a convenience.
G. C. Fox and family spent several

days at Wm. H. Fox's. Cleve left on
Wednesday morning, and the rest of the
family will remain for some time.

Mrs. Fannie Huebner, of Baltimore, is
spending some time with her parents in
this place.
Chas. Shildt, who has been at Millers-

ville School, returned home last Friday
evening, and has Nothing but praise for
the schoo:, and would recommend it to
all who desire to take a short course.
Edward Valentine, who has been with

Mayor Preston's family for eight or nine
years, has been here on quite a lengthy
vacation. He will return about Sept. 1.
Edw. is quite a fine automobile driver,
and is thoroughly equipped in every way
to handle a car.

I. T. Schildt, who had the misfortune
to have one of his fingers torn off while
up greasing a wind wheel, is improving
very slow. In fact he claims that it is
doing nothing in the way of improvement.
John V. Eyler has been confined to his

bed during the past week with muscular
rheumatism. We are informed that he is
up at present, but is unable to work.

Jas. H. Heaver, a former resident of
this place, has just completed a fine new
house in Gettysburg, where he expects to
make his future residence. This makes
Jim the owner of ten dwelling houses,and
all occupied at good rents.
M. R. Snider is rapidly closing out his

stock at cost and less. We are informed
that he will make his home at the S. C.
Shoemaker property, after Nov. 1, when
Mr. Leatherman takes possession of the
store.

MIDDLEBURG.

Marie Eyler. of Baltimore, is spending
some time with Mrs. John Six.

Aubrey Taylor, of Mt. Washington,
spent Sunday with his aunt, Mrs. Chas.
Hyde.
John Bowman and family spent Sunday

at Pen-Mar.
Geo. Humbert and family spent Sun-

day at Ladiesburg.'
Mrs. Carrie Hyde and Mrs. Miller

spent Saturday at New Windsor.
Mrs. Walden is having a new roof put

on her racing stables.
The masons are putting up a new porch

for Daniel Repp. The posts are concrete
and will be very elaborate when finished.

Carrie Bowman spent Sunday with
Hilda Koons, at Good-Intent.
Cora Royston, of Hampstead, is spend-

ing some time with Mrs. Ornie Hyde.
Catherine Ridenour, of Frederick, is

spending some time with her aunt, Mrs.
Mollie Griffin.

The Best Laxative.
To keep the bowels regular the best

laxative is outdoor exercise. Drink a full
glass of water half an hour before break-
fast and eat an abundance of fruit and
vegetables, also establish a regular habit
and be sure that your bowels move once
each day. When a medicine is needed
take Chamberlain's Tablets. They are
pleasant to take and mild and gentle in
effect. Obtainable everywhere.

—
DETOUR,

Robert Spellman and wife, entertained
on Sunday, Mrs. Jacob Frock, daughters,
Helen, Mabel and Edna, and son, Orvil,
Mrs. Houck and son, and Miss Alice
Beard, all of Hagerstown,Howard Moore,
of Frederick, Baker Frailey, wife and
children, Hazel and Carroll, of near
Thurmont, Charles Bowers, wife and
daughter, Ethel, of Ladiesburg,and Chas.
Spellman, of Detour. Mabel Frock who
has been spending some time witn her
aunt, Mrs. Speilman, returned home Sun-
day evening.
Mrs. Charles Eiler, of Baltimore, is

visiting her mother, Mrs. Hannah Weant;
Mr. Eiler spent Sunday at the same
place.
H. H. Boyer, wife, son and daughter,

visited friends in Frederick, one day last
week.
James Warren and wife, Guy Warren,

wife and daughter, Louise, spent Sunday
evening with Parker Smith and wife, of
near Rocky Ridge.

Lillie Speiltnan is spending some time
in Hagerstown, Cavetown and Smiths-
burg.

EMMITSBURG.

On Tuesday, about 5 p. in., during a
heavy thunder storm, the barn of John
T. Long was struck by lightning and con-
sumed with all his season's crop of grain
and hay. Fortunately, all his stock was
saved. There was $300 insurance on the
barn, but nothing on the contents.
Miss Virginia Eyster is visiting her

couein, Mrs. S. C. Ott.
A supper and festival was held on the

grounds of the priest's residence, on
Wednesday. The grounds were brilliant-
ly lighted with electricity. Quite a large
crowd attended.
The Reformed church will be closed

for mid-week service during the month of
August.
Rev. and Mrs. Rinewald will spend

August at Atlantic City.
Rev. L. B. Hensley, who has joined

his family at Beverly, W. Va., will re-
turn the first of September.

PINEY CREEK SUMMIT.

Mrs. Alfred Bowers, of Hanover; Mrs.
Ledley and daughter, Bessie, of Balti-
more; Mrs. Allen Eppley and eon, Den-
nis, and Miss Lillian Lemmon, spent
Sunday at the home of Win. M. Lemmon.

Miss Grace Sharrer, of Frederick, is
visiting John Sauerwein and family.
D. W. Mayers and wife, Clarence

Mayers, and Dr. J. Curtis Mayers, wife
and two children, of Philadelphia, spent
Tuesday at Pen-Mar and enjoyed the
mountain scenery and breezes.
Miss Ruth Sauerwein has returned

home from a pleasant visit to Frederick,
Utica and vicinity.
Dr. and Mrs. J. Curtis Mayers and

children, of Philadelphia, are visiting the
former's parents, D. W. Mayers and
wife.

LI TTLESTOW N.

A year ago, August 2nd., St. John's
church, struck by lightning was totally
destroyed by the resulting flames. This
Sunday the new building erected on the
old site, will be dedicated. The work on
this new building was begun almost im-
mediately after the fire. Steadily the
people of St. John's kept at the task of
replacing the church and today they find
their efforts materializing into a beautiful
new building, both from an exterior and
interior point of view.
This accomplishment is one that merits

congratulations for her members and cer-
tainly every member of the new church.
which challenges in beauty and equip-
ment any church in Southern Adams
county. The structure is of brick, finish-
ed in oak, with a Sunday School room
that can be opened, making both main
auditorium and Sunday School room one
large auditorium with a seating capacity
of about five hundred. It also has an in-
fant Sunday School room. The floors are
covered with a velvet brusselscarpet. The
pulpit furniture is of quartered oak, and
the pews of oak, finished in golden oak.
The building is heated with steam and
lighted by electricity. This church will
be dedicated this Sunday, Aug. 13, with
the following program of service.
9.30—Anthem, "Praise the Lord all Ye

Nation," Choir; Opening Service; Scrip-
ture Lesson, Rev. D. R. Becker; Hymn
No. 197; Prayer, Rev. Dr. John Jay Hill;
Hymn No. 146; Anthem, "Crown Him
Lord of All;" Dedicatory Sermon, Rev.
Dr. H. H. Weber, York, Pa.; Offering;
Solo, "I'm a Pilgrim," Mrs. Irvin L.
Baughman; Dedication, Pastor and Pres-
ident of Synod; Hymn No. 291, accom-
panying Doxology; Benediction.
2:15—Anthem, "God Calling Yet,"

Choir; Hymn No. 103; Scripture Lesson,
Rev. Carl Mumford; Hymn No. 292;
Prayer, Rev. J. B. Lau; Sermon, "God's
Building,” Rev. D. R. Becker, Idaville,
Pa.; Offering; Anthem, "Fount of every
Blessing," Choir; Hymn No. 297, accom-
panying Doxology; Benediction.
7:30—Anthem, "Sweet Sabbath Eve,"

Choir; Opening Service; Hymn No. 25;
Scripture Lesson; Music, Male Voices;
Prayers Rev. D. R. Becker; Hymn No.
294; Sermon, The Prosperous Church,"
Rev. Carl Mumford, Baltimore; Duet,
"Jesus Savior, Pilot Me," Mrs. Irvin
Baughman and Rev. I. M. Lau; Confir-
mation Sermon, Rev. J. B. Lau, New
York City; Hymn No. 511; Confirmation
and Reception of Members; Doxology;
Benediction.
The remains of Mrs. Matilda Mehring,

a former resident of this place, was
brought her for interment on last Sunday
in Mt. Carmel cemetery.
The Christ church picnic which was

held last Saturday was largely attended.
Mrs. Walter Zeigler and two sons, of

Frederick, returned home Sunday after
spending a week with her aunt, Miss
Vertie Hamner.
Miss Naomi Reck, was the week-end

guest of her parents, Zatina Reck and
wife, of Hanover.
Paul Blocher and John Feeser, of Bal-

timore, spent Sunday with the former's
parent, Charles Blocher and wife.
Mrs. Mary Long, returned home on

Monday after spending several weeks with
her daughter, Mrs. William Brumfield,of
Altoona. Mrs. Long was accompanied
home by her grand-daughter, Mary
Brumfield and Miss Frances Winebreitner
both of Altoona.

KEYSVILLE.
•

Miss Carrie Stonesifer, of Baltimore, is
making a hurried visit among friends it
and around this place.

Garfield Pittinger and family, of Phila-
delphia, visited his sister, Mrs. Robert
Valentine, the last week's-end.
Miss Margaret Kauffman, of Woods-

boro, is visiting Miss Kathryn Stull.
Mr. and Mrs. Krepps and Mrs. Lotz

have returned to their home in Baltimore,
after visiting C. H. Valentine and family,
Mrs. George Frock is convalescing after

a bad case of sickness the past week.
Some of our people attended the Tem-

perance Demonstration at LeGore, on
Sunday.

Peter Withide and wife entertained the
following at a chicken roast on Monday
evening: C. H. Valentine, Wife and
daughter, Ellen, Mr. and Mrs. Krepps,
and Mrs. Lotz, of Baltimore, C. A.
Daley and wife, and Maurice Duttera
and wife, of Taneytown, and Mrs. Harri-
son Smith. of Des Moines, Iowa.

Clifford Hahn, wife and daughter,
Mary, of Harney, and Mrs. Alice Hahn,
of Taneytown, were visitors at Calvin
Halin's over Saturday and Sunday.
Master Earl Frock, of near Clear View

school house, is visiting his uncle, James
Kiser and family.
Harvey Shorb and wife took Edward

Shorb, Edward Knipple and C. E. Six a
joy ride in the former's automobile, on
Sunday. They took in Gettysburg battle-
field, New Oxford, Hanover and Littles-
town, on their way home.

Miss Emma Addison, of Frederick, is
visiting at Charles Stonesifer's.
Mrs. Knipple and daughter, of Wash-

ington, D. C., spent a few days with the
former's nephew, Peter Wilhide.

Miss Mary Baumgardner is a guest of
her class-mate, Miss Hilda Engler, at
Uniontown.
Thomas E. Burgoon, of near Philadel-

phia, paid a visit to 0. R. Koontz, last
Friday. It was a very welcome visit as
they had not met for 27 years.
Mrs. Frank Hahn, of Baltimore, is

visiting relatives near here.
Holy Communion will be administered

by Rev. Ibach, on Sunday morning at
10 o'clock.

James Fox and wife, of Arlington, vis-
ited John Shorb and wife, last Friday
evening and Saturday.
Elmer Fox, wife and daughter, Doro-

thy, and Miss Myrtle Suddeth. of Wash-
ington, D. C., visited Samuel Boyd and
wife, last Friday evening and Saturday.
Harry Fox, wife and children, Vernon

and Mabel, Mr. Lewis and son, Willie, of
Washington, D. C., and Earnest Myers,
and wife, and Nellie Myers, recently vis-
ited Harry DeBerry and wife.

KEY MAR.

The Keytnar Base Ball Club defeated
the New Windsor Club, on the grounds
of the latter, on Thursday, August 10th,
by the following score:
Keymar 101210101012101113-8
N. Windsr121110101110 ' 01010-4
There will be a double-header played at

Keymar on Saturday: Keymar vs. Linga-
fore, at 1.30 p. in., and Woods.boro vs.
Keyinar Juniors, at 4 p. in.
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Tools and Cutlery today. They
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All our claims are backed with
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WESTERN MARYLAND COLLEGE
WESTMINSTER. MD.

REV, T. H. LEWIS. 0 D.. LL. 0.. PRESIDENT.

For Young Men and Women in Separate Departments

, LOCATION unexcelled. 1,000 feet above the sea, in the highlands
' of Maryland. Pure air, pure water, charming scenery, Only an
hour's run from Baltimore.
EQUIPMENT complete. Twenty Acre Campus; Modern Build-
ings; comfortable living accommodations; Laboratories, Library,

i Gymnasium, Power and Heating Plant.
CURRICULUM up-to-date. Classical, Scient&

' 
Historical and

Pedalogical Courses, leading to A. B. degree. Music, Elocution
and Oratory. Strong Faculty.

' PREPARATORY SCHOOL for those not ready for College.
Send for Catalogue and Book of Views.

6.23,3in

MANCHESTER.

There i5 strong sentiment expressed
among temperance people that Baltimore
the stronghold of the liquor traffic in
Maryland, will go dry in the November
election. The writer often visited Balti-
more on business, and for love or money
could get no soda water or any kind of
refreshing drink down around the wharf
and lower business section of the city.
Every other house seemed to be a res-
taurant, cafe, saloon or hotel. It will be
nothing short of a miracle to have this all
changed.
Hampstead District is noted tor a large

hay crop. Many loads of hay with five
tons drawn by eight horses and mules
pass through here enronte to Hanover.
Last week Mr. Arrnacost lost such a load
of hay by tire, together with the wagon
both were insured for $.300. which barely
covers the loss.
Mrs. Amanda Harris was taken to a

Baltimore Hospital to be operated on for
appendicitis.
Dr. J. H. Sherman purchased a new

Ford automobile a month or two ago,and
is kept busy even with this modern meth-
od of traveling.

PLEASANT VALLEY.

Rev. S. J. McDowell, D. D., and wi,fe,
of Baltimore, spent a week as the guests
of their friends, John Senft and family,
near Pleasant Valley.

Just the Thing for Diarrhoea.
"About two years ago I had a severe

attack of diarrhoea which lasted over a
week," writes W. C. Jones. Buford,
N. D. "I became so weak that I could
not stand upright. A druggist recom-
mended Chamberlain's Colic, Cholera
and Diarrhoea Remedy. The first dose
relieved me and within two days I was as
well as ever. Many druggists recom-
this remedy because they know that it is
reliable. Obtainable everywhere.

Sherlock Holmes at Church.

Tommy's mother had taken him te
church to hear the evening sermon, and
they occupied seats in the gallery. Tommy
tried not to allow his attenition to wan-
der from the preacher, but it did. He
seemed to be particularly interested in a
family who sat in front of him, and when
the sermon was about half over he whia7
pered to his mother:
"Mamma, I never saw those people

before, but I know their names."
"Hush, dear !"
"But I do," persisted Tommy. "Their

name's Hill.''
"How do you know ?"
'Every time the preacher says his

text, 'I will lift up mine eyes to the hills,'
those two big girls look at each other and
smile."
Subsequent inquiry proved that Tommy

was quite correct.
—

Spend Your Money
with your home merchants.

They help pay the taxes,

keep up the schools, build
roads, and make this a com-
munity worth while. You
will find the advertising of
the best ones in this paper.

1 PRIVATE SALE
OF

A Good Farm
•

On road from Basehoar's Mill to May-
berry,

86* ACRES, 12 PERCHES,
improved with Good Frame Dwelling,
Bank Barn, 70 ft; Wagon Stied, Hog
House, and all necessary outbuildings,all
in good order. About 10 acres in timber,
mostly white oak. Two good wells, one
at barn with wind pump forces water to
house. Wili sell on satisfactory terms.
For information see-
7-28,3t CHAS. E. KEEFER.

PRIVATE SALE
OF —

A FINE FARM
My Home Farm of 149 Acres

in laneytown District, improved with a
BRICK HOUSE, Bank Barn with slate
roof, Wagon Shed, Summer House, Hog
Pen, etc. Plenty a water supplied from
two good wells. In addition, there is on
the place $2000 worth of heavy timber.
Good opportunity for a man with small
capital, as I will sell on easy terms. For
further information, see

L W. MEHRING,
7-21-4t Taneytown, Md.

Notice to Creditors
ThL, is to give notice that the subscriber

has obtained from the Orphans' Court of Car-
roll County, in Md., letters of administration
upon the estate of

JACOB H. SHANEBROOK,
late of Carroll County, deceased. All persoug
having claims against the deceased, are hereby
warned to exhibit the same, With the vouchers
properly .authenticated. to the subscriber on
or before the 8th day of March, 1917; they
may otherwise by law be excluded from all
benefit of said estate.
Given under my hands this 11th day of

August, 1916.
N. CLAYTON SHANEBROOK,

8-11-51 Administrator

PRIVATE SALE
OF

A Nice Home
The undersigned offers his nice home

property, located in Keysville, at private
sale. The improvements are a

GOOD FRAME DWELLING,
containing 7 rooms, good stable, and all
necessary smaller buildings. The lot con-
tains about I Acre. A very desirable lo-
cation. The property will be soldon easy
terms; if desired will let part of purchase
money in the property. Possession
April 1. 1917.
8-4,4t U. R. KOONTZ.

The Maryland State College of Agriculture
Gives Special Courses in—

Agriculture, Animal Husbandry, Dairy-
ing, Poultry Husbandry, Fruit Growing,
Market Gardening, Floriculture, Canning,
Chemistry, Biology, Rural, Civil, Me-
chanical and electrical Engineering.

Military Training.

College Expenses, $50. Living Expenses, $190.
4-year, 2-year, 10-weeks, and CORRE-
SPONDENCE COURSES. FALL TERM
begins September 12th.
For Full Information address—

THE REGISTRAR. College rark, Md.
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Watches, ClocKs and Jewelry

Carefully Repaired O. Worli Guaranteed

MeCLEERY'S JEWELRY STORE
48 N. MARKET STREET, Next to "The News,"

FREDERICK, MD.

Reliable - Courteous - Prompt
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EDDBIjIC B.A_T_Jal,'
OF 60 HEAD OF

Virginia Co s
CONSISTING OF

Fresh Cows and Springers,
Mostly All Springers.

These are some of the finest cows that ila.ve been shipped
here for some time, and weigh from 1000 to 1500 pounds. All
fine, large DURHAM and HOLSTEIN Stock. We believe
this is the finest selected .bunch of Cows that we have ever
bought since we have been .in business. .Come to this big
sale and get a cow.

4; This sale will be held on Carroll Street. near the Lutheran
; Church, on

Saturday, Aug. 12th., at 12 O'clock
IN WESTMINSTER„ MD.

TERMS OF SALE:-5 months with interest. No stock to
be removed until settled for.

J. N. 0. SMITH. Auct. J. ELMER MYERS.
2t E.RCY F. KARVER.

•

Notice!

We Pay For and Remove

Your

Dead Animals

PROMPTLY

Call "LEIDY,"
"Always on the Job"

Phone No. 259,

Westminster, Md
4-21,3m

PUBLIC SALE
— OF —

VALUABLE REAL ESTATE

On friday,18th Day of August,1916
the undersigned Executors of the Last Will
and Testament of Joseph A. Wolf, late of the
Borough of Littlestown, County of Adams and
State of Pennsylvania, deceased, in pursuance
of the authority unto them granted in and by
the Last Will and Testament of said Joseph A.
Wolf. deceased, will sell at public venue or out-
cry, on the premises, the following described
real estate:
TRACT NO. 1.—A tract of land situate in the

Township of Mt Joy, County of Adams and
State of Pennsylvania. adjoining lands of Jacob
Spangler, Aaron Hartman, Agnes Barr,Cbarles
Lambert and Washington Shoemaker, con-
taining

SIXTY-THREE (63) ACRES

more or less, and located on the road leading
trom Littlestown to Emmitsburg, about four
and one-halt miles from Littlestown.
About Four Acres of the above tract is cov-

ered with oak and hickory timber and the bal-
ance is farm land In a good state of cultivation,
tinder ;,;ood fencing and im-
proved with a 2-Story Frame
House, bank barn with wagon
shed attached, hog pen, buggy
shed, chicken house and all
other necessary outbuildings; an excellent and'
never-failing well of water conveniently locat-
ed for use at both house and barn; sufficient
Peach, cherry and other small fruits for family
tate,

TRACT NO. 2.—A tract of land situate in the
same Township, County and State, adjoining
lands of Tract No. 1, Charles Lambert, Agnes
Ear; Gibson Hamer. Joseph Spangler, Isaiah
Harner and Washington Shoemaker, contain-
ing

NINETY 190) ACRES,

more or less, and located on the road leading
from Littlestown to Emmitsburg, about five
miles from Littlestown.

About nine acres of the above tract is cov-
ered with oak auk hickory timber, and the
balance is farm land in a good state of cultiva-
tion, under goop fencing and improved with a

=se\ 2-Story Stone House, 2-Story
Frame Addition and Summer
Kitched attached, bank barn
with wagon shed attached,
hog pen, chicken house, bug-

gy shed, implement shed and all other neces-
sary outbuildings; 2 god wells of water located
conveniently for use at house and barn. On the
Property there are bearing fruit trees of the
following description: Apple, peach, cherry,
Pear, and other small fruits.
The buildings on this property are located

about one-eighth mile from the above men-
tioned public road.
TERMS.-25 Per-cent of the purchase money

1°,.. be paid in cash, or note with approved se-
rilstY Payable April I, 1917, and balance April
14,0, when deed and possession will be given.
„ e Purchaser to have the vendor's share of

e grain crop to be sown, he to pay or furnish
se!..e vendor's share of the seed wheat, or rye.
PaesPhate and grass seed. All taxes for the
Year 1917 to be paid by the purchaser.
Sale to commence on Tract No. tat 1.30 p. m.

and on Tract No. 2 at 3 p. m., when attendance
be given 5 b -

7-21-4t

ALBERT S. WOLF,
HARRY J. WOLF.
WESLEY Gs WEIKERT,

Executors.

ECONOMY IS WEALTH.
Clean your soiled grease spot

c lathes with Lum Turn ClothesCleaner.. Price 15c per bott!e, at
McKellIp's Drug Store,Advertisement.'

Fxecutor's Sale
— OF A --

Valuable Farm
In Middleburg District, Carroll

County, Maryland.

By virtue of the power and authority con-
tained in the last Will and Testament of
Thomas G. Otto, late of Carroll County, Mary-
land, deceased, and an order of the Orphans'
Court of said Carroll County, the undersigned
Executors will sell at public sale upon the
premises, on

THURSDAY. AUGUST 17th., 1916,

at 2 o'clock, p. m., all that valuable farm con-
taining

80 ACRES, 3 ROODS, 22 SQUARE PERCHES,
more or less, improved by a Large Stone and
Frame DWELLING HOUSE, Bank Barn.
Grain Shed, Carriage House, Wait' House,
Corn Crib, Hog Pen, Smoke House, &c. This
is one of the moat desirable farms in Canon,
County, as all the buildings are in excellent
condition, and the land is in a high state of
cultivation, level, kind to cultivate, and very
fertile and productive. It is located on the
public road leading from Middleburg to Key-
mar and Ladiesburg, about one-eighth of a
mile from the former place, in Middleburg
District, Carroll County, Maryland, conven-
ient to church, schools and several grain mar-
kets, as it adjoins the Western Maryland Rail-
way Station at Middleburg, and is about three-
fourths of a mile from York Road and the
Pennsylvania Railroad Station at Keymar.
This property adjoins the lands of the late
R. W. Walden estate, J. Albert Stansbury and
others, is occupied by E. Elmer Smith, tenant,
and was owned and occupied by Thomas G.
Otto at the time of his decease.

TERMS OF SALE.—One-third cash on the
day of sale or on the ratification thereof by the
said Court, and the residue in two equal pay-
ments, the one payable in six months, and the
other payable in twelve months from the day
of sale; the credit payments to be secured by
the bonds or single bills of the purchaser or
purchasers, with sufficient security, bearing
interest from the day of sale, or all cash at the
option of the purchaser or purchasers.

WILBUR H. OTTO and
ELLA ED.N A KOONS,

N. 0. Smith, Auct. Executors.
O. Weant, Attorney. 7-21,4t

PUBLIC SALE
OF AN _

Exceptionally Fine Farm
AND WOOD LOT.

The undersigned, will offer at Public Sale, on
the premises on the public road leading from
Taney town to Keymar, in Carroll county.
about 1 mile from Taneytown, on

SATURDAY, AUGUST 12, 1916,
at 1 o'clock, p. m., his exceptionally fine farm,
containing

133 ACRES OF LAND,

more or less, known as the Nathaniel Raitt
farm. The improvements consist of a large
Brick Dwelling of 12 rooms, a fine Bank Barn
4ux90 feet. tool shed...hog house .and .. all other
necessary buildings, all indne -repair. Water
in the house, barn and hog house, all supplied
from a never-failing well of fine water. Also a I

FINE WOOD LOT,
containing over 4 Acres located on tne Stone
road about 5 miles northeast of Taneytown.

PERSONAL PROPERTY.
consisting of lot of chestnut posts, boring ma-
chine, 2 digging irons, broad axe, post mortic-
ing axe, patent rail holder, 1 one-horse wagon,
2 steel lime measures, lot of oak lumber, 1 inch
and t4 inches, and other small articles, Terms
on personal property, cash.
The above property is all in flue condition

and should attract the attention of buyers of
good real property.
TERMS to suit purchaser will be made

known on day of sale. A deposit of $200.00
either cash, or note, will be required on day of
sale.

P. S. HILTERBRICK.
J. N. 0. Smith, Auct. 7-21-41

Rats destroy nearly
billion dollars

worth of food and property every year. KIII your
rats and mice and stopystir loss with

RAI' CORN '
It is safe to use. Deadly to
rats but harmless to
human beings. Rats simply
dry up. No odor whatever.
Valuable booklet in each can.
"How to Destroy Rats."
25c, 50c and $1.00.
Is Reed. Hardware. Drug
and General Stores.

REINDOLLA R BROS. & CO.
TANEYTOWN, MD. 7 21-6m

SIMPLE, HARMLESS. EFFECTIVE
Pure Charcoal Tablets, for Dysp Spain,

Acid Stomach, Heartburn and Constipa-
tion 10c and 25c—at McKellip's.
acivertiserneut

PUBLIC. SALE
The undersigned, intending to quit farming,

will offer at public sale, on his premises situated
on the stone road leading to Pleasant Valley,
about 1 mile from Marker's Mill, on

THURSDAY. SEPTEMBER 7th., 1916,

at l2in., sharp, my farm containing

17 ACRES AND 41 PERCHES.

about 4 Acres in Timber. The improvements con-
sist of a 7 ROOM HOUSE, summer house, barn,
chicken houses, hog pen, smoke house, good well
at house, brook watered pasture, fruit of all
kinds.

TERMS :—One-third cash on day of sale, bal-
ance to suit purchasers.

Also at the same time and place, I will sell the
following personal property:

TWO GOOD BEDSTEADS
and bedding, Cook stove, 2 chunk stoves, 2 dress-
ers, buffett, :3-piece parlor suite. couch, 6 chairs,
4 rockers, stands, 96 yds. carpet, part good as
new; kitchen cupboard,sink,dining table, 6-hand
painted chairs, swing cradle, 190 yrs. old; Edison
phonograph and about 100 records; 2 high chairs
sink, kitchen table, lawn swing, washing ma-
chine, tubs, lot cooking utensils, 3 lamps, glass-
ware, dishes, lot preserved fruit, work bench,
carpenter tools, iron kettle, 25 fence posts, lot
new lumber and boards, wheelbarrow, hand cart
rakes, picks, shovels, crowbar, crosscut saws,
maul and wedges, cow chains, lot harness, lad-
ders, drilling tools. Sausage grinder, quilting
frame, scythes, grain cradle, grindstone, shovel
plows, corn worker, single trees, plow, 1-horse
harrow, lot wheels, old iron, corn choppers, lot
fence wire, squirrel cage, potato plow, lot framed
pictures, lot books, old musket, revolver, 2 butter
churns, and many other articles not mentioned.
TERMS :—Sums of $5.00 and tinder, cash. On

sums above $5.00 a credit of 6 months will be
given on notes with approved security, with in-
terest. No goods to be removed until settled for.

JACOB S. CROLTSE.
H. E. Cashman, Auct. 8-11-4t

TAX COLLECTOR'S SALE
By virtue of authority vested in me by the laws

of the State of Maryland, and my office as Collec-
tor of State and County taxes for the Tenth Elec-
tion District of Carroll County, State of Mary-
land, and by virtue of an order of the Board of
County Commissioners of Carroll County, I have
seized and taken in execution the following prop-
erty, situate in the Tenth Election District of
Carroll County aforesaid, to pay and satisfy the
hereinafter stated State and County Taxes, due
and in arrear and unpaid, to-wit: all the right,
title, interest and estate of Emma S. Powell in
and to all that lot of ground situated in the vil-
lage of Detour in said County and State, being
the same land that was conveyed to John Wey-
bright by Alfred N. Forney and wife, by deed
dated March 31, 1887, and recorde1 among the
Land Records of Carroll County aforesaid, in
Liber W. N. M., No. 65, folio 532, etc., and being
also the same land that the said John Weybright
devised to the said Emma S. Powell by his last
will and testament duly admitted to probate in
the Orphans' Court of Carroll County, December
20, 1891, and recorded among the Will Records in
the office of the Register of Wills of said County,
in Liber G. M. P. No. 6. folio 57, etc., containing

ONE-THIRD OF AN ACRE OF LAND,
more or-less. The improvements thereon consist
of a Brick Dwelling House and a Store-house, but
the said Store-house is subject to the terms and
conditions of a lease to Emory L. Warner.
Amount of State and County Taxes due and

unpaid:
State Taxes for 1914, $11.94, with interest from

January 1, 1915.
County Taxes for 1914, $26.18, with interest from

January 1, 1915.
State Taxes for 1915, $11.80, with interest from

January 1, 1916.
County Taxes for 1915, $29.20, with interest from

January 1, 1916.
And notice is hereby given that I will offer for

sale at public aution, to the highest bidder, the
above described land and premises, at the Court
House Door in Westminster. Md., on

SATURDAY, SEPTEMBER 2, 1916,

at 11 o'clock, a. m., to pay and satisfy the above
gand CountyreTaxes, interest, costs and legal

charges. 
TERMS

res

TERMS OF SALE :—CASH.
WILSON L. CROUSE,

Collector of State and County Taxes
for Tenth Election District of Car-
roll County, Md.

Charles E. Fink, Attorney. 8-11,4t

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned will sell at public sale,

in Taneytown, on
THURSDAY, AUGUST 24th., 1916,

at 1 o'clock, p. m., at the premises now
occupied by Silas 0. Shoemaker, the fol-
lowing personal property:

ONE BED-ROOM SUITE,

good as new; 1 bed, 1 double-heater,
good as new; 1 new couch,. marble-top
stand, wardrobe, desk, 24-hour clock, 2
split-bottom rocking chairs, cane-seat
rocking chair, 6 cane-seat chairs, 28 yds
brussels carpet, 20 yds of ingrain carpet,
good as new; double-barrel shot gun, old
army musket, 32-calibre revolver, large
mirror, 13 window shades and fixtures,
and a lot of articles not mentioned.

TERMS, CASH.

HARRY G. LAMBERT.

J. N. 0. Smith, Auct. 7-28,4c

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned, as administrator, will

sell at public sale on the premises, near
Mt. Union church, on

TUESDAY, AUGUST 22nd., 1916,

at 1 o'clock, p. m., the
REAL AND PERSONAL PROPERTY

of the late Abraham A. Lambert. This
is a very desirable little home, and will
be sold on the usual terms prescribed by
the Court.

HARRY A. LAMBERT,
S-4,3t Administrator.

PRIVATE SALE
OF A

Good Farm
I will sell at private sale my farm con-

taining about
70e ACRES OF LAND,

with good buildings and plenty of fruit of
all kinds. Two never-failing wells, one
at house and one at barn. Located near
Kump Station. Possession April 1. This
is one of the best farms in the neighbor-
hood.
7-28-3t JACOB MESSINGER.

PRIVATE SALE
— OF —

A Desirable Home
Containing 12 Acres,

with nice Large House, Summer Kitchen,
Barn, Hen House, Hog Pen, etc., all in
good condition. 'Water handy to house
and barn. Plenty of fruit. Call and I
will gladly show you around. Reason for
selling, I am offered a good position else-
where.
Possession given April 1, 1917.

HARRY ECKER,
8-4-4t near Greenville.

Piano Bargains
New Pianos, $125 up; second-hand,$25

up. Organs, $10 up. Easy terms, $5
monthly. Over a dozen makes at Lowest
Factory Prices, including the Famous
Lehr and others, sold 20 years at Birely's
Palace of Music CRAMER'S PALACE OF

MUSIC, Frederick, Md. Phone 455-R.
11-8,15-ly

REAL ESTATE BARGAINS PUBLIC SALE BREAD MADE IN A HURRY
— OF A — Just as Good as When Done in the— IN THE —

Agency of D. VS GARNER GOOD SMALL FARM
The undersigned, as Executor of Samuel

Weybright, deceased, by virtue of an order of

Taneytown, Md. the Orphans' Court of Carroll County, Mary-
land, will offer at public sale, on

TUESDAY. AUGUST 29th, 1916,
at 1 o'clock, p. m., the following described.
farm, consisting of

52 ACRES OF LAND,
about 6 acres in fine timber, improved by a
good as new eight-room Frame Dwelling with

basement; a splendid well of

TRACT NO. 1.
Double dwelling, located on George street,

Taneytown, Md.

TRACT NO. 2.

' Business for sale in Taneytown, Md. Young
man, it's to your interest to look it up.

TRACT NO. 3.
Steam and water-power mills for sale in Car-

roll, Frederick and Adams counties.

TRACT NO. 4.
Building lots, improved, located along new

state highway, on Baltimore street extended.
TRACT NO. 5.

83-Acre Farm, more or less, in Taneytown
district. Buildings all good; none better. Must
be seen to be appreciated.

TRACT NO. 6.

Large new frame house. 10 rooms and store-
room, on Frederick street, Taneytown.

TRACT NO. 7.
Two large brick houses. If not interested in

fine homes, need not apply.
TRACT NO, 8.

160-Acre Farm, in Taneytown, district.

TRACT NO. 9.

About 65 acres of unimproved land. Good
location.

TRACT NO. 10.

109 Acres, more or less, in Taneytown dis-
trict, 15 acres is iu tine white oak timber. Crops
well; taxes about $50.

TRACT NO, 11.

Double dwelling, located on East side of Mid-
dle street extended, Taneytown.

TRACT NO. 12.

75 Acres, more or less, in Middleburg district,
Carroll county. Favorably located.

TRACT NO. 13.

47 Acres, more or less, 'located in Union
Bridge district. Suitable for trucking and
poultry raising.

TRACT NO. 14.
Small property for sale cheap, in Harney,

Carroll county.
TRACT NO. 15.

For rent—the old reliable Fink implement
warehouse. Possession at once.

TRACT NO, 16.
2 Brick dwellings for rent, with all modern

improvements. Possession at once.

• TRACT NO. 17.

$5000 on First Mortgage, on farm, at 5Ss' per
cent.

I will also take property not to be ad-
vertised. Will negotiate fair dealing to
buyer and seller. Come in, we'll talk it
over.

D. W. GARNER,
Licensed Real Estate Agent,

TANEYTOWN, MD.

EXECUTORS' SALE
— OF A

DOUBLE DWELLING HOUSE
— AND —

PERSONAL PROPERTY
IN TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND.

By virtue of the power and authority contain-
ed in the last will and testament of Valentine J.
Harman, late of Carroll County, Maryland, de-
ceased, and an order of the Orphans' Court of
Carroll County, the undersigned Executors will
sell at public sale upon the premises, on

TUESDAY. SEPTEMBER 5th., 1916,

at 3 o'clock. p. m., all that tract or parcel of land
containing

11,556 SQUARE FEET,

more or less, improved by a DOUBLE WEATH-
ERBOARDED DWELLING HOUSE, Stable and
Wagon Shed, located on George Street, in Taney-
town, Carroll County, Maryland. This property
is a very desirable one being located in the resi-
dential part of the town, fronts 54 feet on George
Street and has a depth of 214 feet to an alley.
This will make a profitable investment to any
one as the dwelling accommodates two families,
and is now occupied by Mr. Gassaway Older and
Letha A. Herman and is the same property which
was conveyed to the said Valentine J. Harman
by John H. Diffendal, Executor of Tobias H.
Eckenrode by deed dated March 29th., 1909 and
recorded among the Land Records of Carroll
County in Liber D. P. S. No. 111, folio 431, and
which the said Valentine .1. Harmon owned at
the time of his death.
TERMS OF SALE:- One-third of the purchase

money to be paid to said Executors on theday of
sale or on the ratification thereof by the said
Court, and the residue in two equal payments,
the one payable in 6 months and the other pay-
able in 12 months from the day of sale: the credit
payments to be secured by the bonds or single
bills of the purchaser or purchasers, with suffi-
cient security, bearing interest from day of sale,
or all cash at the option of the purchaser or pur-
chasers.

LETHA A. HARMAN, •
CHARLES E. KEEFER,

J. N. 0. Smith, And, Executors.
E. 0. WEANT, Attorney.

By virtue of the authority contained in the last
will and testament of Valentine J. Harman, late
of Carroll County, Maryland, deceased, and an
order of the Orphans' Court of Carroll County,
the undersigned Executors will sell at public sale
upon the premises formerly occupied by Valen-
tine J. Harman on George Street, Taneytown,
Maryland, on

TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 5th., 1916,

at 1 o'clock, p. m., all the following personal
property, to-wit:-

TWO GOOD BEDSTEADS.
2 leaf tables, double heater coal stove, cook stove,
bureau, safe, cot, stand, 3 rocking chairs, cup-
board, 14-doz. kitchen chairs, 11 dining room
chairs, lot of carpet and matting, 2 clocks, oil
stove, lot of jarred fruit and jellies, iron kettle.
and many other articles not mentioned.

TERMS OF SALE:- All sums under $5.00 cash,
and all sums of $5.00 and above, a credit of 6
months will be given the purchaser or purchas-
ers giving his, her or their notes with sufficient
security, bearing interest from the day of sale.

LETHA A. HARMAN,
CHARLES E. KEEFER,

J. N. 0. Smith, Auct. Executors.

Also at the same time and place, will be sold
the following:

ONE WEAVER ORGAN,

Minnesota sewing machine, couch, wash stand,
chairs, and many other articles. All the above
articles are in good condition.

8-4-4t ALICE L. HARMAN.

PUBLIC SALE
— OF A —

Valuable Farm
The undersigned heirs at law of Pius J.

Babylon, deceased, will sell at public sale, on
the premises, on the road leading from David
Roop's Mill to the Uniontown Pike, about 1
mile from the said Pike, on

TUESDAY. AUGUST 22nd, 1916,

at 2 o'clock, p. iii., that valuable farm of said
deceased, containing

87% ACRES, MORE OR LESS,

in a high state of cultivation, with meadow
and. running water. 10 ACRES IN GOOD
TIMBER. The improvements are a good two-
story Brick House of 8 rooms, also a Tenant
House, good Bank Barn, Wagon Shed, and all
necessary outbuildings in good condition,frult,
water, eta: This farm is in a good neighbor-
hood, convenient to mill, stores, church, etc..

iand s worthy of the attenion of purchasers.
Possession given April 1, 1917.
Terms made known on day of sale, which

will be made reasonable to purchaser; $4,000
can be ieft in this farm on mortgage.

Mae. ANNIE R. CUMMINGS, •
MRS. MAGGIE S. ROBERTSON,
MRS. JESSE B. GILBERT,
MRS. MARY C. DANNER,

Heirs at Law of Pius J. Babylon. deceased.

Mervin J. Cashman, Auct. 8-4,3t

Subscribe for tle RECORD

never-failing water at door,
large cistern at house surly-

Wagon Shed and Corn Crib, and other neces-
sary outbuildings, all in good repair.
This is an exceptionally fine place for poultry

raising; the land is fertile and under good
fencing and well drained. Convenient to
churches, schools and railroad.
This farm is 1 mile west of Keysville and 2S4

miles north of Detour, along the Monocacy
river, at Berry's hole, and ajoins lands of Peter
R. Wilhide, C. Gordon Storsesifer and Samuel
H. Weybright.
TERMS OF SALE.—One-third cash on the day

of sale or on the ratification thereof by the said
Court, and the residue in two equal payments,
the one payable in six months and the other
payable in twelve months from the day of sale;
the credit payments to be secured by the bonds
or single bills of the purchaser or purchasers,
with sufficient security, bearing interest from
the day of sale, or all cash at the option of the
purchaser or purchasers.

JESSE P. WEYBRIGHT.
Executor of Samuel Weybright,

8-4-41 deceased,

PUBLIC SALE
— OF —

A Desirable Home
The undersigned as executrix of Samuel S.

Null, deceased, by virtue of an order of the
Orphans' Court of Carroll County, Maryland,
will offer at public sale on the premises, on

SATURDAY, AUGUST 26, 1916,
at 2 o'clock, p. m., the following described
property, the former home of Samuel S. Null,
consisting of

31-4 ACRES OF LAND
improved by a Two-Story Frame Dwelling, of
S rooms, a good Small Berm, Wash House,
Hog House, Chicken House, large Work Shop,
Smoke House, and all necessary outbuildings,
all practically new and in first-class condition.
There is a good well of water at the house, a
cistern, and both house and barn are well sup-
plied with water.
A young Orchard, and a plentiful supply of

fruit of all kinds.
This property is located on the public road
mfro the Taneytown and Keysville road to

public road that tends to the Taneytown and
Emmitsburg road, and adjoins the land of
Wilbur Shorb and others.
Possession will be given as soon as the terms

of sale are complied with.
TERMS—One-third of the purchase money

to be paid to said executrix on day of sale, or
on ratification thereof by the said court, and
the iesidue in two equal payments, the one
payable in 6 months and the other payable in
12 months from the day of sale; the credit pay-
ments to .be secured by the bonds or single
bills of the purchaser or purchasers with suffi-
cient secsurity, bearing interest from day of
sale; or all cash at the option of the purchaser
or purchasers.

MARY I. NULL,
7-28,5t Executrix of Samuel 5, Null.

Also at the same time and place, will offer
17 ACRES OF WOOD LAND,

adjoining !ands of Daniel Harman and Bennie
Smouse, on Keysville road.

ALBERT J. OHLER.
WM. T. SMITH, Auct.

TAX COLLECTOR'S! SALE
By virtue of authority vested in me by the

laws of the State of Maryland, and my office as
Collector of State and County Taxes for the
First Election District of Carroll County, State
of Maryland. I have seized and taken in exe-
cution the following property situate in said
Election District of Carroll County aforesaid,
to pay and satisfy the hereinafter stated State
and County Taxes due in arrear and unpaid,
to-wit:- all the right, title, interest and estate of
Jacob and Edward Ridinger in and to all that
lot or parcel of land situate on the road leading
from Taneytown to Keysville. about 1% miles
from Taneytown, in Carroll County, Maryland
adjoining the lands of David Sullivan, Nelson
Wentz and James T. Shorb, and assessed to
the said Jacob and Edward Ridinger, contain-
ing

1,,e, ACRES OF LAND,
more or less. The improvements consist of a
two-story Log House. Amount of State and
County Taxes due and unpaid:-
State Taxes for 1913 $1.01 with interest from

January 1st.. 1914,
County Taxes for 1913 82.02 with interest from

January 1st., 1914.
State Taxes for 1914 $1.G1 with interest from

January 1st,, 1913,
County Taxes for 1914 $2.21 with interest from

January 1st., 1915.
State Taxes for 1915 $1.55 with interest from

January 1st., 1916,
County Taxes for 1915 $2.60 with interest from

January 1st,, 1916,
And notice Is hereby given that I will offer

for sale at public auction to the highest bidder
the above described land and premises, on

SATURDAY, AUGUST 19th., 1916,
on the premises at 2 o'clock, p. rn., to pay and
satisfy the above State and County Taxes, in-
terest, costs and legal charges.
TERMS OF SALE: CASH.

EDMUND F. SMITH,
Collector of State and County Taxes
for the First Election District of
Carroll County, Maryland.

CHARLES E. FINK, Attorney. 7-28 4t

TRUSTEE'S SALE
OF A VALUABLE

FARM AND RESIDENCE
In Middleburg District, Carroll

County, Maryland.

By virtue of a decree of the Circuit Court for
Carroll County passed in Equity cause No. 4929
wherein George C. Humbert and others are
plaintiffs, and. Martha A. Humbert,widow and
others are defendants, the undersigned Trustee
will sell at public sale on the first hereinafter
described premises, on

WEDNESDAY, AUGUST 23rd., 1916,
at 2 o'clock p. m.. all the following valuable
Real Estate:
First. All that Valuable Farm containing
115 ACRES AND 36 SQ. PER. LAND.

more or less, located on the public road leading
from Middleburg to Johnsville about one-quar-
ter of a mile from the former place in Middle-
burg District, Carroll County, Maryland. This
is a most desirable farm being improved by a

3-story Stone DWELLING HOUSE
2story Frame Tenant House, Bank
Barn, wagon shed, hog pen, corn
crib, caniage house and tool shed;

the land is in a high state of cultivation, fertile
and productive. This properly is conveniently
located as to church, school and markets, be-
ing about one-quarter of a mile from Middle-
burg Station on the Western Maryland Rail-
way, now occupied by Mr. Joseph Smith, and
was owned by Mr. John C. Humbert at the
time of his decease.
Second. All that lot or parcel land containing

3 ACRES OF LAND,
more or less, located in Middleburg, Carroll
County, Maryland. improved by a
2-story Stone DWELLING HOUSE,
frame barn, hog pen and other out-
buildings. This is a very desirable
property and will make anyone an excellent
nome, as ills located in ihe town of Middle-
burg, convenient to church, school and rail-
road. station, and was occupied by the late
John 0. Humbert, at the time ot his death.
TERMS OF SALE:- One-third cash on the day

of sale, or upon the ratification thereof by the
court, one-third in one year, and one-third in
two years from day of sale. with interest, to be
secured by thenotes of the purchaser or pur-
chasers, with security to be approved by the
Trustee, or all cash at the option of the pur-
chaser.

MARTHA A. HUMBERT,
J. N. 0, SMITH, Allot. Trustee,
E. 0. WEANT, Solicitor 7-28-4t

Advertise Fall Sates in the RECORD

Ordinary Way and Quickly Ready
for the Table. ;

- •

Break two cakes of yeast into one
cup of water at blood temperature. Put
a tablespoonful of sugar on the yeast
to stimulateIt! quick growth. While
this Soaks, warm two cupfuls of mills
with one cupful of water. This, with
the water file yeast, Makes
quart of wetting, sufficient for tout
loaves.

ing both house and arn. In a large mixing bowl put several
sieves of flour and make a depression
In the middle of the flour, into which
put a level tablespoonful of salt and a
heaping tablespoonful of lard. Pour
the liquid and the yeast upon the flour
and mix with the hands, working the,
flour from the outside into the liquid
in the middle of the mass. Make a
stiff dough and lift the ball Out, put-
ting away any remaining flour for fu-
ture use. If the flour is granular, let
the dough lie on the board for ten
minutes, covered with a warm bowl,
that the flour may properly absorb the
moisture. If the flour is not granular,
this wait is not necessary.
Now shape the dough without knead-

ing, lay the ball in a buttered bowl,
and butter the surface of the dough to
keep it soft. Cover and let it double
In a warm place, an hour to an hour
and a half. If you wish still further
to hurry it, set the bowl in warm wa-
ter and place a smaller bowl of warm
water on the lid of the large bowl
containing the dough.
When doubled, shape quickly into

the baking pans for the second rising
and bake when again light. This reci-
pe is excellent for use when one must
have bread in a hurry. Half of the
dough may be made into crusty rolls.

TO WASH WINDOWS QUICKLY

As In Most Other Cases, There Is a
Right and a Wrong Way

of Doing It.

Take a large cloth, a yard long, pat
It into a close swab like a sponge.
Wet soppy, but not dripping, with wa-
ter. Dent the center and pour in ken,
osene and sop it into the face of the
cloth. With this swab quickly wash
the outside of the windows to loosen
all flyspecks, dust, old paint or alka-
line deposit. Follow at once with a
large, soft and dry cloth.
The first cloth leaves it smeary, but

the polishing will make it very clean
and shiny. This first swab will clean
a large number of wind5ws, simply
turning so as not to scratch the glass
with the dust on it. The polishers
need not be renewed until damp.
The windows become very brilliant

and clean and there is no freezing of
water, or wetting the hands, as gloves
can be worn. Especially good in cold
or windy weather.
The same method can be used in-

side. Pure kerosene can also be used,
but the above combination appears
to more quickly soften the varieties
of deposit.

Keep Cupboards Clear.
The majority of women do sot seem

to realize the danger there is in ac-
cumulations in closets. The dust and
lint from old clothes are very inflam-
mable. Lighting a match to look for
some article in a crowded closet, or
taking a candle into such a place often
causes fire. Old clothing, rags, waste
paper and every sort of rubbish should

be cleared out of closets. A spark in
a dusty closet has been known to
ignite a whole building; even an ac-
cumulation under bureaus and sofas is
dangerous. If you do discover a fire
in your closet close the door and get a
bucket of water and a broom. "A wet
broom is the best fire extinguisher
ever invented," said an official of the
fire department. "You can throw a
solid sheet of water with it or only a
spray; you can beat a fire out with a
broom or you can pull down a blazing
curtain with it."

Stuffed Onions.
Place eight large Bermuda onions,

peeled and washed, in a baking dish.
Cover with boiling water slightly salt-
ed. Bake them half an hour or till a'
wire will pierce them, then turn off
the water, then with a sharp, thin-
bladed knife take out the heart with-
out breaking the outer walls, 1111 the
cavity with minced cold chicken and
fine bread crumbs, seasoned with
melted butter. Sprinkle crumbs, but-
tered, over the dish until it almost
tileches the top of the onions. Cover

thism and bake half an hour.

Silver Parfait.
Boil one cupful of sugar in one cup-

ful of water until it threads. Pour it
over the stiffly beaten whites of three
eggs and beat again. When cool add
one pint whipped cream, flavor with
two teaspoonfuls of any kind of fla-
voring desired. Pack in ice and salt'
and let stand until firm. One day for
a company dinner I picked a few
choice strawberries, mashed in a
sieve and added whole, have also add-
ed cherries whole, awl the effect is
very pretty.—Exchange.

Celery Cutlets.
Mix together one cupful of cold

baked beans, one cupful of chopped
celery, two tablespoonfuls of melted
butter, two beaten, eggs, one scant tea-
spoonful of lemon juice, salt and pep-
per. Shape into cylinders, roll in
cracker -dust and fry in deep fat.

To Freshen Stale Bread.
So that it will be like new, dip the

loaf in cold water, put it in a, pan,
bake it until it is heated through; then
wrap it in a damp cloth and, wil,e4,
cold, it will be like fresh bread. ,,
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EMBERS
I They Relighted a

Flame of Love
• •

By CLARISSA MACKIE

••••

•-••

I t 1-1-44-1-1-++

Paula Featherston was a creature
of Impulse. She had accepted her hus-
band on impulse and married him on

Impulse. Before the honeymoon had

waned she decided that she had made
a mistake. Dick Featherston was a

serious, matter of fact fellow With a
strong will. He never allowed his
heart to run away with his head. If

his wife was in error and he was sure
she was in error he refused to con-
.:13,141 the error.

Then, ton, rick was a different man

socially from those to whom Paula had

been accustomed. He was not a danc-

ing man; he was not a social leader;

he was just plain Dick Featherston,

with not .a ray of glitter in his make-

up. When Paula had introduced him

to one of her society friends the young

woman said to her, "Not at all the
kind of person I supposed you would
marry."
Within a few years after the mar-

riage of Dick and Paula there came a
definite result to Paula's dissatisfaction
with her husband. Denis Brown was
exactly the kind of man her friends
supposed she would marry. He was

a Cotillion leader, a club man, a lady
killer. Denis saw that all was not
right between Paula and her husband.
He began by feeling a pride in being
favored by a married woman. But he
did not stop here. He persuaded Paula
to•leave her husband and child and go
away with him.
The elopers were to meet near Dick

Featherston's summer cottage by the
sea. Paula started with a wildly

beating heart. The journey seemed

ton short. When the train drew into

the little station she paused for an in-

stant on the platform and then ran

down the steps to the highway which

curved sharply away toward the sea.
Down a vista of golden hued maples

she saw the blue water and .the curl-
ing white crested waves. It was Octo-
ber, and all of the summer cottages
were. closed. There was an air of
desolation in the boarded windows and
.the bare verandas. The wind was
keen and there was a pungent smell of
bayberries from the sandy bluffs that
ran down to the beach.
Mrs. Featherston passed beyond the

• last small cottage and rounded a jut-
ting point of land to turn into a cob-
blestone gateway that led to a more

. pretentious house. There were grassy
lawns dappled with brilliant autumn
leaves, and back of the house was a
garage, but there was evidence that
the place had been long untenanted.
Paula Featherston inserted a key in

the front door and rather hesitated
, at the gust of musty air that rushed
out as the sea breeze swept in.
When she had closed the door and

stood within the silent house she hesi-
tated again.
The dear familiarity of the hall

struck some answering cord in her
heart. She winced as she turned away
and passed through the various rooms
where the furniture was swathed in
ghostly linen. Before one cleSed door
she paused and then passed on.
It was her husband's library.
It was useless to enter there. What

she had come after was upstairs in her
own boudoir. If she was to meet Denis
Brown at the end of the beach road
she must hasten.
In her boudoir she sat down before

the little satinwood writing desk and
unlocked it. It was growing late, and
the room was quite dark. She went
to the window and unfastened a shut-
ter. It banged in the wind, and her
fair hair was tossed into disorder be-
fore she finally fixed the catch and
closed the sash.
She went back to the desk and open-

ed a secret drawer which was stuffed
full of letters. These she carried to

the hearth and heaped into a little pyre

and touched a match to it. The blue

smoke curled spirally upward; then

the papers burst into sudden flame.
Words stood out clearly here and

there, brief messages out of the past
written in letters of fire.
"The moments have been hours and

the hours days. My dearest sweet-
heart, be careful of yourself. If any-
thing should happen— Tomorrow I
shall call yon.ivife—my darling wife!"
With a flurry the last letter shot up

the chimney, a black, charred thing,
dead, like their happiness. That was
saways the way when one expected too
much of life, and Dick bad been disap-
pointing. He had curbed her in every-
thing. No wonder she bad rebelled.
She tried to laugh as she remember-

ed her absurd happiness that evening
when they arrived at Seaways to spend
their honeymoon. They had made
much ceremony about lighting the
hearth fire in the library, and Dick had
recited the "Hansing of the Crane" as

they sat on the settle and watched the
.flames. Every year after that they had

.spent a few months at Seaways until

last year, when the break crane. Since

then she had traveled, the world over,

the gayest of the gay in every fashion-
able resort, while Dick pegged away in
the,Street, and baby Polly was. spoiled
by a doting grandmother....
, Suddenly. her .filee grew tense, and
uhe closed her eyes. Things would be
bettes..e.fter this, for she had made up I
her mind to go away with Denis

Brown. Then—Ili-en Dick would have
no excuse for withholding her freedom.
At; for Polly, why, Grandmother

Featherston had undoubtedly weaned
the baby away from her mother.
Paula's heart hardened, and she

laughed unpleasantly. The Feather-

stons were all that way—proud and
stiff necked and conventional to a
fault. She could safely say that there
was no ache in her heart for any one—
Dick, baby Polly or any one!
She walked defiantly to the mirror

and, removing her hat, looked closely
it her fair face. She was as lovely as
ever. The two years of strain and
worry had not marred her beauty. She
must keep herself lovely for Denis'
sake. Denis was an artist, a dreamer,

a lover of beauty, and if she had dis-
appointed Dick, who was not a beauty
worshiper, she must not fail to hold
Denis' love forever.
A little terror took possession of her

for the moment, but she shrugged im-
patiently and turned away from the
glass.
Denis was to meet her at the end of

the road, and they were to go in his car
to Boston. She bad wanted this hour
to herself before she left Seaways for-
ever.

Gently she closed the door and went
toward the stairs. Halfway down the
flight she stopped short.
From somewhere in the house came

the smell of burning wood—it was ce-
dar, perhaps driftwood—but, no; it
couldn't be that. She was quite alone
In the house.
It was merely her fancy. Something

in the hour had brought back the past
too vividly. How many times she had
come clown the stairs at twilight sens-
ing that same pungent odor from the
hearth fire in the library!
She must visit the library too. She

wanted that dear picture of Polly from
Dick's desk. He could have as many
more taken as be chose, she thought
bitterly, and he would have Polly too.
Of course the Featherstons would

teach Polly to despise her mother. But
she must hasten; Denis would be wait-
ing.
She turned the knob of the library

door and entered.
Before the warm coziness of the

room she stood in dazed wonderment.

There was a great, roaring fire of drift-

wood on the hearth, and somewhere a

gnarled bit of cedar was sending out

fragrant blue smoke.
A red shaded lamp illuminated the

room softly.
Dick was writing at his desk, some-

thing big and splashing, in his dashing

way.

Curled among the cushions on the
settee was Polly, fast asleep.
A low table was drawn close to the

fire, and on it were a singing kettle and
some clumsily arranged tiny cups and

saucers. Paula recognized them as
Polly's cherished toys. There were
other things—a pot of jam and some

stale looking sweet biscuits. They
might have been hurriedly rummaged

from the chimney cupboard.
Paula saw these things in one swift

glance. She also saw Dick's broad back

as he bent over the desk. He did not
turn his head at her entrance.
"I must go!" she told herself in wild

alarm, but still she stood there, afraid
to move.
Dick did not turn his head, but pres-

ently he spoke, carelessly:
"We've been waiting ages for you,

dear. The kettle's boiling over. I've
promised Polly that she shall pour the
tea."

Paula leaned against the door and
closed her eyes.
"Coming, Paula?" asked Dick after

awhile.

She came forward and, resting her
hands for support on the desk, leaned
toward him.
"I—came here tonight—to—to—run

away with Denis Brown!" she said.
"Yes?"
"Well, you cannot want me to pour

tea for you now?" she laughed bit-
terly.
"Polly is to pour tea," he reminded

her gently. "Besides, you will want
to say goodby to her."
"Ala!" she cried sharply. "You are

cruel."

He was silent. His pen ceased to
write, and she knew that be was star-
ing into the fire.
He must have suffered. His dark

hair was almost white.
Polly stirred, opened her eyes, yawn-

ed like n white kitten and stared at her
mother with unbelieving joy.
"Oh, muvver, muvverl" she shrieked

at last, and, tumbling off the settee,
she came to Paula's outstretched arms.
For a long time Paula held her there,
feeling her numbed heart slowly melt-
ing under the touch of the warm little
body. Baby kisses smothered her face
and throat, and little baby chuckles of
endearment fell on her hungry ears.
At last Paula lifted wet eyes and

looked straight at her husband. "I
came after some letters of mine," she
said honestly. "I must go now. This
Is the end."
Dick arose and went to the hearth

fire. He stood there with an arm on
the mantelpiece, his grave eyes search-
ing her face.
"l'm sorry to spoil your plans, Paula,"

he said slowly, "but I can't allow any
man to run away with my wife, you
know. You've had a year or two of
freedom, and when I heard—oh, well,
he talked a little at the club about
this, Polly, and I came down to stop
it. I met Denis at the end of the road.
I came around the other way by motor,
and I thrashed him and sent him
home."
A glad look came into Paula's face.
"Dick!" she said softly, and she knew

then that the hearth fire had never
been dead. Something had blown the
embers into the warm flame of love
agaiza
,"Come and make the tea, muvver,"

pleaded Polly.

MUST WATCH FOOD BEST MET FOR CHILD
HOUSEKEEPER'S RESPONSIBILITY

IN THE HOT WEATHER.

•Imost Every Variety Will Quickly

Spoil Unless Especial Care Is

Taken—Points of Importance

Worth Remembering.

An additional responsibility is
brought to the housekeeper in the hot
season, writes Mrs. Christine Fred-
erick in the Chicago News. She must
pay greater attention to her food sup-
plies and the way they are kept. It is
in periods of high temperature that all
foods, and particularly meat, milk and
fruits, are likely to spoil and decay.

The laboratory is not so far distant
from the kitchen and, indeed, the best
housekeepers are those who make a la-
boratory out of their kitchen and fol-
low in it the principles that science
has proved. It is undisputed that there
are minute organisms or bacteria in
the air which feed on our foods. There
are also in the foods themselves cer-
tain substances which, while not alive,
are the products of living things and
which cause fruits to ripen, seeds to
grow, etc.

Both these causes result in deterior-
ation or decay of the food unless they
are prevented. Bacteria of various
kinds and allied plant organisms like
mold attack and break down food tis-
sue, causing the food to become unfit
for use. Now, there are about three
ways in which the housewife can pre-
vent food from deteriorating:

1. By keeping the food in a low
temperature, as with the icebox, etc.

2. By sterilizing and killing the bac-
teria by means of a high temperature.
3. By the use of certain preserva-

tives, as sugar, salt, vinegar, spices,
etc.
The first means entails constant su-

pervision of the refrigerator. Newspa-
pers should not be used on the shelves
or on the ice, as this prevents proper
circulation of air and may cause the
box to become bad smelling and damp,
the very conditions under which bac-
teria flourish most. It should be kept
clean and foods properly placed in it.
Overripe fruit, hot or even warm foods,
strong smelling foods, like onions and
bananas, should never be placed in the
box. Small quantities of leftovers
should be covered with glass or agate
saucers and only glass, china or agate
should be used in which to lay away
food.

The second point can be followed by
cooking a quantity of food which
seems to be on the point of spoiling. A
box of berries can be saved by stewing
with sugar. Milk which undoubtedly
would not keep until the next morning
will be satisfactory if scalded. Many
other foods which might become sub-
ject to mold or spullation can be saved
by being thus cooked or sterilized and
perhaps canned temporarily.

Salt, sugar and vinegar are helpful,
natural preservatives. Their addition
to many fruits and vegetables will
make them "keep" several days longer
than if they were not used. For in-
stance, beets, string beans, cucumber,
etc., which in warm weather cannot be
allowed to stand over night unless in a
very low temperature, will be perfectly
preserved if covered with a weak solu-
tion of vinegar or brine. Soups and
all twice cooked foods like stews, etc.,
are particularly likely to ferment and
should be watched carefully. All con-
tainers of food must be allowed suffi-
cient air and not closed when the foods
are still warm.

New Tea.
A beverage that is indorsed by

science as being perfectly harmless is
known as mate. Unlike ordinary tea,

mate is improved by boiling, and the
same handful of herva, or prepared
mate leaves, can be used for two infu-
sions and the second may be better
than the first. It is a tonic, a stimu-
lant and a diuretic. It is especially
desirable for those who wish to coun-
teract the consequences of physical or
mental work.

Fruit Conserve.
Two quarts of cherries pitted, two

quarts of gooseberries, one quart of
red raspberries, one pound of seeded
raisins, three oranges cut in pieces,
leaving rind on; one lemon, juice only,
three-quarters of a pound of fruit.
Boil half an hour or more and put in
tumblers. Prepare the fruit and sugar
over night. By morning the sugar is
dissolved.

Nutmeg Cookies.
Mix two cupfuls of sugar, three-

fourths of a cupful of butter, two thirds
of a cupful of sour milk, nutmeg
enough to flavor, two eggs, a teaspoon-

ful of soda and enough flour to roll.

Roll out thin and bake in a quick

oven.

Mussel or Clam Salad.
Wash, boil five minutes, remove

heads and black membranes, dip in
melted butter, salt, pepper and lemon
juice mixed, set in ice box one hour;
serve with lettuce. French dressing
and minced parsley, cress or cucumber.

Dyeing Rags for Rugs.
When dyeing rags for home-made

rugs, tie the bunches of rags tightly
round before dipping in the dye. This
will give intervals of rags without col-
or, and the effect when woven will be
greatly admired.

To Keep Meringue From. Falling.
To keep meringue from falling, add to

It e'saltspoonful of baking powder just
before putting the meringue on the pia,

ADVICE OF SPECIALISTS OF BU-

REAU AT WASHINGTON.

Preparations of Meat, Fish, Eggs, and

Meat Substitutes Recommended—

Almost Innumerable Variety

of Stews Is Possible.

The following directions for the use

of meat, fish, eggs, and meat substi-

tutes in the diet of a child three to

aix years of age are taiken from Farm-

ers' Bulletin No. 717, °Food for Young

Children," prepared by specialists of

the office of home economics, United

States department of agriculture.

Broiling and roasting are the best

methods of preparing tender meat.

Tough meat should be stewed or pre-

pared in a fireless cooker, or first

chopped and then broiled. It is very

important to teach the very young

child to chew meat properly.

Fried meats, particularly those

which are pan fried or cooked in a

small amount of fat, should not be

given to young children. One reason

for this is that they are likely to be

overcooked and tough, at least on the

outside, and so are likely not to be

properly chewed and to be swallowed

in large pieces. Another reason is

that the fat used in frying and also

that which tries out of the meat is

likely to be scorched and changed in

composition. When this is the case,

it is almost certain to be harmful.

Some recipes for cooking meat for

children follow:

Many cuts of meat too tough to be

broiled whole may be prepared very

satisfactorily by being chopped, salt-

ed and broiled. Allow about one-half

teaspoonful of salt to a pound of meat.

For very little children the meat

should be scraped instead of being

chopped, for in this way the connec-

tive tissue is taken out. An egg or a

little milk may also be added. The

most important point is careful han-

dling, for if the meat is pressed to-

gether it becomes tough and hard. If

a wire broiler is used, the cakes

should not be squeezed between the

two sides. To avoid this, lay them
on top of the broiler and turn them

with a knife and fork.
Stews made out of meat and veget-

ables offer a very great variety of

dishes good in themselves and good

Ideal Dinner for Child—Lamb Chop,

Baked Potato, Spinach (Cut Fine),

Rice and Milk, Bread and Butter.

also because they encourage the eat-

ing of bread. The meat used should,

of course, be in good condition but

need not be from a tender cut. The

lower-priced cuts may be used with

good results, provided they are made

tender by long, slow cooking. Any

vegetable may be added, including the

tougher parts of lettuce, and the

leaves of celery. Rice, barley, maca-

roni, or even crusts of stale bread may

be used in the stew to give variety.

A stew containing a little meat, with

one or more vegetables, and a cereal

comes near to supplying all the need-

ed foods, other than milk.

Cut the meat into small pieces,

cover with boiling water, boil for five

minutes, and then cook at a lower

temperature until the meat is tender.

This will require about three hours

on the stove or five hours in the fire-

less cooker. Add carrots, turnips,

onions, pepper and salt during the

last hour of cooking, and the potatoes

20 minutes before serving. Thicken

with the flour diluted with cold water.

If the dish is made in the fireless

cooker, the mixture must be reheated

when the vegetables are put in.

There is much to be said in favor of

keeping a soup pot on the stove all

the time, provided great care is taken

not to allow the contents to grow

stale. Into this pot can go clean por-

tions of uncooked food and also clean

foods left from the table, such as

meat, milk, mashed potatoes or other

vegetables, crusts, cold cereal mushes,

and even fruits. Soups made from

such materials may not have great

nutritive value, but, like those made

out of materials bought for the pur-

pose, they encourage the use of a
large amount of bread, particularly if
carefully seasoned.

Chicken or turkey can be used for
variety in children's diets. It is palat-
able stewed and served with rice. If
roast chicken is used, select portions

Which are tender. It is well not to
give a young child either highly sea-

soned stuffing (dressing) or rich

gravy.

The use of cured fish, fresh fish and
oysters in stews has been spoken of
above. Boiled or stewed fish is also
good for variety.
Eggs are especially useful food for

young children. The chief point to
remember in preparing them for chil-

dren is that they must not be over-

cooked or they are likely to cause in-

digestion, as experience has shown

Everyone knows how the heat of cook

tag hardens the egg, and it is easy to

understand why the digestive juices

might have difficulty in penetratins

such hard substance as the white oi

a hard-boiled egg. Overcooked yolks

also thought to be hard to digest

However, when es are cooked in ths

shell, the heat reaches the white be-
fore it does the yolk, and so there is

more danger of the white being over-
cooked than of the yolk. The best
ways of serving eggs for children are

poached, soft-boiled, or coddled,
though they may be scrambled for a

change if one is careful not to scorch

the fat used or to overcook the egg.

One of the most satisfactory ways

of cooking eggs is by coddling and is

done as follows: Allow a cupful of
water to each egg, bring the water to

the boiling point, remove it from the

fire, put in the eggs, cover the dish
closely, and leave the eggs in the wa-
ter for about seven minutes.

Milk and eggs, as stated above, are
common meat substitutes. Among

vegetable foods, dried beans, peas,

lentils,- and cowpeas, which are often
classed together and called legumes,

are the best substitutes for meat in

the diet of older people, chiefly be-

cause they have large amounts of

nitrogen needed for muscle building.

In this respect they have some advan-

tage, though not a great one, over

cereals. Beans and the other legumes

are not to be recommended for young

children except when milk, meat, eggs,

fish, and poultry are not to be ob-

tained. When used they should be

cooked until they are reduced to a

mush. Since the skins are likely to

be tough, it is well to put the cooked

legumes through a sieve.

PERFECTION IN THE KITCHEN

One Secret of Successful Cooking Is

Having Proper Materials With

Which to Work.

Most housekeepers have wondered

at times why there is "a touch" about

the best hotel cooking that amateurs

can seldom get. It is not because the

materials are superior or the recipes

exclusive; home cooking can be better

than hotel cooking so far as that is

concerned. It is partly due to the

very simple factor of heat and cold.

In the hotel kitchen everything is hot

that should be hot, and everything

that should be cold is just off the ice.

The home kitchen may not be provid-

ed with huge refrigerators, warming

tanks, and plate racks heated by

steam, but that is no reason for not

being up to date. Enamel double boil-

ers, an enameled bain-marie, even an

enameled saucepan or frying-pan or

baking dish set in the top of a ket-

tle of boiling water, will keep any sort

of dish hot without its being dried or

scorched. And they are far easier to

keep clean than the elaborate copper

and nickel fittings of the hotel.

The other thing in which the chef

Is apt to be superior is in the use of

complex flavors in soups and sauces,

and here again his creations can be ri-

valed with enameled soup-kettles and

double boilers. The one thing that

even some good cooks need to learn is

that the longer and slower the process

of blending flavors the more perfect is

the blend.

"HODGE-PODGE", ECONOMICAL

Can Be Fashioned From Any Scraps
the Larder Affords and Makes a

Most Satisfactory Meal.

Having to live as cheaply as possi-

ble on account of the war, we have

invented a "hodge-podge." It is made

of any scraps the larder affords. Veg-

etable hodge-podge is one of the best,

and gives the idea for all. Take a

baking dish, put in a layer of finely-

cut-up bread (crusts of cold toast is

all right), next a layer of cold boiled

macaroni with tomato sauce (rice

will do as well) then cold boiled cab-

bage, cauliflower or parsnips, or, in

fact any cold vegetable, and a layer

of cold potatoes; salt and pepper. Add

a few spoonfuls of gravy, if on hand.

Repeat layer until dish is full; grate

dry cheese generously on top. If not

quite moist, add a little water. Put

brown bread crumbs on top and heat

thoroughly in the oven. It is surpris-

ingly good, and makes a most satis-

factory meal.—Woman's Home Com-

panion.

Boiled Pork and Chili Sauce.
Prepare the chili sauce before cook-

ing the meat and in a goodly quan-

tity, as it will keep for a considerable

time; or use chili sauce already pre-

pared and bottled. The cultlets, taken

from the leg of fresh pork, should be
about half an inch in thickness. Place
them between the bars of a double
gridiron over a moderate fire, cook for

about 20 minutes; when done place
them on a hot dish, sprinkle over

little salt and pepper, put a little but-

ter over them and serve with the

chili sauce in a boat.

Buckwheat Cakes.
To one and a half pints of pure

buckwheat flour add half cupful of

white flour and cornmeal, three heap-
ing teaspoonfuls of baking powder,

one teaspoonful of salt, one table-
spoonful of brown sugar or molasses.
Sift all the dry ingredients together

and add a pint of milk or water, or

sufficient to form a smooth batter
that will pour easily (not too thin)
from a pitcher.

Oysters In Sauerkraut.
Place in a baking dish alternately

layers of cooked sauerkraut and oy-

sters, starting and finishing with the

sauerkraut. On top place a few strips

of fat bacon. Place in a hot oven for

about half an hour, or until heated

through, and serve at once.

Changing Pillow Cases.
In putting on fresh billow cases,

start the pillow into the case, then,
holding it to you press against the
wall, and the pillow will slip in easily,
filling the corners.

What Is Good Rope.
Rope is sold by the pound, so there

Is always the temptation for a dishoh-
est manufacturer to "load" his product
with an excess of oil or other material
or to make the coil a trifle short. The
consumer then pays the full rope price
for oil, etc. Then, too, much so called
manila contains a percentage of in-
ferior fiber such as sisal and has
neither the strength nor wearing qual-
ities that it should. Tensile tests do
not tell the story, for some of the adul-
terants are almost as strong as manila,
but the strength of poor rope falls off
rapidly with use.
Open the strands and look at the in-

side of an old rope for signs of wear,
as it wears faster there than on the
outside. When a rope passes over the
sheave of a block or around a cleat the
strands slide a little on each other, and
the inner fibers gradually pulverize.
Good manila fiber is light colored,

fine, silky and strong. Rope made from
it is smooth, with few ends of fiber
sticking out.—Outing.

Missed a Sale.
"It seems to me," said a Main street

stationer, "that everybody's writing or
dictating letters these days. Nine cus-
tomers out of ten who come in here
ask for postage stamps.
"This morning a woman was here

browsing around. She looked over the
entire stock. I thought I had a cus-
tomer. After she finished the rounds
she remarked: 'Oh, I nearly forgot.
Have you any postage stamps?' I said
yes and asked her how many she want-
ed. She handed me a wrapped news-
paper and asked how much I thought
It ought to have to carry it to its desti-
nation. I weighed the darned thing
and told her a cent would be sufficient.
'Is that all?' she said. 'Well, I have a
one cent stamp In my pocketbook. I
thought it would come to more. Thank
you very much.' "—Richmond Times-
Dispatch.

Elusive Zeppelins.
In his book "Zeppelins and Super-

Zeppelins" R. P. Hearne points out the
little known fact that it was a French-
man named Spiess, an Alsatian, who
about 1870 drew up a clever design for
a rigid airship and made an attempt to
patent it. In 1870 Count Zeppelin was
a dashing soldier in Alsace, and Mr.
Hearne thinks it more than likely that
he saw Spiess' plans and annexed the
idea.
The Zeppelin is a most elusive object

despite its size. It can leap upward in
the air at astonishing speed. It can
drop rapidly. It can climb at a steep
angle. It can dive wonderfully, and
it can nose from side to side with no
mean agility. To reckon its altitude at
night is most difficult, and to find its
range is a matter of much nicety.

How a Snake Swallows a Frog.
The method of swallowing is a very

simple ode, although if the tfrog be
large more than half an hour may he
consumed in the process. The tyro
bones of the lower jaw are separate
and capable of independent movement,
so the reptile loosens its hold upon one
side of its jaw, and, pushing that side
forward as far as possible, it drives the
teeth in again and draws the jaw back
to its original position. The result Is
that the prey is drawn down by the
movement. The process is then repeat-
ed by the other half of the jaw, thus
inevitably forcing the victim inward.
The snake's skin stretches enormously,
and the jaw is, of course, dislocated,
but the extensible ligaments hold the
bones together.

Gladiators.
The gladiators were originally male-

factors who fought for their lives or
captives who fought for freedom. They
were first exhibited at the funeral cere-
monies of the Romans, 263 B. C., and
afterward at festivals about 215 B. C.
When Dacia was reduced by Trojan
1,000 gladiators fought at Rome for 123
days in celebration of his triumph. It
Is said that in the triumphs of Pompey
the Great 10,000 fought through a
series of many days. These combats
were suppressed in the east by the
Emperor Constantine about A. D. 32:.,
and in the west by Theodoric in A. D.
500.

The Treadmill.
The treadmill was invented thousands

of years ago by the Chive to raise
water for the irrigation of the fields.
The invention, somewhat changed, was
introduced into England and other Eu-
ropean countries and used in prisons as
a mode of punishment. One was erect-
ed at Brixton jail in 1817 and soon aft-
erward in other prisons. Toward the
end of the century, however, it fell into
disuse.

Impertinent.
Mrs. Owens—John, the butcher from

where we used to live has found out
our address. He called with that last
year's bill and was really impertinent.
Owens (hotly)—Impertinent, was he!
Well, now, we'll just let him wait for
his money.—Exchange,

His Sorrow,
The Merry One—Cheer up, old man!
Why don't you drown your sorrow I.
The Sad One—Because she's stronger
than I am; and besides, It would be-
murder—Passing Show.

A Female Veteran.
He—Isn't that General X. and his

daughter over there? She—Yes. They
say that she has been through more en-
gagements than her old father.—Boston
Transcript.

Appropriate.

"Do you think this cane would make
an appropriate gift for" Charlie?"
"Yes. The head is solid ivory."—

Florida Times-Union.

Contentment is always perched on
the round of the ladder just above you.

h-1



SUNDAY SCHOOL
\..;- Lesson VIII.—Third Quarter, For

Aug. 20, 1916.

THE INTERNATIONAL SERIES.

Text of the Lesson, Acts xix, 29-41.

Memory Verses, 29, 30—Golden Text,

I Tim. vi, 10—Commentary Prepared

by Rev. D. M. Stearns.

Paul is now on his third and last

missionary tour. As he returned from

his second tour he left at Ephesus his

two fellow workers, Priscilla and

Aquila, whom he bad brought with

him from Corinth. He then proceeded

to Jerusalem and thence to Antioch,

where he remained for some time be-

fore starting on this last tour (xviii,

1S-23). We cannot think of him tarry-

ing anywhere without seizing every

opportunity to speak of Jesus Christ

and His sufferings and glory. Having
passed through Galatia and Phrygia.
nourishing and strengthening the dis-
ciples with bread from heaven, he
came again to Ephesus (six, 1). Dur-
ing his absence Priscilla and Aquila
had been busy at something more than
tent making, for a Jew from Alex-

andria, eloquent and mighty in the
Scriptures, had come to Ephesus, and
because of the tire that was in him he
spoke boldly in the synagogue and
taught diligently the things of the
Lord, but he did not know of the
baptism of the Holy Spirit. These two
faithful ones expounded the Scriptures
more fully to him concerning some

things, and then he felt led to go to
Corinth and was commended to the

disciples there, whom he was able to
help much, and he mightily convinced
the Jews. from the Scriptures, that
Jesus is the Christ (xviii, 24-28). There
Is many a Priscilla who is qualified to

instruct more fully many an Apollos,
but the latter are not always as teach-
able as this dile seems to have been.

The crown of glory is a special reward

for those who feed others with living
bread, and it is not eloquence that is

needed, but just a willingness to re-

ceive the message from the Lord and
deliver it in His name, as the disciples
received the bread from the Lord's
bands when the 5,000 were fed and

passed on to the people what they re-

ceived from Him. They neither made

It. nor bought it, nor increased it, nor

In any way improved upon it, but were

simply channels or messengers be-

tween Him and the people. Our Lord
Himself only said what His Father
told Him to say, as He has told us in
John•xii. 49. 50, and thus He honored
!His Father, and the Father wrought
through Him.
This gives no opportunity to show

what we know or what we can do
and is therefore very humiliating to

the pride of man, and many will not
submit to it. But there is no other

way by which we can be true messen-

gers of God. If the message is ours
He will not assume any responsibility
concerning it, but if it is His message
He will see that His purpose and
pleasure are accomplished by it (Ise.
lv, Ill. When Paul came to Ephesus
Apollos had gone to Corinth, and Paul
began to inquire as to what the believ-
ers knew of the Holy Spirit, and, see-
ing their Ignorance in this matter, ho
taught them more perfectly and be-

came God's channel to them of the
gift of the Spirit, so that they spake
with tongues and prophesied (xix, 2-7).
Every true believer is a temple of the
Holy Spirit, and when any one re-
ceives the Lord Jesus the Spirit takes
up His abode in that person, but there
Is a difference between being indwelt
by the Spirit and filled with the Spirit
(John xiv, I Cor. vi, 19, 20; Acts ii,
4). The Spirit abides in the believer,
and we cannot pray, as David did,
"Take not Thy Holy Spirit from me"
(Ps. 11, 11), but we may be tilled and
refilled as the need arises for special

service.
For three months Paul spake in the

synagogue at Ephesus, boldly disput-
ing and persuading concerning the
Lord Jesus and the kingdom of God,
and when opposition drove him out he
continued in the school of Tyrannus
for two years or more until all in the
province of Asia (where he was for-
bidden to speak on his second tour, as
In xvI, 6) heard the word of the Lord
Jesus. Some very special miracles
were also wrought by the Lord through
Paul (xix, 8-12). Wicked men tried to
do wonders, even some in high reli-
gious standing, using the name of the
Lord Jesus as they heard Paul do, but
they fared badly indeed, while through
Paul the word of God grew mightily

and prevailed (xix, 13-20). Having
sent Timothy and Erastus into Mace-
donia, where he hoped to follow them,

lie continued in Asia, completing three
years there (xix, 21, 22; xx, 31), as we
shall see in our next lesson. Why he
was forbidden to go to Asia on his sec-
ond journey and now permitted to

spend three years there we may per-
haps learn some (lay.
The rest of our lesson chapter is oc-

cupied with the record of the riot of
the silversmiths, whose craft was suf-

fering because of the exaltation by
Paul of the Lord Jesus. Their cies in
verse 27 concerning Diana, "whom all
Asia and the world worshipeth,"
makes us think of the coming anti-
christ, whom all that dwell on the
earth shall worship (Rev. sit, 8), but
the kingdom shall be the Lord's (Dan.
VII, 14, 27; Obad. 21). Until then we
must expect that opposition to the
truth will steadily increase and people

give heed to lies and doctrines of de-
mons (II Tim. MI, 1-5; tv, 3, 4; H Thess.

It 8-12). But the Lamb will overcome
xvli, 14)..

How Limpets Stick.

like a limpet," but there are
Every one is familiar with the saying

"to stick 
 sALADs IN summER

not so many who know how it is that
a limpet is able to stick as it does to
the rocks upon which it passes its ex- APPETIZING DISHES FOR
istence. The creature is able, by means
of the coatral portion of its body,
which can be raised independently of

• •the edge or frill which surrounds it,
to create a vacuum, much in the same
way that a piece of soft wet leather
ran be made to adhere to a smooth
surface by pressing out all the air.
Thus the so called "strength" of the
limpet is largely due to atmospheric
pressure. It is not entirely so, how-
ever, for If they are closely examined
It will be seen that the shells accom-
modate themselves around the Kips to
the surface of the rock upon which the
limpet is located, and if removed to
another spot the edge of the shell will
probably be found to be a very bad fit
and the creature's power of adhesion
somewhat lessened. If taken by sur-
prise with a smart sidelong blow even
a large limpet is easily enough dis-
lodged; but, given the slightest warn-
ing, its power of suction is instantly
brought into play, and very often con-
siderable force is then necessary ere it.
can be detached.—London Mail.

Taming the Mink.
The United States department of

agriculture is making experiments in
domesticating the mink. Well, here's
luck to its efforts—but heaven help

the poultryman who tries to rear his
chickens near that experimental farm.
The mink has fur as fine as the most
exacting lady could desire, but his dis-
position is as bad as that of a Villista
bandit, and he has at least as much

cunning. He can dig his way into
any inclosure not made of brick, stone
or concrete. He loves blood as well
as a weasel. Ile has a...perfect genius
for evading traps, and e can conduct
his depredations so skillfully that for
months and even years they will be
laid to other marauders, and only the
closest observers will know that there
Is a mink in the neighborhood. The
man—or the department—which un-
dertakes to tame such a creature has
a large self confidence.—Chicago Jour-

nal.

Napoleon and a Submarine.
The idea of submarine navigation is

not so modern as many people imagine.
When Napoleon was banished to St.
Helena a notorious smuggler named
Johnstone conceived the idea of assist-
ing the dethroned monarch to escape
In Scott's "Life of' Napoleon" he says:
"A submarine vessel was to be the

means of effecting this enterprise. It
was thought that by sinking the vessel
during the daytime she might escape
the notice of the British cruisers and,
being raised at night, might approach
the guarded rock without discovery.
The vessel was actually begun in one
of the building yards upon the Thames;
but, the peculiarity of her construction
having occasioned suspicion, she was
seized by the government."

Our First Railroad Train.
On Aug. 28, 1830, the first American

built railroad train made its initial
journey. The train carried passengers
In its one little car and made a trip of
fourteen miles in one hour and fifteen
minutes, to the utter astonishment of
the "natives," who predicted all sorts
of dire calamities from such speed mad-
ness. This was the beginning of the
Baltimore and Ohio railroad, the oldest
American road.

A Lasting Flower.
A common South African flower, the

white star of Bethlehem (Ornithoga-
lum lacteum), will keep fresh for two
months or more after cutting. It can
be sent as a cut flower from South
Africa to Europe or Asia or America,
and then will last for weeks in water.

Pruning Trees.
In pruning branches from trees cut

them off close up to the origin. Never

leave a stub of the portion removed,
for the cut surface will never heal
over, allowing the decay germs to en-

ter and gradually work into the body

of the tree.

Identified.

"You haven't forgotten us, have you,
waiter?"
"Oh, no, sir. You are the two fried

smelts."—Judge.

• +++4.4.4.

+ PRACTICAL HEALTH HINT. +

Treating Hives.

+ An attack of hives has usually 40

f a beginning in some carelessness 4.
4. due to eating. It is a very eons- 4.
+ mon thing to mix up indigestible 4*
+ foods in one's dietary. The par- 4.

$ taking of foods which cause in- 4.

4. digestion must be avoided.

4* Nothing destroys the appear- 4.
• ance of the skin more readily +
$ than repeated bilious attacks, +
4. which are always brought on by 4.
* injudicious eating. The skin be- +
4. comes thick, yellowish and pasty 4.
4. looking and many times covered +
4. with an eruption known as urti-
+ eerie or hives.
40 The hives will quickly disap- 40

40 pear if a good purgative medicine 4*

40 is taken, such as the effervescing +
+ citrate of magnesia, a half glass 4.

+ three times a day between meals 4*

4* for a day or two, or the effer- 4.

4. vescing phosphate of sodium, two 4.

4* heaping teaspoonfuls in a tum-
▪ blerful of cold water three times 4.
40 a day half an hour before meals. 40
40 The itching of the skin will be 40
it• relieved by bathing the skin sev- 40
• eral times a day with a mixture 40
40 composed of vinegar, two table- +
40 spoonfuls, and hot water, four 40
+ tablespoonfuls. •
•
••4•46.4t+++++....+4••

HOT WEATHER.

THE

Apples, Celery, and Walnuts Mixed

Well Together Make One of the

Best—Watercress Is Excellent

—With Oranges and Grapes.

Apple, Celery and Walnut Salad.—
Cut into cubes two apples, pared, and
one apple with the red skin left on, a

few stalks of celery and a cupful of
walnut meats. Stir in a bowl with
some salad dressing. Pile a spoonful

of this on a lettuce leaf, with a dot of
the dressing on top. Use the rest of

the lettuce head for lettuce sand-
wiches at supper time.

Watercress Salad.—Make an ordi-
nary potato salad, chopped potatoes,
with a little raw onion. Arrange in

oval mound on platter. Divide into

quarters with knives, leaving the

knives in the salad. Cover two op-

posite corners with chopped beets. Of

the remaining two corners cover one
with sifted yolk of hard-boiled egg

and the other with the white, chopped.

Marinate with French dressing and

set away to chill. Just before serving

remove knives and in the cross left

put sprays of parsley. Also surround

salad with parsley. This salad is very

attractive.

Pecan and Potato Salad.—Mbr two

cupfuls of diced cooked potatoes with

one cupful of broken pecan meats,

sprinkle with salt, marinate with

French dressing, turn into a salad

bowl rubbed lightly with garlic, sur-

round with watercress and garnish

with halves of pecan nut meats.

Veal and Cabbage Salad.—Mix two

cupfuls of cold cooked veal cut into

dice with one cupful of finely chopped

cabbage, moisten with salad dressing

and serve in nests of lettuce leaves.

Orange and Grape Salad.—Pare two

seedless oranges, cutting deep enough

to remove all the white, and cut the

pulp into small pieces. Add an equal

quantity of malaga grapes from which

the seeds have been removed and one

tablespoonful of canned pimento cut

into tiny strips; moisten with French

dressing and serve in nests of lettuce

leaves.
Turnip and Onion Salad.—Peel one

large white and one yellow turnip, boil

in salted water until tender, drain,

cool and cut into dice. Peel and cut a
medium-sized Bermuda onion in thin

slices. Arrange the turnips and onions

in alternate layers in the form of a

pyramid, surround with slices of hard-

boiled eggs and pickled beets cut in

fancy shapes and serve with French

or boiled dressing.

Fried Frogs' Legs.
Place two dozen frogs' legs in an

earthen dish containing a marmalade

composed of two tablespoonfuls of
olive oil, the juice of a small lemon,

one small onion sliced, a branch of

parsley, two bay leaves, one-half tea-

spoonful of salt and one fourth tea-

spoonful of paprika. Drain, sprinkle

lightly with salt and pepper, dip in
milk and roil in flour. Fry in smok-

ing hot oil until colored a light brown.
Garnish with parsley and serve with
lemon sauce.
Lemon Sauce.—Put the juice of a

large lemon in a double boiler with
one-half cupful of butter, a dash each

of salt and pepper and beat until it be-

comes thick and hot, but do not allow

it to boil. Stir in the beaten yolks of

two eggs and remove from the fire.

Serve hot.

Baked Stuffed Onions.
Pare the onions and boil until ten-

der, changing the water four times

during the cooking. Scoop out the cen-
ters and chop them finely. Mix to-
gether equal parts of chopped ham and
soft bread crumbs, add the chopped
onions, two tablespoonfuls of melted
butter and season with pepper and a
little salt. Fill the onions with the

mixture, arrange them in a baking

pan, baste with water and melted but-

ter and bake until brown.

Hash With Eggs.
This is .delicious: One cupful of

boiled ham, chopped fine; one cupful
of potato, mashed or chopped; one cup-
ful of cracker or bread crumbs; sea-
son well, mix all together with water,
put in a deep plate, smooth it over and
then make little dents in the top large
enough to hold an egg. Put it in the
oven and heat it through, then remove
and drop an egg in each of the places
and return it to the oven till the eggs
are cooked.

Beef Cutlets.
Put the beef through the chopper

(as for hamburg steak), season with

sage and pepper, moisten with cream,

then mold in cutlet form and boil.

Serve with a brown sauce made by
browning a slice of onion in two ta-

blespoonfuls of butter, adding a little

salt, pepper and two tablespoonfuls of

stock. Boil until smooth, then add a
hard-boiled egg, chopped in small

pieces.

West Indian Salad.
Take two medium-sized cucumbers,

remove any seeds, four or five young

onions, the outside of one large green

pepper (no seeds) and put all in chop-

ping bowl. Chop (not too finely), sea-

son with salt, pepper and vinegar.

Serve icy cold with fish or cold meat.

Deviled Sardines.
Remove the skins from the sardines,

place on a buttered plate, season with
Worcestershire sauce, mustard and

cayenne. Cover with buttered crumbs
and bake till brown. Serve very hot.

MOST USEFUL WALL POCKET

Simple Device Will Save Much Time
in That It Keeps Articles Al-

ways at Hand.

Much time may be saved that would
otherwise be spent hunting the combs,
hair, hand and tooth brushes, nail
slippers, hair pins, box of powder,
powder puff, sponge, a lead pencil,
razor, scissors, curling iron and a great

24 INCHES'

many other things that are used al-

most every day in the home by making

a wall pocket like the drawing. writes

Mrs. Ellis Crowley in Farm Progress.

Take a piece of oilcloth—I used white

and bound edges with red tape—it's

18 by 24 inches. Pockets are cut to

size desired and bound with the tape
around edges, then sewed on. I have
mine over the washstand and a small
looking glass hung above. It's a very

handy article.

FOR THE REALLY HOT DAYS

One Cannot Do Much Better Than
Employ What Is Known as "That

Japanese Stuff."

That is what most people call the

pretty blue and white printed cottons
which are being displayed for sum-

mer use at cottages or at home.

These lovely blue and white scarfs.

squares and curtains surely look cool

and clean for hot summer days.
Did you know that you can have a

luncheon set of this printed linen or

crash? Funny blue storks appear in
the corner of each napkin and along
the edge of the runners. If you are

wise you will buy an extra runner and

turn it into an apron like the fudge

apron variety to match the luncheon or

breakfast set. The family will not

object to your sitting down to the

table with this apron on.
Some beautiful Japanese landscapes

can be bought by the yard in this ma-
terial. A valance of the landscape cot-

ton tops blue muslin curtains bordered
with the landscape again. A bit of the
landscape may be framed in mahog-

any for a tray to use in the dining

room in which the curtains appear.
Scrim also conies printed with Japa-

nese mountains, pine trees and clouds.
Centerpieces and doilies of it arc
fringed around the edge and a heavy
double line worked in satin stitch in

black is used to keep it from fraying

farther.

DUTIES OF MAID OF HONOR

Bride's Attendant Is Called Upon for
Important Work in Connection

With the Ceremony.

The duties of the maid or matron of

honor consists in Jailing and holding
the bride's bouquet when the ring b
being put on her Anger and while the
prayers are said, and if the brid,

wears her veil down over her face, the.

honor-attendant must raise it for hot
at the given time. She stands at the
rear of the bride, where she can take

the bouquet and hand it back With

ease.
The best man's duties consist priti-

cipally in keeping the wedding ring
until the momet,t when the ministei
asks for it, when the best man hand:-

it to the bridegroom, who in tuill
hands it to the minister. It is his duty.
also, to make all arrangements feu
the wedding journey, after consulting
with the bridegroom, buying the rail-
road tickets, engaging 'rooms at a
hotel, etc.
These are the principal points of

the ceremony etiquette and are fol-
lowed alike by the wealthy and those
who are but comfortably well off. The
question of expenses remains the same,
even when the girl is poor, although

she may dispense with attendants and
reception.

MADE A GOOD APPEARANCE

Striking Mode Adopted by One Worn
an Would Be Excellent Model

for Others to Follow.

The striking mode of high-necked
dresses has nothing to do with the
collars of sports styles. These are
always arranged so that the neck may
be both protected and exposed, for the
collars are made almost invariably so
they will stand up about the neck or
can be rolled down.
There is little seen of this new style

yet. Women love comfort and wait till
the last moment before they will
change to one which is more uncom-
fortable and which ruins the skin on
the neck. Here and there one does see
it. A very well-turned-out young wom-
an seen recently wore with a blue suit
having a matching Georgette blouse a
collar which completely covered her
throat. But, to take away the dark

and unbecoming look of the blue col-

lar, she had a turnover collar band of

white satin half the width of the high

collar. This was fastened in front by

a fancy bar pin. It really gave her

an up-to-date and chic !appearance

that site would not have had otherwise,

Velvet Lacing.

A deep rose silk bodice is laced

from waist to bust with narrow

black velvet rilsboo..

"My Cooking Is Always
Praised!"

"Irs better than ever now. It's easy,you know, to be a good cook in
a cool, clean kitchen where there's no
coal or wood range heat and dirt."

A New Perfection  Oil Cook Stove cooks
delicious meals at a fuel cost of only 2
cents a meal for 6 people.
Its long blue chimney gives a perfect
draft and puts the heat where it is
needed most. It assures a clean, even
heat and permanent satisfaction.

Saves time, strength and money.
Turns on and off like gas.
Let your dealer show you why.
New Perfections are made in many
styles and sizes.

Look for The Long Blue Chimney

Use Aladdin Security Oil to obtain the
best results in Oil Stoves, Heaters
and Lamps

STANDARD OIL COMPANY
(New Jersey)
BALTIMORE

MD.
Washington, D. C.
Norfolk, Va.
Richmond, Va.

ITN THE LONG

Charlotte, N. C.

Charleston, W. Va.

Charleston, S. C.

BLUE CHIMNEY

DRINKS FOR SUMMER DAYS

Delicious Cooling Beverages That Are

at the Command of Practically

Every Housewife.

Grape juice is an excellent founda-

tion for a variety of delicious drinks,

and has the advantage of being

healthful. It is much more economical

to put up your own grape juice each
year, but if you have not done this a

case of small bottles does not come
high.
Grape juice and limes make one of

the most deliciously cooling of summer
drinks. Pour into a tall glass three or

four fingers of grape juice, add the

juice of two limes and a slice of the

peel; fill the glass with water to taste

—a sparkling water is preferable—and

serve ice cold.

Grape juice and lemonade make a

good combination.
A ginger ale and cold tea punch is a

novel drink that is very good'. Sweeten

half a pitcher of cold tea, add the juice

of a lemon and several sprigs of mint.

Keep on ice and at the last minute pour

In a bottle of ginger ale. This should

not stand before serving, as the ginger

ale will lose its sparkle. A rather

strong and not too sweet ginger ale

should be used for this punch.

Iced cafe au halt is the best drink to

serve if the luncheon is very light, and

a little extra nourishment is wanted.

To make It properly—and It seldom is

made properly—it should be carefully

blended, mixing the coffee and milk

well together and sweetening to taste.

It is better, if possible, to use a sugar

sirup to sweeten it. Stand on the ice

until ready to serve and then add a

little thick cream to each glass and

enough cracked ice to fill the glass. For

the sweeter varieties of soft drinks,

milk shakes and fruit sirups may be
used.
To make a milk shake fill a glass

two-thirds full of milk; sweeten it to

taste with any fruit sirup or with a
little of some strained preserve, if you

have not the sirup. Fill the glass with

cracked ice and shake together until
well mixed.
Fruit sirups can be made from straw-

berries, raspberries, cherries or cur-
rants. Cook a quart of fruit with a

_
pint of water until well softened, then
strain and press out the juice through
a heavy cloth. When cold, sweeten and
dilute to taste, and serve in tall

glasses filled with cracked ice.

TEMPTING DISHES

Chop boiled spinach fine and mix
thoroughly with a raw egg. Mold and
put in the oven a minute to reheat.
A spoonful of boiled and grated

fresh corn or one of the canned corn,
if heated and put in the bottom of the
soup plate just before the tomato soup
is poured in, makes a dish decidedly
new and appetizing.
The top of the round is often cut

up in inch cubes, browned slightly

and then stewed in enough water to
cover it. This is put in the middle of
the platter and then surrounded with
boiled noodles to make a tasty dish.
For anyone who likes cooked ban-

anas a very good idea is to cut the

fruit very, very fine and then add to

the hot cake batter and cook the same

as the ordinary hot cakes. Grated

corn is also very good if used in the

same manner.

Brown Stew.
Two pounds and a half of neck and

shoulder of fresh beef cut in small
pieces. If too fat, remove some of it,
wash meat and put on stove in about
two quarts or more of hot water in a
good-sized kettle. Add two onionsil
sliced thin, two good-sized carrots cut
in dice, three medium potatoes cut up.
Stew should cook about three and a
half hours. Don't boil too hard.
Should be quite thick and very dark
rich brown in color and not fat. Put
In onions, carrots, salt and pepper
when you put on the meat; put in po-

tatoes about one-half hour before stew
is done.

Calves' Liver and Bacon.

Cook rare eight slices of bacon in

the blaze; lift the bacon out, leaving

the fat in the pan; put in eight slices

of liver cut thin and lightly dusted
with flour, and cook for five minutes,

turning continually; now put the ba-

con back to finish, adding a tablespoon-

ful of butter and salt and pepper to

taste. Then serve.



lANDIOWN LOCAL COLUMN
Brief Items of Local News of Special

Interest to Our Home Readers.

Miss Virginia Eyster, of Emmitsburg,
is visiting Mr. and Mrs. S. C. Ott.

Miss Clara Reindollar left on Thursday
.morning for an extended stay at Atlantic
City.

Robert R. Fair, of Baltimore, spent
Sunday with his mother, Mrs. Daniel H.
Fair.

Miss Edna Aulthouse, of Littlestown,
is visiting her grandmother, Mrs. John A.
Anders.

Jiss Lydia Baker is spending from
Thursday until Sunday with relatives at
Baltimore.

Mrs. Upton Birnie and daughters, of
Baltimore, are the guests of Dr. Birnie
and family,

Misses Mary and Irene Fringer are
visiting relatives and friends at Harris-
burg, Carlisle and Elizabethville, Pa.

Mr. and Mrs. Harry I. Reindollar were
week-end guests of Mrs. Donald Neely
and J. J. Reindollar's, of Fairfield.

Wallace Reindollar is spending his va-
cation at Lake Brady, Ohio, with his
mother and sister, Mrs. Edgar Thompson.

John P. Winand, Jr., of Mt. Washing-
ton, is spending his vacation with Mr.
and Mrs. George Clabaugh, at Linden
Farm.

Mrs. R. Lee Dutrow and little daugh-
ter, of Adamstown, spent from Friday to
Monday with Rev. and Mrs. Guy P.
Bready.

Mrs. George Mitten and daughter,
Elizabeth, of Washington, D. C., are vis-
iting her parents, John E. Buffington
and wife.

Mrs 7 Charles Smith and children, of
Washington, D. C., are spending some
time with her parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Elliot.

Mrs. Woodard and Mrs. F. E. Cun-
ningham and son, Motter, of Washing-
ton, D. C., are guests of Mrs. Stott and
Miss Anna Galt.

Miss Ruth Evans returned to her home
in Brunswick, this Friday evening, after
spending some time with her aunt, Mrs.
Lavine Fringer.

Dr. F. H. Seiss joined Mrs. Seiss in
Philadelphia, on Friday, and will return
home Monday morning by way of the

Canal to Baltimore.

Mrs. Harrison Smith, of Des Moines,
Iowa, and Mrs. Daniel Eyler, of Balti-
more, visited at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. M. C. Duttera.

Mrs. W. J. Gallery, and Josephine,
Eugene and Robert Gallery, of Wash-
ington, D. C., are visiting her sister,
Miss Agnes Arnold.

Misses Helen and Rita Shaum attended
the pic-nic at Emmitsburg on Wednesday.
They were accompanied home by Miss
Hazel Elder, who will remain to attend
the fair next week.

Chas. E. Wolf, wife and two daughters,
Romaine and Roberta, of Kingsdale, and
C. Edw. Sloneker, of Baltimore, spent
Sunday with B. 0. Sloneker and family.

Mr. and Mrs. P. E. Engler, left, on
Monday, for a two weeks' vacation at Mt.
Lake Park, 'Md. This makes their fif-
teenth year at that resort-a rather un-
usual record.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Shaner, of Tar-
enturo, Pa., spent Saturday and Sunday
at the later's house, Mrs. Abram Hahn
and family, and Miss Laura Leffler, of
Baltimore, also spent the week at the
same place.

Francis Shawn, accompanied by his
sister, Miss Mary, started on a motor
trip to Philadelphia and New Jersey, on
Tuesday morning, on a visit to reiatives
and friends. They arrived there at 6
o'clock that evening, after a most enjoy-
able ride.

Rev. A. D. Bateman, of Mill Hall, Pa.,
is here on a visit. He left here thirteen
years ago, at which time he was pastor of
the Reformed church, but for some years
he has been in the Presbyterian ministry.
He received a warm welcome from old
acquaintances in all denominations.

The fact that two children in our town,
barely escaped from being crushed to
death, on Thursday, should come as a
warning to parents to keep small children
off the streets. This warning is given
because the coming week may, on ac-
count of the Fair, be one of great danger.

"We enjoy very much reading the
RECI /RD, though we left Taneytown in
1899. Your "Far Away Letter" notice
in last issue is a good one, and have
often thought Oslo just what you ask,

but lacked the courage. Such letters would

be very interesting."-T. A. DAVIS; Man-

ager 15. S. Dept. Agriculture Poultry

Farm, Beltsville, Md.

It would be wise policy for those who
have concrete curbs and gutters, with
brick pavements, to relay the latter early
this Fall, and give them a decided pitch
80 as to run the water off quickly. It is
the freezing of water back of the curb that
has caused so much curb damage in Tan-
eytown, and this has been, largely due to
poorly graded pavements, Some pave-
snente should also be underdrained.

Miiss Agatha Weant is visiting relatives
at Rocky Ridge.

Mrs. Guy Ourand, of Washingtor,
D. C., spent a week with her home folks.

On Thursday, the State Roads Com-
mission decided to build the 3-I miles of
road, or from Taneytown to Bridgeport,
in Carroll county, at an appropriate cost
of $45,000. Its construction will com-
plete the Carroll county part of the State
road from Westminster to Emmitsburg.
The few miles of road from the Monocacy
to Emmitsburg will be built from Fred-
erick county's share of the roads funds.

Three patients from this vicinity were
taken to the Frederick Hospital within
the past 10 days. On Tuesday, Harry
Cutsail, was operated on for appendicitis,
and is now getting along as well as can
be expected. Mrs. John H. Hilterbrick,
was taken there for an operation, but
after a thorough examination, the phy-
sicians in charge, decided not to operate.
Leroy F. Smith is recovering rapidly from
a minor operation.

Notice was received at the 1'. R. Sta-
tion, this place, this week, that a quar-
antine had been placed on all children,
under the age of 16 years, for interstate
travel. The notice states that such chil-
dren must have a physician's certificate
that they are in perfect health, and have
not been exposed to infection from infan-
tile paralysis er are not from infected
districts.

(Conlinusrlarala First Page.)
terial circulated by the company. In
spite of this fact, however, another cam-
paign was begun in 1909, and in 1915
the wheat was actually placed on exhibi-
tion at the Panama Pacific Exposition.
Last year also the same wheat was of-
fered for sale at $7 a bushel under the
name of Egyptian seven-headed wheat.
At other times this wheat has been sold
as Eldorado, Many-headed, Many-spiked
Multiple-headed, Reed, Smyrna, Syrian,
and Wild Goose.

"STONER" OR "MIRACLE" WHEAT.
The claims made by the promoters of

the "Stoner" or "Miracle" wheat are
fully as exaggerated though less romantic,
than those of the Alaska advocated. The
Stoner wheat belongs to the soft red win-
ter wheats commonly grown in the east-
ern United States from the Atlantic coast
to the Mississippi River. According to
its discoverer, in the spring of 1904 he no-
ticed a large bunch of grass in his garden
which, when headed, proved to be wheat.
It had 142 stems or tillers, and he became
convinced that its remarkable tillering
capacity would make it a very wonderful
wheat. The three great advantages which
he asserted that this wheat possessed were
(1) that it would outyield any other va-
riety anywhere, (2) that it sent up more
stems from one seed than any other va-
riety of wheat; and (3) that 20 pounds
of seed per acre produced the maximum
yields while other varieties required 120
pounds.
These assertions were investigated by

the Department of Agriculture RI much
more extensive experiments than it made
with the Alaska wheat. These tests show
that the Stoner wheat is not so good as
some of the wheats now grown in the
eastern half of the United States, but is
somewhat better than others. On the
whole, it is of average value. In com-
parative tests, however, it has never out-
yielded all other varieties and many of
these varieties have surpassed it. Com-
mon varieties have exceeded it in the
number of stalks on a plant. As for the
rate of seeding, the tests show that yields
of this variety are increased when sown
at rate e of seeding higher than those ad-
vocated by the promoters.
The discoverer desired to have his

wheat tried out on a large scale in the
Mississippi Valley. Early in 1908, how-
ever, a Philadelphia promoter took charge
of the matter, but later transferred his
interest to a grain company in Chicago.
Various plans were proposed for growing
the new wheat that do not appear to
have been carried out, to any extent at
least. The Chicago company became in-
volved in a controversy with State officials
in Kansas in the fall of 1908 and there-
after appears to have dropped the project.
That same year, however, the wheat was
widely advertised in Indiana under the
name of "Marvelous," and under this
name extravagant claims are still being
made for it. In 1911 advertisements in
Brooklyn announced that "Miracle
wheat," as it was then called, was the
fulfillment of a biblical prophecy and
that, with the aid of irrigation financed
by Wall Street millionaires, the arid West
was to be made to produce large crops
of it and spineless cactus.

In publishing these facts in its new
bulletin the Department of Agriculture
wishes to point out to farmers that the
Government investigators have never
been able to find the slightest reason for
supposing that either of these wheats is
in any way superior to the commercial
varieties commonly grown. The only ex-
planation of their promoters' extravagant
pretensio.ns is the necessity for finding
some excuse for charging exhorbitant
prices for seed. Farmers who contemplate
the purchase of wheat seed at unusual
prices are advised to communicate first
with their State agricultural experiment
station or with the Department of Agri-
culture, at Washington.
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Transfers of Real Estate.

Greenbury Wilson and wife to Burton
Wilson and wife, convey 115-4 acres, for
$3000.

Charles E. Eyler and wife to Leslie I.
Repp, convey lot of land for $5.

Leslie I. Repo to Mollie E. Eyler, con-
veys lot of land for $5.
Frances Haines and husband to James

W. Robertson and wife, convey 3 acres,
for $250.
James M. Lambert and wife to Thos.

M. Warner, convey 16 acres, for $1800.
Foster Warehime and wife to J. Elmer

Myers, convey 3 acres, 2 roods and 18
square perches, for $3600.
Price L. Howard and wife to Harry 0.

Farver and wife, convey parcel of land,
for $5.

Asbestos Land and Improvement Com-
pany to James E. Freberthauser, conveys
3900 square feet, for $50.
Andrew T. Harrison to Jesse Leather-

wood, conveys 19,512 feet, for $730.
 410e. -

Floral Antiseptic both Powder for
cleaning and beautifying the teeth
Makes the teeth white and purifies the
breath. 10c bottle.-Get at McKellip s
thertisemett.

CHURCH NOTICES

There will be no service in St. Mary's
Reformed church, Silver Run,on Sunday,
August 13th.

S. C. HOOVER, Pastor.

In Trinity Lutheran church next Sun-
day, the pulpit will be filled both morn-
ing and evening by Rev. W. S. Harman,
of Braddock, Pa., a former resident of
this county. The regular Sunday School
and C. E. services will be held.

U. B. Church, Taneytown-S. S., at 9
a. ni.; Preaching, at 10 a. m.; Prayer-
Meeting, at 7.30 Wednesday evening.
Harney-Sunday School, at 10 a. m.;

Preaching, at 7.30 p. III.
W. J. MARKS, Pastor.

Presbyterian, Piney Creek-9 a. in.,
Bible Study Hour; 10 a. m., Worship.
Text: "Life is Something More." A
short study in richer harvests.
Town-9 a. m., Hour for Bible Study.

7 p. in., C. E. Society meets; 8 p. m.,
Worship. Theme, "The chief Advantage
and the Vital Emphasis of the Political
Campaign." A brief study in Christian
citizenship.

Keysville Lutheran Church-10 a. in.,
Communion. Rocky Ridge-2.30 p. m.,
Preaching. Theme: "Palm Tree Christ-
ians." W. 0. Irtavii, Pastor.

The Reformed Church, St. Paul's, Un-
ion Bridge-9.15 a. m., Sunday School;
10.30 a. m., Divine Worship. Subject,
"Judgments Fulfilled."
Stone Church, Detour-2.30 p. m.,

Divine Worship. Subject: "The Spirit
of Life."

St. Paul's, Ladiesburg-7.30 p. m.,
Evening Worship. Subject: "A thirsty
Land." Paul. D. YODER, Pastor.

Uniontown Lutheran Charge-Services
at Uniontown, at 10.30 a. in. Rev. H. T.
Bowersox will have charge. Sunday
School, at Baust at 9.30a. ni.; C. E., at
7 p. in., and Preaching, at 7.30 p. m.

Reformed church, Taneytown.-Serv-
ice at 10 a. m.; Sunday school at 9. No
evening service.

Meet Me at

The Fair Grounds
Aug. 15 to Aug. 19

and secure your Refreshments.

SULLIVAN
from Westminster - the man
they call "Bernheimer."

PRIVATE SALE
OF

A SMALL FARM
I will sell at private sale my very desir-

able small farm on the Taneytown and
Emmitsburg road, about 2-i miles from
Taneytown, containing

24 ACRES OF LAND,

about 3 acrei in timber, with all new
buildings in complete order.
Will sell on very easy terms. Possession

April 1, 1917.
11-3t )1 IC HAEL HUMBERT.

Public Sale!

Horses, Mules, Colts,
Wagons, Harness, &c.
Tuesday, Aug. 22
12 o'clock, noon. at old Montour Hotel

Stables, Westminster, Md.

If you have a Horse, Mule, Colt,
Wagon, Harness, in fact anything you
want to dispose of, bring it in, and we
will sell it for you.

KING & McHENRY.
Phone 46 Westminster, Md.

SEE CEANIER'S PALAI.E (IF MrsIC great
piano exhibit at the Fair. If you intend
to buy within a year or so, it will pay
you to see us now. (iur factory prices
and terms will interest yen. "We save
you money." 8-4-2t

SMALL FARM for sale; 28 Acres with
good House, Summer House, Barn, Hen
House, Hog Pen, etc., all in good condi-
tion, Well of Water at house and one at
barn. Plenty of fruit.-Bkx.i. HYSER,
near Walnut Grove School. 7-28-3

PUBLIC SALE, Aug. 26, 1916. Prop-
erty of the late Samuel S. Null. See Ad.
in this issue. 7-28-4t

FESTIVAL, in Detour, Thursday and
Saturday evenings, Aug. 10th. and 12th.
Proceeds for a well on School grounds.
Band of music both evenings. 7-28-2t

WHY NOT buy a Piano or Player this
year and save money. We positively in-
tend to sell all we exhibit at the Fair, at
special reduced prices. We sell the same
line sold by Birely's Palace of Music, of
43 years standing. It will pay you to in-
vestigate us and our line. Let us prove
that we can save you money on a good
Piano. Very easy terms to suit you.-
CRAMER'S PALACE OF MUSIC. 8-4-2t

PASTURE for Horses, Colts and Cat-
tle, on the "Schwartz Farm," at $1.00
per month.-C. B. Sciiwarrz, Taney-
town, Md. C. & P. l'hone 27-M.

6-16-ti

Read the Advertisements

IN THE

CARROLL RECORD.

ogrosvostopostostoarcieoremecatostoitostoreoltostorkovropolaoreorostopoatc
a   X
it) •Taneytewr's Leading Fa/chitin Stcre." o

Standard I
under this heading at one cent a word, each X
issue. Real Estate for sale, Two Cents each 0 

I X,

Sewing Machines /go
Genera. Advertisements will be inserted 0

word. The name and address of advertiser
must be paid for at same rate; two initials, or
a date, counted as one word. Cash in ad-
vance,unless other terms are mutually agreed
upon. Postage Stamps received as cash.

SPECIAL NOTICES.

CALVES HIGH. 50C for delivering.
Highest Price for Spring Chickens, from
1i to 2 lbe. Squabs 25g pair. Poultry
received until Thursday of each week.

-SCHWARTZ'S PRODUCE.

HIGHEST CASH Prices paid for Eggs,
Calves and Poultry. 50c for delivering
Calves Tuesday evening or Wednesday
morning.-G. W. Murrkii. 6-10-12

READY FOR BUSINESS in my new
location. Wanted; Poultry, Calves and
Squabs at highest cash prices, 50c for de-
livering calves. Farmers' Produce Co.,
H. C. BRENDLE, Mgr., in Davidson bldg
on Middle St. Phone 3-J. 6-2-tf

UNTIL FURTHER notice the Farmer's
Produce Co., will have their place of
business open every evening until °
o'clock, for the accommodation of our
customers. All kinds of produce will be
received every day of the week, except
Calves not later than Friday evening.-
H. C. BRENDLE, Manager. 6-16, tf

VISIT CRAMER'S PALACE OE MUSIC ex-
hibit at the Fair. Best ever. Great re-
ductions on all instruments to save mov-
ing back. 8-4-2t

WE WILL MAKE a Plowing Demon-
stration with a 10-20 Titan Oil or Kero-
sene Tractor, on Thursday, Aug. 17, in
field adjoining Taneytown Fair Grounds.
Provisions have been made with the Fair
Association with reference to passes out
to see this demonstration, free. Come
and see the 10-20 PULL PLOWS AND
PLOW. Make my tent your head-
quarters.-Joux T. LENIMON.

THERE WILL BE a Smoker after the
regular meeting of K. of P. Lodge. Mem-
bers and applicants are requested to at-
tend.

FOR SALE-Fine Colt, 4 months old.
-T. M. MARTIN, near Stover's Store.

FOR SALE OR RENT-My Property
on Emmitsburg road.-D. R. Foote,
Taneytown, Md.

3 SETS OF Genuine Rubber Mounted
Single Harness, and 2 sets of Nickel Har-
ness at a bargain, price. -D. W. GARNER.

SHEEP SALE.--Will sell 16 Breeding
Ewes, 1 good Shropshire Ram en Fair
ground, Aug. 18.-Slink.

AT THE FAIR.-Family Groups and
Post Cards finished while you wait.-
THOMAS STUDIO, the only Professional
Photographer on the ground, near the
Exhibit Building.

FOUND-One pair good Nose Glasses.
Owner can get same by calling at this
Office and paying cost of ad.

JERSEY COW, fresh; will sell on Fair
ground, Aug. 18.-Sinnk.

WANTED.-1000 Men and Women-
not for the army-but to have Poet Cards
taken at the Fair. Chi:dren under 3
weeks old not enlisted.-THOMAS STUDIO.

FESTIVAL-The Reformed Church
will hold a festival on the lawn, this Sat-
urday evening. If it rains that evening,
will be held the following Saturday. The
proceeds to be used in keeping up the
Cemetery.

MOTOR CYCLE (Harley-Davidson)
for sale. It is good as new.-Ina STosie-
SIFEH, near Marker's Mill. 11-2t

FOR SALE-12 Fine Pigs,•6 weeks old.
-ALBERT BAKER.

FOR RENT.-Part of my House en
Baltimore St., Taneytown. Possession
given at once. Apply to MRS. PHOEBE
KOONS, or to W. D. Onts:n. 8-11-tf

10 HORSE-POWER Peerless Traction
Engine, in good condition, for sale, or
will trade on automobile. First man
$200.-gets it. Address A., care of CAR-
ROLL RECORD Office, Taneytown, Md.

8-11-2t

FOR SALE-Fresh COW.-BIRNIE Feesna,
near Basehoar's Mill.

$3000 on First Mortgage on Farm, at 5
per cent. Call at RECORD Office. 8-11-2t

FOR RENT--Halt of Milton Academy
building.-AMoS BUTTER:1. 8-11-2t

WILL BUY Rags, Rubber, Iron, and
all kinds of metals, second-hand Auto-
biles, books, papers. Phone 6-m., or
write CIIARLES SOMMERS, Taneytown.

8-11-2m.

NOTICE.-In attending the Granger's
Fair, near Taneytown, next week, do not
forget to call at "Frock's Lunch Stand"
for your Sandwiches, Soft Drinks, Ice
Cream Sodas and your good Ice Cream,
and you will find the best accommoda-
tions on the grounds.-E. C. Fnock,
Woodsboro, Md.

FOR SALE.-50 Head of Stock-Bulls,
Steers and Heifers; also Fresh Cows and
Springers.-Pootk & SNIITli.

FOR SALE.-Dairy Farm and Store
House, Sand, Gravel and Rock.-S.
WEANT, Kepner, Md.

EVERY PIANO and Player we exhibit I
at the Fair must be sold to save moving
back to Frederick. This is a chance to
save dollars. Buy now. - CRAMER'S
PALACE OP MCSIc. 8-4-2t

IMPROVED FLY TRAPS, large and
easy to clean, 50,- each, at 11kisinottan
BROS. & Co. 8-4-2t

PUBLIC SALE of my farm will be held
as advertised, as it will not be sold
privately.-P. S. HILTERTIRICE. 8-4-2t

FOR SALE.-Celery Plants 10c per
100.-F. P. PALMER, Taneytown, Md.
R. I). 3.

DON'T FAIL to see our great exhibit
of High Grade Pianos and Talking Ma-
chines at the Fair. Finest line ever shown.
Every one sold at a great reduction to
save moving back to Frederick. Buy
now and save dollare.-CRAMER'S PAI„WE
OF MUSIC. 8-4-2t

PUBLIC SALE, Saturday, Aug. 26th.,
1916, following sale of property of Samuel
S. Null, 17 Acres of Wood Land.-ALBERT
J. Older. 8-4,3t

ALL I'lANOS we exhibit at Fair will
be sold at great bargains, to save moving
back to•Frederick. See them. Buy now
and save •dollars, Best line ever exhibit-
ed.-CRAMER'S PALACE OF MUSIC. 8-4-2t
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o Certainly Going Some
o The Extra Low Prices we have put on all Summer Goods
o are certainly moving them fast, but we still have good Bar-

gains and are going to

Give You Another Chance.

TANEYTOWN, MD.

Store Closes Monday, Wednesday and Friday, at 6 p. m.

X

X

Men's Straw Hats.
All new this season's styles.
$1.25 Hats. $ .89
1.50 „ 1.20
2.00 ,. 1.69

• Palm Beach Hats, .49
• $3.50 & $4.00 Panama Hate 2.75

X

21
Ladies' Waists.
75c White Waists,

,,$1.00X „
• 1.50 White Silk Waists,
X Striped Voile Waists,

X

X

X

0

49c
89c
98c
98c

Ladies' Low Shoes.
Not all sizes, but a good many, and

we may have just what you want, if
you

DON'T WAIT TOO LONG.

$3.00 Shoes, $2.69.
o 2.50 „ 2.59
X 2.25 „ 1.89

And some as low as 1.19
Patent, Gun Metal, 'Vici and White.

Low Prices on alt Children's ShoesX

X

Men's and Boy's Clothing.
All Clothing will be higher in price

this Fall, and we advise you to buy
what you can now. You can SAVE
SEVERAL DOLLARS on a Suit. We
are going to sell what Clothing we
now have on hand at the old prices,

SO BE QUICK!

and get your share of this stock.

Ladies' Muslin Underwear

Skirts, 490.
Gowns, 49c.
Corset Covens, 25c.
Drawers, 25c.
Gauze Union Suits, 49c.
Combination Suits, 89c.

Men's Cool Wear.
iik Shirts

Silk Hosiery

Silk Neckwear

Latest Styles to be Found.

GOING AWAY 9 Look over our Line of Suit Cases, Club Bags,
Steamer and Traveling Trunks.

X11011101c7iinsicUnsclinto4cleo5entoitneoltolsolcolooltoWsolsoWolio‘oWc

Here It Is !

The Famous McClernan Sanitary All-Steel
Kitchen Cabinet!

It is pantry, store-room and kitchen table combined. It is
made of high-grade furniture steel, formed on heavy power presses.
All joints reinforced and electric-welded (no solder or rivets, screws
or bolts), giring it a virtually seamless construction as rigid as a
steel casting, yet no heavier than wood.

It has no defects that will develop with use. It cannot warp
or shrink or swell. It not sag or bend. Drawers and doors
and slides will not bind and stick. Joints will not open and make
cracks for dirt and vermin to lodge in. Mice cannot gnaw into it.
Roacries or other pests cannot hide in it.

It is beautifully enameled, inside and out, with a smooth.
hard baked, durable, washable, snow white finish, that will not
chip or flake. A number of exclusive features go with the cabinet
that make its equipment complete.

It excels the ordinary wood cabinet in every way and costs
very little more. To appreciate the marked superiority of the
material, construction and finish of the McClernan Cabinet, you
must see the Cabinet itself.

We are showing it now. Come in soon and look it over.

C. 0. FUSS & SON,
TAN EYTOWN, MD.

•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
 O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
 11

11 
O
O
O
O
O
O
 1
 O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
 •
 •
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
 O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
O
 •
•
 O
O
O
O
O
 •
•
•
•
 

00CAX:C..000000000-%00000000000 00000000000(..00000000C4D000C

BLUE RIDGE COLLEGE
NEW WINDSOR, MD.

Complete classical, educational and scientific courses leading to B. A. and
B. S. degrees. School of Music, one of the strongest in the State, offers
courses in piano, voice, violin, and special teachers' course. School of Art
offers courses in mechanical and architectural drawing, and special art course
embracing water color, oil, pastel, and china painting. School of Business
offers thorough courses in banking, book-keeping, typewriting, and short-
hand. Thorough academic course preparing for entrance to any college.
Strong courses in Expression, Agriculture, Manual Training, and Bible.

Campus and general location unsurpassed in beauty; modern buildings;
strong faculty; tine student body; home-like atmosphere; excellent religious
influence. Terms extremely moderate. Next session opens September 12.

WRITE FOR CATALOG. 7-28,tf
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Taneytown Grain and Hay Market.

Corn
Rye  
Oats 40®40
Timothy Hay  
Mixed Hay 
Bundle Rye Straw  9.00R8.00

Corrected weekly, on day 01 publication.
Prices paid by The Reindollar Co

Wheat    I.40(11.40
 854485

6565

Baltimore Markets.

Coirected Weekly

Wheat I  47@1.47
Corn  93A93

Oats   47(:4)4ts.

Rye 951.00

Hay, Timothy 16.00@l7.0e

Hay, Mixed 15.00@l6.00

Hay, Clover  10,0C(ial 1.0C


