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Tramps, within the past few weeks, are
accused of having robbed a number of
small stores between Emmitsburg and
Thurmont.
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The Westminster armory will get one-
third of the $100,000 appropriation, as
three armories are to be built with the
amount, and not $100,000 for each.

The sides of the state road from Taney-
town to Westminster, are being repaired
after the Winter's effect on them. The
roadbed itself sustained no apparent
damage.

The snow, last Saturday, varied from
six to fifteen inches, in Maryland, ac-
cording to location. In Allegany county,

where the air was colder and little melt-
ing occurred, the greatest depth was
reached.

The following M. P. appointments
have been made for Carroll County:
Finkeburg, Rev. Carroll Maddox; Pipe
Creek,Rev. T. H. Wright; Union Bridge,
Rev. F. M. Clift; Westminster, Rev.
Edgar T. Read.

Edward C. Eckard, 46 years of age, of
Hampden, Baltimore county, died on
Monday of heart disease. Mr. Eckard
was born in Carroll county, and was a
carpenter and builder. He leaves a wife
and one daughter.

The Sunday School, of St. Paul's Luth-
eran church, Littlestown, has decided to
have a hard wood floor laid in the Sun-
day School rooms of the church. Robert
Stover, Joshua Beihl and Rev. J. J. Hill,
the pastor of the church, have been ap-
pointed a committee to decide as to the
material to be used, etc.

Lynn F. Stephens, well known in Car-
rell county, has been elected director of
the Braddock Heights band, for the
coming season, and has already .started
preparations for a number of special con-
certs to be given during the Summer.
The band will be composed of about
twenty-one members,

—•434—•— -

Seventy-six out of eighty-seven cases
of typhoid fever which occurred in a re-
cent outbreak have been traced by the
United States Public Health Service to
infected milk. Had the first cases been
reported to a trained health officer the
..titbreak could have been stamped out
promptly. When will welearn that dis-
ease prevention is sure and cheap?

The Littlestown Savings Institution will
have a new banking house, work upon
which will be started in a few days. The
building will be one of the finest of the
kind in the county; the front will be cut
marble and the sides, for twelve feet
from the front wall will be of the same
material. The floor will be of marble and
all woodwork will be mahogany and the
trimmings of bronze.

The execution of Solomon Sudler, col-
ored, for the murder of William F.
Brown, will be held privately in the jail
yard, Westminster, some time today
(Friday.) It is said that the scaffold will
be enclosed by a high board fence, and
that the execution will be witnessed by
four doctors and twenty persons, besides
the chaplain, sheriff and deputies, which
is a very commendable arrangement.

The dates for the big reunions at Pen-
Mar the coming season have been ar-
ranged by the parties and the Western
Maryland Railroad Company. Two of
them will be in July and two in August.
The Reformeds will lead off as usual and
the Odd Fellows will close the major fes-
tivities. The dates are as follows: Re-
formed—July 20; Lutheran—July 27;
Presbyterian—August 3; Odd Fellows—
August 10.

Manufacturers of automobiles con-
nected with the National Automobile
Chamber of Commerce announced re-
cently their decision to incorporate a
company with "an ultimate capital of
from $5,000,000 to $10,000,000" to pro-
duce gasoline and other products of
petroleums, with the purpose of "dem-
onstrating that gasGline can be produced
and sold at a profit at a price somewhat
lower than that now prevailing, and
within the means of all users of automo-
biles and motor boats."

Rev. Austin A. Kelly will not recall
his resignation as pastor of the Waynes-
boro Lutheran church, presented and ac-

• cepted a few Sundays ago. He writes
from Philadelphia to the council of the
church that he can not accede to its re-
quest to come back and resume the pas-
torate. He tenders sincere thanks for
the compliment of the invitation but adds
that for the reasons stated personally to
council on the occasion of their visit to
him at Gettysburg last Sunday he will be
unable to make any change in his present
plans to take up a charge in Philadel-
phia.— Gettysburg News.

Billy Sunday picniced on the battlefield
of Gettysburg, on Monday. As the guests
of Carl R. Gray, president of the West-
ern Maryland Railway, Mr. and Mrs.
Sunday, with a dozen members of their
party and personal friends went. by rail
and were conveyed over the field in the
usual tourist wagons. At noon they had
luncheon on top of Little Round Top,
adopting the usual picnic fashion of
stones for seats and the grass for a table
cloth. Sunday declined all invitations to
speak, saying it was a trip purely for
recreation. The return trip to Baltimore
was made in the evening.

Our Old Stone Roads.

H. U. Shirley, Chief Engineer of the
Maryland State Roads Commission, is
authority for the statement that a resur-
faced and asphalt-bound macadam road
near Baltimore, a road subjected to very
heavy traffic of all types, has had prac-
tically no maintenance in the last four
years and that he doubted whether there
had been any expenditure prior to that
time. The road was resurfaced in 1910.
The practical significance of Mr. Shir-

ley's statement lies in the fact that here
was an old and thoroughly compact ma-
cadam road made to serve as a founda-
tion, for two or three inches of stone held
in place by a natural asphalt binder in-
stead of the rock dust or line material
constituting the customary binding ma-
terial of macadam. This used to serve its
purpose well under horse traffic exclusive-
ly, but is sucked out and dispersed by the
rubber tires of the motor car, resulting in
rapid destruction of the road.
An analysis of the statement made by

Mr. Shirley shows that our old stone
roads are, after all, a valuable asset in the
way of stable and unyielding foundations.
To cover them with a few inches of stone
costs no more than customary resurfacing
of macadam. The distinction between
ordinary repairs of macadam and the
road to which Mr. Shirley refers is only a
matter of adding a binder that is more
enduring and tenacious than rock dust.
Maryland and Virginia alone have 2,233
miles of stone roads that could be used as
foundations for new asphalt-bound tops.
The United States Office of Public

Roads, in Bulletin 48, gives the average
cost of resurfacing Maryland roads in the
manner described as 64 cents a square
yard, which would be equivalent to about
$6,000 a mile for roads 16 feet wide. This
is a third the cost of some types of new
roads and only half the cost of the vsry
cheapest types of so-called permanent
roads when newly built from the founda-
tion up.

If a resurfaced asphalt-bound macadam
road will stand up under six years of the
heavy traffic always found in close prox-
imity to a large city, it certainly suggests
an economical solution of the road prob-
lem as it applies to old stone roads sub-
jected to lighter traffic. The fact that
they can be used as foundations for dur-
able tops offers a money saving compro-
mise between the huge cost of new high-
ways and the difficulty and expense of
maintaining plain macadam.— Good
Roads Press Bulletin.

•••0•••  
The Publishers' Problem.

Last week "The Register" ordered a
lot of newspaper from the Antietam Pa-
per Company, Hagerstown, and it cost us
Just $13.79 a ton more than the last lot
we bought. We can get no further prices
quoted on print paper, as the raise is still
going on and paper is extremely scarce at
that. When it is taken into considera-
tion that we use over 10 tons of paper a
year on which to print "The Register,"
the increased cost of production in this
one item i alone is heavy.—Middletown
Register.
The question of procuring paper and

supplies, and the great advances in the
prices of these necessities, has become a
most serious one for publishers and print-
ers. It is not only a matter of paying
advanced prices for these articles—in
some instances advances are as great as
one hundred per-cent.—but it is almost
an impossibility to get some things at any
price. Protective measures must be taken
to conserve all supplies.
The management of The Post has found

it necessary to discontinue a number of
complimentary papers and to cut off some
persons who have failed to respond to re-
quests on their subscriptions. Prompt
attention to subscribers statements will
be appreciated.—Frederich Post.

District Meeting.

(For the RECORD.)
The Church of the Brethren will hold

its regular yearly meeting, in the Meadow
Branch church, near Westminster, April
18 and 19. One new church, near Poco-
moke, Eastern Shore, is added to the
District this year, making seventeen con-
gregations now in all. Thirty-seven del-
egates compose the voting body to deter-
mine the poliz,y of the church on ques-
tions of missions, education, charitable
institutions as well as church discipline.
This body will also elect a delegate at
large to represent this District at the an-
nual meeting of the general brotherhood,
which will be held in Winona Lake Park,
Indiana, June 13-15, 1916.

W. E. Room'.

Trim Newly Planted Trees.

All trees purchased from nurserymen
and planted should be trimmed back,
when planted, or they are apt to die. An
authority on this, says:
"The reason is, that when the young

trees are taken from the nursery many of
the small rootlets, which take up water
from the soil to supply the branches and
the leaves, are broken, and the latter
would evaporate more water than the
roots can supply, with the result that the
tree would dry up and die. Therefore,
the branches must be cut back to balance
the loss of the roots.
Cut the side branches so that not more

than two or three inches will remain be-
yond the stem, and cut off the main stem
of fruit trees at least one-third, leaving
the tree two-thirds of its original height
and with short stubs of branches around
the main stem."

By way of correcting a news item in
last week's issue, we make the statement
that Clarence and Edith Buffington did
not attend the moving of Theodore Cum-
mings and family to their new home.

The LeGore Bridge bill, calling for the
payment of $50,000 to James W. LeGore
for his bridge over the Monocacy river,
near Woodsboro, was signed by Governor
E. C. Harrington on Tuesday. Of this
amount the county will pay $20,000 and
the remaining $30,000 will be taken from
the county's unused portion of the State
Aid Road fund. The signing of the bill
closes a long-standing controversy be-
tween the county officials and Mr. LeGore.

THE CANDIDATES
BEFORE THE PRIMARIES.

Interesting Contest for Delegates to

State Convention.

The following is the list of candidates
to be voted for at the primary election in
Carroll County, on Monday, May 1.
For U. S. Senator. Republicans, Joseph

I. France, Phillips Lee Goldsborough;
Democrats, W. Cabell Bruce, Blair Lee,
David J. Lewis.
For House of Representatives. Repub-

licans, Newton D. L. Allen, Linwood L.
Clark, William J. Heaps, William H.
Lawrence; Democrats, J. F. C. Talbott,
Lloyd Wilkinson.
For Delegates to State Convention. Re-

publicans, Dr. Roland L. Diller,J. Brook
Miller, William L. Seabrook, Edward M.
Mellor, Walter H. Davis, Elwood L.
Murray, William H. Flickinger, William
E. Baker, John W. A. Abkin, Samuel
U. Repp, Harry H. Barnes.
Democrats, J. H. Sherman, Dr. N. A.

Hitchcock, William D. Lovell, Jacob A.
Frederick, Joseph B. Boyle, Charles
Jones, Albert L. Davis and John 0.
Devries.
For delegates to State Convention, five

are to be chosen from each party. The
chief interest in this contest centres in
the fact that the State Convention will
elect delegates to the National Convention.
The Democrats have a three-cornered

fight for Senator, and a straight fight be-
tween Talbott and Wilkinson for the
House. The Republicans reverse the sit-
uation by having a straight fight for the
Senate, but a four cornered one for Con-
gress. At this stage, it is impossible to
pick winners so far as the county vote is
concerned, especially for the Senate. For
the House, Talbott will likely carry the
county, while Heaps has a large follow-
ing of personal friends in the county that
gives him a decided advantage over the
other candidates.
For delegates to State Convention,there

is a sort of free for all race, largely friend-
ly and without special significance, though
on the part of some there will be seen a
factional coloring, but the more conserva-
tive element is disposed to let such con-
tests drop hi both parties.
The situation may yet warm up into

open fights between rival Camps, but the
time of the year is not favorable to much
political exertion or excitement, so the
"still hunt" form of campaign is likely
to largely prevail on both sides.

—

Transfers ot Real Estate.

Maggie .1. Snielser and husband to
Rachel R. Aldridge, convey 4752 sq. feet
of land for $2400.00.
Emma T. House to John H. Smelser

and wife. convey 12 acres land for $10.
John H. Urner and others to Chas. H.

Steller and wife, convey parcels of land
for $2500.00.
Edw. F. Olmstead, administrator to E.

A. C. Buckey, convey 3 parcels land for
$2560.00.
John Null and wife to John T. Dotter-

er and wife, convey 12152 sq. ft. land for
$3200.00.
Geary H. Angell and wile, to Lydia A.

Harner, et. al., convey 178 acres of land
for $8060.00.
Samuel C. Stoner and et. al., to W.

Philip Englar, convey 70 sq. perches of
land for $1.00.
W. Philip Englar and wife, to Rowan

F. Erb, convey 70 sq. perches of land for
$1.00.
Rowan F. Erb to W. Philip Englar,

convey 70 sq. perches of land for $1.00.
Arcenus E. Parker and wife, to Louisa

Maring, convey 1 acre of land for $600.
Robert A. Feeser, to John S. Teeter,

convey 1 acre of land for $3000.00.
Matilda Mehring. to John S. Teeter,

convey 105 acres of land for $7600.00.
John S. Teeter and wife, to Irene S.

Weybright and husband, convey 12 acres
of land for $5000.00.

Michael E. McDonald, to Martin L.
Minters and wife, convey 8505 sq. ft. of
land for $1000.00.

Carroll W. Parish, to John J. Knapp
and wife, convey 141 acres of land for
$5000.00.
Kate M. McLane to William A. With-

erow, convey 26i acres of land for $628.
Chas. F. Shryock to Andrew H. Walk-

er, convey 17 acres of land for $2300.00.
Annie M. Townsend to Jacob H. Rout-

son and wife, convey lot in Union Bridge
for $2000.00.
James E. Evans and wife, to David A.

Evans, convey 4 tracts of land for $1.00.
Greenbury Wilson and wife, to Luther

3Iyerly and wife, convey 5 acres of land
for $100.00.

Stone Roads Near Unionville.

Unionville, Frederick county, is on the
map for stone road building, as it pro-
poses to build nine miles on the "two
and one" basis. The road will be in
three sections; toward Liberty, toward
Union Bridge, and the other east toward
Baltimore. At least three miles will be
built this year, for which about 10,000
perches of stone have already been quar-
ried and hauled to the roadside. The
farmers are taking ledges out of their
fields, thereby serving a double purpose.

Petitions for roads of this character—
two-thirds of the cost by the county—
have been so numerous, that the Fred-
erick County Commissioners have been
compelled to call a halt, the road fund
having been exhausted.

-so.-

CALENDARS TO BE HIGHER.

We have received notice that

after April 26, prices on Calendars

will advance Twenty per-cent. All

of our patrons are therefore urged

to call at once, see our line of

samples, and place their orders for

1917. This advance will hold dur-

ing the remainder of the season.

Selection of Seed Corn.

College Park, Md., April 1.—Instruc-
tions regarding the selection of seed corn
as prepared by Prof. Nickolas Schmitz
are being furnished by County Agents to
the members of the State Boys Corn Club,
who are now preparing for the competi-
tion of 1916. As a result of the interest
aroused last year, there will be keen com-
petition among the boys who have en-
rolled in practically every county in the
State. The proper selection of • seed will
play an important part in their success,
the directions issued being as follows:
In securing seed corn from which to

grow a profitable crop, it is a mistake to
go far from home for it, particularly if
a heavy yield the first year is desired.
Seed brought in from a long distance and
grown under different conditions from
those in your neighborhood, will not, as
a rule, yield as well the first year as good
seed of a good variety grown near by.

Usually, the larger-growing and later-
maturing varieties of corn will yield more
than the 'earlier and smaller growing
sorts. Be careful, however, that the va-
riety you select is not too late in matur-
ing and that the cob is not too large and
has not high a percentage of moisture be-
cause a late-maturing, large cob variety
may mean a lot of rotten corn for you,
and hence, a much lower yield.
In sections where the season is long

enough, such varieties as Boone County
White, Collier, Excelsior, Giant Beauty,
Yellow Dent, Johnson County, if grown
near by, the long yellow variety grown
in Frederick county and the white cap
corn grown in Baltimore, Carroll, Cecil,
and other nearby counties, are as good as
any for large yields. These varieties re-
quire from 125 to 135 days to mature.

Orphans' Court Proceedings.

LoN DA Y, April 10th., 1916.—John H.
Stansbury and Emma J. Gummel, execu-
tors of Jacob Gummel, deceased, received
order to sell personal property.

Letters of administration upon the es-
tate of Catherine Basehoar, deceased,
were granted unto Charles H. Basehoar,
who received warrant to appraise.

William T., Walter E. and George E.
Allen, executors of Charles W. Allen,
deceased, returned inventory of personal
property, debts due, and current money,
and received order to sell personal prop-
erty.
David E. B. Pickett, executor of

Thomas Pickett, settled his third account.
Lyman U. Arnold and Nancy E. Lin-

con, administrators of Margaret Ruth
Arnold, deceased, received order to de-
posit funds and settled their first and
final account.

Letters of administration on the estate
of Geo. F. L. Hoover, deceased, were
granted unto Barbara A. Hoover, who
received warrant to appraise and order
to notify creditors.
The last will and testament of Jacob

W. Caple, deceased, was admitted to
probate.
Tt-EsnaY, April 11th., 1916.— George

H. and Clayton M. Black, administra-
tors of Francanna Black, deceased, re-
turned inventory of personal property,
debts due, and current money, and re-
ceived an order to sell personal property.
Cora E. Bachman, received order to

draw funds.
Letters of administration on the estate

of Albert F. Sharrer, deceased, were
granted unto Sarah V. Sharrer, who re-
ceived warrant to appraise and order to
notify creditors.

Letters of administration on the estate
of Sarah A. Zepp, deceased, were granted
unto Dorry R. Zepp, who received war-
rant to appraise and order to notify
creditors.
Emma C. E. Bankert, administratrix

d. b. n. c. t. a. of Alfred W. Bish, de-
ceased, settled her first and final account.
Anna J. Yingling, acting executrix of

Mary A. Lane, returned inventory of
personal property and current money,
and received order to sell personal prop-
erty.

Nathaniel Schaeffer, John D. Schaeffer
and John D. Rohrbaugh, executors of
Reuben Schaeffer, deceased, reported
sale of bank stock.
Kate Thiele, executrix of Henry Thiele,

deceased, settled her first and final ac-
count.
Blanche Franklin, administratrix of

Charles B. Franklin, deceased, settled
her first account.
Harry J. and George E. Turfle, execu-

tors of Thomas Turfle, deceased, reported
sale of real estate which was ratified and
confirmed.
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The Tree Cutting Law.

There is some doubt as to whether the
new roadside tree law amendments apply
to incorporated towns, or not. It is per-
fectly clear that the provisions of the law
are repealed, so far as "unimproved"
roads are concerned—that is, roads not
surfaced with stone, or concrete, com-
monly called "state" roads—but it is not
clear whether the streets of towns are
exempt, or not.
The law in general is not interfered

with, except as of the cutting of trees,
which lets all of its provisions relative to
the planting of poles, etc., stand as here-
tofore. It is probable that, if a test be
made, the Courts will be asked to define
the law as to the streets of incorporated
towns. The streets are not "state high-
ways," neither are they "unimproved."

A large barn on the farm of Fred.
3Iagin, near Smallwood. was destroyed
by fire, on Wednesday. The farm is
tenanted by John H. Hoffman, who lost
all of his farming machinery and a lot of
hay and grain. The live stock was saved.

Henry P. Nusbaum, near Frederick,
and Adam F. Nusbaum, of Walkersville,
twin brothers, celebrated their 76th. birth-
day on Tuesday. The two men resemble
each other very strikingly and some of
their friends have difficulty in telling
them apart. The tastes of the two broth-
ers are similar, both having been farmers
all their lives.

An acetylene lighting system is being
installed in the Reformed church and
parsonage, at Silver Run.

MEXICAN SITUATION
GROWING MORE SERIOUS

Carranza Asks Withdrawal of Amer-

ican Troops.

A serious crisis is at the front in the
Mexican situation, due to a double cause.
The Carranza government has asked that
the pursuit of Villa be abandoned, as the
constitutionalists are now able to look
after the situation. The claim is also
made that the Villa force has been broken
up and scattered, and can not again be a
menace to the American border.

• Closely following this was an attack by
Mexicans on an American column of 150
men at Parral, in which 50 Mexicans
were killed and one American killed and
one wounded.
Major Tompkins, whose command is

reported to have entered Parral, is the
American commander, who at the head
of a small body of American cavalry,
chased Villa and his whole band across
the border at Columbus and for a num-
ber of miles into Mexico, following Villa's
attack on the American town.
American scouts going in advance of

the cavalry column had found evidence
that Villa but a short time before had
been in the vicinity of Parral. The scouts
had been told by Mexicans that Villa
was in Parral and was being hidden there
by the people with the knowledge of the
small Carranza garrison.
The Americans entered Parral without

evidences being shown by the people of
the town or by the Carranza soldiers there
that their presence was resented, the ad-
vices say, and it was not until Ameri-
cans began searching for evidence of Villa
that the excitable townspeople began to
show animosity.

Later, as the Americans were leaving
Parral in response to the request to do so
made by the town officials, Mexican snip-
ers from windows and housetops began
firing upon them. The serious clash came
later when a considerable body of armed
citizens, following the Americans, opened
fire. The fire was quickly returned and
the Mexicans fled, heaving many dead and
wounded in the streets.
It is reported from Washington that

the pursuit of Villa will be continued,and
that a general vigorous American policy
will be pursued.
The opinion is growing in this country

'that it is apparently useless to continue
the pursuit of Villa with Pershing's little
band. Carranza's attitude makes it
hazardous to continue the search in the
interior of Mexico, unless we send a
much larger force. We were not ready
to pursue until the trail had grown cold
and Villa had ridden far into the interior
of Mexico, in a country familiar to him,
where he could not possibly be caught
without the aid of the natives who were
of the Carranza faction. They gave no
aid and will give none, and the continua-
tion of this pursuit, even if Carranza did
not object, seems to be a wild and vain
proceeding.

April, and House Cleaning.

When April comes with its "showers
sweet," its glinting sunshine, and its
fresh and fragrant winds, it is a dull sort
of a housewife who does not try, with
every means at her command, to make
the inside of her home as sweet, whole-
some and beautiful as are the sun-warmed
sky and the rain-washed flowers of the
great, clean world without.
And happily for all of us nowadays,

springtime house cleaning is no longer
the strenuous business it was a genera-
tion ago. We have fewer heavy curtains
than our grandmothers and our mothers
had, fewer useless ornaments, fewer cum-
bersome hangings, and fewer carpets.
With our polished floors, our more
simple furniture, and our curtains of
plain muslin, scrim, or net, dust does not
accumulate as it once did, and one no
longer needs to turn a house upsidedown
for days at a time to get rid of the rub-
bish and dirt of winter.
Our spring cleaning in these days con-

sists merely in a week or more of con-
centrated following up of the cleaning
methods we use from day to day the
whole year round. For along with the
blessing of our present-day fashions of
simple home furnishings we housekeepers
of the present generation have been pro-
vided by modern science and invention
with countless aids for lightening the
burden of household drudgery. Many of
these are simple, and most of them en-
tirely successful as everyday savers of
both time and strength.—BErrv LYLE
Winsox, in April Southern Woman's.

Walter O'Neill, twenty-six, a member
of the Young Men's Christian Associa-
tion, Baltimore, was badly injured in a
friendly wrestling bout in the gymnasium
when Max Siegel, powerful but unskilled,
got a full-Nelson on him and dislocated
several vertebrae in his spinal column.
The whole lower part of O'Neill's body
is now paralyzed.

Through the failure of the State Senate
to confirm two of Governor Harrington's
appointments of Supervisorkof Elections
for Montgomery county, the board will
continue to be controlled by the Repub-
licans for at least two years.

Some speculation is. being aroused as to
how the furniture basis for taxation pur-
poses will be replaced on the books of the
county. Some of the district collectors
advance the claim that it can best be
done through their aid, a percentage al-
lowanCe being made them for their serv-
ices on the basis of new property added.

Frederick County Commissioners last
Monday began a three weeks' session to
place new property on the tax books.
Automobiles and property which has
changed Lands during the sale season
will form a large part of the new assess-
ments. Books used by the clerks at sales
are being utilized to trace changes in
property and to make assessments in the
name of the new owners. This is one of
the beet systems in the State, and has at
-various times been commended by State
and county officials.

Where the Money res.

On our editorial page, this week, will
be found a condensed statement of the
items of the general appropriation bills
for private and state institutions, as
passed by the last legislature. Some of
the appropriations seem to be very lib-
eral, if not excessive, but to the onlooker
at this distance no intimation is had of
the very strenuous and touching appeals
that must have been made by the bene-
ficiaries.
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Marriage Licenses Issued.

Eugene S. Stump and Claudie B. Mel-
horn, both of Hanover, Pa.
Frederick N. Megahan and Mary

Louise Weber, both of Philadelphia, Pa.
Eddie Brown, of New Windsor, and

Elsie Young, of Baltimore.
Luther Brown, of Westminster, and

Mira Shilling, of Sandyville, Md.

Three Dandelion Recipes.

Dandelion Salad.—Wash thoroughly
the young, tender plants and place on
ice until dry and chilled. Arrange on
salad plates and dot over with small
pieces of crisp bacon. Cover lightly with
hard boiled eggs run through a ricer.
When ready to serve, pour over it a hot
dressing made with the strained bacon
fat, vinegar, salt and cayenne.
Cooked Dandelion Salad.—Press three

hard-boiled eggs through a ricer and mix
well with one cupful of cooked and thor-
oughly mashed dandelion leaves. Mix
with this enough mayonnaise so that it
will hold together and press into small
thnbale cups. When ready to serve,turn
out on lettuce and put a small spoonful
of mayonnaise on each.
Dandelion Souffle.—Three tablespoon-

fuls of flour, three tablespoonfuls of but-
ter, one cupful of milk, three eggs, one
and a third cupfuls of cooked dandelion.
Make a white sauce of the butter, flour
and milk, and while hot beat in the yolk
of eggs one at a time. Beat until smooth,
then set aside until cold.
Put the cooked dandelion through a

ricer or mash until perfectly smooth.
Add this to the first mixture and season
to taste with salt and cayenne. Fold in
the stiffly beaten whites of eggs, turn into
a hot buttered baking dish and bake in a
moderate oven until set and cooked
through. Serve immediately when taken
from the oven.—MA .A RET B. F01'1.1: 8,
ill April Southern Woman's.

With the Anti-saloon League outlining
its campaign to make Frederick county
and city "dry as chips," and with the
saloon men and liquor dealers preparing
to wage a light to protect themselves, the
contest over the local option measure re-
cently passed by the Maryland Legisla-
ture is already beginning to assume a
keen aspect in Frederick. Last week the
Anti-saloon League people held a meet-
ing at the Y. M. C. A. Likewise it was
learned that the wet forces are quietly
building up an organization to fight the
battle of their life.

The lire loss at the Hoffman Orphanage
has been adjusted, the Adams County
Mutual paying $519.25 on the contents;
The Gettysburg Mutual $600 on the barn
and $173 on the contents.

DIED.

Obituaries, poetry and resolutions, charged
for at the rate of five cents per line. The
regluar death notices published free.

RE1 N DOLLAR. —On April 8, 1916, in
Baltimore, Miss Dorothy, youngest daugh-
of Mr. and Mrs. Harry A. Reindollar.
Death was due to bronchial pneumonia,
after a week's illness.

1NTEks. —Mrs. Ida May, wife of Mr.
Luther Winters, died at her home, the
Wm. H. Flickinger farm, near Taney-
town, on April 7, 1916, aged 46 years, .10
months and 16 days. She leaves a hus-
band and a number of children. Funeral
services and interment were held at
Woodsboro, on Sunday.

MYERS. —On April 7, 1916, at his home
in Taneytown, Mr. Jessia Myers, aged
72 years, 7 months, 7 days, from pneu-
monia. He leaves a wife, and one daugh-
ter, Mrs. Edward P. Zepp. Also four
brothers, Levi, of Westminster; Thomas,
of near Littlestown; Washington and
Milton, of Pleasant Valley; and one
sister, Mrs. Charles Mathias, of Littles-
town. Mr. Myers was a retired farmer
and has lived in Taneytown for a num-
ber of years.
Funeral services were held on Tuesday,

at Pleasant Valley. At the house, Rev.
L. B. Hafer conducted the services, while
Rev. J. Luther Hoffman held the main
services at Pleasant Valley.

STONEIL—John I). F. Stoner, son of the
late Solomon and Sarah Ann Stoner, died
at his home on Clear Ridge, on Saturday,
April 8th., after a week's illness of pneu-
monia, aged 69 years. A wife, who was
the daughter of the late John Myers, and
four children survive: Emory Stoner,
Mrs. J. Rinehart Zile, Mrs. David Gei-
man and Mrs. Paul Price; also seven
grand-children. Mr. Stoner will be much
missed in the home and neighborhood.
Funeral services, held at l'ipe Creek,

where he was a member, were conducted
by Elders Bonsack, Snader and Englar,
on Tuesday morning. Pall-bearers were
Chas. Ecker, Ed. Beard, harry
Ezra Senseney, John lively and Walter
Snader.

!unlit:IL —Mrs. Robert Arthur died at
her home, 302 N. Hartley St., York, Pa.,
on April 12, aged 66 years, after an ill-
ness of one week from diabetes. Mrs.
Arthur before marriage was Miss Frances
Rhodes, a native of Carroll county. She
was a member of the First Presbyterian
church, of York, and of the Home de-
partment of the Sunday School.
She leaves her husband and the follow-

ing children: Misses Cora M., M. Grace
and E. Blanche, at home; Harry E. of
Indiana, Pa.; William J., of Havre de
Grace, and Robert R. and C. Walter, of
Waynesboro. Also by two sisters, Mrs.
Martha Bollinger, of Thurmont, and
Mrs. Ptolemy Hilterbrick, of Taneytown.
Funeral services will be held this Satur-

day morning, at 11.00 o'clock, at Baust
church.
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Where The Money Goes.

The REcoao gives below, in condensed
form, the chief appropriations carried by
the so-called "omnibus bill," and passed
by the legislature. These appropriations,
except in a few cases in which special
appropriations were made for buildings,
are for the year 1917, and a like sum for
1918. To the best of our information the
figures given represent the amounts act-
ually appropriated, after the bill was
amended.

REFORMATORIES
House of the Good Shepherd $ 8,500
House of Reformation 10,000
Ma,yland School for Boys 20,000
St. Mary's Industrial School 30,000
Other institutions smaller sums,

HOMES AND ASYLUMS

Hebrew Orphan Asylum $4.000
Home of the Friendless 4,000
German Orphan Asylufn 2,500
Baltimore Manual Labor School 2,000
St. Elizabeth's Home 4,000
St. Mary's Female Orphan Asylum 4.000
St. Vincent's Infant Asylum

tlirC01St. Vincent's Male Asylum
Henry Watson Children's Aid 1,500
Other institutions smaller sums.

HOMES FOR ADULTS

Aged Men's and Women's Home
81.000Hebrew Friendly Inn 3,250

Home for Incurables 2,500
Contederate Soldiers' Home 1,500
Confederate Women's Home 1,000
Other institutions sinalle: sums.

GENERAL HOSPITALS
Emergency Hospital, Easton $ 8,000
Annapolis Hospital 8,000
Franklin Square Hospital 7,000
Frederick City Hospital 8,000
General Hospital, Crisfield 6,000•
Havre de Grace Hospital 4,000
Hebrew Hospital, Baltimore 9,000
Hahnemann Hospital 6,000
Hospital for Women 9,000
Home and Infirmary W. Md. 9,000
Maryland General Hospital 15,000
Mercy Hospital, Hal titnore 7,500
Miners' Hospital, Frostburg 8,000

St. Agnes Hospital, Baltimore 8,000 
10,000Peninsular Hospital. Salisbury

St. Joseph's German 15,000
Union Protestant Infirmary 8,000
'United Charities Hosp. Dorch. Co.' 12,500
Maryland University Hospital 17.500
Washington County Hospital 8.000
Other institutions smaller sums,

SPECIAL HOSPITALS

Sylvan Retreat, Allegany Co.
Ball. Eye, Ear and Throat
Hospital for Consumptives
Kernan Hosp. for Children
Jewish Home for Consumptives
So. Bait. Eye, Ear and Throat
Mt. Hope Retreat
Other institutions smaller sums.

SCHOOLS AND COLLEGES

Blue Ridge College
Charlotte Hall School
McDonough Institute
Johns Hopkins University
Maryland Institute
St. John's College
St. Mary's Female Seminary
Washington College
Western Md. College

$ 7,000
8,000
25,000
lO,C00
6,500
4.000
12,500

$ 5,000
7,000
5,500

6,5,000
12,000
35,000
7.500

38,275
22,700

In addition to the above, there are do-
nations to various miscellaneous institu-
tions in sums of from $1000 to 0000.
Aimropriations to the State Institutions,
etc., are carried in a separate bilLknown
as Senate Bill 689, and are in part as
follows:
House of Correction $ 55,000
Md. School for Blind and Deaf (colored) 12,000
Maryland School for Deaf, Frederick
Md. Tuberculosis Sanitarium
Rosewood State Training School
Springfield State Hospital
Spring Grove Hospital
Crownsville State Hospital
Eastern Shore Hospital
Md. Agricultural College, about

The County County Tax Situation.

• ,,
140,000
123,000
160,000
86,000
60,000
45,000

$240,000

Three laws were passed by the legisla-
ture that will affect the tax-rate of Car-
roll county downwards; the replacement
of the tax on furniture, the taxation of
mortgages and the taxation of judgments.
A fourth bill, providing for one tax col-
lector, failed, because of disagreeing Sen-
ate and House bills, but the Commission-
ers are said to have committed themselves
to the one collector plan, under the pres-
ent law, and this may be counted on as
an expense saving and tax reducing item.
There is also the further probability that
the County Commissioners will hereafter
have more to say as to bills for election
expenses.
The replacement of the furniture tax

will increase receipts over $5,000. The

tax on mortgages may reasonably be ex-

pected to produce several hundred dol-

lars more than it did when last in opera-

tion, or say about $5500.00, without al-

lowing for a considerably larger sum in

case banks are taxed on their mortgage

holdings.
The revenue from the taxation of judg-

ments is more of an encertain quantity,

but it has been stated in general terms

that the face valuation of judgments held
in the county is practically the same as
for mortgages; if this be correct. another

$5000., or perhaps not over $4500., in

revenue may be expected from this new
source.

Speculation at present over the tax-
collection question must necessarily be
more or less at random; but as the cost

of the district system has heretofore been
nearly $7000., it seems reasonable to ex-
pect that the salary of a single collector,
and the necessary expenses of his new
office, printing, postage, etc., can hardly
exceed $3000., which would leave $4000.
as an item of saving each year. We there-
fore have these totals, representing the
probable increased county income;

From Furniture Tax $5000.00
From Mortgage Tax 5500.00
From Judgment Tax 4500.00
From Collecting Tax 4000.00

Total $19,000.00
The basis of taxation in the county, a

year ago, was $21,278,921. To this can
now be added the basis lost because of
furniture exemption, or $744,428, which
would give us a present basis of $22,000,-
000 in round figures, which would seem
to permit a reduction in the tax rate of 8
to 10 cents, in order to produce the pres-
ent amount of revenue.

No Envelopes at Primaries.

No envelopes will be used at the pri-
mary election May 1. The bill abolishing
this sysem, passed by the recent Legisla-
ture, was signed by Governor Harrington
as an emergency measure which means
that it goes into effect at once. The elec-
tion supervisors have been informed of
the new law and to a considerable extent
it will facilitate the work of getting ready
for the primary.
The abolishing of the envelope system

is another step in the direction of fair
elections. Under the old law voters were
privileged to carry a marked ballot inside
the polling place and vote it instead of
the regulation ballot. All they had to
do was to remove the ballot from the
envelope, given them by the election of-
ficial and slip in the marked ballot and
return it to the judge who would place it
in the box. The regulation ballot muld
then be marked outside,and in some cases
it was used as a proof to show that the
marked ballot had been voted. In this
way party poll workers were able to keep
tab on persons who would be "con-
trolled."
Under the new law every votor must

mark his ballot in the booth and hand it
over to the officials to be deposited in the
ballot box. This insures absolute secrecy
as to how the individual voted. The old
law was intended as to make the voting
secret, bet from the beginning crafty pol-
iticians got in their work among a class
of voters as effectually as they did under
the old vest pocket system.-Frederick
Post.

Are We in a Heroic Mood?

There is nothing new in Mr. Roosevelt's
latest declaration of his attitude toward a
nomination to the presidency, though the
occasion of his making it emphasizes its
significance. "Don't you do it if you
expect me to pussy-foot on any single is-
sue I have raised," was the characteristic
way he put the case to his unnamed vis-
itor. Or, if the country is not "in a
heroic mood," as he said the other day,
it must look for some one else. In other
words, if Mr. Roosevelt is a candidate it
will be on a platform of straight opposi-
tion to the policies of the present admin-
istration.
He has already spoken very plainly of

Mr. Wilson's dealings with the European
belligerents, of his "watchful waiting in
Mexico," of his views of national de-
fense; and on these points a very large
number of his countrymen agree with
him. They may not be in a heroic mood
in the sense of wanting war; but Mr.
Roosevelt does not want war, either,
though he prefers an honorable war to a
dishonorable peace. As to the familiar
argument of the President's defenders that
he "has kept us out of war," he makes a
very pertinent comment. "You don't"
he says, "in the long run avoid war by
making other people believe that you are
afraid to fight for your rights." The
present state of the submarine issue is an
eloquent commentary on the assertion.
Campaigns, to be sure, are not always

fought upon the expected issues. But
there is no reason to suppose that in this
case foreign policy and defense will be
overshadowed before election day by more
vital topics. Of course, there is need of
intelligent legislation on the tariff, as Mr.
Wilson himself has admitted, and if that
had to be the main plank in the Repub-
lican platform there would be other men
better fitted to qualify as the logical can-
didate than Mr. Roosevelt; he has never
professed great economic wisdom, but has
been content to take his opinions ready-
made.

Justice Hughes would doubtless be far
more satisfactory as a defender of the
principle of protection. But no one just
now is attacking that with much vigor.
Upon the other issues Mr. Roosevelt has
the great advantage over Mr. Hughes of
having made his position absolutely clear.
If the party nominates him, it will know
precisely what it is getting. This is at
once an element of strength and an ele-
ment of weakness, It is an element of
strength because the man who has a mind
and will of his own always commands
admiration, even from those who disagree
with him. It is an element of weakness
because there are members of Mr. Roose-
velt's own party who do not assent to his
views, who distrust his judgment, who
resent what they regard as his disloyalty

in 1912. In other words, while there is

no other porsible candidate who would

arouse so much enthusiasm as he, there

are those, Justice Hughes conspicuously,

who would probably be more successful

in healing factional differences.
Thus the choice might almost be de-

scribed as one between the positive and
negative virtues. Every one knows what
to expect from Mr. Roosevelt, no one
knows what to expect from Justice
Hughes. There is the character of the
two men to consider, of course. That is
why the more conservative voters would
be better satisfied with the latter. They
would trust him to follow a safe policy,
though they do not know precisely what
it would be.-Phila. Ledger.
 0.0••• 

The Newspapers' Burden.

Perhaps it has not occurred to the
readers of The Post that the war could
affect a commodity so indirectly related
to the demands of the European war as
the paper upon which it is printed. It is
one of the ramifications of the conflict
abroad that the publishers of news-
papers are seriously embarrassed these
days. The higher price of paper stock
and the difficulty of obtaining it at
all in England was a chief factor in the
discontinuance in March of the London
Standard, after a career of sixty years,
for a considerable portion of which it was
the most important organ of the middle
classes in England. In this country the
demand for paper has been increasing
for six months as a result of general bus-
iness. activity. At the same time sup-
plies used ill its manufacture have been
decreased by war conditions, and in
some cases have almost been shut off.
The supply of old rags is affected by

the .cutting off of the importation from
the European peasantry and by the de-
mand for the making of gun-cotton. The
chemicals used in bleaching the paper
produced by sulphuric acid and alum are
being devoured by the manufacturers of
explosives, while importations of jute
have fallen off until the price is doubled.
An embargo has been placed on ship-
ments of wood pulp from Norway and
Sweden, while Canada stopped access to
her vast resources some time ago.
The newspaper publisher is, indeed,

hard hit by war conditions in many other
items of supplies besides the basic one of
paper stock. Practically everything go-
ing into the manufacture of daily news-
paper has increased in price from 10 to
15 per cent-inks owing to the advance
in the cost of acids and dyes, from 300 to
3000 per cent; type, owing to the higher
cost of lead, tin and antimony-even the
rubber and felt blankets wrapped around
press rollers add their quota to the in-
creased "cost of living" of the newspaper
as well as the family necessities. But
with all this increased cost of production
the patrons of the Post ought to appre-
ciate the fact that none of it has been
shifted to them. Other interests have
profited immensely by the war while the
newspaper. while giving the news of that
war, have had their expenses increased
and their profits cut.-Frederick Post.
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State Roads or Boulevards.

The Lincoln Highway project, propos-
ing a great roadway from coast to coast,
is practically assured. That part of it
which passes through Pennsylvania is well
onto completion. The Highway, while
promoted with all of the familiar claims
of developing the country, increasing the
value of adjoining real estate, cheapening
the cost of marketing farm products,etc.,
is primarily an automobile road. It was
conceived by the affiliated automobile
clubs of the country, first financed by
the automobile manufacturers, and later
aided by the state highway departments
of the states through which it passes.
Admitting its every advantage, its ben-

efits to the small percentage of state pop.
ulation living adjacent to it, its use in
brioging tourists from other states through
those sections, its beauty and convenience
as a tourist road, and its value as a part
of a great transcontinental highway; ad-
mitting all of these, it must still be con-
sidered primarily as a tourist road and
not a business road or state highway
serving the state's greatest needs. And
every expenditure of state money upon
it must be considered as a state contribu-
tion to a luxury rather than an invest-
ment looking to the development of a
state-wide asset.
Perhaps the state can afford such a

luxury. If the common country roads
of the state were under a system of even
fair construction and maintenance, the
state could well afford to use its surplus
energies in the higher priced luxury of a
state boulevard. Even with the gross
neglect of the country roads with which
most of our rural sections have to con-
tend, the people have accepted the Lin-
coln highway as an inevitable state un-
dertaking and are prepared to make the
best of it.
But the boulevard enthusiasts are

not satisfied with the single cross-
state highway. They must now make it

a loop. They are clamoring for a new
William Penn Highway to parallel the
Lincoln Highway and joining the two at
Greensburg, Westmoreland County, thus

making a great 610-mile loop. The advo-

cates of this new road have organized the

William Penn Highway Association, and

are prepared to press their demands be-

fore the, apparently, willing State High-

way Department officials. In support of
their claims for this new boulevard, these
boosters point out that it passes through
more large cities, presents a wider variety
of scenery, impresses the tourist with the
things that make Pennsylvania notable,
such as industry, farming, mountain and
river scenery, etc., and lastly that it
would add to the preparedness of the na-
tion in case of war.
This latter argument is supposed to be

a "clincher" at this particular time and

withstand all argument and logic. If we
may be pardoned for refusing to be over-
whelmed by this suggestion of prepared-
ness, we would ask our highway author-
ities these questions: Regarding our pub-
lic roads as state property whose value
should be equally distributed to all sec-
tions and all classes of the state, has a
second tourist route a just claim upon
the limited road funds of the state? As
a business proposition in the develop-
ment of the state for all classes, what is
our greatest need, business and market
roads or automobile roads? As a depart-
ment of state government, does the State
Highway Department favor good roads
for all or boulevards for a few? Until
the state has made good on its obliga-
tions to townships under the dirt road
law, has it a moral right to spend money
on a second tourist road ? We ask these
questions because we believe every state
should have a well-defined state road
policy as affecting such projects and we
believe the people of the state should
know what that policy is.-Pennsylvania
Farmer.

Safe Medicine for Children.

"Is it safe ?" is the first question to be
considered when buying cough medicine
for children. Chamberlain's Cough Rem-
edy has long been a favorite with mothers
of young children as it contains no
opium or other narcotic, and may be
given to a child as confidently as to an
adult. It is pleasant to take, too, which
is of great importance when a medicine
must be given to young children. This
remedy is most effectual in relieving
coughs, colds . and croup. Obtainable
everywhere.
Advertisement

Portable Telephones.

Washington, April 10:-A portable
telephone, made of aluminum and weigh-
ing 2i pounds, the invention of a Forest
officer, R. B. Adams, of Missoula, Mon-
tana, will be part of the regular equip-
ment of patrolmen on the National For-
ests the coming field season. This insru-
rnent is regarded as a great improvement
over the set formerly used, which weighed
ten pounds.

It is said that a field man equipped
with this telephone, a few yards of light
emergency wire, and a short piece of
heavy wire to make the ground connec-
tion can cut in anywhere along the more
than 20,000 miles of Forest Service tele-
phone lines and get in totich with the
headquarters of a supervisor or district
ranger. To talk, one end of the emer-
gency wire is thrown over the telephone
line, the two ends are connected to the
portable instrument, and the instrument
is connected to the ground wire, the end
of which must be thrust into the damp
earth or in water. Contact with the line
wire is made possible by removal of the
insulation from a few inches of the etner-
gen cy wire.
The Adams instrument does not ring

the bell of the receiving telephone, but
instead causes a screeching sound from a
small megaphone-shaped apparatus des-
criptively known as a "howler." This
instrument is installed at the ranger sta-
tion telephone and is said to give effective
notice that some one is on the wire. If
the field man needs to talk with some one
elsewhere on the line, the ranger station
instrument can be used to ring up the
person wanted, when the conversation
can be carried on.

Forest officers say that these portable
phones are especially valuable in report-
ing fires and other emergencies with the
least possible delay, and also in sending
instructions to field men and keeping the
district rangers informed as to the prog-
ress of work going on in the field, thus
supplementing the regular telephone sets
installed at lookout points, ranger sta-
tions, and at convenient intervals along
Forest Service roads and trails.

Shall We Have More Good Roads?

Farm and Fireside tells us that the
House Committe on Roads has reported
the Shackleford bill for federal aid to the
States in building country roads. Sub-
stantially the same measure has been be-
fore Congress several years, and demand
for some federal participation in road-
building is getting stronger.
"The Shackleford bill in its present

form provides that not over $25,000,000 a
year shall be appropriated, to be dis-
tributed among the States in the ratio of
their population and of their mileage of
country roads over which mails are ca-
ned. Thus Maine would get $276,000 a
year, New York $1,594,000, Kansas
$747,000, Texas $1,070,000, Calfornia
$504,000, and so on. The money is to be
expended by the state highway depart-
ment, building roads selected by the State
and approved by the Secretary of Agri-
culture; and the federal contribution
shall not be less than 30 nor over 50 per
cent of the cost. The effort of course is
to encourage especially the construction
of tile best types of road, and to provide
object lessons in the construction. Twenty-
five millions a year would not go far, but
it might induce States and counties to re-
newed effort, in order to insure that they
would get their share of the federal gen-
erosity."

AVoid Spring Colds.

budden changes, high winds, shifting
seasons cause colds and grippe, and these
spring colds are annoying and dangerous
and are likely to turn into a chronic sum-
mer cough. In such cases take a treat-
ment of Dr. King's New Discovery, a
pleasant Laxative Tar Syrup. It soothes
the cough, checks the cold and helps
break up an attack of grippe. Its already
prepared, no mixing or fussing. Just ask
your druggist for a bottle of Dr. King's
New Discovery. Tested and tried for
over 40 years.
Advertisement,
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i  HESSON'S DEPARTMENT STORE  I•
• Store Closes at 6 p. m., Monday, Wednesday and Friday
•  

• Grand Display of
•
• Spring Merchandise•
•

•

•
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We welcome the public to make an inspection of each
and every department of our Store and see the many new
additions being made.

DRESS SKIRTS
Don't fail to get one of our

very latest Dress Skirts. They
are right up to the minute in
style and reasonable in price.

DRESS GOODS
We are showing a large variety

of very pretty Dress Goods for
all occasions. Ask to see the
line of Silk Poplins, Voiles,
Messaline and Tub Silks,
Georgiana Crepes, Etc.

DRESS SHOES
For Men. Women and Children
We are showing a line of

standard made Shoes that are of
the latest styles and durable.
They are just the kind the dis-
criminating dresser looks for.

LADIES WAISTS
A very pretty lot of Silk and

Lawn Waists are on display for
your inspection, Look them
over and see what rare values.

LACES AND EMBROIDERIES
We have just replenished our stock with a fine lot of laces

and embroideries, so that without a doubt we can answer the de-
mand in this line.

MEN'S TAILORING
Obey That Impulse

4- >
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UMW
TAILORS Have Your Next Suit

Taylor Made
It is impossible to buy finer

Clothes for the money! They
are made exclusively to your
own individual measurements
from fine genuine all-wool
fabrics - tailored by expert
craftsmen-smartly styled and
in every sense of the word
First-class Tailoring.

The fabrics too are very
superior in point of design;
every new weave color of the
season being shown in our big
display.

COME AND SEE THEM

First Bank of NewYork1797

From the handling of a few hun-
dred thousand dollars each year
at the time of the inauguration of
our government to the position of
practically the money metropolis
of the world is the financial history
of New YorK City.

(,No one of the great banKs of our
national metropolis gives more
careful attention to the correct
principles of banKing than we do.

(I. A savings account at this banK
means an earning capacity for
your money-no matter how small
the amount-and an absolute as-
surance of its safety.

4J, Get the saving habit. It means a
relief from many of life's worries.

41 Start a banK account with us today.

The Birnie Trust Company
TANEYTOWN, MD.
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We Want cta

to keep in mind the
fact that in addition to
printing this news-
paper we do job work
of any kind. When
in need of anything
in this line be sure

To S
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We Are

Always Ready
to serve you with good
printing. No matter what
the nature of the job may
be we are ready to do it
at a price that will be

Satisfactory



DAIRY an
CREAMERY

SPRING DAIRY PROBLEMS.

Cows Sited Especial Care as Warmer
Weather Approaches.

Every season has its peculiar dairy
problems. and if we are wise we will
take these up as we come to them
seriously and not try to run all opera-
tions which have to do with our cows

in the same mold, writes E. L. Vincent
in the Iowa Homestead.
For example, the cow needs differ-

ent feed and care as we get along to-
ward spring than she does when she
first comes into the stable in the fall
of the year. To be at her best and to
do her best through the season a cow
should go to pasture in good flesh and
with vigor unimpaired by the long con-
finement of the whites.
We have learned that careful groom-

ing is a very great aid in strengthen-
ing the cow and helping her to lay on
flesh. It is the time of the year when
the hair naturally falls off. As it
loosens if we do not take some pains I

While the Ayrshire seems by na-
ture adapted to the production of
milk to be used on the table and
for food in its original form, still
she is no mean butter cow, her
milk being rich in butter fat, but
as the cream rises slowly it is much
more profitable to use a separator,
for with a separator the cream is
as readily extracted from Ayrshire
milk as from any other, and there
is no noticeable difference in the
churnability of Ayrshire cream
from that of any of the butter
breeds. The bull shown herewith
is an Ayrshire.

to remove it the body. becomes clogge(
with impurities, the pores of the skin

being stopped up and the poisons

which should be eliminated that way

are turned back into the system, pro-

ducing more or less debility and direct-

ly affecting the efficiency of the ani-

mal.
It may seem at first thought that it

would make no difference with a COW's
flesh if she were not brushed and cur-
ried down regularly. How can it make
a cow fat or thin to groom her or not
to groom her? By repeated experiments
we have settled it for ourselves that
the cow which is not cared for in this
way will actually grow thin on the
same feed which will make another
cow which is well attended to in this
respect, lay on flesh.
The reason for this is not far to seek.

The cow which is not groomed is not
comfortable. She is all the time work-
ing with her tongue and against every
bar post she comes to to free herself
from dust and hair that needs to come
off. Any mass who has watched his
cows at all knows how uncomfortable
they appear at this season of the year.
And, more than the bodily comfort, she
does not get the good out of her food
that she would were her system in
good working order.
Another good thing for the dairy in

the spring of the year is regular exer-
cise in the open air. There will be
days when the wind will he chill and
raw, but there are no days when it
does not do a cow good to get out and
exercise some. Exercise sets the blood
to tingling and freshens up the breath-
ing apparatus. It sends the cow in
feeling good and ready for her meal.
We ought not to expose our herds un-
til they are chilled, for that would de-
feat the purpose we have in providing
the daily outing, but some chance to
stretch the limbs and breathe the pure
air certainly is a great help in the dairy
economy.
And then as juicy and laxative feed

as possible should be furnished in due
measure. It is especially essential that
the bowels be kept open. This would
argue that we should watch the drop-
pings behind the cow to see if they be
hard and packed or soft and easily
voided. These things all call for the
expenditure of some time, but it is time
well expended.

Only Good Cream Makes Good Butter.
The buttermaker at the creamery is

usually thought of as the man respon-
sible for the quality of the butter pro-
duced. The facts are, however, that
the responsibility lies with the pro-
ducer of the cream. The making of a
careful creamery patron out of the av-
erage farmer is one of the big ques-
tions that confronts the creamery man.
The price at which butter sells depends
upon its lmality, and this quality de-
pends almost entirely upon tile clean-
liness and quality of the cream when
it reaches the buttermaker. The most
skillful buttermaker cannot snake good
butter out of poor cream.

Cow Testing Associations.

' Wisconsin now boasts of having more
cow testing associations than any other
state in the Union. She has forty-five
associations that have a total member-

ship of over 1.200 dairymen and 25,000

cows. The highest -average production

for any association is held by Sheboy-
gan county. with 8,279 pounds milk

and 298 pounds fat per cow.—.Hoard's
Dairyman.

** 4 **ea** 4 ********

DAIRY WISDOM.
-4-

• Den•ying produces a human
• food for which there is no sub- *-
4 stitute and for which there will
• always be a constant demand
• and an opportunity to supply at
*- reasonable prices.
-s The colder the milk when sep-
▪ arated the greater the loss of fat *
* in the skimmilk.
• The animal that pays the best •1-
* is bound to be in evidence as *
* dairymen become better inform- *
* ed.
• Old cows that have passed
* their days of usefulness lower *
• the average production of the *
* herd quite as much as young
* heifers.
• Don't trust any bull, no matter *
▪ how gentle, but treat him kindly. *

* de 4 *4 4

A DAIRYMAN WHO IS
MENG GOOD RESULTS
Recently we received an inquiry

from one of our subscribers in Oregon,
says Kimball's Dairy Farmer. He
said: "We have forty Jerseys, of which
seven are on official test. Will you
please give me a ration suitable for
them? I am feeding about twelve
pounds of oats, bran, barley and beet
pulp mixed with about twenty-five
pounds of corn silage and what oat
and vetch hay they will clean up daily.
I am also feeding about two pounds
of oilmen' per cow per day. I milk
twice a day and am getting on an
average from thirty-eight to forty
pounds of milk testing from 5.8 to 6.2
per cent. We have a three-year-old

that made 100 pounds of butter her
first official month."
It is gratifying to see occasionally

an inquiry such as this one. Here is a
man that is securing from his cows
phenomenal results. He is feeding
the same kind of ration that we have
recommended over and over again and
a ration such as is being fed by thou-
sands of other dairymen. The ques-
tion arises, Why is he getting such ex-
ceptional results? The answer is that
to secure great results feed is but one
of the essential requirements. It is
very evident that this mall is mixing
great quantities of brains and love
with his ration.
We venture the assertion that -were

we to drop into his barn some morning
at 4 or 5 o'clock we would find his

The Jersey cow still holds an
honored place in the regard of all
true dairymen. • R. M. Gow reports
that, taking her of every age and
condition, as shown by 4,297 tests,
her average is 7,784 pounds of milk
and 415 pounds of butter fat per
year. In these days of phenomenal
yields, when every breed is strain-
ing to its utmost to beat the rec-
ord, it is well to consider that the
above figures represent first class
business performance. Any dairy
cow of any breed that will come up
to those figures is worth tying to.

The cow pictured is a Jersey.

cows comfortably housed in a well

ventilated, clean, sanitary stable and

we would find him talking softly and

encouragingly to his cows as he went
about his work feeding,' milking and
caring for them. We would find that
he was systematic, that he htail a time

to do everything and everything would

be done on time. We would find him
studying every cow and catering to her

likes and dislikes not only with regard
to the amount and kind of feed she

should receive, but also with regard to

her grooming, exercise and water. We

would • find here a man who has time

to do the little things that are so neces-

sary to unqualified success. All dairy-

men have time to do the big things,

but it is the one who gives just a little

more time to his cows and does the lit-

tle things who secures great and un-

limited success. It is the doing of

these little things, which, by the way,

require less than half as much labor

as the big things, that is responsible

for doubling production.
With a man of this caliber on the job

and with his cows daily we, 2,000 miles

away, have no right to offer sugges-

tions other than to say by way of en-

couragement. Keep right on feeding

and caring for your cows as you are,

studying individuals from day to day.

learning their likes, dislikes and needs,

that you eany be able to cater to them

even better than you already are.

Value of Cow Testing.

A teacher in a Nebraska district in-

terested the boys and girls in keeping

records of the milk produced by each

cow on the farm. On regular days

milk samples were brought to school

and the teacher by the use of a Bab-

cock tester tested for butter fat. As a
result of this work most of the un-
profitable cows of the district have
been discarded. This has not only
been valuable work in au educational
way, but hus act tinily resulted in profit
to the school patrons.
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What Are Your

Possibilities?
Nu MAN CAN PLACE A LIMIT ON ThEM, Bt -T .1

I NG ACCOUNT IN THIS BANK CAN INCREA'-4: T I

SUNDAY SCHOOL
M Lesson lV.— Second Quarter,
0-;

April 23, 191:,

GIVE FATE EVERY CHANCE TO DO HER BEST FOR

YOU. DO NOT THINK YOU CAN GAIN SUCCESS BY Nf

FOLDING YOUR HANDS AND WAITING.

GET BUSY.

EARN MONEY.

DEPOSIT YOUR SAVINGS.

SUCCESS IS YOURS.

IF YOU WISH TO (\1N

US HELP YOU.
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TANEYTOWN SAVINGS BANK ri
TANEYTOWN MARYLAND e•

A SUCCESSFUL CAREER LET
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HINTS TO MONUMENT PURCHASERS
Cheap monuments are DEAR monuments, because like

other cheap goods, they do not give full value for one's money.
Mathias' Monuments are standard quality, at moderate prices.
Mathias presents at all times the lowest priced monuments
worth buying, and all the intermediate grades up to the high-
est priced monuments worth buying, which emphasizes this
well known fact—Mathias' is the best place to buy monu-
ments whether simple or elaborate.

If you intend to have your Cemetery Lot improved be-
fore Memorial Day, place your order for the work NOW, while
there is sufficient time to give this matter the thoughtful con-
sideration it deserves.

 ,1=1•111.11•01•111116 

JOSEPH L. MATHIAS,
East Main St., Opposite Court St.,

WESTMINSTER, MD.

What 0. T. Shoemaker
of Taneytown

has to say about cream
separators this week
REMEMBER that a cream separator has to be used 730

times every year. If it runs hard, or isn't easy to wash,

or doesn't skim clean, it is a constant annoyance and bother
No machine or implement on the farm receives such constant use and

there is no other machine on the farm where quality of work means so

much and first cost means so little.

A little loss of cream with a cream separator, multiplied 730 times, soon

runs into money. It's too big a handicap for any cow owner to try to

work under.

Creamerymen all over the world long ago came to the conclusion that

the De Laval was the only machine they could afford to use. That's why 98%

of the cream separators used in creameries the world over are De Levels.

You will find the biggest
and best dairymen almost
invariably using De Lavals

Experience has taught them that it is the most
= economical.

You can't afford to take any chances with your
cream separator, and we know that if you will
come to us and let us put in a De Laval for you,
730 times a year you will say to yourself "I made
a good move when I bought that De Laval."

Sooner or later you
will buy a DE LAVAL
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THE TWICE-A-WEEK AMERICAN
The Cheapest and Best Family Newspaper Published

ONLY ONE DOLLAR A YEAR

Six Months, 50 Cents

THE TWICE-I-WEEK AMERICAN is published in two issues, Tuesday
and Friday mornings, with the news of the week in compact shape. It con-
tains interesting special correspondence, entertaining romances, good poetry,
local matter of general interest and fresh miscellany suitable for the home
circle. A carefully edited Agricultural Department and full and reliable
Financial and Market Reports are special features.

CHAS. C. FULTON & CO.
FELIX AGNUS, Manager and Publisher

AMERICAN OFFICE BALTIMORE, MD.

THE INTERNATIONAL SERIES.

Text of the Lesson, I Cor. xv, 1-28.
Memory Verses, 3. 4—Golden Text,
I Cor. xv, 20—Commentary Prepared
by Rev. D. M. Stearns.

It is a great privilege to have before
us so constantly in the lessons of this
year the great fact of a risen living
Christ, so that we may be said to have
many Easter lessons instead of, as in
other years, only one in the year. The
lesson chapter for today is pre-emi-
nently the resurrection chapter, lead-
ing us on to the resurrection of the
righteous Head and the translation of
the righteous who shall then be alive
and encouraging the saints to constant
victory through our Lord Jesus Christ
and to be steadfast, immovable, al-
ways abounding in the work of the
Lord (verses 50-58).
Let us notice first what the messen-

ger says of himself. Although he has
been forgiven, he cannot forget that
he was once a persecutor of the
church of God, but he always magni-
fies the grace of God which saved such
a sinner, and he calls himself the least
of the apostles. Later he says that
he is less than the least of all saints.
and still later he calls himself the
chief of sinners (verses 9, 10; Eph.
8; I Tim. 1, 15). That is true growth
In grace, for as we learn to know our
Lord better we cannot but sink lower
In our own estimation. 'The whole
world is guilty before God, and "sin-
ner" is the only fit name for every one,
without exception. But He came to
save sinners, and only by His merits
can any one be saved, so that it is
never a question of what we are or
what we can do, but only Who is He
and what can He do?
As to the message, the gospel by

which we are saved, it is that Christ
died tor our sins, was buried and rose
again the third day and was seen alive
many times by His disciples and, last
of all, by the writer of this epistle.
who saw Him after He had ascended
to heaven (verses 1-9). Paul did not
think out these things, he received
them and delivered them as he receiv-
ed them (verse 3). No minister of the
gospel is expected to think out his own
thoughts and put them into the form
of a sermon or essay and give them to
the people as bread from heaven. But
the true messenger of God must re-
ceive the message from God and deliv-
er it as such. not with enticing words
of man's wisdom, but in demonstra-
tion of the Spirit and of power (I Cor.
ii, 4). The prophets were to speak
only what God told them, and even
our Lord Jesus was told by His Fa-
ther what to say (Jer. 1, 7-9; Ezek.
7; Hi, 4; Deut. xviii. 18; John ail.
49, 50).
The messenger who speaks merely

out of his own heart Isis own message
Is not a true messenger (Jer. xxiii,
16, 26). As well might Israel think to
manufacture their own manna as for
a preacher to get up or think out his
own discourse. Then notice how Paul
repeats the words. "According to the
Scriptures" (verses 3, 4). and remember
how the risen Christ opened and ex-
pounded the Scriptures by Moses and
the prophets and also the Psalms
(Luke xxiv. 27, 32, 44; Acts 1, 3).
There are four great truths which we
cannot magnify enough—the super-
natural birth of Christ by the Holy
Spirit, His bearing our sins on the
cross as our substitute, His resurrec-
tion from the dead and His coming
again to set up His kingdom .of right-
eousness and peace on this earth.
Apart from His resurrection from the
dead there is no forgiveness, no sal-
vation. no glorious future for any one.
but that great event secures all and
enables us to see ourselves as risen
with Christ and seated with Him in
the heavenlies. He our life, our affec-
tions there and we waiting with Him
for the completion of His body, the
church (verses 14-20; Eph. ii. 4-6: Col.
Ili, 1-4).
Believers now being gathered from

all nations to form His body must
have their resurrection bodies in order
to be fit companions for Him when
He shall come to reign. Christ the
first fruits rose from the dead three
days after His crucifixion and forty
days later ascended visibly to heaven,
where He waits for His completed
body, which the Holy Spirit is gather-
ing. At His coming all the bodies of

His redeemed shall be raised and the
living believers changed, and all to-

gether meet Him in the air for the

Judgment seat of Christ and the mar-

riage of the Lamb. Then He shall re-

turn with Ills saints to judge the liv-

ing nations and to begin His reign, for
He must reign till He shall have sub-

dued all things unto Himself and cols
quered the list enemy—death (verses
23-26).
The "afterward" of verse 23 covers

all the present age betWeen the resur-
rection of Christ and that of his re-
deemed. The "then" of verse 24 cov-
ers all the millennial age when He.
with His saints, shall be reigning and
subduing all things unto Himself
tverse 25; Rev. v. 9, 10; xx, 4). He
will not begin His reign till we come
hack with Him in Ills glory. Then
;ball be fulfilled Ise.. xxxii. 1. 17. All
the discipline and the training of be-
lievers now is to fit us to reign with
Him in His kingdom. The last clause
Df verse 28. "That God may be all it
ill," Is (lie isighe.st peak in ScrIptu re.

PROPER PLOWING OF
THE GARDEN IMPORTAN1

Affects Both The Plant Food Available

As Well As The Soil Moisture.

E. F. STODDARD,

Maryland Agricultural College.

Plowing modifies the physical condi-

tions of the land considerably. The
degree of benefit from this operation

will be determined by the condition of

the land when it is plowed, the type

of soil, and the kind of plow that is

used. Since the land should be thor-

oughly pulverized, the soil should be
somewhat moist but never very wet

as is often the case with clay soils. On

the other hand, the top 3 to 5 inches

of soil should not be dried out com-

pletely for the plow would turn this

down and make it more difficult for
moisture and roots of plants to go
deep. Sandy soils are usually so open
and porous that they dry out early in

the spring and sooner after rains than

heavy soils; and for these reasons the
gardener encounters less difficulty in

plowing the land. Ordinarily heavy

soils with stiff clay subsoils should be
broken up rather deep; for good drain-
age is just as important here as in the
seed bed. It may be advisable in some
cases to lay lines of tile drain in order
to carry off excess water, and thus aid
in the amelioration of the land. Sur-
face ditches will help to carry off ex-
cess water but not so well as will the
tile drain. Sandy soils, however, tend
to let too much moisture pass on
through the subsoil; and for this rea-
son plowing need not be so deep and
should be about the same depth every
year in an effort hi compact the under
soil and prevent leaching. The phys-
ical condition of clay soils will be im-
proved if they are plowed in the fall
and left rough over the winter. They
will also absorb more water for the
use of the spring crops and can be
worked into shape earlier than spring
plowed land. Heavy clover sods and
manure plowed down in the fall will
be better decayed and more valuable
to the spring crop. When rotten
manures are used, however, they may
be plowed down in the spring. In case
a cover crop is sown on the land
toward the end of the garden season,
plowing should be deferred until early
spring. When a cover crop is being

turned under it is best to have the fur-
row slice lap and stand somewhat on

end (rather than to be turned clear
over) in order to maintain a connec-
tion with the subsoil and aid in capil-
lary rise of soil moisture.

MAKING THE HEN MOTHER

COMFORTABLE.

R. H. WAITE,

Maryland Agricultural Experiment
Station.

To hatch well, a hen must have a
good nest. If she has to jump down
into the nest box she is apt to break
some of the eggs. Fix it so she can
get on from the side. Use some soft
straw, hay or like substance for the
nesting material. Be sure it is clean
and free from mould. You will not
want to give the chicks any of the
diseases caused by moulds. If you
are not sure it is clean, give it a thor-
ough spraying with some disinfect-
ant and let it dry out before putting it
in the nest. The eggs, while in the
nest, should form a saucer shape. If
the nest is too deep the eggs from the
outside will roll on the top of the others
in the center and then those under-.
neath cannot get the proper heat. If
the nest is too fiat the eggs will roll
apart and those on the outside will
be too cold. Be sure there are no cor-
ners left, just outside the nesting ma-
terial, for the eggs to roll into. It pays
to spend plenty of' time arranging the
nesting material. Too many hens are
set on poorly prepared nests.

Use Care In Feeding.
Feeding sitting hens is a rather sim-

ple matter. Keep fresh water before
them and feed them regularly. It is
probably best to keep some feed
where they can get it whenever they
wish. Corn and wheat or either grain
alone is all the sitting hen requires.
All she needs is some heat and energy
producing food which contains only
enough protein to repair her waste
tissues. If you give her a stimulating
feed (feeds high in protein are usual-
ly considered stimulating feeds), she
is apt to get into laying condition
again and leave off sitting.
Do not put too many eggs under one

hen. Too many persons take a chance
by putting "just a few" extra eggs un-
der a hen thinking they will get a few
more chicks. If the extra eggs alone
were affected it would not be quite so
bad; but the whole nest full will be
treated alike by the hen for she moves
the eggs about and is constantly
changing their positions. The number
it is safe to set varies with the size
of the hen, season of the year, size of
the eggs, and value of the eggs. Nat-
urally, a small hen cannot cover so
many as a large one, a hen cannot
keep so many warns during cold
weather as during warm weather. she
connot cover the same number of
large ones as small ones, and naturally
one would not care to trust many very
valuable eggs with one hen. For some
reason an odd number of eggs is usu-
ally used in setting hens. This may be
due to superstition but it is also partly
due to the fact that thirteen or fifteen
eggs fit the nest better. About thir-
teen eggs in winter and from fifteen to
eighteen in summer would be about
right for a medium sized hen on me
dium sized eggs.
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UNIONTOWN,

The funeral of Mrs. Alice, wife of Henry
Troutfelter, was held at her late home,
last Friday noon, by Rev. W. E. Saltz-
giver ; burial in the Lutheran cemetery in
Uniontown. Pall-bearers Bentley Myerly,
Snader Devilbiss, Samuel Bare, Charles
Bankerd, William Little and Wm. Rob-
inson.
Friends of Mrs. Caroline, wife of Alvan

H. Gallaher, of New York, were shocked
to hear of her sudden death last Wednes-
day, after an operation for appendicitis.
She was a daughter of Iler. C. E. McCul-
lough, former pastor of the M. P. church
in this place.
Mrs. Bettie R. Cover, of Winchester,

Va., is visiting old neighbors and friends
here this week.
Miss Loretta Weaver spent some time

in Union Bridge, first of the week.
Mrs. Howard Brumbaugh and son,

Charles, of Orange, N. J., spent some
time at William Eckenrode's. last week.

Misses Jane and Olevia Crouse, who
spent several months at J. T. Starr's, are
now at their home.
George Slonaker and daughters, Mrs.

Will Caylor and Miss Clara Slonaker, vis-
ited relatives near Pikesville, last week,
and attended a number of Billy Sunday's
services. A number of others from town
went down on Sunday to the meetings.
Mrs. Mary Beard, of New Windsor,

spent latter part of last week at W. F.
Roinspert' s.
Miss Irma Fowler, of New Windsor,

was a week-end guest of Harry Fowler
and wife.
Rev. Parsell preached in the Lutheran

church, Sunday afternoon, in the interest
of the Anti-Saloon League.
Mrs. L. F. Murray, Harold Smelser,

Urith Routson, have been on the sick list.
Miss Gertrude Devilbiss has been visit-

ing relatives in Philadelphia.

LITTLESTOWN.

Franklin Duttera, had the misfortune
to have his right leg broken just below
the knee, on Tuesday noon. while shoe-
ing a horse for Henry Spalding. The
broken limb was set by Dr. Kholer im-
mediately. His place of business will be
closed for six weeks.
The confirmation class of the Redem-

er's Reformed church will not be confirm-
ed until Easter Sunday morning, owing
to a few of the class being ill with the
measles.
The Irwing Literary Society held their

regular meeting last Friday evening in
the public school building, where a very
large program was rendered.

Miss Lydia E. Hartman, left Friday,on
a several weeks' visit to friends at Easton.
The confirmation class of St. Paul's

Lutheran church will be confirmed on
Palm Sunday morning.
The Senior class of the L. H. S., will

hold a festival, on Friday evening, in the
public school building; the proceeds will
go towards raising funds for their trip to
Washington.
John Bucher, left,Tuesday morning for

Flint, Mich., and in a few weeks his
family will also leave for there, where
they will make their future home.

Miss Florence Stumpt, of York, visited
her sister, Mrs. H. S. Crouse,over Sunday.
Mrs. George IVelsh and sons, Joseph

and Preston, and Miss Grace Schroeder,
of York, spent the week-end with the
former's mother, Mrs. Henrietta Yount.

DETOUR.

Mrs. Robert Speilinan and daughter,
Lillie, spent several days recently with
Mrs. S's daughter, Mrs. Fraley, of Thur-
mont, who has been very ill.
The fox, which has been doing so much

damage in this neighhorhood for several
years, was caught this week by citizens.
The old fox, together with eight little
foxes, were obtained by a hole being dug
in the hillside on Charles Diller's farm,
where the animal had its home. Mr.
Mentzer is taking care of the animals, all
of them being alive, and will kill the old
fox and have its hide tanned, when the
little foxes are able to care for themselves.
Samuel Weybright, of near here, had

his tonsils taken out on Friday, at Davis
Hospital, Baltimore. Mr. NVeybright got
along very nicely. M. L. Fogle, of Ar-
lington, helped to oversee the farm work
while. Mr. Weybright was away.
Quite a few persons were busy making

early garden, when the snow-fall stopped
their work.
Master John H. Boyer has purchased

two old rabbits and seven young ones
from P. D. Koons, Jr. John expects to
carry on the rabbit business very exten-
sively.
Harry Spellman, of Washington. D. C.,

is visiting his parents, Robert Speilman
and wife, of near here.
Guy Warren and wife visited relatives

in ‘Vaynesboro, this week.
Mrs. E. D. Diller, Mrs. E. L. Warner

and Miss Mary Weybright, spent a few
days this week in Baltimore, attending
the Billy Sunday meetings.

UNION MILLS.

Wesley Yingling is digging the founda-
tion for his new dwelling, at the west
end of town.
There will be regular services in the

M. E. church, at 2.30 p. in., next Sun-
day, conducted by the new pastor, Rev.
Stone.
The I. 0. M. Lodge of this place gave

a banquet to its members and their fam-
ilies, last Thursday night, which proved
quite a -.uccess The Order is in a flour-
ishing ondition, and several hundred
people enjoyed the feast. The supper
was preceded by a song service and short
addresses were made by Rev. S. C.
Hoover, Rev. Hoffman and Rev, Stone.
Mrs. G. W. Yeiser is spending this

week in Baltimore.
Mrs. Annie Bankert has returned to

the home of her son, Geo. W. Bankert.

BLUE RIDGE COLLEGE.

The baseball season was ushered in last
Thursday and Friday, when the team
played two games, one with Shenendoah
Academy and the other with Massa-
nutten Academy. The resulting score of
the first was 4-0, and the second 6-3. All
hail to Blue Ridge for her first games,
such splendid victories !
For several evenings, while the teams

plan on the ball field, the remainder of
the boys expend their muscular energies
in work of beautifying the campus. Last
week a force of men transformed the loca-
tion of what was once three tennis courts
into a beginning of a lawn in front of the
gymnasium. The boys under the super-
intendency of Prof. John-are-putting the
finishing touches on the edges. The girls
have contributed to the work too, by
making and serving lemonade to the
boys with the shovels.
Now and then some of our number who

missed the big day, go to Baltimore to
hear Mr. Sunday. Last Saturday Mr.
Harshman was down. On Tuesday
Misses Elizabeth Angle, Elizabeth Wey-
bright and Eva John went down to hear
Billy's message.
The Misses Pardew visited their home

on Sunday. They took with them Misses
Ruth Myers and Evelyn Davis.

Misses Anna Royer and Olive Maust
spent Sunday with Miss Miriam Garver,
who resides on College street west of
campus.

Miss Grace Rinehart very delightfully
entertained the girls of her Art Classes at
her home in Union Bridge, on last Sat-
urday. They report having had a big
appetizing dinner and a real jolly big
day.

Misses Alice and Hazel Barto were
called to their home on the Eastern
Shore, but have returned at this writing.

Misses Kelly and Harner, of Taney-
town, visited at the College on Saturday.
Mr. Bonsack left on Tuesday evening

for his regular trip to Elgin, where he
meets with the General Mission Board.
Stanley Hoover, of Timberville, Va.,

visited his brothers, Saturday and Sun-
day.
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Why Constipation Injures.

The bowels are the natural sewerage
system of the body. When they become
obstructed by constipation a part of the
poisonous matter which they should carry
off is absorbed into the system, making
you feel dull and stupid, and interfering
with the digestion and assimilation of
food: This condition is quickly relieved
by Chamberlain's Tablets. Obtainable
everywhere.
A d vertisement

EMMITSBURG.

On Monday, Eugene E. Zimmerman
met with quite a serious accident, while
he was cranking an automobile he was
struck in the face, breaking his nose,
fracturing his cheek bone and injuring
one eye; lie is suffering very much. Dr.
B. I. Jamison rendered the necessary aid.
Mrs. Fannie Eyster, Mrs. Emma Gel-

wicks, Misses Elizabeth Frailey and Vir-
ginia Eyster • motored to Frederick on
Monday for the day.
Frank Shuff has returned from the

hospital, where he underwent an opera-
tion for adenoids, and an operation on
his nose. Two small bones were removed.
Dr. Rumsey performed the operation.
Mrs. E. L. Annan and daughter,

Pauline, are visiting Mrs. G. W. Speed,
of Walbrook.
On Tuesday, Marian Hoke, Grace

Rowe and Helen Shulf; Will Rowe and
John Rosenteel motored to Baltimore to
hear Billy Sunday.

KEYSVILLE.

Mrs. George Frock entertained a few of
her neighbors last Friday at binding
carpet and sewing carpet rags, at which
all had a good time, especially when the
dinner hour came. All were invited to
the dining room to do justice to the fine
dinner, which Mrs. Frock knew how to
make appetizing.
0. R. Koontz and wife were in Balti-

more the first of the week on business.
Mrs. Koontz remained to visit relatives a
few days also to hear Billy Sunday
preach.
Arbor day wr s appropriately observed

by the pupils of the public school, by
having the Governor's letter read to them
on the subject of Arbor day and by plant-
ing a tree.
Miss Anna Newcomer is visiting in

Taneytown.
Charles Cluts, wife and child visited

Mrs. Chits' parents. near Loy's, Sunday.
Mrs. Hummer and Mrs. Shryock visit-

ed Harvey Shryock's, Tuesday.
Three different saw dust pavements

have been laid in our village.
Elmer Moser and bride have moved

into one of O. R. Koontz's houses.

Rheumatic Pain Stopped.

The drawing of muscles, the soreness,
stiffness and agonizing pain of Rheuma-
tism quickly yield to Sloan's Liniment.
It stimulates circnlation to the painful
part. Just apply as directed to the sore
spots. In a short time the pain gives
way to a tingling sensation of comfort
and warmth. Here's proof—"I have had
wonderful relief since I used your Lini-
ment on my knee. To think one appli-
cation gave me relief. Sorry I havn't
space to tell you the history. Thanking
you for what your remedy has done for
me."—James S. Ferguson, Philada, Pa.
Sloan's Liniment kills pain. 25c. at
Druggists.
Advertisement.

PLEASANT VALLEY.

The funeral of Jesse Myers was largely
attended on Tuesday. Mr. Myers for
many years resided on the farm once
owned by his father, John Myers, near
the cemetery, but later sold it to Wm. H.
Yingling and moved to Taneytown.
Noah Powell has been appointed sexton

of the cemetery to fill the vacancy caused
by the death of Jacob Lawyer.
On account of the inclement weather of

last Saturday, the entertainment for the
benefit of the Ladies' Aid Society was
postponed until this Saturday evening,
April 15th. Should the weather be in-
clement the entertainment will be hen on
Thursday evening, April 20th.
Clarence Zepp and wife, of Carrollton,

spent Sunday with their parents, Theo-
dore Zepp and wife, and E. \V. Devilbiss
and wife.

A Perfect Starting Food

for Little Chicks is Rein-o-la Dry Mash.
Easy to feed; it contains the best grow-
ing elements in a way that insures proper
nutrition. Unequalled for growing qual-
ities. Sold on its merits by REINDOLI.AR

L\: Co. 3-31, tf

TYRONE.

Misses Ethel Hively, of Frizellburg,and
Mary Benedict, of Snydersburg, spent
Sunday with David Hahn and family.
1Vm. Halter, wife and daughter, Mar-

garet, and son, Wilbert, of Mayberry;
Mrs. Charles Lutz, daughter, Annie and
son, Stanley, and Miss Annie Flickinger,
of Copperville, spent Sunday with Ira
Rodkey and family.
Mrs. John Marquet, Mrs. George Hy-

miller and John Powell all continue the
same.
The Woman's Missionary Society, of

Baust Reformed church, met on Wednes-
day afternoon to make preparations for
the classical meeting to be held on May
23 and 24.

Mrs. Charles Marker and Mrs. Howard
Marker and daughter, Elizabeth Bell,
spent Wednesday afternoon with Charles
Welk and family.

0•• 
Spring.

Spring is looked upon by many as the
most delightful season of the year, but
this cannot be said of the rheumatic. The
cold and damp weather brings on rheu-
matic pains which are anything but
pleasant. They can be relieved, however,
Dy applying Chamberlain's Liniment.
Obtainable everywhere.
Advertisement.
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PINEY CREEK SUMMITT.

Mr. and Mrs. Oliver Hesson and Miss
Esther Bair spent Sunday with friends
near Silver Run.
John Sauerwinen spent several days

last week in Frederick.
Smith & Yingling Co. are improving

the appearance of their farm by painting
and other improvements.
Irving Mayer., of Gettysburg College,

spent Sunday with home tolks.

MAYBERRY.

The Ladies' Aid Society of the Church
of God, at Mayberry, will hold an Easter
service, Sunday evening, April 16. A
special Easter program is being prepared
for the evening; everybody invited to at-
tend this service and enjoy the evening
with us. Service begins at 7 o'clock.

 60*. 

Philadelphia and Carpets.
More than a third of all American

carpets are 'woven In Philadelphia.
which, it is claimed, leads any other
city of the world in the volume of pro-
duction. Wilton. in England, has giv-
en its name to one of the most wide-
ly known and useful rugs in the world,
but now the Wilton rug producing cen-
ter of the world is in Philadelphia.
Axminster, too, gave its name to a car-
pet, but it long ago ceased to produce
any of it. Brussels likewise is known
all over the earth for its carpet, but
Brussels does not begin to produce the
carpets and rugs which are turned out
In Philadelphia. Philadelphia enter-
prise embarked in the carpet business
while Washington was president of the
United States, but it was not until
more than half a century later that
Pennsylvania led all the states In car-
pet production. As early as 1791 there
was a factory in Philadelphia engaged
In the manufacture of Axminster and
Turkey carpets. China and Russia
send to Philadelphia most of the long.
coarse wool used in the manufacture of
the finest Wiltons.—Argonaut.

Getting Up In the Morning.
The truth is that there is no time at

which it is pleasing to get up. Getting
up in the world is a pleasure, but we
refer to getting up from anything be-
tween a fifty cent cot and a forty dol-
lar mattress after having tried to in-
dulge. to a point of satiety, a normal
appetite for sleep.
To get up willingly is, as Lord Dun-

dreary would say, "something no fel-
low can do." It simply isn't done and
can't be done. Absolutely nobody
does it.
Early rising is with some persons a

sort of religion, like flagellation. But
they, like the rest of us, unless they
are afflicted with a loss of the normal
capacity for sleep, find the moment of
rising painful, however compensating
the pleasure of boasting their early
esing, the joy of bullyragging and be-
littling persons who frankly do not like
at any time to get up, although they
do it heroically every morning.-Lou-
isville Courier-Journal.

The Flag of Denmark.
In the year 1219 King Waldemar of

Denmark, when leading his troops to
battle against the Livonians, saw, or
thought he saw, a bright light in the
form of a cross in the sky. He held
this appearance to be a promise of di-
vine aid and pressed forward to vic-
tory. From this time he had the
cross placed on the flag of his country
and called it the Dannebrog-that is.
the strength of Denmark. Aside from
legend, there is no dcubt that this flag
with the cross was adopted by Den-
mark in the thirteenth century and that
at about the same date an order,
known as the order of Dannebrog, was
Instituted, to which only soldiers and
sailors who were distinguished for
courage were allowed to belong. The
flag of Denmark, a plain red banner
bearing on it a white cross, is the old-
est flag now in existence. For 300
years both Norway and Sweden were
united with Denmark under this flag.

The Gegenechein.
• The Gegenschein is the name given

to one of the most inexplicable objects
known to astronomers. It is visible in

the night sky under favorable condi-

tions, is rounded in outline and is situ-

ated always exactly opposite the place

of the sun. It has been termed by one

eminent astronomer "a sort of comet-

ery or meteoric satellite" attending the
earth. He supposes it to be composed
of a cloud of meteors situated about a
million miles from the earth and re-
volving around it it in a period of just
one year, so that the sun and the me-
teors are always on opposite sides of
the earth. It is estimated that the
size of this ghostly satellite may be
nearly the same as that of the planet
Jupiter-i. e., about 80,000 miles in
diameter.

poiis as Scapegoats.
The earliest dolls found were the

"Answers" of the ancient Egyptians,
which were buried with important per-
sonages in order that they might ful-
fill such duties as the rulers of the
nether world might impose on the dead
dignitary in his next incarnation. The
more important the dead the larger the
number of dolls buried with him.
Even to this day the doil plays iis part
in the folklore of the banks of thz•
Nile. When the river doe3 not nppoar
to rise properly a doll is thrown no.
its waters, reprraiting the livhig vir-
gin or boy who used of old to
thrown in to propitiate the Nile god.
and a similar performance takes place
on the banks of the Tiber, where a
doll made of plaited rushes is used as
a substitute for the human victim.-
Westminster Gazett..•

George Washington's Sobriquets.
Washington was called by many so-

briquets. He was first of all "Father
of His Country." "Providence left him
childless that his country might call
him father." Sigourney calls him "Pa-
ter Patriae;" Chief Justice Marshall.
the "American Fabius." Lord Byron
In his "Ode to Napoleon" calls him
"the Cincinnatus of the West." For
having a new world on his shoulders
he was called the "Atlas of America."
The English soldiery called him by the
sarcastic nickname of "Lovely Georgi-
us." Red Jacket, the Seneca Indian
chief, called him the "Flower of the
Forest." The Italian poet Vittorio Al-
fieri called him "Deliverer of America."
His bitter opponents sarcastically call-
ed him the "Stepfather of His Coun-
try" during his nresidenev.

Keep Your Skin Clear and Healthy.

There is only one way to have a clear,
healthy complexion and that is to keep
the bowels active and regular. Dr. King's
New Life Pills will make your complexion
healthy and clear, move the bowels
gently, stimulate the liver, cleanse the
system and purify the blood. A splendid
spring medicine. 25c. at your Druggist.
A d vertisement.

You Will Find
M. R. SNIDER'S

ONE PRICE STORE

Ready to Meet the Demands
of all Spring Shopping, at Ex-
tremely Low Prices, Ac-

cording to the Market
Prices.

CLOTHING
A large assortment of beautiful patterns

of extra quality, at prices away down.

CARPET AND MATTING
Don't buy until you see our line of

beautiful patterns, and that extra quali-
ty. at prices in reach of all..

DRY GOODS
This line is full and complete.

CiILCLOTH AND LINOLEUM
We are now showing an extra large as-

sortment, at near the old prices, which is
a real bargain.

SHOES
We certainly are showing an extra

large assortment of extra good quality, at
extra low prices, so don't wait.

WIRE AND FENCE
We have all styles and all kinds and

the price is right yet; but my advice is,
don't wait, for just as soon as the market
makes another advance our prices will 

b 

higher.

LOCUST POSTS
We are ready to fill all orders at prices

very reasonable.

DINNER SETS
Did you see out line. yet ? If not, call

before buying.

HARNESS
The roads will soon be good and you

will want a fine set of Buggy Harness.
We have them at the right prices. Also
anything else in this line. An extra
good assortment of Work Collars and
Work Gears.

WIARD PLOWS
You know they are good, and I don't

think you can get a better and an easier
running Plow anywhere. No. 81, at
$11.50; Nos. 80 and 104, at $12.00, at
present, but looking for another advance
in price.

SPECIAL
Lard, 10ic, and Side Meat 1lic. in

trade only.

M. R. SNIDER,
Harney, Md.

4-7,1

PUBLIC SALE
- OF A

Nice Little Home
The undersigned, will sell at public

sale, a nice little home situated LI miles
east of Taneytown, along the State Road,
known as the Gate House Property, on

TUESDAY, APRIL 18th., 1916,

at 1 o'clock, sharp, the following proper-
ty, containing

ACRES OF LAND,

more or less. Improvements consist of a
good 21 Story WEATHER-
BOARDED DWELLING,Sta-
ble, Hog Pen, Hen House,

and all necessary outbuildings, fine lot of
fruit trees, and a well of good water near
the door.
TERMS to suit purchasers.

Also at the same time and place, will
be sold a lot of Household Goods of all
kinds.
TERMs CASH.

ISAAC PIPPENGER.
J. N. 0. Smith, Ana. 3-24-41

Raise Every Chick
on Rein-o-la Chick Feed. Made from
pure, sound grains only, and balanced to
suit the little chicks' needs, it makes
them grow rapidly. Avoid heavy nior-
tality, bowel troubles and other ailments
by using only Rein-o-la Poultry Feeds.—
REANDOLLAPIIBROS & CO. 3-31,tf

PAINT
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When
the painter

ealrt applies paint

4t

on your house
it is to your best interests to know what
that paint is—its spreading capacity
—its appearance—its durability. You
are the man-who-pays-the-bill and who
loses if the paint goes wrong. Make
sure of good results—the most satis-
factory and economical job—by hav-
ing your painter use

SHERWIN-WILLIAMS PAINT
PREPARED

It is better than any other prepared
paint on the market, or "lead and
oil" The Sherwin-Williams Co.
safeguard its quality in every process
of manufacture. -elicy make all their
linseed oil; own and operate large
zinc and lead mines and smelters,
and make their dry colors in the
largest and best equipped dry color:

plant in the United States
The results are in the goods.

Protect your inteiests ard
your property with S.W. P

We sell it.

ElNDOLLARmi,fis - BROS
itrimovaiy.4,70.0,,,o TA NE Y TOWN, MC), PAINT

William James Heaps
Republican Candidate for Congress.

To All Republicans Voters.
At the urgent and insistent requests of

many political friends throughout the
Second Congressional District I hereby.
announce my candidacy for the nomina-
tion for Congress at the Primaries to be
held on May 1, and pledge may friends
and supporters if nominated to make the
same vigorous campaign on Republican
Principles and Doctrines that has char-
acterized my public addresses and cam-
paign utterances in the recent cam-
paigns.
My claim for support of the Repub-

licans in my district is based upon the
fact that in 1914 at a late hour (but one
month before election) I entered the
campaign as candidate with the under-
standing that if I made a lair run I would
receive the backing of the party for the
coming election. The excellent run of
1914 is a matter of history.
My claim is founded furthermore on

the strenuous work done for the party in
the mayoralty campaign last spring, and
in the gubernatorial campaign last fall.
If nominated I will enter the coming
campaign with the same vigor for Pro-
tection, Preparedness and Prosperity
that has characterized all former cam-
paigns. I shall make my fight if nomi-
nated on straight Republican doctrines
as laid down by the Chicago platform,
and consider myself bound if elected to
work for their fulfillment.

As I cannot in the short time between now and the primaries see all the voters
I hereby solicit their support.

Political Advertisement.
WILLIAM JAMES HEAPS.

3-31-5t

Heat Your House with the
Celebrated Pipeless Furnace,

- - The System for
House Warming,
ANYONE WHO IS INTER-

ESTED IN A HEATING PLANTI!
THAT COSTS HALF AND LESS
THAN HALF OF WHAT THE
AVERAGE HEATING PLANT
COST, WE WILL BE GLAD TO
MAIL THEM DESCRIPTIVE
CIRCULAR EXPLAINING
THIS HEATING SYSTEM.
BETTER STILL, CALL AND
SEE US.

MASON & [MOT,
Heating and Plumbing Contractors,

TAN EYTOWN, MD.
2-18-ti

Piano Bargains iSALE REGISTER
New Pianos, $1 up; second-hand,$25

up. Organs, $10 ip. Easy terms, $5
monthly. Over a dozen makes at Lowest
Factory Prices, including the Famous
Lehr and others, sold 20 years at Birely's
Palace Of Music. CRAMER':, PALACE OF

APRIL.
15th-1 o'clock. C. A. Stoner, Gettysburg. An

nual sale of all kinds of Nurseiy Stock.
J. N. 0. Smith, Auct.

18th.-1 o'clock. Isaac Pippinger, on State road
near Taneytown. Real Estate and House-
hold Goods. J. N. 0. Smith, Auct.

Mt•stc, Frederick, Md. Phone 141511.4 Subscribe Now for TD RECORD!



suNDAy WANTS
McCLIERY'S JEWELRY STORE, TO BE ON SAFE SIDE

: Reliable Goods Watch, Clock and Jewelry

Right Prices Repairing

Prompt Service Guaranteed
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1847 ROGERS BROS. L,
"Silver Plate

that Wears"

Silver
Of Proven Quality

15

Rich design and refined beauty in knives, forks, spoons
and fancy serving pieces are not attributes of solid

silverware alone. The skill born of long experience has pro-

duced in the famous 1847 ROGERS BROS. silver plate effects in

pattern and design which make its name for beauty second only

to its reputation for quality—"Silver Plate that Wears."

Sold by leading dealers everywhere. Send for Catalogue

"CL," showing all patterns.

INTERNATIONAL SILVER CO.,
Successor to Meriden Britannia CO.

MERIDEN, CONN.

75 years ago
everyone wore homespun

and, likewise, everyone used hand-mixed
paint. To-day, when machine-spun cloth
is so much better and cheaper, no one
would think of wearing homespun. Many
people are still using hand-mixed paint,

however, because they do not know that

LEAD AND ZINC PAINT
FEWER GALLONS — WEARS LONGER

will save them money and
labor. Devoe Lead and Zinc
Paint is simply made of the
same ingredients the old-time
painter used: Pure White
Lead, Pure White Zinc, and
Pure Linseed Oil. The only
difference is that Devoe is
mixed by machinery, 500
gallons at a time. Therefore,
it is always absolutely uniform in strength,
color and covering capacity.

We guarantee Devoe Lead and Zinc Paint to
We know it contains no whiting, silica or other
materials. Stop in and ask for Color Card.

--)

DIMMEEBanthananamnaaninuatuansonomMor

be pure.
worthless

D. M. Mehring & Son
Taneytown . Maryland

The Homo Insurance Company, New York,
Our inspector has been spending some time in Carroll

County, looking over property insured in the above company.

We wish to call your particular attention to the danger of
terra cotta and hanging flues, air tight stoves, gasoline stoves,
wooden fire boards and shingle roofs.

We also call your attention to the advantage of keeping
premises clean, removing rubbish and other accumulation
which cause fires.

The Home Insurance Company maintains an Information
Department at Baltimore, and shall be glad to write any policy-
holder or property owner giving full information on the subject
ofIfire hazards, as outlined above.

PROTECT YOUR PROPERTY BY INSURANCE AND

AVOID FIRES WHENEVER POSSIBLE.

Write for Information.

A. G. HANCOCK, General Agent.

THE HOME INSURANCE BUILDING, BALTIMORE.

LOCAL AGENTS ---

A. FRANK MILLER, Mt. Airy. CHAS. M. ANDERSON, Sykesville.

CHAS. E. GOODWIN, Westminster. P. B. ENGLAR, Taneytown.

NO newspaper can succeed with-
" out advertising, therefore we

solicit the patronage of our readers
for those who by their advertising
help to mc.k thiz, paper possible.

Dr. E. M. DemareA,
Osteopathic Physician,

62 W Main St.. Westminster. Md.
C. & P. Phone 76R

Elliot House, Taneytown, Md.

lb,tt Fridays of Each Week.

Prefers to Take No Chance of

Eternal Fire.

PLEADS FOR REAL MEN

"If I Thought I Was Gratifying

Curiosity I Would Quit Bal-

timore Before Monday

Morning."

STATISTICS FOR THIRTY-

SEVENTH DAY OF CAM-

PAIGN.

Morning  
Afternoon  
Evening  
Lyric  

Total  
Former Days

Attend.
10,000
10,000
12,000
3,000

35,000
1064,200

Totals  1099,200

Trail-Hitters.

Morning  68

Afternoon  256

Evening  264

Lyric  75

Total  663

Former Days  14,475

Total  15,138

Baltimore.—Hell, a region of terror

Inestimable, an eternal home for the

sinners after they leave this earth, was

painted in realistic fashion by Rev.

Billy Sunday in his sermon to 12,000

men Sunday.
"What will be the end if you obey

not the gospels of God," was the text

Sunday selected for the sermon, and

Sunday answered the text in the one

word, "Hell."
"I believe in hell and heaven: I live

and try to avoid hell and get to

heaven; I die and I go to heaven. You

believe death is an eternal sleep; you

say there is no hell. All right. You

die—and you find out I was right.

Where do you head in then?"
This was the way Sunday summed

up in the sermon his opinion of those
who refute the doctrine of eternal pun-

ishment for the unrepentant sinner.

Sunday's defense of the doctrine of

that region where Satan rules supreme

was an eloquent one. It was replete
with appropriate stories of famous

men and incidents of those who, in life,

boasted their disbelief in a hell for the
sinner and who, at death, spent their
last hours in agony—agony brought on

by visions of the suffering they would

undergo for eternity.
Billy also touched on the question of

whether or not hell was literally a

place of fire. "When God said fire,"

he declared, "He may have meant it

literally; He may have meant it as

typifying the greatest suffering that

man knows. In any case, He meant
it as a place of terror. And I don't

want to go there to find out if God

meant fire literally. It doesn't make

any difference if there is really fire

there if you once get there; you're

going to suffer. It doesn't make any

difference to me whether or not the

streets of heaven are literally paved

with gold. I know heaven is a grand

place and I want to get there."
In the audience was a delegation

of about 3,000 Knights of Pythians,
some of them in uniform. When, at
the conclusion of his sermon, Sunday
issued his invitation for trail-hitters,

more than 100 of these, led by their

flag-bearer, waving Old Glory, came

down the saw dust path.

264 Hit Trail.

Among the trail-hitters also was one

of the most prominent insurance men

of Baltimore and several other well-
known merchants and professional

men.
264 hit the trail at the night

all,
In

service.h egT
realer part of the audience last

night was composed of delegations
from various stores, factories, lodges
and churches. Many requests for an
appearance of the Sunday sextet came
from these delegations, and the
choristers finally answered the call.
"Know thyself a man," was the text

the evangelist selected for his after-
noon sermon. And this text gave him
his best opportunity to show his con-
tempt, his disgust for those who are
called 'men by brevet"—those made
notorious by T. H's denunciation of
them as "mollycoddles."
On the platform, about the streets

In his home—wherever he goes, in fact
—the most noticeable characteristic of
Sunday is manliness. The bitterest
critics of the evangelist cannot find
anything sham about his contempt for

the male of the "mollycoddle" type; It
is one charge, at least, to which Sun-
day has never been subjected by his

critics.
Therefore, Billy's attack on those

who are men by name and courtesy

only, was bound to be virile; bound

to have in it all of the interest, the

instruction that Sunday could put

there.
The sermon which Sunday delivered

to a mixed audience of about 10,000
in the tabernacle in the morning, was
one replete with typical Sunday epi-

grams. It was thought then that Sun-

day had reached his height in this re-
_
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FORTY HORSE POWER 7-PASSENGER FOUR, S875.00

STUDEBBKER
Proved on the ROADS of AMERICA

Last November a Hundred Studebakers went "4 times around the earth in 48 hours," the most convincing

Stock car test that America has ever seen.
To the man who is going to buy a car, the significance of this Studebaker Reliability Run can not be ove

r-

estimated for the simple reason that this was a test not of a car especially prepared, on a race course—but a 
Stock

car, the kind of ear You get, on the very roads You use.
From towns scattered all over the country, a Hundred Studebakers were off on the task of making 1,000

miles each in 48 hours. Weather and roads everywhere were far below normal even for November. Yet over

such roads the 100 cars averaged 1,078 miles in 36 hours and 36 minutes. Over such roads they raced along at

an average speed of 274 miles. Over such roads they averaged nearly 12 miles to the gallon of gasoline. Over

such roads with 4 to 7 passengers, they distanced many of the country's crack "Limiteds." Over such roads

they ran along without one car experiencing the slightest mechanical troubles.

Over the roads of America, the very roads that Studebaker owners use, Studebaker has overwhelmingly prov
ed

its Power, its flexibility, its stamina, and speed and economy. Over the roads of America. Studebaker has

proved its unfailing reliability and its undeniable superiority of mechanical design.

More than 22S.000 Studebaker cars produced and sold.

All Prices f. o. b. Detroit.

The Car of the Golden Chassis

Sold by BASEHOAR (0. MEHRING,
Both 'Phones. LITTLESTOWN, PA.

3-31-2t
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spect. But he proved that he hadn't I

in the afternoon.
The brief, pithy, paragraphs with

which he punctuated his address to the

men were probably the best that Sun-

day has used in Baltimore. They

made points that stuck in the minds

of those who heard them; many of

them drew laughs, but, after the

laughs, they commanded serious con

siderat ion. They were, in practically

every case, perfectly apropos, clearly

illustrative.
"Every man is some boy's hero, and

if every man lived right no boys would

go wrong," he said in the course of a

plea to the older men to set the ex-

ample for the younger men and the

boys.
"Don't look for cushions if you want

to have your face in the Hall of
Fame," was his remark at the conclu

sion of a plea to men to be courageous

when "hitting the hard spots" of life;

not to avoid them, but to "buck up"

and fight hard and win.

"A prudent man won't swallow a

potato bug and then take paris green

to kill that bug," was the way he

pointed another part of his sermon.

Paragraphs such as these kept the

audience intensely interested from

the beginning of the sermon to the

end.
The afternoon audience of 10,000

men responded to the sermon with

rounds of spontaneous applause and

cheers through the sermon and with

268 trail-hitters at the conclusion of

the address.
When Sunday issued his invitation

for trail-hitters in the afternoon the

first man to respond was the flag

bearer for the delegation of 1,000 mem

bers of the Junior Order United

American Mechanics. This man car

ried with him down the aisle the big

silk, American flag, and it was the

signal for cheers from all sections of

the house.
This delegation sent quite a num-

ber of trail-hitters down the saw dust

Paths. A large number of students

from the various colleges and high

schools about the city was also on

hand in a section reserved, and, when

Sunday made a special plea to them

to take their stand for Christ, about

25 hit the trail in a body.

Threw Down Gauntlet.

Rev. William Sunday threw down

the gauntlet to those who use that

statement that tabernacle crowds are

only curiosity-seekers, the basis of

their criticism of the evangelist.

"Down from your curiosity!" he

cried, jumping on his pulpit chair.

"Do you want to know why the great

majority of people here don't hit the

trail? They're too proud to admit

that anything vile has come into their

lives! They're too proud to admit

that they have done anything for God

to forgive! But, let me warn them,

that unless they are forgiven by God

they will rot in hell for eternity!"

Then Billy pointed his attack espe-

cially for the church members. "Do

you know that, after I had spoken in

this way here in another sermon, an

old deacon, leaving the tabernacle,

scratched his chin whiskers, and

whined: "I wonder what he means!"

And another old deacon answered: 'I

didn't quite understand him; but, of

course, he didn't mean us officials!'

The old sinners! That't it! You're

too proud to admit you're an old sin-

ner:"
Billy let up on the deacons and

turnod to society.
"You're afraid!" he cried. "You're

afraid of what your rotten social gang

will say. You're more afraid of the

sneers and scorn of some old two-

legged devil than you are of the frown

of God Almighty! You'd rather slap

God in the face than slap the face of

some old society dame!"

Next, it was the turn of the scof-

fers. "If they were as low down in

stature as they are in character," he

cried, "they could kiss a rat without

ben d tea tit ear Imams!"

"DoWin from curiosity! Down from

pride! Down from fear of man!" he

cried in conclusion. "I hate a coward,

I especially hate the religious cow-

ard."
Women Hear Plain Words.

In sensational and violent terms,

Billy Sunday launched his indictment

• of crimes against maternity to 43,000

women at the tabernacle. At times

the discourse became so brutally frank

that the audienced winced as if under

a lash, but on the whole the most

emotional appeals and the most in-

tense brought forth only laughter and

applause. There were but 256 trail-

hitters out of those 43,000-107 in the

afternoon and 149 in the evening—and

the casual and perfunctory way in

which the handshaking was accom-

plished indicated that the sermon had

failed to have its desired effect—in

that respect.
The tabernacle was packed to its

utmost limits, crowds even standing in

the open doors on the outside. Two

large overflow meetings were held in

the afternoon. Miss Saxe addressing

1,000 women in the lunchroom and Ma

Sunday making a stump speech from

a box on the outside to 3,000 more.

At 11 o'clock in the morning the build-

ing was three-quarters filled, and by

12 o'clock it was packed to suffoca-

tion.

SUNDAY SAYINGS

The man who prays "Thy kingdom

come" and then votes for the whiskey

gang is so low down the devil is dis-

gusted with him.

The tango is the rottenest thing

that ever wiggled its filthy carcass

from the pits of hell.

The host time is always NOW.

Fortunes in Farthings.

It is well known that shopkeepers
make pounds by ignoring farthings, ox
by giving something for them that
is worth far less than a farthing; but
where shopkeepers make the pound.s,
banks and the English government
make their hundreds of pounds, ac-
cording to a writer in Pearson's. If a
farthing is due from you in taxes, you
are charged id. On the other hand,
you are never paid id for a farthing.
The same principle is applied to

fractions of pounds. Banks in reck-
oning interest for themselves call any
part of £1 a full pound, whereas in
reckoning interest for you odd shil-
lings are left out of account. Thus
for a deposit of £99 9s lid you would
receive interest on £99 only.

It is amazing how the state profits
by not paying fractions of pence.
The government has a special fund

in which are placed the fractions of
pence withheld in paying dividends on
government stock. This fund amount-
ed to more than £150,000 in ten years

before being used for other purposes.

As far as the government is con-

cerned, farthings mean a lot.

Industrial Education.

In England, as well as in this coun-
try, manufacturers are taking a lively
interest in industrial education. A
scholarship and an exhibition have
been founded at the University of
Leeds for the purpose of giving the
holders a training such as will enable
them to assist in the development of
the industry. A sum of about $22,500
has been placed in trust for the pur-
pose by two Whitehaven manufac-
turers engaged in the leather and coal
industries, and this will provide a
scholarship of the annual value of
$450.

SIMPLE, HARMLESS. EFFECTIVE

Pure Charcoal Tablets, for Dysp ?psis,

Acid Stomach, Heartburn and Constipa.

tion. 10c and 25c—at McKellip's.

Ad,•ertIsement

BRITISH MUSEUM GETS GEMS

Sir Arthur Herbert Church Bequeathed

Rare and Valuable Collection to

Famous Institution.

For many years the late Sir Arthur

Herbert Church devoted himself to

collecting precious stones, with the re-

sult that when he died he had one of

the finest collections in Great Britain.

Whatever speculation may have arisen

as to what would become of the col-

lection has been finally laid to rest by

the announcement that it has just been

given to the British museum. Sir Ar-

thur was long the president of the

Mineralogical society and in his ex-

ploration work discovered several new

minerals. The collection consists of

more than 200 stones, mostly mounted
in rings, and every specimen unique.
Sir Arthur devoted his attention par-

ticularly to the products of Ceylon and

for many years was able to secure the

pick of the rarer species of gems that

came to light there. To the mineralo-

gist the pride of the collection is a

magnificent aurora-red specimen of

spessartite, a variety of garnet that

seldom provides stones large and clear

enough for jewelry purposes. Weigh-

ing over six karats and beautifully cut

in the modern fashion, the stone stands

practically alone in the literature of

gems. In addition the collection in-
cludes the most varied series of zir-

cons in existence, and there are also

excellent assortments of tourmalines,

topazes, emeralds, opals and spinets.

The opals include two fine stones of
jet black color.

LAKE TAHOE ONCE HIGHER

Some Ancient Volcano Became Active
and Great Rocky Block Sank and

Formed Pool Bed.

The statement sometimes made that
"Tahoe is an old volcanic crater" is
not true, according to report of the
government geological survey. The

region about the lake shows evidences

of volcanic activity of various kinds,
and the lake waters themselves have
probably been dammed at times by
outpourings of lava. A lava flow ap-

pears to have temporarily filled the

outlet channel below Tahoe City. The

lake, however, lies in a structural de-

pression—a dropped block cf the

earth's crust. During the Neocene

epoch and the earlier part of the
Pleistocene epoch the waters of Lake

Tahoe stood much higher than now,

probably on account of lava dams

which have since been cut through.

Distinct beaches that mark former

higher levels are found up to about

one hundred feet above the present

lake, but it is believed that the waters
formerly rose to still greater heights.

At Tahoe City the most distinct of
these old beaches is a terrace thirty-
five to forty feet above the level of
the lake, and it is this terrace that

makes the level ground on which Ta-
hoe tavern is built.

Why Some Folks Swear.

French speech is full of secularized

oaths like "Parbleu!" and the English

of oaths like "By gum!" and "By gin-

ger!" Did not Socrates swear "By the

dog?"
Obviously swearing of this kind is

in the nature of a gesture rather than

of an oath, the New York Evening

Telegram observes.
It is an attempt to elevate prose

above dullness, to keep language from
falling asleep.

Swearing springs from a desire to

give to speech some of the qualities
of action. Soldiers resort to it, one
may fancy, as the language of energy.
Perhaps both soldiers and civilians

swear less than they used to—in
mixed company at least—but others
still remain a kind of technical lan-
guage in times of stress.



t4, •••

A EtE,
INDEED

A Happening at Quince

Harbor

By CLARISSA MACKIE

eur

In Quince Harbor village every man
is a fisherman. We, the Inhabitants.
have been brought up as one people,
and when anything happens here we
all have to hear about it. Perhaps if
there were newspapers published every
day for us to read about what is going
on in the big world we would be less
Interested in each other's affairs.
Captain Barnabas Fish—every man

who owns a boat, be it motorboat or
tug, is called captain—has the principal
sense of humor among us, and when
there is nothing to do and the fisher-
men, their wives and daughters get
together, dependent on one another for
amusement, we usually rely on the
captain to help us out.
One evening just before supper a

lot of us were at Captain Fish's when
some one said that nothing had been
going on in the village lately and t
would be a relief even if there'd be a
fire or something to wake us up.
Captain Barnabas Fish slowly filled

his pipe and packed the tobacco tight-
ly in the bowl with one huge thumb.
His weather beaten countenance was

always a barometer of his mental con-
dition, and now, as I watched his blue
eyes twinkling merrily, while his gen-
erous mouth endeavored to keep itself
straight and In proper order, I scented
Interesting happenings in Quince Har-
bor village.
Mrs. Fish was sewing rags for a car-

pet which she said was much needed
In the spare bedroom, which I as pay-
ing guest was occupying after my cus-
tom, and I was sitting idly enjoying
the lovely panorama of the viltage
snuggling among the hills that sae
down to the harbor, which was ball
embraced by lines of sandy bluffs.
Capta41 Barnabas emitted a throaty

chuckle Maria Fish glanced at him
sharply, t,nd 1 Inclined my beat ear in
his direction.
"For the laud soli's. Barnabas Fish,

what's the matte:-Y' ejaculated Maria
at last. "You'se been actin' all morn-
In as if you was chuck full of some-
thin' funny and was dyin' to tell it
out. Did anything happen at the en-
gine company's meetin' last night?"
Captain Barnabas scratched a match.

lighted his pipe and puffed slowly foi
several moments.
"It was something I heard at the

meeting." he admitted; "something that
happened to Ananias Sline."
"Why is it." I asked. with interest.

"that wherever Ananias Sline is things
begin to happen right away?"
"Because he's so deceitful and cat-

footed that he's always making trou-
ble for somebody." was Maria's prompt
answer.
"Likewise amusement." added Cap-

tain Barnabas. "It seems this happen-
ed last week while we was over to
camp meeting at Rockybrook. so we
missed it. I was in the bank the very
next morning, and as I came out Anan-
ias was polishing the front windows.
I thought he looked mighty sour, and.
says I in kind of a joking way. 'What
you been up to now, Ananias?' And
he turned on me like a spiteful little
cat, and, says he, 'None of your gol-
darned business!' So I shifted my
helm and steered clear of him, but I
knew something had happened to up-
set him. That night he came to me
for help, but he was close mouthed
about his trouble.
"Last night at the engine house

when the meeting was over some ot
'elm got to telling stories about tires.
and all to once they fell to letting tit to
kill over the fire that started in be
whides Rowell's house the night we
WR4 over to Rockybrook camp meet-
ing So me, not being there and no
knowing about it, tte eliti,f told me the
story. and it explains why Ananias is
so glum just now anti -Thy be looks os
all the world as his enemy.
"To begin. it seems that the wtdder

has staving with her a woma u can
vasser from Little River. he name
being Phoebe Pringle, and tot looks
she's quite a trim sailing little craft—
not so tubby as the widder—with a
tongue as sharp as her shoulder blades
and little blaek eyes that snap you up
sharp."
"She came here." interrupted Maria.

threading her needle. "Miss Telham.
you remember that impudent little
gossip that tried to sell me a cookery
book—me who osan cook all around
anybody who ever wrote a cookery
book!"
I remembered the episode of the can-

vasser, and I had enjoyed her battle
of wits with Maria Fish, who justly
prided herself on her culinary tri-
umphs.
"Well, it seems Ananias met this

Miss Pringle three times a day at the
widder's hospitable board, as they say
In story books," went on the genial
captain. "and. her being kind of fas-
cinating. as well as some younger
than the widder. who considers her-
self engaged to Ananias. I s'pose you
know, ma'am. and the Pringle woman.
being fascinating"—
"Humph!" sniffed Maria scornfully.

"Tellow as saffron!"
yellow was becoming with

her black eyes," said the captain sol-
ernnly. "and her being fascinating., to
Ananias, he got to paying her teeny
little attentions, like passing the but-
ler without her asking for it and help.

lig her to pudding sauce three times
and forgetting all about the widder
Howell, who didn't get any.
"Then, the widder watching them

like cat and mouse, it seems Ananias
took to writing poetry to Miss Phoebe
and leaving it around where she'd be
likely to find it. One day he made a
poem and dropped it in one of her rub-
ber overshoes in the hall rack. and Miss
Phoebe wore that poem underfoot all
one rainy day before she found it, all
damp and muddy. Another time he
dropped a poem in her umbrella. that
being handy, too, in the front hall. and
when she opened it in front of the
postoffice some silly girls got hold of it
when it dropped out, and Miss Phoebe
had to pretend she didn't know where
it came from.
"I guess Miss Phoebe as well as An-

anias was having a hard time, both of
'em being under the widder's eagle eye.
But it WaS worse for Ananias, for he
had to keep two jealous females apart
and"—
"I told you he was double dealing

and cat footed." ;nterrupted Maria.
"Well, to make my story short, it

seems that the night of the tire the
widder Rowell had been burning some
rubbish in her kitchen stove and when
she went to bed there were some rags
smoldering there. In some way the
flue was stopped up—swallers' nests in
the chimney, I guess—and along about
midnight the house was filled full of

. smoke.
"The whirler screeched 'Fire!' and ran

out into the road in a• blue flannel
nightgown, and Miss Phoebe screamed
herself hoarse as she stood beside her,
she wearing a Oink flannel—ahem!"
said the captain hurriedly, in response
to a warning glance from his wife's
eye.

"I don't see why them details are
necessary," chided Maria severely.
The captain scratched his chin

thoughtfully.
"Seems funnier to think of the two

of 'em, one in blue and Cother in pink
—well, Maria. I'm going on with the
story.
"Seems Ananias had been out to a

lodge meeting and he was just getting
home when it happened, and he found
them hollering tire. Cap'n Charlie Wil-
lis had already telephoned to the en-
gine house, and. there was nothing for
Ananias to do but try to save some of
the valuables.
"It was an exciting scene, Cap'n

Charlie says. The widder was hol-
lering for Ananias to go in and save
her pocketbook and her gold watch
from under her pillow. and Miss Phoe-
be was screeching at him if he loved
her to go and do the same kindness
for. her.
"So Ananias. being brave in some

ways, tied a handkerchief over his
mouth and sailed into the house. He
had to grope his way around upstairs
to find their pillows with the treas-
ures under them and not trying to save
anything of his own he staggered
downstairs again and gave the widder
a bundle tied in a handkerchief and
another one just like it to Miss Phoebe.
Then, being a little man and not much
stamina to him, he just fainted away
from swallowing too much smoke.
Just then the lire company arrived,
towing the engine, and by the time
they'd flooded the wielder's (lining room
and kitchen they discovered that the
fire was in the stove and nowhere else,
but the smoke Was all over the house.
"Cap'n Charlie says that them three

was the maddest people he ever saw.
Both the wimmen being caught disha-
billy, as Miss Pringle said, was bad
enough. but it seems that Ananias had
mixed up the bundles under their pil-
lows, and while the , wielder had Miss
Phoebe's watch and pocketbook and it
small cargo of Ananias' poems to her
(one of them was called, 'To my Phoe-
be Bird,") why Miss Phoebe had the
widder's watch and money and a pack-
age of Ananias' love letters tied with a
blue ribbon—Maria, do you sleep with
my love letters tied with a blue ribbon
under your pillow?" demanded the cap-
tain, turning to his good wife.
"Do go on. Barnabas. We're dying

to hear the rest of it," urged Maria.
"Well, the rest of it was a terrible

wrangle between the wielder and Miss
Phoebe Pringle when the two ladies
exchanged private and personal prop-
erty and private and personal opinions
of each other, and their opinions
wasn't flattering, neither. As for Ana-
nias, when he found out what had
"nappened he give himself up for lost,
and naturally he come to me to weath-
er the gale. Miss Phoebe went hot
foot back to Little River. while the
widder's been busy cleaning up her
house."
"And where's Ananias been keeping

himself all this time?" asked Maria
suspiciously.
Captain Barnabas removed his pipe

from his lips and pointed out to the
bay where his ship, the Indus, lay at
anchor, enjoying an idle old age in her
home port.
"Ananias shipped aboard the Indus

the very next day, and if you look you
will see his little dory bobbing out to-
ward her now. I reckon he's got his
victuals in a basket, and he cooks for
himself, and he'll have a quiet, peace-
ful time till the wielder Rowell for-
gives him and sends for him to come
back again."
"How about Miss Phoebe Pringle and

her blighted affections?" I asked curi-
ous,lyo.
"Homely as a scrag fence:" inter-

polated Maria.
"Miss Phoebe—why. shk took her

blighted affections back to Little River,
and she's having the poems that Ana-
nias wrote to her all printed in the
Little River Echo with her own nami,
Signed to 'ern. and Ananias is bitter
against her, but he don't dare say a
word."
"That's the punishment of the deceit-

ful and the cat-footed," said Maria as
she arose to prepare supper.

Classified Advertisements,
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J. S. MYERS, J. E. MYERS
Westminster, Md. New Windsor, Md,

Drs. Myers,
SURGEON DENTISTS,

Are prepared to do All Kinds of
Dental Work, including
ALUMINUM PLATES.

DR. J. W. HELM,
SURGEON DENTIST,

New Windsor - - Maryland.

Will be in Taneytown 1st Wednesday
of each month.
I have other engagements for the 3rd

Saturday and Thursday and Friday, im-
mediately preceding. The rest of the
month at my office in New Windsor.

Nitrous Oxide Gas administered.
Graduate of Maryland Universty, Balti-

more, Md.
C.& P. Telephone. 5-1-10
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Subscribe for theTECORD

Prince Albert will
show you the real
road to smoke-joy!

Copyright 1916 by
R. J. Reynolds Tobacco Co.

IDRINCE ALBERT was made to create tobacco
I content where it never existed before! It per-
mits men to smoke all they want without getting
a sore tongue, without any comeback but real
tobacco enjoyment! 'The patented process by which
Prince Albert is made (and controlled exclusively
by us) fixes that—and cuts out bite and parch!

ORINGE ALBERT
the national joy smoke

comes right to your taste fair and square And it
will do for you what it has done for thousands of
men—make pipe smoking the cheerfulest of your
pleasures!

Prince Albert is to be had
everywhere tobacco is sold in
toppy red bags, 5c; tidy red
tins, 10c; handsome pound
and half-pound tin humidors
—and—in that classy pound
crystal-glass humidor with
sponge-moistener top that
keeps the tobacco in such
fine shape—always !

What we tell you about Prince
Albert is a fact that will prove out
to your satisfaction just as quickly
as you lay in a stock and fire-up!

R. J. REYNOLDS TOBACCO CO., Winston-Salem, N. C.
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On the reverse side of this tidy red its you
will read: “Process Patented July 30tb.
1907," which has made three men smoke
pipes where one smoked before!
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READY FOR SPRING
We have for your inspection the largest assortment of
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Men's, Women's and Children's Shoes
we have ever carried. Come in and look them over
before buying.
We have special good values in Ladies' Shoes, at S2.00. Also

great values in Boys' and Girls' School Shoes.
We are agents for the Best Line of Men's Heavy Work Shoes

On the market, from $1.50 to $3.25 per pair.

Everything that is new and up-to-date will be found here.

Remember we are headquarters for
NECKWEAR, COLLARS, SHIRTS, UNDERWEAR,

HOSIERY AND GLOVES.

WM. C. DEVILBISS,
22 W. Main Street, WESTMINSTER, MD.
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Why bear those pains?
A single bottle will

convince you

Sloan's
Liniment
Arrests Inflammation.
Prevents severe compli-
cations, Just put a few
drops on the painful
spot and the pain dis-
appears.

11101)1C1010 ill01011MIOCIVE131010fili

sLOAN'S
LINIMENT

KILLS PAIN
.2447.7z—

No. 4912 EQUITY.

joT
DowN In the .Cttit.oeigiitsGa'o ict,rot frotr iCna7.foillilitCyounfY,

That we do the very
best line of Commercial
Printing and at reasonable
prices. Give us your next
order and let us prove our
assertion.
Bear in mind, we want

your business, and we pro-
pose making ourselves de-
serving. Are you with us?

THANK YOU

EX-PARTE.
In the matter of the Trust Estate of Edgar A.

Slagle,
Edward 0. Weant, Trustee.

ORDERP,D this 111th day of March, in the year
nineteen hundred and sixteen, on the aforego-
ing petition and affidavit, that the circuit
Court for Carroll County, sitting as a court of
Equity, take Jurisdiction in the trust estate of
the said Edgar A. Slagle and that said trustee
settle said trust estate under the supervision
and control of the said Circuit Court for Carroll
County, sitting in Equity.
And it is further ordered that the said Ed-

ward 0. 'W eant, the Trustee in the above cause
named, give the usual notice to the creditors
of the said Edgar A. Slagle, who were such
prior to the 14th day of March, A. D. 1916, to
file their claims properly authenticatA with
the Clerk of the Circuit Court for Carroll Coun-
ty, on or before the 22nd day of May, A. P.
1918, by causing a copy of this order to be pub-
lished in some newspaper in Carroll County,
once a week for four successive weeks before
the 17th day of April, A. 1). 1916.

WM, H. THOMAS.
True Copy Test:

E DWAR D 0. CASH,
Clerk of the Circuit Court for
Carroll County,3-17,51

Drive It Into the Barn
AS we told you, a Low Cloverleaf gives the

manure a double beating. It also spreads
manure eight feet wide or better. But the
wonderful thing is that it does this from a box
only 45 inches wide. The spreader itself is
so narrow that it can be driven into any modern barn
and loaded from the gutters. Only one handling of
the manure for the quickest, best job of spreading
you ever did. How does that sound to you?

If you have even begun to think about buying a
spreader, see this Low Cloverleaf. You will say you
never saw a better manure spreader. It won't take
long to look it over. Your dealer has one set up for
you to see.

International Harvester Company of America
(Incorporated)

Low Cloverleaf spreaders are sold 11,-

L. R. VALENTINE, - - Taneytown, Md.
J. T. LEMMON, Harney, Md.
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Advertise
for it in

these columns
So the People
Nay Know

that you arc-. in busi-
ness, come in and let us
show what we can do
for you in the way of
attractive cards and
letter heads. Good print-
ing of all kinds is our
specialty and if we can-
not satisfy you we don't
want your business.

That's Fair,
isn't It?

thzr Hobby
is Good
Printirtg

OiCt1.1111E6•311•111

Ask to see
samples of
our busi-
nesscards.
visiting
cards,
wed ding

and other invitations, pam-
phlets folders, letter heads,
statements, shipping tags,
envelopes, etc., constantly
carried in stock for your
accomniodation.

Get our figures on that
printing you have been
thinking of

New Type, Latest
Style Faces



A BUY-AT-HOME INVITATION
FROM TANEYTOWN BUSINESS MEN.

For BEST VALUES and BIG VARIETY
—IN

Dry Goods, Shoes, Clothing, Notions,

Carpets,

and EVERYTHING IN GENERAL MERCHANDISE

-- Visit - -

HESSON'S Department Store

Now is the time to make your Selection of
Dishes, while Line is Complete, both
in Open Stock or Sets; also Toilet

Sets, Cutlery, Cooking
Utensils, Etc.

Special Prices This Month!

S. C. OTT.

The Spring Season is here. Call to see us
relative to

FERTILIZERS
which we have on hand. Clover Seed, and Feed of
all kinds for immediate delivery.

THE REINDOLLAR COMPANY,
TANEYTOWN, MD.

- JOHN *IMP BENTON BIDING

McKellip's Drug Store,
(Established in 1853)

Everything usually found in this

line, may be obtained, as well as

our own Special Preparations.

Agents for Wetherell's Celebrated
ATLAS PAINT.

See our Line of Goods be-

fore going to House-
keeping----at the

right price..

Now is the time to get

House Cleaning Articles

°ALLY'S 1 to 25e STORE.

Cemetery Work.
I only ask that the confi-

dence of the people, which I

have enjoyed for the past 35

years, be continued.

B. 0. SLONAKER,
Marble or Granite.
TANEYTOWN.

BUY AT HOME
WHEN YOU WANT

Fresh and Smoked Meats
WE GIVE

A "Square Deal"
to Everybody.

D. B. SHAUM'S
MEAT MARKET.

Latest Styles Lowest Prices

KOONS BROS.
Department Store,

TANEYTOINN, Md.

Dry Goods, Clothing,
Shoes, Notions, Fur-

nishings, Floor
Covering, &c

FASHIONABLE MILLINERY

Spices. Extracts.

ROBT. S. McKINNEY,
DRUGGIST.

Taneytown, Md.

Drugs and Medicines and other
things. Don't make the mistake of
coming only for what you can not
get elsewhere. Come for all you
need. Should we happen not to
have it, then look elsewhere.
CIGARS. KODAKS.

Taneytown Grain & Supply Co.,
DEALERS IN --

Grain, Flour Feed, Hay, Straw, Lumber

Coal, Salt, Fertilizers, Cement,

Brick, Slate, Etc.
P. S.—We are agents for Palmer's Hydrated Lime.

When limeing, why not use the best.
Palmer's is sure to please. Try it and be
convinced.

0
 NE OF THE most persistent advertisers in the history of

success was ROBINSON CRESOE. He knew what he

wanted—a ship—and he put up an "ad" for one. He

tied a shirt on the end of a pole, stuck the pole in the

ground on the highest point of his island—and his "ad''

flapped in the ocean breeze. That, in the language of the sea

—was very plain to every seafaring man. Despite the fact

that he got no inquiries for a long time—R. C. kept at it.

In the end, he got what he wanted, was happy, and his name

and fame are with us today. We've put up our signal—and

Intend to keep it flung to your gaze. Shall we call, o
r will

you send, or call? You'll get the best any way y, ai do it, so

DO IT NOW!

A. G. RIFFLE, The Groceryman.

Our Challenge Buggy

$31.80
Direct from Factory to Your Station.

Fine Assortment of Vehicles

in Stock.

Will take a few Old Buggies in Exchange.

CHAS. E. H. SHRINER & SON.

What Paint Should You Buy?
So far as this locality and climate are concerned,

the best wearing paint, beyond a doubt, is Masury's.
No question about that. We can show you houses
where it has lasted twice as long as other paints close
by.

Masury paint gives you the "Square Deal." Pure
pigment and pure Linseed Oil. No fish oil in Masury's.
No adulteration of any kind, Let us estimate on your
house.

JOHN S. BOWER,
General hardware, Paints and Oil.

TANEYTOWN, MD.

ERNEST W. ANGELL
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND.

DEALER IN

Stoves and Ranges.
Call and see my line before buying elsewhere.

I CAN SAVE YOU MONEY.
— I ALSO DO 

Roofing and Spouting at reasonable Prices.

"And A Little Child Shall Lead Them."

ARE values in our community shrinking? Is our neighboring town getting

ahead faster than ours? Are we making a poor bargain? Have we

cause to wish we had done differently? Then this old familiar picture (one of the

best known in the world) may start us thinking on the right track. Home
 values are bound

to shrink, if our policy of trading is wrong. We only need to borro
w the wisdom of a

child to appreciate the value of trading at home. Patronize the Home Merchant.

Furniture of Merit

Furniture of Service.
Not how cheap—but rather how good.

If you need Furniture—Give us a call.

We carry only goods that we can guarantee.

CHAS. 0. FUSS & SON,
Furniture Dealers and Undertakers.

Start a Savings Account With Us.
You will receive just as courteous at-

tention with a Dollar Deposit as
you would with a Hundred

Dollar One.

START TODAY.

THE TANEYTOWN SAVINGS BANK.

JAS. H. REINDOLLAR, JOHN L. LEISTER.

REINDOLLAR & LEISTER
NEW GARAGE.

We sell Maxell and Oakland Cars.

REPAIRING PROMPTLY DONE.

HOME-MADE BUGGIES.
Automobile Accessories for Sale.

MILK!

Does Dairying Pay?

Sell your milk to the Taneytown

Condensery and find out.

H. M. STOKES,
Treasurer & Manager.

H. A. ALLISON. J. B. ELLIOT.

ALLISON & ELLIOT,
Heating and Plumbing Contractors.

Piping of all kinds always on hand. Large stock
of Stoves and Ranges to select from. Gaso-

line Engines, Wind Mills, Hand and Pow-
er Pumps, Roofing and Spouting.

NOTICE. We are the Agents for the great Empire
• Pipeleas Furnace. Call and see us.

E. A. NEWCOMER
DEALER IN MEATS

Staple and Green Groceries
I thank my friends for their patronage

and good will during the past year, and
am in a position to give them the best
goods at the best prices in the future.
Will endeavor to please and accommo-
date all, and will frequently have new
things to oiler. Yours to Please,

E. A. NEWCOMER.
Phone 27-J.

Ornamental and
Iron Fences

of all kinds.

"MONARCH" FENCE
sold so low that you can afford
to buy it. Farm and Yard Gates
of all kinds.

W. E. BURKE, Agent.

Help Yourself By Helping Your Neighbor.

SPECIAL FOR ONE MONTH

Galvanized Brooder Coop. $1.42.

BUY AT HOME!

When tempted to believe that you can

get more value for your money AWAY

from home—tell us about it. Give us a

chance to tell just how much WE can offer,

and see how reasonable we are about it.

Our Buying Machinery is Well Oiled
and in first-class condition. We buy right
—and give YOU the benefit.

Help Us Along!

REINDOLAR BROS. & CO.

PATRONIZE THE

PLACE Of AMUSEMENT !
Something Doing Every Evening.

Moving Pictures,
Bowling, Billiards.

Clean Amusement at Popular
Prices.

H. C. BOYER, Proprietor.
TANEYTOWN.

FARMERS' PRODUCE CO.
"Still Here"

Not going out of Business, as reported.

Buying and paying more fo;
Eggs, Poultry, Calves,

and General Produce

than ever. Near the railroad, op-
posite The Reindollar Co. Ware-
house, Baltimore St., Taneytown,
Md. C. & P. Phone 3-J.

C. BRENDLE,
MANAGER.

Full Line I. H. C. Goods.
General Agent for Brown Wagons and Corn Plows.

General Agent for the Celebrated Wiard Plows.

Agent for Bucher & Gibbons Rollers and Harrows.
General Agent for the Sharpies Cream

Separator, the only suction feed Sep-
arator on the market.

Buggies and Harness a Specialty.

FRANKLIN BOVVERSOX.

E. E. REINDOLLAR, President. GEO. H. BIRNIE, Cashier.

J. J. WEAVER, JR , Vice-President. G. W. WILT, Asst. Cashier.

THE BIRNIE TRUST COMPANY,
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND.

Capital, - - - $40,000.
Surplus, - 42,000.

Open an Account with us.

WE ACT AS EXECUTOR, TRUSTEE OR GUARDIAN.

FOR QUALITY AND SERVICE
  VISIT 

THE, TANEYTOWN GARAGE CO.,
THE FORD,

DODGE BROS.,
AND OVERLAND CARS.

A FULL LINE OF SUPPIES IN STOCK.



TANEYTOWN LOCAL COLUMN,
Brief Items of Local News of Special

Interest to Our Home Readers.

Johnathan Allison, one of our oldest
citizens, is critically ill at this time with
pneumonia,

Miss Nannie Diffendal, who is at Fred-
erick Hospital, is getting along fine and
will soon be at home.

Rev. Paul D. Yoder, wife and children,
of Union Bridge, were guests of M. A.
Koons and wife, this week.

Homer Hill and Mrs. Luther Hilter-
brick are visiting their father, Judson
Hill, who still continues to be ill.

Misses Martha and Sarah Anders vis-
ited their sister, Mrs. Samuel Aulthouse
and family, at Littlestown, on Sunday.

Miss Pauline Brining spent from Wed-
nesday until Friday with her home folks,
returning to the care of her patient, at
Harrisburg.

Mrs. T. A. Martin, near town, broke
her right arm, one night last week, by
accidentally falling in her room, against
the corner of a bureau.

Mrs. John H. Myers, of George St.,
received a fall, last Saturday morning,
while walking in the garden back of her
home, and broke her left wrist.

Miss Beulah Engler spent the past week
at home, a vacation coming unexpectedly
in the middle of a term, which will have
to be made up at the close of the school
year in June.

Jacob Buffington paid Taneytown a
visit this week. He likes McSherrystown,
and says when they get things fixed in
good shape, they will all like their new
home much better.

The bad tempered Winter kept up its
reputation last Saturday, by presenting
us with about 8 inches of snow that no-
body welcomed. On account of it, the
Bowersox sale was postponed until this
Saturday, 15th.

The union meetings, which have been
well attended for two weeks, will close on
Sunday night, with short addresses by
all four pastors. Rev. Guy P. Bready
will preach tonight (Friday) and Rev.
W. J. Marks on Saturday night.

Rev. James Cattanach will be installed
as pastor of the Govans Presbyterian
church. this Friday evening. These min-
isters will have part in the services: Rev.
H. A. Grupps, Rev. Edward H. Kistler,
Rev. J. B. Campbell, Rev. J. C. Con-
ning and Rev. W. A. Shaw.

Burgess S. Miller, who has kept a
weather record for many years, reports
that on April 14, 1888 there was a hail
storm and rain and very cold; April 6,
1889, a big snow and cold; April 10,
1894 rain and big snow, and on the 11th.,
snowed all day; April 16 and 17, 1905,
snow storms and very cold.

This office received a shipment of paper,
this week, such as is used for the REcorm,
that cost just $88.50 more than the same
quantity cost two months ago. Without
some increase in revenue from the
RECORD itself, this means a clear loss of
the amount named. The same shipment,
if the order was placed now, would cost
us just $88.50 more, or an advance of
3 cents per pound.

A largely signed petition was circulated,
this week, favoring the building of a pike
from Taneytown to the Pennsylvania line
on the Taneytown and Littlestown road,
which would be a continuation of the
Taneytown-Keymar road, connecting up
Frederick with Hanover and York, Pa.
The length of the road is about six miles.
As there is a macadamized road part of
the way from Littlestown toward the
Maryland line, the completion of the
Pennsylvania end of the road would be a
small matter.

The Westminster limes says: "The
time of making garden is near at hand
and it is also time to pen up the chick-
ens. There is perhaps, nothing that
causes as much hard feelings in a locality
as for chickens to wander on a neighbor's
premises and garden. Some say they do
not do any harm. That makes no differ-
ence, your neighbor does not want to be
annoyed with your chickens and you
should not cause trouble by allowing your
fowl to run at large. A hen that will
not stay in the enclosuae will usually
make a fine Sunday dinner."
George W. storm, of New York; Mr.

and Mrs. P. A. Gable, Mr. and and Mrs.
J. H. Gable and daughter, Agnes, and
John Storm, of Columbia, Pa.; Mrs.
Emma and David Clingan, of Kingsdale,
Pa.; Mr. and Mrs. U. H. Bowers and
children, of Taneytewn ;Mrs. Mary Beck-
er and Emma Hoffman, of Gettysburg;
Mr. and Mrs. George Walters, of Littles-
town, all spent Monday with Jerome and
Joseph Storm, and had a family picture
taken, the first time all were together in

25 years; and attended the funeral of

Miss Annie Storm.

A Good Family Cough Syrup

Can be made by mixing Pine-Tar, Acon-
ite, Sugar, Hyoscyamus, Sassafras, Pep-
permint, Ipecac, Rhubarb, Mandrake,
Capiscum Muriate Ammonia, Honey and
Glycerine. It is pleasant, healing and
soothing, raises the phlegm, and gives
almost instant relief. For convenience
of those who prefer not to fuss, it is sup-
plied ready made in 25c. bottles under
name of Dr. Bell's Pine-Tar-Honey. Can
be had at your druggist. Insist on get-
ting Dr. Bell's Pine-Tar-Honey and see
that the formula is on the package.
edvertisement.

. CHURCH NOTICES.

Woodbine charge, Lutheran—Messiah
church: Sunday School, 9.45 a. m.;
preaching, 10.45 a. m.
Calvary church—Sunday School, 9.30

a. m.; preaching, 7.30 p. m.
G. W. BAI GIIMAN, Pastor.

Reformed church, St. Paul's Union
Bridge-9.15 a. m., Sunday School.
Baust church-9.30 a. m., Sunday

School; 10.30 a. m., The Holy Com-
munion; preparatory service,Friday even-
ing, April 14; 7.30 p. m., Young People's
Society, subject: "Efficient Prayer."
Leader, Mrs. Chas. S. Graham.

Special services at Union Bridge,
Thursday evening, April 20, subject:
"The Sin Against the Holy Ghost." Fri-
day evening, April 21, the preparatory
service.

Special services at Ladiesburg, Tuesday
evening, April 18, subject, "The Sin
Against the Holy Ghost." Wednesday
evening, April 19, the preparatory serv-
ice. PAUL D. YODER, Pastor.

Communion service at Winters, at 10
a. m., Sunday. A congregational meet-
ing will be held at Winters church, Sat-
urday, April 22, at 2 p. m. Regular
service at Mt. Union, at 2.30 p. m., Sun-
day. A congregational meeting at Baust,
Good Friday, April 21, at 2 p. m. Con-
gregational meeting, at Mt. Union Easter
Monday, April 24, at 2 p. m. Services
every evening during Holy Week, at 7.30
p. m., at Uniontown.

W. E. SALTZGIVER, Pastor.

Presbyterian, Town-9 a. m., Bible
School; 10 a. m., Worship with sermon.
Theme: "Afterward." 7.30 p. m., C. E.
Meeting.
Piney Creek-2 p. m., Worship with

sermon. Subject: "Looking Ourselves in
the Face." Bible School, at 1 o'clock.
You will always find a welcome at any of
these services.

Reformed Church, Taneytown—Service
at 10 a. m. No evening service. Sunday
School, at 9 a. in. Holy Week services
every evening during the week, up to
and including Good Friday evening. The
service on Friday will be preparatory to
the Holy Communion on Easter Sunday
morning.

Keysville—Service, at 2.30 p. m.

U. B. Church, Harney—Bible School,
at 9 a. m.; Preaching, at 10 a. m.
Taneytown—Bible School, 1.30 p. m.;

Preaching at 2.30 p. m.; Union Evan-
gelistic services at the Lutheran church,
at 7.30 p. m. W. J. MARKS, Pastor.

In Trinity Lutheran church on Sunday
morning the pastor will preach a sermon
appropriate to Palm Sunday. "Obedient
to Your Lord's Command,' will be the
thought of the message. The evening
service will be the closing service of the
evangelistic series, with short addresses
by the pastors of the four churches. Holy
Week services will be held on Wednesday
and Thursday evenings of next week,with
the Preparatory service on Friday, at 2
p. m. New members will be received in-
to the church at the Friday afternoon
service.

Insomnia.
Indigestion nearly always disturbs the

sleep more or less, and is often the cause
of insomnia. Eat a light supper with
little if any meat, and no milk; also take
one of Chamberlain's Tablets immedi-
ately after supper, and see if you do not
rest much better. Obtainable everywhere.
&dvertisement.

Luxury In Puritan Days.
At no time, of course, was luxury

completely absent from America. Men
spend when the purse is full, even
though the purse be small. Not all the
sumptuary laws of seventeenth cen-
tury Massachusetts could prevent so-
ber Puritans from launching into ex-
travagance. from purchasing apparel—
"wollen, silke or lynnen with lace on
It. silver, guide. silke or threed." Even
the pious slid back into embroidered
donhicts with slashed sleeves into
-gold or silver girdles, hatt bands,
he!ts. ruffs, beaver hatts," while wom-
en of 110 particular rank appeared in
forbidden silk and tiffany hoods. A
century biter we encounter disapproval
of John Hancock's "show of extrava-
gance in living." of his French and
English furniture, his dances, dinners,
carriages, wine cellars and fine clothes.
Washington starved with his soldiers
at Valley Forge. but lived like an Eng-
lish gentleman in his home at Mount
Vernon. Luxury, pomp, ceremonial
were not absent in the eighteenth cen-
tury.—Walter E. Weyl in Harper's
Magazine.

Little Chicks Feather Well
when fed Rein-o-la Chick Feed, which
contains a proper quantity of bone-grit.
Makes chicks strong and sturdy. Builds
bone and muscle. A trial will convince
you. —REINDOLLAR BROS. & Co. 3-31,tf

The unicorn.
Chinese annals of great antiquity

contain numerous detailed accounts ot
the supposedly fabulous unicorn, is
which the descriptions are identica
with those handed down from the ear
liest times in the mythology of occi
dental countries. From this it is in
ferred that at some time in the remote
past there actually did exist a singlE
horned equine or cervine animal oh
some sort.

A Problem.
Oldbatch—What are you trying to

figure out? Longsuffer—A little mathe-
matical puzzle. Some time ago my
wife said she'd be dressed in a minute,
and shortly after my daughter said
She'd be ready immediately. I'm try-
ing to find out which one will come
first—New York Globe.

Anticipating.
"Have you heard, that Biglow's

daughter is going to marry a million.
aire?"
"Yes. Heard it yesterday. Biglow

tried to borrow $10 from me on the
strength of it."—St. Louis Post-Dis-
patch.

Postponed Wisdom.

"It's never too late to learn."

"That's right Sometimes it's an ad-

vantage to go slow and not get a lot

of information you'd have been better

eft without"—Washington Star.

WM. J. HEAPS—FOR CONGRESS.

Dr. William James Heaps, of Balti-
more, has announced his candidacy for
the Republican nomination for Congress
in the Second Congressional District. Mr.
Heaps is a Carroll County boy, and for a
number of years was the principal of the
Winfield Academy. He is one o the
leading educators of the State and as
President of Milton University, Balti-
more, has contributed much to the equip-
ment of many young men for their life
work. Prominent and active in fraternal
work, he is well known not only in Ma-
ryland but nationally has won for himself
a position of influence in many directions.
The writer, in the absence from duty of

his father, who is the editor of the Sen-
tinel, now confined to his bed with a
severe attack of illness, does not. assume
to speak for The Sentinel officially, but
expresses simply his own positive and fix-
ed conviction that Mr. Heaps should be
given the Republican nomination without
a primary contest, and that should there'
be any other contestant for the honor, he
should be given an overwhelming major-
ity in the primary. He bases that opin-
ion on his personal knowledge of the man
and of the circumstances under which
Mr. Heaps accepted his party's nomina-
tion and made such a splendid canvass
and such a magnificent showing in the
election two years ago. It will be remem-
bered that at that time the nomination
"went begging," and that there was no
aspirant for the honor. With little hope
of success, the party managers in the dis-
trict urged Mr. Heaps to lead the almost
forlorn hope. For ten days he consider-
ed the matter, and then against the ad-
vice of many friends, among whom was
the writer, he made the sacrifice of time,
money and strength, and accepted the
nomination.
In view of these facts, it seems to the

writer that it is beyond all question the
duty not only of all Mr. Heaps's personal
friends, but of the leaders of the party in
every section of the district, to stand by
him as loyally at this time as he stood by
the party two years ago. No possible
stronger candidate can be named, and
possessing some elements of strength
which no other possible candidate has, if
the party will give him ardent support
from now until the election in November,
with him as the party standard-bearer,
his rallying cry "Protection, Progress and
Prosperity," William James Heaps will
be the next Congressman from the Sec-
ond District.

WILLIAM L. SEABROOK.
(Political Advertisement.)

LARGE PUBLIC SALE
—OF

100 HEAD
— OF —

Horses, Mules & Colts
— ON —

Thursday,April 20th
At 10 a. m., at the old

Montour House Stables, Westminster, Md.

e
Among this lot of stock will be a num-

ber of good horses and mares, also a few
delivery wagon horses. Lot of heavy
draft horses, suitable for city use. Also
about 15 good livery horses, also a few
family broke horses. Anybody in need
of a horse or mule should not miss this
sale, for we will have any kind of mules,
horses and colts you are looking for, and
the best of it is if you buy one and he
doesn't turn out right, you can bring
him back and get every dollar of your
money back as free as you gave it to us.
So don't fail to come and bring your
friends along. A reasonable credit will
be given.
NOTE TO TIIE FARMERS. —If you or any

of your friends have a horse, mule or
colt to dispose of, we will be glad to sell
them for you. If you have any stock at
all to sell send it in on Thursday morn-
ing, April 20th. We will have more buy-
ers at this sale than we had at our last
sale, for everybody knows they will get a
square deal, both the buyer and the sell-
er. Your charges will be $5 if sold, and
if not sold $1 will be charged. For any
further information call Montour Hotel
and ask for King or McHenry. Don't fail
to bring your stock—we will have plenty
of buyers for it all, if it is 200 bead. Sale
rain or shine. Anybody bringing any
stock can get the cash for it.

KING & MellENRY9.
WESTMINSTER, MD.

J. N. 0. Smith and Edw. Mercer. Auct,=.
W. Frank Thomas, Clerk.

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned will sell at Public Sale,

at his residence 1 mile east of Taneytown,
on

WEDNESDAY, APRIL 19, 1916,
at 1 p. m. sharp, the following personal
property:

2 GOOD BED STEADS
and springs, 1 corner cupboard with glass
front; 6 stands, 4 rockers, 6 cane seat
chairs, lot of odd chairs, 2 tables, 1 sink,
kitchen cupboard, 20 yds. good carpet,
8 yds. linoleum, nearly new; 2 good cook
stoves, one new; 1 coal stove, jars, crocks
and cooking utensils, lot of pictures, lot
of lamps, 6 flat irons, 2 looking glasses,
1 good clock, 2 wash tubs, 2 barrels, 1
graphophone with 60 records, 2 iron hog
troughs, 2 iron kettles and stands, 40
bushels of corn on ears, 2 doz. steel traps,
wheelbarrow, grindstone, lot of Cooper
tools, ladders, cross cut and hand saws,
lot of chicken coops, lot of wood and lum-
ber, and many articles not mentioned.
TERMS CASII.

. JEROME STORM.
J. N. 0. Smith, Auct.
Ed. F. Smith, Clerk.

Death.
Death, the dry pedant, spares nei-

ther the rose nor the thistle, nor does
he forget the solitary blade of grass in
the distant waste. He destroys thor-
oughly and unceasingly. Everywhere
we may see how he crushes to dust
plants and beasts, men and their
work-s. Even the Egyptian pyramids,
that would seem to defy him, are tro-
phies of his power, monuments of de-
cay, graves of primeval kings.—Hein-
rich Heine.

Floral Antiseptic 1 ooth Powder for
cleaning and beautifying the teeth
Makes the teeth white and purifies the
breath. 10c bottle.—Get at McKellip,s
Adrertisemeet,

issue. Real Estate for sale, Two Cents eachword. The name and address of advertisermust be paid for at same rate; two initials, ora date, counted as one word. Cash in ad-
vance,unless other terms are mutually agreedupon. Postage Stamps received as cash.

SPECIAL NOTICES. • ,licostostostoitostostostopostonostow0itonost0atostopostop0p0R0K0KG•t061
-Taneytown's Leading Fashion Store." 

Standard Iunder this heading; at one cent a word, each 0
Genera. Advertisements will be inserted I h. 0

Sewing Machines 0
o

500 RABBITS WANTED, at highest
prices; no small rabbits wanted after
Thursday, the 20th. 50P for delivering
Calves. Highest Price for Spring
Chickens. Squabs 28' pair. Poultry re-
ceived until Thursday of each week.
Hides bought until the 15th.

—SCHWARTZ'S PRODUCE.

HIGHEST CASH Prices paid for Eggs,
Calves and Poultry. 500 for delivering
Calves Tuesday evening or Wednesday
morning.—G. W. Morrell. 6-10-12

POULTRY, CALVES, EGGS, Squabs
and Game, always wanted at Highest
Cash Price; 50c for delivering Calves. —
FARMERS' PRODUCE Co., H. C. Brendle,
Manager. Phone 3-J.

RUBBER AND RAGS are away down
in price. CH AS. SOMMER. 4-14-2t

NOTICE.-1 am now located at the
Water Co.'s Mill vacated by David Sentz
and ready to do all kinds of chopping
and sawing. Your trade will be appre-
ciated. —HARRY MYERS.

FOR SALE.—One Mare, 7 years old,
good driver and worker; 1 good 2-horse
Wagon, 1 Spring Wagon. — WARREN G.
DEVILHISS, Elmerest farrn,near Keysville.

NOTICE.—We are now taking orders
for the very best grade of Deering Twine,
at 10c. Prices guaranteed. You're safe.
So place your order at once with M. R.
SNIDER, Harney, Md.

WANTED.—A good man to work on
farm by the month. Good wages to the
right man. —Cii.is. R. EILER, Mt. Union.

14-2t

FOR SALE—A lot of new White
Chestnut Posts, for wire fence.—Mas.
W. T. BORING, Mayberry.

FOR SALE—Bay mare, 5 years old,
with foal by Belgian horse, a sound, off-
side worker.—JoiiN H. SA CELE, near
Otter Dale school-house. 4-3t

FRESH DURHAM COW, and one
Jersey Bull, fit for service, for sale by
Russw. A. MYERS, near Marker's Mill.

THREE YOUNG Fresh Cows for sale
by HOWARD HYSER, near Taneytown.

FOR SALE—Pratt's Poultry, Horse
and Cattle Powder, Golden Crown Syrup,
Gold Medal and Silver Leaf Flour, Pearl
and Crouse's Hominy, English Breakfast
Grits. I will treat you right—come see
me.—Mas. S. WEANT, Bruceville.

FOR SALE—We have Potatoes for
sale. —1-11C101 A N SNIDER, Taneytown.

NOTICE.—Don't fail to see the 6-reel
Show, Saturday afternoon and evening.
Some good comedies. -HOUSE OF AMUSE-
MENT.

BINDER TWINE.—Deering and Mc-
Cormick Standard Twine at 10c per lb.
Hand in your order now.—J. T. LI:3130os,
Harney, Md.

EGGS FOR HATCHING.—For the
balance of the season, Eggs from all pens
of S. C. R. I. Reds will cost you only 50c
a setting. Let me book your order now,
as the supply is limited.—JonN J. REID,
Taneytown.

NOTICE.—I now occupy the shop own-
ed by Mr. James Schildt and vacated by
Mr. Edward Phillips, and am ready to
do general repairing. Horse shoeing a
specialty, all work will be appreciated
and promptly attended to. Yours for
Business, C. W. MORNINGSTAR. 4-7-3t

FOR SALE.—Bay Mare 4 years old.—
C. F. LeGoite, near Barney. 4-7-2t

FOR SALE.—Pair of heavy Draught
Colts; 3 years old. OSCAR BROWN, near
Motter's school house. 4-7-2t

GOOD CORN CHOP, while it lasts, at
$1.45 per 100 lbs., at REINDOLLAR Baos.
& Co's. 4-7-2t

FOR RENT.—Half of my House on
Cemetery Street. Possession at once.—
D. M. MEHRING. 3-31-3t

POTATOES WANTED. Will buy 200
bushels, at 80c per bushel. Bring sam-
ple in for inspection before delivering.
3-17,tf C. B. ScnwArtrz, Taneytown

FOR SALE.—Registered Holstein Bull
Calves, from 1 to 10 months old, also
Duroc Jersey Pigs. Prices reasonable.—
S. A. ENSOR, New Windsor, Md. 3-10-8t

HOUSES AND BUSINESS pieces for
rent. Some of the best in town.—See
D. W. GARNER, Agent. 3-3-tf

HOGS WANTED weekly, dressed or
alive; good Stock Steers for sale.—J.
ELMER MYERS, Phone 8246 Westminster.

10-22-ft

ANYBODY WITH JUNK to sell, not-
ify me by postal and I will come to buy
it on day of sale or before the sale. Iron
rags, rubber, bones, copper or brass—
anything in the junk line.— CHARLES
SO3IMER, Taneytown. 5-12

WANTED.—Raw Hides and Wool.
S. I. MACELEY, Union Bridge, Md.
Phone 15-J. 6-30

Transfers & Abatements.
Notice is hereby given to all persons in-

terested that the County Commissioners
of Carroll County, will sit for the purpose
of hearing applications for transfers and
abatements at their office in the Court
House, Westminster, Md., as follows:

April 18th., District Nos. 1 and 2
„ 19th., 3 „ 4
„ 20th., „ „ 5 „ 6
„ 25th., „ „ 7 „ 8

11

11 26th., 11 If  10 11 11
„ 27th., „ „ 12, 13 „ 14

The Board will sit from 9 a. m., until
3 p. In., on each of said days, and notice
is hereby given that after the sitting as
aforesaid no transfers or abatements will
be made to affect the levy of 1916.

MARTIN D. HESS,
4-7-2t Clerk and Treasurer.

ECONOMY-IS WEALTH.

Clean your soiled grease spot
clothes with Lum Turn Clothes
Cleaner. Price I5c per bottle, at
McKellip's Drug Store,
Advertisement.

X

st

0sr0
TANEYTOWN, MD.at

Store Closes Monday, Wednesday and Friday, at 6 p. in.g

WE CAN NOW SAY 1:14
o 0

X
g 9 9 0• Ready For Easter 00
0 Stocks Are Vast. Assortments Are Wide. st

St Prices Are Eminently Fair. 0

New Spring Dress Goods 0
0

Ladies' Silk Waists 0

Ladies' Silk Hosiery

21 MEN'S SUITS
English or conservative models of

high grade Worsteds and Cheviots in
X all the newest shades, checks, stripes
O • and plaids. Made with slant or patch
O pockets and soft roll lapels. Vest and
x Trousers of the latest cut. Perfectly
0 tailored and the very best trimming.  
o 
X

We Guarantee a Perfectft Fitting.

O BOYS' SUITS
O • Made of all wool blue serge, brown
IV and grey mixtures, and fancy stripes.
° Knife or box pleated coats with patchSt
o pockets, stitched on or three piece
X' belts. Pants cut full.

ft

X'

X

s:

W. B. Corsets, 50e, $1.00, $1.50

0

Warner's Rust Proof Corsets, $1.00

and $1.50 
0
sr

  ft

Men's Dress Shirts St
It
o MEN'S SPRING FIXINGS We have an extra large assortment oX' The new hats, shirts, soft collars,
NS socks, and other ascessories are here of very pretty Spring styles, at S

o
o in splendid variety. 50c to $3.50 Ill

i
o
S'• The New Spring Pumps for Women

o • These smart, snugly-fitting Pumps are wonderfully attractive. They are
X • in many different patterns.
X
O DRESS SHOES FOR MEN
.11 Walk-Over, Ralston, Tuttle and Roxbury are our specials, and no better
x can be found anywhere.

X

X
o We'd like to sell youX
O YOUR EASTER HATis

at
X

St

X

X

Xo And you'll like buying it here, when you see the lovely Hats we show, and o
/10 the moderate price you pay for a Hat of real elegance.

EASTER MILLINERY

X Baby Caps Children's Hats

Xostoaostoaorostowtostotoroaoroaoseostosmaoaoaoaostoaostostostois
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: HE BIG

:

Bowersox Sale
Had to be postponed, last Saturday, on account o

weather conditions, but will be held

This Saturday, April 15th.
Don't miss this big annual event that has become a

famous day in Taneytown, and to the entire county.

3 Carloads of Buggies
100 Sets New Harness

1 Carload of Wagons
New Agricultural Implements

All of the articles previously advertised on Big Posters

FRANKLIN BOWERSOX,
Taneytown, Md.

• •

w.:117.:u•.•arztnar.

PUBLIC SALE Take a Trip to
The undersigned as executor of Mrs.

Catharine Basehoar, deceased, will sell at
public sale at the .Eckenrode building,
Taneytown, on

Thursday, April 27th., 1916,

at 1 o'clock, sharp, the following de-
scribed personal property:

1 COMPLETE BEDROOM SET,

1 fine buffet, 1 kitchen cabinet, 1 excel-
lent range, 1 double-heater stove, 1 egg
stove, 1 chunk stove and pipe, 1 exten-
sion table, 1 bed, 1 dresser, 1 single bed
and spring, 1 couch, 1 refrigerator good
as new, 1 child's go-cart, chairs of all
kinds, 2 couches, several lots of carpet
and oilcloth, 40 yards good home-made;
3 stands, 1 with marble top; I sink, cup-
board with 4 shelves, 2 fine parlor lamps
and other lamps, 1 ice box complete;
carpet sweeper, 1 oil stove, table, lard
and can, lot of jars, wash bowls and
pitchers, lap robes, lot of Hams and
shoulders, and numerous other articles
not mentioned.
TERMS —SlItTIS of $5.00 and under cash.

On sums over $5.00 a credit of 6 months
will be given on note bearing interest.
No property to be removed until settled
for.

CHAS. H. BASEHOAR,

J. N. 0. Smith, Auct. Executor.
4-14, 2t

BIG AUCTION SALE OF
First-class Nursery Stock

Central Hotel, Taneytown,
Saturday, April 15th,

and at Union Bridge, Md.,
SATURDAY, APRIL 22, 1916

Sales begin at 1 p. m., sharp.
Positively nothing but strictly healthy

trees, true to name, will be offered at
sale. State Health Certificate will be on
hand for public inspection.
Buyers need not accept any trees unless

as above described.
Thousands of Peach, Plum, Apple,

Pear, Apricot and Cherry Trees; also
Grapes, Fay's Prolific Currants, Berries,
Ornamentals, Shade Trees. Bargains are
sure to be had. Be sure to come.

BATTLEFIELD NURSERIES,

C. A. STONER, Prop. Gettysburg, Pa.
J. N. 0. Smith, Auct. 3-24-4t

Emmitsburg
While there, visit Emmitsburg's

Clothing and Furnishing
House, and inspect the large
stock

Fine Clothing for Men who want
to -look well dressed." Suits in
all grades, and at the top the
"Style-plus" $17.00. Latest Styles
shown, and money saved.

C. F. ROTERING.
4-14,2t

Ohio & Kentucky Horses

Will receive an express load of
Horses, and Mules, on Friday, April
21st., 1916. Call and see them.

H. W. PARR,
HANOVER, PA.

Taneytown Grain and Hay Market.

Corrected weekly, on day of publication.
Prices paid by The Reindollar co

Wheat    1.12®1.12
Corn   70(470
Rye 75®75
Oats 45(4)45
Timothy Hay, 16.00®16.00
Mixed Hay 12.00®14.019
Bundle Rye Straw  8.00®$.00

Baltimore Markets.
Corrected Weekly

Wheat  1.18@1.19
Corn
Oats   46®49
Rye 95®98
Hay, Timothy 21.00®22.00

.?Hay, Mixed _ 19.00®20.0$
Hay, Clover__ ...........  16.00®17.0I
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