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FROM THE COUNTY AND STATE.

Brief Items of 6eneral Interest from our B-
OMBS and Contributors.

The Republicans saved the Balti-
more sheriffalty from the wreck, by
by a close shave, their candidate, Mr.
Green, being elected over Urannan,
democrat, by less than 200 votes.

Mr. and Mrs. Chas. E. Sloneker
have issued invitations for the mar-
riage of their daughter, Nettye, to
Mr. C. Fred Bitzberger, at 8 p. In., at
the home of the bride's parents, 1328
N. Gilmore St., Baltimore, Md.

We have received, through the cour-
tesy of a subscriber, Win. L. McGin-
nis, of Minneapolis, a copy of the
Washburn-Crosby Cook Book, which
also gives a description of the famous
flouring mill of the same name.
Thanks!

A Carroll County pensioner, named
Burkey, was found dead in an old
building just across the Baltimore
county line, near Hampstead. Re had
been receiving $20.00 a year from the
county, and had on his person an un-
cashed check for $10.00.

A feature of the after election time,
this year, is the absence of roosters
and the old pictorial jubilation from
the county weeklies. A few indulged
in this intellectual exhibit, but by
far the greater number contented
themselves with typographical con-
gratulations.

Harry Huff, proprietor of the Groff
House, Frederick, died suddenly on
Monday afternoon of paralysis of the
heart. He was formerly of Littles-
town, Pa., and for a time was en-
gaged in the hotel business in West-
minster. He was about thirty years
of age, and leaves a widow.

Under a ruling of the United States
Internal Revenue Department, which
took effect Monday, cigar dealers
must sell cigars from the box in which
they are received from the manufac-
turer. The dealer is not even allowed
to remove the last few cigars from a
box and put them into another partly
full box.

To secure a possible $55 due for 11
month's rent, a landlora's warrant
was executed on the property of John
W. Klepper, of York. The sale occur-
red and the net proceeds were $8.25.
The costs of the constable and clerk
amounted to $8.22, and the remaining
three cents were turned over to the
landlord in cancellation of his debt.

A social dinner was served by Mr.
and Mrs. Daniel Shorb, near Emrnits-
burg, on Nov. 5th., to a few invited
guests. Those present were Rev. C.
Reinewald and wife, Samuel Rowe
and wife, Mrs. William Gilleland, Mrs.
George Grimes, Miss Morris Gilleland,
Mrs. George Shorb, Masters Daniel T.
Shorb and Daniel R. Grimes, Misses
Esta Rowe, Bertha and Emma Shorb.

Joshua Owings, of Warfieldsburg,
was accidentally shot and seriously
injured while hunting with Munroe
Yohn, near Bloom, on Tuesday. One
shot pierced the eyelid, and, it is
thought, penetrated the eyeball. A
number of gunners were in a woods
nearby, and it is supposed that
Owings was shot by oue oi them.
Owings was taken to a hospital in
Balt imore.

Judge Burke has signed an order
in the Circuit Court at Towson, re-
moving the case of Mr. Edmund Sta-
bler, superintendent of the Baltimore
Manual Labor School at Arbutus,
charged with assaulting John .W Bar-
ns, a former inmate of the institution,
to Carroll county. The case was
tried before Judges Fowler and Burke
sitting as a jury, and they could not
agree on a verdict.

At a meeting of the State Board of
Health, on Wednesday, Secretary Dr.
John S. Fulton informed the board
that smallpox cases prevailed in two
counties of the state-Garrett county,
where there was one case; in Allegany,
where 14 cases were reported in one
house. "The cases are well in band
by the local health authorities," said
Dr. Fulton, and "no trouble need be
feared by the residents who live near
the infected district."

Wire fences on the farm have the
disadvantage that they attract and
convey the lightning so that it some-
times happens that an entire herd of
cattle standing during a storm in
some shelter near such a fence will be
wiped out at one stroke. A fence
post which is calculated to reins dy
this danger has been invented by
James Van Miller, of Cambridge City,
Ind., and a patent for the same has
been recently issued to him.

Governor Smith has practically
come out in the open as a candidate
for United States Senator by address-
ing letters to a number, perhaps all
of the newly elected Democratic mem-
bers of the Legislature asking their
support. Heretofore the Governor's
campaign has been conducted on the
quiet, and more by moves on the pol-
itical chessboard than by a direct ap-
peal for votes. Both Gov. Smith and
Mr. Raynor are working like beavers,
but neither is doing any talking for
publication at present, and it is diffi-
cult to correctly gauge the situation.

During the last two weeks Elder D.
C. Flory, of Newhope, Va., has been
holding a series of interesting meet-
ings in the German Baptist Brethren's
church of Meadow Branch, near
Westminster, the result of which has
been a considerable addition to the
membership by the right of baptism.
On Tuesday twenty-three applicants
were baptized by immersion in
Meadow Branch in the presence of a
large assemblage. The rite was per-
formed by Elders William E. Roop
and Charles D. Bonsaek, of the
Meadow Branch church. Fourteen of
those baptized are females and nine
males.

Without any formality the United
States has come in actual possession
of the coaling station at Guantanamo.
Although the flag-raising has not
taken place, it was learned at the
Navy Department that the transfer
was effected in a quiet manner sever-
al days ago. Under the arrange-
ment Cuba will pay the owners of the
property. It was ekplained that the
moving factor in the transaction was
the knowledge that Cuba was with-
out a navy, and as the United States
has undertaken the protection of the
island against a foreign foe and de-
sires the station as a naval base to
protect its own interests, the transfer
was made in order that this govern-
ment might complete its plan mapped
out sometime ago.

MARRIED.

KOoNS-GILBERT.-On Nov. 4tb.,
1903, in Uniontown, by Elder W. P.
Engler, Mr. Edwin C. Koons to Miss
Annie K. Gilbert.

Church Notices.

Union Bridge charge, Reformed church.-
Baust church, communion, 10.30 a. In.; pre-
paratory service this Saturday, 2 p. in. St.
Paul's church, 7.30 p.

if. J. Macalister, Pastor.

Taneytown Charge, U. B. Church.-Har-
ney, preaching 10 a. m.; Taneytown, preach-
ing p. m. With this service the protracted
meeting will begin. All are welcome.

A. B. Mowfm, Pastor.

Those 189 Rejected Ballots.

Those who are especially partisans
of Taneytown and everything per-
taining to it's vicinity, as against any
other like section of this county, have
worried themselves since the election
trying to account for the 189 "reject-
ed ballots" charged against the intel-
ligence, apparently, of our voters.
We say, "apparently," and this word
had better be adopted by our critics
-who are having amusement at our
expense-unless they want to fight.
It is reported that in Bruceville a
subscription list is being circulated
for the purpose of "building a Col-
lege" in Taneytown, and even old
weather-beaten Middleburg is put-
ting on airs, boasting of the small
number 'ejected there, intimating
the possession of a greater degree of
"culehah." Perish the thought.
From the result of investigations,

we are impressed with the belief that
we were simply victims of the disre-
gard, upon the part of our judges, of
the "intent" of the voter. They fol-
lowed the law,as she has been written
and most rigidly interpreted, no
doubt on the principle that, "the
best way to get rid of a bad law is to
inforce it." The little dots caused by
the pencil point in checking the num-
ber of candidates voted for, the holes
made by the pencil point because of
the shelf being too small on which to
spread out the ballot flat, and the
short tails of X marks trespassing be-
yond the squares, were not taken
such exact account of in any other
district, from which we have heard.
Of course, our voters should not have
committed such infractions, but they
did so, not through ignorance, but
because-well, because in their own
liberality, thought "it wohld be all
right anyway." But, it wasn't.
In Manchester district, the judges

were so liberal that a voter who had
been imbibing too much strong lem-
onade, and who had failed after a
seventeen minutes trial in the morn-
ing to fold his ballot so it would be
accepted, was permitted to come in
agaiu in the afternoon-after his
temporary indisposition had worn off
-and "try it again," when he was
victorious. Of course, this plan of re-
ducing the number of "rejected" bal-
lots in Manchester, and at the same
time saving the honor of the commu-
nity, was signally successful.
Even old moss-backed Uniontown

district, with its "dumb quarter"
fringe, cast 555 ballots, with but 30
ignoramus certificates against its
credit. As a rule, in districts where
old experienced election officials cast
up the results, the honest intentions
of the. voter were given precedence
over the-as the Clarion puts it-
"hornswogglement and delusion" of
the law.
Without saying any more about it,

we beg to assure our commiserating
neighbors that old Taneytown can
be left to get along with her present
school facilities,and without a lunatic
asylum-we were simply the victims
of a count as the strict laws are, and
not as they strictly ought to be. If
this is not believed to be the truth by
the said commiserating neighbors,
they have only to name the time,
place and weapons, and they will be
convinced more conclusively. Now,
keep quiet about it.

Lutheran Middle Conference.

(For the steeoeno
The Middle Conference of the Mary-

land Synod convened in St. Paul's
Lutheran church, of Uniontown,Rev.
G. W. Baughman, pastor, on Monday
evening. The conference sermon was
preached by the President, J. U.
Asper, on the theme "Christian Char-
ity. ' There was a good attendance
of clerical and lay delegates.
The discussions were a ble,timely and

helpful, and the reports from various
pastorates very encouraging. A com-
mittee composed of Revs. P. H. Mil-
ler, C. A. Britt and Charles Reinewald
was appointed to investigate the re-
distribution of various pastorates.

Officers for next year were elected,
as follows: Rev. U. W. Baughman,
president; Rev. Win. E. Wheeler, sec
retary; Rev. P. H. Miller, treasurer.
Rev. Miller was unanimously re-elect-
ed Missionary President.
Invitations for next meeting place

were received from Hampsted and
Lineboro, and the latter was chosen
by ballot, the meeting to be held in
May, 1904.
Good attendance was given all the

services, and a pleasing feature of the
conference was the entertainment of
the members at the parsonage, for
dinner and supper, during the ser-
vices, by the ladies of the congrega-
tion.

Ridgeley--Shipley.

(For the REcoan.)
A very pretty but quiet wedding

was solemnized at the home of the
bride's parents, Mr. and Mrs. Grove
J. Shipley, at Shipley P. 0., on
Wednesday evening, Nov. 4th., at 3
o'clock. The contracting parties be-
ing Miss Sadie, the second daughter
of Mr. and Mrs. Shipley, and Mr.
Samuel W. Ridgeley, eldest eon of
Mr. Samuel G. Ridgeley, of near
Sykesville. The ceremony was very
impressively performed by Rev. F.
Watson, of West Falls circuit. Miss
Bessie, sister of the bride was bride's-
maid, and Mr. John H. Ridgeley,
brother of the grcom, was best man.
After the ceremony and the many

congratulations, all mere invited to
the dining room where a table was
found laden with the choicest delica-
cies of the season which bad been pre-
pared by the order of hostess, and to
which all did ample justice, amid
much enjoyment and merriment.
Those present were the bride and

groom, Rev. Grove J. Shipley and
wife, F. J. Grimes, wife and son,
Vernon, C. M. Wagner and wife, D.
E. McQuay, wife and son, Oscar,
Samuel G. Ridgeley, John H. Ridge-
ley, Marshal Sellman, Miss Archie
Rid geley, of Sykesville, Harry W.
Hughes, J. Wm. Hughes, of Freedom,
Miss Bessie Shipley, Cornelius H.
Shipley,Mack Sidpley,Harry Wagner,
Miss Holler and Rhoda Wagner. At a
late hour, all returned to their homes,
leaving their best wishes for the hap-
piness of the bride and groom.

The Old, Old Story Again.

A lengthy account of a wedding,
was received from Emmitsburg this
week. As it was unsigned, and none
of the parties are known to us, the
waste basket caught it. Even by tell-
ing it "Over and Over again," every-
body will not learn that articles for
publication must be signed.

Cautious, but Probably Correct.

The Clarion accounts for the word
"inignitous," submitted to it for clar-
ification, recently, as follows;
"It looks as though the compositor

and proofreader were responsible for
the word, but assuming that it is as
the author writ it, and allowing that
he was of a feather with certain other
writers of political matter during the
late campaign, "inignitous" might be
analyzed thus: in, Latin prefix signi-
fying "in"; ignitous, from Latin root
ignis, fire, which latter by association
meaning sheol: thus, "politicians who
ought to be io sheol."
We do not regard such solution as

being even probably correct; it is at
best strained, and possesses the in-
herent weakness of the commonplace;
the epithets used during the late un-
pleasantness were as a rule unique
and the author would have keenly
felt his linguistic poverty had he been
equal to nothiug more original than
this.
It is likely the product of a double

typographical blunder, which escap-
ed the eye of the proofreader, and
was "iniquitions" in the original
MSS."

EXPERIMENT STATION NEWS.
An Unusually Interesting Letter from our

Regular Correspondent.

Our last items included September
transactions. Since that time we have
finished up a great deal of work. Dur-
ing October we finished seeding,
made quite a quantity of second crop
hay, cut corn, and are now engaged
in husking it. This work goes some-
what slow on account of the great
amount of outside work, principally
hauling. We commenced to haul
gravel to day on our section of Coun-
ty Road, and have been promised
$200.00 for that purpose. If that much
is allowed us we will be able to put
the road in such a condition that it
will be good practically all she time.
The election is over and we are glad

that it is, from the fact that it was
hard to keep laboring men at work
regularly. They cotsider election
day, here, a holiday in every sense of
the word, and with a great many of
them it commences a day or two be-
fore and lasts for a day or two after
election.
Almost every one around the Ex-

periment Station watches the doings
of your correspondent,s County close-
ly, and when the returns came in
from Taneytown district they made
it hot for me for awhile. They said
that Taneytown district must either
contain a great many negroes-peo-
ple who could be bought-or else their
intelligence was far below the aver-
age. Although these comments were
made good naturedly, at the same-
time we felt that the amount of bal-
lots thrown out was no credit to our
district.
During October,the Prince George's

County Road League held another
meeting. The chairman appointed a
com mittee, consisting of three lawyers,
to examine all laws bearing on the
question of roads, as well as the
Haman oyster bill, and report at the
next meeting. The consensus of
opinion was in favor of the Haman
oyster bill,and also in favor of taking
all questions relating to roads out of
politics.
Mr. Ager, Master of the Maryland

State Grange, said that the National
Grange would take the subject of
good roads into consideration at its
next meeting and bring the matter
before Congress during the coming
winter. Although Mr. Ager felt sure
that an appropriation would be
granted by the coming Congress, oth-
ers are as positive that it will not be
done. If the Haman oyster bill does
what is promised, and the National
Government makes a liberal appro-
priation, the question of good roads
will be solved, and millions of dollars
will be added to the value of our
farms, but the people must remember
that if they sit idly by, and do noth-
ing, the work will never be accom-
plished.
The U. S. Department of Agricul-

ture has again sown about 700 plots
of wheat. Some of their wheats which
were started with plots as low as a
few grains, have increased in quanti-
ty sufficiently to furnish seed enough
to sow ten acre plots. Should only
a few of these many varieties bring
an increase of but a bushel of wheat
per acre, they would add many dol-
lars to the value of the wheat crop of
our state,
The College boys here made things

lively on the night of Oct. 31. Captain
Silvester told them in chapel that he
would like to see them have some fun,
but he did not want them to damage
property. He also ordered the round
barn locked so that they could not
get the machinery and cannon out,
but this did no good for they got the
doors open in spite of him. They
hauled the cannon about two miles
away, carrried corn and fodder into
the road and College,carried chickens
and ducks in the Captain's office, and
tore up things generally. The worst
thing they did was to ruin some of
our corn experiments which had cost
us much time and labor. The Presi-
dent of the College ordered that the
bill for the work of returning and
putting things in place should be pre-
sented to him, and he would have it
charged to the general breakage ac-
count, which means that the students
will have to pay for their fun.
We raised, this year, over 300 bush-

els of sweet potatoes. We also have
an immense crop of kale. Our crop of
cabbage is quite large and the exper-
iments with fertilizers on this crop
ought to be of immense benefit to
truckers when it is once published.
Our suburban towns along the B.

& 0. R. R., are being boomed for all
they are worth. River Dale, a small
town near here, has advertised for
two hundred hands for the purpose
of laying cement walks from one end
of the place to the other. All lots in
the entire place are supplied with
these walks, whether they are im-
proved or not. The Company which
has these improvements in hand
seems to be supplied with plenty of
cash and they are certainly making a
beautiful place of it.
Prof. Austin and Director Wm. L.

Amoss seem to be immensely pleased
with the success of W. E. 0. Hiner, of
Copperville, in gathering apples for
the St. Louis Exposition. Carroll
County has the reputation of produc-
ing specimens of apples that have not
been exceeded by any received at the
Department of Horticulture at Wash-
ington.
The many friends of Prof. Talia-

ferro will be sorry to learn that his
health for the last few months has
not been at all good. He has been
compelled to take a rest. He left here
about two weeks ago, to go to Atlan-
tic City and is expected to return at
any time. We sincerely hope that he
will be restored to health.
Mrs. Doane, the wife of Prof. C. F.

Doane, of our dairy department, is ill
at one of the hospitals at Washing-
ton with typhoid fever. Mrs. Prof.
Patterson has not yet recovered from
the injury to her foot which she re-
ceived in June last.
Allen Davis, son of the late James

C. Davis, formerly of Taneytown, is
expected to take a position with us in
the near future, and wg hope to se-
cure more Carroll County help before
long. E. 0. G.

The Missing Votes of the State.

As we stated last week, about 900
ballots were rejected at the count of
the votes in Carroll County, in-
cluding those rejected at the ballot
box for being improperly folded. As
the registered vote of this county is
about 8700, we find by deducting 6862,
the number of votes counted, that
1838 legal voters failed to influence
the election, 938 of which "stayed at
home." The result, therefore, as rep-
resenting the majority, is decidedly
in doubt.
The morning Herald, in its issue of

Thursday, gave a table of all the
counties of the state, comparing the
vote of 1903 with that of 1899. Count-
ing only the votes cast in these years,
both Republican and Democratic, it
is found that the former lost 656 and
the latter 544 votes, or a total of ex-
actly 1200, in Carroll county.
The total shortage in the state, ac-

cording to this method of figuring,
was 35,966, nearly equally divided be-
tween the two parties. The Herald
very truly says: "Really, 36,000 does
not represent the lost vote. By all
rules, the vote this year should have
been at least 5 per cent more than in
1899. The real loss, therefore, reach-
es almost 50,000. Think of a trick
election law that disfranchises 50,000
Marylanders-mostly whites !"
The statement further shows that

of the "rejected" ballots, 7200 belong-
ed to Baltimore city, or about 8 per
cent of the total vote cast, and that
of this number about 4700 were Dem-
ocratic and 2500 Republican.

A Letter from Kansas.

Accompanying a renewal of his

subscription to the RECORD, Wm. H.
Overholtzer, of Perth, Kansas, says;
"I am getting along very well out

here. Just added another 160 acre tract
of land to my possessions,which makes
me 520 acres of Kansas soil. Land is
now selling as high as $50.00 per acre,
and some higher, depending largely

upon location. We are having fine
weather now; it had been a little dry
early in the fall, but last week we had
about three days rain which made-the
soil in good condition, and we now
look forward to a big wheat crop. In
this country if we can get the wheat
to go into the winter in good shape,
we are pretty nearly sure of a good
crop the following year. I hope we
shall have a good big crop as I have
out about 340 acres. Wheat is our
main dependence here and when we
fail in wheat we are left in bad shape.
Our bank is doing very well. I

have been running a Bank since I
came home the last time. The office
to which I was elected, while in the
East that time, and qualified before
a Notary Public in Taneytown, I
never got. My contestant raised the
question that I could not qualify out
of the state of Kansas. Of course the
point was not well taken, but I had
to take the case to the supreme Court
and by the time the Court got to it
my time had expired, my opponent
holding the Office until the Court pas-
sed upon the question; so, when I
learned that I was "left," I looked
around for another vocation, and
launched into the Banking Business
which I have been following ever
since. I like the work very much only
it is a little too confining for me.
Alex. B. McNair's whom you knew,

are getting along yery well; they still
run the hotel in Perth. Mr. McNair is
getting very gray, but still works as
hard as ever, and is always on the go.
Henry T. Ryser is livtng in Welling-
ton, and following his old trade, that
of painting. We have quite a settle-
ment of folio from old Taueytown,
and vicinity, and especially Harney
and up towards Gettysourg, Pa.
Wm. A. Delaplane, whom you remem-
ber, settled up at Great Bend, Kansas,
about 100 miles North West of Perth.
William was doing very well the last
I heard from him; he was then run-
ning a dray around town, and still as
talkatiye as ever. He always could
think of something to say, as you no
doubt remember."

Proceedings of the School Board.

On Monday 9th. instant,the School
Commissioners for Carroll County
held a regular meeting in their office
at the Court House, all the members
were present.

The Board discussed the propriety
and practicability of putting the
"Rand, McNally Maps" in all schools
of the county, taking a certain num-
ber of schools per year until all the
schools are supplied. The Maps are
the best made, they come on spring
rollers in good wooden case. The com-
bination selected by the Board in-
clude four large maps, the United
States, North America,South America
and the Eastern Hemisphere. The
Commissioners have about decided
that it is the next most needed im-
provement, and that if the funds will
justify such a course, we will try to
supply about twenty schools at a cost
of $300.00 per year until all are thus
equipped.
Mr. A. J. Jordan formerly of this

County has liberally supplied money
with which to build a public school
house near his old homestead in
memory of his parents. Messrs E. O.
Grimes and Geo. R. Gehr appeared
before tbe Board and stated that the
house is about ready for occupancy,
and formally tendered it to the
School Commissioners of the County.
For a number of years the school in
this community has been conducted
in a dilapidated tenant house belong-
ing to Mr. Jordan, and the Board de-
cided to move into the new house as
soon as convenient, and occupy it,
peuding some later adjustments as to
deed, repairs and certain conditions
connected with the contribution. In
due time the Commissioners will take
formal action in expressing on behalf
of the County their thanks to Mr.
Jordan for this evidence of his at-
tachment to Carroll County and the
home of his parents. Commissioners
Jacob H. Blocher, Fred D. Miller,
John B. Eppley and Peter Buchman
in company with the Examiner rode
out on Monday afternoon to see this
house,which makes a fine appearance
on a cominanding eminence with ex-
tensive ground attached, ample for
all public school purposes.

The Board passed an order for the
Secretary to pay off the teachers for
Fall Term on Friday after Thanks-
giving, 27th. instant.

S. SIMPSON, Sec'y.

Mr. Smelser Celebrates.

The Westminster correspondent of
the Herald, sends in the following ac-
count of a politico-social gathering,
held in New Windsor, on Tuesday
night;
"One of the most remarkable and

successful social affairs in the history
of New Windsor was a function given
last night by Mr. David P. Smelser,
clerk-elect of the Circuit Court for
Carroll County, at his home in New
Windsor, as an expression of his grat-
itude for the generous support he re-
ceived at the polls. Mr. Smelser is a
democrat, but political features were
entirely eliminated from the event
and hundreds of republicans were
present as his guests.

The social affair was preceded by a
parade of about 200 persons through
the streets of New Windsor. The pro-
cession was headed by the First Regi-
ment Band of Westminster, which
was followed by children in pony car-
riages with flags, and after them men
on foot and horseback carrying
torches. After the parade Mr. Smel-
sees guests to the number of 1200
gathered on the lawn at his residence,
where a luncheon of 3000 sandwiches,
forty large cakes and an unlimited
supply of sw eet cider was served.
Speeches were made by George 0.
Brilhart, of the Westminster oar,
democrat; Rev. A. F. Campbell, pas-
tor of the M. E. church,New Windsor,
republican, and Rev. Dr. James Fraz-
er, president of New Windsor College,
prohibitionist."

A "Jim Crow" Law Probable.

Democratic leaders do not hesitate
to say that one outcome of their re-
cent success at the polls and their
control of both branches of the next
General Assembly will be the passage
of a Jim Crow bill by the legislature.
They claim that such legislation will
follow their success as logically as the
enactment of legislation limiting the
suffrage as far as possible to the
white race by constitutional amend-
ment or by an ordinary law, if it is
possible to do so.
As is well-known the object of Jim

Crow legislation is to provide separate
compartments on steamboats,railroad
and street cars for the two races.

Two years ago, Delegate Giles, of
Somerset county, made a most des-
perate attempt to secure the passage
of a J im Crow car bill applying to the
whole state, and despite the narrow
Democratic majority in the House he
almost succeeded in securing the de-
sired legislation. When the bill failed
he received assurances from Demo-
crats who had approved the original
measure that if he limited the opera-
tion of his bill to the Eastern Shore
counties they would support it. The
bill was amended to have local appli-
cation on the Peninsula, but it again
failed.

COURT IN SESSION.

Proceedings ot the November Term, which
Commenced on Monday.

The November term of the Circuit
Court for Carroll County began Mon-
day, with Associate Judge Thomas
on the bench. John S. Sneider, of
Mt. Airy district, was appointed bail-
iff to the grand jury; George W. Ev-
erhart, of Manchester, bailiff to the
petit jury; John A. Hering, of Wool-
erys district, and George W. Selby, of
Uniontown, bailiffs at the gates. The
grand and petit juries were constitu-
ted as follows:
Grand Jury-Charles Jones, of New

Windsor. foreman; John N. Weaver,
Frank J. Engler, Samuel Angell, A dol-
phus H. Chenoweth, Samuel J. Mes-
singer, Richard Owings, Michael John
Lynch, Henry A. Miller, William R.
Trenwith, George W. Brown, James
Kuhns, Howard E. Koontz, David C.
Ott, George A. Eckenrode, Andrew
E. B. Myers, Louis P. Manning, John
H. Biddle, Melchoir Allgire, Nelson
A. Brown, John A. Chew Emanuel
Mackley, William H. Gosnell.
Petit Jury-William H. Wentz, Ar-

thur Hill, Christopher Hanson, Noah
Powell, George Rupp, Charles A. Mar-
quart, David A. Starner, Joshua
Shaffer, Harry E. Erb, Dennis A.
Smith, Harry C. Harrier, Cornelius
W. Jenkins, Charles H. Rupp, John
V. Eyler, William J. Eisenbrown,
Charles F. Beck, Harvey J. T. Rhodes
Charles D. Winebrenner, Francis A.
Brightwell. Thomas Hennesey, John
A. Dell, John U. Leister, Benjamin
F. Bowers, Harry M. Buckingham,
Jacob L. Shaffer.
The docket for the term contains 75

trial cases, 7 appeals and 16 originals.
Five persons are awaiting the action
of the grand jury on the charges of
forgery, eight for larceny, one for
burglary and several others for minor
offenses. Eleven of the accused are
held in the county jail in default of
bail.
Proceedings in honor of the memory

of the late Ex-Judge Charles T. Reif-
snider were held in the Circuit Court
for this county, Tuesday afternoon.
Resolutions were submitted by a com-
mittee of the bar-Charles E. Fink,
E. Oliver Grimes, Jr., and Francis
Neal Parke-and were seconded by
Ex-Judge James A. C. Bond, Francis
Neal Parke, Benjamin F. Crouse,
E. Oliver Grimes, Jr., D. N. Henning,
Guy W. Steele, Claude T. Smith,Ivan
L.- Hoff and George L. Stocksdale, all
of whom spoke of Judge Reifsnider's
extreme devotion to his family, his
fidelity to the interest of his clients,
his arduous labors as an attorney and
counselor, his kindness to young
members of the bar, and his generosi-
ty and charity to all who applied to
him for assistance. Judge Reifsnider's
love of truth was especially referred
to by some of the speakers.
Benjamin Jackson, appellant, ys

Letitia Dorsey, by her husband and
next friend, appellee. Appeal from
Geo. H. Harris, J. P. Judgment re-
versed and judgment for appellant for
the goods replevied, etc. Henning
for appellant, Weant for appellee.

Edward C. Regester, appellant, vs
Charles Yingling, appellee. Appeal
from J. F. Rinker, J. P. Appeal dis-
missed. Weant for appellant, Walsh
& Walsh for appellee.
Jennie Clamber, appellant, vs State

of Md. Appeal from John T. Hill,
J. P. Tried before the court; judg-
ment for the appellant. Steele for
appellant, Weant for appellee.

Ira Vinton vs Francis J. Albaugh,
et al, road commissioners; action.
Judgment of non pros under rule,
security for costs. Steele for plaintiff,
Fink for defendants.
Harriet and Ira Vinton vs Francis

J. Albaugh, et al, road commission-
ers; action. Judgment of non pros
under rule, security for costs. Steele
for plaintiff, Fink for defendant.

Sykesville Perpetual Building Asso
dation, vs Robert W. Carter, et al,
action of assumpsit. Trial before
jury; on trial. Fink for plaintiff,
Steele for defendant.

Young Man Died from Lockjaw.

The correspondent of the Sun, from
Westminster, writes of the following
distressing case;
"Harry M. Bish. aged 18 years, died

in Westminster this afternoon Nov.
6th., of lockjaw, after an illness of less
than 24 hours. Several weeks ago he
burned warts from his hands with
nitric acid and several days later ran
a splinter under his thumb nail. The
physicians in attendance were unable
to tell whether the disease was caused
by the acid or the splinter. The
young man attended a foot ball game
yesterday afternoon and showed no
symptoms of tetanus until he stepped
from the grand stand. He complained
of his jaws being stiff, but it was
thought that this was due to possible
injuries in a foot ball game and no at-
tention was at first given to it. He
rapidly became worse and a physician
was' called in, who pronounced it
lockjaw. Other physicians were sum-
moned, but no relief could be given.
Mr. Bish was a son of Silas M. Bish,
of Westminster.
He was a member of Washington

Camp No. 10, P. 0. S. of A., of Ty-
rone, and a large number of the mem-
bers participated in the funeral ser-
vice, at Krider's church, on Sunday.

The Vote of the State.

The following figures likely repre-
sent the official vote of the state, ex-
cept Baltimore city,which may reduce
Warfield's majority slightly;

Warfleld,
Dem.

Allegany . 8,193
Anne Arundel  3,033
Baltimore City 47,717
Baltimore County  8,774
Calvert  521
Caroline  1,783
Carroll  3,521
Cecil  2,578
Charles   1,109
Dorchester  2,294
Frederick  5,005
Garrett  918
Harford  3,082
Howard  2,031
Kent   1,905
Montgomery  3,192
Prince George's  2,255
Queen Anne's  2,109
Somerset  2,014
St. Mary's  1,121
Talbot. . .     1,965
Washington  4,088
Wicomico  2,323
Worcester  1,907

Totals 110,461

Warfield's majority, 12,193

Rep.
4,180
2,270

40,971
6,939
667

1,456
3,221
2,200
1,204
2,391
5,340
1,714
2,645
1,257
1,700
2,458
1,900
1,195
1,527
1,072
1,667
4,256
1,898
1,551

98,268

Congress in Session.

Washington, Nov. 9.-The fifty-
eighth Congress was opened in extra
session at noon to-day. A speaker and
officers of the House of Representa-
tives were elected and the preliminary
steps of organization were taken by
both houses upon a plan which con-
templates this special session as but
an anticipation of the first regular
session by an earlier meeting.

Joseph G. Cannon was elected
Speaker of the House by the votes of
the majority, and the minor officers
who served during the Fifty-seventh
Congress were re-elected. The com-
plimentary vote of the Democratic
minority was cast for Mr. John Sharp
Williams for Speaker, thus designat-
ing him as the leader of the minority.
The rules of the Fifth-seventh Con-
gress, which are the Reed rules sur-
viving from the Fifty-first Congress,
were readopted, not for the special
session only, but for the entire Con-
gress.

The Mt. Airy Bank Failure.

Frederick, Md., Nov. 9.-At a meet-
ing to-day of the creditors of Jones
& Co., bankers, of Mount Airy, who
recently failed,making an assignment
to Joseph D. Baker, of Frederick,over
200 of the creditors signed a petition
to Judge Morris, of the United States
District Court, Baltimore, asking him
not to declare the firm bankrupt.
This action was due to a Baltimore

creditor holding a claim for $500, who
had made a move to have the firm
declared bankrupt, and who was rep-
resented at the meeting by J. Charles
Linthicum, attorney, of Baltimore.
Mr. Linthicum's proposition was de-
feated by the creditors, and it was
only at the appeal of Mr. Baker, the
trustee, and his counsel, Milton G.
Urner and J. Roger McSherry, that
he was given a hearing at all.
The creditors, in their petition to

Judge Morris, state that it is their
desire that the estate be left in Mr.
Baker's hands for settlement, but
that if it must be thrown into bank-
ruptcy it is their desire that he shall
be continued as trustee.
Mr. Baker made a statement show-

ing the apparent assets to be about
$122,000 and the liabilities about
$109,000, but stated that as there is
involved in the assets about $90,000
of real estate and the rest consists of
stocks that are subject to serious
fluctuations,it was impossible to state
as yet whether the estate is solvent
or insolvent. William D. Jones, a
brother of Albert Jones, the head of
the banking firm was present at the
meeting, and stated that if, when the
estate was ready to be settled, it was
found that $5,000 would enable hie
brother to pay dollar for dollar he
would gladly contribute that amount.

Orphans' Court Proceedings.

MONDAY, Nov. 9th.,1903.-J. Frank-
lin Raver and Carroll G. Raver execu-
tors of J. Franklin Raver, deceased,
settled second account.
Rosa A. Logue, executrix of James

A. Logue, deceased, settled first and
final account.
TUESDAY, Nov. 10th., 1903.-Clifton

L. Murray, administrator of Bettie
Murray, deceased, settled first and
final account.
Rowland Watts, administrator of

Anna H. Watts, deceased, returned
inventories of personalty, debts and
money.
Mary C. Stoner, executrix of George

W. Stoner, deceased, reported sale of
real estate.
Catherine McDonald and Mary A.

McDonald, executrices of Catherine
McDonald, deceased, returned inven-
tory of money. . e
Letters testamentary on the estate

of John N. Selby, deceased, granted
unto Elias G. Selby, who received or-
der to notify creditors.
Milton E. Myers, administrator of

Catherine Sholl, deceased, reported
sale of personal property.
The last will and testament of Emily

J. Arnold, deceased, was admitted to
probate.

Hotel Company Sues Railroad.

The Blue Ridge Hotel Company,
which operates the Blue Mountain
House in Washington county, Md.,
instituted suit last week in the City
Court against the Western Maryland
Railroad Company toenforce the pay-
ment of $3669 interest due and $5000
guaranteed to its stockholders by the
railroad company.
The Blue Ridge Hotel Company has

a capital stoek of $100,000, divided in-
to 1000 shares of $100 each, and has
an outstanding indebtedness on part
of its property, $122,000, divided into
122 bonds of $1000 each. A contract
was entered into by the railroad com-
pany October 23, 1883, in which it is
alleged the defendant agreed to secure
the payment cf a dividend not ex
ceeding 5 per-cent. per annum on tbe
capital stock of $100,000, and also in-
terest at the rate of 6 per-cent. on its
first mortgage bonds not exceeding
$125,000, providing the net earnings
from the hotel and resorts at Pen-Mar
should not be sufficient to pay these
obligations.
It is alleged that the net earnings

from the hotel and other sources were
not sufficient to pay this interest for
the year ended October 1, 1903. It is
stated that the aggregate amount
paid by the railroad to the hotel
company under the agreement was
not in the year 1903 or in any year
prior thoreto more than $8000 in divi-
dends upon its capital stock and $7500
interest upon its capital stock and
$7500 interest upon its bonded debt.
Although demand has been made for
the amount of the dividends and in-
terest for the year 1903, the plaintiff
says the railroad has failed to pay the
same. Edward Guert Gibson, and
Williams, Thomas & Williams are at-
torneys for the plaintiff.

New Windsor.--Mrs. Joseph Engler,
of near this place, entertained the
Women's Home and Foreign Mission-
ary Society of the Presbyterian
church on Saturday afternoon last.
Quite an interesting program was
rendered.

Misses G. May Forrest and Abbie
Fogle, of Taneytown, spent Saturday
last with Mr. and Mrs. M. D. Reid.

Messrs Samuel Lantz and wife, L.
D. Rector and wife, attended the
Democratic parade in Taneytown, on
Thursday evening.
Mrs. Samuel Otto, of this place, en-

tertained the Missionary Society of
the M. P. church, on Saturday after-
noon last.
Mrs. Elizabeth Engler, widow of

the late Hiram Engler. died Nov.
13th., and will be buried Sunday at-
ternoon ;meet atthe house at 1 o'clock.

Special services are being held in
the Presbyterian church,commencing
on this Thursday evening and to con-
tinue all next week.
(Item referring to Democratic jollifi-

cation, omitted for reason that the
substance of it was already in type
from another source.-En.)

Bark Ellen Rifleman,
of Littlestown, was the guest over
Sunday of her brother George Good-
win and family.
Messrs. Henry Baker and Henry

Nieodemus, with their wives, of Avon-
dale, were the guests of Mrs. Evan T.
Smith, on Sunday.
Mr. Powell Ohler, of Sparrows

Point, was here on Monday with his
sister-in-law, Mrs. Joshua Cartzen-
daffier and was trying to rent a house
in this village, so as to remove his
family here.
Mrs. Ianthe Hollenberry, of Blue

Ridge Summit, returned home on
Thursday morning after a week's visit
in the village and vicinity.
Mr. William Smith and bride spent

Sunday with his parents Mr. and Mrs.
Evan T. Smith.
Roy Goodwin writes from W ashing-

ton, D. C., that he has enlisted in
the navy and will go on a cruising
ship in two weeks.
Most of the farmers will finish corn

husking this week. Some are alread y
done, and the yield is far above ex-
pectations.

Pleasant Valley. - Rev. T. M.
Yundt, Supt. of Bethany Orphan's
Home. at Womelsdorf,Pa.,will preach
here Sunday afternoon at 2 o'clock.
On next Wednesday evening, Rey.

A. D. Newcomer, of Allentown, Pa.,
will preach a trial sermon at this
place, and at Silver Run, on Thurs-
day evening.
Misses Clara Myers and Annie Hahn

spent Saturday and Sunday with Mr.
and Mrs. Emory C. Ebaugh, of Car-
rollton.
Mrs. E. C. Yingling and Mrs H. T.

Wentz visited friends in Taneytown,
on Thursday.
Mrs. Jos. P. Yingling and Mrs.

Frances Jordan spent Thursday at
Jos. Cookson's of near Kump's.

COUNTY CORRESPONDENCE.

The Latest Items of News furnished by
our Regular Contributors.

All communications for the RECORD must
be signed by the writer's own name; not nec-
essarily for publication, but as au evidence
that the matters and facts transmitted are
legitimate and correct. Items of a mischiev-
ous character are not wanted.

Harney.-We are glad to say that
our sale, on last Saturday, was large-
ly attended and fairly good prices
were realized. However, about fifteen
good bribes have been forgotten; they
range in value from $5.00 to $20.00.
These goods have been offered to re-
spectable people, but were refused;
they are not soiled, but, being in-
formed that nothing but honesty is
to be expected in the future, and not
wishing to carry this stock over, they
will be disposed of at a reduction of
50 per cent.
Talk about good prices for pork-

we believe that Harney takes the
lead. At Mrs. Sell's sale, on Wednes-
day, three hogs were sold for $102.00.
Our judges say that the three would
weigh about 750 pounds. The old
grand-father's clock brought a little
over $60., and other things sold in
proportion.
John J. Hess lost a fine cow one

day this week; she bad been sick for
some time, but no one seemed to
know what was wrong with her.
A new lightning rod has been placed

on the Mt. Joy Lutheran church, in
place of the one which had been
struck by lightning. The steeple of
the church, recently damaged by
storm, has also been repaired. Other
repairs have been made to the par-
sonage.
The Y. P. S. C. E., presented a

beautif ul eight-day clock to the Luth-
eran church at this place.

Copperville.-Well. the election is
over, and we presume the Editor is
getting in his full supply of news,
which he hoped for after the prevail-
ing epidemic came to an end.
On Friday evening of last week,

Samuel Ocker, who lives alone, left
his home about 6 o'clock and return-
ed at 8 and found his house envelop-
ed in flames. His furniture was en-
tirely consumed; among other valu-
ables was a gold watch and chain,
also several coins of considerable
value. The fire is supposed to have
started from a flue in the second
story, as it was noticed at the roof
first.
Mrs. Samuel Wivell is seriously ill

from a second paralytic stroke.
Mrs. Percy H. Shriver is on a visit

to relatives, in Philadelphia.
Mrs. W. H. Shriner is on a visit to

Baltimore, among friends.
Miss Frances Erb, who spends the

summer with her parents on the
farm, has returned to the city where
sne is employed as seamstress.
T. F. Keefer, of Berrett, Freedom

district, left with W. E. 0. Hiner a
full sample of corn which beats any
we have seen in this section, the ears
being very large and well filled.

Uniontown.-A series of meetings
will begin in the Pipe Creek German
Baptist Church, on Nov. 22, at which
Elder Mitchell Stover,the well known
evangelist, of Waynesboro, Pa., will
officiate. Everybody invited to at-
tend.
Preaching in the Church of God

Sunday morning 10.15 by the pastor
Rev. J. D. Clark. Preaching in the
Frizellburg Church of God Sunday
evening 7.30. Illustrated sermon.
A lady evangelist is conducting re-

vival services in the M. P. Church.
Mre.Babylon, of Taneytown, visited

Mrs. Wm. Segafoose, the past week.
Miss Emma Perry, of Union Bridge,

spent several days with her sister,
Mrs. John Heck.
Thomas Cover, of Easton, Md., is

visiting his parents, M. and Mrs. H.
C. Coyer, much to the sorrow of the
rabbits in this vicinity
A number of visitors were in town,

attending the Lutheran Conference;
Mrs. John Beard, of New Windsor,
was the guest of Mrs. Troutfelter
and Mr. Edward Beard; Miss Florence
Englar was at the home of Miss Mar-
garet Coyer; Mrs. W. E. Wheeler, of
Woodsboro, and Mrs. Jane Raitt were
at the Lutheran Parsonage; Miss
Flora Frizzed, of Frizellburg, was the
guest ot Miss Ida Mering; Miss Grisel-
da Fuss and Mrs. Nellie Yingling,
were at the home of Misses Ella and
Clay Mering.

Linwood.-David Roop and sister,
Miss Irene, visited Nathan Engler
and family.
Mr. and Mrs. R. Lee Myers enter-

tained at supper, Mr. and Mrs. John
Drach and family, Miss Adelaide
Messier, Messrs John S. Messier and
Clayton Englar.
William Curry and daughter, of

Sam's Creek, spent Friday at Mrs.
Albaugh's.
Mr. and Mrs. DeWitt C. Haines and

Mrs. C. E Smith, were visitors at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Englar.
Morris Haines has returned from a

visit to the George school, near Phil-
adelphia, of which he is a graduate.
Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Dayhoff en-

tertained a number of friends; Henry
Gobright and family, Abraham Cru-
shon and wife, Joseph Dayhoff and
family, Mrs. Agnes Schlosser and son,
Frank, Henry Sittig and sister, Clara,
on Sunday.
The exercises at the hall, on Sun-

day, were all very interesting. Rev.
Campbell's address to the Sunday
School was very entertaining and in-
structing, and he received a cordial
invitation to come again.
A number of the members of the

Brethren church, of Hagerstown,
came on the fast mail on Sunday
evening and attended the Love-feast
and communion.
The Democratic politicans of the

village took a wagon load of villagers
to New Windsor, on Tuesday even-
ing, to view the parade in honor of
the recently elected Clerk of the
Court-"Pappy" Smelser.

Evan Haines, a supervisor of the
road,is preparing to rebuild the foun-
dation of the bridge over Pipe Creek,
which was weakened by the many
high waters of the summer.
John E. Senseney is having a hot

water plant put in his residence.

Mrs. J. S. Waltz sent Mrs. Nathan
Englar a huge bouquet of chrysan-
themums. Mrs. Waltz makes a
specialty of this lovely fall flower and
has a fine collection of the most deli-
cate tints.

Emmitsburg.-On Tuesday night,
the Q. R. S. met at the home of George
Beain, "Manchuria" being the sub-
ject. Miss Zeck and Miss Maria Hei-
man committee. The following pro-
gram was then taken up;

Reading of the minutes; opening
paper, "The geography and early his-
tory of Manchuria, ' by G. Lloyd Pal-
mer; male quartet, 'The Knight's
Farewell," Rev. D. H. Riddle, D.,
Messrs E. L. Rowe, G. Lloyd Palmer,
Annan A. Horner; reading, "How
bachelors keep house," Miss Riddle;
paper, on the subject, J. A. Heiman;
vocal solo, "The song of a heart," A.
A. Homer; paper, Rey. D. H. Riddle;
current events; chorus, "Farmer
John."
• Gqests present, Mrs. I. S. Annan,
Mrs. Geo. N. Cook, Mrs. E. D. Stone.
Mrs. J. Hykes, of China; Mrs. R.
Musselman, Mrs. S. N. McNair, Misses
Gertrude, Anna and Alice Annan,
Miss White, Mr. A. A. Horner. "The
Race Question" will be the topic for
December. The next meeting will be
held at Rev. Chas. Reinewald's. Mrs.
Chas. Reinewald and Mrs. J. A. Hel
man committee. Rev. A. M. Gluok
and Miss Shulenberger were voted in
as members of the Q. R. S.

Union Bridge.-Mrs. John Tregallas
and little son, Harold, of Grafton,
Va., and her sister. Miss Laura Getz-
endanner, of Frederick City, spent
this week with Mr. Tregallas' parents,
Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Tregallas.
Mrs. Edith Groff, of Washington,

D. C., spent a week or more with her
brothers, Frank and Will Wagner and
sister.

Miss Eva Repp spent this week in
Baltimore with her sister, Mrs. Eph-
raim Reese.
Assistant Postmaster, Theodore

Wolfe, spent part of this week in
Philadelphia, with his sister, Mrs.
Elsie Miller.
Thomas Lightner of New York,

spent a few days this week with his
brother, Frank Lightner and wife.
Mr. and Mrs. Edwin H. Sharrets,

of Bruceville, spent Sunday afternoon
with Mr. and Mrs. John Delaplane,
near town,
Miss Margaret Cover is spending

several weeks in Baltimore among
relatives and friends.
John W. Angell and family will

move to town next week into Mrs.
Emeline Dudderar's property, on
Benedum street.
Miss Nettie N usbaum, of near

Unionville, spent a few days this week
with Mrs. Eliza Engleman.
Rev. B. F. Clarkson is holding a

series of meetings in the M. E. church,
this week and next.
John N. Weaver is attending Court

in Westminster, this week. He was
lucky enough to get on the Grand
Jury, which promises to be a short
term.
The following items are from the

Maryland Collegiate Institute;
Among the new students enrolled

this week are Berley Koons and
Robert Etzler, of Linwood, and Nor-
man Hann, of Medford.
Prof. Cottrell made a flying trip to

Philadelphia, Friday and Saturday.
He purchased supplies for the chemi-
cal laboratory.
The students of the commercial de-

partment enjoyed the presence of
Geo. R. Gehr, of Westminster, last
week. Mr. Gehr gave one of his usual
stirring and interesting addresses.
This department has strong classes in
both Book-keeping and Stenography.
Mr. Joshua Long, of Downsville,

Washington Co., Md., visited his son
Earl D. Long, this week.
The Hiewatha Literary Society,

will render a special program on Fri-
day evening, Nov. 20th. An admis-
sion fee will be charged. The pro-
ceeds will be used for purchasing lit-
erature for the society.
Johnnie Williamson visited his par-

ental home in Berkley Co., W. Va.,
from Thursday until Tuesday.
Rey. Clarkson, of the M. E. church,

favored the school with a visit one
morning last week, and conducted
chapel exercises, after which he gave
one of his usual emotional addresses,
filled with good advice.

York Road.-Mrs. Mary Angell is
visiting her daughter, Mrs. Martha
Aulthouse, in Taneytown.
Chas. Gardner, wife and daughter,

of Buena Vista, Leonard Lynn and
Mrs. Rebecca Wilson, of Baltimore,
are visiting at W. F. Cover's.
Miss Margaret Barr, of Gettysburg,

spent Tuesday at R. W. Galt's.
Miss Bertha Reindollar, of Balti-

more, has returned home, after spend-
ing some time with Miss Florence
Koons.
Mrs. Kate Haugh, of Waynesboro,

spent a few days with her niece, Mrs.
J. W. Kolb.
Rey. Wheeler and wife, of Woods-

boro, and Mrs. Louisa Hoffman, of
New Windsor, spent Friday with 0.
D. Birely and family.
Mrs. Elizabeth Adams, who spent a

few weeks with friends at this place,
has returned to her home in Hagers-
town.
Frank Weant and wife, of Balti-

more, visited his parents at Bruceville.
The three year old daughter of Eli

Fogle, of York, was brought here Sat-
urday and buried in Mt. Zibn cem-
etery. Rev. Wheeler officiated.
Communion service will be held at

Mt. Zion-or Haugh's church-Sun-
day morning, Nov. 15th. Preparatory
service on Saturday previous.
Bruce Weant, of Bruceyille, has

been seriously ill, but is now improv-
ing.

Stony Branch.-The Stony Branch
Literary Society met at the school
house, Tuesday evening, Nov. 10th.,
and re-organized by electing N. C.
Stansbury, president; M. F. Sayler,
vice-president; Wm. G. Grimes, secre-
tary; Miss Bertha Stansbury, treasur-
er, and Misses Anna and Bertha
Stansbury. organists. The member-
ship enrolled was nearly forty,a great
increase over last year. The people
of Stony Branch are wide-awake to a
project of such prime importance.
The splendid success of this society

is greatly due to its efficient presi-
dent, whose heart and soul enters
unselfishly into the work for the up-
building of the young ladies and gen-
tlemen of this community. The next
question for discussion is "Resolved,
That the illiterate should not vote."
Affirmative, Messrs M. F. Sayler,
R. E. Hockensmith, and Denton
Wachter; negative, Messrs Wm. G.
Grimes, N. C. Stansbury, and Philip
Stansbury. The society adjourned to
meet Tuesday evening, Nov. 17th.
Miss Anna Stansbury and Wm. G.

Grimes, champion crokinole players,
of Emmitsburg district, defeated Mr.
and Mrs. N. C. Stansbury, Tuesday
night, at their home near Motters.
Mr. and Mrs. S. worked very hard to
win, but of no avail. They "barked
up against the wrong tree." We ex-
tend our sympathies. Miss Anna and
Mr. Grimes have never been beaten
in a game, on the general summing
up. Their challenge is open and out
for any desiring to accept it.
A bell has been placed upon oar

school-house by the patrons of the
school.
R. E. Hockensmith leads oft with

the butchering, and to-day the squeal
of the porker was heard for the first
time.
George Naylor has sold his mill

property to Howard Martin, who will
take possession in the spring.
The Tom's Creek M. E. church,now

in course of erection, is ready for the
last coat of plaster.
The ladies of the Foreign Mission-

ary Society of the M. E. church, will
hold their third anniversary at Tom's
Creek church, Saturday evening,Nov.
21st., beginning at 7.30. A returned
Missionary will be present and ad-
dress the meeting. Admission 5 and
10 cents.

Bankert's Mill.-Communion ser-
vices, will be held at Baust church,
by the Reformed congregation this
Sunday at 10 o'clock a. m.
We bad what is usually termed an

election in Maryland recently, bat
when we come to sum it up in its true
light, we would term it an auction of
votes to the highest bidder for cash,
and the largest pile won.
Most of our farmers are done gath-

ering in their corn crop, and are now
making preparations for another crop,
by hauling out manure and plowing
their sod fields.
Mrs. Geo. C. Harmon is indisposed

with Grippe.
Some of our people attended the

Conference, held at Uniontown, by
the Lutheran church, the past week.

Gist.-Mrs. M. E. Phillips, of this
place, is spending this week with her
daughter, in Hampstead, Mrs. Irvin
Kelley, who met with quite an acci-
dent a few days ago. It seems that
while going up a flight of steps, car-
ry ing a bucket of water, she slipped
and fell, breaking three of her ribs
on her left side.
Sterling Shipley, son of Mr. and

Mrs. Carroll Shipley, of °amber, died
on Thursday of brain fever, and was
buried at Bethesda, on Saturday
morning, at 10 o'clock.
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A Discouraging Sign.

The disinclination of men-especi-ally young men-to read currentnews, the progress of the world in in-ventions and science, and the variousmatters which relate to industrialdevelopment and difficulties, is one ofthe most discouraging signs of thetimes. Even older persons, whom itis natural to suppose have learnedthe value of keeping posted on what"the other half" is doing, are also dis-tressingly careless and unconcernedin this particular, and every now andthen we have a striking illustrationof what they lose by it, the most re-cent of which is found in the "reject-ed ballot" total in this county.
While we are as strongly opposedto the form of ballot as anyone canPossibly be, candor compels us to saythat a very large number of the bal-lots rejected were those marked bypersons of average intelligence, whofailed in their participation in theelection simply because they failed toread the daily and weekly papers,nearly all of which contained full par-ticulars of the details of marking bal-lots, with precautionary advice andall necessary information.

Not only preceding an election, butat all times, especially to those whohave not enjoyed the advantages of aliberal school education, it is abso-lutely essential that education besecured by reading. When we havebefore us the lives of Lincoln andGrant and the hundreds of men whoattained greatness in spite of povertyand the lack of early education, it isremarkable, to say the least, that somany of our present-day young mendo not understand the importance ofstoring their minds with the valuableInformation contained in current his-
tory (daily news) which is so cheap,as
well as so easy to secure.
Fifty years and more ago, bookswere the property of the few, and en-

tirely out of the reach of the impecti-rious, except by borrowing. Now,they are so common as to be easilywithin the reach of all,in actual own-ership, while access through other
means, in every town, may be had tovast storehouses of knowledge and re-
search; but, through the perversity of
human nature-the blind carelessnessof our young men for the future-
such opportunities go begging, un-
sought and unappreciated.
There is hope for the young man

who reads, and is ambitious to know
things; to know something of politics
and political differences; who ahns to
know, that he may be superior to the
common run; who reads, that the
conversation of intelligent persons
may not be Greek to him; that gener-
al knowledge may, in part, tiridge
over his lack of a college education.
When this ambition is lacking, as ittoo frequently is, that which the
future holds for such a young man,
can only be estimated with the utmostuncertainty.
The women of to-day are to be com-plimented, not only because of theirgreater propensity for reading than

men, but because of a greater ambi-
tion to become self-supporting and"make their mark" in the world.
Women, as a rule, are the better
talkers on almost every subject, even
those not commonly supposed to be-
long to their world,and this is largely
because they are superior self-educa-
tors-greater readers-as compared
with men. Besides, they do not dull
their mental faculties with the habits
and practices of men, and cultivatetheir wits to help themselves over the
rough places which they would other-
wise find impassable.
We find the superiority of women

exemplified, frequently, after marri-
age, when we say of the wife that
"she made a man" of her husband.
This simply means that the man had
neglected to make the best use of his
opportunities, and was not awakened
to what he had lost, until his wife
made the loss clear to him. With all
the advantages before our young
men, especially, there is no valid ex-
cuse for the crop of ordinary minds
which is undoubtedly threatening
the welfare of the country and the
status of society. Just how to bring
about the awakening is a most serious
problem.

Success Covers Sin.

Recently, a religious body severely
censured one of its clerical members
and reduced him to the laity, pending
his repayment of all the money he
borrowed, and lost, in speculating in
stocks. There was manifest a strong
sentiment for deposing the culprit
from the ministry, indefinitely, and
to "make an example" of him; but,
beneath all, the fact of the failure of
his ventures to turn out successfully,seems to emphasize the crime.
While we cannot say so from posi-

tive knowledge, it nevertheless may
be true that even some of those who
sat in judgment in this case, were
equally guilty, the only difference be-
ing that their speculations succeeded.
At least, this is the fact; that a sin of
the speculative class, followed by pe-
cuniary profit, loses a large measure
of its sinfulness-it is simply shrewd
speculation-while one which fails,
especially if it causes others to lose, is
damned by the failure of its promoter
to "pick et winner," rather than be-
cause of the act itself.
It must be said to the discredit of

the ministry that it is not free from
that sort of speculation which is
rightfully denominated gambling,
though such instances are, of course,
the exception and not the rule. One
thing is sure; the habit is not likely
to grow in this direction, for the very
excellent reason that but few of them
have the surplus wherewith to specu-
late while the number who would
borrow-as in the case cited-is too
insignificant to consider.

Important Questions.

We desire to repeat the invitation,extended in our last issue, that theRECORD be used, this fall and winter,as a channel for publicly debatingthe many important questions nowbefore the people of this state, andwe add to the list of ten topics alreadygiven, two more, the last named pos-sibly being entitled to first place, asIt is likely to be the subject of legis-lation at Annapolis this winter, and,If so, will more or less directly affectevery citizen of this state, if, indeed,It does not become of National im-portance.
The voice of the people should beheard on all such questions, and thetime for this is before the opening ofthe legislature, while the members-elect are yet uninfluenced by themany distractions of new scenes, andbefore the time when their minds aremore or less taken up with the excite-ment of the hour and not so receptiveof calm judgment and of the realwishes of the home people whom theyshould aim to represent.
On many of these subjects, we areof the opinion that the people, ratherthan the press, are best qualified tospeak, especially for the reason thateditorial writers, as a rule, run intohobbies, and in so doing lose at leasta portion of their influence. They aresupposed to have "axes to grind,"and pet theories to boost,consequent-ly their wisdom is taken at a dis-count. With the people, it is differ-ent. The average legislator is apt to

recognize, in a clearly written andsigned article, not only the opinions
of one man, but of the class to which
he belongs. Such opinions stand outclear and unencumbered as one man
speaking to another, and not as theopinions of an Editor, or Attorney,
who presumably has "something uphis sleeve."
We again urge, therefore, those of

our readers who have the time,ability
and desire, to help toward the accom-
plishment of the best legislation, touse the RECORD freely toward thisend; and, as we said before, shouldthe articles be too numerous orlengthy for our news pages, our thirdpage will be given, wholly, if neces-sary, for the purpose. The topicsmentioned, we again repeat, with thetwo additions;
1.-Should the State Tax be abolish-ed.
2.-Needed changes in our presentElection Law and Ballot.3.-The most feasible plan for secur-ing a system of good public roads.4.-State appropriations to privateor semi-private, and semi-sectarian in-stitutions.
5.-What single act of legislationdoes Maryland stand most in need of?6.-The question of Rural SchoolConsolidation.
7.-Should the pensioning of Publicschool teachers continue?
8.-Better pay for Public schoolteachers.
9.-Have we adequate protectionagainst tramps?
10.-Should rabbits be protectedgame at any season?
11.-Is the right of suffrage tooeasily conferred on the foreignborn
12.-Should more extreme measuresbe adopted for disfranchising negrovoters?

Floral Antiseptic
Tooth Powder. Efficient and ex-ceedingly agreeable. It thoroughlycleanses the Teeth, keeps them whitethe breath sweet, and the gumshealthy. Contains nothing injurious.Can bottles only 10 cents-at McKel-lip's Drug Store.

How the Law Worked.

As many of our readers no doubt
read but a comparatively few papers,
they are unaware of the feeling which
exists all over the state in reference
to the election law. For their infor-mation, we add the following from a
few of our last week's exchanges;
"There were 584 votes cast in thisdistrict on Tuesday and although notime was wasted, beyond that natur-ally to be apprehended under the sys-tem, the election officers were kept incontinuous service for 30 hours in or-der to complete the count. All thisto accomplish a secret ballot, and it isour unbiased and positive view of thematter that the old "vest pocket"ballot cast here on Tuesday wouldhave shown practically the same re-sult, 80 really, what does all this folde rol about ballot secrecy amountto? The intention of the law may begood enough, but it is so completelycircumvented by the wiles and devicesof the party workers that the wholebusiness is, practically, a dead letterand the claim of ballot secrecy andprotection of the franchise a horn-swogglement and a delusion."-Thur-mont Clarion (Dem.)

"That some change in the electionlaw of Maryland which will facilitatethe counting of votes is needed isdemonstrated by the slowness withwhich the returns of Tuesday's elec-tion have been received. A system ofcounting which leaves the result ofan election in doubt for twelve or pos-sibly twenty-four hours after the pollshave been closed is eminently unsat-isfactory, and the people will demandthe adoption of some plan which willdo away with this suspense and makeIt possible to have the result of anelection known within a reasonabletime. Such a change in the systemof counting is also to be desired inthe interest of the election officials."-Frederick News (Ind.)

"The result does not to any degreesignify or ratify the will of the major-ity of the voters of the county. Butrepresents a high handed and delib-erate steal, protected by a "law"framed and enacted for the very pur-pose of thwarting the will of themajority. With a registered vote of4750, there was cast a total of 4650votes-one of the heaviest polls in thehistory of the county. But of the 4650ballots cast only 3600 were actuallycounted, 1000 being rejected uponsome technicality.
Of the 1000 rejected ballots 700 werenot put into the ballot boxes at allbut deliberately thrown aside by thejudges in charge of the boxes becauseof a slight variation in the fold whichwas due entirely to the manner inwhich the ballots were originallyfolded. Enough of straight, honestand legitimate Republican ballotswere rejected by this method to haveInsured every candidate on the Re-publican ticket more than 100 major-ity."-Chestertown Enterprise (Rep.)

"It required but a day of ten hoursto cast the vote but it took the elec-tion officials a night and a day tocount and tally the number of votesfor each candidate on the ticket. ThatIs one of the great benefits of the op-eration of the delightful Democraticelection law."-Frederick Examiner(Rep.)

"It was generally known that itwould take all night and part of thenext day to count the vote of Middle-town district, as well as nearly all theother districts in the county, owingto the "disfranchisement ballot,"which necessitates the reading ofevery name on every ballot, and soonafter the polls closed the country pollsclosed the country people began leav-ing town. The counting of the voteof Middletown district was not con-cluded until 12 o'clock Wednesdaynoon, when the result was announc-ed."-Middletown Register (Rep.)

"The voting was slow enough butthe count was worse. What the peo-ple want, and we are speaking for abig majority, is some sort of a shift in

the law as will give us a ballot secretstill and independent as this one butless cumbersome and less large andeasier to handle. The Mail does notstand to disfranchise any man, pooror rich. But we are unalterablypledged to the principle that a intelli-gent ballot is not much to ask anyoneand that a secret one is the boon oflabor and the poor man's harbor frompolitical pressure and wealthy con-trol."-Hagerstown Mail (Dem.)

"If the present ballot is continuedin Maryland elections, majorities willhave to be figured on a basis of one-fourth less than formerly, owing torejected ballots in this county; ifcounted as to the actual intent of thevoter, would have come near chang-ing the rusult as to one or two candi-dates. Thus we see the effects of thepresent election law as it applies totrue results."-Garrett Journal (Ind.Dem.)

"Whatever changes are made in theelection law,it seems to be incumbentupon election supervisors to providebetter booth arrangements for the ac-commodation of voters. Even if a vot-ers succeeds in keeping his ballot outof dangerous proximity to the primitive means of illumination supplied,it is exceeding difficult to handle theimportant bit of paper on the narrowshelf that is provided in many poll-ing places. The chances of lettingthe pencil slip in the making of amark near the edge of the shelf andeither puncturing the ballot or ex-tending the crossmark across one ofthe invialable boundaries prescribedare uncomfortably great."-Catons-vine Argus (Dem.)

"The 5th. district, the smallest butone in Baltimore county, has a regis-tered vote of 626, of which number 16are colored. In counting the vote onTuesday night 73 ballots were thrownout on account of improper marks,etc. So if the entire 16 colored menvoted and all of their ballots were imperfect, it will be seen that there are57 white men in the district who wentto the polls who are incapable ofmarking their ballots correctly."-Bait. Co. Union (Rep.)

"Theie were just 100 ballots thrownout at Towson-60 in the 3rd. precinctand 40 at the 4th. precinct. The plac-ing of the candidates names in alphabetical form, together with thenumber of candidates to be voted forwas sufficient cause to confuse theaverage voter, and the alloted 7 min-utes entitled each voter was infring-ed upon in many instances to twicethat limit. It was said that at the"school" to teach colored voters howto mark their ballots correctly onMonday night, out of about 60 per-sons present 35 were unable to do thework properly."-Towson Journal(Dem.)

"One thousand and fifteen voterswere disfranchised in Allegany coun-ty in Tuesday's election by the in-famous Democratic election law, asshown by the investigation of theBoard of Election Supervisors. Inevery precinct in the county ballotswere thrown out because they did notmeet with the requirement of thatextra-session law. In the main, theelectors robbed of their suffrage arethe laboring class. In the districtswhere the colored vote was heavy thenumber of spoiled ballots was lessthan in the districts where the whiteman reigns supreme. When the factis recalled that this wholesale disfran-chisement represents 15 per cent. ofthe total vote cast in Allegany coun-ty, the hideous character of the Gor-man trick-ballot law becomes distress-ingly apparently.--Cumberland News.
Mr. Williams on the Result.

Stevenson A. Williams, the Repub-lican candidate for Governor, hasgiven for publication, the followingstatement of his views as to the caus-es which led to his defeat. We givethem, not so much because it is im-portant for the people to know whathe thinks on the subject, but becauseof the excellent advice containedtherein, especially to professional pol-iticians and would-be party bosses, asthey relate to rulership of the people;
"The Republicans of Marylandhave met with an overwhelming de-feat. There is nothing in it to dis-courage, but much that is hopefulfor the future. The causes of this de-feat and their relative importance are,in my view, as follows:
First-The election law, with itstechnicalities, and the ballots thrownout, was our greatest difficulty. Ofcourse, some Democratic ballots werethrown out, too; but in the shuffle wewere very largely the losers.Second-Our factional differences,some of which have existed for sever-al years,but the most serious of whichare of recent growth. These bicker-inks caused many who would havebeen willing to aid us, had we beenthoroughly united,to become disgust-ed and doubt our ability to make aneffective and winning fight. Whenwe -become so thoroughly interestedin the work for the public good lyingnear the hand of every Republican inthis State that each of us prefers todo it rather than reach over it to aima blow at some other Republican, wewill surely win again. If we reallywish to be a majority party, we mustact as if we regarded fights for meas-ures as the chief work of the party-not fights for officeholding. Until wedo this, our success will be but localand occasional.

Third-The Democrats have a bet-ter organization than the Republi-cans. Such work with the former ismore professional than amateur. Ours,in most eases, is more amateur thanprofessional.
Fourth-The race question un-doubtedly cut a considerable figure,for there are many of our people whoget very much alarmed about it.Valuable lessons for the future maybe learnes1 from these causes of ourdefeat. We are growing more andmore to realize that our success mustdepend entirely upon the confidenceof our own people in us and their be-lief that wsk are thoroughly united togive fair elections and good govern-ment first, last and all the time, andnot divided in scrapping about officesand political honors. If our defeatdrives these lessons home and the con-test we have made induces ourfriends, the enemy, to carry out someof their pledges, then the past cam-paign will not have been barren offruit."

Not a Sick Day Since.
"I was taken severely sick withkidney trouble. I tried all sorts ofmedicine, none of which relievedme. One day I saw an ad. of yourElectric Bitters and determined totry that. After taking a few doses Ifelt relieved, and soon thereafter wasentirely cured, and have not seen asick day since. Neighbors of minehave been cured of Rheumatism,Neuralgia, Liver and Kidney troublesand General Debility." This is whatB. F. Bass, of Fremont, N. C., writes.Only 50c, at R. S. McKiuney's Drug-gist.

Western Prosperity.
•

Washington, Oct. 20.-The Wash-
ington correspondents who have re-
cently returned from "the irrigation
trip" through the West bring back
glowing accounts of the prosperous
conditions which prevail in that sec-
tion. After making all due allowance
for the "booming" tendencies of the
Western people, one may feel sure
that the present outlook is remarka-
bly bright, and that the recent de-
pression in the stock market has not
reflected real conditions in the heart
of the republic.
"It is doubtful if the people of the

East," said one of the party, "have
any conception of what is going on
west of the Mississippi. In the five
weeks' journey through Missouri,
Kansas, Colorado, Utah, Idaho, Mon-
tana. Wyoming and Indian Territory,
I heard not one dissenting voice from

ANer's
Give nature three helps, andnearly every case of con-sumption will recover. Freshair, most important of all.

Cherry
Pectoral

Nourishing food comes next.Then, a medicine to controlthe cough and heal the lungs.Ask any good doctor."I first used Ayer's Cherry Pectoral 53 yearsago. I have seen terrible cases of lung dis-eases cured by it. I cm never without R."ALBERT G. HAMILTON, Marietta, Ohio.The., Me., 51.00. J. C. AVER CO,
MaRMMISMISIMMISI for  

All drotra wists. Loell, Mass.M 

Consumption
Health demands daily action of thebowels. Aid nature with Ayer's Pills:

the universal acclaim of prosperity. Italked with men in all walks of life,trim the farm hand to the bank pres-ident. Travelling men said theycould not get goods to their customersfast enough. Farmers said cropswere bountiful, and prices all thatcould be wished. R-tilroad men saidtheir only trouble was to handle theenormous volume of traffic. Manu-facturers said their only difficultywas in getting the additions to theirplants completed FO they could catchup with their orders. The warehousemen had no more room in theirelevators; the bankers had vaultsfilled with clepcsits and a ready de-mand for money; contractors andbuilders had work in sight for a yearahead: even the cattle in the fieldsand the horses in the streets lookedsleek. The mortgage on the farm hasbeen paid off, and the farmer hasmoney to loan. Industrials are mak-ing money and railroads are payingdividends. The earth has been pro-lific; buying, selling, carrying, devel-oping, all are going forward with ahum of industry that can almost beheard. Confidence is strong and faithin the future is firm.
"Talk about Wall Street makes theWestern man laugh. A banker and acattle shipper remarked that therewas a time, not many years ago, whena situation like the present one inNew York would have shaken the in-dustrial West to its foundations. Butnow the values in which Wall Streetdeals seem largely remote and apartfrom the real business of the country.Western activities and money are athome. Their business is real. Theircrops are in sight. Their money is inthe bank, or invested in local indus-tries, farms, cattle ranches, sugarfactories, irrigation reservoirs andbusiness blocks. These, values do notshrink in a day and are not mattersof sentiment or speculation.

"Nothing short of a disastrous cropfailure can check the present prosper-ity. The farmer now is not in theconditions of 1893, when he was carry-ing a heavy mortgage, and had toborrow from month to month and
year to year to harvest and move hiscrops. To-day he is intrenched be-hind a farm which is paid for and abank account which is ample, to saynothing of the wheat in his barnsand the cattle in his fields. The farm-er is prepared to stand off the wolffor k long siege, and so long as he isprosperous the rest of the country

will do very well. It is the farm, andnot Wall Street. which supports thecountry."

Stepped Against a Hot Stove.
A child of Mrs. Geo. T. Benson,when getting his usual Saturdaynight bath, stepped back against ahot stove which burned him severe-ly. The child was in great agony andhis mother could do nothing to pacifyhim. Remembering that she had abottle of Chamberlain's Pain Balm inthe house, she thought she would tryit. In less than half an hour after applying it the child was quiet andasleep, and in less than two weekswas well. Mrs. Benson is a well knownresident of Kellar, Va. Pain Balm isan antiseptic liniment and especiallyvaluable for burns, cuts, bruises andsprains. For sale by R. S. McKinney,Druggist, Taneytown, Md.

Facts about Emigration.

Roughly speaking, emigration ispromoted in the countries that sendus the least desirable citizens and re-
tarded in those that send us the mostdesirable. Southern Italy must find
an outlet for its surplus population;
the Italian Government resents ourrestrictions. For the laborers send
many postal orders home, and fre-
quently return with modest compe-
tencies to establish themselves in
small shops or op small farms. De
Plehve has as good as said that he
would like to drive all the Jews in
Russia to America.
No one realizes better than the Ger-

man Emperor the value of a strong
young man to an industrial commmu-
nfty. Twenty years ago emigration
left a dearth of agricultural labor in
Germany. The Kaiser set out to keep
his Germans at home and has pretty
well succeeded. German steamship
companies carry on an active propag-
anda In Italy, Slavonia, and in Rus-
sia as well; but in the Fatherland it-
self nothing of the sort is permitted.Every German being catalogued bythe police, it is not only easy to stop
the departure of those of militaryage, but also to discourage the de-parture oi others. An American vis-iting Hungary is told politely that"we encourage the worst to go andkeep the others."-Collier's Weekly.

A Scientific Discovery.
Kodol Dyspepsia Cure does for thestomach that which it is unable to dofor itself, even when but slightly dis-ordered or over-loaded. Kodol Dys-pepsia Cure supplies the naturaljuices of digestion and does the workof the stomach, relaxing the nervoustension, while the inflamed muscles ofthat organ are allowed to rest andheal. Kodol Dyspepsia Cure digestswhat you eat and enables the stomachand digestive organs to transform allfood into rich, red blood. Sold by J.McKellip, Taneytown, Md.

Mortgages, Deeds, Notes
We sell the above forms at the fol-lowing prices:-
Mortgages, single copy, .10

3 copies, .25
8 " .50
20 " .00

single copy,
6 copies,

16 12

It

ts

Deeds,
•

46 20 "

.05

.25

.45

.70Promissory Notes, 15 copies, .05• 
" 35 " .10GI 
" 100 " .25

Also, Type-writer Paper in fourgrades, size 8x101, in small quantitiesor by the 1000 sheets, cut from flatpapers in stock.

YOUNT'S.
We Have the

Army School Shoe
For Boys.

It's a Shoe made without a seam inthe back and an extra good piece ofsole leather in the bottom.Boys sizes, 2's to 5's, $1 50Youth's Low-heel, sizes 9's to 13's,$1.25.

Warm Footwear
For Cold Weather.

Men's Wool Boots, Perfection Overs,$2.00 Pair.
Women's Wool Combination Boots,$1.75 Pair.
Boys' Wool Combination Boot', $1.50Pair.

Lambs-wool Soles
For Bedroom Slippers.

Women's sizes, 3's to 8's, 25c Pair.Misses' sizes, 11's to 2's, 20c Pair.

A Beautiful Assortment
of Vases, 10c each.

12 inches high, assorted colors. paneland fancy tulip shape tops.
This month only 10c.

Enamel Sauce Pan, I 9c.
4-qt. seamless Berlin sauce pans.Regular pnce 35e, while they last 19c.

Clocks, $1.95.
Wood Mantle Clocks, oak finishedornamental tops. Guaranteed first-class 8-day movement.These may never again sell for $1.95.Better buy now and be sure.

China Plates that sell.
10c each.Size 7+ inch good China, assortedfloral decorations.

Doll Bargain.
Patent washable baby doll, creponslip, baby hood size 12+ inch. 10e thismonth; worth every bit of 15c.

Iron Toy.
Horse and Wagon with driver,usually sold for 20c. This mouth onlyat 10c.
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Separators
and  Agents.

Eight years' experience with
representatives of Cream

Separators.

In all this time it seems that mostof them are hot air, with which theyare filled before they start operatingIn the field.
I saw at a glance that the hot airworked to perfection with the pros-pective purchaser, near town as thelatter was overcome by the heat, butjust as soon as that hot air comes incontact with the EMPIRE pusher.theresult is a spontaneous combustion,and after the debris is all clearedaway you will find the EMPIREscrewed firmly to the floor near town,and a new member is added to thatfamous EMPIRE family, and Mr.Farmer near town is heard singingthat bisautiful song in the "Good OldWinter Time," which is as follows:
We skim our milk coldWith the Empire bowlIn the good old winter time.And we certainly can seeIt's all they claim it to beIn the good old winter time.

It's then we can tellWhy it beats all other SeparatorsAnd all in one voice we do yell.Skimming with the Empire is enjoying,While with the other Separator its annoyingIn the good old winter time.
CHORUS.In the good old winter timeThe Empire is first in lineAnd strolling down the Scrap Pile laneThe other Separators you'll find.The Empire's the machine to skim cold milk,And that's a very sure signWhy we farmers want the Empire machine,In the good old winter time.

D. W. GARNER, Agent,
TANEYTOWN, MD.

DAVID B. SHAUM
k 

BUTCHER.
Dealer in Fresh and Cured Meats.Highest Cash Price always paid forFat Cattle, Hogs, Lambs, Calves,Beef Hides and Furs of all kinds.Proprietor of-

Taneytown Meat Market.
Regular wagon service throughoutthe adjoining country.2-18 1-tf

Try our Special JV'otice

Column when you have an
item, or two to sell, n,o mat-
ter what it may be! If you
want to buy, try it then,!
"Gets at the joints from the inside;"that's the method of cure by Rheuma-cide. You'll find it is your druggist'spride.

Hesson's Department Store.
E cannot make a proper display of any goods in show win-dows, until our landlord has them finished, which will bedone as soon as the glass arrives, However, do not thinkthat because we have nothing in the windows, that we have not
The Finest and Best Selected Stock

of all the latest effects in Dry Goods-DrEss Plaids, Cashmeres,Henriettas, Serges, Venitians, Broadcloths, and a fine line ofSilk Goods in black and colors, at prices up to $1.50 per yard.Remember, our prices on Calicoes, Muslins, Ginghams,CantonFlannels and Red, White, and Blue Flannels_ are on the GroundFloor.

Also a full line of Mercerized Goods and Silks, suitable forLadies' Waists,

Dress Trimmings.
This line contains all the lateststyles of Laces, Braids, Ornamentsand Buttons.

Underwear.
A full line of Underwear for men,women and children.

Boots and Shoes.
All we ask in this department is acall of inspection, and y o u will beconvinced that this is the place tobuy your footwear.

Carpets, Mattings
and Oilcloths.

If you need anything in this line,it will pay you to see our assortmentand get prices on same before pur-chasing elsewhere.

Ready-made Clothing.
This department is full of all thelatest styles of Overcoats and Suitsfor men, boys and youths, at rightprices. Also, a full line Hats andCaps.

Thanking you for your liberal patronage during our OpeningWeek, we solicit a share of your future trade.

D. J. HESSON, - - Taneytown, Md. 
THE BIRNIE TRUST CO.
- TANEYTOWN, MD. -

TRANSACTS A GENERAL BANKING BUSINESS.Receives Deposits subject to Check. Pays Interest on time Deposits,Discounts Business Notes. Makes Loans on approved security.Gives Special Rates to Weekly and Monthly Depositors.Legal Depository for Trust Funds. Collections promptly attended toAuthorized to accept TRUSTS of every description-as Receiver,Trustee, Administrator. Executor, Assignee or Guardian.We have SAFETY DEPOSIT BOXES FOR RENT, inside of a Fire and Bur-
glar proof vault, at from $1.00 to $3.00 per year, according to size.You have VALUABLE PAPERS, such as Insurance Policies, Deeds, Mort
gages, Bonds, Stocks, Certificates, etc., which should be kept in a safe place
-you cannot afford to be without a box at this price.Note the Progress of this Bank since its institution.

TOTAL DEPOSITS.
Feb. 9, 1899. ... .$178,896 85.
Feb. 9, 1900  202,297.09
Feb. 9, 1901  242,330.46.
Feb. 9, 1902  285,592.20
Feb. 9, 1903 .. . 31,304.03.

Feb.
Feb.
Feb.
Feb.
Feb.

TOTAL LOANS.
9, 1899 $164.463.88.
9, 1900  200,373.43.
9, 1901  225,693 30.
9, 1902..   277,336.43.
9, 1903 ... 323,439.56.

-- DIRECTORS.EDW. E. HEINDOLLAR, President. GEORGE H. RIRNIE, Cashier.
J. J. WEAVER, JR., Vice-President. G. WALTER WILT, Ass't Cashier.
MARTIN D. li ESS. EDWIN H. SHARETTS. HARVEY E. WEANT.0505000505050505050505050800o5o5o5o•o505o•0iloO0lio5o5o

•If You are looking,... ••0•0 FOR BARGAINS IN  •0
•0
, •0
•store and get prices before buy- 0
•0
•0
•0
•0
•
t

•0 Remember we carry everything that is new and up-to- 0o
• date in Neckwear, Collars, Shirts, Gloves, hosiery, 0
0 

•
• Underwear, Suspenders, Overalls, Trunks and 0
0 

•
• Suit Cases. Give us a call. 0
4, 

0
• 

••0 WM. C. DEVILBISS •
0 

0
p o

• 
22 W. Main St., Westminster, Md. •0

• 
•
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•0
•0
•0
•
• SHOES, HATS, AND
0
0•0 It will pay you to visit our•0 ing elsewhere.•0
•0
•0
•0

GENTS' FURNISHINGS

Having taken the agency for a new line of Ladies' Shoes,we will close our present stock of $3.00 and $3.50Shoes at $2.50.

J. J. ELLIS.
CHAS. J. STOLL.

ELLIS de STOLL,(Successors to ELLIS tiz BONSACK)Commission MerchantsMain Office and Warehouse,17 W. Camden St. - Baltimore, Md.Branches-1331 W. Baltimore St.. and Patapsco Ave. (Brooklyn)SPECIALTIES OF THIS SEASON:-Potatoes, Poultry, Dressed Pork, Butter and EggsMd. Phone-Bl481-B4471-X152.

OAK HALL ANNOUNCEMENT.___-
Fall and Winter Goods.We invite you to call and see our Fall Stock- Dress Goods in great variety, 25c to 21.25

per yard. Velvets. Silks, Braids and Laces to trim, Flannels, Fleeced Cordets. Mercerized
s.Wimalsgtiin.agdse,.Outings, Flannelettes. all the latest; Beautiful W &Laists from 50c to 0O-regularLadies' and Children's Coats and Skirts.You will regret It by not getting a pair of our Ladies' Shoes at $1.50 to $1.50,
Qur stock of Clothing is comi)lete-Gents', Youths' and Children's. Also Agents for first-

class Tailoring Establishment-300 different samples to select from-Fit Guaranteed; prices
from $13.00 to $30.00. Give us your measure. Also Agents for Brethren's Suits,Our Shoe and Boot Stook is Complete.Nobby Hats and Caps to your liking. Our Gents tOe Fleeced Underwear we will sell at
45c during the Fall.

Blankets, Comforts, Carpets, Oilcloths, Cheap.Our aim is to sell good, clean, desirable goods atVery Moderate Prices, Thanks for past trade.We hope to see you.Very Respectfully,

Come and See Us !
New Windsor, Md. GEO. C. ANDERS.

REMEMBER 
J. S. MYERS, 0.0. II J. C. MYMYERS BROS., Surgeon Dentists,

ERS D. D. S.

WESTMINSTER, MD.The Closing Out Sa'0 work. CROWN and BRIDGE work a special-

We are prepared to do all kinds of Dental
ty. PLATE WORK and REPAIRING willbe given prompt attention.-AT - GAS ADMINISTERED.J. E. MYERS will be in New Windsor, Mon-day,, Tuesday and Wednesday of each week,Reindollar, Hess & Co. s awnedee Westminster the remainder of the

Our Goods must go, and Some ofthem right now.
Anything we have in Fans, Gloves,Mite, Laces, Lawns and SummerGoods in general, must go, withoutregard to cost.

We have still a lot of

Shoes
in stock, and some very good ones,which you can buy very cheap. Theymust be sold.

Now is the time for

Glass Jars.
We haye a lot on hand at a lowprice. Come and get them beforethey are all gone.

We still have a few pieces of

Matting and Carpets
to close out. It will pay you to buyjust now. If you need anything inour line, here is the place to savemoney. Give us a call-we will treatyou right.

REINDOLLAR HESS & CO.

J. S. MYERS will be in Taneytown the firstFriday and Saturday of each month.W. M.. and C. & P. Telephones, 10-13-2

HORSES AND COWS WANTED

Will pay the highest cash dollar for Horsesand Mules, Fresh Cows, Springers, Bolognas,Bulls and Fat Stock of all kind. Persons hav-ing any of the above stock for sale, will dowell by dropping me a postal card, as I willbe pleased to call and see stock at any time.Will have Horses and Mules always on hand.for sale and exchange.
HOWARD J. SPALDING.

1-31-3, tf. LITTLESTOWN, PA

Notice to Creditors.This is to give notice that the subscriberhas obtained from the Orphans' Court ofCarroll County, in Md., letters of administra-tion upon the estate of
CAROLINE SELL,late of riarroll county, deceased. All personshaving claims against the deceased are here-by warned to exhibit the same, with thevouchers thereof legally authenticated, tothe subscriber, on or before the 24th. day ofApril, 1904; they may otherwise by law beexcluded from all benefit of said estate.Given under my hand this 24th. daj ofOctober. 1902.

DANIEL J. HESSON,10-24-4t Administrator

•••••••••00.04440••••••••••

Money Saved •••

You Can Do Both 4.
4'

Money Made
If you buy your

- Groceries,
of which we always have a fullline, and

Deensware
at our store.

Having replenished my stock
I have on hand a

Very Good Assortment,
and anyone will do well to pur-chase their Queensware from-
D. H. Essia,

TAN EYTOWN,

3
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WASHING MACHINES !
$1.00 to $2.00

Second-hand, warranted not tc
Leak.

The 1900 Washing Machine!
Put out on Trial I

I am Sole Agent for this wide!)known machine, in this section; alsthave a fine lot of other machines-infact I am prepared to supply you withany make of Washing Machine orClothes Wringer on the market; alsoRepairs to the same. Call to see we.All goods put out on trial. Satisfac-tion guaranteed. Respectfully,
L. K. BIRELY, Agent,2-7-3 MIDDLEBURG, Mr.

DR. J. W. HELri,
SURGEON DENTIST,

New Windsor, - Maryland.
Crown and Bridge Work, Plate Work, Fill-ing Teeth,and Teeth extracted without pain.I will be in TANEVTOWN.Ist. Wednesday ofeach month. Engagements can be madewith me by mail, and at my office in NewWindsor, at all other times except the 3rd.Saturday, and Thursday and Friday, imme-diately preceding that day. Nitrous OxideGas administered.
J. W. HELM, D. D. S., Graduate of Mary-land University Baittmore. 2-1-4

TAN EYTOWN

SAVINGS BANK
Does a General Banking Busmes.Loans Money on Real or Personal sectrity.
Discounts Notes.Collections and Remittances promptlmade.Interest Paid on Time Deposits.

HENRY GALT, TreasurerJ AS. C. GALT, President.

DIRECTORS.LEONARD ZILE,
JOSHUA KOUTZ,
JAMES C. GALT,
C. W. WEAVER,
W. W. CRAPSTER,

H. 0. STONESIFER,
JOHN S. BOWER,
JOHN J. CRAPSTER,
CA LVIN T. BRINGER
HENRY GALT.

le•••••ess•••••••••••ssosse••••4

Ceptral Hotel.
TANEYTOWN, MD.

THE CENTRAL is entirely new, andnewly furnished throughout. AllModern Improvements.Steam Heat, Bath Rooms and Clots-ets. Charges Moderate. Satlefactionguaranteed.

First-class Livery Connected.
Free Lunch every Saturday night-

3-14-ly ELIAS FISSEL, Prop'r.
••••••••••••••••••••••••••

Littlestowli Carriage Works,

S. D. MEHRING
MANUFACTURER OF

1

Fine Carriages, Buggies,
PHAETONS, TRAPS,
CARTS. CUTTERS, &C.

FINE.lb•-••Dayton, McCall, Jagger
Repairing Promptly Donel
Low Prices and all Work Guaranteed.
LITTLESTOWN, PA.

Opposite Depot

The Carroll County -
Produce Company,

of Taneytown, Md.,
Begs leave to inform the public thatthey have rented the

KOONS WAREHOUSEfor a number of years, and have cometo Taneytown to stay, for the pur-pose of buying all kinds of Produce,Hides and Tallow.Poultry, Eggs, and Calves
Specialty. We do not quote prices,but will pay the Highest Cash Pricethe market affords, and hope, by fairand square dealing, to secure a fairshare hf public patronage. Satisfac-tion guaranteed for delivery of calves.
CARROLL CO. PRODUCE CO.,

1 25-3 GEO. W. MOWERY, Mgr.

- WE PRINT -
- WE PRINT -

WEDDING TN VITATIONR,WEDDING INVITATIONS,

PROGRAMS.
PROGRAMS.

FINE STATIONERY.FINE STATIONERY.

ANNOUNCEMENTS.
ANNOUNCEMENTS,

FOLDERS, BOOKLETS.FOLDERS, BOOKLETS.

MENU CARDS,
MENU CARDS.

LATEST STYLES.
LATEST STYLES.

SAMPLES FURNISHED.SAMPLES_FURNISHED,
- RECORD OFFICE. -- RECORD OFFICE.



I.

CHRISTIAN ENDEAVOR.

Topic For the Week Beginning Nov.

15-Comment by Rev. S. II. Doyle.

Topic.-How may we help abolish the
saloon?-Eph. vi. 10-13. (Temperance.)

That the saloon should be abolished

should admit of no question. That it

Is the direct cause of drunkenness can-

not be denied, nor can it be so regulat-

ed by the state as to make it possible

for the saloon to exist without making

drunkards. License as a preventive of

excessive drinking is a failure. The

most stringent laws about selling to

minors and to confirmed drunkards

have proved a failure. The young

patronize the saloons, and those cursed

with the appetite for strong drink have
no difficulty in obtaining it. If the sa-
loon were abolished and alcohol used
only for medicinal purposes drunken-
ness would soon pass away. But it
never will while the saloon exists. In
the face of the terrible effects of in-
temperance how can any one interested
in humanity advocate the saloon or
oppose its destruction?
The problem of abolishing the saloon

Is beyond question a gigantic one. Its
patrons are legion, and there are le-
gions more who are absolutely indif-
ferent to the havoc it plays among the
children of men. But this only makes
It the more important that those who
do desire and pray for its overthrow
should be instant in season and out
of season for the accomplishment of
their purpose.
The saloon can be abolished. To

some this may seem a vain boast, but
It Is not so. The saloon has been abol-
ished. In some towns, in some coun-
ties and even in some states it has
been prohibited and has ceased to ex-
ist, and what has been on a smaller
scale can be on a larger one if the
people of the larger sphere can be
made to see and act as have those in
the smaller one. The abolishing of the
saloon in the smallest hamlet in the
United States is conclusive proof that
It can be abolished throughout the en-
tire nation if the people of the nation
will act as the people of the hamlet.
Since the saloon should be abolished

and can be abolished, what may we do
to bring about this desirable end?

1. We may help abolish the saloon
by personal action. No one who de-
sires the overthrow of the curse of
mankind should ever patronize it in
any way, shape or form. The total ab-
stainer, is a constant hindrance to the
saloon, and if all men could be led to
totally abstain from intoxicating drinks
as a beverage the saloon would soon
close its doors and cease to exist.
2. We may help abolish the saloon

by educational influence. Public opin-
ion should be educated against the
saloon, and every antisaloonist should
be an educator of the public upon this
subject The saloon is firmly intrenched
In our national life. It is supported by
tremendous financial and political in-
fluences; but, for all that, when the
people of the United States want the
saloon to go and say to the saloon
"Go!" it will go. "Educate" should be
the battle cry of all opposed to the sa-
loon in our land.
3. We may help abolish the saloon

by political action. The ballot is the
decisive influence in our land, and
If all Christian and temperance people
would upon every occasion cast their
ballots against the saloon the day of
Its doom would be hastened. But here
It is well to remember that denuncia-
tion should have no part in our cam-
paign against the saloon. Denuncia-
tion of friends and fellow laborers who
do not see as we do never won a bat-
tle, much less a campaign. God never
made two men exactly alike. Intem-
perate zeal upon the part of many
advocates of temperance has done more
to injure the political campaign against
the saloon than all other causes com-
bined. Education and toleration should
be our watchwords rather than denun-
ciation.
4. We may help abolish the saloon

by prayer. In spite of sin God's power
Is still absolute upon the earth, and
His people should cease not to appeal
unto Him for help in the great struggle
against this gigantic evil. In His
strength we should fight against it
and earnestly call upon Him for divine

power to bring about its overthrow.

BIBLE READINGS.

Josh. 1, 6, 7; Prov. xx, 1; xxiii, 1S-21,

20-32; Isa. v, 11; Zech. Iv, 6; Flab. 11,

15, 16; Matt. xvii, 21; Rom. xiv, 14-23;

I Cor. Iii, 1-7; Gal. v. 19-26.

A New Golf Club.

' A novelty in the way of an iron golf
club with an extension of the sole be-
yond the back line of the head proper
Is now being used. The club is the in-
vention of Billinghall. who won the
Irish championship, and is designed to
prevent the golfer from digging into
the ground and foozling shots.

Fake Kick Under New Rules.

The new football rules seem to en-

courage the fake kick. A full back
may drop to the rear as though he was

going to kick and by a direct pass from
center rush the ball. True, he has to

run out five yards at either side, but
he would do that anyway if he were

to circle the end.

"When the butter won't
come put a penny in the
churn," is an old time dairy
proverb. It often seems to
work though no one has ever

told why.
When mothers are worried

because the children do not

gain strength and flesh we

say give them Scott's Emul-

sion.
It is like the penny in the

milk because it works and

because there is something

astonishing about it.
Scott's Emulsion is simply

a milk of pure cod liver oil

with some hypophosphites

especially prepared for delicate

stomachs.
Children take to it naturally

because they like the taste

and the remedy takes just as

naturally to the children be-

cause it is so perfectly adapted

to their wants.
For all weak and pale and

thin children Scott's Emulsion

is the most satisfactory treat-

ment.
We will send you

the penny, I.2., a

sample free.

Be sure that this picture in
the form of a label is on the
wrapper of every bottle ot
Emulsion you buy.

SCOTT & BOWNE,
Chemists,

409 Pearl St., N. Y.

ere. ard ; cii are 7gists.

The Pledge In Rhyme.

The Christian Endeavor World re-
cently had a competition, with 166 em.

tries. for a rhymed version of the
Christian Endeavor pledge. The fol-

lowing Wits the choice of the judges.
Its author is Lucy (. Whitwell of

Cleveland. 0.:

Now, trusting in the Lord for strength,
This promise I can make:

That I shall try to do His will,
To live for Jesus sake.
My rule of life shall be to pray,
My Bible daily read;

To help my church in every way,
Her services to heed;

Throughout the week. whene'er she calls.
Or on the Sabbath day.

I shall be there unless He leads
My steps another way.

Endeavor meeting I'll attend.
Whene'er that meeting be;

To all my duiles I'll be true;
No silence there for me.

If hindered by the Lord, my God,
I'll not forgetful be,

But send a consecration verse
Which may be read for me.

One Great Object.

But what Is our whole system of
Christian Endeavor if it is not a series

of unconscious steps up invisible moun-
tains? The prayer meetings, in a
sense, are routine affairs, fulfilling the

pledge in our discouraged moments
may seem like a perfunctory obliga-

tion, the committees like the lifeless

parts of a machine, but one great ob-

ject of the society is to form habits of
well doing, habits of confession, of de-
votion, of service.-Rev. Dr. Francis

E. Clark in "Fellow Travelers."

A Runaway Bicycle

Terminated with an ugly cut on the
leg of J. B. Orner, Franklin Grove,
Ill. It developed a stubborn ulcer
unyielding to doctors and remedies
for four years. Then Bucklen's Arni-
ca Salve cured. It's just as good for
Burns, Scalds, Skin Eruptions and
Piles. 25c, at R. S. McKinney's Drug
Store.

To Aunt Polly.

(For tile 1tEcoim.)
I enjoyed your interesting letter

Very much, and now will tell you
about school. I go to the Russ High
School. It is a large building sit
uated on a hill. Any one going
there is said to climb the "Hill of
Knowledge." About three hundred
boys and girls go there. They are
divided into Sophomores, Seniors,
Juniors and Freshies. I belong to
the last named. I wonder if it would
interest you to know about the troub-
les of a "Freshie?" There are about
seventy-the of us this year. It just
seemed as if the Sophomores and Sen-
iors tried to be as mean as they could.

Tile building is large, and in going
to the different rooms one gets con-
f UMW. One poor Freshie in trying to
reach the Algebra room, got lost.
When she asked a large boy who hap-
pened aloug,tie said, -Straight ahead,
turn the corner, and follow your
nose." This so amazed her that she
determined to make bold and open a
door, which inigtit belong to the Al-
gebra room. But, right into the Type-
writing class sue had walked. With
on "excuse me" she went out and
closed the door. She knocked on
several doors but no one admitted
her. By this time the tears were al-
most falling; she was just about to
cry, when a sweet voice asked, "What
is the matter my dear? can I help
you?" She turns, and there stands a
sweet-faced teacher. She tells her
uer troubles and is soon in the right
room. The teachers are all kind, and
make the studies very interesting.
At noon, you may see boys and girls

with lunch baskets seated under every
tree. The hills back of the school
are used for a lunch ground too. The
boys and girls leave their bicycles at
the foot of the hill,under a large Pep-
per tree. They ride them that far,
and, finding them too bard to push
up tee 11111, leave theta there.
After school had been in session for

several weeks, the Sophomores gave
the Freshies a reception. It was held
ot blission Cliff. The program con-
sisted of speeches, music by the school
orchestra, singing, refreshments and
dancing. All went fine until it came
to the refreshments. It was then
found that the Sopho' and Seniors
had stolen all the cookies and cake,
and there was nothing left but fruit
punch. All this was done because
the Juniors made them pay a dime to
get in.
The boys have organized a Foot

Ball team. They are to play the Es-
condido team, Saturday.
Wednesday, Mr. Wright, the Cali-

fornia elocutionist, paid the school a
Visit. Be entertained us, by telling
how woman was made; the story of
the Pessimist and the Optimist, and
a part of one of Shakespeare's plays.
The story of the Pessimist and the
Optimist was very funny. Once, two
frogs lived in the bottom of a pond,
one jolly, and the other cross. Now,
there was a dairyman lived close by
this stream. He kept his milk cans
in this pond so that he would have
cool milk for his customers. He was
in the habit of dipping up one or two
dippers full of water, and puting it
in the wilk. It "made it better" he
said. So, one night he dipped up the
water, and dipped up the two frogs

too. The Pessimist began to grumble.
He was sure that they would die, and

if they lived till morning the man
would kill them. So he sank to the
bottom and died. The Optimist was
not going to die. He wasn't ready
yet. He jumped up and down in the
milk, and even drank some of it. The

next morning the dairyman came to
get his milk, and opening this can,
there sat a frog on a large lump of
nice yellow butter. Out it jumped,

and down into the pond. But in the
bottom of the can was a dead frog,
the Pessimist.
Saturday, Oct. 24th., was Father

Horton's birthday,and a public recep-
tion was tendered him. He is the
father of San Diego, haying built the
first hotel in it, more than fifty years
ago. He is still strong and well, and
people think he will live to see many
more birthdays.
Admission day, the 9th., of Septem-

ber, was oberved as a holiday. There
were boat races and other amuse-
ments.

Good Bye, from
San Diego, Cal. PEARL ECKENRODE.

Sand-Lime Bricks.

From time to time during the last
few years reports have reached this
country from Europe concerning the
production of brick or artificial build-

ing stone by a combination of lime
and sand under pressure. The pro-
cess requires the addition of heat to
complete the hardening, but it is a
simple operation. So successful has
the business become that it has spread
from Germany, where it originated,
to other countries on the Continent
and to Gt. Britain. Much curiosity
has been shown by Americans, but
it does not appear that any factories
have been started here. The interest
already felt, however, has seryed to
draw out important statements from
United States consuls in Germany
within the last few weeks.
Most of the process is so simple that

it is practically unpatentable. Sev-
eral patents hays been taken out,
but they touch only some alleged im-
provement in the art whose merit is
uncertain. One man uses a chemical,
for instance, to promote hardening;
but there are equally good or better
methods of doing the same thing.
Thus, anyone who wants to take up
the business in America is free to do
so. It is too soon to say whether it
will ever be a serious rival ot the clay
brick industry, but the sand-lime sys-
tem will doubtless have a trial, at
least.
No one zan tell yet from actual ex-

perience how well the new building
material will last. It has been in ac-
tual service only a few years. Some
of the earlier products, dried slowly
in the air, show a tendency to grow
more flinty with age, but it is impos-
sible to say how long this trait will
continue. However, elaborate tests
have been made with both air dried
and steam hardened bricks and build-
ing stones by the Swiss Government
and by the imperial testing station at
Charlottenburg, which is standard
for Germany. The sum of all testi-
mony thus obtained is that, when
io.pprired properly, made of pure,

good materials, artificial sand-lime
bricks and stones are permanent and
fulfil all the requirements of high
class building materials.
According to the United States Con-

sul at Berlin, the indispensible mater-
ials are good, clean, sharp sand-as
free as possible from impurities and
containing not less than 70 per cent
of silicic acid-and fresh quicklime,
such as would be suitable for making
mortar of good quality. All the dif-
ferent methods or "systems" thus far
invented for combining these two
inaterialsmay be grouped in two cat-
egories, viz., those in which the lime
is slacked separately and then mixed
with sand, and, secondly, those in
which the dry sand and quicklime
are thoroughly mixed and then slack-
ed. The latter method is generally
practiced. Throughout the whole
process, whichever method of slacking
is used, the point of prime importance
is uniformity, without which there
can be no excellence in the product
or profit in the manufacture.

Only One Way is Right.

"My boy," said Uncle Hiram once, while
giving me advice

"The saw that doesn't wabble is the one that
cuts the ice.

The saw that close applies itself within its
narrow groove

win soon or late fulfill its work by keepin'
on the move.

When half way through, temptation may
beset it, like as not,

To leave the place that seemed hard and
seek a thinner spot,

But shittin' saws will learn, at length, when
failure they invite,

There's many a way o' doin' things, but only
one way's right I

And bear in mind, my boy, through life, if
tempted tasks to shirk,

Success is but a second crop, the aftermath
o' work.

A lubricator tried and true is perseverance
oil,

And fortune's smile is rarely won except by
honest toil.

A safe cross cut to fame or wealth has never
yet been found;

The men upon the heights to-day are those
who've gone around

The longest way, inspired by the sayin',
somewhat trite.

There's many a way o' doh,' things, but only
one way's right!'

I knew my Uncle Hiram had achievement's
summit reached,

I knew him as an honest man who practiced
what he preached,

And so I paid the lesson heed and rapt at-
tention gave,

When in an added afterthought he said: "My
boy, be brave!

Act well your cart; tenaciously to one
straight course adhere;

Though men declare you're in a rut, work on
and never fear;

You'll realize, when you at length have
reached achievement's height,

There's many a way o' doin' things, but only
one way's right!"

Roy Farrell Green in Success.

Thanksgiving Day.

Only in the New England states do
we find the true Thanksgiving spirit:
there the day is held sacred and cele-
brated with a due sense of what the
day signifies. In the South and West
it is observed more as a matter of
form, or for the close association it
has with the old home "back East,"
where Thanksgiving was eagerly an-
ticipated for weeks. Changes have
come since then, but the memory of
those happy times lingers. We can
all find something to feel thankful for
if we try; therefore let us enter into
the true spirit of 441k10 occasion, and
put forth our bet tforts to make
this a day of tru jarkgiving and
joy for the dear Naas n our home.
Do not make t ;stake of think-

ing it will not be "worth while" to
make extra preparations unless com-
pany will be present,-the chances
are your company wouldn't appre-
ciate your efforts half as much as the
members of your own family. When
one is not able to have turkey for din-
ner the following menu may be help-
ful in a suggestive way
Roast pork; spare ribs with dress-

ing: chicken pie; squash; glazed sweet-
potatoes; pickles; pumpkin pie; mince
pie, New England pudding. Fruit.
Coffee. If desirable the above may
be made more elaborate by the ad-
dition of celery and salads Cut the
spare ribs so they may be folded and
the dressing placed between the lay-
ers. To make the dressing, crumble
fine as muchjeread as will be needed,
moisten with cold water, season with
plenty of sage, pepper and salt, add
one egg beaten light.
Make the pudding in same manner

as bread pudding, using crackers in-
stead of bread, and add one cupful of
whole raisins. Cherry dumplings
may be substituted for the pudding.
Sweeten one quart of canned cherries
and bring to a boil. When boiling,
gently add the dumplings, which are
made the same as baking powder bis-
cuit. Cut the dough into two inch
squares, and cook ten minutes. When
done, serye with the cherries placed
about them.-EeLe L. LAYSON, in
_Epitomise.

The Best Remedy for Croup.

(From the Atehison,Kan., Daily Globe)

This is the season when time woman
who knows the best remedies for
croup is in demand in every neighbor-
hood. One of the most terrible things
in the world is to be awakened in the
middle of the night by a whoop from
one of the children. The croup rem-
edies are almost as sure to be lost, in
case oh croup, as a revolver is sure to
he lost in case of burglars. There
used to be an old-fashioned remedy
for croup, known as hive syrup and
tolu, but some modern mothers say
that Chamberlain's Cough Remedy is
better, and does oot cost so much. It
causes the patient to "throw up the
phlegm" quicker, and gives relief in a
shorter time. Give this remedy as
soon as the croupy cough appears and
it will prevent the attack. It never
fails and is pleasant and safe to take.
For sale by R. S. McKinney, Drug-
gist, Taneytown, Md.

The Ideal Home.

The foundation of modern civiliza-
tion and the very cement of moral
society are the family and the home.
In savage life the spirit of individual-
ism predominates; there is no instinct
of solidarity, but as a man becomes
civilized he realizes more and more
the value of cooperation, and the
more truly civilized he becomes the
more coherent become the family and
the home. Sever a man or a nation
from the ideal of singleness of matri-
monial alliance, the family and the
home, and at once there is debase-
ment in moral life, and woman, as
some one has said, instead of being
what God intended her to be, "a
helpmeet to man," becomes his play-
thing or slave.
Home is the place that we bye best,

because it is the place where mother
is, and there, because of her loving
and fostering care, is the place of
greatest earthly security. Man can-
not create the home atmosphere; he
may climb to great heights of fame;
he may win great battles; he may
triumph over all competitors, and
thereby amass great riches; he may
master the sciences, acquire a facility
in innumerable languages, live or
dead, but man, with all his power,
genius and native ability, cannot
make a home. That remains the
task of woman, and in this she re-
mains supreme. Home ought to be
the place where we can find the most
refreshing rest. Home ought to be a
place of genuine warmth; but some
homes are as cold as ice, which
breathe an atmosphere as cold as a
breath from the polar zone. Let our
homes be places of joy, love and
brightest sunshine. Home ought to
be a place of enduring love, the love
which outlasts the wedding day and
produces a life which is one long, un-
broken honeymoon. Home is the
molding-place of character. Your
child has a right to insist that you
live such a life as will exalt the stand-
ard of true manhood and true woman-
hood. Your child has a right to de-
mand that you do nothing to stain by
sin the name you bear and which you
bequeath to him as a life-possession.
Give your child a sweetly religious
atmosphere in which to grow; not one
of monotonous "don't" and "you
must not," but one that presents the
attractive side of Christianity. Let
Christ be the unseen but truly recog-
nized guest in your home, and teach
your child the religion of "the
Book."-G. R. Stair.

Laxative Brom° Qe

Cures a Cold in One Day, Gry in 2 Days

.69/71riele...0 box. 25c

on every

The SPORTING WORLD

Creseens and Lou Dillon.

George H. Ketcham's game stallion

Cresceus is having a merry battle for
trotting honors with Lou Dillon. First

Cresceus leads, and then, a few days
later, news is received announcing that
the spirited little mare owned by C. K.
G. Billings has gone her big rival a
few seconds better.
As matters now stand it is a difficult

matter to prophesy as to just where the

CHESCEUS,

record breaking performances of these
horses will stop. It was but recently
that Cresceus covered a wile at Wichi-
ta, Kan., in 1:59%. only to have his rec-
ord eclipsed shortly after by Lou Dil-
lon, when the Billings mare went the
distance in 1:5SIA
Will Cresceus now turn the tables on

Lou Dillon? Surely a hard task con-
fronts the big stallion, but who can
rightfully deny that he will regain his
lost title?
This great trotter is no exhibition

horse, as lie has defeated most of the
noted trotters of the turf. He is a big
framed chestnut, by Robert McGregor
-Mabel, by Mambrino Howard, and iq
nine years old. He will be retired to
the stud next year.

Ocean to Ocean Motor Run,

Dr. H. Nelson Jackson, who made
the first trip across the continent in an
automobile, has the following to say in
favor of an annual endurance run from
ocean to ocean:
"Such a race would be the greatest

thing that has yet happened ill auto-
mobiling," said he. "It would even
dwarf the comparative importance of
the annual Paris road race and the in-
ternational cup contest. Individual
owners and makers' representatives
would come from Europe for such a
race. Its progress Nvould be watched
by the whole world during the thirty
days or less I estimate the run across
the country would take."

Disastrous Wrecks.

Carelessness is responsible for many
a railway wreck and the same causes
are making human wrecks of sufferers
from Throat and Lung troubles. But
since the advent of Dr. King's New
Discovery for Consumption; Coughs
and Colds, even the worst cases can
be cured, and hopeless resignation is
no longer necessary. Mrs. Lois Cragg
of Dorchester, Mass., is one of many
whose life was saved by Dr. King's
New Discovery. This great remedy

is guaranteed for all Throat and
Lung diseases by R. S. McKinney,
druggist. Price 50c and $1.00. Trial
bottles free.

Chess Champions to Play.

Word has been received from St. Pe-

tersburg that the Russian champion,

M. Tschigorin, will be a competitor in

the forthcoming chL,ss tournament to

be played at Cambridge Springs, Pa.,

next April and May. The European ex-

perts. Lasker, champion of the world;

the Austrian champion. Schlechter; the

French champion. Janowski; the Rus-

sian champion. Tschigorin, and the An-

glo-German expert, Teichtnann, have

accepted the invitation of the manag-

ing directors. while the Americans-

Pillsbury. Marshall. Lipschuetz. Na-

pier. lioOtzes and Barry - have also

stated that they will be on hand when

the contest begins.

Fournier Versus Oldfleld.

Henry Fottruier has been hearth front

regarding Barney Oldfield's challenge.

He says:
"I haee already decided to cross the

ocean. I have no need to be offered

money to do so. and I do not have to

have 15,000 francs inducement. I want

a square and equal race over a dis-

tance calculated to demonstrate the

qualities of a vehicle and a driver."
-

Players Return,

Wylie C. Grant and Robert Le Roy,

both of the New York Lawn Tennis

club. who recently returned from

abroad, had a successful playing sea-

son there. Mr. Le Roy took the cham-

pionship of Europe at The Hague, Hol-

land, and also won the Sussex cup at

Brighton, England. Mr. Grant won

the north of Scotland championship

for the second time.

Skating at World's Fair.

Skating will be a feature at the

world's fair in St. Louis next year.

There will be chamionship races,

open to the world, and probably figure

skating championships decided under

the auspices of the Amateur Skating

association. An artificial rink is to be

built this winter, and this branch of

sport will be a special feature of the

exhibition.

Cured of Piles after 40 Years.

Mr. C. Haney, of Geneva, 0., had

the piles for 40 years. Doctors and
dollars could do him no lasting good.
DeWitt's Witch Hazel Salve cured

him permanently. Invaluable for cuts,
burns, bruises, sprains, lacerations,
eczema, tetter, salt rheum, and all

other skin diseases. Look for tile name

DeWitt on the package-all others

are cheap, worthless counterfeits.
Sold by J. McKellip, Taneytown, Md.

The Influence of the Youth's Com-
panion.

The gospel of good cheer brightens
every page of THE YOUTH'S COMPAN-
ION. Although the paper is nearly
seventy-seven years of age,it does not

look back on the past as a better
period than the present.
The COMPANION believes that the

time most full of promise is the time
we are living in, and every weekly is-

sue reflects this spirit of looking for-
ward and not back.
To more than half a million Ameri-

can families it carries every week its
message of cheer. Its stories picture
the true characteristics of the young
men and women of America. Its ar-
ticles bring nearly three million read-

ers in touch with the best thought of
the most famous of living men and
women.
Annual Announcement Number

fully describing the principal features
of THE COMPANION'S new yolume for

1904 will be sent to any address free.
The new subscriber for 1904 will re-

ceive all the issues of THE COMPAN-
ION for the remaining weeks of 1903
free from the time of subscription,
also THE COMPANION Calendar for
1904, lithographed in twelve colors
and gold.
THE YOUTH'S COMPANION,

144 Berkeley St., Boston, Mass.

The Value of Farmii.

The farms of this country are worth

more to the people than all the mines

and minerals combined. We cannot

eat or clothe our bodies with the prod-

ucts of the mines. The products of the

farms feed and clothe not only our

own people, but to a large extent the

people of other countries, and also en-

rich speculators of every grade.

GETS AT THE JOINTS

FROM THE INSIDE.
BEGINS WORK with the first dose,
cleansing the blood of all the poisonous

acids that produce RHEUMATISM, driving
out all the dangerous germs that infest the

body-that is the way cures are effected by
•

Other medicines treat symptoms; Rheumacide removes the
cause, and, therefore, its

CURES ARE PERMANENT.

Helps the digestion, tones up the system. Sample bottle
free on application to BOBBITT CHEMICAL CO., Pro-

prietors, 316 West Lombard St., Baltimore, Md.

NATIONAL AID.

Row to Get Uncle Sam's Help
Building Good Roads.

Colonel J. H. Brigham, assistant sec-
retary of agriculture at Washington,
In a recent speech at a good roads con-
vention said some things that every-
body ought to read. Among other good
things he said:
"I see no reason why the general

government should not appropriate a
certain sum of money to be expended
In this great work. Of course the
states, counties and local communities
should be expected to co-operate. A
little aid from the general government
would be a wonderful encouragement
to all the people.
"I hear a number of speakers here

saying that we must stir up congress.
Now, I want to impress you with the
idea that we must first educate the
people. When the people are in favor
of national aid in building good roads
congressmen will be in favor of it and
not until then. They are not going
ahead of the people.
"I see no reason why the general

government should not reach out its
strong arm and help the people of this
country get better means of communi-
cation. I want to see this movement
pushed with all the energy that is char-
acteristic of the American people. When
we undertake to do anything in this
country we do it and do it well. We
have started out for better roads, and
we are going forward on this line till
we have as good roads as can be found
anywhere in the world."
In these remarks Colonel Brigham

has sounded the keynote of the good
roads campaign. The masses of the
people must be aroused and educated.
Organization is the principal means to
be employed. Conventions should be
held and associations should be organ-
ized in all sections of the country. It
Is not enough to get out a crowd of
professional road reformers to make
speeches and pass resolutions. The ob-
ject in view is to interest practical and
progressive men in all walks of life, to
arouse the indifferent, to convince the
objectors and to get up a wave of popu-

lar enthusiasm for better roads. Until

this is done no important results will

be accomplied.

In

For a Bad Cold.

If you have a bad cold you need a

good reliable medicine like Chamber-

lain's Cough Remedy to loosen and

relieve it, and to allay the irritation

and inflammation of the throat and

lungs. For sale by R. S. McKinney,

Druggist, Taneytown, Md.

A Big Grain Farm.

Oklahoma chums to have the largest

farm in the southwest. It is the 101
ranch in the Ponca reservation and is

so big that it is necessary to plant sev-
eral varieties of wheat in it, one of
which ripens several days later than
the other, in order that all of them

may be harvested at their prime. On
this farm the wheat fields pre of 1,000
acres each, the cattle pastures are of
1,000 to 1.500 acres each and pasture
6.000 head annually, the corn rows are
one and a half miles long, requiring
500 mules and 300 men to handle the
crop, and it takes thirty self binders
three weeks to cut the wheat crop and
a dozen or more steam thrashers forty
days to thrash it. There are 50,000
acres in the ranch.

DeWitt
DeWitt is the name to look for when

you go to buy Witch Hazel Salve,
DeWitt's Witch Hazel Salve is the
original an d only genuine. In fact
DeWitt'sis the only Witch Hazel Salve
that is made from the unadulterated

Witch=Hazel
All others are counterfeits-base imi-

tations, cheap and worthless-even
dangerous. DeWitt'sWitch Hazel Salve
is a specific for Piles; Blind, Bleeding,
Itching and Protruding Piles. AlsoCuts,
Burns, Bruises, Sprains, Lacerations,
Contusions, Boils, Carbuncles, Eczema,
Tenet', Salt Rheum, and all other Skin
Diseases,

AL
PREPARED BIC

E. C. DeWitt 4 Co., Chicago

For Sale by J. MeKellip.
Frost vt.t Grass.

After a few sLtVere frosts the young

growing pasture is not nearly equal to

what it was before as a feed. It loses

some of its nourishing eoualities and has

a decidedly more laxative effect It is

profitable to feed some dry fodder and

increase the grain ration. At this sea-

son of the year dairy products are look-

ing up in price. and it pays to make

every effort to keep up the milk flow.

The man who has a good supply of

well matured sorghum will find it an

excellent supplement feed with the

grass that is getting poorer every day.

Immediately after the first frost the

sorghum should be cut and put in

shocks or cocks, and it will be all right

to feed until the stems begin to freeze

solid. Don't try to dry it, as it is um

dryable.-L. W. Lighty in Stockman

and Fa rmer. .

Hering's Department Store
'Tr r-7 4T. r7; .72/EV 1111

Another Souvenir Day, at
Hering's Department Stores.

We will give away, to-day,

with every purchase of $1.00

or more,

A Beautiful Souvenir,
entirely different from last Sat-

urday. As this is the last day

we will give Souvenirs, you

should not miss this opportuni-

ty to get,free of cost, something

that will be useful in your

house.

S.A_TTTRIDA:Y" 0:NTT__I-Y-

CHAS, E. HERING, Westminster, Md.
Importance of the Farmer.

A good farmer, one who has an edu-

cated brain and trained hands, is not

exceeded in value to the community

in which be lives by the wealthiest

and most liberal capitalist, the ablest

orator or most learned professional

man. Agriculture is the foundation of

all industries, and there could be no

prosperity worthy of the name that

does not "begin with the plow" and

depend on the plow and plowman for

existence. The importance of the good

and competent farmer cannot be over-

estimated. He is an object lesson that

all neighboring farmers would do well

to imitate, and every one who does so

will become a better farmer and a bet-

ter citizen, and then all these become

object lessons to their neighbors, and

ultimately the influence of the good

farmer spreads over the entire commu-

nity, and all people within his sphere

of influence are benefited and are pros-

perous whether they be farmers or

not.-Farm and Ranch.

Poultry Droppings as Fertiliser.

Have a water tight barrel and put

poultry droppings in it and fill the bar-

rel with w:cr. After two or three

days dip the water out and sprinkle

the garden vegetables with it and fill

up the barrel again. Then watch the

vegetables grow. There is nothing bet-

ter than this for plants the edible por-

tion of which grows above ground.

:Llir r-4.71.7

Economy is Wealth.

Clean your old :clothes with Lum

Turn Clothes Cleaner. It removes

grease spots from all kinds of fabrics.

Seiled coat collar cleaned to look like

new. Large bottles only 15c. Manu-

factured at McKellip's Drug Store,

Taneytown, MO.

LATESTNEW
FROM

KIRSSIN'S UNDERSELLING STORE !
Tells you that he has just received an 

entirely new

line of Fall Goods, consisting of

Clothing, Hats, Shoes and Underwear
and the Largest and Best Stock of Trousers he has ever offered.

The buying public of Taneytown District, has patronized us to such an

extent during the years have been doing 
business with them, that we

have felt justified in increasing our already 
large lines of Goods, thereby giv-

ing them the privilege of selecting from an
 immense stock at remarkably

Low Prices, when making their purchases.

We have also added a fine line of

Ladies' Wraps and Furs,
in which we can give you the greatest barg

ains ever offered in Taneytown.

We name a few prices as follows;

CLOTHING.
A good Knock About Suit for Men,

really worth $5.00 at

$3.48.

A better value $8.00 Suit, at

$4.90.

A nice Dress Suit in black or mix-
tures, Gray, Brown, etc., worth $10.00
at

$7.25.

An extra fine suit for dress
made and finished in high
Tailor style from

$8.50 to $15.00.

grade

Men's Overcoats.
We offer a $6.00 Coat for

$4.00.
A better grade really worth *e.00

for

$4.75.
A fine line Raglans, made in up-to-

date style, gray, blue and blacks from

$7.50 to $15.00,
worth the money.

Youth's Suits.
In Youth's Suits and Overcoats we

offer you great values from

$2.50 to $10.00.

Fine line of Children's Clothing,
sizes 3 to 8 years.

Men's &Youths'Trousers
Nice Dress Pants, price ranges from

$1.25 to $4.00

An immense line of Corduroys at
special prices. We give you a good,
well made and lined pair of Cordu-
roys, really worth $2.50, for

$1.79.
A better grade, worth $3.50, for

$2.39.

Knee Cord Paists for Boys, worth
from 75c to $1.25; at

39c, 69c and 89c.

UN DERWEAR,&C.
We are offering from our im-

mense stock of Underwear, a
heavy fleeced Shirt, 50c value.
for 39c; 35c value for 22c.

A fine line of Men's Dress
Shirts, at 39c.
Our stock of Neckwear is

complete and Up-to-date.

HATS! HATS!
They are all new, and in the

latest shapes direct from the
manufacturers.

SHOES.
Shoes of guaranteed make.

The price we charge is less than
others for like quality and style.

Ladies' Lace or Button Shoes,
patent and kid tips,regular price
$1.35; our price, 98c.

Ladies' Vici Kid, which
would be cheap at $1.75; we
sell at $1.25.

Ladies' hand-welt selected
kid skin, the newest lasts,$3.00
value; our price, $1.98.

Misses' and Children's Shoes,
from 25c to $1.35.

Men's Shoes, worth $1.25, at
98c. Men's Satin Calf $1.75,
at $1.25. Vici Kid, $2.25 at
$1.50. Box Calf, $3.00 at
$2.00, and $3.50 at $2.50,

In Vici Kid and Box Calf,
we have excellent wearing stock
made up in the latest styles:
costs you anywhere else $3.50,
our price, $2.50.

Gum Boots and Rubbers at
the lowest prices.

From our cordial relations in the 
past, we hope our patrons will call

on us again, and will bring their
 friends. Let us advise you to come qu

ickly

in order to have the largest 
assortment from which to select your purcha

ses.

The Baltimore Clothing House,
Eckenrode Building. TAN EYTOWN, MD

HINTS FOR FARMERS

Fighting the Boll Weevil.

It seems that the American cotton

crop is in less danger from foreign

competition than it is from a worm.

The boll weevil has become so destruc-

tive that unless some way of checking

ft can be found the cotton crop will

tail. The state of Texas offered a re-

ward for a simple method of destroy-

ing this insect. We are told that more

than 300 different plans were offered.

They ranged all the way from hand

picking to training birds to catch the

insect, but none was considered wor-

thy of the prize. The national de-

partment of agriculture is helping.

Three methods are suggested. The

use of poison and other insecticides

comes first, then various methods of

culture and the use of "trap crops" to

catch the insects. It is also thought

that a new variety of cotton may be

bred which can either resist the in4ct

or ripen before it can do full ti:tmage.

The spectacle of iulthaial nit .1 state

government a worm i.; a novel ,

one. Yet there
true glory in it •I

some foreiu • --

en.

ere/eel t Lee on eine.

The :•„, • .t is too high.

There has b sei Lie dection fit' a num-

ber of years, (luring which transporta-

tion on other lot-ins of freight has been

materially reduced in cost. Milk is the

most profitable freight carried by any

of the railroads in the middle states. It

goes right along every day, besides

commanding very high rates. The rail-

roads make a great cry about this traf-

fic requiring special service and fast

trains, passenger train schedule, etc.,

but these essentials are the least rail-

roads can do for this magnificent busi-

ness. How profitable milk freights are

Is best demonstrated by the efforts the

railroads are all the time making to in-

crease the shipment of milk. Let the

milk producers' organizations tackle

this reform. If they succeed it will put

a great deal of money into their pock.

.ts.-Auterlran A griculturist.

Liver Pills
That's what you need; some-

thing to cure your bilious-

ness. You need Ayer's Pills.

Want your moustache or beard a

beautiful brown or rich black? Use

Buckingham's Dye
50 cts of druggists orR P Sall &Co., Nashua,N.H

WESTERN MARYLAND R. R.
MAIN LINE.

Schedule in enect October 11th., 1903.

Read down STATIONS. Read 111,

P M..A.M.
.1.9 00 950 527 ie.Cherry Itun.ar
8d3 953 530  Big Pool 
9 14 10 07 542 ...Clear Spring • • •
9._ 
.8.10 
10 10 y 55 54711 N.... .‘Cyhianiani  rltonsport

9 40J10 35 6 15'ar Hagerstown it

A.M.
8 49
8 45
834
R 28
8 19
8 08

122 34° 7 8F8.:4792
1228 828
12 20 823
12 11 814
12 00 802

:Saturday only. The 8.02 p. tn., train leaves Hagers-
town, doily, including Sundays.

P.M. P.M.
*4 12 2 10
425 224
432 231
440 241
450 251

253

A.M. A.M.P.M.P.A .•
7 05 it Hagerstown at *7 30
7 15 ....Chewsville .
7 27 ....Smithsburg... I l0
735 • ...Edgemont... 705
746 Buena Vista Spg 656
74" as-. Hightleld... ... •

1157
11 44
ii 38
11 31
11 20
11 '8
A.M

800
7 46
739
7 31
7 21
- 16

P.M.
256
 '1 24
3 53
4 15
4 31
4 47

A.M.
750 le..Hudificld ar
II 16 ,Fairileld 
8 42
9 04
920
935

... Gettysburg...

...New Oxford...
 Hanover 
ar...Porters..../e

....

A.M.
11 15
10 47
10 all
10 tO
9 45
9 30

P.M
716
It 48
6 20
5 55
89

5 27

P.M.
527
535
80(1

A.M.
9 33.1e....Porters...ar
9 44 Spring Grove.
1010 an  ork it

A.M. P.M
930 447
923 439
900 412

p.m
4 52
4 53
5 17
5 26
5 38
5 45

5 56
6 07

636

7 17

p.m
266
258
321
3111
344
355
3 51.
4 04
4 2)
4 52
13
mM

5 37

a.m
7 5011e.
7 52 ... Itlue Ritlge....
816 ....Thurniont....
8 26 . Rocky Ridge ..
837 ..Bruceville....
845 . Union Bridge..
8411  Linwood.  
854 .. New Windsor..
909 .. Westminster...

. Emory Grove 
94i  Glyndon 

. Arlington.
102; ar..Baltimore-le

a.m
6511
6 52
625
.....
6 07
600

553
6 40

5 11

*430

a.111 p.m
11 15 716
11 13 714
10 47 648
10 36 837
10 25 627
10 17 618
10 Li  
10 08 6(1)
951 554
si 18  
917 528
14 46  
8:5 445

AdditionaL trains Leave Baltimore for Un-
ion Bridge and Intermediate Stations at 10.'2
a. m., and 2.25,6.15 and 11.25 p.m., and leave
Union Bridge for Baltimore and Intermedi-
ate Stations at 4.48, 5.25 a, d 625 a. m., and
12.55 p in., daily, except Sunday.
Sundays only-leave Baltimore for Unk n

Bridge and Intermediate Stations at 9.35 a.
as., and 3.00 p.m. Leave Union Bridge at
6.45 and 8.30 a. m., and 4.00 p. m., for Balti-
more and Intermediate Stations.

Baltimore & Cumberland Valley R. It.

Leave Hagerstown for Shippensburg and
Intermediate Stations at 11.00 a. m., and
amid 7.0, p. m. For Chambersburg 6.30 a. m.
Leave Shippensburg for Hagerstown and
Intermediate Stations at 6.00 a. m., amid ...55
p. m. Leave Chambersburg 1.45 p.

Trains via Altenwald Cut-off.

Leave Hagerstown for Chambersburg and
Intermediate Stations at 3.20 p. m.
Leave Chambersburg for Hagerstown and

Intermediate Stations at 7.47 p. m.

Leave Rocky Ridge for Emniitsburg at 8.26

and 10.36 a. m., and 3.31 and 6.87 p. at, Leave

Emmitsburg for Rocky Ridge at 7.50 and 9.55

a. m., and 2.55 and 4.50 p. an
Leave Bruccville for Frederick at t.36,

9.36 and 10.40 a. m., and 4.45 and 6.30 p. as.
Leave Bruceville for Columbia Littlestown

and Taneytown at 9.47 a. mu., and 3.45 p.m.

Leave Frederick for Baltimore at 7.50 a .ro

and 3.00 and 4.55 p. m.

Connections at Unerry Run, W. Va.

B. & 0. Passenger trains leave Clierry Run

for Cumberland and intermediate points.

daily, at 8.55a. Chicago Express, daily, at

1.14 no m.; Chicago Express, daily, at 8.54 p.

m.

* Daily. All others daily, except Sundat

B. H. GRISWOLD. Gen'l Traffic Manager.

V. M. HOWELL, General Passenger Agent,



TANEYTOWN LOCAL COLUMN.
Current Items of Local News, of Special

Interest to Home Readers.

Robert W. Clingan spent Sunday in
York, with his parents.

The Directors of the CARROLL
RECORD Company are requested to
meet at the office of the Company, on
Monday evening at 7 o'clock.

A. modern style barn is being built
for Judge Clabaugh, as a home for
his driving horses and carriages, on
the opposite side of the road from
the farm barn.

Wm. E. Wagner, of York, Pa.,
Harry F. Fink, of Hanover, William
E. Thomson and Jas. L. Hesson, of
Balthriore, were among the visitors
ot Taneytown during the week.

Rev. A. Bateman will preach his
last sermon, at his present charge, on
Sunday; and on Wednesday, the 18th,
a special 'fleeing of Classis will be
held in the church to give him his
dismissal.

A full attendance of the members
of Washington Camp No. 2. P. 0. S.
of A. is asked at their regular meet-
ing, next Thursday night. A subject
for the good of the Camp, will be the
feature of the evening.

Mrs. Howard Slonaker, nee Burall,
of Baltimore, who has been in deli-
cate health for years, has gone to the
southern pine regions in the hope of
recuperating. She is said to be suf-
fering with lung trouble.

Miss Hattie Bollinger, who is well
known here, has developed into an
extensive traveller. She has seen the
greater part of Europe during the
past two years, and is now in Aus-
tralia, having recently gone to that
warmer climate, from France.

Some person, unknown, threw a
stone at one of the transparencies in
the democratic parade on Thursday
night, which barely missed giving S.
White Plank, one of the horsemen, a
severe blow on the head. Such acts
are deserving of the utmost condem-
nation, and very naturally provoke
ill-feeling.

Our Calendar offer closed on Tues-
day. As the order has been sent to the
factory, in Chicago,we will be unable
to supply those who may have "put
it off" too long. Next year, 160 fam-
ilies will have the opportunity of be-
coming familiar with "Our Presi-
dents." As we have sold over 2500
calendars to business men, there is
not likely to be a scarcity of them.

John T. Renner of near Littlestown,
eldest son of the late John Renner, of
Taneytown, died on Thursday morn-
ing of last week, from apoplexy, alter
having been stricken on Tuesday.
He leaves a wife and several children.
Funeral services were held on Sunday
afternoon, in Littlestown Lutheran
Church, interment taking place in
Mt. Carmel Cemetery. He leaves two
brothers, David and Samuel, and
three sisters, Mrs. Daniel Null, and
Misses Mary and Louisa

It is said that owing to the difficul-
ty in purchasing crushed stone, our
streets may not be given the repair-
ing this fall that they so much need.
Especially at some of the alleys and
street crossings, filling is much needed
as the gutters are gradually widening
out and becoming lodging places for
refuse and filth Another regretable
fact, is, that the sewerage conditions
adjoining the Central hotel will likely
remain for the winter as they are at
present.

The dwelling of Samuel Ocker,near
Otter Dale school house, was destroy-
ed by fire last Friday evening, be-
tween 8 and 9 o'clock, with its con-
tents. Mr. Ocker, who has been liv-
ing alone, was absent at the time,
having left everything apparently
safe several hours before the fire
broke out. The cause of the fire is
unknown. The land and buildings
had recently been sold, and the per-
sonal property advertised for sale, as
Mr. Ocker expects to reside in Taney-
town hereafter. The building was
insured in the Royal Ins. Co.

Last week, 2250 hedge plants were
set around the Lutheran Cemetery,
and 39 Norway maple and Gingko
trees planted on the inside of the
hedge, and on both sides of the main
drive. It is probable that the work
for the year, at the cemetery, will be
concluded with the erection of three
iron gates; an arched gate and two
without arches. This old burial place
of the Lutheran congregation has
been greatly improved during the
past two years, and, with the work
contemplated for next year, it should
be one of the handsomest in this sec-
tion of the state.

Taneytown indulged in two politi-
cal demonstrations this week. On
Tuesday night, several hundred of
the unterrified republicans went up
"Salt River," accompanied by band
and drum corps; and on Thursday
night the democrats celebrated the
result in a torch light parade, with
three bands and drum corps. The
latter event was quite a creditable
showing, and was participated in by
many from the adjoining districts.
Both parades were punctuated with
transparencies, and more or less elab-
orately costumed individuals who
appeared to enjoy the occasion. At
the close of the democratic parade,
Messrs Guy W. Steele and C. 0. Clem-
son delivered brief addresses, at the
square.

Fewer gallons; wears longer; Devoe.

Oyster Supper and Bazar.

(For the Ilscoun.)
The Ladles' Aid Society of the Lutheran

Church of Our Saviour, West Arlington,near
Baltimore, held an oyster supper and bazar,
Thursday and Friday evenings. November
6th. and 6th., at the MechanIc's Hall, Arling-
ton, Md.
Those in charge of the different tables

were: Supper table and kitchen. Mrs. James
Fox, chairman, Mrs. Augusta Euler, Mrs.
Charles Wachter, Mrs. E. Sauble, Mrs. L. J.
Staup, Mrs. Elizabeth Haines, Mrs. Irvin
Zimmerman, Mrs. Harry Fox, Mrs. Clayton
Miller, Mrs. Victor Windersheim, Miss W.
Cameron, Miss E. Jones, Messrs Edward A.
Fox, George Mitchell. Frank Hahn, George
Cameron, John Klair; Fancy Table—Mrs.
Christopher Sommerman, chairman, Miss
Elsie Loser; Ice cream—Mrs. E. E. Hargest.
Miss Mary Griffin; Candy table—Miss Vallie
Fox, Miss Grace Kagle; Cake table—Mrs. J.
W. Loose, Mrs. %V. Thiele, Mrs. Philip Plitt:
Fish pond—Misses M. Eyler, Ora Fox, and
Myrtle Plitt; Country store—Mrs. 11. Lentz,
Sr„ and Mrs. H. Lentz,Jr.
It was a grand success, both socially and

financially. Rev. S. J. Miller is pastor of the
church.

Not Ready Yet.

A Philadelphia photographer tells
this as having actually happened. A
woman entered his studio.
"Are you the photographer ?"
"Yes, madam."
"Do you take children's pictures?
"Yes, certainly."
"How much do you charge ?"
"Three dollars a dozen."
"Well," said the woman sorrowfully.

"I'll have to see you again. I've only
got 11.—Philadelphia Ledger.

A FREE game inside
each package of

Lion Colte
Woodsboro—Mrs. Edward Stinimel,

who has been yery much indisposed,
is slowly recovering.
John Kling, wife and daughter,Miss

Emma. have been visiting their
daughter, Mrs. Milton Carter, of Lib-
ertytown.
Theodore Lowe has accepted the

position as cooper for the flouring
mills of A. H. Etzler.
Miss Hollenberger,of Union Bridge,

is the guest of Mrs. Claude Barrick.
Mrs. David Dorcus,of New Midway,

spent a short while recently with rel-
atives here.
0. A. Haines, of Silver Run, who

has a large orchard near this place,
has been busily engaged in picking
apples the past few weeks.
Thomas Fogle, who had the mis-

fortune to sprain one of his limbs
while picking apples, is slowly im-
proving.
We have had several heavy frosts

in this section the past week, which
destroyed a number of beautiful
flower yards.
Master John Witmer, of Hanover,

Pa., is spending several weeks with
his grand-parents, of this place
Mrs. Dr. Meisenhelder, of Hanover,

Pa., paid a brief visit recently to her
uncle, Abraham Spahe, and family.
John Hoffman and family moved to

Baltimore, this week.
Mrs. Ella Zumbrun, of Union

Bridge, spent several days the past
week with her aunt, Mrs. Thomas
Fogle, of near town.
Josephus Long, who has been very

much indisposed,is slowly improving.
Services in the Reformed church

next Sunday morning at 10 o'clock,
and in the M. P. at 2.30.
Mrs. Rey. Wm. E. Wheeler has re-

turned home, after spending several
weeks with friends at Bruceville.
The ladies of the Reformed church

are making preparations to hold an
oyster supper in the town hall, which
will commence on Noy. 17th., con-
tinuing the remainder of the week,for
the benefit of the chureh.
Mrs. Milton Ruby, of York, Pa., is

visiting friends at this place.
Rev. McCaslin, pastor of the M. P.

church, who has been holding a very
interesting revival for several weeks
past, closed it last week, as no inter-
est was manifested.
Theodore Fogle, of Dayton Ohio,

has returned home after spending
seyeral weeks with his parents, Mr.
and Mrs. Joshua Fogle and other
relatives, of this place.
Communion will be held in the

Lutheran church, on Sunday morn-
ing, Noy. 22nd., by the pastor, Rey.
Wm. E. Wheeler.

Letter to Jas. Buffington.

Dear Sir: Pay more for Devoe; be
glad to. It is full-measure and honest.
Paint is a watch-dog. How would

you like a watch-dog that would't
watch from two to five o'clock in the
morning? That's short measure.
How would you like a watch dog

that had a way of wagging his tail at
a burglar? That's false paint. The
burglar is rain and snow.
Go by the name: Devoe lead-and-

zinc.
Yours truly,
W. F. DlivoE & Co.,

41 New York.

Marker's Mill.—The people of our
section are mostly done husking corn,
and some have their fodder on stacks
for winter. John H. Marker's corn
averaged 12 barrels to the acre.
Samuel H. Eckard is confined to his

bed with la grippe.
Mrs. Charles Lehr and niece, Mabel

Bond, of Wilkesbarre, Pa., who have
been visiting her mother, Mrs. Win.
Maus and family, returned home on
Wednesday.
Mrs. Wm. H. Maus visited her

brother, John Dutterer, of Littles-
town, Pa., one day this week.

A Remarkable Case.
One of the most remarkable cases of

a cold, deep-seated on the lungs,caus-
ing pneumonia, is that of Mrs. Ger-
trude E. Fenner, Marion, Ind., who
was entirely cured by the use of One
Minute Cough Cure. She says: "The
coughing and straining so weakened
me that I ran down in weight from
148 to 92 pounds. I tried a number of
remedies to no avail until 1 used One
Minute Cough Cure. Four bottles of
this wonderful remedy cured me en-
tirely of the cough, strengthened my
lungs and restored me to my normal
weight, health and strength. Sold by
J. McKellip, Taneytown. Md.

Union Mills.—Mrs. Harry Flicking-
er and daughter Lillian, of Hanover,
were the guests of Henry Flickinger
and other relatives the past week.
Mrs. Sarah Byers visited her son, J.

Frank Byers, in New Windsor last
week.
Mr. and Mrs. John Hoff and chil-

dren, Willie, Earl and Lame, of New
Windsor, spent Saturday and Sunday
with Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Frock, near
here.
Misses Vinnie and Helen Stonesifer,

of Littlestown, visited relatives in
this vicinity recently.
Mr. and Mrs. John Burgoon attend-

ed the funeral of their uncle,Ephraim
Yingling, in Baltimore, last week.
The communion services at the Re-

formed church, Silver Run, last Sun-
day, were well attended. Thirteen
young men and three ladies were con-
firmed on Saturday previous.

Signalling Under Water.

The cause of three-fourths of the
shipwrecks and loss of life at sea
seems to be removed. It is not a wire
or even the air, but the water this
time that is used to transmit sound
vibrations. For some weeks there has
been installed on the steamers of the
Metropolitan Company of Boston an
apparatus which may yet make it
possible for the vessel beating about
the coast in a storm to know where
the rocks and shoals are when the
fog will not permit the light to be
seen and the noise of the wind drowns
the sound of the bell-buoy or the
siren; for a battleship to know of the
approach of a submarine and a fish-
ing-smack of the approach of a liner
off the Banks of Newfoundland.
The apparatus is extremely simple.

It amounts to nothing more or less
than ringing a bell under water,
which the pilot or captain can hear
telephonically. Screwed on both
sides of the vessel's hull are two re-
ceivers, which are connected by wires
with the wheel-house. These receive
the vibrations from the bell hanging
in the water on the side of the light-
ship. The navigator has only to put
the ear-piece to his ear and ascertain
on which side the vibrations are the
louder, in order to know the direction
of the lighthouse and his own posi-
tion in the fog with comparative ac-
curacy.
For fishing vessels a ball receiver

has been provided, and this is used
also to get more delicate intonations
aboard a steel vessel. The value of
the apparatus was put to a good test
recently when the steamer James S.
Whitney was approaching the Boston
lightship on her return from New
York. The lighthouse was obscured
by rain and fog. Thanks to the signal
apparatus, the captain immediately
heard the bell and got his direction.
It was. not until five minutes after
that he heard the lightship's whistle
for the first time.—Collier's Weekly.

Origin of Pumpkin Pie.

Several healthy and hungry chil-
dren rushed into the dining-room of
an uptown residence last Thursday,
right from school for their midday
luncheon. The old negro mammy
had prepared for them, among other
things, a luscious pumpkin pie. They
tasted its delicious goodness, when
little "Ned," the smart One of the
group, asked mammy to tell him who
made the first pumpkin pie.
"Law sakes 'live, bonny, I doan

know. I'se beard it was one of dew
Yanks who came down South and 'set
us all free when Mass Liocum was
President. Dat's all I knows 'bout it,
chile."
Just then the mother of the family

came in, and overhearing the conver-
sation, said she would tell them a
story she had heard, which was as
follows:
"An inventor was walking through

the field one day when he came upon
a pumpkin ripening in the sun.
" 'This,' he said to himself, bend-

ing down and feeling of the yellow
orb, ̀is a vegetable growth; but I
firmly believe that it acquires its hue
from small particles of gold which it
extracts from the earth.'
"So he put the pumpkin on his

shoulder and took it home, telling all
anxious inquirers that he was going
to discover how to extract the gold
from it.
"At home, in spite of all his wife

said, he cut the pumpkin up, and put
it in a pot and boiled it—only he
argued that he was melting it.
"When at last it was a pulpy mass.

he poured it out of the pot and right
on top of a pan of dough that his wife
had rolled out for the purpose of
making dried-apple pie.
"Now you know what kind of a

wife he had, do you not? A woman
who will feed her husband on dried-
apple pie deserves to be married to
two or three inventors, doesn't she?
"And so he put the pumpkin and

the dough into the oven, asserting
that he would harden it with the
heat and produce a solid sheet of
gold, and be so rich that he coald
afford to run for office on a reform
ticket.
"But, bless you! when the pumpkin

and the dough came out of the oven
it was not a solid sheet of gold at all,
but a rich, golden, tantalizing section
of goodness.
"And thepoor inventor was hun-

gry, so he bit into it.
"A few minutes later some of the

inventor's friends came in, and they
all tasted the pie and found it good.
The inventor and his good wife often
had pumpkin pie after that, and the
knowledge of making it spread all
over the world."— Balt. .News.

SEND US
A COW,
Steer, Bull or Horse
hide, Calf skin, Dog
skin, or any other kind
of hide or skin, and let
us tan it with the hair
on, soft, light, odorless
and moth-proof, for robe,
rug, coat or gloves.
But first get our Catalogue,

giving prices, and our shipping
tags and instructions, so as to
avoid mistakes. We also buy
raw furs and ginseng.
THE CROSBY FRISIAN FUR COMPANY,

116 !VW/ Street, Rochester, N. Y.

Trick Autemonllists.

Although trick automobilists can be
found in France and England, this
country claims the lead. The accom-
plishment is peculiarly well adapted to
American genius. Another reason for
the supremacy of Americans is the
greater lightness of the American ma-
chines, taken as a class, and their ex-
treme sensitiveness and delicacy of
control. It is of course possible to do
more with a light car than with a
heavy French racer. Another condition
leading to the development of trick
chauffeurs in America is the encourage-
ment given them by the manufactur-
ers, who favor trials of skill because
they serve to exhibit machines and
demonstrate to possible purchasers the
lightness and facility with which auto-
mobiles may be controlled.
There are several tricks which may

be classed as favorites among chauf-
feurs. They are all extremely difficult,
but the one which more nearly borders
on the marvelous is the watch trick.
Only the most expert chauffeurs at-
tempt it, as the cost of failure is the
cost of a watch. To drive an automo-
bile against an open watch, to back ii
and expect to stop the heavy machine
just in time to spare the watch, seems
Impossible, but the feat has often been
performed.—Leslie's Weekly.

Cordite Eaters.

Quite an original spocies of narcoma-
nia is noted by the British Medical
Journal as having been discovered by
Major Jennings, I). S. 0., during the
recent operations in South Africa. It
consists in the eating of cordite, with
which the Lee-Metford cartridges are
charged. The existence of the vice first
became known to Major Jennings from
the suggestion of a regimental non-
commissioned officer that a certain man
had possibly been taking cordite in or-
der to escape service, but in concluding
his notes Major Jennings suggests that
the effects are so exceedingly unpleas-
ant that none but the most depraved
would ordinarily resort to it as a stim-
ulant and that no man could escape
service through its means except by
the exchange of service for incarcera-
tion as a hopeless lunatic or for death
by suicide.

Doesn't Respect Old Age.
It's shameful when youth fails to

show proper respect for old ago, bat
just the contrary in the case of Dr.
King's New Life Pills. They cut off
maladies no matter how severe and
irrespective of old age. Dyspepsia,
Jaundice, Fever, Constipation all
yield to this perfect Pill. 25c, at R. S.
McKinney's Drug Store.

Every Day Sort of a Boy.

A boy once applied for a situation.
"We don't want lazy boys here,"

said the manager. "Are you fond of
work ?"
"No, sir," responded the boy, look-

ing the other straight in the face.
"Oh, you're not, aren't you? Well,

we want a boy that is."
"There ain't any," said the boy,

doggedly.
"Oh, yes, there are. We have had

over half a dozen of that kind here
this morning to take the place we
have."
"How do you know they are ?" ask-

ed the boy.
"They told me so."
"So could I, but I'm not a liar."

And the lad said it with such an air
of convincing energy that he was en-
gaged at once.

Shrewd.

"Mr. Bliggins scents to be a wonder-
fully bright young man."
"He is," answered Miss Cayenne. "in

a certain way. He is careful to select
topics of conversation so abstruse that
you have to take everything he says
for granted."—Washington Star.

Bad Combination.

The Visitor—Why are you here, my
misguided friend?
The Prisoner—I'm the victim of the

unlucky number thirteen.
"Indeed. How's that?"
"Twelve jurors and one Judge."—

Sporting Times.

One Reason Why
Everybody should have a supply of

M.cKellip's Cholera and Diarrhoea
Syrup. It is a speedy and effectual
remedy for Cholera, Cholera Morbus,
Diarrhoea, Pains in the Stomach and
Bowels, Vomiting, etc. Prepared on-
ly by J. MCKELLIP, Druggist, Taney-
town, Md.

Vigorous Old Age
Paine's Celery Compound makes the old

feel young, and cures their ills. It has added
years of health and enjoyment to many a life.
Use this great medicine regularly, and its invig-
orating powers will fill your declining years
with health, strength, and happiness. Read
what George F. Morse, 67 years old, writes:—
WELLS & RICHARDSON CO.,

Gentlemen :— Just a word in favor of
Paine's Celery Compound, hoping it may catch
the eye of some afflicted person, and they
may receive the same satisfactory benefit.
Some 15 years ago I had a combination of
malaria, chills and fever, and grip, which con-
tinued for a year or more; meantime I lost in
weight about 6o pounds, trying different medi-
cines and doctors with unsatisfactory results.
Paine's Celery Compound was recommended,
and, after using a little I began to improve,
gaining about a pound a week. In a year I
had regained so pounds of the lost weight and
good health, and have been a well man ever
since. Yours truly, GEORGE F. MORSE.

LEOMINSTER, MASS., Oct. 27, 1902.

DIAMOND DYES
COLOR ANYTHING ANY COLOR.

Dresses, cloaks, snits, ribbons, coats, feathers,
stockings, — everything wearable, Diamond
Dyes make to look like new.
Direction book and 45 dyed samples free.
DIAMOND DYES, Burlington, Vt.

SHORT STORIES.

Surgeon General Rixey, U. S. N., will
urge congress to enlarge the general
haval hospital at Portsmouth, Va.
There are now 490 of the California

pioneers represented in the society of
that name, their average age being
seventy-eight.
Over 30,000 American farmers, most

sf them with families, have crossed the
border and settled in the Canadian
northwest, where they now own more
than 5,000,000 acres of land.
The death mask of President William

McKinley, taken some few days after
his death by Professor William H.
Holmes of the bureau of ethnology, has
been placed on exhibition in the na-
tional museum, occupying a conspicu-
ous ease by itself near the main en-
trance.
Lloyd's Register for 1903-04 puts the

world's mercantile marine on July 1
at 29,943 steamships of 27,183,365
tons and 12,182 sailing vessels of 6.459,-
766 tons. The United States, while
ranking second in tonnage, has less
than one-fourth as much as Great
Britain.

PLANT FREAKS.

Miss Eliza Barrett of Stoddard, N.
II., raised a potato last summer that
weighed 31/2 pounds.
Mr. F. Waldron of North Vassalboro,

Me., has an apple tree in his yard the
spread of the limbs of which one way
Is forty-seven feet and across the other
is forty-one feet.
John S. Abbott, who 'resides near

Lake Manitou, Ind., has a natural curi-
osity in the way of a well formed po-
tato grown on a sugar cane stalk. The
stalk is small, but has a head of seed
at the top end and a regulation tuber
at the bottom.
Roy E. Fitield of Stonington, Me.,

sent to a Bangor paper the following
squash story: "I took seed from a
squash raised this year, scratched my
name upon it and planted it. The re-
sult was a healthy vine bearing a six
and a quarter pound squash, upon the
surface of which my name appeared
clearly outlined. It was a southern
squash."

JUST WHAT YOU NEED.

Chamberlain's Stomach and Liver
Tablets.

When you feel dull after eating.
When you have no appetite.
When you have a bac taste in the

mouth.
When your liver is torpid.
When your bowels are constipated.
When you have a headache.
When you feel bilious.
They will improve your appetite,

cleanse and invigorate your stomach,
and regulate your liver and bowels.
Price 25 cents per box. For sale by R.
S. McKinney, Druggist, Taneytown,
Md.
For sick headache try Chamber-

lain's Stomach and Liver Tablets;
they will ward off the attack if taken
in time. For sale by R. S. McKinney,
Druggist, Taneytown, Md.

The Snap Shot.
The recent fatal eruption of the Wai-

mangu geyser, in northern New Zea-
land, will be of interest, particularly to
those who have seen the geysers of the
Yellowstone. A party of thirty-two ex-
cursionists were making the tour of tit(
geysers under the control of an expo
rienced guide. Four of them, two la-
dies and two gentlemen, advanced
within twenty feet of the Waimangu
geyser basin. The guide shouted to
them to come away from such a dan-
gerous position, and so did the mother
of the two girls. One of the latter re-
plied, "In a moment, mother; when I
have taken this snap shot." The next
Instant there was a terrific eruption of
stones, mud and boiling water to a
height of 800 feet. When the steam
had cleared away the unfortunate four
were nowhere to be seen. They had
been hurled into a river of boiling wa-
ter, and their bodies, fearfully battered,
were found a mile away.— Chicago
News.

A Good Name.
From personal experience I testify

that DeWitt's Little Early Risers are
unequaled as a liver pill. They are
rightly named because they give
strength and energyand do their work
with ease.—W. T. Easton, Boerne,
Tex. Thousands of people are using
these tiny little pills in preference to
all others, because they are so pleas-
ant and effectual. They cure bilious-
ness, torpid liver, jaundice,sick head-
ache, constipation, etc. They do not
purge and weaken, but cleanse and
strengthen. Sold by J. McKellip.

EDITORIAL FLINGS.

Captain Kidd, had he lived a little
later, might,have been a financier in-
stead of a pirate.—Boston Globe.
One of the universities has establish-

ed a chair of dressmaking. Excellent!
Now for a chair of dishwashing!—Chi-
cago Record-Herald.
Professor Small says Germany may

make war upon the United States. It
Is believed Germany knows a heap
more than Professor Small.—Los An-
geles Express.
The spot on the sun just discovered

has an area of 550.000,000 square
miles. And not a single New York
newspaper has a reporter on the spot.—
Philadelphia North American.
And yet Mr. Schwab was a sick man

when he made that ship trust killing.
Lots of people are wondering what
would have happened if he had been
feeling good and strong.—Cleveland
Plain Deal,qr.

THE MILLER BROS. CO.

WE ARE READY.„
The Store Show Dow Complete.
Scarce a counter or shelf in this store that is not

filled with those stylish and worthy goods that
you are always accustomed to get here. We don't
know of a want in this general line of Dry Goods
that couldn't be filled, and should it be so methiug
out of the ordinary we will be glad to get it.

We are Ready to Supply.
That NeW Dress, Tailor Made Suit, Skirt, Waist,

Blankets, Underwear, Gloves, Carpets, Millinery,
(Clothing, Shoes and Hats, for Men, Boys and
Children,) besides all the many lines contained in
this great establishment. The store that makes a
child as safe a buyer as the best judge of goods.
Because there is only one price to all.

Two Telephones and our Mail Order
Department at your service.

THE MILLER BROS. CO.
POPULAR CASH STORES,

WESTMINSTER, MARV LAND.

GERMANY'S NAVY.

The K.aiser'e Polley For a Mighty
Fleet ‘)f War T.-easels.

The toowing is Germany's naval
programme which was to be completed
by 1916, 1.)::t the work has been so has-
tened that the maximum strength of
the tleet will be reached before that
year: Thirty-eight battle ships, four-
teen large cruisers and thirty-eight
entail cruiser.-. In accordance with the
emperor's scheme six more large cruis-
ers and seven smaller ones were de-
manded for use on foreign stations, but
this portion of the programme could
not be carried through the reichstag,
and for the present it has been drop-
ped, but only for the time.

Geri:It:Di pins her fortunes to the
' battle ship of moderate dimensions and
on a small displacement arranges a
heavy gun power, and except as scouts
to the great fighting ships she spends
little or no money on cruisers. She has
four armored cruisers of just over 9,000
tons in hand, but one searches in vain
for leviathans of 14,100 and 14,800
tons, which figure its the plans of Great
Britain and the United States. Ger-
many knows that she has not a long
purse, and she knows that the next
naval war will be decided by battle
actions. Since she cannot afford to
prepare for the sea fight and also
make provi-;!on for protecting her com-
merce with war cruisers she concen-
trates attention on tile battle which
will decide the Issues of a quarrel, and
her armed merchantmen will have to
render what aid they can to her ship-
ping.
In 1906. when the numerical strength

of the fleet will have been doubled, the
task of repLicing the older battle ships
will be taken in hand, and long before
1916, in addition to the vessels which
will have been built as net additions
to the fleet. Germany will have seven-
teen new first class battle ships, ten
large cruisers of the armored type and
twenty-nine smaller cruisers. Conse-
quently. when the scheme is complet-
ed, the first line of the German navy
will comprise thirty-eight battle ships,
the oldest dating back no farther than
1898; fourteen large and thirty-eight
smaller cruisers and also the ships she
possessed in 1898 when she began the
great scheme of augmentation.
The bedrock on which the emperor

is building is this: Germany, owing to
the many claims she has to meet for
her predominating army, her colonies
and her protective cotnmercial system,
cannot hope to have a fleet to equal
that of Great Britain, but it must be
ship for ship more efficient than any
navy afloat, and in this manner its in-
feriority may be minimized and even
Wiped out. "Germany," to quote from
the navy act, "must have a fleet of
such strength that even for the mighti-
est power a war with her would jeop-
ardize its own supremacy." — Archi-
bald S. Hurd in Cassier's Magazine.

Millionaire's Poor Stomach.
The worn-out stomach of the over-

fed millionaire is often paraded in the
public prints as a horrible example of
the evils attendant on the possession
of great wealth. But millionaires are
not the only ones who are afflicted
with bad stomachs. The proportion
is far greater among the toilers. Dys-
pepsia and indigestion are rampant
among these people, and they stiffer
far worse tortures than the million-
aire unless they avail themselves of a
standard medicine like Green's
August Flower, which has been a
favorite household remedy for all
stomach troubles for over thirty-five
years. August Flower rouses the
torpid liver, thus creating appetite
and insuring perfect digestion. It
tones and vitalizes the entire system
and makes life worth living, no mat-
ter what your station. Trial bottles,
25c; regular size, 75c.

Spain's Lucky Rulers.
That the rulers of Spain are less like-

ly to be killed by assassins than the
rulers of other countries a Madrid his-
torian claims, and the statistics which
he gives are certainly favorable.
Queen Isabella was attacked on two

occasions—by Martinos on Feb. 2, 1852,
and by Fuentes on May 28, 1856—yet
on neither did the would be assassin
succeed in accomplishing his task. Am-
adeus I. was attacked in 1872, but es-
caped, and so did Alfonso XII. when
Moncasi and Otero tried to kill him, the
former on Oct. 25, 1878, and the latter
on Dec. 30, 1879.
Up to date Alfonso XIII., against

whom a plot was recently formed, has
been equally fortunate, and the Mad-
rid historian is confident that his good
fortune will never desert him.

Trolley Time.
On the Albany and Hudson trolley

line it is possible to travel at sixt;
miles an hour. There are two electrit
lines in Indiana that work up to fifty-
five miles an hour each and two more
that make forty. Ohio has ten electric
roads whose cars reach or exceed foriy
miles an hour; two of them make Mk
and fifty-five. Michigan has one trol-
ley line on the forty mile speed limit,
two at forty-five and two at fifty.
There is g fifty mile an hour line in
Iowa, another in New York and anoth-
er in Texas, Speeds of from thirty to
forty miles are too common to mention.

Ten Cent Corn Killer

Removes Corns and Bunions with-
out Pain. Gives no trouble. Makes
the feet comfortable. Spend ten cents
and try it. J. McKellip, Druggist.

A Claim Against sue ,,nth.
The French architect Philippe Mer-

lat was commissioned by the shah of
Persia to build a pavilion for his maj-
esty on the exposition grounds in 1900,
but he has, it is said, never been able
to collect a franc in payment. The
French courts being unable to aid him,
he has appealed to The Hague peace
tribunal to help him in obtaining a set-
tlement of his claim.

HORSES AND HORSEMEN.

McKinney, 2:11%, has seven new per-
formers this year.
Don Cozille. 2:10, is a full brother to

Lottie -Lorain 5tr4.

Prince Ale • started in eighty-
five races all' , forty-five of them.
B0i.rchtwig, .

record of Ne exico from 2:14% to
2:0 1t? lowered the pacing

Sylviaone. 2:09%, by Alcroyue, is the
first 2:10 Kansas performer this season
from 2:14% to 2:09.

Dillon Boy, 2:691/4, is the only trotter
that ever won four races on the grand
circuit in two weeks.
E. E. Knott, 2:11%. by Alcander, died

In New Hampshire recently from the
result of a hemorrhage.
B. S. Dillon. a pacer by Sidney Dil-

lon, sire of Lou Dillon. 1:581,4, has a
half mile track record of 2:16%.

In Retreat.

The Fugitive—Now—if I only—had--a
box of tacks to—seat-ter I'd win in g
Walk!—New York Evening Journal.

Special Notices.
Short aavertisements will be Inserted un-

der this heading at 5c. per line each issue,
counting seven words to the line. No charge
under 10c. Cash in advance.

WANTED.-1000 doz. large clean
Eggs, 28c; 500 Turkeys, highest cash
price paid, delivered from Tuesday
until Saturday; 40 Calves 6c, deliver-
ing 75c; Chickens, 8c to 9c; Ducks, 4
lbs., 10c; 200 Guineas. 50c pair, quick
delivery; Squabs, 28c to 30c; old pig-
eons, 25c; wanted at once, 200 bushels
of Shellbarks, at $1.25 —SCHWARTZ'S
Produce. Milton Fisher, Manager.

12 MAIL BOXES still for sale, at
$1.00 each. Will have no more after
these are gone.—P. B. ENGLA. R..

WE HAVE returned from the City
with all the Latest and Most Stylish
Winter Millinery and Dry Goods. All
Shirt-waist Hats sold at a great re-
duction. Give us a call before buy-
ing elsewhere.—Mas. M. J. GARDNER.

SOW and 8 Pigs, fine stock, for sale
by V. J. CLoUsHER, near Harney.

MARCH 8.—Public Sale of Live
Stock and Farming Implements.—
ALBERT J. OneErt, 3 miles south-east
of Emmitsburg.

WANTED.—Live Common Rabbits,
weighing not less than 3 lbs., and
Guinea Pigs. Delivered not later than
Wednesday of each week—HENRY
K. BARBE.

LARGE FARM for rent at Piney
Creek.—MRS. CATHERINE SCHUR,. 3t

WE WILL close out all Shirt Waist
Hats both trimmed and untrimmed
this week at cost. Give us a call be-
fore it is too late. Yours for business,
J. Wm. Hum, 11-14 'at
PROPERTY for Rent in Middle-

burg; 2+ story Brick Dwelling, witn
13 acres of land. Possession April 1,
1904.—Apply only to MRS. SEABROOK.

PUBLIC SALE, Nov. 28, 2 p. tn.,
Buggy, Harness, Lap Spread, Stove,
Lounge, Baby Carriage, and many
other articles.—REv. A BATEMAN.

11 14-3t

RED CHERRY Cough Cure.—fixo.
SHOEMAKER, Agent. 7 4t

MILL PROPERTY (White Gravel
Springs) and 4+- acres of land, for sale.
Situated 1+ miles south of Uniontown,
and 2 miles north of New Windsor.
For particulars apply to J. Louis
SOWERS. Gettysburg, Pa. 11 7 4t

TO CURE A COLD IN ONE DA1.
Take Laxative Bromo Quinine Tablets. All
druggists refund the money if it fails to cure
E. W. Grove's signature is on each box. 25c.

MANAGER WANTED. — Trust-
worthy lady or gentleman to manage
business in this County and adjoining
territory for well and favorably
known House of solid financial stand-
ing. $20.00 straight cash salary and
expenses, paid each Monday by check
direct from headquarters. Expense
money advanced; position permanent.
Address MANAoRR, 810 Motion Bldg.,
Chicago, Ill. disJan 1

Stops the Cough and works
otf the Cold.

Laxative Brorno Quinine Tablets cure a cold
in one day. No Cure No Pay.PrIce, 25 cents.

CIGARS.—For a mild sweet smoke,
try K. B. "Pen-Mar," 5c straight—at
S. C. RICAVER'S Postoffice

10-8

READ THIS
Goods you want at once, are the goods we

have on hand. We make every effort to have
our goods right for the intended purpose, and
our prices are lower than the same goods can
be obtained elsewhere.
We aim to please our customers, always,

and if any dissatisfaction arises from any cause,
we ask you to be as fair to us as we try to be
fair to you: therefore let us know, so that we
can promptly adjust any difference, to your
satisfaction.

DRESS GOODS.
Come, or write for goods, and it will be our fault if you do

not come, or write for more. Colored Serges and Cheviots,
Plain and Colored Suitings, High-colored Cashmeres and Hen-
riettas, Fancy Waistings,and the prettiest line of White Mercer-
ized Waistings that can be shown anywhere. Goods you know
the value of Bleached and unbleached Muslins and Cantons at
5c, fic and 7c.

We are not anxious to sell you all we have,
but will sell you all you want.

Bed Comforts and Blankets.
Ours are not the cheapest make—so far as quality is concerned—but we

make Bed-rock Prices on Bed Comforts that satisfy with eyery sale.

MILLINERY DEPARTMENT.,...
Every type of woman this town Or county can boast of—be she

blonde, or brunette, pretty or only passable—can be made to Day trib-
ute to our Millinery Department, with such attractive and stylish
Headgear, at such extremely Low Prices.

If we don't save you 25 per-cent on this line
right here, don't buy from us,

Coats, Caps and Jackets.
The newest fashions are embodied in our goods, not only !u this or that

feature, but in absolutely everything pertaining to the garments, and that
is what makes our lower prices so popular with clever, close-buying
customers.

Leather and Gum Boots and Shoes !
Why do we do such a business in this line? Not because we are

related, or have a claim u on you, only that you get satisfaction, and are
not humbugged and deceived. Our line is complete. If you have not
tried us, this is your time. We are just as enthusiastic about our
goods and prices for the coming season, as though this were our first
year in business.

We are not ashamed of our Goods and Prices.

Carpets and Floor Coverings.
The cost of our goods to you is little, but the good in them is great.

This the meaning; "A man is happy if he feels young; a woman, if she
looks young."

Don't fail to see our Stock.
It is Money for 1 ou.

Men's and Boys' Clothing.
Not exactly a side issue, but a saving to the customer. Clothing to the

consumer at a mere profit. We are not asking 50 per-cent profit, neither
are we selling it at less than cost, but will save you money. All we ask is a
look at our goods.

WEANT & KOONS',
TAN EYTOWN, MD,

No TRESPASSING
The name of any property owner, or ten-

ant, will be inserted under this heading,
weekly, until Dec. 19th., on the payment of
25 cents.

All persons are hereby forwarned
not to trespass on my premises, with
doe, gun or trap, for the purpose of
taking game of any kind, in any mari-
ner. All persons so trespassing render
themselves liable to the enforcement
of the law in such cases.
Clabaugh Bros. Herbert Humbert.
Percy H. Shriver. David S. Clousher.
R C. Norman. Lewis J. Hew ler.
J. W. Witherow. Chas. E. Hamer.
D. M. Buffington. J. Frank Kiser.
Wm. Flickinger. W. E. Sanders.
Harry S. Koons. C. E. Buffington.
Michael Humbert. Edward Strevege.
Calvin Hahn. Wm. H. Knox.
Geo. Overholtzer. Geo. H. Diehl.
Jacob H. Brown. Geo. W. Feeser.
Amos Wantz. Wm. H. Bowers.
William Moser. Joshua F. Shorb.
Daniel Null. Samuel E. Clingan
Geo. Winemiller. Jacob Baker.
Wm. F. Boring. Chas. E. Keefer.
Abm. J. Hahn Wm. H. Yingling.
Leon'd Babylon. Wm. Kesselring.
C. D. Hershman. David E. Little.
D. Allen Stull. Josiah Wantz.
Geo. E. Knox. Thomas Yingling.
Emory C. Baust. Chas. H. Leunnion.
C. F. Hiteshew. Charles Jones.
Jasper C. Garner. John T. Nusbaum.
Geo. M. Study. Judge Clabaugh.
Birnie J. Feeser. Solomon Myers.
George G. Chute. Wm C. Smith.
W. G. Ohler. John Aulthouse.
Harry G. Sell. W. M Brower.
N. A. Reiudollar. Milton Ohler.
Clarence E. Dern. Ed w..1. Clabaugh.
George W. Dern. Jacob B. Sentz.

SMALL FARM
AT _

Public Sale!
The undersigned, heirs of Caroline V. Bill-

myer. deceased, will offer at public sale, at
her late residence, on

SATURDAY, NOVEMBER 21st. 1903,
at 12 o'clock, m., the small Farm. situated 1%
miles west of Uniontown, Md., adjoining the
lands of Daniel S. Diehl and others, which
she died possessed of, containing between 28
and 29 Acres of land. The improvements
consist 01 an 8-room Dwelling House with
basement and cellars, a never-failing spring
of excellent water, with pump on kitchen
porch to pump water from said spring; barn,
corn-crib, and spring house; also good fruit.
Convenient to churches, schools and mills,
whin makes it a very desirable little home.
Possession given April 1st., 19e4.
Persons wishing to view the property will

call on Jesse F. Billrnyer, near Fairview
school house, or on George Shoemaker, who
resides on the premises.
TERMS: One-half the purchase money to

be paid on day of sale, the balance in six
months, the credit payment to be secured to
the satisfaction of the heirs, bearing inter-
est from day of sale.
NOTICE:- The creditors of deceased will

please present their bills, properly authen-
ticated, to Jesse F. Billmyer who will see
that they are paid.

JESSE F. BILLMYER,
KEENER C. BILLMYER,
OLIVER M. BILLMYER,

Ht 
eirs of Caroline V. hiumver, deceased

11-7-3 

Notice to Tax-payers !
After the 15th. of November, inter-

est will be charged on your Corpora-
tion Taxes. I will be at the Com-
missioner's Office in Firemen's Build-
ing, on Saturday, 14th., from 1 to 4
o'clock to receive same. All parties
in arrears for back Taxes, will please
make immediate settlement and save
costs of collecting same.

Burgess S. Miller,
It • COLLECTOR.

— WE PRINT —
— WE PRINT —

WEDDING INVITATIONS.
WEDDING INVITATIONS,

PROG RAMS.
PROGRAMS.

FINE STATIONERY.
FINE STATIONERY.

ANNOUNCEMENTS.
ANNOUNCEMENTS.

FOLDERS, BOOKLETS.
FOLDERS, BOOKLETS.

MENU CARDS.
MENU CARDS.

LATEST STYLES.
LATEST STYLES.

SAMPLES FURNISHED.
SAMPLES VURNISHED.

Get Your Suit Made
THIS MONTH.

SHARRER & GORSUCH,
WESTMINSTER, MD.

are showing all time New Correct and
Smart Styles in Suitings and Trou-
serings.

Advantages We Give You
in Merchant Tailoring.

Genuine made to order Suits.
Use best materials and correct styles.
We show you the Goods not Samples.
Use only best linings, and workmanship.
We do not have to add $2 to $3 to price of

suit for cutter.
We guarantee to save you $3 to r on each

suit.
See our patterns and prices this fall before

buying.

We are after Your Clothing
Trade, this Fall,
and we present three claims for it. 1st. The
largest and newest assortment of fine Suits.
2nd. Best qualities and makes. The very
lowest prices for reliable Clothing.

We have Bought $10,000
Worth Men's and Boys' Suits.
We can please you and make it pay you to

supply your Clothing needs here.

Stylish Medium Weight
Overcoats.
Just the time you need them, $5 to $12.
Special values in Fall weight Underwear.
Sweet Orr Overalls.

PUBLIC SALE
— OF 1

VALUABLE PROPERTY !
The undersigned will offer at public sale

on the premises, on
SATURDAY. NOVEMBER 21st., 1903,

at 1.30 p. m., in Cumberland township,Adams
county, Pa., his valuable property contain-
ing 4 Acres and 94 Perches of land, improved
by a

LARGE DWELLING HOUSE,
outhouse. barn. wagon shed, and all neces-sary outbuildings, all newly built. The
dwelling is Cottage style. and contains 9
rooms. The property is well planted in the
choicest fruit trees, all in bearing condition.
It is situated along the Taneytown and

Gettysburg road, 4% miles front Gettysburg,
and mile from A. S. Mills' Store, Barlow
P. O.; any person desiring to see the proper-
ty can either call on the subscriber, who
lives in Hanover, Pa., or on Jacob C. Shriverwho lives on the property.
Terms will be made known on day of sale.

HARRY P. SHRIVER.
11-7-3t

FOR SALE
100 Horses & Mules!

On Monday, Nov. /6th., I will have 100,
Horses and Mules at Private Sale, at my
stables in Littlestown, Pa., consisting of
high-class Harness Horses,fine gaited Saddle
Horses, goad road horses. Draft and general
purpose Horses; Mule Colts, yearling Mules,
two year old green Mules and broke Mules:of all sizes and ages. Come to see this lot of:
stock and get first choice.

H. A. SPALDING,
LITTLESTOWN, PA.

Taneytown Grain and. Flay
Market.

Corrected weekly, on day est publication.
Prices paid by Retudollar Sr Co.

Wheat,  75075
Corn, new. , ,  50050
Rye, new  60060,
Oats,  30(035'
Tinaathy Hay, dry  9.0009.00%
Mixed Hay, new  7.00@8.00
Bundle Rye Straw, new.. 14.00e14.011.

Baltimore Markets.
Corrected Weekly;

Wheat.  
Corn .48@5O.48050
Oats 40042
Rye .56(058
Hay, Timothy  /5.50(016 00
Hay, mixed 13.00014.00
Hay, Clover 12.00013.00
Straw, Rye, bales  17.00019.00
Bran 17.00018.00
Middlings  19.00020.00
Potatoes, per bus   60060
Sugar, granulated 4  86+
Sugar, eonfec A   4.714,


