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THE SUMMER STOVE.
Hints to users of Kerosene and Gasoline for

Cooking Purposes.
As the heat of the summer increas-

es, the housewife naturally turns her
thoughts toward making the kitchen
—her work-room—as comfortable as
possible, and this means as free from
heat as possible. The cook stove is
the first object of consideration, for
this must be kept going the greater
part of each day. If the kitchen is
supplied with a large fire place, the
moving back of the stove is a great
relief, as much of the beat goer up
the chimney with the smoke; but, in
most town houses, such fire places are
absent because of the necessity fo
economizing space.
The kerosene, or gasoline stoye, ap-

peals strongly to most housekeepers,
because they require comparatively
little space, the act of making fire
means simply the application of a
lighted match, the heat produced for
necessary cooking purposes is reduc-
ed to the lowest possible point, cook-
ing can be done almost instantly—
without waiting—and the stove cools
rapidly after the heat has been turn-
ed out. Apparently, an oil stove is
just the thing for hot weather, es-
pecially for small families.
The thorn to the rose, howeyer, is

conspicuously present in the greatly
increased danger of fire and explosion.
This is a fact which should not be lost
sight of for an instant, no matter
how glibly or positively stoye dealers
may enter their denial. By all odds,
the oil stove is less dangerous than
the one using gasoline, for the very
simple reason that the one fluid is
much less dangerous than the other
—less volatile, and a much slower gas
producer. In fact, the use of gasoline
stoves—or the indoor use of gasoline
for any purpose—had better not be
considered, especially not for general
use by the various members of a fam-
ily, old and young.
In the use of an oil stove, avoid

cheap makes. Get the beet on the
market, and do not use one stove too
long; even the best should not be
used over three years. Cleanliness is
absolutely essential to safety. An oil
stove in constant use should be
thoroughly overhauled every two
weeks, removing all incrustation and
dirt of whatever characteacare being
taken to look out for leaks, and all
little imperfections in the blaze or
operation of the wicks.
Do not think of filling the supply

tank of a stove while it is burning—
even the best of oil should not be
poured within ten feet of a blaze of
any kind.
Do not permit children, or persons

with defective eyesight, to operate an
oil stove, and be sure that the burners
are fitted with a stop which will ab-
solutely prevent the blaze from draw-
ing up too high; even then, do not
leave the stove immediately after
lighting—watch it a while.
Whenever a stove suiells,it is throw-

ing of gas, and, as a consequence, is
dangerous. The combustion of the
oil naturally causes some smell, or
gas, in a room, not having the oppor-
tunity to escape outside, but a good
stove in perfectly safe order will not
throw off much gas. Wheneyer the
smell is very pronounced, it is a sign
that your stove needs attention—pos-
sibly a cleaning, or new wicks.
Do not attempt to use one set of

wicks a whole season unless the stove
is but little used. Throw them away
before they become too short for use.
Lastly, use the very best oil you can
get. The degree of test does not al-
ways indicate its quality. Oil 1500 test
may be bought at 10c per gallon, but
there are better grades of the same
degree test which can usually be had
at 14c or 15c. We are not advertising
oils, but Pratt's Astral is probably
one of the best, if not the best, on the
market.
Now, as to gasoline stoves. You had

better make up your mind not to buy
one, or if you already have one, to
throw it away. Undoubtedly, gaso-
line—barring its extreme danger—is
an ideal heating and lighting fluid. It
is especially dangerous when confined
in a close room, or closet, as it is al-
most sure to escape in some way
from the vessel in which it is confined,
impregnate the surrounding air and
become a most dangerous explosive
gas.
Do not, for an instant, take liber-

ties with it. Recently, a woman in
Baltimore went with a lighted lamp
to a closet in which there was a closed
can of gasoline; on opening the door
an explosion occurred, resulting in
the loss of two lives and a destroyed
building. Nearly every day during
the summer the city papers are full of
gasoline accidents, many pi them
fatal.
If such stoves must be med, the

same general instructions applying to
the use of oil stoves must be observed
—tut with double care. There is more
danger in having the stuff about the
premises than there is after it is safe-
ly in the tank of the stove, and in no
case should the supply of it be kept
in a dwelling, but in a freely ventilat-
ed outhouse away from other build-
ings. Remember, that unless your
Insurance Policy specially permits
the use of gasoline, you would not
likely recover any loss to your prop-
erty should a fire occur from its use.
Should a stove or lamp catch fire,

throw it out of the house if you can,
but don't carry it out in front of you
—back out with it. Finally, extreme
care and cleanliness, and thorough
familiarity with all parts of an oil or
gasoline stove, must be rigidly adher-
ed to. If you are not willing to comply
with these requirements, then, stick
to the old cook stove and the heat, or
you may get decidedly more heat
from the improperly cared for wick
stoves than you are looking for.

Miniaterial Meeting at Meadow
I3ra,ncb,

The Ministerial Meeting of Eastern
District of Maryland of the German
Baptist church, met at Meadow
Branch church, on Tuesday and
Wednesday, May 27th. and 28th. The
meeting organized ' by electing Eiger
Uriah Bixler, Moderator,and Elder C.
D. Bonsack, Clerk. The meeting was
felt of spiritual talks and much inter-
est was manifested.
Great stress was laid upon the im-

portance of mission work, and it was
decided to raise $500 to be expended
for that purpose in the district dur-
ing the year. An essay on "Church
Attendance" was read by Carrie M.
Bixler, and one on "The Christian
home" by Rebeeca:L. Rinehart.
Elders Levi Trostle. of Franklin

Grove, Ill.; W. E. Trostle, of Strat-
ford, Ill.; Daniel J. Wanapler, of Cov-
ington, Ohio, and other miaisteas
were present.
Elders S. H. Utz and E. A. Snader

were elected to fill vacancies on the
Mission Board caused by the retire-
ment of Elders A. Hollinger and Al-
fred Engler, Elder E. A. Snader was
elected treasurer.
Elders A. P. Snader, T. J. Kolb and

D. 0. Metz were appointed a commit•
tee to prepare a program for the
meeting next year, which will be held
at Sams Creek.

Brief Items of General Interest.

Daniel Stoner, of Dayton, Ohio,who
has been visiting relatives in Carroll
county, left for his home Thursday
afternoon.

The rain on Monday afternoon was
accompanied by considerable hail in
portions of Frederick county, result-
ing in a greatly lowered temperature.

A postollice inspector was in Wash-
ington county, for several days,inves-
tigating the destruction of a number
of rural mail boxes between Smiths
burg and Wolfsville, Frederick Co.

The in
Fa

eting of the Middleburg
ners' Club has been changed from

Saturday. June 7th., to Thursday,
June 5th., on account of the public
sale of property by W. A. Deyilbiss,
on tile former date.

Twelve indictments for forgery have
been found against Jesse B. Powder
by the grand jury for Carroll county.
The notes range from $52 to $500 and
aggregate about $4,000. The accused
recently went away and is still ab-
sent.

A seventeen year old youth nearly
died in Chestertown, this week, from
drinking "pear cider," or some stuff
sold in evasion of the laws, under
that name. Chestertown is a local
option place, but "speak easies"
flourish in spite of laws.

Francis D. Sanford, a Westminster
painter,fell from a scaffolding in front
of the First National Bank, on Mon-
day, and received fatal injuries. The
scaffolding became disarranged, and
caused the accident. Granville Lippy,
an assistant, saved himself by grasp-
ing the spouting and drawing himself
to the roof.

Clarence L. Valentine, the 16-
months-old son of Edwin F. Valen-
tine, of Rocky Ridge, Frederick coun-
ty, died last Saturday from an over-
dose ot whooping cough medicine.
The medicine had been left by the
physican for another member of the
family, and the child got hold of it
and drank it.

A terrible drouth is being experi-
enced in Australia, the losses in live
stock alone amounting to $75,000.01;0.
Sheep are dying by the hundreds of
thousands, and it is said that a com-
mon method of treating exhausted
horses is to slit the animals palate
with a knife thus reviving him with
his own blood.

It is expected the "McKinley" pos-
tal cards will be in the hands of post-
masters throughout the country
about July 1. The Postoffice Depart-
ment has received the proofs of the
new cards. The original showed a
front view of the late President's face,
but this was not satisfactory. A new
plate has been made showing the
profile view.

Raffale de Stefano m as tried before
a joury of the Circuit Court for Car-
roll county on Wednesday and found
guilty of assaulting Antonio Bone-
vento with intent to kill. The affair
occurred at Sykesville, on Christmas
morning. Two brothers, Antonio and
Francisco Bonevento, were shot and
De Stefano was indicted for assault
with intent to kill them both. The
other indictment remains to be tried.

There are 25,000 immigrants on the
Atlantic due to arrive at Baltimore
this week, and they will Wing the
total for May up to 85,000 or 90,000.
This will break all records for any
month in the last 20 years. The num-
ber of deportations is increasing, 750
persons having been ordered deported
during the first 26 days of May. The
majority of the new arrivals are from
Austria-Hungary, Italy and Russia.

There is a newspaper in Kansas
whose motto is "Lie, steal, drink and
swear," and it is thus explained by
the editor; "When you lie, let it be
down to pleasant dreams; when you
steal let it be away from immoral as-
sociates; when you drink let it be
pure water; when you swear, let is, be
that you will patronize your home
paper, pay your subscription and not
sead your job work away from home."

Fruit growers, don't spoil your trees
by burning the caterpillar nests, but
get some black machine oil (lubricat-
ing oil) and apply it to the nest, by
saturating a woolen cloth fastened to
the end of a pole and etirring this
cloth through the nest to that it
comes in contact with the pests.
Death will result in a few minutes.
Do this in the morning when they are
all in the nest and you will easily get
rid of the pests.

Adam Lee, the colored boy who was
indicted for arson, the specific charge
against him being that he started the
fire by which the barns of Mrs. M. J.
Woodward and Charles C. Gorsuch,
of Westminster, were destroyed, and
the Montour House badly damaged,
two weeks ago, was tried before
Judges Revell and Thomas, in the
Circuit Court, on Tuesday, and found
guilty. Lee is said to be about 14
years old, but is rather small for his
age.

R. W. Burgesser, trainumeter of the
Western Md. R., met with an acci-
dent in the shifting yard at Hagers-
town, Friday night last, which result-
ed in the loss of his left foot. He was
walking between the main track and
a siding when he was struck on the
shoulder by a shifting engine, and
was knocked down, the wbeels run-
ning over his left foot cruehing it to a
pulp. He was conveyed to a hospital
in an unconscious condition and his
foot amputated above the ankle.

John Dyce and Barney Zeitz, who
were indicted for burglariously enter-
ing the store of Baker & Lentz, at
Mount Airy, on the night of January
13, 1902, and also for receiving stolen
goods, pleaded guilty to the latter
offense in the Circuit Court on Mon-
day and the charge of burglary was
stetted. One of them claimed to be
from New York and the other from
Boston. James Behoe pleaded guilty
of larceny and William Cox and Geo.
L. Wetzel were convicted of carrying
concealed weapons.

The Capitol, which ie the largest
building owned by the Government,
covering three acres of ground, is
singalerly deficient In fire protection.
The building is fq11 of high spaces,
which are by no means fireproof, and
it would be an impossibility for fire-
men to cope with an outbreak of fire
in such a multitude of nooks and
crannies as are contained in the
building. Probably there is no other
building in the world FO threaded
with out-of-the-way passages and
subterranean thoroughfares. Every-
where there is a maze of electric wires
—always a menace in the matter Of
fire safety,

FACTS ABOUT LOCUSTS.
Evidence That They are Fit to Eat in Soup,

Roasted or Broiled.

The visit of the locusts is not gener-
al over the United States, as many
suppose; in fact, but six states, Mar -
land, Delaware, Indiana, Ohio, Penn-
sylvania and New Jersey, have any-
thing like a general visitation, as yet,
while western North Carolina. north-
ern Georgia, southern Michigan, east-
ern Illinois and northern Kentucky
are similarly affected. None have
appeared west of the Mississippi, nor
in the New England and Gulf States.

From reports received from differ-
ent parts of Franklin county, Pa.,
the 17-year locusts have appeared by
the thousands and have begun their
work of depredation. Mr. Levi L.
Springer, of near Edenyille, who has
one of the largest cultivated chestnut
orchards in the United States, has
resorted to a novel and unique plan
to save his many thousand trees from
total destruction by the pest. He has
purcased 2000 chickens and placed
them in the orchard to destroy the
locusts. He has a large force of men
who are kept constantly busy looking
after the chickens and trees.

The cicada has a false reputation
for destructive gluttony. He proba-
bly comes by it because he is called a
'locust' and looks like a bad charac-
ter. As a matter of fact, he might as
well be called the 17-year bed bug.
He is as much like a bed bug as a lo-
cust. and has no more power to gob-
ble up trees and crops. As a matter
of fact, it is not certain that he eats
at all. In most cases it is the fact
that he doesn't. Like all of our most
interesting American animals, the
cicada is passing. His periodical in-
vasion is weaker and weaker. The
clearing of forests and the rise of the
sparrow tribe and the increase of his
other enemies seem to be doing him
to a distant finish.

For some reson the locusts have
failed to put in their appearance at
Annapolis. It must be remembered
that one pest a year ought to be
enough for any place, and the action
of the locusts in staying away shows
a creditable discrimination on their
part—they have not forgotten the
Legislature.

Mr. George W. Seipp, crier of the
Circuit Court for Baltimore county.
testifies to the elegance of locusts as a
diet, and says that John the Baptist
was much favored when in his soli-
tude in the wilderness he was allow-
ed to partake of wild honey and
locusts. The fact that locusts are not
now on the bill-of-fares at hotels and
restaurants, Mr. Seipp says, is owing
to lack of knowledge of their edible
qualities. Locusts as a diet, Mr. Seipp
says, were first introduced to him by
Mr. C. Bohn Slingluff, a. well-known
lawyer, who formerly lived at Tow-
son, and whose home was noted for
its hospitality and for the delicious
and rare dishes served to his guests.
Mr. Seipp says that there is no prepa-
ration necessary to serve these 17 year
visitors at the table, but they have
the richest flavor when eaten imme-
diately after emerging from the
ground,and should not be eaten when
their wings haye begun to be formed.

Prof. Philip R. Uhler, of the Pea-
body Institute, Baltimore, says he
has eaten locust soup and tasted
locusts both fried and broiled. "There
is," said Dr. Uhler, "very Mile taste
to the locusts. It is like eating the
soft shell of a crab. There is no more
flavor to the locust than there is to
the shrimp and there is almost no
nourishment at all to it, because of
the lack of meat. On the locust that
we have here, or the cicada, which is
its proper name and title, there is ab-
solutely no meat at all. There is
nothing to it but the shell, and it is
almost impossible to deriye nourish-
ment from it. no matter how it is
cooked or served.
"The locust which John the Baptist

fed upon was entirely different from
the locust which we have now in Bal-
timore. That locust was, in fact, the
grasshopper, and is as different from
the cicada which is with us to-day as
is an elephant from a horse. The
grasshopper, or Rocky Mountain lo-
cust, which is common in the West,
has jaws and can eat. The cicada,
however, has no jaws and cannot eat
when once above the surface of the
ground. It may absorb dew and
dampness, but it cannot eat. I hardly
think the cicadve would supply nour-
ishment enough for a man to live
upon, although the grasshopper, or
locust proper, which is eating all the
time, might."

The Baltimore News says the lo-
gusts are dying rapidly, and that the
cool weather has put a quietus to the
singing of the locusts and hardly a
sound can be heard, even where the
locusts are most numerous. Locust
trees in blossom seem to be the favor-
ite resting place for the insects.
Fences and ground surrounding a
locust tree are covered with locusts
and their shells. Seven wheelbarrow
loads of the pests and their shells
were hauled out of the Courthouse
yard at Towson yesterday.

State Entomologist A. L. Quaint-
ance, of College Park, Md., desires in-
formation on the occurrence of the
present brood of the periodical cicada
in the various parts of the state. This
is one of the largest of all broods of
this insect, and its distribution, date
of appearance and the extent of in-
jury inflicted should be determined
as accurately as possible. From this
data it will he possible to indicate
quite accurately their probable oc-
currence and injury in the future.

The Pen Scheme Exposed.

For the benefit of those who might
hereafter be led into the seductive
schemes of those who propose to
"give away" things—pens, shoes, cor-
sets, oil stoves, queeneware, and such
like—and pay a salary besides, we
give, below, the opinion of the Assist-
ant Attorney General of the United
States in the Van Kirk & Robins
fountain pen letter writing proposi-
tion;
"By this system, at least two weeks

must be given each patron of the
scheme to fulfill tne promises made,
which entails an expense of $5 for sal-
ary and $3 for postage, etc., total $8,
The income from this patron is but
$a.50. The whole scheme resolves it-
self into this proposition; For a con-
sideration of $2.50 and the writing of
120 advertising letters Van Kirk &
Robins promise to give a pen and $8,
an impossible proposition, inasmuch
as the letters all hold out similar
promises, and if returns are received
therefrom it means other similar
promises for an indefinite time. In
other words, there would be no place
in the schemes where it could be end-
ed; it could not stop anywhere, ad
the divergence would be s6 broad that
it would cover the earth."

A Disreputable Scheme.

A most disreputable scheme has
been reported to the RECORD, by a
citizen of Taneytown,showi g the ex-
tent to which dealers in "off color"
articles will go to accomplish their
ends, which, in this case,was through
the use of respectable and innocent
mediums. The plan referred to,
figured out, as follows:
A well known church paper gave a

combination offer of a year's sub-
scription, and also a year's subscrip-
tion to a periodical for boys, through
which the latter was secured at an
additional cost of but 25c a year. The
church paper is high-class, and the
"boy's" paper is apparently a legiti-
mate publication, the literary char-
acter of which is fairly good, but
rather of a class more popular with,
or more easily comprehended by,
young men.
This latter publication contained,

recently, an advertisement of bicycle
hose, in answer to which our inform-
ant forwarded 50c and received in re-
turn full value for his money. In the
same mail, however, and from the
same firm, he received circulars ad-
vertising books purporting to be im-
moral, or of a highly "sporty" char-
acter, and in this is likely shown the
true reason for advertising the bicycle
hose—the securing of names of young
men of the class with money to spend.
Both papers ieferred to have been

notified of the character of this ad-
vertising firm, and the scheme recited
to the Postoffice Department. Wheth-
er or not the 25c paper is wholly clear
from complicity, is possibly a debata-
ble question.

The Last of the McKinley Books.

We have between 30 and 40 copies
of the Life of McKinley yet to be tak-
en at our remarkable offer of 40c for
a $1.50 book. These copies are still on
hand for three reasons (1) the cost of
mailing (20e) has prevented many of
our subscribers at a distance from
taking the work, (2) this has resulted
in the acceptance of the offer largely
in the vicinity of Taneytown, which
had already been canvased by three
agents who sold many copies at $1.50,
and (3) for the reason that the chance
came to us to get the books just at a
time when many of our readers are
too busy to read.
In order that the balance on hand

may be moved off quickly—they are
in our way—and in orcler to distri-
bute them as widely as possible, we
will give them to any person who is
a subscriber or correspondent for
the RECORD, or an advertiser, on
payment of 4oc. and will lay back
copies for those who may have an op-
portunity of coming for, or sending
for, the book in the near future.
Remember, in order to move the

balance off, quickly, simply the pay-
ment of 40c, without any further
payment on account, will secure a
copy, providing you are in some way
a patron of the RECORD. If you are
not a subscriber, we will send you the
RECORD three months and give you a
copy of the McKinley book, for 65c.
Now, be quick, as we want to go out
of the book business.

Fair—Fitz.

(For the RECORD.)
Miss A. Gertrude Fitz, daughter of

Samuel R. Fitz, and Norman 0. Fair,
son of Mr. and Mrs. S. J. Fair, of
Waynesboro, Pa.. were married at
high noon on Tuesday, by Rey. Fred.
D. Anthony at the home of the
groom's parents. The bridesmaid
was Miss Ivel KepneaChambersburg,
and the groomsman, Samuel A. Bare,
Uniontown. The bride was dressed
in light steel landsdowne, trimmed
with applique and carried white car-
nations. The bridesmaid wore a
handsome swiss lawn dress and carried
pink carnations. The wedding march
was played by John Frantz whose
selection was the "Nuptial March" by
E. L. Ashford. The rooms were trim-
med with flowers. Many valuable and
useful presents were received. After
the wedding a collation was served
and the bridal party left Tuesday af-
ternoon on a two weeks' trip to the
eastern cities.The bride wore a gray
traveling suit.
Mr and Mrs. Fair are two very pop-

ular young people and haye numer-
our friends who will extend to them
heartiest congratulations and earnest
wishes for long years of happy mar-
ried life.
The guests at tbe wedding were:

Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Fair, Samuel
Fitz, Sr., Samuel Fitz, Jr., Mrs. Cath-
arine Blubaugh, Cedgar Rapidsjowa;
Misses Minta Fitz,Susie Shriner,Mary
Mikesell, Catharine Koontz, Mary Al-
baugh, Eliza Knox, Maude Gordon,
'Lula and Mollie Fridley,Mr. and Mrs.
John Frantz, Mr. and Mrs. Jacob
Foreman, Samuel Bare, Miss Ivel
Kepner. Mr. and him A. S. Price,
Adam Andrews, Mrs. Yost Harbaugh,
Dr. J. W. Moore and wife, Mr. and
Mrs: Samuel McFerren, Mrs. Maurice
Rowe, Mrs. John Forthman, Mr. and
Mrs. David McGinley and Mrs. Wm.
Boone.

Because of the fact that some of our
contributors failed to observe the no-
tice, in last issue, that the RECORD
would go to press a half-day earlier
than usual, this week, on account of
Decoration day, a number of com-
munications have been unavoidably
omitted from the present issue.

The final examinations at Western
Maryland College have been complet-
ed, and 30 young persons, of whom 16
are men and 14 maide, will graduate
in the senior class on June 11. Hon-
ors went to the men as follows; Chas.
H. Kolb, first; H. Wilson Saulsbury,
second; T. Hubert Lewis, third. To
the women: Mary K. Blandford, first;
Edith A. DeBerry, second; Bessie Lee
Garnbrill, third. 0. J. Humphreys,
H. S. Robinson and T. H. Lewis, and
Misses B. L. Gambrill, A. C. Lingo
and 1. C. Hall won parts in the com-
mencement exercises for excellence in
oratory.

Obituaries, poetry and resolutions. charg-
ed for at the rate of eve cents Per line. The
regular death notices published free of
charge.

MORELOCK.—On May 26, 1902, at
Silver Run, Mrs. Matilda Morelock,
aged 75 years.

SmitszER.—On May 23, 1902, near
Uniontown, Mrs. Hannah Elisabeth
Shriner, in her 64th. year.

IN LOVING RE3IE3IBRANCE
Of our dear mother, Mrs. Mary Shoemaker.

---
A darling mother from us is gone,
A voice we loved is stilled;

A place is vacant in our home,
Which never can be filled.

Rome is sad, 0 God bow dreary,
Lonesome, lonesome, every soot:

Listening for her voice till weary,
Weary for we hear it not.

How can we think our loved one gone!
Our mother we loved so well, ,

How can It be. so sweet -a 110*er
No more witlrus can

• Ily her daughters,
2,11 RS. HARRY G. LAMBERT,
MRS. JOHN T. FOGLE,
MRS. Davin R. FOGLE.

REFORMED GENERAL SYNOD
Adjourned, after an Interesting Session,

Will meet next in Allentown, Pa.

The Reformed General Synod,which
has been holding daily sessions in
Baltimore during the past week, has
handled many questions of great im-
portance to the denomination, with
wisdom and ability. An effort to es-
tablish "denominational headquar-
ters" in order, as claimed by its ad-
vocates, to reduce administrative ex-
pense, was deferred by referring the
question to the two Mission Boards.
In the discussion of the subject, Dr.
Eschbach, of Frederick, declared that
the administration expenses were but
8 per cent of the amount collected.
The report of the executive board

of the Society for the Relief of Minis-
ters and Ministers' Widows was pre-
sented, and Rev. S. S. Miller, treas-
urer of the board, added to the infor-
mation contained in the report the
statement that 70 annuitants are on
the lists of the society; that the aver-
age amount given to each minister is
about $89 and to each widow $69.
Expenditures last year amounted to
$9.714.
By resolutions presented on Mon-

day, Rev. Dr. Schick, of Washington,
President Roosevelt's pastor, was re-
quested to express to the President
the appreciation of the synod at the
courtesy extended by the public re-
ception given to the delegates by Mr.
Roosevelt.
By a vote of 83 to 69 the General

Synod, on Tuesday, decided against
the inauguration of a "movement" to
revise the standard of faith of the de-
nomination—the Heidelberg Cate-
chism. The discussion preliminary to
the decision was participated in by
many ef the ablest members of the
synod—conservatives and progres-
sives. The former declared that there
was no occasion for considering the
question, and the latter, while con-
tending with equal intensity as the
conservatives for the retention of the
historic statement in its entirety,
urged the necessity for the prepara-
tion of a book of instruction such as
was framed by the church of Scotland,
simple and direct in its statements, to
be used in connection with the cate-
chism as a supplementary source of
information.
The question of the revision of the

constitution of the denomination was
finally disposed of at the afternoon
session by the adoption of resolutions
presented by Rev. Dr. H. M. Kiefer,
as a substitute for resolutions offered
by the committee appointed to con-
sider the subject. The resolutions
adopted provided tort he appointment
by the General Synod of a committee
of five,which is to make a preliminary
draft of a new constitution. This
preliminary draft is to be printed and
sent to the Classis for criticism and
suggestion. It is to be revised after
its return from the Classis, on the
basis of the suggestions made there,
and in amended form submitted to
the next General Synod for its con-
sideration.
The result of the election of mem-

bers of the boards was as follows;
Board of Home Missions—Rev. E.

R. Eschbaugh, Potomac Synod; Rev.
P. H. Dippel, Ph. D., German Synod
of the East; Rev. J. H. Sechler, D. D.,
Eastern: Rev. C. E. Miller, D. D.,
Ohio; Elder F. 0. Hobson, Eastern,
and Elder C. M. Boush, Pittsburg.
Board of Foreign Missions—Rey. A.

R. Bartholomew, D. D., Eastern
Synod; Elder J. L. Lemuberger, East-
ern; Rey. E. P. Herbruck,D. D.,Ohio;
Elder B. Kuhns, Ohio; Rey. J. H.
Prugh, D. D., Pittsburg, and Rev. C.
Hassel, Central.
Sunday School Board—Revs. C. S.

Gerhard, D. D.; A. E. Baichly, D. D.:
C. Clever. D. D.; A. E. Dahlman, D.
D.; C. F. Kriete and D. H. Fouee.
Board of Directors of Orphans'

Homes—Rev. S. A. Leinbach and
Elder C. G. Gross.
Synod adjourned OD Wednesday

night to meet at Allentown, in 1905.
The overture from Illinois classis re-

questing that an exhibit of the Re-
formed church be made at the St.
Louis Exposition, to be held in 1903
or 1904, was finally passed by the
synod. A committee composed of
Messrs J. C. Hornung, W. P. Horst-
meier and A. S. Dechant was appoint-
ed to have charge of the matter, and
$500 appropriated to be expended as
they see fit.

Orphans' Court Proceedings.

MONDAY, May 26th., 1902.—The last
will and testament of Herman P.
Keck. deceased, admitted to probate.
E. Oliver Grimes, Jr., administrator

of Mary C. Roop, deceased, settled
first and final account.
The Westminster Deposit and Trust

Company, guardian to Albert C. Else-
road, settled first and final account.
The Westminster Deposit an 1 Trust

Company bonded as guardian to
Claude Sylvester Koontz, infant.
Edwin J. Wentz and John V.

Wentz, executors of Abdel R. Wentz,
deceased, reported sale of grain and
settled first and final account.
A. Melvin Bay, administratrix of

Nath Bay, deceased, returned inyen-
tory of personal property.
Reverdy N. Snader, administrator

of Ella N. Snader, deceased, received
order to sell bank stock.
Clotworthy Birnie, acting execu-

or of Rogers Birnie, deceased, receiy-
order to sell R. R. stock.
George E. Cox, executor of Daniel

A. Cox, deceased, received order to
transfer mortgage.
TUESDAY, May 27th., 1902.—Edward

0. Cash, administrator of Milton A.
Mackley, deceased, returned inven-
tories of personalty and money.
The last will and testament of Jacob

Gettinger, deceased, admitted to pro-
bate and letters testamentary thereon
granted unto Joshua F. McGee, who
received order to notify creditors.
A. E. Lambert, administrator of

Amanda Lambert, deceased, reported
sale of personalty.
Final ratification of the sales of real

estate of Jesse Lambert and Sarah N.
Heagy.

News at $6.45 a Word.

The public has 110 conception at all
what the Martinique disaster is cost-
ing the newspapers. The average
man pays little attention to the
"special cable" line and reads the
stirring news without a thought as to
the cost of it. When it is known that
cable messages from Fort-de-France
cost $2.15 a word and urgent messages
$6.45 for every word, some conception
can be had of the cost of covering
this calamity.
But that is not all. There are the

tugs, the special men and the photog-
raphers All this mounts into the
thousands, but after all the big pa-
pers in New York feel that it is worth
it, and no expense has been spared to.
get this immense story.sestiemiti.

. _
The fouaserir term of Garret S.

Der Grange as postmaster of Freder-
ick expired May 22. He is being
strongly backed for reappointment,
but there are several applicants who
are making an actiye fight for the
position.

Farmers at Agricultural College.

College Park, Md., May 28.—Dele-
gates of 21 different farmers' clubs
and granges from various parts of
Maryland met at the Maryland Agri-
cultural College to-day. President
Richard W. Sib/ester deliyered an ad-
dress of welcome. They then inspect-
ed the working of the different de-
partments of the college, including
the library, the Mechanical Building,
the Chemical Building, Morrill Hall
and the hospital. They were escorted
on the round by President Silvester,
Secretary and Treasurer Dr. Joseph
R. Owens and Prof. H. R. McDonnel.
Director Harry J. Patterson showed
them over the Experiment Station
and explained its work. They ex-
pressed themselves as being much
pleased with what they saw; both at
the College and Experiment Station.
Representatives of the different clubs
and granges are expected at the Ex-
periment Station to-morrow.
Those present to-day were as fol-

lows: Dr. S. A. Oichols and Albert
Nichols, of the Dayton Grange, How-
ard county; T. Rowles Peddicord, of
the Glen wood Farmers' Club; William
A, Harlan, of the Fallston Farmers'
Club; W. Payne Norris, of the Norris-
ville Farmers' Club; Frank P. Cherry,
of the Cecil Farmers' Club; Maurice
C. Reeder, of the Cecil Grange, No. 3;
J. R. Butson, of the White Oak
Farmers' Club; George E. Shelley,
Junior Gunpowder Farmers' Club;
James B. Erison, Belfast Gunpowder
Club, Sr.; James S. Harris, Still Pond
Farmers' Club; Reuben Sayler, Union
Bridge Grange; C. R. Hartshorne,
Sandy Spring Farmers' Club; C. L.
Gilpin,Olney Grange; August Stabler,
Brighton Grange. Joseph B. Aker,
Eureka Grange; H. R, Fuss, Union
Bridge Farmers' Club; Caleb Stabler,
Enterprise Farmers' Club of Sandy
Spring; Joseph T. Hoopes,Forest Hill
Farmers' Club; Milton Ohler, Taney-
town Grange, and John S. Stultz,
Copperyille Club.—Sun.

Two Wills Contested.

Westminster, 31d., May 26.—A
caveat to the will of Elizabeth Jane
Baile, who died in New Windsor on
February 18, was entered in the
Orphans' Court of Carroll county, to-
day by her sister, Mrs. Fannie Webb,
and her nephews, Lewis Carter and
Henry C. Nicodemus. The contest is
made on the allegations of unsound-
ness of mind and undue influence.
Nathan H. Baile is the executor un-
der the will, and the value of the
estate is estimated at $100,000. Most
of it was given to her by her husband,
Jeremiah Baile, by his will, to be de-
vised as she wished. The bulk of the
estate was left to her near relatives.
Four churches received $1,000 each.
The will of John Zehner, who died

at the University Hospital;Baltimore,
last week, was also filed, with objec-
tions to its admission to probate by
his daughter, Mary M. Baugher, of
Ellicott City. The estate is valued at
$20,000 and is devised as follows: To
John Henry Gessell, his grandson, all
the real estate,consisting of a farm of
147 acres, a lot containing 7 acres,also
all of the household furniture, farm-
ing implements, horses, cattle and
$1,000. To Henry Gessell ant: George
Franz Gessell, grandsons, $1,000 each
upon arriving at the age of 21 years.
To his daughter, Mary Magdalene
Baugher, he gave $5 only, because
she left his house and married with-
out his consent and knowledge and
for saying that she could live without
his assistance. Maria Caroline and
Lizette Regina Gessell are made the
residuary legatees. His wife is given
entire use of the estete during her
lifetime, and his son in law, Augustus
Gessell, is named as executor.—Sun
Cor.

Age and Weight of Calves.

Health Commissioner Bosley has
directed the department's food in-
spectors to enforce the ordinance pro-
viding that all calves brought to Bal-
timore for slaughtering purposes shall
be at least three weeks old and weigh
80 pounds. The inspectors have had
considera ale trouble with dealers who
have shipped young calves to Balti-
more. In one case some calves were
scarcely two weeks old. They were
promptly confiscated and sent to the
abattoir. Dr. Bosley says that lie
will condemn all calves that are be-
low the age and weight required by
ordinance. Since the inspectors be-
gan their crusade an improvement
has been noticed in the condition of
the calves sent to Baltimore.

Tyrone.—The much needed rain
which Ise had on Monday, made all
growing grain and vegetables look
very fine, but at present we are hav-
ing very cool weather.
Mrs. Jonas Heltebridle has return-

ed from a visit to relatives and friends
in Baltimore.
Mr. Charles Lemmon, is going to

build an addition to his dwelling
house, which will add greatly to its
appearance.
Mr. David Hahn, wife and daugh-

ter, expect to take a visit to Virginia
the last of this week.

Woodsboro.—The angel of death
entered the home of Mr. Pierce Led-
widge, on Saturday morning, May 24,
and took therefrom his beloved wife,
aged 40 years. She lied been an in-
valid for several months and her
death, though not unexpected, has
cast a feeling of sorrow over the en-
tire community. She was a very
highly respected christian lady,a con-
sistent member of the Evangelical
Lutheran church. Besides a husband
she is suryived by one son; Gay. Fun-
eral services were conducted in the
Lutheran church, on Sunday,by Rev.
Wm. E. Wheeler.
Mr. Josiah Thomas and wife, and

Mrs. Curtis Thoams and eon, of near
Adamstown, spent several days the
past week with Mr. Jacob Dorcus
and family,
The Christian Endeavor Conven-

tion, which was held in the Lutheran
church, here, last week, was very in-
teresting and entertaining, and was
attended by a very large number of
people.
A large number of people from this

place attended the funeral of Mrs.
Ellen Fogle, a very highly respected
lady of Frederick. formerly of this
place. Services were conducted at
Rocky Hill, on Saturday morning last
by the Rev. Wm. E. Wheeler.
Mrs. Charles Dinterman and three

little daughters of Spring Grove, Pa..,
and Miss Alice Geesey, of Hanover.
Pa., have returned home after spend-
ing the past week here attending the
funeral of then. sister, Mrs. Pierce
Led widge.

Emmitsburg. — Memorial services
were held in the Lutheran church on
Sunday afternman. Rev. Chas. Reine-
weld conducted the service assisted
by Rev. D. H. Riddle. Arthur Post,
U. A. R., was present in a body with
Mr. Jas. Black, of Rocky Ridge, Com-
mander.
Dr. Albert Beam, son of Rev. S. Z.

Beam, D. D., of the Reformed church
of Bettsville, Ohio, is a guest of Mr. be very large.
Geo. P. Beam, of this place. In the I The Frederick county fish law is a
early fall with his bride, will sail fort little hard on our fishermen who usu-
China as medical missionary. ally camp at Myers' mill,

WEEKLY CORRESPONDENCE.

The Latest Items of News furnished by
Regular Contributors.

All communications for the RECORD must
be signed by the writer's own name; not nec-
essarily for publication, but as an evidence
that the matters and facts transmitted are
legitimate and correct. Items of a mischiev-
ous character are not wanted.

Union Bridge.—Orval Wright and
little daughter, Catherine, of Balti-
more, formerly of Union Bridge,spent
from Saturday to Monday at the
home of his father, Capt. Thornton
Wright and wife.
Este. Faia of Zeitzland, York Co.,

Pa., spent a few days with her broth-
er. Dr. H. L. Fair, at the home of Mr.
and Airs. Edward Shaffer.
Archibald Hess, of Canada, is visit-

ing his cousins, Mr. and Mrs. Clarence
Smith
Johnson Hoffman, of near Middle-

burg, spent Sunday with his friend,
Gilman Fowble.
Mr. Daniel Stoner,of Dayton, Ohio,

accompanied by his son-in-law,Daniel
Wampler, wife and little son, of In-
diana, are visiting his brother, Jacob
Stoner, in town, and his sister, Mrs.
Augustus Little, near town, also
among the many friends of youthful
days.
Mrs. M. C. McKinstry, started Mon-

day noon for Gratis, Ohio, to visit her
daughter, Mrs. Charles Scott;she also
has a brother at the same place.
From there she will go to Niagara, to
spend a while with her daughter,Mrs.
James Simmons and family
We have another sudden death to

record; Mrs. Harry Yinger, died Tues-
day night. Shortly after midnight
she woke her husband and said she
believed she was going to die and be-
fore he could get anyone in, she was
gone. Her maiden name was Gertie
Stephens.
Mrs. Rev. G. W. Enders and son,

George, spent this week at her home
in Gettysburg. Rev. G. W. Enders
also spent seyeral days at the Semi-
nary Commencement, his brother,
M. L. Enders being a graduate.
Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Metzger, of

Mulley, Indiana, spent a few days
with their son, Prof. C. E. Metzger at
the Md. Collegiate Institute. Mr. and
Mrs. Metzger came East to attend the
yearly meeting of the German Baptist,
at Harrisburg, Pa. Miss Ida Blicking-
stall, also of Mulley, Ind., spent a few
days at the College building.
Mrs. Eliza Engleman, gave a pleas-

ant little social to her Sunday school
class, at her home on South Main St.,
on Tuesday evening. Ice cream,
strawberries and cake were served.
Mrs. Deborah Hughes and Mrs. S.

H. Little, of Taneytown, spent from
Saturday till Monday evening at the
home of D. E. Little, also attending
the Friends Yearly Meeting. Mr. S.
H. Little spent Monday in town, and
Mrs. Little accompanied him home,
but Mrs. Hughes remained a few days
longer among relatives and friends.
Mr. and Mrs. Harry Chew and chil-

dren of Washington, D. C., spent a
few days at the home of Mrs. Wm.
Wagner and her brothers and sisters.
Mrs. Annie R. Nusbaum, widow of

John Nusbaum, died on Friday at the
home of James Snider, near town,
in her sixtieth year. Interment on
Sunday in German Baptist burying
ground at Sam's Creek.

Bark Hill.—Mr. Evan T. Smith,
wife and daughter Carrie, were Sun-
day guests of Mr. and Mrs. George
Hymiller, of Thorndale.
Mr. and Mrs. John N. Smith were

guests on Sunday of their daughter,
Mrs. Rhoda Weller, at Woodsboro.
Mr. E. Grant Shoemaker and son

Willie, Rev. S. A. Kipe and Mr. Levi
Rowe were present over Sunday at
the Sunday school convention in Ger-
mantown, Md.
Mr. Harry Eckard and wife visited

his brother Clinton and family, also
Mr. Jesse Weller's, of Woodsboro, on
Sunday,
Mr. Noah Arbaugh and sons visited

his parents on Sunday, at Wood-
berry.
Mr. George Goodwin was in at-

tendance at his uncle George Good-
win's funeral on Saturday, near Den-
fling's. The interment was made in
the Ebenezer church cemetery.
Mr. Goodwin was accompanied

home on Monday by his cousin Mr.
.John Thomas McCrea. Mr. 0. spent
Tuesday and Wednesday at Meadow
Branch ministerial meetings.
We have been favored with fine

rain showers seyeral times this week,
which have been of great benefit to all
vegetation.

Melrose.—Mr. Lan E. Miller, locat-
ed in the Shaffer building, is doing a
good business in selling wheels, and
repairing them. He told your corres-
pondent that he sold nearly $1000.00
worth of wheels since he opened his
store this spring.
Mr. Horatio Shaffer, is raising a

large frame barn this week.
Mr. Frank T. Crumrine improved

his residence last week by adding a
porch.
Wentz's Sunday school now num-

bers 83, and they are still coming in.
They have decided to hold their an-
nual celebration the last Saturday in
August. The ladies, assisted by some
of our young men, will hold a festiyal
for the benefit of the Sunday School,
on the evening of June 28th.
A refreshing shower of rain eisited

us on Saturday evening.
Quite a number of our bicyclists

went to Westminster on Saturday
evening last, to see Pawnee Bill's
Show.

Uniontown. — Mrs. Samuel Har-
baugh is visiting relatives and friends
in Baltimore.

Misses Romaine Hollenberry,Maude
Wagner and Effie Wagner spent some
time this week in Westminster.
Mr. Theodore Eckard moved his

furniture to town recently and will
reside here; he had been living in
Baltimore.
Mr. and Mrs. David Segafoose, of

Baltimore, are visiting Mr. and Mrs.
Obediah Fleagle.
Saturday evening, at 8 o'clock. as

Mrs. Jacob Price came out of her
back gate she stepped on something
she thought to be a rope. On closer
examination it was found to be a
snake, and she called a neighbor, Mr.
John Geiger, who found and killed
two copper head snakes, one measur-
ing 3 feet, 1 inch, the other 3 feet.
Miss Nellie Weaver spent several

days this week in Baltimore visiting
her uncle, Mr. John Martin.
Rev. C. E. McCullough will preach

at Uniontown M. P. church at 8
o'clock. The sermon will be delivered
to fathers and daughters.
Miss Emma Perry and sister, of Un-

ion Bridge, spent Tuesday with her
sister, Mrs. J. E. Heck.
Mrs. Mervin Powers, of Baltimore,

is spending some time with her par-
ents, Prof. and Mrs. Jesse F. Billmy-
er.
Rev. J. D. Clark will give an illus-

trated sermon Sunday evening,at the
Church of God.
Prof. Jesse F. Billmyer and Rev.

T. B. Tyler, of Carrollton, Church of
God, are delegates to General Elder-
ship which meets at Idaville, White
Co., Indiana.
The person who has been making

nocturnal visits to the coal houses
and hog feed chests in the the center
of town, had better cease their visits,
as a load of shot awaits their next ap-
pearance. A word to the wise ought
to be sufficient.
Mrs. Mary A. Garner, of Copper-

yille, who is in her 85th. year, recent-
ly spent some time with Mrs. E. U.
Gilbert's family.
The colored people of Mt. Joy M.

E. church will hold an all day woods
meeting in the grove of Mr. Harry
Stouffer, on road from Uniontown to
Linwood. Sunday June 1st., the
pastor, Rev. C. U. Walker will speak
at 11 o'clock.
Mrs. Harbaugh, who has been yis-

iting in Westminster, returned home
first of the week.
Mr. Jas. S. Waltz, of Clear Ridge,

has greatly improved his house by
adding blinds to the windows.
Rev. Geo. W. Englar,pastor-elect of

Youngstown, Ohio, is visiting his
mother near town, and will preach on
Sunday afternoon at Mt. Union and
in the evening in Uniontown.

Harney.—C. F. Shryock has a force
of carpenters at work on his new
house. It will make a fine appear-
armee when completed.
Decoration services will be held in

this place on Saturday evening, at 6
o'clock, under the supervision of
Washington Camp No. 39, P. 0. S. of
A. Several speakers have been in-
vited. The Lutheran and U. B. Sun-
day schools and the different orders
of the town are expected to join in
the parade. Music will be furnished
by the Taneytown Drum Corps and
Harney Cornet Band Old soldiers
are especially invited to be present
and all patriotic citizens are expected
to unite in helping to make this the
best decoration service ever held in
this place. Sunday school children
and others are requested to bring
flowers.
M. D. Hess is having his buildings

repainted which will add greatly to
the appearance. The work is being
done by J. W. Fream, our popular
paper-hanger and painter.
John D. Hesson will open up a

green grocery in the near future. He
will also hasidle ice cream arid oysters
in season. John has gone to the
trouble to fix his rooms up in good
shape for the business, and we be-
lieve will do well.
J. W. Slagenhssup is beginning to

harvest his crop of strawberries; the
quality is fine but the crop will not

Middleburg.—Owing to the sudden
illness of the pastor, Rev. F. G. Wat-
son, there was no preaching service
last Sabbath morning.
The community was greatly shock-

ed over the sudden death of Mr.
Frank Humbert, which occurred last
Monday morning. Mr. Humbert arose
that morning in his usual health, ate
his breakfast, did his morning work,
and then told his wife that he was go-
ing to clean his pig pen; after a short
time, not hearing him, she went to
look for him and found him in the
inside pen lying on his face. Help
was quickly summoned but life was
extinct. Mr. Humbert had been great-
ly afflicted for a number of years with
epileptic flits, and it is supposed that
he was seized with one, and falling on
his face, smothered to death in the
manure.
About twelve years ago he gave his

heart to God and became a member
of the M. E. church, and during these
years he has ever been an earnest,
faithful worker, perfectly devoted to
the church and its interests; his life
has been a wonderful example to both
old and young. In his death the
church has met with a sad loss. The
family have our deepest sympathy,
but they have this comfort, that,hav-
ing lived a Godly, righteous life, he
was prepared when the message came
and has entered into that rest reserv-
ed for the faithful. His age was 27
years, 6 months and 22 days. His
funeral took place Wednesday morn-
ing, interment in the M. E. cemetery.
Rev. Kipe. assisted by his former pas-
tor, Rev. J. H. ,Brunges, officiated.
Mr. Harry Otto spent several days

at home attending the funeral of his
friend, Mr. Frank Humbert.

Linwood.—The festival was well
patronized and the receipts aggregat-
ing nearly one hundred dollars. It was
a joyful occasion for old and young.
Rev. Lyons. of Washington, D. C.,

held services in the hall on Sunday
evening.
D. Roy Fisher now holds the posi-

tion as clerk in the ticket and expresa
office here, and is being initiated into
its mysteries. Roy was a successful
student at the M C. I., and though
short in stature did not fall short of
getting his mind filled with useful
knowledge, but seems to stop short
sometimes of going all the way home
with a lady friend.
A Haviland Hull, of Harford Co.,

Md., preached acceptably to the small
audience in attendance at the Friends'
Quarterly Meeting on Sunday and
Monday.
Jesse Smith, of the western suburbs

has had a neat iron fence erected
around his front yard.
John Buffington has laid the foun-

dation for another large corn crop.
Tuesday was a cold, disagreeable

day, could well have been the thirty-
second of March. Enough rain fell
Monday night to wet the surface
nicely, but the unplowed corn ground
was not much benefitted.

Gist.—Early corn has come up very
nicely in this neighborhood, and the
farmers have commenced to cultivate
it, but the late planting is coining up
very badly and there will be a large
per cent to replant.
Clover is in full bloom but is very

short and unless there is considerable
rainfall in the next few days, the crop
is not likely to be up to the average.
Early potatoes seem to have come up
very well, and also potato bugs in
abundance.
Mr. Edward Conoway has begun

the wall for his new house.
Mr. Howel Davis, of Smallwood,and

Mr. and Mrs. David Blooirrand fami-
ly, of near Dennings, spent Sunday
last with Mr. and Mrs. John T. Par-
rish, of this place.
Mr. James V. Criswell, since the

death of his wife, has quit keeping
house, and has gone to live with his
daughter, Mrs. James Buckingham,
also of this place, and will sell his
household effects on Saturday, May
31st., at public sale.
Bethesda Chapter Epworth League

will hold its annual strawberry and
ice cream festival on Saturday, June

Mr. John T. Edmondson has his
new mill under roof, and will soon be
ready to place the machinery in posi-
tion.
Mr. George Goodwin, of near Win-

field, died on last Thursday, and was
buried at Ebenezer M. E. church on
Saturday. Mr. Goodwin was a sol-
dier in the late war, and a member of
Pickette Post-, G. A. It.
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SATURDAY, MAY 31st., 1902.

MANY OF THE newspapers of the
country received a severe shock last
week when the announcement was
received from the Ladies' Home Jour-
nal-in the elegant language for
which it is editorially so conspicuous
-that, henceforth no copies will be
mailed free(?) to newspapers, or ex-
changes. The reason given, is, that
the cost of doing so has been very,
very, large, which carries with it the
intimation that the free advertising
received in return has been very, very,
small. Altogether, this is a sad com-
mentary on the liberality of the
country press; or rather,on its failure
to properly appreciate the Journal
(price $1.00 a year) in not giving it at
least $10.00 worth of free advertising
a year. Serves 'em right.

How General Laws are Published
for the People.

A number of our democratic ex-
changes reached us last week,bulging
out with a supplement containing
certain Public General Laws,publish
ed by authority and expense of the
state of Maryland. To the uninitiat-
ed, these "supplements" appear to
have been printed in the offices from
which they are mailed, but, as a mat-
ter of fact, they are bought by the 100
copies, all from one printing office,
the name of each paper and its date
line being changed to suit, but, oth
erwise identical for all papers favored
with the distribution of the laws.
The difference between the price

charged the various papers for these
"supplements," and that which each
paper receives from the state for
"publishing the laws," would make a
most interesting exhibit to the tax-
payers who indirectly foot the bills.
The injustice and rottenness connect-
ed with the publishing business of the
state will be wiped out, some day, but
the prospect is not encouraging. The
people can do it, but they are awfully
hard to awaken to some things.
We have a number 31' these "sup-

plements" on hand, which may be
had on application at this office by
those interested. As all tax-payers of
the state are not subscribers to the
chosen few democratic newspapers, it
is reasonable to presume that a very
large number of the citizens of Mary-
land who "pay the freight" in this
little transaction, will not receive
their proper share of the goods.

Where, and Why, they Go.

The RECORD, last week, contained
two advertisements for young men,
wanted in York, Pa., and Hagers-
town, Md. In a few words, and with-
out need of much comment, the cir-
cumstance carries a very important
truth with it. It shows where our
young men and mechanics are want
ed, and, as a matter of course, where
they go to. The same truth is also
illustrated by an examination of the
mailing list of the RECORD, as our
subscribers, except in this county, are
very largely those who once lived in
this neighborhood.
There is no use to talk to the capi-

talists of Taneytown about the ad
visability of establishing manufact-
uring enterprises; not because they
are too mentally obtuse to see the
benefit of building up our old town
and neighborhood through the intro
duction of home enterprises, but
rather because it is not in their line of
business-they have neither talent
nor predisposition in that direction.
It is all very well to say, "we need

manufacturing," but, such things do
not come for the saying or wishing-
there must be the intelligence and
business ability of the manufacturer
back of it, or even well-meant efforts
in the right direction may meet with
flat failure. A manufacturing enter
prise backed by those not thoroughly
acquainted with the business, is a
foolish step in the dark; therefore, as
our citizens have had no training
which equips them for entering this
branch of business, we are very likely
to see Taneytown remain, for years,
much as at present.
Indeed, there are reasons why this

may not be a discouraging outlook. A
large town is not necessarily the best
town, and, while we must expect our
young men to go from us, and from
the surrounding farming community,
there nevertheless remains to us the
satisfaction and privilege of going
through life in a comparatively mod-
est way, but at the same time in one
of the best small towns of the country,
in one of the best farming communi-
ties of the country, and there are de_
cidedly worse prospects than this.
What we can do, and ought to do,

is to malfe our town and country
homes just as comfortable and at-
tractive as we can. The country dis-
tricts are not nearly so much sneered
at as they once were; in fact, thous-
ands of those who live in the city,and
are envied by their country friends
and relatives, in turn, deep down in
their hearts-when they do not open-
ly acknowledge it-wish that they
might exchange places with their
country friends. One of the greatest
things on earth is contentment.

To be Court Martialed.

Washington, May 25.-Capt. Harry
E. Smith, of the Coast Artillery, on
duty at Fort McHenry, Md., will be
tried by court martial special instruc-
tions of Secretary Root. Captain
Smith was ordered before a retiring
board, which recommended him for
transfer from the active list. Secre-

tary Root was incensed at the recom-
mendation, and made this comment:
"The evidence before the board,not

contradicted,but practically admitted
by the officer, shows that he was suf-
fering from chronic alcoholism, and
that upon at least one recent occasion
he has been drunk on duty.
"These are not grounds for placing

an officer on the retired list and sup-
porting him the rest of his life in idle-
ness at the expense of his country,but
they are grounds for dismissing him
from the service which he has dis-
graced; nor does it furnish any reason
for keeping such an officer under ob-
servation and treatment for six
months, or for any period. Immedi-
ate and severe discipline is called for
and nothing else.
"My observation has satisfied me

that the standard of sobriety and
good personal habits among the offi-
cers of the army is very high, but it
would not long remain so if cases of
this kind were to be condoned or dis-
posed of in the manner which has
been proposed in this case. Officers
who observe such cases and fail to re-
port them promptly for discipline are
remiss in the performance of their
duties, and I desire the army to un-
derstand that they will be so con-
strued."
Mr. Root followed these remarks up

with a provision that Captain Smith
should be tried by court martial.
Another army officer, Lieut. Wil-

liam R. Mc Gill, on duty at Vancouv-
er Barracks, Wash., has been report-
ed for intoxication. He has been al-
lowed to resign from the service in
order to escape trial by court martial.
-Herald.

"American Business Methods."

Some plain suggestions regarding
American business methods are given
by the British Consul at Chicago, Mr.
Wyndham, in a report to the British
Foreign Office, a copy of which has
reached the Treasury Bureau of Sta-
tistics.
The commercial success in the Unit

ed States, and especially of the city
at which he is located is described by
Consul Wyndham as being due in
part "to the education which teaches
the boy independence and knowledge
of their future responsibilities, and
does not set the professions above
business as a means of gaining a liv-
ing,
"Athletics of all kinds are much en-

couraged in schools and universities,
but very few men continue to take
part in them after completing their
education. Americans are as fond of
outdoor life, shooting and fishing, as
are the men of any European country,
but they gratify their taste as a relax-
ation only and never allow it to in-
terfere with their business.
"Another cause of success is the

keeping of the money, which has been
made in the business, and the brains
which have made the business, in it
as long as possible, and great thought
is devoted to arrangement whereby,
after the death of the builder of the
business, it shall not fall into tile
hands of his heirs, unless they are
practically fitted to take care of it.
"Another and probably the chief

cause is the reward of merit. The per-
centage of men fitted for the highest
posts in business is very small com-
pared with the total numbers employ-
ed, and the heads of the big business-
es, bank corporations and wholesale
firms, are always looking out for men,
not only among those already in their
employ, but also outside, capable of
filling some post under them. To
these men, when found, large salaries
are given, which are drawn by them
as long as they show that they are
capable of earning them. Men em-
ployed in business houses of all de-
scriptions are encouraged to discover
new methods of carrying on the busi-
ness which may in any way lessen the
cost of production or carrying on bus-
iness, and specialisation is carried on
to an extreme point.
"The advantage of a well dressed

show window in every kind of retail
trade is more than ever understood,
and very great trouble, expense, and
ingenuity are used in getting good
results. Many shops now put mechan-
ical toys in the windows to attract
the attention of passers by, The
trade papers are also taking up the
subject and give illustrations and
ideas.
' "In machine shops and factories
the use of the best machinery is un-
derstood and appreciated by the men,
but the succeis of the American man-
ufacturer would appear to be owing
not to the machinery but to the sys-
tem of shop management. Every
man appears to be fully aware that
success depends upon his doing his
best work,and no idleness is tolerated
in anyone. The highest positions in
a shop are open to anyone who can
prove his worth and every man works
with this incentive.
"Many visitors from the United

Kingdom blame the men there be-
cause the same results are not obtain-
ed from machinery as is done here,
but the more the factories are seen
the more certain it becomes that it is
the incentive to work and the energy
of the managers, superintendents and
foremen,and the example set by them
that has the wonderful effect on the
output. This holds good In every
kind of trade and business."

Whooping Cough.
A woman who has had experience

with this disease, tells how to prevent
any dangerous consequences from it.
She says: Our three children took
whooping cough last summer, our
baby boy being only three months
old, and owing to our giving them
Chamberlain's Cough Remedy, they
lost none of their plumpness and
came out in much better health than
other children whose parents did not
use this remedy. Our oldest little girl
would call lustily for cough syrup be-
tween whoops.-JEssin PINKEY HALL,
Springville, Ala. This Remedy is for
sale by R. S. McKinney, Druggist,
Taneytown Md.

The Strike Situation.

Wilkesbarre, Pa., May 26 -It is still
a matter of conjecture whether the
mines in the anthracite region will be
completely shut down next Monday
when the order issued by the execu-
tive boards of the United Mine Work-
ers, governing the hours of labor and
wages to be paid engineers, firemen
and pump iunners. goes into effect.
The operators claim they will have all

the help necessary to keep the pumps
and engines in running order.
The United Mine Workers and the

officers of the Stationary Firemen's
Association, on the other hand, claim
that unless the coal companies grant
the demands made upon them the
great bulk of the engineers, firemen
and punipmen will quit work. There
seems to be no question but that both
sides are straining every nerve to
make the best showing possible.
The operators are bringing all the

influence they possibly can to hold
the men no at wor k,while the strik-
ing miners are also doing missionary
work. Many of the engineers do not
like the predicament they are placed
in. If they quit work, they will dis-
please the company of officials and
may never be reinstated,while if they
remain at their present posts and the
miners should win their strike, they
would probably find that things
would not be so pleasant for them at
the collieries in the future. In order
to reach those who are wavering a
call was issued to-night for a mass
meeting of all engineers, punipmen
and firemen in the Wyoming region
in this city next Friday evening.

American Flour Abroad.

Although the capacity of the flour
mills of the United States is more
than ample to grind into flour all the
wheat that is grown in this country,
yet many of these mills are out of
commission for many months each
year, owing to the exports of wheat.
The growing tendency to export
wheat rather than the flour manu-
factured from this wheat, is caused,
not by the Is ck of demand in foreign
countries for our flour, nor by their
abilitity to manufacture flour of equal
quality, but by the fact that the
transportation companies make a
lower rate on wheat than on the man-
ufactured article-flour.
While American flour is wanted in

European markets, the next best
thing, and much cheaper by reason
of the lower freight rates, is flour
made from American wheat in foreign
mills. Great Britain draws its sup-
plies of wheat from India, Argentina,
Australia, and Russia. While the
British miller prefers American
wheat, nevertheless he can and does
use the supplies from other countries
in accordance with the prevailing
price. If Russian wheat is cheaper,
he uses more Russian. If Indian
wheat is cheaper,ne uses more Indian.
American wheat, therefore, stands in
the severest competition. The sup-
plies of wheat for the British miller,
then, may or may not afford cargoes
for the railroads of America and the
steamships from American ports.
How is it with flour? American

flour, as already statedourpasses that
of any other country for general
bread-making purposes. The brands
of American flour have in Great Brit-
ain a trade-mark value in addition to
an intrinsic value. American wheat
entering a British will loses its iden-
tity, and therefore to the consumer
has no trade-mark value. In other
words, if the transportation compan-
ies of America should help in the de-
velopment of the American flour trade
in foreign countries by transporting
flour at the same freight rate as
wheat,they would enjoy a permanent
traffic for their cars and ships, be-
cause American flour can be obtained
only in America, and, having a trade-
mark value, cannot be so easily re-
jected for substitutes.-From "The
Fallacy of Exporting Wheat," by
Charles C. Boyey, in the American
Monthly Review of Reviews for May.

A Historic Theatre Program.

J. Sherwood Case, of Brooklyn,
N. Y., possessor of the identical
theatre program which President
Lincoln held in his hand at the time
of his assassination, has applied for
apace for its exhibition si,t the St.
Louis World's Fair. In reply to a
letter from him asking about provis-
ion for the safe keeping of the precious
relic, Secretary Stevens has written
as follows: "Your application has
been filed with the committee having
charge of the historical exhibits. It
is strongly probable that one of the
Washington University buildings will
be set apart especially for the exhib-
its, which promise to be not only nu-
merous, but of great value and inter-
est. The Exposition management has
received tenders of historical relics
from this and other countries which
encourages the belief that the collec-
tion will form one of the most inter-
esting features of the Exposition."

Reveals A Great Secret.
It is often asked how such startling

cures, that puzzle the best physicians,
are effected by Dr. King's New Disco-
very for Consumption. Here's the se-
cret. It cuts out the phlegm and germ
infected mucus, and lets the life-giv-
ing oxygen enrich and vitalize the
blood. It heals the inflamed, cough-
worn throat and lungs. Hard colds
and stubborn coughs soon yield to
Dr. King's New Discovery, the most
infallible remedy for all Throat and
Lung diseases. Guaranteed bottles 50e
and $1.00. Trial bottles free at R. S.
McKinney, Druggist, Taneytown,Md.

ASSIGNEE OF ASSIGNEE OF

Mortgagee's Sale
of a Desirable Little Property, situat-
ed in Taneytown District in Car-

roll County, Maryland.

By virtue of the power and authority con-
tained in a mortgage from Emma V. Stone-
siter and Andrew Stonesifer, her husband,to
William H. Cromer, bearing date on the 10thday of May, 1900, and duly recorded among
the Real Estate Mortgage Records of Carroll
County in Liber J. H. B. No. 44, folio 117, etc..
and by him assigned to Daniel J. *lesson and
by the said Hesson duly assigned to the un-
dersigned, the undersigned Assignee of
Assignee of Mortgagee will sell at public
sale, on the premises, on
SATURDAY, THE 14th. DA Y OF JUNE, 1902
at 2 o'clock, p. m., all the Real Estate men-
tioned and described in said Mortgage, con-
taining Two Acres and Thirty-nine Perches
of Land, more or less. The improvements

thereon consist of a Two-story
FRAME DWELLING HOUSE,
Stable, and outbuildings. There
are two wells of water on the

premises. The property is located In the
town of Harney. in Carroll County and State
of Maryland. and adjoins lands of William
Slaugenhaupt, William:Snider and others.
TERMS OF SALE:- Cash ou the day of sale or

upon ratification of sale by the Court, or if
desired by the purchaser or purchasers, one-
third cash on the day of sale or upon ratifi-
cation thereof, one-third in six months and
the other one-third in twelve months from
the day of sale, the credit payments to be se-
cured by the notes of the purchaser or pur-
chasers, with approved security, bearing in-
terest from the day of sale.

EDWARD Is. RE1NDOLLAR,
Assignee of Assignee of Mortgagee

Roberts & Crouse, Solicitors.
Wm. T. Smith, Auctioneer. 5-24-4t

....YOUNT'S

When Men Talk
of Hats, Shirts, Neckwear,and
other Furnishings, and a good
place to buy them, our store is
sure to be favorably mention-
ed. We have the

Shields' Guaranteed Hats,
new Panama Shapes, $1.00 to $2.00

The Capital Shirts,
new Spring styles; they're all they
look to be, and tit as well as you'd
like to have a shirt fit. Price-50c.

Here's a Couple
of Specials in Shoes that you'll
find bard to duplicate in this
town or elsewhere, quality con-
sidered.

No. I• Women's Vici Kid Oxfordswith kid or patent tips, ex-
tension soles, beautiful all over,
and just as good as they look.
Price $1.25.

fio. 2 absolutely solid leather, .Men's Satin Calf lace Shoes,
se-

lected vamps, Kangaroo tops, $1.25.

R. & G. Corsets.
The past uncertainty as to

Corset shape seems to be set-
tled at last in favor of the mod-
ified straight front and medium
short lengths.

We have just received the fol-
lowing at 50c., "R. & G." Straight
Front and Medium Corset. At 75c,
"R. & G." Medium, short hips and
low bust. At $1.00. "R. & G."
Straight Front, full gored, low bust
and short hip.

China Plates, 10c.
Extra. size 25c Plate, transparent

China: size 9+ inch; scalloped gold
edge, decorated centre-only six
plates to a customer, at 10c each,
while they last.

Shears, I Oc.
"Boss Cutter," Nickel-plated

Shears, size '7 inch, brass nut and
bolt, with spring washer to keep
blades in line-cheap enough at 25c
-special price, 10c, May only.

I
Wood Handle Grater, 3c.
One of our old "stand-bys" at 5c.

Full size; strong copper wire run-
ning entirely around the edge;
black wood handle. Special 30 day
price, 3c each.

Wire Potato Masher, 6c.
Heavy rationed wire, double

twisted, making fo-ar strands, firm-
ly fitted in black enameled handle,
always a 10-center; special price,5e.

Crescent Bicycles.
If you desire to beceme a wheel-

man don't buy a disappointment.
Its a high jump from the inferior
grades to the splendid qualities
found in a Crescent. Crescents in
stock, at $25.00.

F. M. YOUNT
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Special Sales

-ON

Boys' Suits

and Men's Pants.

HATS

of all varieties and Prices.

Reindollar, Hess & Co.

TANEYTOWN, MD,

NO. 3969 EQUITY.

In the Circuit Court for Carroll
County, Sitting as a Court

of Equity.
William A. McKellip. Attorney or Agent of

John McKellip,
Mortgagee,

vs.
William Fogle and wife,

Mortgagors.
ORDERED. this 19th. day of May, A. D., 1902,

by the Circuit Court for Carroll county in
Equity, that the sale of the land and premis-
es in the proceedings in this cause made and
reported by William A. McKellip. Attorney
or Agent, be ratified and confirmed, unless
cause to the contrary thereof be shown on
or before the 23rd. day of June. next; provid-
ed a copy of this order be inserted in some
newspaper printed and published in Carroll
county, once in each of three successive
weeks before the 16th. day of June A. D., 1902.
The report states the amount of sale to be

$35000.
JAS. H. BILLINGSLEA, Clerk.

True Copy, 
Test:- JAS. H. BILLINGSLEA, Clerk.

5-24-41.

THE TANEYTOWN

SAVINGS BANK
Does a General Banking Business,

Loans money on Real or Personal Se-
curity. Discounts Notes. Collections
and Remittances promptly made.

Interest paid on Time Deposits.
HENRY GALT. Treasurer

JAS. C. GALT, President.

DIRECTORS.

LEONARD ZILE,
JOSHUA KOUTZ,
JAMES C. GALT,
C. W. WEAVER,
W. W. CRAPSTER,

H. 0. STONESIFER,
JOHN S. BOWER,
JOHN J. CRAPSTER,
CALVIN T. FRINGER
HENRY GALT.
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Our stock is made up of !
the best American, English 10
and French goods, and will
be sold at popular prices.
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you don't have to buy.
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are all very well in
their place. We have
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ROB'T S. McKINNEY,
• DRUGGIST,
• TANEYTOWN, MD.
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iT ewelry
Silverware, Watches,

Clocks and Diamonds
-OF ALL KINDS.-

Remember, that you can get any-
thing in this line you may wish to
have, at-

HULL'S CASH JEWELRY STORE
I have the largest assortment ever

displayed in town,and if I don't have
what you want, I can get it for you-
Right.

Repairing of all Kinds.
Old Gold and Silver Bought.

Talking Machines,
from $5.00 up; also Records
and Repairs.

Spectacles or Eye Glaes.
When in need of these. remember

that you can be served as well by
your home people, as by strangers.

Eyes Examined Free, by Dr. F. IL Seiss.
Hull's Cash Jewelry Store,

T ANEYTOWN, - - - - MD

IMPROVED EMPIRE

Cream Separators
ARE THE BEST.

We can boast just-
ly that more Empire
Separators were sold
during the past five
years within a radi
us of 50 miles of
Taneytown (the best
private dairy sec-
tion of the state)
than all others com-
bined. After repeat-
ed contests will all
makes worthy the
name, over 600 were
sold in said section
alone.

Testimonials.
We can now furnish more testi

monials than there are people living
in Taneytown, Md. Think of it; an
army of Empire users of over 500,000.
sold since 1894; if but one of these
users would sell but a single machine
during the coming year, just think
where it will put the number of Em
pire machines. A proof of the Em
pire's merits is a trial thereof.

D. W. GARNER,
General Agent,

TANEYTOWN, MD.

Also Agent for the Harder's patent
all-open front ROUND SILOS; theN
are the best Silo that money can buy
Now is the time to talk Silo-not wait
(loth you want to fill them. I shall be
pleased to furnish estimates on same.
-D. W. GARNER.

Look to Your Interest!
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( Fenc No. 20.)

We manufacture our own Fence,
oyer our own models, and when you
buy from us you save agent's profits.

Cemetery, Church and Lawn Fences
a specialty. We have many differeer
patterns of Fabric wires for wood or
iron posts. Our Woven Wire Garda!,
Fence is close enough for poultry,and
strong enough to turn horses.
Don't fail to see our Drive Anchor

Post. We guarantee all our work
and are ready to call on you at any
time with our samples, and give you
estimates.
We sell State, County, District and

Farm rights for making our Superi-
or Farm Fencing. Address or call
OD-

J. W. EYLER
MIDDLEBURG, MD

Telephone: Middleburg Exchange. 3-22-3m

Dr. J. W. Eelm,
New Windsor, Md.,

surgeon rentist.
Crown and Bridge Work, Plate Work, Fill-ing Teeth,and Teeth extracted without pain.[will be in TANEYTOWN.Ist. Wednesday ofeach month. Engagements can be madewith me by mail, and at my office in New

Windsor, at all other times except the 3rd.
Saturday, and Thursday and Friday, imme-
diately preceding that day. Nitrous OxideGas administered.
J. W. HELM, D. D. S., Graduate of Mary-land University 1141timore. 5-1-2

There is scarcely any condition. of 111-health
that is not benetitted by the occasional use
of a R•I•P•A•N'S Tabule. For sale by Drug-
gists. The Five-Cent packet is enough for
an ordinary occasion. The family bottle.
60 cents contains a supply for a year. 2-8-3

THE BIRNIETRUSTCO.
---TANEYTOWN, MD.

(Successors to (1E0. H. BIRNIE & CO.)

TRANSACTS A GENERAL BANKING BUSINESS.
We receive Deposits subject to Cheek. Pay Interest on Time Deposits.
Give Special Rates to Weekly and Monthly Depositors.
Discount Business Notes. Make Loans on Approved Security.
Have Safety Deposit Boxes to Rent, for Valuables.
Legal Depository for Trust Funds. Collections Promptly Attended to.
Legally authorized to Accept TRUSTS of every description, as RECEIV-

ER, TRUSTEE, ADMINISTRATOR, EXECUTOR, ASSIGNEE or GUARDIAN.
THIS BANK has been a Successful and Growing

Institution. Its DEPOSITS and LOANS
show its Progress.

TOTAL DEPOSITS. TOTAL LOANS.
Feb. 9, 1898.......$138,798.45.
Feb. 9, 1899   178,396.85.
Feb. 9, 1900  202,297,09
Feb. 9, 1901  242,330.46.
Feb. 9, 1902  285,592.20.

Feb. 9, 1898 $127,760.73.
Feb. 9, 1899  164.463.88.
Feb. 9, 1900  200,373.43.
Feb. 9, 1901 .. 225,693.30.
Feb. 9, 1902  277,336.43.

- DIRECTORS. -
EDW. E. REINDOLLAR, Pres't. J. J. WEAVER, JR., Vice-Pres't.
GEO. H. BIRNIE, Cashier. G. WALTER WILT, AS8't Cashier.
MARTIN D. HESS. EDWIN H. SHAREVI`S. HARVEY E. WEANT.

OUR SPRING LINE,,,mses.
of Men's, Ladies', Misses' & Childrens' Shoes

comprise a much larger variety than ever before;
adapted to all purposes, to suit all pockets, and
satisfy all tastes.

Before buying your Spring Hat
Let us show you our "1902" shapes-prices from 50c
to $2.50.

Everything that is new and up-to-date will be found here in
Neckwear, Collars, Shirts, Gloves, Suspenders, Overalls, Pants,
Trunks and Dress Suit Cases.

SPECIAL BARGAINS!
15 dozen Boys' Golf Caps, regular 25c grade at 15c.
Ladies' and Misses' Rubbers, all sizes, 25c.

WM. C. DevILBIss,
22 W. Main St., Westminster, Md.

New Goods! New Goods!

Spring Goods at Oak Hail.
You are invited to inspect our stock. We have a number of new things in

Dress Goods, that will interest you. Bought in Dress Patterns, with beau-
tiful line of Trimmings to match. Corded Silks, Corded Flannels for waists.
Piques, Percales, Lawns-many bargains in Dress Goods that we want to
close out. Over 100 Silk Waist Patterns, at zo per cent under value. Anew line added-look at our Children's Dresses and Aprons, from 25c to$1.25-beautifully made; Calicoes 3+c and up.

Queensware 56-piece set; 87.89 for 105-piece Dec. Dinner Set. $1.96 for Dec-
The cheapest line in the county. Decorated Tea set. $8.50 for

• orated Chamber Sets.
A beautiful line of Mattings and Carpets. SLIPPERS AND SHOES.-Our Ladies' Shoeat $1.11 is a beauty. Children's and Boys' Clothing-a beautiful line. Thinking of closingout our Men's Clothing, you may expect to hear of such prices and values that will startlethe natives-150 or more Gents' suits to select from, one-fourth to one-third off Regularprice, starting at 52.75.
6 pounds of Prunes for ....5c; 6 pounds of Crackers for 26c. We propose to give our pa-trons an opportunity to get bargains.

New Windsor, Md. GEO. C. ANDERS.
P. S.-We have 50 to 75 Choice Patterns. The and 85c grade to be given our trade at 50c-both plain and fancy-new shades and new goods. Y1, e want to reduce our stock. Comeand see us-we will appreciate your visit as well as your trade. Our stock is Up-to date,but prices are Below Par. -G Eo. C. ANDERS

CAPONS! CAPONS! CAPONS!
POULTRY OF ALL RINDS.

TAG IT TO 

ELLIS & BONSACK,
C3E1NE112.AIL, COMMISSION IVIR.criAivr.s,

30 S. Charles St., Baltimore, Md.,
and get highest prices for whatever you ship.

CLOVER SEED,....
shipped on order. Write for and prices.

$5.00
- WILL BUY -

A CROWN WASHER,
-AT-

D. H. ESSIG'S,
This is the best machine on the

market, and we will give you one a
week on trial.

Queenswa re and Crockery.
Can always show you a fall

stock in these goods-John-
son's Best Ware, of which you
can select your own combina-
tion. 100-piece Decorated
Dinner Sets; also fine Deco-
rated Chamber Sets.

SPECIALS.

Examine my 5c and 103 Glassware.
A full line of Fresh Groceries al-

ways on hand.

Syrups from 25c to 40c.
Yours Respectfully,

D. H. ESSIG,
Jun-8-1 TANEYTOWN, MD

Littlestown Carriage Works.

S. D. MEHRING
MANUFACTURER OF

Fine Carriages, Buggies,
PHAETONS, TRAPS, CARTS,

Cutters, Etc.
DAYTON,

Fine McCALL, 
Wagons,JAGGER,

- AND A

General Line of Light Vehicles.
0

Repairing Promptly Done!
Low Prices, and all work guaranteed.

LITTLESTOWN, PA.
opposite Depot

DAVID B. SHAUM,

13 itc1e r.
Dealer in Fresh and Cured Meats.

Highest Cash Price always paid for
Fat Cattle, Hogs, Lambs, Calves,
Beef Hides and Furs of all kinds.
Proprietor of

Taneytown Meat Market.
Regular wagon service throughout

the adjoining country.
2-16 .1-15

This Space_..-..
IS RESERVED BY

J. S. BOWER,
The Hardware Man,

TANEYTOWN, MD.

Call and See His Goods.

The Tyrone Store !
J. A. ANG.EI,I,, Prop.

Washing Machines.
Do you want a good Wash-

ing Machine? I have them at
prices within reach of all. If
you want to save from one to
two dollars on a washer,come
to see me.

FENCING WIRE.
After the present stock of

wire is disposed of, the price
will advance. No q fencing
wire. $2.75 per hundred
lbs

Shoes, Dry. Goods, Groceries,
Notions and Hardware,

as low as they can be had any-
where, when Quality is tak-
en into consideration.
I am thankful for the pat-

ronage received during the
past year; and hope for a con-
tinuation of the same in the
future.

Yours, etc.,

J. A. ANGELL.
10- 12-tf
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Hail to Spring-tide !
Listen! The season of the year is now at

hand when every well regulated home is
looking after lawn, yard and garden sur-
roundings.
I am still in the Ornamental Fence busi-

ness, and am prepared to make diagrams
and furnish estimates at short notice. Any
person desiring

Ornamental Fence,
for town or country, please call on or ad-
dress-

CHAS. A. FOX,
Route No. 16. KEYSVILLE, MD.

--
I am agent for the Little Gem Wire Fence

Machine, with which every farmer can corn-
I plete his field fence at small cost. 3-1-tf.

QUALITY WINS!
LOOK TO YOUR INTERESTS!
Fancy and Staple Groceries

can be had at

J. T. KOONTZ'S.
I guarantee all goods fresh and to

be as represented or money refunded.
We handle a full line of Fresh

Groceries and Confectioneries.
Best quality at bottom prices. Not

necessary to publish prices, as the
public can be convinced if they give
us a call. We have the agency for
the famous

Cyclone Flour,
Give it a trial and be convinced

that it is superior to all other grades
that you have been using. Use it
once and you will never use any other.
We also carry a full line of all other
grades of Flour, Cornmeal, etc.

Coffee and Tea.
I always keep constantly on band a

fresh supply of Coffee and Tea, at
small prices for the best quality of
goods. Try my 15o Loose Roasted
Coffee, and you will find it the best
for the money that you have eyer
used.

Canned Goods and Dried Fruits,
constantly on hand. Tobacco, Cigars,
etc., always in stock. Eggs and Lard
taken in exchange. Give me a call
and be convinced that my prices are
as low as the lowest.

THE MODEL BAKERY,
TANEYTOWN, MD.

5-A Horse Hats.

5IA Horse Hat
More popular than ever. Endors-

ed by horsemen. Protect your hors-
es from the sun's deadly heat. In-
duce comfort and increase the work
of the horse.

Bonner's Barn Dust.
A perfect disinfectant and absorb-

ent. Sure death to foul air and con-
tagious diseases. Sure preventive of
cholera. Insects will not bother flow-
ers, trees, or any plants upon which
it is used. 25c package.

Wonder Rawhide Whip.
Guaranteed not to swag. Replaced

if broken by fair means. Sole agent.

S. C. REAVER,
SADDLE AND HARNESS MAKER,

TANEVTOWN. MD.

The Way to Happiness!
I have a full line of First-class

Washing Machines and Clothes
Wringers, such as

The 1900 Ball-bearing Washer,
(shown in Cut.)

Vandergrift, Western,Boss,
Sterling, Chief, Good Luck, Ter-

riff Perfect, Handy, New
Becker, Rotary and others,
any of which I will put on three
weeks' trial.
Repairs for all kinds of Washing

Machines and Wringers, on short
notice.

P. B. Englar Mail Boxes,
at $1.25.

3-22-if
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A Liberal Reward
offered for the person that said that
I have gone out of the Swing busi-
ness. Why, I have a finer line of
Swings on hand than ever. Both
Steel and Wooden Swings. Send your
name and address if you stand in
need of an up-to-date Lawn Swing.
Address all orders to-

L. K. BIRELY
41 MIDDLEBURG, MD.

J. S. MYERS, D. D. S. J. E. MYERS, D. D. S.

MYERS BROS., Surgeon Dentists,
NEW WINDSOR, MD.

We are prepared to do all kinds of Dental
Work-CROW N and BRIDGE work a SPE-
CIALTY. Our office at New Windsor will be
always open. At present, the following
towns will be visited by us;
Woodsboro-Tuesday and Wednesday, each

week.
Taneytown - Thursday, Friday and Satur

day, each week.
Johnsville-lst. and 3rd. Monday of each

month.
Uniontown-2nd. and 4th. Monday of each

month.
18-ly

If You Want All the

News, Subscribe for

The Carroll Record.



Dress Goods at Cost! THE MODEL WEEKLY STORE NEWS.
OPs Millinery at Cost!
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65c Bed Sheets, at 49c. 6
Full size sheets-81x90 inches-made of best Muslin and

deep hems, hems, all ready for use-our regular 65c goods. now re-

duced to only 49c each. .
T

I5c Pillow Cases for 9c.
Splendid Muslin Pillow Cases-42x36 inches-ready to go 

. , \ 
 8c Apron Gingham, for 5c..:, 

on the pillows-regularly 15c each; now reduced to only- 9c .f. -_.,,ektf f_ goef e ,4 S.
1 .;.-_,..," .......p,, ..., ....,....•..,, ....---. se, . a)each. 
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50c Wool Nuns' Veiling, at 33c. 25c Embroidery, at 15c. 50c Navy Blue Serge, 38c. 18c Ladies' Ribbed Vests, 12c.

We have to-day an assortment of this most popular 
summer Thousands of yards of our very newest and prettiest em- • 

5 pieces of our very best dark blue serge Cheviot, all pure +
 About 50 dozen Ladies' Fine Swiss Ribbed 

Vests, in nice

material, in all the light shades-Blue, Rose, Cream, Nile an
d broideries in all widths and patterns, either Nainsook or Cam- wool, fast color and 38 inches wide-just the thing for separ- I fine quality, and trimmed with lace and ribbon-all have low

• brie. These goods go on sale to-day at less than cost; they

Cardinal. The material is fine and sheer, 32 inches wide, and are worth regularly 25c-our special reduced price is only ate skirts to wear with Shirt Waists. This lot we have re- 4.) neck; some have wing 
sleeves, others shoulder bands. All sizes

pure wool-regular price 50c; now reduced to 33c yd. st 15c yd. • duced for this great sale from 50c yard to only 38c yd. t
$ in the lot; regularly worth 18e, now reduced t

o 12;c each.
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One Dollar Foulard Silk, 45c.

Stylish beautiful Foulard Silks with Satin face, in the very

newest summer effects. These silks make exquisite seasonable

dresses-we now have a splendid assortment of designs, the
y

are worth always $1.00 yard-now sacrificed at 45c yd.
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$6.00 Silk Waists, at $3.75.
New and very handsome Silk Waists, made

in the latest Gibson effects with open briar stitch

trimming-they come in all the desirable colors

and black-$6.00 values at $3.75.

$5.00 TAFFETA WAISTS, AT $3.25.

$1.50 AND $2 LAWN WAISTS, 98C.

These are the greatest Waist offerings we

have ever made-they are new styles and beauti- .MO0 MO MOICID
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Our Entire Stock
AT REDUCED PRICES!

ful quality; the materials could not be furnished •

for such a price. All sizes are here to-day, but

you better hurry when you can buy for half price.

44 44•,.. ,04.,e. 4,4440 • • • • • •454. 0454604,44 ••••••••• 045••••

Handkerchiefs Below Cost.
We have divided practically our entire stock

of fine Handkerchiefs into four lots, and will sell

them this week at prices which they could not be

imported for to-day-the lots are priced as below:
12c and 15c Handkerchiefs, 7c.
18c and 20c Handkerchiefs, 12c.
25c and 35c Handkerchiefs, 16c.
40c and 50c Handkerchiefs, 23c.

This is a chance to supply your Handkerchief
needs for a year. Come get all you want now.
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50c UNDER MUSLINS, AT 39c.
Drawers, Chemise and Corset Covers of fine

Cambric and Muslin, made in the very best man-

ner and beautifully trimmed in laces and em-

broidery. These are our regular 50c garments,

now reduced to only 39c each.

6.45••••••••••04.1)•••-••••••••••45 • .454•4+4> 
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25c Fancy Ribbons, at 15c.

About a hundred pieces of all pure Silk Taffeta 
Ribbons, in

• every desirable color, including Black and Whi
te. These rib-

bons are 4 inches wide and to-day the most wante
d thing in

every Ladies' Wardrobe, regular 25e quality only )
5c yd.

•4•4•45 0.45454•4454).••••• 
.45+05444•011******* 444500.-1, 

.4...41.44 4

35c and 40c White Goods, i8c.
About 3000 yards in the lot; the styles are all

this season's most wanted effects--Mercerized

India Linen, Pique, Lace effects, Dimity, Persia
n

Lawn-in fact most everything that is stylish; reg-

ular 35c and 40c values, now at 18c yard.

50c and 65c Cotton Goods, 39c,
All of our very finest and daintiest Cotton

Dress Goods in the most exclusive styles have

been reduced from 50c and 65c to only 39c yard.

*4444444•+++44+4444444 •••••
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• Here is a chance to get a handsome and corn- :14.;
• fortable Rocker for a very little price. These n'
• chairs are among the finest we have ever carried„
and have sold up to $8.00; choice now at $4.50

o each.

Children's Rubber Tire Go-Carts at Cost, make a quick clearance they have been reduced

Women..'s Tailor Made Siaits for Half.

$12.50 SUITS AT $6.751 $16.50 SUITS AT $9.501

Any lady who will need a new suit any time within the next year can
not afford to overlook this offer. The materials are

the most desirable cloths; the styles are the very newest and the w
orkmanship is perfect-Black and colors-$6.75 and

$9.5o Suit.

1, as follows:
$40.00 Suits for $31.00.

• $50.00 Suits for $36.00.
• $60.00 Suits for $45.00.
• $65.00 Suits for $52.00.

This is your opportunity to get a very hand-

some Parlor Suit for a little money.
•
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$2.50 and $3.00 Fine Shoes, now $1.80. WESTMINSTER, MD.

PEOPLE OF THE -DAY

Stead as a Prophet.

A sensation in the book world is 'Wil-

liam T. Stead's "Americanization of

the World." Interest in this latest corn

tribution to current literature is not

lessened by the author's close connec-

tion with the late Cecil Rhodes, whose

will provides for the education of

American youth at Oxford. Mr. Stead

WILLIAM T. STEAD.

says that the resentment which is held

In England to the extension of Ameri-

can influence is entirely uncalled for,

as the Americanization of the world is •

but the Anglicizing of the world at one

remove. In the words of the gentleman

himself, "There is no reason to resent

the part the Americans are playing in

fashioning the world in their image,

which, after all, is substantially the

image of ourselves." Of the American

Declaration of Independence Mr. Stead

in his book says, "It is the epitaph of

our empire."

"Hub" Smith Decorated.

Somewhere in the custody of the gov-

ernment is a handsome decoration

which ought to sparkle upon the breast

of Hubbard T. Smith, secretary of the

United States commissioner to China

and consular clerk of the United States.

t a
Gain flesh

Persons have been known to
gain a pOffelPe n day by taking

ounce of SCOTT'S EMUL-
SION. It is strange, but it often
happens.
Somehow the ounce produces

the pound; it seems to start the
digestive machinery going prop-
erly, so that the patient is able
to digest and absorb his ordinary
food, which he could not do be-
fore, and that is the way the gain
is made.
A certain amount of flesh is

necessary for health; if you have
not got it you can get it by
taking

SCOIrS [111111Si011

You will find it just as useful in summer
as in winter, and if you are thriving upos
it don't stop because the weather is warm,

5.c. and $r.00, all druggists.
SCOTT & BOWNE, Chemists, New York.

x
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It Was presented 10 Mu by the ienis

of China, but he cannot accept it mei

congress grants him the necessary lel

mission.
"Hub" Smith made an enviable nein(

for himself as an official during the set

Bement of the Chinese troubles; hut

after all, he will always be known It

fame as the author of the song begin

ning-
A little peach in an orchard grew;
Listen to my tale of woe.

That little tale of woe has been tome

all over the world. Smith composed th,

music one Sunday afternoon while sit-

ting at a piano in his bachelor licine.

Paradise Flats, Washington. after

reading Eugene Field's poem, and he

sold it to a local music dealer for at

mere pittance. It caught on everywhere

and for a time was the most popular

song in the United States. Hundreds of

thousands of copies were sold. Smith

suddenly found himself famous. 11e

wrote quite a number of other songs

Including "Swinging In the Grapevine

Swing," but the tale of woe will be re-

membered when all the others are for

gotten. And this does not please Smith.

for his other songs are much more mer-

itorious productions.

An Innocent's New Home.

Samuel L. Clemens, known the world

over as Mark Twain, the American hu-

morist, has purchased Hill Crest, a

mansion overlooking the Hudson. at

Tarrytown, N. Y. The manor house at

Hill Crest contains thirteen large

rooms. There are fine stables and at

hennery on the place, which consists

of nineteen acres of as picturesque land

as lies out of doors. The place was laid

out and improved by Captain W. T. Ca

SAMUEL L. CLEMENS.

sey, of whom Mr. Clemens purchased

It. "I am in love with the spot," ex-

claimed Mark Twain as he stood upon

a big rock in front of the house and be-

held the Tappan Zee to the west and

the valley of Sleepy Hollow, the land

of Washington Irving, to the north.

Michael Droogin is caretaker of

Twain's new home in the owner's ab

sence on a West Indian yachting trip.

Mr. Wellington's Instructions.

During the spring floods Senator

Wellington went down to the railroad

station in Washington and took a

sleeper for his home at Cumberland,

Md. He did not know that the trains

were likely to be laid off indefinitely

and that schedules had been abandon-

ed. Calling the porter, Mr. Wellington

said, "Be sure and wake me up in time

to get off at Cumberland," and then

turned in.
When Mr. Wellington awoke the next

morning, it was about 9 o'clock. After

looking at his watch he raised the cur-

tain and gazed at the surroundings.

He soon realized that the train was

still standing in the Washington sta-

tion, just where it was when be board-

ed it. He hustled Into his clothes and

•s•
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Actual Values and former prices were, $12.50 to $16.50
.

started for the porter.- 1. hat function

ary explained that be had carried out

his instructions to the letter and that if

the senator had quietly slept for an-

other day or two he would have called

him in ample time to get off at Cum.

berlaad.

Won't Follow Advice After Pay

ing for It

In a recent article a prominent phy-
sician says, "It is next to impossible
for the physician TO get his patients
to carry out any prescribed course of
hygiene or diet to the smallest extent;
he has but one resort left, namely.the
drug treatment." When medicines
are used for chronic constipation, the
most mild and gentle obtainable.euch
as Chamberlain's Stomach & Liver
Tablets should be employed. Their
use is not followed by constipation as
they leave the bowels in a natural
and healthy condition. For sale by
R. S. McKinney, Druggist, Taney
town, Md.

STARTING FLOWER SEEDS.

A Florist's Method Reported For the

Benefit of Aim:ft-firm.

Take a shallow box, say three inches

deep, bore holes in the bottom, cover

with moss, which saturate with wa.

ter. Over the moss place the prepered

filling the box even full. and cein

press it moderately with a truss-el or

board. Then wet the soil theroteehly

with several s:Tasings. laA ail;1,4:ng

enough water at cue time to 1:1:Acc :he

son muddy, the wetting to last until

the seeds germleate.
Over the surface sift a very light

coat-say one-eighth et an inch-of the

same prepared soil. esiee a sieve of

about one-e:; itth iech teesh and tak

Mg pains to sift it evenly over the en-

tire surface of the dampened soil.

Leave it in that condition. Do not com-

press, but leave it 0111.0 n rid porous that

the tine seeds may tind lodgment be-

tween the porticles of soil and thus
gather more inoiSt tire than they would

if resting on at smooth st rface.
Then dust the seed evenly over the

surface. cover with a-wire netting, over

which spread setae fine moss. If the

moss shows dryness at any time, damp

en it.
As soon as the seed is fairly weli

sprouted place under a pane of glass.

allowing all space at the sides. Cover

the glass for a time with tissue paper.

Apply moisture as needed with a tine

spray. but do not water frequently, yet

the surface must on no account becotne

dry.
Be sure to allow no strong sunlight

to strike the young plantlets and at

the same time do not apply too strong

a shade. Tissue paper allows all the

light needed at this stage of growth.

Eternal vigilance is the price of suc-

cess.
As soon as the little seedlings have

made sill-lb-Nen vermeil to be handled

transplant I hem in fresh soil. Be care-

ful that the fine rootlets are not in-

jured and that they are down full

length into the new soil.
After transplanting water with fine

spray.- Farm Journe I.

Ready For Use Plant Food.

Many ready made for use plant foods

are put up by different companies, and,

while most, if not all, of them are gen-

uinely good, they are often hard to pro-

cure, as they are sold only by dealers

in certain lines. The following formu-

la can be tilled through any druggist

and is one of the very best plant foods

In use: Sodium nitrate, three-fourths

pound; sodium phosphate (dry), one

pound; sodium sulphate, one

pound. Pulverize and thoroughly

mix the ingredients dry. It may be

kept for any length of time by cover.

Mg closely. vv reel-nee. Lime,

dissolve In the proportions of one

rounding tablespoonful to a gallon of

hot water. using a half teacupful to a

six Inch pot. Apply once in two weeks

by pouring the solution on to the soil,

not on the plant, varying the amount

used according to the size and vigor

of the plan - and also the size of 04

pot.-Cor. Rural New Yoreer.

EUROPE'S HIGHWAYS

PERFECT SYSTEM BY WHICH THEY

ARE BUILT AND MAINTAINED.

Some of the Splendid Roads In

France, Belgium and Italy - S10,-

000,000 Spent by Latter Country on

Her Highways In Five Years.

It will interest you to know about the

roads of France. In that country there

is no such diversity between the mate-

rial progress of the farmer and that of

the merchant, between the country and

the town, as is found in this country,

says Isaac B. Potter in The Gospel of

Good Roads. The farmers prosper and

have always prospered. Every dollar

spent by the French government to

bring itself more closely in touch with

Its rural population has been well in-

vested.
Of course these roads of France are

not built by farmers who "work out"

their highway taxes after the manlier

followed in this country, nor are they

repaired by he use of plows, hoes or

scrapers, like those which are brought

Into use at the annual farmers' picnic

which takes place when you go out to

"work the road" in your township. On

the contrary, they are built and kept

up under a system which is perhaps

the most perfect in the world. There

is an official in chief who takes charge

of all the main roads of the republic

and requires from his subordinates

complete reports at frequent intervals.

In this manner information is always

at hand showing the condition of the

roads in all parts of the country. Of

course the work is divided bito differ-

ent sections, which in turn are in

charge of subordinate engineers or au.

perintendents. Broken stone is fur'

COUNTRY ROAD IN FRANCE.

fished by contract, and, considering

the amount of labor accomplished each

year on the French roads, the cost is

surprisingly small. The roads of our

own states, at least the important

state roads, should be maintained in

the same way.
In Belgium also the principal roads

are built and maintained by the gen-

eral government, and in 1880 in the

nine provinces of Belgium over 79 per

cent of the highroads were of nig

class, the entire length of high class-

roads being 4,173 English miles out of

BOUM DOOM
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$8.00 FANCY ROCKERS, $4.50.

a total of 5,286 or roahs or an classes.
The best roads of Belgium are in the

provinces of Namur, Liege and Lux-
embourg, and permanent employees

are kept on the roads under the direc-

tion of the chief engineer of the prov-

ince for the purpose of insuring the

observance of the regulations and look-

ing after the constant repair of the

highways.
In Baden the main roads are under

the supervision of the state authori-

ties and are cared for with a studious

regard for the requirements of the

farmer and inland travel. Under the

law relating to roads In Baden the

duty of maintaining the road falls as

follows: One-quarter each upon the

town and county in which the road is

situated, the remaining one-half upon

the state treasury.

In Italy the minister of public works

Is at the head of the department of

public works. The construction of

these roads is in most cases under- I

taken by contracts, the work being

carried on under direction of govern-

ment engineers. The government road

laborers are called "cantonniers" and

are selected with great care, special

reference being had to character and

honesty. They must be of robust con-

stitution and must be able to read and

write. Each one of these contonniers

Is provided with a full set of tools and

implements specified by law. His hours

of work are from sunrise to sunset.

and each day be is obliged to go over

the entire track of road placed in his

charge. He must be constantly upon

the line of his work In all kinds of

weather and in case of necessity is

bound to work on public holidays. His

chief duties are the leveling and repair

of the highways, the removal of snow,

mud, dust, etc. He must assist travel-

ers in distress and vehicles disabled by

accident or by weather, and for any

neglect of duty be may be fined, sus-

pended or dismissed, according to the

degree of the offense.

The fines accumulated during the

year are divided among the deserving

contonniers or given to one of the mu-

tual benefit association of which they

are members. Cantonniers who serve

with credit and distinction for three or

more years are promoted and given an

increase of monthly wages. In the five

years from 1873 to 1878 Italy spent

about $16,000,000 on her roads, al-

though before that appropriation was

made many excellent highways existed

in all parts of the kingdom. In 1881

Italy constructed about 120 miles of

new road and bad then about 11,040

miles in course of construction.

In the Netherlands, as in the coun-

tries alread3 mentioned, the principal

roads are maintained at the expense of

the state.

New Alkaloids- In Tobacco.

A. Pictet and A. Rotschy report to

the Paris Academy of Sciences that

they have found a series of new a lka-

loids in tobacco. The first of these is

a liquid. nieiteine: the Si cond. a solid.

nicotellinc. and the third. nicctinilne.

These alhalolds occur in munch sma
ller

quantities than nicotine.

Holds Up A Congressman.

"At the end of the campaign."

writes Champ Clark, Missouri's bril-

liant congressman. "from overwork.

nervous tension, loss of sleep and con-

stant speaking I had about utterly

collapsed It seemed that all the or
gans in my body were out of order,
but three bottles of Electric Bitters

made me all right. It's the best all
around medicine ever sold ovee a
druggist's counter." Overworked,run
down men and weak, sickly women
gain splendid health and vitality from
Electric Bitters Try them. Only 500.

Guaranteed by R. S. McKinney,Drug-

gist, Taneytown, Md.

lk Dress Ginghams, T2c.
About 3000 yards of the very best Dress Ginghams

 in many

light stripes and plaids-our regular price is 12ic y
d., now re-

duced to 7ic yd.

Just 1000 yards of best Apron Ginghams will
 be sold to-day

-they are worth Sc, special now at 5c yd.

We have just eight handsome 5-piece Parlor

Suits in Damask and Silk Plush, all have elegant

Mahogany frames and Spring edges. In order to

Hai)
Yager's

Sarsaparilla
With Celery
Purifies
the Blood

The glandular system of the body is the con-

necting link between food and blood. Its pur-

pose is to perform certain offices of absorption

and assimilation, and to assist in keeping the

blood in normal condition. If the glandular

system becomes clogged, the part affected be-

comes diseased.

Yager's Sarsaparilla with Celery acts directly

on the glandular system. It keeps the blood

purified by keeping in good condition the ma-

chinery which nature intended to do this work.

The result is self-evident. The blood is ren-

ovated and invigorated. The liver and kidneys

are healthy and easily perform their work.

The root of ninety per cent, of diseases having

been reached it is only a question of time when

the whole body responds to the healthy action

of the remedy.

Yager's Sarsaparilla with Celery is sold in

large 50-cent bottles by all druggists.

YAGER'S LINIMENT for external

application relieve; pain of any name.

Cures cuts, burns, bruises, stings, bites,

neuralgia, stiff joints, rheumatism, etc.

25 cents a large bottle.

GILBERT BROS. 0 CO.. Baltimore, Md.

I \

Ono Ounce of

Blood Before Taking

Yager's Sarsaparilla

15 ,5 hen ry,thick-almost
black. It contains impu-
rities which make easy the
propagation of disra se
germs. it clogs the .ma-
chinery of the body and
makes the person weak,
gloomy and distressed.

One Ounce of

Blood After Taking

Yager's Sarsaparilla

is a rich red color showing
th, abundance qf healthy
corpuscles which give the
power to resist disease.
The functional activities
Of the body are increased
and the entire body Invig-
orated.

A MotWs

In The Entomologist Mr. F. B. Dodd

describes at peculiar instrument by

menus of which the silk producing

moths of the Australian genus at ilie-

r:ea cut their way out of their hard

cocoons. The instrument is a short,

hard, black and curved thorn, situated

in the thick joints at the base of the

fore wings, one on each side. In a rub

bed specimen the thorn Is easily dis-

cernible, but in a good one it is con.

cealed among the dense scales.

Every cause capable of increasing

the amount of blood ordinarily cir-

culating through the brain has at tend-

ency to cause wakefulness, says The

Popular Science News. If the brain is

often kept for long periods on the

stretch, during which tile vessels are

filled to repletion, they cannot contract

even when the exciting causes cease.

Wakefulness, as a consequence, re-

sults, and every day the condition of

the individual becomes worse because

time brings the force of habit into

operation. Everything that tends to

throw the blcod unduly to the brain

or to accumulate it there should be

avoided. This is a vital matter, and

prevention is better than cure.

Tight or ill fitting articles of dress,

especially about the neck or waist, and

tight boots and shoes, should be dis-

carded. The feet should be kept warm

so that the circulation may be promot-

ed. Wearing cork soles in the boots or

shoes and changing the socks every

day are excellent means to this end

and strongly recommended. Apart,

ne‘vesee. rep. .•.•
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Stray Petals.

Make r:: wings Cr SIVV( I IW:ISas SOOD

as frost is ota of the tri.ound.

Set out salvia a nd d miff nastU
rtiutn

plants as scam as the weather is set-

tled.
Sow Shirley poppies where they are

to grow in early spring They do not

bear trains-teeming.

Helen Gouid and Nliss Alice Roose-

velt were the novelties in roses shown

at the lest met-tine. of the American

Rose soteety The first is red. the sec-

D1141 an intense dark pink.

Coleus seed must be planted very

early to lip ready for bedding out in

May. If in the greenhouse. give bot-

tom heat occasion:illy.

Successful plantings of gradiolus

may be made from the time the soil is

-.try enough in the spring till the 4th of

July.

Pansies may be sown in the spring

us soon as the ground can be worked,

though fall sowing Is generally pre-

ferred.

This signature is on every box of the genuine

Laxative Bramo-Quinine Tablets
the remedy that cures a cold In one day

Read down

WESTERN MARYLAND R. R.
MAIN LINE.

Schedule in effect Sept. nth.. 15401.

STATIONS. Read 1:11,4‘

....

A.M.
 9110

9113
 944
 952
 1001
 3915

A.M.
520
521 
535
540 
549
6 08

Ie. Cherri, Itun.ar

. . Clear Spring_
Charlton 

Will'msport,P.V 
ar Hagerstown le

A.M.
8 49

 846
884
828
8154
8 0,

P.M.
12 48
1242186t
1284J
12 2151
12 20
12

P.M
9 Of

842
236
826
$56

..... .... 5 54 to WIll'msport ar   821

P.M. P.M. A.M. A.M.P.M. P.I, ,
M 12 207 7 02 le Hagerstown air07 BO 12 05 SIX
425 223 7 20. . Chewsville.... ..... 11 52 74f
432 241 7 27....Smithsburg... 7 1011 45 721
440 2 41 7 35 ....Edgemont... 7(2 11 87 721
. . 2 49 744  Pen Mar ..... ....• 11 28 721

 Buena Vista Spit
 2513 748or.. Flightleld. le  11 24 7 11

A.M.

P.M.A.M A.M. P.M
• • . 2541 750/e..Highfleld ..ar  11 20 711
 324 8 16 Fairdeld ..... . .10 47 64/
 3 53 8 42 ... Gettysburg... ..... 10 28 6 21
 4 15 904...New Oxford... ..... 1000 651
 431 920 Hanover ..... .. . 9 48 512
 445 9 35 ar .Porters. .le  9113 5s

P.M. A.K. A.M.P.M
 527 935 it... Porters...ar.. ... SRI 41
..  6 35 944 -Spring Grove.  922 4 di
.. .. 6 0010 10  ar Sent it 900 411

p.m p.m flan a.1:0 U.1:11 P.m
 256 7 50 Le Hightifld. or  11 21 711
4113 258 762 ...Blue Ridge-. 6 52 il l9 711
6 17 321 816 .. .Thurruont. .. 6 26 10 51 844
125 331 826 Rocky Ridge .  1089 884
51)8 344 837 .11ruceville.. . 607 10 28 61
546 3 56 845 Union Bridge.. 600 10 20 (III
 459 84t(  Linwood.,,  10 14 6 CA
558 404 854 . New windsOr 5 5-3 13 08 6 01
807 420 9 09 .. Weattalnater --.540 9,51 54t
. . 452.... .. Emory Grove 9 14 .
8 86 453 9413  0 lyndon 511 (113 511
..... 524 ..... ....Arlington ..... 8 44. ..
7 17 5431027 tie.. Baltimore-le'4111 8 -43 411

Additional trains leave Baltimore tor Un-
ion Bridge and Intermediate Stations at 10.'2
a. m., and 2.26 and 6.15 p. tn., and leave Un-
ion Bridge for Baltimore and Intermediate
Stations at 525 and 8.25 a. m., and 12.60 p.
• daily, except SundaY.
Sundays only-leave Baltimore for Union

Bridge and Intermediate Stations at 9.82 a.
m., and 2.35 p. In. Leave Union Bridge at

6.45 a. m., and 4.15 p. m., for Baltimore and

Intermediate Stations.

Baltimore & Cumberland Valley R. R.

Leave Hagerstown for Shippensburg and
Intermediate Stations at 11.06 a. in., and 7.0u

p. m. For Chambersburg 6.30 a. nt. Leave

Shippensburg for Hagerstown and Inter-

mediate Stations at 6.110 a. rn., and 8.00 1).
Leave Charubersburg 1.45 p. mu.•

Trains via Altenwald Cut-off.

Leave Hagerstown for Chambersburg and
Intermediate Stations at 8.20 p. m.
Leave Chambersburg for Hagerstown and

Intermediate Stations at 7.49 p. m.

Leave Rocky Ridge for KnimItsburg at 6.26

and 10.39 a. m., and 3.31 and 6.84 p. M. Leave
Emruitsburg for Rocky Ridge at 7.50 and WOO

a. mu., and 2.65 and 4.50 p. mu-
Leave Bruceville for Frederick at R.81b,

1.35 and 10.40 a. mu., and 5.it2 and 8.30 p. 111.

Leave Bruceville for Columbia LittlesUiwn

and Taneytowu at 9.47 a. m., and 8.46 p.m.
Leave Frederick for Baltimore at 7.60 a.ru

and 3.00 and 4.50 p.m.

Connections as unerry ttun, W. Va.

B. 5; 0. Passenger trains leave Cherry Run

for Cumberland and intermediate points,

daily at 8.56 a. m.; Chicago Express daily, at

1.09 p. m.; Chleago Express, daily, at 10.29 p

• Daily. All others daily, except Sunday.

J. M. HOOD, Pres't and Gen'l Manager.

B. H, GRISWOLD General Passenger Agent

Our Job Printing has a

deservedly wide reputation.

Why? Because it is always

clean, first-class work. The

proof that it is appreciated,

and in demand, is the fact

that we are always busy.

We rarely solicit-the work

simply comes.



TANEYTOWN  LOCAL- COLUMN.
Current Items of Local News, of Special

Interest to Home Readers.

A well developed frost, Thursday
morning, appears not to have done
any harm tc vegetation.

Joseph M. Reaver, a well known
farmer, of this district, is ill with a
bad case of pneumonia.

Elmer Wantz, of Waynesboro, re-
turned home on Thursday, after a
visit of about two weeks among rela-
tives in this section.

We acknowledge the receipt, from
President R. W. Silvester, of an invi-
tation to be present during the com-
mencement exercises of Md. Agricul-
tural College.

Dr. G. Roberta Fleagle, daughter
of Jacob Fleagle, of this place, has
formed a partnership for the practice
of medicine in Hanover, Pa., with her
brother, Dr. M. M. Fleagle.

Painting and repairing of proper-
ties, seems the order of the day in
Taneytown this spring. Such little
improvements add greatly to the gen-
eral improvement of the town.

The locusts are not saying "Pha-
roah," this time. Their song is a cross
between that of a new spring frog and
the squeal of a dying pig-but there
is time, as well as room, for improve-
ment.

Joseph Six, of Warrensburg. Mo.,
called at our office on Saturday and
renewed his subscription. Like near-
ly all western men, Mr. Six lives in
the "best state on earth." Many
years ago he was a citizen of Taney-
town, having married here.

The Grand Jury failed to find an
indictment against Samuel P. Stern-
er, of this district, charged with set-
ting his barn on fire. The fact that
Mr. Sterner has had numerous fires,
led to the suspicion which brought
the case before the magistrate and
Grand Jury.

The Taneytown Band has purchas-
ed through H. E McMillin, of Cleve-
land, Ohio, a fine high-grade double
bell euphonium, manufactured by
George Baring & Son, London. The
instrument will be used for the first
time to-day (Friday) and will be play-
ed by Mr. Levi D. Sell, who has been
connected with the organization, as
baritone player, for 20 years.

The funeral of Mrs. David Shriner
(nee Hiner) occurred on Sunday after-
noon, services being held in the Re-
formed church. She died at her home
on the Uniontown and Middleburg
road, from consupaptien, having been
afflict, el with the disease for a num-
ber of years. But two members of
the Hiner family survive, W. Oliver,
and John, both of this district.

An official of the Home Insurance
Company, N. Y., was here on Friday
last, looking over the town. He ex-
pressed himself very favorably as to
the general character of the buildings
of the town, for insurance risks, but
said that there ought to be a begin•
fling made toward official regulations
for the construction of buildings, es-
pecially frame buildings with shingle
roofs.

At a Special meeting, on Monday
night, the Fire Company voted $50.00
to be divided pro-rata among all mem-
bers who will attend the State Fire-
mens' Convention, in Lonaconing,
with the provision that only members
who have paid their dues to April 1st
shall be the beneflciaties of the order.
The round trip fare will be $4.75, and
the W. M. R. R. fast mail, on Wed-
nesday, June 11th., will be used, go-
ing,and return be made Friday morn-
ing, the latter a night ride. It is
thought that 10 or 15 from the Taney-
town Company will attend.
We are pleased to know, and to

make the correction, that the article
in last issue stating the cost of our
street lighting to be $184.89 is incor-
rect. The addition of lighting salary
and the amount expended for gaso-
line, gives the above sum, but in the
latter item is included the cost of gas-
oline to run the engine at the pump-
ing station, therefore, deducting this,
the cost of street lighting is reduced
to about $125.00, an amount decidedly
more in keeping with the light we
have. This correction makes it all
the more plain that more ought to be
spent for light in order to get greater
benefit from the whole expenditure.

Grain and Grasses.

Corn planting has not yet been
completed, owing to the hardened
state of the soil in many places, butthe acreage yet to be put in is small.In the extreme west the early corn is
coming up nicely and is of good color,
and for the section at large the stands
are quite satisfactory. Germination
of the late planted fields has proceed-
ed slowly. Replanting, thinning,and
first plowing have made fair progress
during the week in the southern
counties. Cut-worms have done more
damage than at any time earlier in
the season, but the loss has not been
serious. In a few localities where the
rains have been light the fields look
yellow, but this is not a general com-
plaint, and the crop as a whole is do-
ing well considering the shortage in
moisture that has prevailed.
Wheat and rye have made but littlegrowth during the week, and the out-look for both crops is promising.Wheat is generally short in head andstraw, and promises considerably leesthan an average yield; the heads arenot in evidence in Garrett county,but elsewhere they are completely

formed. The early sown wheat ismuch better than the late crop in all
districts.
Grasses have improved somewhatunder the stimulus afforded by the

showers, but meadows and pasturesare generally in need of more rain,that already received not having pen-etrated to the roots in many localities.The hay crop is expected to be short,
especially timothy. Clover is head-ing unusually close to the ground,and the spring sowing is in very poor
condition in places. Some alfalfa andcrimson cloyer were cut in the inter-ior districts during the middle portionof the week, and were cured In good
condition.
Oats continue small; in some sec-tions an improvement is reported, inothers the crop is at a standstill. Morerain is needed for all grains andgrasses.

Stand Like a Stone Wall
Between your children and the tor-tures of itching and burning eczema,scaldhead or other skin diseases. -How? why, by using Bucklen's ArnicaSalve, earth's greatest healer. Quick-est cure for Ulcers, Fever Sores, SaltRheum, Cuts, Burns or Bruises. In-fallible for Piles. 25c at R. S. McKin-ney's drug stare.

Keysville. - Mr. Bernard Eckard
and family, and Mrs. Sarah Koontz,
all of Union Mills, visited 0. It.
Koontz's last Sunday.
Mrs. Clay Deleplane and daughter,

of Oak Hill, spent Monday with Mr.
S. D. Fox.
Mr. and Mrs. H. 0. Stonesifer, and

Mr. and Mrs. George B. Froclavisited
several days near Wisner's school
house and Manchester.
Misses Alice Frock and Mollie Zepp

visited Mr. Charles Fink's, last Satur-
day and Sunday.
Mr. Clayton Snook, of Double Pipe

Creek, and Miss Emma Pittinger, of
Troutville, visited Chas. W. Young,
last Sunday.
Mrs. Anna Stonesifer and 51rs. Peter

.L. Ritter are both on the sick list.
Chas. A. Fox and family and Mrs.

W. H. Hess visited Levi Sell's last
Sunday.
Miss Nellie Shoemaker and brother

of near Taneytown. are visiting their
grand-parent's this week.
The festival of the Keysville Drum

Corps will be continued this Saturday
evening.

Bankert's Mill.-We were visited
by several refreshing showers, or last
Monday evening, but at this writing
not a vestige of it remains.
Grain and grasses does not look

very promising and the harvest will
be light.
Geo. C. Harmon built an addition

to his dwelling, and is now ready for
the plasterer.
Mr. Chas. Leintnon is building an

addition to his dwelling.
Mr. Samuel Crouse, our popular

mechanic,is dcing the carpenter work
for both, and John W. Powell is the
mason.
Geo. C. Harmon, an ex-soldier, at-

tended Memorial servies at the Re-
formed church, Westminster, last
Sunday morning.
On Thursday morning, we awoke

and were greeted with a frost, which
did some damage to the young and
tender plants.

State Teachers' Association.

The Maryland State Teachers' Asso-
ciation will hold its meetings at Ocean
City, Md., on June 30, July 1, 2 and
3.
On Monday, June 30, the report of

the committee on school legislation,
administration and supervision will
be made and discussed. On Tuesday,
July 1, reports of the committee on
elementary and secondary schools
and on English will be presented-in
the afternoon reports on geography
and in the evening on history. On
Wednesday, July?, in the morning
reports on aesthetics and physical
training; in the afternoon on manual
training and kindergarten,and in the
evening on modern languages. On
Thursday morning reports of special
committees and election of officers.

What Thin Folks Need

IS a, greater power of digesting and
assimilating food. For them Dr.
King's New Life Pills work wonders.
They tone and regulate the digestive
organs, gently expel all poisons from
the system, enrich the blood, improve
appetite, make healthy flesh. Only 25c
at R. S. McK.inney, Druggist. Taney-
town, Md.

The Questions Ceased.

The precocious little chap,the child
of an old and intimate friend, was
dining along with his parents at a
friend's house. The soup, which was
very thin, was passed around, but
Charlie was observed trifling with his
spoon.
The hostess said: "Are you not

hungry, Charlie ?"
"Yee," replied Charlie, "but I'm not

thirsty."
When the meat was served a little

later the hostess very kindly asked:
"Charlie, can you cut your own

meat ?"
Charlie, who was already handling

his weapons. replied:
"Can't 1? I've out as tough meat as

this at home."
For the rest of the dinner the

hostess did not put any further ques-
tions to the young hopeful.

Sciatic Rheumatism Cured After
Fourteen Years of Suffering.

"I have been afflicted with sciatic
rheumatism for fourteen years," says
Josh Edgar, of Germantown, Cal. "I
was able to be around but constantly
suffered. I tried eyerything I could
hear ot and at last was told to try
Chamberlain's Pain Balm, which I
did and was immediately relieved and
in a short time cured,and I am happy
to say it has not since returned." Why
not use this liniment and get well? It
is for sale by R. S. McKinney, Drug-
gist, Taneytown, Md.

Social near Wakefield.

(For the RECORD.)
A very pleasant evening was spent at the

residence of Mr. and Mrs. J. Thos. Myers. on
the Geiger farm, on the 22nd., the occasion
being a social given by their friends.Prompt-
ly at 11 o'clock refreshments were served,
consisting of cake, lemonade, confectioner-
ies, etc. Games of all kinds, music and danc-
ing were indulged in until a late hour when
all returned to their homes, much pleased
with the evenings enjoyment.
Those present were Mr. and Mrs. J. Thos.

Myers, Clarence, Benjamin and Edna Myers,
Misses Amy and Mary Young, Mary, Annie
and Bessie Wolf. Effie Wagner, Myrtle Mar-
vel', Grace and Mettle Wentz, Della Snyder,
Bertie Fritz, Florence Bull, Lillian and Flor
ence Formwalt, Emma and Rena Schaeffer,
Annie Rickle; Messrs Howard Hull, Howard
Fritz,Guy Forrnwalt,Chas. Lowe, John Wolf,
John Rickle, Marshall Myers, Elmer Royer,
David Myers, Edgar Snyder, Charles Wentz,
Walter Fritz, Howard Helwig, A. W. Wag-
ner, J. Roy Durbin, Elmer Young, Harry
Rickle, Albert Morelock, Benton Flickinger,
Warden Warren, Roy Zahn, Luther Null,
William Myers.

Opening Day, Pen-Mar.

The season at Popular Pen-Mar
Park will commence on Thursday,
June 19th., and the Pen-Mar Express
will commence running on that date.
It will be "Grand Army Day" at Pen-
Mar, and it is expected that a very
large crowd will be in attendance
from Baltimore as well as excursions
from Harrisburg, Pa., and Glen Rock
Pa. The Grand Army Club will baye
a novel and beautiful entertainment
in the Auditorium,and the Glen Rock
Band will give a fine concert in the
Auditorium in the afternoon. This
promises to be the largest and best
opening day in the history of Pen-
Mar. Many improvements have been
made at the Park and new amuse-
ment features added. Excursion
tickets will be on sale and full infor-
mation can be obtained from local
ticket agent. 5-24 4t.

_

Timely.

MlIgg,1119-Youngpop is going to have
his baby christened Bill.
Buggins-How strange,
5luggans-Oh, I don't know, He

came on the first of the month.-Phila-
delphia Record.

Laugh, and the world laughs with
you; weep, and the world 'aught] at
you.-St. Louis Star.

What Ile Really Said.
Mrs. Buffers-The teller at that bank

says you are just the meanest, stin-
giest-
Mr. Buffers-Great Scott! Wha-

what is that? He says-
Mrs. Buffers-Well, be didn't say it

In so many words, but that is what lie
meant, of course.
Mr. Buffers-See here! What did the

fellow say?
Mrs. Buffers-He asked me to indorse

the check, and when I told him I
'hadn't the ghost of an idea what he
meant he said lie presumed I hadn't
had much experience getting checks
cashed, so there!-New York Weekly.

_

HUMOR OF THE HOUR

The First Victim.
"FIello, Jinks! 'Why, I haven't seen

you for several weeks. How's your
health?"
"Poorly. Every little thingthong

seems to affect me lately. Well, at any
rate you are looking like a kingkong."
"Feeling that way, except for a slight

touch of spring fever."
"Yes; springsprong always affects me

too; makes my head ringrong."
"What in thunder Is the matter with

you, old man, the way you've got to
talking?"
"Nothing thong!" said Jinks, making

a swinging movement of his arm
through empty air as his friend backed
away in amazement and alarm.
"I hear that you have become a great

devotee to the fashionable fad of table
tennis."
"Yes," he said wildly. "I like to have
my flingflong and enjoy the banjo sing-
song of the game of pingpong at every
racket's swingswong while the cellu-
loid sphere is on the wingwong. I know
that game's the thingthong"-
Gently the keepers from the asylum

led him away to his padded cell, the
first victim of the omnipresent game of
pingpong.-Baltimore IIerald.

A Lesson In Horticulture.
Four-year-old Nellie was with her fa-

ther one day while he was hoeing po-
tatoes.
There were turnips on the other side

of the garden, which, of course, never
needed any hoeing, and Nellie very
earnestly asked:
"Papa, how do the turnips grow?"
"God makes them grow, my child,"

he answered.
"Well, that's funny," said Nellie. "I

never saw him in here hoeing them."-
Little Chronicle.

Accounted For.

Cholly-Yaas, Miss Cutter, that girl
once made a fool of me.
Miss Cutter-Oh, is that the way it

happened?

Unafraid.
"Colonel," said the fair grass widow,

"supposing you and I were cast away
upon a lonely island, would you be
happy?"
"Yes," he answered, dodging around

the rubber tree. "I wouldn't ever need
tca be afraid when we went out stroll-
ing together there of meeting a preach-
er or a justice of the peace looking for
a ̀job.' "-Chicago Record-Herald.

Judgment l'roof.
ASCUM-I confess I was surprised to

hear of your marriage; thought you
were a confirmed old bachelor.
Oldbache-But I'm in business for

myself now.
A.SCUM-Well?
Oldbache-Well, I had to have a wife

In whose name I could put my proper-
ty.-Philadelphia Press.

Proper Caution.
Courteous Cityman-May I take you

In to dinner, madam.
Cynthia Jaytown (who is visiting her

city cousin)-Well, I dunno as I orter.
The very last thing Si Jaytowu says to
me wuz, "Cynthy, don't yew git taken
In while yew be in the city!"-Chicago
News.

The Difference.
She-Why, I thought the sermon re-

markably short. I'm surprised that you
should consider it long.
He-But I wasn't wearing a new bon-

net to church for the first time with a
consciousness that all the other women
were looking at it. -Philadelphia Press.

As For Him.
"I see here in the paper," observed

Sandy Pikes, "that a noted scientist
says that the constant use of water as
a beverage insures a long life."
"As for me," comments Whiskered

Willie, "give me a short life and a mer-
ry one."-Baltimore American.

Willie's Trouble.
"What's the trouble, Willie?" said

Mrs. Brown to her small son, who was
crying.
"aly kite won't fly," sobbed Willie,

"and I made it out of fly paper too."-
Little Chronicle.

Good Work.

I saw a splendid cut of Cadleigh yes-
terday."
"I didn't see it. What paper was it

In?"
"None; it was on the street. Miss

Kandor did it."-Philadelphia Press.

Getting Back at Him.
St. Peter-Who are you?
New Arrival-I'm the paying teller

nf-
St. Peter-You'll have to get some-

body to identify you.-Town Topics.

A Literal Interpretation.
"Why do we say, ̀ Give us this day

our daily !mead?'" asked a Sunday
school teacher after the lesson.
"Because we want it fresh," answer-

ed a little girl.-Little Chronicle.

One of Rhodes' Ideas,
A well known peer once asked Cecil

Rhodes to stand godfather to his son,
and be replied that he would on one
condition, winch was that he might in-
vest at once £100 In the boy's name
and give £100 on each succeeding birth-
day, provided that it should all go on
at compound interest until the boy was
old enough to begin to spend the inter-
est, and that then he might yearly de-
cide on what to spend it, so long pe It
was not on himself. "This," said Mr.
Rhodes, "will do two things-first. it
will teach your boy how to spend mon-
ey, and, secondly, it will make him un-
selfish and kind to those in need,"--
Court Journal.

Not Guilty.

"IS your husband a bibliomaniac?"
asked Mrs. Oldcastle as she was being
permitted to view the treasures in the
library of the new neighbors.
"Mercy sakes, no," replied Mrs. Packs

enham. "he never bibbles a bit. Oh, of
course, I don't say that he wouldn't
take a little at his meals if the rest was
*loin' it, but that's as far as he ever
goes in them kind of things."-Chicago
Record-Herald.

TRAM P-84----s-3-Art-15-o-s1--stsiv s
'Explanations Which Will Help You

to Understand Them.

The rude drawings hardly need a
key. When on some white gatepost I
found the sketch of a gun, I stole far-
ther down the road. I had a strong ob-
jection so early in my career to being
riddled full of. holes by some intrepid
farmer. The outline of a dog of war-
like proportions, with wild eyes and
ferocious teeth, was wont to make me
go breakfastless. My summer ward-
robe was not in condition to allow of
further mutilation. If I felt brave
enough to kick a yelping cur, I saun-
tered in recklessly at the gate which
bore a portrait of a toy dog. Once past
him one could usually get a bite.
A big round "0" did not make one

wild to approach the premises it adorn-
ed. It generally portrayed a hostess
with a nature of adamant. A single
"X" stood for a cross saw, which with
small manipulation might earn a meal.
Two X's made a tramp of none too
vigorous a makeup go farther down
the road. It suggested considerable
wood cutting in exchange for a meal.
The sign every tramp looks for anx-

iously is a crudely drawn table, with a
lopsided coffee cup and a plate upon it.
Beyond that gatepost dwells a sweet,
simple, motherly soul who will wel-
come the most dilapidated hobo into
her spotless kitchen and set before him
a good square meal. She may sit be-
side him, inquiring as to the safety of
his soul, and she may give him a
mother's gentle advice or she may have
a story to tell tearfully of a wayward
boy lost somewhere in the great world,
and all the fee she asks for her gra-
cious hospitality is a simple request
that in the wanderings of her guest he
may look about for her absent boy and
give him a loving message of a moth-
er's longing and watching. - Good
Housekeeping.

DAIRY NOTES.

Good butter should be solid from the
time it is put upon the table.
Any excitement in the dairy COW

tends to lessen the flow of milk.
Failing to get all the buttermilk out

causes butter to become rancid soon.
To obtain the best results in churning

the cream should be only slightly sour.
In winter the cream should be warm-

ed up to about 60 degrees before put-
ting in the churn.
One advantage in brine salting is

that it almost entirely avoids streaked
or mottled butter.
The milk should always be skimmed

while sweet and the cream then allow-
ed to tura slightly sour.
Sometimes butter has white specks

distributed through it. This is caused
by oversourness in the cream.
In butter making next to controlling

the temperature is to churn often while
the cream is in good condition.
With temperature under control and

churning done at the right time the
butter will become solid and be easily
handled.
On the farm to make the most out of

the milk and butter some of the cows
should be bred to come fresh in the
spring and some in the fall.-St. Louis
Republic.

A Simple Remedy.
The readiness of some people to send

for a man to do those little things
about the house which the smallest
amount of enterprise or ingenuity
would enable them to do for them-
selves is illustrated by an incident re-
ported in the Chicago Tribune of a
family named Chuckster.
They had bought some new gas bum-

em's with mantles. For a week or two
the light was satisfactory; then it grew
dint and dimmer until Mrs. Chuckster
sent for the gas fitter.
"It grows worse all the time," she ex-

plained.
"When was it put in?" asked the

man.
"About a month ago."
"Ah, yes; I see."
Then he lifted the chimney oft, took

It out to the kitchen, washed it with
soap and water, and the light burned
as brightly as ever.
"Fifty cents," said the man.

An Argument For Social Frankness.
It is best to be sincere, as a family in

Germantown recently found out. They
had been entertaining a distinguished
novelist from abroad who was not alto-
gether acquainted with society's way
of saying things it does not mean. The
time came for her departure, and as
the host was handing her to the car-
riage he said very courteously, "I am
sorry you cannot stay longer."
To which came the unhooked for re-

tort, "Oh, but I can!"
There was only one course open. The

trunks were taken down, the carriage
sent away, and, to the consternation of
her hosts, the lady re-entered the
house.-Philadelphia Times.

No Loss of Time.
I have sold Chamberlain's Colic.

Cholera and Diarrhcea Remedy for
years, and would rather be out of
coffee and sugar than it. I sold five
bottles of it yesterday to threshers
that could go no farther, and they
are at work again this morning.-H.
R. PHELPS, Plymouth, Oklahoma.
As will be seen by the above the
threshers were able to keep on with
their work without losing a single
day's time. You should keep a bot-
tle of this Remedy in your nome. For
sale by R. S. McKinney, Druggist,
Taneytown, Md.

The Book Agent.
Agent-1 have a book you should buy

for your son telling how to become a
politician, statesman. president of the
United States, banker, broker-
Mrs. Hennesy-G'wan! Did yer moth-

er buy wan for you?-Brooklyn Life.

Appropriate Treatment.
The Thoughtful Man-What mend

Fop recommend as treatment for a man
who is always going around with a
poor mouth?
The Funny Fellow-Send him to a

dentist. -Yonkers Herald.

Grades of Youngness.
Visitor (kincllse-Hew old are you,

dear?
Little Girl (with great dignity)-I'm

not old at all. Granny's old, but moth-
er's young, and daddy's young, and I'm
very youngl-Panch.

"THE VOLCANO'S DEADLY WORK from
the Fall of Pompeii to the Destruction of
St. Pierre," by Prof. Charles Morris. LI,. D.
Most intensely interesting book ever publish-
ed. Complete thrilling and accurate account
of greatest disaster that ever befell the hu-
man race-greater even than Pompeii. Tells
how Martinique, one of the most beautiful
islands in the world, was suddenly trans-
formed into a veritable hell. About 500 pages
profusely illustrated with phot ()graphs tak-
en before and after disaster. Practically
only "Martinique Book" in the field. for
everyone now insists on having Prof. Mor-
ris book and no other. Best author, largest
book, best illnarated,scientifically accurate.
Price $1.60. Agents' Wanted. Enormous
profit for those who act quickly. Most imers
al terms. Outfit 10 cents. Don't loso a min-
ute. Send for outfit IMMEDIATELY, and be
at work. The chance of a life-time for mak-
ing money.
CLARK & CO.. 222 S. 4th. St., Phila.,

Pa. Mention this Paper. 5-24-4t
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And now Spring Business in Earnest!

to deal with Us.

S. SHOEMAKER,
HARNEY, MD.

The fliller Bros. Co.
••••40,04 0* 490••••••••••••••• ••••••4110•••••.***4

•
   •0}----zeze•-

4*

* Our Wonderful and Magnificent
Display of

Dress Goods, Silks, Suits,
Shirt Waists, Carpets, Millinery, etc.,

is the source of general comment among
the people. Those who have seen their
beauty and richness acknowledge them
to be superior to anything ever shown in
this city.

We are also showing the most Fashion-
* able line of
ep

3 Men', Boys' and Children's
CLOTHING,

it has ever been our pleasure to show.

Mens', Ladies', Misses' and Children's Shoes.
Mens' and Boys' Hats.

We Solicit Your Trade.
4

The Miller Bros. Co.,
WESTMINSTER, MD.

The PI B. Englar Box,
(Approved by the P. 0. Department.)

THE

Popular Mail Box.
For Rural Delivery!

REDUCED TO ONLY

$1.00
Without name or Lock.

To Patrons of Rural Free Delivery.

Hereafter, the Englar Mail Box will be sold at $1.00, without
name, or lock. Name stenciled on box, zoc extra. Master-keyed
lock, 35e extra.

The Dollar Box
has been waited for by many, and now their chance has arrived. Over 10,000
of these boxes have been sold, chiefly in the west and south, and this fact
attests their popularity beyond question.

No lower price to anybody. One Dollar pays for the box in Taneytown;
freight or express charges must be paid by purchaser. Orders by mail must
be accompanied by cash. Descriptive circulatr mailed on application.

P. B. ENGLAR, Patentee.

5-24-tf. TANEYTOWN, MD.

....„.33.0,000.0„...1,„0.000.0.0• .0 ••0 Shoemaker's i•

41BARGAIN STORE!. .. ))._ ,_...... •
• o
o Don't be stampeded by the •
• "Lowest prices on earth; world 0
• beating bargains, marvelous tri- 60o

o umphs in buying, etc.," for "All 0
0 is not gold that glitters" o
• Gentlemen, we can dress you So0 

o from head to foot, latest style in 0
• every respect. We offer o
o •
• o
o Special Reduction •• o
o •• On Ail Summer Suits ! o
o •
• They must be sold, regardless 0
e° of profit. Strictly first-class Cloth- !
o ing at astonishing prices,quality •
• considered. We are headquar- 0

•° ters for the famcoe• o
o 0

•o Shippensburg Pantaloons.•o
• Overalls and Shirts. Pantaloons o
0 at 40e and up; working shirts at •
4.0 20c and up-not the low price le°
• alone that sells, but style and o
0 make too. When you want a •
00 pretty shirt-come to us Also 400
• working gloves at pc and up. o
o •

o SHOES! SHOES! •o•

o• Yes, we have thew, all new 0o
ID stock and attractive styles. No o
2 fad Shoes to peil. Three styles °(!)°
7 of Ladies' buskins, at 50e pair. 0
0 All our $1.00 and $1.25 Slippers o
° to go at 75c a‘pair. Special sale "zO,•
o on Misses and Children's Slip- •
• pers. Our prices will induce you o
° to buy. •
0 o

4 DRY GOODS. S
o

o • 0
,4! Calle°, 3c to 6c per yard. Ask &
0 to see our 6c, iSc and tic ("Ong- o
O hams. We want to Otero our 0

t° Bargains to all. A beautiful line 4• of_ o

i 
0

c, Lawns. Dimities and Silks ,i'
• Just received. Fine line of site °o 0• gingliains.20c to 350 yard. Ladies 0
o come quick if you want a hand- 0
0 some waist. Muslin 3e, yard up 0o ' •
• o
o CHILDREN'S DRESSES & APRONS •• 0

•

• eel/ 'at the nnequalocl price of 80e o
0 each. What is the use spending •

0 tMicaadeen 300f.kMiliavdras Gingham. and •

dresses 
0

o•
• o

• QUEENS o
o 0

o always on hauch at ',does too 0
ot° low to quote, and 0

1 3
o

• GROCERIES! o
o Yes, Inot•e than you need, and 0
0 coming in fresh nearly every 2
co day. All pack Coffee 10c; sugar. 7
o 4ac and Sc; best Coal Oil, 10e gal. •

o
0

Just received from the fl=liel'Y i

FISH I, FISH!
a large lot of new Lake Fish
which we guarantee to be good,
and prices right.

We pay 100 for Side Meat and
Lard in exchange for goods,

0

Give us a call and you will like 0

Ct

C.*

•000•000•000•00010000001000e

Special Notices.
Short advertisements will be inserted un-

der this heading at 5c. per line each issue,
counting seven words to the line. No charge
under 10c. Cash in advance.

WANTED-5000 dozen eggs; 300
squabs; 500 spring chicks, 2 The. 28c,
1.1 to le lbs. 25c; 300 fowls; 1000 tbs.
lard, 10c; 60 shoats, calves and all
kinds produce-at C. B. SCI1Vt'ARTZ'S.

FENCING wire tor sale-second
hand-will be sold cheap.-JNo. YING-
LING, near Taneytown. 31-1t.

MONEY made by buying now.
Millinery goods at reduced prices.-
MRS. M. H. REINDOLLAR, Taney-
town, Md. 31-2t

$3.00 PER DAY will be paid for two
horses and a man-team for scooping
and ploughing-two teams wanted
Saturday morning.-Appay to C. B.
SCHWARTZ.

FOUND.-Purse containing sum of
money: Owner call at RECORD office
for same, giving description of purse
and contents, and pay cost of adv't.

PUBLIC SALE.-Saturday, June
7, near Lawyer's blacksmith shop, at
1 p. ma personal property of the late
Mrs. David Shriner; 2 stoves, 1 safe, 1
lounge, 2 mirrors, 1 bureau, 2 beds,
washtubs and numerous other articles.

ENGLAR Mail Boxes reduced to
$1.00. With name $1.10. Lock 35c.

5-24-3t.

CARRIAGE Blacksmiths, Wood-
workers and Painters wanted. Will
pay good wages to first-class mechan-
ics.-THE HESS CARRIAGE CO., Ha-
gerstown, Md.

ROUND Cornered, enameled Cards,
the ideal card for business men-at
the RECORD office. 24-3t

WANTED.-3 young men, 18 or S'0,
to learn Baking; $4.50 to start with.-
Apply to, FOX it' OTTMYER, York.
City. 5-24-4t.„ - •

TO CURE A COLD IN ONE DAY.
Take I,axative Bromo Quinine Tablets. All
flr N. ug g Gisrtsovsreefunsidgnthaetunrieptitlneyif 4tef iT 

box,
xiolsto mcureE ,

 _ -
THE FIRST object in Life Insur-

ance is the protection of the Widow
and Orphan. Honest methods and
Rigid Economy are essential, and are
all found only under the protection
of the celebrated Massachusetts Law,
and in the Mass. Mutual Life Ins.
Co., for particulars, address-
Jastits M. BIGGS, 4 South St., Balto.

Stops the Cough and works
off the Cold.

Laxative Bromo Quinine Tablets cure a cold
in one day. No Cure, No Pay. Price, 25 cents.
.1M=M1.11•MEIINMOWNE, 

Red Snow.

In the erctie regionspa r:y explorer
were astounded to find laritv afeas ef
ted snow, but the phenomenon is now
familiar tt men of science, who know
that red snow, like a green garde!)
fence, Is due to the presence of unicel-
lular Igen, the only difference being ip
the coloring matter of the protoplasm,
It Is said that acres of snow are fre-
quently covered In a single night by
these tiny plants.-Good Words.

The Climate,

"Dcrn't you think you have a very
changeable climate?" said the stranger.
"No," said the native. "It changes

fast enough when it's pleasant. but
When its disagreeable it bangs on like
grim death."-Washington Star.

WEANT St: KOONS,
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Wash" Fabrics. 
Superior Qualities-Fashions the prettiest, and most distinctive

Styles-offerings that knowing ones will admit are unequaled. For
instance, Fine English Madras, in entirely new effects; value 30c-

OUR PRICE, 19e.

Summer Underwear.
The Ladies' and Gents' Summer Underwear Department is one of

the busiest spots in our store. Good reason-never before has equal
quality been coupled to such moderate prices. And what a variety !

OUR PRICES, 5e to soe.

Ladies' Wrappers.
Made out of Percale, in colored and mourning effects-deep flounce,

Bishop sleeves, tight-fitting lining, finished with narrow Soutache
braid; value $1.25-

OUR PRICE, 98e.

Men's and Boys' Clothing.
Make up your mind you want the Best Clothing for the money to

be had anywhere-seeing our line is the next and only other step nec-
essary. It suits us to suit you with suitable Suits at-

SUITABLE PRICES.

Floor Coverings.
Carpets, Mattinge, Linoleum and Oilcloth. It is not a question as

to where you can get these goods for the least money. The quality is
also considered. A trial will convince you.

FINE GOODS-LOW PRICES

$12.49.

Sewing Machines.
will buy you one of our Twelve Year Guaranteed Ma-
chines-Five drawers, complete set of attachments, drop

head. If needing a machine, don't miss this chance.
OUR PRICE, $12.49.

Weant & Koons=BEST GOODS. LATEST STYLES.LOWEST PRICES.

SNIDER'S
nay Bargains!
We carry by far the largest stock of

goods in our town, and receive new
goods nearly every day.

You can get anything you
want at our Mammoth Store.

OUR CLOTHING SALES-
are immense this Spring. Why ?

Because we buy direct from the man-
ufacturers and have everything you
need for Men, Boys' and Children.
We don't stand back for any large
city in either style or price. Meats'
suits from $1.00 to $12.00; Boys', 14 to
19 years, 75c to $8.00; Children's, from
50c to $4.00.

When in need of Clothing
come our way.

ABOUT SHOES-
A man said "How does it come you

sell so many shoes?" Because we car-
ry more than double the largest line
in our town, buy them for cash and
sell them at the closest possible profit.
You should see our line of Men's Pat-
ent Leather shoes and slippers-they
are "way up" in style and "way
down" in price. Men's Vici, Calf, and
all kinds and makes, ranging from 97c
to $3.06. Men's heavy shoes-strong
and good-87c to $1.90. Ladies Patent
Leather shoes and slippers-Oh ! they
are fine! You must see them, for to
see is to buy. Our line of Ladies'
shoes and slippers all through, is up-
to-date, and a pleasure to show--
shoes, 90e to $3.00; slippers, 75c to $2.

200 prs Hesson's old stock
to be closed at about half price,

QUEENSWARE
Don't forget that we are especially

strong in this line. We have sets of
dishes from $2.50 to $12 and they're
certainly fine.

Carpets and Mattings
Yes, it pays to have a large stock so

customers can get what they want.
Have sold more carpets in the last
month than we ever sold in a year
before. We will prove the prices right
-people come 20 miles to our store.
Brussel, 49c upwards; Hemp, Ingrain
and Granite,10c to 50c yard; Mattings,
10 to 25c.

You must come to Snider's
if you want to buy right.

DRY GOODS--
The subject is too big to talk about

-words do not tell the story. Muslins
and Calicoes from 3c up; Silks,Satins,
Henriettas, Serges, Flannels-but, it's
no use to try, you must come and See.

Closing out lot of 8c & 10c
Lawn at 3c and up.

Groceries, Coffees,Patent Medicines,
Sugars-everything at the lowest.
Lion, Levering'e and Arbuckle's pack
coffee at 10c; York coffee, 11c.

Notice to Farmers
We will sell McCormick standard

twine, until May 15th., at 12c pound.
Prices guaranteed until Jane 1st.
Send your order by Mail if you can't
come, and want to save money.
Remember, we pay 10c Th. for side

meat and lard.
Your Friend,

M. R. SNIDER,
4-19-tf. HARNEY, MD.

CLOSING-OUT SALE
----OE

Uncut  Wood and Tree  Tops.
On Monday, June 9th., 1902,

pn the premises of Win. T. Keefer,
in Taneytown District, Carrolf emin-
ty, Md., on the road leading from
Taneytown to Union Bridge,at Otter-
dale Mills, will be sold at public sale,

.20 Acres of Uncut Wood and Tree
Tops, in lots to suit purchasers.
A credit of Three Months will be given.

Sale to commence at 1 o'clock, p. m., on Mon-
day, June 9th., 1902

' 
when terms and condi-

tions will be made known by

2t. A. M. KALBACH.

Printing Press for Sale.
An Excelsior Job Press, hand self-

inker, size of chase 8x13, in good or-
der, will be sold cheap. Three fonts
of metal job type, and one of wood,in
caeca Press end type has been but
slightly used by a Cigar Box manu-
facturer, for which business the out-
fit is specially 'adapted. The outfit
has been left at this office to sell, and
as we have not the space to store it,it
is desired that it be taken very soon.
Call on or address;
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If You Want All the

News, Subscribe for

The Carron Record.

Things You Should Buy
- FROM-

SHARRER & GORSUCH,
WESTMINSTER, MD.

Men's
Suits.

$5.00 Stylish
Wool Suits,

value $7.00. A
great showing
of Elegant

Suits, $10, $12
and $15.-equal
in style and

quality to fin-
est tailor-made
Suits.

Boys'
Clothing.
500 Suits to se-
lect from, $1.00
to $5.00. Beau-
tiful and Styl-
ish Suits in

Norfolks, Dou-
ble breasted,

You May Want a Suit made to Order
In our Tailoring Department we unques-tionably lead in variety of Patterns, SuperiorMake and Low Prices

Underwear and Shirts.
Special value in 25c Underwear, Our 50cMadras and Bedford Cord shirts are beauties,

Neckties, Collars, Gloves and Hose.You always find the new and correct styleshere.
Working Pants and Shirts.A good Cotton Pants, 50c. 10 dozen HeavyShIrts,35c values, for 25c. We keep SweetOrrs' Overalls.

Have Your
Eyes Examined c

BY AN EXPERT

--OF THE--

American Spectacle Co.,

at the store of

R. S. McKINNEY,
TANEYTOWN, MD.

We make NO CHARGE
for examination, and

GUARANTEE all

our work.

Statement of the
OCEAN ACCIDENT & GUARAN-

TEE CORPORATION, LTD.,

of Eegland.
To December 31, 1901.

Total Admitted Assets $1,814,842Total Liabilities  004,070Surplus  1,080,199

Baltimore Markets.
Corrected Weekly.

Wheat.   .800.81
Corn 65066
Oats 48050
Rye 58060
Hay, Timothy 15.0001apP
Hay, mixed 12.5061.60
Hay, Clover 11.00012.00
Straw, Rye, bales  lt.50011.50
Straw, Rye, blocks .... 6.5006.50
Straw, wheat blocks.. . 6.0006.50
Bran 18.00020.00
Middlings  18.00019.00
Potatoes, per bn  y0071)
Sugar, granulated 4  71-1
Sugar, confec A   4.51f

Tapeytoi,vn efrain and Hay

1Viarkez.

Corrected weekly, on day of publication.
Prices paid by Reindollar & Co.

Wheat,  82052
Corn,  60g60
Rye,  56056
Oats,  30040
Timothy Hay,   9mogio.o0
Mixed Hay,  8.0008.00
Bundle Rye Straw,  9.0009.00


