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Locals and persolialo.
Miss Adelaide McFadden, of Anda-

lusia, Pa., is now visiting at Tre-
vanion.

W. E. Wagner, formerly baker for
Koontz & Long, has opened a bakery
and grocery in Emmitsburg.

Mrs. Jennie Peters of Middletown ,
Pa., who has been here on a visit to
her parents, has returned home.

The new • uniforms for our band
have been ordered, and will probably
be used for the first time on Decora-
tion day.

A delegation of the local K. of P.
attended the institution of a lodge of
the order in Union Bridge on Wed-
nesday night.

Edwin G. Cover, clerk in Englar's
clothing store, was compelled to go
to his home in Uniontown, on Thurs-
day, on account of sickness.

Miss Mary Linah, who has been ill
for some time, is improving slowly.
Miss Alice and Mrs. Niekum have
been confined to their beds with ill-
ness.

F. M. Yount and D. W. Garner,
Baltimore St, merchants, have erect-
ed front porches to their buildings,
which considerably add to their ap-
pearance.

The Shoemaker store room, near
the railroad, is being fitted up as a
hardware store,which will be opened
by Milton H. Reindollar, as soon as
the room is ready.

A homing pigeon recently came to
Solomon Myers', near Trevanion,
which carries a band on one of its
legs, marked "M & A-5." It is no
doubt a long distance from home.

The following persons are reported
as having visited the family of Mr.
Cornelius Stover, one day last week;
Mr. Charles W. Angell, Miss Laura
and Mr. Samuel Overholtzer,and Miss
Allie Putman.

Wm. H. Harnish is attending the
sessions of the Reformed Classis, at
Westminster, as elder from Grace Re-
formed church, instead of Messrs
Duttera and Hagan,who were unable
to attend.

Dr. C. Birnie left on Tuesday even-
ing for Winona Park, Indiana, as one
of six delegates from the Baltimore
Presbytery to the meeting of the
Presbyterian General Assembly. He
will be absent about two weeks.

Robert C. Thomson, of this place,
has been tried and sentenced to the
county jail for thirty days for pur
chasing liqaors for minors. There are
others equally guilty, no doubt, who
should be made examples of, not only
here, but elsewhere.

The following committee of ar-
rangements for Decoration day (Sat-
ur(lay, 29th.) will be pleased to re-
ceive contributions of flowers on Sat-
urday mornina (29th.) for decoration
purposes; B. 0. Slonaker.William W.
Witherow, Charles 0. Fuss, Levi D.
Reid and P. B. Engler.

Considerable activity is being dis-
played by Frederick county republi-
cans and democrats in reference to
coining nominations, many having
openly announced themselves as can-
didates. Carroll seems to be awaiting
like events more calmly, as there is,
as yet, nothing like a "slate" on eith-
er side—at least, not openly.

Libertytown evidently needs a re-
vival of the spirit of progress and up-
to-date-iveneiss, as it has a compara-
tively good hand fire engine and
shows a disposition to let it go to ruin
through failure to repair the engine
house. Editor Lewis, of the Banner
is getting in some hard licks on the
subject. Hit 'em again, brother.

Miss Gleichert, of the Lutheran
Deaconess House, Baltimore, is nurs-
ing Miss Hester Shoemaker, who has
been at death's door with typhoid
fever. Bliss Gleichert has had consid
erable experience in fever cases and
is regarded as a superior nurse. Nurs-
ing is one of the missions of the Dea-
coness House, the organization of
which is of comparatively recent
date in the Maryland Synod.

A considerable number of bills for
over-due subscriptions to the RECORD
have been mailed this week, which
we hope will meet with prompt re-
sponse. Bills will also be made out
for local subscribers and advertisers,
in the near future. We are endeavor-
ing to give our friends a good paper,
and the effort costs money; therefore,
Jet all do their duty, that financial
matters may not hamper us. "Many
a little makes a much."

A Junior Base ball team has been
organized here, with M. C. Duttera,
manager, and the following players;
Charles Clark. p; Robert Clingan, c;
Artie Angell, lb; Frank Lefevre, 2b;
Ross Koons, 3b; Thad Crapster, s. s;
Mat Galt, I. f; Clyde Weikert, c. f;
Claude Fink, r. f. The club is open
for challenges from other Junior
teams, composed of players from 15
to 18 years of age, and Is likely to put
up a very stiff game. Grounds have
been secured from Mr. Charles Har-
baugh, on the Emmitsburg road.

Leaving teams stand unhitched on
our streets is criminal carelessneu,
and should be prohibited by ordi-
nance—an opinion expressed long ago
in this column. The runaway of last
Wednesday, which only resulted in
injury to the team, might as easily
have killed or injured women or
children, had any been on the streets
In the way of the frightened animal
—and 11 on account of neglect to
bitch a-horse. No matter how quiet
the animal, there is something in the
world which will scare it, and you
can't tell when that "something"
will appear.

NOTES FROM EVERYWHERE.

Items of current news boiled down,

for busy readers.

Wm. B. Cromwell has been award-
ed the contract to build a two story
brick school house at Walkersville,
Frederick county, to cost $4,020.

Frank Leslie's, for June, contains
a lengthy, and profusely illustrated
article, entitled, "Baltimore in her
Centennial year," which makes the
number very interesting, not only to
residents of the city, but of the state
as well.

A reward of $100 has been offered
for the arrest of Owen Bowie, who
shot and killed (Merles Smith, of
Monrovia, Frederick county. It is
thought the fugitive is of unsound
mind. He was laboring under the
impression that Smith had "put a
spell" on him.

John Snider, who has for a number
of years past been proprietor of the
billiard room at the Hotel Albion,
Westminster, died suddenly on Sun-
day of paralysis of the brain. Mr.
Snyder was drum major for the Car-
roll County Band,and was well known
in band circles over the state.

Editors, as a rule, are kindhearted
and liberal. An exchange tells of a
certain subscriber to a certain paper
who died and left fourteen years'
subscription unpaid. The editor ap-
peared at the grave as the lid was be-
ing screwed down for the last time,
and put in a linen duster, a thermom-
eter, a palm leaf fan and a receipt
for making ice.

The programme for the eighth an-
nual Reformed reunion at Pen-Mar
on July 15th has been arranged. The
following persons will deliver short
addresses: Rev. Isaac N. Peightal, of
Greencastle, Pa.; Hon. W. Rush Gil-
len, of Chambersbure, Pa.; Rev. Har-
ry H. Rank, of Mechanicsburg, Pa.;
Rev. Cyrus J. Musser, of Philadel-
phia, editor of the Reformed church
Messenger.

The Key Monument Association has
completed and signed the contract
with the sculptor, Alexander Doyle,
of New York, by which the monu-
ment is to be completed for unveiling
on Juse 14, 1898. To complete the
balance of its fund of $10,000, the as-
sociation will appeal to every mein-
her of the G. A. R. and auxiliary or-
ganizations for a contribution of five
cents each.

Thos. McGovern died in New
Windsor,Thursday morning the 13th.
of vertigo, aged about 70 years, and a
native of Connecticut, but for a num-
ber of years a resident of New Wind-
sor district. He leaves a widow and
oneotep daughter. Deceased was in
the employment of the W. M. R. R.
Co., for a long time, until failing
health compelled him to retire from
the service a couple years ago.

While attempting to shoot a bird
last Tuesday, Roy Delaplaine, of
Waynesboro, Pa., accidentally shot
his companion, Howard Bender, in
the right side, the ball lodging in his
lung, The boys went to Bell's dam,
along the Antietan, to flub, and the
accident happenvi about 12 o'clock.
The injured boy is a son of G. F.
Bender, of Waynesboro. The nature
of the wound will not permit the ball
to be removed, and the boy is in a
serious condition.

The following is the latest weather
crop bulletin for northern-central
Maryland; The rains of the past week
were very heavy, retarding corn
planting. Much corn still remains to
be planted. The week has been fav-
orable for rapid growth. Clover is
blossoming. Wheat and oats are
looking very well. Grass fields prom-
ise a large yield. Tomato plants are
crowing nicely. khustures are good.
In short all vegetation is doing well.
Apples and cherries promise an abun-
dant crop.

The county commissioners of How-
ard county, who are making up the
annual levy, have ascertained that
the county tax rate this year will be
four cents higher than the rate of
last year, making it 75 cents for the
present levy. Last year it was 71
cents. Extraordinary expenses on
account of court, making and review-
ing the new assessment, election ex-
penses and searching records in the
clerk's office, etc., are the causes of
the increased rate. The commission;
ers expect to complete the levy with-
in the next few days.

Thieves broke into the Catholic
church at Urbana, Frederick county,
Saturday and stole the ostensorium,
ciborium and chalice and other prop-
erty of the church, valued altogether
at about $1,000. The robbery was
not discovered until Sunday morning,
when Rev. John J. Prendergast went
to celebrate mass and found that
thieves had entered the edifice and
stolen the articles. He sent to Fred-
erick city and secured the loan of a
chalice and ciborium before he was
able to proceed with the mass.

The colored republicans of Freder-
ick evidently disagree with those in
Baltimore, who recently adopted res-
olutions in favor of an independent
movement,as the congregation of the
A. M. E. church of Frederick, num-
bering about 600, has published reso-
lutions, of which the following is a
portion; "We hereby denouncb the
attitude and actions of that class of
colored republicans in Baltimore city
who are advising the overthrow of
the republican party on the grounds
of disappointment in office-getting,as
unwise and unworthy of adoption by
the colored republicans of the Com-
monwealth of Maryland, whose •edu-
cational advantages and material
chance in life at this time are worth
more than mere places."

THE C. E CONVENTION.

Our Uniontown Correspondent re-
ports progress to date.

The Annual Convention of the Car-
roll County Union of the Christian
Endeavor Societies,met at Uniontown
in the Methodist Protestant church,
Thursday morning, May 20th. A pre-
paratory service was held Wednesday
evening, May 19th., at 7.30, in the
Lutheran church. The sermon was
delivered by Rev. A. Bateman of
Taneytown—a very good, inspiring
discourse.
The address of welcome was hearti-

ly extended by Miss Florence E.
Weaver, of Uniontown. The response
In behalf of the delegates was made
by Mr. Wm. J. Horner, of Finksburg.
The convention sermon was deliver-
ed by Rev. Oliver Hemstreet, of Bal-
thnore, on the subject of "Christian
Endeavor Unity," from Romans
12:4-5. The music used during the
convention is the new C. E. Hymns.
In the afternoon the session was

opened by a short prayer and praise
service led by Miss Belle Cover, of
Uniontown, followed by the Presi-
dents' address by Mr. Charles R.
Woods. The Secretary's report, by
Miss Ida M. Diffenbaugh,gave a brief
history of the work of the Union
since its organization which was ef-
fected in Uniontown,Md., in October,
1891. The Union has grown in all di-
rections, the :membership at its or-
ganization was about 200 comprising
7 societies. The membership now is
nearly 1300, with 30 societies. The
work along the line of Missions has
woederfullly developed and grown.
The report from the Superintendent
of Temperance was read by the Sec-
retary in the absence of Mr. W. Arch-
er Burgoon. An address by the State
President, Mr. Wm. A. Schumacker,
of Baltimore, was next on the pro-
gramme; it was good, bright and en-
thusiastic, and made a pleasant im-
pression on the convention. A par-
liament on the "Imperative need of a
stricter separation from the World,"
was to have been conducted by Rev.
W. H. Ehrhart, of Silver Run; but he
was not present, and Rev. S. W. Coe
opened the discussion, followed by
Rev. R. L. Patterson, in a plain,prae-
tical talk; Mr. Robert Barnes closed
the discussion.
At night, the choirs of the two

churches, (and right here we will say
the music by the two choirs has been
rendered in a very good and accepta-
ble manner) opened the services with
some very fine music. The male quar-
tet, Messrs W. R. Zollickoffer,Charles
Sittig, Clarence Davis, and Will
Sittig, deserve special mention. An
address on "Christian Patriotism,"
by Mr. Horner L Castle, of Pitts-
burg, Pa., followed. It was indeed a
treat to the people of Carroll county,
to listen to an address such as Mr.
Castle gave; it was full of beautiful
strong truths and must have come in
to the hearts of all who heard him.
Mr. Schumacher conveyed a greeting
from the Frederick county Union,
which is now in session, to the Carroll
county Union. This was the. greet-
ing, I John 2: 1; 2, and 3 verses; in re-
turn, the following greeting, Phil. 3:
13, was telegraghed the Frederick
county Union, by a unanimous vote.

Is it a Crematory?

For the RECORD.
From the small amount of public

Interest manifested in the cemetery
question, the conviction is getting
positive that the people are not
greatly interested in how, or where,
either themselves or the members of
their families, are "planted." Possi-
bly a crematory would be the thing
to agitate—cemeteries are old fash-
ioned institutions anyway, and a new
one, even, would not be "building
for posterity" to any great extent or
credit.
Taneytown is rather slow to do

things, but when it "gets a ready on"
small craft must move out of danger
or be "swamped." Some of these
days, the cemetery, or crematory,
question, will be taken hold of here
with a whoop, and something so
magnificent will be the result that
the people of earth will flock here
just for the privilege of dying with
the certainty of a Taneytown post
mortent disposition of their mortal
bodies.

WHO KNOWS

Church Notices.

Communion services will be held in
Piney Creek Presbyterian church,
Sunday afternoon, May 30th.

Communion services will be held in
the Lutheran church, Taneytown,
Sunday morning, May 30th, Confir-
mation services Sunday morning, the
23rd., and preparatory services on
Friday afternoon, the 28th.

There will he no church services in
the Reformed church next Sunday,
on account of the absence of the pas-
tor, at Chassis.

An ardent church-worker of this
district says; "Give the children a
chance, and the work of the church
will be done, and both parents and
children will be the happier for doing
so." This is from a lady who believes
that every member of a family shouli
contribute to the support of the
church—and her own family practices
this belief.

Removal of Nuisances.

Eighteen residents of Emmitsburg
have been served with notices by the
Frederick county health officers to
remove nuisances under penalty of
arrest and prosecution. This is a step
in the right direction; there is no
good reason why the twilit!' of towns
should be endangered Mr a few care-
less persons who have no regard eith-
er for appearance or cleanliness.

THE WEER IN COURT.

The Grand Jury discharged. List of

cases disposed of.

M. Schaeffer & Co. vs Carroll Coun-
ty Trotting, Riding and Pleasure As-
sociation; action aseumpsit. Trial
before the court. Judgment for
plaintiffs for $190.10. J. M. Reifsnider
for plaintiff and P. P. for defendant.
Guggenhehner, Wise & Co. vs Lew-

is Shipley; action assumpsit. Tried
before the court; judgment for plain-
tiff for $139.72. J. M. Reifsnider for
plaintiff, and Henning for defendant.
John Lynn and others vs Daniel H.

Lynn, executor, &c. Issues from Or-
phan's Court; trial before jury. Judg-
ment of non pros. Stocksdale, Reif-
snider & Reifsnider, Henning and
Weant for plaintiffs, and Clabaugh &
Roberts for defendant.
State of Maryland vs Joseph A.

Leppo; cruelty to animals. Plea of
guilty confessed, and fined $20 and
costs. J. M. Reifsnider for state, and
P. P. for traverser.
State of Maryland vs Wm. P. Rick-

le; assault and battery. Trial before
jury; verdict not guilty on first count,
and guilty on second count; held sub
curia. J. M. Reifsnider for state,and
Brooks for traverser.
State of Maryland vs Robert Thom-

son, indictment for purchasing liquor
for a minor. Trial before court; ad-
judged guilty, and sentenced to the
county jail for 30 days. J. M. Reif-
snider for state, and Wheatley for
trayerser.
State of Maryland vs Charles M.

Bangs, indicted for forgery; trial be-
fore a jury.

REPORT OF THE GRAND JURY.
GRAND JURY Room,

Westminster, Md., May 19, 1897.
To the honorable, the Judge of the

Circuit Court for Carroll Coun-
ty, Maryland.

The Grand Jury, having completed
the business brought to its attention,
all cases have been carefully consider-
ed and investigated, respectfully ask
leave to submit its report and be dis-
charged.
During the period the Grand Jury

was in session, it has examined thirty
cases, nineteen of which we have in-
dicted, and dismissed eleven. The
examination of these cases have re-
quired the summoning and examining
of 69 witnesses and 12 constables.
In accordance with our duty we

have visited and examined the jail
and found it in a nice, clean condi-
tion, with the exception of the water
closets, which we did not find in a
good sanitary condition; also one cell
in south-east end of building which
we did not find in condition to con-
fine prisoners; also found board walk
in back yard in had condition.

JosiN N. HoFFAutiErt,Foreitian.

An Ingenious Calendar.

Prof. Henry Meier, of this place,
has invented a sort of calendar by
which one can, in a few seconds, tell
the day of the week of any date with-
in the years 1820 and 1920. The model
is a circular tablet, about eight inches
in diameter, which contains on the
left side of its face three small open-
ings through which may be made to
appear every year, month and day,
between 1820 and 1920, by simply
moving three circular sheets,or dials,
of card board so that the proper fig-
ures show through. The right side
of the tablet also contains three open-
ings, through which certains figures
show on account of the movement
the dials on the left to the proper
year and day.
For instance, should we want to

know on what day of the week the
4th. of July,1776,came,we would move
the year 1776 so as to show through
the outer opening on the left; next,
the month of July to the second
opening, and last, the figure 4 to the
third opening, which would give us
1776, July, 4, as placed here. On the
right of the tablet would then appear
three figures, probably 0, 4, 1, which,
added together make 5, or fifth day—
Tim ursday.
The three dials *each have fingers

extending slightly beyond the edge
of the tablet, so that they may be
easily turned round, and the moving
of one does not interfere with the
other. While the model shown ex-
tends from 1820 to 1920, any other like
period can as easily be covered, leap
years being no hindrance to accu-
racy. On the face of the tablet may
be printed simple instructions for
working the novelty, and the other
space could be used for advertising.
The Professor makes no claims for
mechanical ingenuity, as it is simply
an arrangement to show figures
which show the result of calculation.
He has previously produced cards
which show the same conclusion, but
they are not as simple as this later
production. He would like to know
to what important practical use this
calendar might be adapted, as he
may have it patented.

Pennsylvania Flag Law.

Governor Hastings signed the flag
law,on Last Thursday,which provides
that any person who shall wilfully
and maliciously damage or destroy
any American flag or flagstaff, which
now or hereafter may be erected on
any private or public building or
place, or on any public highway or
any public or private grounds, or use
the flag for advertising any business
or trade, shall be guilty of a felony,
and upon conviction shall pay a fine
not exceeding $500 or suffer imprison-
ment not exceeding six months or
both.

The mail route from Union Bridge
to Frederick, via Libel ty, has been
sub-let to Reuben Saylor,of the form-
er place for $400. The original con-
tractor loses $30.20 a year on the deal.

REFORMED CLASSIS.

The Seventy-seventh annual session
opened in Westminster.

The seventy-seyenth annual session
of the Maryland classis of the Re
formed church, opened in St. Paul's
church, Westminster on Wednesday
evening. The opening sermon was
delivered by retiring president Rev.
Dr. E. R. Eschbach, of Frederick,and
was chiefly of a retrospective charac
ter. The following officers were elect-
ed for the ensuing year; President,
Rev. T. H. Hoffmeier, of Middletown,
vice- president, Rey. J. A. Apple, of
Frederick; secretary, Rev. K. Otis
Spessard, of Union Bridge. No other
business of importance was transact-
ed at the opening session.
Two items of more than ordinary

imnortance will claim the attention
of this classis in addition to the usual
business. One is the celebration of
the one hundred and fiftieth anniver-
sary of Rev. Michael Schlatter's first
work as the pioneer-of the Reformed
church in this country and especially
in the state of Maryland. The Re-
formed church in this country is mak-
ing an effort to raise a Sch latter me-
morial fund of $100,000 to aid in carry-

ing forward her missionary work.
The other item is the consideration
of the new constitution prepared by
the General Synod.
The following persons will be in at-

tendance from Baltimore; Rev. Dr.
George L. Staley, Rev. Joel T. Rossi-
ter and Elder Goldsborough S. Griff-
ith, of the First Reformed church;
Rev. Dr. Conrad Clever and Elder
James M. Girvineof the Third church;
Rev. Lloyd E. Coblentz and Elder
Charles N. Zumstein, of St. Paul's
church; Rev. E. Ranson Deatrick and
Elder E. S. Everhart, of Trinity
church; Rev. Adam S. Weber and
Elder A. A. Haminer,of Faith church;
Rev. William I. Stewart and Elder
E. G. Shower,M. D.,o1 Christ chnrch;
Rev. Charles W. Levan and Elder
W. H. Deering, of St. Stephen's
church; Rev. Frederick W. Bald and
Elder J. Charles Knoske, of Grace
church; Rev. Louis F. Zinkhan, su-
perintendent of Bayview Asylummnd
Rev, George Merle Zacharias.
On Thursday, President Hoffmeier

announced the standing committees,
after which the greater part of the
session was taken up with the pre-
sentation of parochial reports.
Rev. J. C. Leonard, field secretary

of Catawba College, Newton, N. C.,
delivered an address for financial
help in raising an endowment for the
college of $100,000.
The classis next gave attention to

the reading of parochial reports of
the ministers in the order of length
of their membership in chassis.
The charge at Thurmont, through

one of its congregations, asked classis
to consider a proposed division of the
charge. The matter was referred to
a committee consisting of Revs. W. I.
Steward, H. J. Macallister, S. M. Roe-
der and Elders W. S. Kefauver and
John Gassman. Rev. Dr. Cyrus Cort,
Sabillasville, delivered an address on
Rev. Michael Schlatter, the pioneer
of the Reformed church in this coun-
try.

Dunkard Annual-meeting Notes.

The tabernacle a‘t the fair grounds
for the annual meeting of the German
Baptists in June, has been practical-
ly completed. The cooking apparatus
will be put in place shortly. The
kitchen and restaurant are in course
of erection.
The work of awarding the con

tracts for supplies has not yet been
completed, but it is thought it will
be in a few days.
The committee on lodging have se-

cured accommodations for all who
will be present. The committee will
have an office on the grounds, where
all applicants for lodging will be giv-
en information.

New K. of P. Lodge.

A lodge of K. of P. was instituted
in Union Bridge on Wednesday night
by Grand Chancellor Lewis Reitz,
Grand Keeper of Records and Seals
James Whitehouse and Past Grand
Chancellors Charles E. Whelan and
John A. Schwartz. They were as
sisted by members from the Taney-
town and Pleasant Valley lodges.
The new lodge has forty-five mem-

bers on the roll, twenty-three of
whom were invested with the degrees
on this occasion. The following offi-
cers were elected: Chancellor com-
mander, John J. White; vice chan-
cellor, William Wood; prelate, W. 0.
Little; master of work, Charles T,
HIltabidle; keeper of records and seal,
Howard G. Winter; master of finance,
Harry 1). Fowble; master of excheq-
uer,. G. R. Markel; master-at-arms,
George W. Byers; inside guard,W. H.
Deinmitt; outside guard, Charles C.
Myers.

The Rev. Dr. H. W. McKnight, pres-
ident of Pennsylvania (Gettysburg)
College, is making an effort to secure
the erection of several dormitories to
accommodate the new students who
will arrive next September. He re-
ports that two, and possible three,
will be erected during the summer.
They are to be built after the English
style, each section to have a separate
entrance and all conveniences, and
to have rooms for thirty men. United
States Senator Wellington, of Mary-
land, is expected to be present during
commencement week and address the
graduating class.

------------
DIED.

MYERS.—On May 21st, near Taney-
town, Mrs. Annie Catharine Myers,in
her 73rd. year.
MCGOVERN. On May 13th, in

New Windsor, Mr. ThomasMcGovern
aged about 70 years.
SNIDER.—On May 16th, in West-

minster, Mr. John Snider,in his 55th.
year.
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Uniontown.

Miss Agnes A. Gilbert went to Mid-
dleburg last Friday, to see her broth-
er-in-law, Mr. Jesse Williams, who is
quite ill; he was formerly a resident
of this place. At this writing he is
critically ill.
Miss Bertie Yeakle, of Arlington, is

visiting Miss Florence Weaver.
Children's day will be observed the

second Sunday in June,by the church
of God. A sermon will be delivered
in the morning by Mr. T. B. Tyler,on
"Flowers." In the evening, an exer-
cise entitled, "The Shepherd's Call,"
will be rendered, consisting of music
and recitations. The church will be
decorated with flowers.
Mrs. Annie Diehl Brumbaugh and

son Donald, of Brooklyn, N. Y., is
visiting her father, Mr. Daniel Diehl,
at "Evergreen Lawn."
The two little colored boys who

were arrested on suspicion of stealing
chickens, had a hearing before Jus-
tice Kolb, Saturday afternoon. They
were acquitted and went home re-
joicing.
On Saturday, May 15th, the Pipe

Creek Brethren church, of near
town, held their annual Love-feast,
which was one of the largest meetings
they ever held, there being nearly
four hundred members to surround
the sacred tables; fully one thousand
people were present. One candidate
was baptised during the afternoon.
The communion service was conduct-
ed by. Elder Andrew Hutchison of
McPherson, Kansas, who has traveled
from sea to sea, and preached in 27
states of the Union. The preachers
present were Elders Andrew Hutchi-
son, of McPherson, Kansas; D. R.
Saylor, of Double Pipe Creek, Md.,
W. H. Franklin, of Sams Creek, Md;
E. Brunner, Frederick City; and fif-
teen others, including three home
preachers. Elder Hutchison is the
guest of Mr. Dayis Myers, this week.
Services have been held every night
since Saturday, dosing last night.
Mrs. Clara Crouse and family, of

Woodeboro, spent several days with
her parents, Mr. and hfrujohn H.
Hamburgh, this week.

Emmitsburg.

Miss Mary C. Gamble, only daugh-
ter of Samuel and Emma Gamble,
died at her home in the country on
Saturday morning, after an illness of
several mouths, aged about twenty-
eight years. The funeral took place
from the Presbyterian church, on
Monday afternoon.
On Tuesday afternoon, Mr. Samuel

Cool and John O'Connor were ser-
iously injured, while blasting at the
quarry, a short distance from town.
Mr. Cool was badly hurt about the
face and one hand very much crush-
ed; Dr. R. L. Annan was summoned
immediately to relieve his sufferings.
Mr. O'Connor's face and eye very
much injured; it is feared be is injur-
ed internally. Dr. J. W. Eichelber-
ger rendered the nemesary treatment
They were sent to St. Joseph's Hos-
pital, Philadelphia, on Wednesday
afternoon.
Rev. W. C. B. Shulenberger is at-

tending Maryland Classis at West-
minster; his pulpit will be filled on
Sunday by Rev. J. B. Kerschner.
During the absence of Rev. Chas.

Reinewald, his pulpit was filled on
last Sunday, by Rev. Oscar Klinger,
of Gettysburg.
Mt. St. Marys College base ball

team defeated the Pennsylvania
State college team, of Bellefonte, on
Wednesday Afternoon; score 11 to 8
in favor of Mt. St. Mary's College.
Quite a large crowd of ladies and gen-
tleman were on the grounds to wit-
ness the game.

Maidensville.

Raymond, Carvel, Florence and
Nellie,chilciren of Mr. and Mrs. Aimee
Fritz, are ill with scarlatina.
The Missionary Conference at Win-

ter's church was well attended. The
music, under the direction of Mr. E.
Fisher, was excellent. A number of
interesting addresses were rendered,
after which the meeting adjourned
to meet at Middletown, Frederick
Co., next time.
Mr. and Mrs. Zack Miller and

daughter, of Middleburg, were the
guests of Mrs. A. Warner. over Sun-
day.
Pipe Creek Drunkard church Love-

feast was well attended.
James Waltz is in Baltimore, visit-

ing friends.

McRinstry's.

The Sam's Creek M. P. church will
hold their ice cream and strawberry
festival, June 4th. and 5th.
Mrs. Effie Breakner, of "Shrub

Summit" spent from Thursday until
Monday with the family of John
Yingling.
Mrs. G. M. Zumbrun spent the past

week in Washington, D. C.
J. H. Senseney has been on the sick

list.
Miss Maud Ptoutz, of near Fountain

school house, spent the past Sunday
with the family of M. 0. Repp.
Quite a number of citizens attend-

ed the Christian Endeavor society at
Sam's Creek, the past Sunday.
J. H. Yingling has purchased a new

buggy.

Linwood.

Last Thursday and Friday after-
noon this locality was visited with
heavy rains—particularly Friday. It
was a regular downpour in our town
and surrounding neighborhood. Own-
ers of, hilly farms had their cornfields
badly washed. Grain and grass in
this section is looking fine.
Last Saturday was a bright and

beautiful day for the Pipe Creek
Love-feast, and an immense crowd of
people was in attendance. The church
seats 1000 people, and yet not more
than one-half could get inside—some
didn't want to. Quite a number of
visiting ministers were in attendance,
and although crowded at night,order
was good.
Mrs. Jesse Smith returned from

Baltimore on Saturday last, where
she had been for a week, visiting
friends.
Mrs. Myra Albaugh is in Baltimore

with her sisters.
Mr. Joseph Gilbert, of Liberytown,

Frederick Co., (father of Mr. Albert
Gilbert of this place) died on Satur-
day evening last, and was buried on
Tuesday morning at Beaver Dam.
Elder Samuel Utz, of New Market,
Frederick Co., assisted by the M. P.
minister, of Libertytown, officiated.
The meetings that have been in

progress at Pipe Creek Dunkard
church have been continued this
week. Elder Hutchinson, minisrer
in charge, preached, on Thursday
night, his la,mt sermon at that place.
From here he goes to Frederick City
where he will bold meetings prior to
our Annual Conference.
RECORD readers, please do not for-

get the strawberry festival, on the
28th. and 29th. of this month.

Tom's Creek.

The heavy rains of last week have
washed many of the corn fields, and
beat the ground so hard that the corn
recently planted will have a hard
time getting through; but the farmers
ought not to complain, as the rain
will help their grass and grain along
very much, which promises to be a
Very heavy crop in this neighbor-
hood. The prospect at this time is
bright for a very large crop of apples,
which means, many good meals of ap-
ple dumplings.
Mr. Mead Fuss had the misfortune,

last week, to lose a valuable young
horse; it was taken with a severe
colic which baffled the skill of the
doctor.
Rey. Courtney has accepted an in-

vitation from the G. A. R. post of
Emmitsburg. to preach a sermon to
them at Tom's Creek church, on Sun-
day, May 23rd.,at 2 o'clock p. in. Ein-
mitsburg Council, Jr. 0. U. A. M.,
will also attend in a body.
Mr. Samuel Bricker, of Bridgeport,

made a flying trip to M. F. Saylor's,
on Sunday, on his wheel.
Mr. R. L. Leatherwood, wife and

daughter Bertha, attended love-feast
at Pipe Creek, on Saturday last.
Miss Mattie Stansbury, who has

been quite ill with the "frizzles," and
W. B. Mort's two children, who had
the scarlet rash, are all out again.
Quite a large number of our people

attended Love-feast at Rocky Ridge
last Tuesday. and report a very large
crowd.
Rev. Reinwald and wife,of Emmits-

burg, Rev. Courtney and wife of Thur-
moat, H. F. Idaxell and wife, and N.
C. Stansbury and wife, of this place,
spent Thursday of this week with ear.
and Mrs. Win. H. Fuss,
There will be children's-day exer-

cises held at Tom's Creek church, on
Sunday evening, June 6th.

Copperville.

Miss Mary Galt went to Uniontown
on Thursday, to spend a few days
with Miss Eva Gilbert and attend
the 0. E. meeting at that place.
Prof. Billinyer ceased his visits to

his scholars in instrdinental music
last week, in order to take his place
during the summer on the Gettys-
burg battle field, as guide and histo-
rian.
Messrs Hiner and Eckert, who were

drawn on the grand jury, were dis-
charged on Wednesday evening. Mr.
Eckert would like to know from the
Editor of the RECORD what connec-
tien that dog, or any other dog, has
with his sausage.
Miss McFadden, in company with

a lady friend, took up her Imeadqugr-
ters at Trevanion on last Saturday,
and proposes to stay about one
month. She is having her house and
lawn put in first-class condition.

Keysville.

Croquet playing seems to be all the
rage at the present.
Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Bushey, of

Freedom, spent Monday last with
Mr. Peter Ba,umgardner's.
Rev. R. L. Patterson, and wife, of

Union Bridge, and Mr. Armenius
Ohler and family, of Tom's Creek,
spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. P.
L. Ritter.
Miss Florence Koons, of York Road,

spent Sunday last with her cousin,
Miss Lulu Forney.
Mr. and Mrs. H. Earnest Ritter

spent one day last week with Mr. and
Mrs. Jacob Waybright's,near Harney.
Keysville was well represented at

the German Baptist love-feast at
Rocky Ridge, on Tuesday last.
Mr. Charles Buffington and family,

of Mt. Union, spent Sunday last with
Mr. and Mrs. George Dern Sr., of this
place.

The Agricultural Departinent has
distributed nearly 10,000 pounds of
sugar beet seed among the farmers in
various parts of the country for ex-
perimental purposes. The beets grown
will be analyzed and the sacharine
value determined, to ascertain where
the beets can be profitably grown for
the production of sugar.

Rump.
— -

Mr. Thaddeus Dorsey, of Boston,
Mass.„was the guest of Mr. and Mrs.
Robert Galt, the past week.
Miss Maggie E. Classon has return-

ed home after spending seyeral days
in Hanoyei, New Oxford and Balti-
more. She also attended the wedding
of Mr. John Heitz, of Hanover.
Miss Barbara Schue visited friends

in Littlestown on Tuesday last.
Mr. Chas. Basehear and wife spent

Thursday afternoon in Littlestown.
Mr. P. U. Wiest is putting tele-

phone poles from his mill to May-
berry.
Mr. and Mrs. S. Klinefelter, of Mc-

Sherrystown, were the guests of Mr.
and Mrs. Emanuel Koontz, over Sun
day.
Mr. Solomon Bair spent Thursday

at Columbia.

Orphans' Court Proceedings.

MONDAY, May 17th., 1897.—James
A. Sheeley and Hezekiah Hahn, ex-
ecutors of Elizabeth Motter, deceas-
ed, returned list sales of goods and
chattels.
George Grose, executor of Betlishe-

ha, Brown, deceased, settled first and
final account.
James A. C. Bond, administrator of

Sarah Painter, deceased, settled first
account.
Letters testamentary on the estate

of David Sentz, deceased, were grant-
ed to Ida A. Seutz.
Lydia A. Stansbury, administratrix

w. a.,of William Stansbury, deceased,
settled second and final account.
Tue last will and testament of

Sarah G, Hollingsworth, deceased,
was admitted to probate and letters
testamentary granted to Cardiff T.
Hollingsworth.
TUESDAY. May 18th., 1897.—Letters

of administration on the estate of
Austin Arrington, deceased, were
granted to Caroline Arrington and
George W. Arrington.

The Sultan has telegraphed his
congratulations to Edhem Pasha and
the Turkish troops, and asked him
for a list of those who distinguished
themselves in the advance to Do-
inokos, in order that he may reward
them.

Governor Black has signed the so-
called anti-scalpers bill. It prohibits
the selling of railroad and steamboat
tickets in the state, except by agents
authorized to make such sales by the
owners of the vessels or trains, or
companies operating them.

The Presbyterian General Assem-
bly met on Thursday at the Winona
Camp Grounds, near Warsaw, lnd.
The inembere of the Presbyterian
church in the United States number
about one million, and they are rep-
resented in the assembly by about
600 delegates. About three hundred
of them are ministers and the balance
lay members.

The Senate, on Thursday, passed
the Morgan resolution recognizing
the belligerency of Cuba, by a vote
of 41 to 14, after a stormy debate,
political lines being obliterated. The
House by a strict party vote declined
to consider the resolution, but voted
in favor of the appropriation of the
$50,000 recommended by President
McKinley for the relief of Americans
in Cuba.

Time secret achieves of the State
Department which have held the
consular reports on the Cuban war
from the public were partially dis-
closed by Senator Foraker, of Ohio.
The facts which Senator Foraker an-
nounced without stating from whom
they came, created a decided stir.
Especially startling was the letter
from Secretary Olney, in which this
country offered mediation to Spain,
and the refusal of that country to ac-
cept the proffered aid.

The longest turntable in the world
was competed recently at East Al-
bany for the New York Central. It
is intended not only tor locomotives,
but for sleeping and long private
cars. It is 68-/- feet hi length, and its
construction required 431 yards of
concrete in the center of the table.
As evidence of how nicely it is adjust-
ed, a boy fourteen years of age turn-
ed one of the company's heaviest lo-
comotives on it with but little effort,
so perfect is its mechanical adjust-
ment. •

The Philadelphia Record says:
"When President McKinley and Vice
President Hobart come to Philadel-
pnia to attend the Washington mon-
ument exercises they will travel by
different roads. It is not generally
known that the President and Vice
President of time United States never
travel by rail together. It is one of
the precautionary measures that
hedge about the lives of the two fore-
most men in the national government,
the idea being that if an accident up-
ou the rail should cause the death of
one of the illustrious men, the other
would still be spared to the country.

---
Germany has passed an emigration

bill which provides that the special
permission of the imperial chancellor
with the assent of the Bundesrath, is
required for the transport of German
emigrants, and this can only be ob-
tained by German subjects or Ger-
man companies having business in
German territory. The Radicals op-
posed the bill on the ground that the
new regulations would be used to di-
rect emigration to South America,
where it is more under the influence
of the German autlrorities, and, also,
on the ground that the new regale;
tions may be used to hamper emigra-
tion to the United States, where the
emigrants escape official German in-
fluence.
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The Dying Century.

Written specially for the RECORD.

There is no period of the world's

history which has been so prolific of

great events as the century whose dy-

ing moments afford so much food for

reflective minds,and in the retrospect
gives such sublime opportunities for

the acquisition of wisdom. The dis-

coveries of Science, which have elec-

trified the world; the adoption of sys-

tematic means and methods for the
amelioration of distressed and down-

trodden humanity, and the establish-

ment, upon foundations broad and
deep, of the American Republic, are
all evidences of activities which haye

told, and will still more protentially
tell, for the weal of the human race.
The most wonderful developments

which have marked the era have had

their birth in Our own highly favored

land, and it is with pride, and at the
same time with the keenest sense of

grave responsibility, that we realize

this fact. The shaping of the world's

thought,the protnptings of the desire
for a higher civilization,and the ideal

conception of the duties and privi-
leges of citizenship, are all due to

the influences exerted by a govern-

ment, the sun and center of whose

system of political ethics is the indi-

vidual, "of whom, for wit out and by
whom" came its existence.
That this is universally true cannot

for a moment be denied,and however
emphatically the logical deduction
from the facts in the case may be dis-
puted, the glory and the honor will
be accorded America when the Muse
of History shall make up the roll of
the Immortals. The seething mass of
conflicting interests which the politi-
cal situation of Continental Europe
presents at the present time, is a case
in point. For years the hearts of all
Christendom have stood still with
horror, as the Armenian atrocities
have been heralded, • and innocence
outraged and womanhood desecrated
have cried aloud for vengence. And
when a Christian nation, whose ter-
ritory bordering upon the domain of
the barbarous Turk, is forced to as-
BUMP, the defensive and battle against
cruelties which would have disgraced
the Dark Ages, we behold the melan-
choly spectacle of the five Great
Powers for commercial purposes and
territorial aggrandizement, not only
holding themselves aloof from render-
ing all possible assistance and sym-
pathy, but actually handicapping
the Grecian patriots by declaring a
blockade of her ports, a violation of
international law and these led by
Christian 0) England,
What shall be the outcome, Divine

Providence alone knows, but in sub-
ordinating the claims of civilization,
Christianity, and the most sacred
rights of the human race, to the de-
mands of national ambition and a de-
sire to obtain the lion's share of the
spoils, these governments are sowing
the seeds of their own dissolution.
The conflict between Turkey and
Greece may soon be ended, but al-
ready the mutterings of contention
are being heard as to what terms of
pacification shall be agreed upon,and
in this conflict of demand and eager-
ness for spoil, may be seen the possi-
ble ignitor of the war flame which has
so long threatened the Continent
with its dread possibilities., That it
may be fore-fended is the prayer of
every lover of peace, but the self-
seeking and arrogant nobility, whose
deeds haye blackened the pages of
history have been "weighed in the
balances, and found wanting," and
already the "Mene, Mene, Tekel,
Upharsin" of their doom has been
pronounced, and soon the lurid flame
of battle tvill write it upon the door
posts, the lintels, and the walls of
their palaces. The decree has gone
forth that the oppressor shall perish,
and in the unrest and upheaval; of
modern society in every part of the
globe can be seen the presence of an
irrestible influence, looking to the
abolition of all serfdom, and the tri-
umph of the cause of Truth and Jus-
tice.
Far removed from the scenes of

wars and rumors of wars, we as custo-
dians of a princely heritage, may re-
trospect with feelings of gratitude
the mysterious paths by winch we
have been led, and as we look into
the future, reconsecrate ourselves to
the maintenance of the liberty which
is our birthright, and through our
instrumentality it shall yet become
the heritage of the race. We have,
however, crave problems confronting
us, which must be solved not only for
ourselves but the millions of earth,
who are looking to us as their exem-
plar. Under this inspiring influence
Cuba has been enabled to successful-
ly compete with forces so overwhelin-
ingly her superior. A contrast drawn
in an editorial in the New York Sun,
contrasting the two wars-Greece

• and Cuba bearing date, May 11th.,
most forcibly illustrates this point.
The editor says: "We do not lose sight

of the fact that the Cubans have an
inspiration that is of supreme value
to theta. They fight for liberty in a

sense in which the Greeks can hardly

be said to have fought for it, though

we sympathize with them in their

efforts to protect their Cretan fellow-

Christians. The Cubans fight, not

under a King or for a King; they fight

under the free flag of Cuba for a Re-

public of equal rights."

And so as we look out into the

Twentieth Century, and endeavor to

forecast its happenings,we may point

with pride to the fact that the glory

of the Nineteenth is our national ex-

istence,and that the brightest galaxy

that blazes in the political firmament

are the 45 stars'of the first magnitude

which form our glorious Union. May

our standard sheet forever float in the

free air of heaven, a symbol of free-

dom, order, civilization and Christi-

anity. May the light of its stars nev-

er dim, but, as the ages wax and

wane, and new gems are added to its

glittering constellation, as the sun of

liberty in its full orbed splendor ap-

proaches the zenith, may the nations

of earth, a glittering retinue, attend

Columbia in her onward march of

peaceful conquest, not as unwilling

subjects or conquered captures, but

as mutual partakers of a common

prosperity, joy and triumph. As the

arbiter of the differences of the peo-

ples of earth, may her peaceful minis-

trations as a universal missionary

spread the glad tidings of civilization,

liberty and equal rights to the con-

fines of earth, and from the redeemed

millions may ascend an anthem of re-

joicing, and from sea to sea, and

shore to shore, resound the echo, till

not one vestige of human slavery re-

mains, and wan, redeemed from the

thralldom of ignorance and supersti-

tion, shall chant the To Deum which

ushers in the thousand years of

peace.
KIRK.

Ragged Edge Printing.

Probably from the very beginning

of the art of printing, lines have

been spaced out so that both the left

and right edges of a column present

an even appearance. This practice

causes a vast amount of lost time, on

account of selecting just the right

spaces, and very often, the appear-

ance of the line so spaced out is any-

thing but pretty, particularly when

certain long syllabled words prevent

the use of the hyphen, and much

wide spacing must be done, or when

very close spacing is necessary to

crowd in a word.
The reason, of course, why this

spacing-out practice has been so long

and so universally followed, is to pre-

vent the ragged edge on the right-

as in these paragraphs-but, after

all, it is a question whether the artis-

tic eye is offended more by the one

defect than the other. In order to

have even lines, there must be une-

ven spacing; while the other plan al-
lows uniform spacing between words

and crowds all the surplus space to

the end of the line.
Type-written letters present an il-

lustration of the one even and one

ragged edge, as there is no way to

make both even; and there is little
or no objection to writing machines
on this account. Considering the ra-

pidity with which it is usually neces-

sary to set type, and that newspa-

pers are not exactly representatives

of mesthetic in the printing art, it

seems strange that some newspaper

has not broken away from the con-

vet tional-for the novelty of the

thing if for no other reason-and

made an asset of this time lost in

spacing out.
Specimens of forced spacing may

be seen in any paper one chooses to ex-

amine, yet it is highly probable

that the average reader has never giv-

en the subject any thought, be-

yond one charging the compositor

with earelessness;and certainly there

has never been any decided com-

plaint, or recommendation of a
change,from those who daily skip the

irregularities in printed lines. This

pargraph represents tile two ideas;the
first portion showing irregularly

spaced lines, and the latter, irregular
endings, but uniform spacing.
Words of one syllable with from six

to eight letters, like "psalms" and

"draughts," coining at the end of a

line, necessitate very frequently the
wide or close spacing now in use,
while with end spacing the composi-

tor would have no trouble or loss of

time.

"They are dandies" said Thomas
Bowers, of the Crocket, Texas,Enter-
prise, while writing about DeWitt's
Little Early Risers, the famous little
pills for sick headache and disorders
of the stomach and liver. J. McKellip,
Druggist, Taneytown, Md.

Don't neglect a cough because the
weather is pleasant; before the next
storm rolls around it may develop in-
to a serious difficulty beyond repair.
One Minute Cough Cure is easy to
take and will do what its name im-
plies, J. McKellip, Druggist, Taney-
„town, Md.

WESTWARD, HO!
• --

Programme for the Convention to

be held in San Francisco is

Completed.

San Francisco, May 14.-The local
committee having in charge the pre-
liminaries for the sixteenth interna-
tional Christian Endeavor convention
to be held in this city July 7 to 12
next, is leaving no stone unturned to
insure its success.
The convention will onen up on

Wednesday night, July 7, with meet-
ings in eight of the largest churches

in this city, and one meeting each in

Oakland and Alameda.
Thursday morning simultaneous

welcome meetings will be held in

Mechanics' and Woodward's pavil-

lions. In the afternoon twenty or

more churches wilt be used for de-

nominational rallies.
Friday morning practical addresses

and open parliaments upon the fun-

damental principles of Christian En-

deavor will be provided. The after-

noon will be given up to a "school of

methods" in the various churches.

"Christian Endeavor Fellowship"

will be the general subject for Friday

evening.
Saturday morning the State secre-

taries are to be heard from in a sym-

posium on the topic "How may we

make the Committee Work in Local

Societies more Effective ?" There will

be an open-air demonstration on Van

Ness Avenue, after which the dele-

gates are to be given an outing by

the local committee.
Sunday there will be three meet-

ings, one for men only, another for

women only, and one for ministers

and church officers.
Monday will be devoted to the

evangelistic and missionary Influ-

ences of Christian Endeavor. The

Junior rally, one of time most impot t-

ant features of the programme, will

be held in the afternoon and the clos-

ing sessions of the convention will be

held Monday evening.

The Westfield (Ind.) News prints
the following in regard to an old resi-
dent of that place: "Frank MeAvoy,
for many years in the employ of the
L. N. A. & C. Ry, here, says: 'I have
used Chamberlain's Colic, Cholera
and Diarrhoma Remedy for ten years
or longer-am never without it in may
family. I consider it the best remedy
of the kind manufactured. I take
pleasure in recommending it.' " It is
a specific for all bowel disorders. For
sale by R. S. McKinney, Druggist,
Taney town, Md. .•

WAR REMINISCENCES.

Written Specially for the RECORD by
Geo. C. Harman, Serg't C.. D., 4th.

Regq. Md. Vol. loft.

PART IX.
Our march from the Potomac

river was uneventful, save for a little
seirmish at Thoroughfare Gap, be
t wean about five hundred rebels that

we met here, and the Seventh Mary.

land Regiment. I had, while on this
march, frequent conversations with
the Negro slaves we chanced to meet
with, and found them without excep-
tion most anxious for freedom. They
were willing to run any risks almost.

provided they could have any assur-

anle of escaping bondage. They man_
ifested the utmost aversion to slavery,
and declared they would rather be
free, if tney had to toil harder and
live upon the merest pittance in the
north, than to be idle and live in
comfort in the south. We told them
we would gladly furnish them the

means to go north but we could not,

we had not the power: "I knows
(hat, young massa," they would say,

"You's berry good-I is berry thank-
ful-God bless you." Many a time I

have heard, "God bless you," which

by daily use has almost lost its sense,
and from lips that were fresh with
youth and beauty, but time celestial
invocation, I am sure, never came
from more grateful hearts, or fell

from tongues, albeit uneducated ,wore
sincere in its impassioned utterance.

To them, the magic word, "Yankee,"
opened all their hearts, and di•ew

forth the loftiest yirtues. They were
ignorant, oppressed, enslaved, but
they always cherished a simple and
beautiful faith in the cause of the
Union, and believed in its ultimate
triumph.
One evening we bivouacked in a

field, about five miles south of Thor-

oughfare Gap, near a Virginia plan-

tation. Corporal Cook and I conclud-

ed to visit the proprietor of the plan-

tation, and like beasts of prey we
went forth in search of food, for we
were very hungry. We advanced to

the laav house and looked in at the

window, and found that several of
our officers had preceded us there;
we took a survey of the premises,and
then repaired to the quarters of the
slaves, and soon obtained a promise
from one of the "Aunties," that if we
would wait, she would prepare us

food. We gladly accepted the propo-

sition and waited until she had pre-

pared for us a liberal supply of corn

bread and bacon.
During the preparation of the meal

I watched the "Auntie" and noticed

that a small house near by contained

about a dozen delicious looking hams;

after we finished the meal, and bade
the darkies good night, we set forth
for camp through a driving rain; be-

fore doing so, however, we found the

door of the meat house was unlocked,

and I concluded to enter and sample

the hams that I saw within. I did
so, while time corporal stood guard,
and I selected one and passed it to
him, and then returned and borrowed
one for myself, just for luck you

Icnow,and we then hastened to camp.

This was my first essay in that de-

pa.rtinent of fine arts, and I congrat-

ulated myself I had done well, nor

was I without a lingering suspicion

that if my talents in that direction

had been properly developed,I might

have been a rival of Jesse James.

The next morning we breakfasted
on ham,coffee and hard-tack, not for-
getting to share with the colonel and

his staff. The officers with whom mve

shared were anxious to know where

we bought the ha in, but we politely

informed them, that if they would

ask us no questions, we would tell
them no lies, and they accepted the
proposition, and devoured their ham

in silence.
On this day, July 24th., we reached

Rappahannock Station, and about 4
o'clock in the evening we flied into a
field in column of companies and
stacked arms. The next morning at
reveille our officers informed us that
we were likely to remain here for
sometime, and that we should pitch
our tents and make ourselves as com-

fortable as possible. We were glad
that we were permitted once again to
provide comfortable quarters for our-
selves. We at once prepared break-
fast, amid then proceeded with our
labor, and in about three hours all
the tents were in position, including
the officers' quarters. In the after-

noon we converted ourselves into
washer-women, going out on the

bank of the river,lighting a lium.te fire
under a catup kettle, and abluting

our underclothes with more energy

titan skill; and all the afternoon, for
it was very warm,denuding and bath-
ing ourselves in the stream.
The 1st. of August was bright,

balmy, and beautiful, but so very
dull in camp that Corporal James
Garret and myself concluded to make

a short excursion into a swamp that

was situated some distance from

camp. We took our tin cups and

sallied forth, for the purpose of gath-

ering blackberries, that we were told
grew in abundance there. The birds
sang more sweetly than was their
wont to the morning sunbeams, and

the sunbeams bathed their leafy

homes in glory. When we arrived at

the swamp, we found, after a long

and diligent search and no little

bAKINO
POWDER
Absolutely Pure.

Celebrated for its great leavening
strength and healthfulness. Assures the
food against alum and all formsof adul-
teration common to the cheap brands.
ROYAL BAKING POWDER CO., NEW YORK.

T. Orndorff's Sons'
UNDERSELLING STORES.

75 pieces of Carpet to be closed out unreservedly, regardless of cost. The
high quality of the goods and the lowness of the price, make these bargains
worth many miles of travel. Any person econotuically inclined cannot
afford to miss this grand golden opportunity. Jute Carpets, worth 18e, at
die a yard. Jute Carpet, worth 25c. at 20c a yard. Rag Carpet, worth 20c,
at 14c a yard. Rag Carpet, worth 25c, at 20c a yard. Home made Rag Car-
pet 25c a yard. Venitian Ingrain Carpet, worth 25e at, 200 a yard. 35c Ingrain
Carpet, at 25c. 4ime Wool Union Ingrain Carpet, at 30e. 45c Wool Super In-
grain Carpets, at 35c. 50e Wool Extra Super Ingrains, at 40e. 65c and 70c.
Wool Two-ply Ingrains, at 50e.

Special Value in Notions.
Sateen Windsor Ties, worth Sc., at 3c; Silk Windsor Ties, worth 15e. at Sc;

Silk Windsor Ties. worth 25c, at 15e; Buttermilk Soap, 3 cakes in box,for 10c:
Men's Fast Black Hose, 5c a pair: Ladies' Fast Black Seamless Hose, worth
15c, at 10e; Children's Ribbed Vests, at 3e, Ladies' Vests, reduced from 25e to
10c; Laundried Shirt Waists, worth 40e,at 29c; Laundried Shirt Waists,worth
50c, at 39c; Laundried Shirt Waists, worth 75c, at 50c;

wading, a spot of dry earth large

enough for two to recline upon. A

few sickly berries we found liere,that

looked up to us timidly, as if they

were trying to apologize, but could

find no excuse for growing in such a

miserable place.
We plucked them from their steins,

for we thought it would be happiness

for them to die somewhere else; not a

minute had we lain there before the

gnats and mosquitos attacked us in

force, and before we could effect our

escape, we looked as if we had just

recovered from an attack of the small.

pox. I looked into my pocket mirror,

a thing I rarely do, for I bate repul

sive objects,aud thought I discovered

a striking resembh mice between my_

self and the Egyptian Sphynx. How-

ever shocking,I looked no wcrse th mi

I felt. We rushed on through mars t

and morasses, breathing gnats and

mosquitoes as if they had all our lives

been our natural atmosphere. We
leaped ourselves out of our blouses

and tied them over our faces, and hi

his bewilderment,, I found Corporal

Garrett eedeavoring to put on a large

willow tree, and I was trying to bury

my head in a mud bank. While we

were struggling along like men under

the influence of a pint of commissary,
we saw a large copperhead snake
ready to spring; we attacked the ser-

pent with our brogans, kicking right

and left, not caring whether she

struck us or whether we struck her,

When we saw time snake was dead,we

congratulated ourselves and thought
we had killed her, but I know now,

the gnats and mosquitos swarmed

down her throat and strangled her.

Snakes had no terror for us then-we
were desperate.
At that moment I believe I would

have walked up and through all the

artillery in the Rebel army, or even

up to the matrimonial altar, without

shrinking. We regarded copperheads

as symbols of Secessia, and we knew

that gnats and mosquitos were of the

rebel tribe, I wished then that I had
all the gnats and mosquitos in a sack
and hung by one silken strand over
the abyss of Topliet, and I stood near
with a glistening cheese knife,or that
I was Confederate scrip-then no one
mould touch me, not even a gnat or

mosquito.
Talk of "straining at a gnat," who

"would not strain at them in our case.
Rather than not do so I would take a

contract to swahow all the camels

that ever crossed the Arabian Desert.

I marvel much whether Job would
not have blasphemed had he ever

been besieged by gnats and mosquitos
such as are found In Virginia swamps;

to be afflicted with boils is bad
enough, but to be besieged by gnats
and mosquitos is absolutely beyond
endurance, and the man of T.% would
not have born it unfeelingly. Per-
haps my readers will think that I am
representing this beyond the truth,.
but all old soldiers who served with
the Army of the Potomac, will bear
the out as to the truth of the above
assertion.

Everybody Says So.
Cascarets Candy Cathartic, the most won-

derful medical discovery of the age. peas-
ant and refreshing to the taste, act gently
and positively on kidneys, liver and bowels,
cleansing the entire system, dispel colds,
cure headache, fever, habitual constipation
and bidousuess. Please buy and try a box
of C. C. C. to-day; 10, 25, 50 cents. Sold and
guarat.teed to cure by all druggists.

Notice to Creditors.
This is to give notice that the sub-

scribers have obtained from the
Orphan's Court of Carroll county, in
Maryland, letters testamentary on
the Estate of

ELIZABETH MUTTER,

late of Carroll county, deceased. All
persons having claims against the
deceased are warned to exhibit the
same, with the vouchers thereof
legally authenticated, to the sub-
scribers on or before the 1st. day of
November, 1897; they may otherwise
by law be excluded from all benefit of
said estate.
Given under our hands this 1st.

day of May, 1897.

JAMES A. SHEELEY,
EZEKIAH HAHN,

May1-4t Executors.

A GREAT REDUCTION.
Cheapness seems to be the motto to

success nowadays, so in ordei to be
successful we have made a great re-
duction on all our Harness, and will
prove the truth of this statement if
you wi:l come and examine our stock
before pnrchasing.

DON'T FORGET
us when you want your Harness Oil.

S. C. REAVER,
SADDLE AND HARNESS MAKER.

Near Railroad. Tanevtown, Md.

FOR SALE!
At a Bargain!

Threshing Rig, almost new,
in thorough repair. 12-horse

Peerless Engine and Thresher
complete. Call on

E. 0. GRIMES,
or J. Q. ST1TELY,

3- Westminster, Md

To Cure Constipation Forever,
Take Cascarets Candy Cathartic. 10c or 250.

It C. C. C. fail to cure, druggists refund money

-44- SI-10S..
We have about 1000 pairs of our immense shoe deal left. The tremendous

and prompt response our shoe advertisement met with, proves that the peo-
ple know that we advertise only the truth-that we advertise just what we
have, and always have just what we advertise.

Lot No. 1.•

39 Child's Tan Sandals, sizes
1-•• to 8 worth 75e; at 39c.

Lot No. 2.
Ladies' fur Top House Slip-

pers, sizes 4 to 8, worth The;

50r. at 50c.Children's Tan Sandals, sizes
10+ to 2, worth 75c; at 50c,

Lot No. 3.
Kangaroo, Spring Heel,lace

sizes 6 to 8; Kangaroo, spring-
heel, button,sizes 0 to 8; Goat-

60c. skin,spring heel, button,sizes
6 to 8, worth $1.00; at 60e.

Lot No. 4.
Misses' Dongola Sandals,

6-ce. sizes 12 to 2. Little Man's
*"'''" buff, spring beel,button,sizes

11 to 2 worth $1.00; at 65e.

Lot No. 5.
Old Ladies' Comfort, Con-

gress Shoes, sizes 4 to 8.
Misses' Kangaroo Lace, sizes

75,.; 12 to 2; Misses Goatskin, but-
' ton, sizes 12 to 2; Misses' Kan-

garoo button, sizes 12 to 2.
Boys' Kangaroo lace, sizes

13 to 2. Worth $1.23; at 75c.

Lot No. 6.
Ladies' Kangaroo Shoes, 3

styles of Toes in button, sizes
85c. 4 to 8. Ladies' Kangaroo

Shoes, in lace, sizes 3 to 8.
Worth $1.25: at 85c.

Lot No. 7.
Ladies' Dongola Patent

Tip, button, sizes 3 to 8.
Misses' Kangaroo, spring-
heel, button and lace, sizes

$1.00 11 t° 2'Misses' Dongola, spring-
heel, button,tip of same,sizes
13 to 2.
Ladies' Dongola, counuon

sense Oxfords, sizes 3 to 8.
Worth $1.50; at $1.00.

Lot No. 8.
Ladies' Dongola, spring-
heel,patent tip, sizes 2+ to 5.

$1.50 Ladies' Calfskin, button
and lace, sizes 2+ to 7.

Worth $2.00; at $1.50.

Lot No. 9.
Ladies' Vici kidShoe.shand
made, patent tip and tip of
same. Coin, Egg, Nicholas

SI 98and 
Pointed Toes, lace and

' button. Coummon Sense.
C, D and E lasts.
Worth $3.50 and $4.00; at
$1.98.

UNCURSSIPIED I
An unexceptionally cheap lot of Mattings. new Spring Dress Goods, Per-

cales, Dimities. Lappettes and Organdies; Silks that have no equal for price

and quality. New line of Men's Shirts, Straw Hats and Spring Ties. The

largest and most complete line of Men's, Boys' and Children's Ready-made

Clothing, at the Lowest Prices. You buy more and betfesgoods here for

time same money, than anywhere else under the sun. We are still giving
coupons.

J. T. ORNDORFF'S SONS,

Mar27-7

20 and 22 West Main Street,

WESTMINSTER, MD.

How's This?
We offer One Hundred Dollars Reward for

any case of Catarrh that cannot be cured by
Hall's Catarrh Cure.

F. J. CHENEY St CO., Props., Toledo, O.
We, the undersigned, have known F. J. Che-

ney for the last li years, and believe him per-
fectly honorable In all business transactions,
and financially able to carry out any obligation
made by their firm.
WEST & TRUA E. Wholesale DruggistaToledo,O.
WALDINIJ, KINNAN & MA YIN, Wholesale
Druggists, Toledo, O.
Hall's Catarrh Cure is taken internally.acting

directly upon the blood and mucous sum faces
of the system. Price 71:c. per bottle. Testimo-
nials free. Sold by all Druggists.
Hall's family Pills are the best..

You will Find
IT HERE!

Do you need anything in BLACK
or FANCY

DRESS GOODS?
We have a nice line at Lowest prices.
Do you need a

WASH DRESS
of any kind ? Here is the place to
get it. We have a fine line oh' WASH
GOODS of almost every kind cheap.
This is the place to get your RIB-

BONS and LACES-we have some
beauties.
We have also a PULL STOCK of

CARPETS AND MATTINGS
way down in price. Table Linen,
Toweling and Towels to please you
all in quality and price. A nice grade
of

BROWN SUGAR
for 3-ic per pound, a Bargain Coffee
as low as can be had anywhere; beau-
tiful Prunes for only 5e; best prunes
4 pounds for 25c. This is Headquar-
ters for the Best Groceries of every
kind. Don't forget to- call for
SYRUP. If yog get it once, you will
come again.
We have a large and nice line of

SHOES AND SUPPERS
to fit amid please every one. If you
need DISHES of any description you
can get them here very cheap. the
nicest assortment of LAMPS you
have ever seen, for the price we ask
for them, arid everything else usually
kept in a country store you will find,
at prices to suit you all, at

Reindollar, Hess & Co's.
TANEY TOWN, MD.

The Atlas Watch

11. E. Slagenhaup,

Jeweler, '
Tnneytown. Md.

Ladies' size, in Gold-filled
Case, with Chain, com-
plete, only - - $10.00

Boys' size, in handsome Sil-
verine Hunting Case,

Only - - $5.00
H. E. SLAGENHAUP, Carroll Record.
Taneytown, Md, JEWELER

Model Bakery
Opposite Meat Market,

Koontz & Long, Prop's.
We are ready at all times to serve

our customers with

BREAD, CAKES, ROLLS,
Contectioniries and Groceries

YOUNT'S

such as Teas at 15e., 40c and 50c a
pound; Coffees from 11c up to 25c a
pound; Molasses 20c to 40e a gallon;
Dried Fruits, Oranges, Lemons, Salt,
Rice, Coal Oil, Tobacco, Cigars and
Cigarettes. We also have a tine vari-
ety of Canned Goods, such as Corn,
Peas, Beans, Tomatoes, Peaches, and
very fine Canned Oysters, Sardines,
and Salmon. We also handle a great
many BRANDS OF FLOUR, as Rob-
erts', Weist's, Baselioar's,Stonesifer's,
Myers', Small's, and excellent brands
of Spring Wheat Flour. as Ditunond
Medal, Rex and Pillsbury; also Corn
Meal by the sack or pound. We are
prepared to serve our customers with
ICE CREAM-the best that can be
made-in any quantity, at short no-
tice. Friends, come and see us, and
we will convince you that our prices
are lower than elsewhere,

Bargain Bulletin!

Child's Button Shoes,
Sizes 8 to 12; Chocolate Colored
Beauties; price 990; regular $1 25

Mrs Potts' Sad Irons.
Three in Set; Iron Stand and
Handle. 59c for set; regular.
$1.00 per set.

Clothes Wringers,
Wood Frame. Special price
$1:15; worth double.

White Counterpane,
Full size, good weight, and nice

patterns; hemmed ready for

use. Special price 59e; worth

85c.

Ladies' Stockings,
Plain Black, all sizes. Special

price 10c; regular price 15c.

Wash Basin,
Granite Iron; 15c, worth 25c.

Pudding Pan,
Granite Iron; 12c, worth 20c.

Preserving Kettle,
Retinned; usually sold at 25c.

This month, 13e each.

Table Oilcloth,
12c per yard.

Yeolio, Balto., Co., Md., April 6, 1897.
•MR. GARNER; SIR:

I received my Separator all right;
enclosed find check for same. I am
very much pleased with the Empire;
I got a neighbor who has one,to'show
me how to set it up, and start it. I
wish I had it long ago; I don't think
they need be sent out on trial,as they
are a perfect wonder of this 19th. cen-
tury. I don't see how they could be
beat for clean skimming, easy run
ping, and simplicity as to their con-
struction.

GRAFTON S. BROOKS.

D. W. GARNeR,
General Agent,

TANEYTOWN, MD.

THE TANEYTOWN

SAVINGS BANK
1.)oes a General Banking Business.

Loans Money on Real or Personal

Security. Discounts Notes. Collec-
tions and remittances promptly
made.

INTEREST PAID 01 TINE DEPOSITS
HENRY GALT, Treas.

W. W. CRAPSTER Pres.

DI REC TORN . +--
SAMUEL STONER. W. JESSE ROBERTS
JOSHUA KOUTZ, H, D. MEH RING.
JAMES C. GALT. JOHN J. CRAPSTER.
T. H. ECKENRODE, cALVINT. FRINGES
W. W. CltAPSTER, HENRY GALT,

28-7-94-1

SUBSCRIBE
-FOR ran-

BICYCLE BARGAINS,
Ladies' New Crescent Bi-

cycle, 1896 pattern,$35.00.
Second-hand "Crescents"

for Ladies, at $19.00, and

$22.50.

F. M. YOUNT,
Taneytown, Md.

At This Season,

N. B. HAGAN
Near the Square, sells Choice

Confectioneries, Groceries, Notions.
AND FRUITS

A Full Line of Ladies' Shirt Waists.
Don't forget y•ou get a beautiful piece
of Glassware with one pound of Java
Blend Coffee. Nice Primes only 5cts.
a pound. A nice breakfast dish is
Wheatlet, Quaker Rolled Oats or
Cook's Flaked Rice-I have them.
All the leading brands of Flour; in-
cluding Ivory White; Corn Meal, and
Chicken Feed; Sugar Syrups, 20, 25
and 30 cm. a gallon. Best Water
White Oil only 12e. a gallon.

ICE CREAM
made to order, in any flavor and
quantity. Canned Oysters, Lobsters,
Sardines, &c. Bread, Rolls, Cakes,
Crackers and Pretzels; one pound of
Cash Down Baking Powder only 10c.
Green Imperial Tea, only 25c. pound;
Nice Baking Chocolate 25c a pound.

when every one is afflicted with lin-
gering Spring Colds and Grippe, and
all run down, there is no more effect-
ive tonic than

Cod Liver Oil,
with Hypophosphites, in their vari-
ous solutions. We have in stock a
line of the best of these preparations
in the market; also the utmost popular
Spring Blood Purifiers. We solicit
your trade.
QM- Physicians erescriptions care-

fully compounded.

ROBERT S. McKINNEY,
Drugs, Medicines, Toilet Articles, &e.

TANEYTOWN, MD.

Pine Hill Roller Mills I

Having remodeled my mill with
the Gyrating system of bolting flour,
I desire to infortu the public that I
am now ready to serve them with
flour, and guarantee satisfaction, and
will give any person the flour from
his own wheat at exchanging rates,
provided it is not less than 20 bushels.
I will also sell Chop at $14.011 per ton,
which I am ;prepared to sell at all
times. 'rlianking you for past pat-
ronage, and soliciting a continuance
of the same, I remain,

Yours Respectfully,

ANDREW STONESIFER,
Jun-1-7 Harney, Md.

IMPORTANT NOTICE

I hereby announce that I have
permanently located in Taneytown
for the manufacture of

CARRIAGES BUGGIES,

Daytons, Phaetons,
and everything in this line. Factory
work will also be kept on hand, and
It shal be my aim to supply the de
mandfor all classes of work.

All Work Guaranteed.
Special attention given to Repair

ing.
Give me a trial and I will convince

you that my Prices and Work will
be found satisfactory.

James H. Reindollar,
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Shop back of Lutheran church.
5-1-95-1v

Notice to Creditors.

-- -
Having retired from the butchering

business, I hereby request all persons

indebted to mime to settle their ac-

counts at once, as I desire to close

my books without placing them in

the hands of an officer for collection.

Please respond to this notice,

Edward Kemper:
TAN EY TOWN, MD.

G. W. DEMMITT.
- DENTIST. -

Taneytown, - - - - Maryland
All persons in need of dental work should

give me a call as I will save them money. Tteth
extracted with little or no pain. The very

best sets of teeth only $10., aud guaranteed for

five years, Temporary sets at low prices. Fill-

ing and all kinds of dental work at bottom

prices, and all work guaranteed. I will visit

person within 12 miles without extra chaXII •

Will be at Myer's store, Pleasant Valley, on
the second Thursday of each month. Give

a trial.
Yours Respectfully,

9-15-ly G. W DEMMITT, Dentist.

This is to give notice that time sub-
scriber has obtained from the
Orphan's Court of Carroll county, in
Maryland, letters testamentary on
the Estate of •

LEAH FEESER,

late of Carroll county, deceased. All
persons having claims against the
deceased are warned to exhibit the
same. with the vouchers thereof
legally authenticated, to the sub-
scriber on or before the 8th. day of
November, 1897; they may otherwise
by law be excluded from all benefit of
said estate.
Given under may hand this 8th. day

of May, 1:397.
PETER M. WE1ST,

May-8 4t Executor,

E. E. REINDOLLAR.

VINDOLLAR
DEALERS IN

Grain, Lumber, Coal,
Hay, Straw, Salt, Feea, Cement,
- AND -

FERTILIZERS.
TANEYTOWN. MD.

BUFFINGTON HOUSE,
NEAR SQUARE,

TANEYTOWN, MD.

JAS. BUFFINGTON, Prop'r.

First-class in Every Respect

Time Popular House for Commercial
Travelers.

Rates Moderate!
UrveLiry in connection with House

I 1.1-4‘'

BALTIMORE AMERICAN,
ESTABLISHED 1773.

ThE DAILY AMERICAN.
Terms by Mail, Postage Prepaid.

One Mouth  .... .. $ AO
Daily and Sunday, One Month $ .66
Three Months  1.50
Daily and Sunday, Three Mouths  1.90
Six 51-mi ha '13.al
Daily and Sunday, six months  . 43.75
One Year $6.00
With Sunday PAU n, One Year 

171)06Sun ay Edition, One Year. ..... ..   1

THE TWICE-A-WEEK AMERICIII.

The Cheapest and Best Family
Newspaper Published,

ONLY ONE DOLLAR AYEAR
Six Months, 50 cts.

Ten Twice-a-Week AMERICAN 18 published in
two issues, Tuesday and Friday mornings.with
the news of the week in compete shine. It also
contains interesting special corres ondence, en-
tertaining romances, good poetry and local
matter as general interest and fresh miscel-
lany suitatile for the home circle A carefully
edited Agricultural Departmeuto, id full and
reliable Fiumecial and Market eports, are
special features.

TERMS AND PREMIUMS:
liana wice-a-weea American. sung e env I

year 
5 copies, one_ year, and extra copy of the

Twiee-a-week, one year, or daily le
mouths. tree..  $5.00

10 copies, one year. with an extra copy of
the Twice-a-Week one year and Daily 3
months rree   10.0

20 copies, one year, with an extra copy of
Ilivice-a-Week one year and Daily 9
months. tree  20.00

30 copies, one year. with an extra copy of
the Twice-a- Week and one copy of
Daily one year. tree 30.00

The premium copies will be sent to any ad-
dress desireo.
Specimen copies sent to any addreas. It is

not necessary for all the names in a club to
come from one office, nor is It necessary to
send all the names at one time. Send on the
names as fast as received.

Remittances should be made by check,
postal money-order or registered letter, as it
is unsafe to send money in ordinary letters,and
the publisher cannot be responsible for losses
occasioned there by.
Entered at the postoffice at Baltimore, Md.

as second-class matter, April 13, 1894.

SPECIAL CLUB RATES.
The Twice a-Week AmerIcan.wIth any of the

following named journals, will be sent one
year, to separate addresses, it desired, at the
prices given in the first column of figure,:

NAMES OF JOURNALS.

American Agriculturist....
American Magazine 
Atlantic Monthly 
American Farmer 
Century Magazine 
Christian Union 
Demorest's Monthly
Leslie's Illustrated Newsp'r.
" Popular Monthl 
" I'le,asant Hours......
" Budget of Wit,........

Godey's Lady's Book
Haryer's Weekly 

Magazine 
" Bazar..... ..... .

Household 
Lippencott's Magazine 
Rural New Yorker 
Scribner's Magazine 
Scientific American 
St. Nicholas 
Turf,Field and Farm 

Club
Price,

$2•25
3.51)
4.50
1.75
4.75
3.75
2.75
4.50
3.75
2.30
3.00
2.75
4.50
4.50
4.60
1.85
3.35
2.80
8.76
3.75
8.75
5.00

Regular
Price.:

$S•50
8.75
5.00
2.00

54..28
3.00
5.15)
4.00
2.75
3.25
3.00

1.18
5.00
2.60
400
840
4
441

8.00

CHAS. C. FULTON & Co.
Felix Agnus Mgr. and Publisher.
11.merlean Office BALTIMORILM

JAS. W. TROXELL,
_SURVEYOR.

Surveys and Calculations carefully
made.

PLATS NEATLY EXECUTED.
38 years practical experience.

Address, EMMITSBURG, MD

(ri

)1.
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COUNTYCOUNTY DIRECTORY.
Court Officers.

[Jury terms held in Westminster, 2nd Mon-
day in May and November; non-jury, 2nd.
Monday in February and August.'

JUDGES-Hon. Chas. B. Roberts, Chief and
Resident Judge. Hon. James Revelle and Hon.
Isaac T. Jones Associate Judges.

CLERK OF THE Com-a-Benjamin F. Crouse.

CRIER-Gershum Huff.

AUDITOR-J. J. Baumgartner.

[Orphans' Court meets in the Court House in
Westminster, every Monday and Tuesday, and
deity during jury terms of Court.

REGISTER OF WILLS-George M. Parke.

ORPHANS' COURT-Jacob Rinehart, William
Y. Frizell. Albert Schaeffer.

County Officers.

111- 
STATES ATTORNEY-J. Milton Relfsnider.
SautuFF-J. Oliver Murray.

COUNTY COMMISSIONERS-John H. Stem, Da-
vid Stoner, Jesse Lemon.

COUNTY 'Must:ulna-Alfred T. flue kingham

Sunvitv00.-William A. Roop.

SUPERVISORS OF ELECTION.- Howard F.
Schaeffer. CharLs H. Sapp, Charles V. Wentz

Legislature.
SENATOR.-Dr. J. W. Hering.

HOUSE OF DELEGATS.-Charles H. Smith,
Charles J. H. Ganter, Dr. Clotworthy Birme,
William F. Cover.

TANEYTOWN DIST
Nozoftv PUBLIC-Dr. F. H. MS&
TA x COLLECTOR,-W. W. Crapster.
MAGISTRATES.-A. F. Orndorff, Henry Wilt,

John T. Fogle.
CONSTABLE, B. S. Mider.
REGISTRARS. - Thomas D. Thomson, J. V.

Rekent ode.

Town Officers.

BURGESS.-H. D. Meliring.
COMMISSIONERS.-Dr G. T. Motter, Edward

Kemper, W. Jesse Roberts, Joshua Koutz, E.
K. Heaver.
BAILIFF and Tex COLLECTOR,-B. S. Miller

Churoh ,Notices.

Presbyterian Church. -Regular church ser-
vices held alternately, morning and afternoon,
In the Taneytown and Pluey Creek Churches.

Rev. James Cattanach. Pastor.

Trinity Lutheran Church.-Regular Ser-
vices every Sunday at 10 a. m. and 7 p.
Sunday School at 9 a. m. Christian Endeavor
atfi p. in. Prayer Meeting every Wednesday
evening at 7 o'clock,

Rev. D. Frank Garland, Pastor.

grace Reformed Church.-Services every
Sunday at 10 o'clock. a. m., and 7.30 p. m. Sun-
day School 9 a. m., Y. P. S C. E. 0.30 p. m.

Rev. A. Bateman. Pastor.

St. Joseph's Catholic Church.Mass 9.30 a. in.
Vespers. 3.30 p. in., catechism, 3 p. in. every
Sunday. On the first Sunday of each month,

111 nenediction after mass, concluding the ser-
vices of the day. Rev. T. D. Mead, Pastor.

United Brethren Church.-Services as fol-
lows; Preaching morning and afternoon alter-
nately at 10.1.10 a. m., and 2.30 p. in.; Sunnay
ecnool at 1.30 p. m.; Prayer Meeting, Wednes-
day evening, at 7.30.
Preaching at Harney morning and evening

alternately. Rev. 3.0. ClIppinger. Past,.,,.

Yost Office.
T. H. ECKENRODE, Postmaster.

Mails arrive from Linwood at 9 a, in.
from R. R. 9.55 a.m. and 5.10 p. tn.; from Har-
ney 2. 30 p. m,
Mails close at office, for R. R. north, 9.46 a.
for Linwood 10.10 a. m.:fot Harney 11.00 a.

m.; tor It. it. south, 6 p. in.
Star Route to York Road, carrying mail for

Baltimore and other points, c oses daily at 4311
a. in. Returning, the carrier arrives at Tenet-
town at 7.30 a. in., with mail from Baltimore.
Westminster and other points.

Societies.
a Patriotic Order Sons of America. Camp 2, Md.

eets In Eckenrode's Hall, Thursday Even-
ings, at 7 o'clock. George E. Koutz, Presi-

-dent. L. 0. Reid, Rec. See`y.

Carroll Conclave HeptiLsophs, meets on the
Second and Fourth Monday evenings of every
month. W. E. Burke, Secretary.

Knights of Pythias,Taneytown Lodge No. au,
meets every Friday night. Levi D. Reid, C. C.;
John J. Reid, K. of R. and S.

THE TIRE QUESTION.

Road Students Are Unanimous For the
Broad Bearing Surface.

In an article in the Indianapolis
Journal on "Broad Versus Narrow
Tires" a writer argues strongly for the
former. He says in part:
"Without one single dissenting voice

the students of road economics say that
the greatest road destroyer is the nar-
row tired wagon. It cuts like a knife,
and, no matter how carefully the surface
is graded and leveled, a rut is bound to
follow its use. It finds every soft spot
and cuts until a fine reservoir is formed
to hold the rains. Onothe contrary, the
wide tire not only keeps gravel but also
dirt roads smooth and in good condition.
The amount of bearing surface presented
to the road prevents any material cut-
ting, but, on the contrary, acts as a rol-
ler, smoothing out rough spots and solid.
ifying the smooth ones.
"When the frost is coming out of the

ground in the spring, the narrow tire
gets in its work of cutting the surface
and forming ruts to start the season
with, while the wide tire is in itself a
roadmaker, smoothing and. packing the
upheaved surface. The wide tire is also
easier on the team. A much heavier
load may be hauled with the same power
on wide than on narrow tires over any
road in the state outside the larger
cities. The same is true on the farm in
the fields "

Beautiful eyes grow dull and dim
As the swift years steal away.

Beautiful, willowy forms so slim
Lose fairness with every day.

But she still is queen and bath charms ta
spare

Who wears youth's corenal - beautiful
hair.

Preserve Your flair
and you preserve your youth.
"A woman is as old as she
Looks," says the world. No
woman looks as old as she is
If her hair has preserved its
normal beauty. You can keep
hair from falling out, restoring
Its normal color, or restore the
normal color to gray or faded
hair, by the use of

Ayer' S Hair Vigor.

Home ad Fain,
Original articles solicited tor triis department

on any subject relative to home comforts,
whether of a social, decorative, aulinary or
general character. Also articles pertaining to
Agriculture, Stock-raising, the Dairy, and
other kindred topics. Contributions must be
received not later than Monday evening to be
guaranteed insertion the same week.
The Editor is not responsible for the opinions

expressed by contributors, nor does the publi-
cation of them make him their endorser. The
public is entitled to the free use of this depart-
ment, as long as a is not used as a medium for
the ventilation at personalities, or for the pub.
lication of articles of no general interest or
benefit. All communications must be signed
by the writer, or authorship acknowledged in
a separate note.

Washing Colored Clothes.

There was never a time when
chintz, gingliams,sateens and calicoes
could be had in such pretty shades
and artistic designs as at present.
There is something neat and attrac-
tive about a clean, cotton gown, no
matter how plainly it is made, if it is
nicely laundered, and they are so
cheap that any woman may have a
number of them. Children's dresses,
aprons, and other articles that must
be consigned to the washtub afar
wearing a day or two, must be care-
fully handled if you wish them to
look fresh and unfaded.
Colored clothes should never be

soaked before washing. Hare plenty
of clean, soft water, which should be
warm but not too hot, and use just
enough good soap to get them clean.
Strong soap and washing powders are
destructive to delicate colors. When
they are clean, rinse in clear water.
Prepare your starch by stirring half
a cupful of lump starch into a cup of
cold water until smooth, then pour
boiling water over it until it is the
proper consistency. Many house-
keepers prefer flour starch, and, if it
is properly made, and a little coal oil
poured in just before it is taken from
the fire, it is very good for colored
clothes, keeping them stiff longer
than the other. Add a little bluing.
and dip each piece in it, seeing that
all parts that need stiffening are
thoroughly saturated. 14Ile cold
starch for collars and caffs of shirt
waists, and other articles that need
to be very stiff, is used later. Hang
them where they will dry quickly, in
fact every part of the process should
be accomplished as quickly as possi-
ble, for letting the garalents lie damp
for several hours is apt to make the
colors run. Bring them in as soon as
they are dry, or the wind will soon
whip the starch out.
To make a quart of cold starch for

the collars and cuffs, dissolve enough
white soap in a quart of water to
make it a little soapy, and mix a
heaping teaspoonful of starch with
the water. Wring the articles out of
this, and when you have smoothed
out the wrinkles, lay them on a sheet
and roll up firmly for an hour before
ironing. The amount of starch need-
ed, varies a little; the kind of goods
you wish to starch, and a little ex
perience is necessary to get it just
right.

One Way to be Happy
Is at all times to attend to the com-

forts of your family. Should any one
of them catch a slight Cold or Cough,
prepare yourself and call at once on
R. S. McKinney,sole agent, and get a
trial bottle of Otto's Cure, the great
German Remedy, free. We give it
away to prove that we have a sure
Cure for Coughs, Colds, Asthma, Con-
sumption, and all diseases of the
Throat and Lungs. Large sizes 50c
and 25c.

Good Rome Recipes.

Tomato Soup.-Good canned to-
matoes may be bought for ten cents,
and one can will be enough for the
soup and the macaroni. For the soup
take the liquid from a can of toma-
toes, and add enough water to make
it it quart. Put it to boil,after adding
one root of celery, one bay leaf, one
slice of onion, a blade of mace and a
sprig of. parsley. Boil fifteen min-
utes. Moisten one tablespoonful of
arrow root and stir it in; season with
a little pepper and salt; strain through
a fine sieve, then add one tablespoon
ful of butter,
Macaroni.- Put to boil in salted

water a quarter of a pound of maca-
roni. Boil rapidly for 20tni n utes, then
strain. Put into a baking dish,cover
with milk. Stew the tomatoes from
the can purchased and mash through
a colander, and one tablespoonful of
butter, half a teaspoonful of onion
juice and a teaspoonful of flour
creamed together. Stir until slightly
thickened and smooth, then pour
over the macaroni and bake 20 min-
utes.
Gypsy Pudding.-Cut stale sponge

cake into slices, spread with jelly or
preserves, and place two pieces to-
gether as sandwiches until all are
used. Place in a deep glass dish.
Make a custard by boiling one pint of
milk, pour it over the yolks of 3 beat-
en eggs, sweeten and flavor and pour
while hot over the cake; then stand
away until perfectly cold before eat-
ing. The whites of the eggs may be
used for angel cake or lady cake.

Going visiting with the Baby.

Unless the conditions at the place
to be visited are well understood, it
Is often a hazardous undertaking to
go on a visit with a child.
If one is not on sufficiently good

terms with the people who are visit-
ed, so that the necessary hints and
suggestions as to the care and diet of
baby will be received, the proceeding
is extremely dangerous.

Difficulties arise, not only from the
change in surroundings, etc., but in
the fact that in many households no
suitable diet is placed on the table
for a child, and, in fact, none is to be
had in the house. If the child de
pends upon milk, it is often impossi-
ble to procure that which is fresh or
good.
An ordinary lunch of cold meat,

bread and butter, pickles, preserves,
and old, stale milk, is very far from
being adapted to the child of one and
one-half or two years.
This is the kind of food which a

mother recently found spread for her-
self and child on a visit to a -friend,
and as a natural result the baby had
colic.
At break fast the following morning

there were pancakes, followed by
sausages, fried potatoes, hot rolls and

coffee; not much of this was suited to
a child of two years.
Simple things, like warm, fresh

milk with good bread and a little
plain sauce, should be provided for
the small people when they go on a
visit.
Toasted bread and simple cereals,

with hot or sterilized milk, will make
the child thrifty, happy, and content-
ed, avoid the danger of colic, and
make the visit a pleasure to all con-
cerned. -Health?' Home.

The Best Remedy for Rheumatism.

From the Fairhaven (N. Y.) Register,
Mr. James Rowland of this village.

states that for twenty-five years his
wife has been a sufferer from rheu-
matism. A few nights ago she was
in such pain that she was nearly
crazy. She sent Mr. Rowland for the
doctor, but he had read of Chamber-
lain's Pain Balm and instead of going
for the physician he went to the store
and secured a bottle of it. His wife
did not approve of Mr. Rowland's
purchase at first, but nevertheless
applied the Balm thoroughly and in
an 'loges time was able to go to
sleep. She now applies it whenever
she feels an ache or a pain and finds
that it always gives relief. He says
that no medicine which she had used
ever did her as much' good. The 25
and 50 cent sizes for sale by R. S. Mc-
Kinney, Druggist, Taneytown, Md.

Things we ought to Know.

That by rubbing your tortoise
shell combs, whenever they are used,
with chamois, the will retain their
pristine freshness.
That care.ffes and fruit jars may be

kept bright by the use of it handful
of line ashes mixed with water.
That blankets should be washed in

moderately warm water in which a
teaspoonful of ammonia has been put
to each gallon of water.
The pianos should be tuned twice a

year, once when the furnace tire 4s
started, and again when it is discon-
tinued.
That oilcloth should be washed,

first with skim milk, if its brightness
and color are to be retained.
That linen may be made beautiful-

ly white by the use of a little refined
borax in the water, instead of using a
washing powder.
That hair brushes should be clean

e(I by rubbing with dry Indian meal
until the dust and grease are extract-

That stains may be removed from
the hands, by rubbing the spots with
a slice of tomato.
That pumice stone is also a great

help in removing spots and stains
from the hands.
That clothespins are made much

more durable by boiling for ten min-
utes before they are used.
That you can clear the closets of

ants. by dampening a sponge and
sprinkling it with sugar. When the
sponge is full of ants soak and repeat
the process.-Exchange.

Sick headache can be quickly and
completely overcome by using those
famous little pills kDOWII as DeWitt's
Little Early Risers. J. McKellip,
Druggist, Taneytown, Md.

Not only piles of the very worst
kind can be cured by DeWitt's Witch
Hazel Sal ve,but eczema,scalds,burns,
bruises, boils, ulcers and all other
skin troubles can be instantly reliev-
ed by the same remedy. J. McKellip,
Druggist, Taneytown, Md.

The Teeth.

Upon the condition of the teeth de-
pends largely the bodily health. The
care of the child's first teeth) is yery
important. The future of the second
set depends upon the care of the first.
Nature uses the first set as a base to
supply nutriment to the second. No
child under eight should lose a tooth.
Decayed teeth in the mouth of a child
produce digestive troubles, and pro-
duce an acid which destroys the sec-
ond teeth.
Liquid food should not be given a

child after the teeth are large enough
for use. Too often soaked biscuits,
crackers and the like are used in-
stead of food which requires chewing.
In order to preserve the teeth we
must use them.. The use of more
coarse breads would be beneficial.
Beware of charcoal and pumice stone.
The following formula, used by most
dentists, is harmless: One ounce orris
root, three ounces precipitate of
chalk, one teaspoonful powered cas-
tile soap and one tablespoonful bi-
carbonate of soda.
A pleasant mouth wash is one-lialf

teaspoonful listerine in one half a
glass of water.
A little bicarbonate of soda placed

upon a tender tooth will often bring
comfort, or for persistently tender
teeth a mouth wash of milk of mag-
!male and water in equal quantities.
-New Orleans Picayune.

An unextinguishable Light.

The remarkable light which has
been brought forward in Germany,
and known as the Durr light, is de-
clared to be equally capable of use
for interior illumination. It is origi-
nated by automatic evaporation and
overheating of the vapors from ordi-
nary lamp petroleuin; the vapors be-
ing converted into gas, when burned,
yield a light of from 3,500 to 14,000
candle power.
The apparatus consists of a tank

containing the supply of petroleum,
which is removed sufficiently from
the burner to avoid all danger of fire
from the flame. The oil is conducted
by drops into a burner of spe:sial con-
struction, after the latter has been
heated for about five minutes by
means of oil which is burned in small
heating pans furnished with the ap
paratus. Behind the burner from
which the flame issues there is a secs
ond burner, which after the heating
of the pans has been removed, con-
tinually produces the vapors and
heats thsin to a high temperature, at
the same time completely surround-
ing the first burner with a strong
flame. This arrangement is said to
make the extinction of the light an
impossibility, even in the strongest
wind,
Fresh air is drawn in between the

burner and the external cylinder by
the force of the flame rushilig out,
and, by using this air in the burner,a
smokeless flame results. The oil used
is ordinary 100 proof coal oil, the con-
sumption of which is about one and
three fourths pints per 100 candle
power.

Reflections of a Boy.

Mothers always think that if they
offer a boy something to eat after
they have refused to let him go to a
circus,he won't feel disappointed.

If a teller's mother didn't tell him
he musn't do so many things he
wouldn't want to.
A girl always thinks she has had a

good dinner if there has been lots of
fancy little china plates on the table.
A boy thinks he has a good dinner
when lie don't feel hungry any more.
It's funny how just as soon as

there's a circus billed for town, boys
begin to be nice to everybody.

Don't Tobacco Spit and Smoke Tour Life Away.
To quit tobacco easily and forever, be mug

netic, full of life, nerve and vigor, take No To-
Bar. the wonder-worker, that makes weak men
strong. All druggists, 50c or al. Cure guaran-
teed. Booklet and sample free. Address
Sterling ReinnOy Ca, Chicago or New York.

STOP MAKING RUTS.
PLACE A PENALTY ON THE USE OF

NARROW TIRES.

They 'Ave a Menace to All Good Roads
and Make Poor Ones Worse - Broad
Wheels Lighten the Horse's Labor, Save
Time and Improve the Roadway.

Narrow tires are a prolific source of
trouble and expense in the maintenance
of highways and have been condemned
by all authorities on roadmaking. A
vriter in the Davenport (Ia.) Repub-
lican makes some suggestions in this
connection, which, while not entirely
new, are worthy of consideration. He
says:

Since the question of good roads is
being considered with more interest al-
most daily, I beg to offer a few sugges-
tions in regard to our present country
roads being kept in repair, with little
expense and no attention required to
speak of, after they are once properly
leveled off and graded, allowing the
necessary fall for good drainage. Would
it not be feasible to urge the use of
broad tired wheels for wagons, say 3 or

RUTS RUIN TER ROAD.
(From Good Roads.]

4 inches wide, and, in order to secure
their early adoption, levy a tax on all
wagons having tires less than 3 inches
wide, while wagons with 3 inch tires,
or even wider, should not be taxed as
much, if at all?
In this, as in other cities, the use of

narrow tired wheels foi heavy hauling,
particularly over paved streets, is pro-
hibited by law, and why should this
law not be applicable to all wagons with
narrow tires used in the country for the
betterment and improvement of the
common dirt roads? With few excep-
tions the present 1% inch tire wagons
are cutting our country roads into ruts
and making them almost impassable. If
it were not for the ruts, our country
roads would drain off nicely and be in
good condition the year round, but dur-
ing the wet season, especially in the
spring, after the frost leaves the ground,
the 1% inch tire wheels act as a plow
and find their way some 8 to 12 inches
into the soil.
The narrow tired wheels are being

used in less numbers every year, since
the farmer fully realizes the fact that
hes must use broad tires in order to light-
en the load for the horses, especially
over the soft meadows and fields. Farm-
ers would be only too willing to abide
by the law by using broad tires, provid-
ing the law is rigidly enforced. The
use of broad tired wheels would enable
the farmer to haul heavier loads to
market, and where he now makes three
trips to transport the produce to market
only two would be necessary. This to
him would be a saving of time, labor
and horseflesh.

It is said that the average cost of
moving a ton one mile over our country
roads at the present time is about 25
cents and for five miles $1, not includ-
ing the time lost by the farmer. Such a
tax for hauling is heavier than that paid
for simply keeping ordinary roads in re-
pair. As a natural consequence, when
the roads are improved, heavier loads
can be hauled and better speed secured.
Why not, then, encourage the use of
broad tired wheels exclusively for the
improvement of our roads? In my opin-
ion the question of good roads cannot be
passed upon more economically by our
county supervisors and obtain equal re-
sults than by levying a tax on all nar-
row tired wagons. Have each wagon so
taxed, numbered and recorded and the
revenue derived therefrom placed for
the improvement of country roads in
the district where the taxpayer resides.
Should an inducement be offered to dis-
card the narrow tired wagon wheels it
would only be a question of time when
they would be a thing of the past and
the broad tired wheels would be used
exclusively instead.

The Very Best Road.
General Roy Stone says that the best

road in this country is the Jacksonville
(Fla.) boulevard, which extends six
miles in a circle around the city. It is
made of white flint rock and is 80 feet
wide. The macadam is 16 feet wide and
9 inches deep. The road was built by
convicts at a cost of $6,000 per mile.

A Handicap to Pleasure.
The king's highway belongs to every-

body, and when it is well planned and
well cared for it is a pleasure to all who
pass over it. But bad roads are a handi-
cap to pleasure, a positive hindrance to
businesi, and it is scarcely too much to
say are a disgrace to any community in
which they are found.-Selected.

Road Improvement on Long Island.
The Queens county (N. Y.) board of

supervisors has authorized an issue of
bonds amounting to $496,000 for the
improvement of comity roads. The
bonds are to run for 20 years and will
be of the denomination of $500 each,
bearing interest at the rate of 4 per cent.

TERRIBLE ACCIDENT.-It is a terri-
ble accident to be burned or scalded;
but the pain and agony and the
frightful disfigurement i can be quick-
ly overcome without leaving a scar
by usii,g DeWitt's Witch Hazel Salve.
J. McKellip,Druggist,Taneytown,h1d.

Don't thin your blood with sassa-
fras or poison it with blue-inass; but
aid Nature by using DeWitt's Little
Early Risers, the famous little pills
for constipation, biliousness and
stomach and liver troubles. They are
purely yegetable. J. McKell lp,Drug-
gist, Taneytown, Md.

McKELLIP'S
c,/,(3c arta atl itr9t
A SCIENTIFIC AND RELIABLE REMEDY FOR

HORSES, COWS, ETC.
One of the Best Condition Powders in use.

The Powders will be found invaluable for cattle in all cases of debility, or where the health has been impairedor the constitution broken down front whatever cause. They will prove an important aid in fattening cattle, asthey will loosen the hide, improve the appetite, and cause a rapid deposition of fatty matter. Owing to theirpowerful alterative effects upon the secretions, Dairymen will find them very beneficial in keeping their Milch Cowsin a sleek, healthy condition, and improving the quality of the milk, imparting a richness ill cream, that cannot beattained without their use.

Prepared only by JOHN McKELLIP, Druggist.
'VAN W N, MD.

BUILD ROADS ON CREDIT.

An Enthusiast Advocates Bonding Towns
to Construct Perfect Highways.

A pamphlet sent out by the depart-
ment of agriculture contains an ex-
tremely vigorous address in favor 'of
good roads which was delivered by
Judge Thayer of Clinton, In., at a re-
cent meeting of the Iowa Bankers' asso-
ciation. In it he declares that mud on
highways annually costs this country in
the destruction of vehicles, feed of extra
draft animals and delay in getting prod-
acts to market something like $250,-
000,000, of which sum the state of Iowa
pays perhaps $8,000,000. Besides this,
says Judge Thayer, there must be reck-
oned the immense amounts each year
spent, or rather thrown away, in mak-
ing and repairing roads of the old fash-
ioned kind, with no result except the
necessity of doing the work over again
the next spring.
What he advocates is the bonding of

every town to an amount sufficient to
build scientifically perfect roads wher-
ever they are needed within its bounda-
ries and connecting with similar high-
ways of the adjoining municipalities.
Judge Thayer admits that when he ad-
vocates this plan among the farmers
they always express a cautious dread of
incurring a debt so large as he suggests.
This he finds most aggravating, and he
is moved to give a few somewhat im-
passioned paragraphs on the beauties of
debt.
"Stagnation, savagism and igno-

rance," he says, "are th 3 fruits of trans-
acting business on the theory that no-
body is entitled to the confidence of
anybody. The business of civilization is
transacted on the credit system. The
business of barbarism is transacted on
the `no trust' plan. The 500,000,000
people who go in debt have food to eat,
clothes to wear and at night a place to
lay their heads. The 500,000,000 who
do not possess sufficient confidence in
themselves to trust one another never
tasted flour or beef, go naked and sleep
out doors. Activity, prosperity and
thrift are the fruits of mutual depend-
ence on one another, cemented with the
legend, 'I promise to pay.'
"When Columbus discovered America,

he found this great continent occupied
by a race of beings who were not only
out of debt, but who paid no taxes.
Debt has made America what it is. Its
flourishing cities, its vast system of
railroads, its multiplicity of industries,
which give employment to millions of
intelligent artisans, its Columbian ex-
position, its wonderful agriculturral
wealth and prosperity, could only have
been brought about by one man using
another man's money and paying some-
thing for the use of it. I cannot imagine
a more dismal condition of things on
this mundane sphere than the world
out of debt."

It Pays Better.
The matter of better roads is an im-

portant one, and it is the coming prob-
lem to be solved by county governments.
In the rural districts of Philadelphia
and the adjoining counties there are
many miles of smooth, well kept and
enjoyable roads, and there is no reason
why Delaware should not move in the
matter. It pays better to have good
roads than to keep on patching up poor
roads with pieces of sod, old roots and
stones as big as a man's head.-Wil-
mington News.

Gain For the Taxpayers.
With the convicts on the roads it is

thought the highways will soon be
transformed into beautiful boulevards
and that the state roads will be made to
compare favorably with any. To the
taxpayer the road convict law would
mean a large gain. Under the present
system, it is charged, the taxpayer is
burdened not only with the expense of
prison maintenance, but he is also
tnulcted in good round sums for road
improvements.-New York World.

Bad Roads Are Expensive.
Bad roads, mud, ruts and irregulari-

ties are expensive things. Au old farmer
used to say that ruts and freezing and
thawing cost him a new wagon every
five years. Very few people realize what
rough roads cost them. Of course it is
only a bolt today, a tire tomorrow, a
wheel sprung next week or an axle
warped out of shape at some other time,
but these things come, sometimes over-
lapping like shingles on a roof. They
are put down to wear and tear and in a
way accepted as the inevitable simply
because roads have always been bad and
one scarcely has a right to expect any-
thing else. But the difference in the
lasting qualities of a wagon on a thor-
oughly good road and an extremely bad
one would surprise the owner of such a
vehicle were he able to keep track of
the exact figures in the two conditions.
-New York Ledger.

Result of Poor Roads.
At the beginning of March the people

of Fossil. in Gilliam county, Or., were
suffering for want of flour. The roads
were in such condition that no hauling
could be dom.

Epigram on Rough Roads.
I'm now arrived, thanks to the gods,
Through pathways rough and muddy-

A certain sign that makin roads
Is no' this people's study!

Although I'm not wi' Scripture cram'd,
I'm sure the Bible says

That heedless sinners shall be damn'd
Unless they mend their ways.

-Robert Burns.

Domestic Joy.
The charm of domestic joy will be

preserved, if those parents, who fear
the early death of one of their loved
ones when attacked with a serious
throat or lung trouble, resort at once
to Dr. Bull's Cough Syrup, a never-fail-
ing remedy. "I used Dr. Bull's Cough
Syrup for my son, who was eight years
old. He has been troubled with a bron-
chial cough since lie was two and a half
years of age, and I have tried every-
thing, but found Dr. Bull's Cough
Syrup does him the most good." Mrs.
A. Gelb, 317 Demott St., West Hobo-
ken, NJ. Dr.Bull's Cough Syrup costs
only 25 cents, and is cheaper than the
dealer's big profit making substitute,
because Dr. Bull's Cough Syrup always
cures while the substitute does not.

The New-York Weekly Tribune
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FOR 

EVERY member of
EVERY family in
EVERY farrn, in

3

THE

Candi Record,
In its new form, is better pre-
pared than ever to give to its
subscribers the full value of
$1.00 many times over during a
year. It means to be so newsy,
so attractive and so good, that
it will be a household necessity
in every family in the county.

STATE NEWS,

COUNTY NEWS,

GENERAL NEWS,

LATE NEWS,

ALL THE NEWS.

The RECORD will have in the fut-
ure, as in the past, its distinctive
features. It will aim at all times to
supply clean, pure, non-sensational
news matter, fit for every member

EVERY village, in 
of the family to read. It will be glad
to receive contributions from its read-
ers, as well as opinions and ideasEVERY State or Territor y
having in view the improvement of
the paper, and the adaptation of its
features to its patrons as a whole.

IMI111.1111•11111

FOR Education.
FOR Noble Manhood.
FOR True 'Womanhood.

GIVES all important news of the Nation.
GIVES all important news of the World.
GIVES the most reliable market reports.
GIVES brilliant and instructive editorials.
GI VES fascinating short stories.
GIVES an unexcelled agricultural department.
GIVES scientific and mechanical information.
GIVES illustrated fashion articles.
GIVES humorous illustrations.
GIVES entertainment to young and old.
GIVES satisfaction everywhere to everybody.

We furnish the "Record" and "N. Y. Weekly Tribune"
ONE YEAR for $1.25
Cash in advance.

Address all order& to THE RECORD.
Write your name and address on a Postal card, send it to Geo. W. Best, Tri-bune Building, New York City, and a sample copy of THE NEW YORKWEEKLY TRIBUNE will be mailed to you.
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tot ALL
25 i 50 i DRUGGISTS
ABSOLUTELY GUARANTEED 

to cure any case of constipation. Casearets are the Ideal Laxa-tive. never grip or gripe. hut cause easy naturalresults. Sam•pie and booklet free. Ad. STEIGIANG REMEDY CO.. Chienwo, Montreal. Can.. or New York. III.•••••••••••••••••.••••••-••-coar-er-wewssiipariNprigo•-•-•••.0.0.0.420•••••414.40

L.I7vCE. L.I7vVE.
All parties that want a good, quick and durable Lime, free of impurities,should buy Legore's Combination of Lime. As-a guarantee and comparisonwe submit five different analyses made by H. J. Patterson, State Chemist ofMaryland, Prince George's Co., for the consideration of farmers and otherswho want the best article. Special inducements in prices, terms, willbe given.
It will pay all parties who intend using lime this season, to give it atrial and the preference. Bend for prices, giving amount wanted. Satisfac-tion guaranteed in every respect. For further information call on or address

J. W. LeGORE Woodsboro,
Below are the five different analyses made by the State Chemist.

per cent, per cent. per cent, per cent.Lime (CaO) Ave. Sol. Lime.. ..... 97.61 96.00 97.00 96.80Magnesia (Dsig0) 
Oxide of Iron and Alumina 
Silica 
Undetermined 

.43 1.08 .43 .72
1.07 1.20 1.60 1.9e
..89 1.63 .41 .68

.09 .56

100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00
Calcium (Lime) Carbonate 98.39 per cent.
Magnesia Carbonate   .51 „
Oxide of Iron and Alumina  .60 „
Silica  .. .50 „

---
100.00 „

11

11

It

11

New and Improved

Wooden Pumps.
I take this method of informing may

frieuds and the public generally that
I am located

At UNIONTOWN, Carroll Co., Md.,
and am prepared to do work in Car-
roll and adjoining counties at moder-
ate prices.
Parties not having Timber or Stocks

will be furnished complete with the
best material. New and Improved

Copper Cylinders,
supplied with all pumps put in.
Old Pumps out of repair that work*

hard, will be repaired and made to
work easy, even when wells are 50 to
60 feet deep.
All Work Guaranteed.
Thankful for past patronage I

would ask a continuance of the same.

• F. E. PALMER.

COMBINATION OFFERS.
'We give below a list of Combina-

tion Offers, with a number of leading
periodicals, on all of which you can
save money and trouble by subscrib-
ing through this office, If you are
already a paid ahead subscriber to
the RECORD, you can have any of the
periodicals named, by paying the
dfference between $1.00 and the com-
bination price.

Name of Journal.
Special
Price .

Regular
Price.

American Miller 
Agricuitual Epitomist.  
Architect St Building 
Arena, The 
Arthur's Home Magazine 
Atlantic Monthly 
Cosmopolitan.
Century 
Demorest's 
Farm Journal 
Forum 
Frank Leslie's Weekly 

" Monthly 
Golden Rule ......  
Herres Weekly 

Magazine 
North American Review 
Peterson's Magazine 
Review of Reviews 
St. Nicholas 
Scribner's Magazine 
Tribune, N. Y, (weekly) 
World N. Y. Ltri-weekly) 
Youth's Companion 
(TO STRICTLY NEW Sunnoormsoa ekno

-
2.90
1.25
2.75
3.90

4.05
1.85
4.75
2.90
1.15
3.90
4.01"
3.75
2.75
4.65
4.50
5.50
1.95
3.50
175
3.85
1.25
1.50
2.50

3.f 0
1.'0
3.03
4.00
2.00
5.00
2.00
5.10
3.00
1.50
4.00
5.00
490
3.00
5.00
5.110
6.00
2.00
3.50
4.00
4.0)
2.00
2.00
2.75

THE CARROLL RECORD,
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Who can think
of some simple

thing to patent? Protect your Ideas; they may
bring you wealth. Write JOHN WEDDER-
Dotty & co., Patent Attorneys, Washington.
13.0.$ for their $1,800 prize offer.

WANTED-AN IDEA

WORTH ITS WEIGHT IN GOLD!
The Genuine
HANES'

AN UNFAILING REMEDY
FOR 1 HE CURE OF

Sweeny, Wind-Galls, Sprains, String-Halt,
Poll-Evil, Ring-Bone, Fistula, Cuts, Bruises,
Old Sores, Swellings, Lumps, Scratches,
Sprains, Spavin, Kicks, etc., in

Horses and Cattle,
and unfailing in the cure of IDcers,Old Sores,
ithematism, Neuralgia, Erysipelas, Chil-
blains. Sprains, Cuts, Wounds and the vari-
ous afflictions of mankind that may receive
an outward remedy.

Ask your Dealer for a Bottle
or send us 10 cents, or 25 cents, for postage,
packing, etc., and receive a small or large-
size sample bottle, on trial, by mail.

HANES' LINIMENT M'F'G CO.
Sole Manufacturers,

STEWARTSTOWN, PA.

IEW YORK WORLD.
THRICE-A-WEEK EDITION.

18 PAGES A WEEK. 156 PAPERS A YEAR,

A paper as useful to you as a great
$6 daily, for only one dollar a year.
Better than ever. All the News of All
the World All tlie Time. Accurate
and fair to everybody. Democratic
anti for the people. Against trusts
and all monopolies. Brilliant illus-
trations. Stories by great authors in
every number. Splendid reading for
women and other special departments
of unusual interest.
It stands first among "weekly" pa-

pers in size, frequency of publication
and freshness, variety and reliability
oh contents. It is practically a daily
at the low price of a weekly; and its
vast list of subscribers, extending to
every state and territory of the Union
and foreign countries, will vouch for
the accuracy and fairness of its news
columns.
We offer this unequaled newspaper

and

The Carroll Record.
together one year for $1.50.
The regular subscription price of

the two papers is $2.00.

WANTED
Three Reliable Agents
n Carroll County to sell POWELL'S FER-
TILIZERS on salary or conunission, Give
references and district.
POWELL FERTILIZER & CHEMICAL CO.

Baltimore, Md.
May 8.14

Carroll Record
Has been a pronounced success so far.
and means to continue to improve,
and thus merit the continuance of
the liberal support which has hither-
to been accoided it.

Subscribe for it!
Advertise in it!
Tell your friends of it!

HELP IT,
and it will help you.

The Job Department
Is as complete as that of any office
outside of a large city, and the char-
acter of the work turned out is of the
best, which may be easily seen by ap-
plying for Samples. Do you want

Sale Bills, Posters, Circulars
Bill and Letter Heads, State-
ments, Wedding Invitations,
Cards, Pamphlets, Pro-

grams, Receipts.
Note, Draft or Check

Books, Envelopes, Shipping
Tags, Labels, Tickets, Certifi-
cates-no matter what, or how
many

Give us a Trial.

AS AN

Advertising Medium,
LOOK NO FURTHER!

Having &large circulation in a pros-
perous section, among different class-
es and professions, and as the RECORD
itself is made up attractively and on
the modern plan, an advertisement
can scarcely be given a poor position
at any place in its columns. It has
been our rule not to contract for read-
ing advertisements which must be
sandwiched in with news items, and
this rule will continue to be adhered
to.

By keeping our space
for reading matter entire-
ly separate from advertise-
ments, we not only please
the reader, but helo the
advertiser too, by placing
all on equality with each
other; we offer monthly
changes without charge
so that advertisement
will form a real news feat
ure for the paper. Fre-
quent changes,and special
offers, will pay both the
advertiser and newspaper,
and benefit the reader.

The Carroll Record,
Taneytown, Md. 

Littlesion Carriage Works.

S. D. MEHRING,
MANUFACTURER OF

FINE CARRIAGES
and Buggies.

SURREYS, PHAETONS,

TRAPS, CARTS) CUTTERS,

Dayton,
FINE McCall, WAGONS.

Jagger,

and a General Line of Light Vehicles
A Good Selection of Second Hand

Work on hand

REPAIRING promptly done.
tir Low PRICES, and all work.

guaranteed.

LitTLESTOWN, Pik
8-21-944 f Opposite Depot.



THE SULTAN'S TERMS.

He demands the Retrocession of

Thessaly and $44,000,000

Indemnity.

A SURPRISE TO THE POWERS.

Constantinople, May 16.-The Porte

has replied officially to the note of

the powers and declines to agree to

an armistice until the following con-

ditions are accepted:
The annexation of Thessaly, and

indemnity of 10,000,000 Turkish

pounds (about $44,000,000) and the

abolition of the capitulations. The

Porte proposes that plenipotentiar-

ies of the powers should meet at

Pharsalia to discuss the terms of

peace, and declares that if these con-

ditions are declined, the Turkish

army will continue to advance.
The demand for the annexation of

Thessaly is based upon the fact that

the proyince was originally ceded to

Greece on the advice of the powers

with the object of ending brigandage

and Greek incursions into Ottoman

territory, the Porte believing at the

time that the cession would attain

these objects, but the recent incur-

sions of Greek bands and the events

immediately preceding the war have

proved to the contrary. This is the

substance of the reply.
The ambassadors met today to con-

sider the Porte's answer, which is re-

garded as raising an extremely grave

issue. It is believed that representa-

tions will be made to the Sultan per-

sonally to induce a modification of

these terms, but it is foreseen that

this will be very difficult, owing to

the attitude of the powerful old Turk

war party.
If the Porte should prove obdurate

a European conference is not improb-

able, although at present Russia is

opposed to this.
It is regarded as quite certain that

the powers will not consent to a re

trocession of Thessaly. Even Ger-

many is believed to be resolute on

this point, because it would involve

a violation of the Berlin treaty, and

imperil the peace of the Balkans.
Altogether the reply of the Porte

has caused the greatest surprise. It

appears that during the discussion of

the note from the powers by the

council of the Sultan's ininisters,news

reached the council that 3,000 Greeks

had landed at Pelona and were

marching to Janina with the inten-

tion of co-operating with other forces

from Arta. This created a bad im-

pression among the ministers.

Time Czar of Russia took a hand in

the situation on Tuesdy, and made a

direct appeal to the Sultan to cease

hostilities and make arrangements

for an armistice. After a consultation,

the Turkish commander-in-chief was

telegraphed to cease hostilities, and

it is not improbable that the terms

of peace may be negotiated directly

between Greece and Turkey. Ger-

many, it appears, had been covertly

encouraging Turkey and this deci-

sive act of,the Czar bears the impress

of a resolution to abide the conse

quences notwithstanding the course

of the other powers.

THE PRESIDENT'S MESSAGE.

Congress urged to provide Food Med-

icines and Transportation from

Cuba for American Citizens.

Washington, May 17.-The Presi-

dent today sent the following mes-

sage to Congress:

"To the Senate and the House of

Representatives of the United States:

"Official information from our con-

suls in Cuba establishes the fact that

a large number of American citizens

in the island are in a state of destitu-

tion, suffering for want of food and

medicines. This applies particularly

to the rural districts of the central

and eastern parts.

The agricultural classes have been

forced from their farms into the near-

est towns, where they are without

work or money.

The local authorities of the several

towns, however kindly disposed, are

unable to relieve the needs of their

own people and are altogether pow-

erless to help our citizens.

The latest report of Consul-General

Lee estimates that 600 to 800 Ameri-

cans are without means of support. I

have assured him that provision

would be made at once to relieve

them. To that end I recommend that

Congress make an appropriation of

not less than $50,000 to be immediate-

ly available for use under the direc-

tion of the Secretary of State.

It is desirable that a part of the sun

which may be appropriated by Con-

gress should in the discretion of the

Secretary of State, also be used for

the transportation of American citi-

zens who, desiring to return to the

United States, are without means to

do so.
WILLIAM MCKINLEY.

"Executive Mansion. May 17, 1897."

Against Race Track Gambling.

The anti-race track convention re-

cently held in Elkton appointed a

committee on public safety, which at

a meeting on May 14th., adopted the

following preamble and resolutions.

WHEREAS, The laws of Maryland in

regard to poolselling, bookmaking

and other forms of race track gamb-

ling are such as to permit, by the

multiplication of race tracks, -racing

the year around, thus inviting into

Maryland the outlawed race track

gamblers who have been driven from

other states; and

WHEREAS, Cecil county is now the

refuge of these gamblers and their

more objectionable followers; and

WHEREAS, Their presence is cor-

rupting our citizens, both old and

young, and is leading many of them

to depart from their ways of industry

and thrift, and to follow these evil-

doers; and
WHEREAS, The constant use of the

vilest profanity upon our streets,and

upon the railway trains and in other

public places, is degrading the hith-

erto fair name of our town and coun-

ty and inflicting upon us an intolera-

ble cure; and

WHEREAS, An effort to have the

last legislature enact a law forbidding

race track gambling was defeated by

the influence of the gamblers; there-

fore
Be it resolved, That we appeal to

the moral sense of the people of the

whole state to aid us in overthrowing

this infamous traffic, by electing only

such men to the General Assembly of

Maryland as can be relied upon to

enact such laws as will effectually

prevent race track gambling in the

state of Maryland; and that we call

upon the press throughout the state

to publish these resolutions and give

us*their p
owerful aid to efface this

blot from the fair name of Maryland.

WOULDN'T CARRY THE PIGS.

And that's how the Pastor got into

Trouble.

The following illustrates the posi-

tion in which clergymen in the rural

districts sometimes find themselves.

A certain Frederick county minister

having two churches to serve on al-

ternate Sundays, was recently ap-
proached by a member of his flock,

who wanted to know if he couldn't

conveniently carry a few small pigs

to a certain member of the other

flock on his next trip down. This the

pastor declined to do for various rea-

sons. The other congregation being
some distance away, the pastor, as a

rule, left home on Katurday,stopping
over night with one of his members.

On this occasion the preacher was

"booked" to stop with the very mem-

ber who wanted the pigs. As time pas-

tor drove into the yard, the brother
sang out:
"Well, haye you got the pigs ?"
The pastor was sorry to acknowl-

edge that he didn't have them, while

the look of disappointment on the

face of the farmer was a sight to be-
hold.
However, the best was yet to come.

That night when bed time crone, the

farmer led the way, with a candle.

keeping on until the garret was

reached. Here a crude bed was rig-

ged up right under the salters. About

midnight the preacher was startled

on hearing a loud snapping noise,

and the immediate squeal of a rat,

assured him that big game had been

trapped somewhere near his bed. The

pastor got up and began an inemedi

ate search for time trap, but had

scarcely gone a few feet when he be-

came entangled in a pair of old over-
alls, thoroughly scented with raw

bone fertilizer, evidently used on the

spring crops. Freeing himself from

the overalls and advancing a step

further he discovered to his horror

that he had disturbed a nest of wasps

in the legs of the old trousers and

the way they commenced to buzz and

flit about was an indication that they
might possibly "get gay."• Pressing

bravely on our hero stumped his toe,

crashing headlong into a lot of glass

jars filled with tomatoes, fruit and

preseryes. This last one was a corker.

The preacher finding it too difficult

to proceed further, calmly scraped

the bits of broken glass and preserves

off his clothing, stole quietly back to

bed a sadder but a wiser man.-Balt.
World.

Glad Tidings.

The grand specific for the prevails

inginalady of the age Dyspepsia.

Liver Complaint, Rheumatism, Cos-

tiveness, General Debility, etc., is

Bacon's Celery King for the Nerves.
Timis great herbal tonic stimulates

the digestive organs, uegulates the

Liver and restores the system to vig-

orous health and energies. Sample
free. Large packages 50e and 75e.

Sold only by Robt. S. McKinney.

QUEER SLIPS OF THE TONGUE.

Funny Mistakes of Language Picked

from Various Planes of Life.

A transposition of two or more let-

ters, or the mistakes of hasty punctu-

ation, offer a miscellaneous comic lit-

erature that, from its absurdity, is

worth collecting. Take for instance

this extract from a bride's letter of

thanks: "Your beautiful clock has

been received and is now in the draw-

ing-room on our mantlepiece where

we hope to see you often."

The literature of advertisements is

sometimes as humorous as the sayings

of the funniest men. In the far west

a man advertises for a woman "to

wash, iron and milk two cows." A

rather ghostly humor surrounds the

announcement of an enterprising un-

dertaker,who says in the daily paper;

"No person who has once triad our

air-tight caskets will ever use any

other."
A dry goods firm put a placard in

the window which read; "Bargain sale

now going on. Don't go elsewhere to

be cheated,come in here."

A compilation of curious advertise-

ments results in the following;

"Wanted-An organist and boy to

blow the same."

"Wanted-A boy who can open

oysters with a reference."

"A lady desires to sell her piano as

she is going abroad in a strong iron

frame,'.'

"Widow in comfortable circum-

stances wishes to marry two sons."

"Bulldog for sale; will eat anything;

very fond of children."

A dentist advertises: 'Peen ex-

tracted with great pains," Ihere is a

delicious humor in the description of

"a young man who sold peaches with

red hair."
The mistakes of speech are some-

times amusing to all except the em-

barrassed speaker. For instance,that

of the insignificant youth who was in-

troduced to a distinguished lady, and

completely transposed the meaning of

his elaborate address when he bowed

low and said: "I think, madam, you

have had the pleasure of meeting me

before." Or that of the charming

elocutionist who thus rendered the

climax of the heroic poem she was

reciting: "Go, your liver loves," said

Cromwell, "Curfew shall not ring to-

night." And the mishap of the smart

boy of the village, who spoke his

piece before a large audience, begin-

ning thuswise;
Under the spreading blacksmith tree
The village chestnut stands.

Then come the slips of reverend

tongues, when it is wicked to laugh,

and worse not to, for who could pre-

serve a normal gravity on hearing the

hymn "Conquering kings" given out

as "kinkering congs," or the "fig

tree" transposed into the "wig tree,"

and not feel a sinful inclination to

laugh? And the parson who took for

his text "Bow not thy knee to an

idol," and read it to his congregation

"Bow now thine eye to a needle,"

must have been chagrined to see the

smiles follow, and not know why. So

with another of the cloth whe intend-

ed to read "This world is all a fleet-

ing show," but by a slip of the

tongue rendered it thus: "This world

is all a floating shoe."

One can imagine the embarrass-

ment of the grand lady who, finding

a stranger in her pew, asked him

haughtily if he intended to "occupew

that pie." An Oklahoma editor ex-

pressed his thanks for a basket of

oranges in this strain: •'We have re-

ceived a basket of oranges from our

friend Fred Bradley, for which lie

will please accept our compliments,

some of which are nearly six inches in

diameter.-Ghicago Times-Herald.

"It is the Best on Earth."

That is what Edwards & Parker,
merchants of Plains, Ga., say of
Chamberlain's Pain Balm, for rheu-
matism, lame back, deep seated and
muscular pains. Sold by R. S. Mc-
Kinney, Druggist, Taneytown, Md.

A SWINDLING BICYCLIST.

He Rides a New Machine Each Season at

a Cost of 1115 or 810.

"I had gone up against a varied as-

sortment of swindling games since I

went into the bicycle business," said

the manager of a down town bicycle

agency yesterday, "but before I got in-

to this lino I was in charge of an in-

stallment house and before that was

cashier in a Broadway hotel, so I had

my eyeteeth cut, you may say. But I've

unearthed a gentlemanly crook whose

game is not only novel, but smooth as

silk, and he is absolutely the limit in

my wide acquaintance with bicycle

swindlers.
"Each season for three years to my

knowledge this fellow has sported a new

machine of standard make, with all the

up to date accessories. At the end of the

season he discards that wheel, and when

spring comes around, with young, ten-

der, green blades of grass in the parks

and equally green and tender chumps

like myself doing business in the bicy-

cle line, this chap will be seen on an-

other wheel, the newest model, the most

popular make and with the latest trim-

mings. His season's riding doesn't cost

him over $10, and that's his record for
three years, if not longer.

"I'll tell you how be does it. In the

first place, he has an honorable pro-

fession and a wide acquaintance. In the

next place, he is naturally a swindler.

In the last place, we bicycle dealers and

agents will stand a great deal before

acknowledging that we have lost a deal

or a wheel.
"The modus operandi of the gentle-

man whose bicycles have been dirt

cheap for him is as follows: Several

years ago at the beginning of the road,

season lie presented his card and his im-

pressive personality at the down town

agency for a well known make of bi-

cycle.
" 'I don't want to waste time in pok-

ing over cheap articles,' he said. 'I

want only the best and that quickly.'

"Of course the salesman was delight-

ed. The professional man's eye lighted

on a wheel that was 'one in a thousand,'

as the makers of rifle barrels say. He

examined it critically, put in a few ob-

jections to the make of tires and the

saddle, just to show that be knew all

about wheels and wheeling, and be

wound up by saying carelessly:

"'Ship it to my home address and

Rend the bill to my office. I shall ex-

pect to try the machine and test it to

my satisfaction.'
"The salesman, a trifle flustered,

went back to the credit clerk, showed

the customer's professional card, and

was told to get a cash deposit of $25,

two references, and an agreement to

pay so much a month on the price.
"Mr. Professional Man beamed upon

the salesman, furnished the references,

giving the names of two gentlemen

well known on Newspaper row, and in

commercial circles, but-he had only

$10 to spare, and presumed that would

suffice as a guarantee of good faith. His

references proved 0. K. He got the

wheel. All the flem received was that

solitary payment of $10. They allowed

the first month to expire without send-

ing him a statement. The next month,

June, they respectfully requested a pay-

ment on account. In July, August and

September ditto, the requests increasing

in businesslike terms, but with no per-

ceptible effect upon the customer, who
meanwhile rode that $10 wheel for all

he was worth. In October the credit

man complained to the head of the firm,

and a peremptory notice was sent to the
delinquent. It read something like this,

"'SIR-You have used the Spokeless

machine No. 0000 six months and paid

only $10 On account. If you do not call

at once and Fettle in full, we shall be
compelled to forcibly remove the wheel

from your possession.'
"The gentlemanly crook had expected

just such a denouement. He promptly

replied, curtly informing the firm that

the Spokeless wheel did not come up to

representation, and that unless it was

removed at once from his premises he

should be obliged to put it in storage at

the expense of the dealers.
"Each year since that fellow has

played the same game on some bicycle

house which does business on the in-

stallment plan. Not only is he not

ashamed of such contemptible trickery,

but he actually boasts of his success in

getting a season's sport on a new stand-

ard wheel for little or nothing."-New

York Sun.

Moving pictures of the Corbett-

Fitzsimmons fight will be debarred

from exhibition in Canada. The ex-

ample set us by our Northern neigh-

bors should be generally followed.

Such exhibitions are demoralizing,

and, moreover,tend to keep up active

interest in the support ot the ring, as

they add enormously to the profits of

a prize fight.

W, B. Johnson, Newark, 0., says:
"One Minute Cough Cure saved my
only child from dying by croup." It
has saved thousands of others suffer-
ing from croup,pneumon la, bronch i t is
andlother serious throat and lung
troubles. J. llacKellip,Druggist,Tan-
eytown, Md.

Some for ten, some for twenty and
some for thirty years have suffered
from piles and then have been quick-
ly and permanently cured by using
DeWitt's 'Witch Hazel Salve, the
graat remedy for piles and all forms
of skin diseases. J. McKellip, Drug-
gist, Taneytown, Md.

Senator Wellington made his maid-

en speech in the Senate on Manday,

in opposition to time resolution to re-

fer the Morgan Cuban resolution,

which accords the insurgents belli-

gerent rights, to the committee On

foreign affairs. He indorsed the pol-

icy of the Cleveland administration

in preserving strict neutrality. The

speech called for warm replies from

Senators Daniel and Stewart, who

favor intervention on the part of this

government.

Considerable merriment was occa-

sioned at the U. B. General Confer-

ence when Rev. A. E. Davis, of Ohio,

read the report of the committee on

church formulas recommending a

new marriage ceremony to take the

place of the one now in use throu,gli-

out the church. The proposed new

ceremony began "God be merciful

unto us, etc." This sentence in the

connection in which it was made to

appear struck the humorous side of

the conference and a general burst of

laughter and applause followed the

reading. 'rime sense of time conference

was decidedly expressed in favor of

the old formula.

Educate Your Bowels With Cascarets.
Candy Cathartic, cure constipation forever.

10c, 25c. If C. C. C. fail, druggists ref uad money.

WOMAN'S WORLD

CHICAGO'S SUCCESSFUL GIRL

AGER AND DIRECTOR.

STATEMENT OF THE

Financial Condition
MAN-  OF THE 

Corporation of Taneytown, Md.,

•

The Woman of the Middle %Vest -Sum-

mer Millinery-Hair Coloring--Glrls In

the Coal Pits-A Famous Woman Sculp-

tor-The Woman's Council.

Since the time of Mother Eve woman

has been "managing things," though it

is only in these end of the century days

that she has ventured to extend her

sphere beyond the walls of her house.

But this age is one of progression, and

when woman once gained a footing in

the business world she decided to turn

her talent for managing, inherited from

generations of capable housekeepers, to

some account in the new field.
There are but few to be found in the

audiences at the Chicago orchestra con-

certs who do not know of Miss Anna

Millar, the bright young woman who is

the business manager of the orchestra.

Until recently Miss Millar was the only

one of her sex to hold such a position in

Chicago, but now in Steinway hall is

the office of another young woman

whose card reads:

L. E. RANDALL,

Business Manager.

Miss Lillian E. Randall-for that is

her full name-doesn't look as if she

could manage anything more earthly

than a slice of angel food or a lemon ice,

but she is known in musical circles as

a most successful manager of concerts

• 3

MISS LILLIAN EYRE RANDALL.

and lectures. She is tall and fair, with

the same kind of blue eyes The Duch-

ess used to give her heroines and hair

that nature and not the hairdresser has

made fair.
She doesn't wear queerly made frocks

or mannish looking hats. She doesn't

spell woman with a big W, nor does she

talk aggressively about the "downtrod-

den sex." She talks about interesting

things when she talks at all, and the

rest of the time she works.
One year ago she was known as a

clever accompanist and a teacher of

mu.sio in Hyde Park, where she lives

One day she undertook, to oblige a friend

who was ill, the disposal of 50 tickets

for a Sunday afternoon concert. She was

so successful in this that the field into

which she had acccidentally strayed

opened wide before her, and as it teem-

ed with possibilities she staid there.

This winter her work has been con-

fined mainly to superintending parlor

recitals, one of them being the Chicago

debut of Mrs. Swabacher, at the resi-

dence of Mrs. P. D. Armour, Jr. She

has also managed several dramatic read-

ers, concert singers and lecturers, among

the latter being Mr. William Armstrong,

the musical critic who has pleased many

audiences as critical as himself with his

lecture on "Unpublished Interviews

With Great Musicians."
Miss Randall, who, it is whispered, is

an own cousin to a title across the wa-

ter, is as much of a success in her home

and the social world as she is in the one

of business. She lives with her mother,

whose hands are raised in indignation

if any one, even jokingly, refers to her

daughter as a "new woman "-Chicago

Tribune.

WHAT WOMEN WEAR.

Among the popular belt buckles are

those of oxidized silver with jewels.

Veils to be fashionable must be plait,

the simple length of soft Brussels net

being one of the most approved.

A corn colored hat with black lace

trimming is pretty, also the same color-

ed hat with a very full wreath of blue

corn flowers.

Skirts are very full at the back and

are gathered over cords and drawn close-

ly, so that the back shows a pointed de-

sign of one cord above another.

Artificial flowers are extravagantly

beautiful. They are exceedingly natural

and very rich looking, and if one buys

good ones they last a long time.

Novelty hats are shown in braids of

every imaginable color. Red is exceed-

ingly popular and when trimmed with

a profusion of soft black lace or chiffon

is one of the most stylish of the mil-

liner's creations.

The surplice front is gaining in favor,

and when carefully adjusted is becom-

ing to almost all figures. For stout

ladies it seems to reduce the bulk, while

for slender ones it can be left slightly

loose and is very pretty and graceful.

Human Ingenuity.

Certainly, for the mechanic, human

ingenuity has never produced a better

liniment than Salvation Oil,which now

stands unexcelled for curing his sprains

and bruises caused by a fall; or cuts

and wounds the result of an accident

with his tool or saw. Salvation Oil al-

ways kills pain. "Recently, I fell

about twenty feet and was very much

bruised on my leg and side, but after

bathing them with Salvation Oil the

bruises soon disappeared. I think Sal-

vation Oil is just the thing for sores

and bruises." A. Jacob Rice, 520

Church St., Easton, Pa. Salvation Oil

may be bought anywhere for 25 cents.

Substitutes offered by dealers may cost

less; hence, do less. Salvation Oil,

however, never disappoints the user.

STRAWBERRY
and ICE CREAM

FESTIVAL!
The Mite Society of the Lu-

theran Church will hold a Fes
tival on the

SCHOOL HOUSE LAWN,-
on the Afternoon and Evening
of

Saturday, May 29th.
All the delicacies of the sea-

son will be furnished in abun-
dance. The public is cordially
invited to attend.

May 10th., 1897.

RECEIPTS FOR YEAR ENDING MAY 10, 1897

Cash on hand May 10, 1896  14 09
Received Taxes for the year 1894  40 98

1895--   125 61 
 870 47

Road Tax for the year 1896  150 00

Dog Tax  10 00

Fines  80)
Licenses  24 50
for Empty Gasoline Blots  4 25

--
Total $1,247 91

DISBURSEMENTS FOR THE YEAR END-
ING MAY 10. 1897.

Fred. & P. R. R., freight on Stone& Oil, $ 75 34
Atlantic Ref. Conipany, Oil  28 61

17 40
9 75
47 20

B. S. Miller, Tax Collector
CARROLL RECORD, Printing 
J. S. Sheets, Lighting Lamps
0. T. Shoemaker, Iron Piping, &c  84 51
J. W, Stouffer, work on streets..    20 02
W. Fringer, work on street. .   24 12
J. Kuhns, Delivering Stone  - 43 27
G. H. Birnie & Co., Interest on Bonds  300 OU
G. H. Birnie  28 53
John Yingling, Stone  I 40
James Shildt, Repairing 1 ools  40
L. D. Reid, Salary as Clerk   33 50
P. B. Englar, Books, &c  40
H. Hill, Work on Corporation....    3 11
T. D. Thomson, Judge of Election  1 00
G. T. Motter,M. D. Services rendered  600
G. E. Houtz, Clerking Election.   1 (0
H. 1). Mehring, Services-rendered  21 00
John II. Kemp, Judge of Election  1 tX1
Jas. H. lteindollar, Repairing Buggy  2 01
Henry Shoemaker, Repairing Well  1(8)
J. A. Fringer, Work on Street  2 00
H. S. Koons, Repairing Street Lamps,- 4 15
Mee. Davidson, Street Lamps ....   21 09
'I'. H. Eckenrode Lumber  7 Si
J. S. Bower, Hardware, &c,   9 00
J. S. Weaver, Crossings   142 10
Sinking Fund   200 00

--
Total  $1140 90

Balance on hand  107 Ut
--
$1,217 94

CONDITION OF TREASURY, MAY 10, 1897.

Due J. W. Legore, Stone.... ......... $380 57

Cash on Hand   107 01
Uncolleeted Taxes for 1894, 1895, lb. 207 04

Fall amount due and in Treasury  $314 08

CONDITION OF THE SINKING FUND,
MAY 10, 1297.

Principal appropriated out of Levy for
the years 1894 'and 1895, and Interest
on same, invested  $425 00

Interest for year ending 1897  28 12
Principal ape'd out of Levy for 1896.- 200 00---

Amount   $65.3 12

HEZEKIAH D. MEHRING, Burgess.

LEVI E. REID, Clerk and Treasurer.

Special Notices.
--

STRAWBERRIES and Pine-app
les

Cheap at G. E. KOUTZ'S GREEN
GROCERY. 2t

LA Native Taneytown-er.)

ATTORNEY-AT-LAW,

NOTARY-PUBLIC

In & For The

Commonwealth of Pennsylvania,

No 435 GRANT STREET,

PITTSBURGH, PENN.

MANY HARD
EARNED DOLLARS

can be saved by the men of Car-

roll county, by buying their

Clothing from

SHARRER & GORSUCH,
Opposite Catholic Church,

Westminster, Md.-

You will make a Mistake,
when you need Clothing-either

made to order or Ready-made-

for yourself or boys, if you buy

before seeing our Splendid Quali-

ties, Latest Styles, and Lowest

Prices. The only place to buy

the newest and best things in

Shirts, Neckties, Collars, and

Furnishings of all kinds.

The only exclusive Merchant
Tailoring, Clothing and Furnish-
ing Store in the county.

Come and See us.

Removal!
Removal!

To Middleburg!

I hereby inform everybody

that I have removed my store

to Middleburg, and opened up a

First-class Stock of

SPRING DRY GOODS
AND NOTIONS.

Will be pleased to have all

my old friends, as well as many

new ones, call to see me.

Fair and Square
dealing all around, is my mot-

to. Give me a trial,

W. E. KOLB,
6,3 tf MIDDLEBURG, MD

GEORGE MIDDOUR,
Manufacturer of

Woven-wire and Cable
Spring Beds.

Hanover, Pennsylvania.

If in want of a first-class Spring

Bed, made to order,and to suit heavy

or light-weight people, giye me a call,

or write to me to come to see you.

JOHN DELAPLANE, Agent,
15,5,6m TANEYTOWN, MD.

SPRING OPENING
At OAK HALL, New Windsor, VA

SA.TITIRODA:Y.,.A.IDIR;11.J10, 1E397

We are again at the helm of the ship, steering our customers i
nto the

Port of Safe Dealing and True Bargains. OUR SPRING STOCK OF

Dress Goods and Trimmings
is full to overflowing. Silk from 20c up. Beautiful all wool goods at 25 cts.

38 inches wide Wash Goods, in great variety. Our stock of CLOT
HING,

both for Gents and Children, surpasses all other attempts.

inr'Call and get one of our New SPRING HATS, if you want to 
be happy.

Shoes and Slippers in great variety. Ox-blood and tan colors in 
Slippers,

with Hose to match. A beautiful line of Mattings from 10 etc. up. 
Cial*DPtR

from 15 cts. up. We offer 5 rolls of Choice Extra Super, all wool, at 5
0 cents

per yard. Dinner Sets of Dishes, $8.50, 100 pieces. Bargain departme
nt NV i I I

be alive for the next 30 days.

SPECIAL SHOE SALE TO TAKE PLACE.
100 pairs of Shoes and Slippers at* to the regular price. 10 to 15 pieces

of Dress Goods, to go at half price. 1500 yards of Best Calico at 5 cent
s. 1000

yards of g:.sod Gingham at 5 cents. We have a number of Jobs to clo
se out,

and if you will call, we will soon convince you that our words are tr
ue and

that we have the goods to deliver, Hats 5 and 10 cents; were 25 and 5
0 cents.

Come and see us and you will not regret it. Though we're thankful fur

past favors:we hope to see you during the Spring trade. Respectfully,

New Windsor, Md. GEO. C. TkNE)]ERS
M'Coupons will be discontinued after May 1st., 1897.

GEO. H. BIRNIE & CO.
BRNKERS,

Geo. H. Birnie,
John E. Davidson,

TANEYTOWN,

MEMBERS OF THE FIRM.

Edward E. Roindollar,
Edwin H. Sharetts,

Discount business notes. Receive deposits subject
Make collections on all points.

SAVINGS BANK DEPARTMENT. Interest paid on Time

SPECIAL RATES to Weekly and Monthly Depositors.

I1D.

Henry Swope,
Samuel Swope.

to check.

Deposits,

A LIST OF SPECIALS
WHILE THEY LAST!

One lot of Men's medium light plaid serge finish Suits,

strictly all wool [regular wholesale price $9.00 a Suit]

bought the lot at a big sacrifice and the price is only $S.00

a suit.
• -Q.-AM.-4. •

One lot of Men's light plaid suits [beautiful pattern, and

worth $8.00] at the special bargain price of $6.50 a suit.

One lot of Men's navy blue soft finish cassimere suits

[all wool, and easily worth $7.00] while they last the price

will .be $5.00 a suit.
• •••• •41•1•• •

A mixed lot of men's suits [old stock, but most of them

in good condition] at prices from $2.5o to $5.00 a suit.

Several lots of Children's Reefer Suits, sizes from 5 to 7

years [regular beauties] prices from $2.00 to $3.50 a suit.

Newburg "Never-rip" Pantaloons and Overalls [if you ever

wore a pair you know them] at prices beginning at 75c.

Men's Crash Suits [for hot weather,] good service and

good style at a $3.00 price per suit.

Men's Dogskin driving Gloves [the greatest bargain you

ever saw] look like Sf.00 gloves, but they are only 50c.

Men's White Unlaundered Shirts [good material and work-

manship and usually sold at 50c] special price now, only 40e.

Men's Waterproof Collars, either standing or turn-down;

[advertised by others as "Celluloid"] only 5c each. Regu-

lar new goods.

Cuffs of the same [would seem cheap at 25c] we are selling

at ioc a pair.
--- • •••• •111111•••• •- -

Hundreds of additional "Specials" in stock, without space

to mention.
- • ••• •

1%\TCI-LA.1=2),
CLOTHIR7AND FURNISHER,

Taneytown, Md.

po pu 1 a r Dry
 -•••••11:Kre..•,•••••••••••••,S•01.=•

(pods Store!
TANEYTOWN, MD.

V7=A_1•71' &l<001\TS.

WESTERN MARYLAND R. R,
Connecting with P. & in. It. at Shippens-

111/).."' itt  
tins) (iii tvslnui'g; Norfolk & 

%la'teHstacigunerits.::
•

town mid Cherry Ruie Penna. It It. at Bruce-
vine and Hanover. and P. W. & B., N. C. and

X. I'. Railroads at Union Station. Baltimore, .

M(7.-11.

Schedule in effect March 60., 1897.1 

• A.M.! A M. I P.M. P 14.
..... 10 10 5 32 lc Cherra• Run, or g 48 2 111 900

:10 1 'I' Ili l'001 
841 -11'0  '!OY):. 1 47: -.Clear Spring.. . 81157 8f1'75 848

  10 51: Charlton-- - 8 27 149 837
  1.0 40. 6 Ur Wain:lama.' P. V. 8 18, 1 39 8 27
  11 • • 1 • 1 g / 8 051 1 21 805

A.M. p.29

8 20r.„.)p.m..11A6.7,11(.111'leWilli0113SpOrlar  

a.m.!P.M P.m
*4 151 1)1171 7 021Ie Hagerstown at '13a12 15 800
4281 223: 7 201...t Iliewsville . . . . . IL 59 746
4 351 25?: 7 271. -Stnithsburg r 10 51 7314
44)1 241 7 36. ....Edgemont.... 7 01111 44% 734
. 230 7 Suer ..Higldield../e 6 53 11 :18 719

I 
A.M. ?.M.

' A7.'1,01. • Ie iii(c41/3
48

  :31 12.211 18 41:1; ...Gettysburg, ..... 31; P64. 41P
4 la 9 et -New Oxford.- ..... 10 01 55 :563,

 Hanover 
44 ;4':13 « r...Porters ...le   

9 46
9;32 527

P.M. A.M. A.M.

I I
A A. M.

i :,:11.11 28 7114
6411

, ... .110 40 634
,,e; :051 620
I; i" 72

lc, 101
•• ; i !II 542

. ..... ..... y e411 ,,.. ••• .1 III!
;I ..... I "I 10 307
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9 
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01. Summer + Goods -+ at Special Prices '10

A Dollar never bought so much as it does now, and the

tirful.uleto spend that dollar is when that dollar is most pow-

erful.

We offer this week, an aggregation of values throughout our

store, never before deemed possible.

Laces of the most desirable makes, at prices to suit the times.

Embroideries-never cheaper in price than now.

1AL7-SH DRESS PRE3RICS,
Home and Foreign make. New French Organdies. New Irish

Dimities in great variety. New Dress Linens, embroideries to

match. New Percales, new Lawns, new Lappettes, 121c a yard.

SILKS FOR ALL--:19c to $1.10 a yard.

Bargains in plain White and Black India Silks. Fancy Taf-

feta Silks for Waists, Dresses and Trimmings. Black and Fig-

ured Silks.
Special Bargain in Table Linen, 25c; worth 50c. Marseilles

Quilts and Bed Spreads-all prices. RIBBONS, Gros Grain

and Moire
' 

all the desirable shades and widths.

24-inch Martha Washington Handkerchiefs, worth 10c; at 5c.

Spring Roller Blinds, 5c up. Table Oilcloth, 1211c a yard.

-•=1(-- II 0 S I 1E HY.
This is one of the Hosiery opportunities that come but sel-

dom. Men's Heavy Half Hose, 5c. Our line is complete.

PRIVATE SALE.
The undersigned offers at Priyate

Sale, his desirable small farm, con-

taining,

i„ a 13 321 ACRES OF LAND.
igh state of cultivation, the im-

provements on which consist of a good
frame dwelling of six rooms, barn
37x61 feet and other necessary out-
buildings. The property is situate
on the Westminster road east of Tan-

eytown, opposite "Antrim," the home
of Att'y-Gen'l Clabaugh, and is a 5
minutes walk from Taneytown. 'rime
land all fronts on the public road,the

dwelling being 200 feet from the road.
The land is very desirable for blind-

ing lots; contains two springs and a

well and a great variety of fruit trees.
The house and laven are well shaded,

and the property is a very desirable
one in every way, Will either sell,or

exchange for a larger farm. Call on,
or address.

CHARLES C. CURRENS,
Taneytown, Md.

DO YOU WANT EMPLOYMENT
At hoane or traveling with GOOD
PAY? If so, write us for particulars,
giving age and occupation. You can
work all or part time, and the work

No-To-Rae for Fifty Cents. 
is LIGHT AND EASY. Address,

Guaranteed tobacco habit cure, makes weak THE HAW
KS NURSERY COMPANY,

Men strong, blood pure. 50c, $1. All druggists. 3-13.4m ROCHESTER, N. Y.

RAMBLER CYCLORIUM,
We have in stock,

'97 RAMBLERS at $80.00,
the Best and Strongest Wheel made,

fitted with the G. & J. Detachable

Tires.

'97 IDEALS, $50.00,
fitted with G. &. J. Tires. "Ideals"

with the New Brunswick time, $40.00.

Second-hand Wheels in stock.
Full line of Bicycle Sundries.

Call and examine our Wheels before

purchasing elsewhere; we can please

you, at the Rambler Cycloritim, El-

liot's New Building, Taneytown, Md.

H. B. MILLER,
Rambler Agent.

, P. M. A.M. ,, I
' 5 2; 9 38 lc... Porters ....d.r1   1 9 3_5 443

1 r 21 '14' ,sliring Grove ..   9 24'1 4:1-.
  r ft' 10 12 0 r  i',,ri- le   901.4 16

!

'1 /, 10 201
i 112

, 0 ,//...N(..w I era . .1( eei 12 15111 00
i A. M. P. M.,1 I P. . 'A .M. A.M

Baltimore& Curnberlanet Valley R. R.
'Ira) miss leave Hagerstown for Waynesboro,

eleimbet•sburg and Intermediate Stations 6.27
;old 11.10 a. in. and 7.01 p. in., and leave
chambersburg for Hagerstown and Interme-
diate Stations at ills. in. and 1.50 and 3.45 p.m.
Leave Cliambersburg for Shippensbut•g and

Intermediate Statioes 7.15 and 14.01 a. in. and
4.41 p. in., and leave Shippensburg for Chain-
berslai rar and Inta•modiate Stations at 9.21 a.
in. and 1.25 and 8.35 p.

Additioaal tra4ns have Baltimore for Union
Bridge and I nterniediate Stations at 10.17 a .
and 6.10 p. in., and leave Union Bridge for
Baltimore at 1.01 a. in., and 12.50 p. in. daily, •
except Sunday.
Sunday's only-leave Baltimore for Union

Bridge and Intermediate Stations rt 9.30 a. in..
and 2.35 p. rit, and leave Bruceville 6.45 a. in.,
and Union Bridge at 4.05 p.m. -for Baltimore
and Intermediate Stations.
Trains for Frederick leave Br uceville at 8.38,

9.16 and 10.40 a. in , and 5.38 atid 6.25 p. in.
Trains for Litt•lestown and Taneytown leave
Brucevil le at 9.24 a. m. an 13.11 p. m.
Leave Rocky Ridge for Emmitsburg at 8.2a

and 10.40 a. m., and 3.51 and 6.54 p. m. Leave
Ern tuitabit rg for Rocky Ridge at 7.50 and 10.00
a. us., and 2.15 and 4.10 p. m.

Connections at Cherry Run, W. Va.
& 0. passenger trains leave Cherry Run

for Cumberland and intermediate points, No.
13, daily", at 8.49 a. m. Express, No. 55. daily.
2.19. p. m.; Chicago Express, No. 7, daily, at
10.48 p.
Passengers for Cincinnati Limited No. 1,

take No. 53 to Hancock and there transfer to
No. 1.
Passengers for B. & 0. Pittsburg Express,

No. 9. take No. 7 to Hancock and there trans-
fer.
B. &. 0. east bound trains arrive at Cherry

Ruin at 4.01 and 9.28 a. in., and 5.01 p. m.
*Daily. All others daily, except Sunday.
$Stops only to land passengers from Haiti-

more.
.I.M HOOD,Pres't and G en'l Manager.

B. 11. GRISWOLD, Gen'IPassenger Agent.

1897. TIIE SUN ! 1897.
BALTIMORE, MD,

The Pa.per of the People,
For the Peonle and with the Peonle

HONEST IN MOTIVE.
FEARLESS IN EXPRESSION.

SOUND IN PRINCIPLE,. •4

UNSWERVING IN II'S ALLEGIANCE TO
RIGHT THEORIES AND
RIGHT PRACTICES.

The Sun publishes all the news all
the time, but it does not allow its
eolunins to be degraded by unclean.
immoral or purely sensational matter.
Editorially, The thin is the con-

sistent and unchanging champion and
defender of popular rights and inter-
ests against political machines ant‘IF
monopolies of every character. Inde-
pendeut in all timings, extreme in
none. It is for good laws, good
government and gootl order.
By mail 50 cents a month, $6 a year

THE BALTIMORE WEEKLY SUN
--

The Weekly Sun publishes all the
news of each weeks giving complete
accounts of all events of interest
throughout the world. As an Agri-
cultural paper the Weekly thou is un-
serpassed. It is edited by writers of
practical experience, who know
what farming means and what far-
mers want in an agricultural jour-
nal. It contains regular reports of
the work of tine agricultural experi-
ment stations throughout the coun-
try, of the, proceedings of farmers
clubs and institutes, and the discus-
sion of new methods and ideas in
agriculture. Its market renorts, Poul-
try Department and Veterinary col-
umn are particularly valuable to
country readers. Every issue con-
tains Stories, Poems, Household and
Puzzle Columns, a variety of inter-
esting and instActive selected matter
and other features, which make it a
welcome yisitor in city and country
homes alike.
One dollar a year. Inducements to

getters up of clubs for the Weekly
Sun. Both the Daily and Weekly
Sun mailed free of postage in the
United Stated, Canada and Mexico.
Payments invariably in advance.

Address
A. S. ABELL COMPANY, .

Publishers and Proprietors,
Baltimore, Md

TAN El".117OWN MARKETS.
Corrected Weekly.

Flour,  .5.00@6.00 .
Bran, per ton  16.00 . .
White Middlings, per ton., 14.00 f

Timothy Hay, prime, per ton.. 8.00
Mixed Hay, per ton. 5  00a 6.00
Rye Straw.  6.00a 9.00
Wheat,  . .77
Rye. new  .33
Oats. .new.   20
Corn,   25
Butter,(Creamery)  . . 16
Eggs  .08
Hams  .10
Hides  .05
Hogs  4.00
Sheep  2.00
Lambs    3.00
Calves    8.56
Beef Cattle, best  -  4.00
Cows  $25 e $35
Bulloces  2.50
Clover Seed . 6i(07

WESTMINSTER MARKETS,

Furnished Weekly for "The Carroll Record,"
By E. 0. Grunes.

Flour, per barrel  5.00@6.(0
Brau, per ton .15.00@l5.00
Middlings, white;per ton .15.0002j15 00
Wheat, per bushel  81 481
Corn, in ear, per barrel  1.25@1.25
Rye, per bushel  33@33
Oats, per bushel  22@22
Potatoes, per bushels   15@.15

,
BALTIMORE MARKETS.

Corrected Weekly.
Wheat  80880
Corn  28Q30
Oats,    24628
Rye   36@40
Hay, Timothy,  12.00Q14.00
Hay mixed  11.00012.00
Hay, Clover....  . 9.00(011.50
Straw, Rye, bales  14.00(014.50
Straw, Rye blocks 10.00a/10.50
Straw, wheat blocks  .7.00@8.00
Brtin 12.5001.5.00
Middlings  16.50a11.50
Potatoes, new, per bus  25Q30
Sugar, granulated  4.58
Sugar, confec, A  4.46
Beef Cattle, Best 4  2505.00
Beef cattle, Medium...   3.50@3.75
Swine, gross  4.2004.20
Swine, Rough  ... _3.0003.00
Sheep, gross  21041
Lambs, gross  4@5+
ealves gross ...... 440i


