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Locals and pergnials.
Miss Eudora Reindollar Is in the

city on a visit to relatives.

A few snow flakes, the first of the
season, fell here last Sunday.

Calvin T. Friuger is getting timber
ready for a new barn to replace the
one recently burned.

Mr. James L. Unger, wife and
daughter are the guests of his par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. J. Unger, of Wal-
brook.

Dollar wheat again seems to be a
coming possibility, and those who
have not sold are correspondingly

interested.

A piece of poetry received from a
Harney youth, which shows consid.
erable talent, cannot be published
because of its decided political tone.

Daniel Null attended the Lutheran
conference in Westminster this week,
as a delegate from this congregation,
accompanying Rev. D. F. Garland.

The first instalment of descriptions
of election ballots will be found on
our second page. We will be able to
give information from nearly every
state.

A great many people came to this
place on Thursday night to attend
the jubilee, notwithstanding the
weather. The postponement to to-
night, (Friday) gave general satisfac-
tion.

There were many long faces, and a
few broad ones, here, on Thursday
evening—the same as on the morning
after the election, except that those
who wore the long ones on Thursday,"
wore the broad ones after the elec
tion. •
It is reported that a gentleman who

has been here for some time, trying
to do business with our citizens,
skipped the town without paying an
election bet. When a bet is squarely
lost by a square man he will squarely
pay up.

Engineer Linton, of Altoona, as

here on Thursday and made an ex-
amination of the Hockensmith—
Reaver springs for our water supply.
It is reported that he has given the
opinion that they are insufficient for
the purpose.

On Thanksgiving day, the 26th, the
P. 0. S. of A. will erect a new flag
pole for the Public School flag, on
which occasion a brief program will
be rendered; afterwards, the Camp
will attend union services at the Re-
formed church.

Benton Brining received a severe
fall from his horse on Monday, and
injured himself about the face and
shoulder. He was riding along in a
brisk canter, over a field on his farm,
when his horse stepped in a hole and
threw him over its head.

There is quite an array of appli-
cants for the post office in this place,
but the fight promises to be a friend-
ly one and will likely narrow down
to two or three. As all of them are
competent, the public is suie to re-
ceive good service, no matter which
wins.

The RECORD is indebted to Geo. H.
Kuhns, William A. Golden, Daniel
W. Danner and Harry J. Brown, for
the election laws, in book form, of
the states of Michigan, Pennsylvania,
Ohio and Florida. Many others have
sent extracts from the laws sufficient
for our needs.

William Hawk, of Bridgeport, mat
with an accident last Tuesday, on
Frederick St., while driving a pair of
horses attached to a buggy, which
resulted in throwing him head-fore-
most out of the vehicle, giving him a
good shaking up. The buggy and
harness were somewhat da maged.
"Keep in the middle of the road,"
William.

The Delaware (Ohio) Gazette pub-
lished by Abram Thomson, a broth-
er of Thomas D., and Joseph M.,
Thomson, of this place, came out
last Wednesday printed in red ink on
yellow paper, in celebration of the
election of McKinley. A brief editor-
ial expresses great satisfaction at the
result in "our dear old native state,"

Maryland.

P. B. Engler, state secretary, ad-
dressed a union meeting of five Bal-
timore city Camps of the P. 0. S. of
A., in the hail of Camp No. 1., cor.
Park Avenue and Fayette Sts., on
Monday night. On Tuesday night,the
24th, he will meet the East Baltimore
Camps, at Sternberger's Hall, North
Gay St. Three new Camps are in
process of formation in Baltimore,and
will be instituted beimare the end of
the present year.

Mrs. Anna M. Rudolph, a respected
lady of this district, died this Friday
morning about 8 o'clock. Funeral
will be preached at her late home, at
T. H. Fringer's, at 1 p. in., Sunday,
and interment will be in the Luther-
an cemetery. She leaves four chil-
dren; Mrs. T. H. Fringer, Mrs. A. J.
Hahn of Tyrone,Pa., M. H. Rudolph,
Wichita, Kansas, and P. 0. Rudolph,
Alva, O. T. She had been in poor
health for some years, but was con-
fined to her bed but two weeeks. She
was in her 71st. year.
Assuming that the electoral vote

of McKinley and Hobart will stand
at 278, David Trimmer and Dr. F. H.
Being came nearest to predicting the
number, the former naming 277, and
the latter, 279. Both, however, were
wrong on four states. With the ex-
ception of the division of the Wyom-
ing vote, the editor of the RECORD
correctly named all the states but
two, though the sum of the vote was
291. A large number of estimates
were received from as far west as
Kansas; McKinley's being placed as
low as 168, and as high as 346.

NOTES FROM EVERYWHERE..

Items of current news boiled down,

for busy readers.
--

Governor Lowndes has been en-
gaged during the week in hearing

applications for pardon. So far,only

one has been granted, but there may

be more.

Miss Annie Hoke, of Einmitsburg,

lost a bet on the election in which

she was to wheel Mr. Charles C. Rowe

to the east end of the town. The bet

was paid last Saturday evening.

Fortunes have been made this year

out of the manufacture of campaign

buttons. The Republican National
committee has distributed more but-

tons than there are men, women and

children in the United States.

Joseph Jefferson, the veteran come-

dian, will appear at Ford's Opera

house, Baltimore, next week in a
repertoire of his favorite plays, in-

cluding the time-honored "Rip Van
Winkle," "Cricket on the Hearth"

and "Lend me five Shillings."

A twelve acre field on the farm of

Geo. Trostle,of Huntington township,

Pa., several years ago yielded 1,800
bushels of corn; it breaks all former

records this year by yielding 2.100
bushels,says the York Springs Comet.

James R. Neely, of the same town-

ship, evidently comes next in line, he

having 61 acres that yielded 1,040

bushels.

The state board of health at a

meeting on Thursday decided to

transfer the appropriation of $200

made by the state tor the compila-

tion of vital statistics to the work of

collecting information as to the ex-
tent of the prevalence of typhoid
fever in Marylan3 during the year.
The appropriation is entirely mad
equate for the compilation of state
vital statistics.

An exchange tells of a practical
joke they are playing on the news
paper men. It is worked this way:
"Take a sheet of ordinary writing

paper, fold carefully and enclose
money sufficient to pay all arrears

and one year in advance. Keep an

eye on the editor, and if a smile
adorns his face the trick works like a
charm. Now is the time to play the

joke."

It is understood that the Court of
Appeals will affirm the decision of
Judge Ritchie in the Creager-Hooper
contest in Balthnore,theieby sustain-

ing the legality of the ordinance
passed by the last City Council di-
vesting the Moyor of his power to
appoint the city collector. The opin-

ion of the court will probably be
handed down by Judge Russum, who
delivered an opinion on the same
case in the preliminary contest.

The price of wheat took another
move upward in Baltimore on Thure-
day. Decreased arrivals in the North-
west, together with the foreign de-
mand and conditions in markets
abroad, were factors in the advance.
At the Baltimore Chamber of Com-
merce spot wheat closed at 91i cents,
again breaking all records for the
year. Wednesday's closing price was
89 cents a bushel. Wheat for Decem-
ber delivery closed at 90i cents a
bushel, an advance of. three cents
over Wednesday's price.

The first conviction in Baltimore
under the law passed by the last
Legislature for the punishment of
wife-deserters, occurred in the Crimi-
nal Court on Thursday. The man in
the case was Win. H. Davenport; col-
ored, 231 North Brue street. His wife
Ellen testified that lie told her he did
not want any wife, and that when
she went after him to ask him to sup-
port her infant he shook money in
her face, but refused her request. He
was first sentenced to one month in
the House of Correction, but upon
his promise to live with his wife the
sentence was changed to a fine of $10.
This, with the costs, amounted to
$23.91.

Andrew Jackson, colored, aged
twenty years, a prisoner at the Mary-
land Penitentiary, was on Saturday
morning last, shot in one of the shoe
shops of the institution, by Deputy
Keeper John B. Wollering, and died
a few hours later from the effects of
the wound. When fired upon, Jack-
son was within a few feet of the of-
ficer, standieg in a threatening atti-
tude, with a hammer in one hand
and a knife in the other. The weap-
on used by the officer was a pistol.
The bullet entered the left side of the
prisoner, just below the ribs, causing
internal hemorrhage. A jury, em-
pannelled by Coroner Buddenbohn,
decided that the killing was justifia-
ble, it having been shown that the
officer fired in self-defense.

No one has yet claimed the bag of.
money found by E. S. Spangler, of
York township, while covering the
barn of J. B. Horne, at Innersville,
near York, Pa. Unless some one
calls soon, Constable Raiker will turn
it over to William C. Solomon and
Mr. Spangler, who found the bag.
The bag contains over four thousand
dollars. Those in the neighborhood
believe it has been in its hiding place
ever since the late war. About the
time the Confederate troops, under
General John B. Gordon, invaded
the borough of York, many persons
fled with their valuables out the Bal-
timore and Chanceford pikes,and the
supposition is that they hid this bag
of money in the rafters of the barn,
where they had slept, to keep the
Confederates from getting it.

The Parade To-night.

The great republican parade to
have been held here last night,
(Thursday) has been postponed until
tonight, (Friday 13th.) Should it
again be rainy, it will come off on
Monday night.

.THE TEAM WAS STOLEN.

A Further History ot the Late Shoot-

ing Affair.

A marked copy of last weeks issue

of the RECORD, addressed to post-
master or constable, Campbelltown,

Pa., containing an account of the ar-
rest of Eldridge and Huhnes last
Thursday, by constable B. S. Miller,

led to the return to the owner of the
horse and wagon which the • two
young men had stolen on the night of

the election, and were making away
with.
As the wagon contained the maker's

name and address, and as it was com-
paratively new and evidently manu-
factured specially for some particular
line of business, it was very natural
to suppose that its owner resided near
where it was made. Acting on this
idea, a copy of the RECORD was mail-
ed, as stated, last Friday evening,and
on Saturday afternoon it was in the
hands of Henry Shaffer, its owner.
Mr. Shaffer at once telegraphed Con-
stable Miller that the team was his;
and, on Monday morning lie arrived
and identified the property,and later,
visited the prisoners in Westminster,
and indicted Eldridge (Hoch) with
theft, through the grand jury now in
session.
It appears that Eldridge, the one

shot in the knee, gave an assumed
name, and that his true name is Fred
Boch. Be has been a floater in the
neighborhood of Campbelltown for
the past six years; going and coming,
and working with a number of peo-
ple. His companion, Hulmes, was
unknown to Mr. Shaffer. The wagon
stolen was used for attending the
Harrisburg market, and was built
with glass sides and front, in order to
keep out cold. It seems probable
that the thieves were making for
Baltimore, where the team would no
doubt have been sold; and, had they
not entered into the altercation with
Mr. Shields,it is very likely that they
would have succeeded.
Hoch is now suffering considerably

from his wound in the knee,and may
have a serious time of it. His leg is
badly swollen and there may be some
injury to the joint which will leave
him with a stiff leg for life; in any
case, he is likely to have plenty of
time to nurse it,both in the Maryland
and Pennsylvania penitentiaries. It
seems probable that Hulmes is a less
hardened criminal and that he will
escape more easily than Hoch, as it
is not charged that he did any of the
shooting, and it is thought would
have surrendered to the officers with-
out trouble. Hulines is unknown to
Mr. Shaffer, and may have been pick-
ed up by Hoch after the team .was
stolen.

Annual C. E. Convention.

The annual convention of the
Christian Endeavorers of Maryland
will be held in Brantly church, Balti-
more, on Tuesday, Wednesday and
Thursday, November 17th, 18th and
19th. Extensive preparations are be-
ing made for this Convention and the
indications are that it will prove an
exceedingly helpful as well as success-
ful Convention.
The Brandy Church is a large,com-

modious structure seating 1600 per
sons and if the interest manifested in
the Convention continues the place
will be filled to overflowing by En-
deavorers.
The Baltimore City C. E. Union

has decided to entertain, without
charge, all delegates who represent
country societies,and this will doubt-
less bring a great many people from
the counties.
The programme is unusually attrac-

tive and men of national reputation
are engaged to speak.
Tuesday afternoon will be given

over to enrollment of out of town
delegates and preparatory devotional
services. The evening session will
attract great attention; the subject
will be •'Armenia, the Martyr race of
the 19th Century" and Rev. Freder-
ick D. Green of New York; Miss Mar-
garet W. Leitch, of Ceylon, and Rev.
Dr. Allan H. Tupper of Balthuore,
will be the speakers. On Wednesday,
addresses will be made by pastors
and laymen of the Maryland church-
es. The evening of Wednesday, Rev.
Dr. John F. Beckley of New York'
will speak on "What can C. E. do for
better Sabbath observance." Hon.
Homer L. Castle of Pittsburg, Pa.,
will speak on "The Christian's Right
Place." On Thursday morning there
will be confeiences on various Chris-
tian Endeavor work led by prominent
laymen and an address by Rev. E. H.
Del k,of Hagerstown,on "The strength
and weakness of Christian Endeav-
orers." Rev. Chas. Roads of Virginia,
will speak on "The Joy of Soul Win-
ning."
One of the most interesting features

of the convention will be the Junior
Rally on Thursday afternoon. 1000
Juniois will assemble and listen to a
talk by Rey. Maltbie D. Babcock, D.
D. Other exercises will make this an
interesting meeting. Thursday, pres-
ident L. B. Whitinan,D. D., of Wash-
ington, D. C. will make an address
on "Every Talent for Christ."
The Convention will close by a ser-

mon by Rev. J. Wilbur Chapman, D.
D., of Philadelphia.
At noon, during the days of the

Convention, Evangelistic Services
will be held down town, for wen, and
Dr. Wharton, of Baltimore, and Rev.
J. Wilbur Chapman will be in charge.
NOTE—The above is from the Press

Committee of the Md. C. E. Union,
H. N. Hanna, chairman.

Official dispatches from Havana de-
scribe an engagement in which Gen-
eral Weyler is said to nave defeated
the insurgents. Reports from Cuba
received by steamer at Key West,
Fla., are to the effect that General
Weyler was repulsed.

MIDDLE CONFERENCE

Of the Maryland Synod held at

Westminster.

The semi-annual meeting of the
Middle Conference of the Maryland
synod Lutheran church met in open-
ing session in Grace Lutheran church,
Westminster,on Monday evening,9th.
inst. Rev. J. U. Asper, the retiring
president of conference, preached the
sermon. His theme was "TLe con-
straining love of Christ." His sermon
was a strong presentation of the sub-
ject. Less then half the conference
was present at the opening service.
Tuesday morning the attendance was
much augmented, and after a devo-
tional service led by Rev. M. L. Beard,
the conference proceeded to elect its
officers. Prof. J. H. Turner, of Lath-
erville, was chosen president, Rev. R.
L. Patterson,Union Bridge,secretary-
and Rev. P. H. Miller, Westminster,
treasurer.
"The sacred nature of the vow of

church membership" was discussed
by Revs. G. W. naughtnan, M. L.
Beard and A. H. Burk. Others partici-
pated in the general discussion of

the subject. The opinion of the

brethren seemed to be that there was

occasion for more strict requirements

in the reception of church members,

that too many came into the church
without a dime sense of the seriousness

and sacredness of the relation. Rev.

M. L. Reinsburg followed with a ser-

mon on the subject, "The hand of

God in the Reformation."
"The Scriptural doctrine of absolu-

tion" was discussed by Dr. G. C. Has-
karl, Prof. Turner and Rev. R. L.
Patterson. This subject brought
out a continued general discussion in
which Revs. Beard, Kuhlman. Pat-
terson, Haskarl, Turner, Remsburg,
Miller and the writer took part. The
subject proved to be a very fruitful
and interesting one, and awakened
more than ordinary enthusiasm of
discussion. The brethren, however,
seemed to get nearer together at the
end than they were at the beginning
of the discussion, although there was
not entire agreement.
At the evening session of Tuesday

the conference resolved itself into a
Christian Endeavor meeting and list-
ened to addresses by Rev. Renssburg
on the "Timeliness and Significance
of the C. E. society;" by Rev. R. L.
Patterson on 'The pledge;" by Rev.
Luther Kuhlman on "Christian En-
deavor Possibilities." The latter two
brethren took the places of Revs. Mc-
Sherry and Reinewald who Were un-
able to be present. The Mid week
Prayer Meeting service was then tak-
en up, and, on motion,the writer was
given 15 minutes to open the discus-
sion, on the theme, "The need of it to
the individual." Rev. Chas. Ritter
followed in a five minute talk on "Its
effect on the life of the church," Revs.
Patterson. Turner, Kuhlman, Miller
and the writer took part in the gen-
eral discussion which followed. A
patient audience filled the church
until nearly ten o'clock at this ser-
vice.
Wednesday morning the subject of

"Missions" was very ably discussed
by Revs. Kulihnan and Diehl. In the
general discussion Revs. R. S. Patter-
son,of Woodsboro,and Miller,of West-
minster, took prominent parts. Rev.
Kuhlman took the position that we
are all wrong in our plan of raising
money for missions—that we ought to
go back to the scriptural method of
laying by each week "as the Lord has
prospered us," and so establish in
every home a "Lord's treasury."
Brother Kuhlman thinks the spas-
modic efforts which we make for the
Lord's work are not in keeping with
St. Paul's direction to the church in
the matter of "gatherings" for be-
nevolence. The writer has long felt
the justice of the position taken in
this discussion, and hopes the church
may speedily come to realize that it
is the part of wisdom to colopt it.
Rev. L. Kuhlman reported on the

Young Lutheran and recommended
instead of two editions that hereafter
there be but one edition for the Mid-
dle Conference. It was adopted,and
the conference proceeded to an elec-
tion of editor-in-chiet,resulting in the
choice of Rev. L. Kuhlman. A resolu-
tion looking to an organization of all
the young people's societies of the
Lutheran churches in Maryland was
adopted. On motion of Rev. R. S.
Patterson it was resolved, "That it is
the sense of this body that any mem-
ber of our churches who signs an ap-
plication for liquor license ought to
be disciplined."
At the invitation of Rev. Chas. L.

Ritter, pastor of the Burkittsville
charge, it was resolved to meet in the
Burkittsville church at the regular
session next spring.
Pastor Miller and his good people

entertained the conference very pleas-
antly, doing all in their power to
make us welcome and comfortable.
The conference was the most inter-
esting time writer has ever had privil-
ege of attending and must have been
profitable to the congregation in
whose midst it met. We may indulge
the hope that Trinity congregation
Taneytown, will have the benefit of
such a meeting at no late date.

Rev. R. S. Patterson preached the
closing sermon of the conference on
the subject, "The abiding presence
of Christ in the Church." The confer-
'ence adjourned at noon on Wednes-
day.

D. FRANK GARLAND.

There are 11to,000,000 old copper pen-
nies somewhert. Nobody knows what
hae become of them, except once in a
while a single specimen turns up in
change. A few years ago 4,400,000 two
cent pieces were set afloat. Three mil-
lions of these are still outstanding.
Three million three cent nickel pieces
are scattered over the United States,
but it is very rarely that one is seen.

THE CIRCUIT COURT.

List of Cases disposed of During

the week.

Court convened Nov. 9th, 1896, with
Chief Judge Roberts on the bench,
Gershoui Huff,crier; Howard Gelman
messenger; William L. Farver, bailiff
to Grand Jury; Josephus Sheeler,
bailiff to petit jury; George A. Biehl
and Benjamin J. Matthias, bailiffs at
the gates.
George A. Shower was appointed

foreman of the Grand Jury. There
were 97 trial, 19 appeal and 15 origi-
nal cases on docket. The following
cases were disposed of since the open-
ing of Court:
John T. Smith, appellant, vs Kir-

wain Bros. Grain Co., appellee; ap-
peal from Lewis. Tried before the
Court; judgment reversed with costs.
Brooks for appellant, and P. 1. for
appellee.

Mary Gibson, appellant, vs state of
Md.; appeal from Baer. Tried before
the Court; adjudged guilty and sen-
tenced to pay a fine of $1.00 and coste.
Brooks for appellant, and J. M. Reif-
snider for appellee.
Marcessa Hawkins vs state; appeal

from _Baer. Appeal dismissed, and
proceedings quashed. Brooks for ap-
pellant, and J. M. Reifsuider for ap-
pellee.
John Gibson Jr. vs state; appeal

from Baer. Appeal dismissed and
proceedings quashed. Brooks for ap-
pellant, and J. M. Reifsuider for ap-
pellee.
Levi B. Hoff, appellant, vs state,

appellee; appeal from Naee. Tried be-
fore court; appeal dismissed, appel-
lant discharged and appellee to pay
costs. Henning for appellant, and
J. M. Reifsnider for appellee.
Henry Zeller, appellant, vs Eman-

uel Stoner appellee; appeal from Cun-
ningham. Tried before jury; verdict
for appellee, and judgment affirmed.
Brooks for appellant, and Reifsnider
and Reifsnider for appellee.
Howard Seitz, appellant, vs state,

appellee; appeal from Baer. Tried
before court; appeal dismissed, and
appellant to pay all costs and stand
committed to custody of sheriff, until
all costs are paid. Brooks for appel-
lant and J. M. Reifsnider for appellee.
Hamlet A. Shipley, appellan', vs

Henry Streaker, appellee; appeal
from Dorsey. Tried before jury; ver-
dict for appellee,and judgment affirm-
ed. Stocksdale, Reifsnider and Reif-
snider for appellant, and Steele for
appellee.
John E. Norwood, appellant, vs

One 0. Miller, appellee; appeal from
Dorsey, (2 cases). Tried before the
court; held sub curia. Clabaugh &
Roberts for appellant, and Steele for
appellee.
Reuben A. Smith, appellant, vs

Joseph A. Leppo, appellee. Tried
before jury: judgment released with
costs and judgment in favor of appel-
lant for $4.75. Henning for appel
lant, and Reifsnider & Reifsnider for
appellee.
Clarence Hill, appellant, vs state,

appellee; appeal from Baer; larceny,
Tried before court; verdict guilty and
sentenced to 5 days in jail. Brooks
for appellant and J. M. Reifsnider
for state.
Wm. J. Tracy vs Northern Central

R. R. Co.; case remaoved from Balti-
more county. Action for damages
$25,000. On Trial. Hussey, Mitchell
& Stocksdale for plaintiff, and Carter
and Bond for defendant.

Notes from the Church of God in
Uniontown.

(For the RECORD.)

Sabbath evening, November 8th., a
"Song Service" was held in the audi-
ence room. The service was conduct-
ed by Prof. Jesse F. Billinyer. The
exercises were opened with an An-
them, "I love the Lord." After the
usual exercises of reading the Scrip-
tures and prayer, an address was
given by the leader,on "Music," which
contained variety of thought, and
was highly appreciated by the large
and attentive audience. Quite a
number of songs were rendered; Miss
Eva E. Gilbert presided at the crgan.
The pastor, Elder G. W. Seilhauser

is holding his protracted meeting at
Frizzellburg.
The repairs of damages done by the

recent storm are nearing completion
as rapidly as possible.
A Packard organ has recently been

purchased for the audience room,
which was dedicated Sabbath night,
October, 1st., after a Musicale. Miss
Ida Diffenbaugh, of Westininster,and
Mr. and Mrs. Grant Heltabridle de-
serve mention for the selections they
rendered; also a solo by Miss, Go-
rinne Hollenberry, 4 years old, en-
titled "Let a little sunshine in." Mrs.
Heckle Reightler gave a recitation in
her usual pleasing style. The event
will long be remembered as one of
profit and pleasure.
The congregation have decided to

adopt congregational singing with
Mrs. Carrie Messier as organist, Miss
Eva E. Gilbert, assistant, and Prof.
Jesse F. Billtuyer. leader.

MARRIED.

MYERS—LINN.—On Nov, 5th, at
Mt. Joy parsonage, near Harney, by
Rev. G. W. Minnick, Mr. Charles E.
Myers to Miss Cora L Linn.

CLICNISON—BUCKEY.—On Nov .11th,
in the Reformed church, in Union
Bridge, by Rev. K. 0. Spessard, Mr.
J. Walter Clemson to Miss Lula
K. Buckey,
FORREST—SPURRIE R.—On Novem-

ber 11th., in Baltimore. by Rev. Wil-
liam Griffith, Mr. Clarence H. For-
rest, to Mrs. Helen M. Spurrier.
SINNOTT—DELPHEY.—On the 10th.,

in time Catholic church, Westminster,
Mr. James Sinnott, of Westminster,
to Miss Addle Delphey of Union
Bridge.
WRIGHT—MYERS.—On November

11th., near Mayberry, by Elder Solo-
mon Stoner, Mr. William W. Wright
to Miss Cora A. Myers.

ortriespondence.
Union Bridge.

Mr. Ira Morningstar has resigned
the position as stenographer in the
office of the master of machinery
here, and is attending Bryant &
Stratton's Business College, of Balti-
more, Md.
Mr. F. M. Ogle is painting St.

James' Lutheran church.
Rev, R. L. Patterson and family

spent several days this week in West-
minster, where he was attending con-
ference.
Mr. Frank Pearre, of Frederick,

Md., was in town on Monday last.
Mr. M. C. Keefer, who has been

clerking in Mr. Win. Wood's store,
has accepted a position in the W. M.
R. R. Co's paint shop here.
Mr. James Sinnott, of Westmins-

ter, Md., and Miss Addie, youngest
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Del-
phey, of this place, took the fast mail
train here on Tuesday evening for
Westminster, where they were mar-
ried in the Catholic church of that
place. The happy couple returned
to the home of the bride, on the 8.30
p. in. train, when they were greeted
by a shower of rice. They were sere-
naded later in the evening.
A pretty wedding was solemnized

at St. Paul's Reformed church of this
place on Wednesday afternoon at 3-
o'clock, the contracting parties being
Miss Lulu K. Hockey, daughter of
Hun. and Mrs. D. E. Buckey, and Mr.
Walter Clemson. Rev. K. 0. Speesard,
the pastor, performed the ceremony.
The members of the church, had it
very tastefully and prettily decorated
with potted plants, &c., the church
was also darkened. The wedding
march was played by Miss Minerva
Miller. Mr. and Mrs. Clemson left on
the 4 p. m. train for a wedding tour.
Dr. Dehoff and wife, of York, Pa.,

visited 'friends on Wednesday.
The McKinley & Hobart Sound

Money club has adjourned subject to
the call of the president. They de-
cided at their last meeting, not to
hold any demonstration here.
Ur. and Mrs. Charles Miller, of

Johnsville, Md., took the noon train
from here on Thursday.
It is reported that a wild cat has

been see in town, by several resi-
dents.

Copperville.

Miss Mary Galt, of this place, visit-
ed Miss Eva Gilbert, of Uniontown,
from Saturday till Monday last.
Mrs. Dr. Rinehart and her daugh-

ter, Mrs. Win. Arthur,of Frizzellburg,
visited Mrs. H. T. Wantz one day last
week. Mrs. Rinehart was quite en-
thusiastic over the result of the elec-
tion, and declared her intention to
shake hands with all good republi-
cans around Copperville.
Mr. Win. Keefer raised his new barn

on Wednesday. Mr. '1'. A. Martin,
the builder, had everything in place
and everything went together nicely.
The recent rains have had the ef-

fect of making the wheat grow rapid-
ly, and it now appears to be in a con-
dition to stand the winter.
Fanners are busy plowing their

corn ground for next year. Some re-
port the ground as being too wet to
plough.
The most of the wells and springs

are still short of water.
Mrs. Debbie Flickinger, of this

place, is rebuilding her barn which
was destroyed by the storm in Sep-
tember.
Some of our farmers are selling

their wheat for fear that it might get
lower; others are waiting for it to go
to a dollar a bushel. Unfortunately
for some, they sold their entire crop
early in the season at 55c.
Mr. Bendigo Newcomer, who had

the misfortu se to be thrown off of a
load of fodder at E. 0. Garner's, on
Monday before the election, causing
a very bad sprain of his ankle f row
which he suffered very much, and
which caused him to lose his vote, is
improving slowly.

Gamber.

As the great political contest is
over, and the country has settled
down to business again, and the man
who bet on the right side is wearing
a new hat, and timings in general are
pursuing the even tenor of their way,
I will endeavor to cite a few of the
current events of our neighborhood.
Mrs. Lewis Shipley entertained the

L. A. S. at her hospitable home on
Thursday, October 29th. The evening
was passed in the work of the society,
conducted by the president, Mrs.
Joseph Caple,vocal and instrumental
music, conversation, etc., until sup-
per was announced,when all repaired
to the dining room where a table
groaned under its load of good things.
to which all present did ample jus-
tice. Among those present were M r.
and Mrs. Lewis Shipley and family,
Mrs. Joseph Caple.Mr. and Mrs. J. M.
Williams, Mr. and Mrs. Jabez A.
Bariles, Mrs. John Braning and son,
Mrs. Joshua Peeling,Miss Annie Mur-
ray, Mrs. Horace Shipley and child,
Mrs. A. M. Gamber,Mrs. John Stocks-
dale, Mrs. Rechel G-riffee, Mr. and
Mrs. R. E. Barnes, Mrs. Mollie Bra-
ning and children, Mrs. J. W. Sellers,
Mrs. Margaret Haines, Mrs. Dulauey
and child, Airs. Marthe Shipley;
Messrs Willie Heinrick and Jack
Dull of Balthnore.
Mr. Jacob Powder has finished saw-

ing and now has his barn ready for
the carpenters.
W. S. Gamber, Esq., who has been

suffering with eczema in his left leg,
is, we are glad to say, nearly well
again.
A fine young inane belonging to Mr.

N. Benson became frightened and
ran over a pile of posts breaking her
leg.

Emmitsburg.

On last Saturday night, Miss Annie
Hoke cancelled her election bet with
Mr. Chas. C. Rowe, by wheeling humu
from the Emma House to the east
end. Promptly at eight o'clock she
started, headed by the Emmitsburg
Cornet band, with quite a large
crowd following; the wheel barrow
was beautifully decorated with ever-
greens and flags. She made but one
rest, which was on the pavement of
Annan, Horner & Co's banking house.
On Tuesday night, the republicans

celebrated the recent victory by an
illumination and torch -light proces-
sion. It was one of the largest pro-
cessions which has been known for
years. Mr. Reno S. Harp, of Freder-
ick, was the speaker. The houses
were al: beautifully decorated, but
especially Annan, Horner & Co's
banking lasase, and Dr. C. D. Eichel-
berger's dwelling. During the proces-
sion a horse belonging to Mr. Paxton
Reilly fell and dislocated one of its
shoulders.
Dr. R. L. Annan and wife made a

visit to Hagerstown. The doctor at-
tended the medical convention.

Bridgeport.

Our farmers are through gathering
their corn, which is a very good crop.
and are now busy doing their Fall
plowing.
Some of our Gold advocates are

very jubilant since the election of
Major McKinley, and seem to think
that gold will flow in a golden stream
now, or perhaps grow on pine trees.
Look out for the stream, friends, and
be sure to gather the eggs as they are
laid, but do not kill the goose think-
ing to find a nest of eggs, for you will
thud her just like any other goose.
Messrs Geo. A. Clabaugh and Ed-

ward Conover took a spin on their
wheels; they went to Baltimore on
Saturday and returned on Monday.
They report having had a good time
and a fine ride.
Mr. Jno. T. Yingling and wife of

Libertytown, spent Sunday with
their daughter, Mrs. E. F. Smith.
Our school under the careful direc-

tion of Mr. Joseph Harner is progress-
ing rapidly. He has about 50 pupils
now with a very regular attendance,
showing that the patrons are not
slow to avail themselves of the efforts
of their teacher, who so jealously la-
bors for his pupils.

Forrest—Spurner.

Mrs. Helen M. Spurrier was married
Wednesday afternoon to Mr. Clar-
ence H. Forrest by Rev. William
Griffith at his residence, 512 North
Gilmor street Baltimore. The wed-
ding was a very quiet one, only a few
friends being present. The bride wore
a French broadcloth traveling cos-
tume, with hat and gloves to match,
and carried La France roses. After
the wedding Mr. and Mrs. Forrest
went on a trip to the North. On their
return they will live at the northwest
corner of Lexington and Carey streets.
Mr. Forrest is secretary of the Mer-
chants and Manufacturers' Associa-
tion. He was recently secretary to
Mayor Hooper, and was formerly one
of the most valued members of the
city staff of the Sun.

Howard County Farmers.

A meeting of Howard county farm-
ers, in accordance with the law creat-
ed by the last legislature for estab-
lishing in the state a department of
farmers' institutes, was held in Elli
cott City, on Monday. Mr. William
L. Amoss,director of the department,
was present and carried into effect
the object of the meeting, that of or-
ganizing an executive committee for
the county, and also committees for
the several districts. After orraniza-
tion, in compliance with Mr. Amoss'
request, ten subjects were then select-
ed, from which a program will be
prepared for discussion at the insti-
tute meeting, to be held in Baltimore
some time during the cowing Winter.
The subjects are: "Co-operation,"
:•Liine," "Grading Produce far mar-
ket." "Dairying," "Poultry," "Beef
feeding," "Swine diseases and
plagues," "Entomology," and "Re-
sults upon the land of fertilization
and cultivation."
It was generally admitted that the

dairy business, if properly conducted,
would pay, and it was argued that it
should receive greater attention from
fanners. In regard to sheep raising,
Mr. Lambert said that he had given
it special attention Lir two or more
seasons, and had found it profitable.
Mr. Amoss also stated that in his
observations in sections of the state
he had visited in his official capacity,
lie had found it to be yielding the
farmers profitable returns, and lie ad-
vised that it would be to the farmers'
interests to givoit greater attention.
Mr. Devries gave some interesting
facts relating to what has been sup-
posed to be hog cholera in Howard
county herds. Numbers of hogs, he
said, had died recently in his section,
supposedly from cholera. He was of
the opinion, however, that the dis-
ease with which the swine was affect-
ed in most of these instances was a
plague not yet accurately defined.
Hot cholera, he stated, was conta-
gious, but a peculiar feature was
that, while whole herds had died on
some farms, on adjacent farms the
hogs had remained in perfect health,
and that it had been fouud that the
treatment for cholera had proved en-
tirely disastrous in its effects. He was
in favor of a more thorough investi-
gation being mace in this line. In
several localities in the upper portion
of the county numbers of farmers
have lost in one day their entire
herds.
Mr. Arum has since perfected or-

ganizations in Frederick and Hagers-
town, and will visit Allegany and
Garrett counties on the same errand,
in the near future.

qenerial and political
Complete returns show that McKin-

ley has 338 plurality over Bryan in
South Dakota. The populists still
claim the state. The official count
only can decide. Senator Kyle will
probably be re-elected.

The statement that efforts will be
made by the Canadian Government
to secure a treaty of reciprocity with
the United States as soon as Presi-
dent-elect 11-eKiniey shall assume of-
fice,has awakened the greatest inter-
est among business men throughout
Canda.

Oscar IL, King of Sweden and Nor-
way, has been chosen by treaty be-
tween the United States and Great
Gritain as the fifth or final arbitrator
of the Venezuela boundary question.
The other arbitrators, four in num-
ber, are to be designsted, two by the
Lord Chief Justice of England, and
two by the Chief Justice of the Unit-
ed States. This is the final and the
most important feature of the treaty
for the complete adjustment of the
long pending Venezuela controversy.

"New" Calitornia women affect to
find in the defeat of the proposed
constitutional amendment giving
them the ballot, plenty of encourage-
ment, because the opposition was
keenest in the cities, and is therefore
attributable to the "liquor power."
That, however, seems to be a delu-
sion. The women whose influence
might be beneficial in politics are the
very women who are most resolutely
opposed to woman suffrage, while in
the states where "the cause" has won
the privilege is not taken advantage
of.

Major McKinley will not leave Can-
ton, except to visit Col. and Mrs.
Myron T. Herrick in Cleveland next
week, until he goes to Washington
to assume his duties as President. He
made this announcement to a party
of ten Cincinnati men, representing
the commercial clubs, head by Ralph
Peters. They had come to invite him
to be the guest of their club week
after next. "You see," said lie, "I
have had four months of pretty hard
work, and I feel the need of rest. If
I accept one invitation I must ac-
cept others, and you all know what
that means."

The annual report of Quartermas-
ter General Sawtelle shows that the
improvement of the equipment of the
army has progressed steadily under
the direction of this department dur-
ing the year. The department pro-
vided 10,639 marble headstones dur-
ing the year to mark the graves of
Union soldiers and sailors. The re-
port closes with a recommendation
looking to the early passage of the
pending Senate bill providing for the
erection of a memorial bridge across
the Potomac River between Washing-
ton and Arlington.

James Rankin Young, Republican
candidate for Congress in the Fourth
Congressional District of Pennsylva-
nia, embracing nine wards in the city
of Philadelphia, was elected to Con-
gress Tuesday by the largest majori-
ty ever given the candidate of any
party in the United States. Mark D.
Cunningham was his democratic op-
ponent. The vote of Mr. Young was
59,270, and for Ur. Cunningham 16,600,
making Mr. Young's majority 42,670.
Mr. Young is a distinguished journa-
liet and was formerly connected with
the Philadelphia Press.

Senator-elect Wellington, upon be-
ing asked if lie thought any action
would be taken at the approaching
session of Congress looking to the
passage of a revenue tariff measure,
replied in the negative. The Senate,
he said,was just the same in complex-
ian as when it killed the Dingley bill
and nothing could be hoped far from
that body. Mr. Wellington thinks
that conditions are such as to make
an extra session of Congress inevita-
ble, and tie believes that President
McKinley will, in all probability, call
that body together soon after he
takes his seat. Senator Wellington
looks for the passage of a tariff act
more comprehensive and reaching
further in its results than the Ding-
ley bill, which he regarded as purely
a revenue measure. While the latter
is an absolute necessity, at the same
time the bill should embrace the pro-
tective feature consistent with the
republican idea.

Orphans' Court Proceedings.

MONDAY, NOV. 9th., 1896.—Josiah
Wantz and Theodore S. Zepp, execu-
tors of Mary Wentz, deceased, re-
turned inventory of goods and chat-
tels, inventory of money and received
order to sell goods and chattels.
Cora A. Leister, administratrix of

Jesse M. Leister, deceased, returned
inventory of goods and chattels and
received orders to sell goods and chat-
tels and notify creditors.
Letters testamentary on the estate

of T. Sewell Purvis, deceased, were
granted to Ella M. Butter.
The last will and testament of Jane

R. Butler, deceased, admitted to pro-
bate.
Samuel H. Mayer, administrator w,

a. of Henry Mayer,settled second and
final account.

Elsie M. Gardner, administratrix w.
a. of Nancy Pelschner, deceased, set-
tled first and final account.
Report sale of real estate of William

Repp, deceased, finally ratified.
TUESDAY, Nov. 10th., 1896.—Letters

testamentary on the estate oh Jane
R. Butler, deceased, were granted to
Matthew F. Butler and William B.
Thomas.
Mary E. Hood, administratrix of

George W. Hood, deceased, returned
list sales of goods and chattels and
settled first and final account.
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THE DEFEAT of Altgeld in Illinois
and Breckinridge in Kentucky, are
gratifying evidences that the people
believe in upholding law and morali-
ty. Bath of these gentlemen are
much safer in private,than in public,
life.

BY ANOTHER week the result of the
election will be a thing of the past,so
far as an exciting public event is con-
cerned, and Ise can then expect to
find out how people really feel about
it. When people are excited, or dis-
appointed, it is a poor time to get
honest opinions out of them.

Electoral Vote Question.

As the method of electing a Presi-
dent and Vice-president of the Unit-
ed States by "Electoral Votes" is not
fully understood by many, we will
state as clearly and briefly as possible,
the workings of the system, and the
reasons for its use.
Instead of voting directly for the

President and Vice-president, the
qualified voters of each state vote for
as many electors as their state has
Senators and Representatives in Con-
gress. Maryland, for instance, has
two senators and six representatives,
consequently the state has eight
electoral votes, or eight Presidential
electors on the tickets.
The electors receiving the greatest

number of votes in each state, meet
in their respective states on the sec-
ond Monday of January following
the election, and vote by ballot for
President and Vice-president. The re-
sult of the balloting must be made
up into three sets of returns, each
signed by all of the electors, and seal-
ed, One of these lists is to be depos-
ited with the United States District
Judge of the district in which the
electors meet; the other two are sent
by the Secretary of State to the
President of the United States Sen-
ate, one by mail and one by messen-
ger.
On the second Wednesday of Feb-

ruary the lists from the several states
are opened by the President of the
Senate in the presence of the two
houses of Congress, and the votes are
counted. The candidates receiving
the highest Lumber of votes are de-
clared duly elected. The successful
electors are termed members of the
"Electoral College."
By this system the people vote but

indirectly for President. The popu-
lation of a state, however,determines
the number of electoral votes each
state is entitled to, because repre-
sentation in Congress is apportioned
according to population. At present,
one Congressman represents every
173,901 inhabitants.

Tile electoral system is considered
more equitable than at. election by
popular vote, because it represents
population, and not, necessarily,
voters. As the Presiaent of the Unit-
ed States is the executive for the
whole people,and not for voters alone,
the point in this claim is easily seen.
It is considered the fairest system,be-
cause it prevents great popular ma-
jorities in certain sections of our
country from exercising an influ-
ence which might be detrimental
to the country as a whole.
In addition, the electoral system

discounts fraud. It might be alto-
gether possible, and no doubt is, that
elections are not wholly free and fair
in all states, Should this be true,
then states with corrupt election offi-
cials could roll up immense majorities
which would foot up a sum total of
popular votes sufficient to defeat the
real will of the people. As 'the law
now is, fraud at the polls has no ef-
fect outside the state in which it is
perpetrated, affecting only the elec-
toral vote of that state.

SAMPLE BALLOTS.

PART 1.

The RECORD has secured from sub-
scribers in many states, specimens of
the ballots used at the late election,
and, in some cases the laws governing
elections, with instructions as to the
proper method of voting under the

laws. As most of the ballots differ
from ours, although the Australian

system in some form is used in nearly

all the states, a brief description of

the collection, will likelybe of inter-

est.
The ballots received, may, or may

not, represent the exact size of the

official ballots used, but it is reason-

able to presume that they very close-

ly represent them, except, possibly,

in color, as all official ballots are

likely printed on white paper. In

some cases the ballots themselves

contain instructions to the voter,

while in others we have received sep-

arate instructions, and in some, noth-

ing but the ballot has been received.

INDIANA.
The size of the balhst is 10+ x 14,and

is printed on pale green paper in

small clear type. It contains seven

tickets for electors in the following
order; democratic; with rooster em-
blem; Republican, with flying eagle;
Prohibition, with rising sun; Peo-

ples, with plow and sledge; Gold
Standard, with Thomas Jefferson

bust; National, with goddess of jus-

tice, and Labor, with arm and ham

mer.
The ballot is marked with a stamp,

making a heavy asterisk, and must

not be marked by any other means.

The mark for a straight ticket can be

made anywhere within the space con-

taining the party emblem which is 1+

inches square. For cutting, small

and heavily outlined squares appear
before each name on the ticket, large

enough for the stamp mark to be
placed in. There are no lines between

the tickets, and, the ballot as a
whole, is the neatest and most con-

venient, barring the small type, of

any yet received.
The county ballot is separate,being

on green paper, size 8 by 10 inches.
It contains four full tickets, headed

with Congressman, and has the same

emblems and the same general char-
acteristics as the larger national and

state ballot described above. Receiv-
ed from L. C. Reaves, Autiville, Jay
county,

WEST VIRGINIA.
The size of this ballot is 14 inches

wide by 31 in length, and in color is
what is known as terra cotta, It con-
tains five tickets; only two, republi-
can and democratic, being complete
for all the candidates, national, state
and county. The other parties repre-
sented are, prohibition, national dem-
ocratic and peoples. It has no party
emblems, and no squires for marking
either at the head, or at the end of
the candidates names.
The voter must cancel the tickets

lie does not wish to vote for, by draw-
ing a line with pen and ink from top
to bottom of them, leaving one clear
uudefaced ba:lot. If lie desires to
vote a mixed ticket he must erase, by
scratching, the names he does not
wish to vote for, and write on the
ticket those ot his choice. In other
words, one ticket from top to bottom
must contain the names of all whom
Ile desires to vote for and all other
names on the other tickets be cancel-
led. It is the old system of voting,
with the tickets of all the parties on
one ballot. Sample received from J.
F. Dugan, Marlowe, Berkeley county.

The Companion Calendar.

It is said that the expense of mak-
ing the Companion Art Calendar for
1897 was so great that had it been
published in the usual quantity it
could not be sold for less than one
dollar. Four beautiful female figures
are reproduced on four folding pages.
Each figure is lithographed in twelve
colors, being a true reproduction of
the original water-color painting,
which was selected because of its ex-
cellence of design and charm of color
and tone. The size of each of the
four folding pages is 10+ by 6 inches.
It is by far the best piece of color

work the Companion has ever -offer-
ed. Both as a calendar and as a gem
of the lithographer's art, it is so at-
tractive that it becomes a valuable
addition to the mantel or centre-ta
ble of any room. It is given free to all
new subscribers sending $1.75 to the
Companion for the year 1897, who re-
ceive also the paper free from the
time the subscription is received till
January 1, 1897.
Celebrating in 1897 its seventy-first

birthday, the Companion offers its
readers many exceptionally brilliant
features. Fully two hundred of the
most famous men and women of both
continents have contributed to the
next year's volume of the paper. For
free Illustrated Prospectus address,

THE YOUTH'S COMPANION,
205 Columbus Ave., Boston, Mass-

NEVADA.
The size of ballot is 17 inches wide

by 21 in length, printed on white pa-
per. The arrangement is not that of
party tickets, and no emblems are
used. The presidential electors for
McKinley and Hobart, Bryan and
Sewall and Bryan and Watson are all
in one column, with instructions to
"vote for three" at the head of each
group, the voting to be done by mak-
ing an X mark in a square at the
right of each name.
The same arrangement-one above

the other-is followed for state and
county officers, there being no separ-
ation as in single tickets. It seems
to be a simple enough method of vot-
ing, providing one can read, but
would not do so well in a state having
a very large list of candidates. Re-
ceived from A. W. Hesson, Elko.

CALIFORNIA.
This ballot is on white paper, 16

inches wide by 18 long, and, while an
improvement, typographically, over
the Nevada ballot, the arrangement
is exactly the same. The instructions
are to vote for nine electors, one rep-
resentative in Congress, &c.,by mark-
ing with a black lead pencil, an X
mark, in the square at the right of
the name. The law provides for vot-
ing in booths and absolute secrecy.
There are nine tickets represented;
republican, democratic, people's, pro-
hibition, national democrat, national
and social labor. Six amendments
to the state constitution followed the
candidates,to be voted for or against.

Only a voter physically disabled
may have assistance, and inability
to read or write, or drunkenness,does
not constitute disability. Any other
writing or marking than the X mark
invalidates the ticket. Received from
J. T. Kuhns, Sisinore, Riverside
County.

MICHIGAN.
This ballot is twelve inches wide by

fifteen in length, on white paper. It
contains five tickets, arranged as fol-
lows; republican, with emblem, flag
containing head of Lincoln in centre;
prohibition, with flag containing seal
of state within a large circle; demo-
cratic peoples union silver ticket,
with a silver dollar emblem contain-
ing head of Bryan; democratic, wav-
ing flag held by a bare hand and
arm; national, with a representation
of justice.
Below each emblem is a circle to

contain the X mark for a straight
ticket, and for cutting, a small square
is placed at left of each single name.
The mark must be made with a
stamp. The name of the office voted
for is at the left side of the ballot,and
all candidates for that office are con-
tained in a horizontal space exactly
opposite the title of the office. This
feature seems to be a good one, and
does not appear on any other of the
ballots yet sent in. Received from
Geo. H. Kuhns, Lansing.
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Is Maryland Republican?

Republican politicians who are now

proclaiming that Maryland is a relia-

bly republican state may be deluding

themselves. In these latter days,

since political bosses have assumed

the leadership of parties and the con-

trol of party organizations, positions

which in other days were held by

statesmen and men of repute, the in-

dependent voter has arisen. And

since the adyent of the independent

voter no state in the Union can be

considered as reliably democratic or

reliably republican. It is true that

the race question and the bitter

memory of reconstruction have kept

the Southern States democratic ever

since the troops were withdrawn. Re-

move the race question and it is like-

ly there would speedily be a division.

But when in Massachusetts and
Pennsylvania voters are driven into

revolt and elect democratic Gcvern-

ors, it is too much to claim that
Maryland is reliably republican or
reliably democratic. A scrutiny of

the returns at this very election
should convince any prudent men of
this fs‘ct. In the twelfth ward of Bal-
timore city there was a majority of

about 2,300 votes for McKinley and

the same ward gave at the same elec-

tion a majority for the democratic
candidate for juage. The ninth ward

gave a majority of nearly four hun-

dred for McKinley and a still greater
majority for the democratic candi-

date for judge and elected a democrat
to the Council. The thirteenth ward

gave McKinly 342 majority and elect-

ed a democrat to the Council by 332
majority, The nineteenth ward gave

a majority of nearly 1,500 tor McKin-

ley and elected a sterling democrat to
the Council.
This election brought out a great

reserve vote which has never before
been polled. The yote of this year
exceeds that of the last presidential
election by full forty thousand. Part
of this represents the natural growth
of the population, but the greater
part doubtless is the reserve vote
which has come out for the fist time.
To which party this vote beloags no
one can tell, but that it is not a hide-
bound partisan vote is apparent from
the fact that itshas not usually come
to the polls.

* * * * * *

The people of this state and city
demand good and clean government.
They demand the right to nominate
their own candidates. If the repub-
lican party gives good government,
better than the democrats gave, then
there is no reason why the people
should not continue them in power.
And if the democrats are going into
the next political contest with any
expectation of success they must go
without any incubus on the party.
The party will need all its strength
to win under the most favorable cir-
cumstances, and it cannot expect to
win in a fight if it is to carry an Old
Man of the Sea upon its back.-Balt.
Sun.

Law in two Nations.

Commenting editorially on the im-
prisonment in England, of Mrs. W.
M. Castle, a wealthy California lady,
for shoplifting; or, as it seems to be
true in her case, kleptomania, the N.
Y. Advertiser, says:
"In its sternness and rigidity,as ex-

emplified in the case of Mrs. Castle,
British justice presents its most un-
lovable aspect. The unfortunate
woman was so manifestly irresponsi-
ble that no American jury would have
found her guilty of a crime which
could not exist without responsibility
on her part. Nevertheless, while this
fact is undisputed, and will unquest-
ionably effect her speedy release, the
acts of larceny of which she was
technically guilty force her to endure
the forms, at least, of punishment
allotted to her offense. To us this
seems unjust and reprehensible,since
intent is the essence of crime. But
this is the principle of British law
that has had the effect of exercising
a repressive influence on crime.
When the United States ceases to

lead the world, with no second, in
crimes of violence-especially murder,
burglary and robbery-it will be time
for us to criticise the British method
Respect for law begins in the British
nursery, and is enforced in the Brit-
ish system of education. Contempt,
for law seems to be one of the object-
ives of our own. Before we can hope
to modify our bad eminence for
crimes of violence we must not only
enforce our laws in the courts, but
begin by enforcing them in our
schools and colleges."

DWIGHT L. MOODY, the famous
evangelist, has made a contract with
the Ladies' Home .Tournal,by which he
will conduct in that magazine a series
of popular Bible studies in the form
of a great National Bible Class. It
will be made into a regular and per-
manent department of the Journal,
and is to be known as "Mr. Moody's
Bible Blass." The evangelist will
personally lead his unique "Bible
Class" each month in the exposition
of some of the vital Bible truths, and
will naturally appeal to a large circle
of readers.

How to Prevent Croup.
SOME READING THAT WILL PROVE

INTERESTING TO YOUNG MOTHERS.

HOW TO GUARD AGAIST THE DISEASE.

Croup js a terror to young mothers
and to post them concerning the
cause, first symptoms and treatment
is the object of this item. The crigin
of croup is a counnon cold. Children
who are subject to it take cold very
easily and croup is almost sure to fol-
low. The first sympton is hoarsettess;
this is soon followed by a peculiar
rough cough, which is easily recogn-
ized and. will never be forgotten by
one who has heard it. The time to
act is when the child first becomes
hoarse. If Chamberlain's Cough
Remedy is freely giyen all tendency
to croup will soon disappear. Eyen
after the croupy cough has developed
it will prevent the attack. There is
no danger in giving this remedy for
it contains nothing injurious. For
sale by R. S. McKinney, Druggist,
Taneytown, Md.

There is more Catarrh in this section of the
country than all other diseases put together,
and until the last few years was supposed to be
incurable. For a great many years doctors
pronounced it a local disease, and prescribed
local remedies. and by constantly failing to
cure with local treatment, pronounced it incur-
able. science has proven catarrh to be a con-
stitutional disease, and therefore requires con-
stitutional treatment. Hall's Catarrh Cure,
manufactured by F. J. Cheney & Co., Toledo,
Ohio, is the only constitutional cure on the
market. It is taken internally in doses from 10
drops to a teaspoonful. It acts directly on the
blood and mucous surface of the system. They
offer one hundred dollars for any case it fails
to cure. Send for circulars and testmonials.

Add ress,
F. J. CHENEY & Co., Toledo, 0.

Sold by Druggists, 75c.
Hall's Family Pills are the best.

Ililton Academy,
Taneytown,

The above Select School entered
upon its second year on Sept. 14, '96.
The number of pupils being limit-

ed. I will be able to give full atten-
tion to each one individually in every
subject of study. The school is open
to both sexes, and from 8 years up.

Terms of Tuition.
General Course, lasting 39 weeks,

viz: Reading. Writing, Spelling,
Arithmetic, Grammar, Geograph y,
History, Algebra, Drawing, Physiol-
ogy and Physics,  14:30.

General Course and in addition Lat-
in, Greek, German or French, *4.40.
General Course, Languages and Ge-

ometry, Trigonometry, etc.,.  $5O.

Pupils can be entered at any time.

Private lessons given in the Sci-
ences and Languages.

Translations from and into Ger-
man, at moderate rates.

For further information, address or
apply to

HENRY MEIER, Principal,
MILTON ACADEMY,

Aug-29 Taneytown, Md.

MODEL BAKERY
KOONTZ & WAGNER, Propr's.

Dealers in

BREAD, CAKES, ROLLS,
Confectioneries, Groceries, h.,

ueii as Teas, Coffees, Sugar, Molas-
ses Dried Fruits, Oranges, Lemons,
Bananas, Sweet Potatoes, Coal Oil,
Salt, Rice,

Tobacco and Cigars,
Cigarettes, Canned Goods of all kinds.

FLOURS 'f-
a all kinds, including the well-known
brands of Alba Rose, Weist's, Roberts'
Stonesifer's, and two excellent brands
of Spring wheat, known as "Cyclone"
and "Wonder;" also New Corn Meal,
Buckwheat, and Hominy; Fine Toi-
let Soap, 3 pieces for 5cts.; also

S VVIE:117 (111)11..,

by the glass or by the gallon.
Our new store room will be com-

pleted by the middle of November,
where we shall be Pleased to wait on
our customers in a better manner
than heretofore.
Eggs and Lard taken in exchange.

TANEYTOWN

Roller • ills
Manufacture and have

constantly on hand

THEIR SUPERIOR

BRANDS OF FLOUR
made from selected wheat, and very
choice

BRAN AND MIDDLINGS.

Highes+ cash prices paid for grs in.

ZOLLICi9FFEk k 13IV.
15,9,94,tf

Old exchanges, in bundles of 100,

only 5 cents, at the RECORD office.

hereny announce that I have
permanently located in Taneytown
for the manufacture of

CARRIAGES, BUGGIES,
Daytons, Phaetons,

and everything in this line. Factory
work will also be kept on hand, and
it shah be my aim to supply the de
man dfor all classes of work.

A
s Blanket Story5 Closing Out

CASH SALE!
It's a short one, But three

things to tell you about -the
sort they are, their value, and
our Selling Price.

All Work Guaranteed.
Special attention given to Repair

ing.

Give me a trial and I will convince
you that my Prices and Work will
be found satisfactory.

James H. Reindollar.
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Shop back of Lutheran church.
5-1-95-ly

E. Kemper.
BUTCHER AND DEALER

IN ALL KINDS OF

MEATS & LIVE STOCK.

TANEYTOWN, MD.

White Bed Blankets!
49c.

Size about 56 by 72, pure white cot-
ton, fleeced. Fancy colored border,
taped and bound. Weight, 2 pounds.
Seventy-five cents their value.

•
November Price 49c the pair.

89c.
Size 11-4, about 65 by 75; weight 4

Pounds. Fancy combination colored
border; a good honest Blanket worth
One Dollar and Twenty-five cents.

November price, 89c the pair.

81.29.
Better grade; size 72 by 80. Weight

5 pounds. Part wool with red arid
blue stripe border; an extra size, and
very heavy blanket. Regular price
Two Dollars.

This month only at $1.29 a pair.

82.49.
All wool Blanket, good size and

weight. Beautiful border, either
red or blue. Three Dollars and Fif-
ty cents their value.

Our special price until Dec. 1.
only $2.49.

$3.69.
Better grade, strictly all wool, both

warp and filling. One of time staple
sellers at a Five Dollar price.

This month only, $3.69 a pair.

Chilly nights speak louder
than words of the seasonable-
ness of these delightfully soft,
warm Blankets,

F. M. YOUNT,
Taneytown, Md.

GENTS'

(fold Fi110
Warranted, Only $9.00,

Gents' Nickel Watch
with Chain,complete only $2.50.

Have you seen them yet?

H. E. SLAGENHAUP,
Taneytown, Ma, JEWELER

Old exchanges, in bundles of 100,on-

ly 5c, at the RECORD office.

GEO. H. BIRNIE & CO,
BANKERS,

TANEYTOWN, MD.

Discount Business Notes.

Receive Deposits subject to check.

Make collections on all points.

Sayings Bank Department.
Interest paid on Time Deposits.

- SPIJCT&L4 EtikrrIES -

to Weekly and Monthly Depositors

.N EAR THE SQUARE,
can be found, and he sells as cheap
as arty one else in the town. You
can find a full line of

GROCERIES, CONFECTIONERIES,
AND NOTIONS.

FRESH OYSTERS
served in any style; also by the gallon.
A beautiful piece of Glassware given

with every pound of Jaye Blend Cof-
fee.

Pure Virginia Honey, 20 cts. a box.
Dice, and Q. & Q. Tobacco only 20

cents. per pound.
Pure Sugar Syrups, 20c, 30c, and 40

cents a gallon.

All the leading brands of Flour; also
Corn Meal, New Hominy, Buck-
wheat Meal, Ste.

Green Imperial Tea, only 25c a pound.
Sweet Potatoe the barrel.

J

Have your

priritir4

DONE AT

THE RECORD OFFICE,

GOOD WORK, LOW PRICES.

Who can think
of some simple

thing to patent? Protect your ideas; they may
bring you wealth. Write JOHN WEDDER-
BURN & CO., Patent Attorneys, Washington,
D. C., for their $1,800 prize offer.

WANTED-AN IDEA

Think not to say that because
we keep up a full line of Nails
and a few other staple articles
to help sell other goods, that
we do not mean to get out of the
Hardware Business. Have sold
out the Tin and Stove Business,
and the Hardware department
will be disposed of as soon as
possible to some one who may
want to engage in a

Good Paying Business,
or in a Retail and Wholesale
way; to clear the room which
is for rent.

It will pay you to call and
see what we have, and get prices
before purchasing elsewhere.
While we may not be able to
sell you 5d., 6d. and 8d. Nails
cheaper than other dealers, but
on other sizes you will find our
prices far below present factory
prices.

Shelf Hardware,
Leather, Bar Iron,
Paints, Harness

and Machine" Oils,
Blankets, Robes, Rims
and Spokes, Chains,

etc., are being sold at a sacrifice.
Come and see that we mean

business, for you will stand a
good chance of paying much
higher prices for the same goods
in the near future, as has been
the case with some other lines
of business.

Respectfully yours;

flcC. Davidson,
TANEYTOWN, MD.

For Rent!
The large Store Room, now

occupied by McC. Davidson, as
a Hardware Store. Suitable
for almost any kind of business;
also 6 Dwelling Rooms adjoin-
ing store. Rent reasonable.
Possession given April 1st., '97.

Mrs. Julia Davidson.

littleston Carriage Works.

S. D. MEH RING,
MANUFACTURER OF

FINE CARRIAGES
and Buggies.

SURREYS, PHAETONS)

TRAPS, CARTS, CUTTERS,

FINE 

1 

Jagger, 

Dayton,
McCall, WAGONS.

and a General Line of Light Vehicles
A Good Selection of Second Hand

Work on hand

REPAIRING promptly done.

Ur' Low PRICES, and all work.

guaranteed.

LITTLESTOWN, PA
8 21-94-tf Opposite Depot.

J. FRANK WEANT,
COMMISSION MERCHANT,

Butter, Eggs, Potatoes
Apples, Onions,
Poultry, &c.

Potatoes in Car Lots a Specialty.

.Personal Attention to consignments.
C, & P. Telephone, No. 1396.

1006 HILLEN STREET,
1UIMOLI, MD.

Near Hillen Station, W. M. R. R. 26,2,6,6m

Just Listen
--

Never look around before making
your purchase, but go right to the
store of

Reindollar, Hess & Co.,
where a blind man can always find a
Bargain. Now is the time to get just
what you need, very cheap, for we
have just opened a new lot of goods.
Come and see our

' Cheap Blankets
We have them at 75c a pair and up.
Our Bcots are the best we have bad

for several seasons; for $1.65 to $2.40
for the best-no trash in stock. The
best line of

DRESS GOODS
that we have ever had, at prices to
suit every one. Carpets and Oilcloths
good end cheap. Men's-wear to snit
all, both Wool and Cotton. Prices
Low.

G. W. DEMMITT:
- DENTIST. -

Taneytown, - - - - Maryland
All persons in need of dental work should

give me a call as Twill save them money. Teeth
extracted with little or no pain. The very
best sets of teeth only $10., and guaranteed for
five years, Temporary sets at low prices. Fill-
ing and all kinds of dental work at bottom
prices, and all work guaranteed. I will visit
person within 12 miles without extra charge.
Will be at Mver's store, Pleasant Valley, on
the second Thursday of each month. Give me
a trial.

Yours Respectfully,
9-15-1Y G. W DEMMITT, Hentist.

SUBSCRIBE

-FOR THE-

Carroll Record.

COFFEE.
Price to-day Fifteen Cents and up-
wards for roasted.

SUGAR

4 and 4/ cents for Brown, and 5 cents
for White-cheaper by the barrel.
Come and see us before you buy;

we carry a line of First-class Goods-
we don't care to handle trash, for
there is nothing in it for any one.
Do not allow yourself to be taken in,
but come in to

Reindollar Hess& Co.,
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Hanover Gloves
OF ALL KINDS.

We have on hand the well-
known Hanover Gloves; we
have the Oil-tanned Califor-
nia White Glove, which has
no equal for corn husking;
also Husking 'Gloves of all
kinds.
Hanover Gloves for Dress and driv-

ing can't be beat for neatness, fit and
wear.

Come and look our Glove Stock
over; if you buy other makes and get
beat, the fault lies with you and not
with us.

KING WASHING MACHINE,
formerly $8.00; this month $4.00 buys
one.

Agent for Empire Separators
and Creamery outfits in general;
also Tread Powers for running
same.

D. W. GARNER.
TA NEYTOWN MD

Old exchanges,in bundles of 100,on-

ly 5c., at RECORD office.

WANTED!
25 lien to buy Fly Nets!
In order to sell the few Nets that

we have left, we will offer them

-›..A AT COST! pe(--
We must make room for our large

stock of

Blankets and Robes,
which we claim to be as low in price,
if not lower, as any others on the
market. All we ask to convince you
of the fact, is to come and examine
my stock and prices, before purchas-
ing elsewhere.

S. C. REAVER,
Near Railroad. Taneytown, Md

BUFFINGTON HOUSE,
NEAR SQUARE,

TANEYTOWN, MD.

JAS. BUFFINGTON, Prop'r.

First-class in Every Respect!

The Popular House for Commercial

Travelers.

Rates Moderate!
RR-Livery in connection with House.

Wind Storm Insurance.
Tornado, or wind storm, insurance

costs but a trifle, and affords protec-
tion against a danger which is be-
coming more frequent than fire.

The Continental Insurance Co.,
of New York,

Wilson & Goodwin, Agt's, Westminster
ssues such insurance at the lowest
rates, on dwellings, barns and other
buildings, for a paid up policy for
three years. For further information
apply to

P. B. ENGLAR,

1,6,6m. Taneytown, Md.

THE TANEYTOWN

SAVINGS BANK
Does a General Banking Business.
Loans Money on Real or Personal
Security. Discounts Notes. Collec-
tions and remittances promptly
made.

INTEREST PAID ON TIME DEPOSITS
HENRY GALT, Treas.

W. W. CRAPSTER Pres.

DIRECTORS.
SAMUEL STONER. W. JESSE ROBERTS
JOSHUA KOUTZ, H. D. MEH RING.
JAMES C. GALT. JOHN J. CRAPSTER.
T. H. ECKENRODE CALVIN T. FRINGER
W. W. CR APSTER. 11 ENRY GALT.

28-7-94-ly

SALESMEN.D We want one or two men
in each County to take

orders for Nursery Stock, and are willing to
Pay well for good work. We agree to RE-
PLACE FREE anything that dies from natural
causes.
We also have a choice line of SEED POTA-

TOES. GIVE US A TRIAL.
THE HAWKS NURSERY COMPANY,

ROCHESTER, N. Y.
9-6-4m.

WRITE

-PLEB -

BALTIMORE AMERICAN,
ESTABLISHED 1773.

ThE DAILY AMERICAN.
Terms by Mall, Postage Prepaid.

One Month   $ .50
Daily and Sunday, One Month 
Three Months   $1.50
Daily and Sunday, Three Months  .81.90
Six M au hs  •$3 00
Daily and Sunday, six months ...... . .•  •$3.75
One Year 
With Sunday Editi n, One Year 
Sun ay Edition, One Year  $1.00

THE TWICE-A-WEEK AMERICAN-

The Cheapest and Best Family
Newspaper Published.

ONLY ONE DOLLA-F. A YEAR
Six Months, 50 cts,

TRE Twice-a-Week AMERICAN is published in
two issues, Tuesday and Friday mornings,with
the news of the week in compete sh.ipe. It also
contains interesting special corms ondence, en-
tertaining romances, good poetry and local
matter AS general interest and fresh miscel-
lany suitanle for the home circle I. carefully
edited Agricultural Department, id full and
reliable Fin, n iial and Market Reports, are
special features.

TERMS AND PREMIUMS:
The Twice-a-week American, single copy 1

year $1.00
5 copies. one year, and extra copy of the

Twice-a-week, one year, or daily 14
months, frce  $5.00

10 copies, one year, with an extra copy of
the Twice-a-Week one year and Daily
months free   10.00

20 copies, one year, with an extra copy of
Twice-a- Week one year and Daily 9
months, free 20.00

30 copies, one year, with an extra copy of
the Twice-a- Week and one copy of
Daily one year free 30.00

The premium copies will be sent to any ad-
dress desired.

Specimen copies sent to any address. It is
not necessary for all the names in a club to
come from one office, nor is it necessary to
send all the names at one time. Send on the
names as fast as received.

Remittances should be made by check,
postal money-order or registered letter, as it
is unsafe to send money in ordinary letters,and
the publisher cannot be responsible for losses
occasioned there by.

Entered at the p-stoffice at Baltimore,- Md.
as second-class matter, April 13, 1894.

SPECIAL CLUB RATES.
The Twice a-Week American,with any of the

following named journals, will be sent one
year, to separate addresses, if desired, at the
prices given in the first column of figures:

NAMES OF JOURNALS. Club Regular
Price, Price.

American Agriculturist.... $34412.....5r 

5.00

25,5: $2• 50

Atlantic Monthly 
American Farmer 

American Magazine 

2.00

3.75

Century Magazine 
5.Christian Union  3.75 4.

Demorest's Monthly  2.75 3.00
Leslie's Illustrated Newsp'r  4.50 5.00
" Popular Month y   3,75 4 oo
" 1 leasant Hours  2.60 2.75
• Budget of Wit  3.00 3.25

Godey's Lady's Book..   2.75 3.00
Har,per's Weekly  4.50
' 5Magazine  4.50 5..88
" Bazar..... ..... .   4.50 5.00

Household  1.85 2.50
Lippencott's Magazine  3.2• 4.00
Rural New Yorker  2.80 3.00
Scribner's Magazine  3.75 4.00
Scientific American  3.75 4.00
St. Nicholas 3.75 4.00
Turf,Field and Farm  5.00 6.00

CHAS. C. FULTON & Co.
Felix Agnus Mgr. and Publisher.
American Office BALTIMORE. MD

qyiND
ootalivivioN

Unprecedented in the History
of Journalism.

The publishers of the CARR OLT. RECORD
have made a special arrangement with the
publishers of the New York

Morning Advertiser
AND Sunday Advertiser

whereby they can furnish the

Carroll Record,
and both of the above papers to a limited num-
ber of subscribers for one year for

$2.50
A first-class metropolitan newspaper by mail

every day for one year and

THE CARROLL RECORD
For $2. 50.

The most liberal offer of the century.

THE MORNING ADVERTISER
A bright and clean eight-page daily, con
tabling every day all the news an
special features of interest to/everybody
a good short story, a woman's column,
gossip about actors and actresses, book
criticisms, special market and financial
reports, and the best sporting page. It is
the foremost lc. newspaper in the United
States, a high-toned and wholesome home
newspaper.

THE SUNDAY ADVERTISER
8 pages (16 columns), 45 columns of which
will be reserved for the news, illustra-
tions, special articles and literary matter.
A model, high-class metropolitan Supday
paper, equal ln every respect to the-high-
priced Sunday papers. It is the largest
consideration ever offered for

Think over the proposition and send in your
subscription at once.

REMEMBER ! ! REMEMBER!!
THIS OFFER MAY SHORTLY BE

WITHDRAWN.

THE REGULAR SUBSCRIPTION
PRICE OF THE MORNING AND
SUNDAY ADVERTISER FOR ONE
YEAR IS

$3.50
BY THIS OFFER YOU GET IT

FOR VIRTUALLY

$1,50.
Sample Copies of the Advertiser

can be seen stip° RECORD office.

NEW YORI'WORLD.
THRICE-A-WEEK EDITION.

18 PAGES A WEEK. 156 PAPERS A YEAR.

Is larger than any weekly or semi-
weekly paper published and is the
only important Democratic "weekly"
published in New York City. Three
times as large as the leading Republi-
can weekly of New York City. It will
be of especial advantage to you dur-
ing tine Presidential Cain-
pain, as it is published every oth-
er day, except Sunday, and has all
the freshness and thneliness of a
daily. It combines all the news with
a long list of interesting depart-
ments, unique features, cartoons and
graphic illustrations, the latter being
a spebialty.

All these improvements have been
made without any increase in the
cost, which remains at one dollar per
year.
We offer this unequaled newspaper

and

The Carroll Record.
together one year for $1.50.
The regular subscription price of

the two papers is $2.60.
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COUNTY DIRECTORY.
Court Officers.

[Jury terms held in Westminster, 2nd Mon-
day in May and November; non-jury, 2nd.
Monday in February and August.]

JUDGES-Hon. Chas. B. Roberts, Chief and
Resident Judge. Hon. James ReveIle and Hon.
Isaac T. Jones Associate Judges.

CLERK or THE COURT-Benjamin F. Crouse.

Citimt-Gershum Huff.

Aunrroli-J. J. Baumgartner.

[Orphans' Court meets in the Court House in

Westminster. every Monday, and Tuesday, and
daily during jury terms of Court.]

RtGISTElt OF WILLS-George M. Parke.

ORPHANS' COURT--Jacob Rinehart, William
Y. Frizell, Albert Schaeffer.

County Officers.
STATES ATTORNEY-J. Milton Reifsnider.

SREitirr-J. Oliver Murray.

COUNTY COMMISSIONERS-Jahn H. Stem, Da-
vid Stoner, Jesse Lemon.

COUNTY TREASURER-Alfred T. Buckingham.

SuitvEvoit-William A. Roop.

SUPERVISORS OF ELECTION. - Howard F.
Schaeffer, Charles H. Sapp, Charles V. Wentz

Legislature.
SENATOR.-Dr. J. W. Hering.

HOUSE OF DELEGATES.-Charles H. Smith,
Charles J. H. Ganter, Dr. Clotworthy Birme.
William F. Cover.

TANEYTOWN DIST.
NOTARY PuBmo-Dr. F. H. Seize.

TAX COLLECTOR,- W. W. Crapster.

MAGISTRATES.-A. F. Orndorff, Henry Wilt.
John T. Fogle.

CONSTABLE, B. S. Miller.

itEGISTRARS.- Thomas D. Thomson, J. V.
Eckenrode.

Town Officers.

BURGESS.-H. D. Mehring.

COMMISSIONERS.-Dr. G. T. blotter, Edward
Kemper, W. Jesse Roberts, Joshua Koutz, E.
K. tteaver.

BA ILIFF and TAX COLLECTOR,-B. S. Miller

Church Notices.
Presbyterian Church. -Commencing on the

first of April, preaching on the first three Sab-
baths in the month at 2.30 p. m., and on the
fourth Sabbath at 10.30 a, m. Sabbath School
one hour before cnurch set vice.-C. E. Socie-
ty Prayer Meeting 6.30 p. m. every Sabbath
Evenluir.-Weeklv Prayer Meeting Tuesday
Evenings at 7.30 p.m.

Piney Creek Church: beginning April 1st.,
preaching on the first three Sabbaths in the
month, at 10 a. Kn., and on the fourth Sabbath
at 2.30 p. m. Sabbath School one hour before
service.

Rev. P. ltioseco, Pastor.

Trinity Lutheran Church.-Regular Ser-
vices during rebuilding, in the U. B. church,at

• 10 a. m. and 7.30 p. Ir., every Sunday. C. E.
services every Sunday evening at 6.31

Rev. D. Frank Garland, Pastor.

?race Reformed Church.-Ser vices every

Sunday at 10 o'clock, a. m., and 7.30 P. m. Sun-

day School 9 a. m., Y. P. S C. E. 6,30 p. m.
Rev. A. Bateman, Pastor.

SC Joseph's Catholic Church.M ass 9.30 a. m.
Vespers. 3.30 p. in., catechism, 3 p. m. every
Sunday. On the first Sunday of each month,
oenediction after mass, concluding the ser-
vices of the day. Rev. T. D. Mead, Pastor.

United Brethren Church.-Preaching every

Sunday at 2.30 p. in. Sunday school at 1.30.
Harney charge, services at 10 a. m., and 7 p.
in.. alternately. Rev. T. Wagner, Pastor.

Yost Office.
T. H. ECKENRODE, Postmaster.

Mails arrive from Linwood at 9 a, m•
from H. R. 9.53 a. In: and 5.10 p. from Har-
ney 2. 30 p. m,

Mails close at office, for It. It. north, 9.45 a.
m.; for Linwood 10.10 a. m. ;for Harney 11.00 a.
m.; for R. R. south, 5 IL m.

Star Route to York Road, carrying mail for
Baltimore and other points, closes daily at 4.30
a. in. Itt turning, the carrier arrives at Tinley-
town at 7.30 a. m., with mail from Baltimore,
Westminster and other points.

Societies.
Patriotic Order Sons of America, Camp 2, Md.
meets in Eckenrode's Hall, Thursday Even-
ings, at 7 o'cloch, Charles E. H. Shriner,
President. John J. Reid, Rec. Sec'y.

Carroll Conclave Heptasophs, meets on the
Second and Fourth Monday evenings of every
mouth. W. E. Burke, Secretary.

Taneytown Improvement Association will
m-et on the third Friday night in November in
Shriner's Hall.

Geo. H. Biruie, President.

Women Live Longer Than Men.

There is a prevailing impression that
men are not only less subject to ail-
meats and illnesses, but are longer lived
than women. But an examination of life
insurance companies' tables will show
that the term of life of women is slight-
ly longer than that of men. The differ-
ence in the mortality rates during the
first few years of life is striking. Dur-
ing the first year the mortality among
males is decidedly greater than among
females. Though more boys are born
than girls, the proportions are reduced
to almost even terms at the end of the
Breit year by the excessive male mortal-
ity. •

taf mess

eica r

wort

After....
Taking

a course of Ayer's Pills the

system is set in good working

order and a tan begins to feel

that life is worth living. He

who has become the gradual

prey of constipation, does not

realize the friction under which

he labors, until the burden is

lifted from him. Then his

mountains sink into mole -

hills, his moroseness gives

place to jollity, he is a happy

man again. If life does not

seem worth living to you, you

may take a very different view

of it after taking

Ayer's Cathartic Pills,

Homo aqd Farm,
Original articles solicited for this department

on any subject relative to home comforts,
whether of a social, decorative, culinary or
general character. Also articles pertaining to
Agriculture, Stock-raising, the Dairy, and
Other kindred topics. Contributions must be
received not later than Monday evening to be
guaranteed insertion the same week.
The Editor is not responsible for the opinions

expressed by contributors, nor does the publi-
cation of them make him their endorser. The
public is entitled to the free use of this depart-
ment, as long as it is not used as a medium for
the ventilation ol personalities, or for the pub-
lication of articles of no general intere,t or
benefit. All communications must be signed
by the writer, or authorship acknowledged in
a separate note.

A CURE FOR RHEUMATISM.

The Poison of Bee Stings said to be
very Effective.

It has for a long time been propos-
ed, owing to the practice of certain
Indian tripes, to treat rheumatism by
the sting of bees. The method is pain-
ful, but they say that when it does
not kill it sometimes cures. The pois
on of bee stings contains considerable
formic acid, and therefore ants could,
without doubt, be used, in a measure
for the same purpose. In Russia,
especially in the euyirous of Moscow,
the peasants attacked with rheuma-
tism treat themselves after a method
that appears to be based on this
principle. They take ant baths, pre-
pared in the following fashion:
A person goes in search of an ant's

nest, and when he finds one he puts
into a linen bag the ants, their eggs,
and necessarily considerable dirt. Re-
turning to the house, he plunges into
the hot water of the bath his bag of
ants, which he has previously fasten-
ed tight shut. After several minutes
the water gives off a very strong,pen-
etrating odor of formic acid. The
bath is now ready, and the invalid is
put into it. Such a bath has a very
active irritant action on the skin,
whence results a sort of counter-irri-
tation that causes the rheumatic
pains to disappear. If this means is
efficacious in Russia, it would doubt-
less be so in France, where the pains
of rheumatism are not wanting. But
we advise those who may be tempteo
to try it not to prolong their stay in
the ant bath too long. The irritation
of the skin may go so far as to injure
it. The invalid would then be cured
of his rheumatism, but would need a
new skin.
We have shown that formic acid

and its derivatives may become quite
fashionable. Can it be that it is the
remedy of the future ?a-Cosmos.

Sitting for a Picture.

A veil imparts a patchy appearance
to the face.
Gloves make the hands appear

much larger than they are in reality.
It is unwise to wear a new dress. It

always falls in awkward folds.
Whenever possible, it is money well

spent to drive to the photographer's.
A feather boa or a lace &Amu has a

wonderfully softening effect on the
features.
Generally speaking. the head and

shoulders wake a far prettier picture
than a full-length portrait.
Above all, if you want your picture

to have a natural expression, you
must forget where you are.
Unless there is any urgent reason

for it, it is a great mistake to be pho
tographed if you are either out of
health or in low spirits.
A just•-theamodeeofatheamoment

style of costume or coiffure will
"date" the photograph and soon
make it look out of fashion.
A white dress or one that takes

"white," gives a ghastly effect, and
one far from becoming, unless the
sitter is young and pretty.

The wife of Mr. Leonard Wells, of
East Brimfield, Maes., had been suf-
fering from neuralgia for two days,
not being able to sleep or hardly keep
still, when Mr. Holden, the merchant
there sent her a bottle of Chamber-
lain's Pain Balm, and asked that she
give it a thorough trial.- On meeting
Mr. Wells the next day he was told
that she was all right, the pain had
left her within two hours, and that
the bottle of Pain Balm was worth
$5.00 if it could not be had for less.
For sale at 50 cents per bottle by R.
S. McKinney, Druggist, Taneytown,
Md.

Talks by a Housekeeper.

To make a sugar crust on the top
of a sponge cake, dredge the cake
thickly with powered sugar.
After frying use an old newspaper

to rub over the range, and the grease
will be instantly removed.
lo replenish a fire in a sick room

bring the coal to the room wrapped
in a newspaper and place paper and
all in the stove. This can be done
with scarcely a rustle to disturb the
invalid.
When the carpets are to be relaid

for the winter spread several thick-
nesses of newspapers over the floor.
You will find that he room will be
much warmer, and the carpet will
wear twice as long as if laid on bare
boards.
When the day comes around on

which you sweep the room in which
you have your stand of flowers, pin a
newspaper over each plant, and you
will find that the dust cannot reach
them, and they will be fresh and
clean.
Theee is nothing better for eleanine

windows than newspaper well soften-
ed between the hands. Wet one pa-
per to use for washing the window;
then polish with a dry paper, and
you will find your windows have a
brightness and polish which it is im-
poseible to obtain in any other way.
It is also a good plan to pin news-

papers over plants on a cold, frosty
night, or if the plants are exposed
before an open window.
In putting away your preserves for

the whiter spread several thicknesses
of newspaper on the shelf; then, urn
less the closet is very dark, put a
newspaper over them to protect from
the light.
Add salt to whitewash and you will

find it will stick much more closely
and will not drop off in flakes.
Before house-cleaning sort out the

old woolen underwear and cut out
neat squares. These may be used for
rubbing up the furniture and also on
the paint.
Clean all the closets arid drawers

before commencing the heavier
house- :dean i
Polish the bath tubs and spigots

with whiting, using one pound of
whiting, one tablespoonful of ammo-
nia and one quart of boiling water.
Mix well and bottle, and you will
find it far more convenient than the
dry whiting.-Phila. Record.

PRAY ER.

The Ram's Horn Makes Some Helpful

Suggestions.

The devil fears a praying mother.
No man can pray right while he is

living wrong.
'When you shut your closet dour,

lock it with a promise.
Half-heartedness makes no prayers

that Ged can answer.
Prayer is not prayer until it be-

comes communion with God.
When we ask God to bless others

we should also pray that He will do
it in His own way.
The prayer of the grateful man will

please God, whether it pleases any-
body else or not.
Do a great deal of praying before

you undertake to tell what a great
sihner you used to be.
The devil will fight hard to keep

the man who has power with God
from (eetting on his knees.
How inconsistent to ask God to

give to us, if we are withholding that
which belongs to somebody else.
Jt was because Daniel kept his win

(lows open toward Jerusalem that he
had no fear of the lion's den.
A marked difference between a

hypocrite and a child of G id is that
the hypocrite has no closet for pray-
er.
The Christian who will take every

need to God in prayer will soon have
a faith that can move mountains.
When you pray for strength to re-

sist temptation, help answer your
prayer by keeping out of bad com-
pany.

'l'o pray the Lord's prayer as Jesus
taught it will make every man the
guardian of his brother's rights.
Our prayers are not always answer-

ed according to our expectations, but
the prayer of faith is never disap-
pointed.
Before Jesus taught His disciples

how to pray He told them of the
Father to whom their prayers should
be addressed.

The Ideal Sitting Room.

An ideal sitting-room is one where
dolce far niente is the order of the
day, where a roomy lounge is ready
to receive anyone who is weary and
wants to put his feet up somewhere;
where deep, restful chairs soothe you
into peace, even after a day's hard
shopping; where a big table holds the
papers, and magazines and books of
the hour, without hinting of study or
brain work,where nobody cares what
you do so that you are comfortable,
and where the lady of the house is
always at the disposal of anyone who
needs her.
Such a household paradise is a mar-

velous antidote to the rush and roar
of our overcrowded lives, and "no
well-ordered house can afford to be
without it." Let the parlors shine in
all their splender, if you choose; let
the libraries and drawing-rooms be
au fait in every dignified particular;
let even the reception room take on a
dainty perfection of its own, but if
you want a panacea for the thousand
ills that beset your busy lives, insist
upon it, you fair mistress of many
homes, that your own particular
house shall have one room in which
old and young, parents and children,
sisters and brothers, shall feel that
absolute freedom from restraints that
is more refreshing than sleep itself.
It is curious, but it is true, that if

you keep your eyes open, you can
tell by a man's mouth whether he
has any corner at home in which he
is entirely at ease; and it is none the
less true that a woman's eyes invari-
ably show whether she ever rests
when she is awake, or-whether she
has a cosy sitting room or only cold
parlors.

Making Hogs Pay,

At the meeting of the Kentucky
Swine Breeders's Association, Mr. C.
M. Powell, in an excellent paper said;
"Careful and judicious breeding

and handling of young hogs is to be
more depended upon than all treat-
ment. We all understand that pre-
vention is better than cure. Every
successful raiser does not trust to
luck, but provides pens, sheds arid
feeding places that will enable him
to keep his sows and pigs comforta-
ble. Sunlight, fresh air and exercise
are the safest tonics and appetizers
for all dams and pigs. With such
accommodations and judicious regu
Jar feeding of sound, unfermented
feed, pens clean and dry, there is lit-
tle danger of scours: but should this
appear, change feed at once. Feed
dry bran and wheat, adding a little
charcoal and copperas occasionally.
"Every breeder should have a hog

house easy of access, properly con
structed feed troughs, and above all
clean quarters and perfect sanitation,
fresh water, shade in abundance, and
lots large enough for plenty of exer-
cise. By providing the above, kept
clean with disinfectants, the fight is
half won. Regarding care and sani-
tation, the best preventives of dis-
ease; keep a quantity of lime, a prep
aration of crude carbolic acid, and
use freely as a disinfectant. Do not
permit hogs to have foul wallows; fill
them up, using lime freely. Remove
the bedding often, burning it. Disin-
fect pens and sleeping places. Care
is the best preventive. Clean troughs,
correct kind and amount of feeding,
controlling the themes of eating, with
sanitary conditions of lot and perawe
can grow pigs less subject to disease.
In closing I give the following prepa-
ration as a preventative of cholera,
highly recommended and used by me
with good results, and no doubt fa-
miliar to most of you, but worth to
repeat for future use; One peck lime,
one pound sulphur, one pound Cop-
peras, dissolved in five gallons of
water, enough shelled corn added to
absorb liquid. Give one pint shelled
corn twice a week. Keep plenty of
coal before them."

One Way to be Happy
Is at all times to attend to the coin

forts of your family Should any one
of them catch a slight Cold or Cough,
prepare yourself and call at once on
R. S. McKinney,eole agent, and get a
trial bottle of Otto's Cure, the great
German Remedy, free. We give it
away to prove that we have a sure
Cure for Coughs, Colds, Asthma, COD
gumption, and all diseases of the
Throat and Lungs. Large sizes 500
and 25c.

THE CHEERFUL MAN.-

things That Lighten Life For Hunters In
the Woods on Dreary Days.

There is a kind of man who never
lacks camping companions. He may be
rich or poor, big or little. He may be
SO weak as to be hardly able to carry
his rifle and never able to bring a stick
of wood for the campfire. He is wanted,
nevertheless. The campers call him the
jovial man, the one who never sulks, but
always smiles. He is cheerful when the
clouds weep and the campers are dismal.
He laughs when he misses easy shots.
He grins when the smoke gets into his
eyes and says that the nubs and sticks
In the camp bed are good, because they
give the sleeper plenty of exercise.
The cheerful man is especially well

liked in a camp where the hunters have
had a bad run of luck. If a week passes
and the woods have been so dry that the
deer or the turkeys couldn't be ap-
proached, then the cheerful man, as he
fries pork or bacon for supper, laughs
and says that any way it's .tt good thing
for the game.
When the weather is gloomy and ev-

ery one has the blues, it is the cheerful
man who gets out and gathers a big
heap of wood, if he can, or, if he can't,
he has somebody else do it, and when
night comes a big campfire is started
that cheers everybody up to the story
telling point, which point indicates
cheerfulness.
Even small boys are welcome in a

veteran's camp when the place is
gloomy. Small boys make things inter-
esting. There are guns to drag around
and owners to say things. There is a
food supply to pick at, and fire to med-
dle with, pipes to break and tin dishes
to rattle. It doesn't take much to cheer
up a sad camp, if only the right visitor
comes along. The arrival of a smiling
woman from another camp, one day
when the rain poured, did that once up
on Moose river. She had a rifle over her
shoulder and three dripping partridges
in her hand. Her hunting suit was drip-
ping wet, and her once curly bangs
hung down over her eyes. Every com-
plaining man of time camp leaped to his
feet, and a great heap of green birch
logs was soon cut and sizzling in the
fire. The gloom was dispelled like so
much smoke. In a few minutes she was
standing near the fire steaming as her
clothes dried. When she left, two hours
later, every one was as happy us a cat
by a grate fire.-New York Sun.

"CALLERS" NOT DESIRED.

A Writer's Reasons For Thinking "Visit-
ing" Intolerable.

Of what earthly use is "company?"
You probably see your neighbors once a
week, meeting them on the public high-
ways, and if you nod pleasantly and
speak a word or two of the weather and
of the health of the family, has not ev-
erything been done that our necessities
require or formality can reasonably de-
mand? If we have business or need in-
formation that others can give us, go
and ask of them. Be brief, but to the
point, and, leaving with what is de-
sired, carry away also their blessing.
To go to another's house, to request of
its inmates, one or all, to sit for half an
hour or longer and listen to your plati-
tudes, and-coming away-lie to them
about a pleasant call, is intolerable.
Yet there are thousands who do this
daily.
Why should I leave my occupation,

be it loafing even, and give my atten-
tion to some man or woman who is
thoughtless enough to "call?" The
actuating motive never appears. Much
is spoken and nothing said. I receive
no worthy thought to profit by or in-
crease the probability of a beatific eter-
nity. The familiar well gnawed bones
of doctrine fall from the devil's table.
Usually I am forced to breathe at such
a time a gossip poisoned atmosphere.
This "call" is another idea of civility,
and I am compelled, it appears, to be a
victim of his or her whim. If I refuse,
as I have done point blank, to present
myself, I am called a boor and all man-
ner of ugly names.-Lippincott's.

Mrs. Zerelda Wallace.

One of the greatest of America's wom-
an orators is Mrs. Zerelda Wallace, the
stepmother of General Lew Wallace
and the original of one of the most
beautiful characters in "Ben-Hur."
Mrs. Wallace has been a temperance

worker and a woman suffragist for
many years. She thus relates the cir-
cumstances of her conversion to the cause
of woman's rights:

After I had been in religious reform
work for a little while I took up the
cause of woman suffrage. It happened
this way: A number of us women went
to Indianapolis to work for the reten-
tion of the Baxter local option law
when the question of its repeal was up
before the Indiana legislature. During
the vote on the question a Dr. Thomp-
son, an elder in the Presbyterian church
and a member of the senate, rose in his
place to explain his vote. He said that
although personally opposed to the liq-
uor traffic he must, as the representa-
tive of his constituency and the taxpay-
ers, cast his ballot in favor of the repeal
of the local option law.
Then I thought to myself, Who com-

pose his constituency and the taxpayers
whom he represents? I was then a wid-
ow with six little children, and I had
my taxes to pay, and we all had to obey
the laws. A light broke over me, and I
came to the conclusion that I was a part
of that constituency of which the sena-
tor spoke, and so was every other wom-
an in the district. After the session I
went up to Senator Thompson, and,
shaking hands with him, thanked him
for that speech and told him that his
speech had made a woman suffragist of
me.-New York Mail and Express.

Miss Martin of Inniskillen is the
first lady guardian elected in Ireland.
On entering the board room of the union
she was received with cheers. The bill
to enable women to act as poor law
guardians in Ireland was introduced by
William Johnston of Ballykilbeg and
easily passed both houses. •

Narrow velvet ribbon is very much
used this season, and endless loops of
black or white are combined with lace
or chiffon in pretty boas for the neck.
Vests of white silk or mousseline de
soie are trimmed crosswise with some
of the baby ribbon, either in black or
colors.

The Enemy Is Ours!
The grippe usually leaves the suf-

ferer in a very feeble condition, with a
persistent cough and other premoni-
tory symptoms of pulmonary affection.
Dr. Bull's Cough Se rup promptly
adininistered at the beginning ofean
attack of grippe, will forestall that dan-
gerous enemy to life-consumption.
Mrs. Maggie Tulga, Ironton, Ohio,
says: "It affords me much pleasure
to bear testimony to the merits of Dr.
Bull's Cough Syrup. I had been a
sufferer from the grippe for a week, I
tried a bottle of Dr. Bull's Cough Syrup,
and after taking it, was completely
cured of time dreadful cough and disease.
I cheerfully recommend it to all suf-
erers." Dr. Bull's Cough Syrup is
sold everywhere for 25 cents.

McKELLIP'S

Cholera and Diarrhoea Syrup
(:)FR. Cholera Morin's, Diarrhcea, Cramps, &c.

Til\TRIV.A.LT_JMD.
McKELLIP'S

Horse and Cattle Powders.
The Best Tonic and Blood Purifier.
Just what is needed to bring the horse into good condition, and brace him up for Summer work.

PERSONALITIES.

J. D. Wood of Beaver Canyon, Ida.,
has flocks aggregating 75,000 sheep.

M. L. Lachenal, president of the
Swiss Confederation, is paying a visit
to England.
The Duke of Westminster gives his

private secretary $5,000 a year and
apartments at Grosrvenor House.

C. E. Duggers of Decatur county,
Ga., was recently carried over the
Oceana falls, 40 feet in height, while
bathing. He escaped unhurt.

Henri Meilhao has sold the billiard
table on which he used to play with
Dumas, fils, and Meissonier. He is grow-
ing old and needs the room for books.

Prince Ademuyiwa of Jebu Remo, in
west Africa, is jet black Methodist, sat
by the side of the magistrate during a
recent trial at the Old Bailey, London.

Hon. Richard T. Browning recently
discovered in the bottom of Deep creek,
Garrett county, Md., a canoe that be-
longed to his grandfather 60 years ago.

Dr. Charles James Branch, bishop of
Antigua, who has just died, had spent
the whole of his ministerial life in the
West Indies and was beloved by all
classes.

Sir Somers Vine has resigned the as-
sistant secretaryship of the British Im-
perial institute in order to be associated
with a large commercial enterprise in
the colonies.

Sir H. H. Kitchener's services as
head of the Dongola expedition have
been recognized by his being promoted
from the rank of brevet colonel to that
of major general in the British army.

The Manchester people are going to
put a portrait of Dr. Maclaren in the
art galleries of the city. Dr. Parker has
just styled Dr. Maclaren "the prince
of preachers in the English speaking
world."

Sir Edward Monson, the present Brit-
ish embassador to France, is not un-
known in America. He acted as arbi-
trator between Denmark and the Unit-
ed States in the famous Butterfield
claims.

Philip Gilbert Hamerton, at the time
of his death, had completed his auto•
biography up to his twenty-fifth year,
when he was married. The narrative
has been continued from that time by
his widow and will be published soon.

John Pakkala of Calumet, Mich., aft-
er having an arm amputated at the
shoulder, was able to get up and walk
down the hospital stairs to the ambu-
lance. Though he fought in the Russian
ranks all through the Turkish war and
has for the past 12 years worked in a
dangerous calling underground, this is
the first time he was ever hurt.

SILK.

In 1840 the silk factories of Prussia
employed 14,000 operators.

In 1714 the first regular silk mill in
England was put in operation at Derby.

The size of each thread, as spun by
the silkworm, is one two-hundredths
part of an inch in diameter.

The official executioner of the sultan
of Turkey uses a silken cord in stran-
gling persons ordered to be put to death.

Silkworm authorities estimate that
the larvae from one ounce of eggs will
eat 1,200 pounds of mulberry leaves and
produce 120 pounds of cocoons.

"Muscadine" is a disease to which
silkworms are liable. It consists of a
fungous growth in the body, which
breaks through the skin and speedily
kills the insect.

The spider produces silk of a fair
quality, but the difficulty of rearing
spiders and the small quantity of prod-
uct from each insect has caused the
abandonment of all efforts to produce
spider silk.

In the time of Francis I silk gowns
were forbidden to all ladies below the
rank of countess. The wives of wealthy
merchants managed to evade the law by
having woolen gowns lined with bright
colored silks.

In the year 1895 the value of the
manufactured silk imported to this
country was $31,206,202. In the same
year the value of the umnanufactured
which was brought to this country was
$22, 626, 055.

In the time of Pliny silk was sup-
posed to be a vegetable product, and his
"Natural History" contains a long
story of the way in which it was picked
from trees in the East Indies and spun
and woven into fabrics. - St. Louis
Globe-Democrat.

DAINTY TRIFLES.

Bohemian glass loving cups are as at-
tractive in appearance as in name.

Turkish coffee cups set in silver
frames are expensive, but beautiful.

Silver bell, silver name plate and sil-
ver bicycle whistles are now counted
among the well to do wheelwoman's
outfit.
There is quite a fad just now among

both sexes for collecting steins, or Ger-
man earthenware beer mugs, from pure-
ly decorative motives.

Side combs of light tortoise shell sur-
mounted by a close set row of pearls
and turquoises mixed please yo'ung
women for evening wear.

An aluminium alcohol lamp set in a
square case of crocodile leather is de-
signed for the woman globe trotter and
is convenient for heating water, curling
tongs, etc.

A novelty in chatelaines for ladies'
watches is composed of several enamel-
ed bars, graduated in size and linked
together with little gold balls. The en-
amel corresponds with that on the
watch.-Jewelers' Circular.

The wild southern passion flower,
with its circle of purple and white and
its fringy lavender rim or border, is
beautiful, worked upon any white sub-
stance, whether it be linen, silk or satin.

Black bodices of chiffon or net em-
broidered in colors or trimmed with
fancy ribbon are the latest thing to
wear with black silk skirts.

RF,INDOLLAR & CO.,
-- DEALERS IN -

Pure + Animal + Bone + Fertilizers
Have you placed your order for Phosphate for the cominz sea-

son ? If not, we would be glad to have you call and learn what we can do
for you in this line. Our goods have been bought, and we are ready to put
them on the market. Compare the Analysis of

Fish Phosphate, & Special Ilixture
with other Brands on the market, and you wit find that our goods are
cheaper. Each of these two Brands is an

"OLD STA.1\TD-IBY,"
and never fails, ueder ordinary circumstances. They show a better Analysis
than goods that are sold for more money, and must be as represented.
We do not wish to say to you that all others are worthless, and ours are

Goods; such is not the case, but we do claim to hive what has given
satisfaction in the past, will do it again, and for less money than other
makes of the same Analysis. We sell

B7NUGH'S PURE BONE,
and will furnish any goods manufactured by this old, reliabla firm at very
low prices. Call and see its.

Respectfully Yours,

REINDOLLAR & CO.

ROBERT S. McKINNEY,
DRUGGIST

TA.1\T=E17Z-̀ 110-W-1\T, MD.

oreio a9d Domestic Drugs
.4.
 + I 4.

THE MOST rOPULAR FANCY ARTICLES - - -
PATENT ® MEDICINES -AND-

IS THE MARKET.  PERFUMERY.
+ 3. + •

Proprietor of McKINNEY'S CHOLERA MIXTURE, A
Reliable Remedy for all Summer Complaints.

RALLY ROUND. THE FLAG,
FOR

SOUND MONEY, 

NATIONAL HONOR, 

HOME PROSPERITY.

The News-York

WEEKLY TRIBUNE,
The Leading National Republican
Family Newspaper:

Will make a vigorous and relentless fight through
the Presidential campaign, for principles which will
bring prosperity to the entire country.

Its campaign news and discussions will interest
and should be read by every American citizen.

We furnish the "Record" and "N. Y. Weekly Tribune"
ONE YEAR for $1.52.

Cush in titl -auce.

Address all orders to THE RECORD.

Write your Dame and address on a postal card, send it to Geo. W. Best, Tri-
bune Building, New York City, and a sample copy of THE NEW YORK
WEEKLY TRIBUNE will be mailed to you.

rockets and Dattons.

Women never look smarter than when
in tailor made gowns. It is remarkable
that the frocks of heavy cloth, cut in
severely plain style, suit every kind of
W0111:111. If she has a good figure, the
tailor made gown sets it off; if she has
a bad figure, the gown improves it so
that it appears good. In view of these
facts it is good news to every one that
the tailor made gown will be more in
evidence this coming autumn and win-
ter than for many years.
The patterns will be mostly shot

goods, with some solid colors. There
will be greens, browns, black and doz-
ens of shades of gray. They will be in
all kinds of combinations, and most of
them will be pleasing to the eye, accord-
ing to the manufacturers. As for the
make of the gowns,•they will be rather
more ornamented than has been the
case. They are to have buttons large
and small and of all kinds of material
and make. The buttons will be put on
wherever there is room for them and
will be attached for ornament as much
as for utility. There will be pockets in
the coats and pockets in the skirts. A
determined effort will be made to sup-
ply women with receptacles for the
small baggage that they always carry
about with them, and that is generally
clutched feverishly in the hand for lack
of anywhere else to keep it. Altogether
there is a prospect of much comfort as
well as style in the tailor made gowns
for the fall and winter. As for the prices
-well, that is another story.--New
Fork Presse

A Little Girl's Riddle.

Several children were asking riddles
the other day, and a bright little girl
who listened got the idea of what a
riddle was. The next day alma went to
her father and said, "There was a blind
end curtains on a pole and the pole fell
end two men laughed." The father
promptly gave it up when she said,

• "Don't you see the point?" Upon being
answered in the negative she puzzled
her brains for awhile, and said, "Nei-
ther do I." She is now practicing on
riddles that have some meaning in
the.m.

COMBINATION OFFERS.
We give below a list of Combina-

tion Offers, with a number of leading
periodicals, on all of which you can
save money and trouble by subscrib-
ing through this office, If you are
already a paid ahead subscriber to
the RECORD, you can have any of the
periodicals named, by pitying the
dfference letween $1.00 and the com-
bination price.

Name of Journal.

Advertiser, N. Y. [daily] 
American Miller 
Agricultual BpilomisL  
Architect & Building 
Arena, The 
Arthur's Home Magazine 
Atlantic Monthly 
Cosmopolitan.
Century 
Demorest's 
Farm Journal 
Forum 
Frank Leslie's Weekly 

Monthly 
Golden RU le 
HaTer's Weekly 

Magazine 
North American Review 
Peterson's Magazine 
Review of Reviews 
St. Nicholas 
Scribner's Magazine 
'tribune. N. Y, (weekly) 
World, N. Y. (tr'-weekly) 
Youth's Companion 
(To STRICTLY NEW Su Suf. REIM ma Vi

Special
Price .

Regular
Price.

$2.50
2.90
1.25
2.75
3.90

4.63
1.85
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THE

CarrG11 Record
In its new furm, is better pre-
pared than ever to give to its
subscribers the full value of
$1.00 many times over during a
year. It means to be so newsy,
so attractive and so good, that
it will be a household necessity
in every family in the county.

STATE NEWS,

COUNTY NEWS,

GENERAL NEWS,

LATE NEWS,

ALL THE NEWS.

The RECORD will have in the fut-
ure, as in the past, its distinctive
features. It will aim at all times to
supply clean, pure, non-sensational
news matter, fit for every member
of the family to read. It will be glad
to receive contributions from its read-
ers, as well as opinions and ideas
having in view the improvement of
the paper, and the adaptation of its
features to its patrons as a whole.

Carroll Record
Has been a oronounced success so far.
and means to continue to improve,
and thus merit the continuance of
the liberal support which has hither-
to been accoided it.

Subscribe for it!

Advertise in it!

Tell your friends of it!

HELP IT,
and it will help you.

The Job Department
is as complete as that of any office
outside of a large city, and the char-
acter of the work turned out is of the
best, which may be easily seen by ap-
plying for Samples. Do you want

Sale Bills, Posters, Circulars,
Bill and Letter Heads, State-

ments, Wedding Invitations,

Cards, Pamphlets, Pro-

grams, Receipts.

Note, Draft or Check

Books, Envelopes, Shipping
Tags, Labels, Tickets, Certifi-
cates-no matter what, or how
many

Give us a Trial.

AS AN

Advertising Medium,
LOOK NO FURTHER!

Having a large circulation In a pros-
perous section, amoPg different class-
es and professions, and as the RECORD
Itself is made up attractively and on
time modern plan, an advertisement
can scarcely be given a poor position
at any place in its columns. It has
been onr rule not to contract for read-
ing advertisements which must be
sandwiched in with news items, and
this rule will continue to be adhered
to.

By keeping our space
for reading matter entire-
ly separate from advertise-
ments, we not only please
the reader, but heir) the
advertiser too, by placing
all on equality with each
other; we offer monthly
changes without charge,
so that advertisements
will form a real news feat-
ure for the paper. Fre-
quent changes,and special
offers, will pay both the
advertiser and newspaper,
and benefit the reader.

The Carroll Record,
Taneytown, Md.



ELECTION ECHOES.

Items of Interest following the

Result.

A REVIVAL OF BUSINESS.

Since the election there has been a

general revival of business in nearly

all branches. Manufacturers all over

the country had conditional orders,

which depended on the election of

McKinley for their filling; therefore,

thousands of hands have been taken

on again for full time, in cases where

they had been working but half time,

or lard off altogether.
The daily papers are full of reports

from manufacturing firms, railroad

companies and large dealers, all re-

. porting activity in business. Wheth-

er or not it is true, as claimed, that

many concerns shut down a month or

so ago to influence the election, will

probably never be definitely known;

but, there can be ng doubt that the

Increased activity now, is not due

wholly, or to any great extent, to

such a cause, but is the natural out-

come of the guarantee that money

values will not be altered by future
legislation.

MONEY RETURNING.

It had Been sent Abroad before the

Election.

There has been a large increase in

cable remittances of money from Eu-

rope since the election. Messrs Alex-
ander Brown & Sons, Bait., haye re-
ceived more than $100,000. This money

was sent abroad before the election by
people who were fearful of the result

in the event of Mr. Bryan winning

the presidency and the enactment of

a free-coinage law. This fear having

been dispelled by the victory of Mc-
Kinley, the money is now coming
back and will be invested in enter-
prises in the city and State.

Shocked a Congiwation.

Pittsburg, Nov. 9.-Deacon Jona-

than Pechter, of the Congregational
Church of Donegal township, shock-

ed the members of the congregation
yesterday by walking into meeting in

his bare feet.
After the service he was waited on

by the minister and his fellow dea-
cons and asked about this strange
conduct. He explained that he was
paying an election bet. He had
agreed with Arnold Herter that in
case of McKinley's election he would
walk to church barefooted,and in case
of Bryan's election _Herter was to do
the same.
A conference was held among the

deacons anti it was decided to discip-
line Deacon Pechter, not because lie
walked to church in his bare feet,but
because Ire had indulged in betting.

Mr. Bryan's Voice.

Lincoln, Neb. Nov. 9.-Mr. Bryan is

having a great deal of trouble with
his voice since the campaign ended.
He has been growing hoarser all the
time and the usual remedies have
done him very little good.
His physicians say that in the over-

exertion his vocal chords have suffer-
ed from his recent work, and that it
will take extreme care and some
weeks to reduce the inflammation. He
looks four years older than when he
began the campaign.
Within the next 10 days, Mr. Bryan

expects to go to Colorado, and will
probably make a number of speeches
in that State. It is generally under-
stood that he expects to take to the
lecture platform.
Chicago. Nov. 9.-A rumor here in

newspaper circles is that W. R.
Hearst, owner of the New York Jour-
nal and the San Francisco Examiner,
will establish a daily here, with Mr.
Bryan as editor-in-chief. It is saia
the negotiations are already on. Mr.
Hearst has already secured the Unit-
ed Press franchise here for an after-
noon and morning paper.

The Tote in the Big Cities.

Philadelphia Press: In the strug-
gle among America's big cities to see
what one could pile up the biggest
plurality for McKinley, Philadelphia
was an easy winner, her plurality for
the republican ticket being nearly
twice as large as that of Chicago,
which stood second. It is also inter-
esting to note in the table of the plu-
ralities and total vote of the big cit-
ies, which is given below, that Chica-
go polled over 22,000 more votes than
New York and rolled up a bigger
majority against anarchy and repud-
iation. The table follows:

Mlliinley's Total
plurality, vote.

Philadelphia 112,999 244.134
Chicago  56,543 345,755
New York  29,701 323,321
Brooklyn  34,165 210,403
St. Louis  15,805 116,441
Baltimore    20,057 107,665
Hamilton county, 0.
(Cincinnati)   17,740 97,545

Boston  18,296 81,381
Pittsburg .. 19,497 45,573

A Backwoods Case.

"Your honor," said a proseauting
attorney in a court in Texas, "the
prisoner at the bar is charged with
killing one of the most exemplary cit-
izens of this country. Andrew Boy-
son, your honor, was in every respect
a model man. He was a beloved mem-
ber of the church, and not once
known to be guilty of an un-Christian
act. Why, your honor, he was never
seen to bet on horses, play poker,
drink whiskey, or use tobacco. He-"
"Hold on a minute," the judge

broke in; "you say he didn't bet on
horses 1"
"That's what I said, your honor."
"And he didn't play poker 1"
"Never was know to play a game."
"And lie never drank ligoor1"
"Never a drop, your honor."
"And he didn't-chew tobacco ?"
"Never took a chew in his life."
"Well, then," said the judge, lean-

ing back with a sigh, "I don't see
what be wanted to live for. There
wasn't anything in life for him, and
don't see why he ain't about as well

.off dead as alive. Release the prison-
er, Mr. Sheriff, and call the next
case."

Method of Brushing the Hair.

Some morning when brushing your

hair the thought may suddenly oc-

cur to you that the -left side of your
head is covered with a more abun-

dant hirsute covering than the right

side, and you will wonder why it is.
But even while wondering you will

conclude that the difference is a mat-

ter of small importance, that the one

sidedness is more prominent in your
imagination than it is in reality, and

that you are the only one who wiil

ever notice it. And then you will

think no more about it-that is, not

at first. But after several months

the scarcity of locks on the near side

of your head will become so apparent
that it will compel you to give it your
attention. Then, if you are wise,you

will straightway seek the cause of the
distressing effect and a remedy there-
for.
By consulting competent advisers

you will in nine cases out of ten learn
the following; The majority of wom-

en do their own hair-dressing, and in
brushing they find it most convenient
to draw the hair down in a string
oyer the left shoulder. In that way
the long strokes are given from the
hair follicles on the left side of the
head to tips of the hair, while the
right side, from which the locks are
tightly drawn, is given only a stroke
and a promise as a sort of peace offer-
ing. Consequently it is the glands of
the left side only that are strengthen-
ed, and it is but a question of time
when the hair on the right side of

the head will begin to fall out and
give evidence of the lack of attention.

The most effective remedy is to in-
augurate a method of treatment dia
metrically opposed to that hitherto
employed. Brush over the right
shoulder instead of the left and give
the hair on that side the attention it
deserves, and it will not be long until

you will notice a difference in its
quantity and general appearance. It
may be rather awkward at first for a
right handed person, but the exigen-
cies of the case demand that. a lost
charm be regained at the cost of a
little personal inconvenience.

Good advice: Never leave home on
a journey without a bottle of Cham-
berlain's Colic, Cholera and Diarrhoea
Remedy. For sale by R. S. McKinney.
Druggist, Taneytown, Md.

His Mistake.
•

"Say, what's going on in tbar 1"
asked an old fkriner at South Pitts-

burg the other day, pointing to a

building from which he had just
emerged.
"Prayer meeting," replied the per-

son addressed.
"Wal, by gum; I thought it was a

democratic rally, an' I went right in

an' waited for the speaker ter begin,"

said the old man. "I 'lowed it was
mighty queer when they started off

with a prayer, an' when a feller got

up and began talking about free sal-

vation instid of free silver, I allowed

it warn't may kind of a crowd an' I

was powerful sartin 'twant no Mc-
Kinley rally cause them yer fellers
don't want nothin' free. The more I

studied on it the more puzzled I got
an' finally I slid out. Say, let's go
somewhere an' liquor utt. I haint

had my nerves so slink up sence the

campaign begun."- Valley News,

Sequaeliee. Tenn.

From Sire to Son.
As a Family Medicine Bacon's Cel-

ery King for the Nerves passes trom
sire to son as a legacy. If you have
Kidney, Liver or Blood disorder do
not delay,but get a free sample pack-
age of this remedy at once. If you
have Indigestion, Constipation, Head-
ache, Rheumatism, etc., this grand
specific will cure you. R. S. McKin-
ney, the leading druggist, is sole
agent,and is distributing samples free
to the afflicted. Large packages 25c
and 50c.

Poetic jilts.
- -

Bike, and the world bikes with you;
Walk, and you walk alone,

And you can't get into society

If you have no wheel of you own.

An ambitious young maid from Dubuque,

Named Susan, tho' some call her Suque,

Has taken a notion
To cross the wide otion

And mary an earl or a duque.

Don't worry over anything,
But simply grin and bear it,

And if your lot in life is hard,
Get some rich girl to share it.

--
I took from her a kiss last night.
It was a wholesome smack.
And now Iwould give me great delight
If I could give it back.

Current Humor.

WOMAN'S WORLD.

THE GRANDDAUGHTER OF IOWA AT

THE STATE'S SEMICENTENNIAL.

BURIED GLACIERS.

Large Fields of Ice Covered Under Masses
of Luxuriant Vegetation.

Eight or ten miles to the north, on
the same side of Robertson's bay, north
Greenland, is a plateau about a mile
long, a quarter wide and with a pre-
cipitous face to the sea of 15 or 20 feet
and which stands back from the wa-
ter's edge not more than 30 or 40 feet.
To the west rise the lichen covered cliffs
to a height of from 3,000 to 5,000 feet,
capped with towers and pinnacles of
brown basalt. To the north is the terri-
ble and frozen expanse of the Verhoeff
glacier, producing every few hours,
with groans and cannonlike explosions,
great icebergs. This plateau, both top
and sides, is a mass of flourishing vege-
tation, chiefly grass, which, when one
walks through it, reaches above the
knees. From among this verdure butter-
cups, poppies, cinquefoil and dandelions
thrust their golden heads in wild profu-
sion. Yet beneath this rich vegetable
life, as glorious in its luxuriance as in
the meadows of temperate regions, with-
out other sustenance than that derived
from decayed moss and grass, is a por-
tion of a dead glacier, a body of ice
which is the sole formation of that pla-
teau, conquered and buried in the first
instance by the indomitable traveling
power of weak looking clump moss.
This sounds like a traveler's tale, but

the explanation of the phenomenon is
very simple, and similar examples are
found in many places along the fiords
of this northland. In the case of the
plateau, many centuries ago, judging by
the thickness of the growth of vegeta-
tion, the glacier at the head of the bay,
now known as the Verhoeff glacier, ex-
tended out to the sea, covering all the
space from cliff to cliff, except a narrow
gorge on each side of the moving, gi-
gantic, frozen river. In these gorges
clump moss struggles bravely for exist-
ence, but while the glacier moved for-
ward, crushing and burying everything
in its path, this form of vegetable life
could do little more than bold its own.
In the course of time, from some un-

known cause, the glacier began sudden-
ly to recede to the point where it now
discharges, that part of it which was in
the water floating away in the shape of
icebergs and those which were on the
shores remaining stationary, to be slow-
ly melted by the summer sun. This was
the opportunity for the mosses. Caring
nothing for the cold, they crept slowly,
inch by inch, over the quiet mass of ice,
perhaps then 50 or more feet thick, and
made their way, first, in thin, netlike
layers, and then, as time passed on and
strength was gathered, in thick masses,
till they reached the edge, which front-
ed the bay. Here, as the sun each sum•
mer slowly melted the face of the ice
wall away, they matted themselves firm-
ly and dropped over, lower and lower,
until they reached the rocky shore, and
the bilge block of ice was completely
hidden. Year after year the mosses
grew and flourished, the young plants
trampling the older underfoot until the
latter, rotting, turning into a rich mold,
burying the conquered fragment of the
Ice king deeper and deeper. Then grass
peed found their way into the moss,
blown hither by the winds or carried
there on the feet of birds. They germi-
nated and increased, and by their great-
er vigor in turn almost blotted out the
moss. To give finish to the charming
picture this created, blooming plants
took up their abode and flourished, un-
til every summer the plateau is a gar-
den of green, gold and white. How
long this condition of things will last
of course it is impossible to say. At any
time nature, who now holds the Ver-
hoeff glacier in check, may unloose her
hands, and then the frozen river will
likely pour down and out the bay once
more, crushing beneath it in its flow
the vegetation which now holds its bead
in triumph.-W. E. Meehan in Inde-
pendent.

"I wish I were an ostrich," said
Hicks, angrily, as he tried to eat one
of his wife's biscuits.
"I wish you were, dear," returned

Mrs. Hicks. "I'd get a few decent
feathers for my winter hat."

Mrs. Mackay-An' so ye have no
mother now?
Jimmy-No mum.
Mrs. Mackay-Well, may boy, when-

ever ye feel the want of a good lick-
ing, come to me and I'll be a mother
to ye.

A letter from a lady at an inland
watering place to her husband con-
tains the following passage: "In your
last epistle you sent me $50 and 1,000
kisses. I should be glad if, in future,
you would send me more money and
fewer kisses.

GEORGE ALL RIGHT. - Anxious
mother-"My dear, I'm afraid George
is getting into bad company. He is
out very late nearly every night."
Observing Father-"Oh, he's all

right. He goes to see some girl or
other.
"He hasn't said a word about any

young lady."
"No; but he's keeping company

with one all the same. His right wrist
is full of pin seratches."

Daniel Webster once owed a large
sum of money to the butcher, and
perhays he could not pay it; at any
rate lie did not. The butcher sued
him for the money. We don't know
whether he eventually got it or not,
but anyway, after the suit began he
did not call as usual to see whether
the Granite State giant wanted any-
thing to-day. Webster met him and
at once inquired, "Why don't you call
at my house any more 1" The butch-
er replied that lie did not suppose
Mr. Webster wanted to see him, in
fact, thought he might be offended.
"Oh; good heavens I" said Wedster,
"sue me as many times as you like,
but for heaven's sake don't starve
me to death I"

"Accident" Swindlers.

The extension of electric traction has
brought upon the scene a particularly
dangerous and offensive swarm of ras-
cals who prey upon the street railroad
companies by bogus claims for personal
injuries received in real or imaginary
accidents. They are fostered by a tribe
of disreputable attorneys, who make a
practice of communicating with all per-
sons whom they can identify as concern-
ed in any street railway mishap, and
often without instructions issue process
against the companies. Some of these
legal sharks have a regular staff of de-
tectives, who prowl about the depots
and termini of the lines on the lookout
for oases. False witnesses are easily
procured, and juries are usually liberal
in the matter of damages, the greater
portion of which are swallowed up in
the attorney's "cost." The evil has be-
come so great that the street railway
press is suggesting the formation of a
mutual protection society of some kind.
It is proposed to keep a register of the
names of claimants and interchange in.
formation as to persons who, it is more
than suspected, make a trade of the
business and travel from city to city for
the purpose.-Boston Journal.

Icing the Beds.

In Florida, where the heat at night
at some seasons of the year is almost as
unbearable as in the day, it is not un-
usual to ice the bed before retiring to
rest. This is done in a very simple way.
A metal vessel or pot, much in the
form of the ancient warming pan used
by our grandfathers, is filled with bro-
ken ice, and, after standing until the
ice has completely cooled the vessel, it
is placed between the sheets and moved
to and fro over the surface of the sheets
and pillows until they are quite cold.
This coolness of the bedclothes is very
soothing to the heated and wearied
body and invariably induces immediate
sleee.-Cincinnati Enquirer. 

The Kangaroo Rat.

One of the most interesting little ani-
mals known to inhabit any portion of
America is the kangaroo rat. This queer
little rodent is found only in the Death
valley region of California. It has long
and powerful hind legs and makes its
way wherever it goes by jumping. Its
coloring varies from light gray to dark
brown, according to whether it fre-
quents the alkali sands or the lava beds,
nature probably intending to protect it
from capture by likening its hue to the
surroundings. The kangaroo rat lives
in burrows, as sloes a smaller species of
rodent called the kangaroo mouse. -St.
Louis Republic.

Gas Economizers.

"Courtship is a good thing to save
gas bills," asserts a gas collector.
"Young women engaged or about to be
engaged usually mean a reduction in
gas bills of $2 a month. Cross children,
on the other hand, generally raise gas
bills $1 a month. Bicycling has injured
the gas trade terribly. First the husband
goes out upon a wheel; then the wife
follows his example. The gas is turned
down, and when they come back they
are usually so tired from the long rAirt
that they have no desire to sit up ifid
burn the midnight oil. "-New York

and,Exprele.

Waves and Curls of Hair-A Clergyman's

Opinion on the Right of Women to

Speak In the Church-Hats, Bonnets

and Toques-The Latest In Millinery.

,Miss Nannie M. Briggs, who deliver-
ed the address and read a poem writ-
ten by her mother, Mrs. Mary E. Briggs,
on "Pioneers and Old Settlers' Day,"
celebrated recently at Burlington, Ia.,
to commemorate the semicentennial of
the statehood of Iowa, is everywhere
known as "the Granddaughter of Iowa."

Miss Briggs is the granddaughter of
Ansel Briggs, Iowa's first governor, and
on this account was invited to partici-
pate in the celebratiqn. The young lady
is a Nebraskan by birth, first having
seen the light of day in Omaha March

MISS ICANNIE B. BRIGGS.

27, 1876. On her father's side she is of
Scotch-Irish ancestry. Her father is the
only living descendant of Ansel and
Nancy M. Dunlap Briggs, who was a
daughter of Major George W. Dunlap,
an officer of the war of 1812. Miss
Briggs was a precocious child and a dili-
gent student. Much of her time when
not in school was spent in travel. She
was a graduate of the class of '94 of the
Omaha High school and has since con-
tinued the studies of French, German
and music.
The poem which she read and of

which her mother is the author was
criticised by Longfellow just prior to
his death. Thus doubly endeared to her,
she dedicated it to the pioneer lawmak-
ers of Iowa.=-Burlington Cor. St. Louis
Republic.

CLOTHING AN ARMY. -

It Cast.: Britain Over S6,000,000 to
Dress Its Soldiers.

It costs the British government 88, -
25 0, 000 annually for clothing furnished
its army all over the world. Each of
the foreign possessions, however, has to
pay back to a certain extent the amount
which the uniforms of the troops sta-
tioned or sent there has cost, and this
entails no end of complicated bookkeep-
ing.
India, for instance, pays for the cloth-

ing of its own troops, and also for the
uniforms of the men which England
sends there. The latter item is about
$675,000 annually. On the other hand,
when a regiment comes home from In-
dia, that country has to be paid back
the full value of the clothes they wear.
The government sells' old and worn-

out articles to the secondhand dealers,
who, by the way, usually accumulate
fortunes in a short time. The value of
castoff clothes so disposed of is about
$140,000 yearly. The scraps remaining
after the uniforms have been cut out
also bring a matter of $30,000 annual-
ly. In all the authorities receive back
about $1,500,000, thus reducing the to-
tal cost of clothing the army to less than
$5,000,000 a year.
The best quality of everything is used

in the manufacture of uniforms. In
fact, it is said they are too good for du-
rable wear. A huge factory in Pimlico,
London, makes a large share of the fur-
nishings, but vast quantities of foot and
head gear are bought ready made. Boots
and leggings, for example, cost $1,165,-
000 and headdresses $250,000.
The thousands of miles of flannel,

linen, calico, cloth, velvet, etc., the
millions of buttons, the tone of cotton
wool, the billions of yards of sewing
cotton, that are made into smart tunics,
tidy trousers and warm shirts cost $2,-
425,000. The wages paid for making
these up are over $6,000 a week. Some
of the salaries paid for this branch are
excellent for England. The inspector of
clothing receives $6,000 and his assist-
ants $2,750 apiece, and so on down the
long list.
But all this vast expense is probably

much less than the annual outlay that
France or Germany makes for keeping
its soldiers smart in appearance in times
of peace. In Germany, for example, ev-
ery man in the army is said to have
four complete suits of military clothing.
-New York Journal.

Waves and Curls of Hair.

Women are dressing their hair as
much as ever in the mode of the figure
8, finished with a Psyche knot. The
hair about the face is puffed out over
small combs, to which are sometimes
attached the fluffy "weddings" which
make a puff look thick and rich, for
women, it is whispered, are beginning
to wear false hair again, and even
"rolls," or stuffing, to augment their
own locks.
The pompadour aureole is worn, pro-

vided it is becoming, and, if the shape
of the face forbids it, it is contrived in
a modified form, and soft little rings of
hair are arranged about the brow and
temples. For most women some kind of
"bang" is indispensable. It should not
be forgotten that it softens the lines so
often seen in women past their girl-
hood. When cut and curled with an
artistic sense, the outline of the hair on
the brow brings out every feature of the
face to the best advantage.

Curls are much in evidence-curls
falling over or beneath flat braids and
coils at the back of the bead; curls peep-
ing out coquettishly behind the left ear
or drooping low on one side of the neck;
ringlets, glossy, smooth, round like a
cylinder and capable of "bobbing" in
enchanting fashion with each move-
ment of the owner's head.

Whether for street or evening toilet,
the hair is worn moderately low. In no
case does it tower above the forehead, as
formerly. Far back, on the very crown
of the head, is the center of the coiffure.
And the tresses must be waved-waved
and crimped all over the head to give
the loose, unstudied, yet pleasing, effect
so much sought. Gloss and smoothness
are desirable, and curling irons are de-
nounced for constant use, as the heat
dries up the natural oil and renders the
hair brittle and liable to premature
grayness.

All kinds of contrivances are used for
producing the requisite wave and crimp.
"Crimpers" have charming little rib-
bons attached as fastenings, so arranged
that madam looks quite as captivating
in her crimping pins as when in full
regalia. A golden head with bewitch-
ing little blue bows dotted all over it
or ebon locks cased in orange or crim-
son crimpers are really far from unbe-
coming.

Every woman wears her grandmoth-
er's tortoise shell comb, or one just as
nearly like it as she can buy. Gold and
silver combs or combs with cut steel
headings make a pretty circlet or half
moon of brightness against dark or au-
burn locks.-Philadelphia Times.
_ -._

A. 11'nettea Haptiszu,

At last our bantling is labeled, regis-
tered, catalogued, classed in its place
in that closed and guarded society
where each one of us stands on his
square like a figure on a chessboard. It
has not yet breathed the fresh air; its
first outing is usually for the sacrament
of baptism. Carried to church in sump-
tuous robes, its sponsors renounce sa-
tan's works and pomps in its name,
while its forehead is all wrinkled by
crying as the holy water trickles on it
and its little face all screwed awry by
the salt laid on its tongue. This cere-
mony, performed before the assembled
family, is a very simple one in Paris
and all large cities. The godfather gives
the godmother a present, another to the
young mother and invariably presents
his godchild with a silver mug, fork
and spoon. Sugared almonds in orna-
mental and gilded boxes bearing the
child's name are distributed to friends,
but that is all. The plainest peasant
baptism has a much more solemn stamp.
It never takes place without a great
feast. The file of guests walking to
church behind the godparents, arm in
arm and two by two, is as imposing as
a wedding procession, And in this re-
spect matters take the same course at
the chateau as they do on the farm.
There is great ringing of bells, a feast
and showers of sugared almonds, min-
gled with pennies for the village ur-
chins. The baby's nurse, overwhelmed
with gifts that day, is the heroine of
the festival.-Th, Bentzon in Century.

Milton ist work,
Milton used to sit leaning back

obliquely in an easy chair, with his leg
flung over the elbow of it. He frequent-
ly composed lying in bed in the morn-
ing, but when he could not sleep and
lay awake whole nights not one verse
could be make. At other times his un-
premeditated lines flowed easy, with
certain impetus and cestrum, as he him-
self used to believe. Then, whatever
the hour, he rang for his daughter to
commit them to paper. He would some-
times dictate 40 lines in a breath and
then reduce them to half the number.
These may appear trifles, but snob tri-
fles assume a sort of greatness when re-
lated of what is great,

The Boy With the Hat.

BUT I1E DOESN'T LOOE IT.
-Punch

Some People's Folly.
Why some persons will suffer with

the excruciating pangs of rheumatism,
when they can be so easily cured by
that greatest of pain-cures, Salvation
Oil, is past human comprehension.
That Salvation Oil does cure rheuma-
tism is evidenced by Mr. G. F. Schra-
der, Pierce, Neb., who says : "I have
used Salvation Oil and think there is

po liniment on earth like it. I had the
rheumatism for several months and
cOuld get no relief until I used Sal-
vation Oil, two bottles of which effected
a cure, and I feel as well as ever. No
home should be without it." Salvation
Oil is sold everywhere for 25 cents.
When dealers offer a substitute be-
ware, you'll be victimized. Insist on
having the best, Salvation Oil.

[A Native Taneytown-er.]

ATTORNEY-AT-LAW,

NOTARY-PUBLIC

In as For The
Commonwealth of Pennsylvania,

No. 435 GRANT STREET,

PITTSBURGH, PENN.

Special Notices.

Schneeberger's
Trade Palace!

33 East Main St. WESTMINSTER, MD.

CABINET PHOTOGRAPHS only
$1.00 per dozen. How? Call at

P. B. Englar's and find out. Every
purchaser of $3.00 worth of goods can
get them.

CHOPPING of all kinds promptly
done. Mili now ready for such

work.
ZOLLICEOFFE & BRO.
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Great Cut-price Event!

Glorious Bargain Record
of 1896!

IMEIMIE1111011011.111•11MMIN

We have in lily reasons for this reduction sale. First, an unusually large
stock, provided months ago, anticipating usual trade; next, the conditions
of past months have left us with more stock than we care to risk on late de_
mand, hence this warranted reduction of prices.

All of 50c Novelty Dress Goods at 39c. All 30c and 40c Dress
Goods at 25c. Trimming Silks, sold formerly at $1.00 and $1.25,
now only 75c. 25 pieces Dress Ginghams reduced from 7c a
yard to Cc. 7c Canton Flannels reduced to Sc. 40c Twill Red
Flannel reduced to 25c. 25c Red Flannel reduced to 18c. 15c
fancy Flannelets reduced to 9c. A reduction of 25 per cent. on
all our Wool Blankets; of which we have a large stock.

CAPES AND COATS.-$8.00 Plush Capes reduced to
$5.50. 02.00 Plush Capes, handsomely trimmed in jet, silk
linings, reduced this week to $7.98. Cloth Capes from $1.49 Up
to $7.00, reduced 25 per cent; this sweeping reduction will thrill
every buyer with wonderment when they gaze upon these mon-
ster values.

BANNER CLOAK BARGAINS.-Ladies' Beaver Jack-
ets, large sleeves, sold formerly at 04.00 reduced to $3.00, La-
dies' Beaver and Cheviot Jackets, very shapely and stylishly
fashioned garments, with new Victoria collar, best $7.00 Jackets,
Schneeberger's reduction price, P.98.

LADIES' AND GENTS' FURNISHING GOODS.-La-
dies' heavy fleece-lined Vests, nicely finished, usually 25c, re-
duced to 17c, Men's heavy Camel-hair Undershirts and Draw-
ers to match, others sell at 75c, our price now only 48c. Here
is the chance of your life -Men's All Wool Ribbed Undershirts
and Drawers, regular price was $1.25; reduced to 89c. Men's
Working Shirts, former price 75c, we have about 10 dozen, re-
duced this week to 48c. Ask to see our Dress Lining and Find-
ings; we save you from 25 to 50 per cent. on your Dress Outfit-
tings. We also announce a reduction of at least 25 per cent, on
all Rag and Ingrain Carpets. Come early and often; the advan-
tages are in your favor.

Corporation Tax-Payers
TAKE NOTICE!

I will be at the Post-office,
to receive Taxes, on
November 14th., 1896,
from i o'clock to 4 o'clock, p.
m., after which time interest
will be charged.

B. S. MILLER,
lt Collector,
•

-- FOR --
Wind Storm Insurance,

apply to

P. B. ENGLAR,
TANEYTOWN, MD.

M. SCHNEEBERGER.

LI7vTE. LIME.
All parties that want a good, quick and durable Lime, free of impurities,

should buy Legore's Combination of Lime. As a guarantee and comparison
we submit five different analyses made by H. J. Patterson, State Chemist of
Maryland, Prince George's Co., for the coneideration of farmers and others
who want the best article. Special inducements in prices, terms, &c., will
be given.

It will pay all parties who intend using lime this season, to give it a
trial and the preference. Send for prices, giving amount wanted. Satisfac-
tion guaranteed in every respect. For further information call on or address

J. W LeGO E; Woodsboro, Md.
Below are the five different analyses made by the State Chemist.

per cent, per cent, per cent, per cent.
Lime (CaO) Ave. Sol. Lime..  97.61 96.00 97.00 96.80
Magnesia (MgO)  .43 1.08 .43 .72
Oxide of Iron and Alumina  1.07 1.20 1.60
Silica  . .80 1.63 .41 .08
Undetermined  .09 .56

100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00
Calcium (Lime) Carbonate 98.39 per cent.
Magnesia Carbonate   .51 „
Oxide of Iron and Alumina  .60 „ o
Silica  .50 „ I,.

100.00 „ SI

THE  SIZE OF  IT!

7 It,
P N.

5 38
5 45

.....
6 53
Ii 07

WESTERN MARYLAND R. R,
Connecting with P. & R. It. at Shippens.

burg, and Gettysburg; Norfolk & Western R.
It. at Hagerstown; B. & 0. Railroad at Hagers -
town and Cherry Run; Penna. It R. at Bruce-
vine. and P. W. & B.. N. C. and B. & P. Rail-
roads at Union Station. Baltimore, Md.

Schedule in effect June 28th., 1896.

Read down STATIONS I Read upward

A.M. A.M.' A.M.
Ii 25 5 25je Cherry Run, ar 848
Ills 528' the Pool  845
11 40 5 42 ...Clear Spring  8 33
11 46 5 48  Charlton.... 828
11 56 559 W'msport, P. V, 8 19
12 15 6 13 ar Hagerstown le
P.M. A.M.

808..Williamsport..

P.M. P M.
120 905
117 902
104 848
12 59 842
1241'831
1235 810

A.M. P.M. P.M.

• ..... 825

P.M.
*4 10

4 29
435
4 42
4 45
4 44,

ioo
2 16
225
231
242
2 45
2 48
253

. .
702
721)
7 2".
736
7 41
7 44
7 46
751

is Hagerstown ar
.Chews v
..Smithsburg
. Edgemont....
:Blue Mountain.
 Pen Mar 
Buena Vista Sprg
ar .. Hi ghlield it

A.M. P.M.P.M
p731' 12 15 808
  11 59 750
1711 11 51 741
7 06 11 45 735
6F 1139 726
6 54 11 31. 7Z4
6 52 11 29 721
  1/ 2t- 720

P.M.
253
336
3 52
4 16
4 3.3
4 45

A.M.
7 50 le. . Nightteld ..ar

Fairtield 8 16
81.3
9 07

9 38

...Gettysburg ...
..New Oxford.
 Hanover 
ar.. Porters .

P.M. A.M.

P.M. A.M.
527 938 le. . Porters . ar
535 947 ..Spring Grove ..
6 00 10 12 ar York is

P.M. P.M. A.M.
  253 750
455 284 752
521 320 816

331 826
344 837
354 845
35'o 849
408 814
427 911
5 03  

637 504 943
519 10 08
6 03 10 27
P.M. A.M.

.....

A.m.
11 25
10 56
10251
10 03
946
935
A.M.

.....

A.M
932
928
900

P.31.
7 17
48

6
5 55
5 42
27

P.M.
4 43
4 31
4 10

fe..Highfiel d..ar
...Blue Ridge...
....Thurmont....
..Rocky Ridge..
....Bruceville....
..Union Bridge..
 Linwood 
..New Windsor 
.. Westminster 
Emory Grove.
 G Lyndon 
....

Baltimore 

A.M. A.M.
  11 28
648 112,1
6 24 1053 
• 10 40
6 06 10 29
6 00 10 20
  10 16
5 53 10 /0
540 956

912
511 911

835
..... 811

P.M.
720
7 15
647
686
623
6 13
607
602
542

4 59
423
4 CO

P.M. P.M. A.M. A.M.
825 7 15 1135 ar Washington le - -
it 54 9 5112 54 -Philadelphia... 12 05
12 33 1238 303 ar..New York..le 900
A.M. .4.M. P.M. P.M.

A.M.
7 CO
3 50
12 15
A M.

P.M.
2 01
1 12
11 00
A.A1

Pen-Mar Express, Sunday, leaves Arlington
9.35 a. in., Sod/nook 9.40, Glyndon 10.01, WeSt-
ininster 10 31, New Windsor 30.45, Union Bridge
10.53, and Thurinont 11.14i a. in.
Blue Mountain Express, [Parlor Car] leaves
Baltimore 3.22 D. in., stopping at Westminster,
New Windsor. Union Bridge. Bruceville !con-
nection for Frederick], Thurmont, Blue Ridge,
Buena Vista Spring, Blue Mountain, $8mith-

burgate ll. hoalgetrattit wiB Express, [east] leaves Ha-
gerstown 6.43 a. m., stopping at above stations,
also Rocky Ridge, Glyndon, Owings Mills and
Sudbrook Park.
Additional trains leave Baltimore for Union

Bridge and Intermediate Stations at l0. It,.
and 5.00 and 6.07 p. m., and leave Union Bridge
foi Baltimore and Intermediate Stations at 5.2
and 637 a. in., and 12.55p. in. daily, except Sun
day.
Sundays only-leave Baltimore for Union

Bridge and Intermediate Stations at 9.30 a. in.,
and 2.30 p. in., and leave Bruceville 03,5 a. in.,
and Union Bridge for Baltimore and Interme-
diate Stations 3.58 p. m. .

There never has been grWer values ia honest Clothing
and Hats offered anywhere in this section of the state, than
are now contained within the walls of my store. Larger
stocks, possibly, but never greater values in the medium and
low-priced grades, such as I carry. A man's experience in
buying is worth something-even if almost any one can do
the selling, particularly if he regards the truth lightly- and
intelligent buying, with honest selling, is all that an honest
customer can expect. You get this at my store, and nothing
less. Those who want to "dicker" and "jew" and be begged
to buy, can't be supplied at my establishment.

Mens' Suits!
A lot of new goods, ranging in price

from $4.00 to $10.00. Every suit a
bargain, and every one at a bed rock
price. Better goods sold by sample-
fit and satisfaction guaranteed. Big
bargains in old stock-most of it as
good as new-suits from $2.50 up-
wards.

Boys' and Children's!
A full stock of all sizes in new

goods. Children's suits from $1.25 to
$4.00. Boys' three-piece suits from
$3 50 to $8.00. A lot of single suits
from $2.00 to $1.00. The cheapest
line of Boys' suits ever in Taneytown,
without doubt. Take a look at them
before fitting out your boys.

Derby Hats
Well, I've sold thousands of Hats,

but have never had such excellent
ones for small money as this season.
For instance, you can get a surpris-
ingly good stiff bat for $1.00; other
prices are $1.25, $1.40, $1.50, $1.75,
$2 00 and $2 25. You never saw such
a great assortment of headwear of
this style-and all new ones. Every-
thing in the Hat line, and pretty
nearly everybody comes to our store
when they want to purchase.

Golf Caps.
This is the great Cap year-have

already sold more this season, so far,
than in any two previous years.
Why? Well, because they are "the
go," and because the cap we sell at
25 cents brings 35 and 40 cents at most
places-and because we know where
and how to buy them. Children's
Caps are- particularly popular, arid
we've got lots of 'em. When you
want a cap come to the Cap head-
quarters.

Gloves! Gloves!
You know we sell Updegraff's.

Everybody who knows of good driv-
ing gloves, knows about Updegraff's.
All kinds of hand covering. Just
think? Men's Oil Tan, lined, knit cuff,
gloves only 25c. Boys' of same, at
same price. Fur gloves from $1.00 to
$3.50-also Fur Collars.

Underwear.
If you want really good Underwear

-whether all wool, part or all cot-
ton-you can't find better goods any-
where. Our 40 per cent, wool shirts
and drawers, both white and natural
wool, at 50 cents, are the very best
the market produces, without excep-
tion,

Fellow citizens, you can rely on our word for it that you
will make no mistake in making your purchases this fall at
our store. Everything learned in twenty years experience
in business, and every fact in connection with the times, has
been carefully brought to bear in the purchase of our present
stock, and the pricing of it -every effort made to make our
interests identical. Will you investigate these statements?

P. B. ENGLAR,
CLOTHIER AND FURNISHER.

TANEYTOWN, MD.

Baltimore Ss Cumberland Valley R. It.
Leave Hagerstown for Shippensburg and

Intermediate Stations 6.2.5 and 11.10 a. in. and
7.05 p. in., and leave Shippensburg for Ha-
gerstown and Intermediate Stations at 6.00 a.
m. and 1(19 and 3.08 p. in.

Leave Rocky Ridge for Eminittsburg at 8.28
and 10.40 a. in., and 3.31 and 6.36 p. m. Leave
Emmittsburg for Rocky Ridge at 7.,0 and 10.00
a. in., and 2.: 0 and 5.50 p.
Leave Bruceville for Frederick at 9.40 a. m.,

and 5.40 p ni. Leave Bruceville for Taneytown.
Littlestown and Columbia at 9.44 a. m. and 3.45
p. in.
B. & 0. passenger trains leave Cherry Run

for Cumberland and intermediate points, No.
13, daily at 8.57 a. m. For Piedmont and inter-
mediate, No. 17 daily, except Sunday, at 1.26 p.
m., and Chicago Express, No. 7, daily at 10.40
p.m.
Passengers for Chicago Limited, No, 5. or

Cincinnati Limited, No.!, take No. 17 to Han-
cock and there transfer to No. 5 or No. 1.
Passengers for B. & 0. Pittsburg Express,

No. 9. take No. 7 to Haueovic and there trans-
fer.

All others daily, except Sunday.
ttitops only to land passengers from Balti-

more.
HOOD,Pres't and Gen'l Manager.

B. H. GRISWOLD, Gen'l Passenger Agent.

1896. THE SUN! 1896.
BALTIMORE, MD,

The Paver of the People,
For the Peonle and with the Peovle

HONEST IN MOTIVE,
FEARLESS IN EXPRESSION.

SOUND IN PRINCIPLE.
UNSWERVING IN ITS ALLEGIANCE TO

RIGHT THEORIES AND
RIGHT PRACTICES.

The Sun publishes all the news all
the thne, but it does not allow its
columns to be degraded by unclean
immoral or purely sensational matter,
Editorially, The Sun is the con-

sistent and unchanging champion and
defender of popular rights and inter-
ests against political machines and
monopolies of every character. Inde-
pendent in all things, extreme in
none. It is for good laws, good
government and good order.
By mail 50 cents a month, $6 a year

THE BALTIMORE WEEKLY SUN

The Weekly Sun publishes all the
news of each week, giving complete
accounta of all events of interest
throughout the world. As an Agri-
cultural paper the Weekly Sun is un-
surpassed. It is edited by writers of
practical experience, who know
whst farming means and what far-
mers want in an agricultural jour-
nal. It contains regular reports of
the work of the agricultural experi-
ment stations throughout the coun-
try, of the proceedings of farmers
clubs and institutes, and the discus-
sion of new methods and ideas in
agriculture. Its market reports, Poul-
try Department and Veterinary col-
umn are particularly valuable to
country readers. Every issue con-
tains Stories, Poems, Household and
Puzzle Columns, a variety of inter-
esting and instructive selected matter
and other features, which make it a
welcome visitor in city and country
homes alike.
One dollar a year. Inducements to

getters up of clubs for the Weekly
Sun. Both the -Daily and Weekly
Sun mailed free of postage in the
United Stated, Canada and Mexico.
Payments invariably in advance,

Address
A. S. ABELL COMPANY,

Publishers and Proprietors,
Baltimore, lid

Taneytown Markets.
Corrected Weekly.

Flour,  .4.2544.25
Bran, per ton  13.00
White Middlings, per ton , 13.00
Timothy Hay, prime, per ton.. 8.00
Mixed Hay, per ton 5  00a 7.00

11.00a 5.00
.85
.35
20
25

Butter   .16
Eggs.  .18
Tallow  .03
Ha rus 
H Ides  .03
Hogs  4.00
Sheep    2.00
Lambs   3.00
Calves    3.50
Beef Cattle, best  4.00

2.00
Cows • $25 4D $35

2.50

Rye Straw 
Wheat 
Rye. new 
Oats. .new.  
Corr,  

Bullocks

Wheat
Corn 
Oats,  
Rye 
Hay, Timothy,  11.50Q13.50
Hay mixed  11.50Q12.00
Hay, Clover  10.50e11.50
Straw, Rye, bales  16.00016.50
Straw, Rye blocks  9.00e10.00
Straw, wheat blocks 6  5007.00
Bran 10.00e12.00
Middlings  9.50010.50
Potatoes, new, per bus  30032
Sugar, granulated  4.58
Sugar, confec, A  4.45
Beef Cattle, Best 3  50Q4.45
Beef cattle, Medium  3.25@3.75
Swine, gross  3.7504.20
Swine, Rough 3  00e3.50
Sheep, gross  2e3
Lambs, gross   NW*
Calves gross   OeliOt

medium 

Baltimore Markets.
Corrected Weekly.

  88(00
29(&30
19260A

. 42Q45


