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Most Anything
At A Glance

- 41a9cal

Almost by the day there is

a steady increase in student
rioting throughout the country's
college and high school campus-
es and one begins to wonder

just when this sort of nefarious
activity stops or lead us. There

is no question that many col-
lege officials have been negli-
gent in cracking down on these
demonstrations and actually ap-
pear befuddled and helpless. We
don't exactly concur with most

of Vice President Agnew's

views on some issues and opin-

ions, but we will have to go

along with his viewpoint this

week concerning the president

of Yale University who appar-

ently has lost control of his

ship. As a matter of fact the

prexy appears to have joined

forces with his dissenters so

who's going to run the ship

with such a mutinous crew

aboard? Anyway the demonstra-

tions are widespread and cover

just about the whole country
geographically, so there has to

be developed a complete new

line of thinking on matters such

as these, and I suppose that

leaves the subject matter in the

hands of the boards of trustees

and the alumni. Good luck,

gentlemen!
s * *

Much has been said and writ-

ten about the great proposed

Sixes Bridge Dam slated for

this area. For at least five

years this is all we have heard

and expectations were that the

project would be at least start-

ed IT this time. Last 3-ear it

was reported that plans had

been completed and it was be-

lie', ed that ire re about ready
to Start. Al'! we had to do was

wait for Congress to recon-

vene and to appropriate the

money. We're still waiting and

there's hardly a word being

mentioned these days about Six-

es Bridge Dam. We had high re-

gards for this project and

thought it would be a bonanza

for this area, but alas, our

dreams are beginning to fade

away.
* * s

Well, our annual Town Elec-

tion is now behind us and is a

matter of history. As usual we

have come out of it unscathed,

a bit surprised for some of us,

but nonetheless determined to

make the Town Government

funition, regradless of who is

running it. Someone must lose

and someone must win but when

the chips are down the welfare

of Emmitsburg is at heart and

that is what we are mainly

concerned with. There was a

little politicking by overly en-

thusiastic individuals, however

nothing of any magnitude. As

a result of Tuesday's action we

have a new Board and a new

year's work lays ahead of us

and this we must not forget.

The race was a clean affair with

but just a few innuendoes being

tossed ab out promiscuously

by certain individuals, but then

what's an election without a lit-

tle excitement? The turnout

was rather good for an election

which apparently had no major

issues to bedate or solve. Just

about half of the registered cit-

izenry advanced on the polls in

the excellent spring weather and

it became just a matter of do

you like this guy or do you

like that guy? Anyway, we

have a new Board and we're wil-

ling to give it a chance to

plunge into the many problems

ahead and see what it ..:an do

with them.

WEATHER REPORT

Temperatures for the Emmits-
burg District for the period end-
ed April 24, as reported by Mrs.
Lucille K. Beale, local weather
observer, were as follows:

H L
Saturday, April 18 --........66 38
Sunday April 19  00 38
Monday, April 20  57 38
Tuesday, April 21  65 42
Wednesday, April 22  70 38
Thursday, April 23  58 43
Friday, April 24  65 49

Precipitation for the period
amounted to 1.52 inches.

Serving in Guam

John Brooke Boyle, III, son of
the late Dr. John Broke Boyle,
Jr., and grandson of the late Mr.
and Mrs. J. Broke Boyle, former-
ly of Emmitsburg, is serving in
Guam while in the Navy.

Shooting Seriously

Wounds Man

At Zara
A 28-year-old Aspers, Pa., man,

Gwynne E. Ott, remains in the
Adams County Jail without bail
on four criminal counts brought
against him in the shooting of
Norman Moore, 29, Marmet, W.
Va., Friday evening at a Liberty
Twp., home, near Zora.
Saturday morning, Ott was ar-

raigned by Pa. State Police before
Cumberland Twp. Justice of the
Peace Charles R. Leader for as-
sault with intent to kill, aggra-
vated assault and battery, point-
ing a deadly weapon under the
uniform firearms act and assault
and battery.

The charges allege that Ott, a
truck driver, armed with a .32 cal-
iber revolver, shot Moore four
times. Moore, who has been list-
ed in critical condition at the
Warner Hospital since undergo-
ing prolonged surgery Friday
night for gunshot wounds of the
mouth, chest and right arm, re-
gained consciousness Sunday af-
ternoon.

The Adams County Grand Jury
had been scheduled to hear three
charges brought against Norman
Moore alleging assault with in-
tent to kill. The charges, signed
scene weeks ago, had been placed
by Gwynne Ott, Moore's wife,
Martha, and Ellen Bradley. Be-
cause of the shooting Friday, all
three cases against Moore were
continued until the next term of
county court.
The shooting of Moore occurred,

state police said, at 8 o'clock Fri-
day evening at a home just south
of the Zora intersection occupied
by Moore's wife, Martha, and their
two children and Mrs. Moore's
mother, Mrs. Mabert (Gingen)
Mahaney.
The charges brought by state

police against Ott also allege
that Mrs. Katherine Moore, 48,
Marmot, W. Va., mother of Nor-
man :Nne re --s eistel-whipped
while seated -in a car near the
Moore home during the shooting
incident. She was taken to the
Warner Hospital where she was
treated for lacerations of the
head and left knee.

According to the officers, the
shooting incident allegedly fol-
lowed a phone call by Norman
Moore to his wife's home in which
Moore is said to have threatened
to kill Ott.

Later Ott was said to have
opened the door at the Moore
home and found Moore at the
doorway. Police said they were
informed Ott fired a shot striking
Moore in the mouth. When Moore

fled, Ott allegedly continued shoot-

ing until Moore dropped to the
ground about 20 feet from the
Zora home.
Pa. State Police, assisted by

flamiltonban Twp. Police Chief

James Bigham, who was first to

arrive on the scene, said that

Ott voluntarily surrendered to

them at the Moore home.

Softball Game

Here Sunday
Action in the Frederick-Carroll

Softball League got under way
last weekend. Emmitsburg played
its initial game away and lost
a squeaker to Woodsboro, 4-3.
The Freeman Shoe team of Em-
mitsburg, a new team in the cir-
cuit, drew a bye last Sunday.
The first local home game will

be played on Community Field
here, Sunday, May 3, starting at
6:30 p.m.

April 26 Scores
Woodsboro 4; Emmitsburg 3

Thurmont 8; Blue Mountain 2
Liberty 8; Frederick 2
Sunday's Schedule

Liberty at Emmitsburg, 6:30 p.m.
Freeman Shoe at Thurmont
Standings

Woodsboro  1 0
Liberty  1 0
Thurmont  1 0
Freeman Shoe  0 0
Emmitsburg  0 1
Blue Mountain  0 1
Frederick  0

Band Practice

Time Changed
Starting Wednesday, May 6,

practice for the Emmitsburg Mu-
nicipal Band will begin at 7:00
p.m. instead of 7:30.
As our first parade is less than

four weeks away, all members
are urged to attend these prac-
tices. The first parade will be at
Union Bridge on May 26.

Opportunity sometimes looks
much bigger going than coming.

Library Art

Contest Under Way
The annual Art Contest spon-

sored by the Emmitsburg Public
Library has engaged many en-
thuastic participants. The contest,
which has been opened to the
Middle and Elementary Schools of
Emmitsburg, will reach its cli-
max on May 2.
The Art Coordinators, Mr.

Schneider of the Middle School,
and Sister Marie William of
Mother Seton School, will meet
with the judges on Saturday, May
2, to choose the winning pieces.
Winners will be announced on

Sunday, May 3. All art work
will be displayed in the Mother
Seton School Auditorium from 2
to 5 on Sunday.
Everyone is invited to COME

view the art exhibit.

Heart Collection

Highest Ever
The largest total ever collect-

ed here for the Heart Fund Drive
has been announced by Philip D.
Topper, drive chairman. The chair-
man reports that $1,146.31 has
been colleeted this year as com-
pared to $1,100.00 for 1968.

Special thanks are accorded both
the local VFW and American Le-
gion Posts for generous contribu-
tions. The committee also wishes
to express appreciation for the
donations received from the other
local organizations, the merchants,
and the general public who dis-
played their generosity by cot-
tributing to this worthy cause.
Your help in fighting the nation's
No. 1 killer and crippler was re-
flected in generous contributions
made to the Heart Association

which leads us in our fight against

heart and blood vessel diseases.

Miss Mary L. Cullison aided the

drive as local Captain, assisted

by these volunteers: Marguerite

Wolfe, Melva Hardman, James F.

Wivell, Jr., Phyllis Wivell, Mark

Wivell, Michael Lind, Sue Lind,

Gerolfe Englestatter, John S. Hol-

linger, Jr., George E. Rosensteel,

Alice F. Gregg, Betty Meredith,

Becky Stover, Fred Stambaugh,

and Sue Sanders.

Legion Auxiliary

Meeting Held
The regular monthly meeting of

the Francis X. Elder Unit 121,
American Legion Auxiliary was
held recently with the president,
Virginia Sanders, presiding.

Roll call showed 19 members
eresent. Minutes of the previous
meeting were read and the treas-
urer's report was read.
The president announced that

the District meeting was changed
to May 18 at 7:30 p.m. She also
announced that the local Unit

has been awarded three prizes

for making its goal. The group

voted to purchase a Child Wel-

fare Foundation Card in memory

of Evelyn Hartdagen; to purchase

200 poppies; and send $3.00 to

Convention Ways and Means. Vir-

ginia Sanders and Melva Hard-

man attended the District meet-

ing in Westminster recently.

Members reported the following

hours of activities: 65% hours

babysitting for 6 veteran chil-

dren, 13 hours babysitting for 5

non-veteran children; 8 hospital

visits were made; 3 get-well and

4 sympathy cards were sent; Girl

Scouts used the Auxiliary room

for 6 hours and one member do-

nated 6 hours time to Scouts; $65

worth of clothing was given to 3

veteran children and $25 worth

of food was given to the needy; 1

member worked 6 hours with the

Bloodmobile; 2 members worked

7 hours with the Senior Citizens;

3 members worked 9 hours at the

Legion party for the men; Pub-

lic Health Clinic used the Aux-

iliary room for 40 hours treating

37 child hygiene cases, 10 ma-

ternity cases and 11 family plan-

ning cases.
Refreshment committee for May

will be Ann Shorb and Emily

Rigby.
Nettie Ashbaugh won the draw

prize and Catherine Fitez's name

was called for the door prize but

was not present. The meeting

adjourned and the ladies joined

the men of the post for refresh-

ments.

The walleye is usually thought

of as a northern fish, but the

largest average size today comes

from the reservoirs of the mid-

South. Tennessee gave up the

world record 25-pounder.—Sports

Afield.

The principle is more than half
of the whole question.—Aristotle.

The big people in this world
usually leave off the big titles.

SINGLE COPY 10c

Hays, Myers Win
Local Election

Just about a flat 50% of the
qualified voters took time out to
cast ballots in Emmitsburg's Town
Election Tuesday. Of over 600
registered on the books, 345 cast
ballots.
In the mayoralty race, Samuel

C. Hays polled the highest num-
ber of votes to take the top slot
in the Town Government. Mr.
Hays polled 174 votes to take the
post. Hays' opposition, J. Ralph
McDonnell, just completing his
three-year term as Town Com-
missioner, was given 114 votes.
The third candidate in the three-
way race for Mayor, Paul E.
Humerick, received 34 votes. Both
Hays and McDonnell had held
Town offices previously while Hu-
merick was making his first bid
for public office.

In the race for Town Commis-
sioner, two 'newcomers battled it
out with E. Eugene Myers winning
with a total of 216 votes, the high-
est number cast for a single can-
didate for the day. He defeated
Joseph E. Stover who received
105 ballots. Neither has held
public office before.
The newly-elected Town officials

will take their oath of office be-
fore Magistrate Guy A. Baker, Sr.,
before Monday evening when they
will assume office at the regular
monthly meeting of the Burgess
and Commissioners. The judges
of election invalidated a total of
39 ballots for various reasons.
In the race for Mayor, 16 ballots
were nullified while 23 were tossed
out in the Commissioner race.
The ballot box and ballots will
remain under the custody of the
Police 'Dept. for 30 days, after
which the ballots will be destroy-
ed.

With the two new officials the
complete slate of Town Officials
will now be: Mayor, Samuel C.
Hays; Commissioners, J. Norman
Flax, Thomas W. Bollinger, Ernest
Rosensteel, all three hold-overs,
and Eugene Myers.

Considering the fact that no
major issues had been at stake,
at least none were debated public-

ly, the turn-out of voters was ex-
ceptionally well and there was a
genuine interest in the event.

All appointments of Town em-
ployees are made at the pleasure
of the Mayor, subject to the, ap-
proval of the Board of Commis-
sioners. These appointments are
either renewed or terminated by
the new administration. Appoint-
ments to be mule are Chief of
Police, Public Works Superintend-
ent and Town Clerk. It is custo-
mary to make these appointments
at the first organizational meet-
ing of the Council which will be
Monday night, at which time a
new Chairman of the Board of
Commissioners will be elected.

Retiring Commissioner J. Ralph
McDonnell, commenting on the re-
sults of the Tuesday's election,
had this to say, late this week:
"I want to thank the _public for
the fine vote accorded me in
Tuesday's election. While I was
unsuccessful in the election, I
really appreciate the support of
my many friends. It was a priv-
ilege and happy experience to be
able to serve you as Town Com-
missioner these past three years.
I pledge my support and efforts
to the new Council and wish them
a succesful term of office."
Mayor-elect Hays released the

following statement: "I wish to
express my appreciation to the peo-1
ple of Emmitsburg who have se-
lected me to be an official of the
Town for the next two years. It
is an honor. Every citizen should
serve his community in some way,
some time. My turn has come and
I shall do my best.
"Those who have already serv-

ed, Mr. Seidel and Mr. McDonnell,
need to be congratulated and
thanked wholeheartedly. Not only
have they already served but both
have promised support to the new
administration.
"The first concern of the new

board should be to plan a course
of action so that all of us can
know where we are going and all
can help to push in the proper
direction."

Mr. and Mrs. John Reaves Feted

At 25th Wedding Anniversary
Mr. and Mrs. John R. Reaves,

402 W. Main St., Emmitsburg,
were honored on the occasion of
their 25th wedding anniversary
Saturday evening at the Parish
Hall of Elias Lutheran Church.
The covered-dish and social were
given by their son and daughter-
in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Ronald E.
Reaves, Lutheran Thelogocial Sem-
inary, Gettysburg.
Mr. Reaves, a native of Lake

Mary, Florida, and Betty J.
(Rohrbaugh) Reaves, a native of
Adams County, were married on
April 17, 1945. They have two
sons, Ronald E., a seminary stu-
dent at Gettysburg, and Gary R.,
a sergeant in the United States
Air Force stationed at Keesler
AFB, Miss.
Those attending included Mrs.

Charles E. Rohrbaugh, Mr. and
Mrs. Ellis Rohrbaugh, Miss Joyce
Rohrbaugh, Mr. and Mrs. George
Glenn, Mr. and Mrs. Charles E.

Rohrbaugh Jr. and children, Den-
nis and Brenda, all of Fairfield
R2; Mr. and Mrs. George Glenn,
Jr., Fairfield; Mr. and Mrs. Don-
ald Vanderau, Gettysburg West
Apartments; Mr. and Mrs. Ron-
ald Reaves, Gettysburg; Mr. and
Mrs. Robert Sayler and Miss Mary
Jayne Sayler, Motter's Station;
Mr. and Mrs. John Flickinger, and
daughter, Penny Dee, Westmin-
ster; Mr. and Mrs. Randolph Val-
entine, Emmitsburg R3; Mr. and
Mrs. Charles Long and daughter,
Peggy, Emmitsburg R2; the Rev.
and Mrs. Ronald Fearer and son,
Daniel John, Emmitsburg; Miss
Ruth Shuff, Emmitsburg; Mr. and
Mrs. Reginald Zepp, Littlestown
R2; Mrs. Kathleen Green and
Miss Patricia Green, Gettysburg
R6, and Mr. and Mrs. Herbert
Rohrbaugh and children, Deborah
and Herbert Jr., Emmitsburg.
Many gifts were received by the
couple.

ROSECROFT TO OPEN

Stanley Dancer, driver-trainer

of the world's greatest trotter

Nevele Pride and holder of 79

two minute mile clockings, will
bring another of his outstanding
groups of horses to Rosecroft
Raceway on Saturday, May 2.
That's the night when the Oxon
Hill, Md. plant gets under way
with its 22nd annual meeting to
last 43 nights.

Dancer has reserved 25 stalls

at Rosecroft to hold his stand-
ardbreds as he tackles some of
the best drivers on the circuit in
search of the many purses offer-
ed in stake races, early closers,
and Atlantic Seaboard Series
Paces.

With a June 6th date kicking
off Grand Circuit Week, Dancer
will have five weeks of racing to
prep his 3-year-old charges for
the $30,000 William E. Miller Me-
morial Pace and the $10,000 John
W. Miller.

Public School

PTA Elects

Slate Of Officers
At a recent meeting of the Em-

mitsburg Middle School PTA, par-
ents and teachers were told of
the 'ungraded system" that is
presently being used at nearby
Victor Cullen School in Sabillas-
ville. Presenting a very inform-
ative talk on the educational
trends in the nearby institution
was Mr. Sherman G. Brett. A
question and answer period fol-
lowed Mr. Brett's talk. He later
was presented a birthday cake
from the local PTA in observance
of his birthday.

Mrs. Kenneth Fields presented
the report of the Nominating Com-
mittee for officers for 1970-71.
Nominated were President, Mr.
Kenneth Fields; vice president,
Mrs. James B. Graff; secretary,
Mrs. Kenneth Gigeous; treasurer,
Mrs. Alice Gregg and correspond-
ing secretary, Mrs. Ruth Wivell.
These officers will be installed at
the meeting scheduled for May
27.

A detailed report was present-
ed in mimeograph form concern-
ing the conditions of the local
school regarding health and fire
ccnditions, the over-all education-
al environment, and the future
possibilities for the present build-
ing. Parents who served since
January on the fact-finding com-
mittee included Mr. Norman
Shriver, Jr., Mrs. Ann Gingell,
Mrs. Gail Graff, Mrs. Florence
Bassler and Mr. Kenneth Field'.

The Hospitality Committee serv-
ed refreshments to the group fol-
lowing the adjournment.

MRS. W. P. PETERSON

Mrs. Rose P. Peterson, 74, of
648% Third St., Hanover, was
found dead at her home Friday
evening by a daughter. Dr. Mark
Redding, York County deputy cor-
oner, attributed her death to a
cerebral aneurism and set the time
of death at 6 a.m. Friday. The
daughter, Mrs. Pauline Kreitz,
who had resided next door to her
mother, discovered the body after
she returned from work Friday.

Mrs, Peterson was the widow
of the late William P. Peterson,
and a daughter of the late Lewis
and Susan Bowers Krug and she
was a native of Emmitsburg. She
was a member of St. Vincent de
Paul Catholic Church, Hanover.

Surviving in addition to Mrs.
Kreitz are four other children:
Mrs. Louella Shuyler, Gettys-
burg; Mrs. Howard Sanders, Mot-
ter's Station; James T. and Ken-
neth D. Peterson, Emmitsburg;
22 grandchildren, 14 great-grand-
children, and a sister, Mrs. Ann
Cool, Emmitsburg.

Funeral services were held on
Monday at 10 a.m. with a requiem
Mass in St. Joseph's Catholic
Church with the Rev. John King
officiating. Interment was in the
Mountainview Cemetery. Wilson
Funeral Home, Emmitsburg, was
in charge of arrangements. Pall-
bearers were Lawrence J Ott,

Howard Sanders, Joseph Peter-

son, Roy R. Sanders, Paul Shock-
ey and Ted Kreitz.

Mount Alumni

Chapter Reactivated
Mount Saint Mary's College has

reactivated its central Maryland
alumni chapter, and John H.
"Buzz" Walter of Emmitsburg
has been elected president.
This brings to eight the num-

ber of Mount alumni clubs or-
ganized in recent months under
the leadership of Msgr. Hugh j.
Phillips, college president. Oth-
ers are: Western Maryland (Cum-
berland), New England, (Ver-
mont, New Hampshire, Maine),
Rhode Island, Worcester, Mass.,
Metropolitan Boston, Ohio, and
Florida.
Other established Mount alumni

chapters are: Baltimore, Connect-
icut, Chicago, Harrisburg, Jersey
Shore, Long Island, New York
City, Philadelphia, Pittsburgh,
Reading/Allentown, Scranton, New
Jersey and Washington, D. C.
The Central Maryland chapter

covers graduates of the college
living in Washington, Frederick
and Carroll Counties.

Other officers are: Terrence R.
Best of Thurmont, vice president;
and George R. Gelles of Emmits-
burg, secretary-treasurer. Mem-
bers of the social committee, ini-
tially assigned to conduct a spe-
cial Italian night function prior
to June 15, are: Frank Ligorano,
chairman; Tom Ryan, Thomas J.
Stoner, and Fr. Philip Barrett.

Prices, at least, seem to find
plenty of room at the top.

RALPH McDON NELL
NEW PRESIDENT

OF LIONS CLUB
The annual election of officers

of the Emmitsburg Lions Club
was held at the regular meeting
of that group Monday evening in
Mt. Manor Restaurant, President
Milton A. Sewell presiding.
Roy Schaefer, Middletown, past

District Governor, gave a short
talk on Lionism. In addition there
were three guests present from
the Middletown and Carroll Man-
or Clubs. Local guests of the
club were Michael Seherrer and
Joseph Zanella.

The president reported I.e had
sent a letter of thanks to State
Senator Goodloe Byron for spon-
soring a successful bill in the re-
cent State Assembly which made
the Emmitsburg Civic Assn., a
tax-exempt organization. Floyd:
L. Lewis, sight conservation chair-
man, announced that the club had
recently purchased three pair s
of eyeglasses for focal indigent
children.

Elected to head the club for
the next year were: President, J.
Ralph McDonnell; first vice pres-
ident, J. Norman Flax; second
vice president, Charles F. Stout-
er; third vice president, Charles
F. Troxell; sccretary, William H.
Kelz; treasurer, Floyd L. Lewis;
tailtwister, Francis S. K. Mat-
thews; Liontamer, Marvin Laws;
directors, Milton A. Sewell, Nor-
man J. Shriver and Arthur Elder.

CYO Election
Scheduled
We wish to remind you that on

Friday, May 1, the CYO is spon-
soring a dance for the benefit of
Hurricane Camille victims. The
dance will feature "The Ques-
tions," and it will last from 8 un-
til 11. Admission is $1.25. Coat
and tie will be required.

Election of officers and com-
mittee heads will be held at the
dance. Anyone wishing to run
for any of these offices, should
have already handed in to Jelin
Hollinger a piece of paper con-
taining their name and the of-
fice they are seeking. Please vote
for the person whom you think
has the qualifications for the of-
fice.

Catholics To Get
Saturday Mass

In its March meeting, the Par-
ish Council of St. Joseph's Cath-
olic Church recommended to the
parish priests that they inaug-
urate a parochial Mass on Satur-
day evenings, at which the pa-
rishioners could fulfill their Sun-
day obligation. Permission for the
Saturday evening Mass was grant-
ed to the Archdiocese of Balti-
more by Cardinal Shehan some
time ago, but implementation was
left to the discretion and the de-
sires of the individual parishes.
The Parish Council did not set a
data on which the Mass would
be started, but asked that it be
done when the parish pliests felt
it was opportune.

Beginning this Saturday, May 2,
there will be a Mass at 7:30 in
the evening, which will conform
in every respect to the Sunday
Mass of the following day, and
at which the Sunday obligation

may be satisfied. It is being of-
fered on an experimental basis;
if the attendance warrants, it
will be continued; if not, it will

be dropped. The Sunday schedule

of Masses will remain the same,

until further notice. If it be-
comes apparent that four Masses

are no longer necessary on Sun-

day morning, in view of the num-

bers attending the Saturday eve-

ning Mass, then the Parish Coun-

ci: will be asked to consider a

re-structuring of the Sunday

schedule.
Confessions on Saturday evening

will be heard from 7 until 7:30,
and after the Mass. No Confes-
sions will be heard during the
Mass.

Senior Citizens'
Spring Festival
The time for the annual Spring

Festival, project of the Emmits-
burg Senior Citizens, is rapidly
approaching. This event will be
held Saturday, May 2, at the
Center, from 10 a.m. until 4:30
p.m. Everyone is invited to con-
tribute either material items or
muscular energy to help make the
affair a success.

Since November, 1969, the club
has been on their own 'financially,
so all assistance is thankfully ac-
cepted.

Don't miss the White Elephant
Table at the Festival. There will
be many useful articles for sale,
also used clothing in fine condi-
tion.
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Frederick County Backgrounds
By SAMUEL CARRICK

The Patterson-Crapster Family
Today, in order that certain

family ties might be fully under-
stood, some "back-tracking" is in
order.

Buried at Piney Creek Presby-
terian churchyard, located just
north of Emmitsburg, Md., are
the pioneer ancestors of the Pat-
terson family.

William (1) and Margaret Pat-
terson, his wife, were natives of
Armagh, Ireland. They came to
America with their only son, Na-
thaniel (2) Patterson, who is
buried beside them in Piney
Creek churchyard.
The inscription follows:
1. William and Margaret Pat-

terson, natives of County Arm-
agh, Ireland, emigrated to this
country in 1749, with their son,
Nathaniel, who is buried on the
north side of them. They iettled
in Delaware, near Chester Coun-
ty line, Pa. In 1756 removed to
Frederick County, Md., where the
old brick house is still standing.
They died in 1768 and 1770. Six
generations of their descendants
are buried round them."

Nathaniel (2) Patterson, son of
William (1) and Margaret, is in-
terred near his parents. The
graves of Nathaniel and his wife
are marked by a marbletable-
tomb:

2. In memory of Nathaniel Pat-
terson, died April 2, 1791, aged
64 years. Also Jane Patterson,
his wife, died March 10, 1891,
aged 60 years.

William (3) Wood Patterson,
son of Nathaniel (2) and Jane
Patterson, married on Sept. 19,
1797, Elenor Porter, daughter of
William and Sarah (Piercel) Por-
ter, his wife.
John (1), the first American

Porter, was born at Kenilworth,
Warwickshire, England, in 1590
and came to America on the "good
ship Anna." He arrived at Dor-

chestershire, Maryland on May
30, 1627. The Porters are buried
in Tom's Creek Presbyterian
graveyard. Eleanor (Porter) Pat-
terson had a sister Alice (2) Por-
ter, who married into the Flem-
ing family—they also are inter-
red at Tom's Creek Presbyterian.

William Woods (3) and Elenor
(Porter) Patterson were the par-
ents of the following children:

1. Margaret (4) Patterson, born
February 15, 1813, married June
13, 1838 to William Hibbard.

2. Nathaniel (4) Patterson. Born
July 19, 1791, married February
6, 1827 to Mary Walker.

3. Sarah (4) Patterson. Born
May 23, 1800, married February
6, 1821 to John Johnson.

4. Dr. William (4) Patterson,
born May 24, 1802, married July
19, 1831 to Mary Law.

5. John (4) Patterson, born De-
cember 1, 1806, married Nov. 7,
1832 to Mary Hibbard.

6. Jane E. (4) Patterson, born
April 29, 1809, married April 27,
1830 to John Barber.

7. Alice M. (4) Patterson, born
April 3, 1811, married December
4, 1835 to Abraham Crapster.

8. Margaret (4) Patterson (no
further data).

9. Harriet (4) Patterson, born
April 2, 1815, married Sept. 6,
1847, to the Rev. Francis Wright.

10. Charlet (4) Patterson. Born
April 13, 1815. Died Jan. 8, 1887,
unmarried.
Charlet (4) Patterson is inter-

red near her paternal grandpar-
ents. The inscription from the
marker at her grave follows:

3. In memory of Charlotte R.
Patterson. Born April 29, 1820,
died January 8, 1887, aged 66
years, 8 months and 9 days.
William Woods (3) Patterson

and his wife, Eleanor Porter are
also interred at Piney Creek. The
inscriptions in their family plot
are as follows:

4. In memory of Eleanor Pat-

BLUE DUCK INN
Emmitsburg, Md.

OYSTERS and CRAB FEED
EVERY WEDNESDAY
Serving From 7 to 10 P. M.

ALL YOU CAN EAT FOR

2.00 each
CRABS—$3 A DOZEN

JUST RECEIVED!
300 PAIRS

Men's Bermuda Shorts
FULL SELECTION OF LIGHT-WEIGHT
JACKETS - SHORT SLEEVE ARROW

SPORT & DRESS SHIRTS

HERSHEY'S
Men's Shop

Opposite The Courthouse

BALTIMORE STREET GETTYSBURG, PA.

HEADQUARTERS

1.•••••••••••••.•

FOR

Turf Builder
Plus 2

STILL ON SALE
Save $2.00-10,000 sq. ft. bag

NOW $12.95

5,000-sq. ft. bag, $6.95
SAVE $1.00

FERTILIZES TOO
Plus 2 makes lawns grow thicker
and greener too—helps grass fill
in where weeds were.

Geo. M. Zerfing
HARDWARE, INC.

Gettysburg Free Parking Rear of Store

terson, relict, William Patterson.
Died February 21, 1853, aged 76
years.
5. In memory of William Pat-

terson, son of Nathaniel Patter-
son, born at the Old Homestead,
July 4, 1776. Died November 22,
1847.
Buried in the last row of graves

(to the west) the first grave-
stone has a rather interesting in-
scription:

Nancy Agnes Brown, colored
servant of William Patterson.
Died at his grandson's, J. J. Crap-
ster, Feb. 8, 1885, about 85 years
of age. Her whole life was spent
with her master and his descend-
ants.
Crapster Notes:
Abraham Crapster was the eld-

est son of Ruliff and Abigail
Crapster. He was born in 1754
and died October 8, 1812. He mar-
ried Margaret McKaleb (McGaleb)
and moved to Liberty Town, where
he was a merchant from 1809 to
1812. Both he and his wife died
at "Liberty" and were interred
at Piney Creek. He is buried on
the right side of his great-neph-
ew and name-sake, Abraham
Crapster. in".-cied Alice Ma-
rk, PatteLz.m.

The inscriptions follow:
6. A. M. Patterson, wife of

Abraham Crapster, died May 26,
1888, aged 77 years, 1 month
and 23 days. Also Abraham Crap-
ster, son of Basil Crapster, died
June 30, 1855, aged 42 years, 3
months and 22 days.

7. In memory of Abraham
Crapster, died October 8, 1812,
aged 58 years.
8. In memory of Mrs. Margaret

Crapster, died February 13, 1809,
aged 59 years and 7 months.
Note: Abraham Crapster, 'Mer-

chant at Liberty Town, Md.," and
his wife, Margaret (McKaleb)
Crapster.
Abraham Crapster and his wife,

Alice Maria Patterson, who are
buried at Piney Creek. In their
family plot are the following ad-
ditional graves:

a. In memory of James Wal-
lace Porter Crapster, son of Abra-
ham and Alice M. Crapster, died
April 24, 1851, aged 15 years, 5
months, and 24 days.

10. In memory of Basil Dorsey
Crapster, son of Abraham and
Alice M. Crapster, died March 13,
1881, aged 43 years, 4 months and
26 days.

11. In memory of John J.
Crapster, son of Abraham and
Alice M. Crapster, born March
11, 1849, died July 20, 1909.
Mary E. O'Neal, wife of John

J. Crapster, born October 5, 1853,
died November 17, 1944.
The historical and geneological

study of the Piney Creek Presby-
terian burial ground, and the fa-
milies interred therein, will be
continued next week.

Every honest man will suppose
honest acts to flow from honest
principles.—Thomas Jefferson

A fool and his money have al-
ways been invited places.

Catoctin High
Honor Roll

By Roxie Aubol
The Catoctin High School Guid-

ance Dept. and principal, Mr.
Harper Long, have announced the
students who qualified for the
Honor Roll having maintained a
"B" or better average.

Six outstanding students lead
the CHS Honor Roll the third
term with straight A grades. They
are, Seniors, J. Calvin Chatlos,
Terry Masemore and Linda Sixx;
Junior, Kathy Best, and Sopho-
mores, Joanne Curry and Carol
Gearhart.
The freshman class led with 36

students qualifying for the Hon-
or Roll followed by juniors with
35. The sophomores had 27 and
the seniors 25, adding to the to-
tal 123 students.

There were 83 girls gaining
Honor Roll status as compared
to 40 boys.
The following students receiv-

ed a "B" or better average for
the third marking period:

Ninth Graders: Horace Beale,
Barry Burner, Jimmie Campbell,
John Creeger, Lewis E. Hahn,
Robert Henke, Brian Hicks, Ches-
ter Kerns, Paul Mackenzie, Car-
roll Newcomer, James Orndorff,
Paul Penwell, David Ryder, James
Sanders, Diane Baker, Paula Bol-
linger, Sigrid Botker, Susie De-
wees, Deborah Edwards, Betty
Sue Gelwicks, Debra Goulden, Sue
Harner, Debra Knott, Regina
Martin, Vernia Nealon, Sheri
Nutt, Rebecca Ohler, Bonnie Orn-
dorff, Sheila Reed, Brenda Smith,
Sandra Smith, Carol Snyder, Deb-
ra Sprankle, Vicki Stambaugh,
Kathleen V and Lisa War-
then.

Tenth Graders: Mark ...,urran,
Danilo Ligsay, Robert Long, Ken-
neth Working, Nancy Adams,
Deborah Armstrong, Roxanne Au-
bol, Karen Brake, Patsy Brett,
Pamela Brown, Sheila Chat10,
Anne Etheridge, Diana Flohr,
Donna Jackson, Brenda Manahan,
Olivia Myers, Diane Perry Mary
Ann Rice, Donna Repp, Eugenia
Ryan, Rita Thompson, Patricia
Trout, Anne Umbel, Deborah
Watkins and Peggy Wolfe.

Eleventh Graders: T i m othy
Campbell, Michael Jordan, Chas.
Keeney, Mark Long, Robert Mar-
tin, Mike McGee, Dennis Mozingo,
Charles Sprague, John Teeter,
Steven Thomas, Fred Tresselt,
Thomas Trout, David Wilhide, Pe-
ter Wood, Deborah Ambrose, Ter-
ri Bayletts, Lana Black, Cynthia
Dern, Peggy Ennis, Myra Gal-
breath, Elaine Goff, Barbara
Irons, Jackie Jay, Sally Mar-
shall, Mari Lynn Ogle, Donna
Pryor, Carolyn Seiss, Cheryl Seiss,
Patricia Stitely, Eleanor Teall,
Sharon Toms, Ellen Wagaman,
Margaret Wagerman and Elean-
or Wantz.

Twelfth Graders: Lee Koontz,
Price Lewis, John Martin, Robert
Martin, Wayne May, Wayne Six,
Cindy Biser, Connie Calimer, Bev-
erly Davis, Susan Fitzgerald,
Gwen Jagow, Patricia Jay, Deb-
orah Joy, Peggy Mathias, Carol
Miller, Theresa Myers, Roxanna
Overcash, Janice Phillips, Wanda
Riffle, Shirley Sheeley, Cheryl

• au
I People, Spots In The Newsl

'NECKPIECE' just fitted to this
cow elk in Wyoming is 24-pound
transmitter to Nimbus-3
weather satellite to trace herd
migra-
tions.

QUINT MAMA Mrs.
Margaret Kienast of
Far Hills, N.J. had been
told to expect multiple
births, but not 5!

' ",• •
NO THREAT to Lisa is Gertie
the Gerbil. Woolworth pet ex-
perts say gerbil's no-bites policy
is key to their popularity.

WHAT'S HE DOING? Dick Rambo of Arizona-State is
vaulting, with fiberglass pole, and photo was made from
directly under bar in new Salt Palace, Salt Lake City.

Smith and Elizabeth Williard.
Letters of commendation were

sent to the parents of these stu-
dents. In the letters Mr. Long re-
marked, "It is my pleasure to
congratulate the students and par-
ents, and to wish for all these
young seekers of knowledge the
best of all possible educations —
the kind that enlightens the
world, fires imagination and
gives wings to dreams. The school
is a door to opportunity, but only
the student can push it open." -

Fire Termed
"Suspicious"
A fire termed as of a "suspi-

cious nature," destroyed a two-
story small barn on the W. B
Shank property off Route 16, three
miles west of Emmitsburg, at 2:10
o'clock Saturday afternoon.

470.4ft$4b.r
tit

Vivacious Leslie Uggams, inter-
national singing star and Broad-
way-TV favorite, joins the grow-
ing parade of celebrities against
cancer. She urges everyone to
support the 1970 Crusade of the
American Cancer Society by
fighting cancer with a checkup
and a check.

Complete
FILM

DEVELOPING
SERVICE

CROUSE'S
Center Square

Emmitsburg, Md.
Phone 447-2211

Fairfield firemen assisted by the
Vigilant Hose Co. of Emmitsburg,
battled the fire for over a half
hour before bringing it under con-
trol.

Fairfield Fire Chief Lawrence
Eversole estimated damage to the
barn and its contents of hay at
$3,000.

Chief Eversole said Adams
County Fire Marshall John Mur-
ren investigated the fire Saturday
and a representative from the
state fire marshal's office in Har-
risburg was expected.
The barn was located near the

site of the Bonnie Myers home
that was destroyed by fire on
April 3. Mrs. Myers had tenant-
ed the frame home which is part
of the Shank property.

Principles become modified in
practice by facts. — Fennimore
Cooper.

5192 !PIE
"CLASSIFIED'
Bream is an all inclusive south-

ern word that can mean bluegills,
pumpkinseeds, redear and green
sunufishes and warmouth and
rock basses.—Sports Afield.

"It Pays To Look

COM 01,1-,T

TONSORIAL SERV ICE

Mac's Barber Shop
EmmiTsBuRG,

Warthen's Lawnmower Service
Repairs & Service

NEW & USED LAWNMOWERS

General Repairs — Blades Sharpened

KEYSVILLE ROAD — EMMITSBLTR.G, MD.

SAVE DURING OUR
STEVENS GULISTAN

COLOSSAL CARPET
SALE

Priced from $4.89 sq. yd. to $9.49 sq. yd.

GETTYSBURG SHOPPING CENTER

22 Springs Avenue Phone 334-7300 Gettysburg, Pa.

a most-wanted remembrance on

MOTHER'S
DAY

SUNDAY
MAY 10

Free Mother's
Day Gift-Wrapping

Choose from our wonderful
collection of soft, feminine
lingerie.

Mother will love our
Peignoir Sets in nylon or

easy-care cotton blends. . .

WALTZ GOWNS.. . SLIPS...
PAJAMAS. . . PETTICOATS..
PANTIES.. . HOUSECOATS..

All this and more!

30 Baltimore St., Gettysburg

Open Mon. thru Thurs. 9-5—Fri. and Sat. 9-9
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Unveil New Track At Brandywine

The bold new face of the all

new five - eighths mile track at

Brandywine is spread out in this

panoramic aerial shot, taken as

construction of the new facilities

nears completion. Pictured here,

from the top, clockwise, is the

barn area, with the luxurious

grooms' quarters and indoor pad-

dock in front, the deluxe indoor-

outdoor clubhouse and grandstand

to the right. The infield of the

new track consists of a single
huge lake, stocked with live fish

and waterfowl. The facilities will
be bathed in the most elaborate
and sophisticated lighting system
in use at any track in the na-
tion. The new track replaces the
venerable half-miler, third co-
fastest in the country, which was
retired at the end of the 1969
season.

Concert Scheduled

At Fort Ritchie
Sing-Out Carlisle, a regional

affiliate of the well-known inter-
national Up with People program,

will appear in concert Sunday
afternoon, May 3, at 2:30 at
the Fort Ritchie theater. Pro-
ceeds of the concert will be do-
nated to the Fort Ritchie Youth
Activities Assn., a self-support-

ing activity which is sponsoring

the event.

The 100-member organization of

high school age youths will pre-

sent a 90-minute concert of mu-
sic that. appeals to young and old
alike. Selections will include folk
sonrs, ballads, "toe-tappers," and
Broadway-like production num-
bers.bers of the national casts of
Up with People.
The cast is accompanied by a

LEGAL
ELSIE S. KLINE

ROBERT S. KLINE, her husband
R. D. 1, Box 90

Emmitsburg, Maryland
vs.

GRANT ABRAHAMS
his wife

MARGARET ABRAHAMS
R. D. 1, Box 88

Emmitsburg, Maryland
and

HARRY W. ABRAHAMS
JEAN ABRAHAMS,

his wife
Exmore, Virginia

NO. 22,786 EQUITY
In the Circuit Court for Freder-

ick County, Maryland.
In Equity

ORDER OF PUBLICATION
This is to give notice that on

the 22nd day of April, 1970, a
petition was filed in the Circuit
Court for Frederick County,
Maryland, by the Plaintiffs against

the Defendants, whose last

known address was Exmore, Vir-

ginia. The petition alleges in sub-
stance that Harry W. Abrahams,
deceased, of Exmore, Virginia,

died seized of two tracts of land

in Frederick County; that the said

Harry W. Abrahams died testate

on August 6, 1957, devising the
aforementioned tracts of land to

Elsie S. Kline, and to the Re-

spondents, Grant Abrahams and
Harry W. Abrahams; that tract

family dwelling and an additional

among the Land Records for
Frederick County, Maryland, in
Liber 428, folio 242; that the sec-

a one and one-half story, single

one and one-half story dwelling,
the deed to which is recorded

number one consists of approx-
imately four acres, improved by

OU

GROOVY GRO N

ond parcel of land consists of ap-
proximately one acre without im-
provements, the deed to which is
recorded among the Land Rec-
ords for Frederick County, Mary-
land in Liber 520, folio 5: that
the properties aforementioned are
not susceptible to partition with-
out substantial loss to the par-
ties hereto.
The relief prayed in the peti-

tion is substantially as follows:
that the properties be sold and
the proceeds, after deducting the
expenses and costs and the pay-
ments of any liens thereon, be
divided among the parties hereto
as their interests may require.
Whereupon it is ordered by the

Circuit Court for Frederick Coun-
ty, Maryland, this 22nd day of
April, 1970, that the Petitioner
cause a copy of this Order to be
in a newspaper published in
Frederick County, Maryland, once
a week in each of four successive
weeks before the 30th day of
May, 1970, giying notice to the
said non-resident Defendants, of
the object and substance of the
Petition and warning them to
show cause, if any there may be,
on or before the 30th day of
lune, 1970, why a decree should
not be passed as prayed.

SAMUEL W. BARRICK,
Judge of the Circuit Court for

Frederick County, Maryland
BYRON, MOYLAN & URNER
By Daniel W. Moylan
Solicitors
Frederic, Maryland
filed April 22, 1970
I fue Copy Test:
ELLIS C. wACHTER, Clerk

511 4t
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10-piece combo of guitars, drums,
piano and brass. Sound equip-
ment owned by Sing-Out Carlisle
and valued at $9,000 is used to
produce the show.
Formed more than two years

ago, Sing-Out Carlisle has ap-
peared nearly 50 times in the
Central Pennsylvania and North-
ern Maryland area. The most re-
cent performance was at North
Hagerstown High School under
the sponsorship of the Hagers-
town Lions Club.

Sing-Out is a non-profit organ-
ization which charges only its ex-
penses for performing. No mem-
ber of the cast or crew is salar-
ied. The organization is not re-
ligiously or politically affiliated.

Tickets are $1.50 for adults and
75 cents for children under 16.
Telephone reservations may be
made by calling Fort Ritchie, Ex-
tension 88240, Monday through
Saturday between 8 a. m. and 4
p. m. Tickets may be purchased
at Fort Ritchie Building 306 on
the same days and at the same

hours, or at the boxoffice on the
day of the performance.

To Discuss

Next 30 Years
"The Next 30 Years of Amer-

ican History" was the subject dis-
cussed on the Mt. St. Mary's Col-
lege campus this week by Arthur
I. Waskow, sometimes referred to
as historian for the "New Left."

Waskow, a resident fellow of
the Institute for Policy Studies
in Washington, D. C., spoke yes-
terday in the college's science au-
ditorium. His appearance was ar-
ranged by the student behavioral
science club in the department of
psychology and sociology. The
public was invited to attend.
Waskow has been active in lib-

eral and radical politics. From
1959 to 1961 he served as legis-
lative assistant to a United States
Congressman and as a member of
the staff of the Liberal Project.
In March of 1965 he spoke at

A lure tor "everyman"
By Tom Andrews

Like some TV celebrities, we also "get letters . . . lots of
letters." Many are from new or occasional fishermen, why pose

a variety of questions as wide as the Mississippi at the Gulf.
The most frequent query, how-
ever, goes something like this:
"What's the best lure for the

casual fisherman, the guy just
trying to relax on weekends?
I want to enjoy myself, and
I'm willing to buy some equip-
ment—but not every lure I see
in the sporting goods store!"
Well, that's a tough one,

particularly for someone who's
been sampling lures for half a
century all over the world.

Millions of people want to
enjoy the ever-popular sport
of fishing without any thought
of becoming really expert at
it. And they don't want to
make big investments of time
or money, either.
So this old-timer's advice to

them has to be cast in terms
of sticking with a few basic
lures, like poppers, jigs and
spoons. And I'll be honest—I
strongly favor spoons.

Properly designed, like the
Sprite or Silver Minnow by the
Louis Johnson people, a spoon
can be used by anglers of all
ages, experienced or not. The
spoon's exciting swimming ac-
tion is "built-in." All the

fisherman need do is vary the
speed of his retrieve from time
to time.
Another strong advantage

the occasional fisherman can
expect from a spoon that's
been around for some years is
the variety of weights and
finishes available to him. Using
the Sprite as an example
again, you can clip on a 1/50-
oz. size if fly fishing tackle is
what you prefer, or make any
choice from 1A  to 3/4 oz. if
you happen to like spinning or
bait casting rods and reels.
To really enjoy an outing

while keeping costs to a mini-
mum, follow these three simple
rules:

1. Buy a few spoons, and
a couple of poppers and jigs.
(Ask the salesman for weights
to match your particular
tackle.)

2. Select lures for color vari-
ety, but have at least two
spoons in high-visibility
chrome or gold.

3. Alternate between slowet
and faster retrieves.
And enjoy the action!

Capitol

Comment
By Charles McC Mathias

U.S. Senator

Crime Figures Provide
Discouraging Reading

The preliminary figures on
crime in the United States
during the calendar year 1969
provide grim and discouraging
reading. Once again, in 1969
we saw a rising crime rate.
Not only are we suffering
more crime than ever before
but a projection of present
trends indicates that we will
continue to suffer more and
more crime.

The rate of serious crime
rose 11 percent from 1968 to
1969. Forcible rape was up 16
percent, robbery was up 13
percent, assault was up 9 per-
cent and murder was up 7
percent. In the same year,
crimes against property such
as, larceny, automobile theft
and burglary rose 11 percent.

The figures upon which
these projections and reports
are based were released by
the Federal Bureau of Inves-
tigation on March 17. The
final report is due in July and
from the final report I am
sure that we can make some
further deductions with ref-
erence to the pattern of crime
in the United States.

But these serious prelim-
inary figures are already
enough to indicate what we
should have known already
about the nature of the crime
problem and what must be
done to solve it. It is not
enough to simply say that we
are going to gear up our so-
ciety and we are going to sup-
press crime. We have to un-
derstand the nature of this
problem and what the prob-
able remedies are.
I would like to start in this

war against crime by provid-

ing the law enforcement offi-
cials, the police departments,
and others who have the pri-
mary rssponsibility for law
enforcement and detection of
criminals with all of the sci-
entific and advanced techno-
logical equipment which will
be helpful in this area. I am
hopeful that action the Con-
gress has taken so far will re-
sult in doing just that.
However, we have not

moved to reform our courts so
that those who are appre-
hended and charged with
crimes get speedy trials. I am
hopeful that at long last this
preliminary crime report for
1969 will convince the Con-
gress and the country that it
is absolutely necessary to
move forward with court re-
form so that no criminal will
be able to wait for months
and maybe even years before
his guilt is adjudged, his sen-
tence is passed, and his pun-
ishment begins. This is a job
which the Congress, in dealing
with the Federal court sys-
tem, shares with every state
legislature dealing with state
court systems.
In addition, we must pay

particular attention to our
penal program so that those
who are apprehended, con-
victed, sentenced and impris-
oned will benefit by their ex-
perience. To simply put hu-
man beings in storage for the
time of their sentence is not
going to be of any substantive
help in solving the crime prob-
lem. I think we need to make
sure that the men who come
out of prison have learned
something from the exper-
ience.

the nation's first Teach-in, at Ann
Arbor. He was one of the au-
thors of "A Call to Resist Illegi-
timate Authority." Li 1968 he
was elected a delegate from the
District of Columbia to the Dem-
ocratic National Convention.
He is a member of the steer-

ing committee of the New Mo-
bilization Committee to end the
War in Vietnam and of the board
of the National Jewish Organiz-
ing Project.

by Mary Reynolds 0
Syruping In Vermont
Each spring the sap flows in

the maple trees of Vermont.
The onset and cessation of flow
varies according to weather
conditions, with the run usual-
ly starting in late February or
early March and continuing
through April. Thus, the sap
run is brief, and the syrup pro-
duced by concentrating the
natural sap is a precious com-
modity.
Syrup from the sap of Ver-

mont maples has become sym-
bolic of fine
cooking with a
real American
flavor. Cooking
with syrup has
always been a
tradition in
Vermont. Be-
cause pure
maple syrup is
hard to find
and then often rather expen-
sive, many cooks are recreating
the spirit of Vermont in their
kitchens by using flavorful Ver-
mont Maid maple and cane
blended syrup, available in
supermarkets nationally.

Add Vermont Flavor To Foods
Inventive cooks are bringing

the spirit of Vermont far be-
yond the usual confines of pan-
cakes and waffles. Take ad-
vantage of the ease and popu-
larity of fondues and give foods
that distinctive maple flavor by
dipping them into it. In warm-
ed or room temperature syrup
dip bite-size bits of fresh fruit,
doughnut sections, poundcake
squares, toasted marshmallows.
Or, for an unusual gl.n.red fin%
Vol\ pour syrup from the bottle
over turnips or sweet potato
quarters just before baking.
Substitute Vermont Maid syr-
up for sugar the next time you
make baked apples and apple-
sauce. Keep a bottle handy for
giving the spirit and flavor of
Vermont to planned and im-
promptu dishes.

AMERICAN ® CANCER SOCIETY

The most publicized endanger-
ed species, the whooping crane,
has increased its population to a
record total of 55 according to
the Bureau of Sports Fisheries
and Wildlife.—Sports Afield.

Hickory shad are found only
in the southern states. — Sports
Afield.

What Thep Wore...by PHYLLIS JOYCE
FASHION FOIBLES

IlsODAY MEN WHO BEMOAN THE ADVENT OF
THE MAXI AND THE MIDI AT THE SAME TIME
MIGHT FIND COMFORT IN SOME OF THE
FANTASTIC FOIBLES THAT WERE CREATED
YESTERYEAR IN THE NAME OF FASHION!

ROMAN-INFLUENCED GOWNS OF THIN WHITE
MYSLIN WERE THE SEDUCTIVE PIECE DE
RESISTANCE OF THE EAR.LY DIRECTOIRE PERIOD,
SOME WOMEN EVEN GREASED THEIR BODIES

SO THE FLOWING GOWNS WOULD CLIN. 'THE
GOWNS WERE DISCARDED WHEN AN EPIDEMIC
OF INFLUENZA HIT PARIS IN IBOS. IT WAS
CALLED *MUSLIN DISEASE:

TRANSLATION OF THOUSAND
AND ONE NIGHTS" IN THE
1870'S INSPIRED MANY
WOMEN TO AN UNGAINLY
DESIGN CALLED THE
ilOJIEGAN'f IT WAS
MILADY'S IDEA OF
"ORIENTAL ROMANTICISM.

EN NE1840'5, DURING ME REIGN
OF THE CRINOLINE, WOMEN
LOVED TO GOSSIP ABOUT THE
LATEST CRINOLINE INCIDENT-
EVERYTHING FROM GETTING /,
CAUGHT IN A CARRIAGE DOOR
TO CREATING A NUISANCE It
IN THE STALLS OF A THEATER, 4

TOVAls..WNEN
BUYINGIOMEN'S OR
CHILDREN'S APPAREL
LOOK FOR THIS LABEL-
THE SYMBOL OF
DECENCY, FAIR LABOR
STANDARDS AND THE
AMERICAN WAY OF LIFE

Merry Tiller SUBURBAN mod-
el—shown with Slasher Ro-
tors and extensions to 261
—combines a popular, four-
cycle, 3 or 4 hp engine with
chain drive to deliver the
oquIvaTent of two more hp
ihan wormlear machines.
Choke of rotors, rotor ex-
tensions, tractor tools. Ad-
jUstable 10/ rear wheels.

Pat%
& Pets,
read,

EMMITSBURG FEED &

Emmitsburg Maryland

SUPPLY -

Maryland

Your Southern States Cooperative Agency

Your Ford Dealers
are the
Low Price Leaders

-
NatEitirmemeMPA:=V-  -1-1A/

1 he best-selling -70 car of them all! Its the 'simple *

. . .

Maverick machine": simple to drive, to park, to service, to repair
and stilt si.r4ple to own at its hold-the-line pr Ice

New '701/2 version of America's all-time

All-new Falcon economy champ. Room for six big adults $24.60... a thrifty 250 Six ... more!

Mustang Still America's No. I selling sporty car. Still way ahead
of its imitators with standards like high-backed buckets,
floor shift, all-vinyl interior, fiberglass betted tires! SAVE

*

•Ford's suggested retail price for the car. White sidewall tires ere not included, they are $30.00 extra. Since transportation charges and stale and local t
axes vary,

they are not included. nor is extra equipment that is specially required by state laws. Dealer preparation charges (it any) are not included in the $1995 mavur ;:,

See your Ford Dealer today and save! ta.)

SPERRY FORD SALES
South Seton Avenue Emmitsburg, Md.
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BUSINESS SERVICES

PATRONIZE our advertisers. These arms
,.re reliable and have proven through the
sears that they handle only quality prod-
acts and offer skilled professional service

advice to their patrons.

TOPPER
Insurance Agency

Est. 1953

Auto - Homeowner's
Casualty - Accident and
Health - Hospitalization

OFFICE AT HOME—MT. RD.
Phone 447-6174 —Notary
—No Parking Problems—

Hanover Maternity Shop
Complete Line Of

MATERNITY WEAR
Infant Wear To T-4

Danskin Leotards & Tights
Shower Gifts

Selva Dance Footwear
41 Frederick St., Hanover, Pa.
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AUTOMAVIC DELIVERY

EWIS E. HAHN
hurmont , Marylon .1

Phone 271-2512

LIBRARY HOURS

Mon., Tue., Wed., Fri.-2:30-5
Thurs.-2-5 — Sat. 9-12

Evenings: Mon., Tue., Wed. &
Thurs.-7-9'

Coffman Jewelers
ART-CARVED DIAMONDS

SYRACUSE CHINA
OMEGA & ELGIN

WATCHES
I6 Baltimore St, Gettysburg

WhInda4POINP4PurIn.14P.PWWWWPdhanun.WWWW,INIV.•

DR. R. P. KLINGER, JR.

Optometrist

19 East Main Street
EMMITSBURG, MD.

Eyes Examined - Glasses Fitted
Complete Optical Repairs

HOURS
MONDAY: 6:30 p.m. to 8:30 p.m.
(Other Evenings By Appointment)

PHONE
WESTMINSTER TI 8-8340

P4Nin••••••••+04P4P•dPe..P•4•••••••••••••••••••••M•

WILSON

Funeral Home

EMMITSBURG. MD,

Phones:

Emmitsburg 4.17-6244

Fairfield 612-6642

For Expert Oil Burner
Service Call
LEWIS HAHN

OIL BURNER SERVICE
Phone 271-2512 - Thurmont

Prescription Service
Fast and Dependable

Accuracy
Comes
First

Your
Resell
Store

Peoples Drug Store
York Street, Gettysburg

BUSINESS
STOCK

aid

by BABSON'S REPORTS
Copright Iwo

Opportunity For Growth Stocks

By Babson's Reports Incor-
porated, Wellesley Hills, Mass.,
April 30, 1970.
The high level of interest

rates, tight credit, and now the
slowdown in business have caus-
ed the stock market to suffer
a sharp decline since late 1968.
With corporate profits already
trending downward and with
the outlook unimpressive for at
least another several months,
investors are naturally wary of
making commitments in com-
mon stocks. But periods of mar-
ket stress do provide opportu-
nities to purchase reasonably
valued issues, even though dil-
igence must be used to select
the best from the vast array of
hard-hit stocks.
Protecting Against
Uncertainties
Despite the multitude of well-

deflated stocks, care must be
used to secure the best possi-
ble protection against the un-
certain economic climate and
the most advantageous position
for benefitting from the even-
tual recovery of the market.

Just because a stock has de-
clined to a substantial extent
does not automatically mean it
is the best investment at the
moment. Also, one can never
be sure just how far a decline
in business and a slump in the
stock market will carry.
Hence, investors able to for-

go a high investment income
can generally benefit more
from the better-quality growth
stocks which can resist the ad-
verse business and profits pres-
sures and may be expected to
pace the later revival in equity
values. These would be issues
of firms which are well man-
aged and have shown above
average growth in sales and
profits in the past, with pros-
pects for further expansion.
Criteria For Selecting
Growth Stocks
Investment analysts utilize

many different benchmarks for
\ selecting growth stocks. For in-
vestors who are not specialists
in the field, however, here are
a few of the less sophisticated,
but nonetheless fundamental,
factors to be considered. Growth

PUBLIC SALE
I, the undersigned, will sell at Public Auction on prem-ises located 2 miles south of Fairfield, Pa., 1/2 mile off Route116 behind Charnita Ski Lodge (look for signs) on

SATURDAY, MAY 2, 1970
10 A. M. (DST)

70 Oliver Tractor with mower, 60 Oliver Tractor withcultivators, T45 International Baler, Case side-delivery rake,Ill Combine, IH 2-row corn planter, IH grain drill JohnDeere disc, Oliver 2-bottom plow, IH silo filler with pipe,IH corn binder, saw rig, drag harrow, springtooth harrow,John Deere hammermill, New Idea hay baler, 4-in. Marlowwater pump with 30-ft. hose, 250 gallon gas tank.
HOUSEHOLD: Home comfort wood and coal stove,wood and gas range, couch and rocker, dressers, 36-inchelectric range, washstand, large 'mirror, small dresser, chestchairs, davenbed, stands, bureaus, baby beds, double bed,both tub and lavatory, and a lot of miscellaneous not men-

tioned.

TERMS: Cash. Not responsible for any accidents.

MRS. J. W. MALLOW
FAIRFIELD R2, PA.

Sale Conducted By:
ROBERT MEUNIER, Auctioneer
Taneytown R2, Md. Phone 756-6350

—Lunch Rights Reserved—

type common stocks should be
culled from companies which
have displayed an average an-
nual growth rate in excess of
10% in sales and earnings for
at least the past five years.
Moreover, the company should
have shown an above-average
return on its stockholders' eq-
uity for the same span of time,
and a substantial portion of
profits should have been reg-
ularly plowed back into the bus-
iness.

Growth-oriented companies are
usually found among industries
which are enjoying a faster
rate of advancement than the
overall economy. These are also
likely to be firms which have
some distinct advantage over
competitors in the form of prod-
uct development, marketing ex-
pertise, and pioneering technol-
ogy.

Other Growth Characteristics
Investors should not necessar-

ily fear concerns that reduce
their dividend payouts, since
many managements with a high
degree of capability have pre-
ferred to temporarily cut divi-
dends than to reduce funds put
back into business to finance
future expansion. This is quite
a different matter from the
elimination of dividends by firms
on the skids because of man-
agement deterioration.
As long as they are basically

healthy issues, stocks which
have slipped moderately from
highs of the past year or so
offer good rebound possibili-
ties, as well as I onger-term
growth. Also, the better buys in
the growth-stocks category us-
ually are those whose current
price-earnings ratios (based on
projected earnings per share of
the current year) compare fa--
vorably with those of past
years.
Risk Versus Opportunity
There is, of course, an ever-

present risk element in pur-
chasing common stocks, even
though a company's past rec-
ord has been good. But this
factor is lessened during a de-
cline in the market. Stocks with

NOTICE TO BIDDERS
The Board of Education of

Frederick County, 115 East Church'
Street, Frederick, Maryland, in-
vites bids from service stations
located within the corporate lim-
its of Frederick City on supply-
ing gasoline, oil, and related ser-
vices for the various cars, trucks
and buses owned by the Board of
Education of Frederick County.

Specifications and pr opos al
sheets may be obtained at t h e
Board of Education Office.
Sealed bids will be received at

the Board of Education Office un-
til 3:00 P. M. (DST), May 19,
1970.
The Board of Education re-

serves the right to reject any or
all proposals and to waive infor-
malities.
By order of the Board of Ed-

ucation of Frederick County.
JOHN L. CARNOCHAN, JR.,

Bid 70-T-3 Secretary-Treasurer

Today a single girl
needs more than just a
closet full of clothes
to call her own.

like a closet full or eligible bachelors for
starters.

But that's the rub.
If you're one of those women who doesn't

want to get married, at least not right
away, you know what we mean.
You want to live a little first. You want

to kick up your heels, see I little of the
world before you settle down.
But, because you're you, you still Want

security.
That's where U.S. Savings Bonds come

in. Bonds are a secure way to save. And
you don't have to be making a fortune to
save them. You can get started with just
a few dollars a pay4ay when you join the
Payroll Savings Plan where you work.
And now Bonds pay 5% interest when

held to maturity of 5 years, 10 months
(4% the first year; thereafter 5.20% to
maturity). That's the highest rate ever.
Who knows, the money you save might

just come in handy when you fall in love
and marry that guy who hasn't made his.
first million yet.

*

Bonds an aafc. If kne, Itolrn. or dntroy,
we replan than. When needed, they can be
naked at mar bank. Tax may be deferred • ..•• •
until nelernption. And
Bonds are • proud nay to save.

Take stock in America.

00

Welthighw paying US. Savings Bends.

Me US. Corimmal kw b./ Nt I. W. W.A:v.
leS presented ejnilla MM. la
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real growth mettle have the ca-
pability of recovering and sub-
sequently forging ahead. Thus,
even though the stock market
decline has not yet displayed
sure signs of reversal, the mar-
ket setback opens up a chance
to buy good-quality growth
common stocks.

4 Rodanne
Hi! My name is Rosanne,

and about once a month I am
going to pass along to you some
thoughts about that comfy old
shoe that we all just take for
granted: salt.
It is no accident that the

term "salary" grows out of the
word "salt."
And salt can
make your sal-
ary grow, since
the white gold
in that familiar
blue package
costs only half
a penny or so an
ounce. You just ,s
have to know
how to use it in Direct mail for
many handy Rosanne to
ways. Morton SaltCo.,
Soaked in or 110 N. Wacker

rubbed on, salt Drive,
can be refresh_ Chicago 60606
ing, make you healthier, even
relieve tension. It can help pre-
serve the glow of beauty one
moment, yet lend a hand in
cleaning and household chores
the next. There are so many
uses for salt that it sometimes
is called the "fifth element."
(Remember the others? Air,
earth, fire and water.)
I will be telling you about

salt's many uses later, but
meanwhile, if you would like
a brand new, handy little book-
let that gives a lot of household
hints with salt, just clip this
article and the name of your,
newspaper and send them to,
me marked "Salty Solutions."
Do you know why we must

have salt to stay alive? Our
blood contains about the same
concentration of salt as sea-
water does. Some doctors,
though, restrict salt intake in
a few of their patients to help
relieve certain special medical
problems. If you are in this
group, there is a new salt sub-
stitute on the market that is
tastier than most. Just watch
for the little umbrella girl.

Your favorite Uncle
asks you to buy

U.S. Savings
Bonds, new

Freedom Shares

GET A DEAL ON THE
1970 CHEVROLET

And On OK Use Cars & Chevrolet Trucks

WANTZ CHEVROLET INC.
Taneytown, Md.

COMPLETE AUTO AND BODY REPAIR

Phone 756-6006 — Open Monday Thru Friday 'Til
9 P. M. — Saturdays 'Til 5 P. M.

Get Out Of The Mud
LET US SPREAD CRUSHED STONE
IN YOUR DRIVEWAY OR LANE

For Prices and Prompt Service
Ca II

S. W. BARRICK & SONS, INC.
WOODSBORO, MD. — PHONE 845-6341

Manufacturers Of

Lime and Limestone Products

WEDDING
INVITATIONS

wood 
bY106•00,

Each distinctive invitation
thormographed on 116% rag

china,white vellum paper
giving you fine raised lettering

that speaks of the
highest quality:4ie

Also matching reception cards,
response cards, thank you cards,

at home cards and informals.
Come in today and make your

choice from our
rEknver Wedding Line" catalog:

Your eludes
01 SIXTEEN

Individual
TYPE STYLES
The wool
popular
selections
shown below%
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NE A iiirPNAPER
Assesidos FoifitIed MIX

Nostra'
Marytand-Detawspo
Piess Awn.,

WHAT IT TAKES!

A PROSPEROUS
. EcoNomy

Tune in WTHU-1450 On

Your Dial Every Saturday

Morning at 9:30 a.m. For

News of Our Area Armed

Forces Service Personnel —

Sponsored By Us.
No. 1 Seller

Reliable Used Cars
1969 Chevy II Nova; 4-Dr.; R&H&A; P.S.; Air.
1969 Javelin Spts. Cpe., V-8; R&H&A; P.S.; Air; Like New.
1968 Chevrolet Impala 4-Dr. Spts. Cpe, V-8; R&H&A; P.S.;

Air.
1968 Plymouth Fury 3, 4-Dr. Spt. Sed., V-8; R&H&A; P.S.
1967 Chevrolet Impala Cony.; R&H&A; Air Cond.; Like New.
1967 Olds Delmont 88, Custom 4-Dr. H.T.; R&H&A; P.S.;P.B.
1967 Plymouth Fury 2, V-8; 4-Dr. Sed.; R&H&A; 1 Owner.
1966 Chevrolet Impala Cony., 327; 4-Speed; R&H; P.S.
1965 Chevrolet Impala, 2-Dr., Spt. Cp.; R&H&A; P.S.

SANDERS GARAGE
—AUTO SALES & SERVICE—

PHONE 447-6151 EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND

LEGAL
ROBERT ROY MINNICK
118 East Fourth Street

Frederick, Maryland
VS.

SHIRLEY ANN MINNICK
21 North Broadway Avenue

West Pittsburg, California 94565
NO. 22,763 EQUITY

In the Circuit Court for Freder-
ick County, Maryland

ORDER OF PUBLICATION
The Bill of Complaint is a suit

to procure a divorce A VINCU-
LO MATRIMONII from the De-
fendant, Shirley Ann Minnick.
The Bill recites that the Com-

plainant is a resident of Freder-
ick County, State of Maryland,
where he has resided for more
than one year last past; that the
Defendant is a non-resident of
the State of Maryland, whose last
known address is 21 North Broad-
way Avenue, West Pittsburg,
California; that the parties to
this cause were married on the
23rd day of April, 1954, at Mid-
dletown, Maryland, by Rev. Mc-
Carney, a regularly ordained min-
ister of the Gospel; that as a
result of the said marriage two
children were born, namely, Stev-
en Roy Minnick, who is at the
present time 15 years of age, and
in the care and custody of your
Complainant, and Jeffrey Scott
Minnick, who is at the present
time 7 years of age, and in the
care and custody of the Defend-
ant; that the Defendant did, on or
about the 15th day of July, 1968,
without just cause or reason,
abandon and desert your Com-
plainant, declaring her intentions
to live with him no longer as
husband and wife, that said aban-
donment and desertion has con-
tinued uninterruptedly for more
than eighteen months prior to the

filing of this Bill of Complaint,
is deliberate and final, and that
the separation of the parties is
beyond any reasonable hope or
expectation of reconciliation.
The Bill then prays that t h e

Complainant, Robert Roy Min-
nick, may be divorced A VINCU-
LO MATRIMONII from the De-
fendant, Shirley Ann Minnick;
that he may be awarded the care
and custody of Steven Roy Min-
nick, one of the infant children
in these proceedings mentioned;
and for such other and further
relief as the nature of his case
may require.

ORDER OF COURT
It is thereupon this 20th day

of April, 1970, by the Circuit
Court for Frederick County,
Maryland, sitting as a Court of
Equity, ORDERED that the Com-
plainant give notice to the De-
fendant of the object and sub-
stance of this Bill of Complaint
by causing a copy of this Order
to be inserted in some newspaper
published in the County of Fred-
erick, once each week for four
successive weeks prior to the
30th day of May, 1970, command-
ing her to be and appear in this
Court, in person, or by solicitor,
on or before the 30th day of June,
1970, and show cause, if any she
has, why a Decree should not be
passed as prayed.

ELLIS C. WACHTER,
Clerk of the Circuit Court for

Frederick County.
EDWIN F. NIKIRK
Solicitor for Complainant
110 North Court Street
Frederick, Maryland
Telephone 662-1781
Filed April 20, 1970
True Copy Test:
Ellis C. Wachter, Clerk 51114t

income heights of close to $100,-
000 a year, plus all the plums
that go with it. (It was recently
discovered that the United Mine
Workers had $72,000,000 cached
away in a checking account!)
More time and effort seems to be
spent in feathering the big
bosses' own nests than in work-
ing for their "boys". Is this the
kind of leadership our labor
unions should have? With this
self-centered, "the-hell-with-
everyone-else" attitude, is it any
wonder that our country is vic-
timized by one crippling strike
after another?

0 • •

Has it occurred to anyone to
ask why France saw fit to send
100 Mirage supersonic jet planes
to Libya — actually a "purchas-
ing agent" for Egypt — yet stub-
bornly refuses to deliver the 50
fighter planes Israel has bought
and paid for? They attempt to
hide the "reason" in a flood of
double-talk. The Soviets do not
hesitate to send their arms all
over the world. It is Russia who
actually fuels the fighting all
over the map, not only in the
Middle East, but in Viet Nam, the
Caribbean, Africa, and points-
north, south, east and west. The
Communists are dedicated to
world turmoil, yet the civilized,
"neutral" French sell out democ-
racies for profit: 4,

• • •
Further proof of the innate

shrewdness of the Japanese in-
dustrialists: that nation's steel
producers admit that during 1969
they exceeded their self-imposed
export quota to the United States
by 2%. (Other informed sources,
by the way, estimate the figure
in excess of 8%). While at first
thought it might seem peculiar
that Japan, which has virtually
no capacity for mining, could
possibly offer steel mill products
on the international market, you
should realize that the Japanese
buy scrap-metal from the United
States, convert it, and re-sell it
to us. If you are puzzled at the
idea of the United States, a prime
mining country, purchasing ap-
proximately 6 million net tons of
steel products from just this one
foreign competitor annually, re-
member that two-thirds of the
cost of an average ton of Ameri-
can steel goes for labor — work-
ers' wages — and that is why
imports appear as such an at-
tractive buy. Isn't this a clear-cut
case of the shortsightedness of
our steel workers who are actu-
ally pricing themselves and their
country right out of all markets?

Congressman Beall Examines Questionnaire Returns

Congressman J. Glenn Beall, Jr.,
(R-6th-Md.) has not really barri-
caded himself behind his desk,
but it looks that way. He is
shown here in his Washington
office with secretary, Jackie Kuhn,
examining the responses to ques-
tionnaires he sent out recently to
learn the opinions of residents of
the Sixth Congressional District
on today's issues.
To date over 22,000 question-

naires containing the views of al-
most 39,000 citizens—space was

provided for the responses of
both the man and woman of the
household where applicable—have
come back and more are pouring
in every day. "The date of re-
sponse is even better this year
than last," Rep. Beall said, "and
I am most grateful for the time
and effort taken to answer and
return the questionnaires to me."

Beall stated, "as Representa-
tive of the Sixth District, I am
finding the results extremely in-
teresting and valuable," and add-

LEGAL
ADMINISTRATOR'S NOTICE
This is to give notice that the

subscriber has obtained from the
Orphans' Court of Frederick Coun-
ty, in Maryland, letters of Ad-
ministration on the estate of
ELLEN FRANCES MILLER

late of Frederick County, Mary-
land, Deceased. All persons hav-
ing claims against the deceased
are warned to exhibit the same,
with the vouchers thereof, legal-
ly authenticated, to the subscrib-
er, on or before the 6th day of

October, 1970 next; they may oth-
erwise by law be excluded from
all benefit of said estate. Those
indebted to the deceased are de-
sired to make immediate pay-
ment.
Given under my hand this 30th

day of March, 1970.
HAROLD S. MILLER,

Administrator
WEINBERG & 'WEINBERG

Attorneys

True Copy—Test:
THOMAS M. EICHELBERGER

Register of Wills for Frederick

County, Md. 4'3'5t

MOUNT PARENTS WEEKEND
ENJOY YOUR VISIT HERE!
FOR YOUR SHOPPING "GOODIES"

WE HAVE IMPORTED & DOMESTIC

BRANDS OF

BEER - WINE - WHISKEY
Plenty of C-o-o-o-l-d Beer

Phone 447-2342

Mountain
Liquors
Pat Buch, Prop.

Emmitsburg, Md.

MARY E.
906.-1959

What joy and triumph, after all, to be
sincerely honored by the ones we loved

Your Local Rock of Ages
Authorized Dealer

OFFICE-SHOP-DISPLAY OPEN:

Mon. thru Sat., 8 A.M. to 5 P.M.

Evenings & Sun. by Appointment

A.EyF

ODOM MEMORIALS
Your Authorized Rock of Ages Dealer

400 West Middle Street Gettysburg,
Phone 334-1413

ed that he will publish them in
forthcoming newsletters and re-
leases. He asked that the ques-
tionnaires be returned as soon as
possible so that the tabulation can
be completed.
Topics covered by the ques-

tionnaire include pollution control,
lowering the voting age, consum-
er protection, welfare, the volun-
teer military and Federal spend-
ing priorities.

THE GAS SERVICE PEOPLE PREFER

llaPP1/ addaq

THE MATTHEWS
GAS COMPANY
EMMITSBURG - THURMONT

Club Calendar
The following local organiza-

tions meet on these dates:
St. Joseph's Church Council,

third Sunday.
Town Council, first Monday.
Ladies of Brute Council, second

Monday.
Knights of Columbus, first and

third Mondays.
Lions Club, second and fourth

Mondays.
New Frontier Democratic Club,

first Monday.
St. Joseph's Sodality, fourth

Monday.
Municipal Band practice every

Wednesday.
American Legion, first Tuesday.
Vigilant Hose Co., second Tues-

day.
Et. Joseph's High School PTA,

second Tuesday.
Senior Citizens, third Tuesday.

Chamber of Commerce, third Tues-
day.
Nurses of Gettysburg, third

Tuesday.
Adams Co. Ambulance Corps.,

third Tuesday.

Indian Lookout Club, 4th Tues-
day, 8 p.m., Fire Hall.

Frederick Co. Central Alarm,
fourth Tuesday.

Library Board, 4th Tuesday, at
7:30 p.m.

VFW, first Wednesday.
Grange, 1st. Wednesday.
Emmitsburg Middle School PTA,

fourth Wednesday.
VFW Auxiliary, first Thursday.
Mother Seton School PTA, sec-

ond Thursday.
Frederick Co. Ambulance Assn.,

fourth Thursday.
CYO, every Friday.
Community Fund, last Monday

of January, April, July & October.

We have never known a poli-
tician who predicted his own de-
feat.

SPRING PAINT SALE ENDS
ON MAY 2! SAVE '2.00 ON

EVERY GALLON

with the Met
ttouble-free, one-coat
vingl plastic paint!

• Truly a flat finish!
• A film you can scrub!
• 1-coat hiding power!
• Superior performance!
• Costs less to use!
• Invisible touch-up!
• Odorless, fast-drying! Req. $7.90 gal.

SPECIAL $5.93 GAL.

shop REDDING'S
Gettysburg, L. — We Give S&H Green Stamps

Comment from the Capital -

DECODING THE DISTORTED NEWS
by Vant Neff mil

The Humphrey hecklers num-
bered only 250 in an audience of
5000 at that disastrously aborted
foreign policy speech the former
Vice President attempted to de-
liver at the University of Mas-
sachusetts. Question #1: If only
a handful of young radicals are
contemptuous, vulgar, name-call-
ing rowdies, why is it that their
activities rate all the headlines
in the news? Question #2:
What's wrong with all the others
who sat quiet as clams without
attempting to toss the trouble-
makers out on their ears?

• * •
The fatal fire that raged

through the home for the Jewish
aged in Munich recently was ap-
palling. The elderly and infirm
victims had little chance for sur-
vival. But is it mere coincidence
that we hear more and more of
this sort of thing — fires, bomb-
ings, vandalism — desecration of
holy objects and places—all
seemingly without connection
but unquestionably way out of
proportion to the number of gen-
eral disasters throughout the
world? We will always have ex-
tremists and fanatics in our
midst, but hasn't the world had
its fill of religious persecution,
especially when it is apparently
directed against a people who
have paid, and paid dearly
throughout the centuries?

• • •

The long arm of the union czar,
it seems, reaches beyond that of
the law. Right into the till, in
fact. Jimmy Hoff a, head of the
reportedly racketeer-ridden
Teamsters' Union, who is serving
time in a federal penitentiary, re-
ceived expense money from t1-..?,
union in 1939. I woncl2r what
accomplished for his "boys" from
his prison cell that won him the
right to any of the money, which
is cl!ppod from their pay envel-
opes every week?

• • *
Tucked away on a back page

of a newspaper I came across a
small news item extolling a
young American for his efforts
in organizing the Decency Rally
in Miami's Orange Bowl. Mike
Levesque, 18, had the unique
honor of being the youngest per-
son ever to receive the George
Washington Award from the
Freedoms Foundation. This cov-
eted gold medal, and accompany-
ing $5,000 check, is bestowed for
helping people to better under-
stand the American way of life.
On the same day, however, the
main pages and headlines of the
same newspaper were blazoned

with stories and pictures of the
anti-American antics of some of
our young dissenters, the ruth-
less bombing of the home of the
distinguished judge presiding
over the Black Panther trial in
New York City, the murder of 47
innocent victims in an Arab ter-
rorist plane bombing and the
outright condemnation of gov-
ernment plans by a hypercritical
union czar. Noting the vast cov-
erage given to these disruptive
events compared to the brief, al-
most-hidden account of young
Mr. Levesque's rather extraordin-
ary achievement in patriotism
only confirmed my belief that far
too much of our news reporting
is devoted to the sensational. To
my way of thinking, it habitually
glamorizes and glorifies, under
the guise of "liberalism", the
deeds of bearded, shaggy-
maned hippies, yippies, loud-
mouthed dissidents, Mafia char-
acters and other destructive ele-
ments in our society and glosses
over the comparatively tame do-
ings of the "silent majority" who
remain loyal, patriotic and sin-
cere. From one man's corner,
Mike, congratulations!

It would be good to be able to
report that the heyday of the
union kingpin, the "big man"
whose every word, wanton or
otherwise, is law, is now over.
Unfortunately, it's far from true,
even though one notorious fel-
low who always appeared to be
side-stepping the law is behind
bars. Still another has been pub-
licly labelled by his own people
as a "tyrant" and an "embezzler
of union funds". And who's to
blame for the willful murder of
defeated union presidency can-
didate Joseph Yablonski, his wife
and daughter? A federal grand
jury contends that a union fund
was actually maintained for the
express purpose of killing the
Yablonskis, and now five union-
connected people are under in-
dictment for their murder. It isn't
unusual for a power-hungry,
money-mad union boss to reach
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Looking
Ahead
by

Dr. George S. Benson
President

NATIONAL EDUCATION PROGRAM
Searcy, Arkansas

Two Million Revolutionaries
The Associated Press says:

"A Harris poll released by
TIME Magazine Sunday re-
ports that 63% of the Negroes
in this country believe the Am-
erican political system 'is rot-
ten and has to be changed com-
pletely.'" Nine per cent, "about
two million persons," the AP
says, "call themselves 'revolu-
tionaries' with "a readiness to
use violence." The nationwide
AP news syndicate also says:
"Hundreds of bombs exploding
across the land boom out a
grim warning to the nation:
Tiny but determined and grow-
ing groups of extreme left rad-
icals have declared war on the
established way of life in Am-
erica." The AP discounts the
suggestion of a unified conspir-
acy.

Are the i.,unataonal Com-
munists involved? The AP dis-
patches don't even use the word
"Communist." And neither does
AP remind Americans that two
million revolutioniaries consti-
tute a force 100 times the size
of Lenin's when he seized pow-
er in Russia in 1917 in a quick
Communist takeover. Who are
the two million revolutionaries
in America today? According to
the Harris poll, they are com-
rades-in-arms of the Black Pan-
thers.
17 Million "If Necessary"
The poll also established the

fact that approximately 8 mil-
lion black Americans now ap-
prove the use of violence "to
win rights," and approximately
17 million (in a black popula-
tion of 22-23 million) do not
reject violence "if absolutely
necessary" to "win rights."
Whether a revolutionary is

black or white, red or brown
is of no particular consequence
in contemplating the danger to
American security. Both white
and black have been identi-fled
among the bombers, and all
races are represented in what
the AP calls the "determined
and growing groups" of revolu-
tionaries. But both the black
and white Communists in Am-
erica and, most significantly,
the Communist leaders in ev-
ery Communist nation, recog-

nize the Black Panther Party
as the "vanguard" of a grow-
ing Communist revolutionary
force within the U. S. This fact
has not found its way into news
reports. It has not been under-
stood by the masses of Ne-
groes; instead, fire-brand Ne-
gro revolutionaries who boast
of being "Marxist - Leninist"
Communist in their own under-
ground press, are not so identi-
fied in the public press, and
therefore are attracting an im-
pressive following.
Nature Clearly Defined

The nature of the Black Pan-
ther Party, its allies, its affi-
liations and its announced pur-
poses are of vital importance
to all Americans, particularly
to our 22 million Negro citi-
zens. Now that the size of the
Black Panther "following" has
been documented in a nation-
ally recognized poll, the AP and
TIME Magazine need to go a
step farther and expose the
"vanguard" b7 t.ellir,';• it like it
is.

The Black Panther "van-
guard" is a vital element in
the world revolutionary force
centered in Moscow and Peking.
Its own chief spokesmen de-
clare it to be a Marxist-Len-
inist Party affiliated with So-
viet, Chinese, and all the other
Communist parties. Its top offi-
cials declare that the goal is
the violent overthrow of the
United States and the setting
up here of a Communist society
linked into "proletarian inter-
nationalism." At its "United
Front" planning session in Oak-
land, Calif., last July, approx-
imately 300 revolutionary organ-
izations pledged their member-
ships, their resources and their
armed might to t?-1 overthrow
of the U. S.
Danger Unrecognized

"Solidarity' (a slogan used
world-wide by the Communist)
was the theme of the Oakland
conference. And the Oakland
conference was under the direc-
tion of the Communist Party
USA. The keynote speaker was
Herbert Aptheker, "brains" of
the Communist Party USA. The
greatest cheers from the 4,000
delegates were sounded as con-
ference officials read cablegrams
from Communist leaders all ov-
er the world, pledging "solidar-
ity" with the Black Panthers
and their mobilizing "united
front" to overthrow the USA.
The present danger to Amer-

ica is made bigger because
these facts are not being
brought to the attention of the
American public. Thus the dan-
ger is not properly assessed by
the citizenry. Those of our pub-
lic servants who are themselves

SPRING LUBRICATION
Bring Your Car In Today

* SPARK PLUGS

* MUFFLERS

* BATTERY

* OIL

* IGNITION POINTS

* FAN BELTS

* TIRES

• ESSO GAS

KEEPERS ESSO STATION
Charles E. Keepers, Prop

EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND

aware of the true situation are
reluctant to speak out for fear
of provoking uninformed ridi-
cule from influential sources.
And so the revolution builds

its strength underground while
its above ground loud-mouthed
horses continue to tear our so-
ciety to shreds. When will the
big strike come? Will Amer-
ica be equal to the test?

OUR LIBRARY
Have you noticed the big yellow

box by the door of the Emmits-
burg Public Library? It is a
"Book Drop" and it was purch-
ased by the Library Board be-
cause of the many requests by
our patrons for this service.
Books may be returned to the
"Book Drop" when the Library
is not open. Our thanks to the
Town Officials for their coopera-

GOLli "l+g:UCH
OF HOSPITALITY

BY JANE ASHLEY cr
Make Berry Sauce In Blender

Fresh fruit flavor abounds
from this easy berry sauce.
Mixed in a blender, it uses
frozen fruit, and takes mere
minutes to prepare. Serve the
sauce warm over ice cream
for sundaes or on cake.

Blender Berry Sauce

1 (10-ounce) package frozen
raspberries or straw-
berries, thawed •

Y2 cup orange juice
1 tablespoon corn starch

Put all ingredients in
blender. Cover and run
blender at high speed until
ingredients are well blended,
about 1 minute. Pour into
saucepan. Bring to full boil,
stirring constantly. boil 1
minute. Sauce will be slightly
thickened. Serve warm over
Ice cream or cake. Makes
11/2 cups.

LLGAL

State of Maryland
NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT

and
•NOTICE TO CREDITORS

TO ALL PERSONS INTEREST-
ED IN THE ESTATE OF Joann
Harris.
This is to give notice that the

undersigned, Gordon Thompson
and James MoSherry whose ad-
dresses are Wondenvood, Star
Route, Rector, Pa. 15677 and
Frederick, Md. 21701, have been
appointed personal representatives
of the estate of Joann Harris
who died on April 19, 1970.

All persons having any objec-
tion to such appointment (or to
the probate of the decedent's will)
shall file the same with the Reg-
ister of Wills for Frederick Coun-
ty on or before October 21, 1970.
A 11 persons having claims

against the decedent must present
their claims to the undersigned,
or file the same with the said
Register of Wills on or before
November 1, 1970.
Any claim not so filed on or

before such date shall be unen-
forceable thereafter.

GORDON THOMPSON
JAMES McSHERRY

Personal Representatives
Date of first publication:
May 1, 1979
THOMAS M. EICHELBERGER,

Register of Wills
ROSENSTOCK & McSHERRY
Attorneys-at-Law
TOO W. Church St.,
Frederick, Md. 21701 511.13t
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WELCOME
STOP

What's
New?

MT.
IN

COLD

ST.
AND

HAVE

PAGAN
(Something

MARY'S
SEE

DUCK
YOU TRIED

US!

PINK?
New)

PARENTS!

ON
THE
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Roger
ANN

Liquor Store
G. ROGER, Prop.

SOUTH SETON AVE. PHONE 447-6262 EMMITSBURG, MD.

Store Hours: Monday Through Thursday, 8 A. M. to 10 P. M.
Friday & Saturday: 8 A. M. to 11 P. M.

DELIVERY AND DRIVE-IN SERVICE

tion and the work crew for plac-
ing and attaching it to the street.
New Books:
The Fifth Column by Ernest

Hemingway—The three-act play
and the hirtherto uncollected stor-
ies contained in this book repre-
sent the first literary fruits of
the active months (1937-1939) Er-
nest Hemingway spent in Spain
covering the Spanish Civil War
as a correspondent for the North
American N e wspaper Alliance
and helping to film battle scenes
for the motion picture, The Span-
ish Earth. Although based direct-
ly on first-hand experiences at
the Hotel Florida and Chicot's
bar in Madrid and on his visits
to the various fronts, all five
works show the, effects of a great
writer's creative imagination.
The Solar System and Back, by

Isaac Asimov—This far-ranging
collection of essays shows Isaac
Asimov at his /ucrd, informative
and entertaining best. He begins
by examining our solar system:
its remarkable symmetry and its
puzzling irregularities. Then he

comes back to earth to explain
the laws that govern expansion
and miniaturization in nature as
well as in science fiction; to dis-
cuss some of the intriguing va-
garies of the metals, gold, mer-
cury and galium; to tell what the
dinosaurs were and were not in
addition to speculating on the
reasons behind their extinction;
to probe the causes and effects of
chromosome abberation; and even
to reflect on the future -ole of
women in our society. For all
their diversity, however, each of
these 17 essays display the wit,
perception, and firm command of
facts that have made Isaac Asi-
mov one of the most prolific and
widely read authors in the field
of popular science.
Fortune Telling by Sybil Leek

—Sybil Leek, the world's most
famous witch, brings astoundinn•
insight and lively intelligence to
a unique interpretation of an art
as old as man's search for happi-
ness. With characteristic wit and
sophistication, she applies her ex-
traordinary vision to today's most

P049-s—Believe /t orNott

LIFELINE! 
IN IN A SINGLE DAY
A PERSON'S BLOOD
TRAVELS ABOUT

16EL000,000 MILES
-ME EQUIVALENT

OF 4720
TIMES AROUND
THE WORLD.

LEUKEMIA, CANCER
OF THE BLOOD,
THREATENS TO
CUT THAT LIFELINE.

PRESIDENT CLEVELAND'S SECRET
CANCER WAS SO FEARED IN 1893 THAT
PRESIDENT GROVER CLEVELAND - TO
AVERT AN INTERIJATIONAL FINANCIAL
PANIC-HAD TO HAVE SECRET SURGERY
FOR JAW CANCER ABOARD A
PRIVATE YACHT ANCHORED IN
NEW YORK'S EAST RIVER. HE
RECOVERED-SECRETLY! TODAY, MORE
THAN 1,500,000 AMERICANS ARE CURED
OF CANCER --AND THAT'S NO SECRET!

LUCKY ACCIDENT
ONE OF TODAY'S
MOST SUCCESSFUL

CANCER TREATMENTS
WAS DISCOVERED
75 YEARS AGO BY

ACCIDENT.' PHYSICISTA, WILHELM ROENTGEN-
EXPERIMENTING WITH A
GLASS VACUUM TUBE IN
A DARK LAB, NOTICED
A PIECE OF PAPER

i GLOWING IN THE BLACK-
NESS. HE REALIZED THE

,..- 1 4 TUBE WAS GIVINS OFF
1 RAYS THAT PENETRATED
.2 THE TUBE'S GLASS WALLr AND NAMED THEM

X-RAYS. NOW X-RAYS
CURE MANY CANCERS.

AMERICAN CANCER SOCIETY

 _g

Created for the American Cancer Society as a public service
by Ripley's BELIEVE IT OR NOT..

LEGAL
MARIETTA E. CUTTING
Highland School Road
Myersville, Maryland

vs.
JOSEPH E. CUTTING
c/o Mrs. Linda Rishko
4129 South 4 Mile Run

Arlington, Virginia
NO. 22,787 EQUITY

In the Circuit Court for Frederick
County, Maryland

ORDER OF PUBLICATION
The object of this Bill is to pro-

cure a divorce A VINCULO MAT-
RIMONII by the Complainant,
Marietta E. Cutting, from the De-
fendant, Joseph E. Cutting.
The Bill states insubstance that

the parties were married on July
9, 1866, in Wheaton, Maryland,
by a regularly ordained Minister
of the Gospel; that the Complain-
ant is a resident of the State of
Maryland, having resided in Fred-
erick County, Maryland, for more
than one year last past; that the
Defendaant is a non-resident of
the State of Maryland, whose
postoffice address is believed to
be in care of Mrs. Linda Rishko,
4129 South 4 Mile Run, Arling-
ton, Virginia; that no children
were born as a result of the mar-
riage; that the Defendant desert-
ed the Complainant on or about
February 17, 1968, and that said
desertion was deliberate and final
and beyond any reasonable hope

o rexpectation of a reconciliation.
The Bill prays that the Complain-
ant be divorced A VINCULO
MATRIMONII from the Defend-
ant, that she may resume her for-
mer name of Marietta Fogle and
for general relief.

It is thereupon this 22nd day
of April, 1970, by the Circuit
Court for Frederick County, sit-
ting as a Court of Equity, OR-
REDED that the Complainant
give notice to the said non-resi-
dent Defendant of the objects and
substance of this Bill by causing
a copy of the same to be pub-
lished in some newspaper pub-
lished in Frederick County, once
a week for four successive weeks
prior to the 30th day of May,
1970, commanding him to be and
appear i nthis Court in person
or by Solicitor, on or before the
30th day of June, 1970, and show
cause, if any he has, why a De-
cree should not be passesd as
prayed.

ELLIS C. WACHTER,
Clerk of the Circuit Court for

Frederick County, Maryland.
EDWARD D. STORM
Solicitor for Complainant
114-A West Church Street
Frederck, Maryland
Telephone 662-2233
Filed April 22, 1970
True Copy Test:
Ellis C. Wachter, Clerk 51114t

popular forms of this area and
guides the prewnt ciay reader to-
ward a deepening understanding
of each method—its history, its
practice and its special character-
istics.
A Manual for Baby Sitters by

Marion Lowndes—This book has
been widely accepted by parents,
baby sitters, youth groups and
baby sitter organizations as the
standard in the field. It gives
complete mastery of the skills of
baby sitting to those who are or
would like to be baby sitters. It
also describes the qualities the
sitter should bring to her job and
the obligations of those who hire
her, the parents of the baby.
One supplementary obligation

of the parents would certainly be
to have this book within reach of

their sitter. It will guide her
through emergencies and it will
aid her as she carries out the
feeding, sleeping and playing
routines. The parents will be
more carefree on their night out,
too, knowing that their sitter is
equipped with the latest tested
and approved advice on the best
methods of procedure in her field
of endeavor.
This book can give no guaran-

tee, of course, but it is hardly
possible that the person who has
studied it can fail to become a
baby sitter after a parent's
dream.

Hunters and fishermen spend
about $150 million for state hunt-
ing and fishing licenses each year.
—Sports Afield.

1968 Fairlane 500 4-Door; Fully Equipped; Low Mileage.
1968 Ford Custom 4-Dr., V-8; Auto.; Very Clean.
1968 Ford Custom, 2-Dr., V-8; R&H.
1967 Ford 4-Door Sdn.,, Fully Equipped; Air Conditioned.
1967 Chevrolet 2-Door Sdn., V-8; S.S.: R&H.
1966 Comet Cyclone 2-Dr. H.T.; 4-Spd., Bucket Seats.
1966 Marlin 2-Dr. H.T.; Fully Equipped; Extra Clean.
1964 Corvair Convertible; Bucket Seats; R&H.
1964 Ford 9-Passenger Wagon; Fully Equipped.
1964 Ford 4-Dr. H.T., V-8; Auto.; P.S.; Extra Clean.
1963 Chevrolet 4-Dr. Wagon, V-8; S.S.; Ran.
1963 Ford Galaxie 500 2-Dr. H.T.; Fully Equpied; Ex. Clean.

1965 GMC 1/2-Ton Pickup; 8 Ft. Body.
1960 Chevrolet 1/2-Ton Nem,.
1958 Ford 1/2-Ton Pickup; V-8.

Sperry Ford Sales
PHONE 447-6171 EMMITSBURG, MD.

WORLD'S LARGEST MAYPOLE, Luray, Va.
Giant's Hall In Luray Caverns, Virginia, 161 feet below the
earth's surface Is the setting for this most unusual Maypole
Dance. The Double Column, towering 82 feet in height, provided
the pole. Ten boys and girls danced over the same ground on
which elves may have performed a similar ceremony millions
of years ago.
The age of this "Maypole" Is estimated by scientists to be In
excess of ten million years. Stalactites and stalagmites form in
Luray Caverns at the very slow rate of one cubic inch In 120
years.

CLEAN 0 SAFE 0 LOW-COST

Yes, yes, yes!

For value supreme.., contact your local Potomac Edison Company. Askthem about FLAMELESS ELECTRIC HOME HEATING. It's today's matchlessvalue.

There are now over 15,000 happy homes in the PE service area which arepresently being heated by FLAMELESS ELECTRIC HEAT.
This modern heating system is safe, clean, economical and of course,CAREFREE! And get this ... it can be installed in your present homequickly and easily.

Why don't you call Potomac Edison soon for a free cost estimate.

Potomac Edison
Part it the Adult hy tagaizezza
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THC MIGHTY MIDGET

WANT ADS WORK

FOR SALE—Holland Bulbs, var-
ious assortment. We give S&H
Green Stamps. E m mitsburg

' Feed & Farm Supply. it

FOR SALE Front-end Loader,
(industry type) for Ford trac-
tor.

tf CHARLES F. STOUTER

FOR SALE — Unico Power and
Riding Mowers. Get your S&H
Green Stamps here! Emmits-
burg Feed & Farm Supply,

FOR SALE — 1960 Ford, 4-door
sedan, R&H. Phone 447-2493.

51112tp

FOR SALE—Lc;.uot Post, sawed
tapered or round.

tf CHARLES F. STOUTER

FOR SALE—High-yielding South-
ern Statos Seed Corn. Emmits-
burg Feed & Farm Supply. it

THE DATSUN PICK-UP TRUCK
Your best buy—Drive one then
decide. Datsun Sales & Service,
DeeGee Imports Inc., Fairfield
Road Gettysburg, Pa. tf

FOR SALE—Small Bakery Bus-
iness located in Emmitsburg.
If interested contact

4124I2tp Carroll F. Newcomer

FOR SALE — 1967 Honda 300
Hawk, $400. Phone 447-2795.

411713tp

FOR SALE—Work Shoes. loots,
Basketball Shoes. We give S&H
Green Stamps. Emmitsburg
Feed and Farm Supply.

NOTICES

CARD OF THANKS
I wish to take this opportunity

to express my sincere thanks and
appreciation to my many friends
for their cards, flowers, visits and
acts of kindness shown me during
my recent hospitalization and
since my return home. I sincere-
ly appreciate all visits from my
friends.
it MRS. LOUISE GILLELAN

WANTED TO RENT — 3 room
apartment or housetrailer in
Emmitsburg. Contact: P. 0.
Box 15, Emmitsburg, Md. 21727.

511.12tp

NOTICE—Food & Clothing Sale,
Sat., May 16, at St. Anthony's
Hall, beginning at 2 p.m. Every-
one welcome. 51112t

NOTICE — Will babysit in my
home, Mon.-Fri. 222 DePaul
St. Phone 447-6289. 5j1.12t

NOTICE
"For The Finest Cars Around,
Come To The Center of Town"

ZENTZ AUTO SALES
Gettysburg, Pa.

NEW 8z USED GUNS FOR SALE
Licensed Handgun Dealer

GUNS WANTED
Gene's Gun Shop
Eugene Bankard

Emmitsburg, R.D. 2, Md.
Phone 447-2869

Guns bought, sold and repaired
6113110p

CUSTOM SLAUGHTERING
AND PROCESSING OF BEEF
Cut and wrapped for the freezer

to your specifications.
NORMAN SHRIVER, JR.

Phone 447-2255 - Emmitsburg, Md.
We sell beef by half or quarters

NOTICE — A Color Pcrtrait the
right gift for any occasion from
The Zeigler Studio, 69 West
Middle St., Gettysburg, Pa.
Phone 334-1311. Artistry in Pho-
tography. tf

NOTICE—Menchey Music Service,
430 Carlisle St., Hanover, has
a reputation for selling fine
quality pianos at fair prices and
for giving complete satisfaction
in service. Rely on this reputa-
tion when you buy a piano or
organ. Choose your instrument
from our large selection. You
can always buy — and save —
with confidence at Menchey's.

FOR SALE
All Types of Awnings
ALUMINUM SIDING

Storm Doors & Windows
Fern Ohler - Gettysburg, Pa.

Phone EDgewood 4-4612

NOTICE— Positively no trespas-
sing for any purposes on Char-
nita property.

CHARNITA, INC.
tf Fairfield, Pa.

tf

ATTENTION FARMERS
Hauling to Auction Everyday

J. E. WATKINS
Dealer in Livestock
Emmitsburg, Md.
Phone 447-2347

FARMERS and DAIRYMEN
Terramycin

Mastitis -- Scours Tablets
Injectables

All Veterinarian Supplies
PEOPLES DRUG STORE

Gettysburg, Pa.

Items Of Interest
From Rocky Ridge
Mr. and Mrs. Monroe Stambaugh

and daughter, Hope, Princeton,
N. J., visited recently with Mrs.
Harvey Stambaugh.
Mrs. Sohn D. Kaas visited re-

cently with Mr. and Mrs. Edgar
Liday.
Mr. and Mrs. Albert Stambaugh

WANTED—Cook with experience,
to work at Mt. Manor Restau-
rant. Must furnish references.
Apply in person at Mt. Manor
Motel, or send resume to Box
126, Emmitsburg, Md. 4124!4t

NOTICE — Will baby-sit
home, Monday-Friday.
447-6256.

in my
Phone
412412t

NOTICE—Taking orders now for
young frying chickens, live or
dressed. Available May 5 and
12. For information call Mark,
Vicki or Jeff Wivell. 447-2513.

2tp

HELP WANTED-.---Waitress, full
time. Apply in person at The
Palms, W. Main St. tf

WANTED — Waitress to work
part-time, eve, and weekends,
and full-time during the sum-
mer. No eperience nxecessary
as we train you. Must furnish
references. Apply in person at
the Mt. Manor Motel, Emmits-
burg, Md. tf

PIZZA
SUBS

Carry-Out Service

THE PALMS
Phone 7-2303 or 7-2991

Emmitsburg, Md.

DR. S. DADUK
OPTOMETRIST

EYES EXAMINED

Located In
Dr. Beegless Office

Call 447-4681

Por Appointment

PALMER
INSURANCE AGENCY

8 N. Carroll St. Thurmont, Md.
Phone 271-2771

Agents For
* TRAVELERS
* GRANGERS
* ROYAL

An Independent Agent Gives You
Insurance Tailored To Your Needs.
Complete Insurance Service In-
cluding Life & Hospitalization.

 InuM111!4•1•1••1

Septic Tank

Cleaning Service

—Saturday & Evenings—

HERBERT W.
ROHRBAUGH

Emmitsburg, Maryland

Phone 447-2286

EDIFICE
CARPENTER

& General Contractors

Charles Mort

Phone 642-5337 - Fairfield

RONALD J. SHORB

Ceramic Tile

Contractor
Baths—Kitchens—Flagstone

Free Estimates

Phone 271-7252

Thurmont, Md.

WEDDING PORTRAITS
Groups At The Studio

WEDDING ALBUMS
Color or Black & White

Finishes. Call us for prices.

THE LANE STUDIO
34 York St.

Gettysburg, Pa.
Over 30 Years Experience

daughter, Shirley, have returned
home after spending a few days
with relatives in Vanceburg, Ky.
Recent guests of Mr. and Mrs.

Earl Flummer were Mr. and Mrs.
Kenneth Watkins, Mrs. Charlotte
Walsh and Mr. Walter Williar,
Silver Spring; Mrs. Laura Plum-
mer, Laytonsville; Mrs. Ida Bol-
ton, Rockville; and Mrs. Charles
Stevens and daughter, Baltimore.
Mrs. Minerva Springer and son,

Real Estate For Sale
Building lots at Catoctin Heights

near Catoctin High School. Finan-
cing available.

2 bedroom, aluminum siding
dwelling with electricity and drill-
ed well on a wooded lot, about 3
miles north of Thurmont.

Building lot of about 1/2 acre
with drilled well, about 5 miles
south of Thurmont.

Thurmont
Real Estate Agency

Branch Office

Edgar B. Palmer, Mgr.
8 N. Carroll St.

Thurmont, Md. 271-2771

1111111111111111111111111111.111

LEGAL
NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT

and
NOTICE TO CREDITORS

TO ALL PERSONS INTEREST-
ED IN THE ESTATE OF Mary
Valerie Kraemer.
This is to give notice that the

undersigned, Robert F. Little,
whose address is 296 South Seton
Avenue, Emmitsburg, Maryland
21727, has been appointed per-
sonal representative of the estate
of Mary Valerie Kraemer who
died on April 13, 1970.

All persons having any objec-
tion to such appointment (or to
the probate of the decedent's will)
shall file the same with the Reg-
ister of Wills of Frederick Coun-
ty on or before October 22, 1970.

All persons having claims
against the decedent must pre-
sent their claims to the under-
signed, or file the same with the
said Register of Wills on or be-
fore October 24, 1970.
Any claim not so filed on or

before such date shall be unen-
forceable thereafter.

ROEBRT F. LITTLE
Personal Representative

Date of first publication:
April 24, 1970
THOMAS M. EICHELBERGER

Register of Wills
W. Jerome Offutt
Attorney-at-Law,
22 W. Second St.
Frederick, Md. 21701 412413t

NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT
and

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
TO ALL PERSONS INTEREST-
ED IN THE ESTATE OF Jessie
Schreiner Ebert.
This is to give notice that the

undersigned, John Edward Ebert
whose address is 147 West Pat-
rick St., Frederick, Md. 21701,
has been appointed personal rep-
resentative of the estate of Jessie
Schrenier Ebert who died on April
12, 1970.

All persons having any objec-
tion to such appointment (or to
the probate of the decedent's will)
shall file the same with the Reg-
ister of Wills for Frederick Coun-
ty on or before October 15, 1970.

All persons having claims
against the decedent must present
their claims to the undersigned,
or file the same with the said
Register of Wills on or before
October 24, 1970.
Any claim not so filed on or

before such date shall be unen-
forceable thereafter.

JOHN EDWARD EBERT
Personal Representative

Date of first publication:
April 24, 1970
THOMAS M. EICHELBERGER

412413t Register of Wills

NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT
and

NOTICE TO CRED11ORS
TO ALL PERSONS INTEREST-
ED IN THE ESTATE OF Amy
Staub Eichelberger.
This is to give notice that the

undersigned, Guy F. Eichelberg-
er, Sr. and Nadine E. Danilson
whose addresses are 406 East St.,
Frederick, Md., and 5480 Wiscon-
sin Ave., Apt. 1205, Chevy Chase,
Md. 20015, have been appointed
personal representatives of the
estate of Amy Staub Eichelberg-
er who died on April 4, 1970.

All persons having any objec-
tion to such appointment shall
file the same with the Register of
Wills of Frederick County on or
before October 15, 1970.

All persons having claims
against the decedent must pre-
sent their claims to the under-
signed, or file the same with the
Register of Wills on or before Oc-
tober 24, 1970.
Any claim not so filed on or

before such date shall be unen-
forceable thereafter.
GUY F. EICHELBERGER, SR.

NADINE E. DANILSON
Personal Representatives

Date of first publication:
April 24, 1970
LAWRENCE A. DORSEY, JR.,
Attorney-at-Law
114-A W. Church St.,
Frederick, Md. 21701
THOMAS M. EICHELBERGER

4!2413t Register of Wills

Carroll, Graceham, were guests
on Sunday of Mrs. Harvey Stam-
baugh.

Mrs. George Albaugh, Union
Bridge; Mr. and Mrs. Gailord
Putman, Mr. and Mrs. John Gru-
ber, Rocky Ridge, were recent
guests of Mrs. Edith Gruber and
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Keeney aid
family.

Mrs. Oneida Eyler, Littlestown;
Mr. and Mrs. James- Welty and
daughter, Lennis, Keymar, visited
recently with Mrs. John Hahn.

Mrs. Virgie Paugh, Mrs. Ethel
Jackson, Mr. and Mrs. Donald
Paugh, Donna and Donald, Jr.,
visited on Sunday with Mr. and
Mrs. Paul Reid, Hagerstown.
Harvey Gearhart is spending a

week with Mr. and Mrs. William
Gearhart and family, Corpus
Christi, Texas.
Recent guests of Mr. George

Motter were Mr. and Mrs. George
Crouse, Taneytown; James R.

LEGAL
NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT

and
NOTICE TO CREDITORS

TO ALL PERSONS INTEREST-
ED IN THE ESTATE OF Katie
E. Grove.

This is to give notice that the
undersigned, Clara G. Wilhide and
Guy W. Nusz whose addresses are
9 W. Second St., Frederick, Md.
and Frederick, Md., have been ap-
pointed personal representatives
of the estate of Katie E Grove
who died on April 15, 1970.

All persons having any objec-
tion to such appointment (or to
the probate of the decedent's will)
shall file the same with the Reg-
ister of Wills of Frederick Coun-
ty on or before October 20, 1970.

All persons having claims
against the decedent must present
their claims to the undersigned,
or file the same with the said
Register of Wills on or before
October 24, 1970.
Any claim not so filed on or

before such date shall be unen-
forceable thereafter.

CLARA G. WILHIDE
GUY W. NUSZ

Personal Representatives
Date of first publication:
April 24, 1970
THOMAS M. EICHELBERGER

4124I3t Register of Wills

BOARD OF EDUCATION
FREDERICK COUNTY,

MARYLAND
INVITATION TO BID

April 17, 1970
TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN.
As of this date, the Board of

Education, Frederick County,
Maryland, is requesting bids for
employee group life insurance, ac-
cidental death and dismemberment
benefits, and optional dependent
group life coverages to be made
available to eligible employees of
the Board of Education and em-
ployees of the Frederick Com-
munity College.
For your consideration, speci-

fications, employee census infor-
mation, and a proposed benefit
schedule are attached. In addi-
tion, we request that you answer
all general questions and comply
with the general remarks when
preparing and submitting your
bid proposal.

All bids must be sealed and
submitted to the office of Mr. John
E. Tritt, Director of Administra-
tive Services, Board of Educa-
tion of Frederick County, Mary-
land, no later than 10:00 A.M.,
Eastern Daylight Time, on Mon-
day, May 25, 1970.

Consideration of the bids shall

be made by the Board of Educa-
tion and the contract shall be
awarded after final approval by
the Commissioners of Frederick

County, Maryland. The Board of
Education reserves the right to
reject any or all proposals and
to waive informalities.

By Order of the Board of Edu-
cation of Frederick County.

John L. Carnochan, Jr.
Secretary-Treasurer

Bid #70-A-1 It

State of Maryland
NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT

AND
NOTICE TO CREDITORS

TO ALL PERSONS INTEREST-
ED IN THE ESTATE OF

LINDLEY W. HOLBROOK
This is to give notice that the

undersigned, Union Trust Com-
pany of the District of Columbia
whose address is Union Trust
Building, 15th and H Streets,
N.W., Washington, D. C., has been
appointed personal representative
of the estate of Lindley W. Hol-
brook who died on March 18, 1970.

All persons having any objec-
tion to such appointment (or to
the probate of the decedent's will)
shall file the same with the Reg-
ister of Wills of Frederick Coun-
ty on or before October 28, 1970.

All persons having claims
against the decedent must pre-
sent their claims to the under-
signed, or file the same with the
said Register of Wills on or be-
fore November 1, 1970.
Any claim not so filed on or be-

fore such date shall be unenforce-
able thereafter.

Union Trust Company of
the District of Columbia
Melville W. Stuart
Vice President and
Trust Officer

Personal Representative
THOMAS M. EICHELBERGER

Register of Wills
Date of first
publication:
May 1, 1970-3t

Motter, Chambersburg; G. Edwin
Motter, Gardners, Pa.; and Mr.
and Mrs. Warren Motter and fam-
ily, Menges Mills.
The Mt. Tabor Lutheran Church

held a covered dish supper in the
Fire Hall recently. Dr. J. C. Don-
ley, Gettysburg, showed slides de-
scribing his trip to Africa. The
young people rendered several mu-
sical selections. Mrs. Isabel Ma-
thias gave a comical reading. Ap-
proximately 55 persons were in
attendance.
Recent guests in the ho.n of

Mt. and Mrs. Donald Paugh and
family were: Mrs.
and children, Mr. and Mrs. Rus-
sell Alexander, Rusty, Mary.,
Paula, Sharon and Marsha Shank
Oakland; Mr. and Mrs. Wayne
Paugh and children, Robert, John,
James, Billy and Mix, Joe, Au-
gusta, Ga.; Mr. and Mrs. Fred

igler and son, Fred, Jr., Mr.
and Mrs. Clifford Zeigler, West-
minster; Mr. and Mrs. Robert
Zeigler and daughter, Stephanie,
Owings Mills; Mr. and Mrs. Gary
Zeigler and daughter, Stacy, Union
Bridge; Mr. and Mrs. Raymond
Bloom, Raymond, Jr., Robert and
Debra, Uniontown; Philip Zim-
merman, Detour; Harvey Gear-
hart, Dennis Mathias and Randy
Bollinger, Rocky Ridge.
Mr. and Mrs. William Fisher

and son, Rocky Ridge, have re-
turned home from a trip to Cali-
fornia where they visited Disney-
land and other places of interest.
Mr. and Mrs. George Delphey,

Rocky Ridge, and Mr. and Mrs.
Edward Meadows and daughter,
Lois, Thurmont, -njoyed a trip
to Williamsburg, Va., over the
weekend and visited Mt. Vernon
on the way home.

r---77jelaM.
- ...... rv,Irt.S.:;,:t&
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Ole Bible

Be not quick ..lo anger.
—(Eccles. 7:8).

We shouldn't let ourselves
become upset or irritable.
Sometimes we let little things
grow out of proportion. Stay
calm and be patient. It is sur-
prising what a little patience,
a dash of kindness, and a pinch
of love will do. What a recipe!
How about trying it today?

LEUKEMIA IN CHILDREN
100%

750/0

50%

25%

O0/,
46 64 .66

Patients temporarily free of
symptoms after best available
treatment in leading medical

centers.
Help Find

A Cure for Leukemia
Give to the
American

Cancer Society

[KEiP IT CLEANperidrClinit

DEAR VIRGINIA WHITE:
Enzymes and enzyme pre-
soaks are big on grocers'
shelves, yet I keep reading
articles in the newspapers and
national magazines about the
Federal Trade Commission in-
vestigating the cause of itch-
ing or rashes, respiratory prob-
lems, etc. by enzymes. What
is your opinion of enzyme prod-
ucts? LEERY SHOPPER.
DEAR SHOPPER: I, too,

have read the many items
about the dan-
gers of enzymes
causing itching
or rashes, etc. I
would suggest
that you try a
product such as
Miracle White
Powerizer Super

Cleaner in order to rid cloth-
ing of enzyme residue. As
clothes are washed there is a
build up of soap, detergent and
enzyme residues. To prove that
your clothes contain these resi-
dues make this simple test. Fill
your washing machine with
water, add 1/2 cup Powerizer
Super Cleaner; DO NOT add
any detergent or soap. Add
clothes; allow to agitate ten
(10) minutes and notice the
impurities, detergent, etc. that
have left the clothes and are
in the water. Get a glass and
hold it to the light, and note
how really clean the clothes
become.

Hint of the Week!
To keep Tupperware storage

containers free from odor fill
with hot water; add 1 or more
tablespoons baking soda to
each container; allow to stand
overnight. Wash in hot sudsy
water, rinse and dry. If odor
remains, place open containers
in freezer overnight, remove
and repeat washing instruc-
tions as above.

Get a free stain removal chart.
write V. W. 7, Miracle White
Company, 1741 West Fullerton
Avenue, Chicago, llinois 60614.

HELPING HAND FOR FAMILY ASSISTANCE

er.

EMMIT GARDENS
3 bedrooms, 11/2 baths, brick and frame Ranch-

FINISHED CLUB BASEMENT

Central air-conditioning, garage, nicely land-
scaped lawn, no thru traffic, recently repainted in-
terior. $22,300.00. SHRIVER REALTY, E. Main
St. Phone 301-447-2180 or 301-447-6224.

LOVELY HALLMARK CARDS
for

Mother's Day
ALSO NICE SELECTION OF

TASTY CANDY FOR "HER"

EMMITSBURG PHARMACY
Paul M. Carter, Pharmacist

W. Main Street Emmitsburg, Md.
Phone 447-6226

;LOSE
10 LBS. IN

10 DAYSiON
GRAPEFRUIT

DIET
HOLLYWOOD, CALIF. (Special) — This is the revolu-

tionary grapefruit diet that everyone is suddenly talking
about. Literally thousands upon thousands of copies have
been passed from hand to hand in factories, plants and of-
fices throughout the U. S. and Canada.
Word of its success has spread like wildlife. Because this

is the diet that really works. We have testimonials in our
files reporting on the success of this diet. If you follow it
exactly, you should lose 10 pounds in 10 days. There will be
no weight loss in the first four days. But you wlil suddenly
drop 5 pounds on the 5th day. Thereafter you will lose one
pound a day until the 10th day. Then you will lose 11/2
pounds every two days until you get down to your proper
weight. Best of all there will be no hunger pangs. Now re-
vised and enlarged, this new diet plan lets you stuff yourself
with foods that were formerly "forbidden," such as big
steaks trimmed with fat, roast or fried chicken, rich gravies,
mayonnaise, lobster swimming in butter, bacon fats, saus-
ages and scrambled eggs. You can eat until you are full
until you cannot possibly eat any more. And still lose 10
pounds in the first ten days plus 11/2 pounds every two days
thereafter until your weight is down to normal. The secret
behind this new "quick weight loss" diet is simple. Fat does
not form fat. And the grapefruit juice in this new diet acts
as a catalyst (the "trigger"), to start the fat burning proc-
ess. You stuff yourself on the permitted food listed in the
diet plan, and still lose unsightly fat and excess body fluids.
When the fat and bloat are gone you will cease to lose
weight and your weight will remain constant. A copy of this
new and startingly successful diet plan can be obtained by
sending $2 to GRAPEFRUIT DIET PUBLISHERS, 1213
Premier Way, Calgary 6, Alberta. Money-back guarantee.
If after trying the diet plan you have not lost 7 pounds in
the first seven days, and 1 1/2 pounds every two days there-
after simply return the diet plan and your $2 will be re-
funded promptly and without argument. Tear out this mes-
sage as a reminder. Decide now to regain the trim, attrac-
tive figure of your youth, while enjoying hearty breakfasts,
lunches and dinners.

Dept. No. 4-23-46

GRAPEFRUIT DIET
PUBLISHERS

1213 PREMIER WAY, S.W.
CALGARY 6, ALBERTA
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The ZIP Column

Effective July 1, 1970, our of-
fice will be advanced to a First
Class status.
The only change which will af-

fect our patrons is that of weight
and size limitation on fourth class
parcels (parcel post).

After this date, parcels mailed
at our office, addressed to our of-
fice, or any other first class office
in the 48 contiguous states, will
be limited to 40 lbs., and 78 inch-
es in length and girth combined.
There are certain exceptions to

this limitation which allow the
previous weight of 70 lbs., and
100 inches, and are as follows:
Those mailed on or to a rural or
star route; those mailed to most
APO and FPO addresses; those
mailed to Hawaii, Alaska, Puerto

Rico or any possession of the
United States; those •-ontaining
baby poultry, nursery stock, ag-
riculturl commodities, books, films
and matter for the blind.

If there are any questions con-
cerning this limitation, please
ccntact me at the office.

George E. Rosensteel, P.M.

Bridal Shower
For Miss McNair
Miss Deborah McNair, R2, Fair-

field, was guest of honor at a
surprise bridal shower given at
her home on Sunday, April 19.
Mrs. Warren Barrett was hostess
for the shower. Those attending
were. Mrs. Sam McNair, Miss
Pat McNair, Mrs. Mervin Tate, of
Fairfield; Mrs. Warren Barret and
daughters, Barbara and Betsy, of
Newington, Conn.; Mrs. Robt. Bish-
op and daughter, Bobbi Jo, Mrs.
Kenneth Bigham, Mrs. Mike O'-
Dell, Mrs. Edgar McDonnell, Miss
Linda McDonnell, Mrs. Donald
Hobbs, Miss Donna Lansberger,
Mrs. Glenn Trostle, Jr., Mrs.
Thomas Bittle, Mrs. Dorothy Mc-
Nair, Miis Blanche Stoops, Mrs.
James W. Bigham, of Gettysburg;
Mrs. Leonard W. Zimmerman,
Miss Edna Zimmerman, Mrs. Rob-

PREGNANCY AND LEG BEAUTY
Does pregnancy mean good-

bye to beautiful legs?
"In far too many cases, that

Is just what it means," said
medical researcher William 0.
Elson, director of the research
laboratories of the Bauer &
Black Supports Division of the
Kendall Company.
"Pregnancy 'normally adds a

temporary 20 pounds to the
weight of the mother-to-be,
and often much more if she
does not carefully follow the
diet her doctor has given her.
"That extra weight places a

severe strain on her legs," the
scientist continued. "An add-
ed complication is that her ex-
tra weigle exerts a pressure on
the veins in the pelvic area
which are returning the blood
from the legs to the heart."

Weak Veins Break Down
The too-frequent result, ac-

cording 0 Elson, is a break-
down of the circulatory system
in the leg;
"Weak veins near the sur-

face, where there is less sup-
port from muscle and tissue,
tend to dilate; tiny valves
within the veins, designed by
nature to help the blood flow
back to the heart, begin to
break down — and the result
is discolored, varicose veins.
Such veins can never be re-
stored to normal. The only
sensible thing to do is to pre-
vent their development in the
first place," Elson said.
How is that done — how can

a woman preserve the beauty
of her legs in spite of preg-
nancy?
"Compression, through elas-

tic or support stockings, is
frequently the answer," the
medical researcher says. "See
your doctor, as early as possi-
ble in your pregnancy, and fol-_

low his advice in all particu-
lars. If you tell him you are
worried about varicose veins—
he will in all probability pre-
scribe either support or elastic
stockings, depending upon your
age and general physical con-
dition. The compression these
stockings provide will give
great support to leg veins
throughout pregnancy — and
afterward, when you are still
carrying the baby — but then
in your arms.

Elastic Twice as Strong
"And, if your doctor tells

you to wear elastic stockings,
follow his advice; don't second.
guess him by wearing support
stockings instead. Remembur,
elastic hosiery offers twice the
compression that supp ort
stockings do; besides, modern
ultra-sheer elastic hosiery now
Woks as much like ordinary
hosiery as support stockings
do."

"Finally," the scientist rec-
ommended, "if your doctor
should prescribe support hos-
iery, because he knows it will
give enough compression in
your particular case, get sev-
eral pairs immediately and
wear a pair at all times. You
can now buy support stock-
ings which look exactly like
regular stockings. Select those
which assure correct support
through patented, encircling
fingers of spandex. It is im-
portant to wear the kind
which is knitted to exact foot
size and which gives greatest
support where it is most need-
ed — at the ankle."
These simple precautions,

the scientist said, will go a
long way towards preserving
youthful leg beauty through-
out pregnancy.

Your Big Chance to Win an

ELECTRIC MINI-MUSTANG
During Our

"FLAMELESS SELF-CLEAN
RANGE RALLYE"

ASK FOR FREE TICKETS & DETAILS
AT OUR STORE

DRAWING MAY 28, 1970

REAVES ELECTRIC
(Open Monday & Friday Evenings)

PHONE 44'7-2497—W. Main St. — EMMITSBURG

SPRINGTIME

“KEDS" FOR THE FAMILY
Best By Test

Made Best

Fit Best

Wear Best

The Shoe Box
LIPPY BUILDING GETTYSB1URG, PA.

ert Koontz, Mrs. Fern Baker, Mrs.
Edward Baker, Mrs. Effie Hoke,
Mrs. John White, of Emmitsburg;
Mrs. E. A. Botterbusch, Mrs. Fred
Botterbusch and daughter, Mary,
Mrs. Richard Stickler, of York;
Mrs. Richard Clevenger, of Hag-
erstown; Mrs. John Seginak, and
Mrs. Morris Barrett, of Washing-
ton; Miss Julia Hartle, of Taney-
town; and Mrs. Herbert Blosser,
of Glen Rock.
Those sending gifts but unable

to attend were Mrs. Thelma Neil-
son of Bethesda; Mrs. Kenneth
Helwig, of Hanover; Mrs. W. R.
Cadle, Mrs. Geroge Gingell, and
Mrs. Herbert Gingell of Emmits-
burg; Mrs. James R. Bigham,
Mrs. Eva McNair, Miss Barbara
Bigham, Miss Amy Bigham, and
Mrs. Harry Carbaugh, of Gettys-
burg; Miss Becky Barrett, of
Springfield, Ohio; Mrs. Bill Bar-
rett, of Newington, Conn.; Mrs.
Gene Walker, of Lancaster.

Miss McNair received many
gifts. After the gifts were open-
ed, refreshments were served to
the ladies who were joined by
the following gentlemen: Patrick
Zimmerman, Leonard Zimmerman,
Robert Zimmerman, Fern Baker,
of Emmitsburg; Sam McNair, Sr.,
Mervin Tate, Sam McNair, Jr.,
of Fairfield; Richard Clevenger,
of Hagerstown; E. A. Botterbusch,
Fred Botterbusch and sons, Fred
and Karl, and Richard Steckler,
of York; and Mr. Herbert Blosser
of Glen Rock.

Miss McNair will marry Mr. L.
Patrick Zimmerman in Elias Ev.
Lutheran Church, Emmitsburg, on
July 4.

Little League
Donors Listed
The following have made a do-

nation to the Emmitsburg Little
League:
B. H. Boyle & Sons, Inc.
The Palms
St. Joseph's Church
Ralph Irelan
Sanders Garage
Farmers & Mechanics Natl. Bank
VFW Post 6358
Mr. & Mrs. Charles P. Harner
Dr. W. R. Cadle
Sperry Ford Sales
American Legion Post 121
D. & Mrs. William Carr
Bernard K.9.1.iSS
Chronicle PresS Inc.

Town of Emmitsburg
Mt. Manor Motel & Restaurant
J. Ward Kerrigan
Carroll Vending Inc.
Keepers Esso Service Station
Frank Topper
Mac's Barber Shop
Freeman Shoe Company
Lewis Smith
John D. White
Reaves Electric
Knights of Columbus
Emmitsburg Pharmacy
Mayor Robert Seidel

Hospital Report
Admitted
Mrs. Jack Wagerman, Emmits-

burg.
Mrs. Kenneth Gumm, Emmits-

burg Rl.
John Brown, Thurmont R2.
Joseph Stahley, Emmitsburg.

Discharged
James Angell, Rocky Ridge.
Mrs. William Wivel, Emmits-

burg.
Mrs. William Smith, Ernmits-

burg.
William A. Shorb, Jr., Fair-

field R2.
Mrs. Merle Knott, Thurmont.
Francis Topper, Emmitsburg Rl.
Mrs. Louise Gillelan, Emmits-

burg.

Births
Mr. and Mrs. Peter Murphy,

Emmitsburg, daughter, Friday.
Mr. and Mrs. William Looken-

bill, Emmitsburg R1, son, Friday.
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Coleman,

Thurmont R2, twins, a son and
daughter, last Thursday.
Mr. and Mrs. George

Jr., Taneytown, son, last
day.

Arnold,
Thurs-

High School

Registration May 8
Registration for St. Joseph's

High School, Emmitsburg, will be
held at 10:00 a.m. in the high
school on May 8, 1970.

Students will be measured for
uniforms, receive forms, and spend
the day in the school for brief
orientation.

* * *

The Business Club of St. Sos-
eph's High School spent all day,
Monday, April 27, in Hagerstown.
They were guests of Hagerstown
Business College and IBM.
The French Club of St. Jos-

eph's went on a field trip to
Washington, D. C., on the same
day. These students spent part
of their day at Georgetown Uni-
versity and the Smithsonian In-
stitute. They had dinner in the
French Restaurant near the uni-
versity.

VFW AMBULANCE
The following were taken to

the Warner Hospital, Gettysburg,
this week via the VFW ambulance:
Norman J. Moore, Marmont, W.
Va.; John Carson, Jr., Thurmont;
Patrick Rice, Charnita, and Nan-
cy Scott, Emmitsburg. John L.
Warthen was returned to his home
from the University Hospital, Bal-
timore, and John Carson, Jr., was
taken to the Kernan's Children's
Hospital, Baltimore. Drivers were
Paul E. Humerick, James Kitting-
er, Michael Boyle and Thomas
White.

Loyalty Day

To Be Observed
Friday May 1 has been des-

ignated Loyalty Day by the Na-
tional Commander of the Veterans
of Foreign Wars.
The local Auxiliary of Post 6658

of the Veterans of Foreign Wars,
would like to mark this day by
calling attention to the care and
etiquette of the Stars and Stripes.
The federal code says the uni-

versal csutom is to display the
flag only from sunrise to sunset
on building and stationary flag-

istaffs n the open. Places and oc-
casions when the flag may be
flown at night are the national
capitol building in Washington,
D. C., from a permanent fort or
ship engaged in battle, or upon
occasions when a special patriot-
ic effect is desired.
The flag flies day and night

over the Frederick, Md., grave of
Francis Scott Key, author of the
national anthem. Congress also
permits the flag to be flown 24
hours a day at Fort McHenry„
Baltimore, Md., in commemora-
tion of Francis Scott Key's "Star
Spangled Banner," and at the
World War Memorial at Worcest-
er, Mass.
There are practical reasons for

restricting display of the Stars
and Stripes between sunset and
sunrise. First, since a flag at
night cannot be seen except at

AIR DELIVERED—Sfc William Long is served home-cooked barbecued pork flown
to Walter Reed General Hospital, Washington, D.C.. from Goldsboro, N.C. The sergeant
was one of 450 servicemen who were served a special meal prepared by the citizens
of Goldsboro, N.C., as a gesture of appreciation. At his bedside is Millie Lewis of
Goldsboro. The sergeant, from Elden, N.C., was returned from Vietnam in January.
(Wide World Photos)

4-H Teens Give Big Assist to Many
A young and vital sector of

the 'nation's population con-
cerned with social problems,
law enforcement, environ-
mental improvement, and
demonstrations are making
headlines. Their number
totals just over 150,000 and
their influence is felt from
coast-to-coast.
They are the junior leaders

of 4-H Clubs, whose activities
spill over into community,
state and nation. They not
only speak up for 4-H, but
help teach the younger mem-
bers the "learn-by-doing"
program. They convincingly
demonstrate a better way to
sew, cook, garden, have fun
or be a good citizen.
They also work with pre-

schoolers, orphans, physically
handicapped, mentally ill,
and even with youngsters
who run afoul of the law.
These "concerned" teen-

agers are participating in the
national 4-H leadership pro-
gram supported for the last 10
years by The Sears-Roebuck
Foundation.

Again this year 12 of the
nation's most outstanding 4-H
junior leaders chosen by the
Cooperative Extension Ser-
vice will receive $600 scholar-
ships.

Said 19-year-old Shirley
Korrey, a 1969 scholarship
winner: "I organized a 4-H
Club especially designed to
help mentally retarded chil-
dren."
She not only brought a new

dimension to their limited ex-
istence, but also encouraged
the parents to improve home
living conditions.

"Hang on ... don't drop that stitch!" says this junior 4-H leader to
her young pupil. She is one of more than 150,000 teenage youths par-
ticipating in the 1970 national 4-H leadership program conducted by
the Cooperative Extension Service in 50 states, and supported by The
Sears-Roebuck Foundation.

A young man who is now a
pre-law student, followed a
different leadership path. He
held offices in his local 4-H
Club, which led to his being
elected state 4-H president.
He is a member of a group
preparing a report for his
state's participation in the
1970 White House Confer-
ence on Children and Youth.

Scores of capable teenagers
will report their leadership
activities in competition for

1970 local, state and national
awards offered by The Sears-
Roebuck Foundation.
One member from each

state will be a leadership
delegate to the National 4-H
Congress in Chicago.
There will be a news con-

ference for the 12 national
champions, radio and tele-
vision appearances, and other
events calling public atten-
tion to this reliable brand of
leadership.

very close range, what is the
sense of flying it? Second, a flag
flying outdoors at night would be
subject to damage by winds and
incelment weather while everyone
sleeps. Third, our flag should
never be forgotten — hence, the
daily care and ceremony of hoist-
ing it briskly each morning and
lowering it at sunset.
A number of booklets entitled

"Etiquette of the Stars & Stripes"
have been distributed to all local
schools and to the Scout troops
(both boy and girl) and teachers
and leaders have been asked to
encourage the children to read,
discuss and become familiar with
the care of "Old Glory."

COUNCIL OF CHURCHES
TO MEET SUNDAY

The quarterly meeting of the
Emmitsburg Council of Churches
will be held Sunday evening, May
3, at 7 p.m., DST, in the Fellow-
ship Hall of the United Church
of Christ. Members of all com-
mittees are urged to attend this
meeting.

High School Drama
Club Show May 4
The Love's Labors Drama Club

of St. Joseph's High School will
present "Long Overdue," a two-
act musical by Phil Wychodzki, on
Monday and Tuesday evenings,
May 4 and 5.
The show, directed by Carole

Wychodzki, is a comedy situated
in a branch library, which reach-
es a climax amidst several love

affairs.
Admission is 25c for students

and 75c for adults. Curtain is at
8 p.m. in St. Joseph's Auditorium.
We guarantee an enjoyable eve-
ning.

BAPTIZED

The infant son of Mr. and Mrs.
James F. Wivell, Rocky Ridge, was
baptized on April 12 at St. An-
thony's Shrine by Rev. Mr. Rich-
ard Broderick, Mt. St. Mary's
Seminary. James, Jr., and Phyllis
Wivell were Godparents for their
brother, who was given the name
Christopher David.

the great crippler

of young adults

Send Oh to MS c/o Postmaster

25c ea4 Wcait
S. Seton Ave.

Emrnitsburg, Md.

Mother's Dap
and

Graduation Do  B

CARDS
BY AMERICAN GREETING

—Nice Selection—

CROUSE'S e Square
—OPEN SUNDAYS—

'HONE 4472211 EMMITSBURG, MD

ALL OF YOUR BANKING
NEEDS SERVED
AT ONE LOCATION
DEPOSITS
Corporate, Business, Individual Savings, Christmas
Club, Vacation Club

CONSUMER LOAN DEPARTMENT
Personal Loans, Automobile Loans, Dealer Financ-
ing, Automobiles, Appliances, Home Improvement
Loans

GENERAL SERVICES
Bank Money Orders, Drive-In Banking, Banking by
Mail, Night Depositories, Bond Coupon Collection
Securities, Purchase and Sale, Cashier's Checks,
Collections, Certified Checks, Travelers Checks,
BankAmericard

PERSONAL TRUSTS
Estate Planning, Trustee Under Wills, Executor
Administrator of Estates, Trustees for Pensions
Profit-Sharing Plans, Guardian for Estates of
nors or Incompetents

and
and
Mi-

CORPORATE TRUSTS
Agent for Dividend Banking, Transfer and Escrow,
Trustee Under Pension and Profit-Sharing Plans

REAL ESTATE
Construction Loans, Residential Mortgages, Com-
mercial Mortgages

COMMERCIAL LOAN DEPT.
Commercial or Business Loans, Industrial Term
Loans, Equipment Financing

SAFE DEPOSIT FACILITIES

Emmitsburg Office

FARMERS AND NECHANEGs

NATIONAL BANK
Member F.D.I.C.


