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COMMUNITY LOCALS
This column is not for use in aavertis-

hag any money-making program, fair, sup-
per, party or sale. It is intended for
news, personals, and such matters as may
be of community interest.
All communications for this department

must be signed by the author; not for
publication, but as an evidence that the
Items contributed are legitimate and cor-
rect. Items based on mere rumor, or such
as are likely to give offense, are not want-
ed.

Miss Eleanor Birnie, of Washing-
ton, D. C., came July 3rd and is a
guest through this week of the Misses
Annan.

Misses Marjorie and Donna Kaye
Wheatley, of Eldorado, Md., are spend-
ing the week with their aunt and un-
cle, Mr. and Mrs. Harry Mohney.

Mrs. John Teeter accompanied her
son, Daniel and two sons, of Gettys-
burg to Bedford, Pa., to attend a D. A.
Convention from Friday 11th until the
13th.

Mrs. Robert Baumgardner and son,
Robert and Miss Jean Botzler, Balti-
more, are spending this week at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Norman Rein-
dollar.

Jean Shorb, of Manchester, and
Francis Myers, of Taneytown, spent
the week of July 4th, in Roanoke,
Va., visiting Miss Shorb's brother and
family.

Mr. Gust Westine, who has been liv-
ing at the home of his son, Mr. Felix
Westine and family, left Monday eve-
ning for Boston, Mass., on an extend-
ed stay.

SA Betty Lynn Robertson, U. S.
Navy, spent the Fourth with Mr. and
Mrs. Paul Robertson and Thomas.
She returned to the Air Base in Rhode
Island on Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. G. G. Hollenbaugh and
son Jack, and Mr. and Mrs. Ted Hol-
lenbaugh, of Reisterstown, spent Sun-
day with Mr. and Mrs. William Hop-
kins and son, William.

Mr. and Mrs. C. A. Bigham and son,
William, of Catonsville, spent from
Thursday until Sunday at the horne of
Mrs. Bigham's parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Norville P. Shoemaker.

- -
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Feeser, son,

Richard, and Mr. and Mrs. ilehrle
Feeser, have returned home after a
week's visit to Niagara Falls, Thous-
and Islands, Ontario, Quebec and the
New England States.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy H. Baker, town,
and Mr. and Mrs. Joseph C. Baker
and children, Michael and Susan, of
Hagerstown, are spending this week
at Williamsburg, Va., with their
daughter and son-in-law, Mr. and Mrs
Joseph F. Jenkins.

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Lambert,
daughter, Patsy, entertained to dinner
Tuesday evening: Mr. and Mrs. Earle
Goodwin, Mr. and Mrs. Robert Rey-
molds, Muskegon, Michigan; Mr. and
Mrs. William Dickensheets and Doris
Putman, Uniontown, Md.

Mrs. George Brown, of Philadelphia,
Pa., spent last week as guest of Mr.
and Mrs. A. H. Carpenter and Mrs.
Mary Coyne. They had as guests
last Thursday Mrs. Robert Teachout,
of Washington, D. C., and Mrs. Agness
Baker, of Terra Haute, Indiana.

Cpl. Harry K. Smith and Mrs.
Smith, of Ladiesburg, spent last Wed-
nesday evening with the Misses
Stunkle. They have just returned
from Wyoming where Cpl. Smith is
connected with' the Air Force. At the
time Cpl. Smith entered the service
they were living in Taneytown, on
Middle St.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Ehrhart, Lit-
tlestown, and Mrs. Kenneth Airing,
Taneytown, returned Thursday, (July
3) from a few days visit with Mrs.
Airing's husband, Pfc. Kenneth Air-
ing, with the Marine Corps, at
Quantico, Va. Mrs. Airing returned
with her husband who spent the
Fourth of July week-end at his home.

Mrs. Mary Wilt and Mrs. Norman
Reindollar entertained at luncheon,on
Tuesday, at the home of Mrs. Wilt.
The guests were the ladies of the Sew-
ing Club, and Mrs. Robert Baumgard-
ner and Miss Jean Botzler, of Balti-
more. There was a birthday cake
with two candles honoring the birth-
days of Mrs. John Teeter and Mrs. Ab-
bie Angell.

A weiner roast was held Friday
evening, (July 4) at the home of Mrs.
Ethel Airing, Taneytown R. D. 2.
Those present were: Mr. and Mrs.
Elwood Airing, children, Donald,
Ricky, Betty and Sandra; Mr. and
Mrs. William Airing, sons, Richard
and Ronald; Mr. and Mrs. Robert Air-
ing, children, Donna Lee and Robert,
Jr., Mr. and Mrs. Ambrose Hess, Pfc.
and Mrs. Kenneth Airing, Mrs. Ethel
Airing and son, Richard, all of Tan-
eytown, and Miss Ethel Warner, of
Westminster R. D. 5. All kinds of re-
freshments were served and an enjoy-
able time was had by all.

Robert L. Zentz, local representa-
tive for E. A. -Strout Realty Agency,

4 Inc., reports the sale of the small
farm of Mr. and Mrs. Manley R.
Campbell, of near Harney, to Mr. and
Mrs. Maurice J. Swetland, of Rancho
Mirag, California. Mr. and Mrs.
Campbell has taken up residence in
Bethlehem, Pa. and has given posses-
sion of the farm to the purchasers.
The sale was made as a result of the
large Strout catalog which the pur-
chasers secured from the Strout Los
Angeles office before beginning their
trip east. The Swetlands mentioned
that this area of Maryland was the
most beautiful section of the country
they found in their trip east.
Swetland is a retired Publisher and
Writer.

(Continued on fourth page)

LIONS MEETING

The Newly Elected Officers
Assume Posts

After a short vacation spent in the
Lions Den the Taneytown Lions have
returned and are ready for a big year
with their new president Lion Single-
ton Remsburg.
The first meeting with President

Remsburg presiding was held at Tan-
ey Inn, July 8, at 6:29 p. m.
Opening with the usual ceremonies

and a few remarks by the President
the meeting was turned over to pro-
gram Chairman Lion Merwyn C. Fuss
who in his own inimitable manner in-
troduced the Rev. Edmund Lippy as
the speaker of the evening. Rev. Lippy
had as the subject of his address 'Why
Should God Bless America'. In his ad-
dress Rev. Lippy presented thoughts
which made every Lion present think
what he might do in order to make
this a better country in which to live.
Chairman Harry Dougherty an-
nounced that the Lions picnic would be
held at the Recreation Park, July 22,
for all Lions, their families and guests.

KIWANIS NEWS

Mr. Charles 0. Fisher, young attor-
ney, of Westminster, and member of
the Westminster Kiwanis Club ad-
dressed the Taneytown Kiwanis Club
at its regular meeting Wednesday
evening at Taney Inn. Mr. Fisher was
presented by William Hopkins who
had charge of the evening's pro-
gram. Attorney Fisher used as his
topic, "Our Country and Our Own Cit-
izenship." He stated that "one of the
best ways to help our country and be
a good citizen was to take an active
part in elections, and to help boost
not knock our public officials in their
efforts in giving us good government."
He also called the club's attention to
the small number of eligible persons
who exercise their privilege and duty
at the primary election held both in
the county and the nation. His speech
was well received by all present.
Guests at the meeting were Judge

Anderson of the Pikesville Club guest
of Dr. Chas. Hopkins and Andrew
Alexander of town and a student of
Oklahoma A. & M. College was the
guest of George W. Crouse.

President Howell B. Royer presided
at the meeting and the invocation was
offered by Raymond Wright. Group
singing was led by Wallace Yingling
with Mrs. Wallace Yingling as pian-
ist.
The meeting next week will be in

charge of Edward Reid and it will be
"Employer and Employee Week."

Plans are now complete for the big
Annual Crab and Shrimp feed to be
held by the club at Taneytown Recrea-
tion Park Wednesday evening, July
23rd. The net proceeds will be used
in community betterment.
On July 30th the Taneytown Club

will join the Westminster Club in a
meeting to be held on the Forest and
Stream Club grounds.

AUXILIARY MEETS

The Ladies Auxiliary to the Fire
Co., met last evening on the lawn of
Mrs. Garber's home. Scripture was
read by the Chaplain, followed by
prayer.
Reports were given on the Carni-

val and Alumni banquet. The presi-
dent, Ethel Garber thanked everyone
who helped make these two affairs a
success.
Four new members were added:

Mrs. Nettie Angell, Mrs. Carrie Wag-
ner, Mrs. Flora Leister and Mrs.
Edwina Welty.
A splendid report was given by

Mrs. Ruth Baumgardner, on the
state convention which was held at
Ocean City recently.
Happy birthday was sung to sev-

eral members who had birthdays.
The social committee for August is

Grace Rodgers, Mrs. Albert Smith,
Grace Bartgis, Mary Dull, Elizabeth
Baumgardner, Mrs. Mary Ovelman,
Reta Bowers, Verna Deberry and
Betty Arbaugh.
The meeting closed with the Lord's

prayer. Several games were enjoyed,
and refreshments were served by the
committee.
 -ck 
CAMP MEETING

The Pine Mar Holiness Christian
Camp Meeting is now in progress and
bids fair to be a far-reaching, success-
ful, evangelistic convocation.
The services consisting of sermons,

soul-stirring songs, earnest prayers,
lively instrumental music, enthusias-
tic shouts and personal testimonies
are open and free for all denomina-
tions and the public in general.
Rev. Andrew Johnson, D. D., Ph. D.

famous "Kentucky Colonel" and na-
tionally-known evangelist, faithful
and efficient exponent of the 'old-time'
gospel is the special guest speaker for
the duration of the encampment,
(July 1-13).

People from the immediate commu-
nity and many surrounding towns are
attending the meeting.
The daily services of worship and

praise begin each evening at 7:30 p.
m. daylight saving time. A cordial
welcome awaits all who come.

4-H NEWS

The 4-H meeting was held at the
home of Vicki Greene, at 8 p. m. on
July 1st.
The meeting opened by singing "My

Old Kentucky Home". A demonstra-
tion was given by Miss Helve Koons
on "How to Make a Wackie Cake."
All members said the pledge. The
roll-call and minutes were read by
Sandra Shorb and the treasurer's re-
port was read by Barbara Neill. All
members will have a hike at the home
of Barbara and Rebecca Neill.
The meeting was adjourned at

9:45. Delicious refreshments were
served to 11 members present.

CITY COUNCIL
MET MONDAY

Financial Statement for the
Year Presented and Approved
On Monday evening the Mayor and

Citg Council received the deed for
part of the Presbyterian lots from Mr.
Robert Ingram president of the Trus-
tees of that church. This plot of land
is 148 feet long and 135 feet wide and
will be used as a free parking area.
The city paid $2,000 for this land and
it was paid for and will be maintained
by using the parking meter money. It
is expected that this will be graded
and stoned in the near future. This is
the second parking lot secured by the
city. The first was the United Breth-
ren Church lot which is leased.
Mr. Walter Benchoff, garbage col-

lector in Taneytown, discussed prob-
lems relative to his business. Several
of Mr. Benchoff's cutomers are taking
unfair advantage of him by putting
out tree branches, broken cement,
plaster and other materials which can-
not be classified as garbage in any
sense of the word. Still worse several
have set out hot ashes with the result
that his truck has caught fire while
others wishing to dodge the expense
and yet receive the service try to dis-
guise their garbage by putting it out
with their neighbors instead of plac-
ing it out in front of their house.
The annual statement for the year

as submitted by the auditors was dis-
cussed and approve& The Mayor and
City Council are especially happy to
note that the city is still out of debt
and has sufficient funds on hand to de-
fray all expenses until the tax session
rolls around this Fall. The Council
further noted that although the sum
of $3250 was listed as a liability it is
an interest free loan from the Feder-
al Government and is not payable un-
til the sewer project is started. Be
sure to read the statement of your
city as it appears on another page of
this paper.

LAWN FETE

The annual lawn fete sponsored by
the Christian Endeavor Society of
Grace Reformed Church, Taneytown,
Md., will be held on the grounds back
of the church on Saturday evening,
July 19. A baked ham supper will be
served family style beginning at 4:00
o'clock. The Westminster Band will
furnish music during the evening.
There will also, be a program present-
ed by local talent.
The following committees have been

appointed: Supper, Mrs. Franklin
Baker, Mrs. Clyde Hesson, Mrs. Cardl
Frock, Mrs. Charles A. Baker, Mrs.
Edward Reid, Mrs. Edgar Essig, Mrs.
Lewis Reifsnider, Mrs. William Simp-
son, Mrs. William Bankard, Mrs. Paul
Hilbert, Mrs. Walter Smith, Mrs. Au-
gustus Crabbs, Mrs. Charles Foreman,
Mrs. George Newcomer, Mrs. Charles
Miller, Mrs. Emma Rodgers, Mrs.
Howard Baker, Mrs. Carroll Garber,
Mrs. Lloyd Lambert, Mrs. Delmont
Koons, Mrs. Otis Shoembaker, Mrs.
Jacob Stambaugh, Miss Lillie Houck,
Miss Millie Brown, Mrs. Isaiah Reif-
snider, Mrs. Roy Baker, Mrs. Russell
Sulcer, Mrs. John Harmon.
Tables: Mrs. George Harmon, Mrs.

Harry Clingan, Mrs. Harry Mohney,
Mrs. Otis Shoemaker, Mrs. John
Feeser, Mrs. Emerson Rue, Misses
Fairy Frock, Dottie Hartsock, Nancy
Baker, Dottie Baker, Barbara Eck-
ard.
Sandwiches: Mrs. Leonard Reifsni-

der, Mrs. Harry Welty, Miss Mary
Shriver, Mrs. Walter Smith, Mrs. Har-
ley Holter, Mrs. Ellsworth Lambert,
Mrs. Murray Baumgardner, Mrs.
George Shriner, Mrs. Janet Smith.
Soft Drinks: Charles Stonesifer,

Kenneth Reifsnider,
Coffee: Harry Mohney.
Ice Cream: Delmont Koons, Carel

Frock, Ned Musser, David Reifsnider.
Novelty Table: Mrs. Emma Rodg-

ers, Mrs. William Simpson.
Fishpond: Misses Margaret Shreeve

Alma Shriner, Ella Smith, Mrs. Car-
roll Eckard, Mrs. Charles Stonesifer.
Program: Mrs. Harry Mohney, Mrs.

Carrie Beall.
Lights, stands, etc: Edward Reid.
Posters and tickets: Wilbur Thomas
Solicitors: Helen Bankard, Margaret

Shreeve, Mrs. Carroll Eckard, Mrs.
Emma Rodgers, Mrs. Card l Frock,
Fairy Frock, Mary Clingan, Mrs. Car-
rie Beall, Mrs. Harry Mohney.

PLANNING gGROUP CARROLL
COUNTY TEACHERS MEET

A planning group of the Carroll
County Teachers' Association met, on
Tuesday, July 8th, at eight o'clock in
the Davis Library at Westminster.
Plans for action during the summer
were outlined. Meetings with county
authorities were scheduled. Plans for
presenting the Association's request
for a salary increase to civic groups
were made.

Representatives of the teachers will
meet with the Manchester Lions Club
on Thursday, July 10 to explain the
teachers situation. They will attend
a meeting of the Hampstead Chamber
of Commerce on July 16 to present
their case to this group.

AMERICAN RED CROSS BLOOD
MOBILE

Mr. Ernest W. Dunbar, Chairman
announces that the Blood Mobile will
be in Taneytown on Tuesday, August
12th. This time it will be located at
the High School.
As it is seven months since the last

visit, it •is hoped that all who gave
before will again make an appoint-
ment. There are doubtless many oth-
ers who will be willing to give their
blood to help our boys in Korea.

EP EST W. DUNBAR.

ANNUAL 4-H FAIR

3-day Event Promises to be
Bigger and Better

Once again the 4-H boys and girls
of Carroll county are planning and
preparing for their annual 4-H Fair.
This year's three day event promises
to be bigger and better than ever be-
fore, and well worth seeing.

In the five years since the fair was
first held it has grown into a major
event. It began in 1947 as a one day
achievement day, with a minimum of
exhibits and exhibitors, but today's
fair is being put on by 640 boys and
girls, representing Carroll County's
15 boys 4-H Clubs and 20 girls clubs.
The fair brings before the public the
projects and achievements of the coun-
ty's youth.
The Fair is the project of the 4-

H-ers themselves. They exhibit the
projects they've worked on during the
year, and state specialists in every
'field are invited to judge the exhibits.
The girls' exhibits fall into four class-
es: Home Management, Home Furn-
ishing, Clothing and professional
results in food. The •boys exhibit
their handicrafts, and in the livestock
division some of the best livestock in
the state is shown, in all breeds. The
boys are rightly proud of their pure-
bred, registered stock, which they
themselves own. The judging of the
livestock this year, done by state
specialists, promises to be an event
well worth seeing.

This year's fair will prove that
girls are not the only ones who can
bake, nor are boys alone capable of
raising prize livestock. Among the
girl's cakes will be some of the boys'
best efforts, and girls will show their
livestock along with the boys. Judging
results' in these classes are worth
waiting for.
Some of the highlights of the fair

include the Tractor Operator's con-
test, where the boys will show their
ability to maneuver tractors around
obstacles, and in belting and hitching
contests. All makes of tractors
will be available for the boys to use,
and will be on display for the public.
But the days' activities do not end

with the sun. With the help of the
Farm Bureau and the Senior Coun-
cil, events continue during the eve-
ning. The Farm Bureau Farm Queen
Contest will be held, as well as the
4-H girl Style Revue, and Senior
Council's open-to-the-public square
dancing.

All in all this year's Carroll County
4H Fair, July 22, 23, and 24, promises
to be a gala event. The public is cor-
dially invited to see not only what
Carroll County's 4-H boys and girls
own, but what they can do. So come
to the Fair.

MISSIONERS MEET

The Keysville Evangelical Lutheran
Missionary Society began its meeting
Tuesday evening by singing, "The
Church's One Foundation." The scrip-
ture lesson was read by Mrs. Melvin
Bostian and prayer was offered by
Dixon Yaste. Mrs. James Coshun ex-
plained the lesson "The Pacific Rim."
The first part of the program gave a
better understanding of the position
of Christianity in the lands around the
rim of the North Pacific Ocean. Those
taking part in this discussion were
Mrs. Robert Stine, Mrs. Vernon 8chaf-
fer and Mrs. James Unglesbee. The
second part consisted of prayer by the
entire group. Pastor Yaste read the
Japanese letter and made suggestions
as to helping missionaries we know.
Mrs. Coshun conducted the magazine
quizz. For the special number Mrs.
Carroll Dougherty and Mrs. Vernon
Schaffer sang, "When I Think of His
Love for Me."
The usual business meeting was

conducted by the president, Mrs.
Gregg Kiser. During this period the
Pastor Yaste was presented with a
Life Membership. Mrs. Roy Baum-
gardner, Mrs. Lloyd Wilhide and Mrs.
Ralph Shoemaker were on the social
committee and they served delicious
sandwiches, pickles and punch. The
members were sorry to hear of the ill-
ness of some of the missionary group
and hope for a speedy recovery. It
was nice to have Mrs. John Harner
and Mrs. Calvin Valentine back in
their usual places. Congratulations to
Mrs. Carroll Wilhide upon the arrival
of Louisa Mae Beth—just another
new missionary. Will be working for-
ward to seeing you in your usual
place in the near future.

FRIENDSHIP DAY JULY 12
CARLIN'S PARK, BALTO.

This is a day for all farm families
to attend and have an enjoyable time.
There will be prizes offered and in the
afternoon a pageant put on by Mr. Ar-
thur Hamilton of the University of
Maryland, showing farm exchange
students in national costume; also a
talent show.

CARD OF THANKS

We wish to express our sincere
thanks to our relatives, friends and
the members of the Trinity Mission
Circle who remembered us with flow-
ers, gifts and cards during our stay
in the hospital and since our return
home.

MRS. MARTIN ZIMMERMAN
and JEAN LOUISE.

CARD OF THANKS

I wish to express my appreciation
to all who remembered me with cards,
flowers and gifts and visited me while
a patient at Bon Secours Hospital,
Baltimore, Md.

MRS. CURTIS N. POWELL,
Thurmont, Md.

You will find poetry nowhere, unless
you bring sonic with you.—Joseph
Joubert.

NOMINATING SESSION
OF REPUBLICAN PARTY

This Week Spent in Selecting
Candidates

The Republican National Conven-
tion that is being held in Chicago op-
ened on July 7 with the usual fan-
fare.
On the evening of the first day the

keynote address was delivered by Gen-
eral Douglas MacArthur.
Tuesday evening former President

of the U. S., Herbert Hoover address-
ed the convention assemblage.

Wednesday evening a vote on the
seating of certain state delegates was
the order of business.
The nominations of candidates for

President were made Thursday eve-
ning. The first candidate for this of-
fice, Senator Robert Taft, of Ohio,
was placed in nomination by Sen.
Everett M. Dirksen, of Illinois. Gen.
Dwight Eisenhower's name was plac-
ed in nomination by Gov. Theodore R.
McKeldin, of Maryland. Gov. Earl
Warren, of California was nominated
by Senator William Knowland, of Cal-
ifornia. With four seconding speech-
es for each candidate named and the
customary exhibitions staged by the
candidates' supporters this night's
meeting lasted until toward morning.
Today (Friday) with a few more

nominations the conclave will go into
the balloting for candidates which
promises to be quite spirited.

TRINITY MISSION CIRCLE EN-
TERTAINS WOMEN'S MIS-

SIONARY SOCIETY

On Wednesday evening, July 9, tile
Trinity Mission Circle entertained the
Women's Missionary Society of Trini-
ty Lutheran church. The meeting was
to be held on the parsonage lawn but
due to the weather, it was held in the
church.
The program was in charge of Mrs.

Louise Riffle, Mrs. Mary Jane Smith
and Mrs. Charlotte Shorb. The topic
for the evening was 'The Pacific Rim"
which dealt with the conditions of the
countries in the Pacific as compared
to our North American countries.
The musical numbers included Miss

Mary Shriver playing two numbers
on the accordian and Miss Fairy Frock
a piano solo. Both were beautifully
presented and very much appreciated.
Mrs. Ernest Dunbar, President of the
Women's Missionary Society, gave a
very inspiring and interesting talk on
her trip to Mexico. Our last speaker
was Mrs. Carl Baumgardner, Littles-
town, Pa., who gave a very humorous
reading about Katrina visiting New
York. Everyone was in stitches listen-
ing to her and was thoroughly enjoy-
ed by everyone. After Mrs. Alma
Bair, President of Trinity Mission
Circle, extended greetings to our
guests, delicious refreshments of fruit
punch and cake were served.

Trinity Mission Circle feels that
the evening was a successful one and
we again look forward to entertaining
the Women's Missionary Society next
year.

CLASS REUNION

The Class of 1932 of Taneytown
High school held their Twentieth An-
niversary dinner on June 28, at the
Charles Carroll Hotel, Westminster,
Md. The following attended: Rev.
and Mrs. Robert Benner, Pine Grove,
Pa.; Mr. and Mrs. Wade Brown, Lit-
tlestown, Pa.; 'Mr. and Mrs. Jay
Brown, Baltimore, Md.; Mr. and Mrs.
Kenneth Davidson, Taneytown, Md.;
Mr. and Mrs. Ellsworth Feeser, Tan-
eytown, Md.; Mrs. and Mrs. Walter
Hahn, Taneytown, Md.; Mr. and Mrs.
George Henze, Sykesville, Md.; Mr.
and Mrs. Vernon Keefer, Westminster,
Md.; Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Scheme],
Baltimore, Md.; Dr. and Mrs. Edwin
Zimmerman, Glen Burnie, Md.

MARRIAGE LICENSES

Clyde L. Bortner and Ruth M.
Bricker, Glen Rock, Pa. No. 2.
John C. Warehime and Shirley Mae

Miller, Westminster, Md.
Merle E. Ragean and Lydia A. By-

ers, Lansing, Mich.
Clarence E. Nelson and Patricia

Ann Kyler, Grantham, Pa.
Richard I. Deeds and Esther E. Mc-

Near, West Lawn, Pa.
Kenneth Elwood Wilson and Lavon-

ne E. Masemore, Taneytown, Md.
Earl C. Costley and Mamie Ruth

Richards, Sykesville, Md.
Kern J. McPeak and Romaine J.

Boden, Greencastle, Pa.
LeRoy Russell Elmo and Martha

Hill, Hampstead, Md.
Charles M. Rippeon and Emma Jane

Chipley, Mt. Airy, Md.
Hubert Tom McDaniel, Jr. and Vir-

ginia Mae Smith, Westminster, Md.
Charles A. Weaver, Jr. and Phyllis

Jean Spahr, East Berlin, Pa.
Kenneth P. Shingara and Ruth Eli-

zabeth Pursell, Sunbury, Pa.
Charles E. Bankert and Janet ler

Wagaman, East Berlin, Pa.
0 -

CARD OF THANKS

I wish to express my sincere thanks
to all my friends in Taneytown who
remembered me with flowers, gifts
and cards, during my stay in the hos-
pital and since my return home.

(Mrs.) OLIVE M. MARTIN.

CARD OF THANKS

I wish to thank my friends for the
cards, flowers, fruit, visits, etc., that
I received during my recent illness. I
especially am grateful for the prayers
of my pastor.

MRS. CALVIN VALENTINE.

THIS 'N' THAT
(Your Chatty Column)

With all my heart, I wish you every
morning

A smile that shall last until the next
day's dawning.

I wish you h?alth—life's greatest
wealthl

I wish you always near so that I may
help to cheer

Each future day and in some way—
help to bring you happiness!

"It's a Family Affair"! When one
reads about those nice homey affairs
of the family reunions annually, it is
even much nicer than it reads. Your
Observer was a guest at the "WEBB"
reunion at Fawn Grove two weeks ago
and that reunion will always linger in
my memory as one of the most pleas-
ant of experiences. No one could even
tell me that "BLOOD DON'T TELL"!
which I have always known all down
through the years. And such 'GOBS' of
food upon thise tables! As I look
ed at that food somehow my thoughts
were of those starving people in for-
eign countries! Then I thought of our
wonderful county—these grand Unit-
ed States and all our many, many
blessings!
Now, truly I was 'floored' in hear-

ing of that fourth arrival around the
town! A little Cherub of a girl. Best
wishes and much happiness!

If you still have missed, "SINGIN
IN THE RAIN" do try and manage
to see it no matter if the drive is a
long one. You will enjoy every min-
ute of it and as for that one dance of
Gene Kelly's—with the umbrella in
the pouring rain—well—it was worth
double the price of the show. You
will sit there spellbound! Another one
you must not miss is "LOVELY TO
LOOK AT"! There are many laughs
and the combination is a full course
dinner of story, gaiety and pictorial-
ness that is bound to satisfy the appe-
tite of the most exacting fan. It is
truly a rival attraction in the Great
Fashion spectacle of "An American in
Paris."
Have you seen Mr. Smith's Chair?

Really it is Mr. Dallas Smith a young
police officer from Indiana who invent-
ed such an economical piece of furni-
ture which seems to be going every
place. Here is the story of its origi-
nality. Mr. Smith was invited to a par-
ty where there were more guests than
chairs so Mr. Smith sat himself down
on a fiberboard crate. It was strong
and he wondered why furniture could'
n't be made of the same material. He
then began to experiment and after a
period of designing, he turned out
an arm chair. Since then these chairs
have received national recognition..
They are so reasonably priced and
meets the purse very nicely of Mr_
and Mrs. Newly Wed. They are around
the price of 20 dollars or a little more.
These chairs can support just one ton
of weight and yet it only weighs 16
pounds! They can be purchased in the
armless chair and by placing two of
them together, they make a grand
"Love Seat". There are coil spring
cushions with rnbberized hair filling:
They truly are just TOPS for 1952 and
a complete line is shown down at the
May Company where this Columnist
observed them.

It just "IS'NT. IN THE RED" any
more as far as finger nails are concern-
ed. The lightest shad of pink or "Sheer
Natural" is just the very smartest.
Here is to the Young couple! When

you build your house and along with
it the garage, be sure and make it
large enough so as it can answer for a
"Play Room when Daddy is off to his
work with the car all day. On rainy
days, the Sun will shine for you,
Mother as the small fry can then play
there for hours until nap time. The
kiddies can even ride the bikes in that
room, too and it can be made most at-
tractively.

Here's a new wrinkle! And all caus-
ed by a snake! Your Observer was
awaiting a package in the Conowingo
Railway Station and while sitting
waiting for the hour for the station
to be opened, was talking to a man
from Indiana who was recently sent
East as Supervisor. There was trouble
up in the switch which was turned off
due to a snake crawling up there and
which was immediately electrocuted
consequently causing the power to be
shut off at this point!
And here is one strictly for the

housewife although men may find it
Of great value if they are on their
feet most of the day. One can be plac-
ed before the sink and yet another any
place in the kitchen where you stand.
"Step on me and you get years of

comfort.
.1 am not a two way stretch but

since I am made of sponge, do
not pull me.

I like an occasional bath in a warm
water detergent. But strong
soaps hurt me"!

This is called, "A Fatigue Rubber
Rug!" and is manufactured by the
Fremont Rubber Company, Fremont,
Ohio. If you can't locate one around
the town write your favorite depart-
ment store. After standing all day,
you will erase those hurty feet. You
will wonder how you ever really lived.
without one! They come in all colors
to harmonize with your room. The
beautiful canary colored one was pur-
chased two weeks ago in Hanover.
Around the town stores of any town
should handle this comfort of Mrs.
Housewife.
So long, Folks. Have a grand week

end always remember, "Whatever
weakens your reason, impairs the
tenderness of your conscience, ob-
scures your sense of God or takes off
the relish of spiritual things. Until
next week D.V. I am,

Faithfully,

YOUR OBSERVER.

The national debt has increased
from just under $17,000,000,000 in
1931 to more than $260,000,000,000--
a rise of more than 1,500 per cent in
21 years.

•
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ARMSTRONG COUNTY IS UNIQUE

Few people have ever hard of
Armstrong County, South Dakota. It's
a tiny speck on the map, with a popu-
lation of 53 people.
However, it is a rather significant

speck. For, according to the Con-
gressional Joint Committee on Reduc-
tion of Nonessential Federal Expen-
ditures, it is the only county left in
this whole huge country which hasn't
a Federal civilian employe working
within its borders.
At present, there are some 2,500,000

of these Federal civilian employees
and 90 percent of them are stationed
outside the Washington area. Their
salaries came to $8,500,000,000 last
year. And their number keeps right
on growing.
This is one of the reasons why, if

you happen to be a married man earn-
ing $5,000 a year, which is certainly
no fortune in these days, you have to
work 34 days to pay your Federal in-
come taxes alone. And if you have a
good $10,000 a year job you work 43
days for the government.

Every Federal department head
wants to put more and more people
on the payroll—because that's one

way to get promotions for himself,

and to gain more political prestige and
power. You, of course, pay for the

waste and the duplication of effort.
About time for a housecleaning,

isn't it ?—Industrial News Review.

GRASS ROOTS OPINION

OSKALOOSA, IOWA,
HERALD: "The court's
opinion is equally explicit

DAILY
majority
on the

legal procedure that is at hand. It
says that Congress not only 'can au-
thorize the taking of private prop-
erty for public use' but 'it can make
laws regulating the relationship be-
tween employees and employers, pre-
scribing rules to settle labor dis;
putes and fixing wages and working
conditions in certain fields of our
economy'. All this as the duty of
Congress—not the executive."
MANSFIELD, OHIO, NEWS-

JOURNAL: "Whatever other ceil-
ings may be established by govern-
ment, there is no appearance of seri-
ous effort to find a , stopping place
for taxes. While chief complaint
has to do with Federal income taxes
it is being gradually disclosed that it
is really the so-called 'hidden taxes'
that are taking the biggest bite out
of take-home pay. According to the
Tax Foundation, an organization
that watches government spending
and taxing, those 'hidden taxes' run
to considerably more than double the
amount of income taxes."
PHILADELPHIA, PA., TRADES

UNION NEWS: "Inflation cheapens
our dollar and drastically cuts our
savings, whether in banks, life in-
surance policies, or in pensions. As
our voluntary savings shrink the de-
mend for larger government control
and protection swells. Few want a
planned economy with its elimina-
tion of the market place and sound
competition, but in general, the pub-
lic fails to realize how damaging and
revolutionary a constantly increas-
ing inflation can be."
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS,SOUTH-

ERN MESSENGER: "....Americans
built a strong, productive country be-
cause they were free to utilize those
resources under a private-enterprise
system that was not hamstrung by bu-
reaucratic restrictions on energy and
ambition."
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GROW your PULLETS
FOR EARLY EGGS

LONG PRODUCTION

....With

PURINA
CHICK GROWENA

The New Purina Growena Checker-Etts with Purina's exclusive

Formula 1028 providing the growth vitamins, B 12 and anti-

biotic feed supplements is the best growing feed we have ever

tested. Pullet development is rapid and uniform, bodies are
heavy at laying time and production, (the payoff), is high and
steady after pullets start to lay.

" POORLY GROWN
Not Ready to Lay .

PURINA GROWN

As an example of the difference Purina can make, we point to
a test run a few years ago. Purina-fed pullets were 11/2 lbs.
heavier per bird at 20 weeks than their sisters raised on a poor
growing ration. Purina-fed pullets averaged 21 eggs per bird
more in the fall and early winter when egg prices were highest.
START ....GROW....LAY... PAY....feed Purina All the
Way! See us soon! 5-23-tf

Taneytown Grain & Supply Co.
Taneytown, Md.

Nationally Known Hardware That
Can't Be Beat GEO. M. ZERFING

FOR SALE
!OJ OR RENT DUPONT sae

for better plant growth
in clay-type soils

• Apply Du Pont Soil Conditioner to worked-up soil for flower
beds, vegetable gardens, borders and for building new lawns;
Simply dissolve in water and sprinkle on the prepared soil
with a watering can:

Treated soil retains a loose and crumbly
surface even after heavy rains. Soil absorbs
water and holds it to help seeds come up
better. Makes plants grow faster.

FREEZER SUPPLIES, BOXES, BAGS AND TAPES

AMERICA'S FAVORITE

BARN "AINT

SAVE YOUR PROPERTY!
Good looks are only half the story
when you paint your barns, sheds
and silos with Sherwin-Williams
Commonwealth Barn Red. This
bright, true-toned red has a tough,
extremely durable film that can
"take it" from any kind of
weather. It will give your build-
ings the complete protection they
need year after year. 5-gallon can
will save you money!

t your SHERWIN •WILLIAMS
PAINT HEADQUARTERS

GEO.
GETTYSBURG

1 Gallon

and

5 Gallon

Containers

M.

GALVANIZED

GARBAGE PAILS

AND CANS

4 Gal. to

30 Gal.

SPRAYERS and
DUSTERS

Spraying and

Dusting

Materials for

Vegetables and

Flowers

"HARDWARE ON THE SQUARE"

LITTLES TOWN
••••••

TANEYTOWN

Teeter
CRUSHED STONE

GETTYSBURG, PA.

Excavating, Road Work, Landscaping, Ditches, Macadam Drive-

ways, Parking Lots, Lanes, Grading, Crushed Stone for a purposes,

all sizes, Grormd for fill, ton soil for Landscaping, Modern Equip-

ment Rental inciuding Bulldozers, Shovels, Rollers, Cranes, Trucks,

Back. Hoe, Graders, Scrapers, Tractors, Track Cranes, Dozer Shov-

els.

ESTIMATES GIVEN WITHOUT OBLIGATION PHONE 696

If it's Tough Construction or Crushed Stone, Call Teeter

.'"qT0t024,20tor,02010.0:020.1otorotototclot*S40:0:039 040. :0:040 tO.clOtOtO 0. totc10:0:44020:0:‹1,,

STITCHERS WANTED
Experience Not Necessary

Apply

THE CAMBRIDGE RUBBER Co.
PERSONNEL OFFICE

MIE4003181E•38898180:4616101318108031E031

2-22-2t
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LAWN FETE
GRACE REFORMED C. E. SOCIETY, Taneytown, Md.

SATURDAY, JULY 19, 1952

BAKED HAM SUPPER, beginning at 4 o'clock
FAMILY STYLE

Adults, $1.00 Children, 50c

Concert by Westminster Band and local talent.

Sandwiches, soft drinks, ice cream, cake, candy, novelty table,
fish pond for the children.

JOHN S. TEETER and SONS I cake

 

MENU: Baked Ham, apple sauce, string beans, potato salad, Har-

vard beets, pepper slaw, relish dish, bread, butter, coffee, ice tea.
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REPORT OF CONDITION
- OF THE -

First National Bank
of Taneytown, in the State of Mary.

land, at the close of business,
on June 30, 1952

published in response to call made by
Comptroller of the Currency, under
Section 5211, U. S. Revised Statutes

assETS.
Cash, balances with other banks,
including reserve balance, and
cash items in process of col-
lection $304,194.14

United States Government obli-
gations, direct and guaran-
teed    871.264.40

Obligations of States and po-
litical subdivisions   90,000.00

Other bonds, notes and deben-
tures   188,849.00

Corporate stocks (Including
$3,000. stock of Federal Re-
serve bank)   3,000.00

Loans and discounts (includ-
ing $58.04 over(lrafts)  558,2:11.1.5

Bank premises owned $3,300.00
furniture and fixtures $3,300.00 6,600.00

-a--.
TOTAL ASSETS  $2,028,198.69

LIABILITIES.
Demand deposits of individuals,

partnerships, and corpora-
tions   506,925.51

Time deposits of individuals,
partnerships, and corpora-
tions     1,336,264.11

Deposits of United States Gov-
ernment (including postal sav-
ings)   5,925.41

Deposits of States and po-
litical subdivisions   48,419.49

Other Deposits (Certified and
cashier's checks, etc)  5,270.14
TOTAL DKPOS/ITIS. $1,902,801.66

TOTAL LIABILITIES  $1,902,804.66
CAPITAL ACCOUNTS.

Capital Stock:
(a) Class A preferred, total par
$None, retirable value $Nil

(b) Class B preferred, total par
$None, retirable value $Nil

(c) Common stock, total
par  $50,000.00 $50,000.00

Surplus   50,000.00
Undivided profits   22,394.03
Reserves (and retirement account

for preferred stock)  3,000.00

TOTAL CAPITAL ACCOUNTS 125,394.03

TOTAL LIABILITIES- AND
CAPITAL ACCOUNTS ..$2,028,198.69

MEMO`RANDA.
Assets pledged or assigned to

secure liabilities and for
otheA• purposes   82,000.00

State of Maryland, County of Carroll, se:
I, Clyde L. Hessor., Cashier, of the

above-named bank, do solemnly swear that
the above statement is true to the best of
my knowledge and belief.

CLYDE L. SESSON, Cashier.
Correct Attest

EDWARD E. STULLER,
NORMAN R. HESS,
NORMAN It. SAUBLE,

Directors.
Sworn to and subscribed before me this8th day of July, 1952.

PEARL L. BOLLINGER, Notary Public.

REPORT OF CONDITION
--,-oF - -

The Detour Bank,
of Detour, in the State of Maryland,

at the close of business
on June 30, 1952

ASSETS.
1. Cash, balances with other
banks, including reserve bal-
ances, and cash items in process
of collection  $115,145.912. United States Government
obligations, direct and guaran-
teed    200,851.584. Other bonds, dotes and de-
bentures    145,391.076. Loans and discounts (includ-
ing $18.86 overdrafts)  188,818.517. Bank premises owned $4,100.00
furniture and fixtures $375.00.. 4,475.00

12. TOTAL ASSETS  $063,682.07
LIABILITIES.

13. Demand deposits of individ-
uals, partnerships and corpora-
tions   246,903.2914. Time deposits of individuals.
partnerships, and corporations 340,917.2815. Deposits of United States
Government including
postal savings)   106.7316. Deposits of States and po-
litical subdivisions   5,000.0018. Other deposits (certified and
officers' checks. otc)  856.1219. TOTAL DEPOSITS 8593,,783.42

24. TOTAL LIABILITIES (not
including subordinated obli-
gations shown below) $593,783.42

CAPITAL ACCOUNTS 
25. Capital*   25,000.0026. ,Surplus   37,000.0027. Undivided profits   7,898.05

29. TOTAL CAPITAL AC-
COUNTS   69,898.05

30. TOTAL LIABILITIES AND
CAPITAL ACCOUNTS ....$663,683.07*This Bank's capitill consists of:

Common stock with total
par value of $25,000.00

MEMORANDa.
31. Assets pledged or assigned

to secure liabilities and for
other purposes  6,000.00

I, Mary Ellen Catlin, Cashier of theabove-named bank, do solemnly swear thatthe above statement is true, and that itfully and correctly represents the truestate of the several trotters herein con-tained and set forth, to the best of myknowledge and belief.

Correct Attest:
MARY ELLEN CATLIN, (Cashier.)

J. D. ADAMS,
E. F. KEILHOLTZ,
JOI1N WOOD,

Directors.
State of Maryland, County of Carroll as•
Sworn to and subscribed before me Me9th day of July, 1952, and I herebycertify that I am not an officer or directorof this bank.
MAE E. FRANKLIN, Notary Public.

My commission expires May 4, 1953.

PERCY M. BURKE
For all Your

INSURANCE Needs

231 E. Ma.;11 St.,

WESTMINSTER, MD.
Phone 1120

"Insure with Confidence"

to:0:4,)2q4,V.4,401.0totob).tototototo

Summer Office Hours:
(until Sept. 1st)

FRIDAYS
2 P. M. to 8 P. M.

Or. Hubert E. Slocum
Optometrist

Eye Examinations
19 East Main Street

Emmitsburg, Maryland
7-4-9t

July Clearance Sale! 
This is the SALE that you have been waiting for. Stocks must be reduced at

once. Every item on this list has been reduced from 10 to 30% BELOW normal selling
price. These prices in effect for 2 weeks only, July 11th to 26th. Come in NOW and
stock up at these "Money Saving" prices.

$1.19 Bottle of
1000

SACCHARIN TABLETS
% grain for diabetics

79c 

59e Bottle of
RUBBING ALCOHOL
(70%) Pint Size

43c

$6.50 Imperial

FLASH CAMERA

with flash attachment

$4.95

75c size Phillip's
MILK OF MAGNESIA
1 pint-10 oz. size

59c

60c Mennen's Skin Bracer
and tube of Mennen's

SHAVE CREAM
both for
59c

$1.00 reg. size

Tussy
PERMASTICK

The lip stick that stays on.

59c

$1.50 Tussy
FRAGRANCE

TRIO
3 bottles of asst. fragrance
Eaude Cologne in gift pkg.

$1.25
39c Insecticide
SPRAYERS

35c

49c Sureshot Insecticide
Spray or Bedbug
DESTROYER. Pint

39c

$1. 25

ABSORBINE JR.
4-oz• .98 -

35c Bottle of 100
SODA MINT TABLETS

5 Grain
25c

89c Heavy MINERAL OIL
Drugmaster Brand.

69c Quart

35c MOTH BALLS, pound
25c

25c West Point
AFTER SHAVE TALC

19c

30c Mistol NOSE DROPS
23c

50c Size Woodbury's
AFTER SHAVE LOTION

51/2 Ounces
35c

$1.29 PLASTIC SET
of Dishes for children

$1.09

39c Carter's

ASPIRIN
TABLETS
5 Grain, 100 for

29c

• 85c Size Doan's
KIDNEY PILLS

69c

19c Hoody Doody
CHARACTERS,
choice of 3 designs

15c each;
2 for 29c

KLEENEX
TISSUES

200's 3 for .47

300's 3 for .69

16-oz. Size $2.00

Houbigant's
Cheramy

SKIN BALM
price - $1.00

$1.49 Fountain Syringe

$1.19

39c Hobson's Baby
TEETHING LOTION

33c

Isoprophyl
Rubbing

ALCOHOL
full pint

23c

29c Box of
WRITING PAPER and

ENVELOPES

23c

75c Pen-O-Rub

LINIMENT. 49c

69c West Point

BAY RUM 8-oz 49c

50c size Woodbury's
Cocoanut Oil

CASTILE SHAMPOO
35c

39c Nyal Pile OINTMENT

27c

98c PLASTIC TRAIN SETS

for children

83c

75c size Fletcher's
CASTORIA

5 oz. Family Size
59c

$1.00
ALCOFLEUR
(Scented Alcohol)

for after bath.

pt. 69c

50c Phillip's Milk Magnesia
TOOTH PASTE
2 Tubes for

63c

25c Dewitt's Nasal
CREAM or

Catarrh CREAM
Choice 19c

$1.00 Size

Tussy Deodorant
CREAM
(Limited quantity.

price 50c

$1.00 Tussy
ICED COLOGNE

STICK
Choice of 3 fragrances

59c

75c Manzan Pile
OINTMENT

59c

50c Dr. Lyon's
TOOTH POWDER

41/2 oz. 39c

82.00 Tussy

Eau de Cologne
choice of 3 fragrances.

8-oz. Size

$1.00
Half Price

25c Bottle of Dex
NOSE DROPS

(for colds and hay fever)
19c

50c Gallotan OINTMENT
for Sunburn 33c

$1.00 Danderine
HAIR TONIC

(No. Fed. Tax) 79c

$1.00 Lavoris
MOUTH WASH

79c

25c EPSON SATS
full pound

19c

TAN EYTOWN9004
CNAS. H. HOPKINS Pw. G., PROP.

TAN EYTOWN, MARYLAND
OPIN EVERY 4//6Afr EXCEPT 7-#0?5. cf,5UM - 10 P M. DAILY • SAT *TIC II PO.

Medford Grocery Co.
STORE HOURS EVERY WEEK-DAY 8 to 6

PHONES: New Windsor 4881
Westminster 549J

Medford
Fresh
Ground

COFFEE
65c

II pound
Why Pay 80c

American
Granulated 11

SUGAR
$9.00
hundred I
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CORRESPONDENCE
Latest Items of Local News Furnished
By Our Regular Staff of Writers
We esire correspondence to reach our

office on Thursday, if at all possible, it
Titin be necessary therefore, for most let-
ters to be mailed on Wednesday morning.
....'..etters mailed on Thursday may not reach
vs in time.

FEESERSBU KG

Maryland public school system lost
one of its most distinguished members
and the public school students lost a
sincere and interested counsellor when
death unexpectedly claimed Dr. R. F.
Cromwell, state supervisor of high
schools July 4 at his home in Balti-
more. Dr. Cromwell was a pioneer in
the field of educational guidance. In
his address, several years ago to the
graduating class of the Elmer Wolfe
school he suggested that schools
should accommodate themselves to the
need of the less able as well as the
average and the gifted child. He be-
lieved in the youth of the state and
was always happy and willing to help
girls and boys work out an education-
al plan to fit them for their particu-
lar career. It was this personal inter-
est in their problems that made him
the best-loved among Maryland edu-
cators. Dr. Cromwell was born in
Walkersville and graduated from
Western Maryland College in 1922.
Years of teaching and school admin-
istrative work followed before he ob-
tained his doctorate in education from
George Washington University in
1940.
The Democratic party has always

had the reputation for doing it's po-
litical fighting before the eyes of the
public while the Republicans, if they
fought at all, did it in the wood shed,
out of sight. This week, at their Na-
tional Convention they reversed them-
selves and on Monday staged one of
the bitterest political fights in the his-
tory of the party. To the Democrats
it must* have been a very encourag-
ing spectacle, while to the independent
voter it must have been an amazing
one. It certainly convinced everyone
that there is some fight in the old ele-
phant yet and maybe when the fur
ceases to fly there will emerge a new
elephant who has learned to forget a
lot that should have been forgotten
years ago.
Cucumbers this year are worth their

weight in green backs or almost.
They have been selling as high as 15
dollars a bushel in Salisbury, but are
now averaging 9 dollars per bushel.
Wicomico county is Maryland's lead-
ing cucumber producer and one of the
top six in the nation. At the normal
price of $2.50 farmers realize very
little profit since it costs about $1.50
to pick, harvest and package a bush-
el of cucumbers and this does not in-
clude the cost of planting.

If you find a "tussock moth" or a
caterpillar, light in color with black
stripes, capering across your porch or
lawn, get in touch with the county
agent for this little pest is a menace
to the poplar tree. The Japanese bee-
tle is also still with us, though in re-
duced numbers. They must have in-
cisors as sharp as razors, the way
they saw off the leaves of a tree.
They must never sleep but eat 24
hours a day by the way they consume
the foliage of a chinese elm in a short
period of time.
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Blankenship have

sold their farm and will move to Ari-
zona in the late summer. It is with re.
gret that we learn they are leaving oui
community for they have been fine
neighbors and talented individuals—
an asset to any community.

Mrs. Lester Staples and three chil-
dren of Radford, Va., have been visit-
ing her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ben
King for the past week.

If what's good enough for your
father is good enough for you, he's
probably wealthy.—Franklin P. Jones.

It is mosquito time again and it
might help to know that when a mos-
quito alights on your skin he or rath-
er she starts drilling instead of biting.
In two seconds, the mosquito can stab
through the skin with four slender,
rapier-like mandibles. She then injects
a flexible, pointed tube called a fasci-
cle. To increase bleeding and deter
coagulation she squirts in an irritant
saliva. That leaves only the actual
injeetion of the blood, which may
take a full minute if the diver is not
disturbed. The residual irritant is
believed to cause the itching and swell-
ing. It may interest you to know
that again the female is more deadly
than the male for it is only the female
mosquito that does the drilling and
she doesn't do it for revenge. Instinct
tells the expectant mother that only
a meal of blood will enable her to lay
a brood of healthy eggs. To the person
that is being bitten a mosquito is a
mosquito but actually there are 1400
species. DDT was quite effective on
mosquitos when first used, but like the
fly, the new generation of mosquitos
have built up an immunity to this once
powerful exterminator. All this infor-
mation is no help at all when one is
trying to sleep and the hum of the
mosquitos wings, make one duck be-
tween the sheets trying to evade the
sneak attack. There is only one con-
solation. You may be the type of
person the mosquito may not care to
drill. Your skin may be too tough or
some other reason of which the ex-
perts are not certain. It is like try-
to determine why one person takes
poison ivy and another one doesn't.
The Ben Kings gave a picnic supper

Sunday evening for their week-end
visitors that included Mr. and Mrs.
J. A. Rosenbaum and son and grand-
son, of Jonesville, Va., Mr. and Mrs
Aubrey King, of Mt. Airy; Mr. and
Mrs. Fred Rosenbaum, of Westminstei
and Mrs. Lester Staples and children,
of Radford, Va.
On Sunday evening the Cleor

Wolfes entertained at supper Mr. and
Mrs. Samul Summers and sons, Billy
and Buddy, of Keymar, and on Tues-
day evening Rev. and Mrs. Donald
Warrenfeltz and three children.

Mrs. Maurice Grinder continues tc
improve slowly from her recent ill-
ness. She is able to walk' about thc
house for short periods.
John Starr was severely burned by

gasoline last week and is confined tc
his home.

Listening to the speeches from the
Republican convention one was im-
pressed with one glaring fact. Every
speaker dwelled on the past. Not one
looked to the future. The speakers
seemed not to realize that this is 1952
and not the age of Lincoln's day. It
was as if they wanted to forget that
this is the age of jet airplanes, of in-
creased population, of new problems,
of world brotherhood and new meth-
ods. Just as Lincoln was far ahead
of his party in 1860, the Republican
leaders are just as far behind theirs
in 1952.
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UNIONTOWN

Mr. and Mrs. Myle Seibert and
daughter, Doris, spent Sunday eve-
ning in the Burall home.
Leon Fritz, of Taneytown, and

Miss Louise Boone are visiting with
Mr. and Mrs. Carroll Boone, also they
are attending Daily Vacation Bible
School at Uniontown school.
Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Caylor and Mr.

and Mrs. John R. Corbin, son Gregory
were Sunday guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Raymond Kaetzel, Boonsboro.
The Uniontown Community Bible

School will mark its concluding pro-
gram with a public service in the
Methodist Church, Sunday evening, at
7:45 P. M. Parents and firends are
cordially invited to these exercises.
The school has been very successful in
every way.

Mrs. Floyd Devilbiss returned
home from the Maryland General Hos-
pital, Friday. Visitors of Mrs. Devil-
biss were: Mr. and Mrs. Norman
Wantz, of Woodsboro; Mr. and Mrs.
Ralph Weant, Mrs. Bertha Shaner,
Thomas Snyder and Carl Ebaugh, of
Frizellburg; Mrs. Annie Caylor, and
Mr. and Mrs. C. Levine Zepp, Union-
town; Mr. and Mrs. Bayard Arnold,
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Arnold, Miss El-
sie Lee Arnold, all of Gamber; Mrs.
Frances Kipe, son Thomas, of Ridge-
ville; Mr. and Mrs. Luther Hahn and
family, and Mrs. Janet Hahn, all of
Emmitsburg, and Mr. and Mrs. John
Arnold, of Gamber.

FRIZELLBURG

The Aid Society of Baust Reformed
met Tuesday evening in the Parish
House. The worship service was led
by Mrs. Denton Wantz. The secre-
tary's report was given by Mrs. Her-
man Arrington. The treasurer Mrs.
Allen Morelock also reported. Birth-
days recognized were Mrs. Evelyn
Boose, Mrs. May DeGroft, and Mrs.
Denton Wentz. Cards of thanks were
read from Richard Cole and Mrs. Rus-
sell Bloom. Further plans were made
for the church picnic which will be
held August 16th. A fried chicken
supper will be served. The following
committees were appointed: Advertis-
ing, Mrs. Allen Morelock, and Mrs. M.
S. Reifsnyder; Cakes and Soft drinks,
the Young People's Sunday School
class; Sandwiches, the Young Adult
Class; Ice cream, Mr. William De-
Groft; Fishpond, the Intermediate
Class; Fancy Table, Mrs. Sadie Form-
Halt and Miss Bessie Yingling; Re-
'Tresmments were served by Miss Ying-
ing, Miss Wantz, Mrs. Arrington and
Mrs. Noah Warehime.
Regular services in Baust Reformed

Parish House will be: Church School,
A 9:30; Morning Worship, at 10:30.
Rev. Miles Reifsnyder, pastor.
Services in Baust Lutheran church:

3unday School, at 9:45; Worship at
1.1. Donald Warrenfeltz, pastor.
Sunday School at the Church of God

at 10 a. m. Mr. Howard Carr, super-
intendent.
Mr. and Mrs. Armstead Mason and

laughter, Lillian, returned home af-
,er a sight-seeing trip through the
Jew England States and Canada. They
iisited Niagara Falls and other places
A interest.

Visitors in the Mason home on Sun-
lay were: Mr. and Mrs. Charles Mark,
VIr. and Mrs. Stelle Batchelor, of Bal-
.imore; Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Stone-
;ifer and son, Darold, of Taneytown;
11r. and Mrs. Emerson Brown and
'amily, this place.

Thirty-four members and friends
Atended the Never Weary Class meet-
ng of Baust Lutheran Sunday School
A the home of Mr. and Mrs. Harold
ihorb, Baltimore St., Hanover, Pa.,
)n Tuesday evening, July 1st. Mrs.
Tharlotte Shorb Was the leader for
he lesson on "Praise." Various
iymns were used and their stories
vere told iby Audrey Myers, Viola
-lull, Isabelle Warehime, Edw. Haif-
ey, Kenneth Lambert and Rev. Don-
ild Warrenfeltz. The business meet-
ng was conducted by the president,
Nalter Myers, Jr., at which time
ilans were made for the summer ac-
ivities. The next regular monthly
fleeting will be held in September at
he home of Mr. and Mrs. David
Starner in Westminster.
Miss Waneta Senft is getting along

iicely after a recent tonsillotomy.
Mr. Rodney Haines and Mr. John

lyle have improved their properties
vith a coat of paint. Mr. Edward Dut-
era our 82 year old painter did the
vork.
Mrs. Hilda Strumsky is ill at the

iome of her sister, Mrs. Gladys Grif-
in.
Mr. and Mrs. Levine Null, Sgt. Carl

7,ole and Virginia Myers went fishing
it Middle River on Tuesday. Their
'etch was perch, cat and eels. Carl is,
;pending a ten day leave from Ft.
VIcNair, Washington, D. C., with
'riends at this place and Frostburg.
The Frizellburg Homemakers will

iold their picnic at the Taneytown
3,ecreation Park, Wednesday, July 16,
it 6:30. Each family will bring their
nvn place setting meal and a dish
,c) pass.
Mrs. Mazie Sullivan returned home

in Tuesday evening after spending
he past week with her daughter and
;on-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Earnest
Tones, Baltimore, Rev. and Mrs. Jas.
'Iobb and daughter, Darla, of near
Dittsburgh, visited with Mr. and Mrs.
fohn Berwager and family, on Wed-
-iesday.
Mr. Walter Myers who has been

iursing a sore foot for the past eight
veeks shows improvement.
Visitors at the Myers home during

,he week were: Mrs. Janet Smith and
laughter, Mary, of Taneytown; Sgt.
arl Cole and Virginia Myers, Wash-
ngton, D. C.; Mr. and Mrs. Clarence
Vlyers, Mr. and Mrs. Otto Myers, Mrs.
dward Geiman and son, Dale, of this

-dace; Mr. and Mrs. Paul Buhrman,
gr. and Mrs. Chester Lenhart, of Uti-
•a; Rev. Donald Warrenfeltz, Union-
Sown; Mr. William Flohr, Westmin-

st,r, anc. "..Inhe. Zimmerman,
Taneytown.
Stewart Young arrived in Paris,

France, on Saturday.
A traveler one night found himself

obliged to remain in a small town on
account of a landslide on the railway,
caused by heavy rain which was still
falling in torrents. The traveler
turned to the waitress with: "This
certainly looks like the flood." "The
what?" "The flood. You've read about
the flood, and the ark landing on
Mount Ararat, surely". "Mister", she
returned, "I haven't seen a paper for
three days."—Cooper's Weekly.

BARNEY

Services in St. Paul's Lutheran
July 13, at 10 a. m., Communion Ser-
vices in charge of Rev. Held. Sunday
School, at 9 a. m. Elmer Shildt, Supt.
Walter Fissel, Asst. Monthly council
meeting Friday eve.
On Tuesday afternoon five of the

Emmitsburg ladies spent a few hours
in our village calling on their cousins.
May call them 42nd, Mrs. Bruce (Shoe-
maker) Patterson and daughter, Mrs.
Peppier and Miss Anna Gillelan at M.
Ruth Snider and Mrs. Gertrude Kump
and sister, Laura (Martin) Shoemak-
er at Rev. Thurlow W. Null and wife.
These ladies also called on Mrs.
Melvin Overholtzer.
Mr. and Mrs. McDonald and daugh-

ter, of Westminster, visited Sunday
evening with Mr. and Mrs. Walter
Kump.

Mrs. Margaret Orner had as callers
Saturday evening: Mr. and Mrs.
Brook Hess and son, Richard and
wife, and son and a soldier
friend of Richard who has been in the
service of the U. S. A. for several
years.
Mrs. Maurice D. Eckenrode and chil-

dren, Patricia Ann, Robert Wayne and
Larry David, spent 4th and 5th of
July in Gettysburg, Pa., visiting rela-
tives and friends.

Mrs. Elmer LeGore was a caller of
M. Ruth Snider, Saturday eve.
Mr. and Mrs. Chas. Smith, daugh-

er, Taneytown, were dinner guests
the eve of the 4th of Mr. and Mrs.
Raymond Reynolds and sons, Terry
and Randy.
Mr. and Mrs. Luther Fox entertain-

ed to dinner in their home Thursday.
Mr. Guy Sterner, Gettysburg; Mr. and
Mrs. Emory Sterner and Mrs. Ira
Fhol and daughter, Aspers, Pa.
Mr. and Mrs. H. J. Wolff had as

callers this week Mr. Guy Sterner and
father, Emory Sterner and Mr. and
Mrs. Edgar Fink and Mrs. Sallie Ey-
ler.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer LeGore had as
supper guests July 4th: Mr. Edward
Bish, of Boyerstown, and Mr. and
Mrs. Kenneth Myers, Hanover. Mr.
Bish was also an overnight guest of
his brother-in-law and sister-in-law,
Mr. and Mrs. LeGore.
Miss Mildred Vaughn, of Millers,

Md., spent the week-end with Wm.
Vaughn, wife and daughters.
Mr. Harry McCans and Edith had

as dinner guests Wednesday eve: Mr.
and Mrs. Paul Bunty and daughter,
Syndia, Littlestown, and Mr. and Mrs.
Phillip Mummert, Littlestown R. D. 2,
Mr. and Mrs. Harry Angell and Ruth
Snider, Harney, Md.
Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Orner and son,

Larry Joseph and daughter, Beverly
Ann, of Gettysburg, were callers of
Mrs. Margaret Orner, Sunday eve.
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Weikert and

two daughters, of Littlestown, Pa. R.
D., were Sunday evening supper
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Luther Fox.
Chas. Snider, Gettysburg R. D. 5,

and his daughter, Mrs. Johnson and
son, of Philadelphia, Pa., were visitors
Saturday of Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Snider.
Mr. Snider who had been ill is able to
weld around through the house and on
the porch.
Mr. and Mrs. Sari Johnson, of Mid-

dleburg, Md., and Mrs. Mary Snyder,
of Baltimore, were visitors on Satur-
day of Mr. and Mrs. Norman Selby
and Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Kiser and
family.

Miss Mary Janet Bower is visiting
her grandmother and aunt in Potts-
ville, Pa.
The Aid Society of the U. B. church

of this village held their monthly
meeting in the home of Mr. and Mrs.
Harry Angell and Vaughn Peck, on
Tuesday eve.

Services in the U. B. church Sunday
evening at 7:30. Rev. Arthur W. Gar-
vin, pastor. Go hear him.
Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Claybaugh and

Mr. and Mrs. Russell Claybaugh and
son, Eugene, are visiting with their
brother, Reginald, wife and family, in
Illinois.
Mr. and Mrs. Norman Welty and

daughter, Judy, have as their house
guest, Miss Sherman, of Middleburg,
Md.
Mrs. Melvin Overholtzer and chil-

dren and grandchildren, planned a
surprise birthday party on last Tues-
day eve, for Mr. Melvin Overholtzer,
Sr. A pleasant evening was had by
all with refreshments of home-made
ice cream, cake, etc. The group left
wishing Mr. Overholtzer many more
happy birthdays.
Mrs. Margaret Haines and daugh-

ter, Mary had as visitors Sunday. Mr.
and Mrs. Howard Smith and family
and Morris Haines and through the
week Mrs. Stewart Green, Mrs. Ira E.
Dorsey.

Miss Patsy Snyder spent from Wed-
nesday till Saturday eve, with her
grandma Haines and aunt, Mary.

Mrs. Lake Ridinger and daughter,
and Miss Hazel Haines were callers
Monday evening in this home.
Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Valentine had

a busy we9k of the 4th visiting their
cousin Mr. and Mrs. Virgel Sunger, of
Waynesboro, Pa., on Tuesday and
Wednesday. On Thursday they spent
in Frederick with their daughter and
son-in-law. Mr. and Mrs. Stockton
Rouzie. 4th and 5th in Gettysburg
with her father, Geo. Aulthouse and
sister, Mrs. Esther Ridinger and wit-
nessed the parade and also visited
their aunt and uncle Mr. and Mrs. Lit-
tle in Taneytown Saturday evening.
Mr. Johnson, Mrs. Nettie Sherman

and daughters, Middleburg, Md., vis-
ited Wednesday evening with Mr.
ind Mrs. No:nian Welty and daugh-
:er, Judy.
Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Valentine and

laughter, Hazel and son Gary return-
home Tuesday from a 9-day trip

;pent in Illinois with Mrs. Valentine's
uncle, Harry Anders and family.
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Koontz and

family moved on Wednesday to their
iew home in Kingsdale, purchased re-
.:ently from Malcom Shadle.

COMM UNITY LOCALS
Wontinued from First Page)

Mrs. Edward Stuller is a patient at
the Maryland University Hospital,
Baltimore.

2nd Lt. U. S. A. R. Donald M. Smith,
reported to Fort Benning, Ga., July 9,
for active duty.

Mrs. George Martell spent several I
days with Mr. and Mrs. Robert Fisher
in Baltimore.

--
Miss Janet Royer left yesterday to

spend several days with her friend,
Miss Grace Brockley, of Hatboro, Pa.

Mrs. Arthur Adams and Mrs. John
Lentz, both of Frederick, spent Mon-
day with Mrs. Cora Weant Duttera.

The Circus is in town today (Fri-
day) afternoon and evening. The one
day stand is on the Firemen's Carnival
grounds.

The Hill reunion was held at the
Taneytown Recreation Park, July 4th,
with an attendance of about 70. The
oldest was Mrs. Edward Williams, of_
Gettysburg, Pa., and the youngest was
Jo Ann Harris, of Baltimore, Md.

Mr. and Mrs. Truman Bowers, Mr.
C. G. Bowers and sisters, Mrs. Retta
Cutsail, of Taneytown, and Mrs. Edw.
Harner and Mrs. Harry Cutsail, of
Littlestown enjoyed a 3-day trip trav-
eling through Pennsylvania and New
York States this week going as far as
Niagara Falls and Lake Erie. They
stopped to see the Rev. Chas. Owen
family at Cohocton, N. Y., former
pastor of the Taneytown Presbyter-
ian church, also Rev. Eugene Stam-
baugh at Urwin, Pa., who is supply-
ing churches there. A distance of
800 miles was covered. •

MARRIED

,WARNER — CURRENS
The wedding of Miss June E. Cur-

rens, daughter of Louisa Currens, 46
Crouse Park, Littlestown, Pa., and
William E. Warner, son of Mr. and
Mrs. Edward Warner, Taneytown, Md,
took place June 28, at 2 o'clock in the
E. U. B. church. The pastor Rev. A.
W. Garvin performed the double ring
ceremony. • The bride wore a street
length dress of white organdy over
white faille and carried a colonial bou-
quet of red rosebuds. Her maid of
honor Miss Betty Eyler, cousin of the
bridegroom was attired in a white
organdy, pink faille and carried mix-
ed flowers in her colonial bouquet.
Richard F. Warner served as bestman
for his brother.

After the ceremony the bridal party
and close friends and relatives were
entertained at a reception at the home
of the bride's mother. A three-tier
wedding cake with a miniature bride
and groom was the center of the
bride's table.
Mr. and Mrs. Warner are housekeep-

ing at 116 Cemetery St., Littiestown,
Pa. Mrs. Warner is employed at the
Sylvia Garments, Inc. Mr. Warner was
recently discharged from the Army
after 4 years of service with the 82nd.
Airborn Division, Fort Bragg. The
groom is now working for Black &
Decker.

SHARRER — GOOD
Miss Doris C. Good, daughter of

Mr. and Mrs. Harry J. Good, R. D. 2,
Littlestown, Pa., and Kenneth W.
Sharrer, son of Mr. and Mrs. D. L.
Sharrer, R. D. 1, Keymar, Md., were
united in marriage on Saturday, June
28, in Mt. Tabor Union church, at 2:00
p. m. The pastor, Rev. Dixon Yaste,
performed the double ring ceremony.
The bride was attired in a white

street length dress with matching ac-
cessories and a red rosebud corsage.
Miss Myrtle A. Good, sister of the
bride was maid of honor and wore a
blue street length dress with a white
rosebud corsage. The groom had as
his hestman, Wesley Ambrose, R. D.
1, Taneytown, Md., Mrs. Sharrer is a
graduate of Littlestown High school
and formerly employed by the Littles-
town Hardware & Foundry Co., Inc.,
Littlestown, Pa. The groom is em-
ployed by his father on the farm. Af-
ter a trip to Atlantic City the couple
will reside at Keysville, Md.

DIED

MRS. CLARENCE E. HARVER
Mrs. Sadie Ann Harver, 72, Taney-

town, wife of the late Clarence E.
Harver, died Wednesday evening at
the Long View Nursing Home, Man-
chester, where she was a patient for
the past year and a half. Before en-
tering the nursing home, Mrs. Harver
who was a daughter of the late Israel
and Catherine Utz, resided for 45
years near Taneytown. Her husband
died twelve years ago.

Survivors are five children, Mrs.
•David Beaver, Westminster, Ralph E.
Harver, near Taneytown; Mrs. Eu-
gene F. Smith, Hanover, and W. Ro-
land Harver and Mrs. Samuel Clingan,
Taneytown; nine grandchildren, three
great-grandchildren and a brother and
three sisters, Daniel Utz and Mrs.
John Gable, Westminster, and Mrs.
Mary Collier and Mrs. James Marsh,
Arlington, Va. Mrs. Harver was a
member of the Piney Creek Presbyter-
ian Church and Sunday School, near
Taneytown.
Funeral services will be conducted

at 2 p. m., Saturday at the C. 0. Fuss
and Son Funeral Home, Taneytown,
by the Rev. Thurlow W. Null. Burial
will be in the Piney Creek Presbyter-
ian cemetery. Friends may call from
7 to 9 p. m. this (Friday) at the fu-
neral home.

NORMAN B. WILLIS
Norman Blaine Willis, 67, near Mt.

Union, husband, of Mrs. Elsie Willis,
died at his residence early. Thursday
morning after several weeks' illness.
Mr. Willis, a son of the late Mr. and
Mrs. Thomas Willis, was a member of
the Bark Hill Methodist church and
St. Matthew's Lodge 62, K. of P.

Surviving besides his wife are two
sons, Carroll and Ira, both of Norris-
town, Pa., and a brother and sister,
John and Carrie Willis, Frederick.

Funeral services will be held Satur-
day at 1:30 p. m. at the Raymond K.
Wright Funeral Home, Union Bridge, I
followed by further services in the
Bark Hill church. The Rev. E. B.
Wilkins will officiate. Interment will be .
in Mt. Joy cemtery. Friends may call

(Continued on fifth page)

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Hilbert and Mr.
and Mrs. Albert Clutz, spent Wednes-
day at Atlantic City, N. J.

Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Bollinger have
announced the birth of a son, Dennis
Allen, on Monday 7th.

--
Mrs. Austin Rice, Harrisburg, Pa.,

spent Tuesday afternoon at the home
of Mr. and Mrs. George Harner.

Major Gen. Upton Birnie, Green
Stone Inn, Blue Ridge Summit, Pa.,
was a guest Monday of the Misses An-
nan.

Mrs. Marie Wagerman and son, are
spending some time with her parents,
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Fream, of near
town.

Paul H. Sell,
service and left
Meade where he
orders.

Jr., was called into
July 2nd for Camp
will receive further

Mrs. Marie Wagerman and son,
Laverne, spent one day with Miss
Katherine Weybright, near Harney.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Wantz and son
Douglas, visited July 1st to 7th with
Mrs. Wantz's uncle and aunt, Mr. and
Mrs. John L. Martin.

The 11th annual reunion of the
Reindollar family will be held July
13, at Pipe Creek Park. Picnic lunch
family style at noon.

Mrs. Nannie Lamb and grandson,
Johnnie Gobrecht, Hanover, spent last
Wednesday at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Carroll C. Hess.

Miss Ruth Jean Ohler entered the
Frederick Memorial Hospital, on Mon-
day, was operated on and returned
home Wednesday. She is doing nice-
ly.

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Hesson and
Miss Mary Fringer spent last Friday
in Frederick as guests of Mrs. Charles
Lippy and daughter, Miss Grace Lip-
py.

Mrs. Charles Hahn, Misses Grace,
Catherine, Marian and Betty Jane
Hahn, spent Wednesday in Baltimore
with Mrs. Hahn's son, Elmer Hahn
and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Mervin Feeser and
Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Champion, Han-
over, left last Saturday morning for
Cleveland, Ohio, to see Mrs. Feeser's
brother, Mr. Clyde Harner and family.

J. H. Ommert's truck was destroyed
by fire last Saturday afternoon. The
blaze occurred near the Littlestown-
Taneytown road. The Taneytown Fire '
Company was called but was unable
to save the machine.

Mrs. Mabel Thornton, Philadelphia,
and her son-in-law and daughter, Mr.
and Mrs. John Hoskins, Hyattsville,
spent July 4th with their cousin, Mrs.
Nan Dutterer, at the Hanover Gener-
al Hospital.

On Thursday evening Mrs. Harry
Dougherty, Mrs. Carel Frock and Mrs.
Harry Mohney entertained the mem-
bers and families of the Quantum
Libet Needlework Guild to a picnic
supper at the Dougherty cottage along
the Monocacy. A picnic menu of fried
chicken, ham, potato chips, vegeta-
ble salad, macaroni salad, pickles,
olives, rolls, ice tea, rootbeer, water-
melon, cake and ice cream were serv-
ed to Mr. and Mrs. Harry Mohney and
nieces Donna Kaye and Margie Wheat-
ley, Mr. and Mrs. Wilbur Naylor and
daughter, Arlene; Mr. and Mrs. Nor-
man Sauble, Mr. and Mrs. Wilbert
Hess, Mr. and Mrs. Merle Ohler, Mr.
and Mrs. Chas. Rohrbaugh and daugh-
ters, Rhoda and Dorothy; Mr. and
Mrs. Ralph Hess, Mr. and Mrs. Loy
Hess and daughter, Myra; Mr. and
Mrs. Paul Robertson, Mr. and Mrs.
Harry Dougherty, Mr. and Mrs. Carel
Frock, daughter Fairy, and Rev. and
Mrs. Edward Welker and children,
Sandra, Ronnie and Judith.

Mrs. Della Bauser, of York, Pa., vis-
ited from Tuesday until Sunday with
Mr. and Mrs. David Sraith and family.

Peter Westine, Robert CI ngan, Jr.,
and David Bair, spent last week at
Camp Nawakwa, near Arlentsville,
Pa.

Misses Marian and Esther Vaughn,
spent a week's vacation with the
former's brother and family, in Cedar-
ville, Ohio.

Mr. and Mrs. Harper J. Watkeys,
Millersburg, Pa., spent the Fourth of
July holidays with Mr. and Mrs. Ken-
neth Shorb and family.

Mrs. Treva Myers, of Lancaster, Pa,
is spending from Tuesday until Sun-
day at the home of her sister, Mrs.
Percy Bollinger and family.

Mrs. Nan Dutterer, who has been a
patitInt in the Hanover General Hos-
pital since March 18th., had a bone
broken in her right leg, on Wednesday.
On two occasions, weeks before, the
bones in her left leg broken.

---
Mr. and Mrs. Otto Jaeger, of Plain-

field, New Jersey and Mr. and Mrs.
Norman Diller, of Elizabeth, New Jer-
sey are spending a ten day vacation
at the home of Mr. and Mrs. John
Vaughn, near town.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Phillips and
daughter, Cherrie, spent a few days
at Virginia Beach, Va. Mrs. Elma
Shoemaker accompanied them to
Falls Church, Va., where she visited
her sister, Mrs. Randall Myers and
family.

Miss Sandra Baker, granddaughter
of Mr. and Mrs. John Vaughn, is
spending a month's vacation in Ohio
with her uncle and aunt, Mr. and Mrs.
Carroll Vaughn and son Dennis. And
she will accompany them home on
their vacation the middle of August.

Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Neill and
family, of New Caanan, Conn., spent
from Thursday until Monday at the
home of his parents, Mr. and Mrs.
William Neill and family. Mrs. Naill's
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Frank Eldridge,
of Washington, D. C., were guests
there Sunday.

Sgt. Richert B. Ashenfelter, son of
Mrs. Preston Smith, arrived Tuesday
night and is home on a 30-day fur-
lough. Sgt. Ashenfelter has been in
Korea for 11 months. About 6 months
ago he was in combat duty and re-
ceived an injury to his left knee. He
is now 0. K.

S/Sgt. John C. Lambert is spending
a 30-day furldugh at the home of his
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Lambert.
Sgt. Lambert has been 14 months
in Germany, He sailed from Wies-
baden, Germany, on June 30th., and
arrived in New York, Tuesday, July
8th, on the U. S. N. S. General Wm.
0. Darby.

Miss Mary Martell had as her guest
Miss Pauline Gow from Thursday un-
til Sunday evening at the her home
with her mother, Mrs. George Martell.
Miss Martell and Miss Gow live at the
Lutheran Hospice, Baltimore. Miss
Gow is a Chinese girl who has just
graduated from a College in N. Caro-
line, and is now studying music at
Peabody Conservatory of Music.

Mr. and Mrs. Luther Luckenbaugh,
daughter, Jean and Misses Grace and
Marian Hahn, returned home last Fri-
day after visiting Mr. and Mrs. Leon-
ard Warvel and other relatives in
Greenville, Ohio, and Mr. and Mrs.
William R. Geisbert and son Ronald,
at Eaton, Ohio. Other dinner guests
of the Geisbert's at the same time
were Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Esminger
and Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Biddinger,
of Hanover, Pa. After sight-seeing in
Ann Harbor and Detroit, Michigan,
they returned home by Niagara Falls,
Canada, and Watkins Glen, New
York.

"Maryland's Greatest BLUE RIBBON Event.

"FRIENDSHIP DAY"
FREE PRIZES!

FREE ADMISSION! *
FREE SHOWS!

SATURDAY, JULY 12th

CARLIN'S PARK+
IN BALTIMORE

State-wide! For Farm and Home. 1st annual
celebration. Full day and night of spectacular
exhibits and entertainment. Pageant of Nations,
Folk Music, Dancing, Costumes, U. N: Flag
Exhibit. Picnicking, Rides, Swimming and
Games.

REMEMBER THE DATE! SAT., JULY 12

FREE
BADGES!
Ask any County
Agricultural or
Home Demon•
stratIon Agent
or at Park.

GRAND
PRIZES!
Farm Feeds Reg.

Calf Fertilize,

100 other Prises

IT WASHES! IT DRIES!
Amazing Now Quickly and Easily
you'll make windows sparkle! i/

DOUBLE ACTION
MAGiC WINDOW CLEANER
A wonderful work saver!

Sturdy, simple to usel Yours

for just 25e and the end of

a Sylvania 4-Pack mailed to

Sylvania Electric Products

Inc., Dept. --, 87 Union

St, Salem, Mass.

and rile end of a
Sylvania 4-Pa..k

TAN   EY T OWNAvexari,
CHAS H HOPKINS P. G PROP 

TAN EYTOWN, M ARY LAN D
°PIN FIERY A1/67/1" D'acP7- r,vags. i RA/ - 10 PM. DAILY • SAT •ri pAit
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SPECIAL NOTICES 
THIS COLt MN is specially for 

Wants,

Lost, Found, short Announce
ments. Per-

sonal Property for sale, etc.

CASH IN ADVANCE paymen
ts are de-

aired in all cases.
REAL ESTATE for sale, Two Cents

each word. Minimum charge, 
50 Cents.

SMALL ADVERTISEMENTS 
will be in-

everted under this heading at
 One Cent a

'word each week, counting n
ame and ad-

dress of advertiser-two in
itials or a date.

.conned as one word. Minimum charge,

SE, (Tots.

STOCK BULLS and Cows, loaned

to reliable farmers.-Harold S.

3lehring. 7-15-tf

CHURCH LAWN FESTIVAL to be

lield at Keysville Reformed Church 
on

lawn Saturday evening, August 2nd
.

Music will be furnished by the Yello
w

Springs Concert Band from 8:30 to

11:30. Refreshments of all kinds fo
r

sale. Everyone cordially invited to at
-

-tend. 6-27-7-11 & 25-8-1

DON'T SUFFER with poison Ivy

-Get Dr. Elliott's Poison Ivy Lotion 
at

The Taneytown Pharmacy.

FOR SALE-Second-hand Hot Air

Furnace.-Mrs. Samuel Ott.

THE TANEYTOWN PHARMACY

is open every night except Thursda
y

and Sunday for your shopping con
-

-venience. 7-11-3t

RE-ELECTED-Week after week

farsighted people elect Center Meat

_Market to buy those delicious Steaks,

.and Roasts from those choice steers.

Cast your vote too.

FOR SALE--1926 Nash, cheap.-

Apply Kermit Reid, Phone Taneytown

4845. 7-11-tf

GET YOUR SWIMMING NEEDS

at The Taneytown Pharmacy; Bathing

'Caps, Swimming Rings, Sun Glasses,

Suntan Lotion and Oils, Ear plugs,

Beach Balls, Bathing Bags, Noxzema,

etc. 7-11-3t

THE TANEYTOWN PHARMACY

is headquarters for Photo Supplies,

Fresh Films, Cameras, Flash Bulbs,

etc. Bring your films to us for ex-

pert developing 'and printing.
7-11-3t

WANTED-Cafeteria Manager for

"Taneytown High School. Contact-

-John Manspeaker, Phone Westmin-

ster 129-J. 7-11-tf

ELECTRIC WASHERS reduced.

New Barton Washers, high grade, reg-

ular price, $139.95, now specially

priced at only $99.95, A fine bargain.

-Reindollar Bros. & Co. 7-11-tf

FOR SALE-Fresh Cow, second
,calf.-Harry J. Crouse.

PUBLIC SALE, August 2, 1952 of

Household Goods, Livestock and Farm
Implements.-Mrs. Walter Brower.

QUICK MEAL, 5-burner Kerosene
Range, new, was $65.00, now only
$45.50.-Reindollar Bros. & Co. 7-11-tf

NOTICE-Will receive grain for
sale, storage or government loan.-
Howard County Farmers Cooperative,
Ellicott City ,Md.

PERFECTION' OIL RANGE, 5-
burner, new, was $79.50, now for a
short time, only $69.50. Also 3-burner
Boss Stove, was $29.95, now only
$19.95.-Reindollar Bros. & Co. 7-11-tf

NOTICE-Taneytown Bakery will
not reopen tomorrow July 12, but will
open the middle of next week.

BE PREPARED-For the unex-
pected. Let us insure you adequate
ly.-Percy M. Burke, 231 E. Main St,
Westminster. Md. Tele. 1120. 4-15-tf

LADY to keep two children in home
-while mother works.-Mrs. Richard
Ohler, 5 Shriner Apt., Telephone
4013. 7-4-2t

LAWN FETE-Sponsored by the
Grace Reformed Christian Endeavor
Society of Taneytown, Md., Satur-
day evening. July 19. Baked Ham
Supper served family style beginning
at 4 o'cock. Adults, $1.00. Children,
50 cents. See large ad for menu.

7-4-3t

DITCHING DYNAMITE and an
experienced man to do the work.-
Medford Grocery Company, Inc., Med-

-ford, Md. 3-16-tf

IF YOU LIKE a clean town, do
your part, have your garbage and
trash collected regularly.-Walter B.

Benchoff, Garbage Collector, P. 0.
Taneytown 11-14-tf

ANNOUNCING EXCLUSIVE dis-
tributors of Smith Glass lined Water
Heaters, Haverly Barn Cleaners, cop-
per lined Milk Coolers, stainless steel
Freezers, Hudson Barn Equipment.
Dealer accounts welcomed. Up to hun-
q-ireds of Stanchions, etc., in stock. Lib-
eral cash discount in retail store.-
-John D .Roop & Sons, Linwood.

10-13-52-52t

FOR SALE-Several Gas Stoves,
in fine condition, priced to sell.-See
S. E. Remsburg at Potomac Edison
'Company. 4-25-tf

FESTIVAL will be held by Keys-
-vine Lutheran Sunday School on the
•zhurch lawn, Saturday night, July 19.
Music by Yellow Springs Band. In case
.of rain Festival will be held Monday
might, July 21st. 6-13-6t

PENN-MD. BASEBALL LEAGUE

GAMES

SUNDAY, JULY 13th

Harney at Fairfield.
Sabillasville at Middleburg.
Emmitsburg at New Windsor.

AMER. LEGION JR. BASEBALL

SATURDAY, JULY 12

Hagerstown at Taneytown
Brunswick at Thurmont
Bye-Frederick
Boonsboro at Clear Spring

WEDNESDAY, JULY 16

Bye-Taneytown
Boonsboro at Hagerstown
Clear Spring at Brunswick
Thurmont at Frederick

SATURDAY, JULY 19

Taneytown at Boonsboro
Bye-Hagerstown
Frederick at Brunswick
'Thurmont at Clear Spring.

CHURCH NOTICES

Walnut Grove Dunkard Brethren
Church at Kump s-Sunday School, at
9:30 A. M.; Preaching, 10:S0 A. M.-
Birnie Shriner, Minister.

St. Joseph's Church, Frederick St.,
Rev. Charles J. Walker, Pastor. Sun-

day Masses; 8 o'clock (High) 10:15
Low Mass. Week Day Masses, 6:30
o'clock, except Saturdays, 7:30. Con-
fessions; Saturdays, 4 to 5-7 to 8;
Sundays Holy Days and first Fri-
days before the Masses. First Fri-
days; Mass at 6:30 and Benediction.
Holy Days, Mauses at 6 and 8 o'clock.
Baptisms on Sunday, at 11:30
o'clock.

Trinity Lutheran Church, Taney-

town. Rev. Glenn L. Stahl, Pastor.
-9:30 A. M., Sunday School; 10:30
A. M., Worship. All services on Day-
light Saving Time.

Union Bridge Lutheran Parish. St.
James-Sunday School, 9:30 a. m.; no
Worship Service.

Keysville church-Worship Service,
9:30 a. m.; Sunday School, 10:30 a. m.

Mt. Tabor Church-Sunday School,
10 a. m.; Worship, 11 a. m. Rev. Dix-
on Yaste, pastor.

St. Paul's Lutheran Church, Har-
ney-9:00 A. M., Sunday School; 10 a.
m., Holy Communion Service.
Mt. Joy Lutheran Church.-No Ser-

vice. Chas. E. Held, Pastor.

Uniontown Lutheran Parish. Don-
ald Warrenfeltz, Pastor. St. Paul's-
Worship, 9:30 a. m.; Sunday School,
10:30 a. m.
Baust-Sunday School, 9:45 a. m.;

Worship, 11 a. m.
Mt. Union-Sunday School, 9:30 a.

m.
St. Luke-Sunday SchOol, 10 a. m.;

Worship, 11 a. m.

Piney Creek Church of The Breth-
ren. Rev. M. A. Jacobs, Pastor. All
day Rally. 9:30 a. m., Sunday School;
10:30 a. M., Worship Service. Sermon
"Our Citizenship." Noon: Basket
lunch in basement, each family bring-
ing their own lunch. 2:30 p. m., the
Prodigal Son in song: featuring solos,
trios, quartets and group singing. 5:00
p. m., Refreshments. 7:30 p. m., Song
Service. Sermon by Elder J. M.
Baugher, York, Pa.

Church of God. Uniontown Circuit.
Rev. John H. Hoch. Pastor. Union-
town-Sunday School, g:30 A. M.
Mr. Herbert Ecker, Supt. Preaching
Service, 10:30 a. m. Theme: 'The

BARBER SHOP OPEN DAILY.
Monday through Friday, 12:30 p. m. to
9 p. m.; Saturday, 8 a. m. to 9:30 p.
m. Special Ladies hair cut any style.
Men and children hair cut reasonable
prices, at Melvin Sell's Store, Taney-
town-Littlestown Road-J. Sally.

7-6-tf

BABY CHICKS.-New Hampshire
und Rock Hamp. cross, each week.
All state blood tested.-Stonesifer's
llstchery, Keymar, Phone Taneytown
4931. 7-2-tf

FOR SALE-New and used Type-
writers and Adding Machines, Rib-
bons and Carbon Paper. Also Ma-
chines for rent.-Charles L. Stone-
sifer, Representative of Remington
Rand, Inc. 5-9-tf

LADIES-Do you want healthy
luxurious Potted Plants for the win-

ter? Use B. C. A. (Bacterial Com-
post Activator) a plant culture teem-

ing with Soil Bacteria. 50c per lb.

will take care of all of your indoor

flowers, all winter. Many other us-

es. Come in and ask about :t.-The

Reindollar Company, Phone Taney-

town 3303. 12-141

FOR SALE-Bread Route.-For in-
formation call at 27 George Street,
Taneytown.

PAPER HANGING and all other

jobs of interior decnratirg including

Plaster Repairs. Call Ralph David-

son for a look at latest Wall Paper

Starples.-Taneytown 4792.
11- -7-tf

CHICKS! CHICKS! CHICKS!-We
are able to supply you with Hall
Brothers Pollorum Clean Hatchery
Chicks and Maryland Chick Hatchery
Good Chicks from Well Breeders. G,et
our prices for successful and profit-
able Layers and meat-producing
Birds.-Taneytown Grain & Supply
Co. 2-15-tf

WE ARE TAKING orders for
Spring Fertilizer "BAUGH'S, The Old
Standby For 0-,-er 100 Years." "MA-
THIESON'S Made To Make Good";
"MILLER'S All Crop". Have your
Fertilizer when you need it. Order
now.-The Reindollar Company, Tan-
eytown. Phone 3303. 3-7-tf

SEVERAL USED Electric Refrig-
erators for sale at very low prices.-

C. 0. Fuss & Son. 6-27-tf

THRESHING AND BALING, call
L. J. Dennis, Taneytown 3585.

6-20-12t

GOOD USED CARS wanted. High-

est Prices Paid.-Crouse's Motor

Sales. 2-25-tf

NOTICE-Dial 3483 for your Sand,

Stone, Blocks and General Hauling.-
Thurston Putman. 7-21-tf

SALESMEN'S Order Books are
4upplied by The Record from the man-

ifacturers, at standard prices. About

,ix weeks are required for filling such

arders.

FRYERS-Any size from 2 to 5
lbs. alive, or we will dress on order.
Frozen Fryers on hand at all times.
Also fresh eggs. Will deliver in town.
-Ted Jester, Phone Taneytown 4633.

1-18-52

LAWN MOWERS sharpened with
Electro-Keen, Circular Saws gummed
and sharpened. Mower and binder
knives sharpened.; Hand Saws filed
and re-toothed, Planer Blades, Chis-
els, Axes and Hand Shears sharpened.
and Band Saws sharpened. New and
Used Lawn Mowers for sale. Will
pick up and deliver. Phone 3598.-

Paul Blanchard, Starner's Dam,
5-2-12t

THE NEW BRASS DOG TAGS,
are now here. Get them at Mid-town

Electric Store, Taneytown Rod & Gun

Club. 6-20-6t

Conquering Life.' Prayer Meeting on
Wednesday evening, 8 p. m. Combined
chorus rehearsal this Friday evening,
July 18, at Uniontown, at 8 p. m.

Wakefield-Preaching Service, 9 a.
m.; Sunday School, 10:15 a. m. Mr.
Charles Hahn, Supt. Prayer Meeting
and Bible Study, Thursday evening, 8
p. m.
Frizellburg-Sunday School, 10 a.

M. Mr. Howard Carr, Supt.
Mayberry-Sunday S zhool, 11:15 a.

m. Mr. WilLam Lwer, Supt. Bible
Study on Tuesday evening, at 8 p. m.

Jehovah's Witnesses-Sunday, Bible
Study, 10 a. m. 'Get out of Here, My
People." also Fixing Destinies in this
Judgment Period. Meetings also Tues-
day, 8 p. m. and Thursday, 7:30 p. m.
E. Baltimore St., Taneytown, Md.

Presbyterian Church-The Rev. J.
Franklin Weaver will supply. Piney
Creek-9:30 a. m., Holy Communion
Service; 10:30 S. C. S.
Emmitsburg 10 a. m., S. C. S.;

Holy Communion Service, 11 a. m.
Taneytown-S. C. S., 10 a. m.; Wor-

ship Service, 7:30 p. m.

Taneytown Evangelical United
Brethren Charge. Rev. A. W. Garvin,
Pastor. Taneytown-S. S. 9:30 a. m.;
Holy Communion Service, 10:30 a. m.;
Sr. C. E., 6:30 p. m.; Bible Study and
Prayer Service, Wednesday, 8 p. m.;
Thursday, Youth Choir outing.
Barts-S. S., 9:30 a. m.
Harney-Holy Communion Service,

7:30 p. m.

Grace Evangelical & Reformed
Church Charge, Rev. Morgan Andreas
Minister, Keysville-9 a. m., The
Lord's Day Worship with the young
people's choir singing. 10 a. m., Sunday
Church School classes meet.
Taneytown-r-9:15 a. m., Sunday

Church School classes meet. 10:30 a.
m., the Lord's Day Worship; 6:30 p.
m., C. E. members meet at the church
for an outside doggie roast meeting in
charge of Edward Reid. Members are
to bring their Bibles for a bible study
program. Monday the children's pic-
nic will be held at Pipe Creek Park.
The cars will leave the church at 1:00
p. m. Thursday evening the Graceful
Workers Class will hold its picnic.
Saturday the annual lawn festival
will be held.

TANEYTOWN DEFEATS MIDDLE-
BURG, 8-6

Junior Dougherty, making his first
start for the Whiz Kids, since the be-
ginning of the season, pitched 2-hit
ball till the fourth when Eckard re-
placed him. Eckard, then giving up

4-hits was relieved by Clingan who
won the ball game.
Louie Crapster's homer in the second

inning put Taneytown ahead one to
nothing to take their early lead as
usual.

Middleburg was ahead, 6 to 5 by the
end of the seventh, but Taneytown
then started their rally. Crapster, who
walked, was then sacrificed to second
by Joe Arnold's bunt. Nusbaum then
singled, driving in Crapster to tie the
scores. But Donnie Baker's. tremend-
ous 3-bagger drove Nusbaum in to put

the town ahead 7-6. Baker then scored
on an error by their catcher.

Middleburg
Smith, If
Ohler, ss
Quesenberry, cf
Alexander, lb
Cheeks, 3b
Sprague, p
Wetzel, c
Michaels, 2b
Blankenship, rf

Total
Taneytown
Myers, 3b
Arnold, G., as
Clingan, E., 2b
Wildasin, lb
Crapster, lf
Arnold, J., cf
Nusbaum, rf
Baker, c
Dougherty, p
Banks, 2b
Eckard, p
Clingan, K., p

Ab R H PO A E

5 0 2 0 0 0
4 0 1 2 2 0
3 0 0 3 0 0

, 4 1 1 7 0 0
5 1 1 1 2 0
1 4 0 0 12 1
4 0 1 10 0 1
3 1 1 1 0 0
4 1 1 0 0 0

33 6 8 24 16 2
Ab R H PO A E
4 0
40
1 0
40
33
1 1
4 1
42
1 0
1 0
0 1
2 0

1 6 2
1 0 1
0 1 0
0 6 0
2 3 1
0 0 0
1 0 0
1 11 2
0 1 13
0 0 0
0 0 0
1 0 0

1
1

Total 29 8 7 27 19 4
Middleburg 0 0 0 0 0 4 2 0 0-6

Taneytown 0 1 0 2 1 0 1 3 x-8
GEORGE B. ARNOLD, Scorer

- - -- -
(Continued from 4th Page)

at the funeral home between 7 and 9

p. m. this (Friday) evening.

ARCHIE B. EYLER

Archie B. Eyler, 72, former Carroll

county resident, died Wednesday eve-

ning at his residence, 2641 Pennsyl-

vania Ave., Baltimore, where he mov-

ed two weeks ago. Previously he re-

sided near Middleburg and had con-

ducted a contracting business in the

area for many years. Mr. Eyler was

a son of the late Mr. and Mrs. Wash-

ington Eyler. He is survived by his

second wife, Georgia; two sons by an

earlier marriage to Mrs. Alice Delphy

Eyler, Arthur W. and Donald W. Ey-

ler, Baltimore, and two sons by the

second union, Harry and Thomas Ey-

ler, also of Baltinwe. The Rev.

Ernest Colwell will officiate at funeral

services Saturday morning at 10 a.
m., at the C. 0. Fuss and Son Funer-

al Home, Taneytown. Interment will

be in Mt. Zion (Haugh's) cemetery, of
near Ladiesburg. Friends may call
between 7 and 9 p. m. this (Friday)
at the funeral home.

CARD OF THANKS

We wish to express our appreciation
of the kindness shown us, and our
thanks for the many cards and the
floral tributes received, after the sud-

den death of husband and father, Wal-

ter C. Brower.
THE FAMILY.

'AEI=
CARD OF THANKS

We desire to extend our thanks to

neighbors and friends for the cards

and other expressions of sympathy in

our hour of bereavement.

MR. and MRS. E. C. CRUM

and son, CARROLL.

The total of all Federal expendi-

tures for fiscal 1952 has been esti-
mated at $70,881,000,000-more than
$457 for every man, woman and child
in the United States.

ANNUAL STATEMENT
OF THE

Corporation of Taneytown, Md.
FOR THE YEAR ENDED

JUNE 30, 1952

Balance on hand.July 1, 1951 $1042.91

Receipts for year  52,228,53

Total $53,271.44

Expenses for the year  36,991.13

Bal. on hand July 1, 1952 16,280.31

RECEIPTS:

Water Rent   8,141.25

Taxes 1950   252.40

Taxes 1951   26,334.41

Gas Tax   2,634.80

Franchise Tax   179.89

Admission Tax   239.18
Income Tax   1,641.16

Road Tax 1950  1,606.25
Road Tax 1951  1,877.98

Auto Fees   1,237.00

Share of Racing Money  1,505.62
Int. on Delinquent Taxes  6.96
Parking Meter Fines  574.96
Traders Licenses   1,924.87
Government Loan   3,250.00
Witholding Tax Collected  218.80
Share Alcohol Licenses   51.00
Share Banks and Trusts  547.00
Damage to Sign  5.00

Total Receipts $52,228.53

EXPENSES:
Mayor's Salary   250.00
Clerk's Salary   720.00
Councilmen's Salary 465.00
Janitor's Salary   120.00
Policeman's Salary   3,218.50
Elmer Creb's Salary  1,440.00
Meter Reader's Salary  136.00
Donations   255.00
Interest Expense ,   81.96
Election Expense   59.55
Electricity. ..Pumping Sta.. 2,926.50

Street Lights   2,643.53
Municipal Bldg   46.94
Stop Light   104.02

Maintenance and Repairs-
Pumping Station  339.43

Water System   3,161.88
Streets & Alleys   5,745.15

Labor   274.31

Fuel   239.34
Telephone  

. 
81.12

Stationary and Printing.. 472.77
Chlorine   29.85
Insurance   566.02
Gutter   13.50
Street Sweeper   400.00
Withholding Tax Paid  280.20
Postage  •   36.64
Freight   22.55
Travel Expense   47.82
United Brethren Lot  12.00
Use of Wilt Alley   5.00
Reindollar Co. Right of Way 1.00
Anna Hoffman   20.00
Water Meters  . 2,437.98
Md. Municipal League.... 66.00
Survey   40.00
Parking Meter Refund  3.00
Water Rent Refund   1.28
Box Rent   1.20
Notes Payable   5,000.00
Tax Refund   34.20
Notary Fees   5.50
Notary Seal   7.95
Uniform Expense   33.08
New Pump   1,531.44
Walter Benschoff   52.00
Engineers Fees   3,250.00
Meter Repairs 190.33
Attorney's Fee   100.00
Tax Books   19.69
Repairs to School Sign  1.00
Typewriter• Ribbon   1.00

Total Expenses  $ 36.991.13

PARKING METER FUND

Bal. on hand June 30, 1951 1,939.47

Receipts   5,533.92

Total $7,473.39

EXPENSES:

Collector's Fee   120.00
Duncan Meter Corporation 920.15
Zone Marking Company  320.00
Snow Removal   562.11

Total $1,922.26

Bal, on hand June 30, 1952 5,551.13

ASSETS:

Munici?al Building  
Land  
Water Plant  
Streets and Alley's 
Street Sweeper  
Water System  
Deposit on Presbyterian lot
Bal. on hand General Acct
Bal. on hand Parking Meter

Account  
1948 Tax Outstanding 
1949 Tax Oustanding
1950 Tax Outstanding 
1951 Tax Outstanding.' 

8,052.00
1,000.00

23,000.00
32,714.74

400.00
38,033.26

200.00
16,280.31

5,551.13
33.48

115.61
77.22

422.50

Total $125,880.25

LIABILITIES:
:Government Int. Fee Loan 3,250.,00

Total Liabilities.... 3,250.00
Assets in excess of

Liabilities   122,630.25

Basis of Taxation $4,116,448.00

Rate of Taxation 65c on the $100.00

HENRY I. REINDOLLAR, JR.
Clerk-Treasurer.

We, the undersigned, duly appoint-
ed by the Mayor and City Council of
Taneytown, Md., to audit the books
of the Clerk-Treasuref of the Corpor-
ation of Taneytown, Maryland, for the
year ending June 30, 1952, have ex-
amined the aforegoing accounts and
found them correct and that there is
a balance on hand of 16,280.31 in the
General Account and $5,551.13 on
hand in the Parking Meter Account
as stated in the report.

WM. E. BURKE,

BERNARD J. ARNOLD,
Auditors..

'Government Interest Free Loan pay-
able when Sewer Project is begun.

STROUTSELLS REAL
ESTATE

Greatest advertiser of coun-

try property. Has made over

74,000 sales of Homes-Farms-.

Acreage. Buyers from all over the

World. Free open listing.

E. A. STROUT REALTY AGENCY

ROBERT L ZENTZ, Rep.
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

Phone: 4471
11-9-tf

goliday and summer woe is
IICLENIC TINE!
=I- Big Savings
In Heinz Foods

Heinz Baked Beans
Heinz Spaghetti
Heinz Macaroni
Heinz Tomato Soup
Cucumber Pickle Heinz Sliced
Heinz Ketchup

HEINZ STRAINED FOODS
HEINZ JUNIOR FCODS
HEINZ CIDER VINEGAR

icn6;o: 27,
2 cans 29.
2 cans 35c
3 cans 35e

16-oz
jar
14-oz M

cbat

3 jars 29c
jar 15c

Pt b°t I4c

IDEAL CREAMY OR CRUNCHY

Peanut Butter
jar Special!

Aunwesr., 1

SPECIAL FEATURE!
IDEAL FANCY FLORIDA

Grapefruit
Sections
21c6:27c

Light Meat Grated Cal.

TUNA
Regularly 23c can -

6 Fruit Flavors---Ideal

GELATINE
DESSERTS

Ideal Puddings or •
Ice Cream Mix

pkgs 25

2 
cans

6-oz 43c
- Ex:ra Special .

34-oz Handy Refrigerator
GLASS SHAKER

with 1 lb can of

Farmdale Extra Grade

DRY MILK
SOLIDS ,

BETH 49c
Princess Enriched

MARGARINE ws

• HERE'S YOUR BEST
ENRICHED SUPREME ,e4

BREAD
large

loaf

15, Why Pay
More?

BREAD BUY

Vir9inia Lee Chocolate Sundae Layer Cakes

lb 224

ea 79q

Eat Plenty of Summertime Fruits and Vegetables2LARGE YELLOW FREESTONE

Peaches 119
LARGE CULTIVATED BLU-BERRIES pt box 33c

CALIF. SEEDLESS GRAPES "329c

PINK MEAT CANTALOUPES large 36 size " 25c

EARLY JUNE APPLES U. S* 
No. 1 2 n's 29c

FANCY SLICING

TOMATOES
TENDER FRESH LOCAL BEETS
FRESH CALIF. CARROTS
LOCAL MIDGET SQUASH

Frozen Ideal Concert. Pure Orange Juice

Juices Ideal Concen. Pure Grape Juice

ctn23c

2 bchS
2 bobs
2 lbs

15c
19c
19c

2 6-oz cans 270
6-oz can 200

Freshly Killed Frying Chickens 59c lb.
DRESSED AND DRAWN

Lean Smoked Picnics 43c lb.

Lean Sliced Corn King Bacon 49c lb.
Meaty Frankfurts 49c lb.

Sliced Lebanon Bologna lb. 23c

Fancy Pollock Fillets lb. 29c Fancy Perch Fillets 39c lb.

Haddock Fillets
Fancy Dressed Whitings

Freshly Picked CLAW CRAB MEAT
Freshly Picked WHITE CRAB MEAT

39c lb.
17c lb

59c lb.
79c lb

Prices Effective July 11-12, 1952. Quantity Rights Rnserved.

YOUR DOLLAR BUYS MORE HERE
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TANE1TOWN ORGANIZATIONS
timesseira Chamber of eciatmeree meets

as the 4th. Monday in each month in
the Municipal building, at 8:00 o'clock.
Merwyn C. Fuss, Pres.; 1st. Vice-Pres..
David Smith; Second Vice-Pres., '
Chas. S. Owen; Secretary, Bernard J.
Arnold; Treasurer, Chas. R. Arn0n.

Taneytown Fire Company, meets on the
2nd Monday each month, at 7:30 P. M.
in the Firemen's Building. President, (
Doty Robb; Vice-President, Raymond
Feeser; Recording Secretary, Robert
Feeser; .Financial Secretary, Stanley :3King; Treasurer, David Smith; Trus-
tees, J. W. Garber, Kenneth Hawk,
Thurston Putman; Chief, Charles D.Baker.

The Americas, Legion—Hesson-Snider
Poet No. 120 meets tirst and third
Thursday of each month at 8 .00 P.
M., in the Legion Home. All service
men welcomed. Commander, Stanley
Bing; Adjutant, Raymond Haines;
Treasurer, Galen K. Stonesifer; Ser
vice Officer, B. Walter Crapster.

tancytown Rod & Gun Club meets last
Friday in each month in the Club

• House. President, Howell B. Royer;• Vice-pres., Robert W. Smith; Fin.
Sec'y, Augustus Shank; Rec. Sec'y,
S. E. Remsburg; Treas., Wm. B. Hop-
kins.

All other Fraternities and organizationsere invited to use this directory, for the
public information it carries. Cost for one'NIT only $1.50.

DEAD ANIMALS

Removed Promptly
HIDES, GREASE and BONES

Phone

LEIDY
Westminster 259

or

JOHN WOLF
Taneytown 4821

•"*"••

3-28-tf

ON THE
BIGGEST

CAR VALUE
IN TOWN

DODGE
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Prove Dodge Value the
'SHOW DOWN" WAY

THE JAMESON-BARNSLEY
CO., INC.

Manchester and Tuc Roads

Westminster, Md.

1#

CRAB & SHRIMP FEED

Cold Cuts, Soft Drinks :1
— at

Taneytown Recreation Park

AUGUST 15, 1952,

6:00 P. M.

PRICE $3.00

MAYBERRY GAME
PROTECTIVE ASSOCIATION

Benefit Game Restocking
6-20-8t

Or. T. J. NORRIS
CHIROPRACTOR

10 York St.,

Taneytown, Md.

4-4-

TRY CA RR OT.T, RVCORD. TANYA-TOWN'. MARYLAND

Every state in the

Union boasts one

hotel that's head and

shoulders above all

others. Here in our

••••••••  •••••••••

JULY it. 11:12.'

6-6-26t

1

POLIO INSURANCE
One policy covers parents and all unmarried children under 25

years of age. Pays all expenses up to, either, $5,000. or $10,000.
(whichever you choose) for each case. Surprisingly low rates. For
information, contact_

ROBERT L ZENTZ, Ageot
TANEYTOWN, MD.

=13142:4======:2221=131 1 1.4;434.
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7-11-4t

BOTH GIVE YOU MORE 
MILES FOR LESS MONEY

Who said all gasolines are alike? Here are gasolines so differ-
ent, they are now PATENTED. . . so revolutionary, they not
only power your car but PROTECT it at the same time—to
give you more miles of car life with less money for repairs.

Used regularly, patented Betholine and Sinclair Anti-Rust
Gasolines, with amazing rust inhibitor RD-119r prevent the
costly damage to your fuel system caused by rust and corrosion
—which is a constant threat with ordinary gasolines.

Remember—with patented Betholine or Sinclair, you get
flashing Power and Long Mileage PLUS the Anti-Rust protection
of RD-119-4n exclusive extra. . . AT NO EXTRA COST!
BETHOLINE, first among premium fuels. SINCLAIR, first
among regular priced gasolines.

•

World's first Anti-Rust Gasolines.N1

keep rust out at no extra cost

,k4

•

•

fl
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HOW MANY TIMES HAVE YOU LET GOLDEN
OPPORTUNITIES PASS YOU BY?

Our firm has one of the Nation's most desirable locations for theIce Cream Drive Inn business $25,000 to $40,000 income potential peryear.
IF YOU QUALIFY, ACT NOW! You must have good businessreferences and be able to devote at least seven months out of eachyear to this full time operation.
Have a minimum ready investment of $10,000.
And be able to make a decision now! If you qualify, Call

PLAZA 2900 OR BELMONT 8332
BALTIMORE, MARYLAND. .

Reverse Toll Charges, or Write Box 1234.
HOW MANY TIMES HAVE YOU ASKED YOURSELF

THESE QUESTIONS?

1. What business shall I go into?
2. Where can I obtain the comparative analysis of different bus-inesses?
3. How much money will it require?

$5,000 to $10,000 Annual Income!
THERE ARE AVAILABLE FRANCHISES FOR ICE CREAM
DRIVE-INNS IN ALL COUNTIES IN STATE OF MARYLAND.

1. You must have good business references.
2. Be able to devote 7 months out of each year to this operation.3. You must have $2,000 Min. investment and be able to makea decision now, as the season opens June 15th. If you qualify, Call

PL. 2900 or BELMONT 8332, Baltimore, Maryland.
Reverse Toll—Giving References

HERE'S WHERE PATENTED ANTI-RUST
GASOLINES SAVE YOU MANY DOLLARS

Used regularly, Betholine

and Sinclair protect against

repairs to your car's fuel

system ... carburetor and

fuel pump ... that can cost

you up to $18 a year.
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International Uniform r
Sunday School Lessons

SCRIPTURE: Judges 4-5.
DEVOTIONAL READING: Psalm 33:12-
=

She Led Men

Lesson for July 13, 1952

WOMEN complain that this is a
man's world. Well, it's half a

man's world anyhow, because about
half the grown people in it are men.
But that's not the point. Women
complain because men are the boss-
es, men get the
big salaries, men
run the govern-
rnent. Women are
teachers but men
run the school-
board, and so
forth. As a matter
of fact, it can be
doubted whether
women actually
would like it the
other way. Women
like men who are leaders, men with
minds of their own, who can take
hold of troublesome situations and
straighten them out.

* * •

• 'Wife, Mother, Judge
ANYHOW, Deborah was a woman
" like that. Her name means
•"Bee" and she was the sort of wom-
en who would somehow sting lazy or
timid people into doing their duty.
She is the only one of the "Judges"

.of Israel who was a woman.
Now some female heroines are a

bit odd, to say the least of'it. Take
Joan of Arc, who was a kind of bee
herself, and who took over when the
rightful leader hung back. Joan was
the kind of girl -who could hear
voices no one else heard. She was
not exactly the kind of girl any man
would feel quite comfortable with.
And naturally she never married.
But this Deborah was a wife and

in mother. She made some man
happy, she was a home-maker, chil-
dren cuddled up in her lap.

When later she became a
"judge" she had all the wisdom
of common-sense and of normal
experience as the basis of her
other wisdom. She knew how
mothers and home-makers feel.
When it says that she "judged Is-

rael" it does not mean that she ran
for office like modern judges, or
that any king had appointed her,
for there was no king to do it. It
means simply that everybody re-
spected her judgment so much that
when there were problems - more
tangled and twisted than common,
they would go ask Deborah what
she thought.

Dr. Foreman

• C *

She Didn't Like a Sissy

QN one famous occasion Deborah
did not wait for the man to

come; she sent for him. He lived
far from her home, and his name
was Barak. She put an idea into his
head, only it was not her idea, she
claimed for it the authority of God.

Barak was to be a general, he
was to recruit an army. She told
him, there under the palm tree,
where he was to get his army,
where he was to take it and
what to do with it when he got
there.

• Space does not permit the details
that would show that Deborah's

,ideas were absolutely sound from a
military point of view. She was a
whole General Staff by herself.
But Barak backed off from his

great opportunity. He would go, he
said, provided she would go along.
Now Deborah didn't like that. She
liked a man who would go out on
his own without having to have a
lady at hand to tell him what to do.
So she went: but she told him the
journey would not be for his honor.

That, however, is another story.
The point is that this Deborah was
a woman so wise that the ablest
man in the country at the time was
not willing to do anything important
without her advice.

• • •

Deborah's Daughters

DEBORAH was not the last woman
'whose wisdom and whose deci-
sions have led men to success.
There are today in the United

States women in congress, both in
the senate and in the house; a wom-
an is in charge of manpower; at
least one woman is a U.S. circuit
judge, the next highest in rank be-
low the Supreme Court. There was
a woman governor of Wyoming as
far back as 1924.

But for every woman who
makes the headlines and Who's
Who, for every woman who has
some official position, there are
hundreds of others, un-nomi-
nated and unsung, who are
known in their homes and in
their home towns for their
unfailing good advice.
"Ask Mrs.   " is the first

thing the neighbors think when
something comes up. And sometimes
a wise woman's reputation doesn't
even get around to the neighbors.
Sometimes it is only her family that
know how wise she is.
But it is a safe guess that if you

took out of our modern life all that
women contribute, all the good acts
and far-sighted policies that they
have thought of first, ours would be
a much worse world than it is.

(Copyright 1951 by the Division of
Christian Education. National Council
of the Churches of Christ of the United
States of America Released by WN1.1
Features.)
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ij picture of health..
That's me --

thanks to Dr. Sals-

bury's Ren-O-Sal.

With Ren-O-Sal, I

get faster growth,

faster feathering,

better coloring, and

good protection

against cecal coc-

cidiosis. • Ren-0-

Sal has made me

a real money-,

maker. Try it in

your flock!

volien you Aced poultry
tmed.c,vIes• ask for .. •

DR. SALSBURY S

Reindoliar Bros, 8b Co,

Phone your Farm Buoteau rep•
resentative now for this valu-
able protection. Pays expenses

up to $9000 for each case.

Covers parents, children under

18. Two year family policy $10,

Individual $5. 4

J. Alfred Heitebridle
FRIZELLBURG, MD.

Phone: Westminster 924-W-1

FARM BUREAU MUTUAL
AUTO INSURANCE CO.

  COLUMBUS, OHIO

•

The Reindollar Company
Taneytown, Md.

9-14-ti
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BALTIMORE RACEWAY

2r, geegle' s
Chiropractic Office
EMMITSBURG, MD.

Phone: Emmits'ourg 117

HOURS BY APFOINTMENI

11-M 41
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FEMALE HELP WANTED
No Experience Necessary

Pleasant Working Conditions
Group Insurance
Vacation Plan

Apply to Personnel Department

The CambridRe Rubber Co,
4

Taneytown, Maryland
12-28-tf

4
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If you want bigger payload you want a Dodge

"We solved our hauling problems
- with Dodge lob-Rated' trucks"
"Our business calls for trucks that can haul big loads
day in and day out—and we like our trucks to last,
too! That's why we prefer Dodge trucks that are
`Job-Rated' to fit our particular hauling job.

"We recently put in service twq, Dodge ̀ Job-Rated'
13/2-ton models. . . and they sure haul big loads the
way we want them to! For instance, the 170-inch
wheelbase models allow for a 14-foot body, which is
ideal for our business. And Dodge easy-handling ad-
• vantages enable us to maneuver these trucks in the

same space as some other trucks with 12-foot bodies."

. . . says
BERNARD J.
CARNEY, Manager
Weyerhaeuser &
Denkmann
Lumber Yard,
Rock Island Lumber CO.
Rock Island, III.

For bigger payloads, choose a Dodge "Job-Rated"
truck-1/2- through 4-ton.

"Job-Rated" engineering makes it possible for you
to haul more with the right Dodge truck for your
needs.

You haul more economically, too, because of such
Dodge advantages as lightweight aluminum-alloy
pistons and others.

For smoother power, extra load protection, gjuol
Fluid Drive is available on 1/2-, 3/4-, 1-ton and
Route-Van models.

Come in for a demonstration—and an extra good
deal!

Better weight distribution. Dodge short wheelbase
allows more weight to be carried on the front axle.
Because the engine is located farther forward and
front axle is moved back, you can haul bigger loads
without oveiloading.

The right load-carrying units. Frame, axles, and other
units that carry the load are "Job-Rated" on Dodge.
Each is engineered to provide strength and capacity
needed to support your load. All are "Job-Rated"
to work together!

The right load-moving units. You get an engine that's
"Job-Rated" with plenty of power to pull bigger loads
at low cost. In fact, all load-moving units—such as
clutch, transmission, rear axle—are engineered to
move bigger loads.

•

7

See us- foo'ox Me 6es-tt bui/ ii /ow-cos, "to tispottabb17.

DO 1r GE4 "IRLIEKS.
The Jameson-Barnsley Co., Inc.

Manchester & Tuc Roads

• Westminster, Maryland

•

Make You %Happy  e Miles that
OW,40

16   
01:47:eR 511:fc.

You'LL discover a lot that you like in  this neat, fleet and nimble traveler
the first mile you drive it.

Such things as cushions broad and deep
— six-passenger room unsurpassed by
any car in America — fabrics rich, soft,
harmonious.

As you take it through traffic—breast a
hill or two—try it out on back roads—
you'll find that you handle Dynaflow
Drive* as if you had always used it—
your ride is serenely level—and a great
tide of power comes surging up as you
need it.

This, you will say, is very Super indeed.

But no one-time sample can tell you
the deep-down enduring thrill that is
yours when you own this great middle
s'2ries Buick.

How easy it is to park in round-town
driving, especially if you have Power
Steering.t

How relaxed you and the family will
feel at the end of a long day's vacation
jaunt—with Dynaflow Drive to let you
drive at ease on the open road, without
the tenseness of clutch-pushing in traffic
—plus a Million Dollar Ride to protect
the comfort of the family.

That ride is something to talk about.
More than a dozen selected engineering
features control roll and wander on
curves—snub dip and sway before they
get past the frame—carry you over all
kinds of roads with lullaby smoothness.

And that Fireball 8 Engine—man, what
a docile thunderbolt you'll find it to be!
Here's a high-compression valve-in-

head that really wrings miles from a
gallon of gas.

In other words, all the miles you travel
in this Buick are going to make you
gladder and gladder that you bought it
—for comfort, for fun, kir thrill and for
thrift.
What are you waiting for? Come in and
get your sample today.
Equipment, accessories, trim and models are subject
to change without notice. *Standard on Roadmaster,
optional at extra cost on other Series. tNow available
on Super as well as Roadmaster—optional at extra cost.

Sure is
true
for '52

THE W. H. DAVIS COMPANY
31 WEST MAIN STREET Phone 1207 WESTMINSTER, MARYLAND
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FROCK REUNION 13ri
SUNDAY, JULY 20, 1952

Mt. Tabor Park, Rocky Ridge, Md.1
r:

All descendants of the late Jacob
and Rachel Frock are invited to 11
spend the day with us. Basket
lunch at noon. Program at 2:00
o'clock. Games for the children.»

FREDA LAMBERT, Sec'y. 0
7-1 1-2t

• •
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NOTICE TO CREDITORS
This is to give notice that the subsceib-

ers have obtained from the Orphans Court
of Carroll County, in Maryland letters
testamentary on the personal estate of

ROSE E. OVERHOLTZElt,
late of Carroll County, Md., deceased. All
persons having claims against the deceased
are warned to exhibit the same, with the
vouchers thereof, legally authenticated, to
the subscribers, on or before the 11th day
of February. next; they may otherwise by
law be -excluded from all benefits of said
estate.
Given under our hands this 1st day of

July. 1952.
S. AUGUSTUS CRABBS,
D. EARL CRABBS.

Executors of Rose E. Over-
holtzer, deceased.

7-4-5t

ITCHING SKIN
Get that famous

white, greaseless salve
that stops itching.
promotes healing. Any
skin trouble head to
foot. Safe for children.

W ONDER` 

SALVE
and SOAP

TAN EYTOWN
F TO b. :I AWHAN D

The Birnie Trust Co•
of Tanetown. in the State of Mary-

land, at the close of business
on June 30, 1952

ASSETS.
1. Cash, balances with other
banks, including reserve bal-
ances and cash items in process
of collliction  $ 628,521.51

2. United States Government.
obligations, direct and guaran-
teed   1,244,544.20
3. Obligations of States and po-
litical subdivisions   105,598.76

4. Other bonds, notes and de-
bentures   161,387.96

a. Corp.. vte sticks (including
$Nono s.ock of Federal Reserve
Bank)   4,78.5.56

6. Loans and discounts (includ-
ing $277.19 overdrafts)  869,378.33

7. Bank premises owned $30,000
furniture and fixtures $6,000- 36,000.00

11. Other assets   1,600.00

12. TOTAL ASSETS  $3,051,816.32
LIABILITIES.

13. Demand deposits of individ-
wds, partnerships, and corpor-

, ations   753,720.29
14. Time deposits of individuals,

i.Artnerships. and corpora-
tions   2,060,618.19

1.5. Deposits of United States
Government (including postal
savings   8,215.68

16 Deposits of States and po-
litical subdivisions   45,310.85

IS. Other deposits (certified and
officers' checks, etc)  5,951.31

19. TOTAL DEPOSITS $2,873,816.32

24. TOTAL LIABILITIES (not
including subordinated obli-
gations shown below)... $2,873,816.32 '

CAPITAL ACCOUNTS 
25. Capitals   75,000.00
26. Surplus   85,000.00
27. Undivided profits   18,000.00

29. TOTAL CAPITAL AC-
COUNTS  178,000.00

30. TOTAL LIABILITIES AND
CAPITAL ACCOUNTS -.43,051,816.32

•This Bank's capital consists of •
(ommon stcck with total
Par Value of $75,000.00

MEMORANDA. ilik1141.+0:Cts3r. Ot.(Kftet.4.1k..._.0481Rheiilac“Agi'31. Assets pledged or assigned
to secure liabilities and for
other purposes  ... 145,000.00
I, Charles R. Arnold, Cashier of theTANEYTOWN GRAIN MARKETS above-named bank, do solemnly swear that

the above statement is true, and that it
$1.79 per bu. sfijalitye oafn;lhecoservreeertallymraetptreersseit:etsreintheeon:utrinue.
$1.90 per bu. ed and set forth, to the best of my linowl•
$1.05 per bu. edge and belief. •

CHAS. R. ARNOLD, Cashier.
Correct Attest:

111-11114444 4 Int 411-1 CS 4411411 I MERWYN C. FUSS.

i: 1616317495(1111191t4(141(.4 ' - - - " - ."
; ,,..-   •...,  o
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DON'T LET THIS HAPPEN ON YOUR FARM

When you are tempted to dump undercured
hay in your barn, remember this: spontaneous
ignition costs America's farmers millions of
dollars in, property loss - every single year.

Let your hay cure a little longer in the field.
You may be taking a chance on
the weather-but you'll be reduc-

• ing the risk of having a costly fire.

JULY 20-26 IS NATIONAL FARM SAFETY WEEK.

BANK CREDIT

L the btst

FARM CREDIT

First National Bank
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Member Federal Reserve System
(Member cf The Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation)

Wheat  
Ear Corn  
Barley  

KOONS FLORIST
Cut Flowers Designs

Corsages
U TTLESTOWN, PENN A.

Phone 140
I

sriLt_t_tittitit

• • ERNEST W. DUNBAR,
a DAVID SMITH,
id Directors

State of Maryland, County of Carroll ss:
Sworn to and subscribed before me this

& 9th day of July, 1952, and I hereby
• certify that I am not an officer or direc-
so tor Of this bank.

WILLIAM E. BURKE, JR.,
Notary PublicMy commission expires May 4th, 1953.

I

WANTED
Experienced Stitchers

Apply-

TANEY SEWING COMPANY

:121. ••4 OF"
•

From coast to coast folks are calling the
'52 Fora' vietoria America's "best-dressed"
car! Its new curved one-piece windshield
is a "first" in its field. Ford's choice of new
body, upholstery and color combinations
is the widest in low-priced car historyi

The young of heart choose Ford's Crest-
line Sunliner. With its new 110 high-com-
pression V-8 horsepower, you get the
mod power ever offered in the low-price
field. And take your pick of Fordomatic,
Overdrive or Conventional.

•

Another favorite son is the all-new Ford
Ranch Wagon-the lowest-priced full-size
station wagon. like all '52 Fords, it has
Automatic Ride Control ... far easier
steering. "Test Drive" o new Ford. You'll
agree no car gives you so much style,
power and comfort for the money. F.D.A.F.

Fordomatic, Overdrive and white sidewalt fires optional at extra cost
Equipment, occessories and trim subp•ct to change without notice.

Crouse Motor Sales

•

Musselmans TOMATO JUICE
1 can .23

Kennys Kosher Style PICKLES 1 Jar .32

Mustard or Oil SARDINES 2 cans .17
Sweet Clover PEAS (New Pack) 2 Cans .25

Hunts Whole APRICOTS 1 can .29
Hearts Delight APRICOT NECTAR 1 Can .34

Crown JAR LIDS 2 doz. .23
Life Buoy SOAP, Bath Size 3 Cakes .2-1

Filberts Solid MARGARINE lb. .27
PICNIC PLATES, CUPS, SPOONS and FORKS

BouGHERTy95
OREM Z VANE

PHONE 3021

GROCERY
TANEYTOWN, MP.

Week-End Specials
JULY 11 JULY 12 JULY 14

if

•••

••••

kfiAINWOjOzt4ttwzstcP900(),40*.

• 111POSSIBLE FOR OTHER

rf

twasfr ietfew

When you

trip, you can easily turn them into money

anywhere. No one else coda cash them. So for

safety and convenience, there's no substitute

for Travelers Cheques-available at this bank.

carry Travelers Cheques on your

The Birnie Trust Company
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND.

(Member of the Federal Depos4 Insurance Corporation)

400*(911)4,-,tik)61C-56104)4140 a:%-•'-'04004**)(14Cii:l

At last-the easier, better, cleaner and lower-cost

way to get rid of flies, mosquitoes and other insects.

Just a few easy strokes on the pump of a Hudson

Nebulizer sends out a floating mist of insecticide that

flies and insects can't escape. Gives insecticide 20%

more knock-down poWer, 25% more killing power. Fight

sickness and annoyance in your home-banish disease-

spreading pests. Get your Hudson Nebulizer today.

SEE OUR
DISPLAY
TODAY-

4 SIZES

TO CHOOSE FROM-

FOR

HOME, FARM,

STORE and OFFICE

114///11f
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Reindollar Bros. Etc Co.
FORD DEALER

Phone 4331 Taneytown, Md.
HARDWARE • PAINTS • 'APPLIANCES

ESTABLISHED 1897 Taneytown, Md TELEPHONE 4564

• 4


