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COMMUNITY LOCALS 
This column is not for use in advertis-

ing any money-making program, fair, sup-
per, party or sale. It is intended for
news, personals, and such matters as may
be of community interest.
All communications for this department

must be signed by the author; not for
publication, but as an evidence that the
items contributed are legitimate and cor-
rect. Items based on sera rumor, or such
as are likely to give offeirge, are not want-
ed.

Miss Laura Rothgaber, Baltimore,
.will be •a week-end guest of Miss
Wanda Mehring.

Mrs. Lott Disney, Baltimore, spent
from Thursday until Saturday with
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Mehring.

Mr. and Mrs. Sheridan Reaver
and family, were supper guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Harry Sprankle and
Atwood Hess, on Sunday evening.

Mrs. William D. Rhea, children,
Billie, Dean and Bernadette, Luther,
Tenn., spent Friday night and Sat-
urday with Mr. and Mrs. Ray T.
Hahn.

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Reindollar
called Sunday afternoon on Doctor
and Mrs. Wilmer Shoop. Mrs. Shoop
before marriage was Miss Ethel
Sauerhammer.

Dr. and Mrs. Francis T. Elliot and
son, Lewis H. Elliot, of Baltimore,
visited Mr. and Mrs. Paul S. Grif-
fith and family, in Fountain Head,
Hagerstown, on Sunday.

Mrs. Harry Merick after spending
the summer in Vineyard, Mass., stop-
ped off to spend some time with the
Misses Annan before returning to her
home in Washington, D. C.

Miss Grace Witherow, Washington,
D. C., will have as her guest over
this week-end at her home here, Mrs.
Wm. E. Wheeler, of the National
Lutheran Home, Washington, D. C.

Mr. and Mrs. Chester Neal have
as guests for a week Mrs. Neal's
brother and sister-in-law, Mr. and
Mrs. Robb Roy Norton and children,
Suzanne and Bobby, of Carrollton,
Kentucky.

Students leaving, or have left in-
clude George Baumgardner and Jerry
Myers at the University of Maryland
College Park; George Null, Fred
Teeter and Fred Wilhide, at Gettys-
burg College.

On Tuesday Mrs. Morgan Andreas
attended a synodical conference meet-
ing of the Women's Guild in Fred-
erick to plan for the fall area meet-
ings which will be held during the
second week of October.

Saturday afternoon Rev. Morgan
Andreas and Rev. Edmund Welker
attended the dedication ceremonies
of the new Homewood Home for the
Aged of the Evangelical and Reform-
ed Church, near Williamsport, Md.

Robert Hughes returned home on
Wednesday afternoon from the York
hospital where he had an operation
on his right knee. His leg from his
ankle to above the knee is in a cast
which will have to be on for seven
weeks.

Mr. and Mrs. Edgar Yount plan
to leave their home in Tampa, Flori-
da, September 22nd for Maryland.
They will have a short visit with Mr.
Yount's sister, Mrs. Charles B. Kep-
hart and Mr. Kephart. They also
will visit, relatives in Washington,
D. C.

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Bacon and Mr.
Claude Glass, of Rose Hill, Va.; Mr.
and Mrs. Henry H. Trent, Mrs. Wil-
liam Rhea, children, Billie, Dean and
Bernadette, of Luther, Tenn., are
visiting relatives and friends in Tan-
eytown and vicinity, and attended the
Glass reunion held Sunday.

Those who visited at the home of
Mr. and Mrs. George Deberry were:
Mr. and Mrs. John Deberry, New
Midway and Mr. Fred Leib and Mr.
and Mrs. Earnest Myers, of Keymar;
Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Hahn and Mr.
and Mrs. William Six, of Walkers-
ville, and Mr. and Mrs. Edgar Phil-
lips.

The Rev. and Mrs. Glenn L. Stahl
and daughter, Cheryl Lane Stahl, Mrs.
Ella Rapp, Miss Blanche Koons and
Mrs. Lillian Ibach visited Tuesday
at the National Lutheran Home, of
Washington, D. C. and had dinner
with the family. Mrs. Ibach visited
with Mrs. Hattie Weaver, formerly
of Union Bridge. They also saw other
guests of the Home.

---
Those from Taneytown who at-

tended the Waltersdorf-Stott wedding
Saturday evening, at 8 p. m. were:
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Crapst:er and
sons, Dr. Basil Crapster and Wirt
Crapster, Mrs. John 0. Crapster and
sons Lewis and William Crapster,
Miss Anna Galt, and the Misses An-
nan, Mrs. Guy Ourand, who was a
guest of Mr. and Mrs. Walter Crap-
ster accompanied them. They were The following men have been in-also guests at the reception which

ducted into the Armed Forces fromfollowed.

GREY LADIES VISIT ACTIVITIES IN
Volunteer Work Done at

Fort Howard

Monday, Mrs. Chester Neal, Mrs.
George Harman and Mrs. Margaret
Nulton, along with four ladies from
Mt. Airy, and Mrs. Ruth Buffington,
New Windsor, the Red Cross Home
Service Director for Carroll Co, went
to Fort Howard to do volunteer Red
Cross work. It was the first visit
for Mrs. Neal and me, who served
as Grey Ladies, and for Mrs. Har-
man, a member of the Ambulance
Corps, who spent the day helping in
the library. The three Taneytown
ladies expect to go again the 24th
of Sept. and October 1st. We arrived
at Fort Howard at eleven and were on
duty until three in the afternoon.
Miss O'Neal, the Educational Director,
met us in the class room and for an
hour explained the work of the Grey
Ladies, and showed us through the
buildings. It is a very large hospital,
four stories and basement. There is a
lovely chapel, a library, a movie room,
and sports for the patients, both white
and negro, all ex-servfce men. We
were shown the blood bank.

Patients are the usual cases in
hospitals, along with the blind, the
amputees and the mentally sick. Miss
O'Neal told of the duties of the Grey
Ladies, in short they are: escort pa-
tients; feed patients; linen and sup-
plies; water pitchers and nourish-
ment; answer call signals and ascer-
tain need and report to nurse; assist
in keeping unit clean; care for flow-
ers, etc.; rehabilitation. We were told
how to talk to the deaf; how to feed
and work with the blind, and work
with the amputee.
Any lady wishing to do Red Cross

Grey Lady work contact me. Those
living in Uniontown, Harney, Keys-
ville, and near Taneytown, would go
in on_ Taneytown's quota. Miss
O'Neal brought out the importance
of the work of the Grey Ladies, how
they can help to keep up the high
standard of efficiency and usefulness
of the hospital. She and another
nurse said, "send us all the Grey
Ladies you can."

MARGARET NULTON.

TRINITY MISSION CIRCLE MEET

Trinity Mission Circle held its reg-
ular monthly meeting, Wednesday,
September 12th. Mrs. Jean Cheno-
weth and Mrs Oneida Skiles were the
leaders for the evening. The topic
for discussion was "Its Our Work."
Mrs. Skiles read the Scripture and
led the prayer. Mrs. Chenoweth led
the topic and others taking part in
the discussion were Mrs. Charlotte
Bollinger, Mrs. Cora Cutsail, Mrs.
Arlene Bollinger, Mrs. Charlotte
Shorb, Miss Anna Mae Wenschoff,
Miss Belva Koons, Mrs. Mildred
Jester, Mrs. Hilda Hopkins, Miss
Eleanor Kiser, Mrs. Esther Harrier
•and Mrs. Vera .0mmert. David
Bair played a number on his trumpet.
The president Mrs. Alma Bair

presided at the business meeting with
the presentation of secretary and
treasurer's reports. The president
announced the outstanding event for
the month of October will be the
Rally with Mrs. Dorothy Stahl as
chairman. The society is making
plans for a food sale to be held in
the near future. It was also announc-
ed that the society would be selling
Christmas cards again this year.
They may be obtained from any
member. The thoughts for the day
were given by Mrs. Hilda Hopkins
and Mrs. Margaret Naill.

THE WONDERFUL LIFE

Sunday and Monday nights, at
7:30, respectviely, :the timely and
meaningful motion picture, "The
Wonderful Life", will be shown in the
Evangelical and Reformed Churches
of Taneytown and Keysville.
"The Wonderful Life" is produced

as a feature film by the cooperating
denominations of Congregational
Christian, Evangelical and Reformed
and Presbyterian USA churches.
This picture is a sequeal to the very
impressive release of last year, "Sec-
ond Chance."

This film which is excellent, artis-
tically and technically, was produced
by the Protestant Film Commission
in Hollywood. It is the true story of
a Christian family by the name of
Wood in a small town of Martins-
ville, Missouri.
This picture which is being shown

in all of the 2,754 Evangelical & Re-
formed churches in the United States
is presented to unlock some of life's
deepest perplexities for those who
see it. It is a picture which the en-
tire family will enjoy, and the gen-
eral public is hereby invited to wit-
ness either or both of these showings
of "The Wonderful Life."

CALLED TO SERVICE

Early September 14th, Mrs. Ella
Ecker and Miss Betty Sauerwein,
youngest daughter of Mr. and Mrs.
Jesse Sauerwein, of near town ac-
companied Mr. and Mrs. David
Ebling, of Bethel, Pa., by car on a
six weeks visit to the Mid-west. They
will visit friends in Dallas Center,
Iowa, Kansas City, Missouri; Mc-
Clave, Col., and Mr. and Mrs.
Donald Ecker and family, Quinter,
Kan., who formerly lived near Tan-
eytown and in Littlestown. Word has
been received they arrived safely in
Iowa Saturday evening and are en-
joying their trip immensely.

(Continued on Fourth Page)

local boards 40 and 41 Carroll Coun-
ty: William Barton Melville, Sykes-
ville, Md.; Roy Herbert Harper, Mil-
lers, Md.; Raymond Thomas Hood,
Rt. 6, Westminster, Md.; William
Robert Haugh, Jr., Woodbine, Md.;
Vernon Leo Harp, Sykesville, Md.;
Earl LeRoy Hossler, Rt. 1 Hamp-
stead, Md.; John Robison Willis, Rt.
1 Sykesville, Md.; Leonard Thomas
Metcalf, Sykesville, Md.; John Ray-
mond Woodyard, 300 E. Green Street
Westminster, Md.; Frank Asher Seal-
over, Jr., Rt. 2, Westminster, Md.;
William Edward Duble, Rt. .1 Key-
mar, Md.; Paul Maynard Reifsnider,
Rt. 7, Westminster, Md.; John Stew-
art Erb, Rt. 7, Westminster, Md.

OUR SCHOOLS
Taneytown High and Elemen-

tary Notes
The Taneytown High School Key

Club held its second meeting, Tues-
day, Sept. 18, 1951, during the lunch
period.
The meeting was opened by the

singing of "America" followed by
the flag salute.

Following the meal we discussed
ways in which we could help keep the
school halls, and class rooms clean.
We planned to fix the boys health
room by supplyihg it with material.
The guests for the day were as fol-

low: Mrs. Virginia Sanders faculty
member of the High school and Mr.
Charles Stonesifer member of our
sponsoring Kiwanis Club.

JAMES F. FREAM.

ELEMENTARY PTA BEGINS
SCHOOL YEAR

The first meeting of the Taneytown
Elementary school was held Tuesday
Sept. 18 and was called to order by
Mr. Singleton Remsburg, President.
After the invocation, several selec-
tions were given by the upper grade
chorus of the school. The newly ap-
pointed secretary, Rev. Morgan An-
dreas read the minntes of the last
regular meeting, after which Mr.
Remsburg appoir4ted the following
commitees, Chairmen, Budget, Mr.
George Kiser; Membership, Mrs.
Ralph Stonesifer; Program, Mrs.
Mary Clingan; Welfare, Mrs. Roy
Haifley; Legislative, Mr. James Po-
teet; Social, Mrs. Felix , Westine;
Publicity, Mrs. Charlotte Shorb, and
Publications, Mrs. Edward Howarth.
The theme of this year's program

will be "Improve the physical and
mental well-being of the child". In line
with this, the first speaker of the
year was Mrs. Josephine West, sup-
ervisor of home economics, who em-
phasized the importance and value
of the school lunch program. Slides
of the Taneytown cafeteria were also
shown.
Mr. Robert Kersey, school instru-

mental music teacher was also pres-
ent to explain the value of instru-
mental music in the total program.
A drive for membership is now

underway. The patrons wishing to
join should either contact the com-
mittee or send their dues (50c per
member or $1.00 per family) to the
school with pupils. After adjourn-
ment, refreshments were served by
members of the social committee.

ELEMENTARY SCHOOL ENTER-
TAINS NEW TEACHERS

As part of an effort to unify and
develop .cooperation between the Tan-
eytown' schools, all members of the
High school faculty were guests of
the Elementary school faculty on
Thursday, Sept. 13. In addition to the
faculties, other guests included Mr.
John Wooden, High school supervis-
or; Miss Ruth Devore, Elementary
supervisor and Miss Evelyn Maus,
Pupil personnel supervisor, all of the
Board of Education staff. After re-
freshments were served, the Ele-
mentary faculty conducted the guests
on a tour of the building.

SALE OF MAGAZINE SUBSCRIP-
TIONS

The magazine campaign that has
been in progress since September 11,
1951 has been brought to a close
with a good showing for the school.
The pupils have done exceptionally
well this year with an average of $9
per pupil. The pupil selling the
highest number of magazines was
Stewart Peterson with a total of
$102. Harry Dougherty almost tied
with him with a total of $101.
The high salesman for each day

was recorded, the pupils name, and
the amount they sold for the day
are as follows: Sept. 11, Arlene Nay-
lor $20.50; Sept. 12, Dean Nusbaum
$17; Sept. 13, Ernest Stonesifer $18;
Sept. 14, Lois Brown $14.50; Sept.
17, Evelyn Wilhide $22; Sept. 18,
Arthhr Garvin, Jr 359; Sept. 19,
Jean Luckenbaugh $56; and the final

(Continued on Fifth Page)

FEDERATION HAS NEW
MANAGER

Clyde L. Hesson, District Chair-
man for the National Federation of
Independent Business in Taneytown,
reports that Edward Hardcastle, of
Hagerstown, is now District Manager
for the Federation in this section.

Mr. Hesson states that the NFIB
has the largest individual member-
ship of any national business organ-
ization in this nNation. The members
express their personal opinions on
important national issues directly to
Congressman J. Glenn Beall thru
their local Chairman, Mr. Hesson.

This month the Federation mem-
bers will express their opinions on 5
important issues. One of these is
whether convicted Communist sub-
versives should be allowed to go
free on bail until they appeal their
convictions or higher courts agree
to hear their appeals.
A Maryland Congressman has writ-

ten to Mr. Hardcastle saying,. "The
ballots forwarded from members are
always helpful in reflecting the
thinking of people at home and it is
my view that it is beneficial not only
to the members of Congress, but to

i the community in general as it keeps
our citizens alive to the problems of
the day."

HARVEST HOME

Festival Event to be Held
in Trinity Lutheran

Sunday morning, September 23rd,
will be the occasion of the Harvest
Home Festival in Trinity Lutheran
Church according to the schedule an-
nounced by the k astor, the Rev. Glenn
L. Stahl. In keeping with the rural
tradition there will be a general. in-
gathering of foodstuff from cupboard,
garden and field as a token of appre-
ciation for• the Good Providence of
God in causing the earth to yield its
increase. As an expression of Christ-
ian Love for the the aged and in-
firm, thee gifts will be sent to the
Lutheran Home for the Aged in
Washington, D. C., where more than
two hundred guests will enjoy them
through the winter months.
The orphaned children at Tressler

will also be remembered on this
special day with the money offering
received through ,the Harvest Home
envelopes.
In addition to this the ingathering

of people who will gather to join in
corporate worship and thanksgiving
will be of no less significance. The
Harvest Festival will be a day of
home-coming joy for the members
and friends of Trinity. All ages will
attend the Church School and Wor-
ship Service at 9:30 and 10:30 a. m.
and the youth of the church will
gather in a special Youth Sunday
rally at seven o'clock in the evening
in the Sunday School auditorium.

KEY CLUB NEWS

On Wednesday evening, Sept. 19,
1951, the Taneytown, Wes,tminster
and Mt. Airy Kiwanis clubs met at
the Westminster VFW home in a
joint meeting for the purpose of
furthering Key Clubs. The Taney-
town High School Key Club was in
charge of the meeting.
The meeting opened by the singing

of "America" followed by the flag
salute. The blessing was offered
by Arthur Garvin, Jr.
A delicious meal prepared by the

ladies of the VFW was served and
very much enjoyed by everyone. Fol-
lowing this was a discussion about
the meaning of Key Clubs. David
Reifsnider of the Taneytown school
sang two solos accompanied by Mrs.
Estella Yingling.
The guest speaker for the evening

was Mr. Frederick C Mallory, secre-
tary of Key Club International. Mr.
Mallory spoke about the purpose of
Key Club and why we have them in
the schools.

WITH OUR ARMED FORCES

Sergeant First Class Edmund Jas.
Morrison, whose home is at 7 Mill
Ave., Taneytown , Md., has been pro-
moted to Warrant Officer Junior
Grade it was announced today at
Maryland Military District head-
quarters in Baltimore. Warrant Of-
cer Morrison will be assigned to the
tIndlantown Gap Military Reserva-
tion, Pa. He was recalled to extend-
ed active duty from the Army Re-
serve last October 9, reporting for
duty at the Maryland Military Dis-
trict headquarters where he was as-
signed to the Plans and Training
Section. Prior to his recall to active
duty Warrant Officer Morrison was
employed by the Cambridge Rubber
Company of Taneytown as Industrial
Engineer.
Warrant Officer Morrison is a vet-

eran of World War II, entering the
Army on August 14, 1944. Early in
1945 he went overseas and saw ser-
vice in Australia, Burma, China and
India. On June 24, 1946 he returned
to the United States. His awards
include the Army Commendation,
Asiatic-Pacific (with 3 Stars), Good
Conduct and World War II Victory
Medals. On July 3, 1946 he was
honorably discharged as a Technical
Sergeant at Fort George G. Meade.
Warrant Officer Morrison has been

active in military and civilian organ-
izations in the Taneytown area which
include the American Legion, Loyal
Order of Moose, Veterans of For-
eign Wars, Fraternal Order of
Eagles, Taneytown Rod & Gun Club,
Taneytown Alumni Association, Holy
Name Society, Taneytown Chamber
of Commerce and the Hanover Lyric
Club.

Miss Freda G. Stambaugh, daugh-
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Jacob Stambaugh
of Taneytown, Md. has been promot-
ed from 2nd Lieutenant to 1st Lieu-
tenant at the 382nd General Hospital
near Osaka, Japan, where she is
presently stationed.

Lieutenant Stambaugh entered the
Army Nurse Corps in Pebrpary of
1951 and reported to the 382nd Gen-
eral Hospital in March of the same
year. Since that time she has been
serving in the Surgical Department.
The 382nd General Hospital, orig-

inally a Washington, D. C. Reserve
Unit, was activated the 11th of Sep-
tember 1950 and sailed for Japan in
January of this year, The principal
function of the unit is the care and
treatment of Korean casualties who
are flown to a nearby air strip often
within a few hours after being
wounded on the front lines.

PAPER COLLECTION A WEEK
FROM SATURDAY

The next gathering by Boy Scouts
of Troop 348, Taneytown, will be made
a week from tomorrow, on Saturday,
Sept. 29th. Rags, magazines, and iron
also are urgently needed, metal scrap
being particularly important if steel
needs for the first quarter of 1952
are to be met.

WORLD NEWS
IN BRIEF

Many Highlights Noted in
Short Paragraphs

Unrest was reported mounting in
East Germany as farmers and indus-
trial workers resent the new quota
systems modeled after the Russian
method.

Royal Idoctors officiatlx confirmd
Tuesday for the first time that King
George VI is suffering from a dis-
ease of the lungs.

All set for any Chinese Commun-
ist offensive in .Korea and the col-
lapse of the cease-fire talks are fresh
combat troops with new props, in-
cluding some of America's latest se-
cret weapons.
The Big Three conference of for-

eign minister agreed last Thursday
that German armed forces will help
defend Europe under the Atlantic
Pact.

Ignoring U. S. criticism of East-
West trade, Britain announced last
Thursday the purchase of 1,000,000
tons of grain from Russia.

Czech airline flights across West
Germany have been barred by Allies.
Czechoslovakia protested Friday to
the Western Allies against the West's
new "Get tough" policy against its
Communist government.
The first guided missile unit is be-

ing formed by the Air Force and
President Truman said this involved
one of the deadly weapons he had
described as "fantastic in their oper-
ation."
, Iranian troops were guarding
strategic points in Tehran Monday as
a guard against a reported attempt
to overthrow the government.
Gen. Matthew B. Ridgway return-

ed to Tokyo Monday night from a
surprise visit to Korea after he pro-
posed to the Communists for a re-
newal of the truce talks.
The Navy has trained crews to

launch atomic-bomb attack's from
carriers, Adm. William Fechteler
disclosed Monday.

Sister Elizabeth Kenny, famed
nurse who has devoted her life to
perfecting a treatment for infantile
paralysis, arrived Sunday in Minnea-
polis to take part in dedication cere-
monies Thursday at which a new
wing of the Kenny Institute will be
opened.
Larger draft calls and fewer de-

ferments are inevitable stated a se-
lective service official saying that
military manpower is the scarcest
wartime commodity in America.
A ceremony and a mock bombard-

ment was re-enacted Sunday at
Fort McHenry to commemorate De-
fenders Day.

Daylight Saving Time will end
officially on Sunday, September 30,
so the clocks should be set back an
hour Saturday night, Sept. 29th.
Just at a time when his doctors

are advising King George VI to rest
he will have increased duties as a
result of the British national elec-
tions set for October 25th.
A one-day strike in demand of pay

increases crippled Italy Wednesday
as it stopped railroads, broke tele-
graph communications, delayed tele-
phone service and halted the mail.
Premier Mohammed Mossadeyh

and his cabinet studied a three-point
plan for re-opening the British-
Iranian oil talks which collapsed
August 22. President Truman's trou-
ble-shooter, W. Averell Harriman,
suggested the plan urging both sides
to take a practical view of the is-
sue, rejecting the idea of an Iranian
ultimatum to the British which he
had refused* to relay to London as
Mossadegh requested.
Yesterday the Reds' war leaders

proposed the Kaesong truce talks be
resumed immediately and there was
general belief the Allies would
agree.
In eastern Korea Wednesday the Red
forces struck back hard and seized a
key hill in a day that saw a new flare-
up of the air war. Outnumbered
American planes scored in air bat-
over "MIG" Alley in northwest Korea.

FIRE COMPANY AUXILIARY

The September meeting of the
Auxiliary of the Volunteer Fire Com-
pany was in charge of the vice-pres-
ident, Mrs. Ruth Baumgardner with
the customary reports of the corres-
pondent and financial secretaries giv-
en by Mrs. Wilson Riffle and Mrs.
George Kiser, and the treasurer's re-
port by Mrs. Elwood Frock. Plans
were made for the annual benefit sup-
per, to be held in the Firemen's build-
ing on the first Saturday in Novem-
ber. The following committees were
appointed: Grace Rodgers, general
chairman, with Mrs. Percy Putman
as cochairman. Table committee com-
prises Mrs. Catherine Baker, chair-
man, assisted by Mrs. Norman Sau-
ble and Mrs. Ruth Sauble. It was
decided to conduct a table of baked
food in connection with the supper,
with Mrs. David Smith in charge.
No soliciting will be done, but each
member is asked to contribute.
Mrs. Louise Riffle made an inter-

esting report on the Cumberland
Convention. Aside from Mrs. Riffle,
delegates Mrs. Grace Rodgers, Mrs.
Hazel Lambert, Mrs. Ruth Fowler
and the president Mrs. Ethel Garber
attended. Mrs. Catherine Baker re-
ported on the rug project, which was
just finished. The birthdays of Mrs.
Ruth Baumgardner and Mrs. George
Kiser were recognized. The meeting
adjourned with the Lord's Prayer
and the Mizpah benediction.

THIS 'N' THAT
(Your Chatty Column)

With all my heart, I wish you every
morning

A. smile that shall last until the next
day's dawning.

I wish you health---life's greatest
wealth:

I wish you always near so that I may
help to cheer

Each future day and in some way—
help to bring you happiness!

How nice it was for the Service
man of our own Uncle Sam' upon his
return from Korea to "Break the
Bank" on the radio show on last
Friday morning for the sum of $2,250.
And it was all due to the little Span-
ish wife from South America who
knew all the answers about the coun-
try and its famous people! So you
see, boys and girls just what it means
to be up on that old time "GEO-
GRAPHY". Eh?
Thinking of Service men—a very

nice letter, arrived from that boy
"Frankie" who is surely as many
others having a grand time over-
seas. As I type this colunm, he is
on his way to Rome for ten days
with his "Buddy" and then the big
moment in his life will be in meeting
the Pope. He will be taken around
the city by "Nick's" sister who re-
sides right there and who is the
Opera singer. Hope she makes the
Metropolitan right here in these
good old United States for which she
is anticipating! Your Observer, wish-
es her the very best! On Labor Day
that soldier boy had a holiday and
with his Buddies Cruised up the
Rhine! (Ain't that Sumpthin grand?)
Now, here is the most odd thing

that ever could happen but leave it to
a child for the following. A little boy,
Johnny met with a harrowing experi-
ence when he crawled into an auto-
matic washing machine in his home.
A tiny playmate pushed the switch,
the machine went into action and be-
fore Johnny (4 years old) could be
rescued from the mechanism, he un-
derwent a rigorous beating suffering
a badly fractured leg in the process.
Then came several months of treat-
ment under a skillful surgeon. There
was twelve weeks in a cast, then a
cumbersome brace and finally Johnnie
was permitted to hobble around on
crutches. The brace was removed just
recently, the crutches are gone but
little Johnny will wear a metal plate
for the rest of his life!
With such adjectives as "Joy"—
(Continued on fourth page)

ALUMNI PLAN CARD PARTY
OCTOBER 11th

Plans and committtee appoint-
ments for the annual card party was
the initial business which was trans-
acted at the regular monthly meeting
of the Taneytown High School Alum-
ni Association, held in the High
school, Monday evening. The card
party will be held again in the' High
school auditorium, Thursday evening
October 11, at 8:00 p. m. The group
was assured that their reputation
for one of the finest parties in the
area would be upheld again this
year and the prize committee express-
ed confidence in efforts for over 100
fine prizes. All proceeds of the af-
fair will go to buying equipment for,
or to aid our local school.
The following committees were

appointed for this, the third annual
•event: Publicity: Leo Sanders, Joseph
Shaum, Janet Royer and Anne Wil-
son. Prizes: Elizabeth Baumgardner,
Mrs. Mary Clingan, Miss Betty
Jane Hahn, George Sauble and Jas.
Fair. Table and chairs: Francis My-
ers, John Harner, Eugene Vaughn,
David Wilhide and Elwood Harner.
Cards and score pads: Phyllis Smith
and Anna Sanders. Refreshments:
Mrs. Kenneth Shorb, Mrs. John
Harner, Mrs. James Fair and Mr.
and Mrs. William Rittage. Serving
committee, Shirley Null, Joanne
Velten, Minnie Ingram and Pearl
Bollinger.
Plans for the annual Thanksgiving

dance to be held Thanksgiving night
were discussed It was decided to ob-
tain "The Tones" of York, to provide
the music for the third consecutive
time and maqing it the fourth time
that the Alumni Association has ob-
tained this fine group for their
dances.
The coining basketball season was

discussed and concern was expressed
for the lack of eligible boys to play.
The armed services, colleges, and dis-
tant jobs are taking many of the Al-
umni players and anyone who would
like to tryout for the team are
urged to contact William Rittase and
John Harner. These two men will
report later about the possibilities
for a team. Prospects for a good
girls team seem very good and it is
felt that there will not be too much
of a problem there. Several appoint-
ments were made in connection with
the basketball teams and will be an-
nounced later.
The many needs of the High School

were discussed by the group. The
unsightly condition of the school
cafeteria- was mentioned and the con-
cern of the school administration over
this condition was expressed. The
cafeteria which was formerly the au-
ditorium has not been painted for
many years and the Board of Edu-
cation cannot provide for this job
this year, it was stated. Many so-
lutions to the problem were sug-
gested and Elwood Baumgardner, Leo
Sanders, John Harner and James
Fair were appointed to investigate
the possibilities and report back next
month.

It was decided to invite Mr. Man-
speaker, the new High School prin-
cipal, to the next meeting to meet
the group. After adjournment de-
licious refreshments were served by
Mr. and Mrs. Elwood Harner.
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OUR BLESSINGS.

'We used to sing a song en
titled—

Count your Blessings—name them

one by one, etc.

' It would be impossible for us to

count all our blessings, while New

York has been in need of rain we

have had an abundance of rain h
ere

auxd can truly thank God for this 
rich

blessing. Our fruit, our grain, our

bay give promise of rich crops. 
Truly

-we are blessed.
W. J. H.

0--

GRASS ROOTS OPINION

MILBANK, S. D., HERALD AD-

VANCE: "On his 77th birthday Au-

:gust 10, Herbert Hoover found him-

self in the midst of a resurgence for

integrity of office and independence

4of the American .citizen. Herbert

Hoover went down nineteen years

ago, with him the concept that gov-

ernme_nt should serve men to find

-their own way. A new concept was

.developed that stood 180 degrees

_Tram that position: Government should

-rule the lives of its citizens. There

are government regulations, govern-

-rnent bureaucracy, government loans,

:government borrowing, government

spending, deficit financing, and heavy

taxing."
WEST POINT, MISS., DAILY

TIMES LEADER: "If we are to meet

- the expenses of the defense program,

-we must provide employment for

everybody, and we must be careful

not to kill the goose that is laying

the golden eggs. Business and indus-

try must, of course, bear their re-

spective shares of the burden, but

men who draw salaries and wages

and who compose by far the largest

'element in our free enterprise sys-

tem must carry their share of the

load."

MANSFIELD, 01110, NEWS-

JOURNAL: "Inflation goes merrily

eon its way as Economic Stabilizer

-Eric Johnston okays the right of all

workers under WSB jurisdiction to

negotiate for 'escalator' clauses....

This fixes it up neatly for organized

groups in positioh to deal with em-

ployers but neglects the far greater

number of productive workers who

act as individuals....If the Federal

government is to be the determining

agent in such matters the only fair

(course would be to compel equaliza-

tion of pay for all workers in van.

cons lines of employment and not give

preferential treatment to ,those in

s *organized groups."

MONTICELLO, N. R., BULLETIN-

;SENTINEL: "Jefferson looked with

apprehension on the laws of Virginia

which supported the Anglican Church

of England. He opposed the laws

which provided for public taxation

for the support of the established

church. Jefferson provided his an-

swer to this question by writing in

1776 a s.tatute to change these laws

..The bill finally was enacted Janu-

ary 16, 1786. Americans today owe

a great debt to Tomas Jefferson for

his brave and courageous fight for

this principle which he thought was

right and just—the principle we take

-for granted—the principle that in

matters of religion every man shall

Nave the freedom to worship his God

as he desires without dictation from

the government."

SOMERSET, KY., JOURNAL:

"One of the most precious things

about this country is every man's

right to express his own personal op-

inion on any subject without fear of

punishment or retribution. We must

stand united in our opposition to

anything that would deprive us of

this privilege."

OLYMPIA, WN., DAILY OLYM-

PIAN. "Mr. Jefferson was a strong

supporter of republican government.

He championed the sovereignty of

the people. He believed in freedom of

thought and speech. He preached

economy in government, and small

public debt. He stood for a policy

of peace, strict construction of the

Constitution and sovereignty of the

states, metallic money, as a stand-

ard; a judiciary beyond the control of

the legislative and executive branch-

es of the government, rotation in of-

fice, elimination of monopolies."

MORRIS, MINN., SUN: "Political

and economic theories often sound

practical and enticing until we re-

duce them to a level where people

live and work." •
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IT PAYS TO LISTEN
Read The Ads

JOSEPH L. MATHIAS
"Mathias Monuments"
Granite - Marble - Bronze

Largest Selection Durable Materials
Builders of Fine Monuments for 45 Years

WESTMINSTER BALTIMORE HANOVER

BUILD WHILE YOU LIVE
9-7 & 21

Read the Advertisements

II
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INSURANCE OF ALL KINDS
Auto Insurance at Money-Saving Rates

Prompt, friendly nation-wide claim service wherever
you travel.

For information without obligation see.

ROBERT L. ZENTZ
TANEYTOWN, MD. Phone 4451

8-31-4t

1-tighway Safety is Everybody's Business

SCHOOL DAYS—CAREFUL

TANEYTOWN POLICE DEPT. MARYLAND STATE POLICE

Any Way You Look
At It...

CLEAN

•

•

cooking with Electricity
.0.15 BEST

The electric range is the "last word" in stoves. It is the result of years of

searching for a better way to cook. Just as obsolete methods of lighting have

given way to modern electric lighting, so old fashioned cooking methods are

being replaced by modern electric ranges.

Sooner or later you too will switch to electric cooking. You just won't

continue to put up with old-fashioned inconvenience.

But why wait? There is a modern electric range built for your particular

needs and for your purse and it's available right now. Don't deny yourself the

pleasure of cooking with electricity any longer.

see them at YOUR ELECTRICAL DEALER'S
or THE POTOMAC EDISON COMPANY
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NOW Is The Time
To Order
1 9 5 2

CALENDARS
— FOR

December Delivery
See our large line of samples

The Carroll Record Co.
TANEYTOWN MARYLAND
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—THE BR. SALSBURY'S WAY

It is estimated that about

23 lbs. of feed are

needed to rear a pullet to

maturity. This means each

pullet represents a

sizable investment by lay-

ing time, in both feed and

management  One way

to protect your investment

is to use Dr. Salsbury'.

6 Germex in poultry

drinking w ate r. GermeX

sanitizes water, kills many

in m 1 u) bacteria,
• •

iruses, and molds.

Reindollar Bros. & Co.

og.itue.
with Johnny Bell

in 2,000 died — who could have lived

In the bloody battle of New Orleans, 1815, 2,000
soldiers died in vain. Tragedy had marched in
step with victory for General Jackson, for the
war had been ended two weeks previously by
the Treaty of Ghent. A telephone, or any other
fast means of communication, could have spared
this waste of lives. As it is, rural telephone serv-
ice today is getting bigger and better, getting
more done faster. That's especially important in
times like these, when speed means defense pro-
duction—and production means peace.

The Pony Express goes galloping on 4
First, the American Indians relayed messages with
smoke signals. Then came the Pony Express gal-
loping mail across the land. Today, tall towers
flash Long Distance calls across those same spaces
by radio waves. It's a far cry from thundering
hooves, but the principle is the same. And the
modern method is invaluable in these times of
national preparedness — with the Long Distance
lines playing such a major role in history's big-
gest defense job.

4• Hard-working "farmhand"

Plenty of work—and pressed for time. That's often the
case on the farm. And the rural telephone helps get things
done faster. You save both time and money when you
put a real hard worker like your telephone to work. You
get really excellent service, too, when you co-operate with
your party-line neighbors. For instance, when you space
out your calls, you enable others to reach you quickly
with calls you wouldn't want to miss.

The Chesapeake 8,z Potomac Telephone Company

of Baltimore City.

fordomatic Drive, available with V-8 only,
optional at extra cost. Equipment, accessories
and trim sublect to change without notice.

' through
the t fi

with FORDOMATIC DRIVE
. • • the newest, finest, most flexible

automatic of them all!

TAKE A "TEST DRIVE"

AT YOUR FORD DEALER'S

You can pay more but you can't buy better!
F.D.A.F.

INSTANT RESPONSE . . . FLASHING

GETAWAY AT THE TOUCH OF YOUR TOE!

With Fordomatic, in traffic you are ct
once master of the situation. Take-offs
from stops are breath-takingly smooth!
Driving is amazingly simple. Once you
set the selector, all you do is step on the
accelerator and steer. Fordomalic does
the rest automatically!

SMOOTH, QUIET V-8 POWER; AUTOMATIC

MILEAGE MAKER SAVINGS TO BOOT!

Part of Fordomatic's sensational success
can be attributed to its powerful team-
mate, the famous Ford V-8 engine. It's the
same type engine now power7ng America's
highest-priced cars. With all its power
and pulse-stirring pep, it costs hundreds
less than most sixes! And Ford's Automatic
Mileage Maker squeezes the last ounce
of power out of every drop of gas.

EASY-ACTING, INSTANT STOPPING
DOUBLE-SEAL, KING-SIZE BRAKES

A little brake pedal pressure goes a long
way in a '51 Ford because Ford's brakes
actually utilize the car's momentum to stop,
safe and sure. They're double-sealed
against water and dirt, too, and King-
Size to take care of any emergency in
the yecrs ahead!

Crouse Motor Sales
FORD DEALER

Phone 4331 Taneytown, Md.

Medford Grocery Co.
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S tore Hours Every Week-day 8 to
PHONES: New Windsor 4881 

6.

Westminster 549J

When You

Ask For

Are Here

• $10.00 I

Prize Card
PERFECTION Dairy Water

Heaters

Build your Silo and Corn
Crib with Snow Fence
We have this Fence in 50
and 100 ft. rolls, 20c foot

TIMOTHY SEED

Small Gauge Wire
for Electric Fences

Also now have No. 9 Wire

Corn Baskets and Scoops

Terracotta Pipe and

Drain Tile

BARB WIRE $8.85 roll

DYNAMITE II

and man to do the work
for ditching

Largest Assortment
Congowall and Linoleum

Whiskey Barrels and Kegs
for Cider

We have some
Metal Roofing now

MEDFCIRD

1 ,GROCERY CO., INC.

mEDFORD. MARYLAND

"ALMOST' EVERVT1-11A16"
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CORRESPONDENCE
atest Items of Local News FurnishEd
By Our Regular Staff of Writers
We desire correspondence to reach our

ethce on Thursday, if at all possible, it

will be necessary therefore, for most let-

ters to be mailed on Wednesday morning.
Letters mailed on Thursday may not reach

vs in time.

FEESERSBURG

For the past several years house-
wives have been fussing about the
price of pepper and wondering just
why it was scarce. During the last
war Indonesia's pepper vines were
destroyed and our source of the pro-
duct was cut off making pepper hard
to get. Today India profits by the
fact that she controls the world's
pepper trade, and she speculates on
that product much the same way as
grain operators in this country spec-
ulates on wheat. While it costs the
Indian planter about $19.60 to grow
pepper the sale price for export is
about $840 per 600 hundred weight.
Housewives can expect pepper to re-
main at its present price for two
more years. By that time pepper
estates of Indonesia will be back in
full production and competition will
bring the price down. It takes 5 years
to raise a pepper plant from a seed-
ling to the roduction stage. Black
and white pepper comes from the
vine; black pepper from the dried
fruit and white pepper from the
same fruit when it is ripe. Pepper
and the cost of pepper has been the
cause of empires rising and falling.
Years ago pepper was used to
preserve food much more than it is
today. The dliscovery of our own
America was due to the lowly pep-
per plant for it was through the
search for new trade routes to the
spice lands of the East that led
Columbus across the Atlantic Ocean
and on to the mainland of our Con-
tinent. So when you pick up the
pepper shaker the next time, know
that in that small container lies the
secret of our being here on the land
of these United States of America.
Upon such a small thing does one's
destiny depend.
The annual Hoke-Roelke reunion

was held Sunday, Sept. 16 in Pipe
Creek Park, Taneytown. There were
about 125 members and friends of
the families present. A picnic dinner
was served at 1 p. m. followed by a
musical program and a magician's
act at 3 p. m. Election of officers for
1952 took place at a short business
meeting. Edgar • Spurrier of Fred-
erick was elected president; Mary
Spurrier, vice-president; Mrs. Ruth
Toms, secretary; Austin Hoke,
treasurer and George Roelke, pro-
gram chairman. To conclude the day's
events movies of the 1950 reunion
were shown followed by ice cream
and cake. Members of the two fam-
ilies came from Falls Church, 'Va.,.
Washington, D. C., Frederick and
Carroll County.
Week-end visitors of the Russell

Bohns were: Mr. and Mrs. Clarence
Myers and two children, of Balti-
more, and Mr. and Mrs. Alton Dut-
terer, of Frederick.
Mr. •and Mrs. Claude Bohn attend-

ed York Fair, on Friday.
For years I struggled to fry

bacon with the ends uncurled. Finally
I have found a way which I pass on
to you. Place a cake rack over the
bacon while frying or broiling and
there will be no curls.
Never bear more than one kind of

trouble at a time. Some people bear
three, all they have now, all they
ever had, and all they ever expect to
have.—Anon.
Maybe I shouldn't write about this

for I am sure to be "put on the car-
pet" by everyone but I must. The
other evening we were watching a
TV program when Ethel Waters came
on and sang some of her old songs
which had made her famous. When
she had finished and turned her
friendly, smiling face toward the
audience, a friend of ours stood up
and applauded. "A great lady" he
said, "A great American." It was at
that moment that I was proud of the
whole human race and knew for a
certainty that in the not too distant
future there will be no barrier be-
tween any race.
Coming events cast their shadows

before and Monday evening's sunset
was a warning that autumn is point-
ing her finger in our direction.

Nothing annoys the average parent
so much as listening to another tell
about his children until there's no
time left for him to talk about his.
The supper sponsored by the Elmer

Wolfe P.-T. A. Saturday evening was
greatly enjoyed by approximately
250 persons. The cooks turned out a
tasty meal and the committee should
take a bow. Mrs. Charles Messier, Jr.
served as chairman with Mrs. Joseph
Coshun, Mrs. Carroll Wilhide, Mrs.
Maurice Gray and Mrs. James
Coshun as assistants.

Mrs. Roger Royer and Mrs. Cleon
Wolfe gave a stork shower for Mrs.
Russell Wetzel at her home near
Clear Ridge, Monday evening. About
thirty-five friends and neighbors
surprised her with lovely gifts and
refreshments.

Again this year we have two Ger-
man exchange students in our com-
munity. One of them is living with
Mr. and Mrs. Roger Roop and is a
student at the Elmer Wolfe school.
The other one is with the Russell
Quisenberry, Finwood and is attend-
ing New Windsor school. The ex-
change students adapt themselves
very easily to American ways and so
far have been well liked by the stu-
dents and families they live with.
This is one of the best ways for peo-
ple everywhere to get to understand
each other better. Children have al-
ways proved to be gooh Ambassadors
for they adjust easily and are tol-
erant. It would be worthwhile if we
eould send two of oer students to
Germany to learn at first hand their
ways and ideas.
Among those attending York Fair

last week were, Mr. apd Mrs. George

Samuel Smith Miss Janet Smith,
Richard, David and Grayson Smith
and Miss Nancy Grinder.

Cattle rustling use to be confined
strictly to the West but in the past
couple years it has become a major
problem in the East. It has gotten
to be such a problem in Frederick
county that Judge Patrick Shnauffer
made it plain that he would impose
extra heavy penalties on anyone con-
victed of stealing cattle. In the west
they use to hang rustlers.
Congress has just given the green

light for Camp Detrick at Frederick
to expand to the extent of 29 million
dollars.

Miss Mary Lou Blankenship has
enrolled in the Maryland Institute of
Art for a four year course.
He who is not taught by his mother

will be taught by the world.—Bantu
Proverb.

FRizELLBUBG

Services in Emmanuel Buast Luth-
eran church on Sunday, September
23rd: Worship and Ingathering at
9:30; Rally Day Service, at 10:30.
Mrs. Charles Schaffer, of Westmin-
ster will be the guest speaker. Bring
canned goods, fruits and vegetables.

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Berwager, Mr.
and Mrs. Russell Berwager and
daughter, Shirley, all of Hanover;
Mr. 0. 1. Berwager and Mr. Arthur
Mummert were Wednesday evening
guests of Mr. and Mrs. John Ber-
wager and family.
Mr. and Mrs. Norman Myers, son

Edward and daughter, LaDonna, Mr.
and Mrs. Harry K. Myers attended
the Stott and Waltersdorff wedding
and reception at St. John's Episcopal
Church, Hagerstown, Saturday eve-
ning.
Howard Reichard, Jr., returned to

Bridgewater College, on Sunday, be-
ginning his senior year.
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Master, Mr.

and Mrs. Leslie Hoff, spent the week
end in Pocono Mountains and Dela-
ware Water-Gap, Pa..
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Wantz and

family, Mrs. Ruth Wantz, son ̂ Carl
and daughter, Shirley; Mr. and Mrs.
Sterling Miller, of Baughman's Val-
ley, attended the wedding of Mrs.
Wantz's niece, in Elizabethtown,
Pa., on Saturday.

Committees appointed for the
Fellowship covered dish supper, at
Baust Lutheran church, to be held on
Wednesday evening, October 3rd.,
are as follows: Arrangement. Isa-
belle Warehime, Kenneth Lambert,
and Audrey Myers; Menu, Margaret
Myers, Alice Zimmerman, Mildred
Lambert, Ruth Myers and Grace
Myers; Table, Walter and Alice
Marker, Ruth and David Starner,
Clarence and Edith Master; program,
Rev. and Mrs. Donald Warrenfeltz and
Wm. Flohr. All members, families
and their friends are welcome.
Please bring own place setting, cov-
ered dish of your choice and enjoy
the evening.
Mr. Charles is ill at his home.
Mrs. Ella Rinehart and son, Maus

were Friday dinner guests of Mr. and
Mrs. H. K. Myers.
Linda, daughter of Mr. and Mrs.

Frank Sufferan celebrated her 5th
birthday anniversary on Friday and
was a guest at the Victory, Hanover.
Others heard over the air from this
place were: Mrs. Frank Sufferan,
Mrs. Harry Cashman, Mrs. Howard
Carr and daughter, Peggy. Many
more happy anniversaries Linda.
"Thyme, a popular seasoning to-

day, was used by ancient Greeks as
incense for their temples."
The Farm Bureau Planning Group

No. 3, met at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Maurice Carr, Uniontown, on
Tuesday evening with 31 members
and guests present. Topic for discus-
sion was "The Family Form Policy
Review". The Planning Group news
was read also "By Faith, Our Nation
was Built"—by Mrs. John J. Flook.
Mrs. John Young gave an interesting
report of her trip to the National
Homemakers' convention, held in
August, at Lansing, Mirhigan. The
hostess served delicious refresh-
ments.
Mr. and Mrs. Sterling Zimmerman,

of Westminster; Mr. and Mrs. Wal-
ter Myers, visited Sunday with re-
latives and friends, at Frederick.
Mrs. Bessie Freet who had spent the
week there, returned home with them

Services in Baust Reformed Parish
House this Sunday, September 23:
Sunday school, at 9:30; Worship, at
10:30. Rally Day services on Sunday
morning, September 30th. A Fellow-
ship dinner at noon and a Film call-
ed, "Wonderful Life" will be shown
in the afternoon. Rev. Miles Reif-
snyder, Pastor.

Mrs. Mazie Sullivan, spent the
week-end at the home of her grand-
daughter and family, Rev. and Mrs.
James Robb, McKingsport, Pa.
Mr. Paul Berwager and Albert

Berwager, of Dayton, Ohio, spent
from Tuesday until Thursday with
their brother, Mr. John Berwager and
family, this place.
"The National Geographic Society

estimates that more than 230,000,000
persons see movies in the world each
week."
"Statistics show that more crimes,

suicides and insanity occur in sum-
mer than at say other time of the
year."
Eight women lived to see their

sons become president of the United
States: Polk, Grant, Garfield, Mc-
Kinley, Franklin Roosevelt and Pres-
ident Truman.

"No turning back the time,
The clock of life ticks on,
No bringing back by any ruse,
Days that are past and gone.
So why not try to live each day,
So well, that each small minute,
Will lighten every passing hour
And put new hope within it."

HOOPER'S DELiGHT

Sunday School Sunday morning, at
10 o'clock at Bethel. Everyone is
welcome.
We are sorry to hear Mrs. Sterling

Poole is in the Frederick Memorial
Hosuital. We wish her a speedy re-
covery.
Mr. and Mrs. Willard Barber spent

Sunday with Jerry and Jackie Lee
Farver while their parents, Mr. and
Mrs. Fred Farver attended the Moose

picnic held near Baltimore. Mr. and
Mrs. Harry J. Farver and daughter,
Faye Jean was at the same place
while Vickie Lynn stayed with her
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Harry 0.
Farver.

Mrs. Joseph Snyder and sons,
Chas. and Ross, spent Sunday with
Mr. and Mrs. Harry 0. Farver.
Mr. and Mrs. Harry J. Farver and
daughters called at the same, place
during the day..

Mrs. Raymond Hughes, Mrs. Ken-
neth Lamert, Mrs. Mildred Perry,
Mrs. Robert Miller and Mrs. Willard
Barber spent Saturday in Baltimore
shopping.
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Snyder and

son, Frankie, spent Sunday in Balti-
more.
Mark E. Redding, Westminster,

received his discharge from the Army
at Camp Kilner, N. J. and is now
at home with his wile and son.
Mr. and Mrs. Harry J. Farver and

daughters called on Mr. and Mrs.
Raynilond McKinney and daughter,
Saturday.
, Thomas Stultz attended the York
Fair, Friday.
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Franklin at-

tended the Fair on Thursday.

HARNEY

Mr. and Mrs. Phillip Mummert,
spent Thursday with their daughter,
Edith and Mc Quann. This group also
attended the York Fair last Thurp-
day.
Mr. Harry J. Wolff, who has been

confineh to his room by illness is
somewhat improved. His daughter,
Mrs. Olivia Witherow, of Avon, N.
Y., is still here helping to care for
him.
Mrs. Chas. Hoffman is still taking

it easy confiner to her bed with a
fractured pelvis bone. Her son-in-
law and daughter, Mr. and Mrs.
Chester Moose who live near them,
are making plans to have them re-
moved to their home soon.

Services at St. Paul's Sept. 23,
Harvest Home services at 9 a. m.
Rev. Held pastor. S. S, at 10 a. m.

It was announced a congregation
supper of St. Paul Lutherans in the
Parish House, Oct. 27, 1951. Not to
far. away. Don't forget the date
and plan to be present and watch the
papers for more news about it.

Holy Communion and Baptismal
Service in St. Paul church, Oct. 7,
at 10 a. in. Rev. Chas. Held, pastor.

Sept. 23, at 7:30 p. m. services at
U. B. church of this village. Rev.
Garvin, pastor.
Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Claybaugh and

Mrs. Edna Snider motored to Union
Bridge, to visit Mrs. Mary Spangler
who makes her home with Mrs. Rowe
Mr. and Mrs. Chas. R. Snider and

daughter, Anna and son Bill, Gettys-
burg R D. 5 visited Sunday with the
former's parents, Mr. and Mrs. Wm.
Snider, Jr.
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Leister are

planning to build a new home here.
The well driller is expected to drill
the well this week.
Mr and Mrs. Howard Conover, Lit-

tlestown, R. D., spent Sunday evening
with Mr. and Mrs. Claude Conover,
this place.
Mr. Norman Hess, received word

on Tuesday morning of the death of
Ella Key (Newcomer) Bush, wife of
the late Rev. L. A. Buso, of Carlisle.
She being a sister-in-law of Mr.
Hess. She was a former resident
of this village and leaves many
friends here. Her last visit here was
to the Lutheran picnic dinner July
28, when she' greeted many of her
old friends. She leaves four sons,
Marion, John, Carroll and Horace
and family and one sister, Douglas
Wolff and family.
Mrs. Mary Fleagle and Mrs. Smith

and daughter, Taneytown, visited
with Mrs. Effie Fream and family,
Tuesday evening.

Mrs. Murray 0. Fuss who has been
on the sick list for a year or more
was moved from her home to the
home of her son-in-law and daughter

.Mr. and Mrs. Robert Strickhouser,
on Monday.
Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Wantz and

Mr. and Mrs. Luther Fox, were
dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs. Dal-
las Shriven last Sunday in Littles-
town, Pa.

Callers in the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Harry Angell and Vaughn Peck
over the week-end were: Mr. and
Mrs. Robert Feight, Mrs. Olive
Feight, daughters, Anna Mae and
Sylvia, Breezewood, Pa.; Mr. and
Mrs. Wayne Hoffman, sons Larry
and Wayne, Jr., New Cumberland;
Mr. and Mrs. Ray Unholtz, daughter
Bonnie Lou, Harrisburg; Mr and
1V1i. Frank Bleyer, Steelton' Pa.;
Mr. and Mrs. Herbert Riclinger and
son, Franklin and daughter, Eileen
Taneytown R D. 1.

Master Arthur Ridinger, spent
Sunday afternoon with his grand-
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Rid-
inger and aunt Treva.
The Volunteer Fire Co., held their

monthly meeting Monday eve. Among
other business transacted was the
planning of a chicken anr waffle sup-
per to be held on the eve of Oct. 13,
in the Parish Hall. This ' will be
their 1st supper, so they will be ex-
pecting plenty of cooperation from
the citizens of the community to make
it a success.
Mr. Norman Hess and daughter.

Oatherine and Samuel D. Snider and
sister. Ruth. attended the funeral of
Mrs L. A. Bush, at Carlisle, Thurs-
day.

DIED
Obituaries. poetry and resolutions, charg-

ed for at the rate of five cents titer line.
The regular death notices publshed free
eltiewhere on our columns.

CHARLES W. SMITH
Charles W. Smith, formerly of near

Johnsville, died suddenly Saturday,
7:15 p. in., at the home of his step-
brother Wilford L. Smith, Taneytown
where he had resided for the past six
months.
Seated in his chair after supper,

he succumbed to coronary thrombosis,
age 66 years. He was a son of the
late John and Rebecca Fogle Smith
and had spent most of his life on a
!email farm near ,Johnsville before
recently removing to Taneytown. He

BRIDAL SHOWER

A surprise wedding shower was
given . by Mrs. Samuel Hostetter, of
Baltimore at her home 17 York St.,
Taneytown on Saturday evening,
Sept. 15th, for Miss Blanche Stull
whose wedding wedding to Francis Lookingbill
will take place on Saturday, Oct. 6.
The bride-to-be's color scheme of

pink, yellow and blue was used
throughout the shower.
After opening the very lovely and

useful gifts games were played after
which refreshments of chicken salad
sandwiches, potato chips, punch, ice
cream, cake and mints were served
to the following present: Mrs. Samuel
Hostetter, BAtimore; Mrs. George
Fream, Mrs. Allen Stull, Mrs. George
Lookingbill„ Miss Charlotte Look-
ingbill, Baltimore; Miss Hazel Hess,
Miss Ruth Stambaugh, Mrs. Janet
Rink, Westminster; Mrs. Harry Ar-
baugh, Westminster; Miss Blanche
Stull. 

I 

GLASS REUNION HELD

The fourth annual Glass reunion
was held Sunday, Sept. 16, at Mt.
Tabor Park with a record breaking
attendance of approximately one
hundred and fifty members from Ma-
ryland, Virginia, Tennessee, North
Carolina, Pennsylvania and Georgia.
A basket lunch was served at noon
followed by the business meeting at
2 o'clock. Officers of the previous year
were retained with the exception of
the President, Mrs. Nelson Bell
was elected to serve in that capacity
with the following former officers to
help: Vice-Pres., Wilson Glass; Treas,
Roy Glass; Historian, Georgia Hahn,
and Secretary, Imes Glass.

Prizes awarded were: Door prize,
Roberta Glass; Youngest Baby, Larry
Glass; Largest family, C. M. Glass;
Coming longest distance, Mrs. Geo.
Hunichen, of Georgia; Oldest lady
present, Mrs. W. E. Glass; oldest
man, Mr. C. M. Glass.
Before the business meeting began

Mrs. James C. Buchanan and friends
of Mt. Airy entertained the group
with a few songs. Mter the meeting
Rev. J3mes C. Buchanan, Padio
Pastor from WFMD, gave a short
talk on "Reunion".

After an afternoon of games, con-
tests and general talk the day ended
as usual by everyone looking forward
to the next reunion.

NATURAL DAM OUTINGS

Informal outdoor meetings saw
several events of interest to the boys,
especially at Natural Dam. Prepared
by Kenneth Frock, Pine Tree patrol
leader, contests in the water followed
the buddy system swimming period.
In a difficult swimming race in which
a pebble was carried on a silver spoon
in the contestant's mouth, Robert
Sentz, Robert Rock and Robert Fuss
placed in that order. A water tug-o'
war proved hilarious and a bit on the
splashy side.

Another week Andrew Alexander,
junior assistant, conducted a scramble
to retrieve numbered blocks scattered
over the water by Stanley F. Frock,
assistant scoutmaster. Among begin-
ners, William Abrecht and Lee Barnes
won first and second. Among swim-
mers, Romanus Haines and Robert
Sentz were the winners. Hard luck in
this contest resulted when someone
grabbed a block not bearing his as-
signed number, for he then gave it a
toss as far as he could.
A few nights were too cool for

swimming, so on one a corn roast
took its place, preceded by a brisk
round of the rugged chase known
as "Jack, Jack, shine your light."

IMPORTANT

There is urgent need for pocket
nove/s, 'games, etc., ,at the Naval
Base at Norfolk, Va., also need for
knitters. We are asked to knit 24
beanies by November 1st—Yarn and
directions supplied. Please contact
Miss Amelia Annan at once.

Electricity is available to 99 out of
every 100 Maryland farms. Is it help-
ing you as much as it could?

was a member of Grace Lutheran
church at Rocky Hill.

Surviving besides his step-brother
with whom he made his residence, is
a sister, Mrs. Lucy Rumpf, Freder-
ick, a step-sister, Mrs. Vernon Air-
ing, York, Pa.

Funeral services were conducted
Tuesday, 2 p. m., at the Funeral
Home in Taneytown. Rev. Raymond
Myers, officiated. Interment in Rocky
Hill cemetery, near Woodsboro. C. 0.
Fuss and Son, funeral directors..

MRS. HERBERT J. MYERS
Mrs. Sarah Elizabeth Myers, 79,

wife of the late Herbert J. Myers,
died at the home of her daughter,
Mrs. Alverta Mathias, 710 Frederick
St. Hanover, Saturday, at 8:30 p. m.
after an illness of seven weeks. A
former resident of Union Mills, Md.,
she was a member of St. Mary's
Lutheran church, Silver Run, Md.
Surviving are seven children, Mrs.

Alverta Mathias, Edgar C. Myers,
Baltimore; Carroll C. Myers, West-
minster R. D. 1; Bernard J. Myers,
Westminster R. D. 2; Herbert E. My-
ers, Westminster R. D. 1, and chil-
dren of an earlier marriage William
Moore, Hagerstown, and Raymond
Moore, Florida; fifteen grandchildren
and twelve great-grandchildren.

Funeral services were held Tuesday
morning at the J. W. Little and Son
Funeral Home, Littlestown. The Rev.
Dr. Frederick R. Seibel, her pastor,
officiated. Interment was in the
Methodist cemetery, Union Mills.

CARD OF THANKS

I wish to thank my friends and
neighbors for the flowers and kind-
ness they have shown fpllowing the
death of my husband.

MRS. C. F. KISER.

CARD OF THANKS

We wish to thank our friends for
the flowers, cards, letters, and other
acts of kindness shown us following
the death of Charles W. Smith.

THE FAMILY.

THIS 'N' THAT

(Continued from First Page)

"Cheer"—"Gleam" and "Tide:' there
should not be one dull moment of
house work for the little wife!
How convenient it is for our Post-

master around the town to walk right
next door to his daily routine. That
little house does appear up to the
minute with its new "front do"!
Did you know that it is exactly

50 years this month that President
McKinley was shot and died eight
days later?
Out toward Littlestown there is a

little bungalow all shining white
with the most attractive Canary col-
ored shutters and trim?

If you know of any girl who is
going off to College, it would be so
nice to surprise her with a "Going
Away to School Shower" Your Ob-
server attended one recently and all
the guests brought such useful gifts
to use and also to fix up her room
besides the lovely personal gifts.
rides to his office in Baltimore which
will make any lawyer smile. There is
a little aged lawyer and (most prom- 

n
Mrs. Norman Reindollar returned

inent one) who actually thumbs 
. 
u,

er hospital, Gettysburg. Mrs.
on Wednesday from the Annie

rides to his offihe in Baltimore which "
he has been doing for many years. Reindollar is much improved.
He is of the 'Old School' and dresses
in the heighth of Fashion always
carrying a cane (even if he does not
have to use it)! He is just about the
most interesting individual; I have
ever met and the nice part is that he
takes an interest in everything and
every one in life. So you see, Folks
what I mean when I write in -this
column, "IF YOU ARE INTEREST-
ED IN LIFE---LIFE WILL BE IN-
TERESTED IN YOU". There nev-
er will be a dull moment!

Ladies, if you want your house to
keep immaculate at all times, do not
fail to White Wash that cellar. Your
cellar should be as nice a room as
any in your house. , If it is damp
there is a remedy for that, too and
then you can place a rug down there
and it makes a nice playroom for the
Kiddies.
Have you seen the latest dress

slaes in pictures—and this right
from New York and Philadelphia—
shoes will appear glamorous this
Fall and Winter with sparklers here
and there in the material. Last yenr
it was the hose and this year the
shoes with those highlights.

If someone would - ik you which
advertising in magazines appealed
to you and appeared just different
in colors and more interesting which
ones would you say? Your Observe/-
would answer right off "Serta" 'and
that pronounced handkerchief of soft
Tissue which is startling white. 'Re-
member?
Do you know "The Legend of The

Dogwood?" There is a legend that
at the time of the Crucifixion, the
Dogwood had been the size of the
Oak and other forest trees. So firm
and strong was the tree that it was
chosen as the timber for the cross.
To be used thus for such a cruel pur-
pose greatly distressed the tree and
Jesus, nailed upon it sensed this and
in His gentle pity for all sorrow and
'suffering said to it, "BECAUSE OF
YOUR REGRET AND PITY FOR
MY SUFFERING, NEVER AGAIN
SHALL THE DOGWOOD TREE
GROW LARGE ENOUGH TO BE
USED AS A CROSS. HENCE-
FORTH, IT SHALL BE SLENDER
AND BENT AND TWISTED AND
IT'S BLOSSOMS SHALL BE IN
fORril. OF A CROSS—TWO LONG
AND TWO SHORT PETALS. AND
IN THE CENTRE OF THE OUTER
EDGE OF EACH PETAL, THERE
WILL BE NAIL PRINTS, BROWN
WITH RUST AND STAINED WITH
RED AND IN THE CENTRE OF
THE FLOWER WILL BE A CROWN
OF THORNS AND ALL THOSE
WHO SEE IT WILL REMEMBER!"
So long, Folks. Have a grand

week-end. Will be seeing you next
week. D.V. and until then "WHEN
SOMEONE KNOCKS A BROTHER
PASS AROUND THE LOVING
CUP. SAY SOMETHING GOOD
ABOUT HIM. IF YOU HAVE TO
MAKE IT UP!"

Faithfully,
YOUR OBSERVER.

COMMUNITY LOCALS
(Continued from First Page)

Mrs. E. A. Campney, Baltimore, is
spending this week with Doctor and
Mrs. Wm. P. Bradley, Jr. and sons.

The Taneytown E. U. B. Ladies'
Aid and Youth Choir will meet at the
church, Thursday, Sept. 27th.

CHILDREN'S AID WILL SOLICIT
FUNDS
---

Once again the Children's Aid So-
ciety calls for help from the good
people of Carroll County, land once
again the call will be answered.
Since its organization in 1929 this
Society has functioned tirelessly and
carefully, with its officers and mem-
bers giving cheerfully of their time
and money in the effort to help where
help is most needed. Laboring un-
der the very real handicap of lack of
funds, the Children's Aid has carried
on through the years, bringing hope
and sunshine into the lives of many
who hitherto had viewed these won-
derful things as almost none-existent.
This year the campaign starts on

October 8, and lasts through October
2. A thorough canvas will be made
in the matter of soliciting funds; but
you may always mail in your con-
tribution. Please remember that no
other local organization specializes
in help for children—these grand lit-
tle girls and boys who some day will
carry life's load willingly. Be gen-
erous, and be glad.

WASHINGTON TRIP

An older boy activity much en-
joyed was a trip to Washington,
where the zoological gardens were vis-
ited and a Yankee-Senator baseball
game witnessed. Explorer Scouts
and their friends were captained on
this occasion by the troop's Explor-
er Advisor, Stanley F. Frock.
The meeting last night was opened

by the Scoutmaster, with Donald
Lawyer, Fox leader, in charge of a
capture the flag contest, and the clos-
ing ceremonies conducted by Robert
Fuss, Pine Tree assistant. A leaders
Green-Bar session will be held to-
morrow evening in the Scout hall
under the direction of Robert Bowers
newly elected senior patrol leader.

Every 5 steps you cut off your daily
chore routines, will save you a mile
of walking in a year.

The Barts E. U. B. Ladies' Aid will
have their annual birthday social at
the church this Saturday, Sept. 22,
instead of Friday.

--
Miss Myrtle Morris and Miss Nell

Hess, Baltimore, are spending from
Wednesday until Sunday with Misses
Edith and Hazel Hess.

--
.Phillip Ohler will enroll at West-

ern Maryland College, Westminster,
the 24th, and Miss Lois Ohler and
Donald Smith the 27th.

Mr. and Mrs. Austin Rice, Harris-
burg, Pa., spent Wednesday after-
noon and evening with Mr. and Mrs.
George Hamer and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur W. Hess, of
Toronto Ontario Canada, are spend-
ing two weeks visiting Mr. and Mrs.
Ralph Hess and other relatives and
friends.

Mrs. Guy Ourand, Silver Spring,
spent the week-end at the home of
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Crapster. Wirt
Crapster accompanied her home Sun-
day for a visit.

Robert, 19-year-old son of Mr. and
Mrs. J. Donald Boone, enlisted Sept.
18th in the Air Force and left the
next day for Sampson Air Force
Base, Geneva, N. Y.

Mr. arid Mrs. Charles Cluts, Keys-
ville, who accompanied Mr. and Mrs.
Guy Boller Rocky Ridge, on a ten-
day tour of the South returned on
'Tuesday evening. Points of interest
in ten states were touched.

At his home at Caledonia Mr. Er-
nest Dunbar has a tomato plant sev-
v m feet tail. Fe has now extended
a string P orn the :ole to his garage
roof and if winter holds off, the to-
mato may start up the roof.

M:. an1 Yre. Ralph Hess, Mr. and
Mrs. Harry Nusbaum, near town;
Mr and Mrs. Hobson Crouse and
Mr. and Mrs Emory Gitt, Gettysburg
Pa., spent last week-end in Potter
County in the 'Allegany Mountains.

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Myers and
daughter, Oneida, town; Mr. and Mrs.
Glenn Stambaugln Union Bridge,
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Harman and family
of Spray, N. C., spent the week-end
together at Endless Caverns, Va.

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Baumgardner
and daughters, Nancy and Ellen, of
Winchester, Va., spent Sunday with
his mother, Mrs. Claude Derr. Mr.
and Mrs. Ralph Stauffer, York, spent
Wednesday evening with Mr. and
Mrs. Derr.

The tent services that are being
conducted by the Rev. Jas. E. Buch-
anan near the Fair Grounds will close
Sunday afternoon at 3 p. in. with
special music. Services will be held
tonight and Saturday night with spec-
ial music by a gospel trio.

Mr. Claude Derr fell last Friday
from a porch roof, a distance of about
fifteen feet down on a concrete pave-
ment. He suffered a head injury, a
broken wrist and is badly bruised. He
was removed in the ambulance to the
Annie Warner Hospital, Gettysburg,
where he was a patient until Sunday
evening. Mr. Derr is doing nicely
considering his injuries.

Again we urge our contributors to
get their news in early in the week,'
when possible. This will not only
help us but insure getting the items
in and good positions. Nearly every
Week we are compelled to leave out
items that we receive late Thursday
and Friday that Could be handed us
early in the week. Whenever possi-
ble get your items of news in early
in the week.

A County Christian Endeavor Rally
will be held in the Evangelical Unit-
ed Brethren Church, Sunday after-
noon, Sept. 30, at 2:30 p. m. The Rev.
Charles 0. Heyward, executive secre-
tary of the Maryland C. E. Union
will be the speaker. The E. U. B.
church will have charge of the devo-
tions. The Grace Reformed church
of Taneytown and the Keysville
Lutheran church will supply special
music. The public is invited.

A weiner roast was held at the Re-
creation Park, Taneytown. Those pres-
ent were: Mr. and Mrs. Preston Smith,
Mr. and Mrs. Maurice Baker, Mr. and
Mrs. Roland Reaver, Mrs. Kenneth
Wolfe and Darlene Haines, Mr. and
Mrs. Wilmer Baker and family, Mr.
and Mrs. Ralph Baker and family,
Mrs. Herman Glover and children, Mr.
and Mrs. Norman Graham and son,
Mr. Lloyd Baker and daughter, Mr.
and Mrs. Lester Kidd and daughter,
Mr. and Mrs. Fern Baker and family,
Roland Reaver, Jr., Hilda Reaver and
Carylan Shipley.

Mrs. Glenn Kinnaman, of Hillcrest
Park and her guests, her sister. Lt.
Bernadette Gryska, of Mitchell Field,
Long Island, N. Y., and Miss Angela
Arnold, of Washington. D. C., spent
Thursday in Chicago. The highlight
of the trip was a "behind the scenes
tour" of NBC in the Merchandise
Mart as the guest of Bill Griskey,
NBC announcer and cousin of Mrs.
Kinnaman and Lt. Gryska. Besides
meeting many personalities they
witnessed the television of the Wayne
King show, Tom Duggan with the
sports news, and Herbie Mintz at the
piano. Griskey has been with NBC
for the past six years.

All true Science represents a moral
and spiritual force, which holds the
earth in its orbit. This force is
Spirit, that can "bind the sweet in-
fluences of the Pleiades", and "loose
the bands of Orion."—Mary Baker
Eddy.
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SPECIAL NOTICES
THIS COLUMN is specially for Wants,

'Lost, Found, Short Announcements, Per-

sonal Property for sale. etc.
CASH IN ADVANCE payments are de-

sired in all eases.
REAL ESTATE for sale, Two Cents

each word. Minimum charge, 50 Cents.

SMALL ADVERTISEMENTS will be in-

serted under this heading at One Cent a

word each week, counting name and ad-
dress of advertiser-two initials or a date,

.couned as one word. Minimum charge,

25 ce•ts.

STOCK BULLS and Cows, loaned

to reliable farmers.-Harold S.

Mehring. 7-15-tf

CARD PARTY, Oct. 8, at 8:30

,Opera House, Taneytown, Md. Plenty

of prizes. Refreshments on sale.

Benefit of Legion Auxiliary. 9-21-3t

HOME-MADE BROOMS for sale

while they last.-Roy Baumgardner,

Phone Taneytown 4873.

FOR SALE-Empire
Grain Drill.-Newton
Starner's Dam. Phone
3708.

Jr. 8-hoe
Mack, near
Taneytown

PIGS FOR SALE, 8 weeks old;

also Chicken Feeders and Waterers,

etc.-Apply A. B. MacLachlan, Route

1, Taneytown Phone 4823.

CHICKEN AND OYSTER Supper,

Mt. Union Church, Nov. 3, 4 to 8 P.

M. Children, 60c; Adults, $1.00.
9-21-7t

PIGS FOR SALE-Roy Baum-

gardner, Phone Taneytown 4873.

CARD PARTY, Oct. 15, at 8:30,

Opera House, Taneytown, Md. Ben-

efit of St. Joseph's Church. Plenty of

prizes. Refreshments on sale.
9-21-4t

WANTED TO RENT furnished or

partly furnished 2 Bedroom House

with conveniences between Taney-

town and Fountaindale. Phone Tan-

eytown 4817. 9-21-3t

CORN PICKING AND BAILING

-Call L. J. Dennis, Taneytown 3585.
9-21-4t

• COMMUNITY SALE - Eyler's

Auction Barn, Thurmont, Md., Tues-

day, Sept. 25, 1951, at 6:30 P. M.

A good lot of Merchandise, also 3

Bedroom Suites-Call 3533 for truck-

ing service.-Mrs. Joe Eyler.

I AM TAKING orders now for

Crocheted Gifts.-Mrs. L. L. Fink, R.

R. 1-M, Taneytown, U. B. 3754.

GET YOUR COMBINATION door

at The Reindollar Co. Cheapest

place in town. ' 9-21-3t

TAKING ORDERS now for made-

to-measure Suits and Topcoats from

the new fall and winter patterns.-

Rob-Ellen Shop. 9-21-8t

FOR SAL -15  Bushels Certified

Vigo Seed Wheat. Apply A. B. Mac-

Lachlan; Route 1, Phone Taneytown

4823.

WE GIVE and REDEEM S & H

Green Stamps. Finish your old books

,or start new ones now.-Rob-Ellen

Shop. 9-21-8teow

WANTED-Washing to do at

bome.-Mrs. E. M. Dodson, 31 George

St., Taneytown, Md.

FOOD SALE-Saturday, Sept. 22,

1951, at 9 A. M., Firemen's Building,
Taneytown, Md., sponsored by Youth
Fellowship Club of Piney Creek
Presbyterian Church, benefited by
church choir.

FOR SALE-Good used Kelvina-
tor Refrigerator, Deluxe Model, $75.
-Brown Equipment Company, Tan-
eytown.

FOR SALE-Used Lumber and
Doors.-Murray Baumgardner, 14
Frederick St., Taneytown, Md.

FOR SALE or Trade Beagle Pups,
litter registered, 8 months old. Cheap.
Not started.-Raymond Reynolds,
Harney, (Md., Phone 3547. 9-1.-2t

FOR SALE-Grey Enamel Kitchen
Range, equipped with oil burners.-
Mervin Conover, Taneytown. 9-21-2t

FOR SALE - McCormick-Deering
Manure spreader, reasonably priced.
-Benjamin Cutsail, Taneytown, Md.,
Phone 3164.

FOR SALE-Wine colored Dress
Coat, teen age size 12, good as new;
also White Roller Skates, size 5-
Call after 5 p. m. Phone 825F3 West-
minster. 9-21-2t

FOR SALE-1948 Chevrolet Panel
Truck, perfect condition.-Benjamin
Cutsail, Taneytown, Md., Phone 3164.

LOST, STRAYED or Stolen, Cat,
medium gray, dim stripes. Answers
to name "Mother" friendly. Reward
-23 Middle Street, Taneytown, Md.

OPPORTUNITY FOR MAN or
Woman to have own business without
investment, servicing 800 family
route in Carroll County. We furnish
stocks, equipment on credit. Need
car. Experience unnecessary. Write
Watkins Co., Box No. 367R, Dept.
NE, Newark, N. J. 9-14-4t

FOR SALE-Peach Butter- -Wm.
Naill, Route 2 Taneytown. Phone
3791. 9-14-2t

TURKEY SUPPER, served fam-
ily style, Saturday, Oct. 6th, in Fire-
men's building, Taneytown, sponsor-
ed by Pythian Sister Temple. Begin
serving at 3:30 p. m. Adults, $1.25;
Children under 10 years, 60 cents.
Home-made cakes. 9-14-4t

WANTED-Mason Work of all
kinds; also Plastering and any other
similar work. Have your chimneys
fixed-before cold weather sets in. No
job too big or too small.-Paul
Blanchard at Starner's Dam. Phone
3598. 9-7-12t

CHICKEN AND OYSTER SUP-
PER served family style, Saturday,
Sept. 29, in Firemen's Building, Tan-
eytown, sponsored by Mite Society
of Lutheran church, beginning at 4
o'clock. Adults, $1.25; Children under
10, 60c. Home-made cakes for sale.

9-7-4t

DOUBLE HOUSE for sale, 68 York
Street, Taneytown. 8-17-tf

CHURCH NOTICES

This column is for the free use of all
churches, for a brief announcement of
services. Please do not elaborate. It is
always understood that the public is in-
vited to services.
Churches are especially given free use

of our Church Notice Column, for brief
notices concerning regular or special ser-
vices.

Trinity Lutheran Church, Taney-
town. Rev. Glenn L. Stahl, Pastor.
Sunday School, 9:30 A. M.; Worship
Service, at 10:30 a. m.

Walnut Grove Dunkard Brethren
Church at Kump's-Sunday School, at
9:30A. M.; Preaching, 10::)0 A. M.-
Birnie Shriner, Minister.

St. Joseph's Church, Frederick St.,
rev. Charles J. Walker, Pastor. Sun-
day Masses; 8 o'clock (High) 10:15
Low Mass. Week Day Masses, 6:30
o'clock, except Saturdays, 7:30. Con-
fessions; Saturdays, 4 to 5-7 to 8;
Sundays Holy Days and first Fri-
days before the Masses. First Fri-
days; Mass at 6:30 and Benediction.
Holy Days, Mauses at 6 and 8 o'clock.
Baptisms or. Sunday, at 11:30
o'clock.

Union Bridge Lutheran Parish. St.
James-S. S., 9:30 a. m.
Rocky Ridge-Worship at 9:30 a.

m.; Harvest Home Service; S. S., at
10.30 a. m.

Keysville-S. S., 9:30 a. m.; Wor-
ship, 11 a. in., Harvest Home Ser-
vice. R. S. Poffenberger, Supply
Pastor.

Uniontown Lutheran Church-Don-
ald Warrenfeltz, Pastor. Emmanuel
Baust-Harvest Home Service, 9:30
A. M.•
' 

Rally Day in S. S., 10:30 a. nn
St. Paul's-S. S., 9:45 a. M.; Har-

vest Home Service, 11 a. M.
Mt. Union-S. S., 9:30 a. m.
St. Luke-S. S., 10 a. in.

Gracie Evangelical & Reformed
Church Charge, Rev. Morgan Andreas
pastor. Taneytown-9:15 a. in., Sun-
day Church School; 10:30 a. m., The
Lord's Day Worship. Sermon sub-
ject: "Seeking the Sufficient Saviour"
7:30 p. in., The showing of the motion
picture, "The Wonderful Life", in the
sanctuary. There will be no C. E.
meeting. Thursday, at 8 p. in., the

SALESMEN'S Order Books are
supplied by The Record from the man-
iracturers, at standard prices. About
Aix weeks are required for filling such
srsi Orb

FOR SALE-Typewriter Ribbons
snd Supplies; Carbon Paper-Charles

Stonesifer, Representative of Rem-
flown Rand. Inc. 7-16-ti

DITCHING DYNAMITE and an
experienced man to do the work.-
Medford Grocery Company, Inc.. Med-
ford, Md. 3-16-tf

NOTICE-Dial 3483 for your Sand,
Stone, Blocks and General Hauling.-
Thurston Putman. 7-21-tt

BALE ELEVATORS-Gulf Fly
Spray and other insect killers, Weed-
No- More at reduced prices, Fencing,
Pipe, Stanchions, Columns, Windows,
Milk Coolers, Food Freezers, Milk-
ing Machines, Water Heaters, Wash
Vats, Dairy Supplies, Paints, Enam-
els, Laddei's, etc, sales and service.-
John D. Roop, Linwood, Phones Un-
ion Bridge 4403 and 4707. 10-13-tf

HAULING OF ALL KINDS, also
Slab Wood for sale.-Phone 5613
Marlin Fair. 9-7-4t

LADIES-Do you want healthy
luxurious Potted Plants for the win-
ter? Use B. C. A. (Bacterial Com-
post Activator) a plant culture teem-
ing with Soil Bacteria. 50c per lb.
will take care of all of your indoor
flowers, all winter. Many other us-
es. Come in and ask about it.-The
Reindollar Company, Phone Taney-
town 3303. 12-1-ti

GOOD USED CARS wanted. High-
est Prices Paid.--Crouse's Motor
Sales 2-25-ti

SALES & SERVICE Airway, Sani-
tizors, Vacuum Cleaners. Write R. D.
7, Westminster, Md. Phone 957-W-3-
R. S. Zeigler. 8-10-10t

BABY CHICKS.-New Hampshire
und Rock Hamp. cross, each week.
All state blood tested.-Stonesifer's
Elatchery, Keymar, Phone Taneytown
4931. 7-2-ti

• PIANOS-Beginners Pianos, $29.
Practice Pianos. $49. Student Pianos.
$99; New Spinets, $299 up. Write
for price list. REMEMBER-CRAM
ER has been Satisfying Customers
for 40 years.-Cramer at Barbara
Fritchie Candy Shoppe, Frederick,
Md. 12-16-tf

BE PREPARED-For the unex-
oected. Let us insure you adequate
ly.-Percy M. Burke, 231 E. Main St,
Westminster. Md. Tele. 1120. 4-15-tf

BARBER SHOP open Monday
through Thursday 12:30 A. M. to 9:30
P. M., Friday and Saturday, 8 A. M.
to 10 P. M., at Melvin Sell's Store,
Taneytown-Littlestown Road. Price
reasonable.-J. Salley. 7-6-ti

THE WOMEN'S GUILD of Grace
Reformed church will hold their an-
nual supper Saturday evening, Oct.
20, in the Firemen's Building.

PAPER HANGING and all other
jobs of interior deenrating including
Plaster Repairs. Call Ralph David-
son for a look at latest Wall Paper
Samples.-Taneytown 4792.

11-7-ti

PLACE YOUR ORDER now for
dried Brewer's Grain for October
shipment, $65 per ton off car.-
Southern States Tancytown Coop,
Phone Taneytown 3261. 9-7-4t

PUBLIC SALE-Saturday, Oct.
27, 1951. Live Stock and Farming
Implements.-George Brown, R. D.
7, Tyrone, Md. Harry Trout, Auct.

9-7-5t

RENT-Our Floor Sander and
Edger. Lowe Brothers Paints. Mc-
Culloch Chain Saws.-Brown Equip-
ment Co., Taneytown Md. Phone 3061.

8-10-tf

SMOKER APPLES for sale. No
Sunday salea-Edgar Wilhide, Key-
mar, Md. 9-14-3t

monthly meeting of the Churchmen's
Brotherhood.

Keysville-- 9 a. m., The Lord's Day
Worship. Sermon subject: "Seeking
the Sufficient Saviour." 10 a. m., Sun-
day school. Monday at 7:30 p. m., the
showing of the motion picture, 'The
Wonderful Life."

Church of God, Uniontown Circuit
Rev. John H. Hoch, pastor. Union-
town-Sunday School, 9:30 A. M. Mr.
Herbert Ecker, Supt. Preaching,
Service, 10:30 a. in. Dr. George T.
B. Davis, of Philadelphia, Pa., will
be our special speaker at 10:30 a. m.
and 7:30 p. m. Dr. Davis. is an
authority on The Land of Palestine.
Evening Service, at 7:30 p. m. The
Reisterstown Men's Chorus will sing
Prayer Meeting on Wednesday eve-
ning at 7:30 p. m.

Wakefield-Sunday School, 10 a.
m. Mr. Charles Hahn, Supt. Prayer
Meeting and Bible Study on Friday
evening at 8 p. m.
Frizellburg-Sunday School, 10 A.

M. Mr. Howard Carr, Supt. Prayer
Meeting and Bible Study on Thurs-
day evening, at 8 P. M.

Mayberry-Sunday School, 11:15
A. M. Mr. William Lawyer, Supt.

Presbyterian Church. Rev. Chas.
S. Owen, Pastor. Piney Creek-9:30
a. M., Service of Worship and Ser-
mon; 10:30 S. S.
Emmitsburg-11 a. m., Service of

Worship and Sermon; 9:45 a. m.,
S. S.
Taneytown-7:30 p. in., Evening

Service; 10 a. m., S. S.

St. Paul's Lutheran Church (Har-
ney)-9:00 a. in., Worship and Ser-
mon, Harvest Home Service. 10 a.
m., Sunday School.
Mt. Joy Lutheran Church-9:30

a. m., Sunday School; 10:30 a. m.
Worship and Sermon. Chas. E. Held,
Pastor.

Jehovah's Witnesses-Sunday, Bi-
ble Study, 10 a. m., "Let Your King-
dom Come", also Daily Bread, For-
giveness and Deliverance. Meetings
also Tuesday 8 p. m., and Friday,
7:30 p. in., at E. Baltimore St., Tan-
eytown, Md. Minister, George My-
ers.

Piney Creek Church of the Breth-
ren, Rev. M. A. Jacobs, Pastor.-9:30
A. M., Sunday School; 10:30 A. M.,
Worship. Sermon by the Pastor; 7:30
P. M., C. B. Y. F. program and
election.

Taneytown Evangelical United
Brethren Church. Rev. A. W. Garvin,
pastor Taneytown-S. S., 9:30 A. M.;
Worship, 10:30 a. m.; Sr. C. E., 6:30
p. M.; Wednesday, Jr. C.' E., 3:30 p.
m.; Prayer Service, 8:00 p.
Barts-S. S., 9:30 a. m.; Ladies'

Aid will meet on Saturday, Sept. 22
at the church.
Harney-Worship, 7:30 p.

TANEYTOWN HIGH SCHOOL
NEWS

(Continued from First Page)

day Sept. 20th, Harry Dougherty,
Jr., with a total of $101.
The highest home room each day

was awarded with a box of Hershey
bars. The pupils of Mrs. Urith Ship-
ley won this award for four days. Mr.
Charles*Ecker won the candy on
Sept.. 13, Mrs. MacDonald Sept. 18,
Miss J. Brown Sept. 14, Mr. Musser
Sept. 20. The total for the high
school for the campaign was $2909.70

A SALUTE TO THS
Being principal of a high school

is a new experience to me and so far
one that has been gratifying. This
gratification stems from two things:
the nice reception you have
given me and the responsibility you
have accepted.

It has been a pleasure to see the
halls kept in good condition, class-
rooms neat and orderly, the grounds
litter-free and the general appearance
of the school one that indicates a fine
espirit de corps,
Another evidence of the feeling of

pulling together that I think you have
shown is the result to date in the mag-
azine campaign. Until now you have
sold more than $2,100 worth and such
a result could not have been achieved
without a united effort of pulling for
Taneytown High.

I salute you for your fine effort.
With such spirit THS will be tops
in all it does.
P. S.-Since writing the above I

have just learned that our total in
the magazine campaign is over $2900.
This is an average of more than $9.00
per pupil. You have put Taneytown
High over the top.
JOHN MANSPEAKER, Principal.

PROCEEDINGS ORPHANS' COURT

James A Lockard, executor of the
estate of Fannie F. A. Lockard, de-
ceased, settled his first and final ac-
count.

Lillie I. Gosnell, executrix of the
estate of Armfield Gosnell, deceased,
settled her first and final account.
G. Emory Hahn, administrator of

the estate of Margaret A. Babylon,
deceased, settled his first and final
account.

Elsie M. Snyder ,administratrix of
the estate of Minnie E. Willey, de-
ceased, settled her first and final ac-
count.
Ralph F. Weybright, administrator

of the estate of Irene Stoner Wey-
bright, deceased, filed inventories of
real and personal estate and debts
due, received order to sell goods and
chattels.
G. Albert Harrison, administrator

of the estate of Norman G. Harrison,
deceased. filed inventory of goo
and chattels and received order to
sell.
The last will and testament of

Charles 0. Clemson, deceased, was
admitted to probate and letters testa-
mentary Iwl.re granted unto Mary
Gray Clemson, who received order to
notify creditors and warrants to ap-
praise goods and chattels.

Letters of administration on the
estate of H. Olevia Manahan, deceas-
ed, were granted unto Clarence L.
Manahan, who received order to no-
tify creditors and warrant to ap-
praise real estate.

Sale of real estate of Edward
Strevig, deceased, was finally rati-
fied by the Orphans' Court.

MARRIAGE LICENSES

Daniel E. Sutpin to Betty V. Lutz,
Owings Mills, Md.
Robert L. Arter to Bertha E. Gor-

such, Littlestown, Pa.
Carl Graybeal to Kate Forbes, of

Sykesville, Md. Rt. No. 1.
Joseph N. Hollenshead to Margar-

et Seacrest, Hagerstown, Md.
Daniel Leroy Myers to Florence

Pauline Nace, Dover, Pa.
. Lonnie R. Boyd to Mary L. Huff,
York, Pa.
Mark R. Harry to Dorothy J. Gel-

singer, Mt. Holly Springs, Pa.
James Howell Davis, Jr. to "Evelyn

Virginia Toland, Westminster, Md.
Casimir Beksinski to Irene Nowo-

gorska, Baltimore, Md.
Walter R. Gause to Elsie G. Mur-

ray, New Windsor, Md.
Franklin R. Moorefield to Frances

0. Ray, Danville, Va.
Thomas E. Forry to Helen N. Senft

Porters Sideling, Pa.
Frederick B. Senseney to Ruth E.

Baile, Westminster, Md.
Thomas D. Russell Jr. to Elizabeth

E. Ensor, Baltimore 12, Md.
Charles Dale Keefer to Madge Eli-

zabeth Fowble, Woodbine, Md.

LITTLESTOWN-TANEYTOWN

The first game in the best out of
three playoff resulted as follows:,

Littlestown Ab H 0 A
Wolf, cf
Hull, c
Strine, 2 b
W. Mehring, ss
C. Crouse, lb
Fuhrman, rf, p
Harner, 3 b
G. Crouse, If
Gerrick, if, p
Barnes, p
Witherow, rf
:*Staub

Totals
Taneytown
Stout, ss 4 1
Shaffer, 2b, p • 5 1
Houck, If 3 1
Shank, 3b 4 1
Gilbert, p, cf 5 0
Wildasin, c 4 2
Bloom, cf, 2b 1 0
Hitchcock, lb 4 0
Crapster, rf 1 1

- - - -
Totals 34 7 27 8

*Struck out for Gerrick in 9th.
Littlestown 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 3 0- 4
Taneytown 3 1 0 2 1 0 5 1 x-13
Errors: Littlestown 7, Taneytown

4. Runs: Stout 3, Shaffer 1, Houck
3 Shank 1, Wildason 2, Bloom 1,
Crapster 21, Wolf 1, Hull, Strine,
Witherow. Two-base hits: Fuhrman,
Stout. Three-base hits: Shaffer. Sac-
rifices: Shaffer, Bloom. Double plays:
Stout to Shaffer to Hitchcock. Bases
on balls: Barnes 6, Furhman 6, Gil-
bert 3. Strike-outs: Barnes 3, Fuhr-
man 3, Gilbert 4, Shaffer 3. Hits off:
Barnes 1 for 6 runs in 3 2-3 innings;
Fuhrman 6 for 7 runs in 3-2-3 in-
nings; Gerrick 0 for 0 in 2-3 inning.
Gilbert 1 for 4 runs in 7 2-3 innings.
Shaffer 1 for 0 runs in 1 1-3 innings.
Wild pitches: Barnes. Winning pitch-
er: Gilbert. Losing pitcher: Barnes.
Umpires: Smith, Lightner, BieVenour
Scorer: Reindollar. Time 2:45.
The second game will be played on

Sunday at Littlestown.

PERSONALITY DEVELOPMENT
MARKED BY 4 STEPS

5
3
4
4
3
4
4
2
1
1
2
1

O 3 0
1 6 1
1 3 1
0 3 1
0 8 0
3 0 1
1 0 0
O 1 0
0 0 0
0 0 1
0 0 0
O 0 0

- - - -
34 6 24 5
Ab H 0 A

23
3 4
2 0
1 0
1 1
70
1 0
9 0
1 0

According to psycholosilsts, nor-
mal personality development passes
through four stages. How much
and physical stress can cause us to
backtrack over them is revealed in
"Up or Down the Staircase of the
Mind" in October 7th issue of

The American Weekly
Nation's Popular Magazine with The

BALTIMORE
SUNDAY AMERICAN

Order from Your Local Newsdealer

RIFFLE'S NEWS AGENCY
Delmar E. Riffle

Taneytown, Md. Phone 5551

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.
This is to give notice that the subscrib-

er has obtained from the Ouphans'
Court of Carroll County, in Maryland, let-
ters testamentary on the personal estate
of

CHARLES F. KISER,

late of Carroll County, deceased. All per-
sons having claims against the deceased
are warned to exhibit the same, with the
vouchers thereof, legally authenticated, to
the subscriber, on or before the 20th day
of April, next: they may otherwise by
law be excluded from all benefits of said
estate.
Given under my hand this 13th day of

September, 1951.
ANNA MAE KISER,

Executrix of the Estate of
Charles F. Kiser, deceased.

9-21-5t

Or. Hubert E. Slocum'
OPTOMETRIS2
EYES EXAMINED

GLASSES PRESCRIBED

OPTICAL REPAIR SERVICE

19 E. Main St.
EMMITSBURG, MD.

OFFICE HOURS:
Wednesdays and Fridays
2 p.m. to 8 p.m.

1-30-tt

TANEYTOWN GRAIN MARKETS

Wheat   $2.08 per bu.
Old Corn  $1.95 per bu.
Barley  $1.05 per bu

NO TRESPASSING 
All persons are hereby forwarned

not to trespass on my premises with
dog, gun, or trap, for the purpose of
shooting or taking game of any kind,
or for fishing, or in any way injur-
ing or destroying property.

This warning applies to both Day
and Night Hunting or Trapping.

Baumgardner, Roy
Harman, William
Keilholtz, LaVerne
Mack, Newton
Null, Thurlow W.
Teeter, Mrs. John (5 farms)
Wible, Helen

,AIV iPTilTh ii

Come, Share In This Harvest Of Food Values ---'

FALL FOOD FESTIVAL
Have You Tried Ideal

APPLE
SAUCE
So many thousands became acquainted
with this delicious Apple Sauce in our
recent sale that we've be!:n asked to re
peat it, so this week you can get

16-oz 29.
cans

6 Fruit Flavor Ideal Gelatine

DESSERTS 3 17cpkgs

Light Meat Grated

CAL. TUNA 2:;0445c
Ideal Fancy Blended or

ORANGE JUICE 4:x23c
Another Virginia Lee Bakery Treat

APRICOT STREUSSEL BUNS
Six generous sized buns, generously filled
with tangy apricot filling and covered with
toasted streussel and icing. You're in for a
real treat.

pkg of 6 33c
Chocolate Sundae Layer Cakes ea 79c
Enriched Supreme Bread ilaoragfe 154

Supreme 100% Whole Wheat Brood loaf 17i
America's Prize-Winning

SWEET CREAM BUTTER Ws lb 771I • Orr

FALL FRUIT & VEGETABLE smso
BARTLETT PEARS Ripec.v.
SEEDLESS GRAPES
U.S. I Jonathan or Grimes Golden

EATING APPLES 5 bag 39°-lb

U.S. 1 GREENING APPLES 3 lbs 19c

Calif.

2 lbs 2541
albs 29a

NEW CABBAGE Solid Heads 2 lbs 96
SWEET POTATOES M Ii!._.•_go•liden 3 lbs 20c
New Snow White

CAULIFLOWER
large 29.
head

Large Peppers 3 for 10c Local Eggplants ea ioc

NEW FRESH SPINACH OR KALE ""° pkg 23c

Frozen
Foods

SEABROOK EXTRA FANCY PEAS
IDEAL CONCEN. ORANGE JUICE
SEABROOK CUT GREEN BEANS

2 10-oz pkgs 39c
2 6-oz cans 39c
10-oz pkg 22c

Give Speed-Up Household Items a Trial
You Get the Best - - for Less!

SPEED-UP BLEACH
qt 11C ./2 9al 21. gal' 5.
bat jug jug

Sr LIQUID STARCH

brts 27' 2 gal

jug

NABISCO BAKERS

Cookie Sale
Your 25C
Choice pkg

Cocoanut Bars 7Y4-oz pkg
Anise Cookies 8-oz pkg

Golden Sugar Cookies 8%-oz
Macaroon Cookies 8%-oz
Raisin Fruit Cookies 7-oz

25c

Save Our Sales Checks
to Help Your School Get a
16-in. PHILCO T-V
WITHOUT CHARGE
This is not a contest. Over 1000
schools are enrolled, 128 sets In
stalled already, 58 more qualified.
Ask for details.

Our H-I Dinnerware Offer Expires Oct. 6th
Hurry! Get your (orris punched to get your sets.

Lean Smoked Picnics

Lean Sliced Bacon

49c lb.

53c lb.

FRESH OYSTERS STANDARDS pt. can 85c

Fancy Pollock Fillets 29c lb. Fancy Perch Fillets 39c lb.

Haddock Fillets

Fancy Dressed Whitings

Freshly Picked CLAW CRAB MEAT

Freshly Picked WHITE GRAB MEAT

Prices Effective September 21-22, 1951. Quantity

39c lb.

19c lb.

59c lb.

73c lb.
-Alights Reserved.

limmollaisilli1
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TANE1TOWN ORGANIZATIONS
7••••..,,S4V/ a I. bombe, of t oninscrea ineet•

an the 4th. Monday in each month in
'Coe Municipal building, at S:00 o clock

r'.:011, Pros :50t, Vice-r,..s.
David Smith; Second Vice-Tres.,
Chas. S. Owen; Secretary, Bernard J.
Arnold; Treasurer, Chas. R. Amt..'").

Taneytown Fire Company, meets on the
2nd Monday each month, at 7:30 P. M.
in the Firemen's Building. President,
George Kiser: Vice-President, Doty
Robb; Recording Secretary, Robert
Feeser; Financial Secretary, Raymond
Feeser; Treasurer, David Smith;
Trustees, Kenneth Frock, J. W. Gar-
ber, Thurston Putman; Chief, Charles
D. Baker.

The America's Legion—Beason-Snider
Post No. 120 meets first and third
Thursday of each month at 8.00 P.
M.. in the Legion Home. All service
men welcomed. Commander, Stanley
King; Adjutant, Raymond Haines;
Treasurer, Galen K. Stonesifer; Ser.
vice Officer, B. Walter Crapster..

All other Fraternities and organizations
are invited to use this directory, for the
public Information it carries. Cost for one
sear only $1.50

The Reindollar Company
Taneytown, Md.

9-14-tf

NOW irs-A
• Ir

glfAsiek,

wit the

• REMINGTON
portable typewriter

: •
70higalhq

441•0'Illb 
MIRACLE TAR

Here's an aid to higher grades-the
finest portable made for smooth.
'clean, fast typing. Come in and try
its exclusive features! Carrying case
included. •

IRE ONLY OFFICE TYPEWRITER

IN PERSONAL SIZE

$94.50 plus
CHARLES L. STONESIFER

DEALER

Remington Portatle Typewriters
and Adding Machines
TA NEYTOWN. MD.

SEVERAL RECONDITIONED
MACHINES

PRICED AS LOW AS $29.50
ALSO 1 GOOD RECONDITIONED

ADDING MACHINE

1 irtreginitt/Wirons,. -. - ....... witritnrionrinItit

You get results from
/ printing done by us

NEW IDEA

01 K1
SHREDDER

for stalks and vines

Builds Up Soil
Kills Corn Borer

Aids Clean Plowing
Converts cornstalks into val-
uable plant food—worth up to
16 per acre! Corn borer's
worst enemy. 16 swinging
httrnmers insure thorough,
positive shredding. Covers
every foot of the field, even
hills and middles. Ruggedly
built for heaviest duty. Simple
to maintain. Works with any
modern tractor.

TESTED
and

PROVED

in corn, cotton,
rye, soybeans,
flax, potatoes,
cabbage, briars,
palmetto, weeds
and cover crops.

STOP IN AND SEE ET I

J. H. OMMERT
Massey-Harris Dealer

Phone 4364
TANEYTOWN MARYLAND

9-21-2t

in
auto

insurance,
too Ai
rip

consult a specialist
Your Farm Bureau representative is

a specialist in auto insurance. Use his
knowledge to get complete protection
at low, money-saving rates. More than
a million city and farm drivers insure
with Farm Bureau ... the 3rd largest
mutual auto insurer in the country.
Compare our rates with any. For an
auto insurance specialist call—

J. Alfred Heltehridle
FR IZELLBURG, MD.
Phone: Westminster 924-W-1

FARM BUREAU MUTUAL
AUTOMOBILE INSURANCE
. _ COMPANY

HOME OFFICE • 
COLUMBJS 3,00

•1-11-1111-inrirtirrsuirinsuirilli171411/
•

• KOONS FLORIST
Cut Flowers Designs

•• Corsages•
LITTLESTOWN, PENNA.

Si

Sf
SI
SI
SI

St

St

• Phone 140

• l• itit _te_9_91t.9-10;19 I Et/ _t *It Alt /it 16

ERNIE AND DOT LIND

Ernie Lind, who is such a crack marksman that he can "draw" pic-
tures with bullets, will give a public 'shooting exhibition with his wife
Dot, a modern Annie Oakley, at Taneytown, Md., at 3:00 P. M., on Sept.
29, it was announced today by the Taneytown Rod and Gun Club,
which is sponsoring the Western-Winchester shooters. This spectacu-lar exhibition of rifle, shotgun and pistol shooting is free and tilepublic is invited to Gun Club grounds.

Bring your stray and unwanted animals to the
Carroll County Humane Society, New Windsor
Road, H miles from Westminster. If unable
to bring them, call Westminster 704-F-14

4-1-tf-eow

MR LONGER BREEDING LIFE
AND

Keep sows in top condition to produce large litters.
Master-Mix Sow and Pig Concentrate with M-V (Methio-Vite)
helps send healthy pigs to market quicker. Ask about this
feeding program today.

The Reindollar Co.
Taneytown, Md.

9-14-3t

0116 6 6 6 6 6 illiTirrolillialliThrlEiliThrirriTtilEITIMEIEll 66 6 6 • • 4*

NOTICE

1•
RICHARD C. ETZLER

•

ifiL9,-2LWAlt.t 119-W W." .9 9 tit* 4,91 /1/".9_9.9 9_91 lk tit 9,11911.  I ILI Olt

For yip's

wag prOfp'Elf 11,>1
I

•

-MANAGEMENT EGG MASi;

In addition to my regular floor sanding and
finishing, this is to announce I am now handling
a complete line of Coronet plastic wall tile, Hako
asphalt tile and nationally known Bonny-Maid
Versa-Tile. Samples displayed and free estimate
given on request,

Phone 5431 Taneytown, Md.

8-31-4t

EGG LAC _

The Reindollar Company
Taneytown, Maryland

9-14-3t

neAttO roti0 .11•••••• .........

-assl• ENTIRE LENGTH OF SLAT
THE TAPES ARE ON THE ENDS

Slats Removed, Washed and Replaced
In a Jiffy, Without Removing Cords.

YOU CAN CHANGE TAPES IN FIVE MINUTES

I UNCONDITIONAL SERVICE GUARANTEEII

Made of durable

* NOTE: Be sure to ask your salesnum, for the blind
with the TAPES a!t, !he Ey.R.S.7 the slats.

Mid-Town Electrical Service
Phone 3041 TANEYTOWN, MD.

8-31-tf

0
:
4
0
 N
*
4
4
4
0
 

^ 
O
S
0
E
>
 O
t
.
 

010105010 0:0:0:0:0:0:0:0:00 0:0:0:0t ZO*0:0:44<> oto•ototo• e10to45401e50totototototo40tototototo

Extra Eggs
from your grain

by supplementing
with

PURINA
CHOWDER

You're just not getting all the eggs possible from your
grain unless you feed it in a properly-balanced growing
ration.

It takes only about one tablespoon of Purina Chowder,
plus grain, to feed a hen for a day. And what a dif-
ference it makes in egg-making power of your grain.

Let us grind and mix your grain with

Chowder—the concentrate made by

Purina to go with grain. We'll grind

and mix your grain according to a

Purina Research-Approved formula.

Come in. Try our service. We're sure

you'll be pleased with results you get.

YOUR STORE WITH THE CHECKERBOARD SO

Taneytown Grain & Supply Co.
Taneytown, Md.

ototirdotototetetototo•oto oto tot tOtinotototot,
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MALE
Help Wanted

NIGHT SHIFT
Permanent Employment

Interesting Work

Experience Not Necessary

— Apply --
Personnel Department

THE CAMBRIDGE RUBBER CO.
Taneytown, Maryland

5-11-tf

Dot Lind Tells Shooting Secrets
FRONT SIGHT

HOW TO
HIT
BOTH

BOTTLES

Shoot with both
eyes open and a
card slipped over
muzzle of a .22
rifle will be no ob-
struction to aim.

•

To hit two bottles
with two quick
shots aim at bot-
tom one for both
shots. Top bottle
drops down.

•

To hit swinging
pendulum target
aim at point just
before the target
starts return at
end of its swing.

Dot Lind, better half of the "Shooting Linds," America's No. 1
team of exhibition shooters, reveals the secrets of making some of
the difficult rifle shots she and her husband, Ernie, perform. The
Linds, Western-Winchester shooters, are now on their annual
coast-to-coast tour demonstrating their uncanny skill.

Dot Lind will give a spectacular shooting exhibition on September
29, at 3 P. M., in Taneytown, Md.,under the sponsorship of the Taney-
town Rod and Gun Club and Winchester-Western. The shoot is free
and the public is invited to attend the event on the Gun Club grounds.
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THE

SPEAKS

In!ern,t1o7.1 Uni:orm

3n.,1 Lessons

"SI DR: KENNETH 1.4 FOREMAN
SCRIPTURE: Isaiah 65: 17-25; Acts

17:16-17, 22-28; Romans 10:12: Revela-
tion 21:1-8.
DEVOTIONAL READING: Isaiah 2:2-4.

World Citizens
Lesson for September 23, 1951

DO YOU belong to the human
race? It isn't as large as you

might think.
Hendrik Willem Van Loon once

figured out that you could make one
box, half a mile long, half a mile

wide and half a
mile deep, and you
could put into that
box every man,
woman and child in
the entire w o r 1 d,
packed in like sar-
dines of course, and
then you could nail
that box up and tip
it over into the
Grand Canyon.
With the human

race no bigger than that, isn't it
.stupid for us not to get together? If
you ever read Mark Twain's fas-
cinating tale, "Captain Stormfield's
Visit to Heaven," you will remem-
ber how that mariner got lost on
his way to heaven and arrived at
the wrong gate. Since no one at that
gate had ever heard of "the earth,"
the captain finally identified himself
as from the Solar System.

Still no one had heard of it. Final-
ly some one discovered it, a tiny
dot on an enormous map. The Cap-
tain was considerably taken down
when he learned how small the
earth is in the immense starry uni-
verse; and so might we all be.

• • •

Passengers on the Same Planet
IN THE EYES of God and his

angels, this earth and the people
on it do not fill up the big place
they fill in the eyes of us mortals.
This does not mean that we are
unimportant to ourselves, or of no
concern to God.

Saint Paul gave us the Chris-
tian reason—always the best of
reasons — why human beings
ought to realize how close to-
gether we really are. Speaking
to the university crowd at
Athens, he quoted from a Greek
poet to prove his point: "We be-
long to His race." (Acts 17:28,
Moffatt's translation.)
God made all peoples "from a

common origin." In him we live
and move and have our being. Re-
member that Paul was not speaking
in a Christian church. Of course
Christians are brothers in an even
warmer and more living sense; but
Paul could say, even to men who
were not Christians as he was, that
he and they were alike offspring of
God, that they all had their being
in the same Creator and Father.

* • •

The Importance of Being Human

P' 
WE would only just stop pinning
our little tags on people! We call

them "foreigners" or "farmers" or
"Canadians" or "college boys" or
"Chinese." So they are; but the
,naost important fact about Chinese,
or fishermen, or farmers or any
other class of mankind, is that they
are human beings.
What we hay* in common, as

human beings, is infinitely more im-
portant than the variations which

• set us off into different races, class-
es and groups. The Christian will
be a loyal citizen of his own land;
but he will also remember that he
is a world-citizen too. And as a
'world-citizen, he will always re-
member certain truths about all his
fellow human beings.

One is that since we all have
a common humanity, we all
stand in need of God. It is not
much exaggeration, if any, to
say that to be human is to be
helpless.
Scholars write books with titles

like "The Human Predicament,"
which is a short way of saying that

.if you are human you are in a
mess. You need God, whoever you
are. But if you know that, then also
remember that all other members
of. the human race need him too,
quite as much as you do.

• • •

Our Lost Brothers
REMEMBER, too, that while all

are summoned to the same
destiny (as Paul said: "God com-
mands all men to repent"—not just
some of them!), many and many a
man (must we say, alas, most
men?) misses that destiny.

There is a broad road leading
to destruction, Jesus said, and
many are traveling that road.
How can a Christian be indiffer-
ent about a thing like that?
Every man on the dark road is
a man who might be a
Christian.
From the dead-end road of self-

ishness, hatred and pride he might
come over to the highway of God
. .. if some one took the trouble to
go after him. But we shall not
bother ourselves much, we shall
not bother ourselves enough, about
our lost brothers, unless we have
the world-citizen's eye and the
world-Christian's heart.
(Copyright 1951 by the Division of
Christian Education, National Council
of the Churches of Christ of the United
States of America. Released by WNU
Features.)

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
This is to give notice that the subscrib-

er has obtained from the Orphans'
Court of Carroll County, in Maryland,
letters of administration on the personal
estate of

IRENE STONER WEYBRIGHT,
late of Carroll County, deceased. All
persons having claims against the deceas-
ed are warned to exhibit the same, with
the vouchers thereof, legally authenticat-
ed, to the subscriber, on or before the 30th
day of Mareh, next; they may otherwise
by law be excluded from all benefits of
said estate.
Given under my hand this 23rd day

of August, 1551.

RALPH P. 'WEYBRIGHT.
Administrator of the estate of
Irene Stoner Weybright, deceased.

8-31-5t

Jr. geegle's
Chiropractic Office
EMMITSBUR, MD.

Phone: Emmitsburg 117

HOURS BY APPOINTMENT

8-1 ti

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
This is to give notice that the subscrib-

ers have obtained from the Orphans' Court
of Cdrroll County, in Maryland, letters of
Administration on the personal estate of

CHARLES B. REAVER,
late of Carroll County, deceased. At
persona having claims against the deceased
are warned to exhibit the same, with the
vouchers thereof, legally authenticated, to
the subscribers. on or before the 27th day
of Alarch, next: they may otherwise by
law be excluded from all benefits of said
estate.
Given under our hands this 15th day of

August, 1951.
CARRIE V. BEAVER,
FRANCIS E. REAVER,

Administrators of the estate of
Charles B. Reaver, deceased.

8-24-5t

PERCY Ni. BURKE
For all Your

INSURANCE Needs

231 E. Ma‘n St.,

WESTMINSTER, MD.
Phone 1120

"Insure with Confidence"

EVERY SIZE

CRUSHED
STONE

for

196081:2381Kleg9k3180839190889080068090311dS'Ae$9131809180EES8S803191its800191E1138813118191103111

Teeter I
CRUSHED STONE

Macadam Driveways, Lanes,
Parking Lots - Landscaping

If It's Tough Construction, Call Teeter

JOHN S. TEETER AND SONS

Phone: "Gettysburg 696 Westminster 918

 JIM•••••••••.-
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Lambert Electrical Store
SWiitig Television's NeTs;Wst Trial-10

SYLVANIA
OLIGHf

'1"The Frame of Light for Viewing Comfort"

FOR GREATER VIEWING COMFORT
\ / 

HAIOLIGtif

//7///// 

It's the Talk of the Town

...Come See It NOW!

THE greatest viewing comfort ... the pleasantest view-

ing for favorite long programs ... yes, those were

goals when Sylvania put its 50 years of lighting and elec-

tronic experience to work. The result is HALOLIGHT, a

wide, soft, cool frame of light around your screen!

It's amazing what a difference it makes! HALOLIGHT

actually makes the picture look clearer — makes it seem

larger.

It is built right into your Sylvania set — as much a

part of your set as the screen or cabinet.

We want you to see for yourself how HALOLIGHT gives
this great viewing comfort. Thousands who've seen it

agree. So come in now and let us demonstrate this newest

TV triumph, on the leading models of the magnificent

new Sylvania Golden Jubilee line.
*Sylvania Trademark

Here's How HALOLIGHT Works

Till now, TV *croon;
have been

surrounded with a .
dark border.

Now HALOLIONT bring,

you this completely

lighted frame

all around the picture —

to relieve the

sharp contrast.

BIG 20" PICTURE k x'
The Madison. Sylvania 20" Mahogany DeLuxe Console. Movie.
Clear* picture, Studio-Clear * sound. Non-glare, wide-angle viewing with
slanted, dust-sealed face. Also available in striking modern blond cabinet.

9

$449.95
Plus $15.00 for 1 year Tubes

and Parts Warranty

Lambert Electrical Store
Phone 4384 Taneytown, Maryland
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SCOUTING IN CARROLL COUNTY

Mr. J. C. Barnsley, Chairman qf
the Carroll District k mance Commit-
tee, Loy Scouts of America, an-
nounces the 1952 Boy Scout Drive
will be conducted in Carroll County
from November 1-15, 1951. The
Campaign Goal has been reduced
from $4,000.00 to $3,500.00. Since
this is an eight per cent reduction
the good for all tne county communi-
ties will be reduced 8% from the
goal of 1951. Mr. James M. Shriver
of Westminster and Union Mills will
again head the Finance Campaign in
Carroll County.
Mr. Shriver announces the follow-

ing chairmen who have consented to
serve: Westminster, West Side, Mr.
Stanley Tevis; Westminster, past
Side, Mr. John Byers; Westminster,
Initial Gifts, Mr. John L. Reifsni-
der III, and Howard Koontz, Jr., of
Westminster for the county towns.
Mr. John A. Bankert, of Westmin-
ster will serve as Vice-Chairman for
the County Finance Campaign.
Mr. Stuart Widener, Westminster,

Chairman of the Carroll District
Camping and Activitiets Committee,
Boy Scouts of America, has develop-
ed plans to construct lour Adiron-
dack Lean-tos at the Deep Run Scout
Camp located 2% miles north of
Union Mills. This is a short term
(four nights or less camping out)
camp purchased Iby the Baltimore
Area Council to be used by all Scout
Troops in the County especially those
in Carroll County. Two Lean-tos have
been constructed and plans are to
have the other two built before the
winter. The camp has a sixty foot
well and a stone latrine. There are
'70 acres in the camp. The Carroll
District holds a spring Camporee and
a fall round-up on the site. Last May
11 Troops out of 17 attended with
nearly 200 scouts and leaders.

Dr. L. A. Welliver, Westminster,
Chairman of the Carroll District
Leadership Training Committee an-
nounces a Scoutmaster's Training
Course to be held at the Silver Run
Lutheran Church, Social Hall, on
October 22 and 29-30 for all Scout-
minster, Troop Committeemen and
fathers of scouts.

4-H PUBLIC SPEAKING CONTEST

The Carroll County 4-H Public
Speaking Contest was held last Wed-
nesday evening. At this time a boy
and girl were selected to represent
this county in the district contest.
The county winners are Barbara

Myers, Route 2, Westminster, and
Robert Flickinger of Taneytown.
They will broadcast over station
WFMD, Frederick, 1V14:1„ on Septem-
ber 24 and 25 respectively at 7:30 a.
M. The subject of this year's 4-H
Radio Speaking program is "The
Relationship of Citizenship to 4-H
Club Work." Both Barbara and
Robert selected "How 4-H Builds
Good Citizens" as their topic. As a
result of their outstanding presen-
tation they will be guests of the

University of Maryland on October
6 to a football game.
These broadcasts will be part of

the Central Maryland District pub-
lic speakilrg coniiest elimination.
Tnis district, includes Washington,
Frederick, Howard and Carroll
Counties. Each morning at 7:30
starting on Sept. 17, and continuing
through Sept. 25, a different contest-
ant will be heard.

RED CROSS COLLECTING ITEMS
FOR ARMED FORCES

There exists an immediate need
for small recreational items for use
in the armed forces during troop
movements and operations. Carroll
County Chapt*r, American Red
Cross, has been asked to act as a
collecting agency for this purpose
and all items received will be for-
warded to the Norfolk Naval Base in
Virginia.
Pocket novels, playing cards and

small games are particularly want-
ed. Used items if in servicable con-
dition, or new ones will be gratefully
received. Any individuals or organi-
zations who can participate in this
worthy cause are asked to send their
items to Red Cross Headquarters at
206 E. Main St., Westminster, or con-
tact any of the members of the Pro-
duction and Supply Service; i. e. Mrs.
Wm. Y. Irwin, chairman, Mrs. George
Hering, Mrs. James Shriver or Mrs.
David Taylor.

All items received will be packed
and shipped to Norfolk by the ser-
vice of the Carroll County Chapter
Red Cross referred to above. Ship-
ping date has been set for Sept. 26.
Will you donate those pocket novels
you have finished reading? Or that
deck of cards you really don't need?
Bring or send them before next Wed-
nesday and afford some pleasant re-
creation for servicemen.

HORSE SHOW IN EMMITSBURG

Plans are completed for the pre-
sentation of the third annual Horse
Show, Sunday, September 23, pre-
sented each year by the Emmitsburg,
Md. Lions Club, President Charles A.
Elder announced this week. Proceeds
will go to the Children's Welfare
Fund of the Lions Club.
Captain H. C. Woodring, general

chairman of the promotion, has an-
nounced the judges for the shows as:
George Pearson, Sr., of Bruingsville,
Pa.; Mrs. George P. Greenhalgh, of
Berryville, Va.; Mrs. H. W. Stuart,
Mt. Holly, N. J.
Miss Georgennette 'Lee, of White

Post, Va„ will act as stewardess of
the show and President Howard, of
Hagerstown, will be ringmaster.

Officials in charge have greatly
expanded the event this year, adding
several more classes and joining the
American Horse Show Association,
Inc. Twenty-six classes will be pre-
sented this year as compared to 21
last season. The affair gets under
way at 11:00 a. m.
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EMMITSBURG LIONS CLUB

HORSE SHOW

Sunday, Sept. 23
11:00 A. M.

Benefit Children's Welfare Fund

Emmit Gardens
EMMITSBURG, MARYLAND
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Copyrfglif Wulf Disney Productions. tlf.51

See Walt D,si,ey's "Al,ce In Wonderland"

VISIT ALICE'S WONDERLAND

2 OF G-E LAMPS!
Here now — the right size, right-type G-E Lamps you
need for proper seeing Fill your empty sockets'

For balls, closets. General Electric 60-watt bulb 14c
For reading lamps, General Electric 100-watt
bulb . .......... . 16
For your choice of light, G-E 3.1ite bulb, 3650-100-150-watt ........ .

0300-wan 3-lite .. . . . . . .. 6 0For larger floor and table lamps, 100, 200,

For kitchen, laundry, workbench. G-E 150.watt 21:1fl0bulb .. .
— PLUS TAX

-.7rFFSIS•••• .•••••.,

Reindollar Bros. EK, Co.
HARDWARE • PAINTS • APPLIANCES

ESTABLISH ED 1897 Taneytown, Md. TELEPHONE 4564

CARROLL COUNTY TO AGAIN
OBSERVE LAND WEEK

The Governor of Maryland has
again sounded the proclamation of
Maryland "Land Week" during the
week of October 7th to 13th.
The land we live on, farm, and use,

is the most precious heritage we have
as a nation. No nation is stronger
than its soil fertility. The observ-
ance of "Land Week" is for the pur-
pose of focusing the attention of all
the people to the importance of main-
taining and: keeping Ian abundant
agriculture.
The Carroll County committee for

planning a suitable program for
"Land Week" feel there are many
activities that will bring to all the
folk (both town and country) the
idea that we have a great responsi-
biity to keep our country strong and

vigorous through the proper land use. '

t
There will be window displays by

he 4-H Clubs and other farm or-
ganizations, such as Grange and
Farm Bureau. The schools will have
programs during the week that will
be educational with regards to the
proper land use. The various civic
organizations and service clubs will
be encouraged to put on programs
that will bring to the attention of ell
the people the importance of this
occasion. The County Extension
Service will use all the educational
measures at their disposals to see
that rural and urban people take
time out during the week to rededi-
cate themselves to the sacred trust
of keeping our beloved country strong
and vigorous. There never was a
time in our Nation's history when
this was so important.

Week-End Specials
Sept. 21 Sept. 22 Sept. 24

Alaska Salmon
Fulco Plums
Smiths Soup Beans
Green Giant Peas
Sun Sweet Prune Juice

1 can .45
1 can .28
2 lb. .26

2 cans .39
1 qt. .31

H . p Heart's Delight Apricot Nectar
1 can .39n h•

ll 11 Hormel Spam 1 can .50
H I,:E g Pitted Dates 4 oz. pkg. .33
D if Filberts Oleo in quarters 1 lb. .31100 ATTRACTIVE PRIZES E Py-O-My Brownie Mix Pan Free

.29 both

3rd ANNUAL

CARD PARTY

Sponsored by T. H. S. Alumni Association

October 11, 1951
8:00 P. M. (E. S. T.)

Admission 50c 2 DOOR PRIZES
9-21-3t
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EARLE THEATRE
W.2 Taneytown, Maryland

Friday & Saturday, September 21 & 22 1"173::
2 FEATURES 2

••••=111.

Barbara Britten in

"Bandit Queen"

MON, & TUES., SEPT. 24 & 25

Van Johnson in

"Go For Broke"
(it means shoot the works)

Added: News and Bugs Bunny
Cartoon

Plus Don DeFore in
"Southside 1-1000"

WED. & THURS., Sept. 26 & 27
A new Lassie Picture with Paul

Kelly and Lassie in
"The PaintedgHills"
Added: News, Cartoon

and a technicolor special
"Give Me Liberty"

COMING Thursday & Friday, October 4 & 5
I ep, The Ten Round World's Championship fight between Randy

Turpin and Sugar Ray Robinson. The fight that could not
be seen or heard elsewhere.

Ii

RAM DY

TURPIIN
vs° sfiGgigON

Highlights in stow MOTION!
Better Than Ringside Seats!

Distributed by RKO Radio Pictures, Inc.

OFFICIAL Exchisive.%yORL 'OffiViOji-Slile FILMS!
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OWNER'S PUBLIC SALE
Of Very Valuable Dwelling Property and

Household Furniture and Effects Contained therein at
Keymar, Carroll County, Maryland
SATURDAY, OCTOBER 6, 1951

At the Hours set forth below:
Commencing at 10:30 A. M., Household Furniture and Effects,

etc., as follows:
5 BEDROOM SUITES

2 coal double heaters, sewing machine, 6 coal oil lamps, 3 new
ibed springs, a lot of dishes of all kinds; two dozen glass goblets,
'kitchen utensils, pots and pans, 2 extension tables, 1 Child's desk,
1 walnut slant top desk very old; 1 knee top desk and table, com-
bined; 1 old bureau, 1 old chest, 6 dining room chairs, buffet, Norge
refrigerator, ice box, butchering bench, floor mirror with marble
slab, antique mirror, acorn top bed, couch, 2 hall racks, lot of
spoons, knives and forks, 6 kitchen chairs, 2 Indian rugs, some

ksmall rugs, % doz. rocking chairs, kitchen cupboard, old; 2 ward-
robes wash bowl and pitcher, 2 volumes of Williams History of
Frederick County, one 12x15 Congoleum rug, new; 2 porch chairs,
porch swing, electric washing machine, 3 Crex rugs, square
piano, high chair, lot of jars, iron kettle, 6 old flat irons, sausage
stuffer, meat grinder, coal range, plow, garden plow, hoes, forks,
shovels, wheelbarrow, carpenter tools, brooder, sawed wood, coal,
kir-Wing wood, and some other small articles.
TERMS OF SAL: CASH.

At 1 o'clocq P. M. REAL ESTATE
A VERY LARGE LOT—Improved by a

TWO STORY 10 ROOM FRAME DWELLING
with slate roof. Good well of water a good cistern 'and electric
pump in basement of dwelling; one large five car garage; chicken
house and brooder house.

TERMS OF SALE--Cash deposit of $800.00 at time of sale.
Balance in cash within 30 days. All expenses to be adjusted to
day of transfer.

Harry Trout,- Auctioneer.
Robert Grimes, Clerk.

MRS. ALLAZUMA FORREST,
Keymar, ; Md.
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BousHERTysGavin&
TAN EY TOWN, NIP.

Phone: 3021

77': the pas
'calls the turn- i,

1,..c1 Not everything is unpredictable

in this crazily spinning world.

Many years of banking service

to this community tell us some of the

things that can be expected in the future

— even immediately.

To meet the ever-present threat of

financial problems, this bank offers ad-

vice to fit your need and situation. It is

available to all in this community, com-

bined with the safety and practice that

only years of stable, successful experience

and friendly cooperation can give.

The Birnie Trust Company
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND.

(Member of the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation)

:.....w.ze;454$4;owesptmiesea
• 1.1001, • • • • • • • •

At the bottom of the ocean?Alt the end of the 
rainbow?

OR IN YOUR BANK 
4CCOUNT?

Deposit regularly here. Th a 's thesure way to build your "future."

First National Bank
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Member Federal Reserve System
k Member of The Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation) •

9-21-3t
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