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COMMUNITY LOCALS 
Miss Anna Galt, went Tuesday to

spend a week with Mrs. John A. Cox,
in Washington, D. C.

Miss Elizabeth W. Sherwood, of
Johns Hopkins Hospital, Baltimore,
was a week-end guest of Miss Clara
K. Brining.

Mr. and Mrs. Edward Sell and son,
moved Monday from Middle St., into
Mr. Raymond Wantz's house, on E.
Baltimore St.

Mr. and Mrs. Ivan Neidermyer, of
West Chester, Pa., spent the week-
end with her parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Harry I. Reindollar.

---
Mrs. Norman Reindollar, spent

from Friday until Sunday at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Robert Baum-
gardner and son, Robert, in Balti-
more.

---
Mr. and Mrs. G. D. Hollenbaugh

and son, Barry Jean, of Randalls-
town, were Sunday dinner guests of
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Howell B.
Royer.

The King's College quartette and
pianist, of New Jersey, were enter-
tained at dinner on Sunday at the
home of the Rev. and Mrs. A. W.
Garvin.

Men have started to work on a
house for G. Delmar Baumgardner.
Situation is across the street where
he and his family now live in East
Baltimore St.

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Humbert
and son, moved Saturday from near
Taneytown into the house, corner of
Fairview Ave and York St., owned
by Russell Feeser.

Miss Mary Angela, nurse at Provi-
dence Hospital, Washington, D. C.,
spent Tuesday and Wednesday at the
home of her parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Arnold.

Cpl. and Mrs. Joseph M. Reaver, of
Southern Pines, N. C., spent last week
end with their parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Walter Eckard and family, of Union
Bridge, and Mr. and Mrs. Joseph M.
Reaver, Sr., Taneytown.

Mr. and Mrs. Percy V. Putman and
Mr. and Mrs. Charles L. Stonesifer,
spent last Sunday afternoon with Mr.
and Mrs. R. K. Dieterle and son, Rich-
ard and Mr. and Mrs. Harry Fehl
and family, of Lancaster, Penna.

The Misses Annan entertained at
tea Monday in honor of Mrs. Robert
Chester Neal who was recently mar-
ried. Out-of-town guests included
Mrs. Norman Boyle, mother of the
bride and Miss Mary Cunningham,•of
Westminster.

•
Guests of Doctor and Mrs. R. S.

McVaugh over the week-end were:
Mr. and Mrs. E. 0. Smithdeal and
Mrs. Margaret Pipes, of Roa-
noke, Va.; Miss Myrtle Fralin, of
Arlington, Va.; Mrs. Roy Miller and
two sons, of Norfolk, Va.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Arnold and
Miss Mae Sanders attended the
"Hootenary" (means song swopping)
given by the Glee Club of Notre
Dame College, Baltimore, Sunday
afternoon. Miss Julia Arnold is a
member of the Glee Club.

Mrs. Earl Bowers was admitted
Tuesday at the Annie Warner Hos-
pital, Gettysburg, Pa. She was op-
erated on Tuesday and Wednesday
and had a tumor removed from her
breast. Mrs. Bowers is getting
along nicely and expects to be home
very soon.

The Taneytown Fire Company is
making its annual drive for funds be-
ginning this week. Taneytown has a
vne record in meeting quotas for any
and all drives—let's not fail the boys
who, through rain, snow and cold, will
answer the call of Fire any time of

' thei_day or night. In case of Fire or
you need the ambulance Dial 3131.

-‘ Miss Phyllis Smith, of Taneytown;
Mrs. Ralph Smith and daughter, Miss
Gloria Jean Smith, of York, Pa., left
Wednesday afternoon for Tacoma,
Washington. Mr. Smith, of York, ac-
companied them as far as Chicago.
Mrs. Smith is a victim of multiple
sclerosis, and, will enter St. Joseph's
Sanitarium in Tacoma for treatment.

Mr. and Mrs. A. D. Alexander and
son, Andy, attended the presentation
of 'La Traviata" by Verdi by the
Baltimore Civic Opera Co., on Sat-
urday, April 14, in the Md. Casualty
Auditorium, Baltimore. Miss Dorothy
Alexander, of Baltimore, daughter of
Mr. and Mrs. Alexander was a mem-
ber of the cast of this operatic group.
Mrs. Harry Sprankle was hostess

to a Stanley party at her home Tues-
day evening, April 10. Mrs. Anna
Topper, Abbottstown, Pa., was in
charge of the demonstration which/was the largest of sales she has ever
had. Those present were: Mrs.
Clarence Naill, Mrs. Earlington
Shriver, Mrs. Truman Bowers, Mrs.
Lake Weant, Mrs. Paul Weant, Mrs.
Paul Snider, Mrs. Luther Angell,
Mrs. Ernest Fream, Mrs. David Hess,
Mrs. Charles Stambaugh, Mrs. Glenn
Beaver Mrs. Melvin Overholtzer,
Mrs. Maurice Haines, daughter, Lin-
da, Miss Hazel Haines, Mrs. Harry
Clutz, Mrs. Marlin Six, Mrs. Wilmer
Baker, daughter, Doris; Mrs. John
McLaughlin, Mrs. Clarence LeGore,
Mrs. Walter Shoemaker, Mrs. Ernest
Reaver, Mrs. Elmer Fuss, Mrs.
Maude Wantz, Mrs. Floyd Strick-
houser, Mrs. Elmer LeGore, Mrs.
Charles Slick, Miss Mary Slick, Mrs.
Lillie Moser and Mrs. Ralph Harver.
Delicious refreshments were served
and a social hour was enjoyed by all.

(Continued on Fourth Page)

KIWANIS NEWS

Miss Ruth DeVore was the
Guest Speaker

President David Smith presided
over the meeting of the Taneytown
Kiwanis Club held Wednesday eve-
ning at Taney Inn. Mrs. Smith was
also present.
Due to the absence of Edward Reid

who had charge of the evening's pro-
gram, Mr. Albert Baldwin substitut-
ed and introduced the speaker, Miss
Ruth DeVore, Supt. of Elementary
schools in Carroll County. Miss De-
Vore gave an interesting account of
her recent trip to Europe. She de-
scribed a few of the many highlights
of her trip which was made in a
large British airship crossing the
ocean at a speed of over 300 miles
per hour. She described the wreck-
age of some of the buildings in Eu-
rope that were damaged in World
War II. She was quite enthusias-
tic about the hospitality, courtesy
and kindness shown her by the peo-
ple, the beautifully laid-out roads
and highways. Two weeks of her
six weeks trip were spent on the con-
tinent of Europe, the other four
weeks spent in England.
The Club "took up" a free-will of-

fering for the Cancer-control Drive.
Some of the members of the Club

will journey to Baltimore next Wed-
nesday evening to join that Club in
an inter-club meeting. The balance
of the members of the club will meet
as usual at Taney Inn. A good pro-
gram will be presented.

HIGH SCHOOL NEWS•

The 8th grade classes under the
supervision of Mr. Ervin made a trip
to Westminster on Wednesday, April
18, to view William F. Myers Son
Meat Packing Company. They have
been studying meat packing in their
Core classes. The group stopped at
Warner's Dairy Bar for lunch on their
way tack to the school.
Under the work experience pro-

gram girls from the 12th grade Com-
mercial course have been working in
\various business places in town.

The 9th grade under the direction
of Mrs. Yingling and Mrs. Shipley
held an assembly program on Wed-
nesday morning during the activities
period. The program was called
"The Festival of Freedom". This pro-
gram will be presented for the public
on April 244,h when the annual
Spring Festival will be held.
On Thursday afternoon the high

school grades under the supervision
of the teachers went to the homes of
several of the pupils in the commu-
nity to view the television program
from Washington. The program they
viewed was General MacArthur's
speech.

Recruiting officers from all branch-
es of the services visited Taneytown
High school on Tuesday at 11:05 to
sneak to the boys and girls of the
12th grade. Their speech emphasized
the importance of a high school di-
ploma in the Arthy, Navy, or Air
Force to receive a rating.

CAPT. ROBERT C. LAMBERT
PROMOTED TO RANK OF MAJOR

Captain Robert C. Lambert, whose
wife and two children, Michael and
James, live in Libertytown, was pro-
moted to Major at the First Corps
Command Post in Korea. Major
Lambert, an operations officer with
the G-2 section of First Corps Head-
quarters, received the prcnnotion
through a special order of 8th Army
Hes dauarters.
Major Lambert graduated from

Taneytown High School and attend-
ed Western Maryland College, re-
ceiving his bachelor of arts degree
in 1941. He entered the Army in
June, 1941 at Fort George Meade
and served with the 82nd and 13th
Airborne Divisions in the European
Theatre of Operations from 1944
through 1945. He was an employee
of The Cambridge Rubber Co. His
father, Oliver E. Lambert, lives near
Taneytown.

GRAND LODGE SESSIONS
— -

U. H. Bowers, David Miller and
Hubert Null attended the session of
the I. 0. 0. F. Lodges of Maryland,
on Monday.
On Tuesday election of officers was

held. Merwyn C. Fuss was re-elect-
ed to the Board of Trustees of the
Odd Fellows Home at Frederick. This
was Mr. Fuss fifth term and he was
also appointed on the committee of
the State of the Order.
\A reception was held, Tuesday

evening in honor of the Grand Mas-
ter Rev. Parke Heller, pastor of Dun-
dalk. Baptist Church. Gov. Theodore
R. McKeldin was the guest speaker.
Those from Taneytown who attended
the reception were Mr. and Mrs. Bir-
nie Staly, Mr. and Mrs. Merwyn C.
Fuss and daughter, Alice.

4-H NEWS
--

The monthly meeting of the Girls
Jr. 4-H Club was held at the home of
Betty Ann Fowler, April 5. 15 mem-
bers were present. Judy Haifley joined
our Club at this meeting. The meet-
ing was opened by the pledge. Doris
Bollinger gave a demonstration on
making paper flowers and Miss Belva
Koons gave a demonstration on mak-
ing a bed.
Games were played and refresh-

ments were served.
DORIS BOLLINGER,

Club Reporter.

The Brotherhood Chorus, which is
preparing for their concert, May 24,
will have a very important rehearsal -
Sunday evening in the church, at 8:00
P.M.

CONVENTION OF
WOMEN'S GUILD

Ladies of the E. 86 R. Church
Hold Session in Taneytown
About 300 delegates, guests and

visitors attended the 10th annual
Spring Convention Meeting of the
Maryland Regional Women's Guild
comprising Washington, Frederick
and Carroll counties held in Grace E.
& R. Church, Taneytown, Wednesday.

Following the registration the
Guild of St. Paul's Church, Westmin-
ster, had charge of the morning de-
votions. The official welcome-greeting
was extended by Mrs. Morgan An-
dreas, following which Mrs. Paul
Bovey, Hagerstown, regional presi-
dent took charge of the business
meeting. The various officers and de-
partmental chairmen then presented
their reports.
.The latter group stood in a semi-

circle in the chancel and lighted can-
dles after they had placed the sym-
bols of their departmental activity
upon the altar. The symbols used
were the lamp of knowledge (educa-
tion), a string of pearls (member-
ship), time, talent and treasure
(stewardship), a globe of the world
(missionary), a coin box (thank-
offering), figures of God's children
standing in the shadow of the flags
of the United Nations (Christian cit-
izenship), willing hands (social ser-
vice), and the flame of consecration
(spiritual life).

Mrs. E. J. F. Dettbarn, Baltimore,
synodical president, brought heart-
felt greetings and challenging infor-
mation from the national guild board
meeting at Cleveland, 0. She empha-
sized the appreciation of the disrupt-
ed peoples of the world for used
clothing', materials, neeaes, pins,
thread yarn and other little and com-
mon things of life which help to ease
the burdens of life for those who have
lost so much during the war days and
to whom Church World Service means
so much.

Following a delightful luncheon
served by the host church women the
Guild of St. John's Church, Clear
Spring, had charge of the afternoon
devotions. Mrs. E. Romaine Motter
served as the organist of the day.
The Recommendation Committee

presented 14 practical suggestions
concerning the .strengthening of lo-
cal guilds and the practicing of
Christian Social Action. The place
of meeting committee reported that
invitations for the fall and next
spring meetings had been received
from Christ church, of Hagerstown,
and the Glade Charge, Walkersville
and Woodsboro, respectively. Both
reports were unanimously accepted.
The highlight of the day was a

most inspirational address given by
Mrs. Frederick A. Goetsch, St. Louis,
Mo. Mrs. Goetsch is the widow of
the denomination's former Executive
Secretary of International Missions
and is an elected delegate of the de-
nomination to the National Council
of Churches. She spoke on "building

, a highway for our God" using the
simile of Isaiah in the.40th chapter.
And she built- it around the theme of
the day which was "Beginning with
Me." She emphasized the qualifi-
cations of the roadbuilding individual
as being able to recognize existing
,evils which he labors to eliminate,
having faith in the future so as to
work for a better day, and being
ready to suffer so as to sacrifice all,
including life itself if necessary.
She spoke very .dynamically and

dramatically concerning the physical
and especially the spiritual needs of
the peoples of the world as they
hunger and thirst for righteousness
and what a great privilege American
Christians have inasmuch as they can
by prayer and their very ways of
life show forth unto them "the light
of the world." She had attended the
meeting of the World Council of
Churches at Amsterdam, Holland,
and spoke graciously and sensitively
concerning her inspirational visits
with the world-famous Dr. Albert
Schweitzer, today's most outstanding
living witness for Christ in the mis-
sion-field as he serves in Africa. Ear-
lier in the day Mrs. Goetsch had pre-
sented two touching vocal solos.
Mrs. William Seibert, Clear Spring

sang "The Lord's Prayer. Mrs. R.
Paul Smith, Hagerstown, served as
the accompanist of the day. The
reconsecration prayer was offered and
the benediction was announced by the
Rev, Morgan Andreas, minister of
the host church. The free-will offer-
ing of the day was given to the cause
of Church World Service.

__--0 

DAYLIGHT SAVINGS TIME BE-
GINS IN TANETTOWN, APRIL 29.

A special meeting of the Mayor
and City Council was held Tuesday
evening with John Chenoweth pre-
siding. It was learned that daylight
saving time will become effective in
Taneytown, April 29th and that the
sewer system will not appear on the
ballot at the annual June election.
The Maryland Legislature recently
passed a bill authorizing the Mayor
and City Council with the consent of
the people, to issue bonds to defray
the cost of installing a complete
sewer system.

Many citizens are interested in
proceeding at once with the project
but only a field survey has been com-
pleted and the final plans have to be
'formulated before the overall cost
can be determined. The Council is of
the opinion that until the cost per
family can be determined and ma-
terials become less critical the vote
should be delayed.

LAUDS MODERN SCHOOL
m

Dr. Benjamin Speaks a
Elementary School P.-T. A.

Speaking at the meeting of the
Elementary School Parent-Teacher
Association on Tuesday, Dr. Harold
Benjamin of the University of Ma-
ryland stated that the schools of to-
day are teaching more of the funda-
mental subjects to pupils and doing
it in a much more effective may.
Attacking vigorously those groups
who are working to undermine pub-
lic education, he reaffirmed his belief
that we are making a mistake in com-
paring the pupils of today with those
of forty years ago. Pupils of today's
schools not only are better eduated
in reading, writing and arithmetic,
but are also better citizens, accept
more responsibility and are better
prepared to take their places in our
troubled world.
Comparing our heritage with that

of other nations, he pointed out that
our nation does appear to have more
natural resources, and more produc-
tive power, but this has been attain-
ed only because of our system of
public education which produced the
trained personnel capable of discov-
ering and putting to practical use
those riches which our land possesses.
Elementary education is the founda-
tion upon which this advanced train-
ing has to be based and therefore
must be given a great deal of atten-
tion. In his closing remarks, Dr.
Benjamin Warned that our greatest
natural resource, children, are in
danger of being neglected in the
midst of technical and cultural ad-
vancement.
The remainder of the program

consisted of several numbers by the
school orchestra, under the direction
of Mr. Kenneth Sampson, and dem-
onstration meeting of the school stu-
dent council.
During the businesS session which

follcowed, it was reported that the
playground has been tremendously
improved through the efforts of the
committee in charge. Special recog-
nition was given to Mr. Wilson Utz
and Mr. Robert Clingan for their ef-
forts. A letter of appreciation from
the student body was also read.
A nominating committee consist-

ing of three members, Mr. Glenn
'Groshon, Mr. Wilson Utz and Mrs.
Kenneth Shorb was elected to pre-
pare a slate of officers to present at
the May meeting.

HIGH SCHOOL NEWS

The Taneytown Junior and Senior
High School will present their Spring
Festival Tuesday evening the 24, at 8
o'clock in the high school auditorium.
The theme of the program is entitled
"A Festival of Freedom." Represen-
tative groups of the high school will

I participate in the vocal and instru-
mental numbers.

I The program will be as follows:
H. S. Orchestra March; Scene I "The
Land Of the Free and the Home of
the Brave" Core 9 pupils and High
School mixed chorus; Scene II "The
Freedom of Conscience", Core 9 pu-
pils; Scene III "The Spring Festi-
val, Core 7 pupils; Scene IV "Amer-
ica Sing" 10th Grade mixed chorus;
Scene V "America Marches Along"
11th and 12th grade mixed chorus.
There will be several solos, vocal

as well as instrumental.
Students accompanists for the eve-

ning will be Suzanne Shower and
Fairy Frock. The program in vocal
music is under the direction of Mrs.
Wallace Yingling, Kenneth Sampson,
instrumental instructor and assisted
by the two core instructors Mrs. Ed-
ward Shipley and Miss Madeline
Myers.

NEW RELIGIOUS MOVIE

"Fire •Upon the Earth". This is the
title of the new religious picture to
be shown in the Taneytown Presby-
terian church, Sunday night at 7:30
and at Piney Creek Presbyterian
church, at 8:30. This new sound
motion picture, put out by the Pres-
byterian church, comes in full color.

It presents the dramatic story of
the church on earth from the time of
Christ till now. The music accom-
panying the picture, is provided by
the famous Westminster Choir and
follows the changes in church music
over the years.
"Fire Upon the Earth" has been

in great demand and is booked up
for many months ahead in the church-
es. At the present time it is being
released only to Presbyterian church-
es using the New Curriculum. Later
it will be released on a rental basis
to all churches.
This production is a screen trans-

lation of Norman Langford's book of
the same title. It presents the brief
and dramatic story of how the
church began on earth, and what it
has accomplished through the centur-
ies, and its great God-given purpose
in the world.

All who wish to see it are invited
Sunday night.
 0 

PROMOTED TO CORPORAL

Francis E. Shaum, Jr., son of Mr.
and Mrs. Francis E. Shaum, 12 Mid-
dle Street, Taneytown, Md., has been
promoted to Corporal in the United
States Army Corps of Engineers.

Corporal Shaum graduated from
Taneytown High School in 1942. He
entered the military service in De-
cember 1948 and served with the
United States Army in the occupa-
tion of Japan until he entered the
European Command in November,
1950.
The Taneytown soldier is a person-

nel technician and is assigned to the
'83rd Engineer Depot Company at
Hanau, 'Germany.

CONVOCATION AT
HOOD COLLEGE

Speakers of National Repute
Will Deliver Addresses

---
Miss Caroline Shriner daughter Of

Mr. and Mrs. George W. Shriner,
Taneytown, Md., will be the student
escort of Mrs. Milton C. Lang, Bal-
timore, Md., for the Convocation on
the Defense of Democracy at Hood
'College, April 20-22.

General George C. Marshall, Sec-
retary of Defense and Mrs. Margaret
Chase Smith, Republican Senator
from Maine, will be the principal
speakers at the 3-day event which is
expected to draw several thousand
visitors from the East and Middle
West. General Marshall will speak
at 10:30 A. M,, April 21, on "Pre-
paring for the Defense of Democ-
racy." At two o'clock that after-
noon Senator Smith will discuss
"Woman's Role in the Defense of
Democracy."

Citations will be presented to out-
standing laymen of the Evangelical
and Reformed Church, with which
Hood is affiliated, to alumnae and to
outstanding women of Maryland,
'persons who the college feels have
made a contribution to the American
way of life and who typify the ideals
for which Hood stands.
An all-day career conference aim-

ed at guiding the students into the
vocations in which they can best
serve society will open the Convoca-
tion. Also on the schedule are open-
house demonstrations in each aca-
demic department, a concert by the
Hood College Choir and a closing
service of dedication at which Albert
E. Day will be the speaker.

Mrs. Lang will receive a church
citation for her work in medical
missions. It will be , Miss Shriner's
duty to serve as a personal guide to
Mrs. Lang during her stay on the
Hood campus.

  0  -
PROCEEDINGS ORPHANS' COURT

J. Irvin Evans, executor of the es-
tate of Eurith Evans, deceased, filed
inventories of debts due and current
money, received order to pay funeral
expenses.

Letters of administration on the
estate of Lyman D. Oberlin, deceas-
ed, were granted unto A. Earl Ship-
ley, who received order to notify
creditors and warrant to appraise
goods and chattels, filed inventory,
received order to sell and order to
transfer title.
The last will and testament of Lu-

ella Decker, deceased, was admitted
to probate and letters testamentary
were granted unto Melvin H. Decker,
who received order to notify credit-
ors.
Grace M. Benson, executaix of the

estate of Raymond L. Benson
' 

de-
ceased, filed inventory of goods and
chattels, received order to sell and
transfer title and stock.
The Birnie Trust Company, exe-

cutor Of the estate of Anna E. Clark,
deceased, settled their first and final
account.
Noah D. Warehime, administrator

of the estate of Charles D. Ware-
hime, deceased, settled his first and
final acconnt.

Ella M. Blacksten, administratrix
of the estate of Ernest L. Blacksten,
deceased, filed inventory of goods and
chattels and received order to trans-
fer titles.

William R. Harvey, Jr., executor
of the estate of Maude R. Harvey,
deceased, settled his first and final
account.
J. Irvin Evans, executor of the es-

tate of Eurith Evans, deceased, filed
inventories of goods and chattels and
real estate.

Letters of administration on the
estate of Harry T. J. LaMotte, de-
ceased, were granted unto Harry B.
Shaw and John L. Shaw, who re-
ceived order to notify creditors arid
warrants to appraise goods and chat-
tels.

REFORMED MEN MEET

Last Friday evening 97 men from
the 7 charges of the Evangelical &
Reformed church in Carroll met
in St. Paul's Fellowship Hall in 

Co.,
est-

minster for their semi-annual lay-
men's conference. Following a deli-
cious meal served by the Veritas
Club of the host church Mr. Denton
Wantz, president of the conference,
took charge of the meeting. A per-
iod of folk-song singing on the part
of the group led by Rev. Morgan An-
dreas followed.
The speaker of the evening was

national Congressman John Philip
Saylor, who came directly from the
Senate Chambers in Washington to
Westminster. He was introduced and
presented by Rev. Edmund Lippy,
who had been a classmate of the
speaker at Franklin and Marshall
College.
In a very personal manner and

with a direct delivery the speaker
held his appreciative audience as he
spoke concerinng current events in
the national capitol. He stressed the
armed service draft bill and explain-
ed some of its modifications as it af-
fects the population in general. He
also spoke concerning the MacArthur
Truman episode which is such a vital
subject in today's discussions. He
also spoke briefly on other subjects
and the work of the Congress follow-
ing which there was a question and
answer period. The meeting which
had begun with the singing of "Praise
God from Whom all Blessings Flow"
concluded with the singing of "Blest
Be the Tie that Binds."

THIS 'N' THAT
(Your Chatty Column)

With all my heart, I wish yo i_ everymorning
A smile that shall last until the nextday's dawning.I wish you haalth—life's greatestwealth;
I wish you always near so that I mayhelp to cheer
Each future day and in some way—help to bring you happiness!
Folks, you won't have to go as faras Washington to see the "CherryBlossoms" for there will be "PinkPeach" .ones right along the High-way this year at "Loves Retreat!"There are thirty-six peach trees.In the month of May, the moviecalled, "I'd Climb The Highest Moun-tain" will be at the Earle and thisyou don't want to miss. "RoyalWedding" with Jane Powell andFred .Astaire are sweet and differentand if .you enjoy dancing you willlove this picture and become fasci-nated when Astaire dances rightupon the ceiling (through of coursemechanical devises of the Motion Pic-ture Industry).
"Uncle Miltie" (Berle) has a thir-ty year contract with his sponsors onT.V. Ugh!
That lovable Arthur Godfrey is stillthe favorite because he is just likethat song of Betty Hutton's, "DoingThings Naturally". If you missed last

week's Wednesday night with Arthur
Godfrey, you missed an hour's fun
right on the farm! There was the cow,
horse, ducks, chickens and the pig!
Arthur fed the little pig a bottle of
milk right there on the stool and
then to top that actually milked the
cow on that stage! The entire show
was, "Down on the Farm". The end-
ing was sweet when Arthur Godfrey
sang (still in his farm suit) "When
Day is Done"!
Cupid shot his arrow in the home

of my nice neighbor. The marriage
may take place before the young man
goes off to war! What a sweet. bride
she will be! Best wishes!

There was only a handful of people
at the 'Civil Defense Meeting" last
week! Remember about the little town
of Coventry in England? So we never
can tell! Eh?
They say that Rita and her "Khan"

are really separated but in a nice
way! I wonder how nice it is?
Now, this from Phila! If you are

too plump, Ladies and really. are
serious about losing weight this is
all you have to do—two days a week.
Breakfast—black coffee—noon a piece
of meat but no fat whatsoever and
for supper exactly six prunes! That
from a M. D. and a big one too!

In Hanover, a gentleman who was
formerly in the furniture department
of M. W's opened his awn store about
a year ago on Carlisle Street. In his
store is a "Loom" where you can
stand and watch him weave the most
attractive throw Tugs of all colors
and sizes. The name is "Stempfly".
During the Easter Holidays, Your

Observer saw that great actor, Dex-
ter who is impersonating Rudolph
Valentino. It was perfection in every
detail. The only difference of the
faces—this actor, Dexter has a dimple
in his chin and his nose is broader at
the base. His dancing was beyond de-
scribing not the light footed Astaire
type but a real dancer. His shoulders
are as broad and muscled as any
wrestler I have ever seen. The color-
ing was most beautiful in every scene
and the girls 'were glamorous.
Thinking of Wrestlers, was surpris-

ed to see Lord Spears on the "Sing It
Again" program as one of the con-
testants. The biggeF,t, surprise was his

(Continued on seventh page)

ORCHESTRA CONCERT AT
WESTERN MARYLAND COLLEGE

The Western Md. College Little
Symphony Orchestra under the direc-
tion of Prof. Philip Royer will present
its 20th anniversary Spring Concert
in Alumni Hall, tonight (April 20,)
at 8:15 P. M. Of unusual interest this
year, will be the return of many form-
er orchestra players (by special invi-
ation) who will unite with the present
orchestra for this special concert.
The program will include the fol-

lowing numbers: "Prelude and Fugue
'in D minor by Handel"; Symphony
in F major" by Carl von Dittorsdorf
and "-Concerto No. 3 in C minor" by
Beethoven.

Presiding at the piano for the first
two numbers will be Miss Marian
Martin daughter of Mrs. Olive Mar-
tin formerly of Taneytown and Dr.
Thomas A. Martin A. Martin,Raleigh,
N. C., formerly of Taneytown. The
final and concert number will be play-
ed by Miss Arleen Heggemeier a
member of the music faculty.
Miss Martin who is a sophomore

and quite active in musical organi-
zations at Western Maryland will
also be the accompanist for the Girls
Glee Club concert which will be pre-
sented at Alumni Hall on Sunday,
April 22, at 7:15 P. M. At that
time the Glee Club under the direction
of Miss Grace Cordelia Murray will
present Vaughan William's "Magni-
ficat" with Miss Olga Greison well
known Baltimore contralto singing
the solo part.
There will be no admission charge

to either of these programs and the
public is cordially invited.

KEYSVILLE-DETOUR WOMEN'S
CLUB

Due to a change in plans the regu-
lar monthly meeting of the Keysville-
Detour Women's Club will be held on

Mondayon t r a t i o
env er no ionmg , oAfpthrile 2.3poitomn the c dEedmi:

Edi-
son building in Taneytohvn.

lt's 
now time to prune your shade

trees.

SUPPORT THE FIRE COMPANY
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FRIDAY, APRIL 20, 1951

HOW OLD IS EARTH?

There are those who sincerely be-

lieve that earth is only 6000 years old.

The eternal _mountains and great

sequoia trees of California indicate a

much greater age. No one has yet

figured out a workable plan to de-

termine earth's age. It seems to me

that there is a way and simple at

that. The saltine contents of the

oceans can readily be determined

and from the rivers that flow into

the ocean it can be determined what

amount of sodium chloride is dis-

charged. This amount per year di-

vided into the total ocean content

would give the earth's age which

would be found to be much more than

the 6000 years. The probabilities are

that it would reach a billion years,

and maybe a trillion.

Whatever the age be Moses hit it

right when he said "In the beginning

God created the heavens and the

earth." Note the heavens (stars)

were created before earth. God is

eternal. He lad no beginning and

will have no ending. How long is

eternity? I don't know but I think

the old Negro preacher came pretty

near being right when he used the

little and for illustrations. He said if

a little ant were to go to the Atlantic

Coast and take up a grain of sand and

cross the continent and deposit it on

the Pacific Coast then return and get

another grain and carry it across

the continent and continue this until

all the sand in the Atlantic Coast

were• deposited in the Pacific Coast

—when done eternity about yet be-

gun. That is intellectual reasoning

par excellence.
W. J. H.

GRASS ROOTS OPINION

QUINCY MASS., PATRIOT

LEADER: "For centuries the world

has sought the amelioration of its

evils, maladjustments and misfor-

tunes, physical and spiritual, thro
ugh

transitory and worldly remedies. But

thes real, the spiritual solution for

these human ills was revealed nea
rly

20 centuries ago by Jesus, and 
the

failure of mankind to understand

and apply His teachings is respon
si-

ble for most of humanity's tr
oubles

today."
CA,NANDAIGUA, N. Y., TIMES-

JOURNAL "We are reaping an un-

savory harvest. For years we have

been demanding more from gove
rn-

ment. For years. we have been ig-

noring our responsibilities to govern
-

ment. The two do not go togeth
er.

If we want government to provide

greater and broader services, we

must expect to pay the piper."

BROI,VNSVILLE, PA., TELE-

GRATH: "If history is any criterion
,

reform will ndt come from within

big government. It will come from

the American people. Higher 
stand-

ards of morality will be imposed fr
om

outside Washington."

RADFORD, VA., NEWS-JOUR-

NAL: "Price control defeats the

free growth of a free economy. 
We

may accept it as a temporary 
meas-

ure during a crisis, but we must 
be-

ware lest the temporary measures

become permanent fixtures in our 
so-

ciety."

NOTICE

SAVE THESE DATES

TANEYT'N FIRE CO. CARNIVAL

JUNE 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 1951

2r. 53eegle'8
Chiropractic Office
EMMITSBURG, MD.

Phone: Emmitsburg 117

TRUSTEES' SALE

— OF —

House and Lot
AT KEYMAR, MD.

By virtue ofia decree of the Circuit
Court for Carroll County in Equity,
passed in Cause No. 8406, the under-

signed, Trustee appointed by said

decree, will sell at public sale on the

premises located along the Western

Maryland Railroad, near Keymar

Station, on
SATURDAY, MAY 12, 1951,

at 1:30 o'clock, P. M., all that lot of

land conveyed unto Harry S. Dor-

sey and Anna M. Barr by deed of

Ellen A. Dayhoff dated January 25,

1913, and recorded in Liber 0. D. G.

No. 121, folio 165; and the interest

of said Anna M. Barr conveyed to

Harry S. Dorsey by deed dated De-

cember 20, 1928, and recorded in

Liber E. M. M. No. 151, folio 479.

The main dwelling house on this lot

has been destroyed by fire, but it is

improved by a small dwelling house

and outbuildings.

TERMS OF SALE—One-third on

the day of sale, or on the ratification

thereof by the Court, the residue in

two equal payments of one year and

two years respectively, the credit

payments to be secured by the notes

of the purchasers, with approved se-

curity, bearing interest from the day

of sale, or all cash at the option of

the purchasers, no deed to pass until

the property is paid for in full in cash

1951 taxes td be paid by the pur-

chasers.
THEO. F. BROWN, Trustee.

Charles D. Roop, Amt.
Brown & Shipley, Solicitors.

At the same time the personal
property of Harry S. Dorsey will be
sold for cash.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

Notice is hereby given to the cred-
itors of Harry S. Dorsey, late of Car-
roll County, in the State of Mary-
land, deceased, to file their claims,
with the vouchers thereof legally

authenticated, in the office of the
Circuit Court for Carroll County, on
or before the 12th day of July, 1951;
they may otherwise by law be ex-
cluded from any benefits from said
estate.

THEO. F. BROWN, Trustee.

REPORT OF CONDITION
(111,

The Birnie Trust Co.
tif Taneytown, in the State of Mary-

land, at the close of business
on April 9, 1951

ASSETS.

I. Cash, balances with other
banks, including reserve bal-
ances and cash items in .process
of collection  $ 794,760.31

2. United States s:overnmenc
obligations, direct and guaran-
teed    1,355,874.00

3. Obligations of States and po-
litical subdivisions   41,392.31

4. Other bonds, notes and de-
bentures    472,032.04

5. Corp • •Ite stscks (including
Veone s,.ocle of Federal Reserve
Bank)   4,798.00

6. Loans and discounts (includ-
ing $1257.13 overdrafts) .... 682,436.65

7. Bank premises owned $5750.00

furniture and fixtures $1.00.. 5,751.00

11. Other assets   514.00

12. TOTAL ASSETS  $3,357,558.31

LIABILITIES.

Depialbd deposits of individ-
uals. partnerships, and corpor-

a( iods   1 ,201,806.93

14. Time deposits of individuals,
partnerships, and corpora-
tions     1,895,411.08

IS. Deposits of United States
470%1.1'111 tent (including postal
savings)    20,116.87

16 Deposita of States and po-

litical subdivisions   45,719.56

17. Deposits of Banks  3,456.98

IS. Other deposits (certified and

officers' checks, etc).  6171.96

19: TOTAL DEPOSITS $3,175,713.38

23. Other liabilities   193.97

24. TOTAL LIABILITIES (not

including subordinated obits

gations shown below) $3,175,907.35

CA P TA L ACCOUNTS.

25, Slipittals    75,000.00

26. Surplus   85,000.00

27. Undivided protits  14,637.90

28. Reserves (and retirement ac-

count for preferred capital) 
7,013.00

29. TOTAL CAPITAL AC-

COU N T,14     181,650.96

30. TOTAL LIABILITIES AND

CIS P LTA L ACCOUNT 
' 
...$3,357,558.31

•This Bank's capital consists of 
s

commis!, steek With total

l'ar Value of $75,000.011

MEMORANDA.

31. Assets pledged or aesUned

to secure liabilities and for

,other purposes   155,000.00

1, Charles it. Arnold, Cornier ot this

:tbove-named bank, do solemnly sw
ear that

the above statement is true, a
nd that it

fiiiiy and correctly represents the true

state of the several matters here
in con:alli-

ed and set forth, to the best of
 my knowl-

edge and belief.

CHAS. R. ARNOLD, Cashier.

Correct Attest:
MERWYN C. FUSS,

GEO. L. HARNER,
DAVID SMITH,

Directors

State of Maryland. County of 
Carroll as:

Sworn to and subscribed befor
e me this

18th day of April, 1951, and I hereby

certify that I am not an officer 
or direc-

tor of this bane.
WILLIAM E. BURKE, JR.,

Notary Public.

My commission expires May 7, 
1951.

Dr. Hubert E. Slocum
OPTOMETRIS2

EYES EXAMINED

GLASSES PRESCRIBED

OPTICAL REPAIR SERVICE

408 W. Main St. Phone 14

EMMITSBURG, MD.

OFFICE HOURS:
Wednesdays and Fri

days

2 p.m. to 8 p. m
.

1-3041

I fa 11-111111M11114-611111111 ills .s-a

I • 10(

I :4

H.
I

bAsi

HI
;

• LITTLESTOWN, PENNA.

• Phone 140
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KOONS FLORIST
Cut Flowers Designs

Corsages
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REPORT OF CONDITION

— OF THE —

*First National Bank
of Taneytown, in the State of Mary-

land, at the close of business,
on April 9, 1951

published in response to call made by
Comptroller of the Currency, under
Section 5211, U. S. Revised 'Statutes.

• asSETS.

'Cash, balances with other banks,
Including reserve balance, and
cash items in process of col-
lection   $324,335.62

United States Government obli-
gations, direct and guaran-
teed    862,511.80

Obligations of States and po-
litical subdivisions   30;325.00

Other bonds, notes and deben-
tures   228,728.51

Corporate stocks (including
$3,000.00 stock of Federal
Reserve bank)   3,000.00

Loans and discounts (includ-
ing No overdrafts)  411,725.70

Bank premises owned $4,000.00 
furniture and fixtures $1,200 00 5,200.00

— -

TOTAL ASSETS  $1,865,826.63

LIABILITIES.

Demand deposits of individuals,
partnerships, and corpora-
tions   469,945.09

Time deposits of indivieuats,
partnerships, and corpora-
tions    1,237,477.17

Deposits of United States Gov-
ernment (including postal sav-
ings)   5,935.57

Deposits of States and po-
litical subdivisions   18,525.22

Other Deposits Certified and
cashier's checks, etc).....   9,758.99

TOTAL DEPOSITS $1,741,642 00

TOTAL LIABILITIES  $1,741,642.04

CAPITAL ACCOUNTS.

Capital Stock:
(a) Class A preferred, total par
$None, retirable value $Nil

(11) Class B preferred, total par
;None, retirable value $N11

(c) Common stock, total
par $50,000.00 $50,000.00

Surplus ,  50,000.00

Undivided profits   22,184.59

Reserves (and retirement account

for preferred stock)  2,000.00

TOTAL CAPITAL ACCOUNTS.. 124,184.59

TOTAL T,TABILITIES ANT)
CAPITAL ACCOUNTS ....$1,865,826.63

MEMORANDA. -

Assets pledged or assigned to
secure liabilities and for
other purposes   117,000.00

State of Maryland, County of Carroll, ea:
I, Clyde L. Hesson, Cashier, of the

above-named bank, do solemnly swear that

the above statement is true to the best of

my knowledge and belief.

CLYDE L. HESSON, Cashier.

Correct Attest'
MERLE S. BAUMGARDNER,

NORVILLE P. SHOEMAKER,

HARRY B. DOUGHERTY,
Directors.

Sworn to and subseribed before me this

13th day of April, 1951.

PEARL L. BOLLINGER, Notary Public.

REPORT OF CONDITION
— 1w - -

The Detour Bank,
of Detour, in the State of Maryland

at the close of business
on April 9, 1951

ASSETS.

1. Cash, balances with other
nanks, including reserve bal-
ances, and cash items in process

of collection  $124,955.30

2. United States Government
obligations, direct and guaran-
teed   209,902.08

4 I 'tiler bonds, notes and de-
benturs   104,453.72

6. Loans and I liscounts (includ-

ing $184.10 overdrafts)  178,368.34

7. Bank premises owned $2,300.00

furniture and fixtures $400.00.. 2,700.00

12. TOTAL ASSETS  $620,379.44

LIABI LITIES.

13. Demand deposits of individ-

uals, partnerships and corpora-

tions   235,324.15

14. Time oeposits of itelividos Is

partnerships, and corporations 311,961.71

16. Deposits of States and po-

litical subdivisions   5,00001

18. Other deposits (certified and

officers' cheeks, etc)  91.94

19. TOTAL DEPOSITS $552,377.80

24. TOTAL LIABILITIES (not

including subordinnted obli-

gations shown below) $552,377.80

CAPITAL ACCOUNTS 

25. Capital*  
26. Surplus  
27. Undivided profits  

25.4100.00
29,000.00
14,001.64

29. TOTAL CAPITAL AC-
COUNTS     68,001.64

30. TOTAL LIABILITIES AND

CAPITAL ACCOUNTS  $620,379.44

*This Bank's capital consists of:

Common stock with total

par value of $25,000.00

'REMORA N D.s.

31. Assets pledged or assigned

to secure liabilities and for

other purposes  6,000.00

I, D. B. Reifsnider, Cashier of the

above-named bank, do solemnly 
swear that

the above statement is true, and that it

fully and correctly represents the true

state of the several matters herein con-

tained and set forth, to the best ot my

knowledge aiel belief.

D. B. REIFSNIDER. CaFhter

Correct Attes• •
WM. J. STONESIFER,
J. D. ADAMS,

• E. F. KEILHOLTZ,
Directors.

State of Maryland. County of C
arroll, as.

Sworn to and subscribed tmefor me th'

15th day of April. 1951, and I hereby

certify that I am not an officer or 
direct's(

of this bank.

MARY ELLEN WARNER CATLIN
,

Notary Public.

My commission expires May 7, 19
51.

TANE1TOWN ORGANIZATIONS

yssw,, Chamber of Commerm meg

9D the 4th Monday in each month

tge Municipal building. at 8.410 o'clric

tforw•n l" Fuss, Pres.: 1st Vise nes.

David Smith; Second vtee-pres..
Chas. S. Owen; Secretary, Bernard J.

Arnold; Treasurer, Chas. R. Arnold.

Taneytown Fire Company, meets on the

2nd Monday each month, at 7:30 P. M

in the Firemen's Building. President.

George Kiser; Vice-President, Doty

Robb; Recording Secretary, Robert

Feeser; Financial Secretary. Raymond

Feener; Treasurer, David Smith:

Trustees, Elwood Frock, J. W. Garber,

Thurston Putman; Chief, Charles D.

Baker.

The American Legion—Hesson-Snider

Post No. 120 meets first and third

Thursday of each month at 8.00 P.

M., in the Legion Home. All service

men welcomed. Commander, Francis

E. Lookingbill Adjutant, Raymond

Haines; Treasurer, Galen K. Stone.

alter; Service Officer, Bernard Elliot.

All other Fraternities and organizations

are invited to use this directory, for the
public information it carries. Cost for one

year only $1.50.

PUBLIC SALE
I, the undersigned will sell at public

sale due to the death of my mother,
on West Baltims;re St., in Taneytown,
Md., on

SATURDAY, APRIL 21, 1951,

at 1:00 o'clocic, the following items

TWO METAL BEDS,
and springs; 2 dressers, 2 wardrobes,
2 wash stands, trunk, clothes trees,
coffee table, porch chair, several
stands, end table, army cot, 3 congo-
leum rugs, 2 Brussels rugs, lot of
good bed clothing, mattress, dining
room chairs, heatrola; radio stand,
library table, sewing cabinet, victrola
and records; claw foot stand, platform
rocker, and several other rockers',
one studio couch, one night stand,
end table, and stand combined;
kitchen cabinet, chrome breakfast set,

Westinghouse refrigerator, good as

new; small white enamel range, wall

cabinets, several clocks, 7-way elec-
tric floor lamp, sink, cupboard, small

cupboard, table top coal oil range,
utility cabinet, commode, all kinds of

jarred fruit, lot of jelly, iron board,

all kinds of cooking utensils, lot of

dishes, silverware, lot of ointments,

blinds and curtains and many other

articles not mentioned.

TERMS CASH.
WALTER D. BARNHART.

Earl Bowers, Auct.
C. G. Bowers, Clerk. 4-6-3t

You can't ea
a gold watch!

It's better to provide adequate-

ly for your retirement yourself

. . . with a low cost Farm Bu-

reau retirement income plan.
Your local Farm Bureau

representative can quickly work

out a plan to combine with any

other pensions you may have

corning so that you'll have an
adequate retirement income.
Call-

J. Alfred Heltebridle
FRIZELLBURG, MD.

Phone: Westminster 924-W-1

FARM BUREAU
LIFE INSURANCE CO.

Home Office

COLUMBUS, OHIO .

•

Remington Rand

ADDING 
MACHINES

You'll whisk through figure work in
much less time with this handy TOP-

flight portable. For office or home, it's

a time and work saver. See it . . .
try it today!

• Lists, adds, multiplies
• • Simple 10-key keyboard

• Capacity to $100,000.00 •
• Light, responsive action

• Streamlined, portable
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NOW IS THEA

GRATITUDE
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XDOQUARTERS

Cincinnoh, Ohgo

MeathiSOMETHING

Our hearts were filled with gratitude

boys in uniform during the fighting.

Their sacrifices for us have left a lasting mark

on the lives of four million disabled veterans.

Our gratitude for their sacrifices must be just

as lasting.

We can show our gratitude today most effec-

tively by supporting the rehabilitation program of

the Disabled American Veterans.

for our

Westminster Chapter No. 22
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FRIED CHICKEN SUPPER
Family Style

Saturday, April 28, 1951
Beginning 4 p. m.

Baust Church Parish House

Benefit of

Mayberry Game Protection Association

Adult's Ticket $1.25 Child's Ticket 60c
4-20-2t

V31€4818181£1688181010180180868080381908teg=0308/888880
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John F. Spangler, V. M. D.

announces the opening of an office for the practice of Veterinary

Medicine, Route No. 3, Emmitsburg, Waynesboro road.

HOURS BY APPOINTMENT

11-23tf

CHARLES L, STONESIFER
DEALER

TANEYTOWN, MD.

4-13-2t
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ALUMNI ASS'N MEETS

The regular meeting of the Taney-
town High School Alumni Association
was held Monday evening in the High
school. Correspondence was read and
a report on membership was made by
Anna Sanders, Sec. The eusiness
Manager of the basketball teams was
directed to get all basketball uniforms
cleaned and moth-proofed. The awards
committee reported that the trophies
had not yet been received which will
be awarded to members of the grad-
uating class. The Association Pres-
ident will make the awards at the
graduation exercises.
Committee reports were heard on

the play, "While Wifey's Away",
which will be presented in the High
School, May 3 and 4th. Doris Harner
reported for the general committee
that everything was coming along
nicely. The play should prove to be
one of the best presentations of this
kind to be given here for some time.
It is full of laughs from start to
finish and the complications which
arise while Wifey's Away are real
entertainment for the whole family.
Tickets are now on sale and may be
obtained from any member of the
cast, active members of the Alumni
Association or at Dougherty's Gro-
ery. Pictures of the cast will be in the
local paper in the near future and
shots of different scenes will be post-
ed in the windows of the Potomac
Edison Co. and the Taneytown Mu-
tual Fire Insurance office. Refresh-
ments will be on sale preceding and
following the play and many home-
made goodies will be available.
The annual Banquet and Dance was

then discussed. The report of the
menu committee was accepted. T.he
banquet was awarded to the Ladies'
Auxiliary of the Fire Company.
"The Four Squares" of York will
provide music for dancing and en-
tertainment following the program.
This orchestra came highly recom-
mended to the committee. The Senior
Class was appointed to have charge
of decorations with Helen Wantz and
Ann Wilson as co-chairman. The
secretary was appointed to write in-
vitations and cards for the Banquet.
Leo Sanders was appointed to have
tickets printed. It was suggested
that those who send cards to mem-
bers of their class would submit the
list of names and addresses to the
Secretary. This would help to bring
the mailing list up to date. Every
alumnus of T. H. S. will want to
stretch every point to be present at
this year's banquet because it should
be the biggest and best ever held.
The Senior Class has been invited

to attend the May meeting. The
Alumni President gave a short talk
to the class last Thnrsday explaining
the Association to them. They will
be honorary members for the year
'51 and will be guests of the Asso-
ciation at the banquet.

After the meeting delicious re-
freshments were served by Mildred
Rittase and Minnie Ingram.

WHILE WIFEIPS AWAY
The cast has been announced for

the three-act comedy "While Wifey's
Away", which will be presented in
the High School, May 3 and 4 by the
T. H. S. Alumni Association.
A fine cast has been selected and

under the direction of Mrs. Mildred
Stine the production will be one that
everyone should see. A picture of the
entire cast will appear in this paper
next week. Watch for it!
George Motter will have the lead-

ing role as Milo Dillon, the absent
minded, but otherwise average hus-
band who loves his wife, but who
would just like to have a peaceful
vacation without her. Mildred Rit-
tase has the role opposite Motter as
Clarice Dillon, his wife. Clarice is a
devoted but suspicious wife, but what
she sees when she returns unexpect-
edly to her home would make any
trusting wife sue for divorce. John
Harner, Jr., is cast as Chester Bivin,
a henpecked friend of the Dillons
who takes everything his wife throws
at him including the rolling pin. His
gossiping and domineering( wife,
Nina, is played by Catherine Martin.
George Sauble, II, portrays the con-
ceited dashing bachelor, Elliot Blair,
who seems to make quite a nuisance
of himself in the Dillon household.
Laura Simpson, the younger single
sister of Clarice who arrives for a
visit and complicates matters even'
worse, is playebi by Minnie Ingram.
Petunia, the colored maid of the Dil-
lon's is depicted by Ruthanna Airing.
Petunia is a lazy and somewhat nosey
darky who thoroughly enjoys a good
joke and seems well satisfied with
the hilarious consequences which en-
tangle the people around her.
Pearl Bollinger portrays an old-

Maid (Aunt of Clarice's who has the
screwy notion of a way to help edu-
cate the children of Berangaria,
(which incidently is near the north
pole). Claudia Cuttleboard, la, female
attorney who comes with impressive
news for Milo, is played by Charlotte
Bollinger. Dixie Bell Garfield is the
colored washwoman who hates work
just as much as 'Petunia. Dixie and
Petunia make a fine pair. Dixie Bell
is portrayed by Anna Sanders. La-
Reina Fream is cast as Mrs. Jimmy,
Queenie), Dillon. Queenie is a new-
ly-wed who, because of a heartless
draft board, was separated from her
husband immediately after the wed-
ding and is sent to the Dillons for a
visit. Francis Myers depicts Uncle
Rarnably, Milo's uncle who collects
pets.

Pictures of numerous scenes will
be displayed in the windows of the
Potomac Edison Co. and in the Mu-
tual Fire Ins. Co. office. Tickets are
now on sale and may be obtained
from Alumni members, several pupils
of the Elementary and High schools,
or at Dougherty's Grocery.

USE OF GAS

For the second consecutive year,
the liquified patroleum gas industry
added a million new domestic cus-
tomers in 1950, Mr. James T. Hays,
of Town and Country Gas Service,
Inc., local LP-Gas distributor, an-
nounced today. Citing the results
of a recent national su rvey. Mr.
Hays revealed that the fast-growing
LPlGas business has made such tre-
mendous progress in the past few
years that it now supplies modern

gas service, directly or indirectly, to
more families than the manufactured
gas industry and to about two-thirds
as many as the natural gas industry
LP-Gas (also known as butane,

propane, bottled and tank gas) is
used today in upwards of 7,500,000
American homes. Domestic consump-
tion of the fuel in 1950 reached an
estimated 2,143,000,000 gallons. This
outstrips the industry's total sales
for all purposes in 1947 and repre-
sents a 31.7 per cent increase over
the 1949 domestic figure. Sales for
all classes of business, excluding
products used in the manufacture of
aviation and motor gasoline and syn-
thetic rubber, are believed to have
aggreagted 3,333,000,000 gallons last
year, a gain of 25.4 per cent over
1949. •
Useed in the home for cooking,

water heating, refrigeration, heat-
ing, clothes drying and incineration,
LP-Gas also has hundreds of appli-
cations in agriculture, commerce
and industdy. The total retail value
of equipment and appliances sold by
the LP-Gas industry for domestic
purpposes alone in 1950 approxi-
mated one-third of a billion dollars,
Mr. Hays said.

MARYLAND MUSINGS

mu fertilizing your lawn this
spring, you'll get the best results
from a straight form of nitrogen-type
fertilizer, such as ammonium nitrate.
Witch the temperatures in storing

potatoes. Keep potatoes cool but
not cold. Remember to keep them in
the dark. Light may cause greenish
disqdloration with deterioration of
eating qualities.

It pays to have your seed tested for
purity and germination whether you
plan to use the seed on your own
farm or sell it.
In frying or roasting poultry, birds

should not be covered, say home eco-
nomics, specialists of the University
of Maryland Extension Service. The
meat is more juicy and there is less
shrinkage.

If eggs are marked 'according to
U. S. weight classes, "extra-large"
eggs will weight at least 27 ounces;
"large" at least 24 ounces; 'mediums'
at least 21 ounces; "small" eggs at
least 18 ounces.
For a trick to save work come dish

washing, use a small pan and rack
when broiling just a few chops or
line the broiler pan with aluminum
foil which can be thrown away with-
out washing.

If cows are turned out on pasture
too early they often drop in milk
production and the pastures are ruin-
ed by the early grazing. Wait until
the grass is 4 to 6 inches tall and the
ground is firm enough so the cows
won't cut up the sod.

Teen-ages desire strict but fair
discipline which is not selfishly im-
posed.
Wise discipline at home gives the

feeling of security which all chil-
dren need and want.

If you leave crust on bread when
you make sandwiches, ypu will avoid
waste and the sandwiches will stay
moist longer.
It is estimated that during World

War II, clothing a soldier for a year
took the wool production of 26 sheep.
To avoid spoilage, refrigerate lard

butter, margarine, drippings and ren-
dered fats and opened containers of
salad oils. Hydrogenated fats (cer-
tain shortenings sold under brand
names) can be kept at room tempera-
ture.

-
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SEVENTY YEARS AFTER ITS FOUNDING BY CLARA D.ARTON,
IN 1881, THE AMERICAN RED CROSS IS READY AS ALWAYS
FOR.s'ACTIVE SERVICE IN TIME OF CRUCIAL NEED.
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Of Special Interest to
Dairy Farmers

Many items you need, especially those manufactured of metal,

have become hard_ to get. Some cannot be obtained. But—

We are in a position to supply you promptly with your require-

ments in

Jamesway Barn Equipment
So don't be satisfied with anything but the best---JAMESWAY.

Get in touch with us—no obligation.

DONALD SIX
Call—Union Bridge 3111 MIDDLEBURG, MD.

4-13-3t

...You can pay more

but you can't buy better!
Jounce, pitch, and sway are things of the past when
you own a '51 Ford. That's because Ford's new Auto-
matic Ride Control self-adjusts to all types of
roads for maximum smoothness. Its a
"look Ahead" Ford feature.

tie
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Fori DriVe...You can pay more
but you can't buy betiler!

For '51 Ford "Looks Ahead" to bring you new Fordomatic*
Drive . . . the newest, smoothest, most flexible Automatic
transmission ever! The great new Fordomatic never lags,
gives you trigger-quick getaway and easy "rocking" in
snow or mud. *Optional on V-8 models of *Oro cod.

You can pay moreng,•.
but you can't buy better!

For years ahead, Ford's elegance of style will rule the road!
New "Color-Keyed" Fordcraft Fabrics, "Safety-Glow"
Control Panel and new "Colorblend" Carpeting are all
custom-matched to Ford's exterior colors.

.0.,,reavrerr- La"

43 "Look Ahead" Features
plus FORDOMATIC* Drive

Crouse Motor Sales
FORD DEALER

Phone 4331 Taneytown, Md.
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Medford Grocery Co.
Store Hours Every Week-day 8 to 6.

PHONES: New Windsor 4881

Westminster 549J

Hybrid
Seed Corn
$6.00 Bushel to
$9.50 Bushel

OTHER SEED CORN
$5.25 Bushel

Still have some
SEED POTATOES

Famous
"ADAMS"
ROOF COATING

CAN FURNISH EXPERIENCED MEN TO
PAINT YOUR ROOFS.

Largest Assortment of

HORSE COLLARS

ELECTRIC FENCERS,
Steel Posts and Coppered

Wire

BROODERS

DYNAMITE for DITCHING
and MU to do the work

GARDEN SEEDS

Rakes, Hoes,

Wheelbarrows

Wall Paper
LINOLEUM

.201111EntX.

TARPAULINS
16-

MEDFORD--
GROCERY CO.,INC.

1,'AMosr EVERVTMAIG"

MEDFORD. MARYLAND
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CORRESPONDENCE
La'est IIALs of Local News Furnished
dy Our degular Staff of Writers

Uebl. eurrespondenze to reach our

see. on Thursday, if at all pos,ible. it

MU be Lece.sa,y therefore, for laost let-

'era to be tuaiie0 on Wednesday, or by

7 1st Mail, west in W. M. R. R., Thur.-

ley morning. Letters mailed on Thur.-

:sy everiug may not reach ne in time.

FEESERSBURG

In all trying positions in which I
shall be placed, and doubtless I shall
be placed in many such, my reliance
will be upon you and the people of
the United States; and I wish you to
remember, now and forever, that it
is your business, and not mine; that
of the union of these United States
and the liberties of this people shall
be lost, it is but little to any one
man of fifty-two years of age, but a
great deal to the 30 millions of peo-
ple who inhabit these United States,
and to their posterity in all coming
time. It is your business to rise up
and preserve the Union and liberty
for yourselves, and not for me. I
appeal to you again to constantly
bear in mind that not with politi-
cians, not with Presidents, not with
office-seekers, but with you is the
question: Shall the Union and shall
the liberties of this country be
preserved to the latest generation?
The above lines were written by

Abraham Lincoln in 1861 but they
seem to apply to this year 1951, as
well. It seems to this average citi-
zen that we have had a tendency
lately to get excited over trivial mat-
ters and to ignore the more import-
ant ones. For instance, this past
week the whole nation has been al-
most hysterical in its debate over
President Truman and General Mac-
Arthur. Most of the arguments were
childish and superficial. Only a very
small group of people attempted to
bring before the nation the real is-
sues involved. And only a very small
fraction of the people made any ef-
fort to find out for themselves. It is
this willingness on the part of the
people to accept the newspaper
headlines as facts and to accept the
commentators and immature politi-
cians statements as gospel, that is
giving our nation a name of "intel-
lectual delinquency" among the other
nations of the world. Whether we
want to be or not, we are the num-
ber one nation in the world and its
about time to think, speak and act
like a citizen of the number one na-
tion.

I worry, I putter, I push and
shove. Hunting little molehills to
make mountsfins of. •
A party telephone is one place

where good manners are a must if
one wishes to keep friends and
neighbors thinking well of us. When

- you answer the phone say "hello",
rather than "the Brown's residence"
or "Central 2121". Talk distinctly,
loud enough to be heard, but not so
lca,c: that your voice is blurred. Avoid
call:ng at meal hours. Give the other
person time to answer the phone, it
is suggested you wait for ten rings.
If you have more than a short mes-
E,age to give, ask, "Do you have time

to chat awhile?" Your friend may
have company or be busy. When you
do the calling it is up to you to say
goodbye. And [for friendship sake
and for the good of the telephone put
the receiver down gently. If year's
is a party line, be sure to .share it
with the other partys and not act
like it's your private line.
The square dance held last Friday

evening at the Elmer Wolfe school
by the elementary grades for the
benefit of the library brought out the
teen age group, but was shunned by
the parents. I must admit this type
of dancing is too strenuous for most
adults but one can have just as much
fun from watching the children as
actually taking part. In fact, it is
rather a comforting feeling to be
able to sit back and "act ones age"
knowing one isn't expected to kick
up one's heels like a ten year old.
Word came to friends in Middle-

liurg last week of the death of Sam
Pelser who died in Boston last Mon-
day. He will be remembered by many
in the community. For many years
he rode horses for Mr. Robert J.
Walden at Bowling Brook racing
farm and lived there until he retired
from riding and went to Boston to
live.

Mrs. Earle Wilhide and Mrs. Sam-
uel Keyton attended the Missionary
Convention held last week in Em-
mitsburg. About 250 members at-
tended from the different Mission-

ary Societies throughout the state.
Things that everyone should know.

The historic Mason-Dixon line is not

an imaginary line but was marked
every mile by five-foot limestone
monuments, many of which still ex-

ists.
One and a half million children of

school age were not in school last

yeqr due to shortage of teachers,

buildings and school equipment.
There were 11,002 books publish-

ed in the United States last year.

This means new books just recently

written. A good many of this num-

ber were text books used in schools

and colleges, but there were also a

great many books of fiction written.

In spite of radio and T. V. there still

remains a large group of people who

enioy reading for pleasure.
Gov. McKeldin vetoed the bill giv-

ing the teachers of Maryland a $300

raise. It seems to me that it is a

case of penny wise, pound foolish, to
practice economy on education, when
even a first grader these days knows

that the destiny of our country will

one day rest upon the shoulders of

our young boys and girls. If they

are poorly educated and equipped to
handle the problems that come up

so will our country suffer, as it is
suffering today for lack of brave

and honest leadership.
Visitors over the week-end at

Merry Knoll were Miss Barbara
Wisner, of Baltimore, and David
RuffiaVton ot Western Maryland
College.

Future first graders were regis-
tered Tuesday at the Elmer Wolfe
school and given a phrical check-

up. About 35 boys and girls signedI in an increase over last year of
about ten pupils.
The "Improvement Committee" of

Middleburg was pleased with the
success of the card party held Fri-
day evening at Memory Lane recrea-
tion Center in Middleburg. The net
proceeds will be used foh the benefit
of the community.
Our English Mockingbird is sitting

in the pine tree outside the kitchen
window looking very much disgusted
with this very cold April weather.
He doesn't seem much in the mood
of setting up housekeeping or taking
a wife. In fact, he is looking right
in the window as if he would like to
come in and get warm.
The world will take on a different

look when each one of us start ask-
ing ourselves "What am I giving
to life" instead of 'What am I get-ting out of it.'

Miss Janice Smith was given a
party Tuesday evening, April 10 by
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Samuel
Smith in honor of her 18th birthday.
Refreshments were served to about
50 guests. The table '.was beauti-
fully decorated with a pink and white
cake as the center piece, with other
refreshments served buffet style.
Those who helped make the party a
memorable affair were: Miss Audrey
Bowers, Dorothy and Betty Johnson,
Donna and Nina Sherman, Lois
Hamburg, Patsy and Jerry Leakins,
Sandra Trent, June Harley, of Yel-
low Springs; Elizabeth, Dorothy and
Becky Leatherman, Gettysburg; Her-
bert Smith, of Walkersville; Austin,
Jack, Richard, David and Grayson
•Smith, Kirby Eyler, Eddie Smith,
Rodney Bostian, Howard Stansbury,
of Detour; Henry Leatherman, Bil-
ly and Bubbie Summers, of Freder-
ick; Mr. and Mrs. Paul Leatherman,
Mrs. Samuel Smith, of Mt. Airy;
Mr. and Mrs. Edw. Smith, Mr. and
Mrs. David Bowers, Mr. and Mrs.
Truman Leakins, Mrs. Reda Bostian,
Mrs. Lulu Grinder, Mrs. Roland For-
new and daughter, Karen; Mr. and
Mrs. Cleon Wolfe and Mr. and Mrs.
Calvin Hoy, of Union Bridge, Janice
received many beautiful gifts.
Only the little woman who lugs

the groceries home would ever guess
it, but it takes about two acres of
farm crops to feed one person a year
 0 
FR1Z ELL BURG

The Women's Missionary Society of
Emmanuel Baust Lutheran church
met at the home of Miss Carrie Myers
Uniontown, on Wednesday evening,
April 11, with a good attendance.
Mrs. Edward Haifley was in charge
of the meeting and led in devotions.
The topic for the lesson study was
"Give us this Day our Daily Bread."
me reading topics, How God satisfies
the desire of every living thing, a
workman who needeth not to be
ashamed and love thy neighbor as
thyself. Mrs. Calvin Starner read
"A Psalm for Today" and a poem
"The Common Task" was read by the
leader, she also conducted the Mag-
azine quiz. A mission study will be
held jointly with the Uniontown So-
nety April 26, in St. Paul's church.
Announcement was also made of the
Mother and Daughter banquet to be
held May 9, 7 P. M., at Silver Run.
A thank you note was read from Mr.
Vernon Zimmerman for basket of
fruit he received from the Society
since his return from the hospital.
it was also stated that the bake sale
recently held in Westminster was a
grand success. Hymns sung were
'We Plough the Fields and Scatter",
"For the Beauty of the Earth" and
"Savior Like a Shepherd Lead Us".
The next meeting will be held at the
Church, May 17.
Mr. and Mrs. William Fox and

family moved last week to the farm
house of Mr. Clarence Myers. Mr.
Myers will farm the land.
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Neill are

the happy parents of a baby boy.
Mrs. Naill and little son returned
fram the Hanover hospital the past
week and are getting along nicely.

-Miss Bessie Yingling is spending
this week with Mrs. Emma Rodkey,
Uniontown.
The Uniontown Parish Joint Choir

presented the Easter Cantata, "Re-
Jemption's Song" at Bethany Evan-
gelical Lutheran church, Baltimore
on Sunday evening. Due to the death
of the mother of the host pastor, Rev.
Andrew F. Theisz, Rev. Donald War-
renfeltz had charge of the service.
Rdfreshments were served in the
social room of the church by the host
choir and Luther League.
Sunday dinner guests of Mr. and

Mrs. Allen Moielock were Mrs.
Glennie Crouse and daughter Evelyn
and Mrs. Emma Rodkey of Union-
town. Other guests were Mr. and
Ars. Denton Wantz, son James and
daughter Jean.
The Uniontown Farm Burean Plan-

ning group met on Tuesday evening
it the home of Mr. and Mrs. Samuel
Rakes, New Windsor with 22 mem-
bers and guests attending.
The Baust Girls 4-H Club met re-

cently at the home of Kitty Orr
Reese with ten members present. The
roll call was answered with "How I
Can Improve My Posture". The pro-
gram consisted of song, "Sons of the

I
Soil", 4-H pledge led by Joyce Put-
man, piano solo by Kitty Orr Reese,
reading "Spring Fever", LaDonna
Myers, song, "Oh, Suzanne". During
the business meeting the national 4-H
thrift program was presented to the
club. Plans were made for the Girls
and Boys Clubs to present a joint
program on National 4-H Sunday,
April 29th in Baust Reformed church.
The group will have charge of the
worshin service, decorating the church
with flowers and will also present
special music. A demonstration on
'Egg Whip" was given by Kitty Orr
Reese and judged by Joyce Putman.
The project demonstration on "The
Care of the Girls Room and Making
a Bed" was given by the local leader,
Mrs. Russell Frock. Refreshments
and games were played by the group.
Mr. Delmar Warehime and Robert

Cornwell spent the weekend on ma-
neuvers, near Edgewood, Md., with
Battery C, National Guard of West-
minster.
Mrs. Mary Sullivan, son Ray, Mr.

and Mrs. Donald Sullivan of Freder-
ick spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs.
John Berwager and Mrs. Mazie Sul-
livan. Visitors in the evening were
Me and Mrs. Harry Berwager, Mr.

and Mrs. Russell Berwager, daugh-
ters Shirley and Bettie of Hanover.

Miss Wanda Mehring and Miss
Diane Thomas of Taneytown were
Tuesday overnight guests of Miss
Dottie Morelock.
The Women's Guild of Baust Re-

formed church met in the Parish
house on Monday evening. A splendid
program was prepared by Mrs. Wm.
DeGroft. The topic was "Our Church
on the Highway". A playlet "What
Makes Mary Tick" was given by
Mrs. DeGroft, Mrs. Martin Rodkey
and Mrs. Lloyd Bowers. The worship
program was led by Mrs. Kenneth
Feeser. The business meeting was in
charge of Mrs. Russell Bloom. A con-
tribution of $5.00 will be given to the
Cancer Fund. Final plans were made
for the Mother and Daughter ban-

quet which will be held Thursday,
April 26 instead of May 18 as was
previously announced.
The Youth Fellowship will meet

Sunday evening in the Parish house
at 7:30 p. m. Rev Miles Reifsnyder,
pastor.
Regular services in Baust Luther-

an church Sunday, April 22. Sunday
school, 9:45, Worship at 11. Rev. Don-
ald Warrenfeltz, pastor.
Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Cashman,

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Cashman and
two grandchildren, Johnny and Tom-
my Cashman visited Sunday at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Harry Cash-
man and family.
Mrs. Frank Suffern and daughter

Linda visited with Capt. Frank Suff-
ern at Indiantown Gap, Pa., on Sun-
day.
Thought you would like this one.

Two hillbillies who had never been
on a train before had been • drafted
and were on their way to camp. A
food merchant came through the
train, selling bananas. The two
mountaineers had never seen bananas
and each bought one. As one of them
bit into his, the train entered a tun-
nel. His voice came to his companion
in the darkness: "Jed, have you eat-
en.  yours yet?" "Not yet," answered
Jed. "Why?" "Well, don't touch it.
I've taken one bite and gone blind."

HOOPER'S DELIGHT

Those who visited at the hoine of
Mr. and Mrs. IL 0. Farver and Mr.
and Mrs. Willard Barber, on Sunday
and during the week were Mr. and
Airs. Ervin Crabbs and daughter
Patsy, Mr. and Mrs. Theodore Stultz,
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Jenkins and
daughter Carol, Mr. and Mrs. Bob
Green and daughters, Vonnie and
Barbara, Mr. and Mrs. Gaines Dodd
and children Gaines and Brenda, Mr.
and Mrs. Jess Close, Mr. and Mrs.
Frank Snyder and son Frankie, Mr.
and J.YIrs. Howard Smith and sons,
Mr. and Mrs. Sterling Poole, Mr.
and Mrs. Charles Porter, Mr. and
sirs. Wm. Edmondson and children,
Mr. and Mrs. William Hooper and
daughter Judy, Mr. and Mrs. Fred
Farver and sons Jerry and Jackie
Lee, Mr. and Mrs. Harry J. Farver
and daughters Faye Jean and Vicki
Lynn, Mrs. Leslie Leister, Mr. and
Mrs. W. Edmondson, Mr. and Mrs.
Kerby Snyder and daughters Tootle,
Sandra, Nancy and aharon, Mrs.
Evelyn Toland and sons Larry and
Thomas, Mrs. Mark Redding and son
Sfevie, Mrs. Raymond Hughes, Mrs.
John Erb, Mrs. Hayes Brown and
daughter Carol, Mrs. J. Brown,
tfovvell Davis, Mr. Shaw, Raymond
and Vollen Barber, Joseph Jenkins,
Frank Poole, Diana Boody and Patty
Shorb.
Mr. Monroe Pickett was a patient

at the University Hospital last week.
Hope he soon gets well.

Little Jerry Farver, son of Mr. and
Mrs. Fred Farver spent last Friday
till Saturday with his grandparents,
Mr. and Mi. Harry 0. Farver.
Mrs. Milton Basler of Westminster

has been on the sick list. We wish
her a speedy recovery.
Mr. red Farver of Westminster

was surprised on Sunday evening
when three of his buddies that he
was o.erseas with in World War II
called tern Loin New York. They con-
versed for 20 minutes talking over

old times, having not seen each other
since 1945.

miss 'Diana Boddie recently spent

a night with Mr. and Mrs. Fred Far-

ver and family, of Westminster, Mr.

and Mrs. Roland Farver visited there

in the past week.
Little Glenn Coefied, son of Mrs.

Helen Bixler, of Westminster is con-

fined to his home with mumps and a

hernia ailment. We also hope he will

be able to be about.
Jerry and Jackie Farver spent

Friday with their grandmother, Mrs.

Leslie Leister.
Mr. and Mrs. Billie Reese and

daughter Dinna Maye spent the week

end with Maye Farver.
Mrs. Harry J. Farver and son,

Harry J. Farver spent last Friday

with Mrs. Farver's mother, Mrs.

Joseph Snyder and son Ross.

Miss Joyce Ann Snyder of Keymar

spent the week end with her uncle

and aunt, Mr. and Mrs. Melvin. Sny-

der of Frederick.
Mr. Willard Barber went back to

Church and Home Hospital on Fri-

day for a check up. He is doing fine.

Hope he continues.
Mr. and Mrs. Harry J. Farver and

daughters Faye Jean and Vicki Lynn

spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs.

Joseph Click and family.
Mr. and Mrs. Albert Cook moved

last week to Sykesville where Mr.

and Mrs. Cook have accepted employ-

ment at the Sanatorium.
Mrs. Ralph Franklin spent one day

last week with Mr. and Mrs. Chas.

Franklin and daughter.
Mr. and Mrs. Bud Stultz and

children and Mr. and Mrs. Charles

Porter spent Sunday with Mr. Port-

er's brother of Baltimore.
Miss Cookie Barnes spent last Sat-

urday with Faye Jean Farver.

HARNEY

Services at St. Paul's, April 22, at

9:10 A. M., Worship with sermon by

Rev. Chas. Held; S. S., at 10:15.

The Supt. of St. Paul S. S. has an-

nounced several committees in charge

of Mother and Daughter banquet is

Mrs. John H. Harner. Mother's day

program chairman Mrs. E. P. Shriv-

en, and Children's day committee,

chairman Mrs. Daniel Yingling, Mrs.

I Wilbur Reifsnider and Mrs. George

I Marshall.

The flowers in the altar vases was
presented by Rev. and Mrs. Chas.
Held and family in memory of their
son who was killed in an auto acci-
dent several years ago.
Mrs. Estella Hahn spent Wednes-

day in Taneytown with relatives and
friends.
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Reaver,spent

'a day recently in Harrisburg, Pa.,
with relatives.
Mr. and Mrs. Chas. Shildt were cal-

lers Sunday evening at the home of
Mr. and Mrs. Murray Fuss and Mr.
Samuel D. Snider and sister Ruth.
Mr. and Mrs. Ambrose V. Ecken-

rode, Emmitsburg, spent Sunday
evening with the former's mother,
Mrs. Hannah C. Eckenrode and fam-
ily.
Mrs. Frank Hoffman will be the

guest teacher of the Ladies' Adult
Sunday School class taught by Mr.
Chas. M. A. Shildt of St. Paul Luth-
eran, on April 22 ,at 10:15. Come
hear her explain the lesson, every
person welcome.
Mn. and Mrs. Sylvester Krumbine,

Littlestown, and Mr. and Mrs. Harry
Cline, Greenstone, Pa. were Sunday
evening visitors of Mr. and Mrs.
Walter Kump.
Those who called over the week-

end at Mr. and Mrs. Dewey Orner's
were: Rev. Chas. Held, Mr. and Mrs.
Solomon Iker, Fairfield, Pa.; Robt.
Orner, Emmitsburg, Wm. Orner, of
Gettysburg. Pa.
Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Wantz enter-

tained to dinner in their home Sun-
day: Mr. Emanuel Kump, Emmits-
burg and Mr. and Mrs. Harry Cline,
Greenstone, Pa.
Mr. and Mrs. McDonald, daughter,

Westminster, were visitors of Mr.
and Mrs. Walter Kump, on Wednes-
day evening.
Mr. and Mrs. Harry J. Wolff had

as Sunday evening visitors Mr. and
Mrs. Dallas Shriver, Littlestown, and
Mr. and Mrs. Earlington Shriver, of
Taneytown R. D. 2.

Services at the U. B. church in
this village Sunday evening at 7:30,
in charge of Rev. Arthur Garvin,
pastor of this charge for over 13
years. The public is welcome to this
service. Let's go.
The Aid Society of St. Paul will

hold their annual Mother and Daugh-
ter banquet on May 8. The meal will
be prepared by the ladies of Mt.
Joy church and served in the parish
house there. Mrs. John H. Harner is
chairman of the committee and Mrs.
E. P. Shriven, Pres. of Aid Society.
Consult them.
Mr. and Mrs. Daniel Yingling,

near this village entertained in their
home last Sunday afternoon in honor
of their oldest son, Daniel, Jr., age
8th year birthday anniversary. A
number of -the boys of this village
and vicinity were guests. Refresh-
ments were served in abundance and
Daniel received many gifts.
Mr. Norman Hess, daughter Cath-

erine, entertained in their home the

ioint Missionary Societies of Piney

Creek Presbyterian and Taneytown

the topic "The American Indian and

Korea" was discussed by the ladies.

The hostess Miss Catherine served
refreshments.
The 4-H Girls' Club held their

monthly meeting in the home of Ruth

Naomi Ridinzer, last week.

 o 

What Sacrifice;
Are Required?

WHAT sacrifice is required of us
in the cause of peace? Our
money? Our labor? Our life?

It may well be one or more of these
things, but primarily it exceeds them
all. Money, work, and human life
have been liberally peered forth in
two world conflicts, but they have
not been adequate to purchase peace.
In the power and humility of his

words and works, Christ Jesus set
the true standard of living for all
people. His teaching of love for God
and man as the bedrock of right liv-
ing drew from the scribe the com-
ment (Mark 12:32, 33): "Well, Mas-
ter, thou hast said the truth: for
there is one God; and there is none
other but he: and to love him with
all the heart, and with all the under-
standing, and with all the soul, and
with all the strength, and to love his
neighbour as himself, is more than
all whole burnt offerings and sacri-
fices."

This, then, is the sacrifice that we
are all called upon to make in peace
as in war—to lift up a standard of
spiritual living; to let go of every-
thing that falls short of it. Referring
to Christ Jesus and the Sermon on
the Mount, Mary Baker Eddy, the
Discoverer and Founder of Chris-
tian Science, writes in "Retrospec-
tion and Introspection" (p. 91):
"What has this hillside priest, this
seaside teacher, done for the human
race? Ask, rather, what has he not
done. His holy humility, unworldli-
ness, and self-abandonment wrought
infinite results." Are his avowed fol-
lowers lifting up these qualities in
their own lives, and achieving pro-
portionate results?

W'e need to sacrifice our frightened
sense of a god of war, a god of
famine, a god of senseless destruc-
tion, from whose despotism there is
no escape and in subservience to
whom there is neither freedom nor
dignity for the human race. We
need to acknowledge one universal,
omnipotent God, who is Love, and
man glorious in the humility of be-
ing His reflection.
When we look with apprehension

at the despotic tendencies of a nation
or a system, let us make sure then*

are no despotic tendencies in our
own thought. If there are, let us sac-
rifice them quickly. If we are hold-
ing another in the grip of human
hate or enslaving, possessive love,
we must release him in the dignity
of his true being.
When we stand aghast at the greed

of another, are we sure that no
slightest taint of greed inheres in
ourselves? May we not ,sacrifice
willingly the urge to hoa?d, or to
defeat government demands by
suuandering what we have. ne,1 re-

with trust in Leve's infinite
provision?

While carpineat the tardiness of
nations or individuals to come to
the rescue of freedom, do we spon-
taneously answer the call? Are we
alert to sacrifice materialistic think-
ing for the prayerful enfolding in
thought of those upon whom the con-
duct of world affairs especially
rests? Or are we secretly relieved
that no upheaving demands have yet
been made upon us, or upon those
we love?
To sacrifice effectively for peace

means constant, consistent struggle
to sacrifice materialism, apathy,
smugness, despondency, criticism,
and narrow, jealous, or spiteful
thinking. It means sincere endeavor
to lift up the standard of Christly
living and bear it quietly and coura-
geously in our day-to-day dealings.
It means quickening. enlarging, and
spiritualizing affection so that it may
grow from faithful beginnings in the
home and the community to embrace
all niankind. . . .
What can we do to better serve

our country and humanity? May we
not, each one of us, loving God with
all our heart, and our neighbor as
ourself, make our life a continuous,
dutiful act of service in its highest
sense, by striving to be more Christ-
like? Loyalty to God and to spiritual
man in the freedom and dignity of
His likeness embraces in its bigness
every true loyalty and brings to our
living a consistent singleness of pur-
pose and usefulness. No less a sac-
rifice is called for, and we may make
it with glad and wholehearted devo-
,tion.—The Christian Scien,.:e Monitor.

4,000-Year-Old Skeleton
Found in Bronze Age Site
SINGEN, Germany — A human

skeleton, that of a woman, believed
to be 4,000 years old, has been
found near Singen and is proof of
human settlement there from the
early stone age to shortly before
the Roman conquests.
The discovery was maae near

Lake Constance, together with the
excavation of 10 other ancient
graves.
According to experts, the excava-

tion sites are the only ones in cen-
tral Europe through which human
history since 4,000 B. C. c an be
traced with continuity.
The 4,000-year-old bronze age

skeleton, was, buried in a sitting
position, facing east and had a
ring, necklace, a large needle and
two ankle hoops, all made of
bronze, with her in the grave.
The other burial places revealed

urns dating back 3,000 years.

DIED

LEVI D. MAUS, SR.
Levi D. Maus, Sr., 81, prominent

citizen of' Carroll county, died at his
home, 31 'Westmoreland Street, West-
minster, Friday evening, April 13,
1951 following a seven weeks illness.
He was born Sept. 24, 1869, in

Adams county, a son of the late Levi
D. and Lydia A. Maus. Mr. Maus
-was active in farming for a number
of years near Tyrone, Carroll county,
until he moved to Westminster and
accepted the position as deputy
clerk in the office of the clerk of the
court under Edwin M. Mellor, Jr.
He served as first deputy until the
death of Mr. Mellor and was then
appointed clerk during the eemainder
of Mr. Mellor's term. In 1928, he
was elected to the office of clerk of
court and finished his service in 1942
retiring after 21 years as a public
official in Carroll county.
Mr. Maus was a member of Door-

to-Virtue Masonic Lodge, Westmin-
ster, since 1905, and a past master
for ten years. He also was a mem-
ber of the Knights of Pythias Lodge,
Frizelli.urg, and a member of the
Westminster City Council at the time
of his death, having served for eight
years. He was a faithful member of
St. Paul's Reformed church and Sun-
day school, Westminster. He and his
wife, Harriet Babylon Maus, cele-
brated their 50th wedding anniver-
sary on Jan. 3rd.

Surviving besides his wife are five
children: Stanley R. Maus, Hanover;
Levi D. Maus, Jr., Pleasant Valley,
and Mrs. Ralph E. Yealy, Mrs.
Franklin S. Gilds and Charles H.
Maus, all of Westminster; a sister,
Mrs. Ellen Rinehart, Westminster,
and a brother, Charles W. Maus, of
Lexington, N. C.

Funeral services were held Mon-
day afternoon, at the J. E. Myers,
Jr., Funeral Home, Willis St., West-
minster. His pastor, the Rev. J. Ed-
mund Lippy, officiated. Burial was in
Krider's cemetery. The Westminster
Masonic Lodge conducted graveside
services.

In Loving Memory of my dear wife.

MYRTLE MYERLY,

who passed away 1 year ago AprIl 16
- —

I *often sit and think of you,
And speak of how you died:
To think you could not say good-bye
Before you closed your eyes.

We think of you in silence.
No eyes can see us weep:
But many silent tears are shed.
When others are asleep.

My heart still aches with sadness,
My eyes till with tears.
God only knows how I miss you
At the end of one year.

Knowing you are gone,
That I cannot forget.
But believing we will be reunited
Is the greatest thought yet.

No one knows how much I miss you.
No one knows the bitter pain
I have suffered since I lost you
Life has never been the same.

There is not a day, dear wife,
That I don't think of you.

Those whom we love go out of sight,
But never out of mind.
They are cherished in the hearts
Of those they leave behind.

Loving and kind in all her ways,
Upright and just to the end of her days;
Sincere and true in heart and mind,
Beautiful memories she left bhind.

A happy home we once enjoyed,
How sweet the memory still.
But death has left a loneliness
The world can never fill.

By her husband,
S. ARTHUR MYEIRLY.

COMMUNITY LOCALS
(Continued from first page)

Mrs. Martina Dutrow, of Baltimoreis s Lilting at the home of her son,Mr. Sam E. Breth and family.
Mr. and Mrs. Luther Luckenbaugh,daughter, Jean, were Sunday supperguests of Mr. and Mrs. Paul Hughes,of Patapsco.

Doctor and Mrs. Ira Deall, of Lib-ertytown, attended services Sundayat Trinity Lutheran church and call-ed at the home of Mr. and Mrs. PercyPutman.

Relit and Mrs. .Morgan Andreashad Mrs. Frederick A. Goetsch andMrs. Ernest J. F. Dettbarn as dinnerguests on Wednesday following theguild meeting.

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Musselmanand sons, Delon and Monty, of Som-erset, Pa.
' 

spent from Friday untilSunday at the home of the Rev. andMrs. Glenn L. Stahl and daughter.
Norman Wiley and Norman Bur-rier, employees of J. H. Ommert(Massey & Harris Farm Imple-ments) attended a three day Mechan-ical School, at Frederick, the pastweek.

Mr. Herbert Smith, .Littlestown, a
former resident of Taneytown, is a
patient at Johns Hopkins Hospital,
Baltimore. He had two operationson. his eyes. He is getting along
nicely and expects to come home theend of the week.

Mr. J. H. Ommert will attend the
Fourth District Governors Cabinet
Meeting Sunday at the Ali Ghan
Shrine Club, in Cumberland. Mrs.
Ommert and Johnny and Mr. and
Mrs. Charles Arnold and son, George
will accompany them.

The Rev. and Mrs. Arthur W. Gar.
yin visited Lebanon Valley College,
Annville, Pa., on Saturday. Mrs.
Garvin attended the mother and
daughter banquet. Their son Ro-
land, a student of the college, ac-
companied them home returning
Sunday.

Sunday guests of Mrs. John Leister
and Mrs. George Bender were: Mr.
and Mrs. John Cashman, Mr. and
Mrs. Norman Lawrence, Mr. and
Mrs. Thomas Oaster, daughters,
Diane and Deborah, all of Hanover,
and Miss Helen Arnold, of town, and
Mr. Joseph Gorwan, of Long Island,
N. Y.

--
Mr. and Mrs. A. G. Riffle had as

guests to dinner Sunday Mr. and Mrs.
Roy Haines, Uniontown; Mr. and
Mrs. Sterling Ecker and family, of
Stewartstov.-n; Mr. and Mrs. Carroll
Riffle and family, of Westminster;
Mr. and Mrs. Wilson Riffle and fam-
ily, and Mr. and Mrs. Delmar Riffle
and family, of town.

- -
Sunday guests at the home of Mr.

and Mrs. Harry Dougherty and son
were: Mr. and Mrs. George Bohn and
son, Darrell, of Mt. Wolf, Pa.; Mr.
and Mrs. Baxter Dougherty, Mr. and
Mrs. Raymond Anders and son,
Wayne, of Detour. . Mr. and Mrs.
Leslie Lind and children, Dale and
Joan, spent the evening in the same
home.

Mr. Howard W. Amos, who has
been with the Federal Bureau of In-
vestigation Office in Philadelphia, has
been promoted to resident agent in
charge of the F. B. I. Office in Col-
umbus, Ohio. Mr. and Mrs. Amos
and children took up their residence
there last week, Mrs. Amos is the
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Charles
B. Kephart, near Taneytown.

---
Those who spent Sunday at the

home of Mr. and Mrs. George Naylor
of Emmitsburg were: Mr. and Mrs.
Raymond Hornbecker and family, of
Hagerstown; Mr. and Mrs. Charles
Naylor, Washington, D. C.; Mr. and
Mrs. Roy Himes, Biglerville, Pa.; Mr.
and Mrs. Wilbur Naylor, Janice and
Arlene, of Taneytown, and Mr. Harry
Naylor and family, of Aspers, Pa.

The meeting of the Taneytown Sr.
4-H Club was held Thursday evening
at the home of Rhoda and Dorothy
Rohrbaugh. After a demonstration
on the proper way of making a bed
by Belva Koons, the members all took
their turns making the bed. Games
were played, several selections on the
piano played by several of the mem-
bers and refreshments were served.

I Those from Pythian Sisters Lodge
No. 23 who attended, Wednesday eve-
ning, the Annual Convention of Dis-
trict No. 2 were: Mrs. Maude Nor-
ton Mrs. Mary Coshun, Miss Jean
Coshun, of Littlestown; Mrs. Grace
Warren Keysville; Mrs. Ethel Garb-
er, Mrs. Mae Baker. Mrs. Larena
Crabbs, Mrs. Maggie Eyler, Mrs.
Carrie Austin, Mrs. Rhoda Smith,
Misses Grace and Cntherine Hahn,
of Taneytown.

The Senior class of the High school
with their teacher, Mrs. Adelaide
MacDonald went to the home of
Andy Alexander, Thursday to see over
the television the reception Washing-
ton, D. C., gave to General Douglas
MacArthur, Mrs. MacArthur and
their son, Arthur, and to hear Gen.
MacArthur's address. The 6th, 7th
and 8th grades of St. Joseph's school
went to the homes of Jean Sell,
Johnny Bre'h and Jack Webb.

CARD OF THANKS

I wish to express sincere thanks
for cards and gifts received. Special

thanks to Pat Murphy and Kenneth

Ecker who were so kind at the time

of my accident.
JAN TRACEY.

CARD OF THANKS

I wish to express my sincere

thanks to all my friends and rela-

tives and to the organizations who

remembered me with cards, flowers,

fruit, and visits while at the Hospi-

tal and since my return home.

OARROLL N. HAHN,
Middle St.,

Taneytown, Md.
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SPECIAL NOTICES 
STOCK BULLS and COWS, loaned

to reliable farmers.—Harold S.
Mehring. 7-15-tf

NOTICE—For Lining Auto Brakes
and other brake service; also car
Washing, Waxing, Simonizing, Grease
Job, Gas and Oil, Tires, Tubes and
Batteries, see—Horton's Service Sta-
tion, Taneytown, Md. Phone 3931.

4-20-2t

FOR SALE—Wheelbarrow Trays,
Cooper, Klipper Power Mower.—J.
B. Ommert. 4-20-2t

NEED MANURE for that garden,
truck patch or farm. No delivery,
no resewing, no charge. Yours for
the hauling while it lasts.—Norman
Devilbiss.

FOR SALE.-1949 Mercury Club
Cpe, Radio and Heater.—Kenneth
Stonesifer, 48 Middle Street, Taney-
town, Md. Apply after 5 P. M.

NOTICE.—Read the article on
"While Wifey's Away" on Page three
•of this week's paper.

NOTICE—Anyone interested in en-
tering horses im the Horse Play Pa-
rade, Tuesday, June 12. contact Roy
Smith, George Shriner or Robert In-
gram.

FOR SALE—Vegetable and Flow-
er Plants.—Mrs. Martin Koons, E.
Baltimore Street, Taneytown 4-20-2t

MEN TO SELL Ice Cream thru
vending trucks in Baltimore and
Washington and their suburbs, and

also in your own vicinify. Large
profits. Pleasant work. Contact
Jack & Jill Ice Cream Co., 1624 E.
Lombard St., Baltimore, Md.

FOR SALE — John-Deere Model

B. 0. Tractor 1938 Model on new

rubber; Oliver No. 7 12-inch Tractor

Plow, McCormick-Deering Corn Cul-

tivator; Lot of good Harness.—Rob-

ert A. Grimes, Emmitsburg R. F. D.

2, Phone Emmitsburg 58F11. 4-20-3t

LOST—Billfold last Friday night.

Valuable papers inside. Please return

to P. 0. Box 253.

4 ROOM APARTMENT for Rent,

2nd. Floor.—S. Arthur Myerly.

FOR SALE — John-Deere Corn
Planter—William J. Stansbury.

• WANTED—Girl for part-time work

with knowledge of bookkeeping.—Ap-

ply at Record Office. 4-20-2t

FOOD SALE—May 12, 10 A. M.,

o'clock on, in Firemen's Building.

Sponsored by Grace E. & R. Guild.
4-20-1t & 5-4-1t

IF YOU HAVEN'T ORDERED

your Seed Corn you can still buy

Pioneer. More farmers are switch-

ing to Pioneer Hybrids every year

because of their outstanding quality

and yielding ability.—Paul F. Brow-

er, Taneytown, Md., R. D. 1. Phone

3742. 4-13-3t

CARD PARTY, Rocky Ridge 'Fire

Hall, Friday evening, April 27, 815

P. M. Benefit Rocky Ridge Fire Com-

pany. Nice prizes. 4-13-2t

FOR SALE.-5-burner New Per-

fection Table-top Oil Stove, late
model.—See Wm. Fogle, Bear Run

Road, near Mayberry. 4-13-tf

WANTED—Rabbits, 4-lb and up.

—Dial Taneytown 3556, Harver's

Rabbitry. 4-13-3t

WOULD $2.50 PER HOUR IN-

TEREST YOU. This is possible

-whether you devote full or part time.

ACT NOW. BE INDEPENDENT IN

OWN BUSINESS 'servicing rural
customers with household and farm
necessities. Need car, no capital.

Write Watkins Co., Box No. 367R,

Dept. BH, Newark, N. J.
4-13-5t

COMMUNITY SALE, Saturday

evening, April 21, at 7:00 in the eve-

ning, in Detour. Anyone having any-

thing to sell, bring it to the sale.—

Barry Trout & Son, Aucts. 4-13-2t

FOR SALE—Fair supply of De-

Kalb Hybrid Seed Corn; this kind of

corn is planted by more farmers than

any other Hybrid. Prove to yourself

its value.—Kenneth W. Miller, Lit-

tlestown Route 1, Phone 904R11. Col-

lect, 4-6-3t

CARD PARTY April 30, at 8 P.

M., Opera House, Taneytown. benefit

of the Ladies' Auxiliary of the Tan-
eytown Fire Department. Plenty of
prizes. Refreshments on sale. 4-6-4t

, ROOM FOR RENT—Apply to Mrs.
Mary MacIntyre, Bruceville Road, R.
D. 1, Keymar, Md. 3-30-4t

DITCHING DYNAMITE and an
experienced man to do the work.—
Medford Grocery Company, Inc., Med-
ford, Md. 3-16-tf

HALL BROTHERS CHICKS—Get
a flying start towards extra profits
and more money with a proven heavy
egg-producer. All Pullorum clean.
C Purebreeds and 4 Cross-breeds. Stop
in and place your order TODAY.—
The Taneytown Grain & Supply Com-
pany. 1-12-tf

LADIES—Do you want healthy
luxurious Potted Plants for the win-
ter? Use B. C. A. (Bacterial Com-
post Activator) a plant culture teem-
mg with Soil Bacteria. 50c per lb.
will take care of all of your indoor
flowers, all winter. Many other us-
es. Come in and ask about it.—The
Reindollar Company, Phone Taney-
town 3303. 12-1-tf

BARGAINS! BARGAINS!-3 used
DeLaval Magnetic Milkers, with
stainless steel pails, $35 each; New
Wilson Freezers Zero-Safe or Chests
and Milk Coolers; Universal Milkers,
Ney Barn Equipment Stanchions,
Water Bowls, Feed Trucks, Ventila-
tors, Wagner Electric Motors, etc.—
John D. Roop, Linwood, Phone Un-
ion Bridge 4403. 10-13-tf

NOTICE—Dial 3483 for your Sand,
Stene, Blocks and General Hauling.—
Thurston Putman. 7-21-tf

GOOD USED CARS wanted. High-
est Prices Paid.--Crouse's Motor
Sales. 2-25-tf

CHURCH NOTICES

Walnut Grove Dunkard Brethren
Church at Kump's—Sunday School, at
9:30 A. M.; Preaching, 10:0 A. M.—
Birnie Shriner, Minister.

Services at Trinity Lutheran Church
Rev. Glenn L. Stahl, Pastor. Son-
day School, 9:00 A. M.; Worship Ser-
vice, 10:00 A. M.; Luther League, at
7:00 P. M.

St. Joseph's Church, Frederick St.,
ley. Charles J. Walker, Pastor. Sun-
day Masses; 8 o'clock (High) 10:15
Low Mass. Week Day Masses, 6:30
o'clock, except Saturdays, 7:30. Con-
fessions; Saturdays, 4 to 5-7 to 8;
Sundays Holy Days and first Fri-
days before the Masses. First Fri-
days; Mass at 6:30 and Benediction.
Holy Days, Masses at 6 and 8 o'clock.
Baptisms on Sunday, at 11:30
o'clock.

St. Paul's Lutheran Church (Har-
ney)-'9:1O A. M. Worship and Ser-
mon; 10:15 A. M., Sunday School.
Mt. Joy Lutheran Church-9:30 A.

M., Sunday School; 10:35 A. M., Wor-
ship and Sermon. Chas. E. Held,
Pastor.

Presbyterian Church. Rev. Chas.
S. Owen, Pastor. Piney Creek-9:30
A. M., Morning Worship and Sermon.
10:30 S. S.; 8:30 P. M., Religious
Movie.
Emmitsburg-11 A. M., Morning

Worship and Sermon; 9:45 A. M., S.
S.
Taneytown-7:30 P. M., Religious

Movie, "Fire Upon the Earth." 10
A. M., S. S.

Uniontown Lutheran Parish—Don-
ald Warrenfeltz, Pastor. St. Paul—
Worship, 9:30 A. M.; Sunday school,
10:30 A. M.; Luther League, 6:30
P. M.
Baust Lutheran—Sunday School,

9:45 A. M.; Worship, 11 A. M. Parish
Brotherhood, Wednesday, 8 P. M.
'Mt. Union—Sunday School, 9:30

A. M.; Catechetical Class, Sunday
7:30 P. M.

Union Bridge Lutheran Parish. St.
James—S. S., 9:30 A. M.

Keysville—Worship, 9:30 A. M.;
S. S., 10:30 A. M.
Rocky Ridge—S. S., 10 A. M.; Wor-

ship, 11 A. M. Congregational Meeting
called to decide on organ repair. R.
S. Poffenberger, Supply Pastor.

Taneytown \Evangmlical United
Brethren Church. Rel... A. W. Garvin,
Minister. Taneytown—S. S., 9:30 A.
M.•
' 

Worship, 10:30 A. M.; Sr. C. E.,
6:30 P. M.; -Jr. C. E., Wednesday, at
3:30 P. M.•

' 
Prayer Service, Wed-

nesday, 7:30 P. M.; Ladies' Aid, on
Thursday, 7:30 P. M.; Choir practice,
Thursday, 7:30 P. M.
Baits—Ladies' Aid will meet Sat-

urday, April 21, 7:30 P. M., at the
church; S. S. 10 A. M.
Harney—Worship, 7:30 P. M.

Grace Evangelical & Reformed
Church Charge, Rev. Morgan Andreas
Pastor. Taneytown-9:15 A. M.,
Sunday Church School,: 10:30 A. M.,
The Lord's Day Worship with the
sermon subject: "Doing the Divine
Dictum." 1:30 P. M. the parish house
planning committee will leave the
church to visit parish buildings at
Gettysburg and Arendtsville. 7 P. M.
C. E. meeting in charge of Delmont
Koons, Jr. Thursday, 7:30 P. M., the
monthly meeting of Churchmen's
Brotherhood will be held.
Keysville-9 A. M., The Lord's Day

Worship. Sermon subject: "Doing the
Divine Dictum." 10 A. M. Sunday
Church School. ,

Church of God, Uniontown Circuit
Rev. John H. Hoch, pastor. Union-
town—Sunday School, 9:30 a. m., Mr.
Herbert Ecker, Supt. Preaching Ser-
vice, 10:30 A. M. Theme: "The
Mount of Olives and the Ascension of
Christ." Prayer Meeting on Wednes-
day evening, at 7:30 P. M. Leader:
Mrs. Mary Schaffer.
Wakefield—Sunday School, 10 A.

M. Mr. Charles Hahn, Supt. Prayer
Meeting and Bible Study on Thurs-
day evening, at 8 P. M. Leader,
Ruth Nusbaum.

Frizellburg—Preaching Service, 9
A. M.• Sunday School, 10:15 A. M.
Mr. Howard Carr, Supt. Uniontown
Circuit Chorus Rehearsal on Friday
evening at Frizellburg, at 8 P. M.
Mr. Joseph Peveral, of Baltimore,
director.
Mayberry—Sunday School, 11:15

A. M. Mr. William Lawyer, Supt.
Preaching Service, at 7:45 P. M. Rev.

John H. Hoch will preach the Gospel.

Jehovah's Witnesses—Sunday, Bi-

ble Study, 8 P. M., "Stability and
Permanence During World Change."

Meeting also Tuesday, 8 P. M. and
Friday, 7:30 P. M., at 109 E. Balti-

more St., Taneytown. George F.

Myers, Minister.

BE PREPARED—For the unex-
)ected. Let us insure you adequate
y.—Percy M. Burke, 231 E Main St,
Westminster. Md. Tele. 1120. 4-15-tf

PIANOS—Beginners Pianos, $29.
Practice Pianos. $49. Student Pianos.
$99; New Spinets, $299 up. Write
for price list. REMEMBER—CRAM
ER has been Satisfying Customers
for 40 years.—Cramer at Barbara
Fritchie Candy Shoppe, Frederick,
Md. 12-16-tf

NOTICE—Starting March 10 there
will be daily Barber Service at Melvin
Sent% Store, Taneytown-Littilestown
road.—J. Salley. 3-9-8t

PAPER HANGING and all other
,ohs of interior decoratirg including
Plaster Repairs. Call Ralph David-
ion for a look at latest Wall Paper
Samples.—Taneytown 4792.

11-/-u

FOR SALE—Typewriter Ribbon
nd Supplies; Carbon Paper—Charles

Stonesifer, Representative of Rem-
leton Rand. Inc 7-16-t1

BABY CHICKS.—New Hampshir.
.nd Rock Hemp. cross, each week
Ul state blood tested.—Stonesifer'F
fatchery, Keymar, Phone Taneytowi
1931. 7-2-tf

HELP WANTED.—Male clerk for
Grocery Store, 45 hour work week.
Time and half for over 45 hours.—
American Stores Co., Taneytown, Md.

DISPOSITIOTOF Atom Re c!cr
4-'41 LEGISLATIVE BILLS Plants saiesi
Senator Hoff Explains Status
,L0f Several Measures Places to or

To the Editor:
Dear Sir:
In this and following letters I will

attempt to summarize some of the
more important statewide and local
(Carroll County) measures that have
been passed by the Legislature and
signed by Governor McKeldin.
As copies of these laws are not

yet available in printed form I will
not be able to comply with the re-
quests that I have had for some meas-
ures. I will, however, be glad to an-
swer any inquiries concerning new
laws that may be directed to my
Westminster office.

RENT CONTROL ELIMINATED
A Bill declaring rent control no

longer necessary in Carroll County
was signed by the Governor this past
Friday. Under the provisions of the
Federal Rent Control Act controls in
Carroll County will end 15 days af-
ter a copy of this Bill is forwarded
to the Housing Expediter of Mary-
land. The Bill provides that such
copy shall be forwarded" to the Expe-
diter immediately upon its approval
by the Governor.

Six Districts of Carroll County
were freed from rent control in Oc-
tober, 1949. They were Uniontown,
Myers, Franklin t Middleburg, New
Windsor and Berrett. This new law
will free the balance of the county.
Other housing accommodations not

subject to control were those that
were not rented prior to February 1,
1947.

SCHOOL ATTENDANCE LAW
CHANGED

In 1947 a law was passed raising
the age for compulsory attendance
at school, from 14 to 16. Senate Bill
335, signed by the Governon, now
permits the County Superintendent
to authorize the withdrawal from
school of any child between the age
of 14 and 16 who would not be bene-
fited by continuance in school.
TEACHERS' PAY RAISE VETOED

Governor McKeldin vetoed the Bill
that would have given all public
school teachers a $300.00 increase
in salary. In a statement issued
since the veto the Governor stated
he was following his policy of not
signing any Bills that would increase
taxes. The teachers' pay Bill would
have been paid for by a 1% increase
in corporate taxes. The Governor al-
so declared that further salary in-
creases for teachers was the re-
sponsibility of the several counties
of the State and not the responsibil-
ity of the State as a whale.

ROAD FUNDS FOR STATE POLICE
Before 1947 the cost of maintaining

the Department of State Police was
paid out of moneys raised from taxes
on motor vehicles and gasoline. When
the Sales Tax was passed this De-
partment was supported from the
General Funds of the State. This
year, due to the decrease of revenue
resulting from the increase of the
sales tax exemption from 14c to 51c
it became necessary to again charge
to road funds the cost of supporting
the State Police. The only alternative
would have been an increase in ex-
isting taxes or the imposition of a
new tax, nether of whith would
have met the approval of the Gover-
nor.

SEIRIAL NUMBERS ,PRIOTECTED
Senate Bill 3Q9, signed by the

Governor, make S it unlawful for any
person to remove or deface the serial
number stamped upon or affixed to
any manufactured article with the
intent of preventing identification.
T'his law was requested by police
authorities to assist them in tracing
and recovering stolen or lost articles
that have been given some identify-
ing serial number. Possession of such
manufactured article, having had its
identifying marks or plates removed,
is made a misdemeanor.

LOCAL BILLS SIGNED
House Bill 187 authorizing the

Sheriff of Carroll County to appoint
more than one Deputy Sheriff at
such salarys as may be fixed by the
County Commissioners.

Senate Bill 297 permitting the
Mayor and Council of Taneytown to
regulate the construction of buildings
and the sub-division of land within
the corporate limits.

Senate Bill 201 reestablishing by
new survey the corporate boundaries
of the Town of New Windsor.

Senate Bill 93 authorizing the
County Commissioners to levy $105,
000.00 over a three year period to
match the $100,000.00 gift of Scott
Bair, and other gifts for the purpose
of building a general hospital in
Carroll County,

Sincerely,
STANFORD HOFF.

UNCHANGED

Entering the house just as her
husband put down the telephone,
the wife said:
"Whom we r e you talking to,

dear?"
"Your mother called," he re-

plied.
"And how is she?"
Wearily he answered, "About

the same — unfair to meddling."

RICHLAND, Wash.—The Hanford
atomic reactor plants are the safest
working places in the world, ac-
cording to records.
Unportected, a man could not

safely come within a quarter of a
mile of such nuclear chain reaction
as takes place in a Hanford pile.
Let no worker at Hanford has

gotten in an entire year as much
radioactivity as having your chest
X-rayed. Thick concrete walls furn-
ish most of the protection but there
are jobs in which workers walk
right into the rays.
For instance, men with peri-

scopes, magnifying lenses and pow-
erful lights detected a piece of ap-
paratus out of order. A remote con-
trol crane lifted it over a wall to
an area free from rays. But the
piece itself was emitting powerful
gamma rays.

Safety Fence Put Up
A crew taped paper on the floor

where the piece was to rest to save
the floor from getting radioactive.
The distance the rays would travel
from the apparatus was calculated,
and a safety fence set up at the
limits of danger.
The piece had to be repaired.

First a crew trained on an identical
piece of apparatus, to save time
when they came to the "hot" ap-
paratus.
After training, the crewmen strip-

ped. Those with cuts or scratches on
hands and arms were rejected. The
others dressed in two pairs of white
coveralls, two pair of gloves, rub-
ber and leather, cloth hats fastened
down over hair, and rubbers over
shoes. They wore masks furnish-
ing their own oxygen for breathing.
At the fence the men found their

tools already laid out at points
nearest each tool's probable need.
All the tools were long handled.
Parts of the crew stepped inside
the fence, into the direct rays, Which
then bathed their bodies. New men
pn this kind of job say they feel
the rays pricking their skin. That
seems to be nerves, because ey-
perienced men never feel anything.

Timekeeper Keeps Watch
A timekeeper watched them,

checking how much of the rays each
worker got. Presently he signaled
one to come out. That man left the
job, because he had received all the
rays permissible on one day. One
of the reserves took his place. So it
went until the job was done.
By that time every man's clothes

were presumed to be covered with
radioactive atoms. The crew went
to a room where they stripped these
clothes, washed and had their skin
tested for radioactivity.
Some had radioactivity on their

hands, the parts which had been
closest to the "hot" apparatus.
These had to scrub several times
with Special green soap and other
chemicals.
The amount of radioactivity per-

mitted these workers is less than
the natural radioactivity which
everyone gets from the air at one
mile altitude. Dust and air might
get radioactive in the Hanford
plants, and for this robot monitors
detect the contamination long be-
fore it is dangerous. The robots
blow whistles, ring bells and flash
lights in warning.

Czech Paper Blames Atom
For Shortage of Onions
PRAGUE, Czechoslovakia—Prace,

the trade-union newspaper, reports
many people in Czechoslovakia are
buying heaps of onions to protect
themselves against atomic radiation.
Others are stocking up on vinegar
to guard against gas attacks.
Prace blamed such citizens, "in-

suring themselves against all even-
tualities", for current shortages of
those two commodities. A bad onion
harvest a n d insufficient vinegar
production has nothing to do with
the current shortage, the newspaper
said.
The newspaper said a woman

spread the rumor that the smell of
onions helped counteract the effect
of radiation after an atomic bomb
explosion.
"And so, people bought a quintal

(220 pounds) of onions and put them
under the bed."
Another woman, Prace reported,

gossiped that in case of a gas at-
tack a handkerchief dipped in vine-
gar was a good thing to have.
"And so these people have their

larders full of vinegar bottles".
Other newspapers have reported

an onion shortage.

8-Year-Old Wields Wrench,
Knocks Out Home Prowler
SEATTLE, Wash.—An eight-year-

old boy has captured his bandit.
Robert Dixon was alone in his

home at 4:30 a.m, when he heard
someone attempting to force the
front door.
When this failed, the man broke a

front window and started to climb
in. Robert was waiting just inside,
armed with a monkey wrench and
a kitchen knife.
Wham! He let the prowler have

it over the head twice, and, for good
measure, he took a slice at the
man's hand with the knife.
The prowler collapsed. A few min-

utes later the boy's parents re-
turned.
The prowler was still unconscious

when police arrived.

1PA.  1F-gVi
Start the Day Right

with a Good Breakfast
Switch to a good, solid break-
fast. Dieticians and health
authorities say that all of us
should get 1/3 of our clan;
calories at the breakfast table.

GOLD SEAL PREPARED MIXES

BUCKWHEAT OR PANCAKE
20-oz
pkgs

MAPLE BLEND SYRUP Ideal
KING GOLDEN SYRUP
IDEAL GOLDEN SYRUP
STRAWBERRY PRESERVES ideal
ASCO SLICED BACON Dry Cured
LARGE CALIF. PRUNES Rob-Ford

Our Finest Quality - --
EVAP.

Homogenized - -
Enriched

3 tall
cans

MILK
38c

Pet, Carnation or Borden's

MILK 3 ctaann. 41c
Gold Seal Corn Flakes
1-o5zinpclic.gs 13 1P3k719c

12-oz bot 25c
40-oz can 32c

24-oz bot 19c
12-oz Jar 37c
V2 lb pkg 35c

lb pkg 26c

For Breakfast and Every Meal!
America's

Prize
Winning

Sweet Cream Butter
You'll appreciate its consistently
creamery-fresh flavor - • no better
butter churned.

Wrapped 77.Quarter:
lb

Richland Creamery Butter

lb 75c

IDEAL FANCY FLORIDA 
•

1:1 0runge Juice
46-oz 29.
can

Special Price- - -
Stock Up! •

•
_ _

Here's the Right Coffee
to start the Day Right - -
Gei "Heat-Flo" roasted

ASCO COFFEE lb 79c
Preferred by 3 out of 4 of

our customers.

Win-Crest Coffee lb 77c
A mild, satisfying blend.

Ideal Vacuum Packed Coffee
Richer,

full-bodied lb 
85'Drip or reg. grind can

Ideal Sliced Red

BEETS
These fancy, tender, sliced beets

sell regularly at 15c jar.25C
jars

Ideal Yellow Margarine
(Quarters) lb 36:

Virginia Lee Fresh Bakery Treats

Delicious DO'NUTS
plain; 24c sugared;

doz 
25c

Glazed, Raised Do'Nuts
pkg of 625c

For Perfect Toast
Get Enriched

SUPREME BREAD
largeloa

Virginia Lee Jelly Cocoanut Bar Cakes ea 39c

Fresher Produce - - Better Values

FRESH CALIF. FLA. NEW WHITE

ASPARAGUS POTATOES
lb 25c 4ibs29cGrve

Fresh Golden Corn 3 ear° 25c
Fresh Lima Beans 2 lbs 33c
Large Green Peppers each 50

Onions or Radishes bch 5c

Fresh Fla. Cucumbers 2 for 15c
Fla. White Squash 2 lbs 19c
New Local Rhubarb bch lOc

Spinach or Kale ceilo pkg Sc1 

ORANGES Lange Fla. vale..
GRAPEFRUIT 'Large Fla. 46-54's

WINESAP APPLES 
- Ideal Pure Concen, Orange Juice 2 6-°1 cane 43.
Seabrook Farms Extra Fancy Green Peas 2 10.ss Pkgs 411.

Western

176's doz 39c
3 for 29€
3 lbs 29'

A. Help Put a 16-inch Phiko T-V in Your School •••
No contest - - merely save our sales cheeks for votes.

For details write Asco-Philco T-V, P. 0. Box 147, Baltimore 3, Md.

Small Lean Smoked Hams
WHOLE Or

SHANK HALF

Lean Smoked Picnics
Freshly Ground Beef
Skinless Frankfurters

59c lb
45c lb.
65c lb.
49c lb.

Fancy Pollock Fillets 29c lb. Fancy Perch Fillets 39c lb.

Haddock Fillets

Fancy Large Shrimp

Fresh Bay Buck Shad

.39 lb.
79c lb.
21c lb.

Prices Effective April 19-20-21, 1951. Quantity ..ights Reserved. $

cArtteiucan



PAGE SIX
THE CARROLL RECORD. TANEYTOWN. MARYLAND

APIZTI 20, 1951"

4.11.

HELP WANTED
I.Men for inside factory work.

Apply at Reaser Furniture Corn-

pany Office, Gettysburg, Pa.
3-23-tf =

Every day farmers are involved in ex-

pensive law suits because of farm

accidents. Special Broad/arm Farm

Liability Policy provides real protec-

tion against ruinous financial loss

which you might suffer as di result

of your liability for injury to m:mbers

of the public and damage to the prop-

erty of others. Don't risk losing what

you work so hard to gain. Get the facts.

ROBERT L. LENT!
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND

Phone: 4471

A MIER CA AR S
MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY

Operating in Iowa as
lellinoisl American Farmers
Mutual Insurance Company

4-13-4t

—THE BR. SALSBURY'S WAY

Chicks hatched free of pul-

may come

in contact with the disease.

So practice good sanitation.

If pullorum does

appear, treat chicks with

Dr. Salsbury's Sulfa Veter-

inary. This sulfa-

drug aid is safe, non-toxic,

and highly effective. Its

prompt use will save

you many chicks. Grow a

healthy flock this year. Get

r‘i1.--"••easy-to-use Sulfa

Veterinary nowt

Reindollar Bros, 86 Co.

:(1."4‹.1A0t):(10.'10:Aclot":‹IGSG:0:GiG:0:,4<IW-
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NEW Purina Research Discovery!

FORMULA 1028

- •
'w/iP1

kts

We Have 1951 Purina Startena With

"Formula 1028" Added

It's the finest Chick Startena Purina

has ever made. That means faster

growth—the biggest 'Chicks at 5

weeks ever raised on Startena. Give

Your chicks the right start—the

Purina Way this year. Come in and

learn more about "Formula 1028."

BABY CHICKS

NEED

PROTECTION
.Help guard your chicks

against disease with

these two precautions:

ry diseases

Thoroughly clean your brooder house

and equipment.Jhen disinfect with

PURINA DISINFECTANT
a highly efficient, all purpose germ killer.

Disinfect chick drinking water and

prevent the spread of common poult-

through water with

PURINA CHEK-R-TABS
handy, economital aspirin-size tablets

Purina Hanging Feeders are Tops forsaving Feed.

Taneylown Grain and
Supply Company

3-9-10t

YOUR STORE WITH THE CHECKERBOARD SIGN
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Custom Tilling of Gardens

PERFECT SEED BEDS - ROTOTILLER
1 Perfect seed bed ready to plant after tilling.

2 It pulverizes, mixes and restores nourishment.

3 Builds humus, holds moisture in dry seasons.

Place your orders NOW!

CARL A. SELL
Write TANEYTOWN, MD. Phone 4947

Three Years Local Seruke
3-23-6t

Though low in cost, Egg-Maker supplies

everything a layer needs to make eggs at

a profit. A 20% protein feed, Egg-Maker contain
s

Limestone, low fluorine Rock Phosphate, Manganese

Sulphate and concentrated Vitamin D for stro
ng bones and

hard shelled eggs. It is also fortified with Riboflavi
n for high

egg production and good hen health.

Try this "economy" laying mash on your flock. He
ns like it

...and you'll like the extra egg money it makes
 for you.

Order a bag today!

Ground

OTHER OPEN FORMULA

SOUTHERN STATES POULTRY FEEDS

Super Laying;Mash . . $5.23 cwt.

Starting and
Growing Mash .. $5.52 cwt.

Super BreedingNash:$5. 43 cwt.

List Other Feeds

Return the Burlap Bags for up to 35c each

Southern States Taneytown Cooperative
Phone 3261

OUR DEMOCRACY

PLOWINGTME AND PLANTING
THE YEARS AT THE CPR/NO

,40i/-• 7e.

by Mat I
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OVER THE LAND, FARMERS ARE PREPARING AND SEEDING THZ SOIL

FOR. THE CROPS THAT ARE COUNTED ON TO PROVIDE FOOD AND

BASIC RAW MATERIALS, NOT ONLY FOR AMERICA I3.UT FOR.

OTHER PEOPLES THROUGHOUT THE WORLD.

• 7.. -=`-•••••-

/A/ THE TREMENDOUS TASK OF EXPAND/NG PRODUCT/ON

THAT FACES OUR DEMOCRACY, THE FARMER'S MIG
HT,'

MULT/PL/ED BY THE POWER OF MACH/NES AND NEW

TECHN/QUES, IS "AS THE STRENGTH OF TEM"

SoiGioto:oiosoiotnot'otoioto:0:0:0:010:0:•::.

CUSTOM WORK

WANTED

New Seaman Field Tiller
Completely fits your soil for planting, Ideal for corn, peas,

and all canning crops. Powerful, Seaman Tiller, plows, discs and

harrows, all in one operation helps promote humus development. Ro-

tary fines, mills and mixes all vegetation and fertilizers uniformly

through full tillage depth.

Now is the time for pasture work. Renovation with the tiller

in heavy brush, weeds and stoney conditions are quickly prepared for

seed legumes and grasses.

Up to two acres an hour tilled and ready to plant with the tiller.

Send a card to me to call at your farm to discuss the uses of a til-

ler. No obligation.

CARL A. SELL
Write TANEYTOWN, MD. Phone 4947

3-23..64
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Building? - Repairing?
Remodeling?

Many items for this kind of work have become hard to get.

Fortunately our stocks are yet pretty complete. And you can

depend upon the quality. Get in touch with us for your needs in —

LUMBER, MILLWORK, BUILDERS HARDWARE, INSULA-

TION, ROOFING, CEMENT, SANDSTONE, ETC., ETC.

Let us figure with you to your best advantage.

Donald Six
Call—Union Bridge 3111 MIDDLEBURG, MD.

4-13-3t
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ON OUR GIANT SCREEN

SATURDAY ONLY

"ALAN LADD"

"Whispering Smith"

Co-Feature

JOHNNY MACK BROWN

"Trails End"

ABBOTT & COSTELLO

"In the Navy"

with ANDREW SISTERS

Also Cartoon and Band

Full Car $1.00 Plus Tax

BRADDOCK -
DRIVE-IN THEATRE'

S Route Alt. 10,2 IC W. FtednIck '

READ THE AD$
Along With the News

11
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EVERY SIZE
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CRUSHED Teeter
STONE

for

CRUSHED STONE

Macadam Driveways, Lanes,

Parking Lots - Landscaping

If It's Tough Construction, Call Teeter

JOHN S. TEETER AND SONS

Phone: "Gettysburg 696 Westminster 918

o:GtototototototoSoScCototo clototeS414:44,4344-GSG3186SeaBleia01803$918110i0MRSOMM302$8:1
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international Uniform
Sunday .i:clioct 1,i-eons

EfitiETP J. FOP,F.IAA.
SCRIPTURE. Exodus 14-15; Deuter

county 3-6; Psal)^ 136.
DEVOTIONAL READING: ,Psalm 77.
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God In a nation
Lesson for April 22, 1951

wHEN IS GOD IN THE LIFE
of a nation?

It depends on
what you mean by
the question. God
is the Ruler of all
nations, and Judge
of them all. But
some nations have
been far more con-
scious of the true
God and obedient to
Him than other na-
tions have. Dr. Foreman

• • •

God's Name on Paper

GOD CAN be mentioned
yet not count for very

in a nation. For instance, His
can be on the money, it can
the state ceremonies, it can
the constitution, or if there
constitution, the monarch may be
said to rule "by divine right."

But such things may be no
better than formal. The money
can pass from wicked hand to
wicked hand, it can be used for
godless purposes by men who
do not have God in all their
thoughts. The name of God in
public ceremonies (such as
oaths of office) or in the con-
stitution may mean no more
than decorative designs on a
letter-head. The king ruling by
"divine" right may be a cruel
and corrupt man.
Religious-sounding songs, such as

`'God Bless America" or "God Save
the King", can be sung by rascals.
No. Gpd in a nation's life must be
more than a name on paper, green
or white.

often,
much
name
be in
be in
is no

.0 • •

God in Great Men

GOD BEGINS to get into the life
of a nation when He gets into

the lives of people. It is not dis-
paraging the common man to point
out the plain fact that as between
one believer in God who is obscure,
and another who is prominent and
powerful, the latter means more in
the long-run life of a nation.

It was so in the era of Moses.
That was a time of religious con-
fusion, just as it is today. Doubtless
there were many humble persons
at that time who had a living faith,
but if it had not been for Moses.
the nation of Israel would never
have been a nation, but would have
shrunk back intq the ruck of little
no-account tribes, never to be heard
from again. When we hear that even
Moses' own brother was so stupid
or bad as to lead the people in wor-
shipping a gold-plated calf, we can
imagine what the masses of the
people were like.

If the United States and Can-
ada can be called Christian na-
tions today, it is because we can
point to men on both sides of
the line who have been not only
high-calibre, influential men, but
also men not ashamed of their
faith in God.
An American congressman who

is respected by friends and oppo-
nents alike, has said it is more im-
portant to him to know what God
wants than what his constituents
want. Most governors of states pro-
fess religion; and some of the best
of them practice it. What America
would have been without such men,
one can only guess; certainly far
worse than it is.

* * *

God in Laws and Lives
nor ,CAN also be in a nation's

laws. It is true, we cannot run

THIS 'N' THAT
(Continued from first page)

fine face in the close tip and his ap-
pearance. He is truly a handsome man
with a wonderful personality. Is more
of the actor in appearance of The
Shakespeare roles! ,
There is a farmer's daughter out

Walkersville way who'gives beautiful
"Tonies" by appointment!

Did you hear, Ladies that there are
men now who also have the "Toni"?
Have you ever noticed that the man

who smokes a pipe is the contented
and substantial type?

In the latest news of last week,
there are always two sides to every
story which was very evident all
around and just like that old saying!

Here's one that did surprise Your
Observer as it did several members of
the Union Bridge Methodist church!
For many years this sign which was
most spritual, "GOD IS LOVE" was
up over the pulpit and which was an
incentive for any one entering that
church. Since the redecoration, that
sign has been torn down! Umph!
The "Taurus" born from April 20

the May 20 (both men and women)
have the greatest strength of all the
signs of the Zodiac. They are keenly
alive and usually act on the impulse of
the moment because they think fast.
They can endure all kinds of hard-
ships for one they love. They have a
remarkable personality and most
sympathetic and kind and can readily
adapt themselves to all classes of
society which makes them a leader
with fine qualifications. Both men and
women in this sign are truly friends
and most loyal. They are independ-
ent and most self-reliant and always
manage to overcome all obstacles
which arise in any situation. They
have excellent memories. They never
grow old in fact are quite handsome
both men and women as the years
come on. The men are inclined to be
jealous and must refrain.from any-
thing intoxicating as at times they
may indulge. The men should take
great care in selecting a mate es-
pecially if he is of the higher planet
to realize true happiness or select
one that will be harmonious with
Taurus. These people should not be
in any business with any partner but
should be on his own. He can take
suggestions and ideas as to listening
but he should do as he thinks beet.
That way he will be sitting on top
of the world! Many a Taurus young
girl or boy have been led in wrong
directions, many in fact running
away to be married. Taurus people
can do about anything and should
make use of every idea to be success-
ful!
The five year sentence of that fa-

mous "Pumpkin" of Carroll County
seemed very small in comparison with
the husband and wife team who
were given the sentence of "Death".
A traitor is a traitor in the opinion
of this Correspondent and all should
be treated alike! So long, Folks. Until
next week D.V. Thank God seven
days of every week that you are an
American! I am,

Faithfully,
YOUR OBSERVER.

MARYLAND STATE POLICE

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
This is to give notice that the subscrib-

er has obtained from the Orphans'
Court of Carroll County, in Maryland,
letters of administration on the personal
estate of

HELEN R. OHLER

late of Carroll County, deceased. All
persons having claims against the deceas-
ed are Warned to exhibit the same, with
the vouchers thereof, legally authenticat-
ed, to the subscriber, on or before the 13th
day of October, next; they may otherwise
by law be excluded from all benefits of
said estate. •
Given under my hand this 9th day of

a modem nation or municipality on March, 1931.
the laws of Leviticus, and nobody A. EARL SHIPLEY,

Administrator of the estatewants to, not even the preachers of
Helen R. Ohler, deceased.

and rabbis. Still, the laws of a 3-23-5t
land either reflect the will of God  
or they do not. So far as the laws
of a nation are in line with the
teachings and truth of Christ, so
far God is in the life of that nation.
But the question is not finally:

What do the laws prescribe, but do
the people respect the laws? God
does not get deeply into the life of
a nation Until He gets into the
homes of high and low alike.

If the nation of Israel ever
became godly, they had Moses
to thank; yet he himself was
under no illusions as to the
people he left behind him. "I
know that after my death ye
will utterly corrupt yourselves
and turn aside from the way
which I have commanded you."
(Deut. 31: 29.)
It took centuries of toil and pa-

tience on the part of God and His
prophets to change Israel from a
nation mostly indifferent to God, to

• a people mostly God-fearing; and'
the change took place only as
homes changed.
Is ours a Christian nation today?

The answer is not in our constitu-
tion, not in our leading men, not
in our history or laws or traditions;
the answer is in our homes. When
the cry goes up "Back to God!"
the place to start back, and the
place that counts most, is our
homes.
Copy right 1931 by the Division of
Christian Education, National Council
of the Churches of Christ in the United
States of America. Released by WNU
Features.)

Dr. Manuel Bendersky
Veterinarian

Phone 4191

New Windsor
4-20-3t
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CARD PARTY

SPONSORED BY

Taneytown Agricultural
4-H Club

TANEYTOWN OPERA HOUSE

April 26 - 8 p. m.

PLENTY PRIZES

Refreshments will be on sale

8.•===:.•
t!

Solicitation for Funds

For The

Taneytown Fire Co.

April 15 to May 1

GIVE!

Help The Firemen
••• •••••

11-

ll PUBLIC SALE
Farm Machinery
Saturday, April 28th

11 :30 A. M.

Trucks available to pick up and deliver.
R. Johnston Bittner
Waynesboro, Airport, Pa.

Phone: 1323 M
SALE DATES: Last Sat. ot Each Month
BUYING AND SELLING EVERY DAY

1-6-4t
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AMERICA'S FINEST
WASHER

Tops in value —
tops in looks —
so, it's your best
buy of all! And
it washes so quick

and easy. Turns
out such a per-

fect wash that
owners say, "You
just can't beat a
Dexter". So, see
this great washer
today!

GOMPARE
gee 1, 7t/a),/

Mid-Town Electrical Service
Phone 3041 TANEYT?WN, MD.

4-13-3t

Learning Better Child Care in India

A pediatrics nurse and a student from India's Delhi College of
Nursing show a group of Indian mothers how to take better care of
their children. The nurse visits homes in India under a child care
program set up by thi United Nations World Health Organization.

Southern States

'k HYBRIDS 
Are Bred to Resist Diseases and Insects

Treated to Resist Diseases and Insects

You're sure of bigger and better yields of corn
when you use Southern States Hybrids because they are both
t-eatad and bred to cut down insect and disease damage.

'e.ornel is given the Slurry Treatment—a 3-way chemical
ore3trnci : for protection against soil and seed-borne diseases
... Hect control before planting. These treatments, which

f::.r1J•?er yields, combined with stronger stalks, greater
ease and e,:on'my of harvesting, make Southern States Hybrids
your best buy •"hether you raise corn for grain or ensilage. Try
Southern States Hybrids this year!

0

A

A

Ii

S. S. HYBRIDS (Flat Kernels, Yellow) .......$ 9.50 Bu.
S. S. HYBRIDS, (Flat Kernels, White)   11.00 Bu
S. S. HYBRIDS, (Round Kernels, Yellow) .... 5.50 Bu.
S. S. HYBRIDS, (Round Kernels, White)   6.50 Bu.

Southern States Taneytown Cooperative
Phone 3261

OUR DEMOCRACY by Mat

HIGH TAXES ARE PART OF THE PRICE OF PREPAREDNESS,

13UT WE MAY WELL SHARE UNGRUPG/NGLY IN PAYING
THAT PRICE-IF NON-DEFENSE SPENDING /5 CUT TO 71-It 80NE.1

--BECAUSE THESE TAXES CONTRIBUTE TO THE MILITARY

AND ECONOMIC STRENGTH OF OUR DEMOCRACY.

—BECAUSE THE POLICY OF PAY-AS-WE-GO /S A LIMITATION

ON DEBT—A CHECK ON INFLATION,

—BECAUSE THESE TAXES THUS HELP TO MAINTAIN THE

BUYING POPIER. OF THE SAVINGS WE HAVE, AND THOSE

WE MAKE A, THRIFTILY PATRIOTIC CITIZENS.

HEAVY TAXES ARE NEVER A WELCOME BURDEN-

13L/T WE CAN GRIN AND SHARE /T.

Preparing Libya for Independent(

An Advisory Council has been established in accordance with a reso-
lution of the United Nations General Assembly to aid and advise the
U.N. Commissioner for Libya, Adrian Pelt, in the formation of an
independent government for the former Italian colony. Here, the
United Nations Commissioner at a meeting in Tripoli confers with
the CminciFs Secretary, Mr. Thomas Power of the United States.
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lina to ru,-enlist—as a sergeant.
But he lost his papers. The ad-

jutant general ordered him reduced
one rank until the papers were
found.
That brought Adrian up to the

Korean war—and Korea, where he
Is with a heavy mortar outfit, as a
corporal.
Now Corporal Adrian hears from

home that he may become an offi-
cer again—just as soon as he is re-
called to active service.

MAliRIAGB LICENSES
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Leroy A. Baumgardner to Phyllis

Stacks, York, Pa.
James Roman Warrenfeltz to Edna I

I • GRAND OPENING •

Elean Bittle, Hanover, Pa.
Joseph A. Sheets to Phyllis M. I

May Watson, Union Bridge, Md.
Philip A. Altland to Delores M.

Riley, Spring Grove, Pa.
Thomas Henry Morrison to Joanne

Barbara Garrett, Taneytown, Md.
Charles R. Roser to Effie E. Dud-

derar, Gaither, Md.
David Vincent Kahley to Leanna

Ruth DeLisle, York, Pa. •
Rufus M. Kauffman to Pauline V.

Dick, Dover, Pa., No. 1.
Donald P. iRaffensperger, Jr. to

Marjorie R. Leedy, Gettysburg, Pa.
Frank G. Edwards to Margaret I.

Houseknecht. Bloomsburg, Pa.
Sherman B. Stough tO Mary J.

Sheffer, Glen Rock, Pa.
Charles Robert Runyon to Mary

Ruth Keen, Baltimore, Md.

MARYLAND MUSINGS

When shopping for celery, avoid
pithy stalks or branches. Pithy
branches are those of open texture
with air spaces in the central portion.
Pithiness can be detected by pressing
or twisting the branches, and stringi-
ness can be detected by breaking.

PERCY M. BURKE
For all Your

• INSURANCE Needs

2,81 E. Main St.,

WESTMINSTER, MD.
Phone 1120

"Insure with Confidence"

irrirani- 6 • U re-36 a art*

• FOR SALE

* 8-room Brick House and Lot,
ss

with all conveniences, 2 car Car-

age and several outside build-

ings. Located on 402 E. Balti-

more St., Taneytown, Md. Write

or call Mervin Conover, Taney-

town, or Ralph Conover, Lit-
*
• tlestown, Pa. 4-20-tf
•
611115ot C. 0,6 I
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EARLE THEATRE !
▪ TANEYTOWN, MD.

I Wed. & Thurs., April 25 & 26

:Mark Stevens, Robert Douglas in '

I "Target Unknown" 

I

oCer8t7hinkl
by

G. H: ENFIELD

UNSCHEDULED STOPS

Life has no through schedule. Un-
scheduled stops are not necessarily
clue to lack of vision or to the lack
of planning. No progress is made
without interruptions. Every trip has
its red lights. Think of the rough
road traveled by Lincoln from a cab-
in to the White House! Edison's path
had its detours. Thousands of un-
scheduled stops were experienced by
the famous men and women of his-
tory. The paths of many people lead
through thickets and jungles. Still
they press on toward their goal. The
larger portion of the journey of life
is not pursued according to schedule,
for frequently there are unscheduled
stops. In every sphere of activity
there are uncertainties. Barriers
cause delay. Obstructions on the
roacrway bring a traveler to a halt.
However, they need not cause him to
turn back.
A weak body did not prevent

Theodore Roosevelt from pursuing
his ambition. Despite blindness Fan-
ny Crosby wrote inspiring hymns
many years ago which are sung in
our modern churches with fervor, and
which will continue to be sung in
ages to come. The purposeful travel-
er is not thwarted by disappoint-
ments, misrepaesentations, resent-
ments, and rejections. He presses on
toward the mark of his high calling.
Some unscheduled stops necessari-

ly occur in the line of duty. They
may afford additional discipline in
those qualities makfrig for strong
manhood and exemplary womanhood:
He who refuses to climb when he
comes to the foot of a mountain may
never reach his intended destination.
Valleys alone do not lead in the di-
rection of final destiny.
To live is like a man taking a far

journey. The sacred writer reminds
us also that the Kingdom of Heaven
is as a man taking a far journey.
Even the heavenly way is not smooth
nor reached by a single bound. John
the Baptist went before to remove
the obstructions for his Master. Per-
haps there would be less joy to liv-
ing were there no pebbles in the way,
and no thorns among the roses. Such
for a time may cause unscheduled
stops. Wgat football player, in a
single season, has not experienced
many unscheduled stops! Neverthe-
less, he presses toward the goal for
a touch down:

G. H. ENFIELD.
 0—

BUY CANNING PLANT

The Sanitary Products Corpora-
tion which operates a manufacturing
and processing plant at Taneytown,
having need for additional warehouse
aad processing space in connection
with its products which are manu-
factured for the drug industry, has
purchased the acreage and buildings
of the Monocacy - Valley Canning
Company at Walkersville.
• The sale embraces about seven
and a half acres of land and several
buildings, it is understood.

Soldier Loses Papers, Army
Can't Decide on His Rank
KOREA — George Adrian of the

First cavalry division is all mixed
up. He doesn't know whether he is
a lieutenant, a sergeant, or a cor-
poral.
A mortar platoon commander in

the Pacific in World War II he

I r. Fri. & Sat., April 20 & 21I Roy Rogers, Penny Edwards &
Trigger in

"North of the Great Divide"'

INOTICE—Due to the increase
in our overhead effective Mon- z,D
day, April 30th our admission
price will be Adults • Saturday
afternoon .35 tax inc. And
Evenings Adults .44 cents Tax .
inc. Children will remain the 0,
• same at all times. But remember

I

• even with an increase in ad-
missions we will still give you

I the best for less . . . ••

• Tru-Color
Extra Added: Woody Dines Out, s.

al Trailer Tragedy & Square Dance
Tonight

was discharged as a lieutenant. He I. Mom. & Tues., April 23 & 24
left the University of South Caro- la Joan Fontaine, Zachary Scott 1.

and Joan Leslie in

"Born To Be Bad" •
▪ Added News & Cartoon Trailer Z

Horn

Added: News & Cartoon
Choo Choo Baby •

is is

SELECT NOW FOR MEMORIAL DAY
GOMM 

voyffef,' -
•

•

•

WE HAVE been in the monument business for
many years and we have always thought

it a privilege to show our values. We like our
work because we feel that we can be helpful to
many people. We are proud of our all-polished

Rainbow Granite monuments and would like
to demonstrate their value to you. We invite

your inspection.

JOSEPH L. MATHIAS
"Mathias Monuments"
Granite - Marble - Bronze

Largest Selection Durable Materials
Builders of Fine Monuments for 45 Years

WESTMINSTER BALTIMORE HANOVER

BUILD WHILE YOU LIVE

New Modern

Supergas
SHOW ROOM

and Plant

Everyone is invited to our
OPEN HOUSE

Three Big Days and Nights

April 26 - 27 - 28
1:00 to 10:00 P. M.

FREE GIFTS
EVERY DAY

Gilts Gifts Gilts

Modern Gas Ranges - Automatic Water
Heater - Refrigerator - Pressure Cookers

Coffee Makers - etc.

Supergas
TOWN & COUNTRY GAS SERVICE, Inc, —Taneytown, Md.

(1 MILE NORTH OF TANEYTOWN ON LITTLESTOWN ROAD)-
Gas has got it!

On the Farm, in the Town, or Country for
Modern Cooking, Water Heating,

Refrigeration, House Heating,
Brooders, etc.

Everybody's Coming Refreshments

Go, 111111=1.111=11•11111111111111011•111M11111141111111111111ii PENNIO ciimamesimaliMp

wed orn
MICHAEL- LEONARD SWEET CORN. THAT IS.
LAR6E-DEFP-TEN1ER -JUICY KERNELS!

NOW
599.95

11/

4 Cycle Engine

Here's the biggest power mower value'
yet! Quick starting! Smooth handling!
Easy guiding! 10" semi-pneumatic tire
wheels, chain belt driven, cutting speeds
from % up to 3.9 mph.

Stop in and See This Outstanding Value

Reindollar Bros. Etc Co.
HARDWARE • PAINTS • APPLIANCES

ESTABLISHED 1897 Taneytown, Md. TELEPHONE 4564

 4ma,

THEY WOULD READ YOUR AD
TOO, IF IT APPEARED HERE
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I  Week-End Specials  I
April 20 April 21 April 23

SP

1 Picnic Hams
Chum Salmon
Kenny's Peanut Butter
Pillsbury Pie Crust

.45 per lb.
I can .51 II
1 glass .30
1 box .15 I

I Strawberry Preserves 1 glass .31 I
I: NuTaste Cheese 2 lb. box .79 i
i Dulany Sliced Strawberries box .59 !
i Dulany Asparagus Spears 1 box .52 I
1 Dulany Asparagus Cuts and Tips 1-- I box .42 I
1 Little Taylor Cleaning Fluid

I 
1 gallon $1.09 1

B 0 u GH ERTyls
• 

Glare. AV('
I 
' "oldiji TANEYTOWN, MD.

I
Phone: 3021

et

INI
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HE'LL OWN THE

FARM SOME DAY

And when your son takes over the farm,

be sure he has a strong financial backing.

Open a savings account in his name—now.

First National Bank
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Member Federal Reserve System

(Member c f The Federal Deposit Insurance Corporatioi)

tiKEOW94:41*-.00.4.+04;i44,8**4
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THE PULSE OF

YOUR COMMUNITY

Business, homes,

personal and public ••

property, individuals ...they're

all protected by the wide experience

of this bank.

We are ever conscious of new policies.

for business and the individual alike

which indicate the need for sound

financial counsel and banking facilities

that keep pace with modern trends.

Consult us for financial personal ad-

vice as you would your doctor or lawyer,
I

relieving you of worry and responsi-

bility.

".;:r:ve:f rir,?f,%•.1:W

The Birnie Trust Company
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND.

(Member of the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation)


