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COMMUNITY LOCALS
T'Aiis column is not for use in advertis-

ing any money-making program, fair, sup-
per, party or sale. It is intended for news,
personals, and such matters as may be of
,commonity interest.

Churches, Lodges, Societies, Schools, etc,
are requested to use our Special Notice
Department for money-making events.
Churches are especially given free use of

our Church Notice Column, for brief no-
tices concerning regular or special ser-
vices. Larger events will be cared for
elsewhere in our columns.

Mrs. Franklin Stair who had been
seriously ill is rapidly recovering.

Mr. and Mrs. Evan Bowers, West-
minster, spent last Sunday with Mr.
and Mrs. Charles L. Stonesifer.

Mr. and Mrs. George E. Garner, of
Baltimore, will leave tomorrow (Sat-
urday) for a two-weeks vacation in
Florida.

Rev. W. 0. Ibach has been on the
sick list and confined to his bed for
about a week. He is suffering from
a severe cold.

Lee King, of near Union Bridge,
graduated from the National Radio
Institute, Washington, D. C., Monday
February 3, 1941.

Mr. Ralph W. Brining, of Phila-
delphia, Pa., was the guest of his
uncle, Mr. Benton Brining and fam-
ily, on Wednesday.

Mrs. Jesse Stonesifer, near Frizell-
burg, spent Monday evening with her
daughter and son-in-law, Mr. and
Mrs. Roy Carbaugh.

- —
Mr. J Ross Galt, of New Windsor,

is spending the week with his sister,
Miss Jennie E. Galt, at the home of
Mr. H. I. Reindollar.

Louis Lancaster returned home on
Wednesday evening from the Marine
Hospital, Baltimne, where he had
been under observation.

The moderation in the weather, this
week, has been a decided improve-
ment over the most of the New Year
—and is very welcome to stay.

Mr. and Mrs. David Little, of town,
and daughter, Marie, of Washington,
D. C., spent the week-end with Rev.
Joseph Lane, of Mt. Savage, Md.

Miss Bessie Yingling, of near
Frizellburg, spent several days the
past week with Mrs. Lum Feagle and
Mr. and Mrs. Martin Koons, of town.

The World's Day of Prayer will be
held in the Presbyterian Church, on
February 28th. An announcement
more in detail will be made next
week.

Robert S. McKinney and Miss Jen-
nie Galt, are spending the winter with
Mr. and Mrs. Harry I. Reindollar. The
McKinney Drug Store is open as
usual.

Among the very ill, in town, is Mrs.
James B. Galt, who for some time has
been under the charge of Mrs. Jere
Overholtzer, and now needs addition-
al care.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Bankert, Silver
Run, entertained a number of guests
from Littlestown and Taneytown, on
Tuesday evening. The event was in
honor of Mr. Bankert's birthday.

There was an 86 year old salesman
in town, the other day, who canvassed
the town "foot-back." We do not
know what success he met with, but
he was surely "on the job" like a
youngster.

--
Again we are compelled to omit

several lengthy articles, for want of
time, and not because of lack of in-
terest, nor for any personal reason
whatever; but we do "have aeheart"
as the saying goes, for our employees.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Hilterbrick,
entertained over the week-end: Mr.
and Mrs. Vernon Keefer, Perryville.
Visitors at the same place on Sunday
were: Miss Oneda Hilterbrick, Miss
Pauline Watson, Mr. and Mrs. James
Wolfe, all of York, and Mr. and Mrs.
Robert Koons, of town.

The third in the series of Bible
Quiz will be held in the Reformed
Church, on Sunday evening at 7:00
o'clock with two teams participating.
The questions will be from the book
of Exodus. This is sponsored by the
C. E. Society. The public is invited.

The Christian Endeavor Society of
Grace Reformed Church will sponsor
the movie "Little Nellie Kelly" at
Shriner Theatre, on next Thursday
and Friday evenings, Feb. 27 and 28.
All persons expecting to attend are
urged to purchase their tickets from
an Endeavorer or at Reid's Food
Market.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter A. Bower and
Miss Virginia Bower, attended a
kitchen shower given by Miss Ruth
Bixler at the home of Mr. and Mrs.
C. E. Niisbaum, New Windsor, for
their daughter. Miss Ruth Ann Nus-
baum. Miss Nusbaum will be mar-
ried Saturday afternoon, Feb. 15, at
4 o'clock. at the Sorority House of
Maryland University, College Park,
Md.

TANEYTOWN SCHOOL NEWS.

The P. T. A. of the Taneytown
School will hold the next meeting in
the school auditorium, on Monday
evening, February 17, 1941, promptly
at 7:30. Following the meeting and
program there will be a basketball
game. The Taneytown team vs an
independent team.

London's official regulations pro-
vide 400 questions, any or all of which
a policeman may have to ask in case
of a fatal road accident on his beat.

JURY SERVICE FOR WOMEN JUDGE FORSYTHE
Bill Would Give Women Same

Rights as Men.

An old-time debate is now going
on in the State Senate before the
Judicial Committee that give to wo-
men the same rights as men to serve
on juries, or would excuse them too,
the same as men. In fact, there is a
sentiment in favor of compelling
them to serve.

This is opposed by many women,
who are in favor of optional service,
while there are others who oppose
the. service as being unwomanly.
Others take the position as they have
the right to vote, the same as men,
should not be refused by state law
from jury service if they want it,
just as they can vote, or not vote.
The question of juries, part men

and part woman, also enters the ar-
gument, as well as does the make-
up of a grand jury.
•

- LINCOLN'S BIRTHDAY.

Through an oversight on our part,
mention was not made last week of
the coming, Feb. 12, of the birthday
of Abraham Lincoln. We are making
mention of it now, not only to do hon-
or to the date, but to call attention
briefly, to an address made by him in
1858, when he was a candidate for U.
S. Senator, the main issue between
the parties being slavery. He was
defeated for Senator, but it so hap-
pened that it was the slavery issue
that brought about the Civil war,
which led up to the later address made
by him at Gettysburg, that has been
published a number of times in The
Record. He said in part—
"A house divided against itself can-

not stand, I believe this government
cannot endure permanently half slave
and half free. I do not expect the
union to be dissolved—I do not expect
the house to fall—but I do expect it
will cease to be divided. It will become
all one thing or all the other. Either
the opponents of slavery will arrest
the further spread of it, and place it
where the public mind shall rest in the
belief that it is in course of ultimate
extinction; or its advocates will push
it forward, till it shall become alike
lawful in all the states, old as well as
new—North as well as South."
Recent research into the genealogy

of Abraham Lincoln has developed
the information that he was not the
"poor white" stock, as his old-time
enemies used to call him, but was a
descendant of "English gentry" in
south-western England, and that his
father had lost his money about the
time the family came to this country.
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COVERED DISH DINNER.

The combined Missionary Societies
of the Lutheran Church held their an-
nual covered dish dinner, on Thurs-
day evening. The tables were taste-
fully decorated in honor of the pa-
triotic birthdays of the month. Dur-
ing the evening the "secret sisters"
exchanged gifts.
The program consisted of singing

of patriotic hymns, scripture, prayer,
solo, "I am an American," Freddie
Teeter; vocal selection "The Rose of
Tralee," Misses Edith and Hazel
Hess, Mrs. Murray Baumgardner,
Mrs. Olive Martin and Mrs. Alice
Ecker, Miss Mary Louise Alexander
at the piano; also a play entitled,
"Polly put the Kettle On," charac-
ters: Mrs. Harry Crouse, Mrs. Merle
Ohler, Misses Catherine and Mary
Crouse, Mildred Stull, Louella Sauble
and Mary Louise Alexander. There
were present a few over a hundred.

LEADERSHIP TRAINING SCHOOL

The Taneytown Leadership Training
School for Church workers will have
its annual school this year on Mon-
day, Tuesday and Thursday evenings
February 17, 18 and 20, the first week
and the 24, 25 and 27, the second
week. The meeting place the first
week will be in Grace Reformed
Church, Taneytown;the second week's
meeting place will be in Trinity Luth-
eran Church, Taneytown. There will
be two class periods each evening be-
ginning at 7:30 and will be over at
9:30 P. M.
The courses under consideration

will be the following: Rev. A. T. 'Sut-
cliffe will teach the course in "Im-
proving Our Leadership." Rev. Irvin
Morris will conduct his course in "the
Kingdom of God." •Rev. A. W. Gar-
vin will bring a study on the "Mira-
cles in the Apostolic Church." The
materials needed is a Bible. There
is no registration fee, as the school
is a cooperative movement of the
Sunday Schools of the Taneytown
district and it is sponsored by the
Taneytown District Sunday School
Association. Mr. Carroll Hess is
president; Mr. Murray Baumgardner.
treasurer. The public is invited to
enroll in these courses.

DR. W. W. DAVIS DEAD.

Dr. W. W. Davis. well known secre-
tary of the Lord's Day Alliance for 30
years, died early Tuesday morning,
after two weeks treatment in the Ma-
ryland General Hospital, Baltimore.
He had been a well known figure at

many sessions of the legislature, in
opposition to legislation that in any
way interfered with a strict observ-
ance on Sunday; in his work had ap-
peared in many of the pulpits in the
state.
Be had also been pastor of various

Methodist Churches, and for several
years acted as superintendent of
Mountain Lake Park, then and now
under the management of the Method-
ist Episcopal Church. Funeral ser-
vices were held on Thursday at the
First Methodist Church, followed by
interement in Loudon Park cemetery.

NAMED CHIEF JUDGE
Governor O'Conor Gives Clear

View of the Situation.
I have proffered to Judge William

H. Forsythe, Jr., of Howard County,
the appointment of Chief Judge of
the Fifth Judicial Circuit, and he has
advised me of his acceptance. Judge
Forsythe will succeed former Chief
Judge F. Neal Parke who recently
retired upon reaching the age limit.
Judge Forsythe has been a mem-

ber of the Bench for more than 35
years, the longest service of any of
the present Judges of the State and,
possibly, the longest Judicial service
ever to be rendered by a Judge in
Maryland.
Endorsements of the Bar Associa-

tions of Anne Arundel, Carroll and
Howard Counties, the three counties
comprising the Fifth Circuit, have
been presented to me. In fact, it is
proper to say that every lawyer in
the circuit has signified his prefer-
ence for Judge Forsythe.
Some time ago I invited the coop-

eration of the Maryland State Bar
Association in filling vacancies in
Judicial offices. At its meeting last
month, the State Bar approved this
arrangement and authorized its
president to appoint a committee to
make such recommendations. I con-
sider this one of the most forward
steps ever taken in selecting Judges
throughout the State and I desire to
commend the officers and members of
the State Bar Association for their
manifest interest in preserving the
high standards of our Courts.
The Committee of ten representa-

tives of the State Bar met recently
and considered the situation caused
by the retirement of former Judge
Parke. In a written statement, sub-
mitted to me through President Wal-
ter C. Capper of the Association, the
committee appointed out that certain
considerations of public policy were
presented in this appointment and
consequently the committee offered
alternative recommendations. The
State-wide committee advanced for
consideration the names of Judge
Forsythe and James Clark of Ellicott
City, as worthy of the appointment to
the highest Court in the State. Of
Judge Forsythe, the committee made
the following statement:
"Judge Forsythe has been an As-

sociate Judge for 33 years, whieh is
the longest term of service Cif any
Maryland Judge now on the Bench.
He is an able, experienced, conscien-
tious Judge. His service has been
satisfactory to the Bar and the peo-
ple of his 'Circuit and the State. His
appointment to succeed Judge Parke
would be a merited recognition of
past service. Furthermore, his ap-
pointment as Chief Judge would
make possible the appointment of an
Associate Judge from Carroll County
which has always had a resident
Judge. Unless these considerations

(continued on Fourth Pape

MORE ABOUT THE BUDGET.

(For The Record).

The "Citizens' Commission" which
is working for a reduction of the pro-
posed budget for the state, issued this
week an analysis of the matter of sal-
aried positions. They show the num-
ber as 5,558, and the appropriations
asked for two years as $13,412,394, an
increase of $1,399,637 over the budget
for the current two years, ending
September 30, 1941.

Besides this there are lump sum
appropriations in various department-
al salary budgets, and the appropria-
tions for the University of Maryland
are not included, so that the "com-
mission" says " just how much of the
State's budget goes for salaries can-
not be determined even after exhaust-
ive study."
A comparison of the budgeta for all

the years from 1920 shows that in
that time the amount has been mul-
tiplied almost by five, increasing
from $11,284,346 for 1920 to $53,756,-
608 for 1943.

YOUR INCOME TAX RETURN.

We had a very clear statement on
this subject in last week's issue, but to
give our readers additional warning
we repeat the matter in a nut shell.

If you are single and had a gross
income of $800, you must make a re-
turn. Remember the gross income is
the amount before any allowable de-
ductions are taken .if.

If your life partner died any time
before December 31, or if you were
separated, you count as a single per-
son.

If you were married and living to-
gether all the year and your combinel
gross income was $2000, you must
make a return.
Do it now. There are just four

weeks until the dead line, and if you
must ask for advice or help, your ad-
visor may be busy or absent or ill at
the last minute, and you risk a penalty
We have received from the U. S.

Treasury Department numerous circu-
lars, and recently a printed sheet of
33 prepared articles, which, if printed
together, would fill the first page of
The Record 'five times.

PASSES TEST.

Miss Rosanna Keilholtz, the daugh-
ter of Mr. and Mrs. •Grier Keilholtz,
near Taneytown, has passed the Penn-
sylvania State Board Examination
for nurses, and now is a registered
nurse. At the present, Miss Kielholtz
is working at the York City Hospital,
York, Pa.

CARROLL COUNTY BOY SCOUTS.

A Meeting Called for Tuesday
February 14th.
_—

After a series of meetings held by
persons interested in the advancement
of the Boy Scout program in Carroll
County, an organization has 'leen ef-
fected. The oistrict will he known as
the Carroll Distr;ct and will include
all of Carroll County. It will be af-
filiated with the Baltimore Area of
Boy Scouts of America under the lead-
ership of the scout executive, W. P.
Bradley. District 2onunittees have
been organized in other counties of
Maryland and it is a most effective
means of promoting scOlii;ing.
At the present tima there are only

seven troops in the county and it is
hoped that through this committee
more troops will be organized and the
whole program of scouting given
greater impetus. This District com-
mittee has under consideration the ad-
visability of employing either a part-
time or a full-time scout leader in
Carroll County and full details will be
announced at a later date.
The following chairmen and com-

mittees were appointed at a recent
meeting; District Chairman,Raymond
S. Hyson, Westminster; District op-
erating committee chairmen: Camp-
ing and activities, C. V. Griefenstein,
Manchester; Advancement, F. E.
Hilmer, Finksburg; Training, Charles
Havens, Westminster; Organization,
George E. Caylor, Hampstead ;Health
and Safety, Dr. Homer E. Cooper,
New Windsor, chairman, and Charles
Gendell, Mt. Airy, vice-chairman;
Finance, Evan F. Bowers, Westmin-
ster.
The District Committee personnel

is organized as follows: Institutional
Representatives, F. E. Hilmer, West-
minster Boy Scouts, Troop 321; C. V.
Griefenstein, Manchester Troop 320;
George Caylor, Hampstead, Troop
344; Dr. Homer Cooper, New Wind-
sor Troop 369; Louis Lancaster,
Taneytown Troop 348, and Emory
Minnick, Union Bridge Troop 330.
Members-at-large are Evan F. Bow-
ers, Paul Lawyer, Silver Run; Asa
Watkins, Mt. Airy; Charles B. Gen-
dell, Mt. Airy; Frank Mather, West-
minster; Holmes Lockard. Sykesville.

Assisting on the camping and ac-
tivities committee will be Paul Law-
yer and Henry Himler, Westminster.
On the finance committee in addition
to the chairman will be Carroll Craw-
ford and James Shriver, Westminster
Asa Watkins and Frank W. Mather.
A meeting has been called for

Tuesday, February 8, at 7:30 P. M.
of all members of the District Com-
mittee to perfect the organization and
discuss plans for the scout program.

CAMP MEADE IS MUDDY.

Those who have arrived at Fort
Meade, and are good judges of what
camp life is, are pretty unanimous in
the opinion that is is a. decidedly
muddy place, including the roads that
are breaking down because of heavy
traffic.
However, the hope is being held out

that during the Summer time, condi-
tions will be greatly better; in fact,
it has some indications of a southern
summer resort; and even now, the
rations are excellent, and the quar-
ters very comfortable.

There are many visitors, of course,
and as the registrants—increase in
number, a limit may be placed on ex-
cursionists who have no interest there
—except curiosity to see what may
be seen.
World War veterans who had ex-

perience in France, recall the mud
"over there" and are skeptical as to
whether it will disappear at Meade;
but as good soldiers are not complain-
ing to any great extent.

THE RETURN OF WILLKIE.

The return of Wendell L. Willkie
has been attended by more publicity
in the newspapers, as to the impres-
sions and knowledge he received than
we had expected. Notwithstanding
the wideness of public interest in the
war in Europe, we doubt the advis-
ability of this report.

Winston Churchill, Prime Minis-
ter of England, in a lengthy radio
address on Sunday, boldly stated
that with the prompt help of the U.
S—not in men but in war munitions
and supplies—England was sure to
win the war. That England had al-
ready laid its plan for 1942, and had
no thought nor intention of meeting
defeat.

According to publioshed informa-
tion. Mr. Willkie is of the opinion
that the United States should help
England as fast as possible, and even
fears that, so doing may be too late.
He says the lease-lend bill represents
the only chance to defend liberty
without war.
Mr. Willkie's report was made be-

fore the members of the Senate For-
eign Relations Committee.
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A NEW "COUNTY RECORD?'

This time, it is a new weekly, pub-
lished at Towson, that says it is "An
independent Democratic newspaper,
dedicated to the advancement of Bal-
timore County." The name of the
paper is the County Record, and it
presents a comely appearance and a
wide variety of local and general
news.

A CENTURY OLD WEEKLY.

The Ellicott City Times is 100
years and 6 weeks old. It means to
celebrate its centennial "soon," and
we'll bet it will be a hummer, worth
waiting for. We are not sure but
expect Brother Stromberg's paper
must be the grand-daddy of all Mary-
land weeklies.

HOFF'S WEEKLY LETTER
FROM ANNAPOLIS.

Concerning Pan -Mutual Betting
at Carroll County Fair.

(To The Carroll Record)

For a number of years it has been
obvious that some action must be
taken to save the Carroll County
Fair. In spite of all efforts on the
part of those in control, of the Asso-
ciation the Fair has been steadily
sinking deeper into financial oblivion
At the present time the Fair Asso-

ciation owes $15,000.00 on a mort-
gage to one of the County banking
institutions, another $15,000.00 to ten
individual judgment creditors, around
$3,000.00 back interest and some
small amount on other obligations.
The stock of the Association, held by
164 individuals in varying amounts,
is worthless, the last transfers being
made at a price of less than 10c per
share.
For ten years the Fair has had no

season that could be regarded as
reasonable successful. Officials of the
Association have readily confessed
that the only reason the Fair has
been able to continue in existance
this long has been due to the capital-
zation upon that somewhat gruesome
spectacle knows as the "public wed-
ding."
The officers, directors, stockhold-

ers, creditors and other individuals
interested in the preservation of our
Carroll County Fair have concluded
that there is but one course to pursue
tb prevent the Fair from closing,
namely, the legislation of pari-mutu-
al betting machines. The bill has
been prepared (and I am informed
will be introduced before the publica-
tion of this column) that will permit
these machines to be operated at our
Carroll County Fair.
As I have not yet seen the pro-

posed bill there is very little more
that I can say about it at the present
time. I hope to be able to follow up
this matter next week in more detail.
I feel that it is my duty to the cit-

izens of Carroll County to clarify my
position on this question now. (I re-
gard fence-straddling as a rather low
form of politics). I believe that this
measure will not only save the Car-
roll County Fair, but will make it one
of the outstanding Fairs in the State
of Maryland. I believe that Carroll
County will greatly benefit by the
capital that this move will cause to
be spent in the county. I believe that
the exhibitors of Carroll County pro-
duce and live stock would materially
benefit by the additional expenditures
that could be made to develop this
port)on of the fair. I am, therefore.
in favor of the legalization of the use
of the pan -mutual machines in Car-
roll County.
As this identical situation arose in

Harford County some years ago when
their Agricultural Fair was virtually
"on the rocks," I was interested in
getting one of the Harford County
legislators to give his version of the
situation in that county. It was
briefly this:

That when pan -mutual betting
was legalized for the Harford County
Fair it was done over a storm of pro-
test from individuals and organiza-
tions throughout the county.
"That immediately after betting

was legalized there was an increase
in the size of the agricultural exhib-
its at the Fair and a considereable in-
crease in the prizes and awards given
to the exhibitors.
"That the businesses in Harford

county were benefited by the thous-
ands of dollars spent by the much
larger crowds of people drawn to the
Fair.
"That the Harford County taxpay-

er was helped by the extra taxes de-
rived by the County from the race
track.
"That the Fair was definitely saved

by he use of par-mutuals.

"And oddly enough, that many who
objected most strenuously to the leg-
alization of pan -mutual machines in
Harford County are now ardent sup-
porters of the Fair and would be th5
first to object at the abolition of bet-
ting at their Fair."
The two bills introduced on Febru-

ary 5, exempting Carroll County from
the list of counties whose roads are
to be maintained by the State Roads

I Commission, are Senate Bill 207 and
House Bill 252. Both bills have been
referred to the roads and highway
committees of the Senate and House,
respectively.
There has been some discussion con-

cerning the introduction of a bill that
would require all persons cre‘ ting• or
repairing any la.ildings to firs: obtain
a permit from the County Cemm;s-
sioners, in the event that such work
shall cost more than $250.0G. The
purpose of the plan is to keel) theAs-
sessment books up to date.

I feel that the inconyemenc3 to the
public would outweigh the benefits an-
ticinated. For example: If Mr. Brown
in Mt. Airy district wished to alter
his barn, at a cost of more thae. $250.
he would not be able to start work un-
less he first came to Westmiaeter and
obtained a permit fr r.n the County
Commissioners. Mr. Jones in Sykes-
ville could be hailed into Court and
lined if he built that new garage be-
hind his house without a permit. I
am afraid that the principal effect
would be to discourage property im-
provements in Carroll County.
Until next week, I am sincerely,

STANFORD HOFF.
(We believe that all who are inter-

ested in any of these proposals should
express themselves to either Senator
A. Earl Shipley; or Delegates C. Ray
Barnes, Stanford Hoff, Paul C. Leis-
ter or Randall D. Sporlein.—Ed.)

HOME-MAKERS CLUB WORK IN
CARROLL COUNTY.

The Homemakers' Club work in
Carroll County is well under way for
1941 and printed programs have been
distributed to the 619 club members.
Figures from the 1940 report of the
Home Demonstration Agent reveal
some interesting facts, beside the
achievement records of the Club mem-
bers themselves. Figures from the
past year show that 857 callers were
received at the Home Demonstration
Agent's Office, which is a large at-
tractive room in the Postoffice Build-
ing. Beside this number of callers,
there were 1147 phone calls, 769 in-
dividual letters written, 75 circular
letters sent out, and about 500 bulle-
tins distributed. Miss Hoffman trav-
eled about 8000 miles in the county
making home visits and attending
meetings. There are 619 club mem-
bers in the 22 Homemakers' Clubs,
283 girls in the 174 4-H Clubs. During
the year, the Homemakers Clubs
made noteworthy contributions to the
Red Cross, Children's Aid Society and
other local charities, and as a county
group, raised $300.00 for remedial
health work among underprivileged
school children in the county. 54 girls
attended the County 4-H Club Camp,
63 girls participated in the Style Re-
vue at the Annual Achievement Day
and 88 girls exhibited at the County
Fair.
The program for Homemakers'

Clubs last year was chiefly Home
Furnishing and Home Management.
Achievement reports in these projects
show that 36 club members improved
one or more windows in their homes
by changing the shape, size or loca-
tion, 78 club members improved the
styling of their window treatments
in one or more rooms, 87 gained a bet-
ter understanding of treatments suit-
able for windows in each room. As
a result of demonstrations of window
curtains and draperies, 55 club mem-
bers improved curtains by remodeling
them, 71 club members selected new
curtains according to demonstrations,
49 club members made curtains at
home according to the demonstrations,
61 improved their selection of mater-
ial for curtains, and 81 improved their
method of hanging curtains. 26 club
members report making better selec-
tion of draperies, 22 made draperies
at home according to demonstrations.
45 improved styling and hanging of
draperies. As :esults of the demon-
strations on the selection and making
of table linens, and the selection of
china were, 33 club members report
making hefts,. •eleci-on of table lin-
ens, 38 club members made table lin-
ens at home, and 170 report giving•
more attention to table setting. 45
club members made selection of dish-
es according to demonstrations, 58*
club members are using their own
china more effectively and 271 club
members report that they have gained
a greater interest in dishes and table
appointments and have observed them
more closely. Results of project
schools show that 48 spring units in
overstuffed furniture cushions were
repaired, 66 hooked rugs were made,
58 other type rugs were made and 111
slip covers were made.

Results of the Home Management
project shows that 135 club members
improved one or more hazardous con-
ditions in their homes to avoid acci-
dents, 133 club members changed one
or more unsafe practices they had
been carrying on in their homes, 165
club members improved the color
schemes in their kitchens, 107 refin-
ished the surface of their kitchen
floors to make them wear better, 60
refinished kitchen walls, 87 took meas-
ures to exterminate household pests.
The Homemakers' Club program for.

1941 is based on foods and nutrition
and clothing, and includes the follow-
ing demonstrations: "Foods Planning-
and the Family Health", "Low Cost
Meals in the Food Plan." "Purchasing
Staple Foods", "Foot Health and the
Selection of Shoes", "Foundations of
Beauty", "Positive Posture", "Pur-
chasing Ready Made Clothing", and
"Fitting of Ready Made Outer Gar-
ments".
'Project schools for the year will in-

clude "Chair Caning", in February;
"Dressmaking," in April; "Canning
and Jelly Making", in June: "Coat
Making," in October: and "Hooked
Rug Making,' in November. Bi-
monthly office exhibits will be an-
nounced nearer the time of each ex-
hibit.
a=21211:12222 

R an dom Thoughts
CROSS-WORD PUZZLES.
We suppose that only a small

percentage of newspaper readers
are interested in cross-word puz-
zles; but the very fact that they
have so long been given space in
both daily and weekly papers,
should testify to their values and
interest.
They represent mental exercise

and familiarity with the use of
words—a study of definitions.
puzzling, to be sure—but a good
test of mental acrobatics—and
the extent of what we call our
vocabulary.
The best government against

these puzzles is the fact that their
architects go to far in their ef-
forts puzzle-using foreign words,
geographical names and expres-
sions, so obscure as to cease to be
measures of intelligence.
As these puzzles are accompan-

ied by solutions, the temptation
is to "give up" too soon, the ben-
efits of this really educational
feature. By all means, keen up
with this exercise, for by so doing
one will gradually accumulate
most of the answers. A good
dictionary will help too, to muster
the puzzles. P. B. E.
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STRIKES MAY LESSEN.

There are indications that strikes
may gradually disappear,especiallyas
they may relate to slowing up orders
for war munitions and supplies, as
strike leaders are beginning to real-
ize that interference with the govern-
ment's business is a serious proce-
dure.
Whether we like all of the interpu-

tations of democracy of the United
States concerning the war in Europe,
it is pretty sure they will not be re-
placed by a strike leader democracy.
There are intimation in some quar-

ters that back of our labor unions
there are influences of distinctly
German—or other foreign nations—
and this, if even only slightly true,
will not be tolerated.

It is also now said that such
strikes of a major character that
have been called, have not as yet in-
terf erred to any great extent with
production, but are being settled by
changes in working rules and wages.
Whether or not—or to what extent

—the U. S. should aid England, is
the business of American sentiment
legally expressed, and if there are
foreign agitators in labor organiza-

tions who would try to decide this
question, they should be weeded out,
the sooner the better.
The following statement, recently

issued, is reassuring—
"At a time when employee and

management troubles are causing
stoppages in vital production in many
other places, the Reynolds Metals
Company, biggest independent alum-
inum enterprise in the country, an-
nounces a formal pledge signed by
its president and seventeen officials
of C. I. 0. and A. F. of L. unions de-
voting combined man power and plant
energies te the supply of war mater-
ials.
The text reads! No greater trust

has ever been the responsibility of
any generation than that of defending
and preserving for posterity the right
to live in the freedom of democracy
which is ours today. We pledge the
resources and facilities of the Rey-
nolds Metals Company twenty-four
hours a day, seven days a week to
supply strong aluminum alloys, vital
to the defense program.
To the fulfillment of this obligation

every employee and executive of this
company, individually and collective-
ly' pledges his energy and unfalter-
ing loyalty. As Americans we can-
not do less; as human being we can-
not do more.
"This is our purpose and our

pledge."

WATCH AND CHAIN MAN.

Edgar A. Guest once wrote one of

his half-Serious, )11a1f4iumlorous
poems, on "The man who gets the

watch and chain," and even per-

mitted his imagination to go so far

as to say "I'm always sorry for such

a man."
But, this old-time nuite common

public function appears to have

gone out of date as a reward for
meritorious services rendered, and
we have substituted honors, instead

hf jewelry—honors frequently at-

tached to fat salaries and perquisites
or it may be that the honor of being

chosen is sufficient—something along

the line of heading a parade.
Without doubt, the motto "Get a

good man and keep him there"
scunds like good business sense; but
the long practice of even a good
motto of this kind is apt to become
monotonious, just as mono is a pre-
fix of monopoly.
Just now we are trying out a third

term President, but we can hardly

say that this was a "watch and
chain" gift as much as it was the re-

sult of political planning on a very

wide scale—a leading part in a long

list of new deals.
-tt 

BIG BONDS AND BABY BONDS.

The prologue for the "buy a bond"
campaign is being chanted by Gov-

ernment officials. The public will be
told that Government bonds are "a
good thing for everybody."

Everyone has heard of Government

bonds. Even to the younger genera-
tion—they know all about "baby
bonds," such as are sold in the post-
offices. Young and old folks will
have no difficulty in buying some of

the new defense war bonds. City
and village banks will help in the
1940's just as they helped purchase
in the 'first World War.
The banks are actuated by self-in-

terest to support these campaigns in-
asmuch as they automatically create
new customers for the banks, and
help to promote community prosper-

ity. The private citizen takes no
risk, and when the hard times come
again—as they will after this war ex-

citement is over—the bonds will be
easy to sell in the public markets or

they may be called in and redeemed
by the Government.—N. I. News Ser-

vice.

THE COUNTRY'S GONE SOFT.

We've been hearing a lot lately

about how the country's gone soft,
and the youth are all reds or anarch-
ists or close to them. And 'somtimes
we look at our own sons and sum-
mon up some frost-bitten memory
from the days of our own youth and
pontificate about how "things ain't
what they used to be."
Now this is a funny way for us to

be acting. Practically the whole na-
tion is yowling its head off for more
naval bases in South America, more
production at home, a bigger army to
defend America, a more belligerent
governmental attitude when Ameri-

ca's toes are stepped on by any for-
eign power—and the ones we have

selected to back up this yowling are
our soft youth. Maybe we're a mite
inconsistent.
When we stop to think of it, this

crazy world hasn't been any bed of
roses thtse past ten years for the
boys in our town. Some of them are

just now getting started in good
permanent jobs; and while there are
always seine loafers, most of them
have been trying all the time.
Our youth are all right. Any bunch

that can get .turned down )fifty times

for a job and come up still hoping for

the fifty-first are bound to be all
right. And that's a lucky thing for

us. Who'd we get to back up our
yowling if they weren't?—Communi-
ty Reporter, Mt. Airy.

ENGLAND'S DEBT TO U. S.

Isolationist propaganda about the
failure of Great Britain to pay its
war debts to the United 'States has

left the impression in the minds of
many Americans that the British
failed to "pay back a dime." Just to
keep the record straight, Great
Britain paid this country, in princi-

pal and interest, $2,024,000,000 up
until the depression brought Eng-

land and most of the rest of the
world close to economic collapse in

1931.
What is more important, and yet

seldom is mentioned in discussions

about war debts, is that of the Axis

nations Germany and Italy owe the

United States substantial sums of

money. On October 31, 1940, Treas-

ury Department Ifigures showed that

Italy's debt was $2,026,901,442.35,

and that Germany's was $1,269,368,-

369.74. At the same time Great

Britain owned this country $5,651,-

792,208.17.
But those figures do not begin to

tell the story. When Great Britain

war debts were funded in 1923, they

were set at $4,600,000,000 with an

interest rate of 3 percent increasing

to 31/2 per cent by 1933. In 1925 ar-

rangements were made with Italy

whereby its debt was funded at

$1,648,000,000, with interest rates to

start at % of 1 per cent, and never

to exceed more than 2 per cent dur-

ing the entire life of the loan.

In other words, payments made by

Great Britain up until 1931 amounted

to more than $2,000,000,000, yet the

high interest rates have kept the

debt increasing at such a rate that

Britain now owes more than it did

when the debt was funded. Mean-

while, Italy has paid only a total of

about $100,000,000, yet the low inter-

est rates have kept its debt from in-

creasing as rapidly as Britain's. Dur-

ing the same time, Germany has paid

only slightly more than $33,500,000

on its total indebtedness to this

country.
It must also be remembered that

Great Britain loaned about the same

amount it received from this country

to France and other Allies. These

countries failed to keep up their

payments to Great Britain during

the world economic crisis, and the

British were deprived of an import-

ant source of income they expected to

use in keeping up the installments

due the United States.

Despite these facts, we still hear of

plans to seize British possessions in

this hemisphere as payment for

these back debts. Little is said, how-

ever, of seizing the 27 Italian and

2 German ships now lying in Amer-

ican harbors as part payment for the

l
back debts of the Axis, partners.—

Scottish Rite Service.

LINCOLN'S OPPORTUNITIES

Young people who say they have no
chance in life should read the life of
Abraham Lincoln, whose birthday was
celebrated on February 12th., Little
"Abe" did not probably have over a
year of schooling. Most American
boys and girls have far better school
chances than that now.
A school that would be called poor

in these times, with inadequate equip-
men and a teacher with insufficient
education, would probably be a good
school compared with the average run
of country schools in Lincoln's early
youth.

If a boy can rise to exalted heights,
and become President of the United
States after such poor chances, few
boys or girls today can say the doors
of opportunity are closed to them.
The fact that a youth has oppor-

tunities does not prove they will do
him any good. Opportunity has to
be utilized. Lincoln had very few
opportunities, but he made use of all
he had. The few good books in his
father's home he read and re-read.
Then he borrowed what he could from
neighbors. He read real books, that
made him think and gave him valua-
ble information. They were books
like the Bible and Shakespeare and
the history of the United States and
the Life of Washington.
There should be enough money in

this country to give opportunities to
all. Persuading boys and girls to use
them, is something different. If a boy
has ambition, but of the crowd with
which he trains is inclined to idle
loafing and mischief, the ambition is
likely to lose its zest. The teacher
that can persuade such a boy to really
work, and cut loose from idle compan-
ions, should be the 'making of a very
fine man, perhaps a great one.—Caro-
line County Sun.

DEFENSE PRODUCTION.

American industry, in its day-to-
day defense production, is making
poor prophets out of all the writers
who have contended that "you will
never make a satin purse out of a
sow's ear."
So far as modern researchers know,

James Howell, in 1659, was the first
man to put that phrase into writing.
Now, 300 years later, Washington
hears daily of new industrial art
complishments for defense which
make transformation of a sow's ear
into silk look like child's play.
The handicaps in many instances

are tremendous—but since the gov-
ernment is setting the policy and
needs weapons and machines for de-
fense, industry is producing them.

1 To the layman, this production
might seem a simple job. But facts
talked privately in Washington show
that it is far from simple. Here is
one especially interesting illustration:
When drafting men for military

service was under consideration, some
government officials favored deferr-
ing watchmakers because they would
be useful in making the fuses which
explode shells and bombs. But now
these fuses are being produced. And
men who regularly work on women's
minute modern wrist watches are too
clumsy for fuse making.
Watchmakers just didn't have the

required skill. So the fuse producers

turned to women who are needle-
workers, doing embroidery, crochet-

ing, and other fine handwork. The
result is perfect fuses.—I. P. Service.

Li 1TIFICATION NOTICE.

In the Orphans' Court of Carroll County:

DECEMBER TERM, 1940

Estate of Elizabeth Annie Shoemaker,
Deceased.

On application, it is ordered, this 21st.
(lay of January 1941, that the sale of the
Real Estate of Elizabeth Annie Shoemaker,
late of Carroll County, deceased, made by
The Birnie Trust Company. Executor of the
last Will and Testament of said deceased.
and this day reported to this Court by the
said Executor. be ratified and confirmed
unless cause be shown to the contrary on
or before tbe 24th. day of Fehr:I:try, next;
provided a copy of this order be inserted
for three successive weeks in some news-
paper printed and published in Carroll
County, ,before the 17th. day ,of February,
next.
The report states the amount of sale to

be $1900.00.
J. WEBSTER EBAUGH.
LEWIS E. GREEN,
E. LEE ERB.

Judges.
True Copy Test:—

HARRY G. BERWAGER,
Register of Wills for Carroll County.

1-24-it

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.
This is to give notice that the subscrib-

er has obtained from the Orphans' Court
of Carroll County. in Maryland, letters
testamentary on the personal estate of

JOHN E. SHRINER,

late of Carroll County, deceased. All per-
sons having claims against the deceased
are warned to exhibit the same, with the

• vouchers thereof, legally authenticated, to
the subscriber, on or before the 7th. day
of September, next: they may otherwise by
law be excluded from all benefits of said
estate

Given under my hand this third day of
February, 1941.

CATHERINE L. SHRINE.R,
Exectutix of the estate of
John E. Shriner, deceased.

2-7-St

Epidemic of
Cold Symptoms

666 Liquid or 666 Tablets with 666
Salve or 666 Nose Drops generally re-
lieves cold symptoms the first day.

--Advertisement

PUBLIC SALE
—OF VALUABLE _

Real Estate and Personal
Property

Intending to discontinue farming,
I will offer at public sale, at my farm
situated 21/2 miles south of Taney-
town, near the Union Bridge road, 1/1
mile from Otterdale School-house, on
WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 19, 1941
at 10 'o'clock, sharp, my farm con-
sisting of

35 ACRES OF LAND,
more or less, with electricity avail-
able. A desirable property consist-
ing of a two-story 6-room FRAME
DWELLING, bank barn, wagon shed,
2 large chicken houses, 2 brooder
houses and all necessary outbuildings
with a well of never-failing water at
the door. Farm and equipment are
highly suitable for farming and poul-
try business. Fields have been well
kept and the soil is of high quality.
TERMS will be made known day

of sale.
MRS. CATHERINE L. SHRINER,

Owner.

At the same time and place the fol-
lowing stock and farming implements
will be offered:

2 HEAD OF HORSES,
dark mare mare, 9 years old,5

line leadseirn.gle 

S
line leader; bladk

EL

horse, 9 years old, single

4 HEAD OF CATTLE,
Jersey cow, third calf just sold off;
Jersey cow, due to be fresh
in May; Jersey cow, due to
be fresh in March; Jersey
heifer, 1 year old.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.
F. 12 Farmall tractor, in excellent
condition; Little Genius tractor plow,
good as new; Ontario 8-hoe grain
drill, 6-ft. Deering binder, Case corn
planter, double pulverizer, nearly
new; David Bradley 24-disc harrow,
Case mower, used 2 seasons, Syracuse
furrow plow, double corn worker,
spike harrow, springtooth harrow, 3-
sections, 2 section harrow, hay ted-
der, dump rake, manure spreader, fod-
der shredder, chopping mill, Kelly
duplex, corn drag, shovel plow, steel
low-down wagon, low wagon, with
bed, carriage, hay fork, rope and pul-
leys, sleigh, lot of wheat, lot short
corn, lot fertilizer, 25-ft. double 5-in
belt, small belts, gas engine, line
shaft, pump jack, cutting box, can.
vas cover, lot posts, 2 ladders, corn
shelter, wagon jack, block and fall,
emory stone, lot small tools, mattock,
saws, scythe, axes, digging iron,
wrecking bar, shock tier, hoes, rakes,
double and single trees, middle rings,
jockey sticks, yokes, chains, forks,
shovels, bag holder, lot of sacks, oil
drums, 1/, drum roof paint.sideboards,
wheels, new wheelbarrow, lot of iron,
front gears, collars, bridles, lines. 1937
TERRAPLANE AUTOMOBILE, in
excellent condition; fodder by the
bundle, 8 acres growing wheat, 1/2 in-
terest in 7 acres growing wheat, 450
LAYING HENS, chicken coops, foun-
tains, troughs, 2 brooder stoves, 2 in-
cubators, milk cooler, new; ice box,
good as new; milk cans, strainer,
buckets, copper kettle, iron kettle,
stirrer, butchering tools, Speed Queen
washing machine, ice box, small; sau-
sage grinder, 2 stuffers, lot potatoes.
jarred fruit, empty jars, butchering
table, churn and buck, table, cellar
cupboard, 2 kettle rings, lot crocks, 5-
burner Florence oil stove and _oven;
Sunshine kitchen range, tubs, lan-
terns, oil cans, egg stove, double heat-
er stove, bed, bureau, chairs and
stand, bed and spring, sewing ma-
chine, radio, rocking chairs, lounge,
stands, four chairs, sofa, sideboard,
carpet, rugs, dishes, tumblers, pitch-
ers, window blinds, jelly glasses, 8-ft
extension table, plain tables, sink,
kitchen chairs, lamps, and other items
too numerous to mention.
TERMS—CASH.
MRS. CATHERINE L. SHRINER.

Executrix of John E. Shriner.
EARL R. BOWERS, Auct.
EDWARD S. HARNER, CURTIS G.

BOWERS, Clerks. 2-7-3t

DR. OSCAR P. HUOT
DENTAL SURGEON.

YORK ST., OVER ROY GARNER'S
HARDWARE STORE

Office Hours: 9 A. M. to 9 P. M. Daily
C. & P. Tel. 60

To relieve
Misery of COLDS

LIQUID
TABLETS
SALVE

NOSE DROPS
COUGH DROPS

Try "Rub-My-Tisin" - a Wonderful Liniment

LARGEST SELECTION

QUALITY MEMORIALS

NEWEST DESIGNS

IMMEDIATE DELIVERY

At the price you wish to pay

JOSEPH L. MATHIAS
WESTMINSTER, MARYLAND

STOPS Heavy, Losses
from Bloody Coccidiosis

'rice Reindollar Company's
•C-KA-GENE MASH

Bloody Coecidiosis? No longer
need you fear its red death will
slaughter your chicks. Thousands
of chicks killed in the Pratt lab-
oratories have shown science how
to easily avoid those awful losses.

Our C-Ka-Gene Ration con-
tains Pratts C-Ka-Gene, the
newly discovered compound
that protects birds from
Coccidiosis.

Our C-Ka-Gene Ration is not
a "cure" nor a "preventibe."
It works by the IMMUNITY
method giving a flock perma-
nent protection against this
terrible disease.

Come in today and let us
tell you how our C-Ka-Gene
Ration will stop Coccidiosis
losses for only about a penny
a bird.

THE REINDOLLAR CO.
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Phone 30

CALENDARS
For 1942

0 

Samples now ready for
Booking Orders

Nearly all New
Designs. See
them now!

There is every advantage, and
no disadvantage in plac-
ing your order NOW.

THE CARROLL RECORD CO.

MR. FARMER-THEY'RE HERE 
TheNew Case Tractor

Come in—

Take the Wheel===You'll Get a Big Thrill
AN ENTIRELY NEW EXPERIENCE in Tractor Operation
Come in today ... sit in the seat of this new

"SC" CASE TRACTOR

grip the rubber-rimmed wheel. See for yourself how handy,
how convenient, how comfortable a modern tractor can be.
Full 2-plow capacity ... 2 or 4 rows ... four speeds forward,
including fast foulth ... greater visibility . . . Synchronized
Steering. 22 NEW CONVENIENCES. $625 UP

Farmers' Supply
M. E. WANTZ, Prop'r Taneytown, Md.

The World's News Seen Through

THE CHRISTIAN SCIENCE MONITOR
An International Dail) Newspaper

is Truthful—Constructive—Unbiased—Free from Sensational-
ism — Editorials Are Timely and Instructive and Its Daily
Features, Together with the Weekly Magazine Section, Make
the Monitor an Ideal Newspaper for the Home.

The Christian Science Publishing Society
One, Norway Street, Boston, Massachusetts
Price $12.00 Yearly, or $1.00 a Month.

Saturday Issue. includ'ng Magazine Section, $2.60 a Year.
Iniroductors, Offer. 6 Issues 25 Cents.

Name

Address

SAMPLE COPY ON REQUEST

Use the RECORD'S Columns

tor Best Results.



FARM
TOPICS

MOLASSES ADDS
FOOD TO SILAGE

Tests Establish Its Value as
Nutrient.

By C. B. BENDER
(Assoc. Professor in Animal Husbandry,

Rutgers University.)

Alcohol and the same acids which
are found in vinegar, cow's milk and
rancid butter occur in grass silage
when molasses is added and they
are also contained in corn silage.
But that's nothing to be held against
silages, for these ingredients are
used by cows for heat and energy.
Experiment station trials which

brought about this conclusion were
started because many dairymen
were of the opinion that the cost of
molasses is a direct preservation
charge when the molasses is used
in the preservation of grasses and
legumes as silage.
Some farmers felt that molasses

is added to silae in order to pre-
serve it because the bacteria convert
the sugar in the molasses to various
acids which preserve the green crop
in the silo. Although dairymen have
fed molasses to cattle for years and
know its value, some believed this
value to be lost as soon as the sugar
is converted into acids.
The studies were made to deter-

mine the chemical changes which oc-
curred in the silo when silage is
made with grass and preserved with
molasses. It was found that the
sugar is converted by bacteria into
alcohol and into acetic acid which
is found in vinegar; lactic acid,
which is found in cow's milk, and
butyric acid, which is found in ran-
cid butter.
Another experiment was then set

up whereby these acids and alcohol
were fed to animals. As the result
of these metabolism trials it was def-
initely established that all of them
were utilized for energy or heat by
the animal's body. This means that
they take their place along side of
the carbohydrates in corn, oats and
other dairy feeds as definite nutri-
ents.

Advises Blue Banding
Winter's Heavy Layers

Mid-winter-which means some-
time during December and January
to the poultryman-is the proper
time to examine each laying bird in
the pullet flock carefully and "blue-
band" the heavy producers for fu-
ture identification, says Dr. W. C.
Thompson, poultry husbandman at
the New Jersey Agricultural Ex-
periment station, Rutgers university.
Farmers who find trapnesting im-

possible may accomplish this iden-
tification job accurately and inex-
pensively by the "blue banding sys-
tem." This involves handling and
examining the pullets, reading the
external characteristics and decid-
ing which individuals possess those
traits indicative of heavy egg yield
during the past two or three months.
A blue celluloid leg band is placed
on the right shank of each pullet
judged to be in heavy winter produc-
tion at that time. Such simple
designation becomes at once a rec-
ord and an indicator.
"The heavy layer in mid-winter

has a deep broad body, long keel,
easily pliable skin, bright red scit
head parts, brilliant prominent eyes
and shows loss of yellow pigmenta-
tion."

Mites on Poultry
Mites do not live on chickens as

do lice, but suck blood from the skin
of the birds while they are on the
roost at night. They then return to
some dark place during the day.
Cracks and crevices in the poultry
house or on the roosts are the places
they generally hide. Painting the
roosts with nicotine sulphate will
prevent the loss from these para-
sites.

Farm Notes

At present prices for tankage and
corn, 100 pounds of skimmilk is
worth about 30 cents to feed to hogs.
This amount of milk will replace 6.5
pounds of tankage.

* * *

Eggs as packaged by nature are
an excellent food but too much heat
in cooking them will damage the
food and health values originally in
the package.

* * *

Exports of nearly all United States
farm products, except cotton, were
greatly reduced during the first 12
months of the current European
war, reports the U. S. department
of agriculture.

* * *

Rubber tires on farm equipment
may reduce rolling resistance by as
much as 46 per cent.

▪ * *

Present indications are that hog
slaughter will be reduced materially
in the first quarter of 1941, according
to the U. S. Bureau of Agricultural
Economics.

* * «

If fully developed, the usage of
cotton for a new cement-cotton roof-
ing shingle might require 1,000,000
bales annually, a U. S. department
of agriculture official estimates.

Poor E.Cai. elligent Otherwise
The disco.e: y that as many as

foul- out of every five persons re-
tarded in reading abihty have nor-
mal or superior intelligence has
prompted the Reading Clinic at the
Pennsylvania State college to en-
large its program of instruction.

"Too many people believe that
reading probflems are solved in the
first six grades of a child's educa-
tional experience," explained Dr.
Emmett A. Betts, who is in charge
of the clinic. "On the contrary, be-
tween 8 and 25 per cent of all school
children have reading faults and as
high as 50 per cent of adults display
little interest in reading."

In the face of these findings, it is
the job of educators through mod-
ern methods, to correct reading dif-
ficulties while the person is still in
school, he said.

Sulfaie-zzole Effective
Sulfathiazole, the latest addition

to the sulfanilamide family, proved
effective in bringing about the recov-
ery of a child suffering from staphy-
lococcus aureus (a yellow pus-pro-
ducing bacterium) meningitis (in-
flammation of the membranes sur-
rounding the spinal cord and brain),
Frederick W. Dietel, M. D., Church-
ville, N. Y., and Albert D. Kaiser,
M. D., Rochester, N. Y., report in
the Journal of the American Med-
ical Association. Staphylococcus
aureus as a causative agent of
meningitis is comparatively unusual
in children, but when it does occur
the morality rate is high. In the
case reported by the two physicians
the drug was administered by mouth
daily for a period of nine days. "At
the end of three weeks there was
complete recovery," they say.

1u, out, In Again
A prisoner in Granville, S. C.,

finished serving a 20-day sentence
for drunkenness and rode from the
county farm into town with one of
the guards. Turned loose, he
promptly got drunk again and when
the guard returnee to camp three
hours later he took the prisoner
back with him, this time to serve
60 days.

World Small Place
The world is a small place after

all, judging by the size of particles,
such as electrons, that make up all
matter. Westinghouse research
physicists, who smash atoms to
learn more about matter, say that
if an orange and an electron could
be magnified until the orange was
as large as the world, the electron
would still be invisible.

ASK YOUR OWN COUNTY, AGENT

VIEAR81 
COU1111 katli 

*ROE US:

"This tool (the telephone) enables a
farmer to keep himself posted as to price trends,
and rather frequently, if he is community-minded,
to exchange ideas and experiences with neigh-

boring farmers.

1110 , a.

ii iII$ HMO

•

"Personally, I wish every farm in the county had

a telephone that could be used at any time.;

r. Ask your own county agent what he thinks of
the telephone as a farm tool. Then ask the nearest
telephone office to install a telephone in your home.

The Chesapeake and Potomac Telephone Company of Baltimore City
. WM. B. HOPKINS, Manager

Taneytown 9900 E. Baltimore Street Taneytown, Maryland
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"THE USA PICKS CHEVROLET"
for Styling -for Road Action with Economy-for tow Price
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VENTILATION

ONLY CHEVROLET

HAS All rag 
QUALITY FEATURES

It's the only low-priced car with a 90-
h.p. Valve-in-Head "Victory" Engine . . . the only

low-priced car with exclusive Body by Fisher and all the
other features listed here. . . . It out-styles, out-accelerates
and OUT-VALUES all other biggest-selling low-priced cars!

The U.S.A. has given its verdict on motor

cars . . . given it unmistakably by awarding

Chevrolet sales leadership over all other

makes of cars for nine of the last ten years . . .

and now the U.S.A. is giving this same verdict

again by showing clear-cut preference for the

new Chevrolet for '41!

"The U.S.A. picks Chevrolet!" And, if you'll

make your own eye it-try it-buy it test of the new Chevrolet for '41,

we're convinced that you'll pick Chevrolet, too. And get the nation's

No. 1 car-value as a result! Please see your nearest Chevrolet

dealer-today!

OHLER'S CHEVROLET SALES
Taneytown, Maryland

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned will sell at public

sale on his premises, along the Tan-
eytown-Keysville road, on

TUESDAY, MARCH 4, 1941,
at 12 o'clock, the following livestock
and farming implements:
6 HEAD HORSES AND MULES,

pair dark brown mules, coming 4 yrs
old, both mare mules, broke and quite

in the stable. Bay mare, 8
years old, good in saddle,
weigh around 1600 lbs.;

one black horse, 7years old, all-
around worker; weigh 1400; black
horse, 5 yeiars old, offside worker,
weigh 1400: black mare, 14 years old,
good plow and harrow leader, weigh
1400 tbs.

12 HEAD OF CATTLE,
Holstein cow, will be fresh last of
March; Guernsey cow, will be fresh
first of April; Holstein cow,
will be fresh in May; Hol-
stein cow, will be fresa
in the Fall; Guernsey cow, will be
fresh in September; Holstein cow,calf
just sold off; Holstein heifer, was just
fresh; Jersey heifer, will be fresh by
day of sale; heifer, half Guernsey and
Ayreshire, will be fresh in May; stock
bull, Holstein, good and quite, weigh
1100 lbs. These cattle are all T. B.
tested.

10 HEAD SHOATS,
weigh about 75 lbs.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.
Deering binder, 8-ft. cut, in good

condition and 'first-class canvass; 4-
hor5e Shettler wagon, 4-in. tread;
4-ton wagon, with two sets of rubbers;
2-horse Acme wagon and bed; E. B.
manure spreader, in good shape; side-
delivery rake and tedder in first-class
shape; Case hay loader, used one
year; McCormirk-Deering mower,
with 2 knives in good shape; 2 walk-
ing barshear plows, New Way corn
planter, with hiller and chains; one
steel roller, one 3-section lever
harrow, good: two riding corn plows,
good; one 8-hoe grain drill, Super-
ior; iron wheel wagon, with hay car-
riage; hay fork, 125-ft. rope and pul-
leys; corn sheller, dung sleigh; large
land drag, 2 clover seed sowers.

HARNESS.
5 sets front gears, 2 sets new front

gears, 5 collars, 5 bridles, 5 halters,
pair binder check lines, 4-horse line,
lead rein, single, double and triple
trees, jockey straps, breast chains.

HOUSEHOLD GOODS,
6-ft. extension table, 2 dressers, buffet
2 old-time beds, 2 porch rockers, 3-=
piece parlor suite, leather Davenport,
2 lge leather rocking chairs, ice box,
coal stove, two 21-in, drum oil brood-
er stove, used two months; 2 milk
buckets, striainer, two 5-gal and two
7-gal. Maryland type milk cans, and
other items too numerous to mention.
TERMS-Sums of $10.00 and under.

cash. On sums above $10.00 a credit of C
months will be given on notes with ap-
proved security, bearing interest from day
of sale. No goods to be removed until
settled for.

CHAS. A. OHLER.
HARRY TROUT, Auct.
CARL HAINES, Clerk. 2-14-3t

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned, having rented his

farm, will sell at public sale on his
farm near the hard road, leading from
Littlestown to Harney, near St. James
Church, on
WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 1941
at 12 o'clock, noon, the following per-
sonal property:
6 HEAD GOOD HORSES & MULES,

all will work wherever hitched.
12 EXTRA GOOD MILCH COWS,
6 will be fresh by time of sale; 2 stock
bulls.

12 HEAP OF HOGS,
10 head shoats, 2 brood sows, will
have pigs by time of sale.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.
4-horse wagon and bed, good as

new; light 2-horse wagon, 3 low-down
wagons, 2 hay carriages, 8-ft. McCor-
mick-Deering grain binder, good as
new; McCormick corn binder, 2 grass
mowers, pea guards and rower; 10-
hoe McCormick-Deering grain drill,
good as new; manure spreader, Syra-
cuse plows, John-Deere double row
corn planter, 4 double corn workers,
some good as new; 2 good 17-tooth
spring harrows, peg harrow, double
disc harrow, land roller, spring wagon,
sleigh, 2 sleds, clover seed sower, hay
fork, corn sheller, grindstone, wind
mill, 6-ft. McCormick binder, for
parts.

HARNESS.
6 sets work harness, bridles, collars,

lines, halters, single,double and triple
trees, jockey sticks, forks, log, breast
and other chains, platform scales,
horse clippers, milk cans, strainer.

HOUSEHOLD GOODS,
Red Cross Victor range, 4-burner New
Perfection oil stove, oil heater, Alad-
din lamp, extension table, 2 rugs,
CHICKENS by the piece; WILLY'S
AUTOMOBILE SEDAN, and a lot of
other articles too numerous to men-
tion.
TERMS-Livestock and farming

implements will be taken care of for
30 days, if purchaser not being able
to move same. Sale to begin at 12
o'clock, noon. Credit will be given
and a liberal discount for cash.
2-14-2t HARRY MYERS.

(
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The Poor Cave Man
Had No Newspaper
To Advertise In.
But You Have!!

I MEDFORD PRICES 
STORE HOURS 7 A. M. to 5 P. M.

7 lbs Buckwheat Meal 25e
XXXX Sugar
7 lbs Raisins
Lard, pound
Bring your

auto trucks or
for us to sell

25e
6c

farm machinery,
furniture any day
at our Community

Sale on Saturday, Feb. 22,
Gasoline gal 71/2c

Meat Scraps ̀ bag $1.65
Chick Oatmeal, bag
Hog and Pig Meal, bag

$2.45
$1 85

Horse Feed, bag $1.75
Horse Feed Supplement bag $3.10
Crimped Oats, bag $1.85
Mids $1.30 bag
Dried Skim Milk, bag $6.50
Bran $1.50

Midds, bag $1.30
16% Dairy Feed, bag
32% Dairy Feed, bag
Molasses Feed, bag

$1.40
$1.85
$1.25

Cottonseed Meal, bag $1.85
Linseed Meal, bag
Hominy Chop, bag
Peanut Meal, bag
Soy Bean Meal, bag
Brewers Grains
Distillers Grain, bag
Steer Supplement, bag
Barley Chops, bag

Oats Hops, bag
Corn Feed Meal, bag

$1.'i 5
$1.75
$1.75
$1.95

$1.70 bag
$1.55
$2.45
$1.60

$1.60
$1.70

Gluten Feed, Bag $1.75
Laying Mash, bag $1.20

Growing Mash, bag $2.25

Broiler Mash, bag $2.45

Fattening Mash, bag $2.15

Starter Mash, bag $2.25
WE BUY BEEF HIDES

7 Rolls Toilet Paper for 25c

20 lb 13-ox Macaroni for 890

3 Cans Shredded Cocoanut 25c

7 lbs. Epsom Salts 25c
1-ply Roofing, roll 75c
2-ply Roofing, roll 98c
3-ply Roofing, roll $1.11

Metal Hog Feeders1$12.50
Peanut Metal, bag
Alfalfa Seed
Red Clover Seed
Lawn Grass Seed
Orchard Grass

$1.75
19c /b
9c lb
12e lb
28c lb

Kentucky Blue Grass 25c lb

Red Top Herd Grass Seed 15c lb

Sudan Grass Seed 6c lb
Permanent Pasture Seed 19c lb
Sweet Clover
Lespedeza Seed
Alsike Seed
Timothy Seed
Peas
Bush Beans
Bush Lima Beans
Pale Lima Beans
Carload Onion Sets

61/2c lb
7c lb
16c lb

$2.39 bu
12c lb
11c lb
12c lb
15c lb

coming
$1.69 bu

Stock Molasses Exchange Drums
$15.39 ton

Stock Molasses in wood barrels
$13.81 ton

Baled Hay, tons $14.00
Oyster Shell 59c bag

2 CARS CERTIFIED SEED PO-

TATOES COMING FOR
SPRING IN 10 PECK BAGS
Cobblers
Green Mountains
Early Rose
liatahdins
Chippewas
Bliss
No.2 Cobblers

$2.50 bag
$2.60 bag
$2.60 bag
$2.60 'bag
$2.60 bag
$2.95 bag
$2.40 bag

BABY CHICKS POST PAID

FROM HATCHERY TO YOU

100% Live Delivery Guaranteed

Mixed Heavy Breeds $7 per 100

Barred Rocks $8.00 per 100

Buffed Rocks $8.00 per 100

Rhode Island Reds $8.00 per 100

White Rocks $8.00 per 100

Cockerels $8.00 per 100

We carry them here

At Store $1.00 per 100 higher

150 Ft.. Rolls Poultry Netting

1-ft wide 98c roll

l'1/2-ft. wide $1.20 roll

2-ft. wide $1.50 roll

3-ft wide $t.:.20roll

4-ft wide $2.69 roll

5-ft. wide $3.39 roll

6-ft wide $3.98 roll

Seed Corn $1.95 bu

Peat Moss $1.65 bag

2 Cars Maine Grown Seed Pota-

toes coming in 10 Perk Bags

Cobblers $2.50 bag

Green Mountains $2.70 bag

Early Rose $2.70 bag

Katahdins $2.70 bag
Chippewas $2.70 bag

Bliss $2.95 bag

The Medford Grocery Co.
J. DAVID BAILE, President

Medford, Maryland
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CORRESPONDENCE 
Latest Items ef Local News Furnished
By Our Regular Staff of Writers
We desire correspondence to reach our

office on Thursday, if at all possible. It
will be necessary therefore, for most let-
ters to be mailed on Wednesd, y, or by
Fast Mail, west on W. M. R. It., Thurs-
day morning. Letters mailed on Thurs-
day evening may not reach us in time.
All communications for this department

must be signed by the author; not for
publication, but as an evidence that the
items contributed are legitimate and cor-
rect. Items based on mere rumor, or such
as Sr. likely to give offense, are not want-
ed.

FEESERSBURG.

and Margaret Smith, deceased, died
at the home of her niece, Mrs. Brooke
Heltibridle, on Log Cabin Branch—
the former Jasper Garner place. She
had been in failing health for some
time, suffered a heavy attack of
pneumonia, and passed away on Sat-
urday morning. Service was held
at the home on Tuesday afternoon
with burial in the Lutheran cemetery
at Uniontown. Two sisters, Mrs.
John Graham, living with her daugh-
ter, Mrs. Heltibridle, and Mrs. Ellie
Shaw, of Uniontown remain.

Wilbur Miller, Jr, looking hand-
some in a new military uniform, was
home for the week-end. We fear in
this we are on the mountain top of
anticipation before we descend to the
valley of realization.
On Thursday of last week, Mrs.

Addie Crumbacker and "yours truly"
called to see Dr. Huot, in Taneytown
where' she had a painful tooth remov-

ed, and we had some repair work
done; but the drive between the snow

covered landscape was lovely: Two

new houses one for F. G. Harbaugh
in Middleburg, and another for Chas
Mehring, near Keymar, are in build-

ing, and we saw the piers set for the
new bridge at Bruceville on the way.
Mrs J H. Stale received a fine lit-

tle basket of tropical fruit from .her Whalen, officiated.
friend, Mrs. Blandey, of Rockville,  lts 
who with Rockward Nusbaum, Jr., p. NCHESTER.
toured Florida the past month.
,On Sunday the Bucher John fam- A number of folks from the local

fly enjoyed a turkey dinner at the Fire Company Auxiliary attended the
Geiman home in Westminster, a. feast organization of a Ladies' Auxiliary
in honor of two near birthdays in the at Pleasant Hill, on Fritlay evening.
family. The fowl weighed 30 lb.•. Mrs. Allen Lippy is a patient at
when dressed, and at the table our Union Memorial Hospital.
friend asked for a drumstick—and Mr. Urban Lippy has received word
one was more than enough. i from his son Earl, who is a baritone
Mr. and Mrs. C. S. Gardner, Blue soloist in Radio City to the effect

Ridge Summit, Miss Sarah Crabb.s, of that he is engaged to be married.
Union Bridge; Mr. and .Mrs. Wilbur Another son. Gilmore Lippy, a Lieu-
Delphey; Mrs. Frank Miller, Middle- tenant will leave Arlington, Va., for
burg. and Miss Emma Ecker, of New Texas in the near future.
Windsor, and Mrs. C. S. Wolfe and Mr. William H. Strevig will sell
Mrs. Addie Crumbacker, of Fees.ers- household good at public sale on Sat-
burg, were visitors at the Birely
home the 'first day of this week. 

urrlay%
Ray Earl. son of 'Mr. and Mrs. John

E. B. John has more than 50 baby L. Dubs, Millers, Md.. R. D., was ban-
lambs, and on Friday had about 30 tized at the Reformed parsonage, this
of them "docked" which seems rather
cruel, but for some reason it is con-
sidered necessary.

This week the Boy Scouts of Amer-
ica are celebrating their 31st. anni-
versary with big parades, mucit music
and brave speeches—now to practice
what they preach. Their motto is
service and we like the idea of doing
a kindness for some one each day.

The most powerful airplane engine
manufactured today has slightly
more than 2,000 horsepower.
 11 

LITTLESTOWN. UNIONTOWN.

Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Simpson,
daughter, Jeannette, York; Mr. and
Mrs. Russell Martin and sons, Ill-
chester, Md., were Sunday visitors of
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Simpson.
Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Lefevre, re-

cently returned missionaries from
India were vsitors on Saturday of
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Kaetzel and
G. Fielder Gilbert.
Mrs. William Caylor spent several

days this week in Baltimore.
Mr. and Mrs. William Slonaker

and Miss Oneida Sloneker, Waynes-
boro, visited G. W. Slonaker, on Sun-
day. Mr. and Mrs. George Bender,
Gettysburg, on Monday.
Some of our citizens attended the

faculty play, "January 16th," which
was given at New Windsor High
School on Friday night.
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Myers and son

Baltimore, visited the former's fath-
er, C. Edgar Myers, on Sunday.
The sick of the town are slowly

improving.
Mrs. Mary Starner and Mrs.

Amanda Baer, Taneytown, called on
Mrs. Alfred Zollickoffer, on Monday
afternoon.
Mrs. M. Collins, Littlestown, visit-

ed her cousin, Mrs. Roy Haines, on
Saturday.
The Ladies' Aid Suciety, of Pipe

Creek Church met at the home of Mrs
W. P. Englar on Wednesday and
had an all day's quilting.
Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Myers visited

the former's aunt, Mrs. Carrie Maus
at the Hanover General Hospital, on
Monday. Mrs. Maus had an appen-
dectomy there on Monday evening.
Mr. and Mrs. Edward Best who

have spent some time in the Sega-
foose family returned to their home
at Allentown, Pa., on Friday.
Eugene Otto, Chevy Chase, D. C.,

called on friends in town on Sunday.
Mrs. LaRue Schaffer and son, Ver-

non, Jr., Mr. Harry Wilson, Union-
town; Mr. and Mrs. Paul Wills, Win-
field, spent Sunday in Baltimore, and
visited at the home of Mr. and Mrs.
Markolf.
Mrs. John Heltibridle, Mr. and Mrs

ligious Leader in America, formally Alva Heltibridle, visited Mrs. Thyra
who's who in clergy. This book is a
biographical encyclopedia of eminent
clergymen representing the import-
ant denominations of America.
The Rev. John C. Brumbach, pas-

tor of Christ Church, was the guest
speaker at the meeting of the Broth-
erhood Bible Class of St. Paul Church
He spoke on co-operation. A male
octet composed of eight men sang
several selections. The Rev. Kenneth
D. James was the guest speaker of
the Rotary Club, he spoke on Amer-
icas responsibility in a world of dis-
tress.

Mrs. Walter Whaler, has returned
to her home in Johnstown, after
spending several weeks at the home
of her father. She was called due
to illness and death of her mother.
Mrs. Anna K. Adams, Lombard St,

wife of Jacob S. Adams, died at her
home, Wednesday evening. Death
followed an illness of one week. She
was aged 74 years. She and Mr.
Adams observed their 57th. wedding
anniversary a few weeks ago. She
was affiliated with Pride Lodge Mn  60

The Ladies Auxiliary of the John
W. Ocker Post American Legion met
Wednesday evening in the post home.
The hostesses were Miss Edna Bloch-
er, Mrs. Harry Harner and Mrs. Win.
Yingling.
Mr. and Mrs. Reginald Pfeffer and

daughter, Washington, spent the week
end at the home of Mr. and Mrs. John
Pfeffer. Mr. John Pfeffer who has
been sick for some months is about
the same.
Mrs. Walter Yingling, near town,

entertained the members of the Tuck-
a-bache Sunday School class of St.
John Lutheran Church, taught by
Mrs. William Lippy, at her home.
The Women's Society of Christian

Service of the M. E. Church held an
orange social on Friday evening in
the Sunday School room.. There was
a large crowd present.
The Youth Council Association held

a valentine party Wednesday evening
in the Mt. Joy Lutheran Church, with
the young people of the church as
hosts.
Mrs. Thomas Dayhoff R. D. 1 was

removed from her home to the Han-
over General Hospital, in the Hanover
Fire Company ambulance, Monday.

Mrs. William Strawsburg, East
King St, was taken in the Hanover
ambulance from her home to the Han-
over General Hospital, Friday evening
The Rev. Eugene S. Keller, R. D.,

who underwent an operation at the
Hanover General Hospital last Tues-
day is reported to be improving nicely

District Attorney J. Francis Yake,
Jr., of Adams County was the guest
speaker at a meeting of the Lion's
Club. He spoke on Juvenile Courts.
Misses Anna Renner and Bernice
Bowers sang several selections. Miss
Ruthanna Bowers played the piano.
The Club accepted the invitation of
the Woman Community Club to be
its guests at the patriotic meeting
February 19 when Judge W. C. Shee-
ly, will be the guest speaker.
An article on the life of the Rev..

Theodore J. Schneider, pastor of the
'Redeemer Reformed Church, will
appear in the 1941 edition of the re-

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Yeagley, Hagers-
town, with Mr. and Mrs. G. B. John,
spent the first part of last week in
Western, Virginia, stopping at the
Roanoke Hotel, where a meeting of
about 150 wool growers was held—
Mr. John being one of the Directors of
the Associaton. On Monday they vis-
ited his aunt, Miss Annie John in the
city of Roanoke. They returned on
Tuesday evening reaching home short-
ly after midnight, and report a very
interesting meeting, and a delightful
trip.

Mrs. C. S. Wolfe accompanied Mrs.
Maurice Late to Baltimore last Thurs-
day and Saturday to see an occulist
because her vision has become im-
paired, who did not promise new eyes
—but relief.
On Wednesday evening of last week

through the courtesy of H. B. Fogle,
Miss Sue Birely and her sister took
dinner with the Baughman-Fogle's in
Uniontown and had an opportunity to
offer congratulations to the bride and
groom, Mr. and Mrs. Howard West,
and view their wonderful array of
wedding gifts—much too numerous
to mention, and too beautiful for de-
scription. Soon they will move into
a new house in Baltimore, and enjoy
finding a place for everything.
We have had the privilege of see-

ing and reading the Book of Remem-
brance presented to Mrs. L. U. Mess-
ier in the Linwood Church at Christ-
mas time, and certainly admired the
thoughtfulness of the ones who made
is possible, for it is indeed 0. lovely
gift of appreciation from her pupils
in private school and Sunday School
—flowers of love while she can enjoy
them. We congratulate Mrs. Messier
and her loyal learners.
The Ladies' Bible Class of the

Methodist Church in Middleburg are
planning an apron social for the near
future—date not fixed yet. A tiny
apron is presented, and a rhyme tells
you to "Measure your waist line inch
by inch and see that the measure
does not pinch," then drop a penny
for every inch into the pocket, soon
they will have scores of raised dough-
nuts for sale and they are always
palatable.
Mrs. Clara Wolfe has spent some

time the past' week with her sister,
Mrs. Dallas Blacksten, who is ,

Ladies Society of the Brotherhood of
ally ill. The hard part is that when Locomotive Firemen and Enginernan,
one sees their loved ones suffer.— Harrisburg. Her husband is a retir-
there is so little one can do to give ed engineer. Surviving are her hus-
relief, band and five children. The funeral

Mrs. Roger Roop (nee Olive Main) was held Saturday morning in St.
was taken to the Md. General Hos- Alovsius Church with the Rev. Joseph
pital on Sunday for .examination and N. Whaler, Rector as celebrant. In-
treatment of some internal trouble terment in the church cemetery.
which was causing much distress re- On Thursday the Draft Board sent
cently. three of our young men to duty.

Miss Ida Smith, daughter of Peter Joseph Redding, Robert Long and
Walter Bemiller.
There was a large turn out at the

birthday party held Thursday evening
by the Christian Endeavor Society of
St. John's Church. The party which
was in celebration of the 60th anni-
versary of the founding of the organ-
ization.
The Borough Tax Duplicate for

1941. Totals $901,245 of this amount
$7.93.895 is for real estate and $107,-
260 for occupation.
The mountain cabin of W. R. Jones

was entered and about $40 worth of
goods stOlen includng a radio.

Another large shipment of wearing
apparel for Europe was sent by the
Adams County Red Cross.
The population of Adams county

was increased by 2,307 in ten years by
figures given by the census bureau.

Mrs. Sarah C. Myers. widow of
Jones Myers, Union Mills, died at
the Woman Hospital, Baltimore, on
Tuesday evening. She had been a pa-
tient for three weeks. Surviving ere
five children, four step-children and
five brothers. Funeral service was
held Friday morning in St. Aloysius
Church. The various soeiet's of the
church met Wednesday evening to say
prayers. Burial was made in the Un-
ion cemetery, Silver ltun. Rev. Jos.

The maximum age limit for British
pilots has been raised from 28 to 31
years.

place, by their pastor Rev. Dr. John
S. Hollenbach, on Wednesday evening
of last week.
Rev. R. E. Carl, Greenmount, J.

Vernon Gill and grandson. William. of
Westminster road, and Mrs. Carlton
Jones, of near Manchester, were re-
cent callers at the Reformed parson-
age. Manchester.
Of course you are coming to wit-

ness the play "The Gift," to be pre-
aented in Trinity Reformed Church,
Manchester, Sunday, Feb. 23, at 7:30.
This will be given by a group of the
young people of the Sunday School
and Church. sponsored by the C. E.
with Miss Katherine Leidy. a mem-
ber of the High School faculty direct-
ing the play.

Welty, at Catonsville, on Sunday.
The Women's Missionary Society

of St. Paul's Lutheran Church met at
the home of Mrs. Harry Wilson, on
Thursday. Mrs. Bowersox was the
leader. During the business meeting
it was decided to hold a St. Patrick's
bake sale, March 15.
Union Bridge Homemakers' met at

the home of Mrs. Lewis Stauffer, of
Union Bridge. Those that attended
from here were Mrs. Harry Hagar,
Mrs. Cookson, Mrs. Harold Smelser,
Mrs. Clarence Lockard and Mrs.
Harry Haines.
Miss Doris and Mrs. Harry Haines

spent Saturday in Baltimore.
 Zr
CLEAR DALE.

Mrs. Franklin H. Stair, of near
Taneytown, formerly of this place,
who had been seriously ill is reported
to be somewhat improved.

Mr. and Mrs. Oliver Hesson and
granddaughter, Miss Margaret Myers
spent Wednesday at the home of Mr.
and Mrs. Milton J. Study, of Northern
Carroll. Mrs. Hesson and grand-
daughter, also visited Mrs. Sterling
Bachman of that place.
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Lemmon and

daughter, Susie and son, Merle, of
Littlestown,spent Sunday at the home
of the former's parents, Mr. and Mrs.

'William Lemmon.
I Mr. and Mrs. Lester Myers and
' daughters, Helen, Ruth and Margaret
and son Jimmie, were dinner guests
on Sunday at the home of •Mr. and
Mrs. Claude W. Olinger, Littlestown.
Mr. and Mrs. Oliver Hesson and

grand-daughter, Miss Margaret My-
ers, were recent visitors at the home
of Mr. and Mrs. William M. Lemmon
of Ulrichtown.

Mrs. Emma James, of Littlestown,
formerly of this place, who slipped on
the icy pavement and injured her
right arm is reported as getting along
nicely.
Wilbur Lemmon who has been re-

siding at the home of his sister and
brother-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Wilbur
Carr, of Westminster, spent last week
at the home of his parents, Mr. and

, Mrs. William M. Lemmon. Mr. Lem-
non who had been employed at Camp
Meade has again resumed work at
that place.
Mr. and Mrs. Oliver Hesson and

granddaughter, Miss Margaret Myers
were Thursday afternoon visitors at
the home of Mr. and Mrs. William
Shadle, of Ulrichtown.
Mrs. Wilbur Carr and son, Kenneth

and Larry, Miss Betty Dehoff and
Eugene Weaver, of Westminster,
spent Sunday evening with the form-
er's parents, Mr. and Mrs. William
M. Lemmon.
Mr. and Mrs. Albert E. Heiser were

recent vsitors at the home of Mrs.
Heiser's sister, Mrs. Emma Myers, of
Littlestown.

-- —11- --

NEW WINDSOR.

Miss Wilma Stein teacher of the
Business Department of the New
Windsor High School spent this week
end at her home in Washington, D. C
Mrs. E. Pendleton and Mrs. George

Redifer, of Catonsville, Md., visited
Mr's. H. B. Getty on Tuesday.
The little daughter of Mr. and Mrs.

Edward Williard who was critically
ill with pneumonia last week, is very
much improved.
Funeral services for Mrs. Mary

Catharine Frounfelter, widow of the
late William Frounfelter. were held
on Tuesday morning at the Hartzler
Funeral Home, Rev. George Bower-
sox, officiating. Interment in the
family lot at Winter's cemetery.

Miss Ruth Ann Nusbaum was giv-
en a miscellaneous shower on Thurs-
day evening in honor of her ap-
proaching marrage on Saturday, Feb
15. in Washington, D. C.

Rev. Ledford, Dr. Bixler and Mr.
Daniel Engler all attended a lecture
at Western Maryland College on
Thursday.

Mr. Lee King, Keymar, has com-
pleted a course in Practical and,
Theoretical Radio and Television and
has been awarded a diploma by the
National Radio Institute, Wash ing-

I ton, D. C.

JUDGE FORSYTHE NAMED
JUDGE.

(Continued from First Page.)

are outweighed by opposing consid-
erations, the appointment of Judge
Forsythe would he in the public in-
terest."

Referring to Mr. Clark, the com-
mittee said:
"In the judgment of the committee,

after consideration of other possibil-
ities, Mr. Clark, is, in character,
ability and experience, well-qualified
to be a member of the Court of Ap-
peals, and is generally so regarded
within his Circuit and outside his
circuit."
I agree with the recommendations

of the committee, and after weighing
all considerations, I feel that the
circumstances not only justify but
require the elevation of Judge For-
sythe. I discussed frankly with Mr.
Clark my views of the matter and he
agrees with me in the decision.
In addition, the Bar Association of

Anne Arundel County reiterated its
endorsement of Judge Forsythe and
added that if he were not to be ap-
pointed, the members of the local Bar
recommended Judge Ridgely P. Mel-
vin. While I, too, have the greatest
respect for Judge Melvin's abilities,
I understand that he prefers that
Judge Forsythe receive the appoint-
ment.
The people of Maryland have the

satisfaction of knowing that from
Judge Forsythe, they will receive on
the Court of Appeals, the same in-
telligent, painstaking and high-mind-
ed Judicial service as have charac-
terized his work over three decades.
His ripened judgment and lengthy
experience are most valuable assets,
and the fact that all the Bar Asso-
ciations unite in endorsing him
speaks volumes to his credit.

In filling the vacancy, I cannot re-
sist the urge to voice, publicly, in the
name of the people of Maryland,deep
appreciation of the most valuable
Judicial service rendered by former
Judge Parke. It is difficult to over-
estimate the benefits accruing from
his work on the Court of Appeals and
in his Circuit. Everyone familiar
with it agrees that it has been sec-
ond to none in our generation.

I think it fortunate that the atten-
tion of the general public has been
focused upon Judicial appointments.
No selections by a Governor are more
important than those to the Judicial
service, and it is reassuring to have
the Bar manifest such an interest by
putting into effect an arrangement
whereby advice and counsel may be
supplied prior to such appointments.
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FEEDING FOR FITNESS.

Speaking of the importance of
"feeding for fitness" as a part of the
defense 'program, DT. R. H. Riley, Di-
rector of the State Department of
Health said "we are slowly waking up
to the fact that the intelligent selec-
tion and use of the kinds of food nec-
essary to maintain health and to keep
our physical machinery in the best
possible condition, are of more im-
portance to each of ,us, than merely
eating food that is chosen without re-
gard to its nutritive qualities.
"In a comparative study made some

time ago of the health of school chil-
dren in two widely separated districts
—one in an agricultural community
and the other in an industrial one—a
large percentage of the children from
the farming sections were found to
show marked signs of malnutrition,
while those from the industrial area
were in much better shape physically.
"Although milk, other dairy pro-

ducts, fruits and fresh vegetables—all
of which are essential for a well bal-
anced diet—were really available in
the farming sections, the children had
been allowed to indulge their prefer-
ence for less familiar and less nour-
ishing foods, with the result already
mentioned.
"Certain factors that affect nutri-

tion—and not all of them apply to
ford—must be given due considera-
tion in 'feeding for fitness.' A six
point program as outlined by the
nutritionist of the State Department
of Health stresses the following:
"First, the diet must be adequate.

That is it must include a generous
supply of the protective foods—milk,
fruit, vegetables, eggs, whole grain
breads and cereals.
"Second, enough sleep and rest are

necessary—without them true fitness
is impossible.
"Third, there must be freedom

from physical defects, such as decay-
ed teeth or diseased tonsils, to insure
the best utilization of food.
"Fourth, correct elimination is es-

sential in the utilization of food.
"Fifth, exercise and fresh air are

necessary to help to stimuate the ap-
petite.
"Sixth, good posture is included

because it gives the digestive organs
room to function well."

SINKING THE MAINE.
(An Old Story).

Twinkling lights flashed fitfully ov-
er the waters of Havana Harbor
where the U. S. S. Maine lay peace-
fully at anchor on the night of Feb.
15, 1898.
Over the quiet reaches of the harb-

or came the musical notes of "Taps,"
destined never again to be sounded by
the young marine who was perform-
ing one of his last official duties for
the day.

Suddenly a terrific explosion all but
distintegr tted the vessel. Death.
agony, ho.—or flames, smoke, gas and
water too.< theft toll as the biward
part of the ship catapulted upward in
a searing flame. More than 250 men
lost their lives.

In the moments that followed, dis-
cipline was superb. Every able-
bodied member of the crew did his
part in rescuing those not fatally in-
jured, even though threatening flames
and minor explosions still harassed
the warship.

Private William Anthony, of the
Marine Detachment, at the time of
'the explosion was the orderly of
Captain Charles D. Sigsbee, who was
in his cabin. The lights were instant-
ly obscured and the compartment 'fill-
ed with smoke. There was immedi-
ate and intense darkness.

Although he knew that the ship

was about to sink, Anthony groped
his way through the darkened pass
age of the doomed vessel to find his
captain. Instinct urged him to seek
his own safety. The call to duty
proved stronger.
Eventually he stumbled into Cap-

tain Sigsbee in the darkness and said
"Sir, I have to report that the ship
has been blown up and is sinking."
He remained at the captain's side un-
til the ship was abandoned.
Small wonder that Captain Sigsbee

wrote later that Anthony's action
was a noble one that he considered an
honor to call to the attention of the
Navy Department.—U. S. Marine
Corps.

BELGIANS STARVING.

Former Presi,dent Hoover will
broadcast Sunday evening, Feb. 16th,
from Chicago. Former President
Hoover, who with the aid of the
Quakers, directed the feeding of 10
million people during and after the
last World War, is studying the ap-
palling conditions in Europe caused
by the present World War. On Jan.
9th., he sent a commission of experts
into" Belgium to get facts. They
found the allowance of food per per-
son to be about one-half the ration
issued in England and Germany.
"Major food supplies to maintain any
Belgium ration will be non-existent in
a month. This means literal starva-
tion—unless supplies are 'brought
from somewhere" says this coinmis-
sion experts on large scale famine
relief.
Due to rationing, caused by acute

shortage of the necessities of life,
conditions among Netherland's 8,600,-
000 inhabitants, Norway's 2,900,000,
Central Poland's 14,000,000, and Fin-
land's 3,700,000 add to the serious-
ness of the situation.

Is America who gave her sons to
die for these same Belgians in the
last war going to stand silently by
and not raise her voice in behalf of
these innocent starving people being
allowed to feed themselves by spend-
ing their own money that is here in
the United States and carry the food
in their own ships that are tied in
our docks?
Former President Hoover is broad-

casting a message for the American
people this coming Sunday night, Feb
16, at 10:30 E. E. T. from Chicago
over the Columbia network. A mes-
sage every American who is interest-
ed in his fellow-man should hear.
Let this broadcast be announced from
every pulpit Sunday morning.

Local committee, Rev. John J. John,
Rev. W. A. Ledford, Mrs. Clara C.
Cooper, Dr. and Mrs. E. C. Bixler, all
of New Windsor; Rev. Frank Williar,
Mt. Airy.
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Smartest Trick of
Whole Sino-Jap War

Four Flyers Land on Enemy

Field and Clean lip.

PEKING, CHINA.—The command-
er of a Japanese naval base in cen-
tral China reports the neatest trick
of the whole Sino-Japanese war per-
formed by four of his fliers.
They landed their planes on the

Chinese airfield at Chengtu in
Szechuan province in the course of
an air attack.
"On the airfield reverberating with

the rat-a-tat of machine guns and
rifle fire, the four airmen sprang
from their machines, firing pistols in
their right hands and tightly grip-
ping a box of matches in the other.
"Like rabbits they ran here and

there, putting fire to still intact
Chinese planes amid a rain of
enemy bullets.
"With flames suddenly enveloping

the machines, one pilot rushed to
the enemy headquarters. Unseen
by the enemy, he brought cans of
gasoline and set the headquarters
on fire."
Thus reads the Japanese report,

undenied by Chinese sources.
"Their work completed," continues
the report, "the four pilots sped to
their planes and took to the air
through the black smoke coverir.g
the field."
These deeds reportedly were car-

ried out after a Japanese bomber
had dropped its load and the fighter
planes had downed Chinese Tlanes
which had gone up to combat them.

Juke Eox Enthusiast
Makes Fatal Mistake

MEXICO CITY.—A nickel in the
slot which brought forth the swing
tune "Woodpecker Song" from a
cantina "juke box" also brought
death for Jesus Valenzuela.
Patrolman Uriel Prado had a par-

ticular aversion to the "Woodpecker
Song" and when lie heard it in the
barroom he demanded to know who
had made the selection.
The bartender pointed to Valen-

zuela. Prado pointed to Valenzuela
with a gun. Valenzuela died a few
minutes later. Prado was held for
murder.

Odd Collection
A Los Angeles man has a collec-

tion of more than 100,000 railroad,
bus and streetcar tickets.

Olive-Tree Agarie
The olive-tree agaric, a mushroom

common in Provence, gives off a
phosphorescent light.

Visitors Increase
Visitors to Crater Lake National

park, in Oregon, increased 28 per
cent in 1938.

Pupils Are Kin
The only pupils of the school at

Alba. Calif.. are the teacher's four
children.

MARRIED

BOWERS—ROOP.
Mr. Robert Bowers, son of Mr. and

Mrs. Geary Bowers, and Miss Audrey
Roop, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Earl
Roop, both of near Taneytown, were
united in marriage on Wednesday
evening, February 12th., 1941, at
6:30 P. M., in Trinity Lutheran
Church, Taneytown, by Rev. Alfred
T. Sutcliffe. The attendants were:
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Feeser, of town.
Immediately after the ceremony,

the couple left for a Hanover studio
to have pictures taken and then re-
turned to the home of the bride's par-
ents where a reception was held in
their honor. There were about fifty
guests present.
The bride and groom are em-

ployed at the Rubber Factory. At
present, they are living at the home
of the bride, but will move into a new
home along the Taneytown-Littles-
town road, as soon as completed. The
many friends of both wish them a
long, happy and prosperous life.

KEEPERS—SANDERS.
Miss Rita 1Sanders, daughter of

Mr. and Mrs. James C. Sanders, Tan-
eytown, and Louis A. Keepers, son of
Mr. and Mrs. Charles A. Keepers, of
Emmitsburg, Md., were united in
marriage on Saturday morning, Feb.
8, at 8 o'clock, at a nuptial mass in
St. Joseph's Catholic Church, Taney-
town, by the bride's pastor, the Rev.
Arthur Murphy.

Miss Theresa Keepers, sister of
the groom, was bridesmaid. The
groom had as his bestman William
Sanders, brother of the bride. The
bride's dress was of dusty rose with
matching accessories. The bridesmaid
wore a teal blue dress with hat to
match. Both the bride and her at-
tendant wcre corsages of rosebuds
;Ind baby's breath. Breakfast was
served to the bridal party and guests
at the home of the bride's parents,
near Taneytown.

DIED.
obituaric", poctr3 and resolutienceharig-

ed for at the rate of live cents per Una.
The regular death notices published tree.

REV. U. S. G. RUPP, D. D.
Rev. U. S. G. Rupp, D. D., for twen-

ty years pastor of the Lutheran
Church, of Frederick, until his retire-
ment in 1930 died in a Baltimore
private sanitarium last Saturday
night. He had been a patient for the
last six weeks, suffering with arthri-
tis and heart trouble. He was 75
years of age. In 1930 he retired
from the active ministry on account
of ill health. He was widely known
in Maryland, where he spent nearly
45 years of his ministry, his other
pastorate being the Lutheran Church
of the Reformation in Baltimore. He
had some good friends in this com-
munity.
Funeral services were held in the

Church of the Reformation, Balti-
more, on Monday evening, and short
service at Annville, Pa., his ancestral
home, where interment took place on
Tuesday morning. Dr. Rupp return-
ed to Baltimore when he retired from
the pastorate at Frederick, and lived
there since that time. The service
in Baltimore was conducted by the
pastor, Rev. Howard F. Reisz, assist-
ed by Rev. Dr. A. R Wentz, president
of the Gettysburg Seminary; Rev.
Dr. A. J. Traver, president of the
Maryland Synod, Rev. Dr. Henry W.
Snyder, Sr, of Washington, who en-
tered the ministry under Dr. Rupp's
pastorate, and Rev. Dr. H. D. Hoover
of Gettysburg, representing the
deaconess board, of which Dr. Rupp
was a long-time member. He was
also a seminary director for many
years.
Dr. Rupp is survived by one daugh

ter, Mrs. Sidney W. Harvey, of
Garden City, L. I., three grand-chil-
dren, and a sister-in-law, Miss Grace
M. Sheeleigh, with whom he made
his home in Baltimore.

MRS. ERVIN R.'HYSER.
Mrs. Mamie C. Hyser, wife of

Ervin R. Hyser, Taneytown, died on
Friday evening at the Frederick City
Hospital, where she hod been a pa-
tient for a week. She was aged 62
years. Mrs. Hyser was a daughter
of the late David and Mary Staley.
She was twice married. Her first

husband being Frank P. Palmer.
Surviving are her second husband;
one sister, Mrs. Russell M. Eckard.
Taneytown; four step-children, Paul
E. Hyser, Abbottstown: George F.
Hyser, Hanover; Mrs. Henry Walt-
man, Littlestown, and Mrs. Nevin
Myers, Hanover; two nephews, Nor-
val W. Eckard, Hanover, and Merle
D. Eckard, Tlaneytown, and one niece
Mrs. Earl Myers, Taneytown.
The funeral was held Monday af-

ternoon, at her late home with furth-
er services in the Taneytown United
Brethren 'Church by her pastor, Rev.
A. W. Garvin; burial was made in the
Reformed cemetery at 'Daneytown.

MISS IDA E. SMITH.
Miss Ida E. Smith aged 78 years, ,

died last Friday evening at 8 o'clock-
at the home of her sister, Mrs. Emma
J. Graham, Mt. Union. Death fol-
lowed an illness of a few days from
pneumonia.
She was a daughter of the late

Peter and Margaret Smith. Surt•tv-
ing her are two sisters, Mrs. Graham
with whom she resided and Mrs. Ella
Mary Shaw, Uniontown.
The funeral was held Tuesday

afternoon from the Graham home.
Her pastor, Rev. George Bowersox,
officiated; burial in the Lutheran
cemetery at Uniontown.

CARD OF THANKS.

I wish to thank my neighbors and
friends for the flowers, words of
sympathy and the use of automobiles
during the illness and following the
death of wife.

ERVIN R. HYSER.



SPECIAL NOTICES
  ADVERTISEMENTS will be in-

serted under this heading at One Cent a
wood, each week, counting name and ad-
dress of advertiser-two initials, or a data,
sionnted as one word. Minimum charge,
11 vents.
REAL ESTATE for sale, Two Cents esek

we'd. Minimum charge, 25 sent..
l'HIS COLUMN I. specially for Wants,

Lost Found, Short Announcements, Per-
sonal Property for sale- etc.
CASH IN ADVANCE payments are do.

sired in all cases.
NO "CALL AT RECORD OFFICE for

Information." Special Notices win be re-,
eelved, except when replies are SEALED

and addressed to a NUMBER to be given
by our office, for turning over to the ad-
vertiser.

STOCK BULLS for sale, or loaned
to reliable farmers.-Harold Mehring.

4-28-tf

WANTED.-Second-hand Brooder
Stove, Newtown 1000 capacity.-I.
Louis Reifsnider, Taneytown.

52 ACRE FARM for Sale or Rent.
See-Harry Bloom, near St. John's
Church, Littlestown.

THE PARENT-TEACHERS' Asso-
ciation of Taneytown School will hold
a sale of fresh Home-made Dough-
nuts, on Tuesday, Feb. 25th. Orders
may be left at David Smith's Econo-
my Store before noon the 25th. Or-
ders in town will be delivered.

ATTENTION FARMERS.-Do not
fail to attend the large public sale of
Charles F. Houck, 3 miles north of
Frederick on Liberty Road. The sale
includes 60 head home-broke horses
and general line of Farming Imple-
ments. The sale will be held on
March 13, at 10 o'clock sharp.

2-14-4t

RADIO REPAIRING, all makes.
Public address system for rent or sale
-Sell' Radio Service, Taneytown.

2-14-7t

FINE PROPERTY at Keymar! Buy
now before the new road is completed
when the price will advance. For
further inflormation apply to-The
Record Office. 2-14-2t

HOUSE FOR RENT, in Detour.
With Bath, Furnace and Garage. Ap-
ply to-S. R. Waybright, Detour.
Phone 95-F-2, Union Bridge. 2-14-2t

A CARD PARTY for the benefit of
St. Joseph's Catholic Church, Taney..
town, Md., Feb. 24, 1941, at 8:15.
Prizes and refreshments free. Ad-
mission 35c. Sponsored by Mrs. U.
H. Bowers. 2-14-2t

FOR SALE-Modern Property,
Bath, Hot Water Heating System, a
very desirable home East of Taney-
town along Baltimore highway.-E.
G. Shockey, Phone 93-F-13. 2-14-2t

LOST-One furlined Leather Glove
Lost in town on Tuesday. Finder
please return to-Edward Reid.

WANTED-Old Barn Pigeons, 25c
pair, delivered until Feb. 28th.; also
Rabbits-L. E. Smith, 2 miles from
Taneytown on Emmitsburg road.

WILL DO SHOE AND HARNESS
repairing until further notice. Terms
Cash.-Harry E. Reck, near Otter
Dale. 1-7-10t

LADIES' AID of St. Paul's Luth-
eran Church, of Harney, will hold an
Oyster Supper in A. 0. K. of M. C.
Hall, Saturday evening, Feb. 15, be-
ginning at 4 o'clock. Price 25 and 35c.

2-7-2t

NOTICE-We pay top prices for
Beef Hides.-Bollinger Meat Market,
Taneytown. 12-13-tf

25 PIANOS $19.00 UP. All Tuned,
Reconditioned. Guaranteed. New
Pianos at very Low Prices. Easy
terms.-Cramer's, Frederick, Md.

12-6-0-tf

DO YOU HAVE some unused
pieces of mediocrity, or furniture,
that you do not need. Why not offer
it to somebody who does need them?
Try a Special Notice in The Record!

WEDDING INVITATIONS and An-
nouncements. Have four grades.
Work almost equal to engraved, and
prices to please you. 5-31-3t

RADIO REPAIRING, all makes
and models. For dependable service,
see-Paul E. Koontz, Taneytown, Md.

3-17-tf

TRY THIS Column for your needs,
both for selling and buying. It brings
customers and makes sales. Good
business men make use of it. Many
readers examine it. 1-14-tf

FOR SALE-New and Used Type-
writers; also Typewriters for rent.-
Charles L. Stonesifer, Taneytown.

SALESMEN'S Order Books are
supplied by The Record from the man-
ufacturers, at standard prices. About
six weeks are required for filling such
orders. 3-22-3t

Lie '.; ...die the . .t
Gabriel Gallardo figui es he's just

as good as in the army now. He's
25, lives in San Francisco, and
thinks the conscription chiefs have
his number already. So why should
he buy himself a new suit if Uncle
Sam is taking his measurements?
Arguing along that line, he told his
tailors he didn't think he'd keep the
suit they made to order for him for
$35. He wouldn't be needing it now,
thanks. The tailors felt differently
about the work they had done sod
brought suit against Mr. Gallardo
in the small claims court. Municipal
Judge Kaufman pointed out that,
even if he is conscripted, Mr. Gal-
lardo will appreciate a change into
"civies" on his day off, and told
him to start paying.

Women Poor Parkers
Speaking of parking, why is it

women are such poor parkers of
cars? It is because their clothes
are too tight around the arms and
they are afraid if they turn the
steering wheel too much they will
rip their sleeves.

CHURCH NOTICES.

This column is for the free use of all
eh arches. for a brief announcement of
services. Please do not elaborate. It 13

always understood that the public is in-
vited to services.

--
St. Mary's Reformed Church, Silver

Run-Sunday School, at 9:00 A. M.;
Morning Worship, at 10:30 A. M.;
Christian Endeavor, 6:30; Worship, at
7:30 P. M. alternate Sundays.

Trinity Lutheran Church, Taney-
town.-Sunday School, 9:00 A. M.;
Morning Worship, 10:00 A..M; Luth-
er League, 6:30 P. M.; Worship, 7:30

Tom's Creek M. E. Church, Rev.
Crist, pastor-9:00 A. M., Sunday
School; Church Services, 10:00 A. M.

Uniontown Lutheran Charge, Rev.
George E. Bowersox, Jr., Pastor.
Winters-Church, 9:30; S. S., 10:30.
Mt. Union-Sunday School, 9:30;

Church, 10:45; C. E., 7:00.
St. Paul's-Sunday School, 9:30;

Reformed Church, Taneytown.-S.
School, at 9:15 A. M.; Morning Wor-
ship, 10:15; C. E. Jr. and Sr., at 7:00
in the church auditorium. The feat-
ure of the program will be a Bible
Quiz based on the book of Exodus.
The participants being two teams of
four members each. This will be an
interesting program and all are in-
vited to be present.
Keysville-No Service. The next

Service Sunday afternoon, Feb. 23,
at 2 o'clock.

Church of God, Uniontown Circuit,
Rev. John H. Hoch, pastor. Union-
town-Sunday School, 9:30 A. M. Mr.
Edward Caylor, Supt. Preaching Ser-
vice, 10:30. Prayer Meeting on Wed-
nesday evening at 7:30. Miss Evelyn
Talbot, leader.

Wakefield-Sunday School, 10:00;
Mr. James Staub, Supt. Preaching
Service, at 7:30; Prayer 'Meeting and
Bible Study, on Thursday evening, at
7:45. A special series of messages
will be given each Thursday evening
on the subject: "Satan: His Person-
ality, Character, Origin, Fall, King-
dom, Present position and work and
Destiny." A large chart will be used
to illustrate these. messages.
Frizellburg-Sunday School, 10:00.

Mr. Marshall Mason, Supt. Prayer
Meeting and Bible Study, on Friday
evening at 7:45. Subject: "Satan."

Taneytown U. B. Charge, A. W.
Garvin, minister. Taneytown-S. S.
9:30 A. M.; Worship, 10:30 A. M. Bi-
ble Study and Prayer Service, Wed-
nesday, 7:45 P. M.
Barts-Sunday School, 1:30; Wor-

ship, at 2:30.
Harney-S. S., 6:30; Worship,

7:30.

Manchester Evangelical and Re-
formed Charge, Rev. Dr. John S. Hol-
lenbach, pastor. Lineboro-Sunday
School, at 9:00; Worship, at 10:00;
Catechise, Saturday, at 10:00.
Manchester-Sunday School, at 9:30

C. E., at 6:45; Worship, at 7:30; Cate-
chise, Saturday, at 1:45; Willing
Workers Aid Society, Monday, 7:45.
The pastor will preach on "Christ-
ianity and War."

It is suggested you listen on the
broadcast favoring aid to stricken
European people on Sunday, at 10:30
P. M., over Columbia Broadcasting
system. The address will be by Hon
Herbert Hoover.

Taneytown Presbyterian Church.-
Sunday School, at 10:00; Morning
Worship, at 11:00; Jr.-Intermediate
C. E., at 5:00 P. M.
Piney Creek Presbyterian Church

-Morning Worship, at 9:30; Sunday
School, at 10:30. The pastor, Rev. I.
N. Morris will be in charge.

PROCEEDINGS ORPHANS' COURT

Robert T. Shriver, executor of
Mary Owings Shriver, deceased, re-
turned inventory of personal prop-
erty.

Letters of administration on the
estate of Samuel Webster, deceased,
were granted to Elisha B. Webster,
who received order to notify credit-
ors.
George Z. Ashman, administrator

of 'Julie T. Hargrave, deceased, set-
tled his first and final account.

Charles W. Long, administrator of
Thomas A. Blizzard, deceased, re-
ported sale of personal property.
Upton E. Myers, administrator of

Mary Jane Myers, deceased, returned
inventory of real estate.

Letters of administration on the
estate of Bertha Mielke, deceased,
were granted to Bertha M. Ruch,who
received order to notify creditors and
warrant to appraise personal proper-
ty.

Wesley C. Brooks, administrator
of Marie A. Brooks, deceased, re-
turned inventory of current money.

Letters of administration on the
estate of Elizabeth Smith, deceased,
were granted to Raymond Lewis,
who received order to notify credit-
ors.
DeVries R. Hering and Lou E. De-

Vries, executors of Harry R. DeVries
deceased, settled their first and final
account and received order to trans-
fer automobiles.
The last will and testament of

Peter Elmo, late of Carroll County,
deceased, was admitted to probate,
and letters testamentary were grant-
ed to Joseph Elmo, who received or-
der to notify creditors and warrant
to appraise real estate.
The last will and testament of

John D. Wilt, deceased, was admitted
to probate, and letters testamentary
were granted to Harry F. Wilt, who
received order to notify creditors
and warrants to appraise personal
pronerty and real estate.
Mary E. Stonesifer, administratrix

of Arthur L. Stonesifer, deceased,
received order to sell real estate.

Earl Zepp, et. al., executors of
Emma M. Caple, returned inventor-
ies of real estate, persoral property,
debts and current money, and receiv-
ed order to sell personal property.

"Papa, what is the hand of Provi-
dence? "The hand of Providence, my
son, is what we see in the misfortune
of others."

CITIZENS' STATE COMMITTEE
TO FIGHT BUDGET.

Baltimore, Md., Feb. 10, 1941.-
Representative delegations from
Washington, Frederick and Baltimore
counties this week will carry to An-
napolis their fight against the pro-
posed all-time high State budget of
$106,000,000. A special hearing has
been arranged for the county taxpay-
ers before the Senate Finance com-
mittee at 8 P. M. Tuesday night at
the State House.

Meanwhile plans for similiar ac-
tion by City organizations are ex-
pected to crystalize at a meeting of
the civic leaders called for Thursday
night at the Emerson Hotel by Dr.
Douglas Huntley Gordon former
president 'of St. John's College and
Chairman of the Citizens' Emergency
Tax Control Committee of Baltimore.
Declaring that in their recent battle
against the City's tax rate boost Bal-
timoreans plainly demonstrated their
strong economy sentiments, Dr. Gor-
don said the time for wishful think-
ing is past, adding that "We must do
something about constantly mounting
costs of State government or face
catastrophe."

Resolutions condemning the pro-
posed $6,00,000 budget increase al-
ready have been lodged with the Leg-
islature by these Baltimore groups:
Park Heights Civic Improvement As-
sociation, Linwood Building and Loan
Association, East Baltimore Business
Men's Association, East Baltimore
Building and Loan Association and
the Retail Furniture Dealers' Asso-
ciation. Like action is looked for at
meetings this week of the Traffic Club
of Baltimore, Exchange Club, of
Highlandtown and the Soroptimist
Club.
Four motorcades will converge on

Annapolis for the hearing. Members
of the Washington County Taxpayers
Association will leave Hagerstown
early Tuesday evening, led by their
president, Roy Mowen. In Frederick
president Charles F. Feete will bring
his Frederick ;County Taxpayers' As-
sociation delegation. Baltimore coun-
tians will form their motorcade at
Towson under the leadership of Harry
S. Middendorf and the Montgomery
County taxpayers will be under the
direction of Curtis J. Ireland, their
president.
Quoting a statement issued by the

steering body, the Citizens' State
Budget Emergency Committee, Coun-
ty spokesmen will tell the Senate
Committeemen just what the $106,-
000,000 Maryland proposes to spend
in 1942 and 1943 really means. That
amount, it is pointed out, actually ex-
ceeds the total taxable real estate
base in one-third of Maryland coun-
ties, namely, Calvert, 'Caroline, How-

, ard, Somerset, Kent, St. Mary's,
Charles and Carroll. The compari-
son is based on official figures for
1938-the last publicly available-in
the State Tax Commission's Twelfth
Biennial Report to the Governor and
Legislature.

Further to highlight the formid-
able increase in governmental costs
in recent years, county speakers will
show that taxpayers under the pro-
posed budget will have to pay ap-
proximately $28 toward the .State's
expenditures in 1942, whereas twen-
ty years ago they paid only about
$7.77, or one-fourth that amount.

; Another point the budget protest-
; ers will emphazize is the pending in-
crease of over a million dollars in the
State appropriation for public schools
Delving into cold facts and figures
again, the county people have found
that alongside a population increase
•of some 400,000 nor 25 per cent in the
last two decades, during the same
period public school appropriations,

; have stepped briskly ahead to in-
crease some 300 per cent. The total
appropriations in the last twenty

1, years for public schools-exclusive of
County and City school taxes-have

! totaled $94,000,000. That, it has
been found, exceeds the entire State
expenses for the two years of 1938
and 1939 and in fact roughly equals
the cost of operating the State gov-
ernment for the years 1921 to 1925
inclusive.
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AMERICAN LEGION NEWS.

I The American Legion through its
11,715 posts is going to register all
of its 1,078,119 members, if possible,
for national defense service. Unaf-
filiated World War veterans also will
be asked to register. The registra-
tion will be entirely voluntary. Its
purpose is to provide the local, state
and national leadership of The Amer-
ican Legion with a complete inventory
of the assets of the organization in
manpower, experience and special
training that could be made available
to the government if needed in the

' defense of the nation.
National Commander Milo J.

; Warner has proclaimed Saturday, Feb
i 22, the 209th. anniversary of the birth
of George Washington, as national
defense day for all Legionnaires and
unaffiliated World War veteran's who
care to do so. On that day every
American Legion post in the country
will ask its membersship and local
World War veterans generally to fill
out a Questionnaire. It will chronicle
every Legionnaire's capabilities and
talents which could be used in nation-
al defense. From these copies will
he compiled post, department and na-
tional indices of American Legion na-
tional defense assets. These indices
will enable the American Legion
quickly to locate any member or vet-
eran for whose special services gov-
ernmental agencies might have a
need.
The Hesson-Snider Post No. 120 of

The American Legion will undertake
to register all Legionnaries and un-
affiliated World War veterans in this
community and surrounding area.
"This is a summons for possible

important service to God and Coun-
try whom we served as young men in
1917-18," Commander R. Rohrbaugh
of the local post said. "I feel certain
that every Legionnaire and World
War veterans generally will welcome
this opportunity of perhaps doing
another bit for their country. We do
not expect to be called for active mil-
itary service. Most of Ps are beyond
that age. But there are many home
defense duties to be performed.
"I urge every Legionnaire and oth-

er interested World War veterans in

this community to register on Feb.
22. It is a patriotic duty, and we of
The American Legion have never
shirked our duty, or lagged in our pa-
triotism. The time has come again
when we may be called upon once
more to stand up for America, and I
am sure every Legionnaire in this
community is ready."
Appointment of a special committee

to handle the voluntary registration
of all local Legionnaires and World

• War veterans generally has been
made.
Commander R. Rohrbaugh has

named J. 0. Crapster as chairman of
the special national defense registra-
tion committee. Other members of
the committee are Charles R. Arnold
and Clyde L. Hesson. All the officers
of the local post will serve as ex-
officio members of this special com-
mittee.
There is nothing compulsory about

the registration. Filing out of The
American Legion national defense
questionnaire and rendering any ser-
vice that may be called for later,both
will be entirely voluntary on the
part of the individual. Registration
does not involve any military liability

It is merely for the purpose of cat-
aloging the quailfications and special
talents of all Legionnaires and
World War veterans for national de-
fense.

MARINES AND MUSKETS.

Accuracy of rifle 'fire has always
been a specialty of the U. S. Marines
who have won their full share of
prizes for skill on the rifle range and
elsewhere.
But it is a far cry from the modern

high-powered infantry rifle to the
old-fashioned 'muskets, which also
were used to good effect by the sea
soldiers in the days of Old Ironsides
and other sailing frigates.
A wide variety of small arms were

used in the early days of the last cen-
tury, including the musket, pistol,
boarding-pike, cutlass, bayonet, knife,
dirk, or tomahlawk. Each weapon
had its use in the days when war ves-
sels often fought at close quarters.
The musket, however, was the

weapon of the marine's. It was usu-
ally of the flint-lock, muzzle-loading,
smooth-bore type and fired a ball of
from one to two ounces. It was fair-
ly accurate at 100 yards, could inflict
a fatal wound at 200 yards, and had
diminishing degrees of effectiveness
up to a quarter-mile.

While loading a musket the sea
soldier had much more to do than to
insert a cartridge clip and manipulate
the bolt, as is the case with most of
the infantry weapons today.

In those days 'he had to bite off the
bullet from the top of the cartridge
so as to expose the powder. He then
sprinkled a little of the powder into
the pan of the gun, snapped the pan
to, dropped the cartridge down the
muzzle, rammed it home with the bul-
let on top, and then took aim and fired
There were numerous occasions

when the musketry fire of the marines
proved to be an important factor in
the winning of sea battles. Their
marksmanship was highly praised by
J. Fenimore Cooper and a number of
other naval writers.-U. S. Marine
Service.

SALE REGISTER
Sales for which this office does printing

or advertising, will he inserted under this
heading (4 lines free of charge.) Charge
for sale register alone. Si 00 until date of
sale Notices longer than 4 lines must be
paid for, extra

FEBRUARY

19-10 o'clock. Mrs. Catherine L. Shriner,
21 f... tulles south of Taneytown, near
Otterdale School. Real Estate and Per-
sonal Property. Earl Bowers, Auct.

22-Community Sale of Farm Machinery.
Autos, Trucks and Fprniture. Medford
Store. Medford, Md.

29-12 o'clock. Harry J. Myers, near
Littlestown, Pa. Live Stock, Farm-
ing Implements and Household Goods.

MARCH

4-12 o'clock. Chas. A. Ohler, along Tan-
eytown and Keys-vine road. Live Stock
and Farming Implements. Harry
Trout, Auct.

5-12 o'clock. Harry 0. Fogle, along Lit-
tlestown and Taneytown road. Live
Stock and Farming Implements. Harry
Trout, Auct.

9-10 o'clock. .Tesse Warner, on road
from Taneytown to Frizellburg. Live
Stock and Farming Implements.
Chas. A. Ohler, Auct.

11-10 o'clock. Jesse Warner, on road
from Taneytown to Frizellburg. All
Household Goods. Chas. A. Ohler,
Auct.

13--t o'clock. Chas. F. Houck, 3 miles
north of Frederick, on Liberty Road.
Oil head Horses and Farming Imple-
ments.

14-11 o'clock. J. Elmer Motter, near
Tom's Creek Church. Live Stock,
Farming Implemeents. Harry Trout,
Ana.

15-10 o'clock. Harry C. Welty, on Tan-
eytown-Keymar Road. Live Stock,
Farming Implements and Household
Goods. Harry Trout, Auct.

20-Chas. M. Diehl. 21/2 miles west of Un-
ion Bridge. Live Stock. Farming Im-
plements and some Household Goods.
Harry Trout & Son, Auct.
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AUCTION
AND SALE

BILLS
• •

Let us help you prepare
your sale bill copy. Since
we handle so much of
this work we are well
equipped to give you
exActly what you want,
when you want it.
Bills printed as we
print them gat attendon
and increase results.
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Mosquito Boat
Is Deadly Craft

Speedy, 70-Foot Vessels Are
Not Vulnerable to

Torpedoes.

NEW LONDON, CONN.-A tiny
armored sea red, which skims over
the water at 90 miles an hour, pre-
senting an almost indestructible
target as it smashes at the enemy
with torpedoes, depth charges and
anti-aircraft guns, may become one
of the navy's most efficient and
deadly fighting units.

Officially, these sleds are known
as "mosquito boats." They are 70
feet long, of shallow draft that per-
mits their safe passage through
mine fields and makes them invul-
nerable to torpedoes, and are the
modern version of the destroyer that
is now more heavily armed than the
light cruiser of 30 years ago.
Two dozen of these boats are be-

ing built by the Electric Boat com-
pany for the navy. They are simi-
lar in pattern to those used by the
British for channel and coastline
defense.

Has Four Torpedo Tubes.
The American "mosquito boat"

mounts two 21 or four 18 inch tor-
pedo tubes on its deck, has two anti-
aircraft guns, at least six depth
charges racked over the stern, is
equipped with smoke screen appara-
tus and is the speediest and most
maneuverable boat afloat.

It has a cruising range of 700
miles at 44 knots; 1,200 miles at 20
knots, and more than 2,000 miles at
9 knots. It is so easily handled
and perfectly balanced that it can
countermarch over its original
course in slightly less than 15 sec-
onds-about the same amount of
time it takes a destroyer to begin a
turn.
The "mosquito boat" can accel-

erate from 8 to 40 knots within 8
seconds, and reduce speed from 40
to 3 knots in 3 seconds. The quick
acceleration is made possible by
having the forward speed lift the
boat bodily from the resistance of
the water. When the speed is re-
duced, the vessel settles back into
the water and comes to a quick
stop.

Can Side-Slip Like Plane.
Navy officials believe the small

craft virtually immune from aerial
bombing and machine gunning, in-
asmuch as it is the only boat ca-
pable of duplicating on water the
sideslip of an airplane.
An official navy bulletin regards

the new "hit-and-run" ship in this
light:
"These so-called 'mosquito boats'

have a sting out of all proportion to
their size. At a fraction of the cost,
they carry the same deadly weap-
ons as their larger counterpart, the
destroyer. Without unduly stretch-
ing the imagination-given the time,
the place and the opportunity-if
two torpedoes will seriously damage
a battleship, two torpedoes will cer-
tainly sink a cruiser under ordinary
conditions. Because of their shallow
draft, the military assets of these
'mosquito boats' are further aug-
mented, since they cannot be tor-
pedoeci and can, for the same rea-
son, enter mine fields without dan-
ger of contact.
"These motorboats would be just

as difficult to detect as a well-hidden
scouting patrol on land under cover
of night or stealthily approaching
behind a smoke screen. Wave after
wave of these tiny boats could be
sent to the enemy battle line, each
succeeding wave laying a chemical
smoke screen to screen the boats
following."

Pitcairn's he-Discov,_
Will Receive a Tribute

MASSILLON, OHIO. -Authors of
"Mutiny on the Bounty" have been
asked to assist in honoring the mem-
ory of the old Yankee skipper and
early Massillon settler who more
than 130 years ago found the secret
South Sea island refuge of the Boun-
ty mutineers.

Citizens here plan to erect a me-
morial marker at the grave of Capt.
Mayhew Folger, the seafarer who
re-discovered Pitcairn's island.

Lord Nelson's Grandson
Lives Quietly in Maine

DENNYSVILLE, MAINE.-In this
quiet town 3,000 miles from Europe
an 80-year-old man eagerly watches
for news of the war.
His concern is deeper than most

Americans'. He is Horatio Nelson
Lund, grandson of England's Lord
Nelson.
Lund has great faith in Britain's

ultimate victory. He sees success
because of the sea power that his
ancestor built to greatness.

Cupid Writes in the Sky
To Tell of Couple's Troth

LAKE ARROWHEAD, CALIF.-
Miss Ethel-Mary Hamilton, Briar-
cliff Junior college graduate, and
Harold Spurrier Anderson Jr., Stan-
ford university student, had their en-
gagement announced with a flour-
ish.
At the home of the bride's mother

here, 40 guests watched an airplane
skywriter link their initials in the
sky and encircle them with a heart.

Blind Girl, 18, Writes
Prize-Winning Fantasy

SEATTLE.-In Marion Anderson's
world of ,darkness there is no room
for butterflies. She is blind.
Yet the 18-year-old girl won a

short story contest sponsored by the
Braille Searchlight magazine. A
fairy tale, entitled "How the 13utter-
fly Got Its Name."
With her prize money Miss An-

derson contemplates purcl,ase of a
cello.

Sweet land of Liberty of thee I sine

1865

OVERNMENT
of the people, by

the people, and for
the people shall not
perish from the earth.

Abraham Lincoln

Standing on the battlefield of
Gettysburg where almost 46,000
so:diers of the North and South
had died. Lincoln dedicated the
National Soldiers' Cemetery on
November 19, 1863, with a
masterly oration. It contains
Fewer than three hundred words,
but each is • forensic pearl of
price.
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Lean Smoked Hams, 27c lb.
Goetz Health  Wieners, 15c lb.

Large Juicy Florida Grapefruit, 6 for 18c
Large Juicy Florida Oranges, 19c doz. 

California Carrots, 5c bunch
Lemons, 18c doz.

WHEATIES, The Breakfast of Champions, 2 pkgs. 21c 
National Biscuit Co. RITZ Butter CRACKERS, 1-lb. pkg. 21c 

Get A Large Box of SUPER SUDS for only lc with purchase of 2 large
packages at 35c-all for 36c 

Ann Page Pure PRESERVES, Nationally Known, (2 lb. jar 29c) 1-lb. jar 17c
A&P Unsweetened GRAPEFRUIT Juice 2 46-oz. cans 27c

Ann Page Pure GRAPE JELLY or Crabapple, (Three Varieties at I2c)
8-oz. glass 10c

Ann Page Salad DRESSING, Nationally Known, (qt. jar 25c) pt. jar 15c

WHITE HOUSE EVAPORATED MILK, 4 tall cans 27c-
EIGHT O'CLOCK COFFEE, 2 1-lb Bags 25c; 3 lb. bag 37c

1
PALMOLIVE SOAP, 3 cakes 17c

WALDORF Tissue, 4 rolls 17e

Tender cut Stringless BEANS, 3 no- 2 cans 19c

Margarine NUTLEY,1-1b. ctn. 10c; Ideal for frying, baking and table use

Cheese Food PABST. ETT, 61-oz. pkg. 15c

A Delightful Spread CHEEZHAM, 4-oz. pkg. 12a
1

Iona Full Flavor COCOA, lb. can 10c; 2 lb. can 17c

Ann Page Luscious. Fruit Flavored SPARKLE Dessests, 3 pkgs. 10c

Dated For Freshness, Marvel BREAD, 3 1 -lb. loaves 25c

Evaporated APRICOTS, lb. 25c

Tender Plump Evaporated PEACHES, 2 lbs. 25c 41

National Biscuit Co. PREMIUM CRACKERS, 1-lb. box 15c

I
Try Jane Parker Dated For Freshness DO-NUTS, Plain, Sugared or

Cinnamon.doz. 12c

1
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OFFICIAL DIRECTORY OF
CARROLL COUNTY
THE CIRCUIT COURT.
ASSOCIATED JUDGES.

William H. Forsythe, Ellicott City.
Ridgely P. Melvin, Annapolis.

CLERK OF COURT.
Levi D. Maus, Sr

TERMS OF CIRCUIT COURT.
Second Monday in February, May,

August and November. Petit Jury
'Terms, February, May and November;
Grand Jury Terms, May and Novem-
ber.

ORPHANS' COURT.
Chief Judge, J. Webster Ebaugh

E. Lee Erb.
Lewis E. Green.

Court meets every Monday & Tuesday

REGISTER OF WILLS.
Harry G. Berwager.

TRIAL MAGISTRATE.
John Wood, Attorney.

STATE'S ATTORNEY.
Donald C. SponseIler

SHERIFF.
Walter L. Shipley.

COUNTY COMMISSIONERS.
Charles W. Melville, Oakland Mills.
Norman R. Hess, Taneytown.
Howard H. Wine, Manchester.

A. Earl Shipley, Attorney.
SUPERVISOR OF ASSESSMENTS.

George W. Brown.

TAX COLLECTOR.
E. A. Shoemaker.

COUNTY TREASURER
Paul Kuhns.

BOARD OF EDUCATION.
W. Roy Poole
J. Keller Smith, Mt. Airy, Md.
Boy D. Knouse, Silver Run, Md.
Eoratio S. Oursler, Manchester, Md.
Edward C. Bixler, New Windsor.
Edward 0. Diffendal, Westminster
Raymond S. Hyson, Superintendent

Stanford I. Hoff, Counsel.
COUNTY SURVEYOR.

John J. John.

SUPERVISORS OF ELECTIONS.
Win. H. Hersh
Harold Smelser
Harry Bushey

HEALTH OFFICER.
Dr. W. C. Stone.

DEPUTY GAME WARDEN.
J. Gloyd Diffendal.

EOME DEMONSTRATION AGENT.
Adeline Hoffman.

COUNTY AGRICULT. AGENT.
L. C. Burns.

COUNTY WELFARE BOARD.Dr. C. R. Foutz, Westminster, Md.Pearce Bowlus, Sec. Mt. AiryH. G. Englar New WindsorPaul Walsh Hampstead, Md.Jonathan Dorsey Sykesville, Md.Hrs. Walter Bower, Taneytown, Md.Roward H. Wine Manchester, Md.Mrs E. K. Brown, Director
Westminster, Md.

HISTORICAL SOCIETY OF
CARROLL COUNTY.

J. David Haile, President.Mrs. Mary Gray Clemson, SecretaryMrs. Irene B. Shunk, Treasurer.
 VI-

TANEYTOWN OFFICIALS
MAYOR.

Norville P. Shoemaker.
CITY COUNCIL

Dr. C. M. Benner, President.Merle S. Baumgardner.David H. Hahn.
Pius L. Hemler
Clarence W. J. Ohler
Clyde L. }lesson, Clerk.

LOCAL HEALTH OFFICER.
Dr. C. if. Benner.

NOTARIES.
Murray Baumgardner
Wm. E. Burke, Jr.

Mrs. Fannie 0. Ohler
Adah E. Sell.

Mrs. Mabel Elliot.

CONSTABLE
Elmer Crebs.

TANE1TOWN ORGANIZATIONS
Taneytown Chamber of Commerce meetsca the 4th. Monday in each month inthe Municipal building, at 8:00 o'clock.Merwyn C. Fuss, Pres.; 1st. Vice-Pres.,James C. Myers; Second Vice-Pres.,David Smith; Secretary, BernardJ. Arnold; Treasurer, ,2has. R. Ar-nold.

Tsneytown Fire Company, meets on the2nd. Monday each month, at 7:30 P. M.in the Firemen's Building. DonaldTracey, President; Doty Robb, Sec'y;Charles R. Arnold, Treas.; RaymondDavidson, Chief.

All other Fraternities and organizationsare invited to use this directory, for theWile information it carries. Cost for oneyear. only $1.50.

SCHEDULE
- OF THE -

Arrival and Departure of Mails
Taneytown, Aid.

Window Service Opens 6:45 A.Window Service Closes 6:00 P.Lobby Service Closes 8:00 P.
MAILS CLOSE

Star Route, Hanover, North
Train, Frederick, South
Train, Hanover, North
Star Rout, Frederick, South
Star Route, Hanover, North
Taneytown-Keymar Route No.

Taneytown Route No. 1
Taneytown Route No. 2

MAILS ARRIVE
Eeymar Route No. 1, Principal Mail

7:30 A. M.Star Route, Hanover, North 7:40 A. M.Star Route, Frederick, South Parcel Post
8:40 A. M.

Train, Hanover, North 9:44 A. M.
Train, Frederick, South 2:30 P. M.Star Route, Hanover, North 6:00 P M.
Taneytown Route No. 1 2:00 P. M.
Taneytown Route No. 2 2:00 P. M.

JNO. 0. CRAPSTER. Postmaster.
No Window Service or Rural Carriers on

Legal Holidays.
9olidays for Rural Carriers are, New

Year's Day; Washington's birthday; Me-
morial Day, May 30; July 4; Labor Day,
1st. Monday in Sept.; Armistice Day,
November 11: Thanksgiving Day. and
Christmas. When a holiday falls on
Sunday. the follo"ing Monday is observed.

. •

M.
M.
M.

8:00 A. M.
9:10 A. M.
2:05 P. M.
4:00 P. M.
6:00 P. M.
1-M
8:00 A. M.
8:15 A. M.
8:15 A. M.

Expert Assigns Names
To Two Hundred Colors

"Color is experiencing its greatest
boom in American history," asserts
Mrs. Margaret Hayden Rorke, who
comes as close as anyone to being
America's "color-dictator." The
Textile Color Card association, of
which she is director, has 1,300 sub-
scribers, running all the way from
makers of apparel and cosmetics to
manufacturers of automobiles and
furniture.

Origin of the association goes
back to 1915, when this country was
still dependent on Europe for dyes.
In those days almost anything from
orange to deep pink was likely to
be labeled "coral," Mrs. Rorke
says. So her first-task was to in-
fluence an entire nation to agree on
a single definition for color-names.
Issue of the first list followed

weeks of discussion, but now ques-
tionnaires are sent and conferences
held annually, with the result that
more than 200 color-names have
been "stabilized." Three months of
each year Mrs. Rorke travels to
study trends in other parts of the
world.
"New quirks in color can be found

anywhere," she told the New York
Times recently. ". . . It is pos-
sible our next source of color may
come from a country spotlighted be-
cause it isn't in the war. Other than
that possibility, the only effect the
war has had on colors is to make
them gayer. France indulged in
drab tones for the last year. Today
it senses the value of color psychol-
ogy."

CorIcSupplyIsAmvle
For U. S. Requirements

C. Dudley Armstrong, vice pres-
ident in charge of foreign operations
of the Armstrong Cork company,
said recently that the company has
on hand in this country stocks of
cork of all kinds enough to last for
many months to come. Cork has
many specialized uses in national
defense.
"Ports on the western side of Por-

tugal, such as Lisbon and Aporto,
largest centers of the Portuguese
cork trade, are open to American
ships," Mr. Armstrong pointed out.
"Portugal is the largest cork-
producing country in the world,
yielding a considerably greater
quantity than either Spain or Africa.
"As regards Spain," Mr. Arm-

strong said, "the Spanish coast north
of Portugal, including the Port of
Vigo, and the coast along the Bay
of Biscay, including Bilbao, are not
in the combat area as defined by the
United States government.
"The company believes it will be

possible to get enough cork from
abroad to meet current monthly re-
quirements, thus keeping the large
reserve stock virtually intact. It is
expected that these shipments will
be effected from the Armstrong sup-
ply points in the cork-producing
areas, largely in vessels of neutral
countries other than the United
States, although shipment in Amer-
ican vessels will be made when con-
venient and where American vessels
can operate."

'Lost' Painting 'Found'
Ruben's canvas, "Portrait of Mul-

lay Ahmad," is on exhibition in the
Boston Museum of Fine Arts-the
first time this powerful canvas has
been presented in a public gallery.
Identity of the picture, which had
been "lost" for more than 40 years,
was established by Dr. Juluis S.
Hold, noted art critic.
The portrait, according to Dr.Hold,

was a copy made from the lost orig-
inal by Jan Vermeyen, a Dutch
painter, who took part in the expedi-
tion to Tunis under Charles V in
1535 and who was commissioned by
Charles to make a series of tapes-
tries commemorating the event and
affirming his role as protector of
Christianity.

Little is known of Mulay Ahmad,
represented in the painting. He was
the son of Mulay Hasan, about whom
more is known. The father was also
involved in the expedition to Tunis.

750,000 Meals Yearly
One of the largest of air lines

served 750,000 meals a year. A
dietician, Miss Mildred Inwood of
Chicago is the supervisor of the
menus. It is her job to see that
passengers get appetizing, whole-
some and attractive meals, regard-
less of where they are flying. Menu,
suggestions are received from chefs
of the company's five commissaries
at Portland, Oakland, Salt Lake
City, Omaha and Chicago which
help her in planning the meals.
In the main office ,in Chicago, the

company maintains an experiment-
al kitchen, in which recipes are
standardized, new menus are devel-
oped and various kinds of new cater-
ing equipment are tried out.

Substitute for Aluminum
There are 30,000,000 tons of aln.-A-

nite in the southwestern part of
Utah, according to Representative
Murdock of Utah. There are mil-
lions and millions of tons of mag-
nesite around the giant lake, a lake
151 miles long, that will be created
in the building of Grand Coulee, in
Washington state, according to Rep-
resentative Leavy of Washington.
Leavy says that this magnesite can
be reduced to metallic magnesium,
which is a metal superior to alumi-
num and is a third lighter. It has a
greater tensile strength and can be
produced for 10 cents a pound. He
says it is the "magic metal of the
future."

CELESTE 'S
WHINES

(Associated Newspapers.)
WNU Service.

HERE was nothing new about
Celeste's whining. All of her
twenty years she had merely
to whine and the whole family

hastened to adjust things to suit her
fancy. Although her sister was only
two years older, Virginia had been
made to give up to Celeste from
the time she was a baby. Neither
the parents nor Virginia realized
how completely Celeste had come
to dictate their lives.
Just now Celeste was demanding

a new dress. It little mattered to
her that she had had two new
dresses since Virginia had any.
Virginia sighed and handed over
the money she had been saving for
a trip. There was more resentment
in her heart than she had ever been
conscious of before, but her moth-
er's caressing little pat assured her
that she had done the right thing.
"You know, she'll be young only

once," the mother consoled, and
seemed not to think that Virginia

, might enjoy being young once, too.
In a few hours Celeste returned

from her shopping trip in a jubilant
mood.
"Just as I guessed. I have a per-

fectly gorgeous date and now I have
'something to wear."

On and on she talked of the man
who has "everything."
"Who is he?" Virginia asked half-

heartedly.
"You'd never guess in a hundred

years. He's just inherited $100,000
and only think what a wonderful
chance for me, mumsey," she re-
joiced.
Her mother agreed with her and

they sat planning how Celeste must
be given every help in the family's
power that she might be sure to
make the proper impression.
"Now, Virginia, since this won-

der man is coming this afternoon,
:won't you do your best with the
:lunch? Some of your delicious
marshmallow cocoa with chicken
salad and some of those new sand-
wiches like you made last night,
with a relish and some nuts would
be just right." The mother had
swallowed hook, line and sinker, as
usual, when Celeste had some new
plan. And, as usual, the real work
of it all fell to Virginia.
Virginia went to the kitchen and

started her task with rising rebel-
lion in her heart.
"Yes, Virginia can look on from

afar and do the work," she stormed
as she shredded the chicken for the
salad.
Before she had finished the salad

she heard Celeste talking in her best
company voice, and she could imag-
ine her sister, crisp and lovely in
the new dress, entertaining her
handsome friend.

"I'll have to admit that she can
look charming," Virginia conceded
grudgingly.
Just then she heard the swinging

door from the dining room creak
and looking up saw her old friend,
Bill Thomas.
"How'er you, Virginia?" he

beamed and grasped both her hands
in a hearty grip. "Up to your old
tricks! Honest, I never saw an-
other girl that could stir up as good
things to eat as you used to fix for
our school picnics."
"Flatterer! Now you'll have to

pay for your rashness by tasting
each of these things I'm preparing
and tell me if you think they are
good enough to trap a hundred-
thousand-dollar husband for Ce-
leste."
"What's this?" Bill paused mid-

way in his sampling.
"That's what I said. I don't know

who he may be, but it certainly
has laid us all out to get her gowned
and fed properly."
"Lucky I didn't stay in there and

queer her chance. Now I'll slip off
my coat and help you here, as we
used to when we were in high school.
What do you say, Virgie?"
Virginia flushed with pleasure at

her old nickname and found herself
confiding that everything there was
Celeste's, without really meaning to
do it. With each glance at Virginia
Bill seemed to wear a more satis-
fied expression.
"You havent told me this new

man's name?"
"Sorry, but Celeste wouldn't even

tell me," Virginia confided.
Bill gave a low wtiistle and went

on helping.
Finally things were ready and

they both prepared to serve the
lunch. Virginia served the plates
in a most tempting way while Bill
filled the cocoa cups.
"I've served enough plates for us

all to have some. Of course, we'll
eat alone so we won't spoil the fam-
ily impression," Virginia laughed.
"Well, something tells me that we

won't need all those plates," Bill
volunteered.
"What, you don't imagine for one

minute that this mysterious gentle-
man has failed to appear?"
"Oh, no, no," Bill consoled imme-

diately.
Sure enough, as Virginia appeared

with the luncheon she was met by
the astonishing sight of Celeste sit-
ting sedately in a large chair, beau-
tiful in her new dress, but accusing-
ly silent and moody toward her sis-
ter. Virginia, entirely innocent of
her sister's plot that had failed,
laughed happily.
"Bill just happened in to help me,

Celeste. But where is the wonder-
ful man?"

Celeste gave one frantic look at
her sister and Bill, the look of a
trapped animal, then fled upstairs
to fling herself on the bed and cry
bitter, stormy tears, unmindful of
the damage done the lovely new
dress.
Virginia gasped in amazement

and turned to Bill.
"Well, looks as if I'd failed to play

up to my part in Celeste's expecta-
tions," he said as they sat down at
table together. "But didn't she tell
you I was planning to come up this
afternoon, and didn't you know that
Uncle William had just left me
$100,000? You don't have to an-
swer, for I can see you didn't."

"Bill, you don't mean-" Virginia
was speechless.
"I do mean that Celeste delib-

erately took your best at home and
then tried to fix things so you'd never
see me. I'd like to see the person
that could keep me away from you,
Virginia, if you really want me near
you," he added tenderly.
"Bill, I'm so sorry for silly little

Celeste," Virginia whispered hap-
pily.

The Homecoming

By ALLISON L. BURKS
(McClure Syndicate-WNU Service.)

LOOKING out the train window,
Laura could see the two old

people who stood on the platform.
In the dim glow of the station light
they looked unchanged, exactly as
they had when she felt them six
years ago.
She lifted the child in her arms

before she went down the steps of
the car. "Laura!" All the way
from California there had been a
weight in Laura's breast. Now, as
her mother's arms closed about
her, she felt the weight miraculously
dissolving.
Her father took the little girl from

her arms. "So this is the baby!"
His voice sounded choked.
A dark figure standing behind

him moved closer. Ma chuckled.
"You didn't see Lew, did you,
Laurie? He wanted to come with
us to meet you."
"Oh, Lew!" Laura's voice was a

little breathless.
The man took the slim hand she

held out to him. She knew he was
looking down at her intently. "I'm
glad you're back, Laura," he said
quietly.

*

"It's just the same! It's just the
game!" The words were like a song
in Laura's heart as they went into
the living room.
Ma went upstairs with her. "I

put new drapes at your windows,"
she told Laura. "How do you think
Lew's looking? He's the only law-
yer in these parts, and he's doing
fine. He's never forgot you, Laurie.
"Of course, I know you must be

grieving over your husband dying
-I wish we could'a known him,
Laurie-but now that you're back
again-"

*

Laura sat down on the edge of
the plump bed. The little girl came
close to her side.
"Are we going to live here, Mum-

my?"
"Yes, darling." She caught the

child to her fiercely, staring ahead
with eyes that were suddenly hard.
Five years! She would have at

least five years. Then she would
have to go back. But the child
would stay here. Ma and Pa
weren't really old. They would be
glad to have the baby when she,
Laura, was gone. For a mo-
ment she felt the pain that parting
would bring. Then she set her lips
resolutely. She would have her five
years in Heaven. Years ago, before
she went away, she hadn't known
it was Heaven. But Jack had taught
her what Hell could be.
Of course, she could have di-

vorced him. But it wouldn't have
done any good. Jack would never
let her go. Sometimes he loved her;
more often he hated her. But he'd
never let go of her.
She washed the little girl's round

lace and chubby hands before they
want downstairs.
Lew came into the dining-room

when he saw her there setting the
table. "I hope you were just a little
glad to see me, Laura," he said
awkwardly.
"Why, of course, Lew." She didn't

look at him.
"You don't care if I come out

here sometimes?"
"The sugar bowl's empty," she

murmured. She went toward the
kitchen. She'd better tell him. She
mustn't hurt him-not again!
Ma was at the kitchen sink, un-

wrapping a newspaper from around
a bunch of celery. She paused, her
eyes caught by an item in.the print-
ed columns.
"Here's a funny thing," she said

absently. "About a man named
John Brown. The same name as
your man, Laura. In Los Angeles-
Oh, well, I guess there's a lot of
John Browns in the world."
She went across the kitchen to

the pantry. Laura drew the news-
paper toward her. She stood very
still, reading the short item.
John Brown, sentenced to San

Quentin for robbery, was shot and
killed while attempting to escape.
Lew had followed Laura into the

kitchen. "You didn't answer me,
Laura," he reminded her.
She turned to him. Her voice was

suddenly alive, vibrant. "Why,
Lew," she said. "I want you to
come. I'll always want you to
come!"
And, her hands against her face,

she began'to cry.

One Extra Pint of Milk
Each Milking Makes Feed

Worth $8.00 More Per Ton

• •

• •

• •

extra pint per milking makes ration worth $8.00 more
a ton.

1½ extra pints per milking makes ration worth $12.00 more
a ton.

2 extra pints per milking makes ration worth $16.00 more
a ton.

(Note: Above prices are figured with milk at $2.00 per cwt.)

Results of experiments at the Purina
Experimental Farm show that a cow
may consistently produce 15 pounds of
milk per milking on one ration and 16
on another. Although that extra pound
Is only a pint more and hardly shows
In the pail, it really does add up to
quite a sum.
This is the way it figures. If a cow

Is fed 10 pounds of a dairy ration each
day and milks 30 pounds of milk daily,
that means a pretty lair return on the
feed she eats, if milk is sold at $2.00
per hundred weight. However, if she
is fed the same amount of a better feed
and gives one pint more each milking,
that feed is worth two cents more per
milking or four cents more per day.
In other words, the better feed is worth
four cents more for each ten pounds,
forty cents more per hundred, or eight
dollars more per ton. An extra pint
more per milking does make a differ-

ence.

While it is hard to tell whether there
are 15 or 16 pounds of milk in a milk
pail, it'S still harder to tell by just look-
ing at a feed whether it will produce
15 or 16 pounds of milk. Two feeds
that look alike may produce entirely
different results when fed to the cow.
It all depends on the ingredients In the
feed, their quality, and how they are
blended.

EDITOR'S NOTE: Our local Purina feed
dealer has checkerboard dairy ra-
tions to be fed straight with home
grown roughage. He also has checker-
board dairy concentrates to be mixed
with home grown grains to make up
dairy rations that are fed with home
grown roughages. He will be happy to
advise cow owners how to feed their
herds to the best advantage, using as
much of their home grown feed as pos-
sible.

Quick Coffee Cake Fills Many a Bill

F IT'S company that drops in for
overnight, or a case of wanting to

"treat" the family, a quick coffee
cake dresses *up almost any break-
fast.
When inspired to bake extra, but

time limits you, then the new self-
rising flour is a good friend. Baking
powder and salt are ready-mixed
into it and evenly, too, so your pre-
cious time is saved. Just mix in fat,
sugar, egg and liquid, and the coffee
cake is ready for the oven.
But here is the exact recipe:

Quick Coffee Cake.
Cut or rub 2 tablespoons fat into

2 cups self-rising flour. Beat 1 egg
with 3 tablespoons sugar, and add
to 3/4 cup milk. Add liquid to flour
mixture, and spread batter in
greased pan (layer should be
inch thick). Cover with top mixture
and bake in hot oven (400 degrees
F.) about 15 minutes.

Top Mixture for Coffee Cake.
Rub 4 tablespoons butter into 1

tablespoon self-rising flour, 1/2 cup
sugar (confectioner's or granulated),
and 1 teaspoon cinnamon. Press 2
dozen raisins into batter at regulai
intervals, and sprinkle sugar mix-
ture over top.
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JESUS TEACHES FORGIVENESS
AND GRATITUDE

LESSON TEXT—Luke 17:1-4, 11-19.
GOLDEN TEXT—Be ye kind one to an-

other. tenderhearted, forgiving one another,
even as God for Christ's sake hath forgiven
you.—Ephesians 4:32.

Did you ever hear of "vinegar
saints"? They are the Christian folk
who are "preserved" (as Paul
prayed in I Thess. 5:23), but are
apparently pickled instead of sweet-
ened. Every housewife knows that
things may be preserved with sugar
or with vinegar.
God never intended it to be that

way. All through His Word there are
admonitions and encouragements to
gracious and considerate living. Ev-
ery Christian is under orders to
"grow in grace" as well as in the
knowledge of our Lord Jesus Christ
(II Pet. 3:18). This lesson stresses
two leading Christian graces.

I. Forgiveness—Not Always Easy,
but Always Possible (vv. 1-4).
The Bible is ever realistic in its

approach to life. God knows that
Christians must live in just our kind
of world; in fact, your kind of world,
and makes provision for it.
Offenses cannot be avoided. There

will always be occasions for stum-
bling. No matter how closely we
may guard our children, they will
face temptations. Let us prepare
them to meet them with the power
of Christ, and let us be so prepared
ourselves.
The fact that offenses must come

does not excuse the one who creates
the cause of stumbling. Someone is
responsible for every such occasion
for offense, and the woe of God is
pronounced upon him.
What shall I do about the one who

thus tempts me and others? Just
grieve over it and look the other
way? No indeed. "Rebuke him,"
says God's Word. Let us do it! If
he does not repent, there is no oc-
casion for forgiveness. To do so
would only encourage him in his sin.
If he repents, or even says he

repents, we are to forgive, not just
once, but over and over again (v.
4). That's not easy for any of us,
but it is possible if we, like the dis-
ciples (see v. 5), ask God to "in-
crease our faith," and use it as
Jesus directs in verse 6.

II. Gratitude—the Almost Forgot-
ten Christian Grace (vv. 11-19).
Nine men wonderfully healed of

the dreadful disease of leprosy, and
only one said, "Thank you," to, Je-
sus, "and he was a Samaritan," an
outsider or stranger. One wonders
whether in our own day of professed
enlightenment and culture the aver-
age of those who express their grat-
itude would even reach one-tenth.
"Gratitude is as scarce as friend-

ship." Many there are who profess
to be Christians who never offer
praise to God for the provision of
their daily food, let alone for all
other temporal and spiritual bless-
ings. The kindness of friends is
taken for granted. The thoughtful-
ness of others is accepted without
comment.
Have you told your minister that

you appreciate his sermons and his
ministry in the community? Does
:your Sunday School teacher know
that you have received help and
blessing in the class? Does the edi-
tor of this paper know that you en-
joy and appreciate this column? If
you do, why not encourage him by
calling him on the telephone or writ-
ing him a note to tell him so?
Young people, have you ever said

.a real heart-felt "thank you" to your
father or mother for all they have•
done for you? Perhaps some older
sister or brother or school teacher
or neighbor would be greatly heart-
ened by such a word from you.
Someone may say, "I am grate-

ful, but I am not the type that
talks about it." One wonders wheth-
er Henry Van Dyke was not right
when he said, "A dumb love is ac-
cepted only from the lower ani-
mals." A dog will show his thank-
fulness by wagging his tail, but a
man has a tongue with which to say
kind and tender words of apprecia-
tion to both God and man.
Most important of all, let us bear

in mind that God awaits our words
of praise. Christ valued the words
of gratitude of this man and missed
them from the nine others. When
He was in Simon's home (Luke 7:
44-46), He gently rebuked His host
for failing to show him the ordinary
courtesies of the household.

Appreciate Beauty
Never lose an opportunity of see-

ing anything beautiful—welcome it
in every fair face, every fair sky,
every fair flower and thank Him ior
It who is the fountain of all loveli-
ness; and drink it simply and ear-
nestly with all your eyes; it is a
charmed draught, a cup of blessing.
—Kingsley.

Bible Is Valuable Guide
I have read it (the Bible) through

many times; I now make a practice
-of going through it once a year; it
is a book of all others for lawyers
as well as divines, and I pity the
man who cannot find in it a rich
supply of thought and rule for con-
duct—Daniel Webster.

Yuma, Arizona, Dryest,
Oregon State Wettest

When the weather bureau reports
half an inch of rainfall in a day, it
may not sound like a great deal, but
it takes a heavy rain to make that
much.
Half an inch of rain over one

acre of ground amounts to about
14,000 gallons! The weight of that
many gallons is more than 56 tons.
If half an inch of rain falls in an

area of a square mile, it means
about 36,000 tons of water tumbling
down.
Some deserts of the earth may

have less than an inch of rain in a
whole year. There are not many
such deserts, however. Most of them
have at least a few inches. When
rain does come on a desert, it may
pour down with great force.
Yuma, Ariz., is dry most of the

time. Its average rainfall is only
about a quarter of an inch in a
month. Yet there was a time in
1921 when Yuma had more than
31/2 inches of rain in the space of
24 hours!
A rainfall map of North America

shows a broad belt of land which
reaches from the western side of
Hudson Bay down into Mexico, and
which has less than 20 inches of
rain in a year. That belt includes
a great deal of the prairie land in
Canada and the United States.
Most other parts of this continent

have more rain. The eastern half of
North America has an average of
about 35 inches per year, or nearly
three inches per month.
The wettest parts of North Amer-

ica include certain sections of Brit-
ish Columbia and the states of Wash-
ington and Oregon. The rainfall in
those sections is above 80 inches
per year. Tillemook county, Ore-
gon, has about 130 inches each year.
Although the torrid zone has most

of the very wet spots, the wettest
of all is a little above the northern
limit of that zone. It is in the
Himalaya mountains, about 150
miles north of Calcutta, India. This
"wettest of all spots" has about 400
inches of rain each year.

Salmon Travels Plenty,
Always Comes Back Home
While salmon are in the ocean

they usually do not go more than
40 or 50 miles away from the mouth
of the river by which they entered.
This is a general rule, but it does
not always hold true.
Salmon have been caught from

200 to 500 miles out to sea!
Sooner or later a salmon goes

back to fresh water. Most often
it returns to the river in which it
was hatched. Reaching fresh wa-
ter, it start.s upstream.
The fish eats little if anything in

the river. Its body contains a store
of fat, and this serves to supply
food during the weeks or months it
is on the way.
A waterfall in the river may be

in the way of the salmon, but it
has fine leaping power. It can jump
six or seven feet high to get over
a waterfall.
Many rivers have cascades, which

rise in a river bed, one after an-
other. Reaching a cascade, the sal-
mon may make jump after jump
until it reaches the top. Then it
goes on with its upstream journey.
When salmon rivers are dammed,

the government takes special steps.
"Fish ladders," which are stairways
of a sort, may be provided, or the
salmon may be taken out of the
river in nets and then transported
by trucks to a point above the dam.
It is ever so important to help

salmon get past the dam. Other-
wise the next year's hatch would
be spoiled, and the salmon industry
would suffer a blow.
Journeys of great length are made

by some salmon. Those which go
up the Yukon river often travel a
distance of more than 2,000 miles.

Librarian 6 Aed Barrel
Restocks Shelves Quickly
WEST HARTFORD, CONN.—Li-

brary officials felt that many per-
sons neglected to return over-due
books because they were embar-
rassed in having kept them so long.
So, they placed a little red barrel
on the library steps and announced
that delinquents could return the
books at night, without being seen,
without paying a fine, and no ques-
tions asked.
In two weeks $120 worth of books,

some of them taken out more than
eight years ago, were dropped into
the barrel. One book was "bor-
rowed" in 1919.

Billion Meals
A billion appetizing meals are

served to guests of America's hotels
annually, 220,000,000 more are
served to their army of employees,
which constitutes a major part of
the hotel business which makes it
"America's Seventh Son."

Stars Not Five Pointed
The stars do not in reality have

five points. The apparent points
of stars when seen by the naked eye
are due merely to scintillation which
arises from inequalities of the
earth's atmosphere.

No Flag in 1777
The continental congress intro-

duced the flag resolution in 1777,
but the nation didn't have an all-
American flag over the Capitol un-
til 1866. English-made cloth was
used before that.

X-Ray an Aid Juicy Fruit Roll

In Treating "Makes" the Meal

Sinus Trouble
By DR. JAMES W. BARTON

ONE day you may read of
the great success certain

specialists have had in the treat-
ment of chronic sinus ailments
by use of X-rays
and of how the
clearing up of the
sinus infection has
resulted in greatly
improved hearing
of the patient. The specialist in
this case has treated a number
of cases and had cured or
helped the majority of them.
Perhaps the next day you read of

another specialist using X-ray treat-
ment in the same
number of cases
without any success
whatever.
Now there would

appear to be some-
thing wrong when
one specialist gets
good results from a
method of treatment
and another gets no
satisfactory results
whatever.
Dr. E. Trible Gate-

wood, Richmond, in
Archives of Otolaryngology (ear and
throat) reports the study of 22 cases
of chronic sinus infection (sinusitis)
before and after treatment by
X-ray. Four patients of the group
showed complete relief of symptoms
and eight were improved as far
as their symptoms were concerned.
Ten patients were not helped at all.

Why were some of these cases
cured, some improved and others not
helped at all?

Ventilation of Sinus Needed.

It depends upon the condition of
the lining or mucous membrane of
the sinus. When this has become
very .thick or hardened, the X-ray
(in the dosage given anyway) was
unable to penetrate or restore it to
normal. If this lining can be re-
stored to normal, the sinus can be
properly ventilated. A well-ventilat-
ed sinus gives no trouble, as the air
destroys harmful organisms and, if
lining is not swollen and thickened,
the sinus can drain properly into
the nose and throat.

Another point about the success
or nonsuccess of X-ray treatment
of sinus infection is that X-ray spe-
cialists are not agreed as to the
"dose" of X-rays that should be
given or how often.

Sufferers with chronic sinus dis-
ease who have tried without suc-
cess all the usual methods of treat-
ment—sprays of adrenalin up the
nose, washing out with salt and wa-
ter, injections of ovary extracts—
can finally try X-ray treatment.
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* * *

How to Relax
And Go to Sleep
A PHYSICIAN is often asked by

adult patients as to the length
of time they should sleep, and his
answer in most cases is that eight
hours is about right.

Two cases often cited are Thomas
Edison, who slept about four hours
at night, and Woodrow Wilson, who
required nine or ten. Most people
forget that Edison was hard of
hearing, and so when he slept he
was not disturbed by noises low or
loud, strange or familiar.

It is being able to keep body and
mind relaxed that prevents us from
becoming tired too soon. A com-
pletely relaxed body and mind is
getting 80 per cent as much rest
as if it were asleep; that is, from
the standpoint of heart rate, breath-
ing, temperature and blood pres-
sure.
When the physician wants the pa-

tient to relax completely so that
an examination of the abdomen can
be made he asks him to hold his
mouth open and breathe slowly
through the mouth. This relaxes
the body and, to a considerable ex-
tent, the mind also.

Relaxation is the exact opposite
of tenseness. To relax requires no
effort. It means to "let loose," to
stop doing. In learning to relax a
person learns to recognize tense-
ness wherever it occurs in the body.
By letting each part of the body go
limp or loose—legs, arms, trunk—
one after the other or all together,
tenseness of body disappears and
with it often tenseness or alertness
of mind.
Sometimes when there is no noise,

no light, no draft, no heat or cold
keeping you awake, try lying on ei-
ther side with arms and legs bent
and your mouth loose and open. You
may snore, but you should get off
to sleep.

QUESTION BOX

Q.—Would prostate gland trouble
have any unfavorable congenital ef-
fect on a child? Is it possible to cure
prostate gland trouble?
A.—If prostate trouble is simply

an enlargement of the gland this
could not affect a baby born to you.
If infection is present treatment by
a specialist is usually necessary.
Sometimes it is necessary to remove
prostate gland. Don't hesitate to
speak to your family physician
about it.

WHEN  the family tires of ber-
ries plain and berries fancy,

try a new trick. It's raspberry roll
which folds juicy raspberries in a
crisp pastry. It's delicious, you'll
agree.
An aid to shorter hours indoors is

the new self-rising flour which
makes hot biscuits, cakes and des-
serts in two shakes. The baking
powder and salt are ready-mixed
into it, thus a double saving of (1)
price of these two ingredients, and
(2) the time of sifting them with
the flour.
Try the new, speed flour in the

following summer dessert:

Raspberry Roll

Make pastry by cutting 1/2 cup fat
into 21/2 cups self-rising flour until
the mixture is thoroughly blended;
adding cold water a little at a time
to make a stiff dough. Roll pastry
in a rectangular shape, keeping it
about 1/2 inch thick. Brush lightly
with 1 egg white diluted in 2 table-
spoons cold water. Spread with 2
cups red raspberries, 1/2 cup sugar,
2 tablespoons butter, and 1 table-
spoon self-rising flour. Roll as for
jelly roll. Wet the edges and press
together to keep in the juice. Brush
top of roll with remaining egg white,
prick with a fork, and place in a
greased dripping pan. Bake in hot
oven (400 degrees F.) for 30 to 40
minutes. Serve with a hard sauce
made by beating 1/2 cup butter to the
consistency of thick cream, sifting
in 11/2 cups confectioner's sugar
slowly, beating until the mass is
fluffy, then adding 1 teaspoon flavor-
ing extract.

Artist, a Refugee From
Europe, in Guard Unit

EL PASO.—A 24-year-old sculptor
who saw Hitler's troops appropriate
Czechoslovakia, the land of his fore-
fathers, is training with the 202d
Coast Artillery regiment of the Illi-
nois National Guard at Fort Bliss.
He is Corp. Joseph Martinek, Bat-

tery D, whose sculptures have been
exhibited at the Chicago Art insti-
tute and other galleries.
Member of a well-to-do Cleveland

family, young Martinek studied at
the Prague School of Applied Arts
from 1934 to 1939. He left six weeks
after the Nazis moved in.

New Floors
Old shellacked floors that are

worn in spots may be renewed by
sandpapering the worn areas with
fine sandpaper, then cleaning the
spot with a cloth, dampened with
alcohol. Two thin coats of shellac
should finally be brushed over the
spot, "fading" the brush strokes
towards the edges where they over-
lap the old shellac. Scratches in
a shellacked floor may be taken
out by simply wiping them with al-
cohol.

The Truth Hurts, but
It's the Only Way Out

TULSA, OKLA.—An attorney was
presented this problem:
"I'm 53 years old," a woman told

him, "but I'm married to a man
who thinks I'm only 39. I've got a
son 36 years old, but to make my
story stick, we dropped some years
off his age.
"Now, my son has to register for

the draft unless he tells his correct
age. If he does that I'll have to
claim he was born when I was three
years old. What shall I do?"
The attorney suggested a family

truth session.

Perfect Bridegroom Is
Utterly Astonished

MEMPHIS, TENN.—The per-
fect bridegroom has appeared.
His handsomely engraved wed-

ding announcements boldly pro-
claimed.
"Frederick Harold Green an-

nounces his utter astonishment at
being accepted in holy matrimo-
ny by the most incomparable Ev-
elyn Estes."

AUTOMOBILE—LIFE INSURANCE
Insure the Farm Bureau, cooperative way—user-owned

protection at economical cost.
ALFRED HELTEBR1DLE

Taneytown, Md. Telephone No. 36-F-11
Representing

FARM BUREAU INSURANCE COMPANIES
Home Office—Columbus, Ohio

Win this Beautiful 1941
Electric Range FREE!

"Says Reddy Kilowatt"
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8 BIG 1VEEKLY SAFETY CONTESTS
FIRST CONTEST CLOSES FEBRUARY 22

GRAND PRIZE
1941

ELECTRIC RANGE

IT'S DST-- BrY
FOLLOW THESE EASY RULES
1, Simply write a letter in 50 additional words
or less, starting with this statement, "1 think an
Electric Range is the safest kind of stove be-
cause - - - - -." Write on one side of a sheet
Of paper. Print plainly your name and (tddress.

2, Mail to Contest Editor, Dep't. , The
Potomac Edison System, Hagerstown, Md. You
can enter these contests as often as you like.
The winner of the grand prize of a 1941 Electric
Range (Model West. AC64, complete with clock
and timer) will be selected from among the win-
ners of the weekly Roaster Prizes. (In case
winners prefer, other electrical appliances equal
in value to the range or roaster, may be selected.)

3. There will be eight weekly contests, each with
a separate prize, of an Electric Roaster (Model
West. RRA81). Opening and closing dates

CONTEST DATES OP EN
F e 
CL
b uOa Sr yE 22

2nd FNerruary 23
1st

3rd 
March 81

March 2
March IS

5th 
4th March 9

March 16 March 22
6th March 23 Marchpri  529
7th March 30 

A 

8th April 6 April 12
4. Entries will be entered In the contest for
which they are received. Final entries must be
postmarked before midnight Saturday, April 12,
1911. and must be received by April 18, 1941.

5, Entries will be judged for originality, sin-
cerity and aptness of thought. The judges' deci-
sion will be final. Entries, contents and ideas
therein, become the property of The Potomac
Edison System. Contests subject to all Federal
and State regulations.
6. Anyone may compete except employes of The
Potomac Edison System and their families.

7. The names of the winners of each of the
weekly contests and of the grand prize will be
announced In this paper as soon after the close
of each of the contests as possible, and the win-
ners will also be notified by mall.

OR ITS EQUIVALENT IN

OTHER ELECTRICAL APPLIANCES

AWARDED AT
CLOSE OF CONTESTS

--1011111C TO SELL
J UST write a letter, in fifty additional words or less,

starting with this statement, "I THINK AN

ELECTRIC RANGE IS THE SAFEST KIND OF

STOVE BECAUSE . . . ."

This is your chance to win kitchen ease, comfort, beauty
and safety for yourself and your family in the form
of a beautiful new Electric Range. All the money
saving, time saving, health protecting and safety
features of modern Electric Cookery can be yours
if you win this simplest and easiest of all contests.

Even if your entry doesn't win the grand prize, you have
eight opportunities to win one of the beautiful auto-
matic Electric Roasters, which are really miniature
electric ranges themselves.

And remember—if you are a winner and prefer to—
you have the privilege of selecting other electric
appliances equal in value to those announced.

There's nothing to buy and nothing to •sell, no coupons
to clip or enclose. Just follow the easy rules at the
left. It isn't the elaborateness of your entry that
counts—it's the sincerity, originality and aptness of
thought.

Anyone can enter and you can enter as many contests
as you wish as many times as you wish. If you
want to find out more about the safety features of
the Electric Range, your OW7I Electric Range dealer
will be glad to explain them. So don't lose time!
Enter today! Enter every contest!

POTOMAC EDISON CO.



HOMEMAKERS' CLUB MEET.

The February meeting of the Home
makers' Club took place on the after-
noon of February 13, at the home of
Mrs. Robert Smith. After being
called to order by the singing of
"The Star-Spangled Banner," the
meeting proceeded in the usual order.
The demonstration concerned econo-
my meals and nutrition and was giv-
en by Mrs. Joseph Elliot, who had
prepared a single dish meal which
was sampled by the members.
The flome-makers' wish to take

this opportunity to thank all those
who so generously and willingly help-
ed them in the drive for funds for the
Library. In particular, for their
generous donations, we thank the
Kiwanis and Chamber of Commerce
as well as those persons who gave in-
dividual donations. For the use of
the Municipal Building for practic-
ing, we extend our gratitude to the
Taneytown Volunteer Firemen. Our
appreciation of the cooperation of the
High School, the members of tha cast
of "Bubbling Over," of the choruses,
is extreme, and we thank the yner-
chants for their consideration. Upon
discussion of the drive at the meeting
the members were all in accord as to
the splendid cooperation which they
received.
The meeting was adjourned to

meet again in March.

KIW ANIS CLUB HOLDS ITS AN-
NUAL VALENTINE PARTY.

The annual Valentine party of the
Taneytown Kiwanis Club was held in
connection with the weekly meeting
of the Club, on Wednesday evening,
Feb. 12, at 6 o'clock, at Sauble's Inn.
President Harry M. Mohney presided.
Club singing was in charge of M.C.

HIGH SCHOOL BASKET BALL.

The Taneytown High School bask-
et ball team seemed to hit their stride
this week when they defeated the
Emmitsburg High School five 24-4 on
Monday, Feb. 3. Taneytown had
previously beaten Emmitsburg by 3
points in Taneytown, but the team
seemed to click better when they got
away. Taneytown led 16-1 at the
half time.
On Feb. 5, Taneytown boys, play-

ed Littlestown on the home floor. Lit-
tlestown is regarded as a far better
team than any which had been meet
before. The game was close in all
periods until the last, when Taney-
town opened up. At half-time the
score was knotted at 16 all. At the
three-quarter mark Littlestown lead
for the first time 23-22. The last
period had no sooner started when
the town boys dropped two to take
the lead never to be headed again.

This victory the fifth out of six. In
the preliminary games the girls won
from Emmitsburg 33-24. They were
beaten by Littlestown on Feb. 5, by
the score of 31-22.
Next week the teams travel to Un-

ion Bridge and Hampstead. The box
scores are:

Taneytown High School (Bays)

F—Crapster, M 3
F— Kelly
C—Harner
C—Wantz
G—Hitchcock 3   6
G—Crapster L
G—Moose

Emmitsburg High School

F—Topper
F—Joy
F—O'Donoghue
F—Ro sen steel

• Fuss, chairman of the music commit- C—Bealltee. Mrs. Wallace Yingling accom- G—Rowe
panied at the piano. G—McNulty
There was present in all fifty-seven G—Walters

members, visitors and guests. The
guest of honor was Osborne Beall,
Lieutenant-Governor of the Sixth
Division of the Capital District. Vis-
itors included Mrs. Mary Mohney,
Misses Mary Lou Essig, Mary Evalyn
Jenkins, Jean Mohney, Virginia Bow-
er, Mary Gilbert, Messrs Elmer Hahn
and John Green.
The program was in charge of the

House and Reception Committee,Ray-
mond Wright, chairman. Mrs. John
Green gave two readings, "Mrs. Lock
gets some Salt" and "Scrumptuous
Wedding."
A play entitled "Who's Cruise,"

was presented by a cast consisting of
Mr. and Mrs. Lester Grossnickle, Mr.
Thurston Foutz, Mr. and Mrs. Paul
Niswander and Mr. and Mrs. Paul
Bowman.
The program next week will be in

charge of the Citizenship Committee,
Prof. Milton Terry, chairman and will
be designated as "Patriotic Night."
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MARRIAGE LICENSES.

Thomas N. Flater and Gertrude V.
Hall, Finksburg, Md.
Woodrow W. Martz and Irene M.

Sanders, New Oxford, Pa.
Rowland F. Ely and Hilda G. Mc-

Daniel, Sykesville, Md.
Woodrow S. Weller and Genevieve

Utz, Westminster, Md.
Lewis I. Shaffer and Helen H.

Veselovsky, Lineboro, Md.
Raymond E. Baugher and Helen L.

Dickensheets, Hanover, Pa.
Charles L. Beeler and Thelma R.

Oarbaugh, Quincy, Pa.
Harry T. Brown, Jr., and Annabell

V. Sipes, Sykesville, Md.
Wm. S. Hudson and Virginia

Brightful, Henryton, Md.
Lawrence E. Spangler and Evelyn

H. Sweigert, Waynesboro, Pa.
Charles R. Bast and Pauline D.

Ragood, Washington, D. C.

Shaum's Specials
2 14-oz Bottles Red Glo Catchup 17c
3 Boxes XXXX Sugar 20c
10 Ms Sugar 47c
2 Boxes Dutch Cleanser 15c
2 Boxes Auna Jemima Buckwheat

25c
21c
19c
16c
22c
41c
17c
Sc

Flour
1 Qt. Jar Sweet Pickles
2 22-oz Happy Family Spaghetti
3 Boxes My-T-Fine Pie Filling
3 Cans Tall Pet Milk
2 Boxes Ralston Cereal
Large Box Cut Rite Wax Paper
1 40-ft. Box Cut Rite Wax Paper
2 Cans Franco American Spa-

ghetti 17c
1 lb Maxwell House Coffee 27c
1 lb Norwood Coffee 24c
2 16-oz Cans Hershey's Chocolate

Syrup 17c
9 lbs Jelly Eggs 19c
4 Cakes Woodbury's Soap 25c

\LJ
\

LUX reg.
RINSO reg.
LUX Tat;
LIFEBUOY

Package 21c

2 Packages 35c

3 Cakes 17c

3 Cakes 17c

SILVER DUST
WITH CANNON
DISH TOWEL 21c

3 lb, Can 47c
-0 Large Juicy Oranges 25c
Grapefruit 4, 6 and 8 for 25c
10 lb Bag Onions 27c
1 Doz Large Juicy Lemons 20c
2 Ms New Peas 25c
2 Stalks Celery 15c
2 lbs Home-made Pudding 25e
Home-made Fresh Sausage 20c lb
Fresh Picnic Hams 18c lb

Don't forget to ask for your S&H
Green Trading Stamps and Book. It
will pay you to trade with us.

Save Monev As You, Spend It
F. E. SHAUNI
Meats and Groceries

Phone 54-R

TANEYTOWN, MD.

9 3
3

1

6
7
6

2
1

1

Taneytown High School (Boys)

F—Crapster, M.
F—Kelly
C—Harner
G—Hitchcock
G—Crapster, L.

Littlestown High

F—Weaver
F—Wilt
F—Thomas
F—Basehoar
C—Ebaugh
C—Bloser
G—Harner, H.
G—Stine
G—DeHoff
G—Harner, A.

 tt 

8
6
3

1 1
1 17
1 13
4 10

School (Boys)

2 4

1 2

3 2 8
2
1

4
2

3 1 7

TANEYTOWN INDUSTRIAL

LEAGUE.

LEAGUE STANDING.

Name W.
Chamber Commerce 32
Baumgardner Bakery 28
Blue Ridge Rubber Co 25
Model Steam Bakery 23
Industrial Farmers 17
Vol. Fire Co. 16

L. PC
16 666
17 622
23 520
22 511
31 354
32 333

NEXT WEEK GAMES.
Moday. Feb. 17, Blue Ridge Rubber

Co. vs Vol. Fire Co.; Model Steam
Bakery vs Industrial Farmers.
Tuesday, Feb. 18, Chamber of Com-

merce vs Baumgardner Bakery.
Note: Baumgardner Bakery and

Model Steam Bakery failed to play
this week on account of sickness.
These games will be played at any
time the two teams agree.

Blue Ridge Rubber Co:

J. Bricker
N. Welty
H. Albaugh
D. Nelson
H. Baker

104
103
96
99
99

111
117
81
99
94

103
131
1,11
97
107

318
351
288
295
300

Totals 501 502 549 1552

Chamber of Commerce:

M. Feeser 104 123 105 332
P. Bollinger 102 91 78 271
H. Royer 125 91 105 321
M. Dahoff 94 99 193
T. Tracey 129 101 138 368
C. Eckard 105 105

Totals 554 505 531 1590

Industrial Farmers:

S. Harmer
V. Flickinger
D. Baker
R. Haines
K. Stonesifer
W. Copenhaver

99
98
118
116
100

93
131
95
118
97

96
82
132
94
90

195
273
381
305
308
97

Totals 531 534 494 1559
Vol. Fire Co.

T. Riffle
'F. Bower
T. Putman
C. Foreman
G. Crebs

120
83
115
104
101

105
106
100
89
123

78
101
106
132
91

303
290
321
325
315

Totals 523 523 508 1554

A DREAM HIGHWAY.

And so, we are now told in the Ma-
ryland Motorist that a ̀ Dream High-
way' is being planned by State Road
officials.

It would be another highway con-
necting Baltimore and Washington,
the present highway having had the
highest accident record in the state—
an average. of over 40 being killed
each year in the state.
The cost of this dream highway

would be about $12,000,000. In con-
nection with this outlay, the Mary-
land motorist says:
"A full three weeks after Gov.

Herbert R. O'Conor repudiated the
salient feature of a report prepared
by the State highway planning sur-
vey (to reduce Baltimore's share of
the State gasoline tax), a letter giv-
ing the report the "wholehearted in-
dorsement" of Thomas H. McDonald,
Federal Commissioner of Public
Roads, was presented to the Legisla-
ture.

Confronted with the need of spend-
ing some $3,000,000 on roads to
handle the traffic pouring in and out
of the Glenn Martin Company air-
plane plant, the State Roads Commis-
sion has opened negotiations to ob-
tain Federal aid."

A GOOD INVESTMENT.

Have you invested in a smile?
Do you think the thing worthwhile?
Wipe out that frown from off the face
It looks not well, fits not your grace.
When you arise from bed each day
What do you do? Or curse, or pray?
If you would lead a happy life,
Freed from Malice, Envy, Strife,
You should begin each new-born day
With thoughts of Love, and how to

pray.
If this New Year we'd all resolve
To live in .peace, bound round by love
We'd find the world a bully place
Chock full of peace and boundless

grace. W. J. 1-1. 12-24-40.

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned will sell at public

sale along the Littlestown and Tan.
eytown road, on
WEDNESDAY, MARCH 5, 1941,

at 12 o'clock, the following personal
property:
10 HEAD HORSES AND MULES,
Kate, a gray mule, 12 years old, extra
good leader; Pearley, 6 years old, good
leader, in foal; Prince, 11 years old,

gif
good leader; Bell, 11 years
old, extra good leader, and
in foal; Diamond, 12 years

old, off-side worker, and in foal by a
jack; Queen, 6 years old, worked in
the lead some; Sam, 6 years old, off-
side worker; Tom, 18 months old;
Helen, 18 months old; Samuel Arthur
blooded, good rider and worker in all
harness and good driver.

25 HEAD OF CATTLLE,
Jersey cow, has her 6th. calf; black
cow, 3rd calf by her side; Guernsey
cow, 6 calves, fresh in the Fall; white
cow, 6th calf sold off; black cow, 4th.
calf in the Fall; Guernsey cow. 3rd.
calf by her side; Holstein
cow, carrying 2nd. calf, in
Fall; Belted cow, 4th. calf
sold off; Red cow, heavy springer,
4th. calf; 'Guernsey cow, fresh in the
Fall, 3rd. calf; Red cow, fresh, early
Fall, 4th. calf; black cow, heavy
springer, 4th. calf; Holstein cow,,
fresh by day of sale; Holstein heifer,
bred; 2 Guernsey Bulls, big enough
for service; Holstein bull, big enough
for service; Registered Holstein bull,
blue roan heifer, bred; 2 Guernsey
heifers, bred; 2 Guernsey and 1 Hol-
stein heifers, 1 Holstein Heifer, 2nd.
calf in the Fall. All cows are T. B.
tested.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.
corn cutter, Osborne binder, in good
condition: 2 corn plows, and many
other articles not mentioned.

TERMS---Sums of $10.00 and under,
cash. Sums above $10.00 a credit of 6
months will be given purchaser or pur-
chasers with security, bearing interest
from day of sale. No goods to be remo:-
ed until settled for.

HARRY 0. FOGLE.
HARRY TROUT, Auct.
CARL HAINES, Clerk.
Huckstering is positively not allow-

ed.
Served by the Edgewood Church.

2-14-3t

RAILROAD CONDUCTOR KILLED

Michael F. Figley, of Hagerstown,
a W. M. R. R. conductor was killed
on Wednesday by a helper locomo-
tive in the yard at Union Bridge, be-
fore his freight train was scheduled
to leave for- Hagerstown.

Both of Frigley's legs were cut off
when he stepped in the way of the
helper after he apparently failed to
hear the whistle of the helper engine. M

In Hindustan a copper cent is called
a "damn." From this probably came
the expression, "It isn't worth a con-
tinental."
 Sit —

There is no such thing as idle cu-
riosity—all curiously is busy.

"How old are you my little man"
asked an old gentleman of a little tot.
"I'm not old at all" said Teddie "I'm
almost new."

TANEYTOWN GRAIN MARKET.

Wheat   .89@ .89
Corn    .65@ .65

"TRY THE DRUG STORE FIRST"

CURE THAT COLD
Buy Our

Cough Syrup

Cold Tablets
Throat Lozenges

Nose Drops

HAND LOTIONS, 10c up
Keep your hands soft

and smooth with these

new hand lotions.

Bring your

MAGAZINE SUBSCRIPTIONS
to US.

McKINNEY'S PHARMACY

I

•

•

•

•

•

Annual Firemen's Supper

TANEYTOWN, MD.

Saturday, February 22, 1941

SUPPERS SERVED FROM 4 TO 8 P. M.

in Firemen's Building

OYSTER AND CHICKEN

Games and Entertainment

New Westinghouse

;41/1144010.5,47er

ONLY S1.50 per week
Full 6-cubic foot Family Size,
with thrifty Economizer
Mechanism ... sturdy All-
Steel Cabinet ... big San-
alloy Super Freezer with
quick-release Select-o-Cube
Trays. See this GREAT
VALUE today!

C1 0. FUSS 8b SON
Taneytown, Md,

1DR-4214---140

CIE ELECTRIC HOME APPLIANCES
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FOR whatever purpose you need

money, you'll find that it pays to

borrow at this bank. We'll be girt('

to discuss your money problem ;.-.17.0

to help you, if we can, with crfAlit.

THE TANEYTOWN SAVINGS:BANK
(Member of The Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation)
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"DRAFTED
*oa '•%:0, ft .4):=04&*DOLLARS"
MONEY "AT YOUR COMMAND"
WHEN YOU PAY BY CHECK

Dollars in a checking account are like
disciplined troops ready to obey your
orders. But you do not have to bark
commands. You write your orders — on
checks. Your dollars march — but you
don't have to march with them. You
are in complete command of your fi-
nancial resources. Yet you can remain
at "headquarters," which means wher-
ever you happen to be with your check
book at hand.

Service, safety, and convenience like
this make a checking account something
worth having to any man or woman.

MEMBER FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORPORATION

The Birnie Trust Company
TANEYTOWN, MARYLAND.
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MA DE ce
THE TOMATASTER WAY

For gala breakfasts or when friends
flock in for Sunday night waffle sup-
pers, this beautiful Toastmaster Waffle
Service will be the center of attraction
Complete with beautifully grained
walnut serving tray, handsome tur-
quoise batter bowl and syrup pitcher,
graceful chromium ladle which measures just one
waffle, and the famous Toastmaster auto  616 95
matic Waffle Baker  

TOASTMASTER AUTOMATIC WAFFLE BAKER

Completely automatic produces just-right waffles
quicker and easier Heavy non-overflow grids prevent
batter running over — signal light tells el 2 95
when to pour and when waffle is done. I

A.


