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TEACHERS AND PUPILS
IN MARYLAND.

Salaries Paid, and Average Attend-
ance, City and Counties,

According to a statement in the
Baltimore Sun, made by Albert S.
Cook, State Superintendent of Edu-
cation, for the year ending June, 1925,
the sum of $10,129,534 was paid to
public school teachers, of which
$4,680,338 was spent in the counties.
The average annual salary paid a
teacher in the white High Schools of
the counties was $1485, an increase of
$8.00 over the previous year. Balti-
more county led the list with an av-
erage of $1841, and Caroline was the
lowest with an average of $1246.
The average salary for teachers in

elementary schools in the counties
was $1057, and in Baltimore city
$1592.
"Size of class has a marked effect

on expenditures and the cost of edu-
cating each pupil," Dr. Cook declared.
"Large classes are less expensive, be-
cause they require the services of
fewer teachers. With the same total

expenditure for salaries in two school
systems of equal size organized with
large and small classes, the former
could afford to pay higher salaries to
each teacher. Teachers with more
preparation and experience could be
attracted to such a system."
In Maryland county white high

schools, there was a teacher for every
twenty pupils "belonging," the term
"belonging" designating the children
of legal compulsory school attendance
age, exclusive of transients, for
whom the school is "responsible."
The range was from thirty-five to

a teacher in Charles county to four-
teen in Kent. As an average, high
school classes in the counties were
slightly larger in 1924-1925 than dur-
ing the preceding year. The white
senior high schools in Baltimore had
an average of twenty-four pupils en-
rolled for each teacher and principal
in 1925 as compared with twenty-six
pupils for the previous year.
The average number "belonging"

for each teacher in county white ele-
mentary schools in 1925 was 32.1, an
increase of .6 over the year before.
Baltimore county led with an average
of forty pupils in each class. Other
counties adjacent to large cities or
having a large proportion of urban
population follow with an average
numbering "belonging" ranging from
thirty-three to thirty-six pupils for
each teacher.
In rural schools having one teacher

instructing the six or seven elementary
grades, each teacher had on the aver-
age twenty-five pupils which was the
same as the average for 1924.

Schools with more than one teacher
showed slight increases in the number
of pupils taught by each teacher. The
two-teacher schools had 29.7 pupils
for each teacher in 1924 and 30.4 in
1925. In 1925 the range in average
number of pupils for each teacher in
two-teacher schools was from 25.5 to
34.3. In graded schools, having three
or more teachers, the average for each
teacher in the counties was 37.6
pupils. Baltimore county, with 43.2
pupils "belonging" for each teacher,
had the largest classes, while Carroll
county had the smallest classes, there
being only 30.7 pupils for each
teacher.

The Senior Class Play "Esmeralda."

Those who heard "Esmeralda" the
four-act play at the Opera House,
last Friday and Saturday evenings,
presented by the Senior Class of the
High School, greatly enjoyed the
excellent rendition. There was not a
weak spot in the cast. The prepara-
tion of the play required close study,
not only of the spoken parts, but as
they should be rendered as fitted to
actual characters. It was a fine piece
of work.
The piano prelude by Miss Mary

Shriver, and the vocal interludes by
Delmont Koons, Miss Marion Hitch-
cock, Miss Leah Catharine Reindollar
and Robert Baumgardner, were also
most enjoyable features of the eve-
ning. The cast of characters was as
follows;
Mr. Elbert Rogers, a N. Carolina farmer,

Ira Witherow
Mrs. Lydia Ann Rogers, his wife

Margaret Crouse
Miss Esmeralda Rogers, his daughter

Helen E. Roop
Dave Hardy, a young N. Carolinian

David Hess
Mr. Estabrook, a man of leisure

Ralph Baumgardner

Mrs. Jack Desmond, an American Artist
in Faris, George Lambert

Miss Nora Desmond, his sister
Ida Edwards

Miss Kate Desmond, his sister
Helen Eyler

"Marquis" de Montessin, a French Ad-
venturer, Charles Reason

George Drew, an American Speculator.
Kenneth Gilds

No Radio from Chicago on Monday
Nights.

Operators of Chicago Radio broad-
casting stations, by mutual agree-
ment, backed by "listeners in," are
closed every Monday night. This is
for the purpose of permitting resi-
dents of the city to get long-distance
programs, without interference from
the many local stations of the city.
Not only city stations, but those with-
in a radius of twenty-five miles, stay
off the air Monday nights. The plan
is working so well that other large
cities may adopt a "silent night"
agreement.
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One of the earliest strikes on rec-
ord was in 1679 when a company of
knitters and makers of silk stockings
in England agreed not to work for a
month, in order to keep up their prices

BEWARE OF STOCK SWINDLES.

Over a Billion Dollars lost Last Year
in Stock Taking.

The Public Ledger, Philadelphia, is
engaged in a campaign against worth-
less securities. The cause is, that
fully one-billion of dollars were lost
last year in fake investments prom-
ising high rates of interest—"get
rich quick" schemes. It is aiming to
help the government to weed out
these schemes by attempting to warn
the public to beware of all high rate
of interest propositions.
The Ledger will run a series of

warnings on the menace of the "white
collar bandits," crooked promoters
and fake security salesman. The first
article appeared in Monday's issue,
and contained the following letter
from Andrew W. Mellon, Secretary of
the Treasury:
"It is of the utmost importance

that the people of this country be
protected against fraudulent schemes
of investment. Each year large sums
are taken in exchange for worthless
securities.

Unfortunately the promoters of
fraudulent enterprises usually prey
upon the small investors who can
least afford to risk their savings.
The wage earner and the small-sala-
ried man must provide out of their
earnings for the years in which their
earning capacity will be diminished.
Furthermore, these are the people
who are largely responsible for the
normal steady demand for the prod-
ucts of the country's principal in-
dustries.

If this class of investors are de-
frauded of their savings, their pur-
chasing power is diminished, poverty
is increased, thrift is discouraged,
and the Government is weakened by
the partial destruction of one of its
greatest financial assets, which is the
ability of its own people to finance
its loans.
To prevent the demoralizing effects

of blue-sky operations, the Govern-
ment has exercised the full power of
its regulatory organizations, but ex-
perience shows that, despite many
prosecutions and convictions of pro-
moters of fraudulent securities, the
successful eradication of this evil de-
pends largely on the education of the
public.
That is why the Treasury Depart-

ment is interested in the movement
now carried on by business organi-
zations and by such publications as
the Public Ledger and the New York
Evening. Post, to inform the public
regarding the subject of thrift and
sound investment. The growth of
such a movement must necessarily be
slow, as are all processes of educa-
tion, but it must be carried forward,
for its success will prove of lasting
benefit to the hanniness and welfare
of the people of the country."

Parent-Teachers' Meeting.

The regular monthly meeting of the
Parent-Teachers' Association will be
held in the Opera House on Feb. 22,
at 8:00 P. M., to which the public is
cordially invited.
The following program will be giv-

en: Two vocal solos, by Miss Estella
Essig; "A Class Rec." by fourteen
5th. and 6th. grade pupils, entitled:
"Columbia and the Thirteen Colonies."
Songs by grades 3 and 4. "A Class
play entitled, "February Birthdays"
by grades 1 and 2. A vocal solo by
Miss Agatha Weant; a class play en-
titled, "Old-fashioned Valentines" by
grades 3 and 4; Valentine songs by
grades 1 and 2; School songs by
grades 1 and 2.
A special feature at this meeting

will be the "Query Box." You are
urged to ask any question you would
like to hear discussed.
Drop your question in the box at the

door; questions 'should be signed, but
the name of the signer will not be
made public. Admission free.

Taneytown Home-maker's Club.

The Taneytown Home-maker's Club
elected the following officers for the
year; Pres., Mrs. John C. Shreeve;
Vice-Pres., Mrs. Geo. Arnold; Sec'y,
Mrs. Harvey Ohler;Treas., Mrs. Wal-
ter Bower; Director, Miss Amelia
Annan; Press Cor., Miss Anna Galt.
Leaders of Departments; Millinery

—Miss Amelia Annan, Mrs. Geo. Ar-
nold; Home Management; Mrs. Wal-
ter Bower, Mrs. Clyde Hesson; Sew-
ing: Mrs. Lavina Fringer, Mrs. Jos.

Elliott.
Food Committee: Miss William

Bricker, Mrs. Curtis Bowers, Mrs.
Norval Shoemaker, Mrs. Harvey Oh-
ler, Mrs. Albertus Riffle, Miss Lou
Reindollar.

Civic Improvement: Miss Anna Galt
Miss Mary Fringer, Mrs. Reuben
Alexander, Miss Ruth Ohler, Mrs.
Geo. Koutz, Mrs. Harry Allison.
Membership: Mrs. Geo. Harner,

Mrs. Geo. Brown, Mrs. Nettie Angell,
Mrs. John Yingling.

Automobile Deaths in January.

Automobiles caused the death of
434 persons in 79 of the cities of the
United States, in January, according
to figures compiled by the Department
of Commerce. Just why all of the
deaths, covering the whole country,
are not compiled, the report does not
state.

A Monster Hog Killed.

J. Abram Dodrer, of Uniontown

district, butchered a male hog, this

week, that weighed 1005 pounds alive,
and dressed 884 pounds. It was about
three years old; Poland China breed,
and was quite a curiosity for the
neighborhood, and likely for the
county.

ANTHRACITE STRIKE IS
FINALLY ENDED.

Work in the Mines Commenced on
Thursday,

The longest coal strike in history
has ended, an agreement having been
reached last Friday. The basis of
agreement is as follows;
A five-year contract, wages to re-

main the same as on August 1, and
not to be changed except by mutual
agreement, or by a board of arbitra-
tion ouside of the industry.
Wages not to be changed until af-

ter Jan. 1, 1927, and then not oftener
than once a year.
When there is failure to agree on

wages, each side shall name three
men outside of the industry. The op-
erators to select one man from the
miners list, and the miners to select
one from the operators list, and these
two shall constitute a board obligated
to reach an agreement within 90 days.
In order to reach an agreement, the
two men may name additional mem-
bers to the board, and in case of an
odd number a majority vote will be
binding.
The question of the check-off of

union dues may be referred to the
Anthracite Board of Conciliation, ex-
clusive of the umpire.
The credit for the agreement is said

to belong to two men only; James J.
Davis, Secretary U. S. Dept. of La-
bor, and William C. Sproul, Pennsyl-
vania's former Governor, with the ap-
proval of the White House. Gov.
Pinchot is not generally given credit
for having had anything to do with it,
and President Coolidge is not claim-
ing any credit.
To the average outsider it is diffi-

cult to see how the miners, especially,
have gained anything; and how the
agreement is to actually mean con-
tinuous work for five years, is also
not clear, for it is altogether unlikely
that wages and the selling prices of
anthracite can remain on present lev-
els, especially considering the inroads
of bituminous coal into the anthra-
cite territory this winter.
The public, however, and especially

the political leaders, are glad the
strike is over; and if the whole truth
be told, the miners themselves are
likely the gladdest of all. But, the big
underlying questions of conflict be-
tween operators and workers; union
demands and the powerlessness of
government to intervene, are all mat-
ters that have simply been laid aside
for the future.
The formal ending of the strike did

not occur until Wednesday when the
twelve negotiations—six on each side
--signed the new five-year agreement.
Work commenced on Thursday, the
mines having been cleaned and made
ready earlier in the week. Coal will
be moving to market, pretty steadily,
next week, to fill accumulated orders.

Heat Plant Explodes.

What might have proven a fatal ac-
cident, occurred last Thursday at the
Strawbridge Home for Boys at Eld-
ersburg, when the furnace in the
building exploded with such force as
to tear out two board partitions.
The superintendent, Miss Stabler,

noticed the furnace was not working
properly, and called a colored man and
woman to go with her to the base-
ment. Nothing noticable was found
wrong, and the three were ascending
the stairway, when Miss Stabler
turned to look back at the furnace,
just as it exploded. The force of the
explosion knocked her to the base-
ment floor and she was badly scalded
about the face and neck. There was
an immediate inrush of water from
the supply tank, which is 20 feet long
by 40 inches in diameter, and, but for
the quick action of the colored help,
she would have been drowned.

Miss Stabler also had a quantity of
dirt blown into her eyes by the force
of the explosion, and, on advice of her
physician, she was sent to Baltimore
for treatment. She is reported resting
comfortably at last accounts.
A force of mechanics was put to

work on the wrecked heating plant as
soon as possible, with the hope of hav-
ing it in operation again in short time.
In the meantime, every effort was
made by those in charge to keep the
orphan boys comfortable.
The accident is supposed to have

been caused by a frozen supply pipe.
There are about twenty small boys in
the Home, and the absence of heat at
this season of the year was serious.—
Sykesville Herald.

Congressman Hill in a Beer Drinking
Wager.

According to the Baltimore Amer-
ican: "The reputation of Baltimore
beer as a potent beverage is at stake
under terms of a challenge accepted every day.
in Congress by Representative John "5—Keep your loud speaker clean.
Philip Hill, Third District, who agreed Use a tooth brush at least twice a day
to drink his fill in a local saloon and and go at least once a year to your
remain sober, or forfeit $100 to the dentist.
Anti-Saloon League of America. "6—Keep your tubes in order. Don't
During a bitter prohibition fight in

the House yesterday, Representative
Thomas L. Blanton, Texas, declared
he could lead the Maryland member
of Congress to a saloon in Baltimore
and feed him beer that "will make
him so drunk he won't remember that
he was even a member of Congress."
Under the wager, if Mr. Hill keeps

sober after drinking all the beer he
can hold, Mr. Blanton will have to
donate $100 to the Association
against the Prohibition Amendment."
Congressman Hill is a candidate

for the Republican Senatorial nomi-
nation, against Senator Weller.

WILL TRY TO PREVENT
R. R. STRIKE.

Congress to Take Prompt j Action
the Coming Week.

Representing quite a contrast to the
way in which Congress acted on the
coal strike, it now intends to take
quick action to prevent the railroad
workers' strike, threatened to take
place in March, unless demands for a
wage increase approximating $1.00
a day for trainmen and conductors,
are met by the Companies.
This action will be the passage of the

Watson-Parker bill, which represents
the first united effort on the part of
railway managers and employes in
support of a legislative plan to settle
their disputes. The bill, modified on-
ly in detail, will be reported to the
House by the Committee on Interstate
and Foreign Commerce and, under an
arrangement made, will come up for
debate and vote Tuesday. The under-
standing is that following action by
the House the Senate will promptly
concur.

Representative James S. Parker, of
New York, chairman of the committee,
says action on the bill is impera-
tive because of threatening aspects of
the wage demands of the railroad la-
bor organizations.
"In view of demands made for wage

increases," he said, "it is highly im-
portant to set up a Government
agency to deal with any emergency
that may arise. If the bill which we
will pass at an early date does nothing
but avert a strike it will be well worth
the time taken in its preparation.
Under its terms railroads and their
employes are morally bound to make
it work."

Hawaiian Student Wins.

A Hawaiian student, John Texeiara,
16 years of age, won the H. S. Fire-
stone Four Year University Scholar-
ship for the best 700 word essay on
"Economics resulting from Highway
Improvement." The winner lives on
the island of Kauai, and had over
200,000 High School contestants from
all of the territory of the United
States. Kauai is 2200 miles west of
the U. S. mainland. The scholarship
is worth over $4000.
The winner says of himself, "I am

the fourth child in a family of ten.
My dad is a common laktoner and
works in the cane fields. For eight
unsteady years I attended public
school in my home town. I graduat-
ed from the sixth grade in 1924 and
in September of the same year I en-
tered Kauai High School which is the
farthest high school in the western
boundary of the United States.

Considering the handicaps of the
winner, and the large number of con-
testants, the performance is a most
remarkable one, especially on such a
subject.

Radio Development.

Outside the realm of fancy there is
nothing in modern science so amazing
as the rapid development of radio. It
has jumped overnight from swaddling
clothes into trousers and in four years
has passed through the field of adven-

a legal holiday the Orphans Court ture to a public utility of importance,
will not be in session. The office will and a social force that permeates
be closed, every part of our daily life.

Largely employed as a medium of
entertainment in the beginning, it is
now being used by the schools to edu-
cate, by the police in apprehension of
criminals, for speedy location of miss-
ing people, weather reports, guidance
of ships, etc.

It has enabled the President of the
United States to address approximate-
ly all the people at one time. Inter-
national relations have been brought
closer, and at home it has done much
to create a sense of national solidarity
even in the most remote settlements.

MR. MALOY FOR GOVERNOR.

Will Candidate Against Governor
Ritchie's Third Term.

William M. Maloy has issued a
statement to the press, in which he
says "Governor Ritchie's announce-
ment of his candidacy for a third term
causes a primary contest, for my
name will be on the ballot in Septem-
ber."
"The Governor is acting strictly

within his personal and individual
rights, though it looks like a pretty
poor performance of party duty. I
have no doubt Senator Weller is sat-
isfied and from the illuminating and
startling comments of Mr. Humphreys
the only Republican candidate for
Governor, as reported in last night's
papers, the rumored but disavowed
"gentleman's agreement" whereby a
Republican Senatorship is attempted
to be traded for a Democratic govern-
ship, is ceasing to be a myth and
fast becoming a fact."
"However, I have no personal com-

plaint. Before I filed my papers I
went to see Governor Ritchie and he
told me it was satisfactory to him for
me to enter as he had not made up
his mind what he would do. He told
me then he would not help me, or any
other of his friends who might enter
the race. I have now been a candi-
date for several months and he now
sees fit to run against me."
"I am surprised that the reasons he

assigns include the "spontaneous"
petitions, because most of the many
signers I have talked with seemed to
be afraid he might run again."
The primary election law was pro-

vided for use and I intend it to sub-
mit to the Democratic party my can-
didacy on certain definite legislature
measures, administrative policies and

to present my ideas and ideals of
what the government of the State of
Maryland should be and do. They

are quite different from those that

have prevailed for the past six years.

I hope the party, to which I have
given loyal support and service for
many years, and the press of the
City and State will give to Governor
Ritchie and me a fair field and an
equal opportunity in the primary
contest.

Proceedings of the Orphans' Court.

Monday, Feb. 15, 1924—Samuel H.
Mayers, administrator of Anamary
Harner, deceased, returned inventory
of personal property and received or-
der to sell same.

Horatio T. Wentz, administrator of
Mary L. Vraf, deceased, settled his
first and final account.
Samuel W. Repp and G. Ernest

Senseney, administrators of Manas-
sah 0. Repp, deceased, settled their
third and final account.

William C. Mathias and L. Etta
Witter, executors of Lydia C. Mathias
deceased, received order to sell per-
sonal property.
Tuesday, Feb. 14, 1926—Franklin

P. Myers, executors of James Henry
Myers, deceased, settled his first and
final account and received order to de-
posit funds for infants.

Letters testamentary on the estate
of Andrew Jackson Skipper, deceas-
ed, were granted unto Charles Carroll
Skipper, who received warrant to ap-
praise personal property and order to
notify creditors.
Note—Monday, Feb. 22, 1926, being

A Health Radiogram.

Radio fans will be interested in the
health message sent out throughout
the State of New York by the New
York State Department of Health,

from station KYH—Keep your health.
The message is relayed to the people
of Maryland by Dr. John S. Fulton,
Director of the Maryland State De-
partment of Health, who cordially
recommends that Marylanders follow
the advice contained in it. Here is
the message:
"Directions:—Use any wave length

suited to your age. If you fade out,
lose your breath easily, or sleep poor-
ly, your wave length is wrong. You
need to reset your health dial. * * *
The human body is like a radio set.
We must be properly equipped and
adjusted all the time; otherwise our
apparatus works poorly and all we
hear is static. Here are seven help-
ful rules to observe:
"1—Keep your instrument proper-

ly set up. Stand upright with your
chin in your chest out and up, and
your stomach in.
"2—Keep your battery working

well. Take care of your heart. Don't
let it get short circuited by rheuma-
tism or any other infection.
"3—Don't shut yourself in an air-

tight cabinet. Tune in with the
oxygen outdoors. Keep your windows
open.
"4—Spread out your antennae.

Swing your arms and legs in the air

abuse your digestive tract or let it
get clogged up. Eat wisely. Drink
plenty of water.
"7—Finally, see that your instru-

ment is given an all-over inspection
often enough to prevent trouble. Have

a health examination by your physi-

cian each year."

In Paris, how to laugh beutifully,
and with ease and grace, is now be-
ing taught in beauty parlors. As this
is "the latest from Paris," the U. S.
is sure to catch it—unless it be true
that we "laugh and grow fat."

A Coolidge Half-dollar.

A Coolidge half-dollar will be coin-
ed as a special piece to commemorate
the 150th. anniversary of the signing
of the Declaration of Independence, to
be used in connection with the Sesqui-
centennial celebration to be held in
Philadelphia, this summer. This will
be the first time that a living Presi-
dent's likeness was ever used on a
coin. There will also be $2.50 gold-
pieces coined.
There will be one million of the

half-dollars and 250,000 of the $2.50
pieces. The government is expected
to reap a considerable profit from the
coinage, as many of them will be held

as souvenirs, and in collections, and

never be presented for redemption.

The Golosh, Revived by Fashion.

The now fashionable goloshes—

more properly "goslosbes" are a cen-

tury or so old, having originated in

France away back when ladies wore

long dresses that hid the clumsy

foot-gear from view. The first spec-

imens had woolen soles with leather
uppers—half-boots—and were worn
almost entirely when the ground was
covered with snow, or slush. The

neat-fitting rubber or felt overshoe
very effectually displaced the golosh,
until a freak idea recently converted
them into a temporary "fashion."

The new County Agent, E. K. Wal-
rath, has taken up his work in this
county, with his office in The Times
building—second floor.

Hawaii has the largest light-house
lens in the world—nine feet in diame-
ter.

THE SESQUI-CENTENNIAL.

Present Status of Philadelphia's Ex-
position.

Those who have been doubting
whether Philadelphia will have its ex-
position buildings ready for the big
Exposition this Summer, are reassur-
ed by visitors to the exposition
grounds who say construction is go-
ing forward at an amazing pace. One
building that covers eight acres is
practically finished. The stadium is
90% finished, and the administration
building was finished several months
ago. A second eight-acre building
has been 80% finished within the past
month.
Congress disappointed Mayor Ken-

drik, of Philadelphia, by cutting its
appropriation to $2,186,500 only
$1,000,000. of which can be spent by
the Exposition authorities. The
amount as passed represents a cut of
$2,000,000. The debate in the Senate
occupied two days, most of the oppo-
sition coming from the Democratic
side. Expositions, just now, are not
very popular, especially considering
debt and tax reducing aims.
The impetus given the Exposition

by this action of the Congressional
body will result in expediting plans
for buildings to house Government
exhibits and arrangements of space
for the location of soldiers, sailors and
marines who will be stationed at the
Exposition.
The participation by the Army will

include the establishment of a pro-
visional brigade of composite troops
depicting the entire army and con-
sisting of 116 officers and 1,744 men,

as well as a citizens' military training
camp for 600 boys, a visit by West
Point cadets and by the United States
Army Band.
The Navy's display will comprise

utilization of the League Island Navy
Yard, adjacent to the Exposition site,

to demonstrate the extent of the arm-

ed naval forces of the Government.
Pennsylvania's official building at

the Sesqui-Centennial Exposition will

be erected on the Exposition grounds

in the form of a hollow square, 300

by 300 feet, according to plans drawn

up by Ralph E. Bencker, Philadelphia

architect. Of the $750,000 appropri-

ated by the 1925 Legislature for par-
ticipation in the Exposition, $335,000
will be expended for the structure.

Fire at Thurmont.

A fire that seemed to threaten the
south-eastern section of Thurmont,
Tuesday night, wrecked greenhouses

of George E. Creager, entailing a loss
of about $5000, not including great
damage to hothouse plants.
The fire was discovered by Mrs.

Creager early in the evening, while
her husband was in Emmitsburg Md.,
where they operate a branch distrib-
uting shop. At the time the fire

was so threatening that calls were

sent to Frederick and Taneytown for
automobile fire-fighting equipment.
The two companies responded and

threw water on the blaze after more

than a quarter of a mile of hose had

been laid to reach Hunting Creek,

Mrs. Creager collapsed during the

fire and required the care of a physi-

cian.

Marriage Licenses.

Clifford R. Beard and Lesba E.
Wholley, Gettysburg, Pa.
David E. Hardy and Ellen Wyatt,

Baltimore.
Walter E. Knipple and Corinne M.

Weider, McSherrystown, Pa.
John A. Brashshears and Bertha M.

Weyer, Hanover, Pa.
Albert L. Ross and Dorothy K.

Dunkerly, Hanover, Pa.
Henry M. Stokes and Gertrude

Spillman, York, Pa.

Bus Driver Badly Hurt.

Lloyd B. Barnes, of Baltimore,
driver of the Waynesboro-Hagerstown
bus, was carried over an embank-
ment, near Leitersburg, on Tuesday,
when his bus skidded from the icy
road, overturned and was wrecked.
Barnes is at the Waynesboro hospital
believed to be suffering from a frac-
tured skull, and is in a critical con-
dition. He was not rescued until two
hours after the accident.

Testing Cattle in Pennsylvania.

It seems that in Pennsylvania the
farmers have the option of having
their cattle tested. At any rate, in
Codorus Township, York county, 90%
of the farmers agreed to having the
test made, and state veterinarians
have been engaged in making the
tests. With the, task incomplete,
eighteen carloads have been shipped
to Harrisburg and Lancaster, contain-
ing more than 300 condemned cattle.
Some of the farmers have gone to
Harrisburg to see their cattle killed.

Amendment to Constitution.

The Norris resolution providing for
an amendment to the Constitution of
the United States, that would change
the inauguration of President, and the
assembling of the new Congress to
January, following the election in
November, has passed Congress. The
inauguration now takes place March
4, but the Congress elected at the
same time does not convene until
December. An effort has been made
several times, to have this change
made, but always failed.

Briar roots for pipes, is such an
important industry in this country
that in 1924 France received for its
exportations 80,000,000 francs.
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ders.
ADVERTISING rates will be given on

application, after the character of the bus- ,
iness has been definitely stated. together I
with information as to space, position, and
length of contract. The publisher reserv-
es the privilege of declining all offers for
space.

All advertisements for 2nd., 3rd., 6th.,
and 7th. pages must be in our Office by
Tuesday morning each week; otherwise,
insertion cannot be guaranteed until the
following week.

FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 19, 1926,

Entered at Taneytown Postoffice as Second
Class Matter.

All articles on this page are either orig-
inal, or properly credited. This has al-
ways been a fixed rule with this Office,and
we suggest the adoption of it by our ex-
changes.

The coal strike has ended, and the
chief result was loss to both sides—
now, and hereafter. The whole thing

was a price of bad advice, and stick-

ing to it so long.
 0_

It has been said that the three chief

news dispensing agencies are "the

telegraph, telephone and tela-woman."

The radio now breaks up the trio—it

tells things, and you can't "talk back"

at it.

Building one's self up, by pulling

somebody else down, is neither good
policy nor good politics. Those who
consider carefully, sooner or late/

"get on to" off-color arguments, and

they react.

Mayor Jackson, of Baltimore, in an
address in Chicago—which a "brok-

en-rib" interfered with his completing

—told the windy city listeners that

he is "118 per cent wet." The Honor-
able Mayor evidently wants his good

qualities to be widely known, outside

of his home town. Perhaps he may be

a candidate for the Presidency?

What the job printers of the coun-

try want, is for the government to
stick to the Postoffice business, and

go out of the competitive printing

business. If the government can

supply customers with printed envel-

opes, it can also supply letter heads
and bill heads. Let the government

attend to government business.

Desecration of Graves of Bible Char-
acters.

The desecration of graves, presum-

ably in the interest of "Historic re-

search" seems likely to continue. This

time, the tomb of Joseph, the son of

Jacob, of Biblical history, is the ob-

ject of the scientist-searchers, and

the search is keen because Joseph's

connection with the Pharaoh of the

time was such that it is believed that

the rifling of his tomb would reveal

riches superior to that found in the

tomb of King Tut-ank-amen, whose

wonderful coffin of gold is now on ex-

hibition at Cairo, Egypt.

The Valley of Kings, at Luxor, is

expected to supply the tomb of Joseph.

Suppose it does. The truth of the

Bible in this respect, is not under at-

tack, historically; so far as we know,

the story of the Bible has not been

successfully attacked in any direction,

or in any age. Why, therefore, should

any of the old Biblical graved be

opened, save for the sake of mere

curiosity—if not, indeed, for money-

making.
To us, the whole procedure seems to

be sacrilegious without the slightest

foundation of justification. The whole

procedure, has a tendency to make

very light of things that ought to be

most sacred—the tombs of the good

men, or at least of the historical char-

acters, of the ages gone by when

civilization was in its infancy, and

closer to the Creator of all.

Why We Do Things.

Have you ever thought, or fully

realized, that most of us do things,

and reach decisions, and form habits,

simply because it ;s natural—perhaps

inborn—for us to do certain things

certain way:,? Well, it's true. Sup-

pose we are "set" on doing just one

thing, and our friends—and perhaps

ourselves—wonder why? If the trou-

ble is taken to investigate, it will be

found, in most cases, that this certain

thing is done because it is perfectly

natural for us to do it.
Take a man, or woman, who does

everything with care, the best he (or

she) can. It isn't at all surprising

that this person declines to be inter-

ested in, or do, a great many things

that others do. He simply does not

do certain things because he feels

that he can't do them well, or perhaps

can't afford to finance them; and

rather than break his record for do-
ing, he does not do a lot of things.

Some men do not buy an automo-
bile, for instance, because they feel
their inability to give the time to
learn how to run one safely; or per-
haps the kind he would like to have
is beyond his ability to finance prop-
erly. Some men just have a distaste
for half-doing anything.
The most of us have inborn char-

acteristics, without recognizing them.
Our likes and dislikes are firmly fix-
ed and of long standing. Sometimes
we find a man doing something that
we do not expect. This is because he
may have a fad, or be a "fan", as we
say, and with fully characteristic
habit he gets back of his fad with
the best that is in him. A lot of peo-
ple do not want to be a failure, at
anything; so, when they go in at all,
it is with the determination to "do
things" and be up in the front ranks
—he does not want anybody to "beat"
him.

If we will just look about us, we
will find a lot of persons who all
through life left well-done work back
of them. It wasn't luck, nor acci-
dent, but just the outcome of perhaps
very quiet determination and applica-
tion. A homely saying of a once
quaint writer—Josh Billings—was,
"Always play to win; a game that
ain't worth winninL', ain't worth play-
in'." This philosophy has lots of fol-
lowers, and sometimes we misjudge
people as selfish, or too unconcerned,
just because we do not understand the
policy that influences them.

More than Farmers are Interested.

High prices for everything the
farmer must buy, and not correspond-
ingly higher prices for his products,
is what is hurting the farmer. In
company with the farmer are all
classes of people who are living off
invested incomes, and are not active
industrialists; the many classes of
employees not engaged in industrial
labor, such as office help, salesmen,
and certain professional classed—all
not in a position, by demands, to force
up wages.
The present era of high prices,

started up by the world war, has up-
set the level of values; created ex-
travagant standards of living; made
necessaries of former luxuries; creat-
ed a mania for wide-spread spending;
made it necessary for incomes to lat
increased by force—especially man-
ual labor incomes—and these increas-
es have been added by manufacturers
to selling prices; the whole scheme
working in a •circle, at the end of
which it becomes necessary to start a
new circle of higher incomes. 4
Farmers—and the many others

named—have not been able to use or-
ganized force to jack up their incomes
and are victims of this vicious circle.
What is needed, is some block to stop
the growth of ;these price increasing
circles, and to unravel them back to a
point that is more fair to all classes
of people and employments. The
present unfair plight of the farmer,
is in fact the plight, very largely, of
all who live rural in America and the
small towns everywhere.

Increasing prices for labor, when
it can be forced, is not a solution to
the situation. There must be some-
thing like a close approach to the
equalization of both receipts and ex-

penditures for all classes. Every-
body's income dollar must fairly rep-
resent value for the outgo dollar. The
low purchase value of the farmer's
income dollar, is what is hurting him,.
and his companions. Give his dollar

equal purchasing value with other dol-
lars, and that is all the help he needs
from anybody.

Legislation for the "farmer," there-
fore, is not "class legislation," in
fact, when it is urged that "some-
thing be done" for the farmer. Farm-
ers are merely the largest single body
of the many bodies interested. Tak-
ing the country as a whole, these
various bodies represent more than a
"class"—they are in the aggregate
perhaps considerably more than half
of the people of the United States.
 0.—

State's Rights, in Practice.

The Chicago Evening Post, in com-
menting on Gov. Ritchie's platform of
State's rights, applies the working of
the idea to the Eighteenth Amend-
ment as an example of how it would
affect states, not only on the question
of prohibition, but others. The Post
says;
"Governor Ritchie proposes that

Congress shall in so many words de-
clare that the enforcement of the
Eighteenth Amendment is a matter
for each state to determine for itself.
We do not know why, if he is going to
give the power of self-determination
in this matter of constitutional enact-
ment to the individual states, he does
not further extend it to the cities.
There are states in this country which
would declare for rigid prohibition ov-
er the protest of their big urban cen-
ters, and so force upon these com-
munities a law distasteful to a ma)or-
ity of their citizens. It is not impos-
sible that the legislature of Illinois
would do this, and that Chicago would
find itself under a state law for the

thorough-going enforcement of the
Eighteenth Amendment.
But if the enforcement of the Con-

stitution is to be a matter of local op-
tion why deny the right of determi-
nation to Chicago? If Chicago and
other cities of like sentiment proceed
to ignore their state laws for the en-
forcement of the Constitution, how
much better off are we than today?
What is gained by the Ritchie pro-
posal save the establishment of a new
doctrine of constitutional interpreta-
tion by individual states? Is that a
doctrine we wish to see established in
this country by act of Congress?"

Hens Will Lay
if you feed them a good high-protein
laying mash. Rein-o-la Laying Mash
has proved itself to be a big egg pro-
lucer. Ask us about it—Reindollar
Bros. & Co. 10-16-tf

--Advertisement

Tariff and the Farmer.

The old familiar falsehood contin-
ues to be repeated, that "farmers
buy under high tariff prices and sell
in almost free trade markets." Pres-
ident Coolidge, in his recent Chicago
address, made complete refutation of

the charge that the tariff is directed
both ways to the detriment of the
farmer.
The facts found in the tariff act it-

self show that the large proportion of
things the farmer consumes are free
from duty, and the large proportion of
things he sells are heavily protected.
What do the free trade advocates

want done with the tariff? Do they
want wool to compete with free wool
from abroad? Do they want free
trade in fruit and dairy products?
The President showed from the rec-

ords that dutiable goods which the
farmer consumes are only 12 percent
of our total imports, and farm ex-
penditures are increased only 1.3 per-
cent by these duties.
The free trader would save the

farmer this 1.3 percent of tariff and
ruin the farmer's home market by re-
ducing farm prices and lowering
standards of living on farms, by sub-
jecting him to unrestricted free trade.
—The Manufacturer.

Local Pride
will induce you to try Rein-o-la Lay—
ing Mash—the good results will keep
you a regular feeder of it. It actual-
ly does all we claim. Contains high-
grade beef scraps—no tankage. Makes
all the difference between profit and
loss. A trial is convincing—Reindol-
lar Bros. & Co. 10-16-tf

Advertisement

The Coal Strike Settlement.

The miners are out so many millions
of dollars in wages that they can nev-
er hope to recoup them. Their losses
are estimated to approxiniate $150,-
000,000 or more. Their victory con-
sists in getting the same rate of
wages they were paid when they quit
work. The check-off, for which they
haire stood out for years as the sine
qua non of settlement of any strike,
is to be modified.
The operators in turn have lost

millions in profits, have seen their
business invaded by substitutes and
their industry shot to pieces to an ex-
tent which must make return to nor-
mal conditions a slow and costly pro-
cess. They have agreed to a five-
year contract to which they were
resolutely opposed unless it contained
a clause providing for arbitration in
the event of business depression which
interfered with trade and profits.
On this point the contract entered

into discreetly avoids use of the word
arbitration, but it seems to contain
the essence of it. It is agreed to sub-
mit any dispute over wage scales oc-
curring after January 1, 1927, to a
meditation board, both parties binding
themselves to abide by the board's de-
cision. President Lewis, of the Unit-
ed Mine Workers, insists that this is
not arbitration. If it means what it
says the operators may answer little
Peterkin by asserting that they have
given the miners the shadow and have
taken the substance. But they have
also strenuously contended for an
agreement to submit differences over

a new contract to arbitration. On

this issue they have lost.
It is clear that both sides, exhaust-

ed by the prolonged struggle, have

yielded something,enough to have set-
tled the strike weeks ago if similar
concessions had been made.
The outstanding feature of the

strike was the demonstration of the
consumer's ability to stand the shut-
down of the mines over so long a
period. He was unusually well stock-
ed with coal to begin with, but there
would have been intolerable suffering
if, for the first time, substitute fuels
had not come upon the market in
quantity to prevent at least that sort
of hardship and distress which here-
tofore have compelled a demand for
a strike settlement at whatever in-
crease in cost to the householder.
No other one thing has had so much

to do with forcing the disputants to
come to terms as public determination
to hold out against an agreement that
would force coal consumers to pay the
losses incurred in the strike. With
that point settled the public has much
reason to be satisfied that negotia-
tions have now resulted in a five-year
contract.

Operators and miners may have
learned their lesson and live in peace

throughout this period, but it would
not be wise for Congress to rely upon
their doing so. The time to set up
ways and means to prevent a tie-up in
an essential industry is before, not
after, a strike begins. Congress has
the recommendations of the Hammond
Coal Commission before it. It knows
that the President is powerless to act
in such emergencies without authority
from it. It would be gravely neglect-
ed of the duty incumbent upon it if it
again left in the hands of operators
or miners liberty to precipitate an-
other such conflict upon the country.
—Balto. Sun.
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Orphans "Kidnaped" From
Grandmother by State

Philadelphia.—Two Camden school,
children were legally "kidnaped" from
their classrooms and taken in charge'
by the state board of children's guar-
dians, because their grandmother was
financially unable to properly nourish
them. The youngsters are orphans. •
Once before the state attempted to

get the children, but tile grandmother,
Mrs. Augusta Wilhelm, refused to give
them up and the method of taking,
them from school was resorted to. ,
One of the children, John Palmer.

ten, was taken from the Mickle school
and Viola, twelve, was taken from the
Sacred Heart parochial school. Mrs.
Wilhelm waited for their return and
after they had been an hour overdue,'
she received a telegram from Miss
Frances Day, superintendent of the
state board, informing her of the ac-
tion.
The father of the children was killed

in a railroad accident at Mauch Chunk,
Pa., nine years ago. Their mother died
four years ago from tuberculosis and
since that time the grandmother has
slaved to keep them.
She has received 50 cents a day from.

the state for the care of the children'
and her only income was the few pen-
nies she picked up doing .odd jobs at.
infrequent Intervals.
Miss Day said the moral and physical.

care which Mrs. Wilhelm had given to
the children was of the best, but her
age and inability to work made it im-
possible for her to properly support
th eni.

••••••

Sorry for Thoughts
"Oh! Are you really a mind-

reader?"
"Yes! I am."
"Then I hope you aren't offended.

I didn't mean what I thought about
you."

How She Knew
A girl met an artist friend in the

street one day.
"I hear you are giving up your

studio," she said.
"Oh!" he exclaimed, "that's news to

me. Who told you?"
"Your landlord."

MOST EXPENSIVE PARTS

Friend—What parts of the country
have you found to most expensive?
Discouraged Motorist—The automo-

bile .parts.

Hall's Catarrh
Medicine wclialilmdofworhaittwe
rid your system of Catarrh or Deafness
caused by Catarrh.

Sold by druggists for over 40 years

F. J. CHENEY Si_ CO., Toledo. Ohio

NEW HANDY PACK
Fits hand
pocket and purse

More for your money
and the best Peppermint
Chewing Sweet for any money

Look for Wrigley's P. K. Handy Pack
on yoar Dealer's Counter o7

Hesson's Department Store
(ON THE SQUARE)
Taneytown, Md.

Keep Your Feet Dry
Nothing like a pair of "Ball-Band"
Arcdcs for keeping your feet dry and
warm in the very worst weather. You
can laugh at freezing cold, deep snow,
slush and mud if you wear" Ball-Band."

ft A 64.

BAL Li@DBAN D9
"Ball-Banct" Arctics save you money
by protecting your leather shoes from
destructive soakings, too.

Ten million people look for the Red
Ball Trade Mark when they buy
Rubber Footwear. Make your choice
of styles from our complete assort-
ment of "Ball-Band."
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Capital Stock;
Surplus
Undivided Profits

$40,000.00
$50,000.00
$35,000.00

ON THE HONOR ROLL OF BANKS

There's a Difference
No doubt a man might get fully as much exercise by

wielding a hoe as he could from swinging
but it isn't half so much fun to some men.

The man who spends all he makes may be as hard a
worker as the one who has a growing account at the bank.
It isn't so much what one makes as what is saved that
counts. Industry is a virtue but so Is Thrift. Have a de-
finite program. Start an account at our Bank and profit
by your labor.

a golf club—

Resources Over $1,250,000.00.
NO08181(481810181318181811308181803681:918181818113116080608t838MMIE088008i8,31863830316,

ATWATER KENT

CROSLEY RADI OLA

MAGNAVOX
All are leaders in their respective fields.
Thousands of people are now enjoying concerts,

listening to addresses, hearing market reports--get-
ting new programs every day right in their own
homes with a Radio outfit. Get a Radio Set now
and enjoy the splendid concerts which these thous-
ands of other people are getting out of the air.

Come in and hear Radio such as you have never
heard before. The simplicity and wonderful clarity
of the incomparable Magnavox will give you an en-
tirely different idea of Radio. Let us demonstrate.

TUBES. BATTERIES. LOUD SPEAKERS.

kr!.,z,m,741
ift1C 1lb,77,7
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PUBLIC SALE PUBLIC SALE PUBLIC SALE PUBLIC SALE PUBLIC SALE Trustees' Sale
The undersigned, intending to quit

farming will offer at public sale, on
the C. E. Buffington farm, 1/2 mile
from Otter Dale Mill, on the Union
Bridge and Taneytown road, on

MONDAY, MARCH 8th., 1926,
at 12 o'clock, the following live stock
and farming implements, consisting
of
3 HEAD OF WORK HORSES,

Frank, gray horse, 14 years old, good
worker and driver, weighs 1250 lbs.;

4K
Lark, gray mare, 18 years
old, works anywhere hitched,

  weighs 1100 lbs. These are
well matched grays. Doris, black
mare, 7 years old, works anywhere
hitched, a good driver and weighs
900 lbs.

9 HEAD OF CATTLE,
8 much cows, 4 will be fresh by day
of sale; 1 in April; 1 in
May; 1 in July, and 1 in
August; 1 stock bull, large
enough for service. These cows are
all good and heavy milkers, and all
have been T. B. tested and no react-
ors.

6 DUROC SHOATS,
weighing about 70 lbs.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.
Brown wagon, 3-ton and bed, holds

7 barrels corn; Spring wagon, run-
about, Deering binder, 8-ft. cut, good;
McCormick mower, good as new; 1-
horse rake for 1 or 2-horses; 10-hoe
Ontario grain drill, Red Chief corn
sheller, clover seed sower, Buckeye
double walking corn worker, Syracuse
barshear plow, 3-shovel corn drag,
single shovel plow, corn coverer, 17-
tooth Syracuse harrow, set hay car-
riages, 18-ft.; new jockey sticks,
stretchers, single, double and triple
trees, grindstone, dung and pitch
forks, bushel basket, half bushel
measure, dung hook, grain sacks,
binder twine, lot new tar rope, cow
chains, log chain, 3 sets breast chains,
4 milk cans, three 5's and one 7, good
as new; 2 sanitary milk buckets, one
sanitary milk strainer, 10-gal. Cedar
churn, 18-gal. Dilartion separator,
milk stirrer.

HARNESS.
2 sets breeehbands, 2 sets front gears,
4 collars, 3 bridles, set check lines,
4-horse wagon line, saddle, good as
new; 2 lead reins, 4 coupling straps,
set buggy harness, 3 halters, 2 neck
ropes, hay rope, and many other ar-
ticles not mentioned.
TERMS—All sums of $10.00 and

under, cash. On larger sums a credit
of 9 months will be given, the pur-
chasers to give their notes with ap-
proved security, bearing interest from
day of sale. No goods to be removed
until settled for.

RAYMOND A. YINGLING.
J. N. 0. SMITH, Auct.
ELLIS G. OHLER, SCOTT GARNER,

Clerks. 2-19-3t

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned intending to quit

farming, will offer at public sale, on the
Mrs. Geo. H. Birnie form. 2 miles from
Taneytown, on road leading to Sell's mill,
300 yards from the State Road, on

TUESDAY, MARCH 9th., 1926,

at llo'clock, the following Live Stock and
Farming Implements:

FIVE HEAD OF HORSES

black horse. 5 years old, works anywhere
hitched; gray horse, 7 years old,
works anywhere hitched; bay
mare, 8 years old: bay mare, 9
years old, good off-side worker;

dapple gray. 7 years old, good off-side
worker. These horses are all of a good
blocky type.

16 HEAD OF CATTLE
Holstein cow, 3rd calf by her
side black cow. 2nd calf by her
side Jersey heifer, calf by her
side 2 Holsteins, close spring-
ers, caryying their 3rd calf; brendie cow,
carrying 4th calf, will be fresh in Sep-
tember; brendle cow, carrying.her 3rd calf,
will be fresh in June; Jersey cow, fifth
calf, will be fresh in September; Guernsey
heifer, will be fresh in April; Holstein
heifer, 1 year old; 5 stock bulls, all large
enaugh for service,Hoist(qn and Durham.
These cattle all passed the T. B. test.

25 HEAD OF HOGS
4 sows, with pigs by (lay of sale: the bal-
ance are shoats, weighing from 50 to 100
pounds; hog crate.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.
One 4 or 5-horse wagon and bed, Champ-

ion wheat binder, 8-ft cut; Deering binder,
6-ft cut; McCormick mower, 5-ft cut; horse
rake. Moline manure spreader, 1 I. H. C.
manure spreader, Syracuse plow, No. 361;
Mountville plow, 1 Syracuse harrow,
17-tooth: 00-tooth smoothing harrow,
3-block roller. 1 riding corn plow, 1 walk-
ing plow, hay carriages, 1 Superior grain
drill, Superior corn planter, single and
double shovel plows, single corn forks, 2
gasoline engines, 1 I. H. C. 4-horse power
on truck; 1 I. H. C. engine. 1% horse pow-
er, good as new; feed cutter, circular saw,
line shaft, pulleys and belts; single trees,
double trees, triple trees, jocky sticks,
log and breast chains, straw and pitch
forks, dung and sheaf forks, dehorner, 50-
gal, gasoline drum, cross-cut saw, wagon
jack, bushel basket, half-bushel measure,
sledge hammer and wedges, digging irons,
shovels, mattock, pick, 50 middle rings,
grain cradle, corn shelter, grindstone, mow-
ing and brier scythes, hay fork, rope and
pulleys; hoes, rakes, block and tackle, 100-
ft of rope; home-made rubber tire buggy,
spring wagon, chicken coops, wheelbarrow,
grain sacks, lot of chickens, by the pound;
feed boxes, blacksmith tools, Champion
blower, anvil, vise, hammers, wrenches.
tongs, pincers, horse shoeing outfit.
HARNESS-5 sets front gears, 5 bridles,

5 collars, spring wagon harness, buggy
harness, wagon and plow lines, check lines,
wagon saddle, hitching straps, carrying
straps, choke straps, horse clippers.

HOUSEHOLD GOODS

Consisting of a Primrose cream separator
No. 4, with power attachment, good as
new; buckets, cream cans, sausage stuffer
and grinder, meat benches, iron kettle.
tables, ice cream freezer, brooms, jars and
crocks, 2 churns, barrels, tubs, ice box,
lined with zinc; chunk stove, 2 antique
beds, 1 single bed, lounge, 12 good chairs,
good range, 3 stands. 2 single-barrel shot
guns, 1 new; two .22 rifles, 1 good cow
dog, and many other articles not mention-
ed.
TERMS—All sums of $10.00 and under,

cash. On larger sums a credit of 6 months
will be given on notes with approved se-
curity, bearing interest from day of sale.

EDWARD R. HARNER.
J. N. 0. SMITH, Auct. 2-19-3t
EDW. S. EARNER & ELLIS OHLER,

Clerks.
The exclusive right will be given the

U. B. Sewing Circle to sell sandwiches,
pies, cakes and candies.

Wise Little Pellahl
Customer to Waiter—A little bird

told Me that this coffee is old.
Walter—Wbat kind of a bird Was it?
Customer—A swallow.

He Placed the Limit.

She—Do you think a woman shout
tell all She knows?

He—Yes, but not ny Mate.

The undersigned, having rented his
farm will sell at public sale on the
farm known as the James W. Troxell
farm, situated 11/4 miles from Green
Valley School-house, and 11/4 miles
northwest of Marker's Mill, on

FRIDAY, MARCH 5, 1926,
at 12 o'clock, noon, the following per-
sonal property, to-wit:-

4 HEAD OF HORSES,
1 gray mare, 12 years old,
work wherever hitched; black
mare, 14 years old, work

anywhere; black colt, 2 years old, good
size; bay colt, 1 year old.

8 HEAD OF CATTLE,
6 heifers, some springers; 2 stock
bulls.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.
2-ton wagon, nearly new; check-

row corn planter, McCormick mower,
good order; 3-section steel land roller,
2 sets breast chains, dung and pitch
forks, jockey sticks, double and single
trees, 3-horse hitch, •

HARNESS.
Two sets front gears, bridles, hal-

ters, collars, and check lines.
TERMS—All sums of $5.00 and under,

cash. All sums over $5.00 a credit of 6
months will be given the purchaser to give
their notes with security, bearing interest
from day of sale. No property to be re-
moved until settled for.

WILLIAM P. HALTER.
WILLIAM WARNER, Auct.
0. E. DODRER, Clerk. 2-12-3t

PUBLIC SALE
ON WEDNESDAY, MARCH 10, 1926.
The undersigned intending to quit farm-

ing, will sell at public sale, on the above
date, along the Littlestown and Taneytown
road, midway between the two towns, near
Piney Creek Station, the following per-
sonal property:

4 HEAD HORSES AND 1 MULE,
consisting of light bay horse. 16 years

old, good saddle or lead horse;

lc dark bay horse, 11 years old,
works any place etscept lead,
and an extra good driver; black

horse; 8 years old. works any place, ex-
cept lead; roan mare, 12 years old, works
wherever hitched; bay mule, 14 years old,
works anywhere hitched.

15 HEAD OF TUBERCULIN TESTED
CATTLE,

consisting of roan cow, carrying her 5th..
calf, comes fresh in July;
Holstein cow, carrying her 6th.
calf„ comes fresh in June;
Jersey cow, 2nd. calf, comes
fresh in Fall; spotted cow, calf just sold
off, comes fresh in 'Fall; red Durham cow,
calf just sold off, comes fresh in the Fall.

6 HEAD OP' FINE STOCK BULLS,
all fit for service,4 head of heifers, weigh-
ing about 500 pounds apiece. These cows,
bulls and heifers are all tuberculin tested.

30 HEAD OF HOGS,
consisting of shoats, weighing from 40 to
80 pounds each.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.
Two farm wagons, 3-ton Weber wagon,

3%-in. tread with bed, 13 feet long, like
new; 1%-ton Acme wagon with bed, 2-in.
tread, good as new; spring wagon, latest
model No. 8 New Idea manure spreader,
used 1 season; Deering binder, 7-ft. cut,
with latest tongue truck, like new; York
low down grain drill, spring pressure,
good as new ; Superior No. 7 double row
corn planter, can't be beat for accurate
dropping, good as new; Deering Ideal
mower, in good running order; 1 pair 19-
ft. hay carriages, (Ickes make), like new;
bay tedder. like 'new; Milwaukee corn
binder, 2 Hench Junior corn workers, 20-
disc Osborne double disc harrow, two 17-
tooth lever harrows, 3-block land roller, 2
Syracuse plows. Ohio hay rake, Cyclone
seed sower, falling-top buggy, square
back sleigh, bob sled. International corn
shelter, like new; Scientific sweep mill,
good as new; lay made to fit a Ford car,
can saw wood or chop with it easily; lot
of single, double and triple trees; jockey
sticks, forks of all kinds; lot of grain
sacks. buggy pole, double extension lad-
der, extra heavy, 32-ft. long; log chains.
wagon jack, bag truck, digging iron, 2
bushel baskets, % bushel measure, hay
knife, grindstone, 2 scoop shovels, garden
rake, 2 ground shovels, pick, crosscut saw,
hack saw, maul and wedges, circular saw,
tilt frame, with 24-in. saw, complete,good
as new: fanning mill, Shriner make; iron
beam shovel plow, wheelbarrow, set pea
guards, like new; briar scythe, 2 mowing
scythes.

HARNESS.
4 sets of front gears, 2 sets breechbands,

set of buggy harness, bridles, collars, lead
lines, check lines, wagon saddle, lead
reins.

HOUSEHOLD GOODS.
Five milk cans, four 5-gal, and one 6-

gal., all good as new; milk buckets,
strainer, butter church with stand; Em-
pire cream separator, double heater coal
or wood stove, parlor stove, 2 beds, old
style; iron kettle and kettle ring; 3-burn-
er oil stove, dinner bell, pudding stirrer,
a lot of home-made brooms, beam scales,
300-1b. capacity; Winchester rifle, 22-cal.,
and other articles too numerous to men-tion.

TERMS—All surs of $10.00 and under,
cash. Above $10.00 a credit of 9 months
will be given, with interest from day of
sale, or 4 percent off for cash.
Sale to begin at 12 o'clock.

CLARENCE E. MAYERS.
.T. N. 0. SMITH, Auct.
EARNER & OHLER, Clerks. 2-19-3t

A Small Properly
For Sale.

Small Property consisting of

FIVE ACRES,

of very productive land, located along
the county road midway between
Ladiesburg and New Midway, Freder-
ick County. This property is improv-
ed with a

FIVE ROOM HOUSE,
large Stable and Shed, Hog House,
Poultry House, Shop and other neces-
sary outbuildings, fruit of all kinds.
A good well, and a never-failing
spring of water, nearby. A most de-
sirable home for a small family or
elderly couple.
For further particulars apply to

J. RAYMOND ZENT,
1-22-tf near Keymar, Md.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.
This is to give notice that the sub-

scriber, has obtained from the Orphans'
Court of Carroll County, in Md., letters
testamentary upon the estate of

ROBERT C. HOTSON,

late of Carroll County, deceased. All per-
sons having claims against the deceased,
are hereby warned to exhibit the same,
with the vouchers properly authenticated,
to the subscriber, on or befort the 26th.
day of August, 1926; they may otherwise
by law be excluded from all benefit of
said estate.

Given under my hands this 29th. day of
January, 1926.

GRACE E. HOTSON,
1-29-5t Executrix.

The undersigned, will offer at pub-
lic sale, on her premises, on the road
leading from Detour, to Motter's Sta-
tion, near Six's Bridge, on
TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 23, 1926,
at 12 o'clock, sharp, the following
personal property:

2 GOOD COWS,
1 cow, carrying her 6th. calf; 1 cow,
carrying her 7th. calf, both come fresh
in March.

BEDROOM SUITE,
good as new; 4 bedsteads, corner
cupboard, buffet, %-doz room chairs,
1/2-doz, cane-seated chairs, 3 rocking
chairs, 4 stands, extension table, one
6-leg walnut leaf table, two 4-leg
kitchen tables, kitchen cupboard, 1/2
doz. kitchen chairs, safe, bureau,
lounge, 2 tubs, 2 iron kettles, work
bench, carpet and matting by the yd.;
some linoleum, some bed clothing,

ONE ESTY ORGAN,
good as new; dishes, glassware, pans,
cook pots, one No. 7 Noble cook stove,
coal stove, baby cradle, hogshead,
wheelbarrow, scoop shovel, dirt shov-
el, garden tools, winnowing mill, one
sleigh, 2 clocks, churn and stand, and
many other articles not mentioned.

TERMS OF SALE—Cash.
MARY C. SIX.

B. P. OGLE, Auct.
J. M. SAYLER, Clerk. 2-5-3t

PUBLIC SALE
OF

Horses, Mules and Cows,
Farming Implements.

The undersigned, intending to quit farm-
ing will sell at public sale, on

MONDAY, MARCH 1, 1926.
at 9:30 .A M.

* 
on my farm, 1 mile South

of Wakefield Station and 3 miles east of
New Windsor, and 2 miles from Medford,

6 HEAD OF HORSES AND MULES,
4 horses, pair Young mules.

ACCREDITED HERD, 27 HEAD OF
GRADE GUERNSEY CATTLE,

20 milk cows, some fresh by day of sale;
3 -heifers. 1 year old; 3 heifers, 4 months
old; registered Guernsey bull,

FARMING MACHINERY,
McCormick a-heat binder. 8-ft. cut; Mc-
Cormick corn binder, Osborne mower,
Keystone hay loader, McCormick hay rake,
12-hoe Ontario grain drill, nearly new; 2
Hoosier corn planters, 125-ft. hay rope,
new; hay fork, 2 wagons, 3-ton Weber
wagon and bed, holds 10 barrels,* 2-ton
Lansing wagon, 2 hay carriages,18-ft. long:
2 Oliver steel beam plows, corn sheller. 5
harrows, double disc harrow, springtooth
harrow and roller, combined • wooden
frame harrow, lever spring-tooth harrow,
70-tooth smoothing harrow, 2 riding corn
plows, 3-leg corn plow, shovel plow, Titan
tractor, 10-20, in first-class order; No. 13
l'apec ensilage cutter and distributory
pipe; 10-inch International chopping mill,
75-ft. 6-in, belt, steel Corn King manure
spreader, spring wagon, buggy, sulkey
cart, dump cart and harness, No. 3 Jeffery
lime stone pulverizer, capacity 3-tons per
hour.

HARNESS:
2 sets breechbands, 4 sets of lead har-

ness, bridles and collars, buggy harness,
lead line, neck strap, wagon whip, saddle,
riding bridle, plow lines, check lines, 2%
H. P. Galloway engine, Universal milking
machine, in first-class order; 3 stone ham-
mers, shovels, scoop shovel, forks of all
kinds, post digger, crosscut saw, wedges,
half bushel basket, single trees, double
trees, triple trees, 2 sets of dung boards,
oak, 2-in, thick; wheelbarrow, wagon um-
brella, anvil and vice, combined; bench,
grinder and special tool grinding wheel,
log chains, extra heavy; 2 medium. steel
oil barrel, 2 wooden oil barrels, gasoline
tank, milk cans, 5 and 10 gallon cans; milk
buckets, milk strainer, lot of other articles
too numerout to mention. Lot of household
goods.

TERMS OF SALE—All sums of $10.00
and under, cash: on all sums above $10.00
a credit of 6 months will be given on notes
with approved security, bearing interest
from (lay of sale. No property to be re-
moved until terms are complied with.

C. SCOTT BOLLINGER.
.T. N. 0. SMITH, Auct.
A. W. WAGNER & H. H. DEVILBISS,

Clerks.
The exclusive right will be given the

Pipe Creek Ladies' Aid Society to sell
sandwiches, pies, cakes and candies.

2-12-3t

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned, will sell at public sale

on his farm, % mile from State Road,lead-
ing from Taneytown to Etninitsburg, and
1 mile north of Bridgeport, on

WEDNESDAY, MARCH 10, 1926,
at 10 o'clock, sharp, the following personal
property:

5 HEAD OF HORSES,
consisting of 1 black mare, 13 years old,

work anywhere hitched; 1 black
mare, 12 years old, offside work-
er; 1 bay mare, 11 years old,
work anywhere hitched; 1 bay

horse, coming 5 years old, extra good sin-
gle line leader; sorrel pacing mare. com-
ing 7 years old, extra good rider and driv-
er.

17 HEAD OF CATTLE,
consisting of 14 milch cows, of which 6
will be fresh by day of sale;
3 Summer cows; 5 fall cows;
2 heifers, and 1 fat bull. You
will find some extra good Dur-
hams and Guernseys in this herd all State
T. B. tested.

20 HEAD OF HOGS,
of which 5 are brood sows, will farrow in
March; 15 shoats, weighing from 30 to 60
lbs.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.

FORDSON TRACTOR AND PLOWS,
in good condition; 3 farm wagons, one 5-
ton Milburn; one 2 and 3-horse wagon and
bed; one 2-horse wagon and bed; one
New Idea manure spreader, one Deering
binder. 6-ft. cut; Massey Harris corn
harvester, Osborne mower, 5-cut; Osborne
horse rake, 10-ft. Empire Jr. 12 disc grain
drill for horses or tractor; J. I. Case corn
planter, Kentucky lime spreader, set 18-ft.
hay carriages, 2 riding corn plows, 2 walk-
ing corn plows, Wiard barshear plow,
double disc harrow, two 17-tooth lever
harrows, harrow and roller combined; steel
land roller, Papec 10-in. ensilage cutter,
International 10-in. chopping mill, circu-
lar saw and frame, fanning mill, oil drum,
cutting box.

FORD TOURING CAR,

1925 model, in good condition, rubber-tire
buggy, steel-tire buggy, 2 sleighs, stretch-
ers, single and double trees, jockey sticks,
fifth, log and breast chains, dung, sheaf
and pitch forks, digging irons, shovels,
dirt and scoop, one ground scoop, 15-ton
jack. No. 3 Sharpies suction feed cream
separator, 6 milk cans, cook stove, ten-
plate stove, 3-burner oil stoveharrel churn,
incubator, 120-egg.

HARNESS,

consisting of heavy and light harness, col-
lars, bridles, lines, halters, saddle, wagon
whip. Stewart horse clippers, and many
other articles not mentioned.

TERMS—All sums of $5.00 and under,
cash. On larger sums a credit of 8 months
will be given, the purchasers to give their
notes with approved security, bearing in-
terest from day of sale. No goods to be
removed until settled for.

D. A. STULL.
B. P. OGLE, Auct.
BURKETT & MAXELL, Clerks. 2-19-3t

The undersigned intending to quit farm-
ing, will sell at Public Sale on the A. J.
Ohler farm, known as the Samuel Null farm
near Bridgeport 11, iriLes from State
Road along Piney Creek, and 1% Inliek
from Keysville road, on

THURSDAY, MARCH 41h., 192C,
at 11 o'clock, sharp, the following person-
al property, to-wit:

FOUR HEAD HORSES,
Lion, black horse, 14 years old,

IFIE will work wherever hitched;
Tobe, black horse, 10 years old,
will work wherever hitched, en

excellent saddle horse; Fan. sorrel male,
14 years old, will work wheraver hitched,
and a good family driver; Kernal, hay
horse 10 years old, a goo -1 strad horse.
All these horses fearless of road objects.

12 HEAD OF CATTLE,
No. 1, white cow, carrying 4th, calf, will
be fresh in the Fall; No. 2,
blue cow, fresh by day of sale;
No. 3, Holstein cow, will have
calf by her side; No. 4. Hol-
stein cow, will be fresh by day of sale;
No. 5 Guernsey cow, will be fresh in the
Fall; No. 6, blue cow, will be fresh by day
of sale; No. 7, red spotted cow, will be
fresh by day of sale; Nos. 8 and 9, 2 heifers
2 years old, will come fresh in Sept.; Nos.
10 and 11; 2 heifers 1 year old; 1 fat bull.
These cattle all passed the T. B. test.

4 HEAD OF HOGS.
1 fine sow, will farrow in April and 3
shoats, will weigh 40 to 50 lbs.

ONE FORD TRUCK,
1918 model, in good running order.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.
One 4-horse Moline wagon, 4-in. tread,

3-ton capacity; good two-horse wagon,
both practically new; set 18-ft. hay car-
riages, set of 15-ft. hay carriages, New
Idea manure spreader, used two seasons;
8-ft. cut Champion binder in good order;
5-ft. cut Moline mower, E and B side-de-
livery rake; horse rake, Buckeye grain
drill, International corn planter, with fer-
tilizer attachment; International riding
corn plow, walking corn plow, Wiard plow,
3-section harrow, steel land roller, spring
wagon, rubber-tire buggy, good is new;
square back cutter, bob sled, sleigh bells,
(lung sled, pump jack, line shaft and pul-
leys lot single, double and traple trees. 2
stretchers, jockey sticks, lot middle rings,
log chain, lock chain, 2 sets breast chains,
2 sets butt traces, pitch forks, dung forks,
straw hooks, hay fork, rope and pulleys,
grain cradle, mowing scythe, all above ma-
chinery in good working order.

4-HORSE STOVER ENGINE,
one Lets chopper. 8-in. buhr.

HARNESS.
2 sets Breechbands, 2 sets front gears,

set buggy harness, 2 pair check lines, 4-
horse wagon line, 6-horse line, 4 collars, 4
halters, 4 bridles wagon saddle, lot bitch-
ing straps, binder whip. Blacksmith tools,
anvil, forge, horseshoeing outfit. soldering
iron.

HOUSEHOLD GOODS.
One Excelsior cook stove, No. 8, a fine

baker; 6-ft. extension table, couch carpet,
matting by the yard: No. 2 Sharpies cream
separator, clutch pulley, tumbler churn, 10
gal. size; Aerator milk cooler, galvanized
milk cooling tank, 5 and 7-gal, milk cans,
buckets, barrels chicken coops, lot brooms,
dinner bell, 75 laying hens, 12 guineas, Cy-
clone seed sower, and many other articles
not mentioned.
TERMS—Sums of $10.00 and under, cash,

Sums above $10.00 a credit of 6 months will
be given, on notes with approved security,
bearing interest from day of sale. No
goods to be removed until settled for.

JOHN H. MOSER,
J. N. O. SMITH, Auct.
S. R. WEYBRIGHT & ELLIS OHLER,

2Clerks. -12-3t

JJ

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned, intending to quit farm-

ing will offer at public sale. on his resi-
dence on the road leading from Taneytown
to Harney, 2 miles from the former place,
on

TUESDAY, MARCH 2, 1926,
at 11 o'clock. the following described per-
sonal property:

3 HEAD OF HORSES,
1 black inure, coming 9 years old, an extra

tine leader; bay mare, coming
10 years old, good leader; one
gray horse, coming 16 years old,
and work anywhere hitched.

The horses are all good size and quiet.
8 HEAD OF CATTLE.

consisting of 6 'flitch cows,
1 will be fresh by day of sale;
1 the last of April, and the rest
are Summer and Fall cows; 1
yearling heifer; 1 good sized stock bull.
These cattle are all T. B. tested.

12 HEAD OF HOGS,
consisting of 10 shoats. 2 brood sows, will
have pigs the first of April.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.
One good 2-horse wagon, hay carriages,

10-ft. long; Deoring binder, 6-ft. cut, in
good condition; Osborne mower, good as
new; International corn planter, with
phosphate attachment and chain, in good
shape; good Moline manure spreader, good
3-horse Syracuse plow, riding corn plow,
two 17-tooth Syracuse lever harrows, one
good as new; land roller, single corn wor-
ker, 2-horse sled, good falling-top buggy,
shovel plow, weeder corn coverer,
spring wagon bed, 2 ladders, one 20-ft.
long; 30 rods poultry wire. 2 gasoline en-
gines, one a 3-horse power, and the other
1%, both are in extra good order; 2 chop-
ping mills, one a Lets mill, good as new;
60-ft of belting, 3 and 4-in.; lot of 2-in,
belting, hay fork, rope and pulleys and
car, corn shelter good as new; pair 1000-
lb. platform scales, one 50-gal, oil drum,
barrel spray, only used one season; black-
smith vise, work bench, grain cradle,
grindstone, road drag, dung sled, wheel-
barrow, surrey spread, crosscut saw, 2
heavy log chains, a lot of standard chains,
breast chains, cow chains, 3-horse double
tree two 2-horse double trees, single trees,
2-horse stretcher, middle rings, jockey
sticks, 100 good guano sacks, digging iron,
pick, scoop shovel, lime shovel, pitch and
dung forks calf crate, some lumber and
posts, lot of good chicken coops, lot of
old iron, 4 bushel good clean clover seed,
corn by the barrel, and chickens by the
pound.

1 Ili

HARNESS.
3 sets lead harness, wagon saddle, collars,

bridles flynets, set single harness, pair
check lines, halters, hitching straps, lead
rein and plow line.

HOUSEHOLD GOODS,
consisting of Sharpies cream separator,
Easy-Way power washer,power churn,good
line shaft and pulleys, 2 meat benches,
barrels, sausage grinder, butcher table,
double heater and pipe; egg stove, corner
cupboard, safe fruit drier. 6 wood bot-
tom chairs, old-fashioned bureau, bed, 2
stands, lounge, 2 rocking chairs, 2%-gal,
ice cream freezer, 1-1b. butter print, but-
ter tub, barrel vinegar, 8 milk cans, buck-
ets, tubs, stone jars, lot of glass jars, and
many other articles not mentioned.
TERMS—Sums of $5.00 and under, cash.

On sums above $5.00 a credit of 6 Months
will be given on notes with approved se-
curity, bearing interest from day of sale.
No goods to be removed until settled for.

IIERBERT D. SMITH.
J. N. 0. SMITH, Auct.

Also at the same time and place, I will
offer the following:

4-HORSE WAGON AND BED,
can be hooked for 3 or 4-horses; pair hay
carriages, 19-ft. long; 2-horse plow, 3-
horse evener, 4-horse double tree, hay
fork and pulleys, 118-ft. rope, new; one
surrey, sleigh, good set buggy harness,
Iowa cream separator, spring cot, 2 Red
Cross cook stoves, etc.
2-12-3t WALTER ECKARD.

Read the Advertisements

IN THE --

CARROLL RECORD

The undersigned intending to quit farm-
ing, will offer at public sale, on his farm,
% mile from Uniontown, on

THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 25, 1926.
at 11 o'clock, the following live stock and
farming implements, consisting of

6 HEAD OF WORK HORSES,
"Frank," grey horse, 13 years old, works
anywhere hitched, and one of the best in
the county; "Nell," a black mare, 10 years

old, works anywhere, an extra
good saddle and lead mare;
"Queen," black mare, 6 years
old, a good• off-side worker, and

a real block; "Tops", bay mare, 6 years
old, a real blocky mare, works most any-
where, has been in the lead a few times;
"Bill," brown horse, 13 years old, an extra
good off-side worker; "Jack," bay horse,
11 years old. a good work horse, will work
anywhere hitched. These horses are all of
a good blocky type, and one of the best
pulling teams in the county.

9 IIEAD OF CATTLE,
steins, Jerseys and Guernseys.
These cows are all good heavy
milkers. and good testers, 4
will be fresh in May, and 4 in
the Fall; 1 stock bull.

3 BROOD SOWS,
2 with pigs by their side, and the other
will farrow in March.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.
3 good farm wagons, one a road wagon

and bed, holds 13 bbls, of corn, the other
wagon and bed, holds 8 bbis. of corn, one
2-horse wagon. holds 5 bbls. of corn, one
spring wagon, good International manure
spreader, good McCormick binder, 7-ft.
cut; Deering mower, horse rake and hay
tedder, hay carriages, good corn planter,
with fertilizer attachment; 2 good Ontario
drills, one 8-hoe drill and one a disc;
disc harrow, 23-tooth lever harrow. two
18-tooth wood frame harrows, one smooth-
ing harrow, 3 barshear Syracuse plows,
land roller, 2 double walking corn plows,
good riding corn plow. 2 single corn plows,
grain cradle, corn shelter. grindstone, 3-
horse evener, two 2-horse stretchers, good
4-horse double tree, 2 triple trees, 3 double
trees, single trees, jockey sticks, fifth, log
and breast chains, dung, straw and pitch
forks, digging iron, shovels, mattock, pick,
scoop shovel, crosscut saw, wagon jack,
bushel basket, half bushel measure, sledge
hammer and wedge, lot good milk cans,
buckets, and strainer, corn by the barrel,
barley by the bushel. •

HARNESS.
2 sets breechbands, 6 sets of front gears,

8 bridles. 8 collars, one good set spring
wagon harness, 6 choke straps, carrying
straps, 7 halters, 6-horse line, 4-horse line,
2 pair check lines, wagon saddle, good
wagon whip. new pair Stewart horse clip-
pers. and one hand clipper, and many
other articles too numerous to mention.
All these articles are as good as can be

found on' any farm.
TERMS—All sums of $10.00 and under,

cash. On larger sums, a credit of 6 months
will be given, the purchasers to give their
notes with satisfactory security, bearing
interest from day of sale. No goods to be
removed until settled for.

MAURICE C. DUTTERA.
J. N. 0. SMITH, Auct.
Jesse P. Garner & 0. E. Dodrer, Clerks.

1-29-4t
•

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned, intending to quit farm-

ing, will offer at public sale, on the Sher-
etts farm, 1 mile from Keymar, and 5 miles
from Taneytown, along the hard road, on

THURSDAY, MARCH 11, 1926,
at 12 o'clock, sharp, the following personal
property:

3 HEAD OF HORSES,
Bess, a bay mare, 8 years old, will work

anywhere, and an extra good
leader; Bird a black mare, 9
years old, will work anywhere
hitched. Both are safe for women

to drive; Charlie, a bay horse, 9 years old,
will work anywhere but in the lead.

6 HEAD OF CATTLE,
1 roan cow, carrying her 6th.
calf, will be fresh by day of sale
and 5 Holstein, New York
heifers. Some of these will be
fresh by day of sale, and others later. All
T. B. tested.

16 HEAD OF SHOATS,
weighing from 40 to 80 lbs.
FARMING IMPLEMENTS.

Champion binder, 7-ft cut; Emerson hay
loader and Emerson rake and tedder, good
as new; Deering mower, 5-ft. cut; Hoosier
grain drill, 8-hoe; McCormick-Deering No.
4 riding corn plow, good as new; Low 20th
Century manure spreader, good as new;
Blue Ridge 3%-in. skein, 3-in. tread, 2%-
ton wagon; Birdsell 3%-in. skein, 4-in.
tread, 4-ton wagon and bed, will hold be-
tween 12 and 13 barrels of corn; Interna-
tional 25-tooth harrow. Moline 2-row corn
planter, 80 rod of chains, 3x6. good as
new; 2 sets of hay carriages 18-ft. long;
Moline barshear plow, Syracuse barshear
plow, single corn worker, double shovel
plow, buggy pole, forks, shovels straw
knife and hook, bushel basket, 134-ft. hay
rope, 2 log chains, wood saw wheelbar-
row, 6 good milk cans, circular saw, Alamo
1% H. P. gasoline engine and house, 8
single trees, two 3-horse trees two 2-horse
trees, 4-horse tree, 6 jockey sticks, 6 mid-
dle rings, wagon jack, digging iron,

IIARNESS.
2 sets breechbands 3 sets front gears,

3 bridles, set of cheek lines, 6-horse line,
wagon saddle, 3 collars, wagon whip, 3
housings, 2 sets of web nets 4 leather hal-
ters, and many other articfes not men-
tioned.
TERMS—Sums of $5.00 and under, cash.

On sums above $5.00 a credit of 12 months
will be given, on notes with approved se-
curity, bearing interest from day of sale.
No goods to .be removed until settled for.

FRANK HOUCK.
J. N. 0. SMITH, Auct.
ELLIS OHLER & EDW. EARNER, Clerks

Also at the same time and place. I will
offer the following:

BEDROOM SUITE,
kitchen cupboard. 8-ft. enxtension table,
2 swing rocking chairs, 6 caneseated chairs,
lot of carpet, mattress, lot of bed clothing,
wardrobe, 6 window blinds, double heater
coal stove. 3-burner oil stove, and baker;
3 axes, 3 hand saws, picks, drills, shovel,
stone hammer, and many articles not men-
tioned.
2-19-3t GEO. H. DIEHL.

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned intending to quit

housekeeping will offer at public sale,
on his premises in Taneytown, on
SATURDAY, FEBRUARY 27, 1926.
at 12 o'clock, the following personal
property:

HOUSEHOLD FURNITURE,
consisting of 3 Bedroom suits, 3
springs, 3 mattresses, 3 bowls and
pitchers, bed clothes, extra bureau,
wardrobe,

ALEXANDRA PIANO,

music cabinet, 3-piece pallor suite,
stand, large mirror, 2x4-ft.; library
table, hall rack, desk, extension ta-
ble, buffet, kitchen cabinet, refriger-
ator, 1/2-dozen kitchen chairs, 6 rock-
ers, 3 cane bottom chairs, leaf table.

WROUGHT IRON RANGE,
double heater, washing machine,
kitchen utensils, dishes, glassware,
crocks, pans, knives and forks;wheel-
barrow, about 1/2-bbl. vinegar, empty
barrel, hogshead, forks, hoes and a
lot of other things.
TERMS made known on doy of sale

H. G. LAMBERT, SR.
J. N. 0. SMITH, Auct. 2-5-4

— OF .A —

DESIRABLE RESIDENCE
in Keymar, Carroll County, Maryland.

By virtue of a decree of the Circuit Court
for Carroll County wherein William J.
Stansbury, et. al., are Plaintiffs and Walter
J. Brown, infant, is defendant. being No.
5673 Equity, the undersigned Trustees, will
sell at public sale upon the premises, on

FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 1926,
at 2 o'clock, P. It.. all that tract or parcel
of land containing 18 square rods, "Lore or
less, improved by a large

FRAME DWELLING,
10 rooms, with porches on 3 sides of
house, cellar, pantry and stable and gar-
age with space sufficient for 3 automobiles
and 2 horses. This is one of the most
beautiful and desirable homes in Keymar,
Carroll County, Maryland, and is equipped
with electric light, other modern improve-
ments, and well of water on porch. There
are also all kinds of fruit upon the prem-
ises.
This property was formerly known as

the residence of William F. Cover and for
the past 4 years was occupied by the late
Joshua Albert Stansbury, and which he
owned at the time of his death.
TERMS OF SALE—One-third cash on

the day of sale, or upon the ratification
thereof by the Court; and the residue shall
be paid in two equal payments, the one to
be paid in one year, and the other in two
years from the day of sale, with interest,
and to be secured by the notes of the pur-
chaser or purchasers, with approved se-
curity, or all cash at the option of the pur-
chaser or purchasers.

WILLIAM J. STANSBURY,
GEORGE F., STANSBURY.

Trustees. .
WEANT & SHIPLEY, Attorneys.
J. N. 0. SMITH, Auct.

Administrators' Sale
— OF _

Household Goods & kitchen Furniture
in Keymar, Carroll County, Maryland.

By virtue of an order of the Orphans'
Court of Carroll County, the undersigned
administrators of Joshua Albert Stans-
bury, late of Carroll County, Maryland,
deceased, will sell at public sale upon the
premises in Keymar, Carroll County, Ma-
ryland, and formerly occupied by the in-
testate, Joshua Albert Stansbury, at the
time of his death, on

FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 26. 1926,
at 12:30 o'clock, P. M., the follow-tag per-
sonal property, viz:-

BEDROOM SUITE,
bed bureau and wash stand, wardrobe, bed
springs, mattress, washbowl and pitcher,
5-piece bureau set, 20 yds. ingrain carpet,
3 chairs and rocker, cane rocker, chair,
wash bowl and pitcher, 3 rugs chest, lap
robe, coverlid, slop jar, china tea pot, um-
brella, clock, small pitcher, 2 lamps, 10 yds
stair carpet settee, rocker, 3 arm chairs,
Morris chair, small settee, stand (clover
leaf); electric lamp, mirror, stand, 35 yds.
brussels carpet, lounge, mohair chair, leath-
er rocker, 2 arm rockers table, victrola.
book-case and desk, combined; double heat-
er, 35-yds carpet, 3 rugs, 8-day clock, re-
frigerator, sink, hand saw, box tools, axe,
lawn mower, step ladder, 18-ft. ladder, hand
cart, pair trestles, digging iron, corn drag,
shovel plow, coal shute, pile of lumber,
shovel, dung fork, chicken house and oth-
er articles.
TERMS OF SALE—All sums under $5.00

cash, and on all sums of $5.00 and upward,
a credit of 6 months will be given, the pur-
chaser or purchasers giving his, her, or
their notes, with approved security, bear-
ing interest from day of sale. No goods
to be removed until settled for.

WLILIAM J. STANSBURY,
GEORGE F. STANSBURY,

Administrators of Joshua A. Stansbury
deceased.

WEANT & SHIPLEY, Attorneys.
J. N. 0. SMITH Auct. 1-29-4t

SHERIFF'S SALE
By virtue of two writs of fieri facias is-

armed out of the Circuit Court for Carroll
County, at the suit of Samuel M. Poole and
Nettie L. Poole, his wife. and L. Amidee
Barnes, respectively. against the goods
and chattels, lands and tenements of Roy
F. Fritz and Beulah AL Fritz, his wife,
to me directed, I have seized and taken
In execution the following real estate, per-
sonal property. gooas and chattels of the
said Roy F. Fritz and Beulah H, Fritz, his
wife, viz:-
All that piece or parcel of land contain-

ing

6 ACRES, 3 ROODS
and 33 Square Perches, more or less, im-
proved by

DWELLING HOUSE,

outbuilding and large carpenters' and
wheel-wright shop, situated about one-
half mile from Frizellburg on the Union-
town road. in Carroll County, and being
the same land which was conveyed to the
said Roy F. Fritz and wife by Edwin C.
Poole and wife, by deed dated August 18,
1923, and recorded among the Land Rec-
ords of Carroll County in Liber E. M. M.
Jr., No. 142, folio 406.

PERSONAL PROPERTY.

Drill press, gasoline engine, 24-in, pulley
and belting, grindstone, lot loose pullets,
scythe, 4 sacks lime, steel drum, 4 log
hooks one 3-way pulley, 4-hqrse evener,
lot lumber, wood lathe, tools and pulleys,
sledge hammer, wood planer and pulleys,
rip saw with three extra saws, lot oak
lumber, jig saw, oak plank, ladder, step
ladder, wheelbarrow frame, cross-cut saw,
6 trestles, saw frame, auger, auto engine,
wheelbarrow, wee, 3 saws, 5 squares, 4
planes, hand axe, (3 braces and bits, lot
bolts, s'erew driver, lot tools, hone and
chisel, box files, post lamp, vise block,
pulleys. ropes and chains, 3 trestle's, draw
knife, 2 saws, 2 clamps 2 chains, saw, lot
sheet iron, level, lot bolts and washers,
wood vise, table, 3 bags fertilizer, roll pa-
per, rope. 2 mill rolls, shoeing hoer, lot
bolts and parts, ladder, lot lumber, lot
hames, lot lumber and boxes. 3 hoes and
mattock, lot walnut lumber, lot poplar
lumber, lot rims Ford truck body, piece
belting, 1 old desk, truck bed, lot belting,
lot steel, tire shrinker, pair shears, foot
vise anvil, block steel, staple bender, 18
hammers, 3 sledge hammers, vise, bolt cut-
ter, lamp drum, lot bits, lot tongs, bellows
and blower, oil can measuring wheel, lot
horse shoes, lantern', lot clips, 2 shovels,
water can, lot chains, 8 clamps vise, store,
mattock, 4 wheelbarrow wheels, solder
iron bolt cutter, tree pruner, lot chisels,lathe tools and box. hoe and handle, dou-
ble tree, lot iron, lot bolts and screws
cleaver, scythe, lot tools, oil can, pipe
wrench, 4 monkey wrenches 2 pair pin-
cers, 2 braces, 5 files, 4 punches. 2 cold
chisels, 3 hammers 6 wrenches, pair snips,
4 chisels, 2 screw' drivers, auto crank. 2
pliers, 11 stocks and dies, hack saw, pipe
cutter, scythe, saw set, lot tools and parts
lot bolts and screws, hand drill, hatchet,
hammer, chisel, wrench, shafting pulleys
and belting, sledge. crowbar, 2 piece axle,
auto chassis, auto body, lot lumber, lot
scrap iron, lot trestles, hammer, shovel.
pick 2 rocking chairs, 5 chairs, sewing
machine, 2 tables, cupboard. Remington
pump gun, buffet, table, 3 rockers, rug,
floor oil cloth and linoleum drafting table.
table, stand, 2 chairs, 2 beds, 2 chairs, 1
kitchen range, and two mattresses.
I hereby give notice that on

SATURDAY, FEBRUARY 20th., 1926,

at 12 o'clock, noon, on the premises afore-
said, I will offer for sale the real estate,
goods and chattels so seized and taken in
execution, by public auction to the highest
bidder, for cash.

WILLIAM T. PHILLIPS, Sheriff.
WEANT & SHIPLEY, Attorneys.
J. N. 0, SMITH, Auct. 1-29-4t
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CORRESPONDENCE
Latest Itemsof Local News Furnished
By Our Regular Staff of Writers
All communications for this department

must be signed by the author; nor for pub-
lication, but as an evidence that the items
sontributer are legitimate and correct.
Items M:sed on mere rumor, or such as are
likely to give offense, are not wanted.
We desire correspondence to reach our

office on Thursday, if at all possible. It
will be necessary, therefore, for most let-
ters to be mailed on Wednesday, or by
Fast Mail, west, on W. M. It. It.. Thurs-
day morning. Letters mailed on Thurs-
day evening may not reach us in time.

EMMITSBURG.

Prof. Edmund J. Ryan, for many
years an instructor in English at Mt.
St. Mary's College, died at his home,
near the College, early Monday morn-
ing, from a complication, being ill
only a few days. His death was a
great shock to his many friends in
this community. He was 58 years
old and is survived by his wife and
six children: Gertrude, Baltimore;
Rita, Edmund, Cornelius, Frank, at
home, and Joseph, of Siou Falls, S.
D.; two sisters, Ellen and Winifred
Ryan, of Hartford, Conn. The fu-
neral was held on Thursday morning
at Mt. St. Mary's Church. Solemn re-
quiem mass was said by Monsingor B.
J. Bradley, and Right Reverend
Monsinger J. J. Tierney, preached the
sermon; interment was in the College
cemetery.
Mr. and Mrs. Vincent Eckenrode,

celebrated the 50th. anniversary of
their marriage, on Sunday. Solemn
High Mass was held at St. Anthony's
Church as a compliment to the bride
and groom, by their pastor, Rev. E. F.
Riley, C. M. The altar was decorated
in gold and white. Many beautiful
presents and numerous congratula-
tions were received from their many
friends. The following were present
at a very delicious dinner, served at
their home: Rev. Connors, of New
York; Rev. Smith, of Pettsburgh;
Rev. E. F. Riley, Sister Bernard
Orndorff, Mr. and Mrs. Vincent Eck-
enrode, Mr. and Mrs. Charles Ecken-
rode and sons, Mr. and Mrs. Bernard
Eckenrode and daughter, and Mr. and
Mrs. John Roddy.
Mrs. Arch Eyler, spent several days

in Baltimore.
Mrs. John Wagerman, entertained

at cards, on Tuesday evening.
The Social Help Society, of the

Lutheran Church, will be entertained
at the home of Miss Ella Shriver, this
Friday evening.
James Riffle, who underwent an op-

eration at the Frederick City Hospital
last week, is very ill.
H. M. Gillelan has returned home,

after spending some time in Florida.

LINWOOD.

Several of our citizens attended the
play, at Middleburg, last Saturday
evening, and considered it very en-
tertaining.
Mr. John Kefauver, died at his

home, at McKinstry's, last Saturday.
Funeral services were held Tuesday
afternoon, at the home.
John Roop and family were Sunday

visitors of Elmer Pittinger and fam-
ily.
Roger Fritz is sick at this writing.
Walter Hines and family and Mrs.

Amos Rudy, of Frederick, spent Sun-
day with Mrs. Mollie Hines.

Miss Bertha Drach attended a val-
entine party in Westminster, last
Friday evening.
"That Girl Anne," will be given at

the hall, this Friday evening.
Mrs. Laura Etzler, spent the week

with her daughter, Mrs. Frank Stev-
enson, of Westminster.
Mrs. Claud Etzler and daughter,

Jane, are visiting Mrs. Warfield, of
Frederick.
Mr. and Mrs. Calvin Hinkley, enter-

tained a few of their friends, last
Thursday evening, at a "Valentine
party." The house was beautifully
decorated with valentine emblems;
and the evening was pleasantly spent
with games, stunts and music. At a
late hour we were invited to the din-
ing room, where delicious refresh-
ments were served. The favors and
prizes were very attractive.

UNIONTOWN.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Haines entc.r
tamed Mr. and Mrs. Ham. Fritz and
family, on Sunday.

While coasting, Saturday, little
Elva Sittig had her leg broken, and
is getting along as well as can be ex-
pected.

Miss Maude Sheler, a student of the
Western Maryland College, was a
week-end guest of Miss Kathryn Gil-
bert.
Rev. J. H. Hoch is on the sick list.
David Cantwell, New Windsor,

spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. B. L.
Waltz.
Mrs. Oscar Fritz, of Clear Ridge,

who has been suffering from the
grippe, is slowly improving. •
The children of Mr. and Mrs. John

Burall gave Mr. Burall a birthday
surprise party on Tuesday evening,
Feb. 9th., 1926.

DETOUR

Mrs. James Few died at her home,
near here, Saturday, Feb. 13, 1926.
She is survived by her husband and
seven small children. Funeral ser-
vices were held Monday at Creagers-
town; interment in adjoining ceme-
tery.
L. D. Troxell spent Tuesday in

Frederick.
Master Arville and Chalmer Gross-

nickle, who were quite sick with
measles, are better again.
Mr. and Mrs. Gregg Kiser and

daughter, Pauline, spent Sunday with
his parents. Mr. and Mrs. James
Kiser. of Keysville.

J. W. Whitmore has been visiting
his sinter in Frederick, the past few
weeks.
John Saylor is on the sick list, at

present.

Frederick A. Eckard, an employe of
the Cement Company, died at his
home in Union Bridge, at 1 o'clock
Tuesday morning, after a nine days
illness of influenza. He was aged 21
years, 8 months and 24 days. He was
married a year ago, in December, to
Miss Gertrude Stover, only daughter
of Mr. and Mrs. George S. Stover, of
this place. He is survived by his wife
and a two weeks' old daughter, Jean
I. Eckard; father, Mr. William U.
Eckard, near Union Bridge, and the
following sisters and brothers, Mrs.
Jonas Geaty, of Baltimore; Mrs.
Clarence Ohler, Taneytown;Mrs. Mon-
roe Wilson and Mrs. Gordon Fogle, of
Union Bridge; Charles and Guy Eck-
ard, of Piney Creek. The body was
removed to the home of his wife's
parents, Mr. and Mrs. George Stover,
in this place, where the funeral was
held Thursday afternoon, at 1:30
o'clock. Rev. D. S. Kammerer, pas-
tor of St. Paul's Lutheran church,
officiating. Interment was made in
Mt. Carmel cemetery. Members of
the K. of P. Lodge, at Union Bridge,
of which Mr. Eckard was a member,
acted as pall-bearers.
Frank Hartlaub, of this place, at-

tended the funeral of Abdiel Cashman,
which was held in Taneytown on
Monday morning.

Miss Florence Study, near town,and
Oscar Stambaugh, Green Springs,
were married Tuesday evening in
Hanover, at the Evangelical parson-
age, by the Rev. G. W. Frey, after
a short wedding trip they will return
and engage in farming, near Green
Springs.
Mrs. Curvin Carbaugh, of Mt. Pleas-

ant, was a recent guest of her par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. James Staub.
Mr. and Mrs. M. I. Engle and

daughters, Betty and Aldena, were
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Harry Hawk,
at Pennville.

Carolyn Elaine Geiselman, infant
daughter of Robert C. and Edna V.
(Matthias) Geiselman, died at their
home at Wellsboro, N. Y., on Monday,
at 4:50 P. M. The deceased was an
only child and was aged 12 days. Sur-
viving are the parents, also the ma-
ternal grand-parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Matthias, of this place, and
the paternal grand-mother, Mrs. Sar-
ah Geiselman, of Gettysburg. The
body arrived in this place Wednesday
morning, and was taken to the home
of the grand-parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Chas. Matthias, at their apartments.
The funeral was held on Wednesday
afternoon. Mrs. Geiselman's pastor,
Rev. A. G. Wolf, of St. Mary's Luth-
eran Church, Silver Run, officiating.
Interment took place in Evergreen
cemetery, Gettysburg.

Miss Catherine Pifer, a Reformed
Missionary of Japan, is a guest of
Rev. and Mrs. Earl G. Kline, at Re-
deemer's Reformed Parsonage.
Mr. and Mrs. Luke Jacobs gave a

valentine party to their daughter,
Marion, on Saturday evening. The
following little girl friends were pres-
ent: Golda Hartlaub, Jane Spalding,
Ruth Warehime, Esther Bair, Ade-
laide Beck, Ethel Lindaman, Peggy
Spalding, Abigeal Kammerer, Janet
Eppleman, Virginia Beck, Elizabeth
Alleman, Louise Crouse, Alma Louise
Weaver, Marion and Ruth Jacobs.
Miss Arlene Trostle, daughter of

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Trostle, has con-
tracted scarlet fever.

NORTH EAST CARROLL.

Preaching at St. David's (Sher-
man's): Sunday evening, at 10 o'clock,
by Rev. E. M. Sando; Sunday School,
at 8:45; Christian Endeavor, at 7:00.

Miss Annie Monath is spending
this week in Baltimore, with her
brother, Parker Monath and family.
Those entertained by Paul Garrett

and family, recently, by radio, were:
Mr. and Mrs. Ervin Fuhrman, daugh-
ters, Arlene and Gladys, Mr. and Mrs.
Clinton Bachman, son, Earl; Miss
Sarah Weaver, Mr. and Mrs. Amos
Grogg, Mrs. Edward Wink, Mr. and
Mrs. Wesley Horich, Mr. and Mrs.
Paul Laughman, Mrs. William Utz,
Mr. and Mrs. Archer Zentz and daugh-
ter, Carolyn; Stewart Garrett, Melvin
Kopp, Guy Sterner, Jacob Wentz,
Herman Fasto, Norman Myers, Ray-
mond Myers and Ernest Fuhrman.
Week-end visitors at the home of

Charles Monath and family were: Mr.
and Mrs. Parker Monath, and son
David; Mr. and Mrs. Clinton Monath,
daughter, Pauline; Mr. and Mrs.
Howard Bowman, Mr. and Mrs.
Marcelas Yost, sons, Norman and
John and Raymond Leese.
The funeral of John Baublitz, of

Pleasant Hill, store proprietor, who
died on Wednesday, at York, West
Side Sanitorium, was held Saturday
at St. David's Church, the Rev. A. M.
Hollinger, pastor, officiated. The
pall-bearers were Jerome Masemore,
John Richard, Melvin Feeser, Wesley
Stegner, George Garrett and Edward'
Wolfgang. Interment took place in
the family lot in St. David's cemetery.

Guests entertained on Faust Naught
evening, at the home of Howard Bow-
man and family, were: Mr. and Mrs.
Clarence Nace, Mr. and Mrs. ReVerdy
Nace, Eugent Resh, Miss Miriam
Nace, Joyce Nace, Gladys Nace and
Clair Nace.
A valuable horse, belonging to

Howard Bowman, died on Wednesday. I

HARNEY.

On last Friday evening, Mrs. Fan-
nie Hesson was stricken with paraly-
sis, on the left side and very severe,
and she was rendered unconscious in
which condition she remained nearly
all the time until Saturday evening,
when she died. She leaves her hus-
band, J. D. Hesson, her father, H. M.
Null, one sister Ella Menchey, of
Baltimore; one brother, Samuel Null,
of Hanover, besides a number nieces
and nephews, and many friends who
will miss her. Funeral services were
held at the U. B. Church, on Tuesday
morning by her pastor, Rev. George
Brown. Interment was made in Moun-
tain View cemetery. Mrs. Hesson
was in her 50th. year.
On Wednesday evening, Mrs. How-

ard Kump and Miss Laura Fream
were married at the Lutheran par-
sonage by Rev. L. K. Young. The
young couple have our best wishes.
There seems to be quite a lot of

sickness throughout the community.

Jack Bower, of Taneytown, spent
the week-end at the home of his
grand-parents, J. H. Roop and wife.
Mrs. Lucinda Greenwood, who re-

cently sold her property, on Pike Hill,
has rented an apartment at Thomas
Pearre's, which she will occupy in the
near future.
Truman Smith, who is stationed at

New York, with the U. S. Marine
Coast Guard, is visiting his parents,
here, Harry B. Smith and wife, for
10 days.

Miss Thelma Smith, who has been
sick, has returned to her work in the
Deputy Clerks office, at Westminster.

Clarence Kemper and \family, of
Westminster, spent Saturday evening
and Sunday at W. 0. Barnes'.
N. H. Haile. who has been suffer-

ing with a severe attack of neuralgia,
is somewhat better, at this writing.
The King Herald Society met at

the home of Mrs. G. W. Paul, on Sat-
urday afternoon last.
The Men's Bible Class of the M. E.

Church, recently finished a contest for
new members, and on Thursday eve-
ning held a social.
Mrs. Alice Richardson, who has

been indisposed, is improving at this
writing.
Mrs. Elgin Lippy and daughter, of

Westminster, visited at T. J. Fritz's,
on Saturday last.
Ralph Lambert, of Thurmont, vis-

ited his parents here, on Monday last.
Miss Margaret Lescallet, of Balti-

more, spent the week-end here with
her parents, Edward Lescallet and
wife.
Paul Wilhelm and family, of West-

minster, spent Sunday last in town,
with relatives.

Blue Ridge Basket Ball team de-
feated the State Forestry team, here,
on Friday evening last. This made
the 9th. straight victory for B. R. C.
But on Wednesday evening, the Juni-
ata College defeated the B. R. C.

TWO TAVERNS.

Mr. and Mrs. C. D. Trostle spent
Saturday evening with Mr. and Mrs.
S. P. Miller, at Littlestown.
The Young People's Bible Class will

meet at the home of Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Trostle, Friday evening.
Prof. I. C. Mummert, Principal of

the Roaring Springs High School,
spent the week-end at home, with his
wife and family.

Miss Nida Miller, a student at the
Littlestown High School, spent Wed-
nesday evening with Miss Ruth New-
man.
Those who visited Mr. and Mrs. N.

B. Conover, Sunday, were: Mr. and
Mrs. Willis Appler, of Gettysburg;
Mr. and Mrs. B. B. Bowers, and Mr.
and Mrs. G. M. Conover, of Frogtown.
A community meeting will be held

Friday evening. Snyder's orchestra
will furnish the music. There will
also be a splendid vocal music pro-
gram. Everybody is welcome.
John Collins, a well known gentle-

man of this place, died Sunday morn-
ing, at the home of his daughter, An-
nie Fleshman, Gettysburg; interment
was made on Tuesday morning, at ,
Grace Lutheran Church, here.
George E. Motter, made a business i

trip to Gettysburg, Monday.
Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Appler and

daughters, Mary Jane and Jessie, of
Gettysburg; L. W. Collins, wife and
son, William, and Pauline Boyd, spent
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. M. E. I
Snyder.
Mr. and Mrs. Edward Weikert, Jr.,

and daughter, Peggy, of Gettysburg,
spent Sunday evening at the home of
his parents, Mr. Weikert's, this place. I
The attendance is not being so !

well at the regular community meet-
ings. So friends, members and fellow-
citizens, let us all come out and ac-
complish something worthwhile.

HELEN'S LUDICROUS
SCHEME TO RELIEVE A
NIGHTS DISCOMFORTP BY
MABEL HERBERT URNER IN
THE "HELEN AND WARREN"
SERIES IN SUNDAY'S BALTI-
MORE AMERICAN.

—Advertisement

BLUE RIDGE COLLEGE.

The final examinations are over for
the first semester and some students
are wiser to learn that probation is
not a nightmare but a reality. Stu-
dents whose scholastic standings are
not satisfactory, were either dismiss-
ed, or put on probation. The Basket-
ball team lost their star center, Ted
Soyster, because of failure to pass his
work. He left for home early in the
week.
The new students are now enrolled

and getting started into the atmos-
phere of Blue Ridge.
The Varsity basketball team is on

a winning rampage, after turning in
three victories in Pennsylvania. and
one with Gallaudet in Washington.
The Blue Ridgers defeated the strong
Western Maryland College team, in
the Armory, by the score of 17 to 14.
This was the second defeat adminis-
tered to Western Maryland this sea-
son.
The team took both games from

Shepherd College and Bridgewater
College, on the Virginia trip, and lat-
er defeated Shepherd, at New Wind-
sor, Feb. 10, by score of 38 to 28 in a
fast floor contest.
The finals in the Freshman debates

are scheduled to close in February.
Arrangements are being entered into
to put on inter-collegiate debates
with the girls of Blue Ridge meeting
the girls team from Bridgewater Col-
lege.
Miss Evelyn Wingate, a loyal Alum-

ni spent last week-end visiting her
sister, Carolyn and other friends of
the College. Miss Wingate is a suc-
cessful teacher in the Annapolis High
School.
Edward Slaughter, brother of

William, is visiting the College Hill.
(Received too late for use last week.)

"HOW CUNNING NATURE
DECEIVES IN AFFAIRS OF
MARRIED WOMEN," BY
KATHLEEN NORRIS, NOTED
WOMAN WRITER IN SUN-
DAY'S BALTIMORE AMERI-
CAN.

—Adve rtisetnent

WILDASIN—CRUSHONG.
Mr. Paul L. Wildasin and Miss

Helen M. Crushong, of Silver Run
Valley, were united in marriage, Feb.
9, 1926, by Elder George F. Bowers,
at his residence.

SAUBLE—SHOEMAKER.
Mr. Norman R. Sauble and Miss

Beulah Shoemaker were married at
the home of the bride, on Saturday,
February 13, at 1 o'clock, by Rev. L.
K. Young, pastor of the Mt. Joy Luth-
eran Charge. Sixty-nine of the rela-
tives and friends of the bride and
groom witnessed the ceremony.
The bride wore a white bridal

satin gown trimmed in Georgette and
pearl beads, and carried a bouquet of
white roses. The groom wore a suit
of midnight blue. The attendants
were Miss Mary Durborow, of Get-
tysburg, and Mr. George Liard, of
New Jersey, student at Gettysburg
Seminary. Otis Shoemaker, brother
of the bride, walked with her, and
Raymond Sauble, brother of the
groom, walked with him. Miss Ethel
Sauble, sister of the groom, played
the Lohrengin wedding march.
Numerous handsome gifts were re-

ceived, consisting of checks, china-
ware, silverware, linen, etc. Immedi-
ately after a buffet lunch was served,
they left for a trip to Niagara Falls.

DIED.
imituarics, poetry and resolutions, charg-

ed for at the rate of five cents per line.
The regular death notices published free

MR. JOHN R. KEFAUVER.
Mr. John R. Kefauver,a well known

resident of McKinstry's Mins, died on
Saturday, aged 82 years, 2 months,
17 days. Mr. Kefauver was a shoe-
maker by trade, and lived in the
neighborhood in which he died, for
many years.
He is survived by his wife and

three sons; John, of Berwyn, Md.;
Elthan. of York, Pa., and Samuel, of
Philadelphia. Funeral services were
held at the home, on Tuesday, inter-
ment being made in Pipe Creek cem-
etery.

MR. LEVI MYERS.
Mr. Levi Myers, formerly a mer-

chant and long time resident of Pleas-
ant Valley, died at the home of his
dauhters, Mrs. T. W. Fowler, in Bal-
timore, Wednesday morning, aged
about 80 years. In addition to his
daughter, he leaves two sons, Howard
and Charles, of Baltimore.
Mr. Myers was a Civil War veteran

and was well known throughout Car-
roll County. Funeral services will be
held in St. Matthew's Church, Satur-
day morning, in charge of Rev. J. W.
Reinecke.

MR. ABDIEL V. CASHMAN.
Mr. Abdiel V. Cashman, a retired

farmer, died at his home on Baltimore ,
St., Taneytown, Feb. 12, 1926, from a '
complication of diseases covering a
long period of ill-health, but was
confined to his bed only a few weeks.
His age was 73 years, 11 months, 29
days.
He is survived by his wife and one

son, Charles, at home. Funeral ser-
vices were held on Monday, at the
home, in charge of Rev. W. V. Gar-
rett. Interment was made in the
Lutheran cemetery. The pall-bearers
were all nephews of the deceased.

MRS. JOHN D. HESSON.
Mrs. Fannie, wife of Mr. John D.

Hesson, died at her home in Harney,
on February 13, following a stroke of
paralysis received on the 11th. She
is survived by her husband, her fath-
er, Henry M. Null, sister, Mrs. Henry
Menchey, of Baltimore, and a brother,
Samuel Null, of Baltimore.
Funeral services were held in the

U. B. Church, Harney, on Tuesday.
by her pastor, Rev. Geo. A. Brown,
interment being in the Lutheran cem-
etery at Harney. Her age was 49
years, 6 months, 4 days.

MR. FRED. A. ECKARD.
Mr. Frederick A. Eckard died at

his home in Union Bridge, early Tues-
day morning, from influenza, aged 21
years, 8 months, 24 days. He was an
employee at the cement plant and was
ill only a little over a week.
He is survived by his wife, and an

infant only ten days old. Also by his
father, William U. Eckard, near Un-
ion Bridge, and the following brothers
and sisters, Mrs. Geatty, Baltimore;
Mrs. Gordon Fogle, Mrs. Elmer Shank
and Mrs. Monroe Wilson, Union
Bridge; Mrs. Clarence Ohler, Taney-
town, and Guy and Charles Eckard,
near Taneytown.
Funeral services were conducted on

Thursday afternoon at the home of
his wife's parents, Mr. and Mrs. Geo.
Stover, Littlestown, on Thursday af-
ternoon. (Mrs. Stover was Miss Belle
Fink, formerly of Taneytown, before
marriage). Services were in charge
of Rev. D. S. Kammerer, and inter-
ment was made in Mt. Carmel ceme-
tery, Littlestown. The K. of P. Lodge
of Union Bridge, conducted the ser-
vices in the cemetery.

MISS SARAH CLUTS.
Miss Sarah Cluts died at the home

of her niece. Mrs. Charles Buffington,
near Mt. Union, on Sunday evening,
Feb. 14, aged about 88 years. She
had been failing for some time, but
was not seriously ill until quite re-
cently.
She was a sister of the late Josiah

Cluts, of Taneytown, and is survived
by the following nephews and nieces:
John H. Cluts, of Taneytown; Jacob
D. Cluts, Elmwood, Ill.; Mrs. Rowe
Ohler, and Mrs. Laura Devilbiss, Em-
mitsburg;Mrs. Milton Ohler, and Mrs.
Hickman Snider, Taneytown, and Mrs.
Chas. E. Buffington, near Union
Bridge, with whom she made her
home, and George Cluts, of Keysville.
Through her generosity toward

the Taneytown Lutheran Church, and
in memory of her parents, she con-
tributed the gates to the Lutheran
cemetery at the time of the improve-
ments to the cemetery some years
ago.
Funeral services were held at the

home, on Wednesday afternoon, by
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Raise All the Chicks You Hatch
Raise them the Pan-a-ce-a way:
Start them right—keep them growirig=withouff

any backset.
PAN-A-CE-A gives chicks good appetite and

good digestion—helps them develop rapidly—gives,
them vigor and disease resistance.
PAN-A-CE-A prevents fermentation of the food;

fermentation is where most of the bowel troubles
start.
PAN-A-CE-A is a gentle tonic to all the little-,

chick organs—keeps the system in order.
PAN-A-CE-A contains the Salts of Iron, so essen-

tial to early chick life, and during the rapid growth
of feathers.
PAN-A-CE-A prevents and cures gapes, indiges-

tion, diarrhea, and leg weakness.
PAN-A-CE-A your chicks and then watch them

feather! A Pan-a-ce-a chick will out-feather a
non-Pan-a-ce-a chick every time.

If you want early broilers, if you want pullets
that will develop into fall and winter layers, then
raise your chicks the Pan-a-ce-a way.

(,))
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Tell us how many chkks you nave. We have a package to salt.

Dr. Hess
Stock Tonic
keeps pigs
healthy.Drites
out the worms.

Dr.Hess Instant Louse Killer Ki1htice

T HE WhifOrftWeR STORE

her pastor, Rev. J. E. Lowe, inter- HEAR TOWN CRIERment being made in the Lutheran
cemetery, Taneytown.

MR. GEORGE W. YEISER.
George W. Yeiser, one of the most

widely known citizens of Carroll
county, whose home was at Union
Mills, died at Plant City, Florida, on
Tuesday. He had been in ill health I
for the past year, and recently suf-
fered a light stroke of paralysis. He
operated a large general store at Un-
ion Mills and was generally active in
community affairs.
He was one of the most active men

in the county in Sunday School and
Temperance work, and had for years I
been at the forefront in such move-'
ments. He was also prominent in the,
work of the Lutheran church, not only
at St. Mary's, Silver Run, but on num-
erous occasions served the church at
large at Conferences and Synods.
Mr. Yeiser had travelled widely,

having visited the Holy Land; and
only a few years ago, in company with
his wife, motored to and from the
Pacific Coast. He is survived by his
wife, who before marriage was Miss
Susan Shaffer, and one daughter, Mrs.
Treva Kindig, of Union Mills, his son-
in-law being actively associated with
him in the mercantile business. His
age was 66 years, 3 months, 18 days.
Mrs. Yeiser, who is also in poor

health, was with him on his visit to
Florida. He is also survived by the
following brothers and sisters; Rev.
M. E. Yeiser, Erie, Pa.;   Yeiser,
Westminster; Clinton H. Yeiser, Mrs.
Harry Berwager, Mrs. Uriah Sterner,
Mrs. John Feeser, Mrs. S. H. Willet
and Mrs. Theodore Flickinger, of
Hanover, and Mrs. Henry Becker, of
Taneytown.

I SEVEN MILES AWAY

IN MEMORIAM

In Sad but Loving Remembrance of our
darling little boy. who fell asleep in

Jesus, one year ago. Feb. 17, 1925.

Our darling son, fare thee well,
Thou wert too pure' on earth to dwell;
Our Blessed Master called thee home,
No more on earth, in pain, to roam.

Voice Carries to Skippers Out
in Channel.

Burnham-on-Sea.— It is a far cry
from this little old-world village to
Point Buoy, or the Bristol channel,
hut it means something to James Cox,
the town crier.
For many years his voice has been

heard resounding along the Marine
Parade to Point Buoy, seven miles
away. For this reason, when Mr. Cox
competed in the national contest for
town criers, the great metropolitan
dailies described him as the man with
"the seven-mile voice."
Burnham-on-Sea, where the portly

and dignified Mr. Cox. with his flow-
ing coat and quaint appurtenances of
office, has become an institution,
thrilled with pride. At last the worth
of its hero had been recognized.
But from America came the report

that Mr. Cox's accomplishment was.
doubted. This surprised and disturbed
many of the citizens, but Mr. Cox
maintained dignified silence.
F. S. Patey, proprietor of the Ga-

zette, was named spokesman in behalf
of Mr. Cox and the village,
"There is no disputing the fact, lo-

cally, that James Cox can be heard'
for a distance of seven miles," he says.
"This has been proven on more than
one occasion. When Mr. Cox is crying
on the Marine Parade his voice can be
distinctly heard at the Point Buoy,
which is seven miles down the Bristol
channel from Burnham-on-Sea. Cap-
tains of vessels more than once have
heard Mr. Cox making his announce-
ment of lost, stolen or strays and have
testified to this fact."

Lawyer Got an Earful.
"And wl at time did the robbery

Thy pain was great, whilst here on earth; 
take place?" asked the lawyer.

it came to thee almost at birth: think—" began the wit ss.
Thy pain is over, our darling boy.
For thou haat gone where all is joy.

By his Loving Parents,
MR. and AIRS. CLEVE WEISHAAR.

Little eyes, so soft and gentle;
Little soul, without a stain;
Little lips, that smiled so sweetly.
Little form, that suffered pain.

Like unto a rose, was he who has
only but half grown:
Dear little darling, Floyd,
Has left us all alone.

By his Sisters and Brothers,,
HELEN, THELMA & MAR% Hs.
 0--.

CARD OF THANKS.

gone,

We desire to extend our sincere thanks

to neighbors and friends for kindness

shown us during the brief illness and af-

ter the death of our dear little daughter,

Anna Catherine Lambert,: also for the

beautiful florril tributes and use of autos
HARRY LAMBERT AND FAMILY.

CARD OF THANKS.

We hereby express our heartfelt thanks
to all friends and neighbors for their many
acts of kindness during the illness and
following the death of our husband and
father.

MRS. LAURA CASHMAN.
CHARLES CASHMAN.

"We don't care what you think," put
in the attorney; "we want to know
what you know."
"Then," rejoined the witness, "I

might as well get down off the stand.
I can't talk without thinking. I'm no
lawyer."—Success.

THIS IS YOUR LAST CHANCE
TO GET A GOOD START IN
THE $30,000 "MAKERS OF
AMERICAN HISTORY CON-
TEST," IN SUNDAY'S BALTI-
MORE AMERICAN. FOUR SETS
OF PICTURES, THE ENTIRE
SERIES IN THE CONTEST TO
DATE, WILL BE PRINTED ON
SUNDAY. THE FIRST PRIZE
IS $2,500 AND THERE ARE
FOUR THOUSAND CASH
AWARDS THROUGH SUN-
DAY'S BALTIMORE AMERI-
CAN. IF YOU CAN'T GET A
COPY OF SUNDAY'S BALTI-
MORE AMERICAN FROM
YOUR DEALER, WRITE CIR-
CULATION DEPT., BALTI-
MORE AMERICAN, BALTI-
MORE, MD.

—Advertisement



SPECIAL NOTICES SALE REGISTER
SMALL ADVERTISEMENTS will be in-

serted under this heading at One Cent a
word, each week, counting name and ad-
dress of advertiser-two initials, or a date,
counted as one word. Minimum charge,
15 cents.
REAL ESTATE for sale, Two Cents each

word. Minimum charge, 25 cents.
APPLY AT RECORD OFFICE ads not

accepted-but will receive sealed replies.
No personal information given.
THIS COLUMN is tpecially for Wants,

Lost, Found, Short Announcements, Per-
sonal Property for sale. etc.
-ALL NOTICES in this column must be
uniform in style.

-- --
HIGHEST CASH Prices paid every

day for delivery of Poultry, Butter
and Eggs. Specialty, 50c for deliv-
ery of Calves all day Tuesday or'Wed-
nesday morning.-Angell & Carbaugh
Successors to G. W. Motter & Son.

WANTED.-Butter. Eggs, Poultry,
Lard, Squabs and Calves at highest
prices. 50c a head for delivering
Calves. Highest prices paid for Hides
and Furs of all kinds.--Frances E.
Shaum's Produce. Phone 3-J 3-28-tf

3 DOZEN BROOMS, home-made,
45c each-Jere J. Garner.

WASHINGTON and Lincoln En-
tertainment, held at Tom's Creek
School, Thursday evening, Feb. 25. If
not fair,the following evening, at 7:30.

BUCKEYE INCUBATOR, 350-egg,
for sale by 0. E. Dodrer, Mayberry,
Md.

FOR SALE-Stock and Fixtures of
General Merchandise store. Will sell
cheap, to quick buyer, as I have ac-
cepted a position with a large corpora-
tion.-Guy W. Haines, Harney, Md.

LOCUST POSTS for sale-by Cal-

vin Myers, near Detour.

FOR SALE-2000 Bundles Fodder

in field, for cash; one 2-year Holstein
Stock Bull, a good one; 2 Sows and
Pigs; 2 Sows will soon farrow; lot of
bred Gilts and Service Boars, some
pure bred Poland China; Apples.-
Hickman Snider, Taneytown. 249-2t

VINEGAR for sale. Also Spring
Wagon Bed.-Jacob A. Hess, near
Taneytown.
- -  
NOTICE-There will be dancing at

the Taneytown Dance Hall, Saturday
night, Feb. 20th. Both round and
square dances. Building located at
railroad.

FEB. 26, Public Sale of Household
Goods, in Harney, of the late Mrs.
Jacob Stambaugh.

SAPLING CLOVER SEED, ten
Bushels, for sale by Upton Mehring,
Keymar, Md. 2-19-3t

SHARP LES CREAM Separator
for sale. Price $30.00.-Arthur Slick,
near Taneytown.

FOR SALE-3 Stock Bulls, 700 to
800 lbs.-Harold Mehring.

SHOOTING MATCH, Feb. 24, at
Taneytown Gun Field, for benefit of
Taneytown Gun Club.

DON'T FORGET the Firemen's
Supper, this Saturday evening, Feb.
20. Anyone having anything to give
that was not solicited, please bring or
send it to the Fireman's Building.-
Committee.

SIX BUSHEL CLOVER Seed for
sale.-Carroll C. Hess.

FOUND-Boys' Right-hand Leath-
er Glove. Owner call and pay cost
of ad and get glove.

FOR RENT-One of my Front Gar-
ages facing on Mill Avenue. Imme-
diate possession.-Geo. E. Koutz.

2-19-tf

A PLAY, entitled, "The Prince of
Liars," will be held in the Opera
House, on Friday and Saturday
nights, April 16 and 17, by the Par-
ent-Teachers' Association.

LOST-Sterling Silver Bar Pin,
containing 7 small sets. Finder re-
turn to Mrs. John E. Byers and re-
ceive reward.

AM TAKING orders for thorough-
bred Buff Leghorn Eggs, for hatching,
at 10c per dozen above market price.
Have orders booked until March 5.-
H. E. Fleagle, Phone 33F2, Taneytown•

SPRING SUITS, $23.00. Call to
see my Line of Samples, at Central
Hotel, Taneytown, on Saturday, Feb.
20th. These Suits are not made up
until order is received at factory.-
Representative of "Golden Rule
Nash," Jos. A. Gilbert, 30 Carroll
St., Westminster, Md. 2-12-tf

GOOD EATING POTATOES, $3.00
per bushel, for sale by B. T. Kanode,
Rt. 2, Taneytown. 2-12-2t

BABY CHICKS AND CUSTOM
Hatching-Chicks for sale Wednesday
of each week. To avoid disappoint-
ment order in advance.-Reindollar
Bros. & Co. 2-12-2t

NOTICE-P. 0. S. of A. members
will attend services in a body, at
Grace Reformed Church, Taneytown,
on Sunday night, Feb. 21st. Meet at
Lodge Hall, at 6:45. 2-12-2t

WANTED-Fat Hogs. Shoats for
sale.-Earle R. Bowers, Taneytown.
Phone 62-M. 2-5-3t

FOR RENT OR SALE-Farm of
150 Acres located near Bethel Church
Carroll Co., Md.-Apply Edward F.
Spangler. 2-12-3t

PIANOS WANTED-Cash paid.
Box 167, Frederick, Md. 2-5-10t

DRESSED OR LIVE HOGS want-
ed. Prefer light weights. Highest
market price. Call Taneytown 12-3,
Monday mornings.-Rockward Nus-
baum. 11-13-tf

PIANO ROLLS 25c, new, with
words. Pianos for sale, Harwood,
$78.00; Chickering, $98.00; Stieff,
$150.00; Player and 100 rolls, $298;
Electric Coin Piano, $198; Victrola
and 25 Records, $18.00; Sheet Music,
5c.-Cramer Piano House, Frederick,
Md. 2-5-10t

Sales for which this office does printing
or advertising, will be inserted under this
heading (4 lines) free of charge. Charge
for sale register alone, $1.00 until date of
sale. Notices longer than 4 lines must be
paid for, extra.

FEBRUARY.

20-12 o'clock. Win. T. Phillips, Sheriff.
Real Estate and Personal. near Frizell-
burg. J. N. 0. Smith, Auct.

23-12 o'clock. Mary C. Six. bear Six"s
Bridge. Cows, Household Goods. B.
P. Ogle, Auct.

23-10 o'clock. Edward Essick, Detour.
Household Goods, Harness, Implements,
Etc. Also 6-room Brick Dwelling and
1/2, Acre of Land at 12 o'clock sharp.
J. N. 0. Smith, Auct.

25-11 o'clock. Maurice C. Duttera, near
Uniontown. Stock and Implements. J.
N. 0. Smith, Auct.

26-12:30. W. & G. Stansbury, Trustees,
Keyruar. Real Estate and Personal J.
N. 0. Smith, Auct.

26-1 o'clock. Jacob Stambaugh, Harney.
Household Goods. (See Adv.)

27-12 o'clock. Harry G. Lambert, .3r.,
Taneytown. Household Goods. J. N.
0. Smith, Auct.

MARCH.

1-9:30 o'clock. C. Scott Bollinger, one
mile east Wakefield Station. Accredited
Herd of 27 Grade Guernsey Cattle, 6
Horses and Mules; large line Farming
Implements. J. N. 0. Smith, Auct.

2-11 o'clock. Herbert Smith, near Tan-
eytown. Stock Implements and House-
hold Goods. N. 0. Smith, Auct.

3-11 o'clock. Jas. S. Schweigart, near
Westminster. Stock and Implements.
J. N. 0. Smith, Auct.

4-11 o'clock. John Moser, near Bridge-
port. Stock and Implements. J. N. 0.
Smith, Auct.

5-12 o'clock. Wm. P. Halter, 1 mi. from
Marker's Mill, on formerly Troxell
farm. Stock and Implements. Win.
Warner. Auct.

6-12 o'clock. Jas. S. Schweigart, near
Westminster. Household Goods. J.
N. 0. Smith, Auct.

8-12 o'clock. R. A. Yingling, near Otter
Dale. Stock and Implements. J. N.
0. Smith, Auct.

9-11 o'clock. Edward Earner, on road
from State road to Sell's Mill. Stock
and Implements. J. N. 0. Smith, Auct.

9-12 o'clock. Samuel H. Mayers, Adm'r,
Mrs. Anna M. Earner, 1 mi. north Die-
trick's Mill. Household Goods. Ar-
thur Boyd, Auct.

10-10 o'clock. D. A. Stull, 1 mile north
Bridgeport. Stock and Implements. B.
P. Ogle, Auct.

10-12 o'clock. Clarence Mayers, on Tan-
eytown and Littlestown road. Stock
and Implements. J. N. 0. Smith, Auct.

11--12 o'clock. Frank Houck on Sharetts
farm Bruceville. Stock and Imple-
ments. J. N. 0. Smith, Auct.

11-9 o'clock. Willis F. Sterner, 3 miles N.
E. Gettysburg. Stock, Implements,
Household Goods. G. It. and Robert
Thompson, Auct.

11-12 o'clock. Harry E. Fleagle, near
Bearmount School-house, on road from
Tyrone to Stone Road. Stock, Imple-
ments. Flickinger & Fuhrman, .Aucts.

12-11 o'clock. Roy Crabbs, near Otter
Dale Mill. Stock and Implements. J.
N. 0. Smith, Auct.

13-12 O'clock. John H. Cluts, Taneytown.
Household Goods. Charles L. Kuhns,
Auct.

13-11 o'clock. Oliver J. Waybright, Free-
dom Twp., Pa., 2 mi. south Moritz's
Store. Stock and Implements. Robt.
Thomson, duct.

15-12 o'clock. Mrs. Margaret Witherow,
near Harney. Stock and Implements.
Luther Spangler, Auct.

16-11 o'clock. Geo. W. Earner, near Em-
mitsburg. Stock, Implements and
Household. B. P. Ogle, Auct.

16-10 o'clock. C. F. Simpson, mi. south
Uniontown. Stock and Implements. J.
N. 0. Smith, Auct.

16-Mervin G. Boyd, 214 mi. north Harney,
Mt. Joy Twp, Stock. Implements, Fur-
niture, etc. Fair & Spangler, Aucts.

17-10 o'clock. J. D. Kauffman, on Royer
farm at Meadow Branch Church. Stock
and Implements. J. 0. N. Smith,
Auct.

17-1 o'clock. Jacob Stambaugh, on road
from Taneytowu state road to Four
Point. east Emmitsburg. Stock, Imple-
ments, Household Goods. B. P. Ogle,
Auct.

18-11 o'clock. Maurice W. Hahn, near
Keysville. Stock and Implements. J.
N. 0. Smith, Auct.

20-12 o'clock. Mrs. David Vaughn, near
Taneytown. Stock, Implements and
Household Goods. A. J. Baumgardner,
Auct.

23-12 o'clock. William Copenhaver, on
Taneytown and Littlestown road.
Stock and Implements. J. N. 0. Smith,
Auct.

24-12 o'clock. P. G. Hilterbrick, nelfr
Hoffman Orphanage. Stock and Im-
plements.. Luther Spangler, Auct.

25-11 o'clock. Chas. 0. Dickensheets, near
Frizellburg, on Wm. H. Wantz farm.
Stock and Implements. J. N. 0. Smith,
Auct.

26-10 o'clock. Edward J. Myers, near
Medford. Stock and Implements. J.
N. 0. Smith, Auct.

27-12 o'clock. Joseph Mummert, 2 miles
north Taneytown. Household Goods,
J. N. 0. Smith, Auct.

APRIL.

3-12 o'clock. Franklin Bowersox, Taney-
town. Big Annual Sale of Buggies, Im-
plements, Harness, etc. J. N. 0. Smith,
Auct.

FOR SALE OR RENT-Property
near Detour, 2 1/6 Acres, 6-room
house, all necessary outbuildings,
plenty of fruit and good water.-J. E.
Sehildt. 1-22-tf

1000 OLD PIGEONS wanted.-F.
E. Shaum. 1-8-tf

FOR SALE-Fine Homes, im-
proved by Brick and Frame Houses
and all improvements, in and out of
town.--D. W. Garner, Real Estate
Broker. 10-5-tf

FAT HOGS WANTED, who has
them?-Harold Mehring. 4-3-tf

WILL DO SHOE and Harness Re-
pairing, until further notice. No work
done while waiting. Terms cash.-
H. E. Reck. 1-1-tf

STORM INSURANCE. Owing to
great increase in losses, and in the
cost of making replacement, Storm
insurance rates on Farm Buildings
have been advanced. There has been
no advance made on town property.
-P. B. Englar, Agt. 2-5-3t

Shoats clod Horses

I have for sale, at my place in Westminster,

60 Fine Shoals
of different sizes.

Today, I received another

Carload of Virginia Horses
which are in fine condition, and will suit nicely
for farm and other work.

No Trouble to Show Stock.

C. W. King
Westminster, Md.

Phone 113 --- Call at Night.

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned, owing to the death of

his wife, will quit farming and house-
keeping, and will sell at public sale on the
E. G. Sterner farm, 3 miles northeast of
Gettysburg, on the road leading from Get-
tysburg to Table Rock, Cutuberland
Township, on

THURSDAY, MARCH 11, 1926,
at 9 o'clock, sharp, the following personal
property:

15 HEAD HORSES AND MULES,
pair mules, 15 years old, one an extra good
wagon leader, the other an off-side work-
er; 4 mules, 4 years old, have been worked
anywhere and in the lead some; mule, coin-

ing 3 years, broke to work;
brown mare, will weigh 1400
lbs., 15 years old, a good saddle

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned intending to quit farm-

ing, will sell at public sale, on the B. L.
Cookson farm, 1/ mile south of Union
town, on

TUESDAY, MARCH 16, 1926,
at 10 o'clock, sharp, the following personal
property:

8 HEAD HORSES AND MULES,
Maud, a brown mare, 12 years old, will
weigh 1650, work wherever hitched, ex-
cellent saddle mare; Harry, brown horse,

11 years old, will weigh 1600,
good offside worker; Dolly,
brown mare, 16 years old, will
weigh 1100, offside worker;

Jack, brown horse, 18 years old, will weigh
1100, work anywhere; pair gray mules, 12
years old, good workers, and one is an ex-
tra tine leader; pair bay mules, 12 yearsmare; black mare, 9 years old, „

works anywhere, bay mare 12 years, works °I", good offtide workers. These horses
and mules are safe for anyone to handleanywhere; sorrel mare, 9 years old, an off-
and are fearless of any road abjects.side worker; black colt, 3 years old, has

been worked; sorrel colt, 2 years old; 17 HEAD OF CATTLE,
yearling mare colt, and yearling mule.

24 HEAD OF CATTLE,
high-grade Holstein and Guernsey, con-
sisting of twenty good mulch cows. 6 will
be fresh by day of sale, one in April: 4.
the calves just sold off, balance are fall
cows; 2 heifers, close springers by day of
sale; Guernsey heifer, year old; stock bull.
This is a herd of big milk producers with
an average butter fat test of 4.40. .

100 HEAD OF HOGS,

Poland China and Chester White; S brood
sows, 4 will have pigs by day of sale, the
other four will farrow in May; Chester
White male hog; balance shoats, weighing
from 40 to 140-lbs each. This is a thrifty
lot of hogs. Any person in need of hogs
should not miss this sale.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.
Three farm wagons, 3-ton wagon and

bed, in good running order, bed holds 100
bushel of corn; 3-ton wagon, in good run-
ning order; 2-horse wagon and bed; 2
sets hay carriages, 18 and 20 ft. long; In-
ternational hay loader, good as new; side-
delivery rake; self-dump hay rake; 12-
disc Empire Junior grain drill. Buckeye
lime sower, 8-ft. Deering binder, Deering
corn binder, Emerson manure spreader, 2
mowers, one McCormick, the other a John-
son; 3 furrow plows, 2 are No. 361 Syra-
cuse, the other an Oliver Chilled; two 3-see-
tion harrows, disc harrow, land roller, 3
double corn plows, walking corn plow; J.
I. Case checkrow corn planter, with billing
and phosphate attachments; Blizzard en-
silage cutter, with shredder head attach-
ments and distributing pipes; 6 H. P.
Portable Quincy engine with saw attach-
ment; 2 single corn plows, shovel plow, po-
tato coverer, New Holland chopping mill,
wind mill, corn sheller for hand or power;
bob sled, spring wagon, surrey, rubber-
tire buggy, runabout, sleigh, single double
and triple trees, 4-horse trees, 3-horse
stretcher, 2-horse stretcher, log, breast and
cow chains, middle rings, jockey sticks,hay
fork rope and pulleys, forks, block and
tackle, bushel baskets, scoop shovels,pick.

MISCELLANEOUS ARTICLES.

Blacksmith anvil, forge, tongs, work
bench, carpenter tools and other tools, 15
milk cans, consisting of 50 and 85-lbs. cans;
Primrose cream separator, good as new;
barrel churn; 200 Plymouth Rock Chick-
ens, by the pound; 200 White and Brown
Leghorn Chickens, by the piece; pair geese

HARNESS.

2 sets breechbands, 6 sets front gears,
wagon saddle, check lines, plow lines,
bridles, halters and tie straps.

HOUSEHOLD GOODS.

Columbia Palace range, Allison cook stove
sink, kitchen cabinet, 8-ft. extension table,
round extension table, library table, organ
buffet, parlor suite, never used; bedroom
suite, 2 beds, cot, bureaus, dining room
chairs, kitchen chairs, rockers, 9x12 brus-
sels rug, never used; 9x12 Axminster rug;
matting rugs, linoleum rung, 100-piece din-
ner set, dishes, kettles, pans, knives and
forks, 2 iron kettles and stands, vacuum
washing machine tubs, sausage grinder and
staffer, and many other articles not men-
tioned. The above furniture is like new.
TERMS-All sums of $5.00 and under,

cash; sums of $5.00 and over, a credit of
1o0r iliosnhths will be given, or 5 percent offf 

Sale to begin at 9 o'clock, A. M., sharp,
when further terms and conditions will be
made known by

WILLIS F. STERNER,
R-6, Gettysburg, Pa,

G. R. & ROBERT THOMPSON, Aucts.
C. C. BREAM, Clerk,
P. S-No stands allowed on the grounds.

2-19-3t

Something for Nothing
Daniel Willard, the railroad mag-

nate, said at a dinner in New York:
"The promoter has rather gone out.

We don't hear of him any more. This
is a good thing, certainly so far as
one type of promoter is concerned-
the type Pierpont Morgan once de-

scihed as-

'The man who'll provide the ocean
if we will provide the ships.'"

consisting of 14 milch cows of which 11
are Wisconsin cows, all grade Holstein,ami
good strong milkers, worthy of any ones
attention, all are Fall cows;
also 1 grade Holstein, carrying
5th. calf, will be fresh in the
Fall; red cow carrying 2nd.
calf, will be fresh in April; 1 grade Guern-
sey, carrying 2nd, calf, will be fresh in
April; Guernsey heifer, carrying 1st. calf,
will be fresh in May; 1 heifer, carrying
1st, calf, will be fresh in June. This herd
is headed by Korudyke De Kol Joe King
No. 454454 H. F. H. B., who. will be 3 yrs
old in August. This herd has just been re-
tested with the state T. B. test.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.
5 farm wagons, one 4 or 6-horse Stude-

baker wagon, 5-ton capacity, wagon bed in
fine condition, will hold 170-bu. of ear corn;
one 4-in, tread wagon, 3-ton capacity, and
bed, will hold 90-bu.; one home-made wag-
on, 3-in, tread; good 2-horse wagon and
bed, will hold 60-bu; low-down iron wheel
wagon, truck wagon, 3 sets of good hay
carriages, 1 set 20-ft. and 2 sets of 18-ft.
Champion binder, 8-ft. cut, in good run-
ning order; Milwaukee corn binder, in run-
ning order; 2 mowers, 1 Osborne and one
Milwaukee, in running order; I. H. C. hay
tedder, horse rake, 8-hoe Superior grain
drill, good as new; Superior lime spread-
er, Black Hawk corn planter, Bellevue
manure spreader, 75-bu. capacity; 5 bar-
shear plows, 3 steel beam Syracuse 3-horse
plows, wooden beam Syracuse 2-horse plow
Wrought share plow, 5 double corn plows,
No. 4 Cresent riding plow, used only part
of a season; 2 other riding plows, and two
walking plows, 2 single corn plows, double
shovel plow, 1-horse weeder, Vulcan potato
digger and subsoiler; 5 spring tooth har-
rows, 3-section and two 2-section Syracuse
lever harrows, in good condition; 2 wood-
en frame harrows, one 17 and ors4,23-tooth;
60-tooth spike harrow, disc hariow, Titan
10-20 tractor, in good running order; P.
& 0. 14-in, bottom tractor plow; No. 11
Letz chopper, French buhr mill, 24-in. New
Holland circular saw and frame, with rip-
ping table attachment; 75-ft. 6-in. 4-ply
Goodyear Klingtite belt and lot of other
belting, 3 H. P. I. H. C, gasoline engine,
fanning mill, Blast wheat grader, 2 sets of
dung boards, boy forks, ropes and pul-
leys, 2 good spring wagons, rubber-tire
surrey, good rubber-tire buggy, steel-tire
buggy, Portland cutter, good 1 or 2-horse
sled, old sleigh, wheelbarrow', carriage
pole, 3-horse evener, two 2-horse stretch-
ers, fifth chain and stretcher, 2 bearing
chains, lot single, double and triple trees,
4-horse double tree, lot jockey sticks, mid-
dle rings, log and breast chains, butt
traces, lot dung, pitch and sheaf forks,
scoop and dirt shovels, 2 good crowbars,
crosscut saw. 2 briar scythes, mowing
scythe, wagon jack, bushel basket, 2 cant
hooks, lot garden hoes, 2-hole corn sheller,
spray pump, 4 steel oil drum and lot of
vinegar barrels, portable hog house, about
6x10-ft; pair block and tackle, 1500-lb.
capacity.

HARNESS.
2 sets breechbands, 8 sets front harness,

set spring wagon harness, 2 sets buggy
harness, set double harness, 10 blind bri-
dles, 10 collars, 6-horse line. 3 sets check
lines, good wagon saddle, riding saddle and
bridle fair leather; lot lead reins and
coupling straps, 4 good pair carrying
straps, 6 housings, 4 sets buggy fiynets,
lot other nets: 8 halters, wagon whip, 1
good Stewart horse clipper, 600-lb. capaci-
ty American cream separator, No. 5 Davis
swing churn, 35 milk cans, most of these
cans are in good condition; lot milk buck-
ets and cooler cans, milk strainer, good
double chop chest, holds about 1500 lbs.;
couple thousand bundles of fodder.

HOUSEHOLD GOODS.
2 good kitchen cupboards, buffett, kitch-

en table, cook stove, ten-plate stove, good
coal stove, hanging lamp, hall lamp, lot of
lanterns, 2 iron kettles, 2 meat grinders,
sausage staffer, washing machine, one 1%.
H. P. McCormick Deering gasoline engine,
and many other articles too numerous to
mention.
TERMS-All sums of $10.00 and under,

cash. On all sums above $10.00 a credit of
6 months will be given on notes with ap-
proved security, bearing interest from day
of sale. No property to be moved until
terms of sale are complied with.

C. F. SIMPSON.
J. N. 0. SMITH, Auct.
NEVIN HITESHEW, JESSE P. GARNER,

M. A. ZOLLICKOFFER, Clerks,
2-19-4t

ChThirles William Stores
New York City Inc.

Confidence
This book
is FREE

The key to
safe buying •

2,000,000 families have con-
fidence that they will save
money when they buy from
The CharlesWilliamStores.
They know that from their

big catalog they can choose what-
ever they need for themselves,their
car or their farm, at remarkably
low prices - confident that they
will get dependable quality and
more than their money's worth.

You, too, have this same oppor-
tunity to save - this same oppor-
tunity for you and for your family
to be stylishly dressed in the latest
Fifth Avenue styles; for your home
to be made more beautiful; your
automobile more enjoyable; your

farm more productive; and, above all, for your savings to
be much greater. Satisfaction is guaranteed. Ask our cus-
tomers - there are many in your community. That is Con-
fidence-the Key to Safe Buying.
Write for your catalog today! A catalog will be sent at once FREE
and postpaid. Act Now!

THE CHARLES WILLIAM STORES, Inc.
978 Stores Building New York City

If you want the newWall Paper Sample Book, ask for Catalog No.6

It is Easy to Buy by Mail and Save Money
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"THANK YOU, MA'AM"

The bright, cheerful,
courtesy and efficient,
eager service of our
managers have become
bywords among women
everywhere. It's apleas-
ure to shop at the. A. &

Our Stores are Headquarters for $
Lenten Necessities.

On Sale until Saturday 20th. only
PINK

SALMON Per Can 12c

RICH CREAMY

Cheese

Pound 29c

I FELS NAPTHA or 1

KIRKMAN'S BORAX

3 Cakes

Soap
17c

ENCORE
SPAGHETTI 

Pea

Beans

2 lbs. 13c
3 Pkgs

3 Cans 25c
A. & P,

Macaroni
or

Spaghetti
25c

SNKZE 3 Cans 20c
DOMESTIC OIL
SARDINES, Can 7C

IONA SAUER- 121-KRAUT, Can -2-e

MUSTARD
SARDINES Can 7c

Pkg

SUNNYFIELD
PANCAKE OR
BUCKWHEAT

Flour
10c

GOLDEN CROWN

Syrup
No. 11/2 Can 11 c Can

WET

Shrimp
20c

Great Atlantic & Pacific Tea The 
.
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EXAGGERATED

Two men were walking along the
beach at Brighton when one of them

accidentally stumbled against a child's

pail.
"My dear friend," exclaimed the

other, "I cannot tell how much I la-

ment your sad death."

"Whatever do you mean-my
death?"

"You have just kicked the bucket,"

replied the first, with a laugh.

"On the contraary,' said the other,

"I just turned a little pail."

Imperative.

"What's the matter, old boy?" asked
Jimmie's friend. "I've never seen you
looking so seedy."

"I've got to go abroad at once," re-
marked Jimmie, gloomily."

"Nonsense! These doctors musn't
frighten you out of your life like
that."

"It wasn't a doctor. It was a law-
yer."-Brisb a ne 1,1a11.

Investigation.
Investigation often finds
A way to lend this life a charm.

It helps men to relieve their minds
And does nobody any harrn.

The Usual.

"You and your wife have decided,
then, to-"
"No. You got it wrong, Bill. My

wife has decided. I have merely ac-
quiesced."

A Neat Distinction.
The Visitor-Is Juggins, of your

town, a good lawyer?

The Resident-He's an able lawyer,

but he's not ranked high among the
good.

Reason Quite Sufficient.

"You make life a burden to me,"

said the busy man to the persistent

life insurance agent.

"In that case you can't take out this
policy any too soon."

".•
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KIDDIE arm
&Arthur Scott

THE WARNING

IT MUST not be supposed that all
of Kiddie Katydid's family made

the same never-ending din at night.
Actually it was only the gentlemen
that so amused themselves. No doubt
the ladies, too, knew the secret about
the mysterious Katy—and what she
did.
But for some reason they never,

never mentioned the matter. Even
when they gossiped among them-

Mr. Nighthawk Was One of the Night
ly Wanderers.

selves, as they sometimes did, they
never touched upon that subject.
Furthermore, in the daytime Kid-

die and his fellows were as quiet as
they could be. Flaying waked the
echoes all night long, they were con-
lent, when morning came, to rest
silently among the trees and shrubs.
And a very good reason did they have,
too, for such a habit. During the day
there were altogether too many birds
flying about, to please the Katydids.
And Kiddie often remarked in a jok-
ing way that the only birds he cared
about were those that didn't care
about him!
Of course, there were a few birds

that prowled about Pleasant Valley
after dark. Mr. Nighthawk was one
of that crew of nightly wanderers.
And whenever the word was passed
around that he had been seen in the
neighborhood, Kiddie Katydid tried
to lower his solemn chant, because he
knew that Mr. Nighthawk was usually
In search of something to eat.

Now, when Kiddie Katydid felt
hungry he drove away his gnawing
pangs by browsing upon leaves and
tender twigs. But Mr. Nighthawk
had no taste for such fodder.
He had an appetite for insects. And

between dusk and dawn a good many
of Kiddie Katydid's neighbors of one
kind or another found their way into
Mr. Nighthawk's tummy.
So you see it was no wonder that

Kiddie was not eager to attract the
attention of that night rover. Some
of the more timid of Kiddie's com-
panions even begged him, at times,
to hush. They said he was making
such a noise that Mr. Nighthawk
would be sure to hear it, even if he
were a quarter of a mile away.
But Kiddie Katydid usually laughed

at those faint-hearted ones; and often
he shrilled his Katy did, Katy did,
more loudly than before, just to
show them that he was not afraid.
"A person has to take a few

chances," he remarked one day. "If
we were all afraid to make a sound
it would pretty hard on Katy, for
then she would have nobody to take
her part. And what would people
think of her?"

Evidently Kiddie's reason was a
good one, because a number of his
cousins spoke up at once and said
that they agreed with him perfectly.
But their' sisters all exclaimed that

sooner or later Mr. Nighthawk would
hear them ; and then there would cer-
tainly be trouble.

Strangely enough, the words were
scarcely out of their mouths before
they heard a loud call that struck
them cold with fear.
Peent ! Peent! The cry came out

of the air above them without the
least warning. And everybody—in-
cluding Kiddie Katydid—knew that
Mr. Nighthawk had come.

((:) by Groeset & Dunlap)

11,1-10 SAID
"No Violent Extreme

Endures"?

THOMAS CARLYLE, author of this
succinct axiom, was the son of a

mason and farmer. He was born in
Ecclefechan, Dumfriesshire, Scotland,
December 4, 1795, and although his
parents intended him for a ministerial
caneer, his propensity to authorship
at an early age convinced the young
man at least that he was more fitted
for the pursuit of literature.

Although his first literary attempts
were published in the Edinburgh "En-
cyclopedia," his career may be said
to have begun in the "London Maga-
zine" in 1823, when portions of his
"Life of Schiller" appeared. This
work in later years was treated sep-
arately, and appeared in special form
in 1825—Carlyle's first success of note
In the literary field.
Few authors have had their works

studied so minutely as Carlyle. and
his ease and fluency in writing have
been seized upon by many as exam-
ples of the sort of literature which
always will endure.
Much time was spent on his "His-

tory of Friedrich the II of Prussia,"
called "Frederick the Great," and this
production of his pen also was the
largest the eminent author turned out.
The last two volumes appeared in
1865, and although he continued to
some extent in his field, this work in
reality marked the end of a successful
career.
While in Scotland Carlyle received

word of the death in London of his
wife, accounting for much of his later
seclusion. In his later life he was
offered a government pension and a
baronetcy, both of which he declined.
He died at Chelsea, February 5, 1881.

—Wayne D. McMurray.
(© by George Matthew Adams)

OD by McClure Newspaper Syndicate.)

crHE WHY of
SUPERSTITIONS
By H. IRVING KING

SYMPATHETIC MAGIC

you will find in some, districts
bear's grease and muskrat oil

highly recommended as sovereign
remedies for bald heads. Also to be
used to prevent the hair from falling
out. The explanation is very simple;
It is merely our old friend sympa-
thetic magic in one of his many medi-
cal guises. The hair which covers the
body of the bear Is long, strong, and
thick; the hair in the coat of the
muskrat is fine, close-set and plenti-
ful. By the magic of contact these
hairy qualities are communicated to
the grease And the oil and by the
magic of transference act upon the
scanty locks of the man whose hair
Is "falling out" or the scanty in-
visible fur on the pate of the bald-
headed man. It is the phase of sym-
pathetic magic which Sir James
Frazer calls homeopathic magic—like
producing like.
The mind of primitive man, blindly

groping for solution of the problem
of cause and effect, found nothing
so satisfying as this homeopathic
theory—which we call sympathetic
magic, but which to him was a dem-
onstrable science. When it failed to
work it was because something was
wrong in the formula employed; or
perhaps evil spirits interfered with
what, to Mr. Cave-man, was a "law
of nature."

(C) by McClure Newspaper Syndicate.)
 0 

Useful for Housewife
A Scandinavian claims to have de-

signed a contrivance that will broad-
cast refrigeration (according to the
Inventor) in exactly the same way aa
present-day wireless stations broad-
cast music. All that the housewife of
the future will have to do is to keep
her refrigeration receiver tuned to a
central sending station.—Mason City
Baener-Times.
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A LINE 0' CHEER

*****414-******--)1(-******41(4-310111

By John Kendrick Bangs

A VALENTINE

IF BEING lover of my kindWill put me in the line.
Why—if you really do not

mind—
I'll be your Valentine;

And if perchance in sorrow you
Are groping on this day,

Or friendless plod in grip of rue
Some dark, unlovely, way,

With all my heart I'm with you,
Friend,

Sharing your sorry lot.
And will be to the very end
E'en though you see me not.

ice) by McClure Newspaper Syndicate.)

Two "New Breeds"
Are Investigated

Believed That "Turken" Is
Nothing Else Than Tran-
sylvania Naked-Neck.

There Is no lure like that of the

cross of widely separated species of
animals and birds. That nature
frowns on such crosses is evidenced by

the failure of repeated and persistent
experiments under favorable condi-
tions. Where progeny has followed vio-
lent crossings, it is sterile as a rule.
The Department of Agriculture has is-

sued a press release in this connection,

which is as follows:
"The United States Department of

Agriculture has received many re-
quests from all parts of the country

for information concerning two so-
called new "breeds" of poultry, the
'Turken' and the 'Kiwi.' The depart-
ment has been aware of advertisements
concerning these new and novel

'breeds,' for which some rather re-
markable claims have been made. The
advertisements and literature describ-

ing the origin and qualities of these

'breeds' seem to have arous0 much

Interest on the part of the public, since

the department has receivd several

urgent requests for an explanation re-

garding the reliability of the claims

made.
How "Turken" Was Produced.

"The statements in the advertise-

ments and literature claim that the
'turken' was originally produced by
crossing a male turkey with a female
chicken, and that the 'Kiwi' was pro-
duced by crossing a male ostrich with a

female chicken.
"Successful crosses have been made

between the pheasant and the chicken,

and in practically every case the prog-
eny has been of the male sex and
sterile. Also, successful crosses have
been made.between the guinea and the
chicken, and here again the sex of the
progeny has almost invariably been
male and the hybrids have been sterile.
Both of these crosses have been made
with great difficulty and, so far as
known, no cross giving any progeny
has ever been reported between the
turkey and the chicken. Furthermore,
it is highly improbable that the prog-
eny, if any have ever been secured.
would breed at all, and certainly not
readily. In such wide or violent
crosses the progeny is always sterile,
and the claim for the 'Turken,' which
is reported to be the hybrid progeny
of a cross between the turkey and the
chicken, is in all probability not found-
ed on fact.

Is Naked-Necked Chicken.

"One other point must be made con-
cerning the so-called `Turken.' The
Illustrations accompanying the adver-
tisements and literature are in all prob-
ability photographs of the Transyl-
vania Naked-neck chickens. Accord-
ing to the best information obtainable
this odd-looking breed originated in
West India, and the characteristic
naked neck has bred true for ma133'
years. It is a distinct character of the
breed. The department believes that
the no-called 'Turken' is nothing else
than the Transylvania Naked-neck
chicken, which apparently possesses
no qualities superior to the more im-
portant standard breeds and varieties,
and has not been shown to be par-
ticularly well adapted to conditions in
many parts of our country.
"As far as the reported cross giv-

ing rise to the 'Kiwi' is concerned, there
Is much less evidence to support such
a cross than in the case of the
'Turken.' This is too violent a cross
to produce any results whatever.
"The burden of proof that such

crosses as those giving rise to the
`Turken' and the 'Kiwi' must remain
with the sponsors of such novel produc-
tions. In the meantime, the interests
of the public should be safeguarded."

Feed to Maintain Cows
of Different Weights

Extensive detailed experiments have
been made to determine the average
amount of protein and other food nu-
triments needed to maintain cows of
different weights. Also, the different
feeds have been tested to determine
the average amounts of digestible pro-
tein and other nutriments. This data
has been arranged in table form and
may be found in various books, ex-
periment station bulletins, etc., but is

too extensive to reproduce here. These
experiments also show the amounts of
food nutriments required to produce
different amounts of milk. By taking
the data from these tables, showing
how much Is required, the balanced
ration is worked out by grouping to-
gether the necessary amounts of the
different feeds to give the correct total
and proportion of nutriments. Rations
as worked out by this process can only
serve as a guide because of the great
variation in individual cows, but they
are very valuable in actually obtain-
ing the best rations.

Exercise Mare and Foal
in Cool of the Evening

In the evening when it is cool and
the flies are Inactive, turn the mare
and foal out on pasture. This will
allow the colt to get plenty of ex-
ercise; grass, and fresh air with the
least possible interference from flies.
When the mare is not working, the
pasture is the best place for both
mare and foal, but they should be pro-
vided with shade of some sort. When
natural shade is not available, a cheap
structure should be built to meet the
needs. Hang a few sacks under the
trees or in the shed so that the mare
and foal can use them to chase off
files.

Fudge Making Finds
Favor With Co-Eds

Fudge may be classed with pie as a
typical American dish. It has a place

in every young
man's heart and
every girl's cate-
gory of accom-
plishments. C o-
e d s swear by
fudge and "fudge
shines" in soror-
ity parlors are
the very latest
wrinkle in colle-
giate circlqs.

There's a big
wallop in a plat-
ter of fudge, the

Meta H. Given. co-eds explain,
because it's one of the greatest sources
of energy, containing both milk, the
"perfect food," and sugar.

If you've any doubt of the place
fudge occupies in the young male
heart, try these recipes on him and
hear his own answer. Each of the ap-
pended dishes was prepared by Miss
Meta Given, doing research work in
the home economics department of the
University of Chicago, and they are
the result of much experimentation.

Chocolate Fudge.
2 cups sugar 2 squares choco-
% cup evaporated late

milk Few grains of salt
1/4 cup water 1 tbsp. butter
1 tbsp. corn sirup tsp. vanilla

Shave the chocolate so that it will
melt more easily. Add the sugar, salt.
milk, water and corn sirup. Cook, stir-
ring until chocolate and sugar are
melted, and then only occasionally to
prevent burning, until the soft ball
stage is reached, or a temperature of
234 degrees Fahrenheit. Remove from
fire and add the butter. Cool until
almost lukewarm, 110 degrees, add fla-
voring and beat vigorously until when
a little is dropped from the spoon it
will hold its shape. Pour into oiled
tins and mark in squares.

Cocoanut Candy.
1% cup sugar 1 tsp. butter
14 cup evaporated 1-3 cup shredded
milk cocoanut

14 cup water lh tsp. vani;la
Put butter into granite saucepan:

when melted, add sugar, milk and wa-
ter, and stir until sugar is dissolved.
Heat to boiling, and cook to the soft
ball stage. Remove from fire, add
cocoanut and vanilla, cool to 110 de-
grees Fahrenheit and beat until
creamy and mixture begins to sugar
slightly around edge of pan. Pour in-
to buttered pan and when cool mark
in squares.

Penoche.
2 cups brown or 1 tbsp. butter
maple sugar 1 tsp. vanilla

% cup evaporated 2 cups chopped
milk nuts
% cup water
Boil sugar, milk and water to the

soft ball stage. Remove from the fire;
add butter, flavoring and nuts. Cool
to 110 degrees Fahrenheit, then heat
until creamy and thickened; pour into
a greased tin and when firm cut.

Unto This End
"By the way," said the lawyer who

was drawing up the will, "I notice
that you've named six bankers to be
your pallbearers. Would you rather
choose some friends with whom you
are on better terms?"
"No, that's all right," was the quick

reply. "Those fellows have carried
me so long they might as well finish
the job."—Boston Transcript.

HARD CASH

First Citizen—Has Zero made much
money in the ice cream business.
The Other One—He made a cool mil-

lion.

Many Hearts Offered
Merritt—So that heiress refused

you?"
Giles—Yes. She said that so many

hearts were submitted to her daily, she
hoped I would overlook the absence
of any individual criticism.

Her Heart Engaged
He (admiringly)—You are a girl aft-

er my own heart.
She—Thank you; but I hope you are

not a man after mine, because it's
otherwise engaged.

RENEWABLE .CHARMS

Mr. Laurels—Mere physical beauty
is all too fleeting.
Miss Manchester—It doesn't last long

but, then, it can be renewed every
day.
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Wm. McKinley Said.
"THE LITTLE SAVINGS BANK in the

home means more for the future of the
children of a family than all the advice in
the world."

Andrew Carnegie Said.
"The man who cannot and does not

save money, cannot and will not do any-
thing else worth while."

We Welcome Your Account
4 percent Paid.

TANEYTOWN SAVINGS
BANK
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Only Gone Before
There is indescribable conso-

lation in tending the plot that
constitutes the last resting place
of the earthly remains of our
dead. See that the grave is ap-
propriately marked. If you
have not yet attended to this
duty of loving remembrance, let
us show you our many designs
and quote you a price for the
memorial and its erection.

High Street Stone Yards,
D. M. MYERS, Prop.

HANOVER, PA,

Phone C. V. 55-Y Bell 1544
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Clean-up Sale

0 

We begin a general clean-
up sale. See us for real bar-
gains. A lot of Women's
Shoes at YOUR prices. If you
are looking for good shoes
at cheap prices, we have
them.

J THOMAS ANDERS,
The Shoe and Hat Store,

22 West Main St., Westminster, Md.

DANGEROUS
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Bag—Heavens, I ere I've been smok-
ing near a powder can.

The Lonely Pine.
Upon the azure wonder of the West
Is etched the figure of a lonely pine:
From Its firm base in every stately

line
It seems the spirit of grace made mani-

fest.

Oh, the Times! Oh, the Manners!
Brown (getting on at way station—

to friend)—Hello, John! Traveling
alone?
Friend—No, indeed. Wife's in the

smoking car. Sit down.

Got "Wise" in Time.
"Why did you break off with that

girl?"
"Well, from the way she and her

mother ran the old man, I judged
they'd make short work of me."

The Exception.
"A thing of beauty is a joy forever!"

quoted the professor
"Yes," chuckled the cynic, "unless

you are married to her!"

Owing to increased patronage, and
also to give better service, Hudson &
Bell, of Frederick, Md., successors of
C. L. Kefauver, will give Optical
Service in Taneytown, every 1st. and
3rd. Friday in each month. Next vis-
its

FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 19, 1926,
If you need a change of glasses, or

new ones, ask any of our satisfied
customers, for we guarantee absolute
satisfaction at a very reasonable
price, as any of our satisfied custom-
ers will tell you.
Mr. Bell is a registered optometrist

and was associated with Mr. Kefau-
ver for some years. Appointments
can be made before these dates at
Sarbaugh's Jewelry Store.

Also don't forget we do all kinds of
repairs, Optical, Watch, Clock and
Jewelry. Also a fine line of every-
thing that is carried in a first-class
Jewelry Store. See us and save
money in your needs.

SARBAUGH
JEWELER,

TANEYTOWN, MD.
Main Store, Hanover, Pa.

10-23-6-kf
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Sunday School
Lesson

(By RE\ k." b. FITZWATER, V.v., Dean
of the Evening School. Moody Bible In-

Chute of Chicago.)
((0, 1926, Western Newspaper Union.)

Lesson for February 21

JESUS RAISES LAZARUS FROM
THE DEAD

LESSON TEXT-John il:1-57.
GOLDEN TEXT-"I am the resur-

rection and the life: he that believeth
on Me, though he were dead, yet shall
he live."-John 11:25.
PRIMARY TOPIC -Lazarus Raised

from the Dead.
JUNIOR TOPIC-Lazarus Raised from

the Dead.
INTERMEDIATE AND SENIOR TOP-

IC-Christ's Power Over Death.
YOUNG PEOPLE AND ADULT TOP-

IC-Christ the Resurrection and the
Life.

I. Lazarus Sick (v- v. 1, 2).
Even those who are in close fellow-

ship with the Lord are not immune
from sickness. Sorrow comes even to
the homes where Jesus is loved.

II. Martha and Mary Send for
Jesus (v. 3).
Those who receive Jesus into their

home when all are well and happy
can be sure of His love and sympathy
when sickness and death overtake
them.

III. Jesus, strange Delay (vv. 4-6).
Martha and Mary sent for Jesus be-

cause He loved Lazarus. They said,
"He whom Thou lovest is sick." Now,
Jesus "abode in the same place" be-
cause He loved Lazarus and his sisters
(v. 5). This mystery Is to be explained
by the fact that Jesus was divine and
knew all things.

IV. Jesus Goes to the Bethany
Home (vv. 7-17).
At le4ngth He turned His face toward

the ortrowing home. Jesus knew and
the disciples apparently knew that go-
ing into Judea meant His own death.
His mission to this home was twofold:
to restore to these sisters their broth-
er and to strengthen the faith of the
disciples (vv. 11-15). The word "sleep"
reveals Jesus' estimate of death.

V. Jesus Teaching Martha (vv. 18-
27).
As He is nearing the village Mar-

tha meets Him with a complaint be-
cause of His delay. He ignores her
complaint and teaches her concerning
the resurrection and life.

1. "Thy Brother Shall Rise Again"
(v. 23).

Most blessed words are these to fall
upon the ears of a sorrowing sister for
a dead brother.

2. "I Am the Resurrection and the
Life" (vv. 25, 26).
He is the source of life and all are

joined to Him by a living faith. The
believer cannot die. The gr9at truth
indeed to be apprehended is that here
we are united to the living Christ.
the source of life, and that this Is a
pledge of bodily resurrection and eter-
nal reunion.

VI. Jesus Weeping With Mary (vv.
28-35).
Mary fell at Jesus' feet, uttering the

same words used by Martha, hut no
doubt with a different tone of voice
and attitude. Her words were respond-
ed to with His tears-"Jesus wept."
He is now a sympathizing Savior; He
can he touched with the feelings of
our infirmities (Heb. 4:15).

VII. Jesus Raising Lazarus (vv.
38-44).
His great sympathy now expresses

itself in supernatural power. Sympa-
thy would be valueless without this
connection with divine power. In this
stupendous miracle we see an illustra
tion of the quickening into life of those
dead in trespasses and sin.
Observe: 1. He Was Dead (v. 39).
This is a type of the sinner dead

in trespasses and sins, even morally
corrupt (Eph. 2:1).

2. The Stone Must Be Rolled Away
(v. 39).

This is the part that the human
must play.
3. Martha's Protest of Unbelief (v.

39).
She insisted that Lazarus had al-

ready undergone putrefaction.
4. Christ's Intimacy and Fellowship

With the Father (v. 42).
In His prayer He declared that it

was not for His sake that He prayed,
but. for those who stood by.

5. Christ's Manner of Dealing With
Lazarus (v. 43).

It was by a call. He is calling men
and women today by His Spirit, Word
and providence.
6, The Response of Lazarus (v.

44).
This shows that the call of Jesus is

with authority and power. With the
call goes the power to heal and obey.

7. The Command to the People (v.
(44).

were to remove the grave
clothes and set him free.

VIII. The Effect of This Miracle
(vv. -15.57).

1. tiome Believed (v. 45).
2. his Enemies Sought to Put Him

to De:111 (vv. 4(i-53).
3. His Withdrawal (v. 54).

The Soul of Religion
Always remember that sincerity is

the very soul of religion. A single in-
tention to please God and to approve
ourselves to Him must animate and
govern all that we do.-Philip Dodd.
ridge.

Holiness
tioHness is religion shining. It is

faith gone to work. It is charity coined
into actions, and ilevetion breathing
henedh•tions on human suffering.-
Bishop Hun tingtun.

- THE -
CHRISTIAN ENDEAVOR

TOPIC

- From --

Moody Bible Institute Monthly

Chicago, Ill.

February 21
Lives Transformed by Christ

Acts 9:1-20
By comparing verses 1, 9 and 20 of

this chapter the reader will See the
extent of the transformation effected
in this instance. Notice the atmos-
phere in which Saul of Tarsus lived,
"breathing out threatenings and
slaughter against the disciples of the
Lord." Then observe the attitude he
took in verse 6, "Lord, what wilt thou
have me to do?" How can you account
for this change except on the ground
of the supernatural power of the
Lord which in a moment changed the
whole outlook and attitude of a life-
time. In view of this experience is
it any wonder that this man wrote the
words in 2 Corinthians 5:17? Study
this verse. It affords a key both to
his experience and his teachings.
This supernatural transforming

power in human life which the Bible
so strongly emphasizes and which
every vital Christian experience cor•
roborates, is the one thing which
Modernism opposes and repudiates.
This is the reason why Modernism as
a system is so perilous. Its acceptance
means the denial of all that makes
our Christian faith redemptive and
saving.
The essential thing in Christianity,

says Dr. McNicol, is a new creation
which is not of this world. The apos-
tles taught this, and the true church
of God has stood for it down through
the centuries and stands for it today.
The effort to impose the teachings of
Christ upon those who belong to the
old creation is like trying to hang
fruit on a thorn bush. Our Lord
Himself said, "A corrupt tree cannot
bring forth good fruit." The old vine
of human nature is corrupt at its very
root. See Mark 7:21-23; Galatians
5:19-21. This necessitates a new vine
which shall bring forth good fruit.
Compare John 15:5 with Galatians
5:22, 23. This fruit, the fruit of the
Spirit, is satisfying to God and man.
Verse 20 reveals the beginnings of
that ceaseless activity which issues
from the new attitude.

Restless Sleep Due
to Stomach Gas

Gas pressure in the abdomen causes
a restless, nervous feeling and pre-
vents sleep. Adlerika removes gas
in TEN minutes and brings out sur-
prising amounts of old waste matter
you never thought was in your sys-
tem. This excellent intestinal evacu-
ant is wonderful for constipation or
stomach trouble. Don't waste time
with pills or tablets but get REAL
Adlerika action! R. S. McKinney,
Druggist.

-Advertisement

Kill Canada Thistles in
Fields of Small Grain

The campaign against the Canada
thistle pest will soon open, and all
sorts of advice will be given. Here
Is the first gun fired by the Ohio ex-
periment station:
"To eradicate Canada thistles in

fields of small grain the use of smoth-
er crops is the most effective. For
this purpose alfalfa and sweet clover
have given the best results. Fields
now in winter wheat may be sown to
alfalfa in March, provided the soil has
been sufficiently limed to insure a
heavy stand of alfalfa. If the field
Is to be sown to grain In the spring,
the alfalfa or sweet clover should be
drilled in at the same time as the
grain.
"Cultivated crops when possible

should be planted far enough apart in
the row to permit of cross-cultivation.
"To clean up permanent grass lands,

orchards in sod, meadows, pastures,
fence rows, and roadsides, recourse
may be had to herbicides or poison
sprays. The soluble arsenites are the
only ones which have thus far proved
satisfactory. These are applied with
a power or compression sprayer.
"Thistles in small isolated patches

can be successfully disposed of by cut-
ting the green shoots with a spade or
hoe just below the surface of the
ground. The operation must be re-
peated as often and as long as green
shoots appear."

Profit Without Honor
"Just put this in," said Bonner.Who so clever sort of gent:"That a profit's without honorIf It's over 10 per cent."

io the Tet
wns a gomd hut eXaS-

PPratil,v and, being touchy,the landimril did not like to offend
tio myo day he cornered the

old man l'ith his most ingratiat-
ing smile :

that you le) to my
"Fink!cl-om I dreamed last night

house, rang
the bell. a,ked for tie. and. without
my s»vir- word Immled me the
money y(01
'SOT'

believe in t!•., :•.m,':"
"I ha Vi • (1001 of faith in

them," sa!fl !h. landlord. hopffully.
"Den Hy.. the receipt." said

Finklehaum nr1 I'll believe in 'em
too."

"Do you

An Honest Laying Mash

strictly high-grade, always fresh
made, high in protein, Rein-o-la Lay-
ing Mash excels in the results it pro-
duces. Try it-Riendollar Bros. &
Co. 10-16-tf

-Advertisement

Prices f . o. h. Flint.
Michigan

Touring $510
Roadster 510
Coupe 645
Coach • 645
Sedan 735
Landau 765
1/2 Ton Truck 395

(Chasus Only)
t Ton Truck 550

(Chassis Only)

for Economical Transportation

So superbly smooth is its performance and so
delightful its comfort that you will step from
the wheel amazed that such power, speed and
snap could be achieved in a car that costs
so little.
No matter what car you are driving or intend
to drive-take a ride in the Improved Chevrolet
and experience the positive revelation it will
afford. Thousands have already done it-and
thousands know the new meaning of Quality
at Low Cost.

See us today and let us give you a demonstration

OHLER'SAHNEN,0.1.,f" ri1,1).ES CO.,

QUALITY AT LOW COST

BIG REDUCTION
In Closed Car Prices

Tudor
Coupe
Fordor

Effective February I I th

New Price Old Price Reduction

. $520 $580 $60

. $500 $520 $20

. $565 $660 $95
Demand for Ford Closed Cars since the improved types in colors were
introduced has been constantly increasing. With greater output of these
types production costs have been lessened and it is the policy of the company
to give its customers the benefits of all such reductions.

New Open Car Prices
TOURING CAR $310 RUNABOUT $290

Starter and Demountable Rims $85 Extra

Tractor, Car and Truck Chassis Prices Remain Unchanged
All prices f. o. b. Detroit

CHIAsviarinnsweect 'CAN,
417/1"47%.Detroit, Mich.

Breakfast Didn't Worry
"You don't mean to tell me you mar-

tied Elsie Spender?"
"But I do-I mean I did," replied the

optimistic bridgegroom.
"Why, your salary won't even buy

her breakfast!"
"Ha! Ha!" laughed the optimist.

"That's where I've got you. Elsie
-won't get up for breakfast!"

NEED FOR SILENCE

The weary diner called the waiter
to him and said: "It is generally con-
sidered improper to speak disrespect-
fully of one's elders?"
The waiter looked puzzled. "So

they say, sir," he returned.
"Ah," said •the diner, "then I must

repress my feelings and be silent
about this egg you have just brought
me."

Reputation Disrespected
Emanuel Jackson, a mule tender,

appeared one morning on crutches.
"Lawsy!" exclaimed a friend. "Ah,

thought yo' was one o' de bes' mule
!millers in de business."
"So Ah is," affirmed Emanuel proud-

ly, "but we done got a mule in dis
mornin' dat didn't know mah reppita-
tion."-Everybody's Magazine.

WANTED

FAT CATTLE
OF ALL KINDS.

We are in a position to handle
your Fat Cattle to an advantage
and will pay the highest cash
prices for Fat Cows, Bulls and
Bologna Cows. If you have any,
call us up on the Phone, or drop
us a card.

Poole & Lambert
NEW WINDSOR, MD.

Phone 21-W 1-8-tf

Victor Records
Hear the New Victor Records re-

ceived every week. Hear
"No Man's Mamma."
"Mighty Blue" by Aileen Stanley.
"That Certain Party."
"Why Aren't Yez Eatin' Mere

Oranges" by the Happiness Boys.
Call and hear the new Orthophonic

Victrola, the Wonder Machine..
VIOLIN INSTRUCTION.

All, Latest Sheet Music in Stock.

JOHN R. SARBAUGH
T aneytown, Md.

SARBAUGH'S JEWELRY STORE.
Main Store Hanover, Pa. 1-8-tf

MEMORIALS
Joseph L. Mathias

PHONE 127

erCarlt every grave,

FOR SALE
Dwelling, Barn, &c with 8 acres
6 Room House wits slate roof, sum-

mer kitchen and other building.

Barn and Garage combined, with
iron roof. Large chicken house.

Five minutes drive fiom Taneytown

Q. E. WEANT,
1546 Aisquith St., Baltimore, Md.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.
This is to give notice that the sub-

scriber has obtained from the Orphans'
Court of Carroll County, in Md., letters of
administration upon the estate of

ANAMARY DARNER,
late of Carroll County, deceased. All per-
sons having claims against the deceased,
are hereby warned to exhibit the same,
with the vouchers properly authenticated,
to the subscriber, on or before the 12th.
day of September, 1926; they may other-
wise by law be excluded from all benefit a
said estate.
Given under my hands this 12th. day of

February, 1926.
SAMUEL U. MAYERS,

2-12-5t Administrator.

SPECIAL
$1.00 Stationery Offer.
It is socially proper as well as business-

like to use printed stationery. It is also
economical and apt to result in having pa-
per and envelopes on hand, when needed
We have filled hundreds of orders received
by mail for our $1.00 offer, and have not
had a single complaint.
200 sheets Hammermill Bond paper,

51/2:81/2 unruled, padded on request, with
100 size 6i, envelopes to match.
Printed either in dark blue, or black.

Not over 4 lines neat type, the same form
on both paper and envelopes Envelopes
printed on back or front. Unless other-
wise directed, orders for ladies will be
printed on back, and for gentlemen, on
front.

Instead of name. an Old English initial
letter can be used, if desired. Initial sta-
tionery should have a box number, or
street address.
When desired, ruled paper will be furn-

ished (167 sheets) with 100 size 61/2 en-
velopes.
We do not print envelopes alone, or pa-

per alone, at 50c.
Cash with order, when sent by mail.

Write instructions, and copy for the print-
ing, very plainly. When mailed to 3rd.and 4th. Zones, add Sc; to 5th. Zone, or
further, add 10c.

TIIE cARROLL RECORD CO.,
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Fate's Grim Jest
About the middle of the Seventeenth

century, when so-called witches were
being persecuted in England, there
were many fanatics who went about
the country seeking out persons ac-
cused of witchcraft and forcing them
to confess by means of examination
and tortures. One man in particu-
lar, Matthew Ilopkins, received the
title of witchflnder-general because of
his industry in the search. In a single
year (1644) he brought 60 persons to
the stake. Being finally accused of
witchcraft himself, Hopkins was sub-
jected to his own favorite test of swim-
ming, and, happening to float, was de-
clared to be a wizard and put to death.
-Kansas City Star.



TANEYTOWN LOCALS
Items of news from town, or vicinity are

always wanted for this column. Especial-
ly accidents, sales of real estate, fires, im-
portant happenings, visits to or from the
community social events, and all matters
a general interest to those at home, and
away from home.

Miss Eleanora Birnie, is spending

some time with friends in Frederick.

Miss Hilda Moser spent the week-

end with her aunt, Mrs. Harry

Sprankle.

Mrs. George Fox, of Rocky Ridge,

is spending some time this week, with

friends in town.

C. Edgar Myers is wiring the upper

floor and auditorium of the new High

School building.

Mrs. Chas. E. H. Shriner who has

been quite ill with pneumonia, is very

much better.

Miss Elizabeth Annan, of Washing-

ton, spent Saturday and Sunday with

her home folks here.

Harry I. Reindollar attended the an-

nual Hardware dealers convention, in

Philadelphia, this week.

Miss Carrie Miller, of Emmitsburg,

is visiting her uncle and aunt, Mr. and

Mrs. Jonn Hockensmith.

Thomas G. Shoemaker has been ill,

this week, with a near approach' to

pneumonia, but is now getting better.

Miss Adelaide Shriver, spent the

week-end with her father, Mr. P. H.

Shriver and returned to Frederick, on

Monday.

Mrs. Preston Snyder, of Hamp-

stead, visited Rev. and Mrs. George

Brown, at the U. B. Parsonage, last

week.

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Baker and

Miss Beulah Forney, of Philadelphia,

spent the week-end with friends in

town.

Mrs. Margaret Stott and Miss Anna

Galt, returned home, on Monday, from

an extended visit to friends and rela-

tives in Washington.

Remember the Firemen's supper,

this Saturday evening, in the Fire-

men's building. Suppers served, be-

ginning at 5 o'clock.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Lurman, of

Cumberland, and Walter Hess, of Em-

mitsburg, called to see Mrs. Ida M.

Reaver, on Tuesday afternoon.

Wm. G. Shaw, of Uniontown, sent

us a 44-page copy of the Tampa,

Florida, Morning Tribune, a prom-

inent feature of it being Real Estate

sales.

Sale advertisements in the Record,

are growing. Read them. Read them

and post yourself on the offerings of

stock and implements, and household

goods.

Mr. and Mrs. Mahlon Brown, of

near town, and Mrs. John T. Albaugh,

of New Midway, spent Thursday af-

ternoon with Mrs. Mary Stover and

family.

Mr. and Mrs. Arda Thomas and

Mrs. Kathryn Thomas, of Lutherville,

spent Wednesday with Mr. and Mrs.

Vernon Crouse and Mr. and Mrs. R.

B. Everhart.

John H. Baird, of Hanover, form-

erly, of Taneytown, was injured some

time in January by being struck by

an automobile, and was unable to

work for a month.

The entertainment by the De Moss

Family, on Monday night, given for

the benefit of the Sewing Society of

the U. B. Church, was very pleasing

to a fair sized audience.

The members of Washington Camp

No. 2, of Md., will attend services

in a body, at the Reformed Church,
on Sunday evening. The pastor,

Rev. Guy P. Bready, will deliver the
sermon.

The Fire Company was called to

Thurmont, on Tuesday night, due to

the burning of a hot house. It proved

to be an unnecessary call, as the local

Company and one from Frederick had

the situation well in hand.

On Monday, Feb. 22, the Rural Car-

riers will not go over their routes.

Postoffice will be closed from 10:00

to 3:00 P. M. Money Order window

will be closed during entire day.—

Harry L. Feeser, Postmaster.

Miss Vesta Strevig and George Hel-

wig, of Union Mills, spent Saturday

with Solomon Wantz and family.

Mrs. Joseph Wantz who was staying

at the home of her son, accompanied

them home and will spend some time

at the home of her daughter, Mrs.

Jacob Messinger.

..Quite frequently, we are told that

our Special Notices would be cheap

at 25c for the smallest. We think so

too—it is the best of advertising—and

the charges are too low, especially

when we must send out bills and try

to collect for telephoned, or mailed,

orders that people forget about.

Miss Amelia Annan, left, on

Thursday morning, for New York,

where she expects to spend several

weeks with relatives.

Mrs. Gilbert E. Carpenter, of

Omaha, Neb., who has been spending

a week at the home of her aunt, Miss

Amelia Birnie, left Wednesday morn-

ing. „

Miss Rose Crabbs, who has been at

the Md. University Hospital for over

four weeks, expects to go to the home

of her brother, Earle, today (Friday).

Letters addressed to 4804 Wayne Ave,

Baltimore, will be gladly received by

her. Her condition has slightly im-

proved.

A monster issue of The Detroit

News, for Sunday, Feb. 14, weighing

21/I lbs., was received by the Editor

through the courtesy of Mrs . Leala

B. Stahl, of Detroit. She writes that

they are having lots of snow, but so

light that it can easily be swept off

with a broom.

While assembling logs on his wood

lot, Thursday evening, Martin D.

Hess was caught between two logs,

and his left leg badly injured. He

was giving attention to a log in front

of him, when a large log back of him

rolled down a bank and caught him

between the two. Fortunately, the

rolling log came on a slant, and not

parallel with the log in front.

Word was received here, just before

going to press, that Charles H.

Basehoar, of Littlestown, died this

morning, at 10 o'clock, from acute in-

digestion. He was a brother of Mrs.

C. M. Benner, Mrs. David M. Mehring,

Mrs. D. W. Garner and Augustus

Basehoar of Taneytown. We have no

further particulars. Mr. Basehoar

was widely known here, and was one

of the most prominent citizens of

Littlestown.

Rev. T. Dewey Ritter, in sending a

check for subscription to The Record,

says; "We miss your valuable paper

very much, and have a very keen ap-

preciation of its real worth.. It is

certainly refreshing in these days to

find a paper, unmuzzled and unafraid

to stand for the things the Kingdom

of Darkness is against. We are get-

ting along very well in our new home,

and are now engaged in enlarging

our church. Best regards to all

friends."

"A MOTHER'S BLESSED TASK
—ONE CHANCE IN TEN FOR
HER BABE", BY FANNIE
HURST, THE WORLD'S HIGH-
EST PAID WOMAN WRITER,
IN SUNDAY'S BALTIMORE
AMERICAN.

—Advertisement

CHURCH NOTICES.

This column is for the free use of all
churches, for a brief announcement of
services. Please do not elaborate. It is
always understood that the public is in-
vited.

Manchester Reformed Charge,
Lazarus, Lineboro—S. S., 9:00; For-
eign Mission Day Program, "Outward
Bound," at 10:00; Sermon on "The
Mourners Comforted."

Trinity, Manchester—S. S., at 9:30;
C. E., at 6:15; Worship, 7:00. Come
and hear more about "The Thief in
the Church." You may be surprised
when you find out who it is. The
Men's Chorus will sing.

Manchester U. B. Charge, Bixler's
—Preaching, 10:30; Prayer-meeting
Wednesday evening at the home of
Otto Harman.
Mt. Zion—S. S., 1:30; Preaching,

2:30; C. E., 7:30.
Millers—S. School, 9:30; C. E., at

7:00; Preaching, 7:30.

Trinity Lutheran, Taneytown-9:00
Sunday School; 10:00 Morning Wor-
ship; 6:30 Christian Endeavor; 7:30
Evening Worship; Mid-week Service,
Wednesday. Catechetical Classes, Sat-
urday. Life Service program, Sunday
morning, Feb. 28.

Baust Reformed Church—Sunday
School, 9:30; Preaching Service, 10:30
Y. P. Society, 7:00.

Uniontown Lutheran Charge, St.
Paul's—S. S., at 9:30; C. E., 7:30;
Mt. Union—S. S., 9:15; Worship

and Sermon, 10:30; C. E., 7:30.
St. Luke's (Winter's)—Worship

and Sermon, 2:30.

Reformed Church, Taneytown—S.
School, 9:15; Service, 10:15; C. E., at
6:30; Service, at 7:30. The P. 0. S.
of A. Lodge will attend in a body.

Keysville—Service, at 2.

Presbyterian, Town—S. S., 10:00;
C. E., 6:45; Owing to illness of Rev.
Brown there will be no Preaching
Service, either in town Church, or
Piney Creek. No S. S., at Piney
Creek.

Taneytown U. B. Church—S. S., at
9:30; Morning Worship, 10:30; Jr.
C. E., 2:00; Sr. C. E., 6:30.
Harney—Sunday School, at 1:30;

Preaching Service, at 2:30.

German Girls' New Tasks
Changing times, changing ideals.

The girls in Germany no longer pre-
fer the occupations they once cher-
ished. Such is the testimony of the
"adviser for professions." Miss Mar-
garette Schmidt, in Perlin-Mitte. Some
years ago girls who had to work
turned to typing and stenography.
Now they prefer dressmakrng and

occupations.millinery  Contrariwise,
there is a lack of deaconesses.

LAST PAGE EDITORIAL.
—0—

IF—

If patent medicines would act ac-
cording to their advertised claims, the
Doctors would be forced out of busi-
ness.

If fair appearance always meant
fair performance, what a lot of trou-
ble would be saved.

If things would go as we plan them,
then only good plans would be needed
for happy existence.

If the passing of laws always meant
the end of evils, our Courts would
have little to do.

If men's promises were always to be
depended on, the saving of losses
would make everything we buy,cheap-
er.

If it was not for dishonesty and
trickery, and new schemes for "get-
ting around" laws,our legislative bod-
ies would not need to assemble more
frequently than about once every ten
years.

If young folks understood the value
of school days, they would leave
school with twice the amount of edu-
cation they now leave with.

If folks would read, what they do
read, with more care and understand-
ing, they would keep on educating
themselves after their school days,and
have less need for education by hard
experience.

If there was less of "They say," and
imaginary conclusions, the peace of
neighborhoods would be immeasurably
increased.

If a lot of people in Maryland could
have their wishes gratified, there
would be at least one more daily
newspaper published in the State.

NINA PUTNAM WILCOX NOT-
ED WOMAN HUMORIST, WHO
HAS BEEN STYLED THE "FE-
MALE MARK TWAIN" IS
WRITING A SERIES OF SPEC-
IAL STORIES, COMPLETE
EACH WEEK IN SUNDAY'S
BALTIMORE AMERICAN. THIS
WEEK "I AND GEORGE." BE
SURE TO START READING
THIS ENTERTAINING SERIES.

—Advertisements.

Some Good Short Ones.

"My son is taking Algebra under
you this term, is he not" remarked a
fond father. "Well" answered the
pedagague "your son has been expos-
ed to algebra, but I doubt if he will
take it."

"What are you crying for, little
boy." "Boo-hoo! Pa fell down the
steps, Sister saw him fall all the way,
and I never saw it at all."

"Here's a letter from a woman who
wants to know what to use when
cleaning carpets." "If she's a married
woman, tell her to use her husband."

Agent; "Here is a book you can't
afford to be without," Victim; "I nev-
er read books, and have no children—
only a cat." Agent, "Well, don't you
need a good heavy book to throw at
the cat sometimes."

"Drs. Brown and Smith are going
to operate on Mr. Gotrox; is the op-
eration necessary"? "Why yes, Brown
has a note coming due, and Smith
wants an automobile."

Pupil to Professor, "What in your
opinion is the most difficult problem"?
Professor, "Making both ends meet."

"Johnny, do you like going to
school"? "Not so well as coming
home."

Johnny had been playing around
the piano, and had fallen. "What are
you bawling about"? asked Bertie,
contempluously; "it was the soft ped-
al your head hit."

"SHOULD OLD LOVES BE
CHERISHED," A DISCUSSION
BY ALBERT EDWARD WIG-
GAN IN SUNDAY'S BALTI-
MORE AMERICAN.

—Advertisements.

Saw Nothing Pretty
in Hopi Snake Dance

The only ceremonial Indian dance of
which I know the date, or approxi-
mately the date, is the Hopi snake
dance, which comes in August, near
the last of the month. Mr. Harriman
writes in Adventure Magazine. The
Hopi themselves never know the exact
date until near the time, as it is fixed
by the time when a shadow hits a
certain point on the mesa. The priests
watch and when a certain shadow
touches this particular spot, then they
know the dance must be held a certain
number of days later.
This makes it vary from year to

year, by a few days.
This dance is held either at °milli,

Hotevilla or Walpi, though at times it
occurs at Shumgopavi or MishongnovL
It is the closing number of a nine-
day ceremonial, which they believe
brings rain. The snakes are caught
and brought in after much mummery.
The whole ceremony is a disgusting
pagan rite, where men hold live snakes
in their jaws and go dancing around
the plaza. They drink an emetic of
strong potency and all stand in a row
and vomit violently over a cliff. Bah 1

Off to the Front
He was a splendid figure as he

stood there in the hallway, his rifle
slung over his shoulder, his automat-
ics strapped tightly around his waist,
and his bag of hand grenades in his
hand.
His wife and children clung tear-

fully to him as he tried to comfort
them. "Fear not," he said, "I'll re-
turn." But in his heart he knew the
dangers that awaited him.

"I'll call you up at noon," he said,
tearing himself away, "and let you
know if I'm alive."
The door slammed. The wife stood

tragically alone in the hallway. The
jeweler had gone to his day's work.—
Life.

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned, administrator of

Anamary Harner, deceased, will sell
at public sale, along the stone road 1
mile north of Dietrick's Mill, on the
John A. Myers property, on
TUESDAY, MARCH 9th., 1926,

at 12 o'clock, the following personal
property:

THREE TABLES,

extension table, one leaf table, one
family table, kitchen cabinet, 2 dress-
ers, washstand, 4 chests, 3 stands, one
organ, in good condition; sideboard,
cupboard, sink, 5 rocking chairs, one
dozen chairs, sewing machine, wood
box, about 20 yards of home-made
carpet, 5 bedsteads, bed spring, lot of
dishes, knives and forks, pans, kettles,
large amount of jellies and preserves,
lot jarred fruit, potatoes by the bush-
el; 25-bu. of corn, in the ear; lot of
empty crocks, 2 new brooms, lot of
empty stone jars, sausage stuffer and
grinder, iron kettle and ring, lot emp-
ty barrels, and boxes, wheelbarrow,
about 4 cords of wood, sawed in stove
length; axe and saw, augers, cow
chains, garden tools, Red Cross cook
stove, and many other articles not
mentioned.
TERMS—All sums of $5.00 and un-

der, cash. Sums above $5.00 a credit of
6 months will be given, bearing inter-
est from day of sale, with notes with
approved security. No goods to be
removed until settled for.

SAMUEL H. MAYERS,
Administrator.

ARTHUR BOYD, Auct. 2-19-3t

PUBLIC  SALE
The undersigned, will offer at pub-

lic sale, in Harney, on

FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 1926,

at 1 o'clock, the personal property of
the late Mrs. Jacob Stambaugh, as
follows;

HOUSEHOLD GOODS,

buffet, safe, 2 bureaus, 3 clocks, lamp,
wash bowl and pitcher, rocking chairs,
3 bedsteads, 3 stands, 2 chests, two
lounges, 2 tables, chunk stove, cup-
board, window blinds, lot of matting,
2 baskets, lot of cooking utensils, lot
of glassware, quilting frames, clothes
horse, 3 mirrors, lot of dishes, bed
spring, oil stove, sausage grinder,
spring wagon, corn plow, cutting box,
and many small articles.
TERMS—A credit of 6 months will

be given on sums over $5.00, on ap-
proved notes, bearing interest. Cash

on sums of $5.00 or less.

JACOB STAMBAUGH.

PUBLIC SALE
The undersigned, intending to quit

farming, will offer at puplic sale. on the
Win. T. Keefer farm, on the road leading
from Union Bridge to Taneytown, near
Otter Dale mill, on

FRIDAY, MARCH 12th., 1926,

at 11 o'clock, the following Live Stock
and Farming Implements, consisting of

6 HEAD OF HORSES AND MULES,

es
1 black mare, 8 years old, good
saddle and lead mare, can not be
hitched wrong; 1 gray mare,
8 years old, good off-wheel

mare and off-side worker; both of these
mares are of good size; 1 pair brown mules

8 years old, one of these mules is an extra
good leader, the other one an off-side
worker; 1 pair black mules, 5 years old,
the one an extra good leader, the other an
off-side worker. All of these horses and
mules are quiet and gentle and worthy the
attention of anyone wanting good horses
and mules.

16 HEAD OF CATTLE

consisting of 13 milch cows, 2
heifers and 1 bull. These cows
are most all Summer and Fall
cows.

FARMING IMPLEMENTS.

3 good farm wagons, one 3-in. tread wagon
with bed, holds 15 bbls. of corn; one 4-in
tread wagon, one 2-horse Moline wag.on,
with bed, holds 6 bbls. of corn. Emerson
Brantingham manure spreader, has only
spread about 40 acres; Deering binder,
8-ft cut; Moline mower, horse rake, 2 sets
of 20-ft hay carriages, good Black Hawk
corn planter, Crown grain drill, with 9
discs; 23-tooth lever harrow, one 17-tooth
lever harrow, 2 barshear Wiard plows, one
steel land roller, 2 Brown double walking
corn plows, 1 corn drag, 2 sets of dung
boards, 126 ft of hay rope, 3 pulleys,
double harpoon fork, grain cradle, 3-horse
evener, 2-horse stretchers, fifth chain
stretchers. 4-horse double tree, 4 triple
trees, 4 double trees, a lot of single trees,
jocky sticks, log chain, 3 sets of breast
chains, lot of cow chains, dung hooks,
straw knife, dung forks, pitch forks,
scoop and dirt shovels, bushel basket.
HARNESS-2 sets breechbands, 4 sets

front gears, 6 bridles, 7 collars, carrying
straps, 6 leather halters, 6-horse line, 3
pairs check lines, wagon saddle, wagon
whip.

DAIRY UTENSILS

One Economy cream separator, in good
running order, lot of good 5, 6 and 7-gal.
milk cans, milk buckets and strainer.

HOUSEHOLD GOODS

One extension table, 1 good buffet, and
1 wardrobe.
TERMS—All sums of $10.00 and under.

cash. On larger sums, a credit of 6
months will be given, the purchasers to
give their notes with satisfactory security.
bearing interest from day of sale. No
goods to be removed until settled for.

ROY CRABBS.
.7. N. 0. SMITH, Auct. 2-19.3t

SATURDAY, FEBRUARY 20th

CHARLES RAY

"Some Pun'kins"
Charlie Ray is a creative boy in

"Some Pun'kins"—he invents a

fireless fire-engine that's engine-

less.

COMEDY

LLOYD HAMILTON
— IN —

"Good Morning"

THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 27th.

"In The Name of Love"
WITH

RICHARDS CORTEZ,
GRETA NISSEN,
WALLACE BEERY,
RAYMOND HATTON.

PATHE NEWS
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Taneytown' a "Leading Fashion Store"

•

Vire SOH

Standard
Sewing Machin...-

cons ros.
DEPARTMENTSTOht

TANEYTOWN, MD.

Final Reductions on all Winter Merchandise.
These Bargains should be taken advantage of by

all who need Blankets, Comforts, Heavy Underwear,
Winter Hosiery, Ladies' Coats and Men's Suits and
Overcoats.

Special Prices on all Ginghams.
Apron Checks in Blue and

White, Brown and White, Black
and White and Pink. Fancy
Dress Ginghams—a large range
of new patterns. Light and Dark
Percales, all 36-in. wide.

Men's Work Shoes.
Reliable wear-resisters, chrome

tanned and all solid leather.
Men's Oxfords, in Tan and Black
Patent Leather, and Gun Metal.
All latest shapes for spring.

Special Prices on all--
Bleached and Unbleached Mus-

lins, Sheetings, Pillow Tubing,
Toweling, Ticking, Light and
Dark Outings, Table Damask,
Table Oilcloth, and White and
Fancy goods, for Ladies' Under-
wear.

New Style Colored Hats for Men.
Distinctive styles, made of fine

soft felt, in colors that will suit
all. A beautiful line of Men's
and Boys' Caps. All latest shapes
and colors.

Ladies Oxfords and Pumps.
Ladies' Patent Leather Strap

Pumps; Tan Pumps and Oxfords,
with the new toes and heels, at
attractive prices, from the best
Shoe manufacturers. Call and
see them, before you buy.

Ball-Band.
We are headquarters for Ball-

Band Rubber Boots, Felt Boots,
one ond four Buckle Arctics for
Men, Women and Children. Light
and Heavy Overshoes.

Linoleum, Congoleum and Floor Tex Rugs,
NEW RUGS IN THE NEWEST PATTERNS IN DIFFERENT

WIDTHS. ALSO, LINOLEUM AND CONGOLEUM BY THE

YARD AT LOWER PRICES. TRUNKS, SUIT CASES AND

TRAVELING BAGS.
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Look up your Old Pictures.
You probably have, on your garret, some

of the colored Lithographic Prints that were

published by N. Currier, or by Currier & Ives,

and distributed throughout the country during

the time of your parents and grand-parents.

Some of these Prints are Now Valuable.

If you have any of these pictures write

me, giving title, name of publisher and date of

publication if any appears. I will call to see

them. Address—

OLD PICTURES,
Lock Box 151,

ct,:tttttttlt-29-4t tttttttttttm.,stttwitxtttttttttuttmiGETTYSBURG, PA.
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THE REINDOLLAR CO.

Manufacturers of Feed
TANEYTOWN, MD.

ANNOUNCEMENT

We beg to announce having installed an up-to-date steel corn

cutter and grader, for the manufacture of cracked corn. This to-

gether with the Feed Mixer we recently put in operation enables us

to manufacture, at low cost, OUR OWN BRANDS of Dairy Ra-

tions, Egg Mash, and Scratch Grains, and to mix for the public any

formulas of their own, at very moderate prices.

OUR OWN BRANDS of Feed should find ready sale, for sever-

al reasons; they are mixed right here at home; made fresh every

few days; contain no ingredients that are not feeds in themselves;

are tested by the State authorities at College Park; and are sold

at prices that are lower by comparison with other feeds of the

same analysis.

We have always on hand for the manufacture of OUR

BRANDS—or any formulas you may select—Bran, W. Feed, C. S.

Meal, F. S. Meal, Gluten Feed, Beef Scrap, Beet Pulp, Alfalfa Meal,

etc.

We invite you to come and inspect our plant, try OUR FEEDS,

and get results—the Cows and the Hens will tell the story.

Also handle Larro Feed, "Ful 0' Pep" Chick Starter, Growing

Mash, and Fine Chick Feed. At your service, we are—

Very Truly Yours,

THE REINDOLLA.R CO.

NOTICE!
The Stockholders of the Birnie

Trust Company, Taneytown, Md., are
hereby notified that the annual elec-
tion, to elect Seven Directors to serve
for the ensuing year, will be held on
Monday, March 8th., 1926., between
the hours of 9:00 and 10:00 A. M., in
the office of said Company, Taney-
town, Md.

G. WALTER WILT, Cashier.
2-19-3t

Taneytown Grain

Wheat
Corn, new  
Rye  
Oats  
Hay Timothy  
Rye Straw  

and Hay Market.

$1.71@$1.71
.70@.70

.90@ .90.50@ .50 In any State.

pi06..000=106..000 .1, AT PRIVATE SALE
2-19-7t

COWS AND BULLS

Howard J. Spalding
LITTLESTOWN, PA.,

has a load of Fine Stock Bulls,
and Cows. All T. B. tested to go


