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SOME RULES FOR
AVOIDING FIRE

Expert Advice, Advice, Based on Results of
Fire Disasters.

Buy matches approved by the .Un-
derwriters' Laboratories, if possible;
place them out of the reach of little
children. If strike anywhere match-
es are used, put them in earthenware
receptacles. Be careful in discard-
ing lighted matches.

Countless fires have been caused by
leaving electric irons with the current
"on"; disconnect them at the socket
immediately when through using.

Ashes, whether inside or outside of
the house, should be placed in metal
receptacles.

Combustile rubbish should not be
allowed to accumulate. If rubbish is
burned out-of-doors, start the fires a
safe distance from buildings and nev-
er light them on windy days. Keep
children away.
Rags or cloths used in oiling floors

or polishing furniture often ignite
spontaneously; they should be stored
in metal containers or else burned af-
ter using.
Removal of paint with a torch is

dangerous; use a liquid paint remov-
er.

If kerosene lamps are used, keep
them clean and well filled, for those
allowed to burn with little oil in them
are liable to explode. Filling should
be done in daylight; never when a
lamp is lighted.
Washing material with gasoline is

highly hazardous, for agitation is lia-
ble to produce a spark of static elec-
tricity which will ignite the vapor
from the liquid. If gasoline or naph-
tha is used for cleaning spots from
clothing or upholstery,the work should
be done in the open or at least in front
of an open door, distant from fire or
open flames. Better still, employ car-
bon tetrachloride which is safe; the
fluid may be procured at any drug-
gist's.

Screen all fire-places in which a fire
is burning.
Hanging electric light cords on

nails or hooks is almost certain in
time to destroy or injure the insula-
tion; this condition may cause a fire.

Clothes should not be hung too close
to hot stoves or stove pipes.
Use an electric torch when explor-

ing a dark closet.
Frozen water pipes are safely

thawed by wrapping them in cotton
cloths, kept saturated with hot water.

If you notice the odor of gas in your
home, first open all doors and -windows
and then seek the leak with the aid of
an electric torch and the sense of
smell. Soap suds applied to joints will
help to locate a leak.

Rigid metal connections to gas ap-
plinaces should be substituted for
those of cheap rubber, which are like-
ly to develop leaks.

If houses are banked in winter with
leaves or other readily inflammable
materials, a covering of earth should
be added to prevent a chimney spark
or carelessly thrown match or cigar-
ette from igniting them and spreading
fire to the house.
Many fires from exposure have been

prevented by wetting down combusti-
ble roofs with a garden hose. Frame
dwellings have been saved from a
nearby fire by nailing carpets or
blankets on the exposed sides from
eaves downward and keeping them
wet.
A candle in the house is dangerous

under any circumstances. If it is ab-
solutely necessary to use one, it should
be fitted tightly into a sturdy candle-
stick, having a wide base, and kept
out of drafts and away from anything
that will catch fire.

Kerosene should not be used to en-
liven a fire, nor poured into a range
or furnace even when the fire is out.

with 
fat may be extinguished

with earth, sand, flour or salt, or by
smothering with a metal cover; water
will scatter flames from grease or oil.
Burying instead of burning dry

leaves will enrich the soil and will re-
move another fire hazard.
Top-heavy and leaky oil heaters are

dangerous.
An electric bulb used for warming

beds or for drying clothes is almost
certain to start a fire.

All gasoline appliances-stoves,
lamps and irons-are dangerous, no
matter, what salesmen say. It is
safest not to use any of them.
Keep matches at regular places, in

metal boxes, high up out of reach of
children, never under any circum-
stances let them lie around loose.

Never let old boxes, excelsior, loose
boards, paper, or rubbish of any kind,
accumulate near buildings.

Thieves Visit Club House.

The Club House of the Forest and
Stream Club, located on the Mono-
cacy river, near Detour, Maryland,
last Saturday night was broken into
by a window shutter being forced,and
a lock broken. At this time it is im-
possible to state the value of the
property damaged and stolen. This
club owns four acres of land and same
have been used by the public for
some time for camping and picnic-
ing.
On account of the public abusing

these privileges, the club has decided
not to allow trespassing, and the pub-
lic are asked to please keep off these
grounds. The property is now in
charge of competent men who will
see that only club members will use
this property in the future.

SELBY LOSS SETTLED.

Mr. and Mrs. Selby Very Grateful to
all, for Assistance.

The following amounts heve been
voluntarily turned in, without a spe-
cial canvass, for the purpose of help-
ing to make up the loss sustained
above the amount of insurance. Any
additional amounts may be left at this
office, or given to Mr. Selby direct. He
has had so much encouragement in
every way, that he intends to rebuild
on the same location, in the near fu-
ture.
Rev. H. A. Quinn
Birnie Trust Co
Carroll Record Co.
Mrs. Elizabeth Hite
Taneytown Savings Bank
Norman Baumgardner
P. B. Engler
G. T. Hockensmith
J. A. Thomson
Curtis G. Bowers
Harry E. Reck
Cash
The Reindollar Co.
Cash
Ervin Hyser
Harry B. Miller
Howard Dern
C. Elmer Reck
R. Smith Snader
H. A. Allison
Wm. Eckenrode
John N. Starr
J. J. Bankard
C. H. Long
Geo. R .Sauble
George Winemiller
Martin Conover
John Shirk
R. S. McKinney
Dr. F. T. Elliot

$ 5.00
10.00
5.00

50.00
10.00
3.00
5.00
5.00
1.00
2.00
2.00
7.00

10.00
3.00
1.00
1.00
1.00
2.00
5.00
5.00
5.00
5.00
5.00
5.00
5.00
5.00
5.00
5.00
5.00
2.00

Total $180.00
We understand that some have

made contributions direct to Mr. Sel-
by, and not reported through this of-
fice.
The proof of loss was executed on

Tuesday, for the full amount of the
Policy in the Planters Mutual Insur-
ance Company, of Washington county,
through P. B. Engler, agent, and the
amount, $1040., paid by draft in less
than five days after the fire-very
prompt work.
Mr. and Mrs. Selby are very grate-

ful to all who so energetically assist-
ed at the fire; also to those who have
since offered labor help when they
rebuild; and especially to all who have
contributed to lessen their financial
loss by making cash contributions.
They realize, more than ever, the val-
ue of neighbors and friends in time of
need.

W. E. Shaw, Engineer, Retires.

William E. Shaw, W. M. R. R. engi-
neer, well known along the line, will
retire on July 1 from active service.
The Hanover, Pa., Sun gives the fol-
lowing account of his service.
"He is the oldest employe in years

of service with the Western Maryland
railroad. On July 1, in addition to
becoming a pensioner of the line, he
will celebrate his 65th. birthday.
He had intended answering the "call
boy" up until Sunday, but the heat of
the past several days has made this
impossible.
Mr. Shaw has been in the contin-

uous employment of the Western
Maryland for forty-two years. All
but two of these years, he has been
a locomotive engineer.
For more than six years he has

been working on the Hanover divi-
sion of the line, covering a daily run
of 188 miles between Baltimore and
Highfield. Within that time, he has
endeared himself not only to every
employe of the company from the
telegraphers to section hands, but to
many patrons of the line as well.

Before he took over the piloting of
the Baltimore-Highfield train, he was
working on the main line of the road,
between Baltimore and Cumberland,
on the fast mail train.
He has witnessed the passing of

many and various types of locomo-
tives in his 42 years of service. It is
said he has operated the throttle of
every type of locomotives on the
road."

Proceedings of the Orphans' Court.

Monday, June 25th., 1923.-William
W. Dudderar and the Central Trust
Company of Md., Executors of Wm.
W. Dudderar, deceased, returned in-
ventories of personal property, real
estate and current money, and receiv-
ed orders to sell stocks, bonds and
personal property.
Jacob P. Buchman, administrator of

Mary A. Buchman, deceased, reported
sale of personal property and settled
his first and final account.
George H. Brown, administrator of

Marshall Hartsock, deceased, return-
ed inventories of personal property
and real estate and received orders to
sell stocks, bonds and personal prop-
erty.
Tuesday, June 26, 1923.-Letters

of administration on the estate of
Clarence E. Myerly, deceased, were
granted unto Emma J. Myerly.
Bertha E. 'Zahn, administratrix of

Luther T. Zahn, deceased, settled her
first and final account.
Lewis Reiter and John E. Mason-

heimer, administrators of Eliza C.
Cox, deceased, returned inventories
of personal property and leasehold
estate on which the Court issued or-
der ni. si. on the latter.
Arthur Zepp, administrator of Lu-

cille E. Zepp, deceased, returned in-
ventory of personal property and
money and received order to sell
former.

Wednesday, July 4th., being a legal
Foliday, Court House will be closed.

THE SCHOOL BOARD'S
SIDE OF THE CASE.

The Reasons Given for Demands
from the Board.

1-The Board of Education of Car-
roll County has noted the publication
of the School Budget in full by the
County Commissioners for which it
feels duly grateful. In consequence
a statement is also due to the public
from the Board of Education indicat-
ing in some detail the position in
which the Board is placed. The fol-
lowing causes increasing school ex-
pense should be fully understood by
the public before it can understand
the reason for the Board's demands.
2-High School enrollment has in-

creased since 1916 from 113 to over
800, and the number of High Schools
from one to ten; a high school teach-
ing force from 5 teachers to 52, and
along with these increases require-
ments made mandatory in the law of
equipment for commercial agricul-
tural, manual training, home econom-
ics, and scientific training. To meet
this growth naturally more class
rooms must be furnished and special
rooms for the special work. Actually
43 rooms are in use for this purpose
of which only 10. have been added
since 1915.
3-This year 439 children have

graduated from the elementary school
and judging from percentages in pre-
vious years 375 will apply for en-
trance to the various schools next
fall; 102 have graduated from the
high school this year, thus making a
probable increase in high school en-
rollment for the coming year of 273.
With the exception of Hampstead
and Mechanicsville the capacity of
every school plant in the county was
filled to its maximum capacity during
the school year just closed.
4-We have had a great deal of

sickness among teachers during the
past year and two deaths, mainly ac-
cording to physicians' reports on ac-
count of over-work. The law re-
quires that no teacher shall have to
meet class;s of more than 40 children
in elementary grades, and more than
20 in high school. Yet we have com-
pelled teachers in 23 class rooms to
carry a daily load of 53 to 62 children.
It is not possible to relieve the teach-
ing burden by increasing the number
of teachers, unless classrooms are
provided in which these teachers may
teach.
5-The Board of Education asked

for necessary relief where the facili-
ties are inadequate and suggested
portable buildings as follows:
Westminster, 2 portables; Mt. Airy

2 portables; Union Bridge 2 portables;
Sykesville, 3 portables; Manchester,
1 portable; Reese, Washington, New
Windsor, colored, each 1 and a two-
room permanent or portable at Roller,
This building program would have
met the congestion for the present
and probably for several years, in-
cluding the necessary provision for
the inevitable congestion in Taney-
town and Charles Carroll by another
year.
6-Since this relief was not grant-

ed, therefore, the Board of Education
is forced to reorganize the school sys-
tem to the extent, that where there is
a teacher overload, to require half-
day sessions for certain grades or
groups of children. This will become
effective in the following schools, in
part or whole: Sykesville, elementary;
Mt. Airy, elementary; Union Bridge,
elementary; Westminster elementary
and high school; Manchester, elemen-
tary; Reese, Washington, Medford,
Detour, Springville, Mt. Pleasant,
Priestland (colored).
7-For lack room, no 3rd. year can

be granted to the high school children
in Manchester, and no 4th. year at
Charles Carroll, or Sykesville. A
platform system must be organized
in Westminster if the enrollment in-
creases, this means two sessions from
8 to 1, and from 12 to 5, or actually
running two schools in one set of
rooms, both for the High School and
the Intermediate School.
8-As insufficient funds have been

allowed for fuel, the Board will spend
the amount granted, which is $11,000,
$3500 less than it actually cost this
past year for fuel and then close each
school as its fuel becomes exhausted.
The Board has no option but to vio-
late the law by either closing schools
which are required to be kept open
180 days, or by incurring expense for
which it does not have sufficient funds
9-It is compelled to take the same

position with respect to repairs. 18
roofs are leaking badly. Floors are
needed in four buildings and much
small repair work and painting is
necessary. This will be curtailed
within the limits of the appropriation.
10-The Board of Education has

had the amount allowed for text-
books and supplies very much cur-
tailed as well as the means of their
distribution. While these items are
to be furnished free under the law to
all pupils, the Board is under the ne-
cessity of announcing that when the
amounts allowed have been exhaust-
ed, no further supplies of any kind
will be furnished to the children.
11-Our schools rank seventh in the

State in efficiency according to the
State report. Our expenditures ac-
cording to this same report in com-
parison with the State average is
very much in our favor, when it is
considered that Carroll stands sixth
in school population in the State with
an enrollment of 7236 children.
Cost per pupil for current expense:

County everage for whole State, rural
(Continued on Eighth Page.)

WOMEN'S SHORT COURSE.

An Enthusiastic and Greatly Enjoyed
Gathering.

In spite of the hot weather of last
week, the women who attended the
short course at College Park are very
enthusiastic in telling of the good
time they had. Carroll County had the
largest delegation of any county in
state. Everyone was delighted, not
only with the good times but with the
valuable things they learned. Two
large buses and four automobiles car-
ried the group from Carroll county.
They left Westminster on Monday for
College Park, and arrived home on
Friday night.
Much had been planned by the Uni-

versity for the entertainment of the
women, in several concerts and talks
on musical appreciation, demonstra-
tions in folk dancing and community
singing. The community singing was
in charge of Miss Barrows, Supervis-
or of music in Washington High
Schools. One of the most enjoyable
occasions was the second night, when
setted under the stars on the grassy
lawn of the campus, they sang togeth-
er some of the new and some of the
old songs.
On Tuesday evening the social fea-

ture was the reception by Dr. Woods,
Presigent of the University. It was
a delightful affair and in front of the
girls' dormitory alight with colored
lights, the women soon became well
acquainted. On Thursday afternoon,
a tea was given by Miss Nount and
Miss Stamp, Dean of the University
of Maryland. At this time the wo-
men were delighted by a talk by Miss
Risteau.
On Friday afternoon a social fea-

ture was the sight-seeing trip in
Washington. Aside from all the so-
cial features, getting acquainted with
the other women of the state, and the
delightful dormitory life, was the
class room work. It must have
brought back to the women their
school days, as they registered for
class room work. And yet, it was dif-
ferent too; in the first place the sub-
jects were the things the women were
most interested in, and the things
which they are going to immediately
use. It was hard to tell which was
the most popular course.
The subjects were food, clothing,

house furnishings, household manage-
ment, landscape gardening, poultry,
home dairying and health. A great
deal of interest was shown in the
health lectures, and it was an inspir-
ing sight to see a couple hundred wo-
men listening regularly to the health
information given. Two large class-
es were the food and clothing courses.
The food work was given by Mrs.
Welsh; the canning work by Miss
Everett and her assistant Mrs.
Duvall. Under the food work came
the steam pressure cooking, salads,
cooking of vegetables and dietetics.

Bread making was given by Miss
Hanna Wessling who came from Chi-
cago for the two demonstrations. Miss
W esseling is considered the best
bread demonstrator in the United
States. Miss Lieby's work in corset-
ing for women was greatly appreciat-
ed. Miss Leiby was a clothing spec-
ialist at the University for several
years and has now taken up the study
of corsets from the health side, and
a trunk load of corsets were shown.
A hundred and twenty-five women

took the courses in clothing and mil-
linery. A hat form was made which
the women brought home with them.
Also models and samples of many
stitches in clothing work. Mrs. Bell's
classes in Home Management and Mr.
Rice's in poultry. were both well at-
tended and we can not help but feel
although the course was short, that
many valuable points were absorbed
by the women.

Carroll County has the banner for
having the largest registration. We
hope this will be an annual affair and
that next year she will still keep the
lead. On stunt night Carroll County
responded with an original song and
yell. The group will never forget the
happy times spent together. A very
pleasant occasion was the presenting
to Miss Kellar and her two assistants
with a most beautiful basket of flow-
ers. Miss Everett, the Home Demon-
stration Agent, wishes to thank the
women for their splendid spirit
throughout the conference.

Billy Sunday Scores Modern Dress.

Columbus, Ohio, June 14.-"High
society is so lowdown that it needs an
airship to get to hell. The whole
world needs the hose wash in God's
bathhouse," shouted "Billy" Sunday
noted evangelist, addressing a local
audience.
"Any fellow who can gaze upon one

of the up-to-date janes and refrain
from having a moral blowout ought to
get a substantial pension," continued
Sunday. "No one can tell me that a
man can look upon a girl as she is
dressed today with prayer-meeting
thoughts in his mind.
"As I study the fashion plates I will

tell you the morals of the age. No
one can tell me that dress has no bear-
ing on the morals of men and women.
I like to see a person dressed neatly.
A person can be modest and still be
neat."

It is said that a Frenchman never
drinks whiskey, nor ice water, and
never gets drunk on wine. Whenever
a man is arrested in Paris, for drunk-
enness, it is uusually an American or
an Englishman.

Statistics show that there is a
white physician for each 553 persons,
and only one physician for each 3194
colored people.

HARDING DRIVES
FARM TRACTOR.
---------

Thinks he ought now get in the
Farmers' Bin,.

The President, while in Kansas, vis-
ited Hutchinson. the centre of the
wheat belt, and demonstrated his
knowledge of practical farming. A
press dispatch says:
"After the handshaking and talk

with the children the party walked
into the wheat field. President Hard-
ing and Governor Davis put up a
shock of wheat but, not pleased with
their work, shocked another.
"Now let me show you the Ohio

way," said the President, and after
stepping a few paces gathered up sev-
eral bundles of wheat and shocked
them to the approval of Governor
Davis and Senator Capper.
"Do I get in on the farm bloc now?"

laughingly remarked the President to
Senator Capper, head of the Senate
farm bloc, as he brushed some of the
wheat straw from his dark coat and
white flannel trousers.
When the binder was driven up by

a farm hand who had been cutting
wheat during the morning the Presi-
dent was asked to drive it about the
100-acre field and consented to do so
at the urging of Mrs. Harding.
The President mounted the tractor,

a 30-horse-power machine, and after
instructions from the operator started
it on its way about the field while
moving-picture men backed ahead of
him, turning their cranks and record-
ing on film the scene of the country's
Chief Executive driving a tractor in a
Kansas wheat field. The binder out-
fit, it was explained, was designated
for one man to operate, and this is the
first season it has been out in Kans-
as."
As the President went down the

field he talked interestedly with the
farm-hand who had been operating
the machine, but never once forgot
to pull the rope to drop the bundles
of wheat when the carrier was full.
The first turn did not even prove an
obstacle, and the President turned the
wheel hard down to the left and ne-
gotiated the corner to the praise of
farmers and others who followed in
his wake. Four times the President
made the corners of the field, and by
the time he had driven the tractor
around to the starting point it was re-
marked that he did not seem a new
hand at the game.
As the President descended from

the tractor, perspiration pouring from
his face, his clothes covered with
dust, Governor Davis of Kansas made
the first comment:
"You're some farmer."
"You're all right," remarked Sena-

tor Capper.
"Now I get into the farm bloc, don't

I?" queried the President of the
Kansas Senator.

Frederick County Hard Hit.

The storm of last Saturday evening
was especially severe in Frederick
county, doing many thousands dam-
age.
Two churches at Creagerstown-

Lutheran and Reformed-were struck
by lightning, but neither greatly dam-
aged. Two houses in the town were
also struck.
Two cows were killed on the farm

of Emory L. Burner, on the Johns-
ville and Liberty pike. They were in
the barn, but the building did not
burn,
More than 800 telephones were put

out of commission, near Jefferson,
Braddock, Middletown and Brunswick.
Four trolley cars were burned out

by lightning. No one was hurt, and
damage was only to the motors.
At Jefferson a cow owned by Wal-

ter Brown was killed, while out in an
open field.
The barn of Elmer Baker, at Point

of Rocks, was struck by lightning and
destroyed.
A large hay shed on the barn of L.

L. Hankey, between Creagerstown
and Rocky Ridge, was destroyed, to-
gether with contents of farming im-
plements and hay.
The storm was at its worst about

Jefferson, Braddock, and near Woods-
boro, while at LeGore and New Mid-
way, it was cyclonic. Great damage
was done to telephone lines.

Lightning struck the bell tower of
the Lutheran church, Woodsboro, but
did no further damage.
Three horses were killed by light-

ning, near Liberty, owned by Harry
Stevens on Mrs. Ida Smith's farm.
Fire destroyed the frame dwelling

of Edward Crum, on the farm of Mrs.
Harry Jones. Nearly all of the con-
tents were burned.

Marriage Licenses.

William A. Rowley and Blanche M.
Groves, Baltimore.
Ezra Wenger and Lavinia C. Roop,

Westminster.
Harry S. Boltz and Elsie M. Cle-

ments, Outwood, Pa.
John Anthony Spudis and Myrtle

Umbaugh, Sykesville.
John H. Getzendanner and Amanda

E, Hollinger, Warfieldsburg.
Earl W. Schultz and Esther C.

Walsh, Hampstead.
Felix F. Barnes and Mary E.

Lowe, Hanover.
William A. Scheihing and Flavis

M. Raysinger, Baltimore.
Walter S. Ward and Edna A. White

Westminster.

MORE WHEAT IN EUROPE.

Farmers Must Decide to Produce More
Profitable Crops.

Europe is gradually getting back to
normal in wheat production, and
promises soon to have a surplus,which
means that the market for U. S.
wheat is apt to be further depressed.
France is reported to have increas-

ed her wheat acreage 1,130,000 over
last year; Russia has increased 24,-
000,000 acres, and smaller counties
have increased 30 percent.
The U. S. is credited with having

decreased its acreage 2,337,000 acres
this year, which appears to show that
a much greater decrease will be neces-
sary, in order to keep the price any-
where near a profit.
On this subject, an editorial in Sen-

ator Capper's Topeka Capital, pub-
lished in the centre of a great wheat
belt, says-
"A larger home market for bread is

the only thing that will enable the
American farmer to maintain his
present production of wheat. The
European market is certain to decline
as Europe recovers production and
when Russia comes into the market
with a normal surplus."
The following is from another

Kansas paper, the Iola Register, edit-
ed by Chas. F. Scott, former member
of Congress, and one of the best post-
ed men in the west.
"The gradual recovery of the agri-

cultural productivity of Europe is in-
dicated by the steady decline in the
export of American farm products,
notably wheat and other cereals. The
lesson of which is that the American
farmers should get away from the
idea of raising crops for export, cut
down the wheat acreage especially,
and give their attention to products
for which there is a sure home mark-
et."
These should be taken for full val-

ue by Eastern farmers, as pointing
the way for future plans for farming.
The folly of continuing great wheat
acreage appears to be apparent, for
there is not likely to be any great fu-
ture foreign demand, except in case
of war, or great crop failures, and
South America with productive lands
and cheap labor, always has a big
surplus to dispose of.
The hope of the American farmer is

in his home markets, with the well
paid, constantly employed American
wage-earner as his customer. He can-
not hope in any circumstance and un-
der any condition to compete in Eu-
rope for European markets, with the
products raised by the Russian moujik
and the peasants of southeastern Eu-
rope. He cannot hope to compete in
the European markets with the pro-
ducts of South America raised on vast
tracts of cheap land and shipped to
Europe by European-owend vessels,
laid down at European ports for less
money than it costs the farmer of this
country to lay his products down at
his nearest railway station.

X 
Cities Lose Building Contracts.

Building activities in the large ci-
ties are confined chiefly to existing
contracts-to work on hand. But few
new contracts are being entered into,
or in prospect, on account of high
wage costs, of which $12.00 a day for
bricklayers, in New York, is a speci-
men. Labor seems to be defeating
itself by its demands, and the victims
are taking the only recourse left-not
building.

Agriculture in Maryland.

Notwithstanding its length, we
think the comments of Dr. Thomas B.
Symons, director of University of
Maryland Extension Service, on the
condition of Agriculture of Maryland,
published as an introduction to the
annual report of the work of the ser-
vice, deserves publication in full-and
not only publication, but reading. We
therefore give it on our editorial page
of this issue.

Rural Carriers Meeting.

A business meeting of the Carroll
Co. Rural Letter Carriers Association
will be held in Westminster, at 7:30
P. M., Saturday, July 7th. All car-
riers are urged to attend this import-
ant meeting.

JOHN H. MARTIN, Sec.

Taneytown Club Meeting.

The regular meeting of the Taney-
town Club will be held on Friday,
June 29, at 2:00 o'clock, at the usual
place. Even though many are going
away for the summer let us try to
keep a good attendance.
I think we will have a treat at this

meeting, as our County Nurse, Miss
Gibson, will give a talk on "First
Aid." RACHEL EVERETT,

Home Demonstration Agent.

The Freemasonry Freemasonry of England pro-
poses to erect a splendid memorial to
English Masons who made the su-
preme sacrifice during the Great War,
When completed it will cost in excess
of $5,000,000, of which $2,000,000 has
already been contributed by London
Masons.

Des Moines, Iowa, is one of the live
cities of the United States, as is evi-
denced by the magnitude of publica-
tion business centered there. While
fifty-second from the top in popula-
tion, it stands only fifth from the top
in the amount of second-class postal
receipts-this fact proving more em-
phatically perhaps than anything
cculd do its vast importance in the
publishing world. Over eleven mil-
lion publications per month are mail-
ed there.
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application, after the character of the bus-
iness has been definitely stated, together
with information as to space, position,and
length of contract. The publisher reserv-
es the privilege of declining all offers for

AU advertisements for End., 3rd., 6th.,
sad 7th. pages must be in our Office by
Tuesday morning each week; otherwise,
Insertion cannot be guaranteed until the
following week.

Entered at Taneytown Post-office as Second
Class Matter.
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AU articles on this page are either orig-
inal, or properly credited. This has al-
ways been a fixed rule with this Office, and
we suggest the adoption of it by our ex-
changes.

Editorial Advice.

Editors of newspapers do not know
everything, and do not pretend that
they do. Sometimes, when a sub-
scriber reads something in a paper
that does not "gee" with his reason-
ing, he is apt to ask—"What does the
editor know about such things?" then
disregard what was said. But, the
editor does a great deal of reading,
and posts himself from what other
people say who "do know." That is
what an editor is for; to assemble to-
gether, for the benefit of readers, a
vast amount of information on many
topics.

There is, of course, such a thing as
biased editorial opinions, as well as
those produced very much on the or-
der of the arguments of a paid attor-
ney; and this is especially true in con-
nection with political topics, or those
on such matters as Prohibition en-
forcement; but taken as a whole, edi-
tors when uninfluenced by ulterior
motives, are apt to give advice and
information worthy of serious consid-
eration, if not adoption.
In a way, an editor is an expert, for

same reasons that professional men
are experts; he reads-up on the mat-
ters he discusses, and weaves to-
gether in his own words the opinions
of others, and in the course of his
work and training familiarizes him-
self with the true and false in logic
and fact. In other words, he quali-
fies himself as a pretty fair judge,
even in matters with which he is not
practically familiar, through a wide
course of reading and study.
The editor must have opinions

worth while, or the presumed influ-
ence of the press that we hear of and
generally admit, would be a non-
existent power. If it is only a thing
to be credited when we agree with it,
it is nothing of any real value what-
ever. On the other hand, if the edi-
tor is at all a professional, his de-
ductions must be taken as are those
of professionals in other lines of
work.

 31E 

Foolish Names for Children.

The following, from the Catholic
Review, while purely in the interest
of more distinctly Catholic names, is

worthy of consideration by non-

Catholics as well, for the whole coun-

try is becoming peopled with foolish-

named persons, because of the im-
maturity of romantic young parents,

who perhaps unfortunately have full

control over the naming of their off-

spring.
"A priest of the Cleveland Diocese

in a letter to the Ecclesiastical Re-
view calls attention to the growing
custom among Catholic parents of
giving their children baptismal names
tbat are "merely secular, or fanciful,
or romantic, instead of names redo-
lent of Catholic times and faith."
He complains rightly of the fact

that some parents name their children
after false philosophers or even
avowed enemies of the Church. The
parents want their children to be dis-
tinguished from birth; to be set apart
from 'the common herd.' Often such
parents' hopes are blasted when their
young hopefuls begin to go to school.
The children may have high-sounding
names, but that lets them out. Per-
haps Waldo Emerson Johnson or
Daniel Webster Smith may turn out
to be the dunces of their class. We
knew of a boy who was named after
one of the great naval heroes of the
country. He turned out to be a frail.
timid youngster, who ran from every
fight that was ever started. We know
also of a devout pastor in this Arch-
diocese who was quite puzzled by the
names borne by the children of one
family in his parish. An investiga-
tion disclosed that the names were
taken from the father's favorite nov-
els. The children had the names of
saints also, but the saints' names
were not used. They were adopted
at baptism simply for appearance
sake."

Another newspaper article along a
different line, but aimed at the same
custom, is from the Atlanta Consti-
tution, written by a reporter who was
seeking light on "why men want to
be President. He says;
"It is because mother names the

babies after 'em. I had that thrill
the other day. First thing one
morning the girls in the front of-
fice said there was a pair of lusty
twin boys down at Mason McCann's
and they had named them Lysander
and Bystander. I got up and floated
cut to the back shop, where one of
McCann's boys works, just in time to
hear Martha ask him if they had
really named them Martha and Mary.
Frank Arend was told later that they
had been named Frank and Hank, and
Roscoe Hutchinson learned with pride
they were called Roscoe and Bosco.
All day long that pair of twins
changed their sex to fit the moment's
visitor. They were Jessie and Bessie
and Helen and Ellen. Then Senator
Brunk and Harry Haymaker were
proud to learn they have been named
Larry and Harry, and Brown smiled
to hear they were called Emmett and
Limit. Potter grew an inch when
he learned they were to be christen-
ed Jimmie and Gimmie, and saw a
great future for them. Sloane and
Loane seemed very appropriate to
Sloane O'Kelly, but none of them
would believe that they had really
been named Lester and Chester."

Agriculture in Maryland.

Agriculture in Maryland has made
decided progress during the past few
years despite the financial difficulties
of the farmer, says Dr. Thomas B.
Symons, director of the University of

Maryland Extension Service in his

eighth annual report which has just

been published and which covers the
work of that organization for the

year 1922. He says;
"From an economic standpoint the

year 1922 was one of disappointment
to the farmers of Maryland," says
Dr. Symons in reviewing the agricul-
tural situation. "Prices for farm pro-
ducts, which began their rapid down-
ward plunge during 1920, remained
low and apparently reacted but little
in sympathy with the prosperity that
was so noticeable in virtually all oth-
er lines of industry.
"The disappointment on the part of

the farmers was all the greater be-
cause they approached the season of
1922 with enthusiasm and with some
degree of hope that the deflation per-
iod had passed. High prices were
certainly not anticipated, and yet the
expectation was prevalent that the re-
turns from agriculture would be ade-
quate to cover the cost of production
and to provide a reasonable remuner-
ation for the labor expended. This
proved not to be the case. The dis-
parity between prices of farm pro-
ducts continued wide. The problem
of meeting expenses and maintaining
customary standards of living re-
mained a serious one throughout the
year with many farm owners and
more particularly with many tenant
farmers.
"The situation of the past season

served mert)y to aggravate conditions
that unfortunately have been press-
ing heavily on the farmers for the
past three years. Much of the pro-
gress that might have taken place in
the agriculture of the State during
that period has been rudely checked.
In fact it is to some extent true that
agriculture has dragged out an exist-
ence during the past three years at
the expense of its living standards
and its productive plant,such as build-
ings, fences and soil fertility.
"Notwithstanding conditions that

have seemed almost like unjust dis-
crimination against agriculture, farm-
ers have not gone on strike but have
continued to produce large crops. It
is a high tribute to their perseverance
to their sensible recognition of econ-
omic factors, and to their ability to
adjust themselves and their business
to trying conditions that they have
"kept faith" with the Nation during a
period when their purchasing power
has been less than two-thirds of what
it was in 1913.
"Not only have the farmers of Ma-

ryland continued to produce in un-
diminished quantity but they have
continued to make a steady progress
along the lines of more efficient agri-
culture. It is needless to say that
this progress would have been far
more rapid if prosperity rather than
depression had prevailed since 1920.
Nevertheless, the serious difficulties
under which agriculture everywhere
has labored, but add to the signifi-
cance of the real achievements which
Maryland farmers have accomplished.
"There is no more striking illustra-

tion of the character of the progress
which agriculture in the State has
been making than the record of the
acre yields of corn for the past thir-
ty-two years. Ever since 1890, when
the average yields of corn per acre in
Maryland were between 20 and 25
bushels. Maryland farmers have
steadily and consistently been im-
proving the quality of their seed and
their cultural methods until in 1922
the average yield mounted to the top
figure of 40 bushels per acre. This is
12 bushels higher than the average of
the United States for the same year
and nearly 18 bushels above the aver-
age production of the State 32 years
ago. It shows that merely by apply-
ing better cultural methods, the farm-
ers of Maryland have been enabled to
raise on 635,000 acres, which was the
acreage planted in 1922, 11,430,000
more bushels of corn than would have
been possible in 1890. It shows that
at 68e a bushel, the farm price for
corn during December, the leading
agricultural crop of the State has
been increased in value by more than
$7,500,000.
"Side by side with this progress

which the average farmer of Mary-
land has made in the production of
corn, is the no less noteworthy
achievement which has been accom-
plished in the State in the production
of pure-bred seed corn. The produc-
tion of high yielding strains of pure-
bred seed corn has become an im-
portant business, particularly in Har-
ford and Cecil counties. Recognition
of the skill and ability which Mary-
land growers have developed in this
industry during recent years came in
unmistakable terms during 1922,when
entries from this State in the Inter-

national Grain and Hay Show at Chi-
cago, competeing against the finest
exhibits of the experienced corn
breeders of the Corn Belt States, won
a total of twenty-two prizes, one of
which was the first prize for the best
ten ears of yellow corn exhibited in
Region 4. The fact that Maryland,
next to Indiana won more prizes than
any other State in the show must be
recognized as a remarkable achieve-
ment, especially when it is recalled
that Maryland is a State of compar-
atively small area and belongs to the
Atlantic coast territory, not generally
regarded as a leading corn producing
region.
"Another indication of the gradual

progress which has taken place in the
agriculture of Maryland, is apparent
in the constantly increasing acreage
being devoted to the legume crops.
Unfortunately figures are not avail-
able to show just how great this in-
crease has been in the past year. It is
estimated that the area planted to
soybeans alone during 1922 totaled
40,000 acres. While this is only an
estimate, it is a well known fact that
legume crops, and particularly soy-
beans, have come to occupy an in-
creasingly prominent place in the
agriculture of the State. In Southern
Maryland, Japan clover has been in-
troduced and is meeting a long-felt
want. In other parts of the State, al-
falfa is now regarded as a crop of
prime importance and is being grown
more extensively. Clovers and cow-
peas have also been planted in in-
creasing quantities. An indication of
the growing favor of legume crops in
the State during recent years can be
obtained from a glance at the Census
figures which show that for clover the
acreage during ten years between
1909 and 1919 increased from 26,545
acres to 41,250 acres, or 55.4 percent;
that for alfalfa the acreage increased
from 3,188 acres to 11,909 acres, or
273.6 percent, and that for small
grains and legumes cut for hay the
acreage increased from 8,846 acres to
21,471 acres, or 142.7 percent. This
increase in legume crops has continu-
ed since the Census figures were tak-
en What is has meant to the in-
creased wealth of agriculture it is im-
possible to estimate. Undoubtedly it
has been an important factor in the
expansion and improvement of the
dairy industry and has had a value,
impossible to measure, in maintaining
and improving soil fertility.
"Another very marked advance in

the agriculture of the State is apparent
in the position which Maryland now
occupies in the production of vegeta-
bles. Notwithstanding the compara-
tively small area of the State, Mary-
land is now third in the acreage de-
voted to vegetables, exclusive of white
and sweet potatoes, raised for sale.
Nearly 120,000 acres of land in Mary-
land are now annually devoted to the
commercial production of vegetables,
other than white and sweet potatoes,
indicating that farmers are taking ad-
vantage of the State's proximity to
large nearby markets and engaging
more generally in the production of
the higher valued agricultural pro-
ducts.
"Closely linked to the expansion of

this phase of agriculture, has been
the growth of the canning industry
and the consequent increase in the
acreage devoted to canning crops.
While the canning industry in the
State has been subjected to severe fi-
nancial strain during the past few
years and economic conditions have
seriously curtailed the production of
canning crops, the State has, never-
theless, maintained its rank as one of
the leading States in this important
industry. Moreover, the past year,
although not a notably profitable one,
has witnessed a distinct advance in
the production of canning crops, be-
cause of the increased attention di-
rected to reducing production costs.
Attention has particularly been cen-
tered on the tomato crop, the largest
and most important of the canning
crops, through successful demonstra-
tions which have illustrated how large
acre yields can bring down the cost of
production to meet prevailing econo-
mic conditions. Every effort is being
made to extend the scope of this work
throughout the State and on its re-
sults may rest the future prosperity
of the canning industry in Maryland.
"Most important to the welfare of

the State during the recent period of
depression has been the sound founda-
tion on which the dairy industry has
been placed. The progress in this in-
dustry has been safe and conservative
and it is a noteworthy fact in com-
munities where a general system of
farming has been practiced that dairy-
ing has served as the principal buffer
against the effects of hard times. Not
a little of the success which has come
to this industry has been due to the
substantial organizations, which have
been erected around it. During the
past year the advancement in the in-
dustry has continued. Organizations
have been strengthened, better pro-
ducing animals have been introduced
and the whole industry has gone for-
ward, despite the fact that it, too, has
felt the ill effects of lowered prices.
"Not all of the progress of agri-

culture during the past year has been
of a material character. One of the
most important forward steps in the
State has been the formation of farm
bureaus in many of the counties.
While it is true that farm organiza-
tions previously existed in many
counties and had performed worth
while services, it is also true the farm
bureau movement has spread the in-
fluence of organization to greater
numbers, has increased the confidence
in the benefits of organization and I
has stimulated numerous co-operative 1
activities. This has been accom-
plished in harmony with other im-
portant existing farm organizations
in the State and the year 1922 must '
be regarded as a most auspicious one
from the organization standpoint.
"Progress of a slightly different

character, but of no less significauce
is noted in the record of the agricul-
tural club boys who won the dairy
cattle judging contest at the National
Dairy Show last October. This vic-
tory, which belongs to the Younger
generation, following on the heels of
the record made the previous year by
another team which was awarded the

your inspection a very beautiful
assortment of Charmeuse, Crepe-
de-chine, Messaline, Taffeta and
Canton Crepe, White, Paisley
and colored Voiles and Organdies,
Linenes, Ratine, Tissue Ging-
hams, etc., in all the leading col-
ors and widths.
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Hesson's Department Store
A Fine Display of

Merchandise for Spring
and Summer Use.

Every effort has been used at our command to make our line of
Merchandise for the Spring and Summer Seasons, the most com-
plete, attractive and reliable possible. Whether we have been suc-
cessful in this end remains for our trade to judge. We therefore,
invite you to visit our store and pass your judgment. However,
we feel confident that you will be able to please yourself in what-
ever Department your needs may be centered.

Dress Goods. Ready-made Gingham
In this department we have for Dresses,

We are showing a very nice as-
sortment of good quality Ging-
ham Dresses for Women and
Girls from 6 years of age up.
They are of fine workmanship full
cut, latest styles and very low in
cost.

McCall Patterns. Men's Dress Shirts.
When selecting that new dress

the question naturally arises,
"How am I to make it?" Mc-
Call Patterns and style books will
help you answer these questions.
Thousands of women are now
using McCall Patterns because
they are so simple to use that
most any child can understand
them. New supplies are receiv-
ed every month at our store, and
all out of date patterns with-
drawn from stock.

Shoes.
In our Shoe Department will

be found at all times a complete
line of the latest styles and
leathers of Oxfords or Shoes for
Men, Women or Children.
We are distributors for the

Selz Six and Royal Blue Shoes,
for Men and Women. They are
the most economical Shoes to buy
The first cost of these is very
much lower than others. And
they give longer wear. Men and
Women everywhere are demand-
ing these because they are the
most economial. They fit well,
look well and wear longer.

Also carry a complete line of
work Shoes, for Men and Women,
of the best quality and for less
money.

Hosiery for Spring.
In our Hosiery Department

you will find a complete line of
Silk and Lisle Hose for Men and
Women, in all the better colors,
from the cheap to the very best
full fashioned.

Also have a very nice line of
one-half and three-quarter hose
length for children.

Taylor made
Clothing
for Men.

are not only pure and genuine
wool, but they are rich in beauty
and assortment.

They comprise the latest of-
ferings in Serges, Woolens,

Worsteds and Tweeds.

Give us a call, look over our

line and get our special prices.
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We believe we have at this
time the most complete line of
Dress Shirts for Men, that we
have ever shown. They are of
Percale, Madras, Silk Stripe Ma-
dras and Crepe. These Shirts
are made by a reliable firm that
gives quality and workmanship
first thought.

Hats and Caps.
Our new line of Hats and Caps

for the Spring and Summer sea-
son, is here complete. A very
pretty assortment of leading
shades of Caps to select from.
Come in and try one of our ad-
justable size Caps. Also have a
very nice lot of Straw Hats for
your convenience. The Straw
Hat season is right here so do not
put off any longer getting yours.

Clothing.
Have you gotten that New Suit

for Spring and Summer yet? We
would call your attention to our
made to measure Suit department
and invite you to look over our
line of samples. Our business in
this department has been grow-
ing steadily, and we are anxious
for you to enlist among our line
of satisfied customers.

Ready-made Suits for Boys.
In this department we are

showing a very complete assort-
ment of Dick-Manly Suits for
Boys' from 7 to 18 years of age.
Dick-Manly Suits are well made,
fit well and look well, and the
prices are within reach of all.

S

EDW. 0. WEANT, President.

E. H. SHARETTS, Vice-Pres.

GEO. H. BIRNIE, Cashier.

G. W. WILT, Asst. Cashier.

THE BIRNIE TRUST CO.
TANEYTOWN, MD.

This bank stands guard
ceaselessly providing your

funds with protection

coveted trip to Europe in a livestock
judging contest at Atlanta and later
defeated an English team in a similar
contest at Cambridge, England, indi-
cates that the progress in agriculture
is not corned to the realms of the
adult. It is, however, an indication
that knowledge is reaching out to
agriculture in all its branches and
that the great industry is forging
steadily ahead despite its numerous
difficulties.
"It is probably true that the Uni-

versity of Maryland, both through
the Experiment Station and the Ex-
tension Service, has been able to ren-
der a greater service and a more ap-
preciated service during the past few
years than ever before in its history.
The times were such as to call for
modifications of farming methods,
changes in rotations of crops, and the
employment of every factor looking
to economical production and the hus-
banding of resources. Conditions
called for expert knowledge, expert
advice and proven, careful practice;
and it is gratifying to know that
farmers and homemakers have made
increasing demands upon the service,
thereby showing their confidence in
the institution and appreciation of its
efforts."

Law Enforcement.

A subscriber asks us to answer
three questions. First, concerning
the condition of law enforcement in
this country. It becomes more and
more a question whether laws are en-
forced or only their violation penaliz-
ed. Putting law into force depends
on the inner conviction and good will
of the citizen more than on anything
else. Officers cannot enforce the law.
They may detect violations of it and
arrest violators. It may be said that
where people believe in the law and
want the law they put it into force
themselves, that is, they observe it in
their conduct.
The second question concerns the

failure of law enforcement. That
there is failure no one can deny. But
the failure is among those who do not
believe in the law which they violate.
Take prohibition, for example. Peo-
ple who believe in it observe it, many
others do not. It is this law which
cur subscriber probably has in mind.
He is probably thinking of the failure
to force the prohibition law upon the
observance of those who object to it.
The failure to do this rests on two
points, first the authorities whose
duty includes enforcement, do not
themselves believe in the law; second,
the number of officers required to
make absolute enforcement would be
so large that it would probably be
equivalent to one-half of the country
taking up police duty against the
other half—a situation that is not
likely to ensue.
On the general question of enforce-

ment, there is this to say; If the con-
science or interest of the country
were aroused, and if the dangers of
law violation were apparent to the in-
telligence of the nation, there would
be no difficulty at all about law en-
forcement. We had military con-
scription and forced bond sales when
whole communities of people objected
to it, but nevertheless the men were
conscripted and the bonds were sold.
The nation can do what it wants to do
when its mind is made up.
The third question concerns sugges-

tions for a remedy. There are as
many suggestions as there are inter-
ested persons. The condition is not
amenable to suggestion. It is work-
ing itself out and will thrust to the
surface its own remedy.—Dearborn
Independent.

Couldn't Understand.
Recently a member of the police de-

partment was sued for divorce. A
man was sent to police headquarters
to serve the papers on him. The man,
unfortunately, was directed to the ser-
geant's desk and mistaking the ser-
geant for the defendant in the suit,
started to read the papers without
mentioning the defendant's name.
The desk sergeant listened patient-

ly, Gradually his mouth drooped, a
sorrowful expression came into his
eyes and he appeared dejected.
"I can't understand that," he said.

"I was only married last December.
I just rented a new house and bought
some new furniture and two tons of
coal. Gosh, she appeared cheerful
and happy when I left this morning.
I don't see what's the matter."
A few minutes later the mistake

was noticed and the desk sergeant
showed his relief, and the man with
the papers went in search of the de-
fendant.—Indianapolis News.

Shark That Swam in Kansas Sea.
Agassizodus variabills, a shark from

Kansas, will soon have his once wicked
teeth brought to foodless rest in the
National museum. Dr. George P. Mer-
rill, curator of geology, has received
as a gift from Dr. Frank Springer the
paleontological collections of the late
Orestes St. John which contained the
fossil remains of this unique fish,
which chased its prey through a Kan-
sas sea many million years ago.
The cartilaginous body of the shark

disintegrated, but a complete set of
teeth, such as has never been found
elsewhere, remained in the coal meas-
ures of Kansas to tell his story. Doc-
tor St. John gave the name Agasslzo-
dus to his find in honor of the famous
Harvard naturalist, Louis Agassiz,
who was his teacher.

Capital Stock;

Surplus

Undivided Profits

$40,000.00

$40,000.00

$25,000.00

ON THE HONOR ROLL
OF BANKS

Deposits are growing. Somebody
has been doing some saving. Some-
body has been investing part of
their earnings for the future.

A Man never

Retires on the

Money he Spends.

Are you going to give Your Sav-
ings Account another boost this
month?
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MEN YOU MAY MARRY

By E. R. PEYSER

Has a Man Like This Proposed
to You?

Symptoms: Awfully noisy,

big, clumsy, always falls over

things and makes things fall

over. Loves to sing though he

has no voice. Always telling

stupid and long yarns and roars

with laughter whether you do or

not. Awfully happy, does every-

thing the wrong way, never is

in a hurry, his favorite pastime

is a cornet. . . .
IN FACT

It's another way for him to

blow off.
Prescription for Bride-to-be:

Z 
Buy domes of silence for
the home.

Absorb This:
Fightin' the Little Cornet

Where You Are Will Not Corner

the Silences!
(g by McClure Newspaper Syndicate.)
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Why don't you live a cheerful life

And make the best of things?
For discontent means constant strife
And other ills it brings.

It is hard tramping on life's pike,
I know that this is true;

But if you can't do what you like,
Try liking what you do.

THINGS FOR THE FAMILY TABLE

WHEN preparing soup and a
dumpling is desired, try these:

One-half hour before the soup is to

be served drop into it a large potato

and cook until done. Put it into a

bowl with a tablespoonful of butter

and mash line, add a slice of grated

toast, an egg, a dash of salt and nut-

meg and work well with a fork. Drop

this paste in small pieces into the soup,

boil up and serve at once.

Alleghany Muffins.

Take one and one-half cupfuls of

sifted flour, one cupful of milk, one

tablespoonful each of butter and lard,

two teaspoonfuls of baking powder,

one-half teasponful of salt and one

egg. Mix all the dry ingredients and

sift through the sieve. Melt the but-

ter and lard in a cup. Beat the egg

very light and add the milk to it.

Pour this mixture into the dry ingre-

dients, add the melted fat and beat vig-

orously for a minute. Pour into but-

tered muffin pans and bake 15 min-

tites.

Rice Flour Pound Cake.

Cream one-quarter of a cupful of

butter with one cupful of powdered

sugar, add the beaten yolks of two

eggs, one teaspoonful of vanilla, the

grated rind of a lemon and one-half

cupful of cold water. Mix thoroughly

and add one and one-half cupfuls of

rice flour that has been sifted twice

with one and one-half teaspoonfuls of

baking powder. Fold in the stiffly

beaten whites of the eggs and bake.

Spring Salad.

Shred a head of lettuce and line a

salad bowl which has been rubbed

with a cut clove of garlic. Cut two

large tomatoes into slices and arrange

in a ring around the lettuce. Sprinkle

each slice of tomato with a tablespoon-

ful of chopped water cress and cover

the whole with a highly seasoned may-

onnaise which has been enriched with

a half cupful or more of whipped

cream. Serve very cold.

(0, 1923, Western Newspaper Union.)

Mere Child's Play.

"As to my prospects, sir," said the

would-he son-in-law bombastically, "I

Intend leaping up the lofty ladder of

my ambition a dozen steps at a time."

"Then It will be mere child's play

for you to clear my 30 front steps

downward at one jump?" said his de-

sirable, but undesiring, father-in-law,

polishing the toe of his right boot on

the hearthrug.

'Has Anyone Laughed
At You
Because —

EL R.
PEvsEit

You Say You Don't Mind Be-

ing Poor?
Of course "poor" is a relative

term. Some would think $10,-

000 annually a miserly income.

Some would think it munificent.

You may mean you don't mind

not owning a yacht, three coun-

try houses, a "movie" picture

theater or two or you may mean

you like being threadbare. Once

there was a poor lady who

thought it vulgar to sit in the

orchestra, but as soon as she in-

herited money the gallery and

balconies in the best ventilated

theaters became foul with bad

air. If you are poor and are

not rebellious you deserve a

certain kind of credit. But it's

as vulgar to vomit poverty as

to crow about wealth. You

make folks just as uncomfort-

able and bored.
SO

Your Get-away here Is:
You are happy In "whatso-

ever" place in life you find

yourself.
(© by McClure Newspaper Syndicate.)

11 Uncommone
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SWELLED HEADS

y ou will find victims of swelled
heads on every bench in the park,

In every bread line, in every poorhouse,
In every jail.

It is an easily communicable and a

deadly disease. The only cure for it

is a severe jolt, and sometimes it is

the remedy that success is made of.

Remember that a little success is

often easily come by. Sometimes it

is due almost wholly to luck. Some-

times it follows advancement through
favoritism, which is probably the worst

thing that can happen to anybody.

In any event, no success can sur-

vive a swelled head.

If in the early years of your career

you find yourself well ahead of the fel-

lows who started with you, look out.

You have still a long way to travel.
If you are satisfied with yourself,

be sure you will never get any better.

And if you don't get any better you

will soon begin to go back.

Authority cannot safely be entrusted

to any man till he shows that his

head will not be affected by it.
Once let him begin to make bad use

of it, to domineer, and to bully, and

he might as well bid any further prog-

ress good-by.

Remember always that big men

never get the swelled head, or if they

do get a slight attack they soon re-

cover.

If you have begun to think that you

are "doing pretty well thank you," and

to pity the poor devils who are not as

bright as you are, stop and take stock.

Don't think about the men you have

passed, but about the men who have

passed you. Consider the important

men of your acquaintance, and of his-

tory.

Read their biographies, and note

how they continually struggled to

make themselves capable of bigger

and better work. There is no time to

get a swelled head when a man Is

really going up. It is the chap who

stops to admire himself who falls vic-

tim to conceit.

If you are as great a man as Lin-

coln, as Shakespeare, as Napoleon,

puff and strut all you please. But the

chances are you are not. And until

you are perfectly sure that you are,

keep on trying. The study of big men

will give you less time to admire your-

self, and thereby save you from a

malady that is absolutely fatal to any

important success.
(Copyright by John Blake.)

Reporting
Service
Troubles

Telephone service embraces a variety

of operations: the installation of tele-

phones and changes in location; oper-

ating; maintenance of the central office

equipment, outside plant and other ap-

paratus; accurate and up-to-date direc-

tory listings; billing; collecting and

numerous other things needed to give

complete and satisfactory service.

We realize that at times difficulties

will arise. Usually these are quickly

remedied but there is always a possi-

bility that some defect may develop

which, in spite of our efforts, is not de-

tected immediately.

It will help if you will make reports

to us in the following way:

CALL THE REPAIR CLERK
if your telephone is out of or-

der. It will be repaired with-

out delay.

CALL THE CHIEF OPERA-
TOR if your calls are not com-
pleted satisfactorily. You will

receive prompt and courteous
attention.

CALL THE BUSINESS OF-
FICE on matters concerning
applications for telephones,
bills, adjustment of accounts,
directory listings, advertising

and the like.

The Chesapeake and Potomac
Telephone Company

(Consult the information pages in the front
of the telephone directory)

United States-17 res
are Good -fires

-and "USCO
9

confirms it!

YOUR enthusiasm over "US C 0" perform-
ance won't surprise the motorist who Lows

the fabric tire field.

Every 30 x 3 tire user recognizes "USCC" as
a value to be respected and to be invcstil;atcd.

The users of "USCO," I now it as a money's
worth that came before tho rul-?iic as
and that has maintained its leadership.

"USCO" is made by the same people who
make Royal Cords.

Where to buy U.S.71 res
TANEYTOWN GARAGE CO., Taneytown

C. E. DERN, Taneytown.
W. H. DERN, Frizellburg.
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iHOW
PHOTOGRAPHERS IN WILDS
GET THEIR "SUBJECTS."
—The clever achievements of
African photography In "Hunt-
ing Big Game in Africa" are
appreciated by everybody. But
only those versed in the subject
are aware of the extraordinary
difficulties that were success-
fully overcome. Sidney Snow,
the cinematographer, states:
"The fact that most animals

4 are nocturnal in their habits
makes it a tough job to get the
daytime pictures. Lions, leop-
ards and other junglers of prey
must be tracked to their midday
resting places, routed out by the
native safari's cries and brush
beating; then the cameraman
must take his chance of keeping
up with the pursuit and of film-
ing the animal often almost in-
distinguishable in the tawny
grass. Our picture of the live
lioness and her cubs shows It
can be done, but it's tough, dan-
gerous work.
"We also located and rounded

up with the filvver the plains
creatures that graze in large
herds for protection like the
giraffes, the blaze bucks and the
gazelles. •I carried a camera
equipped with a variety of
lenses and mounted with a re-
volving turret. This I took with
me in the car, and chased the
herds hour after hour. Event-
ually they would tire and let
us get near. But the giraffes,
with their long periscope necks
enabling them to sight us over
the tops of trees, eluded the
camera for three months!
Eventually, as no shot was fired,
they lost their wariness—and
their tired legs refused to carry
them further.
"With the animals that appear

only infrequently at evening to
drink at the water-holes, another
procedure was necessary. We
would lie hidden in a well-made
blind, motionless for hours and
days, suffering much from heat
and insects, whilst waiting a
chance to get some of those
realistic closeups. Often the
oncoming darkness would foil

our efforts. Sometimes we
would have to keep the animals
from approaching the water for
several nights running, in order

to make them so thirsty that

they would come in the early
morning when pictures could be

made.
"Another thing: successful

hunting requires keeping to the

leeward of the quarry. A shift-

ing wind gives the animal your

scent, and he is down upon you!
On several critical occasions I

escaped by quick side jump

whilst Dad plugged the charg-
ing brute. Both in the rhino

and the elephant hunts, the na-

tive boys had long since taken

to the tops of the trees. With-

out any egotism I think I may
say that only a person fully
conversant with wild nature is
fitted to go into the jungle after
pictures; we had a number of
professional cinema men with

4 us at the start, but they couldn't
I stand the gaff."

ADDS TO COUNTRY'S BEAUTY

How Extension Work of Horticultural
Specialist Has Had Good Results

in Many States.

Improvements in the appearance of

the grounds and surroundings of farms

In the southern states is receiving in-

creased attention as a result of exten-

sion work in those states by a horti-

cultural specialist of the United States

Department of Agriculture, according

to reports received by the department.

For example, as a result of such work

6,925 fences were repaired in 1921 and

4,436 in 1922; 3,484 unsightly buildings

were repaired or removed in 1921 and

3,523 in 1922. The number planting

trees and shrubs rose from 8,308 to

26,313; of those planting flowers and

vines from 42,396 two years ago to

48,437 in 1922; of lawns seeded, from

about 1,600 to 2,600. More than 45,000

planted shade trees and shrubs last

year.
In some of the states, particularly in

North Carolina and Mississippi, the

Improvements in farmsteads are very

marked. Girls' and women's clubs
have been active in stimulating inter-

est in making the home surroundings

more pleasing, and the beneficial effect

upon communities generally has been

very marked.

How "Utopia" Originated.

Utopia is the title of a book written

by the famous Englishman, Sir Thomas

More, who lived from 1480 to 1535. In

this book an account is given of an

imaginary Island named Utopia, the
name being made up of two Greek

words, one meaning not, and the other

place, the whole expressing the idea
conveyed by our word, nowhere. The
island is represented to have been dis-

covered by a companion of the famous
navigator, Amerigo Vespucci, anti as
enjoying the utmost perfection in laws,
politics, and social conditions, in con-

trast with the defects of those which

existed elsewhere. The name hfts

passed into the language of about all
civilized countries to signify a state of
ideal perfection. Utopia Is represented

as a republic, of which the funda-
mental principle is a community of

wealth. that Is. everything belonged to

the people as a whole, end all 'tiered
alike.

WHY
Nature Has Arranged for Sap

to Rise in Trees.

The very interesting results ob-
ta:ned by Sir J. C. Bose, at the Bose
institute, Calcutta, in the investiga-
tion of the phenomenon of tile ascent
of sap are summarized in Nature
Magazine. It is shown that the
ascent of sap Is a process of physio-
logical activity dependent on the pul-
sation of living cells. This process
is arrested by the action of poison.
either in entire plants or in cut shoots.
The active pulsating cells are not con-
fined to the root, but are continued
throughout the stern. It has been as-
certained that in the stein of dicotyle-
dons these cells constitute the cor-
tical layer which abuts upon the en-
dodermis.
The velocity of the ascent has been

determined by three independent
methods which give concordant re-
sults. The ascent takes place in
plants even in the complete absence
of transpiration. In "varnished"
plants this velocity has been found
sometimes to be as high as 70 meters
per hour.
The cellular pulsations have been

Investigated and their characteristics
determined from automatic records;
they consist of alternate contractions
and expansions. The direction of
propulsion is determined by the phase
difference of the adjacent cells. The
velocity increases with the wave
length of the propagated impulse.
This wave length is determined ex-
perimentally from definite points of
electric maxima and miniena. En-
hancement of velocity is associated
with corresponding increase in the
wave length. The enhanced rate of
ascent is also attended by the in-
crease of amplitude and frequency of
cellular pulsations.

Ascent of sap depends upon cellu-
lar pulsation in tall trees as well as
in herbaceous plants. There is, how-
ever, In the former the special adap-
tation of the woody tissue which
serves as a reservoir to meet the ex-
cessive demand for water in the sea-
son of active transpiration. When
this reservoir is more or less depleted,
the phenomenon of "negative pres-
sure" is manifest.

GASES ARE MOTIVE POWER

Why Rockets Rise When Light Is
Applied Is a Simple Matter

When Understood.

If you would see inside a rocket you
would find the lower part of the case
filled with powder, a chemical mixture
that will burn at an enormous rate,
and in doing so will produce a very
large quantity of gas. The great heat
generated by this burning mixture ex-
pands the gas and still further in-
creases its volume, till it is bursting
to get out of the rocket.
At the bottom end of the rocket is

a hole through which the gas rushes
Into the air. Now the air at the
mouth of the rocket strongly resents
being kicked out of the way by this
rustling stream of gas; it takes a
moment to "get a move on," so to
speak. But the gas in the case hasn't
got a moment to spare: it simply must

get so it kicks—hard.
ou had on a pair of roller skates,

an eld an open umbrella in front of

you, you could push it away from you

slowly without feeling any resistance;

but if you thrust hard at the umbrella
the air would resist the sudden move-
ment so strongly that you would be

rolled backward on your skates. Sci-

ence shows that is just what happens

to the rocket; the stream of gas

spreads out at the mouth of the case

and thrusts hard at the air below it

and at the rocket above. As the air

won't move quickly enough, the rocket

must get out of the way. And it does
—quickly.

Why Women Fail as Spies.
"Women do not make good spies,"

said Sir Basil Thompson, former head
of the British secret service, speaking
at the Brooklyn Academy of Music.
"The real reason is that the woman

spy gets compunction at just the
wrong moment. She has obtained in-
formation from some one who should
not have given it to her, and then

when she should pass it along she
feels it would be unfair to her in-

formant and withholds it."
The speaker said that there is the

greatest difference between the patri-

otic spy and the hireling spy. None

of the former type was executed by

the British during the war, he said, but
11 of the latter, all men, forfeited their
lives.—New York Herald.

Why Do We Keep Pets?
Many pets are of direct use to us.

A dog, for instance, protects our house,

a cat catches mice, and so on.
There are, however, two far deeper

motives.
A pet satisfies our instinct of owner-

ship and mastery—one of the most pro-

found desires at the back of our

minds is to be absolute lord and mas-

ter, arbiter of life and death. We

gratify this wish most thoroughly by
possessing a pet animal.

Why We Stop Growing.

We stop growing because certain

body cells lose their power to increase

in size and to produce other cells. It

is one of the marvels of physiology

that this is so and a wise provision of
nature.

Why Snow Is White.

Snow is white because it is formed
of an infinite number of very &mute

crystals and prisms, which refient all

the component rays of which white

light consists.
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CORRESPONDENCE
Latest items of Local News Furnished
By Our Regular Staff of Writers
All communications for this department

must be signed by the author; nor for pub-
lication, but as an evidence that the items
contributer are legitimate and correct.
Items based ove mere rumor, or such as are
Likely to give offense, are not wanted.
We desire correspondence to reach our

office on Thursday, if at all possible. It
will be necessary, therefore, for most let-
ters to be mailed on Wednesday, or by
Fast Mail, west, on W. M. It. R., Thurs-
day morning. Letters mailed on Thurs-
day evening may not reach us in time.

KEYMAR.

Miss Dorothy Haugh spent Satur-
day and Sunday with her uncle and
aunt, Maurice J. Wilhide, of near De-
tour.
R. W. Galt and wife, entertained, at

their home, last week, Wm. Potter
and wife, of Washington, D. C.; Rich-
ard Dorsey and daughter, of Balti-
more; John McAllister and wife, son
and daughter, of Media, Pa. Mr, Mc-
Allister was one of the civil engineers
when the railroad was built from
Keymar to Union Bridge, 11 years
ago.

Misses Lola Forrest and Edna
Wagner, spent Friday last, with the
former's uncle, C. E. Dern and wife,
of Taneytown.
Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Mehring enter-

tained, last Saturday, Misses Mary
Mehring, of near Rocky Ridge; Edna
Wagner, of Middletown, Ohio; Lola
Forrest, of this place, and Emma
and Madeline Dern, New Midway.
Miss Mary E. Sappington, of Hag-

erstown, is spending some time with
her grandmother, Mrs. Fannie Sap-
pington.

Charles Gardner and family, of
Blue Ridge Summit, motored to this
place, Sunday evening, and called at
the home of W. F. Cover.
Last Sunday, J. N. Forrest and

wife, and E. Scott Koons and wife,
Misses Lola Forrest, Edna Wagner,
C. E. Valentine, Edward Wachter,
Augustus Bloom and Ben Blessing,
motored to Chambersburg and Har-
risburg, and had the pleasure of go-
ing throught the Capitol, which was
enjoyed by all.
Rev. Clifford Richmond and wife, of

Union Bridge, were entertained at
the home of W. M. Mehring, Sunday
last.
Tuesday night about 11 o'clock, the

house on the farm of Wm. Mehring,
tenanted by John Harman, was de-
stroyed by fire. Mr. Harman's lit-
tle child became unrestless and Mrs.
Harman got up to see after it. She
told her husband she smelt smoke
and Mr. Harman got up and went
dcwn stairs and found the whole one
side of the house ablaze. The rest of
the family barely made their escape.
Mr. Harman's lost all their furniture
and clothing, and have no insurance.
It is hoped that Mr. Harman and
family will be helped with furniture,
money, clothing, or anything in the
eating line will be appreciated by
them. Mr. Mehring has a small in-
surance on the house. How the house
caught on fire is unknown, but it
originated in the kitchen.
W. M. Mehring on York St., is giv-

ing his house a coat of paint which
adds greatly to the property.

UNIONTOWN.

The family of Rev. J. H. Hoch, are
visiting relatives in Lancaster Co.,
Pa.
On Sunday, a very interesting ser-

vice was held at the Bethel, after a
short sermon by the pastor. Essays
were read by four ladies, Mrs. Harry
Fowler, Mrs. Feilder Gilbert, Mrs.
Will Caylor and Miss Anna Heltibri-
dle, who have finished the teachers
training course and they were pre-
sented with their diplomas, by Elder
Walter Englar, Pres. of the County
S. S. Union. Jesse P. Garner, has
had charge of the instruction of the
class.

Maurice Newman, is visiting his
sister in Virginia.

Children's service at the M. P.
Church, Sunday evening was disturb-
ed by the sudden appearance of an
electrical storm, causing many in the
audinece to start for home.

Visitors have been Mr. and Mrs.
Howard Myers and son, at Solomon
Myers'; Mr. and Mrs. Ben Speck and
son Winter, of Hedgesville, W. Va.,
at J. E. Newman's; Mrs. Bud Haines,
Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Haines, and
two daughters, Baltimore, at J. Sna-
der Devilbiss's; U. G. Heltibridle and
family and Clarence Lockard, West-
minster, at Mrs. C. Hann's; J. New-
comer and family, at Mrs. Rhode
Waltz's; John Ulrich, Washington,
and Miss Blanche Slonaker, Baltimore
at Samuel 'Palbert's; Mrs. Annie An-
ders and son, Earl Anders, of New
Windsor, at M. S. E. Weaver's.
 3K 
UNION BRIDGE.

A great big Fourth of July will be
celebrated here. Of course, all roads
lead to Union Bridge that day.
The infant child of John Albaugh,

of Johnsville, died Tuesday night.
Prof. E. A. Wolfe is taking the

summer course at the University of
Maryland.

Revival services at the Brethren
Church closed on Sunday night. They
were interesting and successful.
Friday night, Calanthe Lodge K. of

P., had a ladies night banquet. Grand
Chancellor Klein and other officers
were present. Music, vocal and in-
strumental, was furnished by local
talent. Addresses were made by the
Grand Officers and the banquet was
pronounced a success.
Woodsboro was the Mecca for many

of our people on Friday. The Luth-
eran Sunday School Convention was
the reason.
Next Sunday, the Eastern Star will

attend service in the Lutheran church.
John B. Pittinger and wife, Grace-

ham, are visiting at the home of Dr.
M. A. Pittinger.

MELROSE.

The destruction of potato bugs now
is the order of the day. One of our
farmers used two tons of hydrated
lime, while another bought 30 lbs. of
Paris Green, and expects to use that
much more. One of our intensive
gardeners, has discovered four or
five varieties of bugs determined to
destroy the leaves of the most valu-
able vegetable in existance, a hard-
shelled, striped bug, a small hard-
shell bug, a greasy soft bug, and a
slimy soft bug.
A party of our young people, spent

Sunday at Atlantic City, and report
having a good time. While we were
sweltering with heat here, they had
the cool ocean breezes to alleviate the
heat. Thirty-two well filled coaches
constituted the excursion train from
Baltimore, while there were train-
loads from other points, starting from
Union Station, Baltimore, at 1 A. M.,
Sunday, they were in Atlantic City at
5 A. M., the train returning at 5 P. M.,
giving them ample time to see the
sights. The historic boardwalk, ten
miles in length, was thronged with
gaily attired ladies, pedestrians, and
wheeled-chairs, besides concerts and
other amusements.
Mr. and Mrs. David L. Frock, Miss

Naomi Thomas and Miss Viola Wine-
holt, of Bachman's Valley, spent Sun-
day evening at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. J. Albert Zepp.
On Monday morning, our genial

friend and fellow townsman, Harry K.
Shaffer, with bag and baggage, left
for the West by way of truck, trolley
and train. He promised your corre-
spondent, to give us some items of
news when he reaches the "wild and
wooly" west, and gets settled down.
and we, in turn, will pass it on to the
thousands of readers.

Wentz's Union Sunday School voted
on Sunday morning, to order about
forty Hall-Mack Co. song and enter-
tainment books for use at their an-
nual celebration, Saturday afternoon
and evening, August 18th.

LIN WOOD.

Mrs. Verley Koons and two chil-
dren, of Jacksonville, Florida, arrived
at John M. Koons', on Monday, for
the summer.

Charlie Rodkey and family, of Ty-
rone, and Mrs. Alice Krenzer, Han-
over, visited S. C. Dayhoff's family,
on Sunday.

Mrs. — Fogle, who has been vis-
iting her mother, Mrs. Ada Fritz, was
taken to the Maryland University, for
treatment.

Walter Brandenburg and wife, and
Claude Etzler, wife and daughter,
Jane, spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs.
Warfield, of Frederick. Miss Janet
Warfield, who has been visiting her
sister's, returned with them.

Miss Anna Anthony, of Walkers-
ville, who has been visiting her uncle,
E. B. McKinstry and family, returned
home on Monday, accompanied by
Miss Joanna McKinstry.
Alva C. Garner, of Owings Mills,

was home over Sunday.
Theodore Parks and family, of Bal-

timore, have moved in with George
Waltz.
Rev. and Mrs. Claude Koontz, were

entertained, on Sunday, by John Eng-
lar and family.
Week-end visitors at John Drach's

were: Mr. and Mrs. D. D. Ransdell,
Mr. Gardner, Mrs. Robert Garver and
two children, Robert Garver, Jr., and
wife, of Washhigton, D. C.
Farmers are busy cutting wheat.

HARNEY.

On Sunday, June 27, a birthday
surprise party was given in honor of
Mr. and Mrs. Albert Clabaugh, at
their home, near Harney. The fol-
lowing were present and spent the
day in a most enjoyable manner: Mr.
and Mrs. Albert Clabaugh, Mr. and
Mrs. James Humbert, Mr. and Mrs.
George Clabaugh, Mr. and Mrs. Jos.
Study and family, Mrs. Herbert Hum-
bert and family, Miss Nettie Boyd,
Mr. and Mrs. George 0. Clabaugh and
son, Theron, Russell Clabaugh and
Joseph Clabaugh, all of Harney, and
vicinity; also Mr. and Mrs. John Cla-
baugh, of Bonneauville, Mrs. Edward
Hobbs and daughter, Edna, of Thur-
mont; Mrs. Luther Bushman, Grace-
ham; Mr. and Mrs. N. 0. Sharrer and
family, of Rocky Ridge; Mr. and Mrs.
Roy Robenstine and daughter,Evelyn,
Hanover; Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Eberly
and son, Arthur, of Harrisburg, and
Mr. and Mrs. R. K. Eberly, of Har-
risburg.

Misses Irene Lemmon and Blanche
Haines, spent three days of last week
at Boiling Springs, attending a C. E.
Convention.

Charles Reck, Walter Fream, and
Elmer Schildt, of this place, have
gone to Towson, to take a six-week's
ccurse at State Normal.
Paul Thompson and sister, Mrs.

Lity Fletcher and son Richard, of
York, spent Monday and Tuesday of
this week, visiting with their aunt,
Mrs. John J. Thompson.

Officers Sent to Break Up Poker Party
Found Only Harmless Players

of Bridge.

Skulking figures circled cautiously
and with light tread about a house on
the north side. Close observation dis-
closed that the figures wore on their
left breasts the pointed stars of of-
ficers of the law. Inside the house
the sound of shuffled cards, muffled
laughter, and light conversation could
be heard. The !noon hung low in the
sky. All was peaceful. Abruptly,
there came a knock at the door of
the house.
The sounds on the inside of the

house ceased and the door was opened.
Before the startled eyes of the po-
lice raiding squad, led by Lieutenant
Louis Johnson, were disclosed eight
well-dressed women, all smiling gra-
ciously, and all engaged in the pleas-
ant pastime and popular indoor sport
of auction bridge.
"Aw, we were sent up here to get

a poker game," Lieutenant Johnson
explained, in substance. "We can't
arrest any bridge players."—Indian-
apolis News.
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" What's In' a 
Name?„

By MILDRED MARSHALL

A

'•14::•:•:•:•x•ax•itxtxtx•x4r.<,:•:•:•:•:11

HELEN
LEONORE, NELLIE, LENA, ELINOR

Facts about your name; Its history;
omwming; whence ii sew derived;

signOcance; your lucky day
and lucky jewel

SOMEONE once said that a woman
may be a proverb for any amount

of evil or misfortune, but as long as
she is a proverb for beauty, her name
will ring through the centuries. In
proof of this is the ever-popular name
of Helen. Coming from "Helios," the
Greek sun god who drove his flaming
chariot around the heavenly vault day
by day, the name signifies light and
brightness, and conjures up a dazzling
figure of youth, beauty and cleverness.
It is the queen of feminine names, its
fame beginning with the oldest of
Greek epics, the Iliad, with Helen of
Troy whom Tennyson describes as

A daughter of the gods divinely tall,
And most divinely fair.

Her loveliness with shame and with sur-
prise

Froze my swift speech; she turning on
my face

The star-like sorrows of immortal eyes.
Spoke clowly in her place.

I had great beauty; ask thou not my
name;

No one can be more wise than destiny,
Many drew swords and died. Where'er

I came
I brought calamity.

One of the first to bear the name was
the mother of Constantine and restorer
of the shrines at Jerusalem, who was
called St. Helena. Through careless
pronunciation, Helen became Ellen or
Ellin, the Welsh version. Elayne fol-
lowed, the name becoming famed as
the mother of Sir Galahad, whom Ten-
nyson later identified with his "Lady of
Shalott." From this, Ireland adopted
Eileen, or Aileen. Its poetical associa-
tions are continued through Ellen Ir-
win and her piteous death upon Braes
of Kirth, and Ellen Douglas, beloved
heroine of Sir Walter Scott.

Italy took the name of Helen and
transformed it into the soft musical
Elena. Provence contributed Alienor,
which became Eleonore in France and
Lemore in Spain. It was finally
brought to England by "good Queen
Eleanor" and was long used as a royal
name by the Plantagenets as Elinor.
Italy contributed one more charming
derivative in Leonora d'Estes, object of
Tasso's hopeless affection.

Other countries brought the distin-
guishing mark of their language to
hear upon Helen, resulting in the
Helenka of Russia; Helene, of Sweden;
Leonore, of France; Nellie and Lena,
of England and America.

The jewel assigned to Helen, and one
to be worn by all who bear the name,
if they would have health, good for-
tune, and happiness, is the hyacinth, or
yellow jacinth, as it is better known.
In early days a jacinth was carried by
every traveler to insure them against
accident or disease—in fact, the stone
Is said to warn its wearer against the
approach of danger by paling in color.

It is also believed to be proof against
lightning. To dream of a jacinth is
interpreted to mean "success," and
Sunday is the lucky day of its wearer.

(5) by the Wheeler Syndicate. Dm)

Saturday "Dress-Up" Day.
Saturdays once were almost univer-

sally pay days, but now, with many
firms paying their help on other days,
Saturdays have lost claim to that dis-
tinction. But another one still pre-
vails, the New York Sum states. To
the stenographer or girl clerk Satur-
days are dress-up days. Even the
most prim and most severely plain
dresser blossoms forth on Saturday.
The system started through en-

gagements for the afternoon Sadie,
or Mamie, or Rose, wished to appear
at her best when she met Tom, Dick
or Harry, or whoever was going to
take her to a movie or Coney Island.
When one of them quarreled with

her particular beau and was without
a companion for the afternoon could
she admit it to the other girls? Cer-
tainly not. And so, whether an en-
gagement awaits or not, the little
stenographer dresses up every Satur-
day.

MARRIED

TOPPER—SANDERS.

Miss Rose C. Sanders, daughter of
Mr. and Mrs. W. E. Sanders, Taney-
town, and Paul W. Topper, Hanover,
were united in marriage at St.
Joseph's Catholic Church, Taneytown,
Tuesday morning, at 7 o'clock. The
Rev. Father Quinn, pastor of the
bride, performed the ceremony. Miss
Ruth Sanders, sister of the bride, was
bridesmaid and Norbert Neiderer was
best man. The bride was attired in
white Canton crepe with hat and
gloves to match. The bridesmaid
wore a dress of orchid organdy. Af-
ter the ceremony a wedding break-
fast was served at the bride's home.

DIED.
Obituaries, poetry and resolutions, charg-

ed for at the rate of five cents per line.
The regular death notices published free.

MRS. ALICE HARNISH.
Mrs. Alice, widow of the late Henry

Harnish, died at her home in Taney-
town, on Wednesday morning, June
27, after a prolonged illness, aged 71
years, 2 months, 27 days. She is sur-
vived by one daughter, Mrs. Lillie M.

Harnish was the last surviv-
ing member of the family of Mr. and
Mrs. George Henry Fair, and had
lived in Taneytown all her life. She
was formerly married to the late
Henry K. Sherman. Funeral services
were held this Friday afternoon. In-
terment in the Lutheran cemetery.

QB

HUMAN AND HUMANE

"Now, Jimmy," said the teacher,
"what is the difference between 'hu-
man' and 'humane'?"
Jimmy thought deeply for a moment.
"Well," he said at length, "suppose

you had two pieces of candy and a hun-
gry little dog grabbed one from you. If
you gave him the other piece you would
be humane, but if you threw a stone
at him you would be human."—Every-
body's Magazine.

Sounds Like an Exception.
Blx—Two wrongs don't make a

right, and to that rule there's no ex-
ception.
Dix—Oh, I don't know. If your

clock is an hour fast it is wrong, and
if you set it forward eleven hours
more you, of course, make it wronger,
but at the same time you make it
right.

Promoting Circulation.
"Haven't you stopped that poker

game?"
"No," answered Cactus Joe. "We've

got to keep it going as an economic
measure. A lot of these Crimson
Gulchers won't work unless they're
broke."—Washington Star.

The Threat of a Teacher.
Said the stern young woman teach-

er: "Tommy, if you cannot behave
yourself I shall have to take your
name?"

Outside, Tommy confided to a
chum: "My teacher's threatened to
marry me if I don't look out."

Casualties.
"Why," asked the Man from Mars,

"do I see so many people lying about
In your streets and making piteous
sounds as if they were in great pain?
Are they the victims of some disease?"
"Yes," replied his terrestrial host.

"They are victims of motormania."

A COMPLAINT

The Earth—Drat it, but those filers
are getting annoying.

Diplomccy.
The diplomat toils days and night
In confabs and conventions,

Evolving phrases most polite
To mask some rough intentions.

Always Good.
"I must get a platform."
"Of course."
"But there are n- issues. What am

I going to do?"
"Jump on the 'vested interests.' Any

politician who can't make an issue
out of that is in e comatose condi-
tion."

Indoor Sport.
First Suburbanite—And don't you

find the evenings vcry long where you
live?
Second Suburbanite—Oh, no; we

read the summer resort literature and
it passes the time.

He Got the Job.
"Suppose," said the bookseller to

the applicant for a job, "suppose a
customer asked for a volume we didn't
have. What would you do?"
"Why," said the young fellow, "I

would book the order and then order
the book."

Adam an Eve.
"You are the first woman I have ever

loved," declared Adam.
"Huh," sniffed Eve. "How about

that woman over in the land of nod?"
"Just a summer flirtation," said our

forefather calmly.

Killing Work.
Author—I suppose the death scene

Is very trying?
Actress—Oh, terribly so! When

finally give up the ghost I'm nearly
dead!

Sarcastic Spouse.
Hub (during quarrel)—You don't

have to tell me, I know all my short-
comings and my weaknesses and de-
fects.
wife—Then you know a great deal.

So It Goes.
"Yes, he is int-Wei-net."
"Oh, we must he tolerant."
"I can't be tolerant about a man

who is intolerant."

Wrong Guess.
Flubb—Do you understand anything

about psychology?
Dubb—I thought I did—until last

night's poker session!

THE
WINCILESTER

STORE 

Balanced Tools
The perfect balance of a Winchester hammer,

hatchet and saw means a great deal at the end of
the day to the man who earns his living with his
tools. They are designed to enable the user to do
good work with the least vmount of eftort.

Add a few good tools to your tool box this week.

WINCHISTEA ii

P.c.c1:1-96

24-in.'Skew-Back Blade
THIS WEEK n
ONLY, at 00C

Winchester Auger Bits—Open and
solid center patterns, 13 sizes. Free,
easy cutting.

Winchester Hatchets—Drop forged
from one piece of solid steel. Handles
tight.

Winchester Nail Hammers—Forg-
ed head. Patented inter-locking
wedge. Claws will pull any headless
nail. Hickory handles.

We Close Every Wednesday Afternoon
During July and August.

T H E wiNciffsilw STORE

DEFIED THE TOUCH OF TIME

Sarah Bernhardt's Remark to Ellen 11•1
Terry Reveals Character of Great

French Actress.

On an evening some twenty-flve
years ago Mine. Sarah Bernhardt Was
the guest of Sir 11-nry lrvinn• at one
of those intimate hi' le suoeer parties
in the Beefsteak room of the Lyceum
theater over which he loved to pre-
side, Comyns Carr writes in the Lon-
don Times. The English actor was
socially always at his best when his
day's work was done, and his gracious
hospitality provoked in those he gath-
ered around his table a sense of ease
and intimacy that Was scarcely to be
matched in any other of the bohemian
entertainments of the time. During her
repeated visits to England Mme.
Bernhardt was constantly to be count-
ed among his guests; and in the art of
Sir Henry Irving, which she never
wearied of praising, she found, I think,
that note of strong personality which
is also the surviving characteristic of
all her own work in the theater. On
that particular occasion, as I remem-
ber, our talk concerned itself with the
age at which some of the great actors
of the past had produced their finest
effects; when on a sudden Mnie. Bern-
hardt, leaning across the table toward
Miss Ellen Terry, exclaimed in he
broken English, which lost nothing o
force from its imperfection, "My dear,
there are two peoples in this world
which shall never be old—you and
me."

RUSHED TO GOAT'S DEFENSE

Small Boy's Argument Would Have
to Be Admitted Both Logical

and Reasonable.

David's grandpa, who lived in the
country, sent him a pet goat recently.

David's family was 100 per cent

against the goat, but grandpa insisted

that the boy ought to have a pet, and,

of course, David was strong for the

idea.
Mother fussed a lot about the ani-

mal, but David and the goat got
through the first week without being
kkked out of the house and home,
and everything had about quieted
down. Then one day the goat got on
a rampage. Before he was discovered
he had devoured a tablecloth, dad's
shoe rag, a sack of clothespins and
sister Nellie's favorite mall-order cata-
logue.
"David, this is absolutely the limit!"

mother excielined. "You've got to get
rid of that goat, and get rid of him
now! Do you think I can have that
animal around here eating up the
clothes and the furniture?"
"Gee whiz!" David exclaimed. "Don't

you suppose a goat ever gets hungry?"

—Kansas City Strtr.

Started Early.
Wife—I'm going to clean up all the

silver today.
Hub—Yes; you (leaned up all I had

In my pocket befe.;, I awoke.

He Wants to Know.
"This production is reputed to out-

strip anything hitherto attempted for
the screen."
"Hum. Is it a beach drama?"

THE
FUNNY
MEN

IN

SEQUENCE

Woman (at Enfield court)—Some-
thing unpleasant was said by a neigh-
bor.
Magistrate—And what happened?
Woman—We had a few words.
"Yes?"
"Then there was a squanute."
"Yes?"
"Then there was a tight."
"Yes?"
"And now we're here."—London Tit-

Bit&

Lessons From Rain.
When an inch of rain falls on an

area the size, say of Pennsylvania,
v much water is that?
--not bother to calculate it; we

did It. And it figures out the very
tidy little total of 3,282,609,000 tons
of pure, distilled water. Every ounce
of it was drawn up from the oceans,
transported without charge across
plains and mountains, and deposited
gently where needed. He is ungrate-
ful who complains of the occasional
perversity of the weather and the
rainfall, and blind indeed who can-
not see in those vast, silent move-
ments of winds and water the finger
of a living God.—Farm Journal.

Horses On the Decrease.
Man's chief beast of burden, the

horse, has decreased in numbers in
the world at large about 11 per cent
in the last ten years. Figures Just
made public by the United States De-
partment of Agriculture show a falling
off in the total head in 85 countries
from 116,500,000 to 103,550,000. The
decrease, however, occurred largely in
Russia, where the decline was nearly
50 per cent, and the United States,
where the total has dropped from 23,-
145,000 in 1914 te 20,559,000. Russia's
total in that year of 34,700,000 has
dwindled to 18,507,000, giving the
United States the greatest number.
Gains were shown in Argentina, Can-
ada, Spain and the Scandinavian
countries.

Pension Money Worth While.
Soldiers of the Civil war now resid-

ing in Germany have been made multi-
millionaires by the receipt of pensions
from the United States. During the
World war their accounts were sus-
pended and the recent payments of ac-
cumulated dues have mounted as hign
as $2,800 for one person. That sum
amounts to more than 50,000,000 marks
at the current rate of exchange.
There are 229 persons in Germany and
ten in Austria drawing regular Civil
war pensions from the United States
and consequently they now rank
among the envied rich.—Pmith finder.



Westminster Ab.R H 0 A E
Zentz, cf 5 1 4 2 00
Alb 5 0 1 3 3 0an, ss

  Buckley, lf 5 0 1 2 0
McDermitt, 3b 5 2 2 1 1 2
Ruark, rf 4 2 2 1 0
Bonsack, p 3 0 1 0 3
Markell. c 4 1 1 7 1
J. Smith, 2b 3 1 1 3 5
Duncan, lb 3 0 0 8 0

- - - - - -
Totals 37 7 13 27 13 6

Taneytown 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 6-8
Westminster 3 0 0 0 0 0 1 3 0-7
Struck out by Bonsack, 6; by Pat-

terson, 5; base on balls, Bonsack, 5;
Patterson, 1. Two-base hits, J. Smith,
Eline, Drenning, Patterson. Three-
base hits, Zentz, Bonsack, L. Hitch-
cock. Stolen base, Buckley, McDer-
mitt. Double play Eline to M. Hitch-
cock to Lawrence; J. Smith to Alban,
to Duncan. Sacrifice hits, Bonsack,
J. Smith, L. Hitchcock. Hits off Bock,
5; Vogel, 0; Patterson 8, Bonsack 12.

CARROit_LARUBN21,.EAGUE

STANDING OF CLUBS.

Won Lost Per-et

Taneytown  5 2 714

Westminster  4 3 571

Union Bridge  3 4 428

New Windsor  2 5 285

The Next Games.

Saturday, June 30.
Westminster, at Union Bridge.
Taneytown, at New Windsor.

Wednesday, July 4th.
Taneytown, at Westminster, 10:30
Taneytown, at New Windsor, at

3:00 P. M.
Saturday, July 7th.

Westminster, at Taneytown.

New Windsor, at Union Bridge.

Taneytown 4-Westminster 2.

Taneytown defeated Westminster,

on Saturday, at Taneytown, in what

was perhaps the best game yet played

by the league. The game was won

by slightly better all around play-

fielding and batting-and Patterson

who pitched for Taneytown, outpoint-

ed Dorsey, though the latter put up

an exhibition that ordinarily wins.

Westminster scored in the first inning

making 3 of its 6 hits, before Patter-

son steadied down. Fisher started

the scoring for Taneytown, in the 6th,

with a hard three-bagger to left that

developed into a home run, on account

of slow fielding by Grimm. The sen-

sational catch of a fly ball, on a run,

by Denver Hitchcock, who fell but

held on to the ball, was a feature of

the game.
Taneytown Ab R .H .0 A E

Eline, 3b 1 1 20

Drenning, ss 0 2 2 0

D. Hitchcock, cf 0 6 0 0

L Hitchcock, c 1 6 0 0

Lawrence, lb 1 8 1 1

Fisher, rf 1 2 0 0

Small, If 1 1 1 0

M. Hitchcock, 2b 0 0
Patterson, p 

- - - - -

40
40
4 1
3 1
30
4 1
3 1
3 0 2 0
3001  0

1

0
20
1 0
0 1
0 0
00
0 0

1
0

0 0
- - - - - -

Totals 31 4 6 27 10 1
Taneytown 0 0 0 0 0 3 0 1 x-4
Westminster 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0-2
Home run-Fisher; Three-base hits

Zentz, Alban; Sacrifice hits, Lawrence
Patterson; Stolen Base, Small;Struck
out by Dorsey, 4; Struck out by Pat-
terson 6; Base on balls, by Dorsey 3;

by Patterson, 1.

Totals
Westminster
Zentz, cf
Alban, ss
McDermitt, 3b
Grimm, lf
Ruark, rf
Bonsack, lb
Markel, c
J. Smith, 2b
Dorsey, p
Duncan, If

4

31 4 7 27 10
Ab R H OA
4 1 1 3 0
4 1 2 2
4 0 1 0
3 0 1 1
3 0 0 0
4 0 1 12
4 0 0 4
3 0 0 1
3 0 0 0
1 0 0 1

3
5

New Windsor 9-Union Bridge 8.

New Windsor broke its losing
streak by winning from Union Bridge

on Saturday, after the latter had
scored a six run lead in the first. Of
the eleven men who faced Metzger in
the first, only three hit Safely. After
this, he settled down and allowed only
5 scattered hits, and fanned 13. All
of New Windsor runs were scored on
clean hits bunched in the 6th. and
8th. Union Bridge took life in the
9th., when Jett hit a home run, scor-
ing Behrens.
New Windsor Ab R H 0 AE
Haggson, 2b 4 1 1 0 0 2
Strobel, 3b 6 1 3 1 0 0
Gerwig, c 5 1 1 13 0 1
O'Keefe, ss 5 0 2 2 1 2
Snyder, cf 4 1 2 3 0 0
Metzger, p 4 1 2 0 4 0
Collins, If 4 1 0 2 0 0
Ochsler, rf 4 1 2 1 0 0
Peters, lb 5 2 3 5 0 0

Totals
Union Bridge
Deshone, rf
Fitzberger, lb
McCarron, 2b
Warehime, c
Statlings, ss
Behrens, lf
Brandenburg, 3b
Jett, p
Martin, cf

- - -
41 9 16
Ab R H
4 1 1
4 1 1
5 1 1
4 1 0
4 1 0
4 2 2
5 0 0
5 1 2
5 0 1

- - -
27 5 5
0 AE
4 0 1
11 0 0
1 4 0
4 1 0
4 1 1
2 0 0
0 2 0
0 3 0
1 0 1

- - - - -
Totals 40 8 8 27 11 3

New Windsor 0 0 0 0 0 4 0 4 1-9
Union Bridge 6 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2-8

Struck out by Metzger 13, by Jett
2; left on bases Union Bridge 10, New
Windsor 10; Home run, Jett; base on
balls. Jett 3; hit by Metzger 3, by
Jett 2; double play, McCarron to Fitz-
berger; earned runs New Windsor 8,
Union Bridge 4. Umpire, Flater.
(Two scores of this game received, vary-

ing slightly. The first one received, used.
-Ed.)

Taneytown 8-Westminster 7.

Taneytown won from Westminster,
on Wednesday, by a batting festival
in the 9th. Taneytown scored 2 runs
in the first, and Westminster came
back with 3, hitting Boch hard. Boch
retired, and Vogel finished the inning.
The next six innings represented a
fine battle between Patterson,for Tan-
eytown, and Bonsack. In the 8th,
Westminster found the channel to the
ball, scoring 3 runs, leaving the score
stand 7 to 2 in their favor at the open-
ing of the 9th. Then the bombard-
ment of Bonsack commenced, ten men
facing him before the side was retir-
ed. illustrating the truth that a game
of base ball is never over until the
last man is out in the 9th.
Taneytown AbR H OAE
Eline, 3b 5220 1 0
Drenning, ss 6 0 1 2 3 2
D. Hitchcock, cf 4 1 0 1 0 0
L, Hitchcock, c 3 2 2 7 1 0
Lawrence, lb 5 0 1 6 2 0
Fisher, rf 5 0 0 3 0 0
Small, If 4 1 2 1 0 0
M. Hitchcock, 2b 4 1 1 6 1 0
Boch, p 0 0 0 0 0 0
Vogel, p 0 0 0 0 0 0
Patterson, p 4 1 2 1 1 0

- - - - - -
Totals 41 8 12 27 9 0

New Windsor 9-Union Bridge 2.

2
1

New Windsor won her second con-
secutive game from Union Bridge,
Wednesday, by a safe margin.
Schaeffer got a bad start in the first
when he walked the first two men to
face him, O'Keefe followed with a
sharp single scoring both. Schaeffer
settled in the second fanning three
straight. In the third a hit batter,
a base on balls followed by two sin-
gles and Peters double, sent in four
runs. Union Bridge scored in the
third when, with two down, Martin
singled and Fitzburger tripled. Both
sides went scoreless until the fifth
when Martin doubled and came in on
Boyle's single. Bases on balls fol-
lowed by hits accounted for New
Windsor runs in the 7th. and 8th. Al-
though both pitchers fanned nine men
Souder showed better form without
apparently exerting himself. As in
former games, O'Keefe made several
unusual stops at short. Peters led at
bat with two doubles. Five of the
runs scored by New Windsor were
made by men who reached first
through Schaeffer's wildness.
New Windsor AbRH OA E
Hoggson, 2b 4 1 0 6 1 0
Strobel, 3b 4 2 1 0 4 1
Gerwig, c 5 0 1 10 0 0
O'Keefe, ss 3 1 1 2 6 1
Snyder, cf 3 1 0 1 0 0
Souder, p 4 1 1 0 3 0
Collins, lf 4 1 3 1 0 0
Oehler, rf 4 0 0 0 0 0
Peters, lb 4 1 2 7 0 0

- - - - - -
Totals 35 9 9 27 14 2

Union Bridge Ab R .H .0 A E
Boyle, rf 5 0 1 1 0 1
Fitzburger, lb 4 0 1 8 0
McCarron, 2b 4 0 0 1 2
Warehime, c 4 0 2 10 1
Stallings, ss 3 0 0 0 2
Behrens, lf 4 0 0 1 0
Brandenburg, 3b 2 0 0 3 1
Schaeffer p 3 0 0 0 2
Martin, cf 4 2 2 0 0

- - - - - -
Totals 35 2 624 8 2

New Windsor 2 0 4 0 0 0 1 2 x-9
Union Bridge 0 0 1 0 1 0 0 0 0-2
Two base hits, Martin, Strobel,

and Peters 2; three-base hits, Fitz-
burger; stolen bases, Peters; sacrifice
hits, Stallings; bases on balls off of
Schaeffer, 4, Souder, 2; batters hit by
Schaeffer. Snyder twice; by Souder,
Schaeffer; struck out by Schaeffer 9,
by Souder 9; wild pitch, Schaeffer one.
Umpire Doyle.

Base Ball Notes.

There is such a thing as being too
cock-sure of capturing a game of base
ball, and perhaps of having too much
"at stake" aside from the winning a
game on the merits of play. All
games should be decided after the full
nine innings are played, and not in
the mind, before the game commences

There are rumors of considerable
money being bet on the games. If
this be true, it is by those who are
enemies to clean sport, and the future
of the League is apt to be endanger-
ed. Cut it out!
The games on Wednesday, July 4,

are "exhibition" games, and will not
count in the League standing.

To Whom it May Concern.

As there seems to be some doubt
as to whether the ball caught by me
in the first inning of a game of base
ball between Westminster and Taney-
town on the latter grounds, on Satur-
day, June 23rd., was a fair catch, or
whether the ball was trapped, I here-
by make oath before a Notary Public
that the catch was a fair one and was
what is called, in Baseball, a "shoe-
string" catch, and that the ball was
not trapped by me; also that Umpire
Doyle's decision that the batter was
out, was a just and fair one.

DENVER L. HITCHCOCK,
Center Fielder for Taneytown

Sworn to before me a Notary Pub-
lic this 25th. day of June 1923.

GEO. A. ARNOLD,
Notary Public.

 • 

This Simple Mixture
Helps Weak Eyes

Taneytown people are astonished
at the QUICK results produced by
simple camphor, hydrastis, witchhaz-
el, etc., as mixed in Lavoptik eye wash
After being afflicted with weak, wa-
tery, red eyes for many years a lady
reports the FIRST bottle Lavoptik
helped her. One small bottle usually
helps ANY CASE weak, strained or
sore eyes. Aluminum eye cup FREE.
R. S. McKinney, Druggist.

-Advertisement

NOTICE TO CREDIT )RS.

This is to give notice that the sub-
scriber has obtained from the Orphans'
Court of Carroll county. in Md.. letters
of administration upon the estate of

EPHRAIM WOLFORD,

late of Carroll County, deceased. All per-
sons having claims against the deceased.
are hereby warned to exhibit the same,
with the vouchers properly authenticated,
to the subscriber, on or before the 13th.
day of January, 1924; they may otherwise
by law be excluded from all benefit of
said estate.

Given under my hands this 15th. day of
June. 1923.

CHARLES F. CASHMAN,
6-15-5t Administrator.

SPECIAL NOTICES
SMALL ADVERTISEMENTS will be in-

serted under this heading at One Cent a
word, each week, counting name and ad-
dress of advertiser-two initials, or a date,
counted as one word. Alinimnin charge,
15 cents.
REAL ESTATE for sale, Two Cents each

word. Minimum charge, 25 cents.
APPLY AT RECORD OFFICE ads not

accepted-but will receive sealed replies.
No personal information given.
THIS COLUMN is specially for Wants,

Loot, Found, Short Announcements, Per-
sonal Property for sale. etc.
..ALL NOTICES in this column must be
uniform in style.

HIGHEST CASH Prices paid every
day for delivery of Poultry, Butter
and Eggs. Specialty, 50c for deliv-
ery of Calves all day Tuesday or Wed-
nesday Morning. Geo. W. Motter.

HIGHEST CASH prices paid for
Butter, Eggs, Calves and Poultry, at
the New Produce Hou.e, formerly
Schwartz's Produce. 50c for deliv-
ery of Calves.-W. A. Myers, Phone
57-M. 6-20-tf

SEVEN PURE-BRED SHOATS for
sale.-T. C. Fox, Keysville.

NOTICE.-Will be closed all day,
July 4th.-Taneytown Grain & Sup-
ply Co., Reindollar Co.

HOUND PUPS for sale by Charles
W. Snyder, near Keysville, Md. Phone
31-F-2.

CROSS
Margaret
Dale Mill.

WATCH DOG, for sale-
McReynolds, near Otter

9 PIGS, 6 weeks old, and 2 Shoats,
will weigh 75 to 100 lbs. each.-L. E.
Hilterbrick, on Walnue Grove Road.

FOR SALE-A fine Bay Horse,
good worker, and an excellent and
speedy driver.-George T. Stonesifer,
Jr., near Mayberry. 6-29-2t

FESTIVAL on lawn at Mt. Union
Church, Saturday evening, July 14.
Union Bridge Band will be present.

6-29-3t

10 PIGS, 6 weeks old, for sale by
David F. Eyler.

NOTICE-All parties who have
books of shares for Taneytown Base
Ball Club please return at once to
Wm. E. Burke, Secretary.

WASHING MACHINE and Wring-
er, complete, in good order for sale.-
Robert S. McKinney. 6-29-2t

HOME-MADE ICE CREAM, Cakes
and Sandwiches, Saturday evening.-
Mrs. N. A. Hitchcock.

KEYSVILLE PICNIC in Stonesif-
er's Woods, Saturday, August 4, all-
day. Detour Band. Festival in eve-
ning. 6-22-7t

NOTICE.-When you have a sick
Horse or Cow, Hogs or Poultry. Call,
or phone C. & P. No. 63 Taneytown,
Md., Residence Frederick St., Office
Hours 6 to 8 A. M., and 12 to 1, and
7 to 9 P. M.-Dr. N. I. Wantz, D. V.
S., Veterinary Surgeon. 6-22-4t

SHORT TERM INSURANCE on
Grain and Hay, covering the danger-
ous period, when the regular insur-
ance is not enough to cover a fire loss..
Time to take it out now.-P. B. Eng-
lar, Agt., Taneytown, Md. 6-22-4t

WANTED-Small Red Land, Slate
and Limestone farms; also town prop- I
erties from now till July 1, 1923.-D. '
W. Garner, Real Estate Broker, Tan-
eytown, Md. 6-15-3t

PUBLIC SALE of a Fine Home, in
Ladiesburg, on Saturday, July 7, at
1:30 P. M.-U. J. Eyler and Mrs. J. A.
Price. J. N. 0. Smith, Auct, 6-8-5t

FOR SALE CHEAP.-No. 50 Colt
Acetyline Light Plant, in first-class
condition, together with piping and
fixtures for 8-room house; 2 porch
lights. Reason for selling, electricity
coming to our town.-Jesse P. Wey-
bright, Detour, Md. 5-25-tf

WANTED-Men or women to take
orders for genuine guaranteed hosiery
for men, women and children. Elim-
inate darning. Salary $75.00 a week
full time, $1.50 an hour spare time.
Beautiful Spring line.-International
Stocking Mills, Norristown, Pa.

5-25-10t

DAY OLD CHICKS-we sell them.
Let us have your order.-Reindollar
Bros. & Co. 3-16-tf

WANTED.-Butter. Eggs, Poultry,
Lard, Squabs and Calves at highest
prices. 50c a head for delivering
Calves. No Calves received after
Thursday evening. Open every eve-
ning until 8 o'clock. H. C. Brendle's
Produce. 1-5-tf

FOR SALE-Ford Touring Car at
an attractive price.-D. W. Garner.

4-27-tf

SPECIAL OFFER
FOR:

Home Stationery
We will continue, for a time, a

special offer for printed paper and
envelopes, for those who need sta-
tionery in small quantities. Either of
the following offers mailed postpaid
for $1.00, anywhere within the third
zone-300 miles. Add 5c when to be
mailed to 4th and 5th. zones, and 10c
beyond 5th. zone.

OFFER NO. 1.

150 sheets 6x9 paper, ruled, good
quality, in two pads; with 100 size
6% envelopes to match.

OFFER NO, 2.

200 sheets Hammermill Bond paper,
51/2x83' unruled, padded on request,
with 100 size 6% envelopes to match.

Printed either in dark blue,or black.
Not over 4 lines neat type, the same
form on both paper and envelopes.
Envelopes printed on back, if desired.
Paper printed either in corner, or cen-
tre of head.
Cash with order, when sent by mail.

Write instructions, and copy for the
printing, very plainly.

THE CARROLL RECORD CO.,

Write for rates on Business sta-
tionery of all kinds, stating quantity,
and all necessary information. Prices
and samples will be submitted.

FOR A HUTH
STATE UNiVERSITI

WOMEN HOLD A FOUR DAY CON-

FERENCE AT COLLEGE PARK.

20 COUNTIES REPRESENTED

The Confereece Affirmed Its Interest

In The Agricultural Committee Ap-

pointed By The Governor, And

Pledged Its Support In Resolutions

Passed.

Two hundred and thirty-seven wom-
en, representing twenty counties of
the Stese assembled last week in a
four day conference at the University
of Maryland at College Park, came
out strongly for plans to advance the
agricultural interests of Maryland by
improving farm life generally and in
favor of a greater State University.
In resolutions passed last Friday the
conference affirmed its intereet in the
agricultural committee appointed by
the Governor, and pledged its support

to the committee in these words:
"We affirm our interest in the com-

mittee appointed by the Governor to
draw up a program for the advance-
ment of agriculture, to improve farm

life, to make easier the tasks of farm
women, and pledge our support to
such a program."
The conference also approved the

work of the University and decided to
petition the Legislature to pass the
general program Qt the University;

and asked especially that the Univers-

ity make the Rural Women's Confer-

ence an annual feature of the pro-

gram. The part of the resolution re-

ferring to the University reads:

"We urge that the Rural Women's

Conference be made an annual fea-

ture of the University program, we

endorse the administration of the

University of Maryland and commend

its policies in trying to make avail-

able to all the people of the State the
opportunities it offers. We especially

approve the Home Demonstration

work of the Extension Service, and

urge that this phase of the work of

the University be broadened to meet

the needs of the general program of

the University, espeoially the provi-

sions for additional facilities for the

education of young women, and sug-

gest that a legislative committee be

appointed before the next legislature

In support of this program."
It was left to the Committee on

Resolutions, of which Miss Mary Ris-

teau, of Harford county, is chairman.

to appoint members of the legislative
committee and also appoint its chair

man. Miss Risteau announced that

Mrs. Hayes Brown, of Frederick coun-

ty, would be chairman of the commit-

tee, and that the other members

would be named shortly. A repre-

sentative of each of the twenty coun-

ties composed the Committee on Reso-

lutions.
The conference consisted of gen-

eral class room demonstrations of

work in which the women of the State

are particularly interested, of special

lectures on various topics of State

interest, and special musical pro-

grams.
Dr. A. F. Woods, President of the

University; Dr. T. B. Symons, Di-

rector of the University Extension

Service; Dr. H. J. Patterson, Director

of the Agricultural Experiment Sta-

tion; Dr. Norment. in charge of the

health center at Hagerstown; M. M
Stewart, Secretary of *e Maryland
Farm Bureau Federation; Miss Mary

Risteate the only woman to sit in the

House of Delegates at Annapolis and

member of the State Board of Educa-

tion, and Miss Lavinia Engle, State

Chairman of the League of Women
Voters, were among those who ad-

dressed the various assemblies.
Carroll county led in the number ol

representatives present at the confer-

ence with a total of 59, while Fred-
erick county was second with 44, and
Washington county was third, with 17

Kent county led the Eastern Shore

counties with a representation of 9.
Talbot, Somerset and Calvert counties
were the only counties not repre-
sented.
So successful was the conference

that the University authorities have

determined to make it a feature of
the annual program. Special efforts
will be made within the next few
months to organize the women of

Somerset, Talbot and Calvert counties
so that next year no county will be
missing from the conference.
Active preparations for the confer-

ence and its entire management was
under the direction of Miss Venia M.
Keller, head of the Home Demonstra-
tion work of the University. The suc-
cess of the conference was due large-
ly to her efforts. As one of the au-
thorities of the University puts it,
"The conference gave the women
representatives of the several coun-
ties much useful information they can
take back to their club organizations
ann went a long way towards showing
them just how the women may take
advantage of the opportunities the
State • Usiversity oilers."

Residue.
How many an oil well do we find
That fades into the empty air.

And, fading, only leaves behind
Some deskroom and an empty chair.

An Oratorical Flood.
"He flooded the hall with his ora-

tory."
"I understood it was an overflow

meeting."
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A Splendid Example
of Enterprise
and Organized Effort

The Hall Mark

of Service

THE KIND OF SERVICE A GREAT ORGANIZATION
IS CAPABLE OF GIVING IN A GREAT EMERGENCY
UNDER PRIVATE OWNERSHIP.

The Philadelphia Inquirer on Wednesday, June 13, pub-
lished the following editorial:

"AN OBJECT LESSON IN RAILROAD EFFICIENCY

The word efficiency has been greatly overworked in recent
years, but it can be applied in all justice to the officials of the
Pennsylvania Railroad who are meeting the emergency pro-
duced by the destruction of the trainshed of the Broad Street
Station.

While the conflagration was still in progress heads of the
engineering and construction departments were in consulta-
tion, and the fire had not been extinguished before numerous
wrecking crews were at work. In the meantime the traffic
department wa.s called upon to make a readjustment of ser-
vice, and special bulletins promptly informed the traveling
public of the disposition of trains.
In less than twenty-four hours after the fire started the

builders were employed in restoring platforms. Men had been
summoned from everywhere, but there was a minimum of
confusion, because every squad had a definite duty. It has
been a splendid object lesson in efficiency on the part of the
world's greatest railroad. In these days of speed, demoraliz-ed train service spells general congestion, and that this should
have been so largely and quickly overcome is a matter of con-
gratulation.
The American spirit is shown at its best when meeting

seemingly unsurmountable difficulties. Say that a thing is
impossible in this country and, as if by magic, men will ap-pear to make it possible. Those who travel may be subjectto some temporary inconvenience, but if the public be as pa-tient as the railroad company has been enterprising, there
will not be much reason for complaint."

QL- 'Train service in and out of Broad Street Station hasalready practically been restored to normal conditions.

Pennsylvania Railroad System
THE STANDARD RAILROAD OF THE WORLD
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START RIGHT.
Don't ruin your child's foot with it's first pair of shoes. We are

showing a line of

Children's PUMPS and OXFORDS
that are made right, they fit the feet, are made smooth, and of the

best leather, shoes that wear. We have all the new things in

W9MEN'S PUMPS AND OXFORDS
from the cheapest to the best,

$1.75 to $7.50
Women's S:11K Hose that are guaranteed, all colors.

J. 171.0144A,IF AND3
WEST MAIN STREET

Westminster, M.
teie:oloteeeeiloeeoiereeiet.> - teeleto:eiseo: :eiteleto.eesee.4 •
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50 Stylish Popular Light
Colored Suits Reduced.
Handsome Styleplus and Schloss
Bros. Suits Reduced 15 percent.

$25.00 Suits, now
30.00 Suits. now
35.00 Suits, now

$21.25
25.50
29.80

1
1

The Best Genuine Palm Beach Suits

S.

a •

all the popular shades, $12.00 and $15.00. "Faultless'
Night Shirts and Panamas. Men's Union Suits, 50c,
75c, $1.00, $1.50. A big variety Dress Shirts, $1.00,
$1.50, $2.00 and $2.50.

Try one of the "Brave Man" Work Shirts, and
pair of "Lann" Khaki Pants.

Fly Swatters given to Customers.

Sharrer, Gorsuch & Starr
WESTMINSTER, MD.

Carroll County's Big and Only Exclusive Clothing Store
6-29-2t

leeetteel.1,14-4111.-titttttte.tttleXttittAttit

Uneattned Roman Skeletons.

While the girls of Paris were strut-

ting their Tut-Ankh-Amen styles, arche-

ologists were uncovering relics of art

and human bones from an entire buri-

al ground of the Gallo-Roman period,

nearby, it as learned. Some of the

relics date back to the First century.

Skeletons found were remarkable for

the almost perfect sets of teeth found

in the skulls. The spot was once a

burial ground for the Romans and

later the Merovingians.

Will Be Bolder Next Time.
"So you saw them married, did yon'
"Yes."
"Was it a quiet wedding?"
"I should say so. Both the bride and

groom were so scared they could hard-
ly speak above a whisper."

AN EXCEPTION TO THE RULE

Angelina-Too bad real estate Is

going up so high Just as we are

planning to get married.
Edwin-Yes, all real estate Is go-

ing up except my castles In the air.

They're coming down.

The Dollar Chaser.
There most be certain types of men
Who think of others now and then;
But when we view the race for pelf
Each one seems centered on himself.

Making Her Angry.
"What do you do when your wife

catches you coming in very late?"
"Tell her I forgive her."
"Hey?"
"That always makes her so mad she

can't talk."



Matrimonial Adventures

One Man's Meat
BY

Dorothy Canfield
Author of "The Brimming
Cup," —ma Squirrel Cart•,"
"The Bent Twig," "The Day
of GLory," "A Montemori
Mother," "Mothers mad ChM.

firm." $te,
••

s. 61:24

Copyright by rnitell Feature Syndicate

SOMETHING ABOUT
DOROTHY CANFIELD

Dorothy Canfield has so many
successes to her credit and is so
versatile a person that one despairs
of chronicling even a small part of
her achievements. 'When little
more than a girl she had won two
degrees, a Ph.B. and a Ph.D., and
it was not many years after that

• tha; she became famous as an au-
thor. - ; `,""
Her books are the type that live.

To speak of one of her latest big
successes, "The Brimming Cup, '
calls up mention of her earlier
work and starts discussion of "The
Bent Twig" or "The Squirrel Cage,"
or away from her novels to her
books on the Montessori method.
When war came, Mrs, Fisher

(she is Mrs. Fisher in private life)
went to France with her husband
and two children—where she did
big and important work. But all
the time she was working abroad
she was writing, too, stories that
appeared in our leading magazines,
and books that were published
upon her return.
MARY STEWART CUTTING, JR.

The first time I ever heard the
threadbare saying about a square peg
In a round hole, was when my father
used it in an attempt to excuse Aunt
Emily. Up to that time I had never
heard anyone say anything of her ex-
cept that she was a detestable woman
with the most infernal capacity for be-
ing perfectly wretched herself and
making everybody else so. What a
home she made for poor mild Uncle
Charlie, and for their thres nervous,
Scrawny, rabbit-faced children!
You are not to think she neglected

her home or her children. Indeed no!
She house-kept with a fanatical com-
petence and expended on the up-bring-
ing of her children an extravagant
energy which filled the house to Its
remotest corner, as a sawmill is filled
by the strident energy of the saw.
Never were three children so brought
up as my poor little cousins. Aunt
Emily was determined that she should
do her whole duty by them, that they
Should be perfect, and do everything
exactly right. Of course she knew
much better than they weat was right,
and hence had never an instant of re-
pose from her labor of pushing and
shoving them into the way they should
go.
Oh, how we hated to be sent on an

errand to Aunt Emily's house. I spare
you the description of what a meal at
Aunt Emily's table was. with Aunt
Emily teaching the children table man-
ners. There are plenty of intolerable
things in real life, without dragging
Into a story what happened when
Uncle Charles spilled gravy on a clean
tablecloth.

You notice, perhays, that I say "at
Aunt Emily's table," and not "at Uncle
Charles'"; and that sets me at an-
other angle of their home life; what
that home life meant to Aunt Emily's
husband. He was what is known in
America as a man "with no head for
business," and yet there had never
been anything but business in his life.
He had been a handsome, dreamy.
eyed, musical-minded young account-
ant in Emery's Emporium when Aunt
Emily, very young herself, had mar-
ried him; married him, apparently for
the same reason that he was in busi-
ness, because there seemed to be noth-
ing else to do. But Uncle Charles was
no money-maker, and imprisoned in a
grinding round of petty economies and
nnescapable shabbiness, how Aunt
Emily ate her heart out, and what a
life Uncle Charles led! But not even
Aunt Emily's terrible energy could put
into her husband's gentle, artistic, un-
commercial soul, a single gust of the
Stormy ambition which blew like a tor-
nado in her harried heart. Uncle
Charles hated all business desperate-
ly, and found the only pleasure in his
life in his children.
My mother always said that those

three Burton children would certainly
just have wasted away, if it had not
been for their father at this time. He
had as great a gift for calming ana
cheering them as their mother had for
damping the very life out of them.
Whenever Aunt Emily was away from
home for a few hours, and Uncle
Charles was there with the children,
what a good time they had in those
short hours of respite, Uncle Charles
in an easy chair, the children piled
on top of him, his arms around them
tight, while they had what they called
a "visit." This meant a chatter of
little voices, birdlike and free, which
Aunt Emily had never heard in her
life. Or perhaps they'd all sing to-
gether, for they had inherited Uncle
Charles' gift for music.

If he had only had time he would
have given piano lessons to all the
children. But, dear me, he had no
time except for that account keeping,
and they had no money to pay a pro-
fessional music teacher. Uncle
Charles always looked ten years
younger after such a visit with his

wifereas S ctin morning
stwilt with the (Thildren in tile house.
.11ways made Aunt Emily look a thou-
sand yt ars old. "they wore on her so,"

I they upset so the pert ect order of her
!Will ierfully kept house. And yet they

did their best not to wear on her, by
keepIng away from her as much as
possible. They never went lanne from
school until it was actually supper-
time. and always played in our yard,
not their own.
The result WIlS that Aunt Emily was

left quite to herself in a Sahara des-
ert of lonely housekeeping and des-
perate economies with the poor pit-
tance which was all that Uncle
Charles could earn. Her thin face
grew grim and dark, as she mended
and Patched and turned and dyed and
reyormed miracles on tough necks of
mutton and cheap curtain materialg.
All of it she did with superlative skill
but burning and raging inwardly (and
many times not so very inwardly)
against the necessity of doing it at all,
and crying out bitterly with 'many fits
of hysterical tears that she was killing
herself for her family, and nobody
gave her a bit tg credit for it.
Oh, yes, evM•yhody dodged when

Atha Emily hove in view, father as
much as the rest, in spite of all his ex-
tenuations. Whenever we did have to
fie there, on unavoidable errands, we
children would stand hi the doorway,
and assure her volubly that we
couldn't come in, because our feet
were muddy. This brought about the
desired result of being told severely
to hurry along then, and not get the
whole house cold, with that door stand-
ing open.
Then came the climax in their mis-

fortunes, as if they were not already
sufficiently singled out for misery.
Uncle Charles fell on the stairs, and
hurt himself terribly, threw several
vertebrae out of position, I believe, so
that he lay almost wholly paralyzed
from the waist down. And not a penny
of savings to pay the doctor, not even
for the grocer's bill at the end of the
month. It was disaster, absolute black.
irreparable disaster. Aunt Emily was
stunned into silence, a dreadful gray
silence, as of some one whose grudge
against fate is rising to mania. I re-
member hearing father say to mother,
after he came back from his turn at
spending a night of care for Uncle
Charles, "I'm afraid of the woman, I
positively am. She looks as though
she'd go mad." "Well, it's not out of
sympathy for her poor husband, that's
sure," mother answered acidly.
What do you suppose was the result

of that terrific accumulation of emo-
tion in Aunt Emily? What was the
momentous, tremendous decision to
reach which, in 1885, it was necessary
for her to rise to that pitch of frenzy?
Why nothing more nor less than this
. . . and in those days it was a de-
cision both momentous and tremen-
dous for any married woman with chil-
dren . . . she put on her bonnet,
yes, bonnet, it was in the last days of
bonnets, when only young girls wore
hats . . . and marched down town
to ask for work in Emery's Emporium.
She got it, of course. Even if it had

not been Aunt Emily, the humane head
of the firm would have felt under some
obligation to the wife of a faithful em-
ployee of such long standing. And in
addition to this, it was Aunt Emily
. . . of course she got what she

went after.
She was put . . . well, I don't

know that I ever heard just in what
small corner she was put at first, as
an experiment; something easy and
simple to suit her supposed inexperi-
ence of business and her supposed
feminine incapacity for it. The life at
home was organized somehow, any-
how, as best they could with different
cousins taking turns to go in and help
out with the work. Uncle Charles did
not suffer any pain, and was quite
himself as far as his head was con-
cerned, his body like a log in the bed,
but his eyes bright, his fine sensitive
face pale, but calm and philosophic as
always. He was quite able to direct
the children as they dressed and un-
dressed themselves and studied their
lessons and learned to do the house-
work,
As Uncle Charles got better so that

lie could sit up in bed, things ran more
smoothly. His bed was moved down
to a corner of the dining room, where
he could look into the kitchen. He
could work with his hands now, which
he had always loved to do, and they
were never still from morning till
night. My father gave him a wheeled
tray which was always piled with
work, done or to be done. He did all
the mending and darning and he and
Phoebe did the cooking and the kitch-
en work together. The children all
brought their school books to their
father's bedside, and "did" their les-
sons there, to a running accompani-
ment of such sympathetic, helpful Corn-
meats from him, as they'd never
known before. By mid-winter of that
year, Uncle Charles was well enough
to sit in a wheeled chair, which Aunt
Emily bought out of the first raise in
her salary, and presented proudly to
him on Christmas day. After this, he
was all over the house at once, active
and cheerful.
He always sat beside Phoebe, as she

practiced her music lesson, to listen,
to play the bass in a simple duet, and
to teach. My mother says she never
saw a child get forward with her mu-
sic as Phoebe did, after her father be-
gan to teach her. In no time she was
playing the accompaniment for his
light, clear baritone, and then the little
house rang with music like a shell
with the murmur of the sea. We all
used to love to go there, as soon as
school was over to "have a concert."
Sometimes they sang Scot^h airs
. . . the tears we have shed over

"Loch Lomond." the zest for batti
poured into us by "Scots whim' oi.
!t might be Irish, . • how we faiye

laughed over "Father O'Flynn," and
yelled out the chorus of the "Cruis-
keen Bawn"; . . or negro. There
never was anybody who could sing
"spirituals" like Uncle Charles. Oh,
they were great concerts, we'll never
forget.
And what was Aunt Emily deing all

this time? You know as well as I do
what Aunt Emily was doing. She was
rising like a rocket through every
plane of the management of Emery's
Emporium. She was passionately in-
terested in her work, because she
could use it to serve her ambition;
and because she was passionately in-
terested in it, she mastered it, and
owned it, and put it in her pocket.
Everybody in that line of business in
that part of the country soon knew
her; she was hail-fellow-well-met with
all the traveling men, who liked her
bluff manners and sharp tongue,
feared her piercing eye, and respected
her capacity always to get the better.
of them.
She was detested but admirably

served by the staff of the store, i'-114-5
were bewildered by her really inhu-
man capacity for endless exactitude
of detail, angry at the everlasting high
tension of her demands, but placated
by the growing fame of the Store, AO
by her instant recognition of business
ability in a subordinate. "Business
ability!" How Aunt Emily adored
it! What a starved, wolflike appetite
she had for all that it stood for. How
Intensely she lived in her new life!
Before long she had developed a

new line, advertising (this was before
the modern science of advertising was
dreamed of) and while I dare say it
would be an exaggeration to claim
that she was the first to expand the
present principles of psychological ad-
vertising, I know a good many people
who think she came very near doing
so. Merchants from other cities came
to see her window displays, and talked
with her about advertising. Aunt
Emily, who never did anything for
nothing, soon saw that she had a mar-
ketable product there, and proceeded
to put it on the market. She organ-
ized what I'm sure was the first ad-
vertising agency, and ran it in odd mo-
ments of her busy days.
She was up and off to work early,

reading the morning paper as she ate
breakfast, which Uncle Charles had
seen to. Then they saw her no more
till night, when she came home walk-
ing strongly In the door, looking very
distinguished and chic in the beauti-
fully cut tailor suits of the best mate-
rial that money could buy . . . I
mmii speaking now, of course, of the
times after that difficult beginning.
That period lasted, after all, only till
she could get her bearings In the new
world. Very soon, she was earning
more money than Uncle Charles
had ever dreamed of making. By
the time Uncle Charles was around
on crutches, there was a good
competent girl in the kitchen. This
left Uncle Charles more time and
strength to give to the children, more
leisure to perfect his own music, and
more energy to plan the thousand in-
genious variations, on the theme of
domestic life which made their home
the most delightful one to visit in, you
can imagine.
Aunt Emily fitted in it all very com-

fortably. She was always agreeably
tired by night, and relieved of her sur-
plus energy, she was astonishingly
good-natured and easy to get along
with. There was plenty of money
these days, for competent help, which
Uncle Charles managed smoothly;
there was plenty of money for good
clothes, and good food, and nice china,
and pretty glassware, and fine linen.
all of which Aunt Emily enjoyed with
a hungry pleasure which was never
blunted by ceaseless repetition. She
was happy for the first time in her
life, Aunt Emily was, and although
she was by this time, middle-aged and
gray-haired, she was handsomer than
she had ever been in youth. She grew
and grew in acumen and business abil-
ity, and ripened with experience, till
our small city was not big enough for
her. She soared off to New York,
carrying the family with her to an ex-
pensive apartment, and from there to
Paris, where they lived for many
years, Aunt Emily being the Paris rep-
resentative of a great New York de-
partment store.
To the day of . his death Uncle

Charles always kept the children close
to his heart, and directed their growth
just as lovingly and wisely as ever.
Phoebe is a professional pianist now,
well known all over America and Eu-
rope. For years she was usually com-
panioned by her father, crutches and
all. Charlie is a successful architect,
with a lovely French wife and two
babies. It was beautiful to see Uncle
Charles with his grandchildren!
Bobby would certainly have gone
straight to the dogs, if he had not had
the most inspired handling at his fa-
ther's hands. He was a wild, tempera-
mental, unreasonable, warm-hearted,
hot-tempered boy, who could not get
on an instant with his mother. But
Uncle Charles held to him through
everything, made a man of him at last,
for he is a noted field worker for the
New York Natural History museum.
This story sounds as though It were

petering out, doesn't it, and as though
this was about all there was to it? But
there is something else, something I
never told anyone but father. It was
the great shadow secret of my child-
hood, something father and I knew,
and nobody else. But now that-Uncle
Charles and Aunt Emily are gone, T
can tell it.
This is what happened: When I

was nine years old (about three years
after Uncle Charles' accident) I
chanced to stay at their house over
night. I had a bail dream, out of
which I woke up with a start, and un-
able to get to sleep afterward, I got
• "t oi lied ,nil ‘vandered to the win-
dow to look out into the moonlight.

And, there in front of the house, walk-
ing round the garden paths, what do
you suppose I saw? You will never
guess. I saw my Uncle Charles, walk-
ing nimbly and briskly without his
crutches.
I went home the next morning in a

maze of bewilderment, and climbed up
to my father's attic study. Speaking
all in an excited hurry, I told him
what I had seen. His first expression
was one of utter amazement, "Your
Uncle Charles walking without his
crutches!"
And he fell into a long, thoughtful

brooding silence, looking over my
head, and not listening to my rush of
exclamations. Finally he glanced down
at me, with a strange, anxious look
and with a voice of deep earnestness,
such as I have never heard addressed
to me before, as though something of
terrible importance depended upon
me, upon me! - ••• • • -

ten -my darling," he said
urgently, "you must never, never,
never tell anybody else what you have
seen. Promise me you will never speak
of It again, not even to me. Just put
it right out of your mind, as if you
had not seen it. Lift your hand and
promise."
As scion as I could recover from my- -

awe at the solonnity of his look, I
lifted my hand and promised, and a
silence fell between 7 -At
Then I said, "Father, please, I want

to ask just one thing. If Uncle
Charles doesn't need his crutches
. . ." But I got no further.

"Doesn't need his crutches . . .
what are you talking about?" ex-
claimed my father. "He needs his
crutches! What in the world makes
you think he doesn't need his crutches?
He couldn't get along a minute with-
out them."
I stared at him, beside myself with

astonishment. My father went on:
"They are his only defense against the
Inquisition."
"The Inquisition," I faltered, "West-

ward Ho" in my mind, "We haven't
any Inquisition in America."
"Oh, yes, we have," said my father.
I struggled up through the over-

whelming flood of my bewilderment,
till I could get breath enough to speak,
and protested, "But father, the only
inquisition I ever heard of is . . .
you know, that thing that tortures peo-
ple because they don't conform to the
religion of the particular country
they're in."
"Well, that is the kind we have in

America, all right," said my father,
"and if it weren't for your Uncle
Charles' crutches, It would seize right
on him and torture all his family, in-
cluding Aunt Emily."
"I don't understand a word of what

you're saying," I cried out desperately.
"Well, maybe you will, sometime,"

answered my father.

ESSENTIAL TO MAKE CHOICE

Excellent Advice Which Young Mother
Will Do Well to Give Deep

Consideration.

Take the case of any young mother
who has two or more children, no
nurse and no maid. Life feels like a
fight. There are certain things in that
mother's life that have to be slighted.
It mustn't be her children. It mustn't
be her husband. And it mustn't be her
charm.
What then?
Her house; her social duties. Put

away all the knickknacks. You can have
more elaborate beauty when your chil-
dren are older. Have simplicity now.
Have your house bare as possible and
get your beauty in harmonious colors.
Have one room where the children's
toys can be dumped, and then have
enough control to think about the dis-
order of that room. Back of all the
clutteredness in this world there is a
law of order. Back of the messiness
of that room is a bigger law of order
than the mere orderliness of a room—
It is the orderliness of a mind that
has decided to keep its charm, its
beauty, its strength, so that there will
be a personality as the mother of that
family instead of just a driven, pa-
tient, sweet woman. Take the dining
room, if you have to, and have a jolly
kitchen and eat there or in the living
room. If you've got a spare bedroom,
take that. Don't be an immaculate
housekeeper—be an irresistible human.
—From the Delineator.

Divided Skirt Is Old Idea.
No one thinks twice today of seeing

a woman in breeches or a divided skirt.
This fashion is much older than that
of the crinoline, for so long ago as the
Thirteenth century women rode astride
In divided garments. In 1568, when
France was in the throes of a terrible
civil war, women again took to divided
skirts for greater ease and comfort in

The third great revival of the fash-
ion was in 1850, when an American
lady, Mrs. Elizabeth Smith, adopted
the much-discussed "bloomer" cos-
tume.
Another feminine fashion much old-

er than most suppose is the form of
hat called the "toque." This was first
worn by ladies of the court of Henry

To Make It Permanent
"Lewd bless mull soul!" exclaimed

good old Brother Buckover. "Yo'
doesn't tell me, sah, dat Jim Dinger,
de gamblin' man, has done fuhsook
his nickerties, 'knowledged de urror of
his ways, axed to be took into de fel-
lership of de church, and begged de
bruddren and sisttihs to pray for him
dat he never backslide?"
"He sho' did, sah!" replied Brother

Lump. "And I advocate dat de dea-
cons take him out and ca'mly and de-
lusively 'sassinate him befo' he slips
ag'in into de sasspole o' sin."—Kan
sas City Star,
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A Small Start often Leads
to a Big Finish,

In this respect many a wealthy man remembers
the penny bank of his boyhood,

Money kept in a teapot pours no interest.

It is much better to put it in a bank and let it
"brew there."

The best crops come from the most fertile soil.

Fertility comes with cultivation. How about
your little BANK BOOK? WE PAY 4 PER-CENT
INTEREST.

TANEYTOWN SAVINGS

BANK
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A Dainty Home
for the Things

You Eat.

C. 0. FUSS & SON

Furniture
Dealers

Funeral Directors
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Well Kept
Food

The health of your family dependa
upon keeping food in a fresh, sani-
tary and wholesome condition. The

WHBUI PE@OV
REFRIGERATOR

with its double insulation and its
metal non-warping, tight-fitting
doors, gives you a dry cold at a
lower temperature than heretofore
thought possible.

Get our booklet,"What You Should
Know About a Refrigerator."

The Belvedere Sales Co.
BALTIMORE, MD.

DISTRIBUTING TAPPERS

Philadelphia Diamond Grid Batteries
BEG TO ANNOUNCE

—any

er on.

that C. E. Dern has been appointed
distributors for this territory. This
Battery Service Station will be equip-
ped to Recharge, and Repair all
makes of batteries. A complete
stock of new and rental batteries and
repair parts on hand at all times.
The Battery Department will be in

charge of Mr. Roland Koons who has
just completed an extensive course of
battery training at our shop in Balti-
more and who is thoroughly capable
of repairing and rebuilding any make
of battery.

Remember this. You can also
buy a long-life, power-packed Dia-
mond Grid Battery at no extra cost.
Come in and see them. We give
prompt, skillful service on any battery

car—any time. Prompt attention will save you money and trouble lat-
Will take old batteries in exchange for new ones.

C. E. DERN
DISTRIBUTOR

TANEYTOWN, MD.
Phone 57-W.

318180818181819100819)81881811318181081:318086X 318481611868.90181868,3113181011301
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All orders promptly delivered by Motor service 1
D. M. MYERS, Propr.

Hanover, Pa,

Monuments and Headstones
to select from

Use the RECORD'S Columns
7- for Best Results.

HIGH STREET

Marble and Granite Yards
Large Stock of New Designs in



IMPROVED UNIFORM INTERNATIONAL

SundaySchool
Y Lesson

(By REV. P. B. FITZWATER, D. D.,

Teacher of English Bible in the Moody
Bible Institute of Chicago.)

Copyright, 1833, Western Newspaper T.Jnioa..

LESSON FOR JULY 1

JOHN, THE BAPTIST

(May be used with temperance appli-
cations )

LESSON TEXT—Luke 3:3-8; 7:24-23,
GOLDEN TEXT—"He shall be great

in the sight of the Lord, and shall
drink neither wine nor strong drink."
—Luke 1:15.
REFERENCE MATERIAL — Matt.

3:1-17; 11:2-15; Mal. 1:1-6.
PRIMARY TOPIC—The Baby, John.
JUNIOR TOPIC—The Man Who Pre-

pared the Way for Jesus.
INTER.MEDIATE AND SENIOR TOP-

IC—The Herald of the Christ.
YOUNG PEOPLE AND ADULT TOPIC

—Character and Work of John, the
Baptist.

John was a great man. In an-
nouncing his birth the angel said,

"He shall be great in the sight of the
Lord." He was not only great in the

Lord's sight, but was great when
measured by the standards of men. In
the teaching of this lesson a survey
should be made of John's life and
work.

I. Birth and Ministry Foretold
(Matt. 3:3; cf. Ise. 40:3).
He was thought about and his work

planned long before he was born. He

came as God's messenger. His life e as
a plan of God. He was said to he a
man sent from God (John 1:6). There
Is a sense in which every life is

planned—everyone is sent from God.
Everyone should remember that God
has something to do with his life.

II. His Character.
1. Humble (Luke 3:4). He did not

seek human praise and commendation.

His supreme concern was to proclaim

the Christ. He did not make himself

prominent—was only a voice calling

upon people to prepare for the Mes-

siah. His person and habits were a
protest against the luxury and hypo-

critical formality of his time.
2. Courageous (Luke 3:7). He faced

a great multitude and struck hard at

their sins. He did not trim his mes-

sage to suit the crowd. He even de-

nounced the religious leaders of his
time and demanded of them fruits
worthy of repentance.

III. His Preaching (Luke 3:3-8)•
1. Demanded Repentance (vv. 3-6).

Suddenly emerging from his seclusion,

he came into the region of the Jordan

as a messenger of God, calling upon

the people to repent In prepared n for

the coming of the Messiah.
2. Demanded Proofs of Penitence

(vv. 7, 8). He insisted that their false

religions be abandoned—their sinful

hearts renovated—showed them that

the vile passions of their souls must

be uprooted. A change of mind, that

is, the turning of the soul from sin to

God, was necessary. This. Is a prepa-

ration vvhich must be made before one

can See and experience the salvation

of God.
IV. Jesus' Testimony to John (Luke

7:24-28). Because John did not see

the interval between the "sufferings

of Christ" and the "glory that should

follow" he was perplexed. Therefore

he sent a deputation to Jesus for light.

The prophets did not see, or at least

did not make elear, the interval be-

tween the erueiexion of Christ and His

second coming. The two events were

so presented as to appear to he In close

succession. John in his preaching has

stressed the mighty judgments which

should take place at the appearance of

the Messiah. The turn things were

taking (he himself being imprisoned

with the eloorny prospect of death).

was in greet contrast to the coming of

the Messiah in fiery judgment—"the

13X is laid unto the root of the trees"

and "the chef( le burned tip with un-

quenchable fire" (Matt. 3:10. 12). The

trend of events puzzled him. It was

not lack of faith, but confusion of

mind that prompted his inquiry.

Christ's testimony defended him

against any such an accusation. Christ

vindicated him against a vacillating

mind because of the storms of persecu-

tion. He was not like a reed shaken

by the wind (v. 24). He had lived a

life of self-denial, therefore he did not

deny his faith in Christ because of the

dungeon (v. 25). Jesus declared that

no greater prophet had arisen. That

which perplexed John was the delay in

judgment—the day of God's patience

while gathering out the Church. This

was a truth not disclosed to the

prophets—that which Paul made

known—because a special revelation

had been granted (Eph. 3:3).
V. The Martyrdom of John (Mark

6:14-219).
While John was in prison Herod had

frequent interviews with him. John

boldly told him that it was unlawful

for him to have his brother's wife. He

did not mince matters even with the

king. This so enraged the licentious

Herodias that she caused his death. He

sealed his testimony with his blood.

Seeking the Name of God.

The Turks carefully collect every

scrap of paper that comes in their way.

because the name of God may be writ-

ten thereon .—Rich t er.

Men of Genius

Men of genius are often dull and

Inert in society; ne the blazing meteor,

when It descends to earth. is only a

stone.—Longfellow.

Prosperity and Adversity.

His that swells la prosperity will be

sure to shrink in adversity.—Colton.

— THE -
CHRISTIAN ENDEAVOR

TOPIC
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Moody Bible Institute Monthly

Chicago, Ill.
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Lessons from the Psalms

Psalm 44:1-8 (Patriotic Consecrati
on

Meeting)

The 44th. Psalm is divided by Dr. F.

B. Meyer in this way:

Verses 1-3—Thou hast helped us.

Verses 4-8—Thou must help us.

Verses 6-16—Thou art not helping

US.

Verses 17-22—We are not conscious

of having done anything to forfeit

thy help.
Verses 23-26--We invoke thy help.

The Psalm recognizes God's control

in all things. History attests His

goodness and the fathers confirm it.

All that we have and are and hope for

is of His goodness and mercy which

follows us all the days of our life. Out

of this recognition there issue the ex-

pressions of confidence found in

verses 5-8.

The word "but" in verse 9 indicates

change; distress and disaster have

come.

The closing verses, 23-26, contain

a prayer for deliverance from difficul-

ty and defeat, so that all the way

through, in prosperity, in perplexity

and in prayer God is recognized as

supreme and sufficient.

The renewal of such faith in God

and of loyalty to His will in communi-

ty and national affairs should charac-

terize this meeting if it is to carry

out the purpose of the committee on

topics and be a "Patriotic Consecra-

tion Meeting."

A movement has just been inaugu-

rated under the name of the "Minute

Men of the Constitution" which gives

promise of rapid growth and great

usefulness. Company No. 1 of the

Minute Men was organized at Evans-

ton, Ill., on the first of May of this

present year. Three thousand five

hundred people were enrolled at the

opening meeting. The organization

stands for the renewal and building

up of respect for law and the Consti-

tution of the United States. It de-

clares that loyalty to the government

of the United States must be above

and beyond that of any other organ-

ization or group of any kind. It is a

movement for good government and

is not launched for the interest of any

political party. It has come into be-

ing largely because the safety of our

great free and constitutional govern-

ment is endangered through aggres-

sive anl minority organizations to

which political leaders and office seek-

ers often surrender.
0

‘The KITCAER
CABOT

(©, 1923, Western Newspaper Union.)

Let us be better nien:

In a world that needs so much

The loftier spirit's touch.

Let us grow upward toward the light
Wedded to wanting to do right

Rather than wedded to human might.

SEASONABLE GOOD THINGS

A salad which is

this season and of
especially good at
materials found

in the home and

market is:
Peach and Grape-

fruit Salad. — On
heart leaves of
lettuce arrange
halves of canned
peaches, fill the
centers with fine-

ly-shredded celery and arrange sec-
tions of grapefruit around the

peaches; sprinkle with chopped

pecan meats and serve with the fol-
lowing dressing: Beat until firm one-
half cupful of cream, add paprika,

one-fourth teaspoonful of salt, two

tablespoonfuls of lemon juice. Place
a spoonful of this dressing on the

peach and garnish with a candied

cherry.
Oatmeal Bread. — Take one-half

cupful of boiling water, let stand un-

til lukewarm, then add one-fourth of

a cupful of molasses, one teaspoonful

of salt. Dissolve one-fourth of a yeast

(-eke in a little water, stir in all the

flour it is possible to put into the mix-

ture, using a spoon; let rise over night

or until light. Pour into a bread pan

and let rise until twice its size. Bake

in a moderate oven for two hours.

Shirred Eggs With Bacon.—Into

ramekins, brushed with butter, place

a tablespoonful of cooked bacon, break

an egg into each cup, sprinkle with

seasoning and set into the oven to

bake just long enough to set the egg.

Hashed Brown Potatoes.—Cut cold

boiled potatoes into small pieces, us-

ing two cupfuls, season with salt and

pepper, cook three minutes In one-

third of a cupful of bacon fat, stirring

constantly. Let stand a few seconds

to brown underneath; fold like an

omelet and serve on a hot platter

earnished with parsley.

Raisin Gruel.—Take a dozen large

raisins, seed, place in a double boiler

and pour over then: a pint of boiling

water; cook for an hour. Strain off

the water and thicken it with one tea-

spoonful of eornstereli dissolved In a

tablespoonful of milk ; stir constantly

while adding, cook ten minutes or

longer, add salt and Istiger to taste. Let

stand until cool, then add one-half

cupful of good trait:.
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THE BEST BOOK

fr HE soft-toned clock on the library

mantle struck twelve, and the little

boy chasing a butterfly, and who lived

In a frame, was just stepping out of

it to run on the broad shelf below,

when he stopped.
Someone was talking. It was the

magic hour, but Little Boy had al-

ways been the only one who took ad-

vantage of it. He looked about the

room—no one was in sight. He must

have been mistaken.

But no, there it was again! "I tell

you I am the best book to read," said

a voice. Little Boy looked at the books

In the case that reached around the
sides of the room. Yes, it was the

books. They were quarreling.

"I have a much handsomer binding

than you. I am quite new, so of course

I shall be the most popular."

"You can never tell the worth of a

book by binding," said an old book

"I Am 'Alice in Wonderland.'"

with a worn cover as it slid out of the

case a little way to be better heard.

"I am the book that is best loved.

I am sure of that."

"Oh, just hear that old book," said

a bright new one leaning far out of

the case. "Why, my dear old book,

you are as old-fashioned as the hills.

I have a story that makes people sit

up all night to read."

"Yes, and as false as is your imita-

tion leather binding," said a real

leather-covered book. "You are fic-

tion. Not a word of truth in you.

Don't brag.

.ia vs) f lets, real true thiugs from

which people can gain knowledge when

they read. I am the most popular

book here, I am sure you will all

agree."
"Goodness, hear It talk," said a shrill

voice and another book leaned out so

far it tumbled on the floor.

"Ha, ha," laughed the other book,

"you are where you belong, on the

floor. You are full of vIse sayings.

hut so old no one ever looks at them

these days. Every one knows them."

Out from the case leaned a red book.

"You seem to forget that people wish

to be amused," it said, "and when

they open my cover they begin to

laugh. I am full of funny sayings and

jokes, so you all can stop your quar-

reling, for I am the most popular book

here."
Little Boy stood listening. He was

afraid the books would all tumble out,

they were so excited, when out from

a book jumped a little girl and, bow-

ing to all the books, she said, "I am

ashamed of you! The idea of quar-

reling about which is the most pop-

ular!"

"Don't you know that there are all

sorts of people in the world and that

they all like different books? If they

didn't, there would he only one book

and then where would you be, for you

must know ttat grown-ups and chil-

dren all love to read about me."

"It is Alice," saI the clock in a

soft voice to Little Boy.

Little Boy had never had a play-

mate; he began to smile. "Alice," he

said, "do come and play with me. Per

haps we can catch the butterfly."

Alice turned around. "Oh, I can't"

she replied. "Don't you know who I

am? I have to be in the story or

there wouldn't he any. I am 'Alice in

Wonderland.' Did you never hear the

story?"

"No; tell it to me," said Little Boy.

"I will have to go back into the

book," said Alice. "but If every one

will be quiet I will tell the story."

And all the books in the big case,

knowing Alice told the truth, slid back

into their places. The clock ticked

very softly while she told Little Boy

her wonderful experiences.

And every night after that at the

magic hour Little Boy left his frame

on the wall to listen to the story of

"Alice in Wonderland," for, just like

all folks, big or tittle, he is never tired

of hearing it.

by McClure Newspaper Syndicate.)

'0 What's in a Name?" 5,V 66

By MILDRED MARSHALL

14;
Facts about your name; its history;

meaning; whence it was derived;

significance; your lucky day

and lucky jewel
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FLORENCE

FLORENCE, signifying flourishing,

can scarcely be separated from

its quaint diminutive flora, Meaii.n,,;

flowers. Flora in mythological legend

was the goddess of the flowers, and

the festivals of Flora or Floralia were

celebrated in the first burst of spring.

In later times, the name of ?torus

was formed from that of the goddess,

and is memorable as that of the proc-

urator whose harshness drove the

Jews to their last rebellion. It is be-

lieved that the feminine Flora came

from this.
There is a church at Florence of

Saints Fiore and Lucille, but other-

wise the first instance of the name is

In Roman-Gothic Spain, where the un-

happy daughter of Count Julian was

called by the Spanish diminutive

Florinda, and thus caused the name to

be so much detested that, while Span-

ish ballads call her La Cava the

wicked, her Christiap name was only

bestowed on dogs.

A Spanish maiden martyred by the

/Moors brought Flora into better repute.

It became Fiore in France, where It

was adopted as a romantic epithet,

and from there it found its way

to Scotland. In the Gaelic, it is

spelled Florie, as t/se island heroine

of the '45 wrote herself. Florentia

was a natural product, and named a

fentinine saint martyred in Diocletian's

seism in Gaul.
The prevalence of the name Flor-

ence, in England, seems to have been

due to so many English girls being

born in the Italian city of that name.

Deeper and dearer honor has been

given to it by Florence Nightingale.

Many fictitional heroines have borne

the name and its derivatives. Blanche-

Geur, meaning white flower, is one

of its forms, and was bestowed

on Sir Trystan's mother. Versions,

particularly romantic, are found with

Ariosto's two heroines, Fiordespina

(thorn flower) and Fiordilizi (fieur

de lys).
Florence or Flora, used by the Irish

peasantry, become Fingnan or Fincen.

Florrie and Flossie and perhaps even

Lora, are purely American diminu-

tives.
The carnelian is Florence's talis-

manic gem. Its warm, bright color is

said to dispel timidity and give cour-

age, vitality and animation. It like-

wise brings good luck to the bearer

of the name. To dream of it, how-

ever, signifies impending misfortune.

Florenee's lucky day is Saturday, and

1 is considered her liteky number.

(Q by Wheeler Syndicate, Inc.)

; THE ROMANCE OF WORDS

"BEDLAM"

ssIQEDLAM," the word by

which we now designate

a hubbub, an excited crowd or

an uproar, bias been derived not

from "Babel," as might be ex-

pected, but from "Bethlehem,"

the name of an insane asylum in

London and formerly one of the

most abominable torture-houses

of the British capital.

"Bethlehem" itself dates back

to 1247, when Simon Fitz-Mary,

a sheriff of London, founded a

priory dedicated to St. Mary of

Bethlehem. Everyone connected

with this institution was com-

pelled to wear a black robe, with

a single star on the breast, In

memory of the star which guided

the Magi to the stable at Bethle-

hem. Some three centuries lutes

a London tailor named Stephen

Gennings offered to start a fund

to purchase the House of Bethle-

hem and turn it into a hospital

for the insane, hut it was not

until Henry VII made a gift of

the house to the city of London

that it became an insane asylum.

Owing to the fact that lunatics

were considered at that time to

he possessed by devils, Bethle-

hem was made a place of chains,

manacles and stocks, while all

manner of hideous tortures were

devised to rout the evil spirits

which haunted the bodies of the

living. During the Sixteenth

century the place became so

filthy and loathsome that no one

would enter It and It fell into de-

eay, to be renovated in 1675,

when a stone image of madness,

carved in the likeness of one of

Cromwell's doorkeepers, was

placed on the outer wall. In the

literature of the day we find that

the name of the asylum is short-

ened, first to "Bethlem." then to

"Bedlem" and finally changed to

"Bedlam," in which form It re-

mains.
(C) by Wheeler Syndicate, Inc.)
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Many Coming to Baltimore for
These Wonderful Electro-

Therapy Treatments
The amazing stories of marvelous relle

from pain and freedom from disease, after
years of suffering, resulting from these
wonderful new Electro-Therapy treat-
ments have spread all over Maryland, and
people from all pat ts of the State are com-
ing to Baltimore to consult Dr. Reger, th •
famous specialist in Electro-Therapy. so
many people have been benefited and
healed by Eleetro-Therapy. after doctoring
for years without getting any better, that
nobody should be discouraged. If the very
first treatment does not show what can be
done, it does not cost yoU one eent. THE

The Reger Institute is the largest institu-
tion of it. kind in Maryland. Chartered by
the State of Maryland and highly endorsed
by prominent men and women in Baltimore
and throughout the State. Dr. Reger was
formerly in the lUntted States Medical Corps.
and is a medical practitioner and diagnosti-
cian of proven and well-known ability.

It is only because of the large numbers
constantly availing themselves of these won-
derful new treatments that the cost of them
is brought down so low that even the hum-
blest wage-eariaer can afford them. The best
medical authorities agree that ordinary phys-
ual diagnosis is not sufficient in many cases
to reveal the actual cause of the ailment.
Hence Dr. Reger uses the latest and most
powerful Fluoroscopic X-Ray, which, with the
marvelous diagraphoscopic attachment, en-
ables him to see into arid through the body

REGEH INSTITUTE
338 N. Charles St.,
BALTIMORE. MD.

SPECIAL X-RAY F:XA3IINA-
TION OFFER.

How the X-Ray delves deep
Into the human body and dis-
closes the hidden causes of dis-
ease is one of the wonders of
medical science.
In addition to the special re-

duced rates now being made
Dr. Reger offers his regular 165
examination, including the X-
Ray, thorough physical examina-
tion and diagnosis, for $1 to all
who begin treatment now.
If you have been ailing a long

time, or if you have some trou-
ble that does not seem to hu-
mpy° under ordinary treatments,
now Is 3 our opportunity to give
this new method a trial, and a
short time may show you how
needless Is all your suffering.
By discovering some hidden

cause of suffering which could
not have been found without the
use of an X-Ray. Dr. Bauer's
examinations have attracted
widespread Interest and have
started scores of sufferers on
the road to recovery.
Dr. Reger' s office hours at

The Reger Inktitnte of Electro-
Therapy, 338 North Charles St.
(occupying entire four-story
building), are daily, 8 A. M. to
4 P. M.: evenings, 8,30 to 8.80.
(No evening hours on Tuesdays
and Fridays and no Sunday
hours.)

SANALT
“THE SENSIBLE TONIC"

Regulates Stomach, Bowels
and Liver—Enriches Blood

ONE OF THE

A GUARANTEE OF QUALITY

Line of Home Remedies

Robert S. McKinney,
Wholesale and Retail

Distributors.
4-20-tf
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IJOSEPH L MATHIAS

MEMORIALS
300 in Stock to select

from
Buy where you can see

the Goods.
WESTMINSTER, MD.

PHUNE17

WESTERN MARYLAND COLLEGE
WESTMINSTER. MD

ALBERT NORMAN WARD, D. D., LL. D., President
.

For Young Men and Young Women in Separate Departments

Fifty-seventh Year Begins September 17, 1923.

ADMISSION. Graduates from approved four year High Schools

admitted without conditions. Fifteen units required.

MODERN CURRICULUM. Eight courses leading to the A. B.

degre are offered. Grouped about one of the following sub-

jects as majors: English, History and Political Science, Math-

ematics and Physics, Chemistry and Biology, Modern Lan-

guages, Latin and Greek, Education, Home Economics. Special

courses in Speech, Voice and Piano. Unit of Reserve Officers'

Training Corps is maintained by the Government.

LOCATION unexcelled. 1000 feet above the sea in the highlands

of Maryland. Pure air, pure water, charming scenery. One

hour's run from Baltimore, two from Washington.

EQUIPMENT complete. Thirty acre campus; sixty acre college

farm; modern buildings; comfortable living accommodations;

laboratories; library of 15,000 volumes; gymnasium; power and

heating plant. New athletic field, costing $50,000 now in use.

New Dormitory, costing $150,000 recently completed.

BOARD and TUITION $400.00.

Prospectus for 1923-24 on application 6-22-3mo

Read the Advertisements.



TANEYTOWN LOCALS
Brief Items of Local News of Special
Interest to Our Home Readers.

Mr. and Mrs. James M. Haugh will
replace their burned buildings, which
were only partly insured.

Herbert Smith was operated on for
appendicitis, on Wednesday of last
week, at Frederick Hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. John W. Stouffer, re-
turned home on Tuesday, after a ten
day's trip to Philadelphia and Atlantic
City.

Miss Beulah Englar spent the week
at sbury Park, N. J., and will re-
turn home for the summer, this Sat-
urday evening.

Dr. F. T. Elliot and family, and a
number of other relatives, visited Mr.
and Mrs. Lewis Elliot, near York
Springs, last Sunday.

Wheat harvest is well under way,
the grain having ripened pretty uni-
formly, and promises to be good, both
ir yield and quality.

Mrs. Curtis H. Reid returned home
from the Hospital, on Saturday and
is undergoing treatment, in the care
of Miss Flora Spangler.

No game of ball here, on Saturday,
or on July 4. The next game will be
on Saturday, July 7, when Westmin-
ster again visits Taneytown.

Mr. and Mrs. Francis C. Yingling
and famiti; 'and Mr. Bagget, of Balti-
more, spent Sunday in Littlestown,
Pa., with Mr. and Mrs. Gus Crouse.

Roger Birnie Horgan returned to
New York, on *Thursday, after a
month's stay in Taneytown. Misses
Elizabeth and Mildred Annan accom-
panied him as far as Baltimore.

Mrs. Mary L. Motter is at the Sau-
ble home for the month of July. She
reports that Mrs. Cunningham had a
bad fall, last week, at her home in
Washington, and will be housed up
for a while.

No, the closing of stores on Wed-
nesday afternoon is not specially on
account of Baseball. Wednesday is
a kind of "off day" anyway, and those
who work in stores are entitled to a
little out-of-doors in addition to Sun-
days.

Misses Vesta and Gladys Zepp, and
Miss Mary Ohler are attending sum-
mer school at College Park, and Mrs.
G. May Fouke, Misses Helen Bostion,
Edith Eyler, Carrie Novella Harner,
Iva M. Hilterbrick and Pauline Study,
are at Towson; Miss Margaret
Shreeve, at West Chester Normal.

B. T. Bower, of near Harney, was
given a surprise, several weeks ago,
in honor of his 73rd. birthday. Ten
of his children with families, were
present; also Rev. Wachter and fam-
ily, and Jacob Bowers, a brother, who
is 83 years old.

Taneytown baseball "fans" were
given the opportunity on Wednesday
afternoon, for an exhibition hilarity
that does not often come in such
a large dose. It was an occasion like
Byron must have had in mind when
he wrote, "On with the dance! let joy
be unconfined."

Dr. and Mrs. F. H. Seiss have
bought another home in Washington
—3812 Eighth St., N. W.—to which
they will remove the first week in
July, but will retain their first home,
as an investment. The new one is
semi-bungalow, with modern improve-
ments.

Our lights were "off" on Saturday
evening and night, and Sunday eve-
ning during the rather light electrical
disturbance. Perhaps no fault can be
found for this, especially considering
the long line over whicja "trouble"
may occur; but it at least gives an-
other instance of the objectionable-
ness of long distance current. Some
day, Taneytown must have its own
plant.

Dr. Walter M. Charlesworth, wife
and daughter, of Los Angeles, Cal.,
who visited the Shrinc s Convention,
in Washington, are so pleased with
this section of Maryland that the Dr.
has decided to locate in gestminster.
He is a Chiropractor, am' expects to
open an office in Taneytown, two or
three days a week, if he can secure
desirable rooms. He was here or
Monday, looking around.

(For the Record.)
Those who spent Sunday at the

home of Mr, and Mrs. Harvey Lock-
ner and family, of Mount Pleasant, on
Sunday, were; Walter Bowers, wife
and daughters, Edith, Catherine and
Emma, of Black's School-house; El-
mer Crumpacker and George Crum-
packer, Ernest Parker and Mr. Fogle,
all of York; Cleason Erb, wife and
son, William, and George Myerly and
wife, near Sell's Mill, spent Monday
evening at the same place.

Mrs. E. M. Dutterer has resigned
as saleslady in Koons Bros. store.

Miss Mildred Annan let Thursday
on a visit to Mrs. Dennis Smith, of
near New Windsor.

Miss Rose Smith left, on Thursday,
for Washington, where she will be-
come an Ursuline Sister.

Miss Ethel Sauerhammer has re-
turned home from her teaching posi-
tion at Lansdowne, for her summer
vacation.

All of the new dwellings on the Bal-
timore street extension are well under
way, and will soon take on finished
appearance.

There is no special event, of which
we are aware, scheduled for Taney-
town, on the 4th. Too busy a time
for the farmers of the district.

Potatoes, and vegetables generally,
have been greatly injured by the long
continued heat and drouth, and the
corn is also short for this time of the
season.

It seems to be reliably stated that
Thomas Bennett & Hunter will begin
a contract, next week, for placing
shoulders and a macadamized top on
three miles of state road adjoining
Taneytown, and that the work is to be
completed in six weeks.

The P. 0. S. of A. elected the fol-
lowing officers- on Thursday night:
President, Chas. Stonesifer; Vice-
Pres., Kenneth Koutz; M. of F., M. C.
Fuss; Conductor, Sherman Gilds;
Guard, Emmanuel Harner; Delegates
to State Camp at Havre de Grace,
Rev. L. B. Hafer, Chas. 0. Fuss, Chas.
Stonesifer, Milton Ohler.

For the benefit of inquirers, and to
settle an argument, the big fire in
Taneytown that destroy--I The Record
O id, auch other , ioperty, oc-
curreu on Friday night, November 26,
1897, or 25 years ago last November.
The loss at that time, was estimated
at $25.0(10. It will be recalled that
the standpipe was full of water, but
the hose had not yet arrived with
which to use it.

CHURCH NOTICES.

Sunday services, Church of the
Brethren, New Windsor, in College
Chapel: Mission Study Class, 8:45 A.
M.; Sunday School and Bible Study,
9:45; church services, 10:45; Christ-
ian Workers' meeting, 6:45 P. M.;
followed by song service at 7:20;
preaching at 8.

Reformed Church, Taneytown—S.
School, at 9:15; Service, at 10:15; C.
E., at 6:30. No evening service.
Keysville—Sunday School, at 1:00;

Service, at 2:00.

Emmanuel Baust Reformed Church
—Saturday, 2:00, Mission Band. Sun-
day, 9:15, Union Sabbath School;
10:30, Morning Worship; 8:00, Young
People's Society.

Uniontown Lutheran, St. Paul's-
9:30, S. S.; 7:30, C. E., Missionary
Society, Thursday, July 5, at 2:30, at
Mrs. J. E. Newman's.

St. Luke's (Winters)-9:30, S. S.;
10:30, Worship and Sermon; Aid So-
ciety, July 7, at 2:00, at Mrs. Ella
Lantz's, New Windsor.
Mt. Union-1:30, S. S.; 2:30 P. M.,

Preaching; 7:30 C. E.

Uniontown Church of God-9:00,
S. S.; 10:00 Preaching Service. Theme
"Abraham offering up his son Isaac."

Frizellburg-2:00, S. S., the pastor
will teach the lesson; 7:30, Ordinance
Service.

Pipe Creek M. P. Church, Union-
town-9:30 S. S.; 10:30, Morning
Worship. Theme "Ye must be born
Again." 8:00, Evening Worship. All
welcome.

In Trinity Lutheran Church next
Sunday morning the pastor will have
for his sermon topic, "Where We
Cannot See." The congregation will
join with the other churches in the
evening service in the United Breth-
ren Church.

U. B. Church, Harney—S. School,
9:00; Preaching, 10:00; Holy Com-
munion at this hour. C. E., in the eve-
ning, at 8:00. The nature of this
service will be an "Auto Race."
Town—S. School, 9:30; Union Ser-

vice in the evening, at 7:30. Sermon
by Rev. Paul Shettle, Walkersville,
Md. C. E., Saturday evening, at 8:00.
Holy Communion morning of July 8.

Presbyterian, Town—S. School, at
9:30; Preaching Service, 10:30; C.
E., at 6:45; Union Service at U. B.
Church, at 7:30.
Piney Creek—Sabbath School, at

1:06; Preaching Service, at 2:00.

*lion Services for Taneytown.

F. -'wing the custom of many
years past the churches of Taneytown
will ...old union services on the Sun-
day evenings of July. The schedule
will be as follows:
July 1, United Brethren Church,

with sermon by Rev, W. C. Wachter,
or a visiting minister.
July 8, Presbyterian Church, with

sermon by Rev. L. B. Hafer.
July 15, Lutheran Church, with ser-

mon by Rev. Guy P. Bready.
July 22, Reformed Church, with

sermon by Rev. G. W. Shipley, D. D.
July 29, a union service by the C. E.

Union of Taneytown. The time, place
and other details will be announced
later.

All the services except the last will
begin at 7:30 P. M.

(Continued from First Page.)

$43.41, graded $40.26, High School,
$111.80; for Carroll County, rural
$35.39, graded $34.93, High School,
$114.40.
12—The chief item of school ex-

pense in proportion to numbers en-
rolled must be charged to our large
number of rural schools. Many of
these schools have barely a sufficient
number of pupils to keep them open
under the law. The figures in the
State report show that in Carroll the
average number of pupils to a rural
teacher is 22.6, and to a grade teach-
er 27.4, and in consequence more
money must be apportioned to the
rural school than the attendance war-
rants. In many cases the farmer
who is the beneficiary of this system
of rural schools, would assist mater-
ially in decreasing the cost of educa-
tion by agreeing to the elimination
of many of our rural schools and pa-
tronizing the consolidated school, thus
receiving for his children a far super-
ior type of instruction and lessening
his own taxes at the same time.
13—The Board of Education is in

entire harmony with the Board of
County Commissioners in its desire
to keep down school expense and fav-
ors a reorganization policy such as it
promulgated in 1917. This policy
includes these salient principles.
14—Constructing adequate school

buildings or portables in the general
centers of the county, and transport-
ing by some means all children who
are accessible by our state road sys-
tem to these centers.
15—As it is now, it is costing the

county just as much to educate 22.6
pupils (this year's average in the ru-
ral schools) as it would cost to edu-
cate the 40 pupils allotted to each
elementary teacher under the law. In
some rural schools where the requir-
ed average of 12 pupils has been
barely maintained, those 12 pupils
have proved a costly investment to
the county.
16—There are 37 one-teacher

schools that could be eliminated, and
better provision made for the educa-
tion of the children of these schools,
whose current expense for the past
Year amounted to a little more than
$30,000, to keep them open. It is very
evident that the 700 children involved
could be transported for less than half
of this amount.
17—The Board of Education in

making these announcements of its
policy has no intention to criticize the
Board of County Comissioners, but
simply to lay before the public the
problems it has to face. If the peo-
ple of Carroll County desire to have
their children educated, and continue
to crowd them into the high schools,
then the necessary building facilities
must be provided. As the attendance
law requires all children of elemen-
tary grade to attend school, it follows
that the necessary provisions must be
made for them too, and this is up to
the public. This is your problem as
well as ours. Economy is sometimes
the most costly thing in the world,
when it defrauds our children of their
rights.
18—We as tax-payers feel that the

taxes paid should be spent in the best
way possible and that no more taxes
should be levied for schools than the
amounts necessary to give the chil-
dren of the county a proper education
and to comply with the State law, for
many of the items we have to deal
with is a law of this State, and we are
only trying to carry out the law and
at the same time give to the people
of Carroll County the best schools for
the least possible cost.

J. PEARRE WANTZ, Pres.
J. H. ALLENDER, Vice-Pres.
MILTON A. KOONS.
MRS. MARY FORLINES.
THOMAS SLINGLUFF.

Locals 25 Years Ago.

Dr. C. Birnie left on a visit to his
sister, Mrs. Geo. W. Clabaugh, at
Omaha, Neb.
Wheat harvest was under way, June

25-26.
Taneytown Fire Company attended

its first fire, the burning of stables
owned by Mrs. Helen Englebrecht and
John Renner, and several dwellings
on Middle St., that were in danger
from sparks.

John Kemper, the father of Edward
Kemper and Mrs. 0. T. Shoemaker,
died June 27.
Robert S. McKinney attended the

State Pharmacists Convention, held at
Pen-Mar.
Wm. C. N. Myers and Miss Margar-

et A. Shoemaker, were married, on the
30th., by Rev. A. D. Bateman.

Markets; wheat 75c; rye 40c; oats
25c; old corn, 30c; bran, $18.00; tim-
othy hay, $5.50; mixed hay, $4.00; po-
tatoes, 30c; butter, 13c; eggs, 10c;
hams, 10c.
 11F 

When Time is Limited.

A tourist passing through a village
found that his watch had stopped.
Seeing a little boy standing outside
the general store, he went up to him
and said:
"Can you tell me the time, sonny?"
Just 12 o'clock," was the reply.
"Only 12?" said the tourist. "I

thought it was more than that."
"It's never any more in these parts,

sir," answered the boy. "It goes
up to 12 o'clock and then commences
again at 1."—London Answers.
 • 

Going Out!
"Poor thing! She certainly is up

against it!"
"Financially?,
"No, not that; but with the skirts

growing longer and taboo on paint,
powder, lipsticks and symmetricals.
she's afraid there won't be anything
left of her but herself."

Deined.
"Pa, what is worldly wisdom?'
"Worldly wisdom, my son, Is a per-

fect knowledge of the failings of our
neighbors."

Pluck of a Kind.
"Has that fellow any pluck?"
"He's a pickpocket, they say."

Work Under Difficulties.
Workmen are carrying out repairs

to the masonry at the very summit of
Big Ben, the great Westminster clock
tower in London, which is more than
BOO feet high. A large Tudor rose re-
cently fell from the highest point of
the spire, and to reach the spot it was
necessary to erect a scaffold 100 feet
above the highest gallery. It was then
found that five other roses were loose,
and these have been taken down, re-
paired and refixed. When there is a
strong wind the work has to be sus.
pended.

A Model of Discretion.
"Are you a competent chauffeur?"
"I drove for a man who had an eye

for the ladies and a suspicious wife."
"Well?"
"When I left both begged me to

stay and both meant it."
"You must have brains."

Had Him There.
He—This magazine says that a wom-

an should make herself as attractive to
her husband after marriage as she did
before.
She—Ha! My father always gave

me plenty of money to make myself at-
tractive with. You don't.

Wednesday
All of the Dry

Stores will close
noons, during
remain closed
cery Stores will
6 o'clock. The
4. This is in
force in most
the country.

D. J. HESSON.
KOONS
HARRIS
REINDOLLAR
ROY B.
WM. M.

Closing
Hardware

after-
and

.The Gro-
12 noon tc

be July
custom in

throughout

8z CO,

Goods and
on Wednesday

July and August,
for the day..
close from
first date will

line with the
large towns

BROTHERS.
BROTHERS.

BROS.
GARNER.
OHLER.

MRS. N B. HAGAN.
A. G. RIFFLE.
CURTIS G. BOWER.
S. C. OTT.
S. WHITE PLANK.

Why Do You Gel
Headache?

Defective Eyesight is the
Answer.
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Much human misery is caused by
defects in the eyes. Correctly fitted
Glasses get at the cause and corrects
not one, but thousands of headaches.
If you are troubled come to see me.
We sell only the best and as low in

price as any competitor.

CHAS. E. KNIGHT.
REGISTERED OPTICIAN
TANEYTOWN, MD.

3-16-tf

Farm for Sale
Private sale of large Farm of 196

Acres in Mt. Joy Township, Pa., along
Rock Creek. Good buildings of all
kinds, and plenty of water wherever
needed. About 1% miles northwest
of Harney. Possession April 1, 1923.
For terms and other particulars ap-
ply to—

THOMAS KOONTZ,
6-22-3t Harney, Md.

To Chicken Breeders
Why bury your profits when
Englar's Chick Winner

is a Specific for White Diarrhoea
in yourg chicks. Sufficient in
bottle for 500 chicks.
Price $1.00 per Bottle. Parcel

Post prepaid.

DR. J. F. ENGLAR,
Veterinary Surgeon,
WESTMINSTER, MD.

4-13-tf

NOTICE!
East End Improvement Association

Society, will meet at D. W. Garner's,
Tuesday evening, July 3rd., at 7:30,
for the purpose of transacting im-
portant business. Every member is
requested to be present. To those
building new homes, a double invita-
tion is extended.

By Order of the President,

H. L. BAUMGARDNER.

St===========

1 NEW THEATRE 1
1 :
i Saturday, June 30. 1.
1

WM. DESMOND :
• :i IN •

:
"FIGHTING MAD," :. .

i and Comedy. :
i :
! Wednesday and Thursday, I

:i July 4th. and 5th. •
: :i TOM MIX •. .
: IN •
: "CATCH MY SMOKE" :

: AND .
I "In the Days of Buffalo Bill 1

wi• th—Art Acord.i 
:

Uttititt=====

Taneytown's "Leading Fashion Store"

II
TANEYTOWN, MD.

We Sell
Standard
Sewing Machines

New Summer Merchandise
We are here to supply you with Merchandise

at prices that represent the fairest values possible. 

Summer Dress Fabrics
We have Crepe de Chine, Taf-

feta, Mesaline and Paisley Silks
in the staple colors.

Cotton Voiles.

Including fine printed and Nor-
mandy Voiles 36 and 38 inches.
Fine Ratine for Skirts and one-
piece dresses.

WASH GOODS.

in Percales, wide Zephyr Dress
Ginghams, Silk Stripe, Madras
Shirtings.

WHITE GOODS.

Plain White Organdie, White
Nainsook, White Voiles, White
Poplin, White and Pink Cotton
Crepe, White Pajama check,
White Long Cloth, White and
Colored Indian Head.

r.
Hosiery

Men's, Women's and Children's
Hose, in cotton, Lisle and Silk,
medium and light weights, a
large variety of styles and colors.

Men's New Style Straw
Hats
Men's Dress, Yacht shape,

Straw Hats, fine sennit concealed
stitched toothedege. Natural fan-
cy yacht shape rough straw and
Toyo Jap Panamas.

Summer Underwear
Men's, Women's and Children's.

Women's and Children's Vests
and Union Suits.

Men's and Boys' checked Nain-
sook Union Suits. Men's Balbrig-
gan Union Suits, short sleeve,
ankle length, Balbriggan Shirts
and Drawers.

Shoes, Oxford and Pumps
Our usual big assortment of

1923 styles in Patent Leather,
Vici, Tan and White Canvas.
Ladies' White Pumps, high and
low heels.

Ladies' Patent Leather Vamp,
grey back quarter, one strap,
rubber heels.

Misses' and Children's one
strap Patent Leather Pumps.

Men's and Boys' Oxfords and
Lace Bals, a large line to select
from. Men's Brown, neatly made
Good-Year Welts, perforated tips
latest shape Oxfords. Men's all
Leather Work Shoes. Come and
see them.

Mens Negligee Shirts
made 01 guaranteed washable
materials, cut full, all sizes in
silk stripe, Madras and fancy
Percales, soft french cuffs.

Warner Brothers' Rust
Proof Corsets

Guaranteed not to Rust,
break or tear. It is a practical
Corset, well fitting, long wearing
and economical. All sizes in white
and pink coutil.

Do you need a Suit?
Made to order and Ready-made

Suits. Men can be exceptionally
well dressed, at very low prices
by giving us their order, in
Tweeds, Cheviots, Cassimeres and
Worsteds.

Linoleum and Floor Cover-
ings
Congoleum Rugs, 7x9 and 9x12

Jap Matting Rugs, Brussels and
Wool and Fibre, and Deltox Grass
Rugs, all at special prices.

Our Store will be closed every Afternoon, until Sept. 1st

NOTICE

Big Banana Auction
This Saturday Night.

ABOUT 85 BUNCHES.

Haines' Bargain Store,
HARNEY, MARYLAND.

Certificate of Deposit. I GLASSES
Notice is hereby given that Certifi-

cate of Deposit No. 32,782 for $1200.
dated April 8, 1922, drawn to the or-
der of William A, Naill on The Birnie
Trust Co., Taneytown, has been lost,
and application has been made for the
issue of a duplicate of the same.

6-29-3t WILLIAM A. NAILL.

To Owners of Dogs!
The law requires all owners of dogs

to take out license on or before July
1st. This is to notify all who have
neglected to comply with the law that
they have rendered themselves liable
to prosecution, and to urge them to
procure their licenses from Justices
of the Peace, Constables, or County
Treasurer, without delay.

SAMUEL J. STONE,
6.29-3t County Treasurer.

One may be short sighted in judg-
ment as well as in eyes; so short
sighted that they will not see what
their eyes need. Let me help you
see things in the right light.
Examinations free...Lowest Prices.
Will be at "Central Hotel" Taneytown

THURSDAY, JULY 5th., 1923.

C. L. KEFAUVER,
Registered Optometrist,

Frederick, Md.
11For Sale a Far 55 15 YEARS EXPERIENCE.m 4-13-tf

"Just Different that's all."

Safety First—Buy a Farm. Saler
than Bank Stock.

150 Acre Lime stone farm, improv-
ed by 2 fine houses. House No. 1-
2% Story Brick, 8 rooms and bath,
hard wood floors, electric lights, hot . . .
water boiler cave in cellar, beautiful 1 MS is the time to take
lawn, large shade trees.
House No. 2-2%-story Frame, 8 out short term Fire Insur-

rooms, running water. Both houses
fronting in sight of enterprising town. ance on Hay and Grain

SHORT TERM

CROP INSURANCE,

Large bank barn and all necessary out
buildings, concrete block dairy, under
construction. Now, the lay of this
land is South, every acre of it. The
crops speak for themselves.
TERMS CASH.

Will have over $2,000,000 of Real
Estate for sale. Come let's see what
I have for you. All Real Estate en-
trusted to me will be treated strictly
confidential and will be listed from
the Middle West to the Atlantic.

D. W. GARNER,
Real Estate Broker,
TANETOWN, MD.

Read the Advertisements

for 3 to 6 months, to give
protection while heavy
crops are on hand, before
marketing. Only a few
dollars to make you safe.

P. B. ENGLAR, Agt.

Home Insurance Co., N. Y.
TANEYTOWN, MD.

6-22-4t

Taneytown Grain and Hay Market.

Wheat  $1.00@$1.00
Corn   .85@ .85
Rye   .70@ .70
Oats   .50@ .50

CARROLL RECORD. Rye
ey Iirmaowthy   13.00@ 13.00
 12.00@l2.00
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