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LOCALS AND PERSONALS.

Dr. Samuel Swope returned home
last week, from a pleasant visit to
Gettysburg.

Mr. A. J. Lightner, of Baltimore,
paid us a short visit on Wednesday.
Ile was here looking after his farm-
ing interests.

Mr. T. D. Thomson reports having
a Sun-flower stalk twelve feet high,
eleven inches in circumference, with
thirty-six flowers in bloom, and buds
innumerable.

Mr. W. Jesse Roberts has been ap-
pointed a delegate to the republican
state convention, in place of P. B.
Engler, who cannot attend on account
of editorial duties.

Mr. C. M. Hess left at our office a
bunch of Smith cider crab-apples,
which contains sixteen beauties on
three inches of stem. The tree itself
looks like a large bouquet.

Mr. Jerry Newcomer, living with
Mr. Hickman Snider, was thrown
from a colt on Thursday morning,
and had his right fore-arm broken.
Dr. F. H. Seiss reduced the fracture.

Mr. Harry S. Koons has opened up
the green grocery business at the old
stand. Look sharp, Harry, the
"green goods" business is hard to
handle. We wish you success, and
advise you to advertise.

One day last week, Mr. Emanuel
Overholtzer hauled to town a load of
hay which weighed 4125/bs. This is
remarkable from the fact that it was
done by two horses, and drawn a dis-
tance of three miles, over a hilly road.

We don't want to build a storage
warehouse for the accommodation of
our old exchanges. We do them up
in bundles of 1)0 or over, and offer
them for 15c. This makes the cheap-
est wrapping paper out. Try a bun-
dle.

Mr. Joseph Sloneker of Baltimore
who recently met with a serious fall
from a scaffold, was here during the
week on a visit to his brother, B. 0.
Sionaker. He can move around with
the aid of crutches, but will not be
able to go to work for some time.

The editor extends thanks to Mr.
E. C. Sauerhammer, an enthusiastic
gardener of this place, for a bountiful
supply of perfect tomatoes and beets,
and to Mr. B. 0. Sloneker for a num-
ber of Samoni Prunes, a new and ex-
tremely large and beautiful fruit.

Mr. Milton Rudolph, of Wichita,
Kansas, has just paid a weeks visit to
his sister, Mrs. T. H. Fringer. He
subscribed for the RHoosio, and says
it is the "best paper in the county."
Mrs. Fringer also subscribed for her
brother, P. 0. Rudolph, of Alya,
Oklahoma. 0

A letter to the editor, from Rev. H.
Ditzler, of Mt. Jackson, states that
lie has been ill for over twenty weeks,
and confined to bed for eight weeks.
We hope he will soon be well again,
as this is a long time to be sick, par-
ticularly when one's services are need-
ed in a community.

Cover & Kemper received three car
loads of steers from New York on
Wednesday, which makes eleven car
loads in all which they have had
shipped to this place. On account of
plenty of feed, the number of cattle
which will be fed in this section will
be much larger than in late years.

The public meeting to discuss the
public water supply question, will be
held in the school building this (Fri-
day) evening. Nothing should stand
in the way of securing this much
needed protection to our property, if
it is possible to secure it. The recent
fire at Berlin should .be a warning to
us, and we should act so that we may
avoid the possibility of being visited
by the calamities which other Mary-
land towns have bad in recent years.

The Catholic pic-nic on Wednesday
was a great success, and up to the
standard of those formerly held. The
streets leading to the grove was alive
with vehicles the whole day, and, on
the grounds there was the usual life
and activity displayed in making the
pic-nic profitable and enjoyable.
Refreshments in large quantities were
disposed of, and the dancing floor,
and other attractions, were most
liberally patronized. The crowd was
on its good behavior and no accident
or disorder is reported. The amount
taken in was $425., and the net profit
over $300.

It is to be regretted by subscribers
to Western Maryland Telephones,
that the company and the town offi-
cials of Union Bridge, could not agree
on terms. The principal difference
between them was the length of time
for the privilege of the use of the
streets, the company wanting ten
years, while the officials would only
agree to five years. This is one of the
most important points in the county,
for the RECoan to be in communica-
tion with, and we trust that the
difference will yet be bridged over,
and the subscribers in the place con-
nected with the system.

Where are we at? Will someone
please straighten out this electric
railroad business? The Harneyites
are talking of the road coming from
Gettysburg to their town, and on to
Taneytown and Washington. In
Littlestown, the road is to go to Bal-
timore by way of Union Mills and
Westminster, with a. proposed cross
line from Taneytown to Hanover.
Here, the idea seems to be for the
road to come here from Littlestown.
and then to Westminster or the West-
ern Md. R. Ra by way of Uniontown.
The first thing we know, we'll get
mixed up in these lines, and be "run
over."

Reindollar & Co. has purchased a
new •'Eli" hay press, and a "Peerless"
traction engine, which they send a-
round over the country, with six
hands, and pack hay right on the
farms. This is a mutual advantage
to the firm, and the farmers, because
it saves the farmer the work of haul-
ing so many loads, and enables them
to clean up their whole crop at once
without loss; and it benefits the firm,
because it gives them the hay in a
compact shape for storage. When it
is brought in loose, it makes so much
bulk that it must be packed and ship-
ped, whether the market is satisfac-
tory or not. The press packs one
bale a minute.

NOTES HERE AND THERE.

The carriage factory of E. M. Gil-
bert, Woodsboro, was destroyed by
tire on Monday. Loss $2000.

Emory Grove Camp opened on
Thursday night. On Sunday, Rev.
Sam Jones, the noted evaneelist will
preach, and is expected to attract a
large crowd.

A young son of John Agnew, of
Emmitsburg, was caught in the ma-
chinery of King's ice-cream factory,
and had his clothes torn .off, and his
right leg injured.

On Sunday afternoon, during a
thunder storm, a barn on the farm of
Mrs. Hannah Dutrow, near Union-
town was struck by lightning and
totally destroyed by fire, with its
contents except live stock. Partially
insured.

A fierce thunder-storm passed over
the Middletown Valley on Tuesday
evening, and one inch of water fell.
During the storm Peter Hauver's
barn was struck by lightning and
burned, together with a lot of grain.
No insurance.

We are always glad to send sample
copies to the friends of our subscri-
bers. Whenever you know of some
one whom you think would become a
subscriber if he saw the paper, please
hand in the name, and samples will
be sent free of charge.

Mr. John E. Hurst was officially
notified of his nomination on Thurs-
day, by the committee appointed. He
stated that he would "take up the
matter shortly," which is supposed
to mean that his letter of acceptance
will soon be made public.

It was thought that Governor
Brown would appoint a republican
successor to Judge Hoffman, to act
until the regular election, as his suc-
cessor will undoubtedly be a republi-
can, but it is now pretty certain that
a democrat will be appointed.

The Middletown Valley electric
railroad enterprise is taking another
turn, and now, negotiations are being
made to make Brunswick the rail-
road terminus, if Frederick does not
"pony up." The new line would
take in Middletown, Broad Run,
Burkittsville and Petersville.

Business men of Baltimore fire tak-
ing hold of the proposed Centennial
Exposition in a way that promises
abundant success. Among the latest
subscribers to the stock is the firm of
J. Seth Hopkins & Co., who have
also decided to make an elaborate
display of European wares and art
goods, and of the finest American cut
glass.

The last weather crop bulletin for
northern central Maryland, says;
Corn continues to look well, and if
the dry spell soon terminates, the
crop will be above the average.
Wheat has generally turned out well,
but there are many small yields. Oats
and rye are an average crop, if not
more. The prospects for cloverseed
are probably not above the average.

Mary Holland, a colored nurse in
the family of James W. Orr, Union-
ville, Frederick county, took their
baby into a flouring mill to show the
child the working of the machinery,
and approaching too near the wheels,
her skirts were caught in the cog-
wheels of the main shafting which
hurled her through the air, tearing
the clothing from her body and dis-
locating her right arm at the shoul-
der and also tearing the muscles
loose from the bone. After making
several revolutions through the air
she released her hold on the baby
which fell to the floor unhurt.

All the business portion of the
town of Berlin, Worcester county,
together with many private resi-
dences, was completely destroyed by
fire on Sunday night. The loss is
about $200,000, with a light insur-
ance. The fire originated in a stable,
and is supposed to have Leen caused
by a cigar stub. Very few people
were in the town owing to an ad-
jacent camp meeting. About six
acres have been burned over. There
was but little insurance in the town
owing to the fact that within the last
six months nearly all policies held in
the place have been cancelled, be-
cause the rates of insurance were
raised, on account of the defenseies
condition of the town in case of fire.

There is a telephone war at Wil-
liamsport between the subscribers
and the managers of the Chesapeake
and Ohio Telephone Company. Mer-
chants who have telephones at their
place of business demanded of the
Company cheaper rates in conse-
quence of the bad service rendered
by the company's instruments. They
informed the management that they
desired a reply on or before August
5. They received no reply on that
date,but instead,their telephonic con-
nections were cut off. This will result
in a private line being built between
Williamsport and Hagerstown.

The republican nomination for
Governor is exciting considerable
speculation. The Lowndes men claim
success, with great confidence, while
the Meister supporters are hopeful,
and say their man is gaining every
day. Figuring on the result of the
conventions already held, is rendered
somewhat uncertain, as both sides
claim the unpledged delegations.
Lowndes undoubtedly has the largest
number of sure votes. The name of
Mr. Baker will not likely be present-
ed to the state convention, except as
a compromise candidate. The result
of the primaries in Baltimore city will
be iinportant, and may decide the
contest between 'the two candidates.

Death of Judge Frizell.

Mr. William Frizell, one of the
best-known and most highly respect-
ed citizens of Carroll county, died at
his home in Frizellburg, on Tuesday
morning. He had a partial stroke of
paralysis, which, coupled with stom-
ach trouble at his advanced age, was
the cause of his death. Ha was born
in October, 1818, in the home in which
he died, and consequently was in his
seventy-fifth year. He was an ardent
Democrat and took an active part in
politics.
He served as a "judge of the Or-

phan's Court for Carroll county for
eight Years. Many years ago he was
appointed leather inspector by the
Governor and served in that capacity
for some time. His widow and four
children survive him. Mr. Enoch
Frizell, of Emmitsburg, is one of his
sons, and Caspar and Robert, of Friz-
ellburg, the others. Miss Flora Friz-
ell, of the same place, is time only
daughter.
Judge Frizell leaves considerable

property, and his farm at Frizellburg
is one of the finest in the county. He
was over six feet in height and weigh-
260 pounds. He was splendidly pro-
portioned and was the very picture
of vigorous manhood. His funeral
took (dace from his late residence at
1 o'clock, Wednesday afternoon. A
large concourse of people met at the
house to show their respect for his
memory. Rev. G. W. Seilliamer, of
the Church of God, and Elder Solo-
mon Stoner, of the German Baptist
church, both spoke in feeling terms
of the deceased. The pall-bearers
were Leonard Zile, Abraham Willet,
Howard Welch, Chas. T. Stevenson,
Jacob Zahn, Emanuel Forney, Fred-
erick Zahn and William Heagy. The
remains were taken to Westminster
and interred in the lot at the West-
minster cemetery.

Death of Mrs. Nancy Warehime.

One of the oldest citizens of this
place, Mrs. Nancy Warehime, widow
of the late John Warehiine, died on
Wednesday morning, just before
noon, at the residence of her son, Mr.
Joshua Koutz. Mrs. Warehime has
been confined to her room for a period
of two years, on account of injuries
sustained by a fall, but she was not
seriously ill for more than two weeks.
She was married three times; first

to Michael Koutz, from which union
there is one representative living, Mr.
Joshua Koutz, a well known sitizen;
her second husband was John M.
Foreman, and the third, John Ware-
Wine, who died recently. Her funeral
was on Friday morning, and the in-
ternment in the Reformed cemetery.
She was born May 15th, 1806, and was
consequently in her 90th. year.

Death of William Fleagle.

Intelligence of the death of William
Fleagle, of Cuyahoga Falls, Ohio,
reached.here on Tuesday. Mr. Flea-
gle was a son of Daniel Fleagle, and
was the eldest of a family of thirteen
children. He left this neighborhood
about 57 years ago, and in 1872 set-
tled at Cuyahoga Falls, Ohio. He
was a miller by trade, but of late
years was engaged in trucking. His
widow and a number of children sur-
vive him.
Mr. George W. Fleagle,a well known

citizen of this district is a brother of
the deceased, also, Daniel, living in
Hanover, Pa., and Henry, of near
G•raceham, Frederick county. One
sister, also, is Hying, Mrs. Samuel
Slick, of near this place.

The Electric Railroad.
--

A well attendad meeting of the citi-
zens of the town was held at the
Public school house on last Saturday
evening, for the purpose of effecting
an organization which will represent
the interests of Taneytown in secur-
ing the extension of the proposed
Gettysburg and Washington electric
railway by the way of Taneytown.
This road will, in all probability, be
built, and the time is now here when
our people must awake, and show in
a substantial way that they desire
the road, otherwise it may pass us by.
The meeting was called to order by

Robert S. McKinney. and Dr. C. Bir-
nie was elected chairman, arid A. H.
Zollielsoffer, Secretary. George H.
Birnie then stated the object of the
meeting. The proposed route of the
road, which will take in this place, is,
from Gettysburg along the pike to
Littlestown, then to Taneytown,
Trevanion and Uniontown, to West-
minster, then to Washington.
The company requests that the

right of way along the public roads,
be secured, free of charge, and that a
satisfactory amount b subscribed,
which will be guaranteed by first
mortgage, gold bearing bonds at 6
per cent interest, with the additional
security of a lien on the power house
and the portion of the line now in
operation, The bonded debt of the
road is not to exceed $15,0u0 to the
in lie.
The following committees were ap-

pointed to solicit subscriptions; H. D.
Mehring and C. T. Fringer, from
Taneytown to Littlestown; Dr. G. T.
Motter and A. H. Zollickoffer in
Taneytewn; Benton Brining and
Samuel Stoner, from Taneytown to
Uniontown.

An election of directors of the West-
minster and Union Mills Electric
Railroad was held in Westminster on
Tuesday and resulted in the re-elec-
tion of T. Herbert Shriver, Charles
E. Stewart, John L. Reifsnider,
Charles C. Gorsuch, George W. Al- I
bough, Wm. B. Thomas and E. J.
Lawyer, of Carroll county, and Gov.
Frank Brown and George R. Webb,
of Baltimore, as directors. The board
reorganized and re-elected T. Herbert
Shriver, president; Charles E. Stew-
art. vice-president; Win. B. Thomas,
treasurer, Charles H. Vanderford,
secretary, and Charles E. Fink, coun-
sel. Colonel Anderson, of Washing-
ton, who was employed to promote
the enterprise, has his report ready
and will probably make it on Satur-
day.—Stiss.

Carroll County Republicans.
--

The republican convention of this
county, for the purpose of selecting
five members of the State central
cominittee, and to elect delegates to
represent the county at the state con-
vention at Cambridge on the 15th.,
met in Westminster on Monday. Dr.
U. T. Motter, of Taneytown, was
elected president, and James C. Galt,
John D. Myers, Israel C. Rinehart
and others, vice-presidentA, and Dr.
Luther Kemp and Dr. Morris Wood-
en, secretaries.
The convention throughout, was

harmonious, and solidly in favor of
time nominatiou hi Harry M. Ciabaugh
for Attorney General, and Hon. Lloyd
Lowndes for governos. The slight
opposition to Clabaugh, from Union-
town district, did not oppose the un-
animous adoption of a resolution,
pledging the county delegation to
support him at Cambridge. Resolu-
tions were reported and unanimous-
ly adopted, expressing gratitude at
the signs of returning prosperity, de-
claring positively for a new and just
re-assessment which will equalize the
burdens of taxation, and condemning
the democratic party for having re-
peatedly violated pledges on this
subject.
The convention selected as mem-

bers of the State Central Committee,
to serve for two years; H. M. Clabaugh
W. L. W. Seabrook, William Wood,
Wm. T. Frizell and Joseph A. Stouf-
fer.
The convention conferred upon Mr.

Clabaugh the privilege of naming
twenty delegates to the convention,
the names of whom are as follows;
Dr. Geo. T. Motter, isewis Reese,
Louis E. Shriver A. T. Buckingham,
Asa Hepner, C. J. H. Ganter, James
S. Baer, W. A. Shriver, John W. Kel-
baugh, E. A. Zile, W. F. Cover, F. J.
Devilbiss, J. J. White, Walter R.
Rudy, James W, Beacham, Preston
B. Engler, Thomas A. Barnes, Cleve-
land Anders, Whitfield Stansbury
and Geo. P. Panebaker.

Orphans' Court Proceedings.

MONDAY, August 5th, 1895.—Frank
W. Shriver and Isaac Shriver, execu-
tors of Frapcis Shriver, deceased, re-
turned inventories of goods and chat-
tels and money and list of debts and
received orders to sell goods and
chattels, sell real estate, notify credi-
tors and sell stocks.
George R. Warelihne and Jacob P.

Baltozer, executors of Samuel Ware-
hime reported sale of real estate.
William Y. Frizzell, administrator

of Eliza Dorsey, deceased, returned
inventory of goods and chattels and
received order to isotify creditors.
TUESDAY, August 6th, 1895.—Han-

nah S. and C. Ganser, executors of
Jacob Yon, deceased, received orders
to sell goods and chattels and sell real
estate.
Clara C. Jelly, administratrix of

Alexander M. Jelly, deceased, return-
ed inventory of goods and chattels
and received order to notify credi-
tors
The last will and testament of John

Bushey, deceased, admitted to pro-
bate and letters testamentary granted

I 

to Luther M. Bushey.

P. 0. S. of A. Convention.

The bi-ennial state convention of
the Patriotic Order Sons of America
of Maryland was held in Westminster
on Monday night, all the Camps ex-
cept two being represented. The
convention was called to order by
Senior District President, Warren
Lincoln, of Baltimore, and P. B.
Engler of Taneytown was selected
chairman, and J. W. Robinson of
Sparrows Point, secretary.
The principal business of the con-

vention was the election of one dele-
gate to represent the state at the
National Camp Convention, which
meets in Indianapolis,beginning Sept.
17th. The candidates were Dr. F. B.
Lauderbaugh, of Allegany county;
James Roberts, of Woodberry and
L. D. Reid, of Taneytown. The lat-
ter was elected on the second ballot.
A number of addresses were made,
the principal of which was an elo-
quent effort by H. K. W. Patterson,
of Philadelphia, who is now in this
state in the capacity of National Or-
ganizer. Much enthusiasm was man-
ifested, and the organization seems
to have a bright future in the state.

A Runaway.

(Contributed.)
On last Sunday night the 4th.,

while returning from camp meeting
at Middletown, and while descending
the steep incline which leads from the
woods, a horse which was driven by
Mr. Wm. Garber, of near Union
Bridge, came dashing down the hill
and ran into the rear part of a team,
the occupants of which were Misses
Cora and Grace Arthur and Robert
Arthur Jr.

' 
all of whom narrowly es-

caped death.
Mr. Garber's team had been tam-

pered with by some malicious person.
The harness were cut in several
places, in such a manner as to pre-
vent the horse from holding the ve-
hicle on the incline, and as a result
the buggy ran on the horse which
frightened the apimal, and it became
unmanageable. The team driven by
Robert Arthur Jr. was a short dis-
tance in advance of the runaway,and
thus they collided. The Misses
Arthur were both thrown from the
carriage and Robert fell under the
buggy, it passing over him. Fortu-
nately there were only a few slight
wounds received.
Mr. Garber and the lady with him

escaped uninjured. He thinks some
person had a grudge against him,
and took this method of meting out
his revenge. A person resorting to
such measures of revenge, should be
looked up and dealt with in the most
severe manner.

A Laborer Murdered.

Manchester, Md., August. 8.—A
laborer on the farm of Oliver Ever-
hart, near this place, was murdered
last night by nil known parties. His
body was found in a thicket of un-
derbrush on the farm of Theodore
Tracey, near Melrose, about three
miles north of this place, late this
afternoon. His face was considerably
cut and bruised, and his body con-
tained two large stab wounds in the
region of the heart. Miller was in
Manchester last night in the company
of two strange tramps, and all were
intoxicated and quarreling. He is
about fifty years old and unmarried.
It is reported here that two strange
men called at Hoff's Hotel, at Melrose,
this morning, and reported that they
found the body of a dead man in a
woods near there. They are sup-
posed to be the parties who committ-
ed the deed. Justice J. R. Strevig
summoned a jury of inquest, which,
after viewing the body, rendered a
verdict that Miller came to his death
at the hands of unknown parties.
--Bait. American.

DIED.

Obituaries, poetry and resolutions charged
for at the rate of live cents per line. The reg-
ular death notices published free of charge.

Union Bridge vs. Telephone.

[special to the CA RROLL RECORD.'
It was thought and spoken of as

though Union Bridge would have a
new telephone line in use in the near
future, but we learn, to our disap-
pointment, that there will be no new
'phones in town. We are sorry that
Union Bridge cannot keep up with
beneficial improvements, as do the
other towns around us.
As we understand the matter, there

was a contention between the town
Council and the W. M. Telephone
Company, in regard to an entrance
into the town, the planting of their
poles, and th( trimming and topping
of trees through the streets. The
Council did not see proper to let the
Company plant its poles along time
streets without permission of proper-
ty-holders, and if said Commit should
have allowed them to plant them on
the streets then the property-holders
would again complain.
We think that if the citizens of Un-

ion Bridge who were interested in the
Telephone movement, would have
gone together and held a meeting and
acted fully upon the matter, and then
brought their action before the
Council, there might have been a tel-
ephone line in town by this time. It
looks as though our citizens think
more of our shade trees along the
streets than they do of the benefit
the telephone line would be to us.
Another objection of the Council was
the topping and cutting out limbs of
the trees, which would spoil their
beautiful appearance.
The last objection of the Council

was, that it objected to allowing a
longer limit than five years, and we
understand the Company wanted a
term of ten years. The Council said
it would grant them five years, with
a provison, if it paid or benefited the
citizens of the town during the first
five years. it would grant them five
years longer. This the Company
would not accept; thus the final rea
son why we have no telephone to-day.
It was also stated that the Compa-

aay wanted but one man out of the
three as street commissioner, to ad-
vise in placing the poles, which was
objected to by the Council, which
said that two men should go along if
any went; this did not suit the Com-
pany, and the Council passed the or-
dinance allosyieg them the five years,
which they would not accept. It
looks as thought the Company wanted
all on its side and none for the town.
If the Company will comply with

the plans of the Council, there will
not likely be any further objection to
allowing them to enter the town and
place their 'phones. We further ad-
vise all those who desire to have the
line of the Company in town, to go
together and devise some plan that
will prove beneficial and satisfactory
to all. Wa hope that such action
will be taken in the near future; let
us keep up with our sister towns in
improvements, etc.

FLEAGLE.—On the 6th., in Cuya-
hoga Falls, Ohio, William Fleagle,
aged :9 years. (See special notice.)

FRIZELL.—On the 6th., in Frizell-
burg, William Frizell, aged 77 years.
(See special notice.)

WAREHIME.—On the 7th ., in this
place, Mrs. Nancy Warehime, aged
89 years, 2 months and 22 days. (See
special notice.)

The "Sun" Denounced.

A county convention of Gorman
democrats met in Annapolis on Wed-
nesday, and denounced the Baltimore
Sun in the following resolution;
"Resolved, That this meeting condemes the

course of the 'Baltimore Sun' in its misrepre-
sentation of the political affairs of our county.
For the past year it has striven to divide the
democratic party on false issues, has magnified
and fostered dissension, and in our opinion it
has willfully misstated facts.
The SIM says editorially, in refer-

ring to this action;
"This grieves us, grieves us to the heart. The

Sus feels almost as badly cut up as a judge
would feel who should be condemned by an
offender whom he had just sentenced. But
really we do not think the meeting meant any
harm. Those who voted for the resolution
were simply carrying out orders. Although
the words of their resolution seem harsh, they
were actually very complimentary. What
they intended to convey was something like
this:
"Whereas, in accordance with orib:rs from

Mr. Gorman, we must express our opinion of
the Baltimore Suit, resolved that it is a journal
of too much honesty and indepenience to suit
our ideas,-and that if it keeps on talking out in
meeting, we will be elected to stay at home;
resolved that it has given so truthful an ac-
count of the situation in this county as to en-
courage the friends of honest government and
greatly impair the influence of our local bosses;
resolved that this sort of thing won't do at all,
don't you know, and that that awful Sunpaper
ought to be deprived of free speech; resolved
that we hope these resolutions are in line with
what Mr. Gorman expects; resolved that the
unbought democracy of Anne Arundel county
expects everyman at this meeting to do his
duty; and, therefore, lastly and chiefly, resolved
that this meeting do now _adjourn and take
several drinks, and that the chairman be in-
structed to send the bill to Mr. Gorman, who.
with some others, it is understood, will 'pay
the freight' in this campaign." Signed Peter
Thirsty and John Always Dry."

Proceedings of the School Board.

The School Board met on Monday.
All the members ere present except
Dr. Reindollar.
Several bills were passed and order-

ed paid. Repairs at various school-
houses were ordered to be made.
A committee consisting of Mr.

Slingluff, Mr. Blocher, Dr. Reindollar
and Mr. Anderson was appointed to
audit the accounts of the treasurer
for the last year. The following was
unanhnously adopted:
Ordered, That the Fall Term of

schools begin on Monday, September
9th, and that the County Teacher's
Association meet on Friday, Septem-
ber 6th.
The Board adjourned to the first

Monday in September.

Porters.

The I. 0. G. T. held its annual
pic-nic on Saturday, August 3rd., in
the grove of Mr. H. C. Shipley at
Daniel. Addresses were made by sev-
eral prominent speakers, among them
being Revs. Thomas Wheeler and J.
R. Campbell. The day was spent
very pleasantly, and every one seem-
ed to enjoy himself. Winfield Cornet
Band furnished the music.
Rev. A. A. Kelly, of Messiah church,

preached a Harvest Home sermon on
Sunday last. He chose as his text
the 104th. Psalm, 24th. verse. The
church was beautifully decorated
with stalks of tasseling corn, bundles
of golden grain, and potted flowers.
The sermon was delivered in his usu-
al soul-stirring manner, which coin-
u.anded the strictest attention from
his audience.
The Young People's Missionary

meeting was well attended on Sunday
evening. The meeting was led by
Miss Minnie McKinney. One of the
chief features was a solo entitled
"Down by the sad sea-shore," which
was skilfully rendered by Miss Abbie
Shoemaker.
Mr. and Mrs. Gamber and

Mr. &amber's mother, were visiting
the family of Robert E. Barnes on
Sunday.
Miss Bessie Davis, of Baltimore, is

visiting at Philip Lauterbach's.

COUNTY CORRESPONDENCE.
New Windsor.

One day last week, while Mr. Jacob
Routson,of Smelser's Mill, was plow-
ing out potatoes, he was kicked in
the stomach by the horse, injuring
him so badly that he is still confined
to his bed.
While painting a chimney on the

house of Mr. John Murray, on Main
St., Mr. Chas. Sheets fell from the
roof to a porch below, a distance of
about twenty feet. spraining his
ankle badly, and sustaining severe
bruises on other parts of his body.
The accident was caused by the giv-
ing away of the chimney, to which he
was clinging, while at work.
Messrs. N. H. Baile, Henry Engler,

W. S. Drachm, Nelson A. Brown and
F. J. Devilbiss, were the delegates to
the Republican convention at West-
minster, on last Monday. The dele-
gation was solid for Clabaugh for At-
torney.general.
Mr. Job Hibberd was elected presi-

dent and Mr. Joseph A. Stouffer Vice-
president of the First National Bank
of New Windsor, at the election held
last Saturday. Mr. Hibberd has been
vice-president of the bank since 1886,
and his election to the presidency is
to fill the vacancy caused by the
death of the late Thomas F. Shep-
herd.
The dedication of the new Odd

Fellows's Hall, which was announced
in a former letter to take place on
August 27th., will be held on the
29th., and the pic-nic the same day
in Mr. Smith Snader's grove, near
this place.
Mr. Jesse Devilbiss lia.s secured the

position of traveling salesman for Mr.
F. S. Staley, cigar manufacturer, of
Taney town.

Linwood.
--

Mrs. Sarah Messier, or "Auntie," as
she is called by old and young, was
stricken with paralysis, some days
ago, but at this writing is much im-
proved, We trust she may be spared
yet a few more years, as she is dearly
beloved by all who know her.
Miss Carrie Engler and her friend,

Miss Mary Crisp, from. Anne Arundle
Co., Miss Crissie Firestone of Freder-
ick, and Miss Merle Engler of Balti-
more, spent a very enjoy able time on
the moonlight excursion to Pen-Mar,
chaperoned by Mrs. Jennie Rouzer.
The guests at Linwood Shade, Mrs.

E. L. Shriner's, were pleasantly en-
tertained by Mrs. Jennie Rouzer and
her friends, Miss Crissie Firestone and
Miss Merle Engler, on Saturday even-
ing last. Miss Crissie gave some fine
selections on the piano.
Benjamin Ecker, an old and re-

spected former citizen of this vicinity,
died at his son's residence near
Wakefield, and was buried at Beaver
Dam cemetery on last Sunday a
week
Mrs. Rosa Utz, of New Market,

Frederick Co., and Miss Clara Utz,
are guests of Mrs. Jasper Shriner.
Miss Carrie Engler, and her friend

Miss Crisp, attended the "Amateur
Theatricals" entertainment in West-
minster on Tuesday night.
The latest arrivals at "Linwood

Shade" are Miss Mary Kone, Mrs.
Dell and daughter, Miss Clara Hemp-
son, Mrs. William Sohl and son, of
Baltimore, and Miss Annie Shriver of
Westminster. A party of twelve
visited the Gettysburg battle-field on
Thursday.

Tyrone.

Your Tyrone correspondent has at
last emerged from the harvest field
and taken up his pen to giye you a
few happenings in this locality, The
harvest which has just been gathered
and stored away was a good one, al-
though troublesome to handle, yet it
will compensate the husbandman for
all his extra labor. The corn looks
very promising thus far, but it will
require rain shorly to make a full
crop.
We are writing about the harvest

rather late in the season, but we, as
well as all communities, have some
farmers who are a little slow, and
this takes in the early and the late.
Our farmers are busy preparing for
another crop: many are plowing and
getting out their manure, while
others are spending a few hours each
day babbling with the different phos-
phate agents, and examining differ-
ent grades of their goods.
Miss Jane Sell and Miss Maggie

Foglesong are on the sick list with a
complication of diseases. Dr. Kemp
attends both of them.
The Baust church Sunday school

will hold its annual pic-nic in the
grove of Mr. Rodkey near Tyrone,
on Saturday, Sept. 7th. The Taney-
town band will furnish the ynusic. All
are invited.
Rev. Mr. Spessard has been grant-

ed a vacation for several weeks.
There will be no service on Sunday,
August 18th., and not until Sep-
tember 31st., at 10 o'clock, a. m.

Bridgeport.

Miss Cornelia Humbert, of Balti-
more, is spending several weeks with
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. M. Hum-
bert.
Mr. M. F. Saylor has in his orchard

a cluster of 9 apples growing on a sin-
gle twig 4 inches long; the average
circumference of the appes is 8 inches.
Mr. J. W. Birely, of Frederick, vis-

ited our town this week.
Miss Sallie Thompson, of Lebanan.

Pa., spent part of this week with Mr.
E. F. Smith.
Our genial young cattle dealer,

Mr. Scott Smith, has sold a fine lot of
young cattle to our farmers.
Mr. Andrew Stonesifer has begun

work on the new bridge to be erected
over Aloways creek, near his mill.

Bruceville.

The Bruceville Sabbath School will
hold their pic-nic in the grove of Mr.
James White, on August 10th.
Mrs. Samuel Birley and family of

Baltimore, are visiting Mrs. John
Airing's.
Mrs. Geo. C. Eichelberger and baby,

Ruth, have returned home.
Misses Viola Fox and Ree Fuss

spent Sunday with Miss Fox's parents
near Johnsville.
Mrs. Jessie Lewis, of Baltimore, is

spending some time with Mrs. David
Six.
Mrs. W. Kolb and daughter Annie,

is visiting her son, Mr. W. E. Kolb.
Quite a number of our sports spent

Thursday at Bay Ridge; also our bus-
iness men spent the day in Balti-
more.

Harney.
--

Mr. Glenroy L. Black, of Balti-
more is visiting friends in this place.
Mr. Black is looking well and his
visits are always appreciated by his
many friends in this place.
Mr. John G. Hess's three daughters,

Misses Lottie, Blanche and Mary, are
spending some time visiting relatives
in this place.
Mr. W. A. Snider, our popular mer-

chant, has shown his generosity by
taking two of the little "fresh air"
girls of Baltimore city. We believe
that these two little girls are deserv-
ing of this kindness, and we feel con-
fident that they are enjoying their
short visit to the country. Of course
all the little children sent out, may
be deserving of a similar visit, but in
some way or other the idea has be-
come prevalent in this community,
that the children of parents who
could well afford to send them to the
country at their own expense, are
often sent out, and thus the people
are imposed upon; if there was a cer-
tainty that only those who are really
deserving of charity would be sent, we
are confident that accommodations
for a score or more could be made,
and our people would be delighted to
take them.
We are told that if time citizens of

Taneytown, Harney and surrounding
community, will take $100,000 worth
of bonds, bearing interest at 6 per
cent., the electric road will be built
from Gettysburg to Harney, and on
to Taneytown. We thiuk that our
moneyed men should investigate the
matter, and, if this is the case, we do
not see why any one should hesitate
to take the bonds. We believe that
we could secure the right of way
through from Gettysburg to this
place, without running along the
public roads, thus avoiding consider-
able danger; then too, we know we
have the shortest, and we belieye
the best, route that has yet been
spoken of.
We are glad to see our friend, Mr.

A. J. Lis htner, of Baltimore, in town
again, looking well; he reports busi-
ness improving.
Mr. Samuel C. Shoemaker thinks

that if people knew the value of frogs
there would not be so many of them
killed; it seems that until quite re-
cently, Mr. Shoemaker had a great
trouble in keeping the drain open at
the creamery, and the refuse water
and milk that this drain was intended
to carry off, would stand there and
cause a bad smell, but a short time
ago a large frog took possession
of the drain, and has kept it open
ever since. Mr. S. says that he would
not take a dollar for it. Now in all
probability it would be a wise act to
bring a dozen or more up, and put
them in our side drains.

Littlestown, Pa.

The building of the Trolley line
from Gettysburg to Baltimore seems
to be assured. The officials met our
Town Council this week, and secured
the right of way through town. A
line from Hanover to Taneytown is
also under contemplation. A power-
house and shops are to be erected in
Littlestow n. •
Our Town Council's muddle with

the milk-men has been adjusted. The
Chief Burgess thought he had all his
own way, and fined each milk-man
$10. for not taking out new licensee
but the men at once took legal pro-
ceedings to have justice prevail, and
the authorities were reluctantly com-
pelled to refund the fine and license.
Thus the milk-men wear a broad
smile as they make their free rounds,
serving their customers, who com,rat-
ulate nein on their yictory.
Some time during Sunday nigilt,

while the family were asleep, Mrs.
W. Eline left home. Noclue could be
had of her whereabouts, until to-day
a dispatch from Cleveland, Ohio,
brought the intelligence that she is
in that city. She left a little babe
only eleven days old. No reason can
be assigned for her strange actions
except that she is considered dement-
ed. Besides the baby, there are five
other small children to need the caret
of parents. Mr. Eline is a good citi-
zen and always provided well for his
family, and has the sympathy of the
entire community in his troubles.
St. Paul's Lutheran church is un-

dergoing some improvements. A
platform has been erected in the
corner beside the pulpit for the organ
and choir.

Maiden sville.

Mr. John Slimmer, who is in the
employ of Mr. Jos. L. Haines, had two
of his fingers badly crushed by a bar-
rel of water falling on them.
A manure-spreader at work in

field near our county road, was
curiosity to every passer by.
Mrs. John Coombe and daughter,

spent a few days at time home of her
parents this week.
Mrs. Eliza Frounfelter and Miss

Fannie Engleman, of New Windsor,
were the guests of Mrs. Robert David-
son, on Sunday.
Miss Rice, of Baltimore, delivered

an interesting address to a large au-
dience at Winter's church, on last
Sunday morning.
The RECORD is always an expected

and welcome guest—we would not
know how to do without it. Long
may it prosper.

• Ridge,

Mrs. Shank and son, of Woodsboro,
spent some thne with her cousin, Mrs.
H. F. Maxell.
Miss Ada Lough of Frederick city,

is visiting her Aunt, Mrs. Willis E.
Fisher.
Miss Jessie Shaw, of Baltimore, is

rusticating at "Valley Farm."
Mrs. Stovall and daughters, of Dan-

ville, Va., are summering at Mrs, G.
M. Morrison's.
Miss Ellen D. Cansey, who was

spending her vacation at Mr. N. C.
Stansbury's, has returned to her
home in Baltimore.
Messrs. Basil Gilson and Thomas

TroorxIdeally. were in Libertytown lastm 

Mr. H. F. Maxell and family spent
last Tuesday in Uettysbnrg.

Mrs. Susan Talmage, wife of Rev.
T. DeWitt Talmage, died in Danville,
New York, on Monday morning.
Since the burning of the Brooklyn
tabernacle last year, Mrs. Tahnage
has suffered from nervous prostra-
tion, and has never fully recovered
from the shock,
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HAS ANYONE noticed how scarce
two-cent pieces are? This is not
meant to assist in the perpetration of
poor jokes on the scarcity of other
coins, but is really a fact. How many
two-cent coins have you owned in the
last six months?

THE REPUBLICAN primary on
Saturday was wholly one-sided.
While the post-office department
profited by a "letter-writing" cam-
paign, the serenity of the "banner
district" was not disturbed thereby,

in the slightest degree.

"IT NEVER rains, but it pours," is
applicable to our town at present.
The electric road, and a water sup-
ply, are both desirable additions to
our progress, but, whew 1—what a lot
of cash they require. Shall we have
either, both, or neither?

It is said that the bicycle will be
an important factor in politics this
fall, as it furnishes an easy and rapid
means for campaigners to cover a
wide area, at small expense. Cam-
paign orators of ability will be in
great demand, and those who are not
wheelmen will be handicapped.

THE W. M. Telephone Company
thought Taneytown the hardest
place to get into in the county. It
hadn't heard from Union Bridge yet.
We know a good thing when we see
it, but our officials .simply wanted
the company to know that this isn't
a "cheap" town, Our sister town
seems to have made herself ridicu-
lously exclusive, and ,has missed a
good thing by being too ".tony."

A Town Destroyed.

On Sunday night the town of Ber-
lin, Worcester county, Maryland
was almost totally destroyed by fire,
about seventy-five houses being burn-
ed, with very light insurance. The
loss is very heavy, from the fact that
many policies have been cancelled by
the Insurance Companies, in the last
few months, on account of the de-
fenseless condition of the town, in re-
gatds to water.
Berlin was a town somewhat larger

than Taneytown, but likely in about
the same condition as far as water is
concerned. It is probable that we
,have more brick buildings, and more
slate and metal roofs, but in other
ways there is but little difference be-
tween our present condition and that
of the town just wiped out of exist-
ence. This event furnishes another
warning to our citizens, which needs
no comment. What are we going to
do about it?

Indisputable Facts.

A friend of the RECORD in referring
to newspapers, writes us, that, "A,
fearless advocate of indisputable
facts, is what is‘wanted in-these de-
generate times." There, is a motto,
which can scarcely be improved on,
for every newspaper in the land, and
yet, a dangerous one to follow abso-
lutely. Certainly no paper would
acknowledge that it published any-
thing but "indisputable facts," and
would treat with scorn any imputa-
tion of venality or lack of stamina,
nevertheless it is likely true that but
few papers are absolutely defensible
against these charges, and, if any
there be, they are likely very unpop-
ular and unprofitable sheets, particu-
larly when issued in small towns.
A newspaper is generally managed

to suit its patronage as a whole and
not to represent simply the views of
its management or any one particular
class; and, if it aimes at success
through the support of the masses,
this would seem to be its only safe
road. The people are responsible for
a partially muzzled press, because
the truth at all times does not suit
them, and they don't want to hear it.
Most papers prefer to "dodge" certain
items of news, and, while what does
appear in print may be true, certain
other items and subjects are diploma-
tically overlooked, although equally
true, for the sake of that power in
America—patronage.
The following, from a recent pub-

lication, aptly fits in here; "There
are always people who can find 'Ino-
tives' if a newspaper happens to rub
the wrong way. They don't seem to
appreciate the fact that it is the news-
man's business to publish the news
as he finds it. When he doesn't do
that, lie should get out of the busi-
ness. There is seldom an issue of a
paper that does not trample on some-
body's toes. The people trampled

upon are generally the ones who find
the 'motive' that is apparent to no-
body else."
There is a parallel between the

press and pulpit, which it is not our
intention to follow, further than to
say, that, the truth should be told at
all times, and without evasion,
whether it suits everybody ornot,
particularly when it is a truth worth
telling, or which may reasonably be
expected to do good in some way.
The RECORD does not mean to be
either untruthful, or vacillating, but
there are a number of subjects which
we think it prudent to avoid because
we do not care to take the chance of
loss of revenue by telling a truth, not
strictly our business to tell. Our col-
umns, however, will be open in most
cases, for our friends to "advocate
indisputable facts," as they see them,
over their own names, then the re-
sponsibility will be theirs.

Politics growing Interesting.

The political situation so far as our
state and county is coneerned, may
he said to be growing interesting.
The nomination by the democrats, of
Mr. Hurst for governor, makes the
prospects of the republicans much
brighter than they have been for
years, because of the growing senti-
ment against Gorman and his dicta-
torship. No matter how good a bus-
iness man Mr. Burst may be—even if

he were in favor of a just re-assess-
ment bill, which seems to be very
doubtful—the fact of his being. a
nominee.of the great "boss," handi-
caps him as nothing else could, and
compels his ability and fitness for the
position to be a secondary considera-

tion in the minds of many good dem-

ocrats who have decided to break
loose from "boss" rule.
Mr. Gorman is not wholly objected

to on account of the tight rein with
which he drives the machine, but be-
cause of his record on the tariff issue,
and his opposition to President
Cleveland, all of which objections
have been Materially added to by the
summary manner in which be dis-
posed of the aspirants for guber-
natorial honors in the late contest.
While the party press of the state

will conceal as much as possible the
chagrin of defeat, and urge harmony
and united support of the ticket., as
the lesser of evils, there can be no
doubt that even strong local candi-
dates and persistent effort on the
part of local workers, will not be
sufficient to bring their full party
strength to the polls, so deep-seated
is the feeling of resentment against
"Boss" Gorman.
Whether the republicans will be

in perfect fighting trim remains to be
seen, as their course is not without
its dangers from tht present outlook.
While the cry of "bossism" is neither
so loud, or so well defined, it will take
careful management to steer the craft
clear of the rocks of discord which
show themselves in certain directions.
They will, in the campaign on the

state ticket, have the advantage of a
better organization in Baltimore city,
than they have ever had before, pro-
viding the full tatrength of it is not
interfered with by internal dissen-
sions. A great deal depende on the
coining state convention for both
sides. If the republicans nominate a
strong ticket, which will poll the full
pvrty vote, and declare positively for
re-assessment, then it would seem
that their chances for success are
brighter than they have ever been,
and Mr. Hurst will have a hard battle
to fight.
The result in the counties will like-

ly be influenced to a considerable de-
gree by the popularity of the state
ticket. Certainly it will be the very
worst time for either party to place
ordinary men on the county ticket.
As a rule, the heading or a ticket by
candidates for state offices, usually
strengthens the county part of it.
This time, however, it may be exact-
ly the opposite. Then too, both sides
are confronted with an unusual num-
ber of candidates—a serious trouble
alone—and "sore heads" will likely
e plentiful, which will serve to fur.

ther complicate the situation. The
outlook is certainly for a very inter-
esting game this fall.

The Cruel Check Rein.

Man, on account of his being the
master of domestic animals, if for no
other reason, should, in his use of
them, be kind and considerate. Any-
thing which approaches the cruel
should be sedulously avoided, and
mere style, or appearance, should
never lead him to misuse his power.
The Creator placed the horse in the
world for the use, not the abuse, of
man, just the same as everything else
we have, and, it is possible that in
many cases we do not properly use
what he has given us.
The use of the check rein on horses

is becoming very common, and, if it
is cruel, it should be abolished. Most
people likely give the matter no
thought, which May mean that they
do not consider the horse susceptible
to feeling in minor ways, like people.
It requires but very little reflection,
on our part, when we choose to know,
that an animal is anatomically very
much like ourselves, and that as we
are particularly sensitive to any re-
striction of the free use of the head
and neck, that a horse feels the same
way also.
The following on this subject re-

cently appeared in the Indiana
Farmer;
Of all the devices conceived in the

chamber of evil of the human brain
it would be hard for me to imagine
one more terrible to man or beast,
more destructive of dumb animal
comfort or more utterly useless or
senseless in its application than the
modern overhead check rein. It might
well be named Satan's choke strap or
Pluto's gag-leather, but whatever its
name may be, it is an instrument of
torture the like of which was never
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thought of even in the days of the
cruel tyrant Nero.
Men have been broken on the wheel,

tortured on time rack, turned on the
spit and drawn and quartered, but all
of the fiendish ingenuity of the Dark
Ages was not sufficient to invent a
device as evil in its consequences as
the modern overhead strangler. The
inquisitors of the olden days burned
the midnight oil concocting methods
for producing the most excruciating
pain in the human body in order to
get men to renounce their heresies,
but none were so brutal as to put a
piece of cold steel into man's mouth
and bend his neck until the back of
his head touched the small of his
neck, just for fun and to make Win
look nice and step up sprightly.
No. Such wisdom was left to be

displayed by persons of superior in-
tellect in these fin de siecle days now
upon us. The most brutal slave-
driver never dreamed of using such
inhuman means of coercing into obe-
dience the most unruly of all his
slaves, and would have felt himself
disgraced forever in the eyes of the
whole world if he had committed
such an outrage upon passive, will-
ing, obedient servants. Yet here in
the day when intelligence and com-
mon-sense are supposed to be the rule
of action for mankind we find the
most willing and faithful of all ser-
vants treated in the most cruel fash-
ion, and what for? To tickle the
vanity of man, and for no other rea-
son. Such treatment is inhuman
anywhere, but when applied to poor
dumb creatures that cannot protest,
it becomes outrageous.
And there is not a single argument

that can be advanced to justify such
a proceeding. As well tell me that
the driver or a horse whose head is
lariated to a right angle with his body
would be comfortable under the same
circumstances. Why, how would be
feel to have his head thrown just as
far back as muscle and bone would
let it go and held there until the tor-
turer got enough fun out of the
scene? But a horse cannot tell his
misery. He steps high. He throws
his head. He tosses his mane. He
turns his head from side to side. He
foams at the mouth and champs the
bit; yet thaintelligent (?) driver can-
not discover that these are his mute
protests against such inhuman tor-
ture.
I was sitting recently at a window

overlooking a street when two beau-
tiful bay horses were driven past with
their heads lashed up and their noses
pointing straight out. Not the long
stretch of head and neck that is seen
on a race-horse as he speeds down
the homestretch, but a cramped,
sharp, angular bend of the head that
denoted anguish in the extreme, and
the pain that poor team suffered
could be seen in every movement;
yet the young lady and gentleman in
the buggy sat in stately dignity, as if
perfectly satisfied that they were cut-
ting the loudest swell of the season,
when, in fact, such treatment of the
poor dumb brutes excited nothing
but disgust in the minds of all sensi-
ble people who saw it. If you think
a horse likes to be gagged up in such
a manner go up to him and put your
hand on his neck when he is in this
conditiou. You can feel quite dis-
tinctly every ring in the windpipe,
and the skin and muscles on the un-
der side of it are drawn so tensely
that his breathing is seriously inter-
fered with, and he cannot suffer such
treatment very long until lie becomes
windbroken and unfit for service.
You will also notice that he makes
frequent noises, as if attempting to
swallow something. This is because
the saliva from the mouth threatens
all the thne to run down the wind-
pipe.
It is gratifying in the extreme to

notice that there are many people in
the country yet whose consciences
are not quite seared, as with a hot
iron, and who propose to keep up the
war on gags until they shall give
plaee to something more sensible and
less torturing. Indeed, the rein that
produces discomfort at all should be
abolished.

Late Litepary News.

Not since "The Anglomaniacs" has
there been so clever a society satire
as Henry Fuller's "Pilgrim Sons,"
which is published in the August
Cosmopolitan. The problems involv-
ed in woman's use of the bicycle are
so startling and so numerous, under
the rapid evolution of this art, that
one welcomes a careful discussion of
the subject by so trained a mind and
so clever a writer as Mrs. Reginald de
Koven. The Cosmopolitan illustrates
Mrs. de Koven's article with a se-
ries of poses by professional models.
A new sport, more thrilling thati any
known to Nimrod, more dangerous
than was ever experienced by even a
Buffalo Bill, is exploited in the same
issue in an article on "Photograph-
ing Big Game in the Rocky Moun-
tains," before shooting. The idea
that ten cents for The Cosmopolitan
means inferiority from a literary
point of view is dispelled by the ap-
pearance in this number of such
writers as Sir Lewis Morris, Sir Edwin
Arnold, Edgar Fawcett, Tabb, W.
Clark Russell, Lang, Sarcey, Zangwill,
Agnes Repplier, etc. Nor can we en-
tertain time idea of inferiority in illus-
tration with Buell names as Hamilton
Gibson, Denman, Van Schaick, Lix,
Sandham, etc., figuring as the chief
artists of a single month's issue.

One night when Mr. Isaac Reese
was stopping with me, says M. F.
Hatch, a prominent merchant of.
Quartermaster, Washington, I heard
him groaning. On going to his room
I found him suffering from cramp col-
ic. He was in such agony 1 feared he
would die. I hastily gave him a dose
of Chamberlain's Colic, Cholera and
Diarrhma Remedy. He was soon re-
lieved and the first words be uttered
were, "what was that stuff you gave
me ?'' I informed him. A few .days
ago we were talking about this at-
tack and he said he was never with-
out that remedy now. I have used it
in my family for several years. I
know its worth and do not hesitate
to recommend it to my friends and
customers. For sale by R. S. McKin-
ney, Taneytown, Md.

Beware of Ointments for Catarrh that
contain Mercury,

as mercury will surely destroy the sense of
smell and completely derange the whole sys-
tem when entering it through the mucous sur-
faces. Such articles should never be used
except on prescriptions from reputable physi-
cians, as the damage they will do is ten fold to
the good you can possibly derive from them.
Hall's Catarrh Cure, manufactured by F. J.
Cheney & Co., Toledo, 0., contains no mercury
and la taken internally, acting directly upon
the blood and mucous system. In buying'
Hall's Catarrh Cure be sure you get the genu-
ine. It is taken internally, and made in Toledo,
Ohio. by F. J. Cheney & Co. Testimonials free.
PirSold by Druggists. Price 75c. per bottle. 1

herman $14,
HEADQUARTERS FOR

Good Fresh CANDIES,
and Fresh Groceries.

CANNED GOODS
such as Lima Beans, 3 cans for 25cts.;
Corn, Peas and Tomatoes; Canned
Oysters and Sardines.

Zollickoffer's, Roberts', and Myers'
Flour; Roberts' Corn Meal.
LEMONS, ORANGES, BANANAS,
Prunes lOc., Raisins 5 and 10c., Ma-
son's Sc Water Crackers, Sc Ginger
Snaps, Coal Oil.

1GE CRERM
by the gallon or quart, and made to
order in any flavor desired. Call and
get prices before purchasing else-
where.

MILK SHAKE,
different flavors; also Ice Cold Lem-
onade, and Pop on ice.

SHERMAN GILDS,
Near Depot.

Buttermilk Soap 10c, a box

Second Announcement!
As our venture in the Clothing and

Men's Furnishing Goods business has
proven to be more of a success than
we had anticipated, and feeling en-
couraged thereby, we have taken ad-
vantage of the early inducements
offered by the Wholesale Trade, and
bought a large stock of

FAH, & WINTER, CtOTIIING
of the Latest Designs, and best work-
manship obtainable, which will ar-
rive from September 1st. to the 15th.,
and in order to make room for them,
we will sell what remains of our
Spring and Summer goods at a

Slight Reduction
from former prices, from now until
September 1st., hoping that all those
who have not supplied themselves
fully for the Summer, will call on us
at an early day, as we believe that it
is poor policy to allow goods out of
season to accumulate.

Thanking you for flop liberal en-
couragement extended, we remain

Yours to command,

ECKENRODE & SON.
TANEYTOWN, MD.

8-6-54f.

Summer ain't gone.
Lots of time left in

which to sell Light Weight
Suitings and Single Pants.
I have Blue Cheviots reduced
from $Io.00 and $12.00 to
$5.00 and $6.00, and other
Light Suits reduced from
Sio.00 and $12.00 to $5.00

and $6.00. Single Pants from
Come and give us

selling away

25cts. up.

a call; we are

BELOW COST
to make room for Fall and
Winter Goods.

Merchant Tailoring a spe-
cialty.

Yours Respectfully,

ROB'T E. PATTON,
LITLESTOWN, PA.

E. E. REINDOLLAR W. M. REINDOLLAR

FEINUOLLM k oos

---- DEALERS IN —
Grain, Lumber, Coal,
Hay, Straw, Feed, Salt, Cement,

— AND —
FERTILIZERS.

TANEYTOWN MD.

GOOD

MORNING!!
DO YOU

NEED

ANYTHING

TO-DAY?

SEE

Show Window,
and come in for

SPECIAL

AUGUST

BARGAINS,
F. M. YOUNT,

Leading Dealer in

Boots, Shoes, and Notions.

TANEYTOWN. MD.

I hereby announce that I have
permanently located in Taneytowu,
for the manufacture of

CARRIAGES, BUGGIES,
Taytons, Phaetons,

and everything in this line. Factory
work will also be kept on hand, and
it shall be my aim to supply the de-
mand for all classes of work.

All Work Guaranteed.
Special attention given to Repair-

ing.

Give me a trial and I will convince
you that my Prices and Work will
be found satisfactory.

James H. Reindollar,
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Shop back of Lutheran church.
54-95-1y

Garner's.
We have filled up our stock with

Seasonable Goods.

New Brighton Stoneware.
We have it from one pint to fifteen

gallons; all sizes and shapes. You
will get Best Goods at Best Prices.

Glass Jars.
We have these in pint, quart, and

half gallon sizes. We handle nothing
but Mason's Porcelain-lined Tops.
Guarantee every Jar solid when it
leaves the store; after that our re-
sponsibility ceases.
Tin Cans cheap; Sealing Wax and

Strings. Jelly Tumblers with or
without Tin tops.

HARNESS.
We are selling Harness at greatly

reduced prices. Having bought be-
fore the advance, we can give you
bargains.

SI-10MS
in like proportion with the above.
We also carry a Pull Line of

Groceries.
Agent for the following goods: Hand
Cream Separators, Barrel Churns,
Butter Workers, King Washing Ma-
chines.
Bacon and Lard taken in exchange

for goods, at highest market prices.
Respectfully Yours,

D. W. GARNER. 

The New Trump Watch.
STEM WIND!

Insured for One year.

ONLY $2.50.
Not a Pocket Clock, but a
Genuine Nickel Watch.

H. E. SLAGENHAUP,
Taneytown, Md. JEWELER

ment desired on short notice
not kept in stock.
Binder Twine, all grades.
Wheelbarrow Grass Seeders.
Washing Machines, price $4.00
Oliver Chilled Plows ana repairs.
Spring Tooth Harrows.
Corn Planters and Workers.
Feed Cutters from $3.50 up.

I will be at my Machine Ware-
house in Harney, every Saturday af-
ternoon, and at other times either in
Harney, or at my residence near by.
I respectfully solicit your patronage,
as I am in business to do business.

S. S. SHOEMAKER,
2-23 5-tf BARNEY, MD,

D. W. Garner,
GENERAL AGENT

for Carroll and Frederick counties,
Md., and Adams Co., Pa.

Have you Five or more Cows?
If so a Hand
Cream Sep-
arator will
earn its cost
for you every
year. Why
continue an
inferior sys-
tem another
year at so
great a loss?
Dairying is

now time only
feature of Ag-
riculture that
is protitabie.
Properly con-
ducted it always pays well, and must
pay you. You need a Separator, and
you need the BEST, viz: THE DAVIS
HAND  SEPARATOR.  
I sell all kinds of Creamery supples;

Butter Workers, Barrel Clinrns. Rec-
tangular Churns, Butter Prints,
Cream Thermometers, Butter Ship-
ping Boxes, &c. For further infor-
mation call on or address D. W. GAR-
NER, General Agent for Dairy Fix-
tures.18-5-tf

C.O.FUS
FURNITURE.

• AP. .1MP. •

We have the goods you want at

Prices you can afford to pay and

every article is backed by a guaran-

tee of goodness.

UNDERTAKING
in all its branches. A full line of

LADIES', MEN's and CHILDREN'S

ROB
EMBALMING A SPECIALTY.

Prices to suit hard times.

C.O. FUSS,
Near Itallroad

E. Kemper.
BUTCHER AND DEALER

IN ALL KINDS OF

MEATS & LIVE STOCK.

Taneytown, Md.

FARMERS
Before buying anything in the line
of

Agricultural Implements,
come to see me and get prices.
mean

ECONOMY! THE PEN_
If you want to follow this motto

direct your steps to the "Old Stand" dulum of our business is al-near the Corner, where you will find
a First-class line of ways on the swing, and the

tick of our price clock is so
low and pleasant to the ears ofDress Goods, Coatings,

Flannels, both Wool and Cotton, No-
tions, Carpets, Boots and Shoes,
&c., at Prices as Low as Good goods
can be sold anywhere. Goods bougil
right sell themselves. RemeMber we
buy alone for

CASH,
and give the customer all the advan-

tages. Hard times affect the con-
science, and we always do the best
we can for the buyer. If you buy
trash you miss. the motto. "Some-
thing good is something cheap."
Give us a call and be convinced that
we are telling the truth. The place
to find this class of goods is at

our customers that space for
horn-blowing is crowded out
to make room for the goods
-themselves, which are always
of interest to the buying pub-
lic.

Brooms,

Dates, Gold Medal,
Rolled Oats,

.07

.08

.03
We guarantee it to be as

good as anything under the
name of Rolled Oats, or
looks like Rolled Oats.iumllours Full N. Y. Cream Cheese, .12

Cream Chocolates, Fancy .12;
Made by Croft & Allen..

If they don't know how to
make a first-class article, it
will be hard to find some
one that does.

Linen, Damask, .26
Just one word. Don't pay

50c before you look at this
article. Pure Linen.

to turn my attention to this Wooden Buckets, two hoop .10
line altogether and will handle all
the best makes. Also Princess Coffee,

FERTILIZERS
For Spring Crops. Table Oil Cloth,

•I will handle a general line of Im- Pins,plements, and repairs to same, and

will furnish any Machine or Imple- 
Sardines,when

.23

.12!

.01

.04
Cactus Toilet Soap, .04

Almost time exact counter-
part of Buttermilk Soap.

MOSQUITO NETTING, .043

W. D. HAUGH & CO.
THE ONE PRICE CASH STORE,

PUBLIC SQUARE,

TANEYTOWN, ,11 D.

TANEYTOWN

13oller •
Manufacture and have

constantly on hand

THEIR SUPERIOR

BRANDS OF FLOUR
made from selected wheat, and very
choice

BRAN AND‘MIDDLINGS.

Highest cash prices paid for grE in.

ZOLLICKOFFEk
9-15-94-tf

IF YOU BUY RIGHT,
YOU CAN SELL RIGHT.

Having bought our stock of Nets
before prices advanced on leather, we
can afford to sell them much lower
than those who waited too long and
bought while prices were raising.
Remember, those who come first will
get the bargains, for the longer you
wait the higher price you will have
to pay. We claim to have the cheap-
est Nets for the money in the country
to-day, and the only way to convince
you of the fact, is to come and see,
for seeing is believing.

8. O. REAVER.
Near R. R. TANEYTOWN, MD.

SPECIAL BARGAINS
— AT THE --

Baltimore Bargain loose.
All our Stock will be sold at

Reduced Prices, as the Spring
and Summer Goods must be
sold on or before Sept. lst., in
order to make place for our Fall
and Winter Goods. Who wants
a Suit, or Dress, or Hat, or
Shoes, shall be kind and call at
once and get their choice, as we
sell them very low.

Respectfully Yours,

C. SILK & CO.,
6-7-4t TANEYTOWN, MD.

WELL DRILLING!
I have located in Taneytown, for

the purpose of conducting the Well
Drilling Business, Hot and Cold Wa-
ter circulating, and the Pump Busi-
ness generally—Spray Pumps are now
in season. All calls promptly attend-
ed to. Prices for Well-drilling are
are only about one-half of former
price. All persons having work in
my line would do well to give me a
trial. All work guaranteed.

WIND PUMPS A SPECIALTY.

0. T. SHOEMAKER,
Near Railroad. Baltimore St.
134-5-iy TANYETOWN, MD.

Allsmw 



COUNTY DIRECTORY.
Court Officers.

JUDGES-ROIL Chas. B. Roberts, Chief and
Resident Judge. Hon. James Revelle and Hon.
Isaac T. Jones Associate J

CLERK OF THE COURT-Benjamin F. Crouse.

CRIER-Gershum Huff.

AUDIT01.-J. J. Baumgartner.

REGISTER Os' WILLS-George M. Parke.

ORPHANS' COURT-David H. litaftteker,Lewis
P. Cash, Albert Schaeffer.

STATES ATTORNEY-Chas. E. Fink.

SHERIFF-Elias B. Arnold.

• COUNTY COMMISSIONERS-John H. Stem, Da-
vid Stoner, Joshua F. Caltrider.

COUNTY TREASURER-John J. Reese.

SURVEYOR-M. Theodore Veiser.

SUPERVISORS OF ELECTION, JaS. H. Smith,
Michael Buchman Marshall G. Shaw.

Taneytown District.

NOTARY PUBLIC-A. ll. Zollickoffer.

TAX COLLECTOR,-Geo. H. Birnie.

MAGISTRATES.-A. F. Orndorff, Henry Galt.

CONSTABLE, 13. S. Miller.

REGISTRAR.-J. S. Fink.

Town Officers,

BURG ESS.-II . D. Mehring.

COMMISSIONERS.-Dr. G. T. Motter, Edward

Kemper, W. Jesse Roberts, Joshua Koutz, E.
K. Heaver.

BAILIFF and TAX COLLECTOR,-B. S. Miller.

Church Notices.

Presbyterian Church. -Beginning April
First, preaching on thefirst three Sabbaths in
the month at 2,30 p.m., and on the fourth Sab-
bath at 10.30 a. m. Sabbath School one hour
before church service.-C. E. Society Prayer
Meeting 6.0 p. m. every Sabbath Evening.
-Weekly Prayer Meeting Tuesday Evenings
at 7 p. m.

Piney Creek Church: beginning April 1st.,
preaching on the first three Sabbaths in the
month, at 10 a. m., and on the fourth Sabbath
at 2.30 p. m. Sabbath School one hour before
service.

Rev. P. Itioseco, Pastor.

Trinity Lutheran Chareh.-Services every
Sunday at 10 a. m. and 8 p. m., Sunday School
9 a. m. Y. P. S. C. E. 7p, m. W. H. and F.
Missionary Society 1st Saturday in each month,
2 p. m. Mission Band, and Junior C. E .alter-
nate Sundays. 3 p. m.

Rev. G. W. McSherry, Pastor.

Grace _Reformed Church.-Services every
Sunday at 10 o'clock, a. m., and 8 p. m. Sunday
School 9 M., Y. P. S C. E. 6.15 p. m.

Rev. A. Bateman, Pastor.

St. Joseph's Catholic Church.-Mass 9 a. m.
Vespers, 7.30 p. m., catechism, 3 p. m. every
Sunday. On the first Sunday of each month,
oenediction after mass, concluding the ser-
vices of the day. Rev. T. D. Mead, Pastor.

United Brethren Church.-Preaehing every
Sunday at 2.30 p. m. Sunday school at 1.30.
Harney charge, services at 10 a. in., and 7 p.
m., alternately. Rev. T. Wagner, Pastor.

Post Office,

T. II. ECKENRODE, Postmaster.

Mails arrive from Linwood at 9 a, m.
from R. It. 7. 55-a.m. and 5.15 p. m.; from Har-
ney 12. 30 p. m,

Mails close atopflice, for R. R. north, 7.45 a
m.; for Linwood 10.10 a. m.; for HarneY 8.50 a.
in.; for R. R. south. 5 p. m.

Societies.

Patriotic Order Sons of America. Camp 2, Md.
meets in Eckenrode's Hall, Thursday Even-
ings at 8 o'clock. M. F. Sayler, Fresident.
Chas. 0. Fuss, Rec. Sec'y.

Carroll Conclave Heptasophs, meets on the
First and Third Monday evenings of every
month. Henry Galt, Secretary.

The Taneytown Literary Society meets every
Friday evening. Dr. C. !Arnie, President.
Miss Carrie Elliot, Sec'y.

The Young Women's Christian Temperance
Uniou meets first Monday evening of every
month. President, Mrs. J. Forward; Vice
President, Mrs. Eudora L. DIcherry; Rec.
Sec'y Lorena Leirevre; Cor. Sec'y, Anna L.
McSlierry; Treasurer, G. May Forrest.

In
Poor
Health
means so much more than
you imagine-serious and
fatal diseases result from
trifling ailments neglected.
Don't play with Nature's

greatest gift-health.

Brown's
Iron
Bitters

If you are feeling
out of sorts, weak
and generally ex-
hausted, nervous,
have no appetite
and can't work,
begin at once tak-
ing the most relia-
ble strengthening
medicine, which is
Brown's Iron Bit-
ters. A few bot-
tles cure- benefit
comes from the
very first dose-it
won't stain your
teeth, and it's
pleasant to take.

It Cures
Dyspepsia, Kidney and Liver
Neuralgia, Troubles,
Constipation, Bad Blood,
Malaria, Nervous ailments

Women's complaints.

Get only the genuine-it has crossed red
lines on the wrapper. All others are sub-
stitutes. On receipt of two 2C. stamps we
will send set of len Beautiful World's
Fair Views and book-free.
BROWN CHEMICAL CO. BALTIMORE, MD.

SUBSCRIBE

-FOR-

THE CARROLL RECORD.

Macadam and Telford Roads.

The improved roads are becoming

so common in various parts of our

country that the following instruc-

tions, issued by the Road Improve-

ment Association of London, Eng.,

for the guidance of their roadrnen,

will be of great service to all who

have to do with this class of roads;

for one thing is sure, a Telford or

Macadam roads needs the best of care

to be in good condition, and unless

this care is given them they soon get

out of order, and the work of repair-

ing them is expensive.
1. Never allow a hollow, or rut, or

a puddle to remain on a road, but fill
it up at once with chips from the
stone heap.

2. Always use chips for patching
and for all repairs during the summer
months.
3. Never put fresh stones on the

road, if by cross-picking and a thor-
ough use of the rake the surface can
be made smooth and kept at the
proper strength and section.
4. Remember that the rake is the

most useful tool in your collection,

and it should be kept close at hand
the whole year round.
5. Do not spread large patches of

stone over the whole width of the

road, but coat the middle, or horse
track first, and, when this has worn
in, coat each of the sides in turn.

6. In moderately dry weather, and

on hard roads, always pick up the

old surface stone into ridges six inches

apart and remove all large and pro-

jecting stones before applying a new
coating.
7. Never spread stones more than

one stone deep, but add a second
layer when the first has worn in, if

one coat be not enough.

8. Never shoot stones on the road

and crack them where they lie, or a

smooth surface will be out of the
question.
9. Never put a stone upon the road

for repairing purposes that will not
freely pass in every direction through

a two inch ring, and remember that
still smaller stones should be used,
for all slight repairs.

10. Recollect that hard stones
should be broken to finer guage than
soft, but that the two-inch gage is
the largest that should be used under
any circumstances where no steam
roller is employed.
11. Never be without your ring

guage, remember Macadam's advice
that any stone you cannot easily put
in your mouth should be broken
smaller.

12. Use chips, if possible, for bind-
ing newly-laid stones together, and
remember that road sweeping, horse
droppings, sods or grass and other
rubbish, when used for this purpose,
will ruin the best road ever construct-
ed.
13. Remember that water-worn or

rounded stones should never be used
upon steep gradients, or they will fail
to bind together.
14. Never allow dust or mud to lie

on the surface of the roads, for
either of these will double the cost of
maintenance.
15. Recollect that dust becomes

mud at the first shower, and that
mud forms a wet blanket which will
keep a road in a filthy condition for
weeks at a time, instead of allowing
it to dry in a few hours.
16. Remember that the middle of

the road should always be a little
higher than the sides, so that the
rain may run into the side gutters at
once.
17. Never allow the water-tables,

gutters and ditches to clog up, but
keep them clear the whole year
through.
While all the above rules are un-

portant, and embrace the principals
of good road administration in a
small space, especial force should be
attached to rules 14 and-15, as upon
the observance of these two rules de-
pends in a great measure the useful-
ness of all Macadam and Telford
roads. Yet, how frequently do we
see these best of roads made offensive
by the neglect of these simple princi-
ples. In too many instances the sur-
face is allowed to become foul with
horse voiding and an accumulation of
dirt and dust, are seldom scraped or
cleaned, and, being constantly
sprinkled, the surface, which should
be hard and clean; becomes foul with
a sticky, nasty mud two or three
,inches deep.

Helping the People at Home. -

There are very few of us earning
our-living who have not some one else
to care for, and that is much to the
credit of the American girl, writes
Miss Ruth Ashmore in a very sensible
article on "The Girl and Her Money,"
in the August Ladies' Home Journal.
Sometimes it is the people at home;
sometimes it is a younger sister who
is to be helped to an education, but
always a helping hand is needed.
You laugh at the idea of making a
will, but no matter how little you
have, if it is nothing but a gold watch,
you ought to attend to its disposition.
And if there are people depending
upon you, old people, stop the soda-
water, stop the candy and have your
life insured.. You will not die any the
sooner, and you will feel that the
mother or the young sister you love
so dearly will not, when you cease to
be here, depend upon the hard char-
ity of strangers.

Leather tires will in the future be
employed on bicycles made for the
French Army.

"It is the best patent medicine in
the world," is what Mr. E. M. Hart-
man, of Marquam, Oregon, says of
Chamberlain's Colic. Cholera and Di-
arrhea Remedy. "What,leads me to
make this assertion is from time fact
that dysentery in its worst form was
prevalent around here last suunner
and it Lever took over two or three
doses of that remedy to effect a cure."
For sale by R. S. McKinney, Taney-
town, Md.

The Evasion of (Aerm Diseases.

It has long been known that hu-
pure water is a source of infection
with the germs of disease, and that
milk may have sitnilar evil potency.
Cheese, in virtue of the alleged dead-
ly tyrotoxicon that it sometimes de-
velops, is in the same category, and
recently it is said to convey the germs
of diphtheria. Butter, presumably
the most wholesome of fats, has been
tested and found wanting, because a
large proportion of the samples tested
contained the bacilli of tuberculosis.
Beef and pork are likely to contain
the germs of tapeworms and trichinte
respectively, besides harboring no
end of bacteria if not absolutely fresh
and an assortment of deadly pto-
maines when canned. Nearly all the
manufactured foods and food pro-
ducts have been found by the Ohio
food commission to contain adultera-
tions of uneatable debris or more or
less poisonous chemicals. Latterly
the oyster has been accused of con-
veying typhoithfever germs. And
DOW, to complete the overthrow of
tottering confidence, science has as-
sailed the staff of life. asserting the
bread, after undergoing the ordinary
process of cooking, contains living
bacteria, which may as well as not be
disease-producing species.
Of course this picture of disease

lurking everywhere in search of vic-
tims has another side. Water may
be boiled and milk sterilized, with.
the result of killing any germs they
contain. Thorough cooking will
effectually destroy the eggs of parasi-
tic organisms, if present. Properly
canned meats do not contain pto-
maines, and there are such things-
though unquestionably they are
anomalous-as pure manufactured
foods. Moreover, the very authori-
ties who show us that bread as ordi-
narily cooked contains bacteria, de-
monstrate that proper cooking' will
kill these bacteria. As yet no one has
suggested a way in which the possi-
ble poisons of cheese and the germs
in butter may be effectually got rid
of. But, after all, these are only two
out of a long list of eatables, and
these might be omitted from the
dietary of any one who is especially
afflicted with pathophobia. The most
timid person, therefore, it has been
supposed, might with safety continue
to indulge himself in a sufficiency of
nourishment, provided he devoted
most of his time to insuring proper
preparation of the nourishment.-
Harper's Weekly.

Sensitive Girls.

The problem of dealing with sensi-
tive girls is a most difficult one for -
parents of guardians. It is necessary

Ithat such girls should be most judi-
ciously managed. The sensitive tem-
perament is, of all others, that which
makes most unhappiness and trouble
for its possessor, until he (or she) has
trained himself to govern it and not
allow it to govern_ him.
The chief obstacle to helping peo-

ple of sensitive temperament, whether
such people are yoting or old, • is the
idea which dominates most of them
that their sensitiveness is a merit,
and not to be accounted a defect or a
fault, or to be controlled by the laws
of common sense.
Sensitive people usually .feel proud

of the sufferings which proceed from
the delicate condition of their feel-
ings, and very scornful of those
phlegmatic folks who show little feel-
ing, but work along happily amid
rude and unsympathetic surround-
ings. This belief is shared by young
girls, who are half proud, half unhap-
py, over the nature they do not yet
comprehend. They go through much
real misery, hugging their sensitive
feelings to their hearts, their pride
and their Unhappiness mutually en-
couraging each other.

Sensitive people, above all others,
have most need of that grand spirit-
ual virtue, common sense. And sen-
sitive girls should be carefully in-
structed as to the capabilities and
dangers of their peculiar tempera-
ment. They should be taught to
govern not only their actions, but
their thoughts and feelings, by reason
and judgment. They should be shown
how to argue their misery out and
reduce it to its lowest terms before al-
lowing themselves to be made_miser-
able by imaginary sorrows.
And such girls should be made to

believe firmly that no virtue lies in
unhappiness. The virtue and strength
is to make ourselves happy in spite
of outward circumstances. We were
meant to be happy, not miserable,
and although it takes some determi-
nation and perseverance to clahn onr
inheritance, it is well worth it when
we have obtained it.
For girls, or for those older who

have never been properly disciplined,
such training is essential before they
can find any peace or comfort amid
the conflicts of an emotional temper-
ament. The final virtue of the sensi-
tive spiritual nature is to be happy.
And although it may take many a
struggle to att ain this state, the nand
should be .definitely made up that
happiness is the right and highest
condition, and that only weak-mind-
ed people believe it a fine thing to be
miserable.

The Yellow Sea of China is so call-
ed from the presence of yellow mud,
washed down by the great rivers that
empty into its waters.

One of our greatest medical author-
ities has stated his objection to the
"great and growing plague of dis-
playing advertisements in the
streets," on the ground that they are
injurious to the public health.

"Homeric laughter" is the classical name for
unquenchable mirth. It is the sort of inughing
which those persons indulge in who have taken
Ramon's Tonic Liver Pills, and changed a
sallow complexion, dull eyes and pale cheeks,
Into a ruddy complexion, bright eyes and rosy
cheeks. Ask It. S. McKinney, your druggist,
for a free sample dose.

Not Enough.
Liver pills have their good and bad

side. They cleanse the bowels and
clean otifthe system, but they leave
the patient weak, exhausted and
unstrung, with no appetite and no
strength.

If y`ou were to go to a physician he
would tell you that your liver pills
were all right but that they did not
go far enough. You need something
else to restore the appetite, repair the
waste, purify the blood and build up
the system. He would give
you a tonic.
We supply you with the regular

physician's medicine for an entire
treatment of nearly three weeks.
There is one small case of ten of the
Liver Pills (the finest in existence)
and there is another box contaiuing
fifteen of the Tonic Pellets. You get
them both for 25e. Ask your druggist
for Ramon's Tonic Liver
Pills and Ramon's Tonic
Pellets. Together they make a
sure treatment for Constipation and
Biliousness.
At all dealers, or mall, for 25c., S boxes $1.00.
BROWN MFG. CO., New York.
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For Sale by R. S. McKinney,
Tanevtown, Md.

tittleston Carriage Works,

S. D. MEH RING
MANUFACTURER:OF

FINE CARRIAGES
and Buggies.

SURREYS, PHAETONS)

TRAPS, CARTS, CUTTERS,

Dayton, )
FINE McCall, WAGONS.

Jagger,
and a General Line of:Light Vehicles

A Good Selection of Second Hand
Work on hand
REPAIRING promptly done.

tar Low PRICES, and all work
guaranteed.

LITTLESTOWN, PA,
8-21-94-tf Opposite Depot.

N. B. HAGAN
Near the Square, in his

NEW STORE ROOM
has a Full *line of all kinds of

Fruit, Confectioneries,
Groceries and Notions.

IC CRE7k7VT
of any flavor made to order, and de-
livered in any quantity. Also the
leading brands of

Flour, Corn Meal,
and Chicken Feed.

Pure Sugar Syrup 20 and 30c a gal.
Spot Cash Baking Powder, lOcts, a
pound.
A Full Line of Canned Goods at

Bottom Prices.

filObEt, 1311KE1Y.
TANEYTOWN, MD.

Koontz & Wagner, Propr's.

FRESH BREAD. ROLLS,
CAKES AND PRETZELS 

Mason's Best Crackers,  
" Crackers  '

Ginger Snaps.
Soda Crackers

8c.
4c
4e.
4c.

FRESH GROCERIES,
Confectioneries, Nuts, Oranges, Ba-

nanas, Dried Fruits, Canned
Goods, Tobacco and

Cigars always in stock.

TEMPERANCE DRINKS.
Pop, Tonic Beer, Ginger Ale, and

Milk Shake.

Egg's and Lard in money or in:trade.
Or Prices to suit the times.

THE HAMMOND

:TYPF_IALR1TSR.

A Few Leading Points.

SPEED-Highest Record.

ALIGNMENT-Perfect, Permanent.

TYPE-Instantly iuterchangeable.

All styles and languages.
IMPRESSION-Uniform.

PAPER--Will take any width.

WEIGHT-Only 181bs., hence suita
ble for travel or office.

THE EDISON MIMEOGRAPH,

A Full line of Mimeograph supplies
and for all duplicating machines.

A Full line of Linen paper, note
books, carbon paper, and supplies for
all typewriters.

WRITE FOR CATALOGUE.

JOHN G. PARKER & SON, Agts,

Win. F. Rein, Manager.

15 .E German St. Baltimore Md

ATTRACTIVE

ic-nic Bills
omptly Executed.

Everybody should have a supply of

McKEIALIP'S

Cholera & Diarrhoea Syrup
The Great Remedy for all Bowel Complaints.

Prepared Only Illy

J. McKELLIP, Druggist,
TANEYT OWN, MD.

FRANKLIN BOWERSOX
TANEYTOWN, MD.  

1,141A1DING.' 13k.IAL1;2.1Z IN

Irriplments.

THE LEADING GRAIN DRILLS.
Buckeye Glass Feed, Bickford & Hoffman, Champion, Pennsylvania

Low Down, Crown, and Superior.

Roland Chilled Plows,--the Leader.
Wrought and Cast Plows.

Spring Tooth Harrows, float and lever.
Hand and Power Feed Cutters.

Wagons, Buggies and Stick Wagons.
Full Lihe of Repairs for all kinds of Plows, Grain Drills, &c.

ROBERT S. McKINNEY,
DRicia-GI ST.

TANEYTOWN, - MD.

Fore19 a9d Domestic Druqs
THE MOST POPULAR

PATENT ,:;) MEDICINES
FANCY ARTICLES - - -
-AND-

.1.

IN THE MARKET.  PERFUMERY.

4 

Proprietor of McKINNEY'S CHOLERA MIXTURE, A
Reliable Remedy for all Summer Complaints.
Physicians prescriptions carefully compounded.

41111•6110•21-

R N DO LLAR & Co.,
DEALERS IN

Pure Animal Bone Fertilizers,
The season for the Phosphate Agent, or Drummer, is fast approach-

ing, and, as we may possibly not have time to drum you or send our
Agent to bore you, we take this method of calling your attention to the
fact that we are still in the

FERTILIZER BUSINESS
and as well, if not better, prepared to give you closer prices this season, than
ever before. Goods are cheap; we buy them for cash, and will sell them
on a very small margin. We realize the fact that farmers cannot afford to
buy High-priced Phosphate at the prbsent low price of grain. We are
going to meet these difficulties, and feel that we can.
If you will call on us, we will prove what we say by showing you

BETTER GOODS AT A LOWER PRICE
than you have been buying in the past. Do not close your contracts until
we have seen you.

Respectfully Yours,

INDOIAR & CO.
26-6-5-tf TAN EYTOWN, MD

larti WIND

BrOVRCA/TitinVai
And Our Large Assortment of

HARDWARE.

You Can't Help

Being Tickled
at the

Bargains given our Customers.
mcC. DAVIDSON - TANEYTOWN

New York Weekly Tribune
-- AND

The Carroll Record.

ON YeAR.

$1.25.
Address all orders to THE RECORD.

GEO, H. BIRNIE & CO.,
BANKERS

TANEYTOWN, MD.

Discount Business Notes.

Receive Deposits subject to check.

Make collections on all points.

Savings Bank Department.
Interest paid on Time Deposits.

- SP1iCIAJi, IA1S ---

to Weekly and Monthly Depositors.

THE TANEYTOWN

SAVINGS BANK.
Does a General Banking Business.
Loans Money on Real or Personal
Security. Discounts Notes. Collec-
tions and remittances promptly
made.

INTEREST PAID ON TIME DEPOSITS.
HENRY GALT, Treas.

W. W. CRAPSTER, Pres.

DIRECTORS. -.-
SAMUEL STONER. W. JESSE ROBERTS.
JOSHUA KOUTZ, H. D. MEH RING.
JAMES C. GALT. JOHN J. CRAPSTER.
T. H. ECKENRODE, DAVID BOLLINGER-
W. W. CRAFSTER. HENRY GALT.

7-28-94 ty

ELLIOT HOUSE!
Centre Square,

TANEYTOWN, MD.

C A. ELLIOT, Prop'r.

First-class in all respects I Special
Attention given Commercial Travel-

lers. Good Livery attached.

Bar well stocked with Choice

Liquors, Wines and Cigars.

TERMS MODERATE!
224-94-ly

BUFFINGTON HOUSE,
NEAR SQUARE,

TANEYTOWN, MD.

JAS. BUFFINGTON, Prop'r.

First-class in Every Respect

The Popular House for Commercial
Travelers.

Rates Moderate!

UV-Livery in connection with Hosue.

LOUIS ASH & SON,
Wholesale Manufacturers

CLOTilING.
319 W. Baltimore St.

Retail Department complete-
ly stocked with the season's
-thoicest Weaves and Novelties.

Garments made to order a
specialty. Samples and Prices,
with rules for self-measurement,
furnished on application.

When in the City give us a
call.

LOUIS ASH & SON.
319 W. Baltimore St.,

Between Howard and Eutaw,

BALTIMORE, MD.

NEW ROLLER MILL!
Having my mill dam about com-

pleted, I desire to inform the public
that I am now prepared to grind and
exchange wheat on flour. All those
who give me their custom work will
get the flour from their own wheat.
I use the Full Roller Process, and
guarantee all my flour to be free from
alum or any other drugs. I guaran-
tee satisfaction.

Chopping and Sawing
are Specialties. All work done at
short notice, and at prices to suit the
times. I solicit your patronage.

Respectfully Yours,

ANDREW STONESIFER.

1-6-3m HARNEY, MD.

GENERAL AGENT
- FOR -

DAVIS HAND

CREAM SEPARATOR.
None are superior, and few equal it.

Write, or call on me if you intend
buying, amid get my prices, and see
how they compare with others.

E. S. BANKERD,
31-8 • McKINSTRY'S MILLS, MD.

G. W. DEMMITT.
- DENTIST. -

Taneytown, - - - - Maryland.
All persons in need of dental work should

give me a call as I will save them money. Teeth
extracted with little or no pain. The very
best sets of teeth only $10.Jand guaranteed for
five years, Temporary sets at low prices. Fill-
ing and all kinds of dental work at bottom
prices,and all work guaranteed. I will visit
person within 12 ,miles without extra charge
Will be at Mver's store. Pleasant Valley, on
the second Thursday of each month. Give we
a trial.

Yours Respectfully,
9-15-1v G. W DEMMITT, Dentist.



HISTORY OF HARNEY. 
went out of business, and the store A serious conflict has taken place at

BY J. W. RECK. 1895.

PART III.

THE TOWN NADIED.

The next thing that presented it-
self was a proper name for the place.
Prior to this the town had no partic-
ular name, but was commonly called
"Monocacyville." As there was al-
ready one post-office in the state by
that name, it was necessary to change
the name before the office could be
started. Quite a number of names
were suggested, but none could be
definitely settled on. as there always
seemed to be another place by the
name suggested, so at last Mr. Rine-
hart went to Einmitsburg to examine
the post-office directory, so that a
name might be chosen that was not
already on the list of offices. It was
then decided that James Elder, post
master at that time, as well as a
prominent and influential citizen of
Emmitsburg, should have the honor
of naming the place.
In 1850,. Utah was organized as a

terriVry, by the United States gov-
ernment, When Brigham Young was
appointed governor by President Fill-
more, and his appointment was sub-
sequently renewed by President
Pierce. In 1857, however, charges of
violence toward the officers of the
federal government in Utah, were
brought against the Mormons, and,
in June of this year, General Harney
was appointed to the command of a
large body of troops who were to ac-
company Mr. Cumming, a new gov-
ernor, appointed in Brigham Young's
place by Mr. Buchanan, to the scene
of his duties.
When Mr. Elder was informed that

he was to name the new post-office, lie
had just finished reading an account
of the above named trouble, and he
promptly replied "we will call it
Harney, after General Harney," and
the name was sent on to the Post-
office Department where it was ac-
cepted, and the office established,
with Jeremiah Rinehart, who is well
known throughout Carroll county, as
the first post-master.
A short time after this, however,

Rinehart sold his store and property
to Wm. Hiteshew, who used the place
for a dwelling and store for a short
time, when he saw the necessity of
having a larger and more suitable
room for the ac3ommodation of his
rapidly increasing trade, and he built
a very respectable brick store house
on the corner of Gettysburg and Lit-
tlestown streets, where he moved his
store, and filled it up with nearly a
full line of new goods. After several
years he sold his property to Jacob
Shoemaker, who rented the property
for a number of years, then sold it to
Daniel Hess, who afterwards sold the
store house and part of the lot to
S. S. Shoemaker.

PROGRESS IN BUILDING.

In 1857 and 1858 the town seemed to
be in a prosperous condition. John
Black built a new house on the Em-
mitsburg road, E. D. Hess built on
the lot situated between the Taney-
town and Bridgeport roads, Daniel
Hess bought a tract of land, and
built on the Littlestown road, and
Jacob Kreglo built on the Littlestown
road near the squ tre, thus making
four new houses in a short time.
In 1880, George Fream built a full

set of new buildings on a tract of land
purchased from his father's farm,and
James Angell built on Littlestown
street. In 1861 James DfcIlhenny
built a new brick house on Gettys-
burg street, but soon after sold to
Polly Bowers.
About this time, David Bollinger

bc tight Jacob Kreglo's property near
the square, and commenced store-
keeping just across the street, in the
store house formerly built by William
Hiteshew. Here he carried on busi-
ness until about the close of the war,
when he built a new store house on
his own property, where he carried
on business for some time, then sold
his property to John Davis, who kept
a saloon.
In 1864, E. D. Hess sold his proper-

ty to J. Worthington Jones, and
bought the James Angel propertyon
Littlestown street. After moving
there, lie built an addition to the
house, and also a small shop, and
started the cabinet-maker business.
Mr. Jones also erected a small build-
ing on his property and commenced
store-keeping.
About this time, Phillip Shriner

sold his property on Gettysburg
street to Dr. Bear, and bought the
Daniel Hess property on Littlestown
street, where he moved in the spring
of 18e5, and carried on the wagon
maker business until his death, which
occurred in 1886, when the property
was left to his wife as long as she
lived.
After Daniel Hess sold out to

Shriner, he bought another tract of
land on Littlestown street, and im-
proved it with a full set of new build-
ings; while living there, his son, John
G. Hess, started the blacksmith bus-
iness, and soon after, he built a new
dwelling house on the corner of Lit-
tlestown street and the road leading
to Walnut Grove school house, ad-
joining his blacksmith shop, which
he afterward sold to the present
owner, John J. Hess, who continued
the business. Jelin G. Hess, after
this, became famous as a coach build-
er, and is today general manager of
the famous Hess Manufacturing
Company of Hagerstown, Md.
Daniel Hess also moved away, and

rented his property for several years
and finally sold to its present owner,
0. T. Shoemaker, who greatly im-
proved the place and it is now con-
sidered one of the most beautifiil, as
well as one of the most convenient,
homes in the community.
In 1866, J. Worthington Jones quit

storekeeping, and rented his room to
Dr. E. B. Simpson, who bought out
Dr. Bear's large practice. Simpson at
that time was the only physician in
the community, and had an unusual-
ly large practice. Mr. Jones after-
wards went into the, butchering busi
ness, which he continued for a nutn-
hers of years, he was also at one time
appointed Squire, but, finding it a
very provoking business, he resigned
his commission and lived a retired
life, and at his death, which oceurred
In 1894, left his estate to his daughter,
Miss Eudora V. Jones. In 1866 the
United Brethren church was bqilt, a
full history of which will be given
later on.
In 1868 Daniel Shoemaker bought a

lot from Polly Bowers and built a two
story frame dwelling house. Mr.
Shoemaker kept a small confection-
ery, and was postmaster for a num-
ber of years.
In 1869 or 1870, W. F. Eckenrode

bought a lot on the corner of Gettys-
burg and Eminitsburg streets, and
built a large frame house suitable for
a store and dwelling; this house made
quite an improvement to the town,
and here Mr. Eckenrode kept store
for a few years, then sold the stock
to his father, Mr. John Eckenrode,
who, with his younger son, J. V.
Eckenrode, went into business, and
afterward bought the property, and
continued merchandising until a few
years ago, when he sold out and rent-
ed to E. S. Eyler, who afterwards

property was rented to its present oc-
cupant, 1). J. Hesson.
For several- years following the

building of the Eckenrode house, the
growth of the town seemed to come
to a standstill, but business kept
gradually increasing, until the peo-
ple of the community began to think
that the town could be made a place
of considerable importance. In 1875,
Henry Kemper bought a lot and
built on Gettysburg street, and in
1876. Wm. H. Lightner bought his
father's property, tore down all the
old buildings, and built- a fine .brick
house and a good barn, thus making
it a desirable home; here Mr. Light-
ner lived until his death which occur-
red in 1893, when his property was
left to his wife, Mrs. Sarah Lightner.
In 1878, three new houses were

built, one by Rufus Bishop on the
road leading from this place to
Bridgeport, one by Josiah Hawn,and
another by Henry Ryser; both these
properties are located on the road
running from this place to Walnut
Grove school house. In 1880, J. V.
Eckenrode built a house on Eminits-
burg street; this house he rented until
he quit business, then he moved into
it himself. In 1881 Wm. Shriner
built on Littlestown street. In 1882
two new houses were built, one on
Gettysburg street by Henry M. Null,
and one on Littlestown street by
Daniel Hess.
In 1883, James H. Reaver built a

fine frame house; here he carried on
the boot, shoe and harness-making
business, for several years. Prior to
this, Reaver had built a small frame
house adjoining his new house on
Gettysburg street and S. S. Shoe-
maker's store property; he finally sold
this property to Shoemaker, who
lived in the house for several years.
In 1884, T. J. Hess built on Littles-
town street and started a coach re-
pair shop. In 1885, James H. Reaver
sold his property in town to Abraham
Hesson, and about the same time
bought a tract of land at the edge of
town, and put up a full set of new
buildings.
In-1886, George W. Shriner built on

Littlestown street, and Chas. H. Hess,
a house and carpenter shop on Gettys-
burg street; this property was after
wards sold to C. F. Reindollar, who
fitted the shop up for a drug store;
later it was traded to John V. Eyler,
who sold it to its present owner, Mrs.
Perry Eyler, and Miss Sallie Snider
opened up a millinery store in the
store room. Mrs. Peter Sell also built
qn addition to her property on Gettys-
burg street, thus making a great im-
provement. E. H. C. Shoemaker, dur-
ing this time, also built a large and
handsome house on the same street.
The year 1887, is prominently noted

for being the most prosperous of any
single year in the history of the town,
D. D. Hesson bought the old saloon,
and a small lot connected, and built
a large and commodious Hotel. Dr.
John C. Bush built a beautiful house
on Littlestown street, which is con-
sidered the most perfectly built house
in the town; everything was arranged
to suit his own convenience, but, un-
fortunately, he was not permitted to
enjoy it very long, and, after his death
in 1893, the property was sold to W.
A. Snider, its present owner. Andrew
Degroft built on the lot joining the
U. B. Church. Charles A. Cornell
bought and built on Gettysburg
street; Cornell sold his property to
Samuel C. Shoemaker, who built an
addition to the house, and it is to-day
a beautiful residence.
S. S. Shoemaker built to the side

and over the top of his store room,
thus, making it quite a large building.
All these buildings were large and
added very much to the appearance
of tfie town.

GENERAL AND POLITICAL.

The owners of the Defender and
Vigilant have had some differences
over sailing rules, and there will be
no more trial contests between them
until after the international race.

President Cleveland will start the
machinery at the Atlanta Exposition
by pressing an electric button, prob-
ably at Gray Gables. He will, in
company with his cabinet; visit the
Exposition on October 23.

The Convention of the Irish Race
in America, which has been agitated
for the past two years, will be held in
Chicago September 24, 25 and 26. It
will consist of 1,000 delegates chosen
by the Irish patriotic and military
organizations of the country.

The manufacturers of news paper
have formed a trust with a capital of
$35,000,000, and expect to control the
output of sixty mills which turn out,
on an average, twenty tons of paper
a day each. Paper has already ad-
vanced from $2.00 to $3.00 a ton.

The democratic state convention of
Missouri has declared for free silver,
and the Iowa convention against it.
A silver convention has been held in
Texas, which was addressed by Sena-
tor Chilton and Governor Culberson,
which adopted a platform in favor of
free coinage.

The Baltimore World, is responsi-
ble for the statement that the labor
organizations are incensed at the
nomination of John E. Hurst for
governor, because, it is claimed, he
opposed laws for the benefit and pro-
tection of labor, and that the leaders
openly denounce him.

Senator Peffer laments that the sil-
ver question is dying out in the west;
he said in a recent iecture,-"I think
that the silver men in the Democrat-
ic end Republican parties will be
swamped, when it comps to elections.
They will talk silver, protest their
allegiance to silver, and all that, but
when the time comes, they will grit
their teeth and stand their medicine.
They will vote with their parties.

It is reported that Emperor Will-
iam, of Germany, (hies not like Amer-
icans, and that American vessels were
only invited to the Kiel festivities,
because lie could not well avoid ex-
tending the invitation. It is reported
that in sending an invitation to an
English noble to be his personal and
unofficial guest, he said; 'There will
be no Americans present. Damn
them all."

The Ohio Populists have nominat-
ed J. S. Coxey for governor. The
platform reaffirms the principles of
the Omaha platform; Coxey's non-in-
terest bond and good roads bills; issu-
ing enough legal tender paper money
to put the country on a cash basis;
free and unlimited coinage; national-
ization of public monopolies; de-
nounces interest-bearing bonds; de-
nounces process in Debs case as
subversive of rights of trial by jury;
favors the law against payment of
any debt in gold; demands immediate
al.olishment of national banks; favors
a per diem service pension bill.

Spring Valley, Illinois, a mining set-
tlement, between Italians and Poles
on one side, and negroes on the other.
The latter have been driven from
their homes by the foreigners, and a
number of them killed. The negroes
over the state are arming and
threaten to take the law in their own
hands if Governor Atgeld does not
give them protection.

The news from the Cuban revolu-
tion, is very contradictory and unsat-
isfactory. The Spanish government
exercises jurisdiction over all cable-
grams, and all reports which may
claim to be impartial, are received
unofficially from vessels which arrive
from Cuban ports to this country.
Tile reports during the week show
that both sides have gained unimpor-
tant victories, with a slight balance
in favor of the insurgents.

The Nashville Banner says: "Mr.
Cleveland is reported to have said
that it was his enemies only who talk-
ed about giving him a third term. It
is a sort of effort to kill him with
kindness. The President does not
aspire to a third term, but he will
continue to be a power in politics for
some time yet, not by working the
wires as politicians generally do, but
by the force of his character, the con-
fidence he inspires by his straightfor-
ward dealing and the soundness of
his policies."

Cardinal Gibbons will be tendered
a reception by the Catholic Club upon
his return to Balthnore from Europe.
At a meeting of the board of mana-
gers of the Catholic Club it was de-
cided to make arrangements to meet
the Cardinal upon his arrival on Au-
gust 24th. One of the features of the
occasion is to be an address of wel-
come by one of the members. It's
expected that a large number of
members of the club will be present
to receive the Cardinal. On the fol-
lowing evening, Sunday, at eight
o'clock, a reception will be tendered
Cardinal Gibbons at the Catholic
Club, on Charles street opposite the
Cathedral.

The N. Y. Herald recently publish-
ed the following; "The simple truth
is that Mr. Cleveland would like to
go into history as theduan who refus-
ed a third term as President. Be is
awaiting an opportunity to make
that record. He is conscious of the
fact that this will give his career a
greater dignity than anything else
that could now occur to it. He fully
realizes that the refusal of a third
term would give him a place in our
public annals which no man since
Washington has been fortunate
enough to occupy. He does not in-
tend that any premature declaration
on his part shall spoil the chance to
make this record. He will bide his
time and speak when the time comes

Mr. C. G. Strong, principal of the
public schools at Anderson, Cal.,says:
I have used Chamberlain's Pain Balm
and have found' it an excellent rem-
edy for lameness and slight wounds."
Lameness usually results from a

sprain, or other injury, or from rheu-
matism, for which Chamberlain's
Pain Balm is especially intended and
unequalled. It affords almost imme-
diate relief and in a short time effects
a permanent cure. For sale by R. S.
McKinney, Taneytown, Md.

Where the Presidents of our Country
Lie Buried.

George Washington is buried at
Mount Vernon, Virginia; John Adams
at Quincy, Massachusetts; Thomas
Jefferson at Monticello, Virginia;
James Madison at Montpelier, Vir-
ginia; James Monroe at Richmond,
Virginia, John Quincy Adams at
Quincy, Massachusetts; Andrew Jack-
son at Nashville, Tennessee; Martin
Van Buren at Kinderhook, New
York; William Henry Harrison at
North Bend, Ohio; John Tyler at
Richmond, Virginia; James K. Polk
at Nashville, Tennessee; Zachary
Taylor at Louisville, Kentucky; Mil-
lard Fillmore at Buffalo, New York,
Franklin Pierce at Concord, New
Hampshire; James Buchanan near
Lancaster, Pennsylvania; Abraham
Lincoln at Springfield, Illinois; And-
rew Johnson at Greenville,Tennessee;
Ulysses S. Grant at Riverside Park,
New York; Rutherford B. Hayes at
Columbus, Ohio; James A. Garfield
at Cleveland. Ohio; Chester A. Arthur
at Albany, New York.-August La-
dies' Home Journal.

A VALUABLE FIND.
After years of study and labor,

there has at last been discovered a
sure and never-failing remedy. It has
been tested on patients, who have
despaired of ever being cured, the re-
sults have been, in every -case, won-
derful. Groff's Rheumatic Cure is
unequaled as a positive remedy in all
cases of Chronic and Acute Inflam-
matory Rheumatism, Gout,Lumbago,
Sciataca, Neuralgia;, especially Ova-
rian Neuralgia, Dysirenorrlicea and
all kindred affections. It is also a
valuable Blood Purifier, being espec-
ially useful in Eczema, Psoriasis,
Scrofula, all Glandular Enlargements
and diseases of the Liver and Kidneys.
It is absolutely free from all narcot-
ics. Severe attacks are relieved in
from one to three days and a positive
cure effected in from five to eighteen
days. For sale by J. McKellip, Drug-
gist, Taneytown, Md.

[A Native-Taneytowner.]

ATTORNEY-AT-LAW,

NOTARY-PUBLIC

IN & FOR ALLEGHENY COUNTY,

No. 435 GRANT STREET,

PITTSBURGH, PENN.
1-6-5-Iy

Public Sale
OF

FINE CATTLE.
The undersigned will sell at the

usual place in Taneytown, on
SATURDAY, AUGUST 17th., 1895,

at 1 o'clock, p. m., sharp,

30 HEAD OF

COWS, HEIFERS,
Bulls and Steers.

These cattle are of the Durham
and Jersey breeds, and are of differ-
ent ages and sizes. They are from
New York, and are a fine, healthy
lot.
VeTerms made known on day of sale.

2t. G. W. BAUMGARDNER.

5000 DOLLAR'S WORTH FANU
OOMBINATION
0FFEk
Unprecedented in the History

of Journalism.

-OF-

SEASONABLE MERCHANDISE TO BE SOLD WITHIN THE

NEXT 30 DAYS REGARDLESS OF COST.

It is the greatest reduction in prices that has been made in yrars, and

not confined to one, two or three special lines, but extending to every de-

partment in the house. We are very much crowded with goods and to

make a proper display of tlatim we have decided to enlarge our first awl

second floors. Now you very well know what tearing down and rebuild-

ing means. It means dust all over the fine as well as cheap goods, and

the only remedy we know of keeping the dust and sand from getting into

the goods is to get the goods away from it, and to accomplish this we have

decided to sell the abOve amount of

STRICTLY NEW, SEASONABLE AND DESIRABLE GOODS

at almost one-half the regular value

We shall make this a "MEMORABLE SALE" to our friends, pa-

trons and the public in general in presenting such values, which can only

be appreciated by an inspection of the same.' When we say that this great

"REBUILDING SALE" will surpass all that has gone before,

trons from near and far are awire that

our pa-

We Mean to Break all Previous Records for

LOW PRICES.

To accommodate those who are unable to visit our store duriiig the day-

time we shall keep open at night until 9 o'clock,

M. SCHNEEBERGER'S

TRADE PALACE.

33 East Main St., Westminster, Md

Opposite Catholic Church. Jul 13

If you want to "dicker" over a purchase, and in all prob-
ability be cheated after you get the goods at your offer, don't go
to ENGLAR'S. He don't do business on that plan. Intelli-
gent people should decide, before buying, whether a man who
has be,-,n doing business in the town for 13 years, will likely mis-
lead or overcharge them There is more of an object in business,
than mere dollars and cents-with some merchants. -
NEW FALL STYLE STIFF HATS AT ENGLAR'S.

CIZOWI\T
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Absolute, Positive Force Feed for
Grain, Grass Seed and Fertilizers.
No gears to alter, no loose wheels to
change, no pinions to lose. Has a con-
tinuous polished Steel a xle,and is gear-
ed direct to axle--imparts motion in-
stantly. Sows right or left, or in cir-
cles without loss of motion. Can
distribute damp or sticky fertilizers
evenly. Has the most perfect Fertili-
zer Attachment in the world, and will

sow Plaster and Ashes, when others fail. Perfect self-acting Spring Hoe-
no stopping for rocks, stumps or roots. Is warranted to do good work. Is
the lightest draught Drill of any. The CROWN is the leading Drill of to-day.

I carry a Full Line of Crown Drill Repairs, which will be sold only for
Cash. Please write at once for circulars and prices.

•
JOHN S WEYBRIGHT Agent - - Double Pipe Creek, Md.
July 20-3m.

PicTnic Register.
Under this heading all Pic-Nics will be an-

nounced. free of charge, when the bills are
printed at this office. The announcement will
be kept in the paper from the time the order
for the bills is placed, until the pic-nic comes
off. When the bills are printed elsewhere., 50c.
will be charged for the notice.

August 10th. The Mayberry Union Sunday
school will bold its annual celebration In
'Jacob Marker's grove. The public are
cordially invited. Taneytown Band.

August lOth.-Anunal Pic-nic of the Bruce
vijle Union Sabbath School in the Grove
of Jas. White. on Bruceville and Taney-
town mail. Union Bridge Band.

August 17th. Annual celebration of Oak
Grove Sabbath school, in Leonard Baby-
lon's Grove. Double Pipe Creek Band.

A ngust 24th. Christian Endeavor Picnic, under
the auspices of the C. E. Society of
Trinity Lutheran church, Taueytowu.
Taneytown Band.

RATIFICATION NOTICE.

No. 3313 Equity.

In the Circuit Court for Carroll
county, in Equity.

Calvin T. Fringer, assignee, &c.,
vs. James F. Fringer, mortgagor,
defendant.

Ordered this 1st. day of August, A.
D. 1°95, that the account of the Audi-
tor filed in this cause be finally rati-
fied and confirmed unless cause to the
contrary thereof be shown on or be-
fore the 19th. day of August inst:
provided a copy of this order be in-
serted for two successive weeks before
the last named day, in some newspa-
per published in Carroll County. '

BENJ. F. CROUSE, Clerk,

True copy-Test;
8-8-2t BENJ. F. CROUSE, Clerk.

Special Notices.

STIFF HATS. - The new Fall
Styles, now on Sale at.

P. B. Englar's.

CIDER BARRELS. A lot of good
Barrels for sale cheap. Call and

eiatnine.
W. P. ENGLAR,

Aug-10-2t Uniontown, Md.

MIDDLEBURG

Cider Factory.
Having a late improved Hydraul-

ic Cider Press, with a capacity 50

barrels a day, I am ready for the

season to

Manufacture Cider
for all persons at reasonable rates.

As apples will be plenty this year,

expect to do a large business, be-

cause I have the best facilities in the

country for making cider in large

quantities and on short notice. I

will run my press every day in the

week except Saturday.

Yours Respectfully,

WILSON L. CROUSE
27-7-4t Proprietor-

The publishers of the CARROLL RECORD
have made a special arrangement with the
publishers of the New York

Morning Advertiser
AND Sunday Advertiser

'whereby they can furnish the

CARROLL RECORD,
and both of the above papers to a limited num-
ber of subscribers for one year for

• 0S2 "0
A first-class metropolitan newspaper by mail

every day for one year and

THE CARROLL RECORD
For $2.50.

The most liberal offer of the century.

THE MORNING ADVERTISER
A bright and clean eight-page daily, con-
tainiug every day all the news and
special features of Intel est to everybody,
a good short story, a woman's column,
gossip about actors and actresses, book
criticisms, special market and financial
reports, and the best sporting page. It is
the foremost lc. newspaper in the United
States, a high-toned and wholesome home
newspaper.

THE SUNDAY ADVERTISER
8 pages (16 columns), 45 columns of which
will be reserved for the news, illustra-
tions, special articles and literary matter.
A model, high-class metropolitan Sunday
paper, equal in every respect to the high-
priced Sunday papers. It is the largest
consideration ever offered for lo.

Think over the proposition and send in your
subscription at once.

REMEMBER ! ! REMEMBER ! !
THIS OFFER MAY SHORTLY BE

WITHDRAWN.

THE REGULAR SUBSCRIPTION
PRICE OF THE MORNING AND
SUNDAY ADVERTISER FOR ONE
YEAR IS

$3.50
BY THIS OFFER YOU GET IT

FOR VIRTUALLY

$1.50.
Sample Copies of the Advertiser

can be seen at the RECORD office.

BALTIMORE AMERICAN,
ESTABLISH:7D 1773.

ThE DAILY AMERICAN.
Terms by Mall, Postage Prepaid.

One Month $ .50
Daily and Sunday, One Month  $ .65
Three Months $1.50
Daily and Sunday, Three Months  .$1.90
Six DI moths  li.00
Daily and Sunday, six months  • • •83.75
One Year $6.00
With Sunday Editi n, One Year  $7.55
Sun may Edition, One Year  $1.00

THE TWICE-A-WEEK AMERICAN.

The Cheapest and Best Family

Newspaper Published,

ONLY ONE DOLLAR A YEAR
Six Months, 50 cts.

T El E Twice-a-Week A nom ICAN is published in
two Issues, Tuesday and Friday mornings.with
the news of the week in compete shape. It also
contains interesting special corres ondehce, en-
tertaining romances, good poetry and local
matter as general interest and fresh miscel-
lany suitable for the home circle. A carefUllv
edited Agricultural Department, and full and
reliable Financial and Market Reports, are
special features.

TEEMS AND PREMIUMS:
The Twice-a-week American, single • copy 1

year 
5 copies, one year, and extra copy of the

Twice-a-Week, one • year, or daily .14
months, free..  $5.00

10 copies, one year, with an extra copy of
the Twice-a-Week one year and Daily 3
mouths free    10.00

20 copies, one year, with .n extra copy of
Twice-a-Week one year and Daily 9
months, free 20.00

30 copies, one year, with an extra copy of •
the Twice-a- Week and one copy of
Daily one year. free 30.00

The premium copies will Le sent to any ad-
dress desired.
Specimen copies sent to any address. It is

not necessary for all the names in a club to
come from one office, nor is it necessary to
send all the names at one time. Send on the
names as fast as received.
Remittances should be made by check,
postal money-order or, registered letter, as it
is unsafe to send money in ordinary letters,aud
the publisher cannot be responsible for losses
occasioned there by.
Entered at the postoffice at Baltimore, Md.,

as second-class matter, April 13, 1894.

SPECIAL CLUB RATES.
The Twice a-Week American,with any of the

following named journals, will be sent one
year, to separate addresses, if desired, at the
prices given in the first column of figures:

NAMES OF JOURNALS.

American Agriculturist....
American Magazine 
Atlantic Monthly 
American Farmer 
Century Magazine 
Christian Union 
Demorest's Monthly 
Leslie's Illustrated Newsp'r 
" Popular Month y 
" Pleasant Hours 
" Budget of Wit 

Godey's Lady's Book......
Harper's Weekly 

Magazine 
" Bazar...-. ..... .

Household.... ..... . .  
LIppencott's Magazine 
Rural New Yorker 
Scribner's .  
Scientific American 
St. Nicholas 
Turf,Field and Farm 

Club Regular
Price, Price.

$2.25 $2.50
3.50 3 '-
4.50 MO
1.75 2.00
4.7E 5.00
3.78 4.00
2.75 3.00
4.50 5.00
3.75 4.90
2.60 2.75
3.00 3.25
2..0 3.00
4.50 541
4.50 5.00
4.50 5.00
1.85 2.50
3.25 4.00
2.80 3.00
3.75 4.00
3.73 4.00
3.75 4.(X1
5.00 6.15)

CHAS. C. FULTON & Co.

Felix Agnus Mgr. and Publisher

American Office.
BALTIMORE MD

SUBSCRIBE

-FOR-

THE CARROLL RECORD.

WESTERN MARYLAND R. R.
Connecting with P. & It. R. at ShIppens-

burg, and Gettysburg; Norfolk & Western R.
R. at Hagerstown; B. & 0. Railroad at Hagers
town and Cherry Run; Penna. It R. at Bruce-
ville; P. W. .k B., N. C. and B. & P. Railroads
at Union Station. Baltimore, Md.

Schedule taking effect June 30th., 1893.
Read down STATIONS Read upward

A.M. A.M. 

. 
P.M.

11 25' 5 25 ie Cherry Run, at 848 1 20 905
11 28 528  Bice Pool  845 117 902
ii 40 542 ...Clear Spring  8381 04 848
11 49 548  Charlton.... 8 28,12 59 842
II 56 559 W`msport, P. V. 8 19F1249 881
12 13 813 or Hagerstown le 8 06;12 35 8 10
I'M. A.M. A.M.ip.M. p,51-

  608 ..... I..... 8 35

P.M. p.n.
*4 15 mu)

2 16
29)
2 35
2 42
2 45
2 48
2 51

4 31
4 35
44;)
44,
448

A.M
7 02 at H age rstown le
720 ...Chewsville....
727 ...Sm ithsburg
736 . 

. 
..Edgemout

7 4.1..Blue Mountain..
7 441 Pen Mar 
7 46:Bnena Vista Spg 
7 War ..Hightield../e

1,11.15C9. 
P.M.*7 30 12 15 808

11 51 741
06 11 45 735

6 57 11 35 716

6 

521

1 29 721
:128 720

854
65111

32 1132 7 24

253 7 50 le. -1-figbfield..ar
322 818  Fairfield 
3 52 8 43 ...Gettysburg
416 907 ..New Oxford.-
4 33 923  Hauover....
4 45 9 3t• ar. Porters . •it
P.M. A.M.

  ii 25 7 17 
10 56 648
1028 620 
 10 03 556 
 9 46 5 39

  956 527
A.M.

527 938 le- . Porters. .ar
585 947 -Spring Grove ..
65. 10 10 at York le
31. A.m.

  910 443 
 924 436

  902 414
A.M. P.M.

P.M. P.M. AM
  ra 750 le Highfleld ar
4481 25.4 759 ...Blue Ridge...
5261 xiO 816 ....Thurmont....
  331 8211 ..Rocky Ridge..
538 344 837 ....Bruceville....
545 3 Z6 845 ..Union Bridge..

40.t. 849  Linwood 
409; 8 14 ..New Windsor 
4 341 9 11 .:Westminster 
 5l0,  -Emory Grove..

637 51l, 943  Glyndon 
  6 6,10 08 .... A rli lig ton .
718 6 Mill) 27 ....Baltimore....

P.M.!A.M,

553
607

P.M.
825
930
12 33
A.M

P.M A.M.
8 15 11 35 am Washington le
95i• 12 54 ...Philadelphia-
12 33 303 ar..New York..le
A.M. P

 1128 720
6 48 11 243 715
0,25 10 543 647

. 
10 40 6 36

6071029 623
6 00 10 20 613

10)6 607
5 53 10 10 602
540 953 542

511 99 1121 459
8 36 4 23

« m. 811 4C0
.A. A nt. P.M.

i:ao 

a.m. A.M. e.fh.
- .. 701 201

129.0095 12
350
15 111 0012

I 

P.M. A.M. A.M

Blue Mountain Express, [Parlor Car] leaves
Baltimore 3.22 p. m., stopping at Westminster,
New Windsor, Union Bridge, Bruceville [con-
nection for Frederick], Thurmont, Blue Ridge,
Buena Vista Spring, Blue Mountain, Smith-
burg, Htigerstown.
Blue Mountain Express. [east' leaves Ha-

gerstown 6.43 a. m., stopping at above stations,
also Rocky Ridge, Glyndon. Owings Mills and
Sudbrook Park.
Additional trains leavp Baltimore for Union

Bridge and Intermediate Stations at 10.17 a . m.,
and 5.05 and 6.07 p, m., and leave Union
Bridge for Baltimore and Intermediate Sta-
tions at 5.25 a. m. Bruceville 6.25 a. in.„ and
Union Bridge 12.45p. m. daily, except Sunday.
Sundays only-leave Baltimore for Union

Bridge and Intermediate Stations at 9.30 a. m.
and 2.30 p. m., and leave Bruceville 6.25 a. m.
and Union Bridge for Baltimore and Interme-
diate Stations 3.58 p. m.

. Baltimore k Cumberland Valley B. B.
Leave Hagerstown for Shippensburg and

Intermediate Stations 6.25 and 11.11) a. m. and
7.0) p. m., and leave Shippensburg for Ha-
gerstown and Intermediate Stations at 6.00 a.
m. and 109 and 3.08 p. m.

--
Leave Rocky Ridge for Emmittsburg at 5.26

and 10.37 a. in., and 3.31 and 6.29 p. m. Leave
Emmittaburg for Rocky Ridge at 7.50 and 10.00
a. m., and 2.:1.5 and 4.45 p.m.
Leave Bruceville for Frederick at 9.40 a. m.

and 5.40 p.
Leave Brucevil le for Taney town. Littlestown

and Columbia at 7.44 a • nm. and 3.45 p. m.
B. & 0. passenger trains leave Cherry Run

for Cumberland and intermediate points, No.
13, daily at 8.57 a. m. For Piedmont and inter-
mediate, No. 17 daily, except Sunday, at 1.26 p.
in., and Chicago Express, No. 7, daily at 11.03
p.
Passengers for Chicago Limited, No. 5. or

Cincinnati Limited, No. I, take No. 17 to Han-
cock and there taansfer to No. 6 or No. 1.
Passengers for B. & 0. Pittsburg Express,

No. 9. take No. 7 to Hancock and there trans-
fer.
*Daily. All others daily, except Sunday.
:Stops only to land passengers from Balti-

more.
J. M. HOOD,Pres't and Gen'l Manager.

B. H. GRISWOLD bien'l Passenger Agent

Our Combination Offers.
We have made terms with the following

periodicals by which they will be furnished in
combination with the itscoun at specially low
rates.

The New York Weekly TRIBUNE,
Republican iii politics, A great Family, News,
and Political paper. Regular price $1.00 a year.
In combination with the REDORD only $1.25
a year.

The New York Semi-Weekl y WORLD
Democratic in politics. A great journal de-
voted to general news and politics. Regular
price 61.00 a year. In combination with the
RECORD only $1.50 a year.

The COSMOPOLITAN Magazine, one of
the most popular monthly magazines in the
country. Devoted to Science, Fiction and Art.
In combination with the RECORD only $2.00
a year.

The _FARM JOURNAL, a leading mon.thly
Agricultural Journal, devoted to the Interests
of farmers and stock raisers everywhere. The
orchard, dairy, garden, and poultry features
are also valuable. In combination with
the RECORD, only $1.1.0 a year.

The New York Morning Advertiser,
daily and Sunday, regular price alone $3.50;
a bright, clean and Up-to-date newspaper,
with the CARROLL RECORD only $2.50 a year
for the two, or $1.85 for the RECORD one year,
and the Advertiser 6 months

Taneytown Markets.
Corrected Weekly.

Flour,  , ...4.0005.00
Bran, per ton  17.00
White Middlings, per ton., 19.00
Timothy Hay, prime, per ton.. 10.00
Mixed Hay, per ton 5  00a 7.00
Rye Straw.   4.00a 6.50
Wheat, new  ,65
Rye. new  .43
Barley. 
Oats. .new.   25
Corr, new 
Clover Seed, per lb 
Potatoes.  50 a 50
Butter   .14
Eggs  .10
Lard  .064
Tallow  .04
Hams  .12
Sho alders  .08
Sides  .07
Hides  .06
Hogs  6.50
Sheep   2.00
Lambs   3.00
Calves    3.50
Beef Cattle, Lest  5.00
e e

Cows,  $25 0 $35
Bullocks  3.50

43

medium  2.00

-
Baltimore Markets,

Corrected Weekly.
-

Wheat  69070
Corn  47049
Oats,    25029
Rye  45050
Hay, Timothy,  15.00016.00
Hay mixed  11.00013.00
Hay, Clover.   9.00010.00
Straw, Rye, bales  8.5009.00
Straw, Rye blocks 5  0006.00
Straw, wheat blocks 5  0005.50
Bran •   15.00016.00
Middlings 15.00016.00
Potatoes, new, per bus 40060
Sugar, granulated  41
Sugar, confec, A  44
Beef Cattle, Best 4  5005.00
Beef cattle: Medium  3.0003.25
Swine, gross  5.4505.90
Swine, Rough  3.5003.50
Sheep, grws  1iO3e
Lambs-, gross  4R5c
Calves, gross  Sig5c


